

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. RUBIN REGARDING PENDING MATTERS					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W210 - BUSINESS OPERATIONS:		109.20	\$ 69,677.64		
02/09/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW CASH REPORT FOR REPORTING PURPOSES	0.10	67.00	W220	11319130
02/13/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW BANK SETTLEMENT AND MISCELLANEOUS DOCUMENTS (.2); CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN AND J. FINK REGARDING ELECTIONS (.2)	0.40	286.00	W220	11382805
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W220 - UTILITY ISSUES (DEPOSITS, ETC.):		0.50	\$ 353.00		
02/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit REVIEW AND GATHER DOCUMENTS RELATING TO KPMG TAX TRANSACTIONS REQUESTED BY N. JONES AND COORDINATE SENDING OF SAME TO HER.	1.70	629.00	W230	11327571
02/03/04	Bower, David TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES FOR EMBATREL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THORNE REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.50	290.00	W230	11401185
02/04/04	Goldring, Stuart PHONE CALLS WITH J. UFFNER REGARDING STOCK OWNERSHIP (.5); PHONE CALL WITH J. LONGMIRE AND R. REINHOLD REGARDING CLAIMS OWNERSHIP (.3); DRAFT EMAIL TO KPMG TAX, M. HOENIG, M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.4); DRAFT EMAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING NOTE ELECTION AND CLAIM OWNERSHIP (.4)	1.60	1,144.00	W230	11312578
02/04/04	Bower, David REVIEW REORGANIZATIONAL PROPOSALS REGARDING 304 AND 355	1.50	870.00	W230	11401193
02/06/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS AMONG J. LONGMIRE, M. FRENCH (KPMG) AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING REPORTING AND ELECTIONS MADE BY FINANCIAL VENTURES	0.70	469.00	W230	11316929
02/09/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND R. COX (OF AKIN GUMP) REGARDING STATUS OF TAX EMERGENCE ISSUES	0.30	214.50	W230	11325188
02/09/04	Hoernlein, Michael TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. COX AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS	0.50	185.00	W230	11331304
02/09/04	Grogan, James PREPARE STIPULATION WITH STATE OF NEW YORK DEPARTMENT OF TAXATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.20	73.00	W230	11334035
02/10/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH R. KOST OF LAZARD REGARDING RESTRICTED SECURITIES	0.20	143.00	W230	11325199
02/11/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W230	11396818

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM S. DZIBINSKI (MCI) REGARDING OHIO REQUEST FOR EXTENSION OF BAR DATE FOR TAX CLAIMS				
02/11/04	Hoernlein, Michael	1.20	444.00	W230	11331808
	TEND TO TELMEX LETTER REGARDING OWNERSHIP OF WORLDCOM DEBT				
02/12/04	Goldring, Stuart	2.00	1,430.00	W230	11325179
	PHONE CALLS WITH R. REINHOLD REGARDING REPRESENTATION LETTER (.4); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.4); PHONE CALL WITH J. UFFNER OF STROOCK REGARDING SAME (.3); EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING OTHER CLAIM OWNERSHIP (.4); CONFER WITH L. FIFE AND S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.5)				
02/12/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W230	11328006
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. GOLDRING AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING CERBURUS'S COMPLIANCE WITH THE TRADING ORDER				
02/12/04	Hoernlein, Michael	0.80	296.00	W230	11332218
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FRENCH AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING TELMEX LETTER REGARDING OWNERSHIP OF WORLDCOM DEBT (0.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. UFFNER AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING TELMEX LETTER (0.3).				
02/13/04	Hoernlein, Michael	0.70	259.00	W230	11332411
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH S. COHEN REGARDING OPERATING OF NOTE OVERSUBSCRIPTION PROVISION OF PLAN (0.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (0.2).				
02/14/04	Fife, Lori	0.30	214.50	W230	11382702
	EMAILS REGARDING KPMG AUDIT LETTER.				
02/14/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W230	11328682
	REVIEW TAX STATEMENTS AND COMMUNICATION FROM PINELLAS COUNTY.				
02/19/04	Grogan, James	0.70	255.50	W230	11353226
	REVIEW TAX CLAIMS FOR OBJECTION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SALTZBERG REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/20/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W230	11353229
	CORRESPOND WITH R. CUKRAS AND J. SALTZBERG REGARDING NEW YORK TAX STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW ORDER APPROVING SAME (.1).				
02/23/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.20	143.00	W230	11362612
	FOLLOW-UP ON OBTAINING REP LETTERS FROM CREDITOR				
02/24/04	Hoenig, Mark	1.60	1,144.00	W230	11364403
	INTERNATIONAL TAX PLANNING.				
02/24/04	Strochak, Adam	0.60	330.00	W230	11395537
	REVIEW NORTH CAROLINA DRAFT TAX CLAIM REGARDING ROYALTIES (0.2); E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING SAME (0.2); REVIEW REQUEST FROM RITENOUR SCHOOL DISTRICT REGARDING PAYMENT ON GRANT AGREEMENT IN LIEU OF TAXES (0.2)				
02/24/04	Hoernlein, Michael	0.90	333.00	W230	11370410

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH S. GOLD AND B. COOPER REGARDING DTC'S CONCERNS ABOUT TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. DEFRIES AND M. HOENIG REGARDING TAX CONSEQUENCES OF CERTAIN INTERCOMPANY AGREEMENTS (0.4).				
02/25/04	Hoening, Mark	0.70	500.50	W230	11366458
	MCI CHARTER RESTRICTION.				
02/25/04	Goldring, Stuart	3.90	2,788.50	W230	11361755
	PHONE CALL WITH M. PALMER REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.5); CONFER WITH R. KOST, M. HOERNLEIN, M. FRENCH, M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS AND SECTION 382(L)(5) (2.2), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH M. FRENCH (.2) AND WITH M. FRENCH AND J. THOREN (.4) REGARDING SAME; CONFER FURTHER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING DTC QUESTIONS ON CHARTER RESTRICTION (.2).				
02/25/04	Hoernlein, Michael	2.30	851.00	W230	11371558
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, M. FRENCH, T. SAVAGE, R. KOST, B. COOPER REGARDING CREDITOR ELECTIONS, POTENTIAL VALUE OF SECTION 382(L)(5) (1.7) AND QUALIFICATION FOR SECTION 382(L)(5) - AND CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING AND M. FRENCH REGARDING THESE ISSUES (.5)				
02/26/04	Hoening, Mark	0.50	357.50	W230	11366711
	RESEARCH AND ANALYSIS UNDER SECTION 382.				
02/26/04	Goldring, Stuart	2.60	1,859.00	W230	11398168
	CONFER WITH L. FIFE REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND OTHER SECTION 382 RELATED ISSUES (.4); FURTHER CONFER WITH L. FIFE IN PREPARATION FOR CALL WITH COMMITTEE COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.4); PHONE CALL WITH AKIN GUMP (TAX AND BANKRUPTCY), R. KOST, T. SAVAGE, L. FIFE, M. FRENCH AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND SECTION 382(L)(5) (1.0); FURTHER CALL WITH R. COX OF AKIN GUMP REGARDING SAME (.4); AND WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2); PHONE CALL WITH G. BRAE OF MILBANK REGARDING CERBERUS CLAIM OWNERSHIP(.2)				
02/26/04	Hoernlein, Michael	1.00	370.00	W230	11371958
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, D. GOLDEN, P. COX, M. FRENCH, T. SAVAGE, R. KOST REGARDING CREDITOR ELECTIONS AND SECTION 382(L)(5).				
02/27/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.00	715.00	W230	11395568
	CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W230 - TAX ISSUES:		29.50	\$ 17,034.00		
02/01/04	Johnson, Virginia	4.60	1,518.00	W240	11264434
	REVISE MOTION TO DISMISS/CONSOLIDATE TWIN CITY APPEAL REGARDING EXCESS INSURANCE POLICIES (2.5); RESEARCH REGARDING "EXCUSABLE DELAY" (1.5) CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INSURANCE (.6)				
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W240	11342606
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INSURANCE				
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W240	11342605
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. PEREZ AND P. CURNIN REGARDING HEARING FOLLOW-UP.				
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W240	11341849
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. FERRILLO, A. PEREZ, B. BENJET AND P. CURNIN REGARDING INSURANCE				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING (.5) AND REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OUTLINE FOR HEARING (.9)	1.40	1,085.00	W240	11342445
02/02/04	Allerhand, Joseph REVIEWING APPEAL BRIEF REGARDING D&O ISSUE.	0.80	588.00	W240	11298989
02/02/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. FERRILLO, B. BENJET, P. CURNIN, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING D&O ALLOCATION MOTION (1.8), REVIEW PROFFER AND ARGUMENT FOR MOTION (.30)	2.10	1,407.00	W240	11309939
02/02/04	Ferrillo, Paul TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET ON D&O SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET, P. CURNIN AND D. STEUBER ON D&O POLICY ISSUES (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ ON D&O SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN ON D&O SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. MORRISON (D'AMATO & LYNCH) ON D&O SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (0.2).	2.50	1,325.00	W240	11298896
02/02/04	Ferrillo, Paul TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, P. CURNIN AND B. BENJET ON PROPOSED D&O SETTLEMENT (0.5); DRAFTED HISTORY AND PROFFER OF TESTIMONY ON PROPOSED SETTLEMENT (3.0).	3.50	1,855.00	W240	11296713
02/02/04	Sipple, John PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORLDCOM, STEPTOE & V. JOHNSON, ET AL REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES	1.00	601.09	W240	11401342
02/02/04	Johnson, Virginia REVISE MOTION TO DISMISS/CONSOLIDATE TWIN CITY APPEAL REGARDING EXCESS INSURANCE POLICIES (2.1); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.7) DRAFT AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO DISMISS AND GATHER ACCOMPANYING EXHIBITS (3.0) PREPARE FOR FILING AND SERVICE OF MOTION (2.0) CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. SIPPLE, WORLDCOM AND STEPTOE REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES (1.0)	8.80	2,904.00	W240	11289434
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia FURTHER REVISE OUTLINE REGARDING PRESENTATION ON D&O ALLOCATION.	1.00	775.00	W240	11342420
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia ATTEND HEARING REGARDING AT&T STATUS AND D&O ALLOCATION.	2.00	1,550.00	W240	11342149
02/03/04	Ferrillo, Paul PREPARATION FOR AND APPEARANCE AT BANKRUPTCY COURT WITH M. GOLDSTEIN ON D&O MOTION.	2.50	1,325.00	W240	11302951
02/04/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. TOTH REGARDING RETROSPECTIVE PREMIUM PAYMENTS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MCELMEEL REGARDING SCHEDULING A CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS ZURICH'S CLAIMS UNDER PRIOR POLICIES (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING NEEDED CLIENT CONTACT (.10).	0.30	133.50	W240	11304119
02/05/04	Jacoby, Mark	3.80	2,356.00	W240	11376760

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE (.5); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. KILBERG REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW A16 BLENDED POLICY AND BRIEFS IN BANKRUPTCY COURT ON BOND RESCISSION ISSUES (2.0)				
02/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W240	11342261
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING D&O ISSUES				
02/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W240	11341825
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING D&O ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ' CHAMBERS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE RAKOFF'S CHAMBERS (.1) REGARDING CASE ISSUES.				
02/05/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11310592
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM P. ANDERSON REGARDING CLIENT CONTACT AT ZURICH AND THEN FORWARD SAME TO S. MOONEY.				
02/05/04	Johnson, Virginia	1.20	396.00	W240	11308783
	CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND, P. FERRILLO AND WITH BORGEEST REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT REGARDING TWIN CITY APPEAL (.7); SET UP CONFERENCE CALL (.5)				
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W240	11342016
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING D&O				
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W240	11342547
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING D&O LITIGATION				
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W240	11342548
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING D&O LITIGATION				
02/06/04	Ferrillo, Paul	4.50	2,385.00	W240	11317259
	REVIEWED LEGAL BILLS OF S. KELLETT AND SUMMARIES PREPARED BY S. PIERSON (4.0); EMAIL TO CLIENT ON KELLETT LEGAL BILLS (0.5).				
02/06/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.60	198.00	W240	11312848
	CONFER WITH JUDGE RAKOFF AND COUNSEL FOR TWIN CITY REGARDING MOTION TO DISMISS/CONSOLIDATE TWIN CITY APPEAL (.3); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING APPEAL (.3)				
02/07/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W240	11317541
	COMMUNICATIONS TO/FROM P. FERRILLO REGARDING S. KELLETT'S ATTORNEYS' FEES				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W240	11342395
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING D&O ALLOCATION.				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W240	11342393
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH AL. PEREZ REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON D&O ALLOCATION (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. FERRILLO, B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.4)				
02/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.70	469.00	W240	11319131

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND PROFFER IN CONNECTION WITH D&O ALLOCATION MOTION (.50), COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. FERRILLO AND B. BENJET REGARDING D&O MOTION (.20)				
02/09/04	Ferrillo, Paul	2.80	1,484.00	W240	11319219
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH H. RUMELD (WCOM), J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY ON STATUS OF ERISA SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (0.4); RESEARCH ON ERISA BOND REQUIREMENT (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. STEUBER ON ERISA BOND REQUIREMENTS (0.4).				
02/11/04	Jacoby, Mark	2.20	1,364.00	W240	11383314
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. STEUBER AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES (.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. STEUBER REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL AGREEMENTS INSURANCE RESCISSION MOTION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE H. RUMELD REGARDING MEDIATION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE G. GOTTO REGARDING MEDIATION AND EXTENSION OF TIME TO OBJECT TO ERISA PROOF OF CLAIM (.4); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. STEUBER REGARDING OBJECTION TO ERISA PROOF OF CLAIM (.2)				
02/11/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.50	367.50	W240	11324693
	REVIEW APPEAL PAPERS (TWIN CITY) REGARDING D&O INSURANCE.				
02/11/04	Ferrillo, Paul	1.60	848.00	W240	11322168
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. STEUBER ON ERISA INSURANCE COVERAGE ISSUES (0.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. STEUBER AND M. JACOBY ON STATUS ON ERISA INSURANCE ISSUES (0.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM D. SMOYER ON D&O ALLOCATION SETTLEMENT (0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM N. MORRISON ON D&O ALLOCATION SETTLEMENT (0.2).				
02/13/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.50	367.50	W240	11344713
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH DISTRICT COURT AND OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING APPEAL FROM D&O RULING.				
02/13/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.80	424.00	W240	11333390
	PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE RAKOFF AND OPPOSING COUNSEL ON TWIN CITY APPEAL (0.4); REVIEW CUTTER AND BUCK DECISION ON RESCISSION ISSUES (0.4).				
02/13/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11328747
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. TOTH REGARDING PAYMENT OF RETROSPECTIVE PREMIUMS				
02/17/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.20	124.00	W240	11385171
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH W. KILBERG (GIBSON DUNN) REGARDING STATUS OF MEDIATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P.FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.1).				
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W240	11543089
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES				
02/17/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11349674
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. TOTH REGARDING SCHEDULING INSURANCE CALL WITH A. MCELMEEL TO DISCUSS RETROSPECTIVE PREMIUMS.				
02/17/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.50	165.00	W240	11335540
	DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING TRANSFER OF TWIN CITY APPEAL (.3); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND RE: SAME (.2).				
02/18/04	Johnson, Virginia	1.20	396.00	W240	11339567

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING TRANSFER OF TWIN CITY APPEAL (.9); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND (.3).				
02/20/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.50	222.50	W240	11357140
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. TOTH REGARDING RETROSPECTIVE PREMIUM ADJUSTMENTS AND PAYROLL AUDITS.				
02/23/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.70	231.00	W240	11354808
	DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING TRANSFER OF TWIN CITY APPEAL (.5); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/24/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.60	267.00	W240	11359157
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL MADE TO ZURICH AND COUNTERPROPOSAL RELATING TO SAME (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MOONEY REGARDING COUNTERPROPOSAL SUBMITTED BY ZURICH (.20); DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO B. BENJET REGARDING ZURICH'S COUNTERPROPOSAL WITH RESPECT TO MCI'S SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL (.20).				
02/24/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.40	132.00	W240	11354223
	REVISE LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING TRANSFER OF TWIN CITY APPEAL (.2); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/25/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.60	198.00	W240	11360356
	REVISE LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING TRANSFER OF TWIN CITY APPEAL (.2); SEND LETTER TO JUDGE COTE AND OPPOSING COUNSEL (.2); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND (.2)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W240 - INSURANCE ISSUES:		58.70	\$ 30,673.59		
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W260	11341646
	REVIEW EMAILS (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH N. JONES, L. FIFE (.4) REGARDING EMPLOYMENT AGREEMENTS, SEVERANCE PLANS.				
02/05/04	Youdelman, Sharon	2.00	990.00	W260	11390798
	CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING OBJECTION TO ERISA PLAINTIFFS CLAIM [0.3]; REVIEW & REVISE SAME [1.4]; CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING DRAFT OBJECTION [0.3]				
02/06/04	Youdelman, Sharon	3.20	1,584.00	W260	11389992
	REVIEW & REVISE DRAFTS OF OBJECTION TO ERISA PLAINTIFFS CLAIM [2.8]; CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME [0.4]				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W260	11342392
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCGAREY REGARDING EMPLOYMENT CONTRACTS.				
02/11/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.90	445.50	W260	11393350
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET & S. COHEN REGARDING OBJECTION TO ERISA PLAINTIFFS CLAIM [0.1]; NUMEROUS E-MAILS WITH J. ALLERHAND, A. STROCHAK, ET AL REGARDING SAME [0.3]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND & S. COHEN REGARDING SAME [0.1]; REVIEW & REVISE SAME [0.2]; CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME [0.2]				
02/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W260	11341592
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. MCGAREY AND L. FIFE REGARDING EMPLOYMENT CONTRACTS.				
02/13/04	Fife, Lori	0.20	143.00	W260	11382699

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCI REGARDING EMPLOYMENT					
02/20/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.40	268.00	W260	11388492
	REVIEW SEVERANCE PLAN ISSUES				
02/23/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.90	603.00	W260	11380547
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES (.20), CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING RESEARCH WITH RESPECT TO EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES (.70)				
02/23/04	Grogan, James	3.80	1,387.00	W260	11392356
	CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES (.7); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (2.8); REVIEW FIRST DAY ORDERS PERTAINING TO EMPLOYEE BENEFITS (.3).				
02/24/04	Fife, Lori	1.50	1,072.50	W260	11384421
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SEVERANCE PLAN (.3); REVIEW EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (1.0); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/24/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.40	268.00	W260	11378738
	REVIEW CASE LAW REGARDING SEVERANCE ISSUES (.20), CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.20)				
02/24/04	Grogan, James	3.10	1,131.50	W260	11393227
	CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES (.1); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (1.7); DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (1.3).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W260 - EMPLOYEES/UNION ISSUES:		18.10	\$ 9,210.00		
02/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.20	594.00	W280	11367186
	REVISE DOCUMENT ROOM FORMS				
02/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.80	1,386.00	W280	11367185
	REVIEW DILIGENCE REQUEST AND ANNOTATE				
02/02/04	Gold, Simeon	1.20	882.00	W280	11305726
	REVIEWED SEC FILINGS REGARDING MCI TRANSACTION.				
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W280	11342033
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DELOITTE PARTNER REGARDING STATUS.				
02/02/04	Green, Frederick	2.80	2,170.00	W280	11398635
	REGARDING MCI: ORGANIZE FOR MEETINGS ON WEDNESDAY (1.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY AND P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING SEC (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LAZARD REGARDING SEC (1.0)				
02/02/04	Goldring, Stuart	2.60	1,859.00	W280	11312020
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING CERTAIN NOTE ELECTIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH SAME AND A. KASHLINSKAYA REGARDING RECONCILIATION OF CLAIMS (.4); PHONE CALL WITH J. LONGMIRE OF WILKIE FARR REGARDING SAME (.4); FOLLOW-UP WITH A. KASHLINSKAYA REGARDING SAME (.6); FOLLOW-UP WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.6); EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH S. COHEN AND OTHER WGM TEAM MEMBERS REGARDING INTERCOMPANY DEBT TREATMENT (.4)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/02/04	Dixon, Catherine REVIEW AND COMMENT ON TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT, RESEARCH, ETC.	2.50	1,887.50	W280	11369173
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH J. MCGARRY REGARDING IP	0.20	99.00	W280	11367246
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW	0.20	99.00	W280	11367247
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM ASSEMBLY PROJECT	1.00	495.00	W280	11367233
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. DELUCA, C. PETREN REGARDING ELECTION ISSUES	1.00	495.00	W280	11367244
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH R. PETERSEN REGARDING IP	1.20	594.00	W280	11367245
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH D. FLINN, S. KYNE REGARDING NOTE ISSUES	1.90	940.50	W280	11366933
02/02/04	Youdelman, Sharon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE B. BENJET REGARDING TREATMENT ELECTIONS	0.10	49.50	W280	11391923
02/02/04	Strochak, Adam MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW (0.7); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM D. WHITTAKER REGARDING SAME (0.5)	1.20	660.00	W280	11396935
02/02/04	Skarda, Michael CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI AND F. GREEN REGARDING LEGAL ISSUES IN MCI TRANSACTIONS (1.2); RESEARCH AND REVIEW RELEVANT SEC FILINGS (2.8); REVIEW APPLICABLE PRECEDENT AND RELATED SEC RULES FOR SUCH TRANSACTIONS (3.5).	8.00	3,680.00	W280	11337912
02/02/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED T-3/A.	0.50	222.50	W280	11316125
02/02/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT.	0.80	356.00	W280	11317247
02/02/04	Holzman, Daniel TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING AND J. LONGMIRE OF WILKIE FARR TO DISCUSS ELECTIONS (.8) AND EXCHANGE OF EMAILS REGARDING THE SAME (.5)	1.30	578.50	W280	11317205
02/02/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED OPINION AND BACK-UP OPINION.	2.00	890.00	W280	11317206
02/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit REVIEW LETTER RECEIVED FROM ATTORNEY FOR ENTITY WISHING TO CONVERT PREFERRED STOCK	0.20	74.00	W280	11328920
02/03/04	Gold, Simeon	0.80	588.00	W280	11305291

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARATION AND CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND F. GREEN REGARDING 2/4 DUE DILIGENCE MEETING REGARDING POTENTIAL MCI TRANSACTION (.4); REVIEWED BIDDER'S SEC FILINGS (.4)				
02/03/04	Green, Frederick	1.90	1,472.50	W280	11395866
	REVIEW PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES (0.5); MEET WITH D. WHITTAKER AND M. SKARDA REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEW PROCEDURES LETTER (.4)				
02/03/04	Fife, Lori	4.10	2,931.50	W280	11384040
	CONFS WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND R. BERKOVICH REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE MATERIALS (1.0); REVIEW SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND F. GREEN REGARDING MEETING (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING MEETING (.3); REVIEW DOCS IN PREPARATION FOR DUE DILIGENCE MEETING (2.0).				
02/03/04	Dixon, Catherine	3.00	2,265.00	W280	11369177
	REGARDING DCP'S, REVIEW OF MATERIALS REGARDING RB INQUIRY, ETC.				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11366951
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11366940
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS WITH C. POOLE, M. DELUZA, A. STERN, C. WATKINS, A. STROOCK				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.00	495.00	W280	11366950
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN, M. SKARDA REGARDING DOCUMENT ROOM PROCEDURES				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.50	742.50	W280	11366952
	REVIEW HR DOCUMENTS AND INDEXING				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.60	792.00	W280	11366938
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.80	891.00	W280	11366939
	REVIEW AND REVISE LITIGATION SUMMARY				
02/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	9.00	4,455.00	W280	11366944
	SET UP DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/03/04	Strochak, Adam	3.20	1,760.00	W280	11396933
	MEETING WITH M. DELDUCA, D. SMORODIN, H. RUMELD, WITH SINGLE (ALL MCI), C. WATKINS, A. STERN REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT (1.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. WHITTAKER, C. PETREN (MCI), M. DELDUCA (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.8); E-MAILS TO/FROM M. DELDUCA REGARDING SAME (0.3); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM D. WHITTAKER REGARDING STAFFING FOR DOCUMENT REVIEW (0.4)				
02/03/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11317010
	REVIEWED TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT.				
02/03/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.30	133.50	W280	11317021
	DISCUSSED STATUS OF CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE WITH S. GOLD				
02/03/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W280	11317013

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSED T-1 WITH J. HARDY AND J. INGRAM OF THE SEC AND SENT RELATED EMAIL TO IRV APAR (CITIBANK'S COUNSEL).				
02/03/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W280	11317022
	DISCUSSED RESTRUCTURING WITH FABIO DIMINICH.				
02/03/04	Stern, Andrew	1.00	290.00	W280	11388338
	CONFER WITH A.STROCHAK (WGM), D. WHITTAKER (WGM), M. DEL DUCA (MCI), B. SINGLE (MCI), D. SMORODIN (MCI), H. RUMELD (MCI), AND C. WATKINS (WGM) REGARDING ANALYSIS OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS.				
02/03/04	Stern, Andrew	10.80	3,132.00	W280	11388339
	ALONG WITH C. WATKINS, REVIEW AND ANALYZE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS/CONSENT DECREES AND ATTACHED CORRESPONDENCE FOR A. STROCHAK (WGM) AND D. WHITTAKER (WGM).				
02/03/04	Watkins, Claire	12.30	4,059.00	W280	11374802
	ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW REGARDING MCI				
02/03/04	Welty, William	3.80	1,045.00	W280	11386008
	EDGARIZED AND REVISED INDENTURES FOR T-3 FILING				
02/04/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.50	1,102.50	W280	11324439
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. DIXON REGARDING INQUIRY (.6); REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING INQUIRY (.9)				
02/04/04	Green, Frederick	8.90	6,897.50	W280	11395416
	MCI: SEC ALL DAY MEETINGS IN DC WITH TRANSACTION REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/04/04	Fife, Lori	7.10	5,076.50	W280	11384059
	DUE DILIGENCE MEETING (6.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING WHITE PAPER (.3).				
02/04/04	Dixon, Catherine	3.00	2,265.00	W280	11369186
	DISCUSSIONS WITH BONY REGARDING DRS (1.0) DRAFTING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (.7); DISCUSSIONS WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INQUIRY (.6) REVIEW OF RELATED MATERIALS (.7)				
02/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11366963
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN, M. SKARDA REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11366964
	MEETING WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES				
02/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.70	841.50	W280	11366961
	REVISE INDEX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.40	1,188.00	W280	11366960
	INDEXING DOCUMENTS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	10.50	5,197.50	W280	11366958
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS AND PERSONNEL				
02/04/04	Buksbaum, Gregg	1.20	534.00	W280	11394058

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH WGM MIS PERSONNEL REGARDING MCI LAPTOP ISSUES (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. REIFMAN, H. RIGGS AND D. WHITTAKER OF WEIL, GOTSHAL REGARDING STAFFING NEEDS FOR PRODUCTION (0.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING STATUS AND COORDINATION EFFORTS (0.3).				
02/04/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.30	133.50	W280	11315993
	REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON CUSTODY AGREEMENT.				
02/04/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.50	667.50	W280	11316092
	REVIEWED AND ANALYZED PROVISIONS RELATED TO EFFECTIVENESS OF THE PLAN.				
02/04/04	Holzman, Daniel	2.20	979.00	W280	11316091
	REVIEWED MATERIALS REGARDING RESTRUCTURING TRANSACTION (1.7) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH P. LIBRETTA (.5)				
02/04/04	Berkovich, Ronit	2.30	851.00	W280	11328628
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE AND V. HARKER REGARDING WHITE PAPER ON BANKRUPTCY (.3); DRAFT SAME (2.0)				
02/04/04	Stern, Andrew	0.80	232.00	W280	11388340
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER (WGM), M. DEL DUCA (MCI), B. SINGLE (MCI), D. SMORODIN (MCI), AND H. RUMELD (MCI) REGARDING ANALYSIS OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS AND PLEADINGS.				
02/04/04	Stern, Andrew	4.00	1,160.00	W280	11388377
	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLEADINGS FOR A. STROCHAK (WGM) AND D. WHITTAKER (WGM).				
02/04/04	Stern, Andrew	9.30	2,697.00	W280	11388341
	REVIEW AND ANALYZE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS/CONSENT DECREES				
02/04/04	Watkins, Claire	16.20	5,346.00	W280	11374803
	ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW AT MCI.				
02/05/04	Green, Frederick	3.60	2,790.00	W280	11395366
	MCI: SEC: JDA FOR TRANSACTION (1.0); REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING DILIGENCE (1.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM (1.0)				
02/05/04	Dixon, Catherine	2.50	1,887.50	W280	11369188
	REVIEW LISTING MEMO (1.5); REVIEW DRS (1.0)				
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11366970
	CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN, C. PETREN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, LITIGATION				
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11366526
	PHONE CALL WITH R. PETERSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND EHS DOCUMENTS				
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11366827
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GOLDING REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11366971
	CONFERENCE WITH M. VONHOF REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESSES, OPERATION AND PROCEDURES				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM, HR DOCUMENTS	0.60	297.00	W280	11366525
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA, P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS AND UPDATING	0.70	346.50	W280	11366977
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX	0.80	396.00	W280	11366978
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS REGARDING EHS, CONTRACTS, TAX, LITIGATION	2.90	1,435.50	W280	11366979
02/05/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM AND PERSONNEL (6.5) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM (1.0)	7.50	3,712.50	W280	11366807
02/05/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM M. REIFMAN, D. WHITTAKER, F. GREEN REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION	0.50	275.00	W280	11395170
02/05/04	Fine, Lisa COORDINATE ACCESS AND USE OF PRODUCTION ROOM.	0.50	205.00	W280	11388969
02/05/04	Holzman, Daniel EXCHANGE OF EMAILS WITH COUNSEL TO ELECTING HOLDERS AND THE BANK OF NEW YORK REGARDING THE ELECTIONS.	0.30	133.50	W280	11316085
02/05/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, M. MEROLA, B. COOPER, S. COHEN, N. JONES AND M. CHASTKA REGARDING CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS.	0.70	311.50	W280	11316088
02/05/04	Hyatte, Theresa REVIEW ISSUES AND QUESTIONS REGARDING FORM 8-A.	0.70	304.50	W280	11382774
02/05/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. BERKOVICH REGARDING THE DECEMBER 2 SEC HEARING TRANSCRIPT AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MITCHEL REGARDING LOCATING SAME.	0.10	44.50	W280	11310593
02/05/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAILS TO COMPANY AND D. EISEN REGARDING CONVERSION OF PREFERRED STOCK.	0.50	185.00	W280	11328095
02/05/04	Stern, Andrew REVIEW AND ANALYZE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS/CONSENT DECREES AND ATTACHED CORRESPONDENCE FOR A. STROCHAK AND D. WHITTAKER	9.10	2,639.00	W280	11388376
02/05/04	Watkins, Claire ATTENTION TO MCI DOCUMENT REVIEW.	10.20	3,366.00	W280	11374805
02/05/04	Libretta, Paul	1.00	275.00	W280	11311602

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	SPOKE WITH D. HOLZMAN ABOUT THE MERGERS WORLDCOM WILL BE DOING IN THE NEAR FUTURE AS PART OF CLEC CONSOLIDATION (.5) BEGAN RESEARCHING THE CERTIFICATES OF MERGER/DISSOLUTION FOR THE VARIOUS JURISDICTIONS (.5)				
02/05/04	Druker, Kara-Lee	7.50	1,200.00	W280	11389920
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND INDEX DOCUMENTS				
02/06/04	Green, Frederick	2.90	2,247.50	W280	11395888
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH CLIENT REGARDING TRANSACTION (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT, D. WHITTAKER AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. EPSTEIN OF STEPTOE REGARDING SAME (.7)				
02/06/04	Dixon, Catherine	3.00	2,265.00	W280	11369195
	ATTENTION TO BOARD BOOK REVIEW (1.5), REVIEW NASDAQ LISTING (1.5)				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11366855
	PHONE CALL WITH H. RIENELD REGARDING HR LITIGATION				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11366856
	PHONE CALL WITH J. LEWIS REGARDING MUNICIPAL TARIFFS				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11366862
	PHONE CALL WITH G. BUKSBAUM REGARDING PROCESS				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11366519
	PHONE CALL WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING STAFFING				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11366520
	PHONE CALL WITH M. SCARDA REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11366848
	MEETINGS WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, COPYING, ETC.				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.40	1,188.00	W280	11366863
	REVIEWING AND INDEXING DOCUMENTS				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	5.70	2,821.50	W280	11366849
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
02/06/04	Strochak, Adam	1.00	550.00	W280	11397038
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM M. REIFMAN, D. WHITTAKER REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW PROJECT				
02/06/04	Buksbaum, Gregg	0.20	89.00	W280	11393597
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING STATUS OF PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/06/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.80	356.00	W280	11317819
	REVIEWED MERGER MATERIALS (.5) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH P. LIBRETTA (.3)				
02/06/04	Hyatte, Theresa	4.30	1,870.50	W280	11382785
	REVISE MEMORANDUM REGARDING NASDAQ LISTING PER C. DIXON'S COMMENTS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/06/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. MITCHEL TO R. BERKOVICH REGARDING DISTRICT COURT TRANSCRIPT FROM SEC PROCEEDINGS.	0.10	44.50	W280	11312384
02/06/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL TO COMPANY REGARDING CONVERSION OF PREFERRED STOCK.	0.10	37.00	W280	11328116
02/06/04	Stern, Andrew ALONG WITH C. WATKINS, REVIEW AND ANALYZE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS/CONSENT DECREES AND PLEADINGS FOR A. STROCHAK (WGM) AND D. WHITTAKER (WGM).	8.00	2,320.00	W280	11405694
02/06/04	Watkins, Claire ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW FOR MCI	5.50	1,815.00	W280	11373828
02/06/04	Libretta, Paul SPOKE WITH D. HOLZMAN ABOUT MERGER CHARTS THAT WERE SENT TO US (.3) STARTED CREATING A CHART IN ORDER TO DETERMINE WHICH MERGER CERTIFICATES/LAWS WE NEED TO PULL (2.2)	2.50	687.50	W280	11312345
02/06/04	Druker, Kara-Lee ORGANIZE COMPUTER, INDEX DOCUMENTS	5.00	800.00	W280	11389993
02/07/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW DILIGENCE INDEX	3.50	1,732.50	W280	11385419
02/07/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL COMMUNICATION WITH WORLDCOM AND D. EISEN REGARDING JMG'S DESIRE TO CONVERT PREFERRED SHARES TO COMMON SHARES.	0.20	74.00	W280	11328698
02/07/04	Taylor, David CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW	1.00	290.00	W280	11443407
02/08/04	Whittaker, Donald REVISIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE INDEX	0.70	346.50	W280	11385451
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING REPORTING, MORS, ETC.	0.30	232.50	W280	11342044
02/09/04	Dixon, Catherine ATTENTION TO CORPORATE INQUIRY	2.00	1,510.00	W280	11389800
02/09/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH P. EKSKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.20	99.00	W280	11384997
02/09/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME	0.20	99.00	W280	11388932
02/09/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH M. VON HOF REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.30	148.50	W280	11388931
02/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11388919

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.80	891.00	W280	11386354
	REVISE INDEX				
02/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	7.50	3,712.50	W280	11385472
	INDEXING AND MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS WITH PARALEGALS				
02/09/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11331486
	REVISED BACK-UP OPINION.				
02/09/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.60	267.00	W280	11331208
	CALL WITH F. DIMINICH REGARDING BY-LAWS OF SUBSIDIARIES AND T-3 (.4) AND FOLLOW-UP (.2)				
02/09/04	Holzman, Daniel	2.60	1,157.00	W280	11331320
	RESEARCHED STATUTORY UNDERWRITERS IN CONNECTION WITH SECTION 1145 OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE (2.4) AND SENT EMAIL TO BRETT GOLDBLATT OF MILBANK REGARDING THE SAME (.2)				
02/09/04	Berkovich, Ronit	1.40	518.00	W280	11328712
	REVIEW DRAFT PLEADINGS SENT BY J. GOLDFARB (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK AND MCI REGARDING SAME (.5); PREPARE FOR STATUS CONFERENCE REGARDING J. GOLDFARB EMERGENCY MOTION (.5)				
02/09/04	Libretta, Paul	4.00	1,100.00	W280	11331318
	COMPLETED AND REVIEWED CHART OF CONTEMPLATED MERGERS				
02/09/04	Powell, Kristin	10.50	1,365.00	W280	11368457
	COORDINATE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION				
02/09/04	Sazlaykova, Guergana	3.00	435.00	W280	11387271
	COMPARE BOXES OF DOCUMENTS WITH A CD ROM				
02/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11384873
	PHONE CALL WITH G. ROBERTS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11386985
	PHONE CALL WITH A. YOON AND DOCUMENTS REGARDING EMERGENCE AND PLAN				
02/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11384880
	PHONE CALL, CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING INDENTURES WITH S. COHEN				
02/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11387004
	CORRESPONDENCE AND PHONE CALL WITH J. LEWIS REGARDING FOREIGN CHANGE OF CONTROL REQUIREMENTS				
02/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.90	1,435.50	W280	11384847
	INDEX REVISIONS TO HR SECTION AND REVIEW				
02/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	6.40	3,168.00	W280	11384834
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS AND INDEXING				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/10/04	Buksbaum, Gregg CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER OF WGM REGARDING STATUS OF PRODUCTION ROOM AND STAFFING ISSUES	0.30	133.50	W280	11390347
02/10/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT.	0.20	89.00	W280	11331914
02/10/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED STATUS OF INDENTURE ACT FILINGS AND MISCELLANEOUS WITH S. GOLD	0.80	356.00	W280	11331118
02/10/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED T-3.	0.80	356.00	W280	11331234
02/10/04	Holzman, Daniel CALLS WITH GEORGIA COUNSEL AND R. BERKOVICH REGARDING CONVERSION OF PREFERRED STOCK.	1.30	578.50	W280	11331111
02/10/04	Berkovich, Ronit PREPARE FOR TELEPHONIC STATUS CONFERENCE ON EXPEDITED MOTION TO CONVERT PREFERRED SHARES (2.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.7); E-MAIL TO WORLDCOM REGARDING SAME (.2)	3.70	1,369.00	W280	11328714
02/10/04	Libretta, Paul ATTENTION TO INDEX ISSUES	1.60	440.00	W280	11331739
02/11/04	Dixon, Catherine DISCUSSION WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING POTENTIAL INQUIRY (.5), ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW (.5)	1.00	755.00	W280	11389825
02/11/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.20	99.00	W280	11386530
02/11/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH M. VOH HOF REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.40	198.00	W280	11387757
02/11/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH M. REIFMAN (.2), H. RIGGS (.2) REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.40	198.00	W280	11387798
02/11/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEXING PROCESS	5.90	2,920.50	W280	11386528
02/11/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED STOCK DISTRIBUTIONS WITH I. FROM.	0.10	44.50	W280	11332364
02/11/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT WITH F. DIMINCH.	0.20	89.00	W280	11332879
02/11/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED MERGERS OF SUBSIDIARIES WITH P. LIBRETТА.	0.30	133.50	W280	11332880
02/11/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.30	133.50	W280	11332931

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEWED TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT.				
02/11/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.20	534.00	W280	11332353
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, J. MCGAREY, M. SILVERO, K. HENNESSY, J. THOREN, F. DIMINICH, C. WELTY AND P. LIBRETTA REGARDING MERGERS OF SUBSIDIARIES AND FILING OF T-3/A.				
02/11/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W280	11394627
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL OF T. TWEED AND H. RUMELD REGARDING REJECTION OF STOCK OPTION PLANS.				
02/11/04	Stern, Andrew	0.20	58.00	W280	11388397
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANALYSIS OF CONFIDENTIAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
02/11/04	Stern, Andrew	0.40	116.00	W280	11388398
	REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CONFIDENTIAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR D. WHITTAKER.				
02/11/04	Libretta, Paul	8.10	2,227.50	W280	11331911
	RESEARCHING CODES AND CONSOLIDATING FORM MERGER AGREEMENTS FOR THE MERGER OF WORLDCOM SUBSIDIARIES.				
02/11/04	Reifman, Marli	4.00	520.00	W280	11383699
	COORDINATE AND INDEX DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION				
02/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11386851
	PHONE CALLS WITH H. RIGGS, O. VASSIENATA REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
02/12/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11331960
	DISCUSSED REGULATION FD ISSUE WITH S. GOLD AND F. GREEN.				
02/12/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.60	267.00	W280	11331915
	RESEARCHED DISTRIBUTION TO BANK CLAIM HOLDERS.				
02/12/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.10	489.50	W280	11331978
	REVISED OPINION.				
02/12/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.80	296.00	W280	11328732
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FILED BY JMG (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. METH REGARDING SAME (.2); DRAFT LETTER TO CHAMBERS REGARDING ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/12/04	Libretta, Paul	6.50	1,787.50	W280	11331194
	RESEARCHED DELEWARE LAW ON MERGE AGREEMENTS AND CERTIFICATES OF MERGER (3.5) DRAFTED FORMS FOR EACH VARIATION OF MERGER IN ACCORDANCE WITH PLAN (I.E., DOMESTIC CORP INTO FOREIGN CORP, SUB INTO PARENT, ETC) (3.0)				
02/12/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	7.00	910.00	W280	11384603
	ASSIST AND ORGANIZE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS FOR A. STROCHAK				
02/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11366878
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. REIFMAN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/13/04	Whittaker, Donald READ DOCUMENTS FROM A. YOON REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.10	49.50	W280	11366880
02/13/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. LEWIS AND DOCUMENT REVIEW	0.30	148.50	W280	11366879
02/13/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE INDEX	0.40	198.00	W280	11366876
02/13/04	Libretta, Paul RESEARCHED CALIFORNIA LAW REGARDING MERGER AGREEMENTS AND CERTIFICATES OF MERGER AND FOUND FORM DOCUMENTS FOR EACH.	5.50	1,512.50	W280	11331195
02/13/04	Philpott, Elizabeth ASSIST AND ORGANIZE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS FOR A. STROCHAK	7.00	910.00	W280	11384082
02/13/04	Powell, Kristin COORDINATE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION	5.50	715.00	W280	11368471
02/14/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDED INDEX (.1); CORRESPONDENCE TO P. ESKILDSEN RE: SAME (.1).	0.20	99.00	W280	11366881
02/14/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED AND DISTRIBUTED EMERGENCE CHECKLIST.	0.40	178.00	W280	11340904
02/14/04	Berkovich, Ronit DRAFT OBJECTION TO EMERGENCY MOTION TO COMPEL CONVERSION.	2.00	740.00	W280	11328126
02/15/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED MATERIALS RELATED TO STOCK ISSUANCE UNDER SECTION 1145 (.3); LEFT S. GOLD A VOICE MAIL REGARDING THE SAME (.1).	0.40	178.00	W280	11341246
02/17/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AUDIT DOCUMENTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11367108
02/17/04	Whittaker, Donald EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH CLIENT RE: PRODUCTION ROOM.	0.20	99.00	W280	11366882
02/17/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE INDEX	0.40	198.00	W280	11366883
02/17/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW NEW PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.50	247.50	W280	11367107
02/17/04	Fine, Lisa REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY S. MAYER OF WORLD COM FOR PRIVILEGED AND RESPONSIVENESS IN WELLS FARGO LITIGATION CONCERNING \$2.65 BILLION DRAW DOWN.	2.80	1,148.00	W280	11389219
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11341104

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSED ELECTION WITH BANK AND SENT RELATED EMAIL TO LUCA PICONE.				
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11340830
	REVISED CLOSING CHECKLIST.				
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W280	11341109
	RESEARCHED 1145 IN CONNECTION WITH RESTRICTED SECURITIES (.1); DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH S. GOLD (.1); AND CALL WITH N. JONES AND S. GOLD TO DISCUSS THE SAME (.2).				
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.50	222.50	W280	11340856
	REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON RESOLUTIONS OF SUBSIDIARIES.				
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.60	267.00	W280	11341240
	REVIEWED THE T-3				
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W280	11341108
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, M. MEROLA, S. COHEN, M. SILVERO AND J. MCGAREY TO DISCUSS CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE ITEMS.				
02/17/04	Watkins, Claire	6.00	1,980.00	W280	11375561
	[WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW.				
02/17/04	Libretta, Paul	3.50	962.50	W280	11348813
	CONSOLIDATED THE COLORADO LAWS ON PLANS OF MERGER AND STATEMENTS OF MERGER AS WELL AS COLLECTED AND REVISED FORM DOCUMENTS FOR MERGER FOR THE MERGERS TO TAKE PLACE UNDER THE PLAN UNDER THE COLORADO CORPORATIONS ACT (2.0) BEGAN RESEARCHING FOR MERGERS TO BE CONDUCTED IN GEORGIA (1.5).				
02/17/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	8.00	1,040.00	W280	11384083
	ASSIST AND ORGANIZE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS FOR A. STROCHAK				
02/17/04	Reifman, Marli	2.50	325.00	W280	11384506
	COORDINATE AND INDEX DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION				
02/17/04	Powell, Kristin	7.00	910.00	W280	11368473
	COORDINATE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION				
02/18/04	Dixon, Catherine	0.20	151.00	W280	11392411
	RESPONSE TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING ISSUES RELATED TO CORPORATE MATTER				
02/18/04	Fine, Lisa	5.10	2,091.00	W280	11389264
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED FROM S. MAYER AND M. SALISBURY FILES FOR PRIVILEGE AND RESPONSIVENESS IN WELLS FARGO LITIGATION CONCERNING \$2.65 BILLION DRAW DOWN.				
02/18/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.30	133.50	W280	11340866
	CALL WITH F. DIMINCH TO DISCUSS AMENDMENTS TO CHARTERS.				
02/18/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W280	11341095
	REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON STOCK CERTIFICATE LEGEND.				
02/18/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W280	11341098

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEWED DOCUMENTS SENT BY CONSOB.				
02/18/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.80	356.00	W280	11340865
	REVISED CERTIFICATES OF MERGER.				
02/18/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.90	400.50	W280	11340867
	REVISED RESPONSE LETTER TO SEC.				
02/18/04	Libretta, Paul	6.00	1,650.00	W280	11348830
	CONSOLIDATED THE GEORGIA LAWS ON PLANS OF MERGER AND STATEMENTS OF MERGER AS WELL AS COLLECTED AND REVISED FORM DOCUMENTS FOR THE MERGERS TO TAKE PLACE UNDER THE PLAN UNDER THE GEORGIA BUSINESS CORPORATION CODE (4.0); WENT BACK TO DEL, CAL, COL MERGER DOCUMENTS TO MAKE REVISIONS (2.0).				
02/18/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	3.80	494.00	W280	11384189
	ASSIST AND PRODUCE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR P. FRIEDMAN				
02/18/04	Powell, Kristin	3.00	390.00	W280	11367763
	CREATE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR E. LYTTLE				
02/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11367122
	ATTENTION TO DOCUMENTS				
02/19/04	Fine, Lisa	0.40	164.00	W280	11389228
	CONFER WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING DOCUMENTS REVIEWED FOR RESPONSIVENESS AND PRIVILEGE FOR PRODUCTION IN WELLS FARGO LITIGATION.				
02/19/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11345223
	REVIEWED TRANSLATION OF CONSOB DOCUMENT (.1) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH ITALIAN COUNSEL (.1).				
02/19/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.00	445.00	W280	11345227
	REVISED CERTIFICATES OF MERGER.				
02/19/04	Libretta, Paul	5.00	1,375.00	W280	11349083
	CONSOLIDATED CODES AND FORMS FOR THE JURISDICTIONS I HAVE RESEARCHED THUS FAR (DE, CA, CO, GA) FOR THE PURPOSE OF DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGER AND AGREEMENTS OF MERGER FOR THE SUBSIDIARIES OF WORLDCOM (3.5) BROUGHT CODES AND FORMS AND SAMPLE DOCUMENTS TO D. HOLZMAN TO GAIN FEEDBACK (.5) CONTINUE RESEARCH FOR OTHER JURISDICTIONS (1.0)				
02/20/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11345575
	DISCUSSED MERGER DOCUMENTS WITH P. LIBRETTA.				
02/20/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11345583
	REVIEWED CERTIFICATE OF MERGER (.1) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH H. DICKER (.1)				
02/20/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	5.50	715.00	W280	11383247
	CREATE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR P. FRIEDMAN				
02/20/04	Powell, Kristin	4.00	520.00	W280	11367768
	CREATE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR E. LYTTLE				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/23/04	Berkovich, Ronit DRAFT AND FILE OBJECTION TO JMG MOTION TO CONVERT PREFERRED SHARES (2.9); COORDINATE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.5)	3.40	1,258.00	W280	11410326
02/23/04	Libretta, Paul BEGAN RESEARCHING CODES FOR MERGERS TO TAKE PLACE IN LOUISIANA AND ILLINOIS (2.5) DRAFTED DOCUMENTS FOR EACH (3.0)	5.50	1,512.50	W280	11369854
02/24/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH M. HOENIG REGARDING EUROPEON INTERCOMPANY AGREEMENT (.3); CONFER WITH ROB KOST REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.1)	0.40	286.00	W280	11361750
02/24/04	Libretta, Paul CONSOLIDATED THE MICHIGAN, LOUISIANA AND NEW HAMPSHIRE LAWS ON PLANS OF MERGER AND STATEMENTS OF MERGER AS WELL AS COLLECTED AND REVISED FORM DOCUMENTS FOR THE MERGERS TO TAKE PLACE UNDER THE PLAN UNDER THE MICHIGAN, LOUISIANA AND NEW HAMPSHIRE CODES.	6.00	1,650.00	W280	11369734
02/25/04	Berkovich, Ronit DRAFT STIPULATION REGARDING ELECTION	0.80	296.00	W280	11410728
02/25/04	Libretta, Paul CONSOLIDATED THE MISSOURI AND NEW HAMPSHIRE LAWS ON PLANS OF MERGER AND STATEMENTS OF MERGER AS WELL AS COLLECTED AND REVISED FORM DOCUMENTS FOR THE MERGERS TO TAKE PLACE UNDER THE PLAN UNDER THE MISSOURI AND NEW HAMPSHIRE CODES.	7.20	1,980.00	W280	11369863
02/25/04	Philpott, Elizabeth ASSIST AND CORRECT PRIVILEGE LOG FOR E. LYTTLE	4.50	585.00	W280	11384468
02/26/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH P. ESKILSEN, M. REIFMAN, F. GREEN REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW	0.40	198.00	W280	11386757
02/26/04	Berkovich, Ronit COORDINATE WITH WORLDCOM AND A. STROCHAK ON JMG STIPULATION.	0.20	74.00	W280	11411039
02/26/04	Libretta, Paul RESEARCHED CORPORATE CODES AND CONSOLIDATED MERGER FORMS FOR NEW JERSEY AND NEVADA.	6.60	1,815.00	W280	11369817
02/27/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. REIFMAN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.10	49.50	W280	11388365
02/27/04	Whittaker, Donald INDEX OF FOREIGN DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11388367
02/27/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED T-3 WITH C. WELTY (.2) AND REVIEWED RELATED EMAILS (.2)	0.40	178.00	W280	11397146
02/27/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAILS WITH D. EISEN AND MCI REGARDING JMG STIPULATION.	0.20	74.00	W280	11410710
02/27/04	Libretta, Paul	6.50	1,787.50	W280	11369801

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
RESEARCHED CORPORATE CODES AND CONSOLIDATED MERGER FORMS FOR NEVADA AND NEW YORK.					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W280 - CORPORATE/SECURITIES:		493.20	\$ 187,213.00		
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	0.20	155.00	W300	11341659
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. GRAFSTEIN REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	0.20	155.00	W300	11341787
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia FOLLOW-UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	0.20	155.00	W300	11342598
02/02/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH MCI, LAZARD REGARDING LETTER TO ANATEL (1.2); REVISED DRAFTS OF SAME (2.5); WORK ON REVISIONS TO SPA (1.3); REVIEWED STRUCTURE CHART, EQUITY INTERESTS TO BE SOLD AND COMMENTS FROM R. BARRETTO TO SPA (2.1)	7.10	3,266.00	W300	11353059
02/02/04	Wright, Stefan WRITE AND SEND EMAIL REGARDING DALLAS REJECTED TOWER LEASE FOR MMDS	0.20	92.00	W300	11319970
02/02/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD, R. BARRETO REGARDING ASSET ISSUES (.6); REVISIONS TO REPLY TO PURIFICACION (1.0); RESEARCH ON JURISDICTION (1.5)	3.10	1,023.00	W300	11335681
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. ESKILDSEN, S. KELLY REGARDING D.C. MEETING.	0.40	310.00	W300	11342153
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN REGARDING DC MEETING (.3) AND REVIEW OUTLINE/AGENDA FOR D.C. MEETING (.3)	0.60	465.00	W300	11341617
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, S. COHEN, R. BERKOVICH REGARDING PREPARATION OF MEMO.	0.60	465.00	W300	11341661
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH R. BERKOVICH, S. COHEN REGARDING MEMORANDUM (.5); REVIEW SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.40	1,085.00	W300	11341881
02/03/04	Goldring, Stuart PHONE CALL WITH D. BOWER AND J. THOREN REGARDING STRUCTURE OF EMBRATEL SALE	0.30	214.50	W300	11312060
02/03/04	Skarda, Michael CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN (0.2); REVIEW MATERIAL AND PREPARE FOR MEETINGS IN WASHINGTON D.C. (2.5); CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN AND D. WHITAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND WEDNESDAY MEETING (.5).	3.20	1,472.00	W300	11337914
02/03/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.40	2,944.00	W300	11353060

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MEETING WITH C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING CREATING CHART OF SELLERS AND MCI SUBS AS ANNEX TO SPA (.7); REVIEWED SAME AND REVISED (2.4); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, E-MAILS WITH C. SANTOS REGARDING TELMEX NDA AND VARIOUS ISSUES REGARDING SAME AND PRODUCTION ROOM PREP (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. BOSTON (TELMEX COUNSEL) REGARDING NDA COMMENTS AND STRUCTURE OF BIDDING ENTITY (1.0); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. WIDMER REGARDING LATEST PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.8)				
02/03/04	Buksbaum, Gregg	7.90	3,515.50	W300	11393397
	CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK, D. WHITTAKER AND H. RIGGS REGARDING COORDINATING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS (0.6); COORDINATE AND ASSEMBLE PRODUCTION ROOM OF DILIGENCE DOCUMENTS (7.3).				
02/03/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	4.60	1,518.00	W300	11336585
	MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SPA (.8); DRAFTING OF ANNEX A TO SPA--STRUCTURE CHART PROJECT (1.5); REVIEW REVISED SPA (1.5); REVIEW PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.8)				
02/04/04	Skarda, Michael	11.30	5,198.00	W300	11337915
	ATTEND MEETING IN WASHINGTON D.C. TO DISCUSS MCI ISSUES (9.0); SUBSEQUENT MEETING WITH F. GREEN AND D. WHITAKER (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITAKER TO DISCUSS PRODUCTION ROOM (1.8).				
02/04/04	Hirsch, Stuart	8.20	3,772.00	W300	11353128
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. BOSTON (TELMEX COUNSEL), C. SANTOS REGARDING COMMENTS FROM TELMEX TO NDA (1.0); REVISED SAME AS PER CALL AND CIRCULATED FOR REVIEW (2.8); FURTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. BOSTON, C. SANTOS (SEPARATELY) TO RESOLVE OPEN ISSUES (.5); REVIEWED PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX SENT BY EMBRATEL TO ANATEL AGAINST MARK-UP DELIVERED TO C. SANTOS (1.8); E-MAILS, TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, G. WIDMER REGARDING SAME (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. WEBSTER, N. MELTON REGARDING STATUS OF ANATEL DISCUSSIONS (1.6)				
02/04/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	6.00	1,980.00	W300	11336857
	NEGOTIATION OF NDA WITH EMBRATEL AND WILKIE FARR (4.0); INSERTION OF WILKIE'S COMMENTS TO OUR DRAFT (1.0) INSERTION OF NEWLY NEGOTIATED TERMS (1.0)				
02/05/04	Skarda, Michael	6.00	2,760.00	W300	11337916
	ATTEND MEETINGS IN WASHINGTON D.C. REGARDING MCI ISSUES				
02/05/04	Hirsch, Stuart	4.80	2,208.00	W300	11353133
	ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO SPA AND DISTRIBUTED TO GROUP (2.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. BRANCHER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MATERIALS (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING STATUS OF 2/9 MEETINGS (1.9)				
02/05/04	Buksbaum, Gregg	0.30	133.50	W300	11393592
	REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. MCGAREY OF MCI (0.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER OF WGM REGARDING STAFFING ISSUES AND OVERALL STATUS ASSOCIATED WITH PRODUCTION ROOM (0.2).				
02/05/04	Wright, Stefan	1.00	460.00	W300	11312472
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE J. COAKLEY, J. GROGAN REGARDING ASSUMED CONTRACTS AND CURE AMOUNTS (.3) ASSEMBLE CURE AMOUNT MATERIALS (.2) REVISE CLOSING CHECKLIST (.5)				
02/05/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	2.60	858.00	W300	11335902
	NEGOTIATION OF NDA WITH TELMEX AND C. SANTOS FROM EMBRATEL (.7); REDRAFTING OF NDA WITH RESPECT TO NEWLY NEGOTIATED TERMS (1.0); REVIEW BLACKLINE (.3); REVIEW OF PRODUCTION ROOM LIST (.3); REVIEW OF TELES NDA IN PREPARATION FOR NEGOTIATION (.3)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/06/04	Gold, Simeon CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN (.4), CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND F. GREEN (.7) AND CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, F. GREEN, D. WHITTAKER AND M. SKARDA (.5) REGARDING TRANSACTION.	1.60	1,176.00	W300	11316918
02/06/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALL WITH WILLKIE FARR, C. SANTOS REGARDING TELMEX NDA (.6); REVISED SAME AND DISTRIBUTED FOR EXECUTION (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BEHM REGARDING MCI SUBSIDIARY DILIGENCE (.4); REVIEWED TELOS BID MATERIALS (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. WIDMER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROGRESS AND STATUS OF RIO MEETINGS (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TELMEX COUNSEL REGARDING NDA AND MEETINGS DURING WEEK OF 2/9 (1.0); VARIOUS OTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, E-MAILS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROGRESS, ANATEL DISCUSSIONS AND BIDDER NDA'S (1.5)	5.80	2,668.00	W300	11353254
02/08/04	Hirsch, Stuart REVIEWED NDA FROM TELOS AND BID PACKAGES FROM TELMEX, TELOS AND TELES (4.0); REVIEWED LATEST MEMORANDA FROM R. BARRETTO ON REVIEW PROCESS OF CADE, TELOS INVESTMENT RESTRICTIONS AND OTHERS (2.7)	6.70	3,082.00	W300	11353279
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ASSET AGREEMENT	0.30	232.50	W300	11341373
02/09/04	Hirsch, Stuart MEETINGS IN RIO WITH D. WEBSTER, G. WIDMER, R. BARRETTO REGARDING PREP. FOR MEETINGS WITH REGULATORS, ASSESSMENT OF SALE PROCESS AND ANALYSIS OF BIDDERS (5.3); REVIEWED BID PACKAGES AND BACKGROUND INFO ON BIDDERS (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. SANTOS REGARDING NDA NEGOTIATIONS AND OPENING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (.5)	6.80	3,128.00	W300	11353282
02/09/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. COAKLEY AND S. WRIGHT REGARDING NEXTEL CLOSING	0.70	255.50	W300	11334032
02/10/04	Gold, Simeon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER (.2) AND V-MAIL TO A. YOON (.1) REGARDING LEGAL DUE DILIGENCE FOR TRANSACTION.	0.30	220.50	W300	11323687
02/10/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY AND J. CRANE REGARDING ASSET SALES.	0.30	214.50	W300	11383631
02/10/04	Skarda, Michael REVIEW EXECUTED JOINT DEFENSE AGREEMENT	0.30	138.00	W300	11337923
02/10/04	Hirsch, Stuart MEETINGS IN RIO WITH D. WEBSTER, R. BARRETTO, F. GREEN, R. BEHM REGARDING GOVERNANCE ISSUES AND REPLACEMENT OF EMBRAPAR/EMBRATEL BOARDS AND MANAGEMENT (6.0); ANALYSIS OF TELOS BID MATERIALS AND POSSIBLE CONFLICTS (3.0); MEETINGS AT EMBRATEL WITH C. SANTOS, N. GLATT, G. WIDMER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM CHEKLIST, TELOS NDA AND OTHER ISSUES (2.5); MEETING WITH MCI, LAZARD AND CONSULTANT (2.0)	13.50	6,210.00	W300	11353283
02/10/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET AND NEXTEL TRANSACTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. KOPPEL REGARDING CURE AMOUNTS FOR ASSUMED CONTRACTS (.5); CORRESPOND WITH R. KOPPEL REGARDING NEXTEL CLOSING (.1); CORRESPOND WITH R. KOPPEL REGARDING HAMPTON ROADS LEASE (.1).	1.00	365.00	W300	11334036
02/11/04	Gold, Simeon	0.20	147.00	W300	11324494

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	E-MAILS WITH F. GREEN AND M. SKARDA REGARDING TRANSACTION.				
02/11/04	Hirsch, Stuart	7.20	3,312.00	W300	11353002
	MEETINGS AT EMBRATEL WITH C. SANTOS, N. GLATT, G. WIDMER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX, TELOS NDA, PRODUCTION ROOM PROCEDURES AND OTHER ISSUES (6.0); MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX AND PROCEDURES AND MEETINGS REGARDING SAME (1.2)				
02/12/04	Gold, Simeon	0.30	220.50	W300	11333809
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH F. GREEN AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL FD ISSUES.				
02/12/04	Hirsch, Stuart	11.40	5,244.00	W300	11353008
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TELOS, C. SANTOS REGARDING NEGOTIATION OF NDA (1.0); REVISED SAME AND DISTRIBUTED (4.0); FURTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, TELOS AND C. SANTOS REGARDING FINALIZING TELOS NDA (1.9); MEETINGS AT EMBRATEL TO FINALIZE NDA'S, PRODUCTION ROOM CHECKLIST AND PROCEDURES (3.0); MULTIPLE MEETINGS WITH C. SANTOS, G. WIDMER REGARDING SAME (1.5)				
02/13/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.50	2,990.00	W300	11353088
	MEETING WITH MCI, LAZARD AND CVM IN BRAZIL (4.0); MEETINGS WITH TELOS AND CALAIS REGARDING OVERVIEW OF BIDS (1.2); MULTIPLE OTHER MEETINGS WITH D. WEBSTER, R. BEHM, R. BARRETTO, G. WIDMER REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES AND STRATEGY (1.3)				
02/13/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W300	11336789
	MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING TOWER & REAL ESTATE SALES				
02/13/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	1.30	429.00	W300	11336023
	REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS/ARTICLES PERTAINING TO CALAIS SA (.4); REVIEW OF EXECUTED NDA AGREEMENTS FOR TELOS (.5); REVIEW OF MEMORANDA PREPARED BY RICARDO BARRETA'S FIRM REGARDING ANATEL AND CADE MEMBERS (.4)				
02/13/04	Grogan, James	2.00	730.00	W300	11334048
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. WRIGHT REGARDING HAMPTON ROADS CURE AMOUNT (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. GAMBINO REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. WAFFORD REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. ROSEMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING CLAIM TRANSFERS AND PLAN PROVISIONS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BURNS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR NEXTEL SALE (.7); CORRESPOND WITH R. KOPPEL REGARDING SAME (.2).				
02/16/04	Hirsch, Stuart	4.10	1,886.00	W300	11353023
	REVIEWED VARIOUS MEMORANDA FROM R. BARRETTO REGARDING TELOS GOVERNANCE, EMBRATEL DIRECTORS/OFFICERS AND DILIGENCE REVIEW; REVIEWED NOTES FROM MEETINGS IN RIO IN PREPARATION FOR TUESDAY MORNING CALL.				
02/17/04	Hirsch, Stuart	3.80	1,748.00	W300	11353037
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD REGARDING FOLLOW-UP ON MEETINGS IN BRAZIL (1.2); REVIEWED DILIGENCE MEMO FROM R. BARRETTO AND ANATEL CORRESPONDENCE (2.6).				
02/17/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	0.90	297.00	W300	11335581
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING ANATEL (.4); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH TO CATCH UP ON LAST WEEK'S EVENTS IN BRAZIL (.5).				
02/18/04	Hirsch, Stuart	2.10	966.00	W300	11353252

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEWED DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. BARRETTO TO PURI AND TO BRAZILIAN AGENCIES (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. WIDMER REGARDING TAG ALONG PAYMENT (.4); AND FORWARDED MEMORANDA ON SAME (.2).				
02/19/04	Hirsch, Stuart	3.40	1,564.00	W300	11353257
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI LEGAL, D. WEBSTER, R. BEHM REGARDING UPDATE ON PROCESS AND SUMMARY OF ISSUES (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. GLATT (EMBRATEL CFO) REGARDING REFINANCING TRANSACTIONS AND PREPAYMENTS (.6); E-MAILS WITH F. GREEN REGARDING FOLLOW-UP (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. WIDMER REGARDING TAG ALONG PREMIUM, CALCULATION OF SAME AND REACH (1.0).				
02/19/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W300	11345225
	DISCUSSED CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT WITH FABIO DIMINICH.				
02/20/04	Hirsch, Stuart	2.40	1,104.00	W300	11353261
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH MCI, R. BARRETTO REGARDING GOVERNANCE ISSUES AND MANAGEMENT ISSUES AT EMBRATEL AND TIMING FOR DILIGENCE (2.0); E-MAILS TO F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.4)				
02/24/04	Hirsch, Stuart	1.70	782.00	W300	11377292
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH N. MELTON, G. WIDMER REGARDING DISCUSSION OF STATUTORY TAG-ALONG RIGHT (.9); REVIEWED COMMENTS TO SPA FROM R. BARRETTO IN PREPARATION FOR WEDNESDAY CALL WITH R. BEHM (.8)				
02/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W300	11543754
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN/GRAFSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
02/25/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.20	99.00	W300	11392117
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING POTENTIAL DISPOSITION OF CERTAIN ASSETS				
02/25/04	Hirsch, Stuart	2.30	1,058.00	W300	11377726
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BEHM REGARDING COMMENTS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.4); REVIEWED ORGANIZATIONAL CHART REGARDING NEW STARTEL OWNERSHIP OF SHARES AND MARK-UP OF SPA (1.9)				
02/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W300	11543275
	CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
02/26/04	Fife, Lori	0.50	357.50	W300	11382598
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE AND GRAFSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2).				
02/26/04	Hirsch, Stuart	5.80	2,668.00	W300	11378346
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD, CFF REGARDING STATUS, BIDDERS, GOVERNANCE AND OTHER MATTERS (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING BANKRUPTCY IMPLICATIONS (.7); WORK ON REVISIONS TO SPA (3.5); E-MAILS TO R. BARRETTO AND OTHERS REGARDING GOVERNANCE ISSUES (.3)				
02/27/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W300	11543293
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
02/27/04	Hirsch, Stuart	9.30	4,278.00	W300	11379176

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	WORK ON PURCHASE AGREEMENT AS PER COMMENTS FROM R. BEHM AND R. BARRETTO (2.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. BARRETTO REGARDING SAME (.7); DRAFTED MEMO REGARDING ALTERNATIVE STRUCTURES FOR SALE AND BENEFITS OF EACH (2.0); REVIEWED MEMORANDA FROM CFF REGARDING VOTING, REPATRIATION OF FUNDS AND OTHER ISSUES (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WEBSTER REGARDING GOVERNANCE ISSUES, BOARD REPLACEMENTS AND ISSUE OF U.S. CITIZENS ON BOARD (1.0); FURTHER E-MAILS, CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. BARRETTO REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TELOS COUNSEL REGARDING EXECUTION OF ADDITIONAL NDA'S WITH TELOS CO-BIDDERS (1.0)				
02/29/04	Hirsch, Stuart	2.90	1,334.00	W300	11379228
	REVIEWED EMBRAPAR BYLAWS REGARDING BOARD SIZE AND AMENDMENTS TO SAME (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. BARRETTO REGARDING REQUIREMENTS FOR AMENDING BYLAWS AND REGARDING QUESTIONS ON MCI-STARTEL LOAN REPAYMENT FROM SALE PROCEEDS (.7); REVIEWED ADDITIONAL MEMORANDA FROM R. BARRETTO (.8) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN REGARDING U.S. CITIZENSHIP ISSUE (.4)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W300 - ASSET DISPOSITIONS:		183.80	\$ 84,203.00		
02/02/04	Youngman, Stephen	0.50	275.00	W310	11326183
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MECHANICS' LIENS (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING RESPONSES TO LEASE ASSUMPTION INQUIRIES, REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.3).				
02/02/04	Cohen, Scott	1.20	480.00	W310	11314723
	CORRESPONDENCE E. PRELAZ REGARDING NEW WORLD TOWER LEASE (.2); CORRESPONDENCE D. OHLER REGARDING BROKER & OTHER REAL ESTATE ISSUES (.3) TELEPHONE CALL D. YOON REGARDING SAME (.4); DISCUSSION A. PEREZ REGARDING GITSA & RELATED MATTERS (.3)				
02/02/04	Larson, Michelle	1.30	578.50	W310	11301997
	CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING VANGUARD COMMISSION AGREEMENT (.4); DRAFT LETTER TO A. SAYER WITH RESPECT TO SHERMAN OAKS AMENDMENT (.5); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING MECHANICS' LIEN (.3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING RIGHT OF FIRST REFUSAL (.1).				
02/02/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.20	60.00	W310	11304614
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. GLUCK REGARDING COPIES OF ORDERS AND MOTIONS ON SALE OF TOWERS TO ATI (.1); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING PULPIT ROCK ROFR AND WHY PULPIT ROCK DIFFERS FROM KINGWOOD ROFR (.1).				
02/02/04	Bartram, Lyle	1.10	170.50	W310	11349407
	RESEARCH DOCKET REGARDING MOTIONS RELATING TO OMNIBUS AUTHORITY TO SATISFY MECHANICS' LIENS OR SATISFY OTHER 365(D)(3) PROVISIONS WITH RESPECT TO LIENS ON REAL PROPERTY LEASES FOR M. LARSON				
02/03/04	Larson, Michelle	1.30	578.50	W310	11303430
	CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING RIGHT OF FIRST REFUSAL (.2); REVISE LETTER TO A. SAYER AND CORRESPOND WITH CLIENTS AND COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.8); CORRESPOND TO CHASE REGARDING LANDLORD COMFORT LETTER (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING COMMISSION AGREEMENT (.2).				
02/03/04	Pullo, Christina	0.80	220.00	W310	11329098
	PREPARE QUARTERLY DE MINIMIS SALE REPORT FOR FILING				
02/03/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.40	120.00	W310	11304621

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW 79 TOWERS PURCHASE CONTRACT TO DETERMINE IF THE LETTER TO METROPOLITAN EDISON IS A BREACH OF THE AGREEMENT (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON AND M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING WHETHER ANY OTHER OUTSTANDING ROFRS EXIST (.2).				
02/04/04	Larson, Michelle	0.90	400.50	W310	11311061
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON AND E. LEVIN REGARDING PULPIT ROCK RIGHT OF FIRST REFUSAL (.5); FOLLOW UP CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND ANALYZE CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. COX REGARDING COMMISSION ISSUES (.2).				
02/04/04	Pullo, Christina	0.60	165.00	W310	11328525
	PREPARE QUARTERLY DE MINIMIS SALE REPORT FOR FILING				
02/04/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.80	240.00	W310	11310304
	REVIEW DOCKET TO VERIFY THAT NO OBJECTIONS HAVE BEEN FILED TO THE 63 TOWERS MOTION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. LEVIN AND M. LARSON REGARDING PULPIT ROCK ROFR (.5); DRAFT REPLY EMAIL TO E. LEVIN'S EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE PULPIT ROCK ROFR (.2).				
02/05/04	Larson, Michelle	2.20	979.00	W310	11311088
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FRIES REGARDING OPEN ISSUES (.3); FINALIZE LETTER TO A. SAYER REGARDING AMENDMENT (.1); FINALIZE S. BROADWAY TERMINATION MOTION FOR FILING (.7); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING COMMISSION ISSUE (.3); RESEARCH REGARDING AND REVISE DEFAULT LETTER (.8).				
02/05/04	Pullo, Christina	0.80	220.00	W310	11327701
	DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR ML OFFICE (.1) AND PREPARE EXHIBITS THERETO (.7).				
02/05/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.60	180.00	W310	11328886
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING THE 25 TOWERS SALE TO MIDAMERICAN (.1); REVIEW AND ANALYZE THE 25 TOWERS PURCHASE CONTRACT (.2); REVISE THE 25 TOWERS MOTION TO PARALLEL THE EXECUTED 25 TOWERS PURCHASE CONTRACT (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL, R. GARCES, M. SCHNEIDER AND P. MCMURRAY REGARDING NOTICE LIST FOR 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1).				
02/06/04	Larson, Michelle	0.60	267.00	W310	11314744
	CORRESPOND WITH K. CORDRY REGARDING 63 TOWERS ORDER (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENTS AND COUNSEL REGARDING S. BROADWAY TERMINATION MOTION (.2); REVISE 63 TOWERS SUMMARY (.2).				
02/06/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.70	210.00	W310	11328891
	REVISE 63 TOWERS ORDER TO EXCLUDE REFERENCE TO TRANSFER TAXES PURSUANT TO AGREEMENT REACHED WITH STATES ATTORNEY GENERAL (.1); REVISE 25 TOWERS ORDER TO EXCLUDE REFERENCE TO TRANSFER TAXES PURSUANT TO AGREEMENT REACHED WITH STATES ATTORNEY GENERAL (.1); DRAFT EMAIL SUMMARY TO A. PEREZ REGARDING 63 TOWERS MOTION WHICH IS SET FOR HEARING ON 2.10.04 (.5).				
02/09/04	Pullo, Christina	2.00	550.00	W310	11337808
	PREPARE QUARTERLY DE MINIMIS REPORT				
02/09/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.30	90.00	W310	11328906
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS SENT BY M. SCHNEIDER EVIDENCING LEASEHOLD AND FEE INTERESTS TO BE SOLD PURSUANT TO 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. GLUCK REGARDING ISSUES ON THE TITLE INSURANCE POLICIES FOR THE 79 TOWERS (.2).				
02/10/04	Youngman, Stephen	0.30	165.00	W310	11336386
	REVIEW PENDING TOWER SALES				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/10/04	Larson, Michelle	0.50	222.50	W310	11334452
	REVISE MEMORANDUM TO E. LEVIN REGARDING PULPIT ROCK (.1) CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING AMENDED 63 TOWERS ORDER (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. CORDRY REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 79 TOWER TRANSACTION (.1) AND CONFERENCES WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING SAME (.1)				
02/10/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.80	240.00	W310	11328911
	DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSE TO M. GLUCK REGARDING HIS VARIOUS QUESTIONS ON THE 79 TOWER TRANSACTION (.3); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING AMERICAN TOWER'S LETTER AS OF 1.30.04 (.1); CORRECT ORDER ON 63 TOWERS MOTION TO REFLECT AGREED UPON LANGUAGE WITH THE STATES ATTORNEY GENERAL AND SUBMIT TO THE COURT FOR ENTRY (.4).				
02/11/04	Youngman, Stephen	1.00	550.00	W310	11336398
	REVIEW AND REVISE PLEADINGS REGARDING BELTSVILLE TERMINATION (.4); REVIEW PENDING TRANSACTION (.3); REVIEW EFFECTIVE DATE TIMING AND IMPACT ON TRANSACTIONS (.3).				
02/11/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.20	85.00	W310	11351296
	TELEPHONE CALL TO L. COOK REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT				
02/11/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W310	11326951
	REVISE EDS LETTER & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
02/11/04	Larson, Michelle	0.30	133.50	W310	11334456
	CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING VANGUARD ISSUES (.2); CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING VARIOUS TOWER ISSUES (.1).				
02/11/04	Pullo, Christina	0.70	192.50	W310	11337353
	PREPARE QUARTERLY DE MINIMIS REPORT (.3); DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR SKYTEL (.4)				
02/11/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.70	210.00	W310	11327778
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. CORDRY AND M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING 63 TOWERS ORDERS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND P. JONES REGARDING SITES INCLUDED IN 25 TOWERS MOTION (.2); REVIEW NEW 25 TOWERS AGREEMENT AND DETERMINE WHICH SITES HAVE BEEN ADDED AND DELETED (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING NEEDED DOCUMENTS FOR CREATING EXHIBIT OF PHYSICAL TOWER LOCATIONS (.1); REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION TO CHANGE PURCHASE PRICE REVISION IN 25 TOWERS PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.1).				
02/12/04	Youngman, Stephen	0.40	220.00	W310	11336400
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. PORTMAN, LANDLORD ATTORNEY, REGARDING CURES AND EFFECTIVE DATE TIMING (.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING TERMINATION MOTION (.2).				
02/12/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.50	212.50	W310	11351300
	FINALIZE MOTION REGARDING SUBLEASE TERMINATION				
02/12/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W310	11396323
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MCGEE REGARDING STATUS OF LEASES.				
02/12/04	Larson, Michelle	0.20	89.00	W310	11334267
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE				
02/12/04	Pullo, Christina	0.90	247.50	W310	11337511

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARE QUARTERLY DE MINIMIS REPORT (.2); DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR SKYTEL (.4); CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.1); DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR FOXBORO, MA TOWER SITE (.2)				
02/12/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.20	360.00	W310	11335739
	REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION AND GIVE TO S. YOUNGMAN FOR REVIEW (.3); REVIEW SCHEDULE OF LOCATIONS OF 25 TOWERS AND REVISE TO REFLECT FOR CHANGES MADE TO 25 TOWERS CONTRACT (.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER, P. MCMURRAY, AND G. MITCHELL REGARDING NEEDED DOCUMENTS FOR COMPLETION OF THE 25 TOWERS EXHIBIT (.2); REVISE EXHIBIT TO 25 TOWERS MOTION TO INCLUDE CENTERVILLE, TENNESSEE LEASE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. GLUCK REGARDING CERTIFIED COPIES OF ORDER APPROVING 79 TOWERS MOTION (.2).				
02/13/04	Youngman, Stephen	0.70	385.00	W310	11336415
	REVIEW AND REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.4); REVIEW PENDING TRANSACTION (.3).				
02/13/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.40	120.00	W310	11350906
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND G. MITCHELL REGARDING CURE COSTS REGARDING THE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN, L. CARSON AND E. LEVIN REGARDING INQUIRY ON TEXAS TOWERS (.1); REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.2).				
02/17/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.30	127.50	W310	11350835
	REVIEW STIPULATION.				
02/17/04	Grogan, James	1.10	401.50	W310	11353318
	CORRESPOND WITH B. KOPPEL REGARDING NEXTEL UNDERTAKING FOR HAMPTON ROADS LEASE (.2); REVIEW NEXTEL ACQUISITION FILE REGARDING STIPULATED CURE AMOUNTS (.4); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH B. KOPPEL REGARDING STIPULATED CURE AMOUNTS FOR MMDS AND ITFS LEASES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/17/04	Larson, Michelle	0.40	178.00	W310	11350265
	CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING CHICAGO TITLE REQUEST (.1); REVIEW MOTION TO MODIFY PLAN AND CORRESPOND WITH CLIENTS AND COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/17/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.30	90.00	W310	11350911
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING REPLY TO M. GLUCK (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ANDRULIS REGARDING LIENS ON 25 TOWERS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. GLUCK REGARDING QUESTION REGARDING 79 TOWERS TRANSACTION (.1).				
02/18/04	Youngman, Stephen	0.60	330.00	W310	11356216
	REVIEW LEASING AGENT AGREEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. LARSON REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/18/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W310	11373130
	TELEPHONE CALL S. GASSER REGARDING MARKET POST LEASE & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
02/18/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.30	111.00	W310	11349243
	TULSA LEASE INQUIRY BY R. CHOSICK (.2) AND CALL TO A. YOON REGARDING SAME (.1).				
02/18/04	Larson, Michelle	1.20	534.00	W310	11350267
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON BRANDT BROKER AGREEMENT (.5); CONFERENCES WITH S. YOUNGMAN AND K. COX REGARDING SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING AMENDMENTS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH I. RIAHI REGARDING AMENDMENTS (.1).				
02/19/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.40	170.00	W310	11351116

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. CHONG REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2); REVIEW THE SAME (.2).				
02/19/04	Larson, Michelle	0.30	133.50	W310	11352175
	RESEARCH BROKERAGE AGREEMENT.				
02/19/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.50	150.00	W310	11350929
	REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING STATUS OF 25 TOWERS MOTION (.2).				
02/20/04	Larson, Michelle	0.80	356.00	W310	11351385
	REVIEW BROKERAGE PRECEDENT AND CORRESPOND WITH K. COX, B. FRIES AND S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING AMENDMENTS (.3).				
02/20/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.10	30.00	W310	11368498
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHELL AND P. MCMURRAY REGARDING 25 TOWERS LEASES				
02/23/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.20	85.00	W310	11388799
	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LEASE TRANSACTION				
02/23/04	Larson, Michelle	2.20	979.00	W310	11355698
	REVIEW VARIOUS LEASE AMENDMENTS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.6); CORRESPOND WITH R. DOUGHERTY AND K. COX REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING VANGUARD (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. COX, R. DOUGHERTY AND B. FRIES REGARDING AMENDMENTS (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. APTER AND B. FRIES REGARDING SAME (.4); DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO G. APTER REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING 79 TOWERS AMENDMENT (.1).				
02/24/04	Simpson, Stefanie	1.10	467.50	W310	11388578
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CARSON, S. SNARR AND P. MURPHY REGARDING SIGNING AND STATUS (.5); REVISE MOTION REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. BIRKELBACK REGARDING LICENSES (.2); REVIEW LICENSE APPLICATION EXHIBIT (.2).				
02/24/04	Larson, Michelle	0.20	89.00	W310	11356489
	CORRESPOND WITH G. APTER AND R. DOUGHERTY REGARDING LEASE AMENDMENT (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING 79 TOWERS AMENDMENT (.1).				
02/24/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.70	510.00	W310	11369135
	ANALYZE FIRST AMENDMENT TO 79 TOWERS CONTRACT (.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING FIRST AMENDMENT TO 79 TOWERS CONTRACT (.4); ADD ADDITIONAL LEASE INFORMATION TO EXHIBIT C TO 25 TOWERS MOTION (.7).				
02/24/04	Jones, Peggy	0.80	132.00	W310	11354326
	REVIEW OF ADDITIONAL LEASES FURNISHED BY WORLDCOM (0.4); REVISE SCHEDULE OF SAME FOR MOTION (0.3) AND EMAIL SAME TO K. SIMPSON (0.1).				
02/25/04	Youngman, Stephen	0.40	220.00	W310	11385997
	CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON (.2) REGARDING AND REVIEW (.2) LEASE CURE ISSUES AND TIMING				
02/25/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.30	127.50	W310	11388609
	CIRCULATE FINAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
02/25/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W310	11403423

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. JONES REGARDING REAL ESTATE CURE					
02/25/04	Larson, Michelle	0.90	400.50	W310	11365463
CORRESPOND WITH J. WILSON REGARDING NEW LEASE AND REVIEW AND COMMENT ON SAME (.3); CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING PENDING REAL ESTATE MATTERS (.2); REVIEW ORDER MODIFYING PLAN AND CORRESPOND WITH J. WILSON REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM G. APTER REGARDING 450 MISSION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN AND B. JONES REGARDING CURE PROCESS (.1).					
02/25/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.10	330.00	W310	11367552
ADD LEASE SITES TO EXHIBIT TO 25 TOWERS MOTION (.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. MCMURRAY AND G. MITCHELL REGARDING NOTICE LIST AND CURE COSTS ON 25 TOWERS (.2); REVISE EXHIBIT TO 25 TOWERS MOTION (.3).					
02/26/04	Larson, Michelle	0.50	222.50	W310	11365629
CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING TAX LIENS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND K. SIMPSON REGARDING SAME (.1).					
02/26/04	Pullo, Christina	1.50	412.50	W310	11400152
DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR FCC LICENSES					
02/26/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.80	240.00	W310	11386225
VERIFY THAT NO OBJECTIONS FILED TO TEXAS LEASES MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN AND M. LARSON REGARDING TEXAS LEASES MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL AND M. LARSON REGARDING ORDERS FOR HEARING ON 3.2.04 (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING TAX LIENS (.1) CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING PALM BEACH TAX LIENS (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON AND M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING TAX LIENS (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. GARCES REGARDING TAX LIENS (.1).					
02/27/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W310	11405559
MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REAL ESTATE					
02/27/04	Larson, Michelle	0.30	133.50	W310	11377429
REVIEW SUMMARY OF TOWER MOTION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX AND B. FRIES REGARDING 55 SOUTH MARKET (.1); PREPARE S. BROADWAY TERMINATION ORDER (.1).					
02/27/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.40	120.00	W310	11388696
REVISE ORDER APPROVING TEXAS LEASES MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. GARCES REGARDING TAX LIENS (.1); DRAFT EMAIL TO A. PEREZ REGARDING TEXAS LEASES MOTION TO BE HEARD ON 3.2.04 (.2).					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W310 - REAL PROPERTY LEASES:		44.90	\$ 16,734.00		
02/02/04	Wells, Renee	0.70	210.00	W320	11309456
REVIEW AGREEMENT WITH INTELSAT TO TRANSFER SERVICES AND AMEND, TERMINATE AND ASSUME CERTAIN AGREEMENTS (.4); REVIEW FILE REGARDING SAME (.3).					
02/03/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W320	11306476
CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING RESOLUTION OF PREPETITION CLAIMS HELD BY DTE ARISING UNDER TARIFFS AND WHETHER THE TERMS OF THE RELEVANT RELEASE WOULD RESULT IN A RELEASE OF CURE CLAIMS.					
02/03/04	Wells, Renee	0.50	150.00	W320	11303642

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW NOTICE OF SETOFF WITH FLORIDA DIGITAL NETWORKS (.1) AND CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT REGARDING EXECUTORY CONTRACTS AND REVIEW SERVICE TRANSFER, AMENDMENT AND TERMINATION AGREEMENT WITH INTELSAT (.3).				
02/04/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W320	11304120
	REVISE THE RELEASE LANGUAGE INCLUDED IN THE DTE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.1) AND CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.1)				
02/04/04	Graham, Richard	0.40	148.00	W320	11395279
	DRAFT EMAIL TO A. PEREZ REGARDING WHITTAKER CLAIM.				
02/04/04	Lederman, Elana	0.20	66.00	W320	11326223
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING SHEKM E/BAY HEARING				
02/04/04	Costa, Andrew	0.30	117.00	W320	11312087
	CONFER WITH CSX COUNSEL REGARDING STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING CSX AND NCR STIPULATIONS (.1).				
02/05/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.20	1,474.00	W320	11317546
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET, M. GOLDSTEIN, S. YOUDELMAN AND J. FINK REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT (.70), REVIEW TERM SHEET, PRESENTATION AND DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND COMMENTS TO SAME (1.5)				
02/05/04	Lederman, Elana	0.30	99.00	W320	11326238
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. RICHARDS & L. MCCOY REGARDING MAIL MACHINE (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. KNIGHT & B. BENJET REGARDING J. SPICER LETTER (.1).				
02/05/04	Wells, Renee	1.60	480.00	W320	11322449
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EXECUTED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH NTS (.1); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2); UPDATE CHART OF PENDING SETTLEMENTS (.3); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN AND J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW LIST OF FILED SETTLEMENTS FROM HURON AND CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM C. FLEMING REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAILS REGARDING TIMING OF DISTRIBUTING NOTICE REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING SAME (.1).				
02/05/04	Grogan, James	1.70	620.50	W320	11315197
	CORRESPOND WITH M. PEIPER AND B. FEIGENBAUM REGARDING LEASE PAYMENTS ON RATTLESNAKE MOUNTAIN LEASE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. WRIGHT AND J. COAKLEY REGARDING CURE OF LEASES TO ASSIGN TO NEXTEL ACQUISITION CORP AND CLAIMS RELATED TO REJECTION DAMAGES (.7); CORRESPOND WITH J. MONROE REGARDING NTS SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SETTLEMENT COMMITTEE CONFERENCE (.1).				
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W320	11366861
	PHONE CALL WITH S. COHEN REGARDING REJECTED CONTRACTS				
02/06/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.90	1,273.00	W320	11316927
	REVIEW AND FURTHER REVISE AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND PROPOSED FORM OF MOTION (.50), COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET REGARDING STATUS (.30), PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN UPDATE CONFERENCE CALL WITH HOULIHAN, COMMITTEE COUNSEL, S. MOONEY, B. BENJET AND M. BEACH (.80), COMMUNICATIONS WITH T. VOGEL AND M. SCHEINDER REGARDING ADDITIONLA CIRCUIT REJECTIONS (.30)				
02/06/04	Wells, Renee	0.10	30.00	W320	11322877

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO					
02/08/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.70	1,139.00	W320	11317543
CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET REGARDING COMMENTS TO AT&T 9019 MOTION AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.30), REVIEW AND REVISE 9019 MOTION AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.80), REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO TERM SHEET PROPOSED BY AT&T (.20), COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET REGARDING STATUS OF NEGOTIATIONS (.40)					
02/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.80	536.00	W320	11319134
COMMUNICATION WITH B. BENJET REGARDING AT&T MOTION AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.20), REVIEW CHANGES MADE BY J. GROGAN (.30), COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. SILVERIA AND R. GRAHAM REGARDING REJECTION OF VARIOUS EMPLOYEE BENEFIT PROGRAMS (.30)					
02/09/04	Graham, Richard	0.90	333.00	W320	11395948
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM M. SIVERIA (MCI CORP. AND SECURITIES ATTORNEY) REGARDING REJECTION OF EMPLOYEE CONTRACTS.					
02/09/04	Graham, Richard	1.70	629.00	W320	11395352
REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING CIRCUIT REJECTION STATUS (.1); COMPILE REPORT (1.4); RESPOND TO EMAIL WITH ATTACHMENT (.2).					
02/09/04	Grogan, James	3.40	1,241.00	W320	11334031
DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION SEEKING APPROVALS OF AT&T SETTLEMENT (2.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. FEIGENBAUM REGARDING RATTLESNAKE MOUNTAIN LEASE PAYMENTS (.2).					
02/10/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W320	11319779
REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM M. SILVIERA AND R. GRAHAM REGARDING REJECTED BENEFIT PLANS (.30), COMMUNICATIONS TO/FROM S. BAKER REGARDING REVISIONS TO BP CONTRACT (.20)					
02/10/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.20	804.00	W320	11320153
REVIEW REVISIONS TO AT&T 9019 MOTION AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.80), COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET REGARDING STATUS AND PENDING ISSUES (.40)					
02/10/04	Graham, Richard	0.30	111.00	W320	11397484
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SIVERIA (MCI CORP. AND SECURITIES ATTORNEY) REGARDING REJECTION OF EMPLOYEE CONTRACTS.					
02/10/04	Graham, Richard	2.40	888.00	W320	11398174
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL OF T. TWEED REGARDING REJECTION OF STOCK OPTION PLANS.					
02/10/04	Costa, Andrew	0.40	156.00	W320	11332691
CONFER WITH M. PARIS REGARDING NCR RECONCILIATION (.1); REVISE NCR STIPULATION (.3).					
02/10/04	Wells, Renee	0.20	60.00	W320	11341554
REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM K. HACKNEY REGARDING NOTICE OF SETOFF WITH TXU					
02/11/04	Graham, Richard	0.90	333.00	W320	11394862
EMAILS TO M. SIVERIA (MCI CORP. AND SECURITIES ATTORNEY) REGARDING REJECTION OF EMPLOYEE CONTRACTS AND 10K.					
02/11/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W320	11334040

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.1); CORRESPOND WITH L. CARLSON REGARDING MPOWER SETTLEMENT (.2).				
02/12/04	Grogan, James	2.40	876.00	W320	11334044
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING AMENDMENTS TO BP AGREEMENT (1.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.2); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. PEIPER REGARDING RATTLESNAKE MOUNTAIN LEASE PAYMENTS (.2).				
02/13/04	Graham, Richard	0.30	111.00	W320	11397165
	EMAIL TO A. PEREZ REGARDING WHITTAKER DISCOVERY.				
02/13/04	Graham, Richard	0.40	148.00	W320	11396448
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL OF C. SMITH OF DELOITTE REGARDING GLOBAL CROSSING CIRCUIT REJECTIONS.				
02/13/04	Graham, Richard	1.30	481.00	W320	11397150
	REVIEW WHITTAKER DISCOVERY REQUESTS (.8); SEND VOICEMAIL TO R. HELMS AND EMAIL TO A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME. (.5).				
02/13/04	Grogan, James	1.40	511.00	W320	11334047
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.6); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF BP CONTRACT (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING CURE STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW FILE REGARDING CURE AMOUNT STIPULATIONS (.6).				
02/17/04	Strochak, Adam	0.90	495.00	W320	11394223
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF MESSAGEPHONE SETTLEMENT OF CURE DISPUTE REGARDING TECHNOLOGY LICENSE (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING SAME (0.2); PHONE CALL FROM N. BYNUM (MCI) REGARDING AUDIOFAX CLAIM AND POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF SAME (0.2)				
02/17/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.80	412.00	W320	11337717
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. SILBER, C. CHAMBERS, P. ABOOD AND J. GROGAN REGARDING BP CONTRACT MODIFICATIONS.				
02/17/04	Grogan, James	2.90	1,058.50	W320	11353319
	CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BAKER, P. ABOOD, C. CHAMBERS AND J. SILBER REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.8); REVIEW CURRENT PROVISIONS OF BP CONTRACT (1.6); REVIEW FILE REGARDING NUVOX SETTLEMENT AND NOTICE OF SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SAME (.2).				
02/18/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.30	154.50	W320	11339949
	REVIEW P. ABOOD OUTLINE OF POINTS REGARDING BP CONTRACT.				
02/18/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W320	11353220
	CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING NUVOX SETTLEMENT.				
02/19/04	Costa, Andrew	0.60	234.00	W320	11342021
	CONFER WITH CSX COUNSEL REGARDING PROPOSED STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH NCR COUNSEL REGARDING PROPOSED STIPULATION (.1); CONFER WITH M. PARIS REVISED DEBT TO NCR (.1); FINALIZE NCR STIPULATION (.2).				
02/20/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.80	412.00	W320	11350848

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING BP CONTRACT WITH P. ABOOD, C. CHAMBERS, T. TAYLOR AND J. GROGAN (.5); PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF REVISED BP CONTRACT (.3).				
02/20/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.50	335.00	W320	11388473
	FINALIZE AT&T DOCUMENTATION				
02/20/04	Wells, Renee	0.20	60.00	W320	11353588
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAILS FROM C. FLEMING AND N. HIRSCH REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO.				
02/20/04	Grogan, James	3.60	1,314.00	W320	11353747
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD AND C. CHAMBERS REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.6); REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDMENT TO SAME (1.1); REVIEW BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (1.6); CORRESPOND WITH P. LANGILLE AND P. ABOOD REGARDING AMENDMENTS TO BP CONTRACT (.3).				
02/22/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.40	268.00	W320	11380592
	REVIEW FINAL AT&T 9019 MOTION AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT				
02/23/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.50	1,005.00	W320	11380546
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET, G. MITCHEL AND J. FINK REGARDING FINALIZING AND FILING AT&T 9019 MOTION (.80), COMMUNICATIONS WITH CHAMBERS, M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. WOLF REGARDING HEARING ON AT&T 9019 MOTION (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. ANKER REGARDING VERIZON SETTLEMENT (.30)				
02/23/04	Grogan, James	0.70	255.50	W320	11392163
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING ASPECT COMMUNICATIONS SETTLEMENT (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT WITH BP (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING STATUS OF BP CONTRACT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING STATUS OF PT-1 SETTLEMENT (.1).				
02/23/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.30	90.00	W320	11369130
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. MCMURRAY REGARDING 25 TOWER SITES (.1); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING MODIFICATION OF THE 79 TOWERS CONTRACT (.1); CONFERENCE WITH E. LEVIN REGARDING MODIFICATION OF 79 TOWERS CONTRACT (.1).				
02/24/04	Costa, Andrew	0.30	117.00	W320	11372929
	CONFER WITH CSX COUNSEL REGARDING STIPULATION (.1); REVISE NCR STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING NCR STIPULATION (.1).				
02/24/04	Wells, Renee	0.50	150.00	W320	11361296
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM M. COVEY REGARDING NOTICE OF SETOFF WITH TXU (.2); REVIEW EMAIL FROM P. REYNOLDS REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT, MECHANISM FOR OBTAINING COURT APPROVAL OF SAME AND SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES (.2).				
02/24/04	Grogan, James	1.00	365.00	W320	11393223
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING TD WATERHOUSE PROPOSAL (.4); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW TD WATERHOUSE BILLING PROPOSAL (.4).				
02/25/04	Wells, Renee	0.20	60.00	W320	11390430
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM C. FLEMING REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO				
02/25/04	Grogan, James	0.40	146.00	W320	11392354

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING STATUS OF BP CONTRACT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.1).				
02/26/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W320	11379623
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. MOONEY, B. BENJET, M BEACH AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING 2002 SETTLEMENTS AND SET-OFFS				
02/26/04	Graham, Richard	0.20	74.00	W320	11394872
	REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO EMAIL OF T. PRIDAY REGARDING DATES OF CIRCUIT REJECTIONS OF RBOCS.				
02/26/04	Wells, Renee	1.90	570.00	W320	11390587
	REVIEW WELLS FARGO FILE AND DRAFT NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (1.5); DRAFT EMAIL TO C. FLEMING REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ AND DRAFT EMAIL TO A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/26/04	Grogan, James	0.60	219.00	W320	11390680
	CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING STATUS OF BP CONTRACT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/27/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.20	103.00	W320	11403559
	DISCUSSION WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING BP CONTRACT.				
02/27/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.50	335.00	W320	11379589
	REVIEW WELLS FARGO SETTLEMENT (.20), COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND S. MOONEY REGARDING WELLS FARGO SETTLEMENT (.30)				
02/27/04	Wells, Renee	0.10	30.00	W320	11390677
	CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH R. WELLS FARGO				
02/27/04	Grogan, James	5.50	2,007.50	W320	11392374
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT ISSUES (.5); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDMENT TO BP CONTRACT (1.4); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS SCHEDULES RELATED TO BP CONTRACT (.7); DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP CONTRACT (2.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING STATUS OF PT-1 SETTLEMENT (.1).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W320 - EXECUTORY CONTRACTS:		56.10	\$ 24,111.50		
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W330	11342247
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT ISSUES.				
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W330	11341645
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING AT&T (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. WOLF REGARDING AT&T DISCUSSIONS (.2)				
02/02/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.00	670.00	W330	11309940
	REVIEW RESPONSES AND STRATEGY FOR HEARING ON LIFT STAY (.8) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT ISSUES (.2)				
02/02/04	Billeck, Jason	4.00	1,660.00	W330	11318664

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH T. VOGEL AND P. REYNOLDS REGARDING THE SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH DETROIT EDISON (1.1) AND DRAFT STIPULATION ON DETROIT EDISON'S MOTION FOR SETOFF (2.9).				
02/02/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W330	11443394
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT ISSUES				
02/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.30	111.00	W330	11327590
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET REGARDING REQUEST BY CREDITOR TO LIFT THE STAY.				
02/03/04	Billeck, Jason	6.80	2,822.00	W330	11318663
	RESEARCH REGARDING CURE FOR ASSUMPTION IN CONNECTION WITH THE LANGUAGE OF THE DRAFT DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (2.2); WORK ON THE DETROIT EDISON DRAFT STIPULATION; COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS AND T. VOGEL REGARDING THE DETROIT EDISON DRAFT STIPULATION (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH DBRMS, M. LAWLESS, R. LOVE, AND D. BABIONE REGARDING STATUS OF DBRMS'S SETTLEMENT RESPONSE (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CDI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS OF CDI DRAFT STIPULATION (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING REFUNDS OWED TO THE DEBTORS (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH DUNN & BRADSTREET'S ATTORNEY REGARDING STATUS OF DRAFT STIPULATION (.1); AND REVIEW SPREADSHEET PROVIDED BY MISSOURI AND COMPARE IT TO MISSOURI'S PROOFS OF CLAIM (.4).				
02/03/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W330	11328970
	CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING REQUEST TO LIFT STAY.				
02/03/04	Thompson, John	0.20	66.00	W330	11395843
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR BAYLOR HEATING AND AIR REGARDING ASSUMPTION OF LEASES UNDER PLAN (.1); ATTENTION TO CORD MOVING & STORAGE ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE MOTION (.1)				
02/04/04	Billeck, Jason	8.30	3,444.50	W330	11318661
	RESEARCH REGARDING A CREDITORS' ABILITY TO ASSERT SETOFF AS AN AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSE WITHOUT FILING A PROOF OF CLAIM (5.9); COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING CREDITORS' ABILITY TO ASSERT SETOFF AS AN AFFIRMATIVE DEFENSE WITHOUT FILING A PROOF OF CLAIM (1.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE STATE OF CONNECTICUT'S ATTORNEY REGARDING COURT APPROVAL OF THE CONNECTICUT/WORLDCOM STIPULATION (.1); COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS, T. VOGEL, AND DETROIT EDISON'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE DRAFT DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.6).				
02/04/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.20	74.00	W330	11328601
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ATTORNEY WISHING TO LIFT STAY (.1); E-MAIL TO ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME (.1)				
02/04/04	Thompson, John	7.00	2,310.00	W330	11398959
	ATTENTION TO CORD MOVING & STORAGE ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE MOTION (3.5); ATTENTION TO SPECTRUM RESOURCES ADMINISTRATIVE RENT MOTION (1.5); ATTENTION TO RESPONSE TO MOTION BY DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS (.9); CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING AGENDA AND UPCOMING OMNIBUS HEARING (.5)				
02/04/04	Grogan, James	5.40	1,971.00	W330	11315193
	PREPARE FOR (1.5) AND ATTEND HEARING ON WORLDCOM'S MOTION TO LIFT STAY (3.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. HENDRICKSON AND C. CHEZEM REGARDING SAME (.6); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W330	11342270

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AT&T SETTLEMENT STATUS.				
02/05/04	Strochak, Adam	0.80	440.00	W330	11395188
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON OBJECTIONS TO CAMPBELL LIFT STAY MOTION (0.4) AND "DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS" APPLICATION (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
02/05/04	Billeck, Jason	1.70	705.50	W330	11318090
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING SETOFF ASSERTED BY BOISE CASCADE (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS AND DETROIT EDISON'S ATTORNEY REGARDING DRAFT STIPULATION BETWEEN DETROIT EDISON AND WORLDCOM (.9); AND REVISE DRAFT STIPULATION BETWEEN DETROIT EDISON AND WORLDCOM (.5)				
02/05/04	Thompson, John	9.80	3,234.00	W330	11397323
	DRAFT OBJECTION TO LAHTI-CAMPBELL LIFT STAY MOTION (4.3); DRAFT OBJECTION TO DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS MOTION (2.5); CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.5); ATTENTION TO CORD MOVING AND STORAGE MOTION FOR ADEQUATE PROTECTION AND CONFER WITH COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (2.5)				
02/06/04	Strochak, Adam	0.50	275.00	W330	11397039
	REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF OF MDIP ON MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY AND TO ALLOW LATE-FILED CLAIM (0.4); E-MAIL TO S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
02/06/04	Billeck, Jason	1.80	747.00	W330	11318086
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS, THE CREDITORS' COMMITTEE, AND DETROIT EDISON'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE DRAFT STIPULATION ON DETROIT EDISON'S MOTION (.8); REVISE THE DRAFT DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. SALTZBERG REGARDING THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S CLAIM FOR SETOFF/TAX REFUNDS (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CDI'S ATTORNEY AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE DRAFT CDI STIPULATION (.3); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH G. JACOB REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE DUNN AND BRADSTREET STIPULATION (.2).				
02/06/04	Thompson, John	1.60	528.00	W330	11399004
	RESEARCH REGARDING CORD MOVING & STORAGE				
02/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W330	11341543
	REVIEW TERM SHEETS AND DRAFTS REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
02/09/04	Strochak, Adam	0.50	275.00	W330	11397099
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING LEK SECURITIES LAWSUIT AND AUTOMATIC STAY ISSUES				
02/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W330	11319132
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM M. LAWLESS AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING LAWSUIT BROUGHT IN VIOLATION OF THE STAY IN NEW YORK				
02/09/04	Wells, Renee	0.10	30.00	W330	11319467
	CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING NOTICE OF SETOFF WITH FLORIDA DIGITAL NETWORK AND REVISE CHART OF PENDING SETTLEMENTS				
02/09/04	Thompson, John	6.50	2,145.00	W330	11394919
	DRAFT OBJECTION TO CORD MOVING & STORAGE MOTION (4.1); ATTENTION TO PREPARATION FOR TUESDAY OMNIBUS HEARING (2.4)				
02/10/04	Strochak, Adam	3.10	1,705.00	W330	11394234

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PARTICIPATE IN HEARING ON LIFT STAY MOTIONS OF PAUL BROWNING, DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS, AND CORD MOVING AND STORAGE (2.4); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING APPLICATION OF JMG FOR AN ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE TO EXPEDITE HEARING ON MOTION FOR STAY RELIEF (0.4); CONFERENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME (0.3)				
02/10/04	Billeck, Jason	0.90	373.50	W330	11333770
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S CLAIMS FOR SETOFF (.4) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE STATE OF MISSOURI, S. DIBINZKSI AND J. SALTZBERG REGARDING SAME (.5).				
02/11/04	Strochak, Adam	1.70	935.00	W330	11396822
	DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR LEK SECURITIES REGARDING COMMENCEMENT OF LAWSUIT IN VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.9); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM T. TSEKERIDES REGARDING FILING OF NOTICE OF AUTOMATIC STAY IN LEK SECURITIES CASE (0.2); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LETTER TO CITY OF NASHVILLE REGARDING STAY AND SECTION 525 DISCRIMINATION ISSUES (0.4); E-MAILS TO/FROM N. BYNUM REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
02/11/04	Billeck, Jason	1.00	415.00	W330	11333768
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW TXU ENERGY'S SUGGESTED REVISIONS TO THE DRAFT TXU ENERGY STIPULATION (.4) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S ATTORNEY, J. SALTBERG AND S. DZIBINKSI REGARDING MISSOURI'S PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR SETOFF (.6).				
02/11/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W330	11324689
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING PRIOR RESEARCH RELATING TO STAY VIOLATION WHERE A POSTPETITION COLLECTION ACTION WAS FILED RELATING TO A PREPETITION CLAIM.				
02/11/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.70	231.00	W330	11323248
	REVIEW TWIN CITY'S REPLY BRIEF REGARDING MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE/STAY APPEAL (.4); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.3)				
02/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.30	148.50	W330	11390958
	REVIEW DECISION REGARDING TRIZEC SETOFF MOTION				
02/12/04	Billeck, Jason	0.90	373.50	W330	11334492
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH G. JACOBS AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING DUNN & BRADSTREET DRAFT STIPULATION/STATUS (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH G. JACOBS, DBRMS'S ATTORNEY AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING STATUS OF DBRMS NEGOTIATIONS (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE CDI DRAFT STIPULATION (.2).				
02/13/04	Strochak, Adam	0.20	110.00	W330	11399036
	E-MAILS TO/FROM K. CAPLAN REGARDING "DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS" CLAIM AND STAY RELIEF MOTION				
02/17/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W330	11399032
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT RESPONSE TO SUPPLEMENTAL FILING OF MDIP IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY AND TO ALLOW LATE-FILED CLAIM (0.5); PHONE CALL TO S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
02/17/04	Billeck, Jason	0.70	290.50	W330	11353760
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING APPROVAL OF THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. BABIONE REGARDING THE DRAFT DUN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION (.2); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH RMS AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.3).				
02/17/04	Lopez, Christopher	2.40	600.00	W330	11335631

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT CHANGES TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM THE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
02/18/04	Billeck, Jason	3.90	1,618.50	W330	11353759
	WORK ON RESPONSE TO SOUTHERN EDISON'S MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM THE STAY TO SETOFF PREPETITION DEBTS.				
02/19/04	Billeck, Jason	0.40	166.00	W330	11353753
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS, D. BABIONE, AND GREG JACOB REGARDING STATUS OF DBRMS SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.2) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS REGARDING STATUS OF APPROVAL OF THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.2).				
02/20/04	Lopez, Christopher	1.10	275.00	W330	11345078
	DRAFT CHANGES TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S MOTION TO SETOFF				
02/21/04	Billeck, Jason	1.80	747.00	W330	11353762
	WORK ON RESPONSE TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM THE STAY TO EFFECT A SETOFF (1.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TXU'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE TXU DRAFT STIPULATION (.1).				
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W330	11542477
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING REYNOLDS ACTION.				
02/23/04	Strochak, Adam	2.20	1,210.00	W330	11398603
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OBJECTION TO JMG MOTION FOR STAY RELIEF (1.1); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM R. BERKOVICH, J. FINK REGARDING SAME (0.4); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING TREATMENT OF SPECIFIC PERFORMANCE CLAIMS IN CONNECTION WITH JMG MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY (0.7)				
02/24/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W330	11395536
	PHONE CALL FROM D. GOLDEN (AKIN GUMP) REGARDING JMG MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY (0.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM R. BERKOVICH, B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
02/24/04	Strochak, Adam	3.90	2,145.00	W330	11395538
	REVIEW SHAREHOLDER DERIVATIVE COMPLAINT IN REYNOLDS V. ALLEN CASE (0.5); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM D. ELBAUM AND P. CURNIN (SIMPSON THACHER) REGARDING SAME (0.5); RESEARCHING AND DRAFTING LETTER TO REYNOLDS' COUNSEL REGARDING ASSERTION OF AUTOMATIC STAY OVER DERIVATIVE ACTION AS PROPERTY OF THE ESTATE (2.9)				
02/25/04	Strochak, Adam	1.60	880.00	W330	11395506
	FINALIZE LETTER TO PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL REGARDING REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE LAWSUIT AND ASSERTION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.5); PREPARATION OF NOTICE OF BANKRUPTCY FOR FILING IN REYNOLDS V. ALLEN CASE IN SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK (0.5); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. ELBAUM (SIMPSON THACHER), B. BENJET (MCI), M. RIBAUDO REGARDING FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME (0.6)				
02/26/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W330	11395501
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM R. BERKOVICH REGARDING RESOLUTION OF JMG MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY TO ALLOW CONVERSION OF PREFERRED SHARES TO COMMON STOCK (0.2); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. ELBAUM (SIMPSON THACHER) REGARDING FILING OF NOTICE OF STAY IN REYNOLDS V. ALLEN DERIVATIVE LAWSUIT (0.2)				
02/26/04	Thompson, John	1.70	561.00	W330	11395434
	ATTENTION TO SPECTRUM RESOURCES MOTION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE (1.0); TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. BOLIN REGARDING SAME (.7)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/27/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM R. BERKOVICH REGARDING RESOLUTION OF JMG MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY	0.20	110.00	W330	11395968
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W330 - AUTOMATIC STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION:		89.10	\$ 36,949.50		
02/01/04	Lyttle, Eric REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELL FARGO CLAIM	4.50	1,305.00	W400	11404131
02/02/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING ERISA CLAIMS AND MEDIATION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SECTION 510(B) SUBORDINATION OF ERISA CLAIMS (.4)	1.40	868.00	W400	11377680
02/02/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO ERISA PLAINTIFFS' CLAIM	0.20	99.00	W400	11390696
02/02/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF ORDER AUTHORIZING SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEFING ON M. RAY WEST CLAIM (0.2); E-MAIL TO J. BEHAR (WOLF BLOCK) REGARDING SAME (0.1)	0.30	165.00	W400	11395190
02/02/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING ERISA CLAIM	0.50	200.00	W400	11314739
02/02/04	Caplan, Katharine TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. LEDERMAN REGARDING PROCEDURES FOR PENDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS INCLUDING BONDHOLDERS	0.20	69.00	W400	11331353
02/02/04	Protopapas, Lydia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING PROPOSED SETTLEMENT OF ZURICH CLAIMS (.20); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING PROPOSAL WITH RESPECT TO ZURICH'S CLAIMS (.20); AND THEN CONTACT P. ANDERSON REGARDING NEEDED BUSINESS CONTACT PERSON AT ZURICH WHO MCI MAY DEAL WITH DIRECTLY (.10); DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO S. MOONEY AND B. BENJET REGARDING THE PROPOSAL RELATING TO ZURICH'S CLAIMS (.10).	0.60	267.00	W400	11309782
02/02/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW BANK SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING CLAIMS (.2)	0.50	212.50	W400	11410192
02/02/04	Lyttle, Eric REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM	8.30	2,407.00	W400	11404132
02/02/04	Watkins, Claire OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK AND ATTORNEYS AT JENKINS & GILCHRIST REGARDING STRATEGY OF CLASS CERTIFICATION HEARING ON MARCH 2ND.	0.40	132.00	W400	11374790
02/02/04	Watkins, Claire TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. COUCH REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.6); EDIT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT TO ADDRESS THE ASSUMPTION OF THE AMENDED LICENSE AGREEMENT (.6)	1.20	396.00	W400	11376004

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/02/04	Watkins, Claire ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW REGARDING WELLS FARGO	2.40	792.00	W400	11374789
02/02/04	Grogan, James PREPARE AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN SUPPORT OF OBJECTION TO RAUL ACOSTA CLAIM (.5); PREPARE AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO HEARING ON XEROX MOTION FOR SCHEDULING ORDER (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. SANDERS REGARDING SAME (.2); PREPARE AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO HEARING ON MISSISSIPPI DEPARTMENT OF TAXATION STIPULATION (.3).	1.30	474.50	W400	11315175
02/02/04	Lopez, Christopher CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN ON XEROX PRICING MATTER (.2), REVIEW DOCUMENTS ASSOCIATED WITH XEROX PRICING AGREEMENTS WITH MCI (1.1)	1.30	325.00	W400	11289065
02/02/04	Devine, Kim RETRIEVE MESSAGES FROM WORLDCOM CLAIMS HOTLINE (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO D. PERRY REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO A. MASHA REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRY (.1); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.2); UPDATE TELEPHONE LOG SUMMARIZING WGM RESPONSES TO CLAIM INQUIRIES (.7); INTEGRATE DOCUMENT INTO EXISTING FILES (.1).	1.30	195.00	W400	11335686
02/03/04	Allerhand, Joseph MEETING WITH B. BENJET, P. FERRILLO TO DISCUSS ERISA LITIGATION.	0.50	367.50	W400	11324428
02/03/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & S. COHEN AND B. BENJET REGARDING OBJECTION TO ERISA PLAINTIFFS CLAIM	0.40	198.00	W400	11391450
02/03/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW E-MAILS FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI), J. BILLECK REGARDING RESEARCH ON SETOFF ISSUES REGARDING BOISE CASCADE SETOFF DEMAND	0.30	165.00	W400	11395173
02/03/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW PREMERGER CLAIMS WITH B. BENJET (1.0); REVIEW SUBORDINATION ISSUES (.5)	1.50	600.00	W400	11314757
02/03/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO WELLS FARGO CLAIM (3.3); COORDINATE WITH PARALEGALS IN NEW YORK REGARDING PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS (.3)	3.60	1,476.00	W400	11394422
02/03/04	Lyttle, Eric REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIMS	5.70	1,653.00	W400	11404133
02/03/04	Loftspring, Sharon J TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. HAWLEY REGARDING PACIFIC COIN MANAGEMENT CLAIM (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING TAX ISSUE (.2); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ALLOWED CLAIM STIPULATION (.2) AND CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); DRAFT WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.5); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS OF MISSISSIPPI STIPULATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH B. UZE REGARDING DEADLINE FOR OBJECTING TO DOUGLAS COUNTY MOTION (.2); REVIEW OBJECTION TO REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2); BEGIN PREPARING RESPONSE TO LAHTI LATE CLAIM MOTION (.3).	2.50	812.50	W400	11310071
02/03/04	Watkins, Claire ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW REGARDING WELLS FARGO	3.10	1,023.00	W400	11374791

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/03/04	Taylor, David WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM (.3) CONFER WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.60	174.00	W400	11404051
02/03/04	Grogan, James PREPARE FOR AND ARGUE ON BEHALF OF DEBTORS AT FEBRUARY 3, 2004 OMNIBUS HEARING	4.00	1,460.00	W400	11315179
02/03/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW PRE-MERGER CHART FOR MISSING CLAIMS.	0.20	55.00	W400	11328765
02/03/04	Lopez, Christopher CONFERENCE WITH M. BEACH AT MCI REGARDING FLORIDA DIGITAL NETWORK NOTICE OF SETOFF (.1); CONFERENCE WITH R. WELLS REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.20	50.00	W400	11304924
02/04/04	Strochak, Adam DRAFT OBJECTION TO M. RAY WEST NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF ORDER ON CLASS CERTIFICATION BRIEFING (0.7); PHONE CALL TO J. BEHAR (WOLF BLOCK) REGARDING SAME (0.2); PHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS REGARDING SCHEDULING OF WELLS FARGO CLAIM OBJECTION HEARING (0.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS), P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING WELLS FARGO DISCOVERY (0.2)	1.20	660.00	W400	11396929
02/04/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW REVISED WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.20), REVIEW PROPOSAL AND COMMUNICATIONS FROM B. BENJET REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH AT&T (.30), COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING AT&T (.20), COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. GRAHAM REGARDING TREATMENT OF J. WHITAKER CLAIM (.20)	0.90	603.00	W400	11309722
02/04/04	Cohen, Scott CONFER WITH C. PULLO REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS	1.60	640.00	W400	11443401
02/04/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO WELLS FARGO CLAIM (3.1); COMMUNICATE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS (.3)	3.40	1,394.00	W400	11394424
02/04/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH B. UZE REGARDING STATUS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. LITTLE REGARDING ENTRY OF MISSISSIPPI STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW MEMORANDUM ORDER LIFTING STAY TO LITIGATE CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW DOCKET AND CALENDAR UPDATES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING TAX RESEARCH (.2); PREPARE WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION AND CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING SAME (1.5); PREPARE OBJECTION TO LAHTI LIFT STAY MOTION (1.0) AND CONFER WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING SAME (.5).	4.40	1,430.00	W400	11310001
02/04/04	Taylor, David ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA (3.3) CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW (3.0)	6.30	1,827.00	W400	11404049
02/04/04	Pullo, Christina CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS.	1.60	440.00	W400	11328526
02/04/04	Lopez, Christopher DUE DILIGENCE FOR XEROX PRICING MATTER	0.50	125.00	W400	11310067
02/04/04	Devine, Kim	2.80	420.00	W400	11335351

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CALL TO M. PERRY REGARDING CLAIM INQUIRY (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO AQUENT REGARDING CLAIM INQUIRY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO WD COMMUNICATIONS, INC. REGARDING CLAIM INQUIRY (.3); RETRIEVE MESSAGES FROM WORLDCOM CLAIMS HOTLINE (.3); SEARCH BSI DATABASE TO CONFIRM TO OBTAIN CLAIM NUMBERS (.5); UPDATE TELEPHONE LOG SUMMARIZING WGM RESPONSES TO CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.8); INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.4); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GROGAN REGARDING UPDATES TO TELEPHONE LOG (.2); DRAFT LETTER D. PERRY FORWARDING COPY OF THIRD OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.3); MAKE FILE COPIES (.1);				
02/05/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.50	1,072.50	W400	11312608
	PHONE CALL WITH M. RYAN OF BANK OF NEW YORK REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS, ETC. (.3); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. LONGMIRE REGARDING CLAIM OWNERSHIP (.2); DRAFT EMAIL TO A. KASHLINSKAYA REGARDING CONFIRMATORY LETTER FROM CREDITOR (.3); REVIEW 13G AND SECTION 382 AUTHORITIES (.6); REPLY TO D. HOLZMAN EMAIL REGARDING VIN # (.1)				
02/05/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.80	891.00	W400	11392839
	REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT [0.3]; CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK & M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME [0.3]; REVIEW & REVISE DRAFT SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT [1.2]				
02/05/04	Strochak, Adam	0.80	440.00	W400	11395171
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS), J. DUBEL (ALIX), B. BENJET (MCI), P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING WELLS FARGO DISCOVERY REQUESTS				
02/05/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.40	206.00	W400	11314832
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING OBJECTING TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS AND FILED CLAIMS AND CERTAIN GENERAL PROCEDURES RELATED THERETO.				
02/05/04	Cohen, Scott	3.60	1,440.00	W400	11315169
	PREPARE 510(B) OBJECTION REGARDING SUBORDINATION				
02/05/04	Friedman, Peter	3.50	1,435.00	W400	11394645
	COORDINATE WITH WELLS FARGO COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY REQUESTS (.3); COORDINATE WITH IN-HOUSE COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT FILES FOR PRODUCTION TO WELLS FARGO (2.8).				
02/05/04	Caplan, Katharine	0.10	34.50	W400	11331360
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING POTENTIAL OBJECTION TO ERISA CLAIMS AND PROCEDURES FOR SETTING HEARING RELATED THERETO				
02/05/04	Fink, Jessica	5.50	2,337.50	W400	11410558
	DRAFT AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MOTION TO APPROVE SAME.				
02/05/04	Lyttle, Eric	4.70	1,363.00	W400	11404143
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
02/05/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.80	585.00	W400	11309471
	REVIEW CALENDAR UPDATES (.2); CONFER WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING OBJECTION TO LAHTI MOTIONS AND REVISE SAME (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING REVISIONS TO WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2).				
02/05/04	Taylor, David	5.80	1,682.00	W400	11404482
	ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM. CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW (4.8) AND CONFER WITH E. LITTLE REGARDING SAME (1.0).				
02/05/04	Grogan, James	5.00	1,825.00	W400	11315195

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT AND REVISE SETTLED ORDER AND NOTICE FOR SAME ON RAUL ACOSTA ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. CUKRAS REGARDING STIPULATION WITH NEW YORK DEPARTMENT OF TAXATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH N. BEIZER, G. TEITELMAN AND C. MATHERS REGARDING XEROX ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING TERMINATION OF XEROX AGREEMENTS (.4); REVIEW DRAFT TERMINATION LETTER PERTAINING TO SAME (.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED BY XEROX IN PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION OF XEROX CLAIM (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING AMENDMENT TO XEROX ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.4); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MCMORRIS REGARDING HEARING ON NEW YORK DEPARTMENT OF TAXATION CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH HURON CONSULTING REGARDING CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION (.7).				
02/05/04	Pullo, Christina	0.50	137.50	W400	11328247
	REVISE OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS BASED ON OWNERSHIP OF COMMON STOCK, SENIOR DEBT CLAIMS, OR PREFERRED STOCK.				
02/06/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.80	891.00	W400	11390407
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK AND A. PEREZ REGARDING DRAFT AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2) & DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SAME [0.1]; REVIEW & REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SAME [1.5];				
02/06/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W400	11397065
	REVIEW NOTICE OF DEPOSITION TO ALIX PARTNERS IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (0.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM J. DUBEL (ALIX PARTNERS), D. SCHNEEMAN (MCI), B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.6)				
02/06/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W400	11443405
	CONFER WITH J. FINK AND S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING AT&T MOTION				
02/06/04	Cohen, Scott	5.80	2,320.00	W400	11326408
	DRAFT VIVIEN OBJECTION (5.5); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PRE-MERGER CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CALL A. STROCHAK REGARDING CLAIM MOTION (.1)				
02/06/04	Friedman, Peter	2.20	902.00	W400	11394797
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO RELATED TO CLAIM				
02/06/04	Fink, Jessica	2.50	1,062.50	W400	11410575
	REVISE AND CIRCULATE AT&T MOTION AND AGREEMENT (2.3); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ AND S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/06/04	Lyttle, Eric	7.50	2,175.00	W400	11404144
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
02/06/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.00	325.00	W400	11313282
	CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FILING OF LAHTI OBJECTION AND ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON 8TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. GROGAN AND S. BAKER REGARDING HURON'S CLAIM REPORT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. ACKER REGARDING RESOLUTION OF NOTEHOLDER CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING MDIP RESPONSE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIMS SUBJECT TO 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.2).				
02/06/04	Taylor, David	6.00	1,740.00	W400	11402237
	REVIEW WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM (2.0) AND CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW (4.0)				
02/06/04	Grogan, James	2.70	985.50	W400	11315208

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON 8TH AND 14TH OMNIBUS CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SETTLED ORDER FOR RAUL ACOSTA CLAIM (.4); ATTEND TO REVISIONS OF SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING AMENDED XEROX ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.4); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. TEITELMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES FROM HURON CONSULTING (.3); CORRESPOND WITH CO-COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.2).				
02/06/04	Pullo, Christina	1.70	467.50	W400	11327760
	REVISE PRE-MERGER CLAIMS OBJECTION (1.0); ADD CLAIMS TO CHART (.2); REVISE EXHIBITS (.5)				
02/07/04	Taylor, David	1.00	290.00	W400	11402238
	ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM				
02/07/04	Grogan, James	0.60	219.00	W400	11315221
	REVIEW AND REVISE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF STIPULATION ON NEW YORK DEPARTMENT OF TAXATION CLAIMS				
02/08/04	Taylor, David	4.50	1,305.00	W400	11402239
	ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM (2.6) CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW (1.9)				
02/09/04	Strochak, Adam	4.40	2,420.00	W400	11397097
	PHONE CALL TO K. HENNESSY (MCI) REGARDING WELLS FARGO DISCOVERY ISSUES (0.3); E-MAIL TO L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING SAME (0.1); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF WELLS FARGO CLAIMS IN PREPARATION FOR BRIEFING OF OBJECTION (1.9); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING CLASS CERTIFICATION OF ERISA CLAIMS IN CONNECTION WITH SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB CLAIMS (2.1)				
02/09/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.40	206.00	W400	11333363
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS PROCESS AND ISSUES RELATED THERETO.				
02/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W400	11319133
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM J. GROGAN AND OPPOSING COUNSEL TO SETTLEMENT XEROX ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS MOTION				
02/09/04	Billeck, Jason	4.30	1,784.50	W400	11334497
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS, G. MITCHEL, THE CREDITORS' COMMITTEE'S ATTORNEY AND DETROIT EDISON'S ATTORNEY ABOUT STATUS OF THE HEARING/STIPULATION (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. SALTZBERG, S. DZIBINSKI, AND MISSOURI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING MISSOURI'S CLAIMS AND MOTION FOR SETOFF (1.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH DUNN & BRADSTREET'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE DRAFT STIPULATION (.1); RECEIVE AND REVIEW DUNN & BRADSTREET'S REVISIONS TO THE DRAFT STIPULATION (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND J. DAMON REGARDING THE DRAFT CDI STIPULATION (.6); AND REVISE THE DRAFT CDI STIPULATION BASED ON SAME (.8).				
02/09/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11326202
	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 510(B) OBJECTION				
02/09/04	Fink, Jessica	1.50	637.50	W400	11411224
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SETTLEMENT REGARDING CLASS 5 BANK CLAIMS (.5). DEAL WITH BANK ISSUES (1.0).				
02/09/04	Lyttle, Eric	2.50	725.00	W400	11403041
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/09/04	Loftspring, Sharon J TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. ACKER REGARDING NOTEHOLDER CLAIMS (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING REVISIONS TO WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2) AND REVISE SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH L. FELD REGARDING WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO MDIP MOTION AND REVIEW SUPPLEMENTAL PAPERS RELATED TO SAME (.7); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF LAHTI HEARING (.2) AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. LOWERY REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF LAHTI HEARING (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING REVISIONS TO ERS STIPULATION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING CLAIMS SUBJECT TO 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.4); REVIEW HURON CLAIMS REPORTS (2.0).	5.20	1,690.00	W400	11317945
02/09/04	Watkins, Claire [WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW REGARDING \$2.65 BILLION CREDIT FACILITY.	3.80	1,254.00	W400	11375505
02/09/04	Watkins, Claire [MPI] DRAFT MOTION AND ORDER REGARDING MPI SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (2.5); RECEIVE AND REVIEW FINAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND AMENDED LICENSE AGREEMENT (1.0); UPDATE MOTION TO REFLECT SAME (.5)	4.00	1,320.00	W400	11375503
02/09/04	Taylor, David REGARDING WELLS FARGO, INTERMEDIA - CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW.	3.00	870.00	W400	11406779
02/09/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING AUDIT OF XEROX CLAIM (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING MEDIATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. TEITELMAN REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER TO XEROX (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFERS (.6); DRAFT AND REVISE MEDIATION STATEMENT FOR XEROX MEDIATION (.5); REVISE LETTER CANCELLING XEROX CONTRACTS (.6); CORRESPOND WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING XEROX DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.4); PREPARE AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR MEDIATION WITH XEROX (3.4); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING XEROX SETTLEMENT OFFERS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING EXHIBITS TO MEDIATION STATEMENT ON XEROX CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. OWENS REGARDING WIRELESS ONE OPERATING REPORTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DEVINE REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE CALLS (.2).	7.20	2,628.00	W400	11334030
02/09/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW LEASE REJECTIONS TO SEE IF THEY ARE MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS (.4); REVISE OMNIBUS OBJECTION FOR SHAREHOLDER CLAIMS (.6); REVISE EXHIBITS FOR ADDITIONAL CLAIMS RECEIVED FROM MCI (.4);	1.40	385.00	W400	11337039
02/09/04	Lopez, Christopher CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING DRAFT XEROX PRICING MATTER.	0.10	25.00	W400	11317034
02/09/04	Lopez, Christopher CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING NOTICE OF SETOFF WITH FLORIDA DIGITAL NETWORK (.1); REVIEW NOTICE OF SETOFF WITH FLORIDA DIGITAL NETWORK (.1); CONFERENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.30	75.00	W400	11317033
02/09/04	Devine, Kim DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GROGAN REGARDING UPDATES TO TELEPHONE LOG (.2); RETRIEVE MESSAGES FROM WORLDCOM CLAIMS HOTLINE (.1); INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.1); UPDATE TELEPHONE LOG SUMMARIZING WGM RESPONSES TO CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.2).	0.60	90.00	W400	11336908
02/10/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W400	11319897

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW STIPULATION ENTERED AND THE THREE DOJ PROOFS OF CLAIM (.20), COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. DRORI REGARDING STIPULATION (.10)				
02/10/04	Fink, Jessica TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING BANK CLAIMS.	0.20	85.00	W400	11411474
02/10/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW AND REVISE AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND MOTION TO APPROVE.	3.40	1,445.00	W400	11411475
02/10/04	Lyttle, Eric REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM	8.00	2,320.00	W400	11403047
02/10/04	Loftspring, Sharon J TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. JACKSON REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION AND CONTINUATION OF NOTEHOLDERS' CLAIMS (.4); REVISE ERISA STIPULATION (.5) AND CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS AND B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ENTRY OF LAW DEBENTURE STIPULATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH N. BYNUM REGARDING LETTER TO LANDOWNERS ABOUT ENCROACHMENT ISSUES (.2); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING ERS STIPULATION AND 8TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. NEWMAN REGARDING TRANSFER AGREEMENT (.2); RESEARCH STATE TAX ISSUES AND CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (1.5); CLAIM DILIGENCE FOR HURON CLAIM REPORTS (1.5).	5.00	1,625.00	W400	11323968
02/10/04	Watkins, Claire [MPI] ATTENTION TO EDITING MOTION REGARDING MPI'S SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	0.50	165.00	W400	11375508
02/10/04	Watkins, Claire [WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW OF \$2.65 BILLION CREDIT FACILITY.	6.70	2,211.00	W400	11375506
02/10/04	Taylor, David WELLS FARGO - INTERMEDIA CLAIM - CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW.	3.00	870.00	W400	11402255
02/10/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. TEITELMAN AND N. BEIZER REGARDING XEROX DISCOVERY (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW SAME (.5); PREPARE AND REVISE DRAFT OF MEDIATION STATEMENT (4.2); CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT IN PREPARATION FOR XEROX MEDIATION (3.7); CORRESPOND WITH J. GUECK REGARDING MEDIATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GUECK REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS REPORTS (.1).	9.10	3,321.50	W400	11334037
02/10/04	Lopez, Christopher CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SOUTHERN EDISON MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING STATE OF MISSOURI MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.1).	0.20	50.00	W400	11321707
02/11/04	Goldring, Stuart REVIEW DRAFT LETTER FROM WILKIE FARR REGARDING CLAIM OWNERSHIP (.3); DISCUSS SAME WITH M. FRENCH (.6) AND LATER WITH M. HOERNLEIN, M. FRENCH AND M. HOFFENBERG (.7); FURTHER REVISE SAME REFLECTING ON GOING COMMENTS BY EMAIL (1.5); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO J. LONGMIRE WITH REVISED LETTER (.4)	3.50	2,502.50	W400	11325869
02/11/04	Strochak, Adam E-MAILS TO/FROM J. ALLERHAND REGARDING ERISA 401K CLAIMS AND SUBORDINATION ISSUES (0.3); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OBJECTION TO ERISA CLAIMS ON SUBORDINATION ISSUE (0.5); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS FROM/TO L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING DISCOVERY ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS AND HEARING SCHEDULE (0.7)	1.50	825.00	W400	11396782

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/11/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 510(B) OBJECTION (.2) INCLUDING MEETING WITH J. ALLERHAND (.4) & DISCUSSION WITH S. YOUDELMAN (.4)	1.00	400.00	W400	11326952
02/11/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO	2.30	943.00	W400	11394589
02/11/04	Fink, Jessica REVISE AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.50	212.50	W400	11411482
02/11/04	Graham, Richard EMAIL J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING SIGNATURE FOR CITIGROUP STIPULATION.	0.10	37.00	W400	11394696
02/11/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW ERISA OBJECTION (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.90	333.00	W400	11394895
02/11/04	Watkins, Claire [WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW.	3.50	1,155.00	W400	11375509
02/11/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH V. CULVER REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIM.	0.10	36.50	W400	11334041
02/11/04	Grogan, James PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEDIATION WITH XEROX CAPITAL SERVICES, INC. (15.0); CORRESPOND WITH M. OWENS REGARDING WIRELESS ONE BANKRUPTCY (.1).	15.10	5,511.50	W400	11334039
02/11/04	Froim, Idit FOLLOW UP ON TELMEX/FINANCIAL VENTURES CLAIMS (RESOLUTION OF DISCREPENCY FOUND BY KPMG) (1.8). DISCUSSED SAME WITH D. HOLTZMAN AND M. HOERNLEIN (.7)	2.50	925.00	W400	11374326
02/12/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. PARKER AND J. GROGAN REGARDING QWEST POC'S (.20), COMMUNICATIONS TO/FROM S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING THE 8TH AND 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS (.10)	0.30	201.00	W400	11328005
02/12/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW CLAIM OBJECTION	0.20	80.00	W400	11336755
02/12/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO OPPOSING COUNSEL IN WELLS FARGO CLAIM	1.70	697.00	W400	11394592
02/12/04	Caplan, Katharine CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS FILED BY SHEKHEM, EL BEY AND THE RESOLUTION OF SAME	0.30	103.50	W400	11399724
02/12/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON AT&T SETTLEMENT.	0.80	340.00	W400	11411488
02/12/04	Fink, Jessica	3.00	1,275.00	W400	11411489

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DEAL WITH ISSUES RELATING TO BANK CLASS 5 CLAIMS (1.0), INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. CHASTKA, S. COHEN AND M. HORNLIN (.7); REVIEW TREATMENT IN PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.3)				
02/12/04	Lyttle, Eric	3.30	957.00	W400	11403050
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
02/12/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.60	1,495.00	W400	11325510
	REVIEW CALENDAR AND DOCKET UPDATES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH N. BYNUM REGARDING ENCROACHMENT LETTER TO LANDOWNERS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING CLAIMS DILIGENCE (.4), AND WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING ENTRY OF LAW DEBENTURE STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW DEBTOR'S MOTION TO MODIFY PLAN AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING POSTPONEMENT OF EFFECTIVE DATE (.4); CORRESPOND WITH A. MALLAN AND R. SARUBI REGARDING POSSIBLE POSTPONEMENT OF EFFECTIVE DATE (.4); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARINGS ON 8TH AND 14TH OBJECTIONS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING REVISIONS TO ERS AND TRS STIPULATION (.2) CONFER WITH J. GROGAN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING STATUS OF LATE CLAIMS (.2); PREPARE REPLY TO MDIP SUPPLEMENT (1.5); CORRESPOND WITH A. TSAI REGARDING NOTICE OF BAR DATE FOR LATE CLAIM MOTION (.2).				
02/12/04	Watkins, Claire	1.00	330.00	W400	11375538
	[MPI] OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING MOTION TO APPROVE MPI SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); EDIT MOTION (.6); LEAVE VOICE MESSAGE FOR JEFFREY CROUCH REGARDING SAME (.1)				
02/12/04	Watkins, Claire	1.10	363.00	W400	11375539
	ATTENTION TO RESEARCH REGARDING WHETHER A COURT, IN CONSIDERING CERTIFYING A CLASS, ASSUMES THE FACTS IN THE COMPLAINT TO BE TRUE.				
02/12/04	Watkins, Claire	2.50	825.00	W400	11375537
	[WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS REGARDING \$2.65 BILLION CREDIT FACILITY.				
02/12/04	Taylor, David	1.90	551.00	W400	11402242
	WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM - FINISHED REVIEW OF PRODUCED DOCUMENTS AND SENT SUMMARY TO P. FRIEDMAN				
02/12/04	Grogan, James	1.60	584.00	W400	11334042
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SILLIMAN AND V. CULVER REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO PT CABLE CLAIM AND GT TELECOM CLAIM				
02/12/04	Grogan, James	4.30	1,569.50	W400	11334045
	REVIEW FILE REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS CLAIMS (.7); CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. BURNS AND H. BAER REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.3); DRAFT LETTER TO N. BEIZER AND G. HALL REGARDING XEROX SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. PARKER REGARDING DEADLINE FOR QWEST CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS AND S. BAKER REGARDING CLAIMS TRANSFERS (.3); RESEARCH REGARDING RULE 3001(E) (.5); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SCHEDULED CHARITABLE CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING CLAIMS TRANSFERS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. BAER REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BURNS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW R. ACOSTA MOTION FOR PREPETITION CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. BAILEY REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING CLAIMS TRANSFERS (.4).				
02/13/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W400	11542536
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CLAIMS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/13/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING CLAIMS (.5); CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.00	775.00	W400	11542504
02/13/04	Goldring, Stuart FOLLOW-UP ON REP. LETTERS FROM CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIM OWNERSHIP	0.30	214.50	W400	11350223
02/13/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM S. TOLL (ALIX PARTNERS), J. DUBEL (ALIX PARTNERS), P. FRIEDMAN, L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION FOR ALIX PARTNERS IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS	1.60	880.00	W400	11399034
02/13/04	Baker, Sylvia REVIEW RESEARCH MEMO REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND 502(D) ISSUE.	0.40	206.00	W400	11337828
02/13/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS WITH L. FIFE, S. BELVILLE (BROWN RUDNICK) AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING RESOLUTION OF THE CLAIMS OF AD HOC TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE	0.20	134.00	W400	11328011
02/13/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING PT CABLE'S PREPETITION CLAIMS AND DEBTORS' COUNTERCLAIMS (.4); REVIEW CONTRACTS, CLAIMS, COMMUNICATIONS, AND CALCULATIONS REGARDING PT CABLE'S PREPETITION CLAIMS (2.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE DRAFT DUNN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION (.2); REVISE THE DRAFT DUNN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION (.7); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS, T. VOGEL AND A. PEREZ REGARDING THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.2).	3.80	1,577.00	W400	11334494
02/13/04	Caplan, Katharine EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH A. STROCHAK REGRADING CLAIMS FILED BY SHEKHEM, EL BEY	0.30	103.50	W400	11399725
02/13/04	Lyttle, Eric REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM	1.00	290.00	W400	11403054
02/13/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING REVISIONS TO ERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING REVISED CLAIMS REPORT (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. CAPLAN REGARDING CLAIMS OBJECTION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. STEIN REGARDING MERCANTILE PARTNERS CLAIM (.1); PREPARE REPLY TO MDIP SUPPLEMENTAL AFFIDAVITS (2.0).	2.80	910.00	W400	11330551
02/13/04	Watkins, Claire [MPI] ATTENTION TO EDITING MOTION OF MPI SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	1.10	363.00	W400	11375541
02/13/04	Watkins, Claire RESEARCH ISSUE REGARDING WHETHER FACTS ARE ASSUMED TO BE TRUE IN COMPLAINT FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION.	1.10	363.00	W400	11375543
02/13/04	Watkins, Claire [WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS REGARDING \$2.65 BILLION CREDIT FACILITY.	3.60	1,188.00	W400	11375540
02/13/04	Grogan, James	2.90	1,058.50	W400	11334049

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.1); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. CAPLAN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING DEPARTMENT OF MOORISH AFFAIRS CLAIMS (.2); DRAFT LETTER TO C. BAILEY AND H. RUMELD REGARDING ACOSTA MOTION (.3); REVIEW CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES PREPARED BY HURON CONSULTING GROUP (1.1); CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING PENDING OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.3); REVIEW FILES REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIMS (.6); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.2).				
02/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.20	804.00	W400	11378023
	REVIEW REVISIONS TO AT&T SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT AND 9019 MOTION (.30), COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND J. FINK REGARDING AT&T (.20), REVIEW PROVISIONS OF QWEST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.20), COMMUNICATIONS TO/FROM T. DIXON REGARDING QWEST (.20), REVIEW PROPOSED STIPULATION WITH BANK GROUP MEMBERS (.30)				
02/16/04	Fink, Jessica	1.50	637.50	W400	11410596
	REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AT&T SETTLEMENT AND SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.				
02/16/04	Lyttle, Eric	1.00	290.00	W400	11403056
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM (1.0)				
02/16/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.20	65.00	W400	11337800
	CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING MDIP REPLY.				
02/17/04	Strochak, Adam	2.00	1,100.00	W400	11394220
	PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF M. BROWN (ALIX) IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION (1.7); CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (0.2); E-MAIL TO WITH GINEGAW (MCI) REGARDING CALIFORNIA SETOFF ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH ATCAS CONTRACT (0.1)				
02/17/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.80	412.00	W400	11337718
	CONFERENCES WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING VARIOUS PROCEDURAL ISSUES RELATED TO CLAIM OBJECTION PROCESS, INCLUDING ISSUES REGARDING TAX CLAIMS, SCHEDULED CLAIMS, CONVENIENCE CLAIMS AND RELATED MATTERS.				
02/17/04	Cohen, Scott	1.60	640.00	W400	11373100
	REVIEW PRE-MERGER CLAIM OBJECTION (.6); DISCUSSION C. PULLO REGARDING PRE-MERGER CLAIMS & OBJECTION (.8); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CLAIMS QUERY (.2)				
02/17/04	Caplan, Katharine	4.00	1,380.00	W400	11401133
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING CLAIMS FILED BY SHEKEM, EL BAY AND LETTER TO THE COURT REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW FILES ON CONTINUED CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AND BSI WEBSITE REGARDING CLAIMS FILED BY SHEKHEM, EL BEY (2.1); BEGIN RIDER FOR LETTER TO THE COURT REGARDING THE CLAIMS FILED BY SHEKHEM, EL BEY AND THE RESOLUTION OR STATUS OF SAME (1.7)				
02/17/04	Fink, Jessica	1.00	425.00	W400	11410615
	REVISE AT&T SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.6); CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.4).				
02/17/04	Fink, Jessica	1.50	637.50	W400	11410618
	REVIEW MOTION BY JMG FOR TRANSFER OF STOCK AND REVISE OBJECTION.				
02/17/04	Lyttle, Eric	9.10	2,639.00	W400	11403594
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS OF M. SALSBUURY, ESQ. AND M. BARRY REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM FOR PRIVILEGE AND RESPONSIVENESS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/17/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING REVISIONS TO MDIP REPLY (.3); AND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FILING OF SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING ARKANSAS RETIREMENT SYSTEM'S MOTION TO RECONSIDER SUBORDINATION AND REVIEW SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRY FROM ENVOY (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND REVISED REPORT (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2).	1.50	487.50	W400	11337250
02/17/04	Watkins, Claire [MPI] OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK (.2); EDIT MOTION FOR MPI SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.2).	0.40	132.00	W400	11375562
02/17/04	Watkins, Claire PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO A. STROCHAK REGARDING RESEARCH ON CLASS CERTIFICATION.	0.40	132.00	W400	11375566
02/17/04	Watkins, Claire [AKHAR ALI] ATTENTION TO DRAFTING NOTICE AND ORDER FOR AKHAR ALI MOTION.	0.60	198.00	W400	11375563
02/17/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING ORDER ON SEVENTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.6); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ AND E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET TRANSACTION (.3); REVIEW MISSISSIPPI EDNET EQUIPMENT REQUEST (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. RAY REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW CLIENT DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO EQUIPMENT EXCLUDED FROM XEROX SETTLEMENT (.2); DRAFT LETTER TO G. HALL REGARDING XEROX SETTLEMENT (.2); REVIEW HURON CONSULTING CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION (.2); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING VARIOUS PROCEDURAL ISSUES RELATED TO CLAIM OBJECTIONS, CONVENIENCE CLAIMS, AND SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.8); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ONVOY CLAIMS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. SHAW REGARDING SAME (.1); DRAFT AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH XEROX REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (2.5); CORRESPOND WITH G. TEITELMAN AND N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.3).	5.80	2,117.00	W400	11353313
02/17/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW UNRESOLVED PRE-MERGER CLAIMS FOR MEETING WITH S. COHEN (.2); CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS (.9); DRAFT OBJECTION TO MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS BASED UPON EQUITY INTERESTS AND SENIOR DEBT CLAIMS (2.5)	3.60	990.00	W400	11349967
02/17/04	Devine, Kim RETRIEVE MESSAGES FROM WORLDCOM CLAIMS HOTLINE (.2); UPDATE TELEPHONE LOG SUMMARIZING WGM RESPONSES TO CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.5); INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.1).	0.80	120.00	W400	11354004
02/18/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CLAIMS, ETC.	0.30	232.50	W400	11543530
02/18/04	Youdelman, Sharon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING PRE-MERGER CLAIMS.	0.10	49.50	W400	11389499
02/18/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND ANALYZE INTERMEDIA FINANCIAL PRODUCTION IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO DISCOVERY AND CLAIMS OBJECTION PROCESS (1.4); PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH M. BROWN (ALIX PARTNERS) (1.2); MEETING WITH M. BROWN AND S. TOLL (ALIX) IN PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION (1.6); REVIEW AND ANALYZE WELLS FARGO CLAIMS, OBJECTIONS TO PLAN, AND CASE LAW ON LENDER STANDING (1.6)	5.80	3,190.00	W400	11394095
02/18/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.40	206.00	W400	11339948

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CONVENIENCE CLAIMS AND RELATED ISSUES.				
02/18/04	Cohen, Scott	0.50	200.00	W400	11373129
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CLAIMS QUERY (.2); & DISCUSSION WITH C. PULLO REGARDING PRE-MERGER (.3)				
02/18/04	Caplan, Katharine	3.30	1,138.50	W400	11399699
	FINALIZE RIDER FOR LETTER TO THE COURT REGARDING THE CLAIMS FILED BY SHEKHEM, EL BEY AND THE RESOLUTION OR STATUS OF SAME AND (1.9); DRAFT E-MAIL TO A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM B. DAVIS REGARDING QUESTIONS RELATED TO CLAIM STATUS OF CLAIMS ON CERTAIN CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND RESEARCH (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.3); DRAFT FOLLOW-UP E-MAILS TO B. DAVIS (.4)				
02/18/04	Lyttle, Eric	4.30	1,247.00	W400	11403597
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS OF M. SALSBUURY, ESQ. AND M. BARRY REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM FOR PRIVILEGE AND RESPONSIVENESS.				
02/18/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.60	520.00	W400	11340009
	CORRESPOND WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING ENVOY CLAIM INQUIRY (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING REVISIONS TO ERS STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING REVISED CLAIM SUMMARY (.3) AND REVIEW SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH S. STEIN REGARDING STATUS OF MERCANTILE PARTNERS CLAIM (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2).				
02/18/04	Watkins, Claire	3.80	1,254.00	W400	11373794
	[WELLS FARGO] ATTENTION TO DOCUMENT REVIEW (2.5); [MPI] ATTENTION TO SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.3).				
02/18/04	Grogan, James	6.20	2,263.00	W400	11353219
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER AND J. SMITH REGARDING SCHEDULED CLAIMS, CONVENIENCE CLAIMS AND OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND EVIDENCE NEEDED FOR CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.8); REVIEW WORLDCOM REORGANIZATIONAL PLAN, FIRST DAY ORDERS, SETTLEMENTS, AND STIPULATIONS RELATED TO SAME (1.4); CORRESPOND WITH G. HALL REGARDING XEROX STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH G. TEITELMAN AND N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.2); REVISE SAME (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GUECK REGARDING MEDIATOR'S REPORT FOR XEROX MEDIATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH C. MATHERS REGARDING PENDING XEROX INVOICES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. TEITELMAN REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM (.3); CORRESPOND WITH G. TEITELMAN, N. BEIZER AND C. MATHERS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. BAILEY REGARDING R. ACOSTA CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. HOERNLINE REGARDING EMPLOYEE WAGE CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ONVOY CLAIMS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. SHAW REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. SHAW, T. MEINKEN, B. BENJET, J. TROFIMUK AND A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.4).				
02/18/04	Pullo, Christina	2.10	577.50	W400	11350095
	REVISE MCI PRE-MERGER CLAIMS OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO EQUITY INTERESTS AND SENIOR DEBT CLAIMS AND EXHIBITS THERETO (1.9); CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/19/04	Strochak, Adam	5.00	2,750.00	W400	11394091
	PREPARE FOR (1.2) AND PARTICIPATE IN (2.3) MEETING WITH M. BROWN (ALIX PARTNERS), E. BANNIGAN (MORGAN LEWIS), S. MOLDOFF (WELLS FARGO) REGARDING DISCOVERY ON WELLS FARGO CLAIM (.3); PHONE CALL TO S. FELDERSTEIN (STATE OF CALIFORNIA COUNSEL) REGARDING NEGOTIATION OF SETOFF DISPUTES (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYZE INFORMATION FROM WITH GINEGAW (MCI) REGARDING POST-PETITION COSTS INCURRED UNDER ATCAS CONTRACT AND SETOFF ISSUES (0.4); DRAFT E-MAIL TO S. FELDERSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.3); PHONE CALL AND E-MAIL FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING ASSERTION OF COUNTERCLAIMS IN CLAIMS OBJECTION PROCESS (0.3)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/19/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING THE "DEEMED" WIRELESS CLAIMS FROM M. BEACH AND J. GROGAN (.2), CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING AMENDMENT TO SCHEDULES (.2)	0.40	268.00	W400	11387042
02/19/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO WELLS FARGO CLAIM	3.80	1,558.00	W400	11394171
02/19/04	Fink, Jessica TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MACGAREY REGARDING JMG MOTION.	0.20	85.00	W400	11410758
02/19/04	Lyttle, Eric REVIEW DOCUMENTS OF M. SALSBUURY, ESQ. AND M. BARRY REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM FOR PRIVILEGE AND RESPONSIVENESS	3.80	1,102.00	W400	11403599
02/19/04	Loftspring, Sharon J REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL AND S. STEIN REGARDING ENTRY OF MERCANTILE PARTNERS' STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION AND REVISE SAME (.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO M. COALE AND ENRON STIPULATION REGARDING ERS CLAIM (.3); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ AND S. COHEN REGARDING RESOLUTION OF TRADE CLAIMS AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO BROWN RUDNICK REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING PRESENTMENT OF SUNTRUST STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. FELD REGARDING PROPOSED WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW CISCO SYSTEM'S REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM AND CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM PINELLAS COUNTY TAX COLLECTOR AND CORRESPOND WITH R. GARCES REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GILLIN REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW UPDATED CLAIMS REPORT PREPARED BY HURON (.5); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL AND A. PEREZ REGARDING RESPONSE TO ARKANSAS' MOTION TO RECONSIDER SUBORDINATION (.3); RESEARCH RECONSIDERATION OF SUBORDINATED CLAIM (1.0); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING A. ACKER'S PROPOSED STIPULATION AND RESPONDING TO ARKANSAS MOTION (.2).	4.70	1,527.50	W400	11343740
02/19/04	Watkins, Claire [MPI] REVIEW JENKEN'S EDITS TO MOTION APPROVING SETTLEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. CROUCH REGARDING SAME (.3) [WELLS FARGO] OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH E. LYTTLE REGARDING STATUS OF DOCUMENT REVIEW AND PRIVILEGE LOG (.3)	0.90	297.00	W400	11373802
02/19/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING VARIOUS CLAIM ISSUES INCLUDING OFFSET OF CREDITS AND CONVENIENCE CLASS ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ AND M. RAY REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING ONVOY AGREEMENT (.2); REVISE STIPULATION WITH XEROX REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING OBJECTION TO PT CABLE CLAIM (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION QUESTIONS (.3); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. OWENS REGARDING WIRELESS ONE OPERATING REPORTS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH, B. BENJET, M. FISHER AND R. RODRIGUES REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES PERTAINING TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.5); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING OBJECTION SUMMARIES (.1); REVIEW SAME (.3); REVIEW CLAIMS HOTLINE RESPONSES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DEVINE REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH V. CULVER REGARDING INTERNATIONAL VENDORS (.1); REVIEW REVISIONS FROM P. ABOOD TO BP CONTRACT (.1); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SMITH REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH E. MARTINEZ, M. RAY AND E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.5).	4.80	1,752.00	W400	11353223
02/20/04	Strochak, Adam	0.80	440.00	W400	11394238

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARE FOR (0.1) AND PARTICIPATE IN PHONE CALL TO M. GARRETT (MCI) REGARDING WELLS FARGO DISCOVERY (0.7)				
02/20/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.70	360.50	W400	11350849
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION PROCESS AND LOGISTICS AND COORDINATION RELATED THERETO (.3); BRIEF REVIEW OF CLAIMS REPORTS PREPARED BY HURON (.4).				
02/20/04	Billeck, Jason	2.90	1,203.50	W400	11353755
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND A. COSTA REGARDING THE DRAFT NCR STIPULATION (.4); REVIEW NCR STIPULATION (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND CDI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE DRAFT CDI STIPULATION (.3); REVISE CDI STIPULATION REGARDING SAME (.5); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND DUN & BRADSTREET'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE DRAFT DUN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION (.4); AND REVISE DUN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION REGARDING SAME (.7).				
02/20/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11375414
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. BASIL REGARDING PRE-MERGER CLAIMS				
02/20/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11375906
	MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PRE-MERGER CLAIMS				
02/20/04	Friedman, Peter	5.80	2,378.00	W400	11394172
	REVIEW PRIVILEGE LOG OF WELLS FARGO DOCUMENTS (1.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO (4.7)				
02/20/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.20	390.00	W400	11344939
	CORRESPOND WITH M. COALE REGARDING TRS STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW UPDATED CLAIMS REPORTS (.3); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARINGS ON 8TH AND 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING CISCO'S REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.3).				
02/20/04	Watkins, Claire	1.00	330.00	W400	11374396
	[MPI] ATTENTION TO FILING MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.7); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH N. BYNUM REGARDING SAME (.3)				
02/20/04	Grogan, James	2.60	949.00	W400	11353227
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CULVER REGARDING FOREIGN VENDOR CLAIMS (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SMITH REGARDING SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING PT-1 SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING PROPOSED CONFERENCE WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. LAWLESS, M. BEACH AND S. BAKER REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SMITH REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH C. BAILEY AND H. RUMELD REGARDING R. ACOSTA MOTION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING STIPULATION WITH XEROX (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. BURKLEY AND N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING STATUS OF PT-1 SETTLEMENT (.4).				
02/21/04	Fink, Jessica	1.50	637.50	W400	11410768
	WORK ON CMG OBJECTION.				
02/21/04	Lopez, Christopher	1.70	425.00	W400	11345884
	DRAFT CHANGES TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM THE AUTOMATIC STAY TO SETOFF.				
02/22/04	Lyttle, Eric	7.00	2,030.00	W400	11404324

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	EDIT AND REVISE PRIVILEGE LOG				
02/23/04	Strochak, Adam	3.60	1,980.00	W400	11398618
	REVIEW ORDER ON ABSTENTION MOTION REGARDING ABBOTT CLAIMS (0.2); E-MAIL TO A. KUZNITZ REGARDING SAME (0.1); PHONE CALL FROM M. SHAIKEN REGARDING SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP CLAIMS AND COUNTERCLAIM (0.6); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES ON SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB CLAIMS (2.3); E-MAILS TO/FROM E. BANNIGAN (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING DISCOVERY ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (0.4)				
02/23/04	Baker, Sylvia	1.10	566.50	W400	11359899
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. BEACH, M. FISCHER, M. LAWLESS, AND J. GROGAN REGARDING OBJECTING TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.8); FOLLOW UP DISCUSSION WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/23/04	Billeck, Jason	1.40	581.00	W400	11387829
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS AND T. VOGEL REGARDING THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.9) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH PETRINI'S ATTORNEY AND N. BEIZER REGARDING PETRINI'S CLAIM AGAINST THE DEBTORS (.5).				
02/23/04	Friedman, Peter	2.20	902.00	W400	11394684
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCUMENTS AND PRIVILEGE LOG REGARDING DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO				
02/23/04	Fink, Jessica	0.50	212.50	W400	11410793
	REVIEW AT&T SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/23/04	Lyttle, Eric	1.30	377.00	W400	11404326
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG				
02/23/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	5.20	1,690.00	W400	11352389
	REVIEW AND REVISE THIRD AMENDED NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON DEBTOR'S 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION AND SERVICE LIST (1.0); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL AND J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. HAMMOND REGARDING STATUS OF WEBBER WENTZEL CLAIM (.3); FORWARD CISCO ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM REQUEST TO HURON AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING STATUS OF ERS STIPULATION (.1); REVIEW CLAIMS SUMMARY REPORT (.6) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS AT HURON REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HOLMES REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF NETSOLVE CLAIM (.3); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES AND RULE 9019 MOTION REGARDING AT&T SETTLEMENT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH R. JACKSON REGARDING CONTINUATION OF NOTEHOLDER CLAIMS (.2); RESEARCH RECONSIDERATION OF DISALLOWANCE OF CLAIMS (.5); CORRESPOND WITH ATTORNEYS REPRESENTING CLAIMANTS SUBJECT TO 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING (1.0).				
02/23/04	Watkins, Claire	1.00	330.00	W400	11375870
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING BRIEF (.4) [WELLS FARGO] ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR RETURN TO STORAGE (.6)				
02/23/04	Grogan, James	2.40	876.00	W400	11392161

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER, M. BEACH, M. LAWLESS AND S. BAKER REGARDING OBJECTION TO SCHEDULED CLAIMS (.8); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF EIGHTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING NOTICE OF SAME (.2); REVIEW EXHIBIT OF CONTINUED CLAIMS RELATED TO EIGHTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. CHERVOKAS REGARDING PROCESS FOR FILING ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. VELEZ REGARDING HURON CONSULTING CLAIMS REVIEW (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. VERMETTE REGARDING PREFERENCE CLAIMS AND SECTION 502(D) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE (.1); REVIEW CASE LAW RELATED TO PRECLUSIVE EFFECT OF SECTION 502(D) ON PREFERENCE ACTIONS (.3).				
02/23/04	Devine, Kim	0.10	15.00	W400	11393615
	RETRIEVE MESSAGES FROM WORLDCOM CLAIMS HOTLINE				
02/24/04	Strochak, Adam	3.00	1,650.00	W400	11395534
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH S. MOONEY, WITH WOODRUFF, M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF CALIFORNIA SETOFF CLAIMS (1.2); PHONE CALL TO S. FELDERSTEIN AND M. MOSELY (STATE OF CALIFORNIA COUNSEL) REGARDING SAME (0.8); CONFERENCE WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING OPPOSITION BRIEF ON SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB CLASS CERTIFICATION (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. SCHEEDER (JENKENS & GILCHRIS), J. SPECTOR (MCI), C. WATKINS REGARDING SAME (0.5)				
02/24/04	Billeck, Jason	1.00	415.00	W400	11387817
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH MISSOURI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING ITS MOTION FOR SETOFF (.2); WORK ON DRAFT STIPULATION FOR MISSOURI (.5); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH DETROIT EDISON'S ATTORNEY, P. REYNOLDS AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING EXECUTION OF THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.3).				
02/24/04	Lyttle, Eric	2.80	812.00	W400	11404329
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG FOR WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
02/24/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	5.10	1,657.50	W400	11355970
	REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING SERVICE LIST FOR 8TH AND 14TH HEARING NOTICES (.5); CORRESPOND WITH T. LEWIS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. BLUE REGARDING ARKANSAS' AMENDED RESPONSE TO 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION AND REVIEW SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. UZE REGARDING DOUGLAS COUNTY LATE CLAIMS (.3); PREPARE STIPULATION REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING PRESENTMENT OF SUNTRUST STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW ADJOURNMENT NOTICE AND SERVICE LIST FOR HEARING ON 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.4); DO DILIGENCE ON TEACHER RETIREMENT SYSTEM CLAIMS (1.1) AND CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. LEVEE REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW ARKANSAS RETIREMENT SYSTEM CLAIM AND RESEARCH SUBORDINATION ISSUE (1.0).				
02/24/04	Watkins, Claire	11.00	3,630.00	W400	11375873
	[GOLDFARB] ATTENTION TO BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF CLASS CERTIFICATION (5.0); PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK, B. SHEEDER AND J. SPECTOR REGARDING BRIEF (2.5); ATTENTION TO BRIEF IN OPPOSITION OF CLASS CERTIFICATION (3.5)				
02/24/04	Taylor, David	1.10	319.00	W400	11397475
	WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM - REVIEW WHAT HAS BEEN PRODUCED AND REVIEWED AND REPORT TO P. FRIEDMAN.				
02/24/04	Grogan, James	3.10	1,131.50	W400	11393225

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. FAMATID REGARDING PAY PHONE CLAIMS AND TRANSFERRED CLAIMS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET SETTLEMENT CALL (.3); REVIEW MISSISSIPPI EDNET PROOF OF CLAIM (.4); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING CONFERENCE WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. LADOEN REGARDING ONVOY LETTER AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON EIGHTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.2); CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME AND REGARDING RESPONSES TO FOURTEENTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.6); CORRESPOND WITH C. ADAMS REGARDING DOUGLAS COUNTY PROOF OF CLAIM (.1); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING EXHIBIT TO NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT ON EIGHTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH T. TSEKERIDES AND S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ARKANSAS STATE RETIREMENT SYSTEM RESPONSE TO FOURTEENTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING NOTICES OF ADJOURNMENT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.2).				
02/25/04	Strochak, Adam	4.30	2,365.00	W400	11395505
	REVIEW TELCOVE MOTION FOR ALLOWANCE OF CLAIMS (0.2); PHONE CALLS FROM M. SOMERSTEIN (KELLEY DRYE) AND S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (0.2); PHONE CALL FROM B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF MESSAGEPHONE CLAIMS (0.2); E-MAILS FROM/TO E. BANNIGAN (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING ADDITIONAL DISCOVERY ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (0.3); REVIEW DAILY CASH REPORT IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS LITIGATION (0.2); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. STRAUSS (SIMPSON THACHER) AND B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING ABBOTT CLAIMS (1.1); PHONE CALL TO K. HULETT (ABBOTT COUNSEL) REGARDING SAME (0.2); REVIEW DRAFT OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION OF SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB ERISA CLAIMS (0.5); REVIEW SECOND CIRCUIT CASE LAW ON CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES (1.4)				
02/25/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.10	51.50	W400	11359915
	BRIEF CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS PROCESS				
02/25/04	Billeck, Jason	1.10	456.50	W400	11387813
	WORK ON DRAFT STIPULATION WITH THE STATE OF MISSOURI (.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING SAME (.1); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS, DETROIT EDISON'S ATTORNEY, A. STROCHAK AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION (.2).				
02/25/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11403415
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. BURNS REGARDING PRE-MERGER CLAIM				
02/25/04	Friedman, Peter	1.80	738.00	W400	11394650
	REVIEW PRIVILEGE LOG (1.4); PRODUCE DOCUMENTS TO OPPOSING COUNSEL (.4)				
02/25/04	Lyttle, Eric	0.50	145.00	W400	11404332
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG				
02/25/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.80	1,560.00	W400	11359891
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. ETKINS AND J. GROGAN REGARDING RESOLUTION OF SUBORDINATION ISSUES (.5); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING RESPONDING TO VARIOUS STATE RETIREMENT SYSTEM CLAIMS (.4); REVIEW INFORMATION FROM HURON REGARDING CONVENIENCE CLAIMS (.2); PREPARE DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION REGARDING LATE CLAIMS, AND CORRESPOND WITH B. UZE, R. GARCES AND C. ADAMS REGARDING SAME (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FELD REGARDING REVISIONS TO WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION AND REVISE SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); REVIEW FINAL AMENDED NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT FOR HEARING ON 14TH OBJECTION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ENTRY OF SUNTRUST STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING STATUS OF ERS STIPULATION (.2); RESEARCH SUBORDINATION ISSUES (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF ADJOURNMENT NOTICES (.2).				
02/25/04	Watkins, Claire	3.50	1,155.00	W400	11375876
	ATTENTION TO BRIEF OPPOSING CLASS CERTIFICATION.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/25/04	Taylor, David WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM - REVIEW PRODUCED DOCUMENTS.	3.90	1,131.00	W400	11398443
02/25/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH V. NGUYEN REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DEVINE REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. FISHER AND S. BAKER REGARDING CONVENIENCE CLASS ISSUES (.2); REVIEW EXHIBIT TO NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT FOR EIGHTH OMNIBUS CLAIM OBJECTION (.3); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING EFFECT OF FILING PROOFS OF CLAIM ON SCHEDULED CLAIMS AND CONVENIENCE CLASS ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING STIPULATION WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. RAY, E. MARTINEZ AND J. COAKLEY REGARDING EQUIPMENT AVAILABLE FOR TRANSFER TO MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING EQUIPMENT AVAILABLE FOR TRANSFER TO MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.3); CORRESPOND WITH K. DEVINE REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE CALLS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING DEADLINE TO FILE QWEST PROOFS OF CLAIM (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. PARKER REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH J. TROFIMUK REGARDING SAME (.1).	2.60	949.00	W400	11393228
02/25/04	Devine, Kim RETRIEVE MESSAGES FROM WORLDCOM CLAIMS HOTLINE (.1); UPDATE TELEPHONE LOG SUMMARIZING WGM RESPONSES TO CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.2); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN (.1); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GROGAN REGARDING UPDATES TO TELEPHONE LOG (.1).	0.50	75.00	W400	11390831
02/26/04	Strochak, Adam RESEARCHING LAW ON ERISA CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH BRIEFING OF OBJECTION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION ON SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB CLAIMS (3.5); DRAFTING AND REVISING OPPOSITION BRIEF TO CLASS CERTIFICATION OF SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB CLAIMS (5.8); PHONE CALL FROM C. WATKINS REGARDING SAME (0.1); PHONE CALL TO R. SCHEEDER (JENKENS & GILCHRIST) REGARDING SAME (0.3); PHONE CALL FROM N. WESELY (SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB COUNSEL) REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT OF CLAIMS (0.4); PHONE CALL TO M. TAUB (SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP COUNSEL) REGARDING MOTION FOR ABSTENTION AND MEDIATION OF CLAIMS (0.2); REVIEW E-MAIL FROM E. BANNIGAN (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING FURTHER DISCOVERY REQUESTS ON WELLS FARGO CLAIM AND E-MAIL TO P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (0.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. SHAIKEN (STINSON MORRISON), N. CHONG (KLETT ROONEY), K. BOLLINGER (MCI) REGARDING CLAIM OF SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP AND MCI COUNTERCLAIMS AND POSTURE OF LITIGATION (0.8)	11.30	6,215.00	W400	11395971
02/26/04	Baker, Sylvia CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING PAY PHONE PROVIDERS' CLAIMS.	0.30	154.50	W400	11403556
02/26/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK, M. LAWLESS, AND J. SALTZBERG REGARDING WITHDRAWAL OF THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S MOTION FOR SETOFF (.5) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH DUNN & BRADSTREET'S ATTORNEY AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE DRAFT STIPULATION FOR ASSUMPTION (.4).	0.90	373.50	W400	11388200
02/26/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH N. GONZALEZ REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.2); PREPARE NOTEHOLDERS' STIPULATION REGARDING ALLOWANCE OF CLAIM (.5); CORRESPOND WITH B. UZE REGARDING APPROVAL OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING ATRS MOTION TO RECONSIDER RECLASSIFICATION AND SUBORDINATION OF CLAIM (.2).	1.10	357.50	W400	11377585
02/26/04	Grogan, James	2.80	1,022.00	W400	11392360

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BURNS REGARDING WORLDCOM CLAIMS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GIBBS REGARDING TENNESSEE TAX CLAIMS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MITCHEL REGARDING USAC TAX CLAIM (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING TAX CLAIM ISSUES (.2); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING FCC RULINGS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MOORE REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW VARIOUS SETTLEMENTS RELATED TO SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING DEADLINE FOR QWEST TO FILE PROOFS OF CLAIM (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SALTZBERG REGARDING USAC CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING STAY ISSUES (.3).				
02/27/04	Strochak, Adam	5.60	3,080.00	W400	11395966
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OPPOSITION BRIEF ON SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB ERISA CLAIM CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES (3.5); CONFERENCES WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING SAME (0.5); PHONE CALL FROM N. WESELY (SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB COUNSEL), R. SCHEEDER (JENKENS & GILCHRIST), J. SPECTOR (MCI) REGARDING BRIEFING ON CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUE AND SETTLEMENT POSTURE OF CASE (1.1); PHONE CALL TO JUDGE GONZALEZ'S CHAMBERS REGARDING SCHEDULING ORDER ON ABBOTT CLAIM (0.2); PHONE CALL FROM S. COHEN REGARDING TELCOVE MOTION FOR ALLOWANCE OF REJECTION DAMAGES CLAIMS AND CURE AMOUNTS (0.3)				
02/27/04	Lyttle, Eric	1.60	464.00	W400	11402231
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
02/27/04	Watkins, Claire	3.00	990.00	W400	11383063
	[GOLDFARB] ATTENTION TO BRIEF OPPOSING CLASS CERTIFICATION.				
02/27/04	Grogan, James	1.70	620.50	W400	11392375
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH K. BURKLEY REGARDING STATUS OF XEROX STIPULATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET REGARDING STATUS OF STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ AND M. RAY REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. EPSON REGARDING JOHN HEALEY CLAIMS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING CLAIM ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING XEROX STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. TEITELMAN REGARDING IMAGISTICS INVOICES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH G. TEITELMAN REGARDING STATUS OF XEROX STIPULATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SCHEDULED CLAIM ISSUES (.2).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W400 - CLAIMS RESOLUTION & ADMINISTRATION:		508.50	\$ 189,150.50		
02/03/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.80	1,116.00	W420	11376956
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TOM GIGOT REGARDING ERISA 501(B) ISSUES; TWO TELEPHONE CONFERENCES P.FERRILLO REGARDING SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE GARRY GOTTO REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE LETTER.				
02/03/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo	2.30	632.50	W420	11310543
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. WEISS AND WHITE & CASE, REGARDING DISPOSITION OF AVANTEL, JOINT VENTURE BETWEEN BANAMEX/CITIGROUP AND MCI.				
02/06/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.60	372.00	W420	11382174
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STATUS OF MEDIATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P.BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2)				
02/08/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.00	735.00	W420	11324653
	REVIEWING ISSUES REGARDING R. BEHM INVESTIGATION (.5); DISCUSSED SAME WITH J. GOLDFARB AND H. GREGORY (.5)				
02/09/04	Jacoby, Mark	2.50	1,550.00	W420	11383693

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW FAX FROM G. GOTTO AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. GOTTO REGARDING. ERISA LITIGATION (.4); REVIEW DEBTOR'S INITIAL OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAIM BY VIVIAN PLAINTIFFS (.4); REVIEW FAX FROM PAUL CURNIN REGARDING NOTICE OF DEPOSITION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING MEDIATION AND ERISA BOND ISSUE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING MEDIATION (.3); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE B. BENJET AND H. RUMELD REGARDING MEDIATION AND ERISA BOND ISSUES (.2)				
02/09/04	Allerhand, Joseph TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY, H. RUMELD AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING. ERISA ISSUES.	0.50	367.50	W420	11324606
02/09/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND FINALIZE NOTICE OF DISMISSAL OF CAMPOS ADVERSARY PROCEEDING	0.20	110.00	W420	11397124
02/10/04	Jacoby, Mark OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH PAUL FERRILLO REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE (.3) AND MEDIATION (.9)	1.20	744.00	W420	11383283
02/10/04	Allerhand, Joseph INTERVIEWING WITNESSES REGARDING R. BEHM INVESTIGATION (2.0); REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING SAME (1.2)	3.20	2,352.00	W420	11324418
02/10/04	Ferrillo, Paul APPEARANCE IN BANK CT. WITH A. PEREZ AND B. BENJET FOR D&O ALLOCATION SETTLEMENT (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN ON D&O ALLOCATION SETTLEMENT (0.2); LETTER TO K. SAGAT ON BOND CLAIM (0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO M. JACOBY ON STATUS OF ERISA COVERAGE ISSUES (0.3).	2.70	1,431.00	W420	11323476
02/11/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED 510(B) OBJECTION; REVIEW OF OBJECTION.	0.90	661.50	W420	11324696
02/11/04	Allerhand, Joseph REVIEWING DRAFT LETTER REGARDING EXAMINER'S REPORT (ROYALTY PAYMENTS).	1.10	808.50	W420	11324690
02/11/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW ERISA OBJECTION	0.10	37.00	W420	11394896
02/12/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING MEDIATION SCHEDULING (.2); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING REPRESENTATION OF INDIVIDUAL DEFENDANTS (.2)	0.40	248.00	W420	11382870
02/13/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING MEDIATION AND REPRESENTATION ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING MEDIATION AND ERISA BOND ISSUE (.2)	0.40	248.00	W420	11384196
02/13/04	Ribaudo, Mark CHECK IN SDNY FOR DECISION FROM JUDGE RAKOFF IN TWIN CITIES FOR V. JOHNSON.	0.50	70.00	W420	11350012
02/16/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING REPRESENTATION ISSUES IN ERISA LITIGATION.	0.20	124.00	W420	11383853
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W420	11542388

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. MITCHELL REGARDING ATT				
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W420	11542399
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ATT.				
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W420	11542386
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING ATT (.2) CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. PETREN AND J. FINK (.2) REGARDING SAME				
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W420	11542387
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. PETREN REGARDING ATT				
02/18/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W420	11543124
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS				
02/20/04	Jacoby, Mark	2.00	1,240.00	W420	11387731
	MEETING WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING ERISA BOND CLAIM AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. KAM REGARDING ERISA BOND REQUIREMENTS (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE H. RUMELD REGARDING MERRILL LYNCH DEPOSITIONS IN ERISA LITIGATION (.7)				
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W420	11542478
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ATT.				
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W420	11542437
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. WOLF REGARDING ATT.				
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W420	11542460
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS				
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W420	11542493
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING ATT & REVIEW SETTLEMENT PLEADING.				
02/24/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.20	124.00	W420	11385536
	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DEPOSITION SUBPOENA WITH S. DIXON, WORLDCOM OUTSIDE BENEFITS COUNSEL.				
02/25/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.50	310.00	W420	11385119
	REVIEW DRAFT AND DOCUMENTS FROM DAVID STEUBER REGARDING PROPOSED MOTION TO FILE SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF ON INSURANCE RESCISSION ISSUE.				
02/27/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.20	124.00	W420	11385240
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING S. DIXON SUBPOENA AND COORDINATION OF REPRESENTATION.				
02/29/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.30	806.00	W420	11391899
	REVISE PROPOSED MOTION AND SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W420 - ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS:		27.40	\$ 17,001.00		
02/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W430	11366962

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS WITH MAUREEN DELUCA, CAROL POOLE, A. STERN, C. WATKINS				
02/06/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W430	11316930
	REVIEW STAMPONE RESPONSE				
02/06/04	Billeck, Jason	1.60	664.00	W430	11318084
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW STAMPONE'S MOTION TO A JUDGMENT AGAINST THE WORLD COM DEFENDANTS (1.2) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BRUNO, A. PEREZ AND R. RODRIGUES REGARDING SAME (.4).				
02/09/04	Billeck, Jason	0.20	83.00	W430	11334498
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BRUNO REGARDING STAMPONE'S MOTION FOR JUDGMENT.				
02/14/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.60	402.00	W430	11328683
	REVIEW PROPOSED CALIFORNIA QUI TAM COMPLAINT AND COMMUNICATION REGARDING SAME (.40), DRAFT LETTER TO D. SMORODIN REGARDING QUI TAM ACTION (.20)				
02/19/04	Billeck, Jason	0.20	83.00	W430	11353752
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH LOCAL COUNSEL REGARDING RESPONSE TO STAMPONE'S MOTION FOR JUDGMENT (.1) AND RECEIVE AND REVIEW GOVERNMENT'S LETTER TO DISMISS CASE AGAINST PRESIDENT BUSH AND THE SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE COMMISSION (.1).				
02/23/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W430	11395542
	PHONE CALL FROM C. ABOD (MCI) REGARDING TREATMENT OF PERSONAL INJURY LAWSUITS UNDER PLAN OF REORGANIZATION				
02/24/04	Billeck, Jason	0.70	290.50	W430	11387826
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW COURT OPINION DISMISSING STAMPONE'S LAWSUIT (.4) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BRUNO, G. COSTA, AND B. RODRIGUES REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/27/04	Billeck, Jason	0.40	166.00	W430	11388204
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW STAMPONE'S NOTICE OF APPEAL OF DISMISSAL (.2) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BRUNO AND B. RODRIGUES REGARDING SAME (.2)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W430 - NON BANKRUPTCY LITIGATION:		5.10	\$ 2,472.50		
01/08/04	Gregory, Holly	2.00	1,238.62	W440	11299289
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING FINAL GOVERNANCE DOCUMENTS (.5); REVIEW SAME (1.0); E-MAILS TO NICOLE JONES REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE GUIDELINES (.2); E-MAILS TO BETHANY COOPER REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE GUIDELINES AND CORPORATE DOCUMENTS (.3)				
01/09/04	Gregory, Holly	2.10	1,298.42	W440	11298884
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING PREP FOR MEETING WITH R. BEHM AND RELATED ISSUES (.8); REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING SAME (1.0); E-MAIL TO J. GOLDFARB REGARDING ROLAND BEHM SCHEDULE (.3)				
01/12/04	Gregory, Holly	5.30	3,332.72	W440	11301541

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MEET WITH B. COOPER TO DISCUSS BOARD AND COMMITTEE AGENDA FOR FIRST QUARTER 2004 (.5); REVIEW MEMO REGARDING SAME (1.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. GLEASON (NACD) REGARDING EXAMPLES OF ANNUALIZED BOARD AND COMMITTEE AGENDAS (.5); PREPARE FOR (1.0) AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, S. GOLD AND B. COOPER TO DISCUSS DIRECTOR'S COMMENTS ON VARIOUS CORPORATE DOCUMENTS (ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION, BYLAWS, ETC.(1.2); E-MAIL TO C. DIXON REGARDING MCI/BOARD ISSUES FOR 1ST QUARTER (.3)				
01/13/04	Gregory, Holly	0.60	377.29	W440	11301924
	VARIOUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. COOPER REGARDING BOARD DELEGATION/AGENDA/R. BEHM ISSUES.				
01/14/04	Gregory, Holly	0.50	313.88	W440	11301093
	MEET WITH B. COOPER REGARDING ANNUAL BOARD/COMMITTEE AGENDA AND DELEGATION OF AUTHORITY				
01/15/04	Gregory, Holly	0.70	439.36	W440	11300275
	MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND, B. COOPER, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES (.5); E-MAIL TO B. COOPER REGARDING COMPANY-WIDE CODE (.2)				
01/16/04	Gregory, Holly	1.50	934.24	W440	11307335
	REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING GOVERNANCE, DELEGATION OF AUTHORITY AND RELATED ISSUES; MEET WITH BETHANY COOPER REGARDING GOVERNANCE DOCUMENTS AND RELATED ISSUES.				
01/18/04	Gregory, Holly	0.20	124.56	W440	11303723
	E-MAIL TO ROLAND BEHM, JOSEPH ALLERHAND AND MARCIA GOLDSTEIN REGARDING TUESDAY MEETING.				
01/20/04	Gregory, Holly	0.50	305.70	W440	11302914
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BETHANY COOPER REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE GUIDELINES.				
01/21/04	Gregory, Holly	0.40	242.42	W440	11306148
	MEET WITH BETHANY COOPER.				
01/22/04	Gregory, Holly	0.20	123.75	W440	11309157
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BETHANY COOPER.				
01/23/04	Gregory, Holly	0.20	124.43	W440	11304272
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BETHANY COOPER.				
01/26/04	Gregory, Holly	0.50	310.45	W440	11303976
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARCIA GOLDSTEIN AND BETHANY COOPER REGARDING PENDING ISSUES.				
01/27/04	Gregory, Holly	1.50	930.32	W440	11309170
	REVIEW NEW MATERIALS RELATED TO CORPORATE ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.7); E-MAIL TO J. ALLERHAND AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2)				
01/28/04	Gregory, Holly	0.30	184.98	W440	11308183
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING MCI AND CORPORATE ISSUES				
01/29/04	Gregory, Holly	0.40	248.58	W440	11304474

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING GOVERNANCE (.2); MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND AND B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.2)				
01/30/04	Gregory, Holly	0.70	433.52	W440	11308982
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. DIXON REGARDING DOCUMENTS (.3); MEET WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.3); E-MAIL TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.1)				
02/01/04	Radin, Stephen	0.40	286.00	W440	11279850
	REVISE J. GOLDFARB E-MAIL MEMO REGARDING GOVERNANCE				
02/01/04	Goldfarb, James	0.30	127.50	W440	11303554
	DRAFT EMAIL REGARDING BOARD MINUTE CONVENTIONS.				
02/02/04	Gold, Simeon	3.50	2,572.50	W440	11305725
	PREPARATION (.1), ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES ET AL. (.7), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH D. HOLZMAN AND B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMERGENCE DATE, SEC FILINGS, ETC. (0.3); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON WG&M LEGAL OPINION FOR TRANSFER AGENT (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET AND D. HOLZMAN (.5) AND REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS (.3) REGARDING BANK/BONDHOLDER ELECTION RESULTS; WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILING (0.7).				
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W440	11342139
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING GOVERNANCE				
02/02/04	Green, Frederick	0.60	465.00	W440	11398550
	REGARDING MCI: ATTENTION TO RIGHTS PLAN QUESTIONS RAISED BY BOARD (.4); CHANGES PROPOSED (.2)				
02/02/04	Cooper, Bethany	4.00	1,700.00	W440	11386088
	REVIEW GOVERNANCE ISSUES (3.0); EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (AND PREPARATION FOR MEETING) (1.0)				
02/02/04	Goldfarb, James	0.20	85.00	W440	11302602
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING GOVERNANCE (.1); UPDATE J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.1)				
02/02/04	Nettleton, Stacy	0.50	165.00	W440	11320885
	REVIEW AND COLLECT DOCUMENTS REGARDING INQUIRY				
02/03/04	Gold, Simeon	4.80	3,528.00	W440	11305254
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JONES (1.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. DIXON, H. GREGORY AND B. COOPER (.8) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH C. DIXON AND GREGORY REGARDING CORPORATE MATTER (.4); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON WG&M OPINION FOR TRANSFER AGREEMENT (0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH JONES AND D. HOLZMAN (.6) AND FOLLOW-UP REGARDING SUBSIDIARY MERGERS (.5); REVIEWED COURT ORDER REGARDING SEC VICTIM FUND (0.3); TRADED E-MAILS WITH GEORGIA COUNSEL REGARDING MCI REINCORPORATION MERGER (0.4).				
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W440	11341620
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. GREGORY, J. ALLERHAND REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUE				
02/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W440	11341648
	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUE				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/03/04	Allerhand, Joseph TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL REGARDING GOVERNANCE	0.20	147.00	W440	11324525
02/03/04	Radin, Stephen CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDFARB AND S. NETTLETON REGARDING FIDUCIARY DUTIES	0.50	357.50	W440	11306608
02/03/04	Gregory, Holly MEET WITH B. COOPER REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES REGARDING INQUIRY AND REMEDIAL GOVERNANCE MEASURES (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. DIXON, B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.6)	1.30	780.00	W440	11392806
02/03/04	Cooper, Bethany REVIEW MEMO REGARDING IRAQI BID (5.0); REVIEW SHAREHOLDER RIGHTS PLAN WITH F. GREEN AND R. GIETZ (.5)	5.50	2,337.50	W440	11388904
02/03/04	Goldfarb, James MET WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON REGARDING INQUIRY (.8); MET WITH H. GREGORY, B. COOPER, S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.7); MET WITH S. RADIN, S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.7); SEND EMAIL J. SPEAR (MCI) REGARDING SAME (.3)	2.50	1,062.50	W440	11302529
02/03/04	Nettleton, Stacy MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING PRELIMINARY ISSUES (.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE UNDER SOXA (2.4); MEET WITH S. RADIN REGARDING PRELIMINARY ISSUES (.5); MEET WITH H. GREGORY, B. COOPER, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE RECOMMENDATIONS AND INQUIRY STATUS (.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. SPEAR, J. GOLDFARB, J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.9); REVIEW MATERIALS AND DRAFT INTERVIEW QUESTIONS IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEW WITH J. SPEAR (2.4)	7.50	2,475.00	W440	11320913
02/04/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION (.3) ATTENDED MEETING WITH J. ALLERHAND, H. GREGORY, C. DIXON, M. GOLDSTEIN AND B. COOPER (.8), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER (.3); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S NEW MCI CLOSING CHECKLIST (0.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. DIMINICH (DC) (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH JONES REGARDING MCI POISON PILL (0.3); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (1.2); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON WG&M OPINION FOR TRANSFER AGENT (0.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JONES REGARDING SUBSIDIARY MERGERS, ETC. (0.8).	5.10	3,748.50	W440	11302981
02/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH H. GREGORY, J. ALLERHAND, S. GOLD, B. COOPER, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING INQUIRY	0.50	387.50	W440	11342419
02/04/04	Gregory, Holly PREPARE FOR (.7) AND PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COOPER, C. DIXON, M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLD, J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING INQUIRY (1.2); PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONE INTERVIEW WITH J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB, S. NETTLETON OF JON SPEAR REGARDING SAME (.6)	2.50	1,500.00	W440	11393561
02/04/04	Cooper, Bethany MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING INQUIRY AND RELATED GOVERNANCE ISSUES (INCLUDING PREPARATION AND FOLLOW-UP) (3.0); REVISIONS TO AND DISTRIBUTION OF EMERGENCE TEAM CLOSING CHECKLIST (1.2)	4.20	1,785.00	W440	11386320
02/04/04	Goldfarb, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPEAR (MCI) REGARDING GOVERNANCE (1.0); WGM TEAM MEETING REGARDING INQUIRY (1.5); MET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (1.0); MET WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (1.3)	4.80	2,040.00	W440	11302628

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/04/04	Nettleton, Stacy ATTEND INTERVIEW OF J. SPEAR WITH J. ALLERHAND AND J. GOLDFARB REGARDING GOVERNANCE	2.00	660.00	W440	11320838
02/04/04	Nettleton, Stacy ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB, H. RUMOLD AND E. MCGHEE REGARDING EMPLOYMENT ISSUES (1.5); ATTEND MEETING WITH H. GREGORY, J. ALLERHAND, S. GOLD, B. COOPER, C. DIXON, M. GOLDSTEIN, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING STATUS OF INQUIRY AND WORK PLAN (1.5); PREPARE QUESTIONS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEWS (1.5)	4.50	1,485.00	W440	11320784
02/04/04	Welty, William REVISED INDENTURES, PREPARATION OF T-3	2.20	605.00	W440	11392146
02/05/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION (.2), ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES ET AL (.8), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING POISON PILL IMPLEMENTATION, ETC. (0.3); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S LIST OF POST-EMERGENCE ITEMS (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.4); FOLLOW-UP WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILING (0.5)	3.10	2,278.50	W440	11310458
02/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING GOVERNANCE	0.20	155.00	W440	11342257
02/05/04	Cohen, Scott EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL	0.60	240.00	W440	11315172
02/05/04	Cooper, Bethany EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (PREPARATION AND FOLLOW-UP) (2.0); REVIEW MEMO CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUES (1.5)	3.50	1,487.50	W440	11387835
02/05/04	Goldfarb, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPEAR, S. NETTLETON REGARDING INQUIRY STATUS (.4); MET WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING INQUIRY STATUS (.4)	0.80	340.00	W440	11313374
02/05/04	Nettleton, Stacy DRAFT SUMMARY OF INTERVIEW OF J. SPEAR (2.6); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GOLDFARB AND J. SPEAR (1.2)	3.80	1,254.00	W440	11320840
02/06/04	Gold, Simeon CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING MCI POISON PILL, DELAY IN EMERGENCE DATE (.4) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED DRAFT OF MCI CLOSING CHECKLIST (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEWED LATEST E-MAILS REGARDING MCI CORPORATE POLICIES, ETC. DRAFTED BY C. DIXON AND H. GREGORY (0.7); CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, F. GREEN, D. WHITTAKER AND M. SKARDA REGARDING DELAY IN EMERGENCE DATE, STATUS OF SEC FILINGS, ETC. (1.0)	3.30	2,425.50	W440	11316917
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INQUIRY	0.20	155.00	W440	11342551
02/06/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED ERISA CASE WITH M. JACOBY (.1) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING INQUIRY (.2)	0.30	220.50	W440	11324648

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/06/04	Fife, Lori MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES	1.00	715.00	W440	11384267
02/06/04	Radin, Stephen CONFERENCES WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING FIDUCIARY DUTIES	0.60	429.00	W440	11317771
02/06/04	Gregory, Holly E-MAIL TO C. DIXON REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE.	0.20	120.00	W440	11389973
02/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES	1.00	495.00	W440	11366854
02/06/04	Skarda, Michael REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF PROPOSED MCI CHARTER, BY LAWS, RIGHTS PLAN AND RELATED CONFIRMATION DOCUMENTS (3.8); MEETING WITH WGM TEAM TO DISCUSS MCI TRANSACTIONS (1.2).	5.00	2,300.00	W440	11337917
02/06/04	Cooper, Bethany REVIEW OF MEMO AND RELATED CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUES	2.30	977.50	W440	11385261
02/06/04	Goldfarb, James MET WITH S. RADIN REGARDING SECURING DOCUMENTS (2.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING INTERVIEWS (1.4); MET WITH S. NETTLETON AND J. SPEAR REGARDING STATUS (2.5)	6.60	2,805.00	W440	11320555
02/06/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW MATERIALS AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR INQUIRY (3.0); REVISE WORK PLAN, TIMELINE OF RELEVANT EVENTS AND LIST OF RELEVANT PERSONS (2.5); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. SPEAR, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING STATUS (2.5)	8.00	2,640.00	W440	11320850
02/07/04	Gold, Simeon REVIEWED HYATTE'S NASDAQ CHECKLIST SENT TO JONES.	0.50	367.50	W440	11316754
02/07/04	Goldfarb, James PREPARE FOR INTERVIEWS.	7.90	3,357.50	W440	11320562
02/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia EMAIL TO BERESFORD REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY	0.20	155.00	W440	11341542
02/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING MOTION AND BOARD ISSUES.	0.40	310.00	W440	11341541
02/08/04	Gregory, Holly E-MAIL TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING MCI.	0.20	120.00	W440	11391043
02/08/04	Goldfarb, James PREPARE FOR INTERVIEWS REGARDING BOARD ISSUES	1.90	807.50	W440	11320132
02/08/04	Nettleton, Stacy MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING STATUS AND WORK PLAN (.6); REVIEW MEMO REGARDING APPLICABLE LAW (3.1); REVIEW AND PREPARE MATERIALS FOR INTERVIEWS (3.1)	6.80	2,244.00	W440	11320852

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/09/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED CORPORATE INQUIRY WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, J. GOLDFARB, S. NETTLETON.	0.50	367.50	W440	11324440
02/09/04	Gregory, Holly PREPARE FOR INTERVIEWS REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (2.0); TRAVEL TO WASHINGTON, DC FOR SAME (3.0); INTERVIEWED E. SOSNITSKY, S. LEFRANCOIS, J. WALTERS REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.2); E-MAILS TO C. DIXON, J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB, S. NETTLETON REGARDING DOL-ALJ OPINION ON SOXA (.5); E-MAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING COMMITTEE CHAIR (.1)	6.80	4,080.00	W440	11392766
02/09/04	Cooper, Bethany REVIEW MEMO REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUES	1.00	425.00	W440	11384645
02/09/04	Goldfarb, James CONDUCT EMPLOYEE INTERVIEWS (9.5)	9.50	4,037.50	W440	11319161
02/09/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW AND PREPARE MATERIALS FOR INTERVIEWS (1.5); DISCUSS INQUIRY STATUS WITH J. ALLERHAND (.5)	2.00	660.00	W440	11334532
02/10/04	Gold, Simeon REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR EMERGENCE TEAM (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER AND BY-LAWS (0.8); REVIEWED C. DIXON AND D. HOLZMAN E-MAIL EXCHANGE (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING DRS/TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT (0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING 2/11 EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (0.4).	2.50	1,837.50	W440	11323686
02/10/04	Gregory, Holly PREPARE FOR INTERVIEWS REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (2.0); WITH J. GOLDFARB (AT MCI HEADQUARTERS) (.6), INTERVIEWED MARLIN FORBES, F. BRIGGS (1.0); E-MAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING COMMUNICATION WITH COMMITTEE CHAIR (.2)	3.80	2,280.00	W440	11391595
02/10/04	Cooper, Bethany REVIEW MEMO REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUES (2.5); REVIEW OF SHAREHOLDER RIGHTS PLAN (.5); REVISED ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION AND DISTRIBUTION TO N. JONES (.5) CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE (1.0)	4.50	1,912.50	W440	11385915
02/10/04	Goldfarb, James CONDUCT CLIENT INTERVIEWS	8.00	3,400.00	W440	11327248
02/10/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW AND ORGANIZE MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEWS (2.5); UPDATE TIMELINE (1.0); ATTEND INTERVIEWS OF M. FORBES AND F. BRIGGS (2.3)	5.80	1,914.00	W440	11334865
02/10/04	Welty, William REVISIONS TO FORM T-3, FORM T-1	6.80	1,870.00	W440	11383724
02/11/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION (.2), ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (.8), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH S. COHEN, A. YOON AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEWED LATEST E-MAILS REGARDING BONY/DRS ISSUES (.2) AND CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.2).	1.70	1,249.50	W440	11324316
02/11/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.50	1,102.50	W440	11324620

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (.8); MEETING WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (.7)				
02/11/04	Gregory, Holly	0.20	120.00	W440	11390559
	E-MAIL TO J. GOLDFARB AND J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INTERVIEWS.				
02/11/04	Goldfarb, James	2.50	1,062.50	W440	11326536
	MET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STATUS (.4); MET WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH EMPLOYEES REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, D. BERESFORD REGARDING STATUS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING STATUS (.4)				
02/11/04	Nettleton, Stacy	4.00	1,320.00	W440	11334912
	REVIEW AND UPDATE TIMELINE OF RELEVANT EVENTS (1.2); DRAFT SUMMARIES OF INTERVIEWS (2.0); MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING INVESTIGATION STATUS AND SCHEDULING (.8)				
02/11/04	Welty, William	4.60	1,265.00	W440	11383731
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI REGARDING T-3 (2.0); REVISIONS TO T-3 (2.6)				
02/12/04	Gold, Simeon	1.40	1,029.00	W440	11333790
	REVIEWED LATEST E-MAILS REGARDING BONY/DRS ISSUES (.2) AND CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING REVISIONS TO WG&M CLOSING CHECKLIST (0.6); REVIEWED CONSOB SUBMISSION SENT BY ITALIAN COUNSEL (0.4).				
02/12/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.30	220.50	W440	11344522
	MEETING WITH J. GOLDFARB TO DISCUSS CORPORATE INQUIRY				
02/12/04	Gregory, Holly	0.50	300.00	W440	11391615
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING INTERVIEWS.				
02/12/04	Goldfarb, James	9.20	3,910.00	W440	11338726
	DRAFT INTERVIEW SUMMARIES (5.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, E. MCGEE (PIPER RUDNICK) REGARDING NON-PRIVILEGED STATUS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. ARONSTEIN REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.6); TASK J. ROSEN WITH DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, PRIVILEGE RESEARCH (1.0); MET WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING PRIVILEGE ISSUE (.5)				
02/12/04	Nettleton, Stacy	5.30	1,749.00	W440	11335092
	DRAFT INTERVIEW SUMMARIES (3.3); UPDATE TIMELINE (1.0); MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB AND J. ROSEN REGARDING PRIVILEGE ISSUES AND REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS (1.0)				
02/12/04	Rosen, Jennifer	2.70	891.00	W440	11335101
	MEETING REGARDING OVERVIEW OF CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.0) READING BACKGROUND MATERIALS (1.7)				
02/12/04	Welty, William	2.30	632.50	W440	11387678
	PREPARATION OF T-3				
02/13/04	Gregory, Holly	1.30	780.00	W440	11393135
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. DIXON REGARDING GOVERNANCE (.3); RESEARCH/REVIEW REGARDING REMEDIAL MEASURES (1.0)				
02/13/04	Dixon, Catherine	0.30	226.50	W440	11389839
	DISCUSSION OF AUDIT COMMITTEE INQUIRY WITH H. GREGORY.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/13/04	Holzman, Daniel RESEARCHED MERGERS AND REVISED CERTIFICATE OF MERGER.	1.70	756.50	W440	11332451
02/13/04	Goldfarb, James MET WITH J. ROSEN, P. DUTKA REGARDING PRIVILEGE RESEARCH (.7); MET WITH S. NETTLETON, J. ROSEN REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW (.6); MET WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING SECURITY CLEARANCE AND INVESTIGATION (.5)	1.80	765.00	W440	11342086
02/13/04	Nettleton, Stacy DRAFT INTERVIEW SUMMARIES (5.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY E. SOSNITSKY (1.5)	6.70	2,211.00	W440	11335114
02/13/04	Rosen, Jennifer BACKGROUND READING. DOCUMENT REVIEW (6.7) RESEARCH ON PRIVILEGE ISSUE (.9) MEETINGS REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW (.4) MEETING WITH P. DUTKA REGARDING PRIVILEGE ISSUE (.5)	8.50	2,805.00	W440	11334556
02/14/04	Goldfarb, James READ AND REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMOS.	1.30	552.50	W440	11342112
02/15/04	Gregory, Holly E-MAILS TO J. GOLDFARB REGARDING FLIGHT INFORMATION.	0.20	120.00	W440	11398095
02/15/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY E. SOSNITSKY.	10.00	3,300.00	W440	11333177
02/15/04	Rosen, Jennifer REVIEWED CLIENT DOCUMENTS.	9.20	3,036.00	W440	11334162
02/16/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED CORPORATE INQUIRY WITH J. GOLDFARB.	0.20	147.00	W440	11344927
02/16/04	Goldfarb, James REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: GOVERNANCE (1.8); CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. NETTLETON AND J. ROSEN RE: PRIVILEGE ISSUES (.5).	2.50	1,062.50	W440	11342116
02/16/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY E. SOSNITSKY (1.9); MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB AND J. ROSEN REGARDING PRIVILEGE ISSUES AND STATUS INVESTIGATION (.5); DRAFT INTERVIEW SUMMARIES (1.8).	4.20	1,386.00	W440	11333193
02/16/04	Rosen, Jennifer RESEARCHING PRIVILEGE ISSUE (1.4); REVIEWED TREATISES ON PRIVILEGE (1.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. NETTLETON AND J. GOLDFARB RE: PRIVILEGE ISSUES (.5).	3.10	1,023.00	W440	11334081
02/17/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION (.1); ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (1.0); AND FOLLOW-UP WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN (.2); AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING CERBERUS/SILVERLAKE SECURITIES LEGEND ISSUES (0.5); REVIEWED PROOF OF MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.3).	2.30	1,690.50	W440	11341463
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W440	11542396

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY S. KELLY REGARDING GOVERNANCE				
02/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W440	11542385
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY REGARDING BOARD ISSUES				
02/17/04	Allerhand, Joseph	4.50	3,307.50	W440	11345120
	DISCUSSED CORPORATE INQUIRY WITH J. GOLDFARB, ET AL. (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN RE: SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MCGEE, EMPLOYMENT COUNSEL (.5); REVIEWING LETTER FROM COUNSEL (1.0); DRAFTING RESPONSE TO SAME (1.6).				
02/17/04	Gregory, Holly	0.80	480.00	W440	11398871
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND RE: GOVERNANCE (.3); EDIT MEMO REGARDING REMEDIAL MEASURES (.5).				
02/17/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W440	11341103
	DISCUSSED 10-K DISCLOSURE WITH S. GOLD AND LEFT RELATED VOICE MAIL FOR M. CHASTKA.				
02/17/04	Goldfarb, James	6.20	2,635.00	W440	11342122
	MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STATUS (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INTERVIEWEES REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. ROBERTS REGARDING SCHEDULING INTERVIEWS (.5); READ AND REVIEW INTERVIEW NOTES (2.9).				
02/17/04	Nettleton, Stacy	7.80	2,574.00	W440	11350697
	MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB AND J. ROSEN REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY STATUS AND PRIVILEGE ISSUES (.7); REVISE SUMMARIES OF INTERVIEWS (1.0); REVISE TIMELINE OF RELEVANT EVENTS (1.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM F. BRIGGS (.9); ORGANIZE MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEWS (2.0); REVIEW LETTERS FROM D. KATZ (1.9); DISCUSS INVESTIGATION STATUS WITH J. ALLERHAND (.3).				
02/17/04	Rosen, Jennifer	5.20	1,716.00	W440	11348818
	RESEARCH ON PRIVILEGE ISSUE (2.5); READ TREATISES (2.1); MET WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING STATUS OF RESEARCH (.6).				
02/18/04	Gold, Simeon	0.30	220.50	W440	11341785
	EXCHANGED V-MAILS WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE, TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS, ETC.				
02/18/04	Allerhand, Joseph	2.20	1,617.00	W440	11352584
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDFARB RE: GOVERNANCE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN RE: SAME (.4); REVISING LETTER TO OPPOSING COUNSEL (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD RE: SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY RE: SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MCGEE RE: SAME (.5).				
02/18/04	Radin, Stephen	0.50	357.50	W440	11340464
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB, J. ROSEN REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY ISSUES				
02/18/04	Gregory, Holly	1.60	960.00	W440	11394580
	PREPARE FOR (.4); AND PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONE INTERVIEW OF D. WEBSTER WITH J. GOLDFARB (1.2).				
02/18/04	Goldfarb, James	5.10	2,167.50	W440	11342920
	INTERVIEW WEBSTER (3.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON, S. KELLY (MCI) RE: WEBSTER (1.5); EXCHANGE VOICEMAILS WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING M. PACHMAN (.2).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/18/04	Nettleton, Stacy ATTEND INTERVIEW OF D. WEBSTER IN ASHBURN, VA. (1.0); REVIEW RECENT RELEVANT ALJ DECISION (.4); ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS (.4); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH H. RUMELD, J. ALLERHAND AND J. GOLDFARB RE: INTERVIEW (1.0); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. KELLY, J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB RE: SAME (1.0).	3.80	1,254.00	W440	11351202
02/18/04	Rosen, Jennifer WGM TEAM MEETING TO DISCUSS RESEARCH ON PRIVILEGE.	0.70	231.00	W440	11348810
02/19/04	Gold, Simeon REVIEWED LATEST CONSOB/ITALIAN MATERIALS (.2); AND CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.2); REVIEWED WG&M COMMENTS ON MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE AND D. HOLZMAN / M. CHASTKA E-MAIL EXCHANGE REGARDING SAME (0.3).	0.70	514.50	W440	11344515
02/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW VOICEMAIL AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS ISSUES (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.70	542.50	W440	11543031
02/19/04	Allerhand, Joseph CONDUCTING INTERVIEWS IN WASHINGTON, D.C. (7.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. BERESFORD RE: SAME (.6).	7.90	5,806.50	W440	11353152
02/19/04	Gregory, Holly E-MAILS TO D. WEBSTER, J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB AND B. COOPER REGARDING M&A PROCESS AND BOARD COMMUNICATION.	0.30	180.00	W440	11394301
02/19/04	Goldfarb, James EMPLOYEE INTERVIEWS (HIGGINS, ROSCITT) (1.5); MEETING WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.0); T/CS WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON, D. BERESFORD, M. PACHMAN RE: CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.5).	4.00	1,700.00	W440	11343667
02/19/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY INTERVIEWEES (2.4); REVISE TIMELINE AND LIST OF INTERVIEWEES (4.0); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. BERESFORD, J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING SAME (1.5); DISCUSS CASE STATUS WITH J. ALLERHAND AND J. GOLDFARB (1.0)	8.90	2,937.00	W440	11351525
02/20/04	Allerhand, Joseph CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL REGARDING STATUS OF CORPORATE INQUIRY	0.70	514.50	W440	11353156
02/20/04	Goldfarb, James REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING GOVERNANCE (4.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT REGARDING GOVERNANCE (.4)	4.80	2,040.00	W440	11348939
02/20/04	Nettleton, Stacy ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING STATUS OF CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.0); REVIEW AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM INTERVIEWEES (4.8)	5.80	1,914.00	W440	11351539
02/21/04	Goldfarb, James REVIEW DELEGATION OF AUTHORITY (1.2); READ AND REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMOS (.3)	1.50	637.50	W440	11348947
02/21/04	Nettleton, Stacy DRAFT SUMMARY OF INTERVIEW OF D. WEBSTER.	2.60	858.00	W440	11351540

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/22/04	Goldfarb, James REVIEW DOCUMENTS (4.4); MET WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.5); READ AND REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMOS (2.0)	6.90	2,932.50	W440	11348948
02/22/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY INTERVIEWEES (1.0); REVIEW AND ORGANIZE RELEVANT DOCUMENTS (1.0); MEET WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY STATUS (.5); DRAFT SUMMARY OF INTERVIEW OF D. WEBSTER (2.0); DRAFT OUTLINES OF INTERVIEW QUESTIONS (2.0)	6.50	2,145.00	W440	11351541
02/23/04	Gold, Simeon CONFERENCE WITH H. DICKER REGARDING SUBSIDIARY MERGERS (0.2); EXCHANGED E-MAILS WITH B. COOPER REGARDING REVISIONS TO CLOSING CHECKLIST, ETC. (0.3).	0.50	367.50	W440	11355927
02/23/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED STATUS OF INVESTIGATION WITH J. GOLDFARB (.4); INTERNAL MEETING TO DISCUSS CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.0); REVISING LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING D&O APPEAL (.5)	1.90	1,396.50	W440	11366710
02/23/04	Gregory, Holly MEET WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING INTERVIEW (1.0); MEET WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.4); E-MAIL TO B. COOPER REGARDING INTERVIEW NOTES (.1); E-MAIL TO J. GOLDFARB REGARDING MEETING (.1)	1.60	960.00	W440	11397190
02/23/04	Cooper, Bethany REVIEW OF MEMOS REGARDING INTERVIEWS (CORPORATE GOVERNANCE) (1.5) AND WGM TEAM MEETING REGARDING SAME (1.0)	2.50	1,062.50	W440	11387324
02/23/04	Goldfarb, James PREPARE FOR EMPLOYEE INTERVIEWS (2.7); WGM TEAM MEETING REGARDING STATUS (1.0)	3.70	1,572.50	W440	11356620
02/23/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELEVANT TO CORPORATE INQUIRY (3.9); ATTEND MEETING WITH H. GREGORY, J. ALLERHAND, B. COOPER AND J. GOLDFARB REGARDING STATUS (1.0); REVIEW RELEVANT DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE OUTLINE IN PREPARATION FOR INTEVIEW OF R. BEHM (2.5)	7.40	2,442.00	W440	11379193
02/23/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF T-3	1.20	330.00	W440	11384955
02/24/04	Gold, Simeon CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER (.2) AND REVISED WG&M CLOSING CHECKLIST (1.0) REGARDING 2/25 EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL; CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER (.1), TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA (.3), CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. HOENIG AND M. HOERNLEIN (.3), TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MASSAY (DTC) (.3) REGARDING DTC ISSUES WITH MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GILL (STROOCK) REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.9); V-MAIL TO F. GREEN REGARDING MCI POISON PILL, ETC. (0.2); V-MAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING 2/24 BANKRUPTCY COUNT HEARING (0.1).	3.40	2,499.00	W440	11357126
02/24/04	Allerhand, Joseph INTERVIEWS IN CORPORATE INQUIRY INVESTIGATION [EDGERTON/PACKMAN]	5.50	4,042.50	W440	11367202
02/24/04	Gregory, Holly E-MAILS TO J. GOLDFARB REGARDING SCHEDULE OF INTERVIEWS (.2) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH BERESFORD REGARDING SAME (.1)	0.30	180.00	W440	11397361
02/24/04	Cooper, Bethany	1.00	425.00	W440	11387326

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTION OF REVISED CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (.7) CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING SAME (.3)				
02/24/04	Goldfarb, James	5.00	2,125.00	W440	11356666
	EMPLOYEE INTERVIEWS (4.3); MET WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.7)				
02/24/04	Nettleton, Stacy	8.00	2,640.00	W440	11381129
	REVIEW AND ORGANIZE RELEVANT DOCUMENTS (3.0); REVIEW RELEVANT PROVISIONS OF SARBANES-OXLEY (2.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE OUTLINE FOR INTERVIEW (2.3) CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING SAME (.7)				
02/24/04	Welty, William	1.20	330.00	W440	11376415
	PREPARATION OF FORM T-3				
02/25/04	Gold, Simeon	3.80	2,793.00	W440	11367400
	PREPARATION, ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (1.1) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER ET AL. REGARDING CLOSING ITEMS (.3); CONFERENCES WITH B. COOPER (.3), CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. HOENIG, M. HOERNLEIN AND B. COOPER (.4), CONFERENCE CALL WITH WADDELL AND MASSAY (DTC), M. HOERNLEIN AND B. COOPER (.5) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER (.2) REGARDING DTC ISSUES REGARDING MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE; REVIEWED MCI CHARTER REVISIONS PROPOSED BY MCI'S HR STAFF AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.6); REVIEWED LATEST TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.4).				
02/25/04	Allerhand, Joseph	2.90	2,131.50	W440	11367213
	TELEPHONE INTERVIEWS REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (1.9); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. BERESFORD REGARDING INVESTIGATION (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.3)				
02/25/04	Gregory, Holly	1.20	720.00	W440	11394243
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING INTERVIEW (.4); REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMOS (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB REGARDING SAME (.4)				
02/25/04	Cooper, Bethany	1.00	425.00	W440	11387342
	EMERGENCE TEAM CALL (INCLUDING PREPARATION).				
02/25/04	Goldfarb, James	2.80	1,190.00	W440	11398013
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON, J. SPEAR REGARDING GOVERNANCE (2.1); MET WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON REGARDING STATUS (.7)				
02/25/04	Nettleton, Stacy	7.00	2,310.00	W440	11378160
	ATTEND MEETING REGARDING STATUS OF CORPORATE INQUIRY AND PRIVILEGE ISSUES WITH J. ALLERHAND AND J. GOLDFARB (2.0); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALLS WITH D. BERESFORD, H. RUMELD AND J. SPEAR REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE OUTLINE IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEW (4.0)				
02/26/04	Gold, Simeon	2.10	1,543.50	W440	11366798
	WORK WITH B. COOPER AND WELTY ON REVISIONS TO MCI'S TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.9); REVIEWED MCGARVEY'S REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER (REGARDING HR ISSUES) AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.6); V-MAIL FROM MELTON, E-MAIL TO GREEN AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING MCI POISON MATERIAL, LAZARD MATERIALS, ETC. (0.6).				
02/26/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.50	367.50	W440	11367236
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. SPEARS (.2); MEETING WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (.3)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/26/04	Gregory, Holly TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WEBSTER REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW (.3) E-MAIL TO B. COOPER REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW (.2)	0.50	300.00	W440	11397718
02/26/04	Cooper, Bethany CHANGES TO ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION AND COMPENSATION COMMITTEE CHARTER REGARDING J. MCGAREY'S COMMENTS (2.6); COORDINATION OF T-3 FILING (.9)	3.50	1,487.50	W440	11387406
02/26/04	Goldfarb, James EMPLOYEE INTERVIEW (P. WATERS).	2.60	1,105.00	W440	11398037
02/26/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY INTERVIEWEES (4.4); REVIEW RELEVANT DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE OUTLINE FOR INTERVIEW WITH R. BEHM (2.5) CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING CORPORATE INQUIRY (.3)	7.20	2,376.00	W440	11379537
02/26/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF T-3 FOR FILING	10.40	2,860.00	W440	11372951
02/27/04	Gold, Simeon WORK WITH B. COOPER AND WELTY REGARDING MCI'S TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MELTON (.1) AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING MCI POISON PILL (0.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING DTC ISSUES REGARDING MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (0.2).	1.80	1,323.00	W440	11391754
02/27/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING GOVERNANCE	0.30	232.50	W440	11543294
02/27/04	Allerhand, Joseph PREPARING FOR (4.0) AND MEETING WITH D. BERESFORD REGARDING INTERVIEW (1.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH H. RUMELD AND E.MCGEE REGARDING EMPLOYMENT LAW ISSUE (1.5)	7.20	5,292.00	W440	11401916
02/27/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO RIGHTS PLAN ISSUES	0.70	542.50	W440	11396194
02/27/04	Gregory, Holly PREPARE FOR (2.0) AND PARTICIPATE IN MEETING WITH J. ALLERHAND, D. BERESFORD REGARDING INTERVIEW (2.5)	4.50	2,700.00	W440	11395004
02/27/04	Cooper, Bethany COORDINATION OF T-3 FILING.	2.50	1,062.50	W440	11387606
02/27/04	Nettleton, Stacy PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW WITH EMPLOYEE (.9); MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND AND D. BERESFORD REGARDING SAME (.7); ATTEND INTERVIEW OF EMPLOYEE (2.0); CASE MANAGEMENT (.7); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING STATUS OF INVESTIGATION WITH EMPLOYMENT ATTORNEYS AND IN-HOUSE COUNSEL (2.0); PREPARE MATERIALS TO SEND TO D. SANDLER (.5); REVIEW SEC CONSENT DECREE FOR WORLDCOM (1.0)	7.80	2,574.00	W440	11377988
02/27/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF FORM T-3 FOR FILING	9.20	2,530.00	W440	11376438
02/28/04	Goldfarb, James	2.20	935.00	W440	11398816

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT EMPLOYEE INTERVIEW MEMO (P. WATERS).				
02/28/04	Libretta, Paul	3.30	907.50	W440	11369753
	RESEARCHED CORPORATE CODES AND CONSOLIDATED MERGER FORMS FOR OHIO AND TEXAS.				
02/28/04	Welty, William	2.30	632.50	W440	11376434
	PREPARATION OF FORM T-3 FOR FILING				
02/29/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.50	367.50	W440	11404372
	DISCUSSED CORPORATE INQUIRY WITH S. NETTLETON.				
02/29/04	Nettleton, Stacy	5.00	1,650.00	W440	11377159
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND DRAFT OUTLINE IN PREPARATION FOR INTERVIEW S. KELLY (4.2); MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.8)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W440 - CORPORATE GOVERNANCE/BOARD:		502.50	\$ 225,803.24		
02/23/04	Taylor, David	1.10	319.00	W460	11397980
	REVISE ATTACHMENT TO ASSIGN FCC LICENSES TO NORTHWEST PIPELINE AND FORWARD TO S. SNARR, OPPOSING COUNSEL AND S. SIMPSON.				
02/24/04	Taylor, David	1.50	435.00	W460	11398448
	PREPARE APPLICATION (1.1); CONFER WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL, CLIENT L. BIRKELBACH AND S. SIMPSON REGARDING SAME (.4).				
02/25/04	Taylor, David	2.10	609.00	W460	11398447
	DISCUSS APPLICATION WITH FCC (0.3); REVISE ATTACHMENT (0.8); COMPLETE ONLINE APPLICATION (0.8), RESPOND TO QUESTION BY D. GURARD (.2)				
02/26/04	Taylor, David	0.90	261.00	W460	11397976
	REVISE APPLICATION BASED ON OPPOSING COUNSEL COMMENTS (.5) AND DISCUSS PAYMENT OPTIONS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL (.4)				
02/27/04	Taylor, David	1.40	406.00	W460	11397496
	MADE CHANGES TO APPLICATION AND SUBMITTED APPLICATION (.9), WORKED WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL ON MAKING PAYMENT FOR THE APPLICATION (.5).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W460 - GOVERNMENTAL/REGULATORY COMMUNICATIONS:		7.00	\$ 2,030.00		
02/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W470	11342447
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. KAM AND L. FIFE REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES				
02/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W470	11342446
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN WITH L. FIFE REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES				
02/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W470	11342258
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING COMMITTEE CALL.				
02/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W470	11342260

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES.				
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W470	11342424
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING COMMITTEE CALL FOLLOW-UP ON 60-DAY EXTENSION.				
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W470	11342422
	SEVERAL CALLS WITH S. KELLY REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES.				
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W470	11342421
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, B. BLAKELY, L. FIFE AND CREDITORS' COMMITTEE REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES				
02/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W470	11341533
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING TERMS OF EXTENSION MOTION.				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W470	11342045
	CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING STATUS OF COMMITTEE POSITION.				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W470	11342043
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN (.2) AND CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN (.2) REGARDING SAME.				
02/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W470	11341878
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING CASE ADMINISTRATION				
02/18/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W470	11543176
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES				
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W470	11542496
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION MOTION.				
02/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W470	11543701
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS MATTERS.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W470 - COMMITTEE COMMUNICATIONS/MEETINGS:		5.50	\$ 4,262.50		
02/02/04	Youdelman, Sharon	5.30	2,623.50	W500C	11390704
	REVISIONS TO REVISED DRAFT INSIDER COMPLAINT [4.9]; CONFERENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME [0.2]; CONFERENCE WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME [0.2]				
02/03/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.50	247.50	W500C	11390449
	REVIEW DRAFT INSIDER COMPLAINT (.4) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME [0.5]				
02/11/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.40	198.00	W500C	11393349
	CONFERENCE WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING INSIDER COMPLAINT & REVIEW OF EXHIBITS				
02/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.90	445.50	W500C	11393830

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING INSIDER COMPLAINT [0.3]; REVIEW & REVISE SAME [0.6]				
02/18/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW & COMMENT REGARDING REVISED INSIDER COMPLAINT.	0.80	396.00	W500C	11389500
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W500C - AVOIDANCE ACTIONS:		7.90	\$ 3,910.50		
02/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OF EBBERS COMPLAINT (.8); CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.30	481.00	W505	11327602
02/02/04	Johnson, Virginia CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING EBBERS COMPLAINT.	0.50	165.00	W505	11293350
02/03/04	Johnson, Virginia REVISE EBBERS COMPLAINT (3.5); GATHER AND ORGANIZE EXHIBITS TO BE ATTACHED TO COMPLAINT (2.3); CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.7)	6.50	2,145.00	W505	11302146
02/09/04	Johnson, Virginia REVIEW EBBERS COMPLAINT (1.0); CHECK ALL EXHIBITS (.2); PREPARE FOR FILING (.3)	1.50	495.00	W505	11318395
02/11/04	Johnson, Virginia CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING EXHIBITS TO COMPLAINT (.2); REVIEW COMPLAINT (.2); PREPARE FOR FILING (.2)	0.60	198.00	W505	11322752
02/17/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCE WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING INSIDER COMPLAINT	0.70	346.50	W505	11390075
02/17/04	Johnson, Virginia REVISE EBBERS COMPLAINT (1.7); CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN RE: INSIDER COMPLAINT (.7).	2.40	792.00	W505	11336302
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W505 - EBBERS TRANSACTIONS:		13.50	\$ 4,622.50		
02/02/04	Lederman, Elana RESPONSES TO CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION.	0.70	231.00	W510B	11326212
02/02/04	Pullo, Christina RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM ELAW.COM (.2); HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS (.2)	0.40	110.00	W510B	11328521
02/03/04	Lederman, Elana RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALLS.	2.10	693.00	W510B	11326216
02/03/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS.	0.10	27.50	W510B	11328292
02/04/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITOR OF CASE REGARDING MCI ISSUES	0.30	111.00	W510B	11328599

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/04/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS.	0.10	27.50	W510B	11328524
02/07/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL TO WORLDCOM CREDITOR.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11328704
02/09/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL COMMUNICATION WITH CREDITOR REGARDING CASE	0.10	37.00	W510B	11328710
02/09/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS (.1) ; CONFER WITH J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING GEORGIA TAX ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM QUESTION FROM CREDITOR (.1)	0.20	55.00	W510B	11337047
02/10/04	Lederman, Elana RESPONSES TO CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION	1.30	429.00	W510B	11328397
02/11/04	Berkovich, Ronit EMAIL COMMUNICATIONS WITH CREDITORS REGARDING CASE	0.20	74.00	W510B	11328727
02/11/04	Lederman, Elana RESPONSES TO CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION.	0.90	297.00	W510B	11328438
02/12/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CREDITORS REGARDING CASE	0.20	74.00	W510B	11328733
02/12/04	Lederman, Elana RESPONSE TO CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING NOTICE OF CONFIRMATION	0.70	231.00	W510B	11327667
02/12/04	Pullo, Christina RETURN CREDITOR CALLS.	0.20	55.00	W510B	11338073
02/13/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER CALLS.	0.20	74.00	W510B	11397258
02/13/04	Pullo, Christina RETURN CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING CASE	0.10	27.50	W510B	11337033
02/17/04	Pullo, Christina RETURN CREDITOR CALLS RE: CASE.	0.20	55.00	W510B	11350714
02/17/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR QUESTION REGARDING REJECTION DAMAGE CLAIMS (.7); CONFER WITH J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING SAME (.2);	0.90	247.50	W510B	11350101
02/18/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS RE: CASE.	0.20	55.00	W510B	11350909
02/23/04	Berkovich, Ronit REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM CREDITORS REGARDING WORLDCOM.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11410327

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/23/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER CALLS.	0.20	74.00	W510B	11399198
02/23/04	Pullo, Christina RETURN CREDITOR CALLS.	0.60	165.00	W510B	11400161
02/24/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CREDITORS REGARDING CASE	0.20	74.00	W510B	11410340
02/24/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER CALLS.	0.20	74.00	W510B	11394670
02/24/04	Graham, Richard CONFERENCE WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING HERBERT LITIGATION.	0.40	148.00	W510B	11394789
02/24/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW AND ANSWER CORRESPONDENCE FROM CREDITORS (1.9); RETURN CREDITOR CALLS (.9)	2.80	770.00	W510B	11399981
02/25/04	Graham, Richard REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING HERBERT LITIGATION.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11394814
02/25/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS.	0.70	192.50	W510B	11401266
02/26/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CREDITORS REGARDING CASE	0.50	185.00	W510B	11411052
02/26/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW AND ANSWER CREDITOR QUESTION REGARDING NOTICE OF BAR DATE (.6); RETURN CREDITORS CALLS (.2)	0.80	220.00	W510B	11400017
02/27/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CREDITORS REGARDING CASE	0.20	74.00	W510B	11410709
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W510B - CREDITOR/VENDOR/CUSTOMER COMMUNICATIONS:		16.00	\$ 4,998.50		
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH G. DEFRIES, S. COHEN REGARDING NEW EMEA PROPOSAL	0.40	310.00	W520B	11341797
02/06/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSIONS WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING PROJECT & EMEA	0.50	200.00	W520B	11326409
02/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE WITH G. DEFRIES REGARDING STATUS AND FOREIGN ISSUES	0.40	310.00	W520B	11543621
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W520B - INTERNATIONAL ISSUES:		1.30	\$ 820.00		

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
01/20/04	Sipple, John PREPARER AND SEND AN E-MAIL TO COFRA REGARDING STATUS OF INFORMATION GATHERING.	0.10	59.34	W560	11293393
02/01/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM ASSEMBLY PROJECT	0.10	49.50	W560	11367187
02/01/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM ASSEMBLY PROJECT	0.10	49.50	W560	11367200
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING EMERGENCY/REPORTING ISSUES.	0.20	155.00	W560	11342147
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING UPDATE ON EMERGENGE/REPORTING ISSUES.	0.30	232.50	W560	11342138
02/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR (1.0) AND ATTEND MEETING WITH S. KELLY, P. CURNIN, N. JONES, SANDLER AND KAPLAN (DAVIS POLK) (1.0), CONFERENCE CALL WITH BLAKELY AT SAME TIME REGARDING EMERGENGE AND REPORTING ISSUES (.7)	2.70	2,092.50	W560	11341805
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING DOCUMENT COLLECTION	0.80	396.00	W560	11367240
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW DOCUMENT LIST FOR PRODUCTION ROOM	2.90	1,435.50	W560	11366932
02/02/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM	6.30	3,118.50	W560	11366931
02/02/04	Yoon, Andrew EMERGENGE CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.	0.40	170.00	W560	11306397
02/02/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, B. COOPER, A. YOON, N. JONES AND M. CHASTKA TO DISCUSS CHAPTER 11 EMERGENGE DOCUMENTS.	0.50	222.50	W560	11316107
02/02/04	Protopapas, Lydia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING M. PALMER'S COMMENTS TO THE PLAN ESCROW CLOSING AGREEMENT AND HIS APPROVAL OF SAME (.20); REVISE THE PLAN CLOSING AGREEMENT TO REFLECT SILVER LAKE'S COMMENTS AND THEN RESUBMIT SAME TO THE PARTIES TO THE ESCROW AGREEMENT (.30).	0.50	222.50	W560	11309781
02/03/04	Green, Frederick MEETING REGARDING EMERGENGE FROM CHAPTER 11 AND TIMING ISSUES WITH MCI	0.90	697.50	W560	11395910
02/03/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW DOCUMENTATION NEEDED FOR EMERGENGE (.20), COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BERKOVICH, S. COHEN, M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING DOCUMENTS NEEDED (.50)	0.70	469.00	W560	11309938
02/03/04	Taylor, David DOCUMENT REVIEW (3.4).	3.40	986.00	W560	11443397

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia ATTEND MEETING WITH COMPANY, ET AL REGARDING EMERGENCE, ETC. (2.0) CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN AND L. FIFE DURING TRAVEL REGARDING MEETING ISSUES (2.0)	4.00	3,100.00	W560	11342418
02/04/04	Fife, Lori MEETING WITH WCOM REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AKIN REGARDING PLAN ISSUES AND MISCELLANEOUS (.4).	1.40	1,001.00	W560	11384080
02/04/04	Cohen, Scott DRAFT MODIFICATION MOTION	4.10	1,640.00	W560	11314759
02/05/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO AMEND PLAN (1.2); CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.6); CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. COHEN REGARDING MOTION TO AMEND PLAN (.5); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE DOCUMENTS (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE INVESTIGATION WHITE PAPER (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME (.3).	3.70	2,645.50	W560	11384099
02/05/04	Cohen, Scott REVISE PLAN MOTION (1.6) INCLUDING DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE & M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CALL G. DEFRIES REGARDING GEMINI CABLE (.7) CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING PLAN (.6)	3.40	1,360.00	W560	11314782
02/05/04	Berkovich, Ronit DRAFT WHITE PAPER ON BANKRUPTCY ISSUES (2.7); COORDINATE WITH V. HARKER REGARDING SAME (.6) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.3)	3.60	1,332.00	W560	11328096
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING EXTENSION/COMMITTEE.	0.20	155.00	W560	11342553
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BLAKELY REGARDING EXTENSION MOTION.	0.20	155.00	W560	11342554
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BLAKELY REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES.	0.30	232.50	W560	11342423
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EXTENSION MOTION, ETC.	0.40	310.00	W560	11342425
02/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW DRAFT EXTENSION MOTION (.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN AND L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.00	775.00	W560	11342545
02/06/04	Green, Frederick MEETING REGARDING EXTENSION OF TIME TO EMERGENCE FROM CHAPTER 11.	0.80	620.00	W560	11395909
02/06/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS DOCUMENTS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (2.5) REVIEW MCI OPINION (.2)	2.70	1,930.50	W560	11384272
02/06/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W560	11326417

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PLAN MOTION WITH L. FIFE & M. GOLDSTEIN				
02/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W560	11342555
	CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING LATEST DRAFT OF EXTENSION MOTION.				
02/07/04	Cohen, Scott	1.20	480.00	W560	11326432
	REVISE MOTION TO MODIFY PLAN (.4) INCLUDING DISCUSSION M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.8)				
02/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W560	11341540
	EMAILS TO B. BENJET, S. KELLY REGARDING EXTENSION MOTION.				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W560	11341561
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EXTENSION TERMS.				
02/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W560	11342042
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH A. PEREZ (.4); B. BENJET (.3); S. COHEN (.3) REGARDING EXTENSION MOTION.				
02/09/04	Fife, Lori	2.60	1,859.00	W560	11382730
	REVIEW REVISED EXTENSION MOTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.2); REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS DOCS AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RELATING TO EFFECTIVE DATE (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING AUDIT LETTER (.2).				
02/09/04	Cohen, Scott	1.40	560.00	W560	11326436
	DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.4) & TELEPHONE CALL M. GOLDSTEIN & A. PEREZ (1.0) REGARDING PLAN MODIFICATION & DRAFT PROVISION				
02/10/04	Fife, Lori	3.90	2,788.50	W560	11383629
	REVIEW AND REVISE EXTENSION MOTION (.6); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCI, P. CURNIN REGARDING SAME (.8); CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE PRESS RELEASE REGARDING SAME (.5); EMAILS REGARDING RESTRICTIVE STOCK PLAN AMENDMENT (.4); REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND DOCS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (1.2).				
02/10/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.50	1,005.00	W560	11320154
	REVIEW REVISED MOTION TO EXTEND (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH L. FIFE, P. CURNIN, B. BENJET, S. KELLY AND B. BURNS REGARDING CONTENT OF THE MOTION AND TIMING (.50), REVIEW RELEASE AND REVISIONS THERETO (.40), CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. BARRACATO REGARDING PROPOSED EXTENSION MOTION (.20)				
02/10/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W560	11331912
	CALL WITH B. GOLDBLATT OF MILBANK REGARDING ISSUANCE OF STOCK.				
02/10/04	Cohen, Scott	1.20	480.00	W560	11326942
	REVISE PLAN MOTION (.5) & DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.4) & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.3)				
02/10/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11322191
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING THE ANTICIPATED PLAN CLOSING DATE.				
02/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W560	11341591

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION.				
02/11/04	Fife, Lori	2.60	1,859.00	W560	11384549
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WCOM AND S. COHEN REGARDING EXTENSION MOTION (1.2); REVIEW REVISED MOTION AND FINALIZE SAME (.8); RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6).				
02/11/04	Whittaker, Donald	3.50	1,732.50	W560	11387784
	REVIEW EMERGENCE PLAN				
02/11/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.70	297.50	W560	11322696
	EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.				
02/11/04	Cohen, Scott	0.80	320.00	W560	11326950
	ATTENTION TO PLAN MOTION				
02/11/04	Cohen, Scott	0.80	320.00	W560	11326953
	EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL				
02/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W560	11341876
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN				
02/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W560	11341877
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN				
02/12/04	Cohen, Scott	1.00	400.00	W560	11336753
	DISCUSSION WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING EMERGENCE (.2); DISCUSSION J. FINK REGARDING BANK CLAIMS (.5); DISCUSSION L. FIFE REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES & RELATED ISSUES (.3)				
02/13/04	Fife, Lori	2.50	1,787.50	W560	11382695
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN, J. FINK AND R. KOST REGARDING OVERSUBSCRIPTION (1.0); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE POHL REGARDING PLAN AMENDMENT (.2); EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING CERBERUS (.1).				
02/13/04	Cohen, Scott	2.60	1,040.00	W560	11336788
	DISCUSSION J. FINK, R. KOST & L. FIFE REGARDING OVERSUBSCRIPTIONS (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL M. CHASTKA & J. FINK REGARDING OVERSUBSCRIPTION (.7); DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & L. FIFE REGARDING OVERSUBSCRIPTION & EMERGENCE ISSUES (.5); DISCUSSIONS WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING OVERSUBSCRIPTION (.4)				
02/13/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.40	178.00	W560	11328746
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING PAYMENT OF INTEREST ON TRADE COMMITTEE CLAIMS AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.20); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. PALMER REGARDING STATUS OF THE PLAN CLOSING ESCROW AGREEMENT (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. PEREZ AND S. COHEN REGARDING BROWN, RUDNICK'S QUESTION CONCERNING PAYMENT OF INTEREST (.10);				
02/13/04	Fink, Jessica	2.50	1,062.50	W560	11411497
	FINALIZE AND FILE BANK CLASS 5 STIPULATION (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN AND M. CHASTKA REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS (.7); CONFER WITH L. FIFE, R. KOST AND S. COHEN REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS (1.0)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/16/04	Libretta, Paul CONSOLIDATED THE CALIFORNIA LAWS ON MERGER AGREEMENTS AND CERTIFICATES OF MERGER AS WELL AS COLLECTED AND REVISED FORM AGREEMENTS/CERTIFICATES OF MERGER FOR THE VARIOUS MERGERS TO TAKE PLACE UNDER THE PLAN UNDER THE CGCL.	6.00	1,650.00	W560	11348951
02/17/04	Fife, Lori PREPARE LETTER FOR KPMG (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING SAME (.3); RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.2).	0.80	572.00	W560	11383790
02/18/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WCOM REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.5); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.2); CONFERENCE WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING BANK OF AMERICA (.2).	1.20	858.00	W560	11383826
02/18/04	Marcus, Christopher RESEARCH REGARDING BANK OF AMERICA CLAIMS.	0.60	255.00	W560	11342310
02/18/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. COHEN REGARDING THE PLAN CLOSING ESCROW AGREEMENT.	0.10	44.50	W560	11343235
02/20/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3)	1.00	715.00	W560	11384084
02/20/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. JACKSON REGARDING REVISIONS TO THE PLAN CLOSING ESCROW AGREEMENT (.10); REVISE THE RELEASE AND PLAN ESCROW AGREEMENT AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO R. JACKSON REGARDING SAME (.30).	0.40	178.00	W560	11357141
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION.	0.20	155.00	W560	11542461
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION.	0.40	310.00	W560	11542475
02/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION MOTION AND MISC MATTERS.	0.60	465.00	W560	11542455
02/23/04	Fife, Lori CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (1.0); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.5)	1.50	1,072.50	W560	11384100
02/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN ISSUES	0.30	232.50	W560	11543716
02/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION (.3); ATTENTION TO MISCELLANEOUS ISSUES WITH COMMITTEE (.2)	0.50	387.50	W560	11543699
02/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.50	1,162.50	W560	11543718

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON PLAN EXTENSION.				
02/24/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.80	356.00	W560	11359156
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. JACKSON REGARDING REQUESTED REVISIONS TO THE PLAN ESCROW AGREEMENT AND TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE RELEASE (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JACKSON REGARDING CLARIFICATION WITH RESPECT TO SAME (.10); AND THEN INCORPORATE REVISIONS AND RESUBMIT THE DOCUMENTS TO R. JACKSON (.20); INCORPORATE THE FURTHER COMMENTS OF R. JACKSON INTO THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE AND THE PLAN ESCROW AGREEMENT AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO THE PARTIES TO THE AGREEMENT REGARDING SAME (.40).				
02/24/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W560	11393224
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BURNS REGARDING AMERICA WEST STIPULATION				
02/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W560	11543376
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTIONS.				
02/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W560	11543373
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN				
02/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.60	2,015.00	W560	11543378
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY (.6); D. GOLDEN (.4); T. SAVAGE (.8) REGARDING PLAN EXTENSION, ELECTIONS; CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.8)				
02/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	4.40	3,410.00	W560	11543366
	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON EXTENSION AND OTHER MATTERS.				
02/25/04	Fife, Lori	4.40	3,146.00	W560	11384457
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KPMG, S. GOLDRING, LAZARD REGARDING NOL ISSUE AND ELECTION (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE BREY REGARDING ELECTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE PALMER REGARDING ELECTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KPMG AND N. JONES REGARDING AUDIT LETTER (.8); REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLAN RELATED DOCUMENTS (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SEVERANCE PLAN (.2).				
02/25/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.10	67.00	W560	11376929
	REVIEW EXTENSION ORDER AND COMMUNICATE SAME TO B. BENJET				
02/25/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W560	11403404
	DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING OVERSUBSCRIPTION				
02/25/04	Protopapas, Lydia	1.10	489.50	W560	11386817
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. SAVIN REGARDING HIS REVIEW OF THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. PALAZZOLO OF DECHERT REGARDING REVISION TO THE PLAN ESCROW AGREEMENT (.10); INCORPORATE REVISIONS REQUESTED BY A. PALAZZOLO AND THEN RESUBMIT THE PLAN ESCROW AGREEMENT (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE TO TRADE COMMITTEE MEMBERS (.10); AND THEN REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.10); REVIEW FURTHER E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. PALAZZOLO REGARDING COMMENTS TO THE PLAN ESCROW AGREEMENT, REVIEW THE RELEVANT AGREEMENT AND THEN DRAFT RESPONSIVE E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO A. PALAZZOLO REGARDING SAME (.20); REVIEW FURTHER E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. JACKSON REGARDING REVISION TO THE SIGNATURE BLOCK ON THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE, INCORPORATE SAME AND THEN RESUBMIT SAME TO R. JACKSON (.20); REVIEW FURTHER E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM R. JACKSON REGARDING THE SIGNATURE BLOCKS TO THE FORM OF PLAN RELEASES AND THEN REVISE SAME AND RESUBMIT TO R. JACKSON (.20).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING ELECTIONS.	0.30	232.50	W560	11543274
02/26/04	Fife, Lori NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTION/TAX PLAN ISSUES (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES PALMER AND SAGE REGARDING ELECTION ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AKIN AND HOULIHAN AND LAZARD REGARDING ELECTION/TAX ISSUES (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES MILBANK REGARDING CERBERUS TAX ISSUES (.3); REVIEW DOCS IN PREPARATION OF CONFERENCE CALL WITH AKIN (.5); RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.4).	5.20	3,718.00	W560	11382597
02/26/04	Protopapas, Lydia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SAVIN REGARDING COMMENTS TO THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE RELEASE AND THEN INCORPORATE SAME (.20); DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. MCCARROLL AND D. ALBAUGH REGARDING THEIR REVIEW OF THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.10).	0.30	133.50	W560	11387559
02/27/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES AND CONFERENCE CALL.	0.80	620.00	W560	11543295
02/27/04	Fife, Lori NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. KELLEY REGARDING ELECTION/TAX ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6); RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.8).	2.40	1,716.00	W560	11384374
02/27/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. MCCARROLL AND D. ALBAUGH REGARDING THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS.	0.20	89.00	W560	11398958
02/28/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE AND D. GOLDEN, ET AL. REGARDING MCI DEBT ALLOCATION.	1.70	1,317.50	W560	11543311
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W560 - PLAN CONFIRMATION:		119.50	\$ 70,802.84		
02/02/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW WGM OPINION TO LC REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT.	1.90	807.50	W570	11306398
02/03/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW EXHIBITS TO LC REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT.	1.30	552.50	W570	11305963
02/04/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW EXHIBITS TO LC REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT.	0.70	297.50	W570	11304076
02/04/04	Goldman, Jeremy REVIEW OF VIRGINIA EASEMENT ISSUES (.1) AND DRAFTED EMAIL TO A. YOON REQUESTING DOCUMENTS (.1).	0.20	74.00	W570	11315347
02/05/04	Goldman, Jeremy REVISIONS TO MORTGAGE RELEASE DOCUMENTS (.1); DRAFTED EMAIL TO TITLE CO. WITH ALL RELEASE DOCS ATTACHED (.4); CONVERSATION WITH D. BERLYNE REGARDING VA EASEMENT ISSUES (.6); CONVERSATION WITH R. CHOZICK REGARDING VAEASEMENT ISSUES (.2).	1.30	481.00	W570	11315376

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/10/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW EXHIBITS TO FORM OF LETTER OF CREDIT REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENT.	3.40	1,445.00	W570	11320251
02/11/04	Goldman, Jeremy CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. YOON AND R. RESNICK OF WCOM REGARDING SUBDIVISION ISSUES IN VA.	0.60	222.00	W570	11334061
02/12/04	Goldman, Jeremy REVIEW OF EMAILS SENT BY A. YOON AND CHOZICK REGARDING VA RELEASE.	0.10	37.00	W570	11333319
02/13/04	Goldman, Jeremy REVIEW OF NORTH CAROLINA INVOICE IN CONNECTION WITH DIP FINANCING AND EMAILED SAME TO S. MORODIN (.2); READ EMAIL FROM A. YOON, REVIEWED VIRGINIA RELEASE DOCUMENT AND EMAILED SAME TO YOON (.2).	0.40	148.00	W570	11333655
02/19/04	Goldman, Jeremy REVIEWED EMAIL FROM NORTH CAROLINA TITLE CO. REGARDING SUBSTITUTION OF TRUSTEE DOCUMENTS (.1); REVIEWED AND REVISED SUB. OF TRUSTEE DOCUMENT (.2); DRAFTED EMAIL TO TITLE CO. REGARDING SAME (.2); REVISIONS TO BOTH NC SUBSTITUTION OF TRUSTEE DOCUMENTS (.3); REVISION TO CHECKLIST (.1).	0.90	333.00	W570	11348811
02/27/04	Goldman, Jeremy VIRGINIA DEED OF TRUST RELEASE: REVIEW OF EXECUTED RELEASE (.1); CONVERSATION WITH M. GLUCK (.2) AND DEBBIE ROBBINS (.1) REGARDING RECORDATION OF RELEASE; DRAFTED LETTER TO ROBBINS REGARDING RECORDATION OF RELEASE (.4); DISTRIBUTION OF RELEASE AND COVER-LETTER ELECTRONICALLY TO CHOZICK, GLUCK, YOON AND ROBBINS (.2).	0.90	333.00	W570	11394884
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W570 - EXIT FINANCING:		11.70	\$ 4,730.50		
02/24/04	Fink, Jessica PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO EXTEND EXCLUSIVITY (.5); DRAFT TALKING POINTS FOR HEARING (1.0)	1.50	637.50	W590	11410807
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W590 - EXCLUSIVITY:		1.50	\$ 637.50		
02/01/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH KIRKLAND REGARDING ALLEGIANCE LIFT STAY	0.20	134.00	W650	11306167
02/01/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SETTING OF LAHTI LATE CLAIM HEARING (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); REVIEW TRANSFER NOTICE FROM BSI AND CORRESPOND WITH J. NEWMAN REGARDING SAME (.2); RESEARCH JUDICIAL ESTOPPEL ISSUE (2.0) AND CORRESPOND WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2).	2.80	910.00	W650	11265984
02/02/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	9.20	2,990.00	W650	11301953

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING PREPARATION OF OBJECTION TO LAHTI MOTIONS (.2) AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SETTING OF SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. STEIN REGARDING MERCANTILE PARTNERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING APPROVAL OF ERS STIPULATION (.1) AND CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ AND J. GROGAN REGARDING MISSISSIPPI STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FELD REGARDING WILMINGTON TRUST INTEREST ISSUE (.2) AND BEGIN PREPARATION OF STIPULATION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN AND A. PEREZ REGARDING PREPARATION OF REPLY TO ALLEGIANCE'S OBJECTION TO LIFT STAY MOTION (1.0); RESEARCH SAME AND PREPARE REPLY (6.0).				
02/02/04	Grogan, James	8.80	3,212.00	W650	11315174
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE OBJECTION TO WORLDCOM'S MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.8); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3); PREPARE REPLY TO SAME (1.9); CONDUCT RESEARCH FOR REPLY (1.5); CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING ON MULTIPLE OCCASIONS REGARDING REPLY (.7); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER TO ALLEGIANCE (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SETTLEMENT OFFER TO ALLEGIANCE (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. FRISHBERG REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER AND HEARING ON MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.6); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER (.1); PREPARE EXHIBITS AND DOCUMENTS IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO LIFT STAY (1.0); PREPARE FOR HEARING ON SAME (1.0).				
02/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle	2.00	320.00	W650	11292241
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE LIST OF EXHIBITS FOR HEARING (.7), PREPARE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE AND FILE (.5), FED EX EXHIBITS BINDERS TO U.S. TRUSTEE, J. HENES, KIRKLAND & ELLIS, AND J. MORSE, HENNIGAN BENNETT (.8)				
02/03/04	Perez, Alfredo	3.70	2,479.00	W650	11306140
	REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE REPLY TO OBJECTION FORM ALLEGIANCE (1.5), COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. HENDRICKSON AND J. GROGAN REGARDING NEGOTIATIONS WITH ALLEGIANCE (.40), REVIEW PLEADINGS AND DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR LIFT STAY HEARING (1.8)				
02/03/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	2.50	812.50	W650	11310072
	REVISE REPLY TO OBJECTION TO LIFT STAY MOTION (1.9), AND CONFER WITH A. PEREZ AND J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.6)				
02/03/04	Grogan, James	8.90	3,248.50	W650	11315192
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. FRISHBERG REGARDING HEARING ON MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.4); CONFERENCE WITH J. MARTINEZ REGARDING EVIDENCE IN SUPPORT OF SAME (3.7); DRAFT AND REVISE LEGAL ARGUMENTS IN SUPPORT OF SAME (2.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING HEARING ON SAME (.4); PREPARE DOCUMENTS AND EVIDENCE FOR SAME (.8); REVIEW WORLDCOM'S REPLY TO ALLEGIANCE'S OBJECTION TO MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.4); REVIEW CASE LAW RELATED TO SAME (.7).				
02/03/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.50	120.00	W650	11303218
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
02/04/04	Perez, Alfredo	3.00	2,010.00	W650	11309718
	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND DOCUMENTS (2.0), PARTICIPATE IN ALLEGIANCE LIFT STAY HEARING (.80), COMMUNICATION WITH B. BENJET REGARDING HEARING (.20)				
02/04/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.20	65.00	W650	11307768
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING RESULTS OF ALLEGIANCE LIFT STAY HEARING.				
02/04/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.80	128.00	W650	11318277
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
02/05/04	Grogan, James	2.20	803.00	W650	11315207

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT AND REVISE SETTLED ORDER AND NOTICE OF SAME FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO LIFT STAY (1.2); REVIEW TRANSCRIPT OF HEARING ON SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING CLAIMS AGAINST ALLEGIANCE TELECOM, INC. AND CONTRACTS WITH SAME (.5).				
02/06/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.60	402.00	W650	11316926
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.30), REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED FORM OF ORDER (.30)				
02/06/04	Grogan, James	0.40	146.00	W650	11315220
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.1); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SETTLED ORDER ON HEARING TO LIFT STAY (.1); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.2).				
02/09/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W650	11334034
	DRAFT LETTER TO J. HENES REGARDING EXHIBITS TO MOTION TO LIFT STAY AGAINST ALLEGIANCE				
02/09/04	Larson, Michelle	0.20	89.00	W650	11334450
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. MENDEZ REGARDING EMERGENCE				
02/11/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.50	240.00	W650	11326884
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
02/12/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W650	11334046
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE PLEADINGS				
02/13/04	Grogan, James	0.70	255.50	W650	11334615
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE PLEADING (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF ALLEGIANCE CASE (.3).				
02/18/04	Grogan, James	1.40	511.00	W650	11353222
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET AND ORDER GRANTING WORLDCOM'S PROVISIONAL MOTION TO LIFT STAY (.4); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING ALLEGIANCE STATEMENT IN SUPPORT OF XO COMMUNICATIONS SALE (.4); REVIEW SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH C. CHEZEM REGARDING ALLEGIANCE LETTER OF CREDIT (.3).				
02/19/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.70	469.00	W650	11387041
	REVIEW XO OFFER FOR ALLEGIANCE AND OBJECTION FILED BY VERIZON				
02/19/04	Grogan, James	2.20	803.00	W650	11353225
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET (.2); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE STATEMENT IN SUPPORT OF SALE MOTION (.2); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE RESPONSE TO SALE OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW VARIOUS OBJECTIONS TO SALE MOTION (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING ALLEGIANCE SALE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING STATUS OF ALLEGIANCE SALE PROCESS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING ALLEGIANCE LETTER OF CREDIT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING ALLEGIANCE SALE (.1).				
02/20/04	Grogan, James	3.10	1,131.50	W650	11353228
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET (.4); CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT REGARDING XO COMMUNICATIONS SALE (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. ADAMS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT WITH XO COMMUNICATIONS AND ORDER APPROVING SAME (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. KUPIEC REGARDING DRAW ON ALLEGIANCE LETTER OF CREDIT (.4); REVIEW PROPOSED LETTER TO JPMORGAN CHASE REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING ALLEGIANCE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT WITH XO COMMUNICATIONS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING ALLEGIANCE SALE ORDER AND ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT WITH XO COMMUNICATIONS (.2).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
02/23/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW ISSUE RELATED TO DRAWING ON THE LETTER OF CREDIT	0.20	134.00	W650	11380552
02/23/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH C. CHEZEM AND B. BENJET REGARDING ALLEGIANCE LETTER OF CREDIT (.4); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT WITH XO COMMUNICATIONS, INC. (1.4).	1.80	657.00	W650	11393222
02/24/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE TELECOM DOCKET REPORT	0.10	36.50	W650	11392358
02/24/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11355512
02/25/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE TELECOM DOCKET REPORT (.1); CORRESPOND WITH C. CHEZEM REGARDING DRAW ON ALLEGIANCE LETTER OF CREDIT (.2).	0.30	109.50	W650	11393230
02/25/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11369381
02/27/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11368950
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W650 - MCI/ALLEGIANCE:		60.30	\$ 22,506.00		
02/02/04	Gordon, William CITE CHECK AND PREPARE TABLE OF AUTHORITIES FOR MOTION TO DISMISS	2.90	478.50	W670	11289760
02/20/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. SATYAPRASAD REGARDING CLOSING OF THE APPEALS.	0.10	44.50	W670	11357142
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W670 - APPEALS:		3.00	\$ 523.00		
02/05/04	Billeck, Jason DRAFT LETTER TO THE COURT REGARDING STATUS OF ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK'S OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY (1.7) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. TROPER, T. VOGEL, D. SMRODIN, AND B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.2).	1.90	788.50	W690	11318089
02/05/04	Grogan, James CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN DOCUMENT DISCOVERY (.1) AND STATUS CONFERENCE ON SAME (.1).	0.20	73.00	W690	11315196
02/06/04	Billeck, Jason WORK ON MATERIALS FOR COURT REGARDING CONFERENCE ON ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORKS' OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY (.7) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH G. MITCHEL AND B. TROSPER REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.00	415.00	W690	11318085
02/09/04	Grogan, James	0.50	182.50	W690	11334033

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN STATUS CONFERENCE (.3); REVIEW LETTER REQUESTING SAME (.2).				
02/10/04	Billeck, Jason	1.10	456.50	W690	11333769
	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY (.9) AND DRAFT LETTER TO COURT AND ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ATTORNEY REGARDING TELEPHONIC HEARING (.2).				
02/10/04	Lopez, Christopher	1.50	375.00	W690	11321355
	RESEARCH CASE LAW ON FAILURE TO COMPLY WITH DISCOVERY REQUESTS				
02/11/04	Billeck, Jason	5.90	2,448.50	W690	11333767
	PREPARE FOR HEARING REGARDING ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY RESPONSES (2.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S COUNSEL REGARDING ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY (.4); RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES (1.1); AND RESEARCH REGARDING THE ADEQUACY OF ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES (1.8).				
02/11/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.20	50.00	W690	11323190
	CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ ON 2/12/04.				
02/11/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.50	125.00	W690	11323191
	REVIEW DOCKET FOR THE BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE MIDDLE DISTRICT OF FLORIDA (ORLANDO DIVISION) FOR INFORMATION ON ATN CHAPTER 11 CASE.				
02/11/04	Lopez, Christopher	1.00	250.00	W690	11322758
	CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN SCHEDULING ORDER WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK TO PREPARE FOR SCHEDULING ORDER WITH J. GONZALEZ (.5); RESEARCH CASE LAW ON DISCOVERY SANCTION UNDER THE LOCAL RULE OF BANKRUPTCY PROCEDURE FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NY (.4);				
02/12/04	Billeck, Jason	2.40	996.00	W690	11334491
	PREPARE FOR TELEPHONE CALL WITH COURT AND ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORKS' ATTORNEY (.8); COMMUNICATIONS WITH COURT AND ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORKS' ATTORNEY (.5); RESEARCH REGARDING DEFICIENCIES IN ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORKS' DISCOVERY RESPONSES (1.1).				
02/12/04	Lopez, Christopher	3.00	750.00	W690	11325776
	ASSIST J. BILLECK WITH PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ (.8); CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ AND COUNSEL FOR ATN (1.0); RESEARCH ON VIOLATING THE AUTOMATIC STAY IN FLORIDA (1.2)				
02/13/04	Billeck, Jason	0.10	41.50	W690	11334495
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
02/17/04	Grogan, James	0.60	219.00	W690	11353317
	CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING LETTER TO J. FOSTER ON ATN DISCOVERY (.1); REVIEW ATN DISCOVERY RESPONSES (.3); REVIEW ATN DOCUMENT DATABASE (.2).				
02/18/04	Billeck, Jason	3.10	1,286.50	W690	11353758

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATIONS NETWORK, INC.'S ATTORNEYS, J. GROGAN, AND THE US TRUSTEE FOR ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATIONS NETWORK, INC. REGARDING STATUS AND DISCOVERY (1.8); AND RESEARCH REGARDING ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATIONS NETWORK, INC.'S BANKRUPTCY PROCEEDING (1.1); CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ RE: ATN DISCOVERY (.2).				
02/18/04	Grogan, James	1.40	511.00	W690	11353221
	CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK AND J. FOSTER REGARDING ATN DISCOVERY (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SUAREZ AND J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN CHAPTER 11 CASE (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK AND J. PARRISH REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.3).				
02/18/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.20	50.00	W690	11338917
	CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN DISCOVERY (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ (.1).				
02/19/04	Billeck, Jason	1.70	705.50	W690	11353751
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES AND DOCUMENTS (1.1) AND WORK ON LETTER TO ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK'S ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME (.6).				
02/19/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W690	11353224
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN BANKRUPTCY				
02/19/04	Lopez, Christopher	3.90	975.00	W690	11343792
	CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN RESPONSES TO THE DEBTORS' DISCOVERY (.1); DUE DILIGENCE REGARDING ATN'S DISCOVERY (1.7); DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR ATN REGARDING SAME (1.3); CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR ATN (.1); DRAFT CHANGES TO LETTER (.7).				
02/20/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.30	75.00	W690	11345479
	REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR ATN REGARDING ATN'S RESPONSES TO THE DEBTORS' DISCOVERY				
02/20/04	Staskus, Sandra	0.20	33.00	W690	11347734
	DOWNLOAD AND PRINT CASE EMAILS FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE.				
02/23/04	Grogan, James	0.60	219.00	W690	11392132
	REVIEW AND REVISE LETTER TO J. FOSTER REGARDING ATN DISCOVERY RESPONSES (.2); REVIEW ATN'S BANKRUPTCY SCHEDULES (.4).				
02/24/04	Grogan, James	1.60	584.00	W690	11393226
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING ATN BANKRUPTCY (.1); PREPARE AND REVISE MOTION TO LIFT STAY IN ATN CHAPTER 11 CASE (1.5).				
02/25/04	Billeck, Jason	0.90	373.50	W690	11387814
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CYPRESS ATTORNEY, J. GROGAN, B. TROSPER AND B. BENJET REGARDING STATUS OF CYPRESS/ATN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING.				
02/25/04	Grogan, James	2.30	839.50	W690	11393229

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING ATN CHAPTER 11 CASE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING EFFECT OF AUTOMATIC STAY ON ATN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING EXTENSION OF ANSWER DATE FOR CYPRESS COMMUNICATIONS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING ATN CHAPTER 11 CASE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING ATN CHAPTER 11 CASE (.4); DRAFT AND REVISE ATN MOTION TO LIFT STAY (1.2).				
02/25/04	Wright, Sherri	1.50	135.00	W690	11358827
	SORT AND ORGANIZE FILE MATERIALS, E-MAILS AND CORRESPONDENCE.				
02/26/04	Wright, Sherri	0.50	45.00	W690	11363641
	CREATE FILE OUTLINE IN PREPARATION FOR SETTING UP THIS CASE INTO FILE FORM.				
02/27/04	Grogan, James	0.70	255.50	W690	11392377
	REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT FILED IN ATN BANKRUPTCY CASE (.5); CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK AND N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.2).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W690 - ATN:		39.00	\$ 13,331.00		
02/03/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.30	111.00	W700	11328955
	COORDINATE TO ENSURE N. JONES RECEIVES KPMG DOCUMENTS.				
02/05/04	Johnson, Virginia	2.20	726.00	W700	11303624
	REVIEW THIRD AND FINAL REPORT OF D. THORNBURGH, BANKRUPTCY COURT EXAMINER.				
02/06/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.20	74.00	W700	11328115
	ENSURE N. JONES RECEIVED ALL KPMG DOCUMENTS.				
02/11/04	Strochak, Adam	1.40	770.00	W700	11396874
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT LETTER REGARDING KPMG CLAIMS IDENTIFIED IN EXAMINER'S REPORT (1.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (0.3)				
02/12/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W700	11394227
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM P. ESKILDSEN AND S. KELLY (MCI) REGARDING DRAFT LETTER TO AUDIT COMMITTEE REGARDING KPMG				
02/12/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.30	97.50	W700	11443410
	REVIEW EXAMINER'S FINAL REPORT				
02/13/04	Strochak, Adam	2.00	1,100.00	W700	11394237
	REVISE AND FINALIZE LETTER FOR MCI AUDIT COMMITTEE REGARDING KPMG IDENTIFIED IN EXAMINER'S FINAL REPORT (1.8); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM P. ESKILDSEN (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
02/13/04	Friedman, Peter	0.40	164.00	W700	11394590
	REVIEW FINAL VERSION OF LETTER TO WORLDCOM RELATED TO EXAMINER INVESTIGATION AND KPMG CLAIMS				
02/17/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W700	11394225
	PHONE CALLS FROM/TO P. ESKILDSEN (MCI) REGARDING KPMG RELATING TO TAX ADVICE (0.2); PHONE CALL TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
02/17/04	King, Kristin	4.50	1,732.50	W700	11387011

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARE SUMMARY OF EXAMINER INTERVIEW OF D. RICHARDS.				
02/18/04	Strochak, Adam	0.90	495.00	W700	11394097
	DRAFT LETTER TO KPMG REGARDING CLAIMS IDENTIFIED BY EXAMINER IN FINAL REPORT (0.8); E-MAIL TO J. ALLERHAND, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
02/18/04	King, Kristin	3.70	1,424.50	W700	11386176
	COMPLETE SUMMARY OF EXAMINER INTERVIEW OF DOUG RICHARDS.				
02/19/04	Strochak, Adam	0.80	440.00	W700	11394093
	REVISE DRAFT LETTER TO KPMG (0.5); E-MAILS TO/FROM J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (0.1); E-MAILS AND PHONE CALLS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING SUBPOENA SERVED ON KPMG (0.2)				
02/20/04	Strochak, Adam	0.10	55.00	W700	11394240
	E-MAIL TO P. ESKILDSEN (MCI) REGARDING KPMG LETTER				
02/23/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W700	11398621
	PHONE CALL TO D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING EXAMINER PRIVILEGE ORDER AND APPLICABILITY TO STATE TAX INVESTIGATIONS				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W700 - EXAMINER INVESTIGATION:		17.80	\$ 7,739.50		
GRAND TOTAL:		3,484.50	\$ 1,263,345.31		

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/01/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET [0.1]; REVIEW CASE CALENDAR [0.1]	0.20	\$ 99.00	W110	11525711
03/01/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS TO G. MITCHEL REGARDING AGENDA FOR MARCH 2 HEARING	0.30	165.00	W110	11489071
03/01/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. BYRNES AND M. TOM REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARINGS (.10), REVIEW AND FINALIZE AGENDA FOR MARCH 2ND (.80), REVIEW PAPERS AND DOCUMENTS FOR HEARINGS ON MARCH 2ND (.40)	1.30	871.00	W110	11418484
03/01/04	Grogan, James REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET REPORT	0.10	36.50	W110	11427502
03/01/04	Pasion, Luis OBTAINED DOCUMENT# 137 - ORDER ENTERED 2-23-04 UNDER 02 CV 4963, USDC, SDNY.	1.00	110.00	W110	11400009
03/01/04	Reifman, Marli EDIT AND ORGANIZE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR INTERMEDIA SEARCH FOR E. LYTTLE (4.0); FILE AND SERVE MEMORANDUM OF LAW OPPOSING GOLDFARB CLAIM FOR C. WATKINS (1.5)	5.50	715.00	W110	11491909
03/01/04	Devine, Kim REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND CHART DUE DATES.	1.60	240.00	W110	11455975
03/01/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W110	11417313
03/01/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (9.0); EMAIL COMMUNICATION FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF SQUIRE SANDERS 1ST FEE APP HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM L. STEEL, WILSON ELSNER, REGARDING FEE STATEMENT FORMAT (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. WRONSKY, LCC, REGARDING UST'S OBJECTION REFERENCE TO LCC REPORT AND CONFIRMATION OF 2ND INTERIM PERIOD APPLICATION ADJOURNMENTS (.2); SEARCH ON-LINE CALENDAR FOR SETTING FOR ARKANSAS TEACHERS RETIREMENT SYSTEM MOTION TO RECONSIDER RECLASSIFICATION WITH EMAIL OF 3/9 HEARING TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR ORDER GRANTING MOTION TO POSTPONE EFFECTIVE DATE AND TRANSMIT SAME TO S. LOFTSPRING (.2); TELEPHONE CALLS TO J. THOMPSON REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF 2 ADVERSARY CONFERENCES FROM 3/2/04 HEARING CALENDAR (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN MOTOROLA ADV. 03-2169 CONFERENCE TO 3/9/04 WITH EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO J. THOMPSON (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. FINK REGARDING OBTAINING LCC REPORT REFERENCED IN UST'S OBJECTION, TRANSMIT DEBTORS' REPORT AND RECOMMENDATIONS REGARDING 2ND INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS TO HER (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN ZINSMEISTER PROOF OF CLAIM OBJECTION TO 4/6/04 WITH EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO J. THOMPSON AND J. HARRINGTON, JENNER & BLOCK (.1); REPLY TO EMAIL REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE MOTIONS HEARINGS FROM S. LOFTSPRING AFTER CALENDAR AND DOCKET SEARCH (.3); TRANSMIT COPY OF AT&T RULE 9019 MOTION TO B. BENJET, MCI, AT REQUEST OF A. PEREZ (.1); REVISIONS TO 3/2/04 HEARING CHART, NOTICE OF AGENDA AND TIME GRID, TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME, TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME, SUBMISSION TO CHAMBERS, REVISE IN ACCORDANCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ' INSTURCTIONS, FILE AND SERVE SAME, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW SITE, DISTRIBUTE FINAL FILED COPY TO INVOLVED ATTORNEYS (4.1); UPDATE CASE CALENDARS FOR MARCH, APRIL AND MAY 2004 (1.2); START DRAFT OF 3/9/04 HEARING CHART (1.1).	9.20	1,472.00	W110	11417312
03/01/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL.	0.60	90.00	W110	11464414
03/01/04	Jalomo, Chris	4.00	320.00	W110	11424132

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CREATE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE DOCUMENTS REGARDING MULTIPLE MOTIONS (1.0); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (2.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0).				
03/02/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525726
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/02/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.50	1,675.00	W110	11418473
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN HEARINGS BEFORE JUDGE GONZALEZ INCLUDING AT&T 9019 (2.5)				
03/02/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W110	11427658
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET REPORT				
03/02/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	9.50	1,235.00	W110	11504674
	INDEX AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM PROJECT FOR A. STROCHAK				
03/02/04	Reifman, Marli	2.60	338.00	W110	11491912
	EDIT AND ORGANIZE PRIVILEGE LOG FOR INTERMEDIA SEARCH FOR E LYTTLE				
03/02/04	Devine, Kim	3.00	450.00	W110	11455973
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND CHART DUE DATES (2.0); SEARCH DOCKET TO CONFIRM DOCKET ENTRY OF VARIOUS STIPULATIONS (1.0)				
03/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W110	11417069
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle	6.70	1,072.00	W110	11417068
	RETRIEVE TELEPHONE MESSAGES AND RETURN TELEPHONE CALLS TO R. BERKOVICH, M. SHAIKEN, STINSON MORRISON AND M. TAYLOR, DELOITTE & TOUCHE (.3); REVIEW PROPOSED WILSON ELSER FEE STATEMENT FOR 9/2003 THRU 1/2004 AND EMAIL COMMENTS TO L. STEEL (.5); RESPOND TO N. CHONG, KLETT ROONEY, EMAIL REGARDING LCC (FOILEY & LARDNER) LETTER AND UST OBJECTIONS RESPONSE DATE, TELEPHONE CALL TO C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.2); PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE RESPONSE OF CROWELL & MORING LLP TO THE UST OBJECTION (.5); MEET WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING FINALIZATION OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER, PREPARE SAME FOR HANDING UP AT 3/9/04 HEARING (.7); DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.6); SEARCH DOCKET FOR LOWE ENTERPRISES MOTION TO FILE LATE PROOF OF CLAIM AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING AMENDED SUNTRUST BANK ORDER (.2); PREPARE AND FILE MULTIPLE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE FOR RECENTLY DOCKETED PLEADINGS (1.4); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN SIGNED XEROX CAPITAL SERVICES ORDER, TRANSMIT SAME TO N. BEIZER, C. MATERS AND G. TEITELMAN, MCI, AS HIS REQUEST (.3); UPDATE CASE CALENDARS FOR MARCH AND APRIL (.5); CONTINUED WORK ON 3/9/04 HEARING CHART (.2).				
03/02/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	0.30	45.00	W110	11464415
	SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL.				
03/02/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11424049
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/02/04	Jalomo, Chris	4.50	360.00	W110	11424050
	CREATE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE DOCUMENTS REGARDING MULTIPLE MOTIONS (3.0); REWRITE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE DELOITTE'S FEE STATEMENT DOCUMENTS IN PDF FORMAT AS REQUESTED BY G. MITCHELL (1.5).				
03/03/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525643

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/03/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W110	11428119
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET				
03/03/04	Devine, Kim	1.40	210.00	W110	11514344
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND CHART DUE DATES.				
03/03/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.50	1,360.00	W110	11417071
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM N. CHONG, KLETT ROONEY THAT FORMAL RESPONSE TO UST OBJECTION NEEDS TO BE FILED BY 3/4/04 (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN AMENDED MOTION FOR CLASS CERTIFICATION OF SETTLEMENT CLASS CLAIMANTS AND OBJECTION TO PROOF OF CLAIM OF WM. KIMBALL TO 4/6/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK (.1); TRANSMIT COPY OF TELCOVE ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE MOTION TO J. THOMPSON AT HIS REQUEST (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN T-NETIX PROOF OF CLAIM OBJECTION HEARINT TO 4/6/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. HSU (.1); PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE RESPONSE OF HOWREY SIMON TO UST'S OBJECTION TO 2ND INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS (.6); SERVE WELLS FARGO SETTLEMENT NOTICE (.5); REVISE 3/9/04 HEARING CHART, DRAFT 3/9/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA (6.1).				
03/03/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	2.80	420.00	W110	11492349
	SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.3); RETRIEVE PLEADING REGARDING DITTHAVONG FOR R. BERKOVICH AND E-MAIL SAME (0.3); ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCES AND PLEADINGS INTO FILING SYSTEM (1.2).				
03/03/04	Jalomo, Chris	3.50	280.00	W110	11424134
	REWRITE HELLER FEE STATEMENT DOCUMENTS IN PDF FORMAT AS REQUESTED BY G. MITCHELL (1.5); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (2.0).				
03/04/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525738
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/04/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W110	11428093
	REVIEW WORLDCOM CASE DOCKET				
03/04/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.00	1,280.00	W110	11417560
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.6); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SOUTH FLORIDA REGIONAL TRANSPORTATION AUTHORITY RULE 2004 MOTION TO 4/6/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAILS TO S.E. COHEN AND A. STROCHAK (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO M. REIFMAN CONFIRMING EARLY ADVERSARY SERVICE (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN CROSS-MOTION OF IMATGISTICS INTERNATIONAL TO 4/9/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO L. TAYLOR, DUANE MORRIS, AND J. GROGAN (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN ARKANSAS TEACHER'S RETIREMENT SYSTEM MOTION TO RECONSIDER RECLASSIFICATION TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S. LOFTSPRING (.1); PREPARE NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT ON IMAGISTICS CROSS-MOTION WITH REVIEW BY J. GROGAN, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE SAME WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. GROGAN (.7); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP PRE-TRIAL CONFERENCE TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK (.1); SEARCH DOCKET FOR TAX STIPULATIONS FOR STATES ALLOWING FOR LATE CLAIM FILING FOR A. STROCHAK, PREPARE LIST AND TRANSMIT LIST AND PDF'S OF STIUPLATIONS (1.6); SEARCH DOCKET FOR AT&T RULE 9019 ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR 3-TIRED SETTLEMENT ORDER FOR J. GROGAN AND TRANSMIT TO N. HELLER, KRAMER LEVIN (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. STROCHAK REGARDING GRAYSON EX REL. HEARING DATE, ONLINE SEARCH AND REPLY EMAIL THAT HEARING SET FOR 3/25/04 (.2); RESPOND TO D. WINKELMAN, PIPER RUDNICK, REGARDING TIMING FOR PIPER MATTERS AT 3/9/04 HEARING (.1); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERFICE FOR RESPONSES TO UST OBJECTIONS FILED FOR CROWELL AND HOWREY (.5); PREPARE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT FOWILMINGTON TRUST STIUPLATION FOR S. LOFTSPRING (.8); REVISE 3/9/04 HEARING CHART AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, REVISE 3/9/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS FOR INPUT (2.4)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	9.10	1,365.00	W110	11493633
	FILE AND SERVE SUPPLEMENTAL AFFIDAVIT OF WILSON, ELSE (0.4); FILE AND SERVE TWENTY-FIRST NOTICE OF INTENT (0.5); RETRIEVE PLEADINGS FOR R. BERKOVICH REGARDING BY-LAWS AND INFORMATION REGARDING DITTHAVONG (0.3); RETRIEVE ORDER MODIFYING PLAN FOR R. BERKOVICH (0.1); FILE AND SERVE DEBTORS' RESPONSE TO TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION TO SECOND FEE APPLICATION (1.5); FORWARD E-MAIL OF ALL PLAN SUPPLEMENTS TO C. PULLO (0.1); PREPARE FOR, FILE AND SERVE SECOND FEE APPLICATION CHART (3.5); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.0); ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCES AND PLEADINGS INTO FILING SYSTEM (1.7).				
03/04/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11424144
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/04/04	Jalomo, Chris	3.00	240.00	W110	11424145
	CREATE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE DOCUMENTS REGARDING MULTIPLE MOTIONS (2.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0).				
03/05/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W110	11519735
	REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (0.3); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM G. MITCHEL REGARDING AGENDA FOR MARCH 9 HEARING (0.5)				
03/05/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.60	402.00	W110	11418461
	WORK ON AGENDA FOR MARCH 9TH HEARINGS				
03/05/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W110	11416978
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/05/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.50	1,360.00	W110	11417225
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.2); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM E. MILLER REGARDING AVAILABLE APRIL AND MAY HEARING DATES (.1); COMPLETE DRAFT OF 3/9/04 AGENDA AND CIRCULATE TO ATTORNEYS FOR INPUT (3.1); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM N. VANDERHOOP, LAZARD FRERES, REGARDING FOURTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION PERIOD (.1); REVIEW ORIGINAL ORDER, AND ALL ORDINARY COURSE AND DI MINIMUS NOTICES OF INTENTION TO EMPLOY FOR LI WEN PARTNERS, BEIJING, CHINA, FOR R. BERKOVICH AND D. AGEE, MCI (2.0); INCORPORATE INFORMATION FROM ATTORNEYS INTO AGENDA REVISIONS, TELEPHONE CALLS TO D. STEUBER, HOWREY SIMON, C. FISHER, GILBERT HEINTZ & RANDOLPH, REGARDING AEGIS ADV., SCOTT SULLIVAN-SWISS REGARDING MOTION SET FOR HEARING 3/9/04, ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO HEARING CHART AND AGENDA (1.7) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING AGENDA (.5)				
03/05/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.00	600.00	W110	11499947
	FORWARD COPIES OF THE RESTRUCTURING DOCUMENTS TO MCI PER C. MARCUS REQUEST (0.3); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.8); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES (1.9)				
03/05/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11424090
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/05/04	Jalomo, Chris	3.00	240.00	W110	11424091
	CREATE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE DOCUMENTS REGARDING MULTIPLE MOTIONS (2.0); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0)				
03/08/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525735
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/08/04	Strochak, Adam	0.80	440.00	W110	11489852

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM G. MITCHEL, A. PEREZ, J. THOMPSON REGARDING AGENDA FOR MARCH 9 HEARING AND STATUS OF PENDING MOTIONS				
03/08/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W110	11457803
	REVIEW STIPULATIONS SET FOR HEARING ON MARCH 9TH AGENDA				
03/08/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W110	11430812
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET				
03/08/04	Aaronson, Heather	2.50	412.50	W110	11421196
	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM C. PULLO REGARDING RETRIEVING DOCUMENTS FROM THE INTERNET (.1); RETRIEVE THE SAME FROM THE INTERNET (.1); E-MAIL THE SAME TO C. PULLO (.1); CREATE BINDERS FOR HEARING (2.2)				
03/08/04	Devine, Kim	1.50	225.00	W110	11455832
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS.				
03/08/04	Mitchel, Gayle	10.10	1,616.00	W110	11424921
	<p>DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM T. QUINN, GILBERT, HEINTZ & RANDOLPH, REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF SCOTT SULLIVAN MOTION TO 4/13/04 (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. GROGAN TO TRACE FILING HISTORY OF INDIANA MOTION TO FILE LATE CLAIM AND SEARCH OF DOCKET FOR SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REQUESTING COPY OF 3/9/04 AGENDA DRAFT; TRANSMIT SAME VIA EMAIL (.1); TRANSMIT DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION TO J. DE LOS SANTOS FOR 3/9/04 HEARING (.1); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM D. WINKELMAN, PIPER RUDNICK, REGARDING TIMING OF 3/9 HEARING (.1); REVISE 3/9 AGENDA WITH INPUT FROM A. STROCHAK (.2); TRANSMIT INTERMEDIA ORDER TO J. DE LOS SANTOS FOR 3/9 HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING CHANGE IN TIMES FOR 3/9 HEARING; REVISIONS TO 3/9 AGENDA (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM V. GREENFIELD, GLOBAL DEBT SOLUTIONS, REGARDING \$303M SR. NOTES (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS TO MOVE VARIOUS MATTERS TO 3/15 AT 9A.M., EMAILS TO ATTORNEYS INVOLVED, REVISIONS TO 3/9/04 AGENDA (.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. THOMPSON REGARDING FOCAL COMMUNICATIONS ADVERSARY MATTER ADJOURNMENT, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS, EMAIL CONFIRMING ADJOURNMENT TO 5/4/04 (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. STROCHAK REGARDING RESOLUTION OF CAMPBELL/LAHTI MATTERS, REVISIONS TO AGENDA (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM S. E. COHEN REGARDING AVAILABLE APRIL AND MARCH HEARING DATES, EMAIL RESPONSE REGARDING SAME (.1); EMAIL TO AMERICAN APPRAISAL REGARDING 3/9 HEARING APPEARANCE (.1); EMAIL TO D. WILLIAMS, CUSHMAN WAKEFIELD, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING APPEARANCE (.1); EMAILS TO AND FROM M. RATHBURN, AMERICAN APPRAISAL, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING (.2); EMAIL CALL-IN INSTRUCTORS FOR SDNY TO D. WILLIAMS, CUSHMAN WAKEFIELD (.1); TRANSMIT COPY OF 3/9 AGENDA DRAFT TO F. GRESE, AKIN GUMP, FOR CREDITORS COMMITTEE (.1); EMAILS FROM AND TO B. ELWOOD, PATTON BOGGS, REGARDING 3/9 AGENDA TIMES (.2); REPLY TO S. LOFTSPRING EMAIL REGARDING CAMPBELL/LAHTI MATTERS, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SAME TO 4/6/04, CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S. LOFTSPRING AND J. THOMPSON (.2); EMAILS FROM M. O'REILLY AND C. KAPLAN, GIBBONS DEL DEO, REGARDING REPLY BRIEF (.2); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE FOR RESPONSES TO UST OBJECTIONS FILED 3/4/04 (.5); UPDATE CASE CALENDARS (1.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM S. DELLA FERA, GIBBONS DEL DEO, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING AGENDA (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM N. BEIZER, MCI, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING (.1); SUBMIT DRAFT OF 3/9 AGENDA TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING CHANGES TO SAME, TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAIL FROM A. PEREZ WITH CHANGES TO AGENDA, REVISE SAME, REGARDING-SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, ELECTRONICALLY FILE SAME AND SERVE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE, TELEPHONE CALLS TO ALL FIRMS REGARDING TIME CHANGES IN FINAL AGENDA, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC E-LAW SITE (3.4).</p>				
03/08/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11424095
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/08/04	Jalomo, Chris	3.00	240.00	W110	11424097

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0); NOTIFY VARIOUS PARTIES WITH NEW INFORMATION REGARDING HEARING SET FOR 3-9-04 AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ (1.0).				
03/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.80	536.00	W110	11458111
	PREPARE FOR (.50) AND PARTICIPATE (.30) IN NON-FEE APPLICATION HEARINGS BEFORE COURT				
03/09/04	Aaronson, Heather	0.30	49.50	W110	11423341
	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM J. THOMPSON REGARDING DISK FOR COURT (.1); PREPARE DISK AND COPIES OF STIPULATION FOR HEARING (.2)				
03/09/04	Devine, Kim	1.00	150.00	W110	11455815
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS.				
03/09/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.60	96.00	W110	11425199
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/09/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.40	1,344.00	W110	11425198
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.5); TELEPHONE CALL AND EMAIL FROM J. BILLECK REGARDING PREPARATION OF NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT FOR CDI STIPULATION (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING FINAL 3/9 HEARING AGENDA AND DOUGLAS COUNTY STIUPULATION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. FISHER, HURON CONSULTING, REGARDING 60 DAY EXTENSION TO PLAN EFFECTIVE DATE (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM K. KELSAY, AMERICAN APPRAISAL, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM D. WILLIAMS, CUSHMAN WAKEFIELD, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. RATHBURN, AMERICAN APPRAISAL, REGARDING 3/9 HEARING (.2); COORDINATE XEROX CAPITAL SERVICES, XEROX CORPORATION PROOFS OF CLAIM PROJECT, ZIP FILE AND EMAIL TO J. GROGAN (.2); WORK ON CHART OF ALL FEE APPLICATIONS FOR 2ND INTERIM PERIOD FOR USE BY JUDGE GONZALEZ AT REQUEST OF J. GROGAN (.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS AND TRANSMIT EXHIBITS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION VIA EMAIL TO J. DEPIEROLA (.2); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE FOR MULTIPLE FILINGS (1.5); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF STIPULATION AND ORDER BETWEEN WORLDCOM AND CDI CORP. WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. BILLECK (.5); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF STIUPULATION AND AGREED ORDER WITH WILMINGTON TRUST COMPANY WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S. LOFTSPRING (.5); SEARCH DOCKET FOR ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR CLAIMS OBJECTIONS NOTIFICATION FOR C. LOPEZ (.3); LATE DOCKET CHECK (.3); CODE CASE FILING FOR CASE CLERK (2.7).				
03/09/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.30	645.00	W110	11514934
	PREPARE ORDERS FOR HEARING FOR A. PEREZ (0.5); PREPARE HEARING BINDER FOR J. FINK (1.0); REVIEW DOCKET FOR CONSULTANT FEE ORDER (0.3); RETRIEVE DISCOVERY ORDER FOR C. LEE (0.2); RETRIEVE AND E-MAIL ORDER MODIFYING PLAN TO INTERESTED PARTY (0.1); PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF PUBLICATIONS FOR FILING (0.3); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.0); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES (0.9);				
03/09/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11424121
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/09/04	Jalomo, Chris	4.00	320.00	W110	11424098
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ (2.0) UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (2.0).				
03/10/04	Pasion, Luis	1.50	165.00	W110	11434039
	OBTAINED DOCUMENT# 134 & 135 UNDER SEC V. WORLDCOM - 02 CV 4963, USDC, SDNY. FOR RONIT BERKOVICH.				
03/10/04	Bailey, Gregory	2.00	300.00	W110	11519610

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PRODUCE BOXES TO SEC TO BE SCANNED THEN DELIVER TO THE SEC FOR D. HOLZMAN/F. DIMINCH.				
03/10/04	Reifman, Marli	2.00	260.00	W110	11494909
	PULL INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY DOCUMENTS FOR A. STROCHAK				
03/10/04	Thompson, Janice	0.10	16.50	W110	11435110
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING PARALEGAL ASSISTANCE				
03/10/04	Devine, Kim	1.50	225.00	W110	11455817
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS (.5); SEARCH DOCKET VIA INTERNET TO RETRIEVED ENTERED ORDERS REGARDING PLAN STIPULATIONS (.5); INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.5).				
03/10/04	Joffrion, Karen	8.60	1,376.00	W110	11471568
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING FILES (2.6); REVIEW WORLDCOM FILES FOR NAME AND ADDRESS INFORMATION FOR NOTICES TO BE SENT (4.0); PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF FINDINGS TO S. SIMPSON (2.0)				
03/10/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W110	11424642
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/10/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.20	1,312.00	W110	11424643
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS (.9); EMAIL AND TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. MCGOWAN, PWC, REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING SIGNED DOUGLAS COUNTY ORDER (.2); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT TO J. THOMPSON SIGNED DEPT. OF MOORISH AFFAIRS ORDER (.2); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT TO K. SIMPSON, SIGNED ORDER APPROVING TERMINATION OF UNEXPIRED SUBLEASE IN BELTSVILLE, MD (.3); TRANSMIT COPY OF FILED CDI NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT AND FILING RECEIPT TO J. DAMAN, DECERT LLP, AT THE REQUEST OF J. BILLECK (.2); UPDATE ADVERSARY DOCKETS AND CLOSE DISMISSED ADVERSARY FILES (2.4); UPDATE CASE CALENDARS THROUGH DECEMBER 2004 (1.4); TELEPHONE CALL FROM S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING HEARING DATE OF AR TEACKERS RETIREMENT SYSTEM MOTION FOR RECLASSIFICATION HEARING DATE (.1); WORK WITH J. GROGAN TO PREPARE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF INDIANA STIPULATION (.5); CODE CASE FILING FOR CASE CLERK (1.6); SEARCH DOCKET FOR TAXING AUTHORITY ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.2).				
03/10/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.00	600.00	W110	11510011
	RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND E-MAIL INTERESTED PARTIES (0.4); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.6); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES INTO FILING SYSTEM (2.0).				
03/10/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.00	160.00	W110	11440501
	CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE				
03/11/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.20	99.00	W110	11525718
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET [0.1]; REVIEW CASE CALENDAR [0.1]				
03/11/04	Grogan, James	0.60	219.00	W110	11430828
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET (.1); CONFERENCE WITH S. BAKER REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND CLAIM ADMINISTRATION AND RELATED ISSUES (.5).				
03/11/04	Vacek, Steve	2.00	290.00	W110	11430862
	CONTACT G. MITCHEL FOR INFORMATION ON FILING AND SERVICE OF WORLDCOM/BP MOTION (0.3); ASSIST WITH PREPARATION AND FILING OF WORLDCOM/BP MOTION (1.1); COORDINATE E-MAIL SERVICE OF WORLDCOM/BP MOTION (0.6).				
03/11/04	Mitchel, Gayle	3.00	480.00	W110	11432948

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.2); RESPOND TO TELEPHONE CALL AND EMAIL FROM S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ARKANSAS TEACHERS RETIREMENT OBJECTIONS DATE (.1); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER BETWEEN THE STATE OF INDIANA AND THE DEBTORS RESOLVING CERTAIN DISPUTES AND CLAIMS (.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. KAPLAN, GIBBONS DEL DEO, REGARDING HEARING DATES IN APRIL (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAILS FROM C. KAPLAN REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF (.2); DRAFT 3/15/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA, EMAIL TO D. HANDZO REGARDING SAME (.6)				
03/11/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	2.00	300.00	W110	11507603
	SCREEN CREDITORS CALL (1.0); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES (1.0).				
03/11/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11440443
	UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS				
03/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525717
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/12/04	Cohen, Scott	1.70	680.00	W110	11433630
	DRAFT LETTER TO M. TOM REGARDING UST CORRESPONDENCE WITH APEREZ (1.5); MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMERGENCE (.2)				
03/12/04	Ribaud, Mark	0.50	70.00	W110	11434990
	ORDER TRANSCRIPT FROM SDNY COURT REPORTERS IN US V. SULLIVAN FOR V. JOHNSON.				
03/12/04	Long, Tom	3.00	225.00	W110	11470971
	CREATE INDEX OF CORRESPONDENCE AND PLEADINGS FILES IN PREPARATION FOR ARCHIVING.				
03/12/04	Reifman, Marli	1.00	130.00	W110	11495337
	LOCATE DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT FOR A. STROCHAK				
03/12/04	Devine, Kim	1.20	180.00	W110	11456452
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND RELATED NOTES (.7); CREATE ADDITIONAL LIST OF PARTIES OBJECTING TO PLAN (.5).				
03/12/04	Vacek, Steve	0.10	14.50	W110	11430872
	FORWARD RETURN E-MAILS FROM SERVICE OF WORLDCOM/BP MOTION TO G. MITCHEL				
03/12/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.50	1,360.00	W110	11432959
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.0); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. STROCHAK, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB HEARING TO 3/25/04, EMAIL CONFIRMING ADJOURNMENT TO A. STROCHAK (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS TO MOVE 3/15 HEARING TO 10 A.M., EMAIL TO D. HANDZO, JENNER & BLOCK, REGARDING SAME (.1); COMPLETE 3/15/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA AND SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, FILE AND SERVE SAME, EMAIL FINAL COPY TO D. HANDZO WITH NOTICE OF TIME CHANGE TO 11 A.M., UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE (1.0); BEGIN INITIAL DRAFT OF 3/16/04 AND 3/22/04 AGENDAS (.5); UPDATE CASE CALENDARS FOR MARCH AND APRIL 2004 (.5); PERFORM SERVICE ON MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDED BP INTERNATIONAL GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.8); EMAIL A. STROCHAK REGARDING TELDAR COMMUNICATIONS 4/5/04 HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. HART, JENNER & BLOCK, REGARDING PLEADINGS TO BE FILED MONDAY (.2); WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT FOR J. GROGAN REGARDING LITIGATION RELATED CLAIMS AND ADVERSARY CASES (4.2).				
03/12/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	0.70	105.00	W110	11509697
	SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/12/04	Jalomo, Chris UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ (2.0); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0).	3.00	240.00	W110	11440604
03/15/04	Reifman, Marli CITE CHECK WELLS FARGO BRIEF FOR A. STROCHAK (3.4); FILE AND SERVE WELLS FARGO BRIEF AND AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (3.0)	6.40	832.00	W110	11493594
03/15/04	Etienne, Donald RECORD FILING OF LEGAL PLEADINGS	1.50	142.50	W110	11508775
03/15/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); DOCKET SEARCH FOR JANUARY OPERATING REPORT FOR R. BERKOVICH (.3); PREPARE MULTIPLE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE FOR PLEADINGS FILED LAST WEEK (.5); TELEPHONE CALLS TO P. CROSBY AND A. WHITEHEAD, HELLER EHRMAN, EMAILS TO P. BENVENUTTI, REGARDING GE GLOBAL ASSET MANAGEMENT SERVICES, REGARDING-VISE 3/16/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA, FILE AND SERVE SAME, UPLOAD TO ELAW PUBLIC WEBSITE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE (2.7); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE REPLY MEMORANDUM REGARDING C.G. YOUNG PLAINTIFFS FOR D. LUBETZKY, JENNER & BLOCK, WITH EMAIL CONFIRMING SAME (1.6); BEGIN DRAFT OF 3/17/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA (.6); TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING 3/16/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA REVISIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CALLS TO A. JACOBSON, JENNER & BLOCK, AND R. KEWUTTESM PAYTON & CARLSON, REGARDING TELDAR MATTERS SCHEDULED FOR 4/5/04, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SAME TO PRE-TRIAL CONFERENCE DATE OF 9/8/04, EMAIL CONFIRMING SAME TO A. JACOBSON (.3); CONTINUED WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT REGARDING LITIGATION RELATED CLAIMS AND ADVERSARY CASES FOR J. GROGAN (1.2).	8.00	1,280.00	W110	11439915
03/16/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET	0.10	49.50	W110	11525677
03/16/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE, DOCKET, CALENDAR, ETC.	1.50	637.50	W110	11530779
03/16/04	Ribaud, Mark OBTAIN FROM SDNY COURT REPORTERS TRANSCRIPT IN U.S. SULLIVAN FOR V. JOHNSON.	0.50	70.00	W110	11472781
03/16/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W110	11439765
03/16/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM M. REIFMAN REGARDING REPLY MEMORANDUM FILED REGARDING WELLS FARGO BANK (.1); ELECTRONICALLY FILE 3 AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); SEARCH DOCKET FOR JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENTS OF SCULLY, SCOTT AND DITTHAVONG AND FORWARD TO R. BERKOVICH (.3); DOCKET SEARCH FOR OBJECTIONS TO WELLS FARGO NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT FOR R. WELLS (.3); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM N. CHONG, KLETT ROONEY, REGARDING 4TH INTERIM FEE PERIOD (.1); PREPARE AND FILE 4 AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.8); REPLY TO R. BERKOVICH EMAIL REGARDING 3/9/04 HEARING AND FEE ORDER (.1); UPDATE MARCH AND APRIL HEARING CALENDARS (1.1); CODE FILING FOR CASE CLERK (3.9)	7.70	1,232.00	W110	11439763
03/16/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL	0.60	90.00	W110	11501095
03/16/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W110	11440608

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/16/04	Jalomo, Chris CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.5); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0).	2.50	200.00	W110	11440610
03/17/04	Etienne, Donald RECORD FILING OF LEGAL PLEADINGS	1.00	95.00	W110	11513046
03/17/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.7); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); CHECK OF RECENTLY RECEIVED FAX TRANSMISSIONS FOR NETSOLVE SIGNATURE PAGE AND EXHIBIT A (.2); CONTINUED RESEARCH FOR J. GROGAN ON CLAIMS BASED ON LITIGATION ALLEGING CLASS ACTION (5.6); TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. SHULMAN, HELLER EHRMAN, REGARDING AEGIS HEARING, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS REGARDING SCHEDULING DECISION (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM T. SHAW, JENKENS & GILCHRIST, REGARDING FEE APPLICATION (.2).	7.40	1,184.00	W110	11441978
03/17/04	Jalomo, Chris CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.5); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.5).	3.00	240.00	W110	11451589
03/18/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET	0.10	49.50	W110	11525678
03/18/04	Powell, Kristin PREPARE PRODUCTION ROOM FOR SHIPMENT TO TEXAS	1.00	130.00	W110	11486221
03/18/04	Calles, Linda REVIEW AND CODE DOCUMENTS FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (2.8); UPDATE FILE OUTLINE (0.5).	3.30	478.50	W110	11456301
03/18/04	Dapara1, Dapara1 OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE DATAROOM (.5) AND PREPARATIONS FOR SAME (.5)	1.00	140.00	W110	11446550
03/18/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); APRIL CASE CALENDAR UPDATES (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO COORDINATE TIME FOR 4/8/04 DECISION TO BE RENDERED ON GE GLOBAL ASSETS MOTION TO DISMISS, EMAIL NOTIFICATION OF SAME TO ATTORNEYS (.2); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM E. AYERS, PWC, REGARDING FEBRUARY MONTHLY STATEMENT ATTACHMENTS AND SERVICE LIST (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. WATKINS REGARDING GRAYSON, EX REL, HEARING DATE AND OBJECTIONS DATE (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING 2ND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION PERIOD ORDER (.1); CONTINUED WORK ON LITIGATION BASED PROOFS OF CLAIM RESEARCH PROJECT FOR J. GROGAN (3.9).	7.00	1,120.00	W110	11452094
03/18/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND E-MAIL INTERESTED PARTIES (0.5); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (2.0); REVIEW AND REVISE FEE CHART WITH DATE AND DOCKET NUMBERS FOR EACH FEE APPLICATION THAT WAS OBJECTED TO BY THE TRUSTEE (1.0); DRAFT AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (0.4); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES INTO FILING SYSTEM (1.5).	5.40	810.00	W110	11518685
03/19/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET	0.10	49.50	W110	11525679
03/19/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W110	11489669

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALLS FROM R. RODRIGUES (MCI) REGARDING LITIGATION STATUS NOTEBOOKS (0.2); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM G. MITCHEL REGARDING AGENDA FOR 3/22 HEARING ON WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS (0.2)				
03/19/04	Mitchel, Gayle	6.50	1,040.00	W110	11452271
	DOWNLOAD DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. RIZZA, SEC, REGARDING WORLDCOM CLAIMS REGISTER AND BSI WEBSITE (.2); TELEPHONE CALLS FROM M. FISHER, HURON CONSULTING, REGARDING DEPARTURE OF B. GOREN AND NEW SIGNATORY AUTHORITY FOR AFFIDAVITS, FEE STATEMENTS AND FEE APPLICATIONS, AND QUESTION REGARDING RETENTION APPLICATION CHANGES REQUIRED BY THE CHANGE (.2); TELEPHONE CALL AND EMAILS FROM E. AYERS, PWC, REGARDING UPCOMNG FEE STATEMENT (.2); PACIFIC BELL PROOF OF CLAIM SEARCH FOR R. WELLS, TRANSMIT RESULTS TO M. EVANS, MCI (1.3); SEARCH FOR AUTHOR OF PROGRESS TELECOM SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT FOR R. WELLS (.2); COMPLETE RESEARCH AND PRELIMINARY CHARTS OF LITIGATION BASED PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR J. GROGAN (3.3).				
03/19/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	5.00	750.00	W110	11518169
	RETRIEVE INDENTURES AND E-MAIL M. MEROLA SAME (0.2); ORDER 3/9/2004 TRANSCRIPT (0.2); FILE AND SERVE SALE OF EMBRATEL STOCKS (2.0); FILE AND SERVE TWENTY-SECOND NOTICE OF INTENT (0.6); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.0); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS INTO FILING SYSTEM (1.0).				
03/20/04	Reifman, Marli	0.60	78.00	W110	11495891
	PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE FOR REYNOLDS MOTION				
03/22/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W110	11465669
	REVIEW WORLDCOM CASE DOCKET				
03/22/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.70	1,232.00	W110	11456493
	DOWNLOAD DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); FILE AND SERVE MOTION FOR APPROVAL TO SELL 25 TOWERS FOR K. SIMPSON (1.5); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT COLORADO SERS LATE CLAIM MOTION TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM G. MCMORRIS, STINSON MORRISON, REGARDING MAY AND JUNE 2004 HEARING DATES (.1); REPLY TO E. AYERS, PWC, EMAIL REGARDING FEE REQUESTS FOR WORK IN PROGRESS (.1); EMAIL FROM D. WINKELMAN, PIPER RUDNICK, REGARDING ADDING AGREED STIPULATION AND ORDER MODIFYING DISCOVERY TO 3/23 AGENDA, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS, EMAIL TO D. WINKELMAN REQUESTING WORD PROCESSING COPY OF AGREED STIPULATION TO SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS, FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CALL REGARDING SAME, SUBMISSION OF AGREED STIPULATION AND ORDER TO CHAMBERS WITH PDF OF SIGNATURE PAGE (.5); PREPARE AND FILE 4 AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.8); PREPARE AND FILE CHOICE ONE COMMUNICATIONS RULE 9019 MOTION, WITH SERVICE OF PROCESS AND AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (1.0); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ATTORNEY RESPONSIBLE FOR DEBTORS' 19TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING VIVIEN PLAINTIFFS AND ERISA LITIGATION, ORIGINATOR OF AMICUS BRIEF FILED IN CASE, RESEARCH SAME AND REPLY (.4); UPDATE DRAFT OF 3/23/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA, TELEPHONE CALL AND EMAIL TO D. WINKELMAN, E. MILLER AND Q. CRAWFORD REGARDING SAME, TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM CHAMBERS, REVISE AGENDA, FILE AND SERVE SAME, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE (2.0); TELEPHONE CALL FROM D. WILLIAMS, CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD, REGARDING HEARING DATE FOR 2ND INTERIM APPLICATION FILERS OMITTED FROM 3/9/04 HEARING (.1).				
03/22/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.50	675.00	W110	11518196
	FILE OCP AFFIDAVIT (0.3); RETRIEVE STOCK PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND E-MAIL SAME TO B. COOPER (0.3); DRAFT AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (0.5); FILE BSI AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (0.3); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.9); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES (1.2).				
03/22/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11511851
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/22/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.00	160.00	W110	11507816

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0).				
03/23/04	Fife, Lori	0.50	357.50	W110	11514177
	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND DOCUMENTS REGARDING CASE ADMINISTRATION				
03/23/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.10	67.00	W110	11493847
	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY OF SLIM OWNERSHIP STAKE				
03/23/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.20	99.00	W110	11525725
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET [0.1]; REVIEW CASE CALENDAR [0.1]				
03/23/04	Bartram, Lyle	0.70	108.50	W110	11500410
	REVIEW DOCKET AND RETRIEVE ALL PLEADINGS RELATING TO MARVEC OR MOUNTAIN RESOURCES CORPORATION FOR S. SIMPSON				
03/23/04	Etienne, Donald	2.50	237.50	W110	11500186
	RECORD FILING OF LEGAL PLEADINGS				
03/23/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.20	1,312.00	W110	11460232
	VERIFY RESEARCH ON ZINSMEISTER MDL AND KIMBALL, STATE OF LOUISIANA CLASS ACTION FOR J. GROGAN (.5); DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.0); REVISE 3/25/04 AGENDA AND CIRCULATE FOR ATTORNEY INPUT (.4); UPDATE CASE CALENDARS (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. WATKINS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF GRAYSON MOTION, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS ADJOURNING GRAYSON TO 4/13/04, EMAIL TO C. WATKINS AND A. STROCHAK CONFIRMING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK REGARDING CDI PRESENTMENT DATE AND RESEARCH ON SOUTHER CALIFORNIA EDIXON REJECTION DAMAGE CLAIMS (.5); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS REGARDING RAUL ACOSTA MATTER CALENDAR FOR HEARING 4/6, EMAIL TO J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING WM. BROWN STIPULATION FROM PIPER RUDNICK, TELEPHONE CALL TO D. WINKELMAN, PIPER RUDNICK, REGARDING SIGNATURES, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS WITH SIGNATORY NAMES (.2); SEARCH ADVERSARY DOCKET FOR AND EMAIL ISAAC LEVIN PLEADINGS TO A. STROCHAK (.3); REPLY TO S. LOFTSPRING EMAIL REGARDING ALLEGIANCE TELECOM DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION DEADLINE (.1); INITIAL DRAFT OF 4/6/04 HEARING CHART (2.0); INITIAL DRAFT OF AGENDA FOR 4/5/04 (.6); BEGIN INITIAL DRAFT OF 4/6/04 AGENDA (1.9).				
03/23/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	3.00	450.00	W110	11518210
	RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND E-MAIL INTERESTED PARTIES (0.4); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.5); DRAFT VARIOUS AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICES (1.1).				
03/23/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11507857
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/23/04	Jalomo, Chris	4.00	320.00	W110	11507911
	CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (2.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (2.0).				
03/24/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525736
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/24/04	Cohen, Scott	0.70	280.00	W110	11465046
	CALL WITH N. JONES REGARDING REGULATORY ISSUES (.4) & DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING CASE ADMINISTRATION (.3)				
03/24/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.10	1,136.00	W110	11460476

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DOWNLOAD AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. MCGOWAN, PWC, REGARDING FEE STATEMENTS (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK REQUESTING ADVERSARY PROCEEDING AGREED ORDERS, DOCKET SEARCH AND TRANSMITTAL OF SAME TO HIM (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. REIFMAN REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS WITHDRAWAL OF CLAIM, RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.2); SEARCH DOCKET FOR RECENT ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIMS, ASSEMBLE INFORMATION INTO CHART AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM B. CRUZ, UNSECURED CREDITOR, REGARDING STATUS OF CASE (.1); TRANSMIT DRAFT OF 3/25/04 AGENDA TO CHAMBERS, TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME, TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM E. MILLER, PIPER RUDNICK, AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING JUDGE GONZALEZ' TIME CHANGES, REVISE AGENDA, REGARDING-SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE SAME, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE, UPLOAD TO ELAW PUBLIC WEBSITE (2.3); RETRIEVE AND TRANSMIT TO A. TOGUT TRANSCRIPT OF 3/9/04 HEARING FOR M. GOLDSTEIN (.3); PREPARE AND FILE 2 AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); SEARCH ALLEGIANCE DOCKET AND TRANSMIT 2 PLEADINGS TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT RICHARD REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE MOTION TO A.STROCHAK (.2); CONTACT E. DENNE, ELAW, REGARDING PLEADINGS MISSING ON WEBSITE (.1); CONTINUE WORK ON PROOFS OF CLAIM CHART FOR J. GROGAN (.5).				
03/24/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.00	600.00	W110	11517451
	SEARCH FOR HEARING TRANSCRIPT REGARDING 2004 AND MAIL TO A. WHITTEMORE AT MCGUIRE (1.0); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.0); ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCES AND PLEADINGS INTO FILING SYSTEM (2.0).				
03/24/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11511826
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/25/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525635
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/25/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W110	11533350
	PREPARE BINDERS OF KPMG RESTRUCTURING TO BE SENT TO S. JAMAL AT REQUEST OF D. WHITTAKER.				
03/25/04	Ribaud, Mark	1.00	140.00	W110	11477794
	SUBMIT LETTER TO MAGISTRATE JUDGE DOLINGER IN SDNY AND HAD SO ORDERED FOR P. FERRILLO.				
03/25/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.00	1,280.00	W110	11466228
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.9); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); REPLY TO S. COHEN EMAIL REGARDING SOUTH FLORIDA TRI-RAIL RULE 2004 HEARING DATE AND NEW LICHT PLEADING HEARING DATE (.1); CONTINUED WORK ON CLAIMS CHART FOR J. GROGAN, TELEPHONE CALL TO J. THOMPSON AND TRANSIT SAME FOR INPUT (2.5); SEARCH DOCKET FOR NOTICES OF ADJOURNMENT FOR 8TH AND 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS FOR S. LOFTSPRING AND REPLY TO B. DAVIS, HURON CONSULTING, EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. LARSON REGARDING MCI CLAIMS WORK (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM R. POLVADO, JENKENS & GILCHRIST, REGARDING FEBRUARY FEE STATEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILECK REGARDING MAY AND APRIL HEARING DATES (.1); CODE AND FILE CASE CORRESPONDENCE (3.3)				
03/25/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	3.00	450.00	W110	11517498
	ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCES AND CORPORATE DOCUMENTS INTO FILING SYSTEM.				
03/25/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.00	600.00	W110	11517487
	FILE VARIOUS AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE (1.4); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.0); RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND E-MAIL INTERESTED PARTIES (0.4); ORGANIZE CORRESPONDENCES AND PLEADINGS (1.2).				
03/26/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525737

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/26/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W110	11471486
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET REPORT				
03/26/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W110	11477010
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/26/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.20	1,152.00	W110	11477009
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK REGARDING BT CONCERTS RESEARCH, DOCKET SEARCH AND SETTLEMENTS/SET-OFFS SEARCH (.8); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS REGARDING ARTHUR ANDERSEN STAY ENFORCEMENT MOTION BEING RECONVENED FOR 3/29/04 AT 5 P.M., DRAFT NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR SAME AND SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE AND UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE (1.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO J. THOMPSON REGARDING CLAIMS CHART, TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. THOMPSON REGARDING CHART AND WITHDRAWAL OF ZINSMEISTER DOCKETED 3/24/04, ADDITIONAL WORK ON CLAIMS CHART FOR J. GROGAN (.4); TELEPHONE CALL FROM N. VANDERHOOP, LAZARD FRERES & CO., REGARDING RESTRUCTURING WORK AND WORK ON SALE CONSUMATED IN NOVEMBER 2003 (.2); TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAILS FROM AND TO J. KOPPY, JENNER & BLOCK, REGARDING REVISED SCHEDULING ORDER FOR GENERAL GROWTH MANAGEMENT AND PROPER PROCEDURE FOR SUBMISSION, PREPARATION OF SAME AND TRANSMITTAL TO CHAMBERS (.7); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. AZELTINE, STINSON MORRISON, REGARDING PROPER PROCEDURE FOR SUBMISSION OF WITHDRAWAL OF DUPLICATE CLAIMS, CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME, TELEPHONE CALL TO M. AZELTINE (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM R. POLEVA, JENKENS & GILCHRIST, REGARDING FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT EXHIBITS (.2); EMAIL FROM E. MILLER, PIPER RUDNICK, REQUESTING SDNY CALL-IN INSTRUCTIONS AND TRANSMITTAL OF SAME TO HIM AND J. JACOBS AND E. SLUSSER, MCI (.2); ADDITIONAL RESEARCH ON ADVERSARY CLAIMS FOR CLAIMS CHART FOR J. GROGAN (.5); REVISIONS TO 4/6/04 AGENDA AND HEARING CHART (2.0).				
03/26/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	2.60	390.00	W110	11517522
	FILE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.3); RETRIEVE ORDER MODIFYING PLAN AND E-MAIL L. FIFE (0.2); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.1); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES (1.0).				
03/26/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11512070
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/29/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525739
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/29/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W110	11505053
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET REPORT				
03/29/04	Long, Tom	3.20	240.00	W110	11493788
	CREATE INDEX OF CORRESPONDENCE AND PLEADINGS IN PREPARATION FOR ARCHIVING FILE.				
03/29/04	Joffrion, Karen	0.50	80.00	W110	11494240
	CONTINUE PRINTING EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.40); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.10).				
03/29/04	Etienne, Donald	2.00	190.00	W110	11503476
	RECORD FILING OF LEGAL PLEADINGS				
03/29/04	Mitchel, Gayle	5.80	928.00	W110	11476397

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); EMAIL A. STROCHAK REGARDING STATUS OF ISAAC LEVIN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING PRE-TRIAL CONFERENCE (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. THOMPSON REGARDING 4/6/04 HEARING, TRANSMIT HEARING CHART (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON LIFT STAY HEARING TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL (.2); REPLY TO J. JACOBS, MCI, EMAIL REGARDING RESERVATIONS FOR TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT 3/29/04 5PM HEARING (.2); DOWNLOAD ISAAC LEVIN (ADV. 04-2331) DOCKET TO CHECK FOR SERVICE, TELEPHONE CALLS TO J. THOMPSON AND CHAMBERS REGARDING LACK OF SERVICE (.2); SEARCH DOCKET FOR WORKER'S COMP ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO VERITEXT REGARDING WHEREABOUTS OF 2/2/04 HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.1); EMAIL FROM L. ADAMS, HELLER EHRMAN, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN AEROTEL MOTIONS TO 5/11/04, WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS REGARDING ISAAC LEVIN HEARING, TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS ADJOURNING HEARING, PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR 3/30/04, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE AND UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE (1.0); REPLY TO N. VANDERHOOP, LAZARD FRERES, EMAIL REGARDING 4TH INTERIM FEE PERIOD (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO N. VANDERHOOP TO LOCATE LAZARD REPORT FOR AND EMAIL TO S. BAKER (.1); RECEIVE AND TRANSMIT TRANSCRIPT OF 2/2/04 HEARING TO S. TOMASHEFSKY AND J. GROGAN (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. FINK REGARDING E. AYERS EMAIL (.1); WORK ON CODING DOCUMENTS FOR FILING (2.2).				
03/30/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W110	11488961
	PHONE CALL FROM D. SMORODIN (MCI) REGARDING SETTLEMENTS				
03/30/04	Ribaud, Mark	0.50	70.00	W110	11508194
	PAID TRANSCRIPT FEE TO SDNY COURT REPORTER FOR V. JOHNSON.				
03/30/04	Long, Tom	3.20	240.00	W110	11493789
	CREATE INDEX OF CORRESPONDENCE AND PLEADINGS IN PREPARATION FOR ARCHIVING FILE.				
03/30/04	Wright, Sherri	1.50	135.00	W110	11479062
	CREATE NEW FILES AND LABELS AND SET UP IN FILE DRAWERS.				
03/30/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	3.90	585.00	W110	11504262
	REVIEW PLAN SUPPLEMENTS AND NOTICES OF REJECTION FOR REJECTED LEASE IN NY FOR E. MARTINEZ AND FOR REJECTION OF IFN CONTRACTS (3.5); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (0.4).				
03/31/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11525719
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
03/31/04	Cohen, Scott	1.50	600.00	W110	11528503
	DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING LICHT RESPONSE & REVISE SAME & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/31/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W110	11510645
	REVIEW WORLDCOM CASE DOCKET				
03/31/04	Long, Tom	5.80	435.00	W110	11493140
	CREATE INDEX FOR CORRESPONDENCE AND PLEADINGS IN PREPARATION FOR ARCHIVING FILE.				
03/31/04	Devine, Kim	1.50	225.00	W110	11514341
	REVIEW DOCKET TO IDENTIFY ENTERED ORDERS REGARDING PLAN STIPULATIONS				
03/31/04	Mitchel, Gayle	5.70	912.00	W110	11511212

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.0); UPDATE AND REVISE 4/6/04 AGENDA AND HEARING CHART WITH ATTORNEY INPUT (1.0); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN T-NETIX HEARING TO 5/4/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. HSU, HELLER EHRMAN (.1); ARRANGE AND COORDINATE CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS MOTION FOR A. PEREZ, JUDGE GONZALEZ, AND B. BENJET, C. PETREN AND A. KELLY, MCI (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. TOWER, HOWREY SIMON, REGARDING STATUS OF REMAND IN WESTCHESTER FIRE INSURANCE CO. ADV. 03-06950, ONLINE DOCKET SEARCH, CALL TO CHAMBERS FOR STATUS UPDATE, CALL TO A. TOWER (.5); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN NEON OPTICA TO 5/11/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S.E. COHEN (.1); PREPARE AND SUBMIT SECOND REVISED SCHEDULING ORDER REGARDING POWER SOLUTIONS PROOFS OF CLAIM TO CHAMBERS WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S. STOLTE AND M. AZELTINE, STINSON MORRISON (.5); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN ADVERSARY CASE BEING HEARD 4/6/04 (.1); SEARCH DOCKET FOR OBJECTIONS TO CDI PRESENTMENT ON 4/5/04, EMAIL TO J. BILLECK (.3); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO 4/6/04 HEARING CHART AND AGENDA (.6).				
03/31/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	2.20	330.00	W110	11512526
	REVIEW DOCKET AND 2002 LIST TO CONFIRM THAT STATE OF MASSACHUSETTS WAS SERVED WITH THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0); FILE AND SERVE TWENTY-THIRD NOTICE OF INTENT OCP (0.5); FILE OCP AFFIDAVIT (0.3) RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND E-MAIL INTERESTED PARTIES (0.4)				
03/31/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11510933
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/31/04	Jalomo, Chris	3.00	240.00	W110	11509744
	CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.5); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.5).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W110 - CASE ADMINISTRATION:		399.10	\$ 62,002.00		
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W120	11545295
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING FEE APPLICATION				
03/01/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.00	1,340.00	W120	11418470
	STARTED WORK ON RESPONSE TO US TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION (.40), CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING SEVERAL ISSUES RAISED BY US TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION (.60), COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. FINK REGARDING RESPONSE (.40), OUTLINED CONTENTS OF CHART FOR COMPARISON PURPOSES (.20), REVIEW FIRST DRAFT OF CHARTS (.40)				
03/01/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.00	1,340.00	W120	11418486
	REVIEW JANUARY FEE STATEMENT				
03/01/04	Fink, Jessica	9.80	4,165.00	W120	11530799
	RESPOND TO UST OBJECTION TO WGM FEE APPLICATION (6.6); PREPARE CHARTS OF FEES AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH OTHER PROFESSIONALS REGARDING UST OBJECTION (3.2)				
03/01/04	Pullo, Christina	9.30	2,557.50	W120	11524426
	DRAFT RESPONSE TO FEE COMMITTEE OBJECTION TO SECOND INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.				
03/02/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.00	670.00	W120	11418487
	REVIEW JANUARY FEE STATEMENT				
03/02/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.80	1,206.00	W120	11418469

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND REVISE INITIAL DRAFT OF RESPONSE, PRIOR RESPONSE TO FOLEY AT ISSUE LETTER, FEE APPLICATION AND US TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION (1.8)				
03/02/04	Fink, Jessica	6.00	2,550.00	W120	11530803
	REVISE AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO UST OBJECTION TOWGM FEE APPLICATION.				
03/02/04	Pullo, Christina	2.00	550.00	W120	11524490
	ATTEND TO TRANSITORY ATTORNEY ISSUE RAISED BY FEE COMMITTEE OBJECTION TO SECOND FEE APPLICATION (1.5); CONFER WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.2); REVISE RESPONSE TO FEE COMMITTEE OBJECTION (.3)				
03/03/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.00	670.00	W120	11418471
	REVIEW REVISED DRAFT OF RESPONSE PREPARED BY J. FINK				
03/03/04	Fink, Jessica	7.10	3,017.50	W120	11530350
	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO UST OBJECTION TO FEE APPLICATION (6.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
03/03/04	Pullo, Christina	3.00	825.00	W120	11525562
	CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS QUESTIONS FROM RETAINED PROFESSIONALS (.2); REVIEW EMAILS SENT BY G. MITCHEL IN CONNECTION WITH RETENTION AGREEMENT QUESTION FROM WILSON, ELSER, MOSKOWITZ, EDELMAN & DICKER LLP (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO L. STEEL AT WILSON, ELSER REGARDING SAME (.3); REVISE CHARTS FOR RESPONSE TO OBJECTION TO FEE COMMITTEE (2.0); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH D. WILLIAMS FROM CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD AND LEGAL COST CONTROL REGARDING LCC REPORT FOR CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD (.3)				
03/04/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.80	1,876.00	W120	11418467
	REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE RESPONSE TO US TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION				
03/04/04	Fink, Jessica	4.00	1,700.00	W120	11530357
	REVISE AND FILE RESPONSE TO UST OBJECTION TO FEE APPLICATION				
03/08/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W120	11457802
	REVIEW US TRUSTEE OBJECTION AND RESPONSE				
03/08/04	Pullo, Christina	0.70	192.50	W120	11525427
	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON SECOND FEE APPLICATION				
03/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.20	804.00	W120	11458110
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN MEETING WITH J. BYRNES AND M. TOM REGARDING WG&M'S FEES				
03/09/04	Fink, Jessica	2.30	977.50	W120	11530197
	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON FEE APPLICATIONS.				
03/09/04	Fink, Jessica	4.50	1,912.50	W120	11530198
	ATTEND HEARING ON FEE APPLICATIONS.				
03/30/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.50	120.00	W120	11512480
	REWRITE HALL, ESTILL ETC. FEE STATEMENT DOCUMENTS IN PDF FORMAT AS REQUESTED BY G. MITCHELL.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W120 - WG&M					
RETENTION/BILLING/FEE APPLICATIONS:		62.80	\$ 27,062.00		
03/01/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING PROFESSIONAL FEES	0.20	73.00	W130	11427501
03/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS FROM DITTAVONG FIRM REGARDING FILING FEE APPLICATIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING BILLING ENTRY (.1).	0.60	222.00	W130	11410764
03/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE DELOITTE & TOUCHE LLP JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT (.8); PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE DELOITTE CONSULTING LP JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT (.6); PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE JENNER & BLOCK JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT (.4)	1.80	288.00	W130	11417067
03/03/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MOST (WORLDCOM) REGARDING FEE APPLICATION OF DITTAVONG FIRM (.1); DRAFT E-MAIL TO J. MOST REGARDING SAME (.1); UPDATE CHART OF ALL PROFESSIONALS PER REQUEST OF J. SCHELLEMBERG (WORLDCOM) AND SEND TO SAME AND D. SMORODIN (WORLDCOM) (.6)	0.80	296.00	W130	11446689
03/03/04	Fink, Jessica DEAL WITH RETENTION ISSUES REGARDING PWC AND CUSHMAN & WAKEFIELD.	0.20	85.00	W130	11530352
03/03/04	Mitchel, Gayle TELEPHONE CALL FROM L. STEEL, WILSON ELSER, REGARDING FEE STATEMENTS AND FEE APPLICATIONS (.1) TELEPHONE CALL TO C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.2) CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ ON QUESTION OF SEGREGATING SEPTEMBER 2003 FROM INITIAL MONTHLY STATEMENT OF WILSON ELSER (.1) TRANSMIT COPY OF FEE APPLICATION SUMMARY SHEET TO L. STEEL (.1)	0.50	80.00	W130	11571583
03/04/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW FILINGS BY VARIOUS FIRMS IN RESPONSE TO US TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION INCLUDING JENNER, KPMG, PIPER, AKIN AND OTHERS (1.3)	1.30	871.00	W130	11418468
03/04/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAILS WITH D. AGEE (WORLDCOM) AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING RETENTION OF CHINESE LAW FIRM (.2); E-MAIL WITH J. MOST (WORLDCOM) REGARDING RETENTION OF DITTHAVONG (.1); E-MAILS WITH M. LAWLESS (WORLDCOM) AND D. SMORODIN (WORLDCOM) REGARDING RETENTION OF DOMINCA LAW FIRM (.1); FILE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS NOTICE FOR DOMINICA FIRM (.1).	0.50	185.00	W130	11446536
03/04/04	Fink, Jessica DRAFT AND FILE CHARTS RELATING TO FEES REQUESTED AND OBJECTED TO FOR ALL PROFESSIONALS	7.00	2,975.00	W130	11723336
03/04/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW AND REVISE FEE CHARTS FROM RETAINED PROFESSIONALS	6.70	1,842.50	W130	11525357
03/04/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE HELLER EHRMAN JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT	1.00	160.00	W130	11417561
03/05/04	Fife, Lori	0.20	143.00	W130	11508938

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HUEBNER REGARDING DPW.				
03/05/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W130	11418463
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH DAVIS POLK REGARDING CONVERSION TO 327 (E) COUNSEL				
03/05/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W130	11447073
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING UNCLEAR TIME ENTRIES.				
03/05/04	Fink, Jessica	0.30	127.50	W130	11530359
	WORK ON ISSUES RELATING TO OCPS AND PROFESSIONALS.				
03/08/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.00	1,340.00	W130	11457795
	VARIOUS CALLS AND CONFERENCES WITH VARIOUS COUNSEL, J. BYRNES, B. BENJET AND CHAMBERS REGARDING SCHEDULING, MATTERS RESOLVED, AGENDA AND HEARINGS FOR TOMORROW				
03/08/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W130	11446865
	REVIEW E-MAIL BY L. PALMER ON PROFESSIONALS ORDER AND E-MAIL TO J. FINK AND J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING SAME				
03/08/04	Fink, Jessica	3.00	1,275.00	W130	11530196
	WORK ON ORDER FOR 2ND INTERIM FEE HEARING.				
03/08/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.80	128.00	W130	11425197
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE STATEMENT OF FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS OF WILSON, ELSER, MOSKOWITZ, EDELMAN & DICKER LLP FOR THE MONTHS OF SEPTEMBER 2003, OCTOBER 2003, NOVEMBER 2003, DECEMBER 2003 AND JANUARY 2004, WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO L. STEEL				
03/08/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.50	200.00	W130	11723330
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W130	11616420
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG.				
03/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.10	1,407.00	W130	11458126
	PREPARE FOR AN D PARTICIPATE IN WORLDCOM FEE HEARINGS				
03/09/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W130	11446451
	E-MAILS TO G. MITCHEL AND A. PEREZ REGARDING DELOITTE CONSULTING ORDER.				
03/09/04	Fink, Jessica	1.30	552.50	W130	11530199
	WORK ON ORDER APPROVING FEES (.9) INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.4).				
03/09/04	Grogan, James	2.60	949.00	W130	11430814
	TELEPHONICALLY APPEAR AT WORLDCOM HEARING ON PROFESSIONALS' APPLICATIONS FOR FEES AND EXPENSES (1.0); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING CHART OF PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATIONS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW FILE FOR PREVIOUS FEE ORDERS AND CORRESPOND WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW CHART OF FEE APPLICATIONS (.2).				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.20	930.00	W130	11622643

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, B. BENJET, A. STROCHAK, ET AL. REGARDING KPMG.				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W130	11622563
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ; A. STROCHAK; B. BENJET REGARDING KPMG. JOINED BY S. KELLY AND C. PETREN REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS AND KPMG.				
03/10/04	Strochak, Adam	2.40	1,320.00	W130	11516425
	PREPARE FOR (0.5) AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLEY, C. PETREN, D. RICHARDS (MCI), D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL), M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS THREAT TO FILE MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG AND STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE TO SAME (1.1); PHONE CALL TO M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.3); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING SAME (0.1); REVIEW KPMG RETENTION APPLICATION AND AFFIDAVIT (0.4)				
03/10/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.30	111.00	W130	11446390
	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM A. PEREZ REGARDING DISTRICT COURT ORDER REGARDING DELOITTE CONSULTING AND E-MAIL TO J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING RECEIVING SAME (.1); REVIEW SAME (.1); E-MAILS TO L. PALMER (WORLDCOM) REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/10/04	Fink, Jessica	9.50	4,037.50	W130	11530203
	DRAFT ORDER APPROVING FEES (4.5) INCLUDING CHART (2.0) INCLUDING NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ (.5) AND VARIOUS PROFESSIONALS (2.5)				
03/10/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W130	11430824
	CORRESPOND WITH J. FINK REGARDING ORDER ON PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATIONS				
03/10/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W130	11723331
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ				
03/11/04	Fink, Jessica	2.50	1,062.50	W130	11530651
	REVISE FEE ORDER AND ACCOMPANYING CHART (1.0); FINALIZE (.2); SEND TO COURT (.2); CONFER WITH COURT REGARDING CHART (.3); CONFER WITH VARIOUS PROFESSIONALS REGARDING CHART (.4); CONFER WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING CHART (.4)				
03/11/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.00	160.00	W130	11723332
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ				
03/12/04	Fink, Jessica	1.00	425.00	W130	11530665
	REVISE CHART ACCOMPANYING FEE ORDER AT REQUEST OF COURT.				
03/13/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.20	74.00	W130	11446667
	REVIEW REQUESTS FOR ADDITIONAL PROFESSIONALS SENT BY D. SMORODIN (WORLDCOM) AND L. PALMER AND E-MAILS TO EACH OF THEM REGARDING SAME.				
03/15/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.90	603.00	W130	11458106
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. WRONZKI REGARDING ORDER TERMINATING THE FEE REVIEW COMMITTEE (.30), COMMUNICATIONS WITH CHADBOURNE, PARK REGARDING JH COHN (.30), COMMUNICATIONS WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING FEE ORDER (.10), COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. FINK REGARDING ISSUES RELATED TO THE FEE ORDER (.20)				
03/15/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W130	11446780
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MOST (WORLDCOM) REGARDING JANUARY MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS FOR SCULLY SCOTT AND DITTHAVONG AND E-MAIL TO G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/16/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW REVISED FEE ORDER (.10), COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. TOM REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES RELATED TO THE FEE ORDER INCLUDING PWC, SQUIRE, SANDERS, SIMPSON, THATCHER AND J. H. COHN (.20), REVIEW COMMUNICATION FROM C. MEYERS REGARDING SQUIRE, SANDERS (.10)	0.40	268.00	W130	11458091
03/16/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAILS TO A. PEREZ REGARDING RESULTS OF FEE HEARING (.1); E-MAIL TO J. MOST REGARDING SAME AND JANUARY FEE STATEMENTS OF SCULLY SCOTT AND DITTHAVONG (.1).	0.20	74.00	W130	11446978
03/16/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT OF LAWLER, METZGER & MILKMAN	0.50	80.00	W130	11439764
03/16/04	Jalomo, Chris UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ	1.00	80.00	W130	11723333
03/17/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING KPMG MOTION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLEY REGARDING KPMG MOTION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING KPMG MOTION (.3)	1.10	786.50	W130	11515650
03/17/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND ANALYZE MASSACHUSETTS MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (1.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM S. KELLY (MCI), D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE TO SAME (0.6); PHONE CALL FROM M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.3)	2.00	1,100.00	W130	11489607
03/17/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH L. FIFE, S. KELLEY, B. BURNS AND R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME (.70)	1.10	737.00	W130	11458114
03/17/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAILS TO M. LAWLESS (WORLDCOM) AND D. SMORODIN (WORLDCOM) REGARDING UPDATING LIST OF ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS.	0.10	37.00	W130	11532429
03/17/04	Berkovich, Ronit REVIEW MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BURNS (WORLDCOM) REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.80	296.00	W130	11532426
03/17/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION	0.40	178.00	W130	11446101
03/17/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE HOWREY SIMON ARNOLD & WHITE FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM	0.80	128.00	W130	11441977
03/18/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING HEARING ON MONTHLY FEE PROCEDURES ORDER (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH US TRUSTEE, COMMITTEE, APPLICANT AND OBJECTOR REGARDING FEE PROCEDURES ORDER (.30), COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. KELLY, B. BENJET AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SCHEDULED STATUS CONFERENCE (.90)	1.60	1,072.00	W130	11458020
03/18/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W130	11533504

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. TOM (UST) REGARDING ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL CAPS.				
03/18/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.00	160.00	W130	11452407
	PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE AMENDED SECOND APPLICATION OF JENKENS & GILCHRIST, A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION, AS SPECIAL COUNSEL FOR THE DEBTORS, FOR ALLOWANCE OF INTERIM COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES INCURRED FROM APRIL 1, 2003 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2003, PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE REGARDING SAME				
03/19/04	Strochak, Adam	1.20	660.00	W130	11489676
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. PEREZ, T. WEBER (GREENBERG TRAUIG) REGARDING REQUEST BY CHAMBERS FOR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.6); PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.6)				
03/19/04	Perez, Alfredo	3.20	2,144.00	W130	11458012
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COURT REGARDING IMPLEMENTATION OF THE MONTHLY FEE ORDER (.50), VARIOUS CALLS WITH N. PETERMAN REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE (.40), CONFERENCE CALLS WITH B. BENJET, P. ESKILDSEN, S. KELLY, B. BURNS AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING ISSUES RELATED TO IMPLEMENTATION OF MONTHLY FEE ORDER AND RELATED REPORTS (2.3)				
03/19/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.30	111.00	W130	11533164
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH (WORLDCOM) REGARDING FIRM FROM KAZIKSTAN (.1); E-MAILS TO M. LAWLESS (WORLDCOM) AND D. SMORODIN (WORLDCOM) REGARDING RETENTION OF ADDITIONAL ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL (.1); DRAFT NOTICE REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W130	11621437
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG RESPONSE.				
03/22/04	Strochak, Adam	1.00	550.00	W130	11489635
	CONFERENCE WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION AND STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE				
03/22/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.50	80.00	W130	11456494
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE FEE STATEMENT OF CROWELL & MORING FOR FEBRUARY 2004				
03/22/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.00	160.00	W130	11723335
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W130	11632627
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W130	11632659
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SEC REQUEST REGARDING KPMG.				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W130	11631540
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. BENJET, C. PETREN REGARDING KPMG.				
03/23/04	Strochak, Adam	3.00	1,650.00	W130	11489660

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALL FROM A. WHITTEMORE (MCGUIRE WOODS) REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.6); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM M. GOLDSTEIN, B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. WHITTEMORE, S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS) REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION AND STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE TO SAME (1.2); PHONE CALL FROM J. FINK REGARDING RESEARCH ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION AND PREPARATION OF OBJECTION TO SAME (0.4)				
03/23/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W130	11518166
	VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING KPMG ISSUES				
03/23/04	Fink, Jessica	3.20	1,360.00	W130	11530502
	CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING ALLEGED CONFLICT OF INTEREST				
03/24/04	Strochak, Adam	0.60	330.00	W130	11489658
	E-MAILS AND PHONE CALLS TO/FROM A. WHITTEMORE (MCGUIRE WOODS) REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION				
03/24/04	Strochak, Adam	1.70	935.00	W130	11489646
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. SMORODIN (MCI), C. SCHEELER (PIPER), M. DAJANI (PIPER) AND P. FENN (PIPER) REGARDING KPMG RETENTION AND AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE ISSUES AND MASSACHUSETTS MOTION TO DISQUALIFY (0.9); REVIEW AND COLLECT DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION IN CONNECTION WITH CHALLENGE TO KPMG RETENTION (0.8)				
03/24/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.20	192.00	W130	11460477
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENTS OF HALL, ESTILL, HARDWICK, GABLE, GOLDEN & NELSON AND SMITH, PACTHER, MCWHORTER & ALLEN, AND JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT OF LAZARD FRERES & CO.				
03/24/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.50	120.00	W130	11511827
	REWRITE SMITH, PACTHER ETC. FEE STATEMENT DOCUMENTS IN PDF FORMAT AS REQUESTED BY G. MITCHELL.				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W130	11632912
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG.				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W130	11632913
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, A. PEREZ, ET AL. REGARDING KPMG.				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.20	930.00	W130	11632699
	RESPOND TO EMAILS (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK, ET AL. (.4) REGARDING KPMG AND "TAX WHITE PAPER" AND REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUESTS (.4)				
03/25/04	Fife, Lori	0.80	572.00	W130	11511534
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY AND M. CAPELLAS REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/25/04	Strochak, Adam	0.60	330.00	W130	11489661
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, C. PETREN AND B. BENJET (MCI), M. GOLDSTEIN, A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION				
03/25/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.20	1,474.00	W130	11469862
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY REGARDING KPMG (.40), CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET AND M. DEL LUCA REGARDING KPMG ISSUES (.60), CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT, A. STROCHAK AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING KPMG ISSUES (1.2)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/25/04	Fink, Jessica REVISE FEE ORDER (.3); CONFER WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.60	255.00	W130	11530659
03/25/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING "INTERESTEDNESS," DISQUALIFICATION OF PROFESSIONALS.	2.70	1,147.50	W130	11530667
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING ISSUES RETENTION	0.20	155.00	W130	11634017
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. MESSINEO REGARDING KPMG INDEPENDENCE.	0.20	155.00	W130	11634032
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING KPMG.	0.20	155.00	W130	11634033
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING KPMG INDEPENDENCE.	0.30	232.50	W130	11633369
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING KPMG, ETC.	0.50	387.50	W130	11633819
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET, C. PETREN, ET AL. FROM MCI.	1.00	775.00	W130	11633824
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. CAPELLAS, S. KELLY, ET AL. REGARDING KPMG.	1.00	775.00	W130	11633836
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCGUIRE WOODS, PETREN, A. STROCHAK, S. KELLY, ET AL REGARDING KPMG DISCOVERY, ETC	1.10	852.50	W130	11633362
03/26/04	Fife, Lori CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING KPMG ISSUES.	0.30	214.50	W130	11507863
03/26/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL AND E-MAILS TO C. DIXON REGARDING AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE ISSUES	0.70	385.00	W130	11489630
03/26/04	Perez, Alfredo CONFERENCE CALLS WITH CLIENT, KPMG, M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY MASSACHUSETTS	2.20	1,474.00	W130	11469850
03/26/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON OBJECTION TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.	3.00	1,275.00	W130	11530505
03/26/04	Pullo, Christina CONFER WITH J. FINK REGARDING THE INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEE APPLICATION.	0.30	82.50	W130	11525336
03/27/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. STROCHAK, A. PEREZ AND MCGUIRE WOODS ATTORNEYS REGARDING DISCOVERY, STRATEGY (1.0); FOLLOW UP INTERNAL CALLS (.5)	1.50	1,162.50	W130	11633856

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/27/04	Strochak, Adam CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. PEREZ, M. GOLDSTEIN, A. WHITTEMORE (MCGUIRE WOODS), S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS), D. WAGNER (KPMG) REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG AND DISCOVERY ISSUES (1.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. PEREZ, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.6)	1.90	1,045.00	W130	11489625
03/27/04	Perez, Alfredo PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATED IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH KPMG, COUNSEL FOR KPMG, M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. STROCHAK (1.0), FOLLOW-UP CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING KPMG (.30)	1.30	871.00	W130	11469848
03/28/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. DABNEY, M. DEL LUCA, S. KELLY AND B. BENJET REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY MASSACHUSETTS	0.60	402.00	W130	11469801
03/29/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. PETREN REGARDING RETENTION ISSUES	0.20	155.00	W130	11633803
03/29/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ AND ATTORNEYS FROM MCGUIRE WOODS REGARDING KPMG.	0.50	387.50	W130	11633901
03/29/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL TO J. FINK REGARDING RESEARCH ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.3); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MOTION FOR PROTECTIVE ORDER AGAINST MASSACHUSETTS DISCOVERY ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.4)	0.70	385.00	W130	11490874
03/29/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW DISCOVERY REQUEST FROM MASSACHUSETTS (.50), COMMUNICATIONS WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH MCI REGARDING RESPONSE TO MASSACHUSETTS MOTION AND DISCOVERY REQUEST (.5)	1.40	938.00	W130	11516917
03/29/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.	0.10	37.00	W130	11532643
03/29/04	Fink, Jessica CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.	0.30	127.50	W130	11530367
03/29/04	Fink, Jessica REVISE FEE ORDER AT COURT'S REQUEST.	0.40	170.00	W130	11530373
03/29/04	Fink, Jessica DRAFT OBJECTION TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.	9.00	3,825.00	W130	11530377
03/29/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW FEES AND EXPENSES OF THE INDENTURE TRUSTEE AND COUNSEL FOR REASONABLENESS	0.40	110.00	W130	11524937
03/29/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE HELLER EHRMAN WHITIE & MCAULIFFE FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT	0.80	128.00	W130	11476401
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W130	11633804

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. PEREZ, S. KELLY, ET AL. REGARDING KPMG				
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W130	11633579
	CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS/KPMG MATTER (.5) REVIEW LETTER TO JUDGE GONZALEZ (.3)				
03/30/04	Dicker, Howard	0.40	256.00	W130	11519435
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. HYATTE REGARDING RESEARCH ON AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE				
03/30/04	Strochak, Adam	1.00	550.00	W130	11488960
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH A. PEREZ, A. WHITTEMORE AND S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS), D. WAGNER (KPMG) REGARDING DISCOVERY ON MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (0.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. KARTSONIS (LAW CLERK TO JUDGE GONZALEZ) AND ALL COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (0.2); E-MAILS TO/FROM S. KELLY (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.1); REVIEW LETTER TO JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING MASSACHUSETTS DISCOVERY DEMANDS (0.1)				
03/30/04	Perez, Alfredo	5.30	3,551.00	W130	11517747
	VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH KPMG, MCGUIRE WOOD, MCI AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING DISCOVERY PROPOUNDED BY MASSACHUSETTS (3.1), DRAFT, REVISE AND FINALIZE LETTER TO CHAMBERS REQUESTING A STATUS CONFERENCE (2.0), PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING SCHEDULING (.20),				
03/30/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.40	148.00	W130	11532757
	PREPARE ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS NOTICE TO ADD TWO ADDITIONAL FIRMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. SOLOMON (HARRITY) REGARDING ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL FIRM EXCEEDING \$500,000 (.2).				
03/30/04	Fink, Jessica	0.20	85.00	W130	11530389
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH PWC REGARDING ADDITIONAL DISCLOSURES.				
03/30/04	Fink, Jessica	10.00	4,250.00	W130	11530382
	DRAFT OBJECTION TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.				
03/30/04	Pullo, Christina	5.10	1,402.50	W130	11525111
	REVIEW INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES FOR REASONABLENESS				
03/30/04	Reith, David	1.30	162.50	W130	11499992
	RESEARCH ACCOUNTING LITERATURE AND FEDERAL CASES REGARDING IMPARTIALITY OF AUDITORS DUE TO NON-PAYMENT OF FEES.				
03/30/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.30	208.00	W130	11483574
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE SCULLY, SCOTT, MURPHY & PRESSER FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT (.5); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT (.8)				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W130	11632737
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG.				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W130	11632934
	REVIEW MASSACHUSETTS RESPONSE.				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W130	11632743

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ, J. ALLERHAND, J. FINK REGARDING RETENTION (.5) THEN JOINED CONFERENCE CALL WITH SAME PEOPLE PLUS CAROL PETREN AND OTHERS REGARDING KPMG (.5)				
03/31/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.50	1,102.50	W130	11507345
	REVIEWING CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DISQUALIFICATION OF MOTION (KPMG) AND DISCOVERY DISPUTES.				
03/31/04	Strochak, Adam	4.20	2,310.00	W130	11490034
	REVIEW MASSACHUSETTS LETTER REGARDING DISCOVERY (0.4); PREPARE FOR (1.7) AND PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE WITH REGARDING MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (0.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, C. PETREN, B. BENJET (MCI), A. PEREZ, J. ALLERHAND, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE WITH COURT ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.4); MEETING WITH D. WAGNER (KPMG), S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS), T. WEBER (GREENBERG TRAUIG) REGARDING SAME (0.5); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (0.5)				
03/31/04	Perez, Alfredo	4.20	2,814.00	W130	11518077
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN STATUS CONFERENCE WITH THE COURT REGARDING KPMG (2.2), CONFERENCE CALLS WITH J. ALLERHAND, M. GOLDSTEIN, S. KELLY, A. STROCHAK AND B. BENJET REGARDING SUBPOENA, MASSACHUSETTS RESPONSE, AND RESULTS OF STATUS CONFERENCE (2.0)				
03/31/04	Hyatte, Theresa	6.50	2,827.50	W130	11512700
	CONTINUE RESEARCH ON AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE (REVIEW ACCOUNTING LITERATURE, TREATISES AND CASE LAW SEARCH) AND BEGIN DRAFT MEMORANDUM (5.0) REVIEW ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE ISSUES (1.5)				
03/31/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.30	111.00	W130	11532611
	ATTENTION TO FILING NOTICE ADDING ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONALS AND AFFIDAVIT.				
03/31/04	Fink, Jessica	0.40	170.00	W130	11530541
	REVISE FEE ORDER (.2); CONFER WITH CLERK, CHAMBERS REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/31/04	Fink, Jessica	0.70	297.50	W130	11530395
	MEETING WITH C. PULLO REGARDING EMBRATEL AND INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES.				
03/31/04	Fink, Jessica	5.50	2,337.50	W130	11530392
	DRAFT AND REVISE OBJECTION TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.				
03/31/04	Pullo, Christina	4.00	1,100.00	W130	11525424
	REVIEW INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES FOR REASONABLENESS (3.6); CONFER WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/31/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.80	288.00	W130	11511213
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE AMERICAN APPRAISAL ASSOCIATES FEES AND EXPENSES FOR FEBRUARY 2004, WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.9); PREPARE FILE AND SERVE JENNER & BLOCK FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.4); TELEPHONE CALL FROM L. SALOMON, HARRITY SNYDER, REGARDING FEE STATEMENTS AND FEE APPLICATIONS, EMAIL SAMPLES AND INSTRUCTIONS OF SAME (.5)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W130 - RETENTION/FEE APPLICATIONS: OTHER PROFESSIONALS:		189.20	\$ 88,082.00		
03/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.50	335.00	W140	11458090

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, DAVIS, POLK AND M. TOM REGARDING MOR'S AND REPORTING REQUIREMENTS POST EFFECTIVE DATE					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W140 - SCHEDULES/STATEMENT OF FINANCIAL AFFAIRS/US TRUSTEE REPORTS:		0.50	\$ 335.00		
02/19/04	Goldfarb, James TRAVEL TO AND FROM WASHINGTON, D.C.	6.00	1,275.00	W180	11438244
03/02/04	Perez, Alfredo RETURN TO HOUSTON AFTER HEARINGS IN NEW YORK	3.00	1,005.00	W180	11418472
03/05/04	Gregory, Holly TRAVEL TO/FROM WASHINGTON, DC	6.00	1,800.00	W180	11571584
03/05/04	Cooper, Bethany TRAVEL TO AND FROM MCI HEADQUARTERS IN VIRGINIA	6.00	1,275.00	W180	11571586
03/07/04	Perez, Alfredo TRAVEL FROM HOUSTON TO NEW YORK CITY FOR HEARINGS	3.00	1,005.00	W180	11418454
03/09/04	Perez, Alfredo TRAVEL FROM NEW YORK TO HOUSTON AFTER HEARINGS	3.00	1,005.00	W180	11458109
03/11/04	Fife, Lori TRAVEL TO VIRGINIA FOR BOARD MEETING	2.50	893.75	W180	11513421
03/11/04	Gregory, Holly TRAVEL TO/FROM WASHINGTON, DC	4.00	1,200.00	W180	11571587
03/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia RETURN TO NEW YORK FROM DC	3.00	1,162.50	W180	11667214
03/12/04	Green, Frederick TRAVEL TO NY FROM DC	3.00	1,162.50	W180	11571590
03/12/04	Fife, Lori TRAVEL TO N.Y. FROM DC	3.00	1,072.50	W180	11513489
03/16/04	Strochak, Adam TRAVEL TO AND FROM NEW YORK FOR DEPOSITION OF N. GLUCKMAN IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION	3.50	962.50	W180	11489588
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald TRAVEL TO DC FROM NYC.	3.40	841.50	W180	11474384
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald TRAVEL TO DC FROM NY	4.20	1,039.50	W180	11474127
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	6.00	1,485.00	W180	11474342

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TRAVEL FROM DC TO DALLAS ROUNDTRIP				
03/20/04	Whittaker, Donald	4.10	1,014.75	W180	11474178
	TRAVEL FROM DC TO NYC				
03/21/04	Whittaker, Donald	5.20	1,287.00	W180	11474328
	TRAVEL TO DALLAS				
03/21/04	Strochak, Adam	1.20	330.00	W180	11489638
	TRAVEL FROM WASHINGTON TO NEW YORK FOR HEARING ON WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS				
03/22/04	Strochak, Adam	2.30	632.50	W180	11489636
	TRAVEL FROM NEW YORK TO WASHINGTON AFTER HEARING OF WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS				
03/22/04	Marcus, Christopher	1.00	212.50	W180	11454672
	RETURN FROM WELLS FARGO HEARING				
03/23/04	Friedman, Peter	2.00	410.00	W180	11473104
	RETURN TRAVEL FROM NY TO DC FOR WELLS FARGO TRIAL				
03/24/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.50	502.50	W180	11470320
	TRAVEL TO DALLAS FOR MEETING WITH B. BENJET TO REVIEW CLAIMS				
03/25/04	Strochak, Adam	2.90	797.50	W180	11489640
	TRAVEL TO AND FROM NEW YORK FOR HEARING ON OBJECTION TO CERTIFICATION OF CLASS CLAIM ON SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB ERISA PROOF OF CLAIM				
03/25/04	Watkins, Claire	3.00	495.00	W180	11571596
	TRAVEL TO NYC FROM DC				
03/26/04	Watkins, Claire	1.50	247.50	W180	11571597
	TRAVEL FROM NYC TO DC				
03/31/04	Strochak, Adam	3.00	825.00	W180	11490035
	TRAVEL TO AND FROM NEW YORK FOR STATUS CONFERENCE ON MASSACHUSETTS MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W180 - NON WORKING TRAVEL:		87.30	\$ 23,939.00		
03/02/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.40	170.00	W200	11415467
	DRAFT AMENDMENT TO BANK ONE CONTROL AGREEMENT.				
03/05/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.30	180.00	W200	11421080
	REVIEW QUESTION ON GUARANTEES OF NON-DEBTORS RECEIVED FROM B. BENJET (.2); DISCUSS RESPONSE WITH A. YOON (.1)				
03/08/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.40	240.00	W200	11424057
	CALLS WITH S. HIRSCH, A. YOON REGARDING IMPLICATIONS OF EMBRATTEL SALE UNDER AMENDED DIP AGREEMENT (.2); DISCUSS WITH A. YOON REGARDING SAME (.2)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. HEUBNER REGARDING FINANCING	0.20	155.00	W200	11616746
03/09/04	Urquhart, Douglas REVIEW PROVISIONS OF AMENDED DIP FACILITY RELATED TO EMBRATEL SALE	0.20	120.00	W200	11425217
03/12/04	Urquhart, Douglas CALLS WITH J. FINK, A. YOON REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE AND REQUIREMENT FOR CONSENTS FROM LENDERS UNDER AMENDED DIP FACILITY.	0.40	240.00	W200	11432854
03/16/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW COLLATERAL REQUIREMENTS UNDER DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT.	0.50	212.50	W200	11446242
03/17/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW DIP TERMINATION ISSUES.	1.40	595.00	W200	11446072
03/18/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW DIP CONTROL AGREEMENT TERMINATIONS.	2.10	892.50	W200	11446081
03/19/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT TERMINATION DOCUMENTS.	1.60	680.00	W200	11447349
03/20/04	Longobardo, John PREPARE TERMINATIONS FOR CONTROL AGREEMENTS UNDER DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT.	3.70	1,017.50	W200	11467036
03/22/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT TERMINATION DOCUMENTS.	2.10	892.50	W200	11458292
03/22/04	Harings, Teresa SPOKE WITH J. LONGOBARDO REGARDING A. YOON'S EMAIL OF FRIDAY, MARCH 19 (.3); RECEIVED INFORMATION TO CREATE PARTIAL RELEASES OF MCI LIENS (.6); ORDERED UCC SEARCH ON MCI WORLDCOM BRAZIL LLC PER REQUEST OF A. YOON (.1)	1.00	130.00	W200	11495930
03/23/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW ISSUES RELATING TO TERMINATION OF DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT.	2.10	892.50	W200	11458315
03/23/04	Harings, Teresa PREPARED UCC3 AMENDMENTS - PARTIAL RELEASES OF COLLATERAL (.3) TRACKED DOWN ORIGINAL FILING NUMBERS AND DATES, ADDRESSES OF DEBTORS AND SECURED PARTIES, AND CREATED FORMS (1.0) EMAILED TO A. YOON AND J. LONGOBARDO REGARDING SAME (.2)	1.50	195.00	W200	11493318
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. YOON REGARDING DIP.	0.10	49.50	W200	11474076
03/24/04	Yoon, Andrew REVIEW DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT TERMINATION ISSUES.	0.70	297.50	W200	11459731
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. MALMAY REGARDING PRINTING OF FINANCIAL CHARTS.	0.20	50.00	W200	11501197
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W200	11501199

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH G. FOSTER IN NEW YORK REGARDING PRINTING FINANCIAL CHARTS.				
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W200	11501198
	CONFER WITH L. HIGGINBOTHAM REGARDING PRINTING FINANCIAL CHARTS.				
03/25/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.40	240.00	W200	11465330
	REVIEW REVISED LEGAL OPINIONS ON LETTER OF CREDIT REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENTS				
03/25/04	Longobardo, John	1.00	275.00	W200	11467335
	REVISING OPINION FOR DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT, TERMINATIONS FOR CONTROL AGREEMENTS UNDER DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT.				
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W200	11501238
	CONFER WITH K. MALMAY REGARDING FINANCIAL CHART PRINTOUTS.				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W200	11505063
	CONFERENCE WITH A. SUMMERFORD REGARDING FINANCIAL INFORMATION				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W200 - FINANCING/CASH COLLATERAL:		21.40	\$ 7,848.50		
03/01/04	Fife, Lori	2.40	1,716.00	W210	11506316
	REVIEW MEMORANDUM REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN, B. BENJET, GRAFSTEIN, S. HIRSCH REGARDING EMBRATEL (.8)				
03/01/04	Cohen, Scott	0.60	240.00	W210	11412629
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. HIRSCH REGARDING LIEN QUERY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL L. CARSON REGARDING TRIRAIL & DADE COUNTY FEE (.3); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING TELETECH (.2)				
03/02/04	Green, Frederick	0.90	697.50	W210	11521414
	ATTENTION TO AVANTEL ISSUES				
03/02/04	Green, Frederick	2.40	1,860.00	W210	11521400
	REVIEW AND REVISE EMBRATEL/INVESTOR NDA				
03/03/04	Green, Frederick	4.80	3,720.00	W210	11521415
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MICHAEL CAPELLAS REGARDING WORLDCOM ISSUES (1.0); ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING STRATEGY WITH INVESTOR (3.8)				
03/03/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W210	11412663
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. AMADEO REGARDING TRIRAIL & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W210	11621311
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING PENDING MATTERS				
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W210	11620404
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, A. PEREZ REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS MATTERS.				
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W210	11622951
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING PENDING MATTERS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (3.7); WORK ON DEAL REGARDING SAME (2.0)	5.70	4,417.50	W210	11521430
03/04/04	Pearlstein, Debra REVIEWING STATEMENT FOR NEW HIRES FOR COMPLIANCE WITH DOJ COMMITMENT AND EMAIL REGARDING SAME	0.30	201.00	W210	11468508
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	0.50	387.50	W210	11619550
03/05/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (3.0); DISCUSSIONS WITH INVESTOR REGARDING SAME (2.0); ATTENTION TO NDAS ISSUES (3.3)	8.30	6,432.50	W210	11521433
03/05/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW TELTECH STIPULATION	0.40	160.00	W210	11433819
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS MATTERS.	0.40	310.00	W210	11616738
03/08/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (2.2); MEETINGS ALL AFTERNOON AND EVENING REGARDING SAME (2.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, WORLD COM AND LAZARD REGARDING DOCUMENTS (1.5) CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL AND OTHER ISSUES (1.0)	6.70	5,192.50	W210	11521453
03/08/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH C. PULLO REGARDING TELTECH & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CARSON REGARDING TRIRAIL & OTHER MATTERS (.1); DISCUSSION WITH B. BENJET REGARDING EMBRATEL & PRE-MERGER CLAIM (.2)	0.50	200.00	W210	11433838
03/09/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO AVANTEL (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. RICHARDS & R. BEHM REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.4)	0.80	620.00	W210	11521464
03/09/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL (.9); NEGOTIATIONS WITH INVESTOR REGARDING SAME (3.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH BANKERS REGARDING SAME (2.0) DOCUMENT REVISION (5.0)	10.90	8,447.50	W210	11521463
03/09/04	Cohen, Scott MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING LITIGATION QUERY (.2); DISCUSSION WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUE (.1)	0.30	120.00	W210	11433253
03/11/04	Green, Frederick FINALIZE AND INVESTOR SIGNS (2.3); ORGANIZE FOR BOARD (2.0); PREPARE SUMMARIES (2.0)	6.30	4,882.50	W210	11521473
03/13/04	Green, Frederick CALLS REGARDING PRESS RELEASE AND NEXT STEPS.	2.90	2,247.50	W210	11521297
03/14/04	Green, Frederick REVISED OFFER FROM TELES (3.6); CONFERENCE CALL TO PREPARE RESPONSE (1.1)	4.70	3,642.50	W210	11521298

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/15/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO PUBLICITY (1.8); ATTENTION TO 8-K (2.0); REVIEW SALE MOTION (1.5)	5.30	4,107.50	W210	11521299
03/15/04	Rubin, Steven REVIEW TERM SHEET FROM CITIGROUP (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BEHM REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.60	402.00	W210	11456341
03/15/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW TELTECH STIPULATION	0.30	120.00	W210	11451283
03/16/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO SALE ORDER	3.90	3,022.50	W210	11521309
03/17/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL (3.0); REVIEW MATERIALS FOR BOARD MEETING (1.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WILKIE FARR REGARDING SALE MOTION (1.0)	5.70	4,417.50	W210	11521321
03/17/04	Rubin, Steven CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI WORKING GROUP REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.8); REVIEW TERM SHEET (.2)	1.00	670.00	W210	11456349
03/17/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING FCC LICENSES WITH M. KOTLER & COMPANY	0.20	80.00	W210	11450502
03/18/04	Rubin, Steven WORK ON TERM SHEET, ETC.	0.60	402.00	W210	11502504
03/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	0.70	542.50	W210	11621866
03/19/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL: SALE MOTION (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING TELES ISSUE (1.2)	1.90	1,472.50	W210	11521379
03/19/04	Rubin, Steven REVIEW QUESTIONS REGARDING JV (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BEHM REGARDING SAME (.3); PREPARE RESPONSES (.2)	0.80	536.00	W210	11456351
03/20/04	Rubin, Steven E-MAIL RESPONSES TO QUESTIONS FOR MCI.	0.70	469.00	W210	11456352
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. LEWIS REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ (.2) REGARDING SAME.	0.40	310.00	W210	11621478
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. FIFE, F. GREEN, A. STROCHAK, S. KELLY, ET AL REGARDING UPDATE ON PENDING MATTERS.	2.00	1,550.00	W210	11621434
03/22/04	Green, Frederick	2.10	1,627.50	W210	11521611

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS ISSUES REGARDING EMBRATEL (2.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. YODELMAN REGARDING SAME (.1)				
03/22/04	Fife, Lori	1.80	1,287.00	W210	11506299
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, A. PEREZ, S. YODELMAN REGARDING PENDING MATTERS - KPMG, EMBRATEL (1.0); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.8).				
03/22/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.20	99.00	W210	11525611
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING INQUIRY REGARDING EMBRATEL MOTION [0.1]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LONGMIRE REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING [0.1]				
03/22/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.10	544.50	W210	11525680
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET [0.1]; MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING PENDING MATTERS [1.0]				
03/22/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.40	938.00	W210	11516972
	PREPARE FOR (.4) AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, A. STROCHAK AND L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL, KPMG, EMERGENCE AND ELECTION ISSUES (1.0)				
03/22/04	Cohen, Scott	0.40	160.00	W210	11465042
	REVIEW NEON MOTION & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W210	11632644
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PACELLE (WSJ) REGARDING PENDING MATTERS				
03/23/04	Green, Frederick	0.80	620.00	W210	11521629
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2); D. WHITAKER (.2); P. ESKILDSEN (.2) REGARDING SAME				
03/23/04	Green, Frederick	3.90	3,022.50	W210	11521627
	MEET WITH B. METGE REGARDING EMBRATEL ISSUES (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HALSCYON PARTNERS REGARDING SAME (1.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, METGE REGARDING SAME (.7)				
03/23/04	Fife, Lori	0.70	500.50	W210	11514157
	MEETING WITH METGE, F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL				
03/23/04	Rubin, Steven	3.40	2,278.00	W210	11502526
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. METGE, B. LACY REGARDING EMBRATEL (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE TERM SHEET (2.5)				
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W210	11474381
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING DILIGENCE PROCESS.				
03/23/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	2.40	792.00	W210	11475485
	MEETING WITH B. METGE REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); REVIEW OF ANATEL FILING (1.4)				
03/24/04	Rubin, Steven	0.80	536.00	W210	11501250
	WORK ON TERM SHEET CHANGES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/25/04	Green, Frederick	4.80	3,720.00	W210	11520363

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATTEL ISSUES REGARDING USE OF EXPERTS (2.3); ATTENTION TO TELES OFFERS (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LAZARD REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
03/25/04	Fife, Lori	1.10	786.50	W210	11511559
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING EMBRATTEL (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. YOUDELMAN AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/25/04	Rubin, Steven	0.40	268.00	W210	11501256
	WORK ON TERM SHEET.				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W210	11633645
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HAMILTON FROM REUTERS REGARDING PENDING MATTERS				
03/26/04	Green, Frederick	5.70	4,417.50	W210	11520364
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATTEL (3.2) CALLS ALL DAY REGARDING NEW TELES OFFER AND RESPONSE (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WILKIE FARR REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
03/26/04	Rubin, Steven	0.70	469.00	W210	11501259
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.4); FINALIZE CHANGES TO TERM SHEET (.3)				
03/26/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W210	11527691
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH F. DIMINISH REGARDING AUDIT ISSUES & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/26/04	Fink, Jessica	2.50	1,062.50	W210	11530504
	WORK ON DISTRIBUTION ISSUES, INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. CHASTKA (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH COUNSEL FOR TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE (.5); REVIEW INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES (1.0)				
03/26/04	Froim, Idit	9.40	3,478.00	W210	11470314
	FOLLOWED UP ON THE EMPLOYEE ISSUES/MCI SITUATION WITH WILLKIE (.7) TALKED WITH N. JONES REGARDING EMPLOYEE ISSUES (.5) GATHERED FACTS AND DRAFTED LETTER TO DOJ IN CONNECTION WITH EMPLOYEE ISSUE (8.2)				
03/29/04	Green, Frederick	5.30	4,107.50	W210	11520389
	EMBRATTEL DISCUSSIONS (2.0); CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING RICARDO ET AL (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WILKIE REGARDING EMBRATTEL (.6); ATTENTION TO ANATEL PETITION (1.7)				
03/30/04	Green, Frederick	4.20	3,255.00	W210	11520415
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WEBSTER REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING TELES (.8); PREPARE COMPARISON OF BIDS (2.4); REVIEW RICARDO'S DRAFT OPINION (1.0)				
03/30/04	Fife, Lori	0.60	429.00	W210	11511994
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM COMPANY REGARDING PENDING MATTERS				
03/31/04	Green, Frederick	3.90	3,022.50	W210	11520446
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING STRATEGY (2.4); REVIEW PRESS RELEASES (.7); CALLS WITH LAZARD REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.8)				
03/31/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W210	11528142
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. AMADEO REGARDING TRIRAIL & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/31/04	Taylor, David	0.20	58.00	W210	11520951

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFER WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING STATUS OF BANKRUPTCY COURT APPROVAL AND STATUS OF FCC FILING.					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W210 - BUSINESS OPERATIONS:		144.70	\$ 103,043.50		
03/01/04	Hoernlein, Michael TEND TO SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS.	0.50	185.00	W230	11416013
03/02/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH L. FIFE REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.1) AND FOLLOW-UP REGARDING SAME (.2); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO M. FRENCH REGARDING SECTION 382 ANALYSIS (.2); REVIEW VOICE MAIL FROM, AND CONFER WITH, T. KRELLER OF MILLBANK REGARDING CERBERUS OWNERSHIP (.3); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO WORLDCOM TAX ADVISORS, R. KOST, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW DRAFT MEMORANDUM FROM AKIN GUMP REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND PROVIDE COMMENTS (WITH L. FIFE) TO R. COS (1.5) AND FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH L. FIFE (.2)	2.80	2,002.00	W230	11415398
03/03/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH M. FRENCH, R. KOST AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING CERBERUS OWNERSHIP AND NOTE ELECTIONS (.5); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH R. KOST REGARDING CERBERUS ELECTIONS (.4); REVIEW CALCULATIONS REGARDING SAME (.2); CALL WITH D. GROPPER OF ELLIOT ASSOCIATION REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.3) AND WITH R. COX REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER FURTHER WITH M. FRENCH AND R. KOST REGARDING CERBERUS OWNERSHIP AND SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS (.3); FOLLOW-UP WITH J. UFFNER REGARDING SAME (.2) AND WITH R. KOST (.2) REGARDING MODEL; CALL WITH G. BREY OF MILBANK REGARDING CERBERUS TREATMENT AND EMAIL TO TAX ADVISORS, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, R. KOST REGARDING SAME (.4)	2.70	1,930.50	W230	11415403
03/03/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT) REGARDING STATE TAX CLAIMS AND SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (0.4); E-MAILS TO/FROM R. GARCES (MC1) REGARDING RITTENOUR SCHOOL DISTRICT TAX ISSUES (0.3)	0.70	385.00	W230	11518309
03/03/04	Grogan, James REVIEW TAX CLAIMS PROPOSED FOR OBJECTION (.7); CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING SAME (.4).	1.10	401.50	W230	11428124
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. PALMER, D. GOLDEN REGARDING NOL ISSUES.	0.50	387.50	W230	11620407
03/04/04	Goldring, Stuart CALL WITH R. COX AND A. KASHINSKAYA REGARDING STATUS OF SECTION 382 (L)(5) QUALIFICATION MODEL (.2); CONFER WITH J. UFFNER, M. FRENCH AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING MATLIN OWNERSHIP (.4); DISCUSS SAME FURTHER WITH M. HOERLEIN (.2); DISCUSS SECTION 382(L)(5) QUALIFICATION WITH M. FRENCH (.3); CALL WITH M. PALMER, J. UFFNER, M. FRENCH AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) QUALIF. (.9); CALL WITH R. COX, M. HOERNLEIN AND M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (.8) AND FURTHER CALL WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (.3); PREPARE FOR COALL WITH MILLBANK REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) (.3); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO L. FIFE AND OTHERS REGARDING CREDITOR REQUEST FOR SECTION 382(L)(5) INFO (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH G. BREY, S. FRIEDMAN, K ROSELL, A. WALDENBERG, L. FIFE, M. FRENCH AND M. HOENIG REGARDING CERBERUS NOTE TREATMENT (.4) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH L. FIFE AND M. FRENCH (.2); CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) SCHEDULES (.4)	4.60	3,289.00	W230	11415457
03/04/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT) REGARDING OHIO MOTION TO ALLOW LATE-FILED CLAIM (0.3); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT) REGARDING SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH STATE TAX CLAIMS (0.6); REVIEW HOOD CASE REGARDING SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY AND STATUS IN SUPREME COURT (0.4)	1.00	550.00	W230	11518312

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/04	Hoernlein, Michael TELEPHONE CALLS WITH M. FRENCH, J. UFFNER, M. PALMER, AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) QUALIFICATION AND FACTS REGARDING CERTAIN CLAIMS HOLDERS (1.8); RESEARCH REGARDING TREAS. REG. SECTION 1.382-9 (0.4); TEND TO DTC REQUEST FOR INFORMATION ABOUT STOCK TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.3).	2.50	925.00	W230	11415998
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.50	387.50	W230	11620602
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.50	387.50	W230	11621775
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE, M. CAPELLAS REGARDING TAX ISSUES	1.60	1,240.00	W230	11619595
03/05/04	Strochak, Adam CONFERENCE WITH L. FINE REGARDING RESEARCH ON 507(A)(8) TREATMENT OF TAX PENALTIES (0.2) ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.50	275.00	W230	11519737
03/05/04	Fine, Lisa CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING STATE TAX LAW ISSUE.	0.20	82.00	W230	11515313
03/05/04	Hoernlein, Michael TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, S. GOLD, J. MASSAY REGARDING STOCK TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.5); SUMMARIZE SUBSTANCE OF CALL FOR N. JONES (0.3); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING CERBERUS CLAIMS OWNERSHIP (0.3).	1.10	407.00	W230	11416000
03/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING NOL ISSUES.	0.70	542.50	W230	11617826
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, M. PALMER REGARDING SET-UP MEETING.	0.40	310.00	W230	11618755
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.5)	0.70	542.50	W230	11622799
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.70	542.50	W230	11622845
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.80	620.00	W230	11622797
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. SAVAGE, S. KELLY, M. CAPELLAS REGARDING MATLIN AGREEMENT.	1.40	1,085.00	W230	11622844
03/08/04	Bower, David REVIEW CONTRACT (.4); SEND TAX RELATED COMMENTS (.3)	0.70	406.00	W230	11521932
03/08/04	Strochak, Adam	0.80	440.00	W230	11489853

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALLS, E-MAILS, AND CONFERENCES WITH L. FINE REGARDING RESEARCH ON WITHDRAWAL OF REFERENCE ISSUE IN CONNECTION WITH STATE TAX CLAIMS (0.6); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
03/08/04	Hoernlein, Michael	6.70	2,479.00	W230	11432803
	RESEARCH REGARDING TREASURY REGULATION SECTION 1.382-9 (5.0); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. CAPELLAS, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, S. GOLDRING, M. NEPORUNT, S. KELLY REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND SECTION 382 (1.2); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/08/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.50	185.00	W230	11446864
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND A. KASHLASKAYA (KPMG) REGARDING WORLDCOM'S POSITION ON RECHARACTERIZATION OF INTERMEDIA NOTE (.2); E-MAIL TO J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING DISPUTE OVER NOTE/STOCK ELECTION BY CERTAIN CREDITORS (.2).				
03/08/04	Berkovich, Ronit	1.90	703.00	W230	11446823
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING ALABAMA TAX CLAIMS (.1); REVIEW MEMORANDUM BY R. GRAHAM REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW MEMORANDA WRITTEN BY ALABAMA REGARDING SAME (.9); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING PREPARING COMPANY FOR RESPONSE TO ALABAMA (.7).				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11616813
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11616748
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.50	1,162.50	W230	11616146
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.6); PREPARE MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME (.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W230	11622517
	MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, M. PALMER, D. GOLDEN AND M. SAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES (1.2) AND CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE (.4), T. SAVAGE (.4) REGARDING SAME.				
03/09/04	Goldring, Stuart	13.00	9,295.00	W230	11434037
	CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING NUBIL/NUBIL ANALYSIS AND SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS (.5); MEETING WITH M. PALMER, M. SAGE, M GOLDSTEIN, C. MARCUS, M. HOERNLEIN AND (ON PHONE) D. GOLDEN REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND PLAN (1.5); FOLLOW-UP WITH M. HOERNLEIN, J. UFFNER AND M. PALMER REGARDING SAME (.3); PARTICIPATE IN EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND M. PALMER REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENTS (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. COX, P. FENN, D. KILLIP, M. FRENCH AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (1.3); REVIEW M. FRENCH EMAIL REGARDING EARLY SECTION 382(L)(5) MODEL (.3); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN, M. FIFE, M. PALMER AND J. UFFNER REGARDING EARLIER CALL WITH AKIN (.5); CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING SAME DISCUSSION (.4); CALL WITH P. COX REGARDING MATLIN AND SILVERLAKE OWNERSHIP (1.3); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (.3); DISCUSS SAME WITH M. HOERNLEIN (1.3); REVIEW FILES FOR PAST INFORMATION ON MATLIN/SILVERLAKE DISCUSSIONS (5.0)				
03/09/04	Bower, David	1.20	696.00	W230	11522317
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/09/04	Strochak, Adam	0.90	495.00	W230	11516305

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, D. RICHARDS, B. BENJET (ALL MCI), M. GOLSTEIN, C. SCHEELER (PIPER), D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING NEGOTIATIONS WITH STATE OF ALABAMA OVER TAX CLAIMS				
03/09/04	Hoernlein, Michael	5.30	1,961.00	W230	11433146
	CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND SECTION 382 ANALYSIS (1.3); MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, M. PALMER, M. SAGE (WITH J. UFFNER AND D. GOLDEN ON THE PHONE) REGARDING SECTION 1.382-9 AND CREDITORS ELECTIONS (1.8); TENDING TO CREDITORS' COMMITTEE REQUESTS FOR INFORMATION REGARDING SILVER LAKE'S PARTICIPATION IN PLAN FORMULATION (2.2).				
03/09/04	Grogan, James	1.20	438.00	W230	11430816
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GIBBS AND C. LOPEZ REGARDING TENNESSEE TAX LITIGATION (.6); CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE CLAIMS (.3).				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11622620
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING (.2); M. HOENIG (.2) REGARDING SAME				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11622617
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11619359
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING ELLIOTT ASSOCIATES (.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.30	1,782.50	W230	11619322
	CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, R. KOST, M. PALMER AND WITH MATLIN, COMMITTEE AND OTHERS REGARDING NOL/ELECTION ISSUE (1.0) AND CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, S. GOLDRING (.8) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/10/04	Hoening, Mark	2.70	1,930.50	W230	11427943
	DISTRIBUTION OF NOTES REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/10/04	Fine, Lisa	2.50	1,025.00	W230	11515342
	RESEARCH REGARDING TREATMENT OF STATE TAX PENALTIES UNDER 507(A)(8)				
03/10/04	Hoernlein, Michael	5.90	2,183.00	W230	11432588
	MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING ET AL. REGARDING SECTION 4.06(D) OF THE PLAN (2.8); CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING MEETING (0.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING AND M. FRENCH REGARDING MEETING (1.0); REVIEWING FILE FOR CORRESPONDENCES RELEVANT TO SECTION 4.06(D) OF THE PLAN (1.6).				
03/10/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.20	74.00	W230	11446402
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. FRENCH (KPMG) AND J. FINK REGARDING WORLDCOM POSITIONS WITH RESPECT TO INTERMEDIA NOTE.				
03/10/04	Grogan, James	2.80	1,022.00	W230	11430826
	CORRESPOND WITH J. SALTZBERG REGARDING TAX SETTLEMENTS (.1); DRAFT AND REVISE CLAIM OBJECTION RELATED TO SAME (1.8); REVIEW LIEN NOTICE FROM NEW BERLIN, ILLINOIS (.2); CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. KNIGHT REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. SALTZBERG REGARDING REGULATORY FEE CLAIMS (.1).				
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11620283

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W230	11620350
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, E-MAILS WITH ROSNER REGARDING ELLIOT ASSOCIATES (.4) AND CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11623856
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE AND L. FIFE REGARDING D. GROPPER, ETC.				
03/11/04	Hoening, Mark	2.20	1,573.00	W230	11429830
	SECURITIES DISTRIBUTION.				
03/11/04	Fife, Lori	1.00	715.00	W230	11506318
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING, STROOCK REGARDING TAX/ALLOCATION ISSUES.				
03/11/04	Goldring, Stuart	5.30	3,789.50	W230	11434234
	CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING RESOLVING NOTE ALLOCATION (.3); CONSIDER VOICE MAIL FROM M. HOENIG REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.3); PARTICIPATE IN EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH P. COX REGARDING INFORMATION REQUESTS RELATING TO NOTES ELECTION (.1); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN, B. COOPER, AND D MASSEY (OF DTC) REGARDING CHARTER RESTRICTIONS (.6); CONFER WITH K. WALLIE REGARDING STOCK TRANSFER EQUIVALENTS (1.1); DISCUSS WITH P. COX ARRANGEMENTS FOR MEETINGS WITH VARIOUS CREDITORS (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. SAGE, M. PALMER, J. UFFNER, L. FIFE , M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATION (1.2); FOLLOW-UP WITH L. FIFE (.2), M. HOERNLEIN (.2), J UFFNER (.7) AND M. HOENIG (.2) REGARDING SAME.				
03/11/04	Walli, Karl	1.10	638.00	W230	11463865
	DISCUSS OPTIONS UNDER SECTION 382 ISSUES WITH S. GOLDRING.				
03/11/04	Strochak, Adam	0.90	495.00	W230	11516297
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH S. KELLY AND D. RICHARDS (MCI), D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING NEGOTIATIONS WITH MASSACHUSETTS ON TAX CLAIMS AND THREATENED MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (0.6); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD REGARDING SAME (0.3)				
03/11/04	Hoernlein, Michael	2.90	1,073.00	W230	11432560
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH S. GOLDRING, M. PALMER, M. SAGE, J. UFFNER, L. FIFE REGARDING SECTION 382 ANALYSIS (1.0); CONFER WITH GOLDRING REGARDING SECTION 382 ANALYSIS (1.4); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, B. COOPER, J. MASSAY AND J. WADDLE REGARDING STOCK TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.5).				
03/11/04	Grogan, James	1.80	657.00	W230	11430831
	CORRESPOND WITH M. FISHER REGARDING OBJECTION TO SETTLED TAX CLAIMS (.4); DRAFT AND REVISE OBJECTION TO SAME (1.4).				
03/12/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.50	357.50	W230	11434890
	FOLLOW-UP WITH KPMG BY EMAIL REGARDING REVISIONS TO (L)(5) TRACKER MODEL (.2); CALL WITH A. KASHLINSKAYA REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/12/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W230	11430835
	CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING WAGE WITHHOLDING ISSUES				
03/13/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11620607
	CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, S. GOLDRING, ET AL REGARDING NOL ISSUES.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/15/04	Hoenig, Mark SECTION 382 CALCULATIONS AND ANALYSIS (1.3) CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.2)	1.50	1,072.50	W230	11439333
03/15/04	Goldring, Stuart CALLS WITH T. SAVAGE OF LAZARD REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS (.9); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO R. COX REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) TRACKER MODEL (.2); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS (1.2) AND WITH M. HOENIG REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND ANALYZE SAME MODEL RUN (1.2); DISCUSS SAME WITH R. COX REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS (.6)	4.30	3,074.50	W230	11447878
03/15/04	Hoernlein, Michael TELEPHONE CALL WITH T. SAVAGE AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS (0.2); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING MEMORANDUM ON NEW NOTE ALLOCATIONS (1.0); DRAFT MEMORANDUM ON NEW NOTE ALLOCATIONS (0.6).	1.80	666.00	W230	11448940
03/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, E-MAILS WITH L. FIFE, S. GOLDRING, D. GROPER REGARDING UPCOMING MEETING WITH D. GROPER REGARDING NOL ISSUES.	0.80	620.00	W230	11621826
03/16/04	Goldring, Stuart DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO M. FRENCH REGARDING STATUS OF TRACKER MODEL (.3); CONFER WITH T. SAVAGE AND N. JONES AND STACIA KELLEY FOR PART, REGARDING IMPLEMENTATION OF PLAN PROVISIONS (.7); REVIEW NOL VALUATION MODEL (.2); RESPOND TO P. COX QUESTIONS REGARDING TRACKER MODEL (.2); CONFER WITH F. DINIMICH (.5), C. TRAJTENBERG (.2) AND S. YOUDELMAN (.2) REGARDING FINANCIAL VENTURES OWNERSHIP; CALLS WITH M. FRENCH (.2) AND J. UFFNER (.2) REGARDING NOL VALUATION.	2.70	1,930.50	W230	11450852
03/16/04	Hoernlein, Michael CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (1.3); DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS AND SECTION 382 OF THE CODE (1.7).	3.00	1,110.00	W230	11448943
03/17/04	Hoenig, Mark ATTENTION TO SECTION 382 TAX ISSUES	1.50	1,072.50	W230	11457363
03/17/04	Goldring, Stuart CALLS WITH T. SAVAGE (1.1) AND M. HOENIG (.4) REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) QUALIFICATION CONSIDERATIONS	1.50	1,072.50	W230	11450482
03/17/04	Hoernlein, Michael TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. COX AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING MEETING WITH ELLIOT ASSOCIATES REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATION (0.3); DRAFT MEMORANDUM ON NEW NOTE ALLOCATION AND SECTION 382 (6.4).	6.70	2,479.00	W230	11449336
03/17/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING INTERIM VS. FINAL TRADING ORDER.	0.10	37.00	W230	11532423
03/17/04	Khavulya-Maksin, Natalie BANKRUPTCY RESTRUCTURING - RESEARCH ON SECTION 382(L)(5) AND CONSOLIDATED RETURN REGULATIONS.	2.90	797.50	W230	11446384
03/18/04	Hoenig, Mark SECTION 382 FACT DEVELOPMENT AND ANALYSIS.	2.00	1,430.00	W230	11457373
03/18/04	Goldring, Stuart	7.10	5,076.50	W230	11450603

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CALL WITH J. UFFNER, M. PALMER AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATION (.5); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS (.8); CALLS WITH M. HOENIG REGARDING SAME (.6); CALLS WITH K. FERRELL OF DAVIS POLK REGARDING SAME (2.0); CALL WITH R. KOST AND M. FRENCH REGARDING NOL VALUATION (.4); MEETING REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATION WITH J. UFFNER, M. PALMER AND M. SAGE OF STROOCK, D. GOLDEN, I. DIZENGOFF, D. KILLIP, P. COX, AND P. FENN OF AKIN GUMP, S. COHEN AND M. NEPORUNT OF CERBERUS, G. BRAY AND S. FRIEDMAN OF MILBANK TWEED (BOTH BY PHONE), K. ROSELL OF SCHULTE ROTH, DAN GROPPER AND J. PIKE OF ELLIOTT ASSOC., J. BORTNICK OF KLEINBERG, D. ROSENER OF KASOWITZ, R. KOST OF LAZARD, M. FRENCH AND M. HOFFENBERG OF KPMG, J. THOREN OF MCI, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, M. HOENIG AND M. HOERNLEIN (2.5); AND FOLLOW-UP WITH T. SAVAGE OF LAZARD (.3)				
03/18/04	Khavulya-Maksin, Natalie	0.60	165.00	W230	11446797
	BANKRUPTCY RESTRUCTURING - RESEARCH ON SECTION 382(L)(5) AND CONSOLIDATED RETURN REGULATIONS.				
03/19/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.90	1,358.50	W230	11450728
	PARTICIPATE IN EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH M. FRENCH AND R. KOST REGARDING NOL VALUATION MODEL (.3); CALL WITH R. KOST (.1) AND CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN ON FACTUAL DILIGENCE REGARDING SECTION 382 (.2); FURTHER SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS (.9); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN (.2) AND CALL WITH M. FRENCH (.2) REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) TRACKING MODEL				
03/19/04	Hoernlein, Michael	7.20	2,664.00	W230	11448979
	DRAFT MEMORANDUM ON NEW NOTE ALLOCATION AND SECTION 382.				
03/21/04	Hoernlein, Michael	2.80	1,036.00	W230	11474162
	REVISE MEMORANDUM ON ALLOCATION OF NEW NOTES UNDER THE PLAN.				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W230	11622009
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.50	1,162.50	W230	11622047
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE AND D. GOLDEN REGARDING NOL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. PALMER, ETC. (.3) THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING NOL (.3); THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W230	11622008
	PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING NOL VALUATION WITH L. FIFE, S. GOLDRING, LAZARD, ET AL.				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	3.00	2,325.00	W230	11621905
	MEETING WITH L. FIFE, T. SAVAGE JOINED BY S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/22/04	Hoenig, Mark	1.10	786.50	W230	11458976
	ATTENTION TO SECTION 382 ISSUES				
03/22/04	Fife, Lori	4.90	3,503.50	W230	11506266
	MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND T. SAVAGE REGARDING ELECTION/TAX ISSUES (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN AND T. SAVAGE REGARDING SAME (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, CREDITORS COMMITTEE REPRESENTATIVES AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLD REGARDING CLOSING (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, KPMG, AKIN, LAZARD AND HOULIHAN REGARDING NOL ISSUES (1.5).				
03/22/04	Goldring, Stuart	3.20	2,288.00	W230	11472695

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	SEND EMAILS TO A. KASHINSKAYA OF KPMG AND R. KOST OF LAZARD REGARDING NOL VALUATION MODEL, AND DISCUSS SAME WITH A. KASHINSKAYA IN PREPARATION FOR CR. COMM. CALL (.4); CALL WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE REPRESENTATIVES, M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING NOL VALUATION MODEL (1.4); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.4) AND R. COX (.3) REGARDING SAME; CONFER WITH F. GREEN REGARDING NOL TREATMENT (.3); CALLS WITH B. COOPER AND S. GOLD REGARDING DTC AND CHARTER RESTRICTION (.4)				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11632388
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11632589
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES REGARDING NOL.				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11632635
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GROPPER, ROSNER REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.70	1,317.50	W230	11632616
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CAPELLAS (.5); THEN WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING NOL/ELECTIONS (.4) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.8)				
03/23/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.50	357.50	W230	11473386
	CALL WITH A. KASHINSKAYA (.4) AND REPLY TO R. COX (.1) REGARDING SILVERLAKE OWNERSHIP				
03/23/04	Strochak, Adam	0.10	55.00	W230	11489662
	PHONE CALL TO D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING OHIO MOTION FOR EXTENSION OF BAR DATE AS TO TAX CLAIMS AND POTENTIAL COMPROMISE ON NEXUS COMBINATION ISSUES FOR 2001				
03/23/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	3.20	1,040.00	W230	11457345
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING MINOOKA COUNTY TAX ISSUE (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. AGEE REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING STATUS OF ERS STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL AND S. HOLMES REGARDING STATUS OF NETSOLVE STIPULATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING PROPERTY TAX ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CAUGHLIN REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY TAX SALE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. KNIGHT REGARDING PROPERTY TAX ISSUES (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING CISCO'S ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.7) AND CORRESPOND WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET AND CALENDAR UPDATES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING LAHTI STIPULATION (.2).				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11631921
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W230	11631674
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. DIZENGOFF (.3); THEN WITH LAZARD REGARDING NOL UTILIZATION (.4)				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W230	11632667
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/24/04	Fink, Jessica	6.30	2,677.50	W230	11530646
	CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING DISQUALIFICATION OF PROFESSIONALS (5.3); REVIEW WHITE PAPER REGARDING TAX ISSUES (1.0)				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11632911

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE (.5); M. CAPELLAS (.5) REGARDING SAME				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.20	930.00	W230	11633591
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAXES (.4) FOLLOWED BY TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SAGE (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN AND I. DIZENGOFF (.5) REGARDING SAME				
03/25/04	Fife, Lori	0.20	143.00	W230	11571595
	CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/25/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.60	429.00	W230	11472235
	CALL WITH A. KASHINSKAYA REGARDING NOL MODEL, AND FOLLOW-UP VOICE MAIL FOR D. RICHARDS (.3); CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND R. KOST REGARDING NOL VALUATION (.3)				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W230	11633351
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. PALMER REGARDING MEETING.				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11633643
	MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING AND L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11633816
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11633820
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11633601
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W230	11633345
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. DIZENGOFF AND T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/26/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.20	858.00	W230	11471818
	CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND FOLLOW-UP CALLS TO D. RICHARDS REGARDING NOL VALUATION MODEL (.4); CALL WITH A. KASHINSKAYA (.4), M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE (.2) AND T. SAVAGE (.2) REGARDING SAME				
03/28/04	Strochak, Adam	0.60	330.00	W230	11491090
	E-MAILS TO/FROM D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING STANDARDS FOR AMENDMENT OF TAX CLAIMS (0.3); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING RELATION BACK OF POST-BAR DATE AMENDMENTS TO TAX PROOFS OF CLAIM (0.3)				
03/29/04	Goldring, Stuart	2.50	1,787.50	W230	11485088
	CONFER WITH R. KOST REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5)/(L)(6) VALUATION MODEL (.2); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH AND R. KOST TOGETHER (.9) AND WITH L. FIFE (.3) REGARDING SAME; CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING SAME (.4); FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH R. KOST REGARDING SAME (.7)				
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W230	11634057
	MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, ET AL REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.4); CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.4)				
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11633228

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, M. PALMER, L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11633578
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SAGE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING AND R. KOST REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/30/04	Goldring, Stuart	4.50	3,217.50	W230	11484091
	CONFER WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5)/(L)(6) VALUATION MODEL (.3); CONFER WITH M. HOENIG (.2), M. HOERNLEIN (.2), M. GOLDSTEIN (.1), AND R. KOST (.3) REGARDING SAME; MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND, FOR PART, L. FIFE, R. KOST AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS AND NOL CONSIDERATIONS (3.2), INCLUDING CALLS WITH M. FRENCH, D. RICHARDS AND B. BLAKELY (.1); FOLLOW-UP WITH M. HOENIG AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.1)				
03/30/04	Hoernlein, Michael	5.20	1,924.00	W230	11504448
	MEETING WITH M. PALMER, J. GILL, J. UFFNER, SILVER LAKE, BAIN REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS UNDER THE PLAN (0.4); MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, R. KOST REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS - INCLUDING TELEPHONE CALLS WITH M. FRENCH, D. RICHARDS, R. BLAKELY AND S. KELLEY (2.4); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (1.5); TEND TO SECTION 382 ANALYSIS AND NOTE ALLOCATION ANALYSIS (1.9).				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11635122
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING SEC/TAX ISSUES				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11632931
	REVIEW L5 AND L6 ANALYSIS.				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11633384
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CAPELLAS REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
03/31/04	Goldring, Stuart	5.80	4,147.00	W230	11484973
	CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5)/(L)(6) VALUATION STATUS (.3) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH R. COX REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH (.5) AND R. KOST (.4) REGARDING SAME AND RELATED CONSIDERATIONS; CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.2) AND L. FIFE (.1) REGARDING SAME; CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING POSSIBLE INTERNAL MERGERS (.4); CALL WITH R. COX TO REVIEW VARIOUS ELEMENTS OF COMPARATIVE VALUATION MODEL (2.8) AND GO OVER SAME WITH M. FRENCH (.7)				
03/31/04	Hoernlein, Michael	2.40	888.00	W230	11503050
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH S. GOLDRING, M. FRENCH AND P. COX REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) V. 382(L)(6) COMPARISON MODEL (1.5); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS (0.9).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W230 - TAX ISSUES:		211.90	\$ 125,196.00		
03/01/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.50	310.00	W240	11521225
	REVIEW OF REVISED MOTION AND SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE AND SEND TO P. FERRILLO FOR FORWARDING TO D. STEUBER AND FOR DISCUSSION AND REVIEW WITH WGM BANKRUPTCY TEAM.				
03/02/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11419414
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VOICE MESSAGE FROM P. ANDERSON REGARDING THE PROPOSED ZURICH SETTLEMENT.				
03/05/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.60	198.00	W240	11415325

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL REGARDING D. MYERS' REQUEST FOR ADVANCEMENT OF LEGAL FEES (.3); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/08/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.60	198.00	W240	11420038
	DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR D. MYERS REGARDING REQUEST FOR ADVANCEMENT OF LEGAL FEES (.3); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/09/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.80	264.00	W240	11422567
	CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING DEFINITION OF "CULPABLE INDIVIDUAL" UNDER PLAN OF REORGANIZATION (.2); RESEARCH REGARDING "FINDING IN FACT" OF CRIMINAL LIABILITY/GUILT (.3); DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR D. MYERS REGARDING REQUEST FOR ADVANCEMENT OF DEFENSE COSTS (.3)				
03/11/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.60	198.00	W240	11427875
	REVIEW PLEADINGS REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH NATIONAL UNION AND INDIVIDUAL INSUREDS.				
03/12/04	Johnson, Virginia	2.80	924.00	W240	11430440
	RESEARCH REGARDING EFFECT OF GUILTY PLEA ON OBLIGATION TO ADVANCE DEFENSE COSTS (2.2); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING RESPONSE TO MYERS LETTER (.6)				
03/15/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.80	264.00	W240	11435369
	CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING RESPONSE TO LETTER FROM D. MYERS SEEKING ADVANCEMENT OF DEFENSE COSTS.				
03/16/04	Johnson, Virginia	2.40	792.00	W240	11438475
	REVISE LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR D. MYERS REGARDING REQUEST FOR ADVANCEMENT OF DEFENSE COSTS (1.6); CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND, P. FERRILLO AND R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME (.8)				
03/17/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.40	212.00	W240	11445695
	REVIEW MYERS LETTER (.2); EMAIL TO V. JOHNSON ON CULPABLE INDIVIDUAL STATUS OF D. MYERS (.2)				
03/19/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.20	106.00	W240	11450729
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO DAVE STEUBER ON ERISA MEDIATION.				
03/19/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.60	267.00	W240	11448286
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SETTLEMENT REACHED WITH ZURICH (.10); AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. GROGAN REGARDING DOCUMENTING SAME (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING THE ZURICH AGREEMENT (.10); DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO B. BENJET REGARDING CONVERSATIONS WITH P. ANDERSON CONCERNING THE PROPOSED SETTLEMENT (.20); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING TERMS OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION (.10).				
03/21/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11451548
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING TERMS OF THE ZURICH SETTLEMENT.				
03/22/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.20	106.00	W240	11456215
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY ON STATUS OF ERISA MEDIATION.				
03/22/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.40	178.00	W240	11455573

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING TERMS OF THE PROPOSED ZURICH SETTLEMENT (.20); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING TERMS OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION (.10); AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING DRAFTING SAME (.10).				
03/22/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W240	11466383
	REVIEW VARIOUS SETTLEMENT PROPOSALS REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES (.2) CONFERENCE WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING ZURICH STIPULATION (.1)				
03/23/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.50	222.50	W240	11458256
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING TIMING FOR DRAFTING THE ZURICH STIPULATION AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. GROGAN REGARDING SCHEDULE FOR RESPONDING TO SAME (.20); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING THE TERMS OF THE ZURICH SETTLEMENT AND THE GUARANTEED COST PROGRAM (.2) AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/24/04	Protopapas, Lydia	1.20	534.00	W240	11462373
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING THE TERMS OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION (.10); REVIEW AND REVISE THE ZURICH INSURANCE STIPULATION (.20); AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING NEEDED REVISIONS TO SAME (.20); DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO S. MOONEY REGARDING THE TERMS OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON AND J. GROGAN REGARDING OUTLINE OF THE SETTLEMENT (.50); AND THEN CONTACT S. MOONEY REGARDING SAME (.10).				
03/25/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.60	318.00	W240	11464941
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM D. STEUBER ON ERISA PAYMENT PLAN (0.4); PARTICIPATE ON STATUS CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, M. JACOBY AND P. CURNIN (0.2).				
03/25/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.40	178.00	W240	11465061
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MOONEY REGARDING PROPOSED TERMS OF THE ZURICH SETTLEMENT (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING PREPARING REVISED FORM OF ZURICH STIPULATION (.10); AND THEN CONTACT P. ANDERSON REGARDING SAME (.10).				
03/26/04	Ferrillo, Paul	3.00	1,590.00	W240	11469671
	PARTICIPATE IN ERISA MEDIATION.				
03/26/04	Protopapas, Lydia	1.30	578.50	W240	11473006
	REVIEW AND REVISE THE ZURICH STIPULATION AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.60); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING PROVISIONS OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION RELATING TO ALLOWANCE OF ZURICH'S CLAIMS (.20); REVIEW AND REVISE THE UPDATED DRAFT OF THE ZURICH SETTLEMENT STIPULATION (.50).				
03/29/04	Ferrillo, Paul	1.00	530.00	W240	11498845
	REVIEW HEALTHSOUTH DECISION.				
03/29/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.60	267.00	W240	11479663
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MOONEY REGARDING PRESENTATION OF ZURICH SETTLEMENT TO HOULIHAN LOKEY (.10); REVIEW AND REVISE THE ZURICH STIPULATION (.40); AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING INCORPORATING RELEVANT REVISIONS (.10).				
03/29/04	Johnson, Virginia	1.50	495.00	W240	11473191
	REVIEW RECENT D&O INSURANCE DECISIONS (1.0); CONFER WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/29/04	Grogan, James	2.20	803.00	W240	11505043

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MOONEY, C. STYRUS, T. MEINKEN AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING VARIOUS INSURANCE SETTLEMENTS (.8); REVIEW PROPOSED SETTLEMENTS (.4); CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE STIPULATION (.3); REVISE SAME (.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ANDERSON, S. MOONEY AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.2);				
03/31/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.60	267.00	W240	11513950
	REVIEW THE REVISED WORKERS' COMPENSATION STIPULATION (.10); AND THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING NEEDED REVISION TO SAME (.10); REVIEW FURTHER E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING THE REVISED FORM OF ZURICH STIPULATION (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY AND P. BROWN REGARDING FUNDING OF WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIMS (.20); AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.10).				
03/31/04	Grogan, James	0.90	328.50	W240	11507760
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE STIPULATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVISE STIPULATION (.4).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W240 - INSURANCE ISSUES:		25.20	\$ 10,327.00		
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W260	11622885
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD AND FOLLOW UP CALLS, E-MAILS REGARDING RESTRICTED STOCK PLAN, EMPLOYMENT CONTRACTS.				
03/04/04	Fife, Lori	0.40	286.00	W260	11507549
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SEVERANCE AND REVIEW CASE LAW.				
03/04/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.80	536.00	W260	11418437
	REVIEW CASELAW (.40) AND ISSUES RELATED TO SEVERANCE AND EMPLOYEE BENEFITS WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.40)				
03/04/04	Grogan, James	0.70	255.50	W260	11428096
	CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES (.2); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.5).				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W260	11622567
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMPLOYEE STOCK PLAN (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCGARY REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/16/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.20	99.00	W260	11525695
	REVIEW M. JACOBY CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING VIVIEN DEPOSITIONS				
03/18/04	Protopapas, Lydia	2.20	979.00	W260	11447016
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY AND B. BENJET REGARDING TERMS OF THE PROPOSED ZURICH SETTLEMENT (.20); REVIEW AND REVISE THE SECOND DRAFT OF THE RESPONSE TO WORKERS' COMPENSATION OBJECTIONS (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE ANOTHER UPDATED DRAFT OF THE RESPONSE TO THE COMMITTEE'S WORKERS' COMPENSATION OBJECTIONS (.50); REVIEW THE FINAL DRAFT OF THE RESPONSE TO THE WORKERS' COMPENSATION OBJECTIONS (.50).				
03/22/04	Grogan, James	0.40	146.00	W260	11465667
	CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING EMPLOYEE ISSUES				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W260	11631542

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE, R. KOST REGARDING EMPLOYEE STOCK PLAN.				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W260	11631588
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING EMPLOYEE STOCK PLAN.				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W260	11631681
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EMPLOYEE STOCK PLAN.				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W260	11632987
	RESPOND TO FURTHER EMAILS REGARDING EMPLOYEE STOCK PLAN (.3) CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/29/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.20	147.00	W260	11509054
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING ERISA SETTLEMENT (.1)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W260 - EMPLOYEES/UNION ISSUES:		8.20	\$ 5,006.00		
03/01/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.30	180.00	W280	11402154
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS ON T3 AND REQUIRED GUARANTORS UNDER NEW NOTES INDENTURE RECEIVED FROM D. HOLZMAN				
03/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11436836
	PHONE CALL AND CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. RIEFMAN, E. PHILPOTT REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/01/04	Holzman, Daniel	4.90	2,180.50	W280	11417487
	REVISED T-3.				
03/01/04	Berkovich, Ronit	3.10	1,147.00	W280	11411532
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING JMG STIPULATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. EISEN REGARDING SAME (.7); CONFERENCES WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCGAREY REGARDING SAME (.2); REVISIONS TO SAME (.8); E-MAIL SAME TO CREDITORS' COMMITTEE (.1); PREPARE SHORT MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME FOR A. PEREZ (.5).				
03/01/04	Libretta, Paul	1.50	412.50	W280	11418155
	COMPLETED RESEARCHING CORPORATE CODES AND CONSOLIDATING MERGER FORMS FOR TEXAS AND OHIO.				
03/01/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	10.70	1,391.00	W280	11504672
	INDEX AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM PROJECT FOR A. STROCHAK				
03/01/04	Powell, Kristin	9.50	1,235.00	W280	11484816
	COORDINATE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.20	534.00	W280	11417211
	REVISED THE T-3.				
03/02/04	Merola, Michael	2.00	950.00	W280	11517310
	CALLS REGARDING WORLDCOM BONDS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit OBTAIN AND REVIEW ENTERED ORDER RESOLVING JMG MOTION (.1); E-MAIL TO WORLDCOM REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.20	74.00	W280	11410776
03/02/04	Powell, Kristin COORDINATE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM	8.50	1,105.00	W280	11484817
03/03/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM TO DISCUSS CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE ITEMS.	0.50	222.50	W280	11416992
03/03/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEW ELECTION ISSUES	3.80	1,691.00	W280	11416929
03/03/04	Hoernlein, Michael TEND TO DTC'S REQUEST FOR INFORMATION ABOUT STOCK TRADING RESTRICTIONS.	0.50	185.00	W280	11415996
03/03/04	Libretta, Paul REVIEWED CODES FOR 14 JURISDICTIONS AND E-MAILED D. HOLZMAN ABOUT THOSE WHICH HAVE THE SAME PROVISION AS DELAWARE REGARDING MERGERS WITHIN REORGANIZATIONS.	0.50	137.50	W280	11417967
03/03/04	Philpott, Elizabeth INDEX AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM PROJECT FOR A. STROCHAK	8.00	1,040.00	W280	11504675
03/03/04	Powell, Kristin COORDINATE DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM PRODUCTION	7.00	910.00	W280	11484818
03/04/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW & COMMENT REGARDING 2002 10-K [2.2]; CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & B. BENJET REGARDING SAME [0.2]; E-MAIL SILVEIRA REGARDING SAME [0.1]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SILVEIRA REGARDING SAME [0.1]	2.80	1,386.00	W280	11525728
03/04/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS WITH D. EISEN (JMG ATTORNEY) REGARDING MISTAKE IN JMG NUMBER OF SHARES (.3); REVIEW LETTER SENT BY D. EISEN REGARDING SAME (.1); E-MAIL TO WORLDCOM REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.50	185.00	W280	11446664
03/04/04	Philpott, Elizabeth PRODUCTION ROOM INDEXING AND ORGANIZATION FOR A. STROCHAK	3.00	390.00	W280	11504467
03/05/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING TRANSACTION	2.70	2,092.50	W280	11521435
03/05/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED THE T-3/A (6.9) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH C. WELTY AND F. DIMINCH (1.0)	7.90	3,515.50	W280	11416954
03/07/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND COMMENTED ON T-3/A.	1.20	534.00	W280	11417281
03/08/04	Green, Frederick MEET WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.4) & CONFERENCE WITH WGM TEAM (1.0) REGARDING TRANSACTION	1.40	1,085.00	W280	11521451

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND REVISED T-3 (4.8) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH F. DIMINICH AND C. WELTY (.8)	5.60	2,492.00	W280	11430481
03/09/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED STOCK CERTIFICATES.	0.20	89.00	W280	11430710
03/09/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED SUBSIDIARY MERGERS WITH PAUL LIBRETTA.	0.50	222.50	W280	11430709
03/09/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED THE T-3/A (4.1) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH F. DIMINICH AND C. WELTY (.7)	4.80	2,136.00	W280	11430706
03/09/04	Libretta, Paul SPOKE WITH D. HOLZMAN ABOUT STATUS OF MERGERS (.5) COMPILED LIST OF JURISDICTIONS WITH CODE PROVISIONS SIMILAR TO DE'S SECTION 303 WHICH CONCERNS ACTIONS PURSUANT TO REORGANIZATION (FOR CORPORATIONS AND LLCs) (2.2)	2.70	742.50	W280	11433319
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING ELECTION LETTERS.	0.50	387.50	W280	11619361
03/10/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED, REVISED AND ARRANGED FOR FILING OF T-3/A.	5.20	2,314.00	W280	11430389
03/11/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED DOCUMENTATION RELATED TO MERGERS.	0.90	400.50	W280	11430922
03/12/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED EMAIL FROM L. PICONE REGARDING CONSOB (.2), SENT REPLY EMAIL (.1) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH L. PICONE (.1)	0.40	178.00	W280	11430396
03/12/04	Holzman, Daniel DRAFTED AMENDMENT NO. 3 TO T-3.	1.90	845.50	W280	11430490
03/12/04	Froim, Idit FOLLOW UP ON STAKE IN MCI.	1.50	555.00	W280	11493142
03/12/04	Powell, Kristin ASSIST M. REIFMAN IN PREPARING DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION	1.00	130.00	W280	11487651
03/14/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED T-3/A.	0.40	178.00	W280	11448969
03/15/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH G. ROBERTS REGARDING DOCUMENTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11470697
03/15/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED STOCK DISTRIBUTIONS WITH I. FROM.	0.10	44.50	W280	11448830
03/15/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11448775

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSED 5% STOCKHOLDERS WITH F. DIMINICH.				
03/15/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED SEC DISTRIBUTION PLAN.	0.40	178.00	W280	11448776
03/15/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND REVISED FORM T-3.	1.80	801.00	W280	11448828
03/15/04	Froim, Idit FOLLOW UP ON INVESTOR'S STAKE IN MCI (.4) WROTE A REPORT ON THE SITUATION TO D. PEARLSTEIN (.5) WROTE AN E-MAIL TO D. HOLZMAN ON THE SUBJECT (.4) CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING STOCK DISTRIBUTIONS (.1)	1.40	518.00	W280	11451495
03/15/04	Riggs, Herbert CITE CHECK AND REVIEW 4TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION	4.00	660.00	W280	11511501
03/16/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL TO M. CHUNG REGARDING ELECTION ISSUES	0.10	49.50	W280	11471302
03/16/04	Holzman, Daniel RESEARCHED AND DRAFTED FORM 15.	1.00	445.00	W280	11448835
03/16/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND REVISED T-3/A.	4.40	1,958.00	W280	11449227
03/16/04	Froim, Idit FOLLOW UP ON STAKE IN WORLDCOM (E-MAIL FROM GODRING, DISCUSSED WITH HOLMAN AND HEORNLEIN) (1.3) DISCUSSED FCC FILING WITH F. DIMINICH (.5)	1.80	666.00	W280	11451077
03/16/04	Bailey, Gregory ARRANGE TO OBTAIN DOCUMENTS FROM THE SEC FOR DANIEL HOLZMAN	1.30	195.00	W280	11519637
03/17/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND COMMENTED ON LETTER TO DTC.	0.10	44.50	W280	11448769
03/17/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED FORM 8-A.	0.20	89.00	W280	11448773
03/17/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM TO DISCUSS CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE ITEMS.	0.80	356.00	W280	11448772
03/17/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED REGISTRATION RIGHTS AGREEMENT AND RELATED PROVISIONS IN THE PLAN (2.4) CONFERENCE WITH I. FROIM REGARDING INVESTOR'S STAKE IN MCI (.4)	2.80	1,246.00	W280	11448768
03/17/04	Froim, Idit DISCUSSED WITH D. PEARLSTEIN FURTHER STEPS CONCERNING MONITORING INVESTOR'S STAKE IN MCI (.9) DISCUSSED SAME WITH D. HOLZMAN (.4)	1.30	481.00	W280	11450623
03/17/04	Bailey, Gregory ASSEMBLE DOCUMENTS FOR SEC FILING FOR D. HOLZMAN	2.50	375.00	W280	11519653

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/18/04	Green, Frederick RESTARTING TRANSACTION (2.8) ORGANIZE DILIGENCE (1.9) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING NOTE ISSUES (.2)	4.90	3,797.50	W280	11521355
03/18/04	Pearlstein, Debra CONFERENCE WITH I. FROM REGARDING STOCK OWNERSHIP	0.30	201.00	W280	11468322
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH G. ROBERTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11474560
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING NOTE ISSUES	0.20	99.00	W280	11474243
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. BUXBAUM REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MOVE.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474382
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.20	99.00	W280	11474561
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING PARALEGAL	0.30	148.50	W280	11474562
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH H. RIGGS REGARDING NOTES	0.40	198.00	W280	11474563
03/18/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX, DOX.	0.70	346.50	W280	11474385
03/18/04	Ferrillo, Paul RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM CARRIERS ON BOND CLAIM (0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ALAN JOQUIN ON BOND CLAIM (0.2); REVIEW LETTER FROM D. AMATO & LYNCH ON BOND CLAIM (0.4).	0.80	424.00	W280	11445801
03/18/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED FORM 8-A AND RELATED RULES.	0.50	222.50	W280	11448887
03/18/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, N. JONES, M. KAPLAN AND R. SANDLER TO DISCUSS REGISTRATION RIGHTS AGREEMENT.	0.50	222.50	W280	11448890
03/18/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED EXHIBITS TO T-3/A (.3) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH F. DIMINICH AND G. BAILEY (.3)	0.60	267.00	W280	11448892
03/18/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED PLAN SUPPLEMENT PROVISIONS (.8) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH S. GOLD, D. URQUHART, S. COHEN AND B. COOPER (1.0)	1.80	801.00	W280	11448891
03/18/04	Hoernlein, Michael	8.50	3,145.00	W280	11449337

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. UFFNER AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING MEETING WITH ELLIOT ASSOCIATES REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS (0.5); MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, M. HOENIG, T. SAVAGE, R. KOST, D. GROPPER, J. BORTNICK, J. PIKE, D. ROSSNER AND P. COX REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS UNDER THE PLAN (2.6); TELEPHONE CALL WITH K. FARRELL AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SUCH MEETING (0.3); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING MEETING (0.4); DRAFT MEMORANDUM ON NEW NOTE ALLOCATIONS AND SECTION 382 (4.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. MANISCHEWITZ REGARDING APPLICATION OF SECTION 4.06(D) OF THE PLAN (0.6).				
03/18/04	Bailey, Gregory	1.80	270.00	W280	11519657
	PREPARE DOCUMENTS TO BE FILED WITH THE SEC FOR D. HOLZMAN				
03/18/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	2.00	260.00	W280	11504064
	ORGANIZE AND CONSOLIDATE PRODUCTION ROOM CONTENTS FOR D. WHITAKER				
03/18/04	Thompson, Janice	0.50	82.50	W280	11462610
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PARALEGAL ASSISTANCE FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.1); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ARRANGEMENTS FOR TRANSPORTATION OF BOXES OF DOCUMENTS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MOVE SOLUTIONS REGARDING SAME (.1); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING SAME (.1)				
03/19/04	Green, Frederick	2.10	1,627.50	W280	11521378
	ATTENTION TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUESTS (.9); PREPARE RESPONSES FOR EMBRATEL AND AVANTEL QUESTIONS (1.2)				
03/19/04	Urquhart, Douglas	2.00	1,200.00	W280	11450296
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, D. HOLZMAN, B. COOPER REGARDING FILING AND RESUBMISSION OF INDENTURES (.5); DISCUSS SAME WITH M. MEROLA (.5); REVIEW AND APPROVE LEGAL OPINION FOR LETTER OF CREDIT AGREEMENTS (.5); REVIEW REQUIREMENTS FOR SUBMISSION OF INDENTURES WITH S. GOLD, D. HOLZMAN, M. MEROLA (.5)				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11474347
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MOVE.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11474351
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. RIGGS REGARDING DC STAFFING.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474346
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. BUXBAUM REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MOVE.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474352
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING STATUS.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11474348
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND CONFERENCE WITH E. PHILPOTT REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MOVE.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11474343
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM SETUP IN DALLAS.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.70	841.50	W280	11474345
	SET UP OF ROOM IN DALLAS WITH J. ENGLISH AND C. COX.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.20	1,089.00	W280	11474349

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS FOR MOVE TO DALLAS.				
03/19/04	Whittaker, Donald MOVE AND SET UP PRODUCTION ROOM	3.80	1,881.00	W280	11571591
03/19/04	Holzman, Daniel EXCHANGED EMAILS REGARDING CONSOB NOTICE AND ARRANGED FOR TRANSLATION THEREOF.	0.40	178.00	W280	11448782
03/19/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH S. GOLD AND B. COOPER.	1.60	712.00	W280	11448779
03/19/04	Froim, Idit CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING STAKE IN MCI.	0.20	74.00	W280	11451393
03/19/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING PROJECT.	0.20	50.00	W280	11503290
03/19/04	Philpott, Elizabeth PREPARE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS FOR SHIPMENT TO DALLAS OFFICE (1.2), ASSIST DUPLICATION OF FOREIGN SUBS (1.3) PREPARE FOREIGN SUB DOCUMENTS FOR SHIPMENT TO DALLAS AND MCI HEADQUARTERS FOR D. WHITTAKER (1.5)	4.00	520.00	W280	11503317
03/19/04	Cox, Sara SET UP PRODUCTION ROOM WITH D. WHITTAKER AND J. ENGLISH (3.1); INDEX DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (2.3)	5.40	513.00	W280	11486836
03/19/04	Riggs, Herbert COORDINATE WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW	1.00	165.00	W280	11723334
03/19/04	Dapara1, Dapara1 MULTIPLE TELEPHONIC CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION DELIVERY AND SET UP OF PRODUCTION ROOM FOR SAME (2.4); ATTENDANCE TO DOCUMENTATION DELIVERY MATTERS AND INITIAL SET UP OF PRODUCTION ROOM (3.1)	5.50	770.00	W280	11449075
03/20/04	Cox, Sara INDEX DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (1.5); SET UP PRODUCTION ROOM (1.5); CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH (1.0)	4.00	380.00	W280	11486835
03/20/04	Dapara1, Dapara1 GENERAL ORGANIZATION OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION AND FINAL SET UP OF PRODUCTION ROOM.	6.00	840.00	W280	11449076
03/21/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING INDENTURE ISSUES	0.20	99.00	W280	11474329
03/22/04	Green, Frederick TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SAME (.3) REVIEW PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES (2.0)	2.40	1,860.00	W280	11521610
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM.	0.10	49.50	W280	11474361

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. ROBERTS REGARDING DOCUMENT COPYING.	0.10	49.50	W280	11474367
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.10	49.50	W280	11474370
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING CONTRACTS.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474327
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEXING.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474363
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. PETERSON OFFICE REGARDING HR DOX.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474368
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. REIFMAN REGARDING HR DOX.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474369
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH A&P, S&C REGARDING DOCUMENTS, REVISED INDEX.	0.50	247.50	W280	11474365
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETINGS WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS AND INDEXING.	1.10	544.50	W280	11474364
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETINGS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS, INDEXING NEW DOCUMENTS, DOCUMENT REVIEW.	1.80	891.00	W280	11474362
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS.	1.90	940.50	W280	11474360
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald REVISIONS TO PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.	2.20	1,089.00	W280	11474359
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND CONNOTATION OF DOCUMENT REQUEST LISTS.	2.70	1,336.50	W280	11474358
03/22/04	Holzman, Daniel EXCHANGE OF EMAILS REGARDING FCC (.1) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH S. GOLD (.4)	0.50	222.50	W280	11466287
03/22/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED CONSOB ORDER (.6) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH L. PICONE (.3)	0.90	400.50	W280	11466284
03/22/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED SEC COMMENT LETTER (1.0) DRAFTED RESPONSE (1.2)	2.20	979.00	W280	11466283
03/22/04	Libretta, Paul COPIED ALL CODES OF RELEVANT JURISDICTIONS AND FORWARDED TO D. HOLZMAN.	0.80	220.00	W280	11453443
03/22/04	Froim, Idit	0.90	333.00	W280	11470250

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW CONFIDENTIALITY OF INVESTOR'S STAKE IN MCI IN CONNECTION WITH FCC FILING (.7) READ RELATED E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE (.2)				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11501156
	CONFER WITH D. ANDERSON REGARDING PRINTING NEW DOCUMENTS AND REVISIONS TO PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11501157
	CONFER WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING INDEX AND PRODUCTION ROOM.				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11501158
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING INDEX AND PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.30	325.00	W280	11502389
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (.8) CONFERENCES WITH S. COX REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.80	450.00	W280	11501155
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, INDEXING, AND ANNOTATIONS TO THE DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.50	625.00	W280	11501124
	REVIEW AND INDEX NEW DOCUMENTS.				
03/22/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.60	650.00	W280	11501154
	ANNOTATE DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST WITH CROSS-REFERENCES TO THE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.				
03/22/04	Bailey, Gregory	3.50	525.00	W280	11521382
	PREPARE SEC FILING FOR D. HOLZMAN				
03/22/04	Thompson, Janice	0.40	66.00	W280	11495305
	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ASSISTANCE FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.2); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH AND C. COX REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/22/04	Cox, Sara	10.50	997.50	W280	11484970
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (9.2); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEX [.8]; CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEX [.5].				
03/23/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.50	1,072.50	W280	11473385
	CONFER WITH F. DIMINICH REGARDING FCC INFORMATION REQUEST REGARDING FOREIGN OWNERSHIP				
03/23/04	Dicker, Howard	0.20	128.00	W280	11520768
	DISC WITH B. COOPER REGARDING RULE 10B-17 AND RIGHTS PLAN				
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474336
	MEETING WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING DOCUMENT DISTRIBUTION.				
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474338
	MEETING WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING INDEXING.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. PETERSEN REGARDING DATABASES.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474341
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. PETERSEN OFFICE REGARDING HR DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11474380
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING CUSTO	0.30	148.50	W280	11474340
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH K. COX REGARDING ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS, NAME CHANGES.	0.80	396.00	W280	11474337
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETINGS WITH J. SACHA REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, INDEXING.	0.90	445.50	W280	11474333
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald REVISIONS FOR DOCUMENT REQUEST ANNOTATION.	1.80	891.00	W280	11474334
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS.	2.40	1,188.00	W280	11474379
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETINGS WITH J. SACHA, S&C, A&P, STRAUSS REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUESTS AND ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS.	2.50	1,237.50	W280	11474335
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE DOCUMENT INDEX.	2.60	1,287.00	W280	11474378
03/23/04	Skarda, Michael ASSIST WITH PREPARATION FOR MCI DALLAS MEETING AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION	1.20	552.00	W280	11498517
03/23/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED T-3/A	2.30	1,023.50	W280	11465985
03/23/04	Goldman, Jeremy EMAIL TO A. YOON (.1); EMAIL TO T. REESE REGARDING PREPARATION OF RELEASE DOCUMENTS (.1); CONVERSATION WITH T. REESE REGARDING SAME (.1); CONVERSATION WITH JOHN LONGOBARDO REGARDING CLOSING (.1); CONVERSATION WITH J. BUTENAS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUE AND TIMING OF SAME (.1); EMAIL TO T. MATHIAS REGARDING SAME (.1); EMAILED RELEASE DOCUMENTS TO BUTENAS (.1); PREPARATION OF RELEASE DOCUMENTS (.5).	1.20	444.00	W280	11464674
03/23/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3 AND T-1	1.00	275.00	W280	11512104
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.30	75.00	W280	11501159
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP REGARDING ANNOTATIONS AND EMAILS FROM P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING SAME	0.40	100.00	W280	11501161
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11501165

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH D. ANDERSON REGARDING REVISIONS TO PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX AND ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11501160
	CREATE LIST OF DOCUMENTS FOR P. ESKILDSEN.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.80	200.00	W280	11501192
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.90	225.00	W280	11501191
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM, INDEXING, AND ANNOTATIONS.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.90	225.00	W280	11501193
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND INDEXING.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11501163
	REVIEW ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST AND UPDATE THE SAME.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.20	550.00	W280	11501164
	ATTENDED PART OF MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER AND INTERESTED PARTIES REGARDING THE DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST AND ANNOTATED RESPONSES.				
03/23/04	Jamal, Sacha	4.70	1,175.00	W280	11501162
	REVIEW NEW DOCUMENTS (2.0) INDEX THE SAME (1.0) AND UPDATE DUE DILIGENCE ANNOTATIONS (1.7)				
03/23/04	Bailey, Gregory	1.40	210.00	W280	11521381
	ARRANGE TO OBTAIN SEC DOCUMENTS TAKE THEM TO OUTSIDE COPY SERVICE TO MAKE ADDITIONAL COPIES TO REGARDING FILE AT THE SEC FOR D. HOLZMAN				
03/23/04	Thompson, Janice	0.20	33.00	W280	11495312
	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH, K. JOFFRION AND C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROJECT.				
03/23/04	Cox, Sara	12.60	1,197.00	W280	11487607
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEX [.90]; CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEX [.60]; CONFERENCES WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE [.40]; CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING DOCUMENTS [.30].				
03/23/04	Joffrion, Karen	7.40	1,184.00	W280	11471160
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW NUMEROUS EMAILS AND THE PRINT OUT OF EACH EMAIL WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENT (5.30); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING PRINTED EMAILS AND DOCUMENTS AND INDEX (.40); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRINTED EMAILS AND DOCUMENTS AND INDEX (.80); PREPARE REDLINE OF VERSION 6 OF THE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX TO VERSION 13 (.90).				
03/23/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	4.50	630.00	W280	11456124
	INDEXING OF ADDITIONALLY RECEIVED DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION (3.5); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (1.0)				
03/24/04	Gold, Simeon	3.20	2,352.00	W280	11470286

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.4); WORK WITH MCGAREY AND B. COOPER ON REVISIONS TO MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BY-LAWS (1.1); WORK ON RESTRICTED STOCK VESTING ISSUES WITH S. KELLY, MCGAREY, M. GOLDSTEIN AND B. COOPER (0.8); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISIONS OF JONES' CLOSING DOCUMENT CHECKLIST (.4) AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.5).				
03/24/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.50	335.00	W280	11493893
	REVIEWING TALKING POINTS REGARDING MEETING WITH FCC (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. FROM REGARDING FCC (.2) VOICE MAIL WITH N. JONES REGARDING SAME (.1)				
03/24/04	Dicker, Howard	0.20	128.00	W280	11519484
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING RIGHTS PLAN AND RULE 10B-17				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11474077
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SILMAN REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUEST				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11473963
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUEST				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11473967
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING INDEXING, REGULATORY FILINGS.				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11473965
	CONFERENCE WITH A&P REGARDING GOVERNMENT CONTRACTS.				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11473968
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. LEWIS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11473969
	REVIEW ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST TO PREP FOR P. ESKILDSEN MEETING.				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11473962
	MEETING WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST.				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11473971
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11473966
	CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING HR DOCUMENTS, UPDATING INDEX, FILING DOCUMENTS				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11473970
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEX (.4); ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST (.4)				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.80	891.00	W280	11473972
	MEETING WITH SEC REGARDING ANNOTATION UPDATE.				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.90	940.50	W280	11474075
	REVISE ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST FOR MEETING WITH SEC.				
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald	4.50	2,227.50	W280	11473973

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MANAGING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS.				
03/24/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED T-3/A REGARDING INDENTURE	0.10	44.50	W280	11465848
03/24/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED DISTRIBUTION TO INTERMEDIA CREDITORS WITH M. CHASTKA.	0.30	133.50	W280	11465844
03/24/04	Holzman, Daniel DISCUSSED FCC MEETING WITH F. DIMINICH AND N. JONES.	0.30	133.50	W280	11465847
03/24/04	Froim, Idit PREPARED FOR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING WORLDCOM'S FILING TO THE FCC, IN PARTICULAR ON THE ISSUE OF THE AGREEMENT WITH THE DOJ (1.3) TALKED WITH N. JONES (.4) READ MCI'S TALKING POINTS (.5) DISCUSSED WITH D. PEARLSTEIN (.3) PREPARED TALKING POINTS FOR THE CALL (.8)	3.30	1,221.00	W280	11470209
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. HOGAL REGARDING REVISIONS TO INDEX.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501231
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH V. CURRY REGARDING REVISIONS TO INDEX.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501232
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP EMAIL TO J. SPEARS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.20	50.00	W280	11501228
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRINTOUTS FOR MEETING.	0.20	50.00	W280	11501229
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. ANDERSON REGARDING REVISIONS TO ANNOTATIONS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11501230
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP TO TUESDAY'S ANNOTATIONS AND INDEXING.	0.50	125.00	W280	11501196
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING INDEXING.	0.50	125.00	W280	11501202
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING NEW DOCUMENTS, PRINTING AND INDEXING.	1.10	275.00	W280	11501201
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING INDEXING, ANNOTATIONS AND PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	1.40	350.00	W280	11501200
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha ATTENDED PART OF MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.	1.50	375.00	W280	11501227
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.	2.00	500.00	W280	11501235

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	2.30	575.00	W280	11501233
03/24/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.	2.30	575.00	W280	11501234
03/24/04	Bailey, Gregory OBTAIN DOCUMENTS FROM COPY SERVICE AND REGARDING DELIVER TO THE SEC FOR D. HOLZMAN(NYO)	1.40	210.00	W280	11521140
03/24/04	Cox, Sara ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (5.2); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM [.20]; CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEXING DOCUMENTS [.50]; CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING INDEX [.20]; INDEX NEW DOCUMENTS (7.7)	14.10	1,339.50	W280	11486837
03/24/04	Joffrion, Karen OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS PRINTED FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.40); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING EMAILS RECEIVED, DOCUMENTS PRINTED, AND PREPARING INSERT FOR DOCUMENTS TO BE INSERTED IN PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (1.10); DRAFT, REVIEW AND REVISE INSERT OF DOCUMENTS TO BE ADDED TO PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.60); RECEIVE, REVIEW AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (6.20).	8.30	1,328.00	W280	11478592
03/25/04	Green, Frederick ATTEND TO DILIGENCE QUESTIONS (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS (.4)	1.70	1,317.50	W280	11518909
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH K. JOFFRIEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11474085
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SECURITIES STATUS, ETC.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474082
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474083
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOX.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474088
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING STATUS, STAFFING.	0.20	99.00	W280	11474094
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.40	198.00	W280	11474084
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETINGS WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM STATUS.	0.50	247.50	W280	11474087
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.60	297.00	W280	11474086

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENT REQUEST ANNOTATION, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX AND PRODUCTION ROOM DOX.	1.00	495.00	W280	11474095
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEXES.	1.90	940.50	W280	11474105
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST.	2.80	1,386.00	W280	11474106
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS.	3.60	1,782.00	W280	11474107
03/25/04	Holzman, Daniel AMENDED FORM T-3/A AND RELATED SEC RESPONSE LETTER.	2.20	979.00	W280	11465738
03/25/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	2.00	800.00	W280	11500579
03/25/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	6.50	2,600.00	W280	11504947
03/25/04	Froim, Idit PREPARATION FOR DISCUSSION WITH THE FCC (PARTICIPATED IN A CONFERENCE CALL OF MCI/WGM LAWYERS) (1.3) REVIEWED REVISED NOTES ETC. (1.7) CONTINUE FOLLOW UP ON STAKE IN MCI (2.5) WROTE A REPORT TO D. PEARLSTEIN REGARDING SAME (2.0)	7.50	2,775.00	W280	11470113
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING PRINTOUTS FOR P. ESKILDSEN.	0.20	50.00	W280	11501236
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS.	0.40	100.00	W280	11500643
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha MEETING WITH J. MENCHACA REGARDING FINANCIAL SECTION OF ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.	0.50	125.00	W280	11501266
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING INDEXING AND MISSING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS.	0.90	225.00	W280	11501237
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, ANNOTATIONS AND INDEXING.	1.00	250.00	W280	11501264
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE ANNOTATIONS.	1.00	250.00	W280	11501267
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND INDEX NEW DOCUMENTS.	3.50	875.00	W280	11501263
03/25/04	Jamal, Sacha	3.60	900.00	W280	11501265

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
03/25/04	Cox, Sara	13.10	1,244.50	W280	11486838
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT(.1); DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE FOR D. WHITTAKER (.2); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM, INDEX AND VARIOUS TASKS [.4]; CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEXING AND MISSING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS [.90]; CONFERENCES WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAIL PRINTING [.40].				
03/25/04	Joffrion, Karen	6.00	960.00	W280	11477379
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (2.20); DRAFT INSERT FOR LITIGATION DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (2.80); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.10); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS AND LITIGATION INSERT (.30); OFFICES CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS AND LITIGATION INSERT FOR PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.60).				
03/25/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.70	378.00	W280	11462705
	INDEXING OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION AND FORWARDING OF SAME TO S. JAMAL FOR INCLUSION IN PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (1.0); MULTIPLE OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING STATUS OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION (.8); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (.9)				
03/26/04	Green, Frederick	2.40	1,860.00	W280	11520371
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS (.8); REVIEW PRIOR DEALS (1.6)				
03/26/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.20	134.00	W280	11494852
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. FROIM REGARDING LETTER TO DOJ				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11474072
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING SPE'S				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474066
	CONFERENCE WITH S&C REGARDING CONSENT DEGREES				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474070
	CORRESPONDENCE AND CONFERENCE WITH T. CURROTTA REGARDING WEEKEND PRODUCTION ROOM ACCESS				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474483
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11474477
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11474479
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING CONTRACTS				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11474476
	CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11474481
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH A&P REGARDING GOVERNMENT CONTRACTS AND MUNICIPAL FRANCHISE AGREEMENT	0.60	297.00	W280	11474065
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.70	346.50	W280	11474482
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUEST ANNOTATION	1.00	495.00	W280	11474064
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	1.10	544.50	W280	11474060
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE DOCUMENT ANNOTATION	1.40	693.00	W280	11474062
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS (2.1) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.8)	2.90	1,435.50	W280	11474069
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX	3.80	1,881.00	W280	11474063
03/26/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED T-3/A.	0.70	311.50	W280	11477108
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. MALMAY REGARDING PRINTOUTS OF PRESENTATION MATERIALS FOR P. ESKILDSEN.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501308
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha UPDATE P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING STATUS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11501274
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha DELIVER HARDCOPIES OF MANAGEMENT PRESENTATION TO P. ESKILDSEN	0.20	50.00	W280	11501309
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEXING.	0.50	125.00	W280	11501272
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha RESEARCH REGARDING PROCEDURES	0.50	125.00	W280	11501310
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEWED AND REVISED ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.	0.50	125.00	W280	11501311
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha MEETING WITH P. GOLDING AND D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS TO THE DUE DILIGENCE LIST.	0.60	150.00	W280	11501271
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.60	150.00	W280	11501273

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING PRINTING FOR P. ESKILDSEN.				
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.90	225.00	W280	11501313
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.50	375.00	W280	11501312
	REVIEWED AND REVISED PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.				
03/26/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.60	400.00	W280	11501270
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, ANNOTATIONS AND INDEXING.				
03/26/04	Cox, Sara	11.70	1,111.50	W280	11486839
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (10.6); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM [.60]; CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEXING DOCUMENTS AND PRODUCTION ROOM [.50].				
03/26/04	Joffrion, Karen	4.10	656.00	W280	11478065
	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX AND INDEX INSERT (.80); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.60); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM AND DOCUMENTS TO INDEX (.60); RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS (1.40); DRAFT INSERT FOR PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX OF CONTRACT DOCUMENTS (.70).				
03/27/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.30	201.00	W280	11493002
	REVISING I. FROM DRAFT OF DOJ LETTER				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11474205
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11474211
	CONFERENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474204
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474207
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474210
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11474212
	CONFERENCES WITH A&P REGARDING GOVERNMENT REGULATORY DOCUMENTS, SCHEDULING				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11474215
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11474213
	CONFERENCES REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS, CONTRACTS				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11474208

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.10	544.50	W280	11474209
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.70	841.50	W280	11474214
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
03/27/04	Whittaker, Donald	3.00	1,485.00	W280	11474216
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/27/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11501315
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEXING.				
03/27/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11501318
	BEGIN REVIEWING CAPITAL LEASES.				
03/27/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.20	300.00	W280	11501316
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
03/27/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.30	325.00	W280	11501314
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, INDEXING, CAPITAL LEASES AND ANNOTATIONS.				
03/27/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.70	675.00	W280	11501317
	REVIEWED AND FIXED ERRORS WITH INDEX.				
03/27/04	Cox, Sara	10.50	997.50	W280	11486840
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (9.2); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEXING [.8]; CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEXING [.05].				
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474411
	PHONE CALLS WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11474426
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11474412
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM (.4) ATTENTION TO PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES (.2)				
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11474410
	CONFERENCES WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.50	742.50	W280	11474424
	REVIEW SEC FILINGS				
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.40	1,188.00	W280	11474425
	REVIEW LITIGATION DOCUMENTS FOR INDEXING				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/28/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS	3.30	1,633.50	W280	11474423
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP REGARDING LICENSES.	0.20	50.00	W280	11501346
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE ANNOTATIONS.	0.30	75.00	W280	11501347
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND CAPITAL LEASES.	0.40	100.00	W280	11501319
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING INDEXING.	0.50	125.00	W280	11501341
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW PRODUCTION ROOM INDEXING.	0.60	150.00	W280	11501345
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND RESPOND TO REQUESTS FROM LAWYERS.	0.70	175.00	W280	11501344
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW 10-K AND OTHER MISCELLANEOUS BACKGROUND MATERIALS.	2.40	600.00	W280	11501343
03/28/04	Jamal, Sacha SORT, ORGANIZE, AND HIGH LEVEL REVIEW OF CAPITAL LEASES.	2.50	625.00	W280	11501342
03/28/04	Dapara1, Dapara1 INDEXING OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION (6.0); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (3.5)	9.50	1,330.00	W280	11467103
03/29/04	Pearlstein, Debra TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH I. FROM REGARDING NOTICE TO DOJ REGARDING OWNERSHIP SHARE	0.30	201.00	W280	11493523
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SEC FILINGS	0.10	49.50	W280	11503682
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION	0.10	49.50	W280	11503698
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION	0.10	49.50	W280	11503699
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCES WITH A. SUMMERFORD REGARDING IT	0.20	99.00	W280	11503592
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION, JOINT VENTURES	0.20	99.00	W280	11503683
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11503700

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALL WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING MUNICIPAL FRANCHISES				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11504397
	CONFERENCES WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM, MEETINGS, SCHEDULING				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11504420
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENT REVISIONS, PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11504399
	CONFERENCES WITH S. FARIA REGARDING SCHEDULING AND COPIES, LITIGATION, CONSENTS				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11504439
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11504421
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS, INDEXING				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.20	594.00	W280	11503606
	PHONE CALL WITH S. COHEN REGARDING RETAINED DEBT				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.20	594.00	W280	11504438
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, INDEXING, LITIGATION DOCUMENTS, CUSTOMER CONTRACTS				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.60	1,287.00	W280	11504446
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX CONTRACTS LITIGATION, CORPORATE DOCUMENTS				
03/29/04	Whittaker, Donald	4.90	2,425.50	W280	11504447
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/29/04	Holzman, Daniel	2.60	1,157.00	W280	11486266
	REVISED T-3/A.				
03/29/04	Froim, Idit	5.10	1,887.00	W280	11495721
	INCORPORATED D. PEARLSTEIN'S COMMENTS AND FINALIZED DRAFT LETTER TO THE DOJ REGARDING MCI COMPLIANCE RECORD (2.0) GATHERED INFORMATION FOR NOTIFICATION TO DOJ REGARDING STAKE IN MCI, REVIEWED DRAFT LETTER AND COMMENTS TO THE FCC (2.8) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. PEARLSTEIN REGARDING NOTICE TO DOJ (.3)				
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11500644
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11501352
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING EDS AGREEMENTS.				
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11501378
	CONFER WITH L. HUFFMAN REGARDING PREPARATION OF MISSING DOCUMENT LIST.				
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11501379
	CONFER WITH L. HUFFMAN REGARDING PRINTING OF EDS AGREEMENTS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501381
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING NEW DOCUMENTS.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501384
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING NEW DOCUMENTS.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501385
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501386
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. ANDERSON REGARDING REVISIONS.	0.10	25.00	W280	11501389
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11501388
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.	0.30	75.00	W280	11501380
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES.	0.30	75.00	W280	11501382
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING INDEXING.	0.30	75.00	W280	11501387
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. WILLIAMS AND B. WALKER REGARDING PRINTING OF EDS DOCUMENTS AND MISSING DOCUMENT LIST.	0.30	75.00	W280	11503188
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP REGARDING EDS AGREEMENTS.	0.40	100.00	W280	11501351
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW INDEXING.	0.70	175.00	W280	11503187
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEWED CAPITAL LEASES AS PART OF FOLLOW UP.	1.50	375.00	W280	11501383
03/29/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	4.30	1,075.00	W280	11501350
03/29/04	Cox, Sara CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING NEW DOCUMENTS.	0.10	9.50	W280	11484154
03/29/04	Cox, Sara EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. WATSON REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.	0.20	19.00	W280	11484156
03/29/04	Cox, Sara	0.40	38.00	W280	11484153

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.				
03/29/04	Cox, Sara	0.90	85.50	W280	11484155
	CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.5); REVIEW NEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE (.4)				
03/29/04	Cox, Sara	8.30	788.50	W280	11486841
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
03/29/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.40	336.00	W280	11476882
	DRAFT OF DUE DILIGENCE QUESTIONS SUBMITTED BY DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW TEAMS AND FORWARDING OF SAME TO D. WHITTAKER FOR REVIEW AND RESPONSE (.9); DRAFT AND PRODUCTION OF DUE DILIGENCE TEAM(S) ATTENDANCE SHEETS AND SUMMARY AND FORWARDING OF SAME TO D. WHITTAKER FOR REVIEW (1.0); MONITORING OF DUE DILIGENCE PRODUCTION ROOM AND ASSISTANCE WITH DOCUMENTATION PRODUCTION (.5)				
03/30/04	Green, Frederick	0.90	697.50	W280	11520440
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING ISSUES.				
03/30/04	Dicker, Howard	0.10	64.00	W280	11519763
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GIETZ REGARDING RULE 10B-17 FOR RIGHTS PLAN				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11500746
	PHONE CALL WITH B. COOPER REGARDING OFFICERS AND DIRECTORS				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11504773
	PHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING STATUS, SCHEDULING				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11504703
	PHONE CALLS WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM, SCHEDULING				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11504704
	PHONE CALL WITH J. LEWIS REGARDING INTL RETULATORY				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11504733
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING DOCUMENTS				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11504737
	CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING STATUS, SCHEDULING, STAFFING				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11505016
	PHONE CALLS WITH C. COX REGARDING DOCUMENTS				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11505078
	CONFERENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING FRANCHISE AGREEMENTS				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11504665
	MEETINGS WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11505031

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH B. ROBINSON REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX AND ANNOTATION DOCUMENTS				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11505088
	CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION FILES				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11505029
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEXING, LITIGATION, SCHEDULING MEETING				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11505014
	CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND PROCEDURES, INDEXING				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11505069
	REVIEW 3/29, 3/30 MEETING BOOK				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11505030
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING LITIGATION, INDEXING, PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.40	693.00	W280	11505090
	REVISE INFORMATION REQUEST ANNOTATION				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.50	742.50	W280	11505089
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
03/30/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.00	990.00	W280	11505096
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/30/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.50	222.50	W280	11486268
	DISCUSSED STOCK ISSUANCES WITH I. FROM.				
03/30/04	Holzman, Daniel	7.00	3,115.00	W280	11486267
	REVIEWED AND REVISED T-3/A AND RELATED DOCUMENTS (5.6) CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING CONSOB MEMORANDUM (1.4)				
03/30/04	Hyatte, Theresa	6.10	2,653.50	W280	11512697
	RESEARCH AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE (REVIEW ACCOUNTING LITERATURE)				
03/30/04	Watkins, Claire	1.40	462.00	W280	11491188
	E-MAIL WITH SIMPSON, THATCHER REGARDING BOXES AND ABBOTT (.1); ATTENTION TO OBJECTION REGARDING GRAYSON (1.3)				
03/30/04	Froim, Idit	9.10	3,367.00	W280	11492388
	CONT. WORKING ON NOTIFICATION TO THE DOJ REGARDING INVESTOR (5.7) DISCUSSED WITH D. HOLZMAN THE T-3 FILING (.5) ATTENTION TO CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING FILING TO THE FCC (.9) TALKED TO THE DOJ REGARDING FILING TO THE FCC (2.0)				
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11503191
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAILS AND PRINTOUTS FOR P. ESKILDSEN FOR MANAGEMENT MEETING.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING CURRENT STATUS AND PLAN FOR THE WEEK.	0.20	50.00	W280	11503197
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. ANDERSON REGARDING REVISIONS TO ANNOTATIONS TO DILIGENCE LIST.	0.20	50.00	W280	11503214
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha EMAILS TO F. GREEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM	0.20	50.00	W280	11503215
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha RESPOND TO QUESTION FROM M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM.	0.30	75.00	W280	11503194
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.	0.40	100.00	W280	11503195
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING INDEXING.	0.40	100.00	W280	11503216
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING INDEXING AND PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.50	125.00	W280	11503196
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, INDEXING AND ANNOTATIONS.	0.70	175.00	W280	11500645
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH RETRIEVING AND LOCATING MANAGEMENT PRESENTATION BINDERS FOLLOWING END OF MANAGEMENT PRESENTATIONS.	0.70	175.00	W280	11503198
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW MANAGEMENT PRESENTATION.	0.90	225.00	W280	11503192
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH MANAGEMENT OF PRODUCTION ROOM.	2.50	625.00	W280	11503190
03/30/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.	2.50	625.00	W280	11503193
03/30/04	Cox, Sara ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (4.0); INDEX DOCUMENTS (3.0); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEX [.6]; CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND INDEX [.04]; CONFERENCES WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE (.3)	8.30	788.50	W280	11486842
03/30/04	Joffrion, Karen RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.80); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.20); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.10).	1.10	176.00	W280	11494243
03/31/04	Green, Frederick	1.40	1,085.00	W280	11520448

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTENTION TO PRODUCTION (.4); WORK WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/31/04	Pearlstein, Debra	1.00	670.00	W280	11495922
	TELECONFERENCES, EMAILS WITH I. FROM REGARDING CALCULATING INVESTOR EQUITY SHARE				
03/31/04	Dicker, Howard	0.20	128.00	W280	11519788
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING RULE 10B-17 AND RIGHTS PLAN				
03/31/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.70	420.00	W280	11490227
	REVIEW FINAL ALLOCATIONS FOR NEW NOTES (.4) AND DISCUSS SAME WITH D. HOLZMAN (.3)				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11508442
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION ISSUES				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11512828
	PHONE CALL WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION QUESTIONS				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11508543
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING NOTES ISSUES				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11512882
	CONFERENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING COMPLIANCE, FRANCHISE AGREEMENTS				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11508801
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, LITIGATION, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX, DOCUMENT ANNOTATION				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11512833
	PHONE CALL WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING RESPONSES TO LITIGATION QUESTIONS				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11508396
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING DOCUMENTS, INDEXING, PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11508803
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING LITIGATION ISSUES, REVISIONS TO INDEX, ANNOTATED QUESTION, MEMORANDUM				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.90	940.50	W280	11505978
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.80	1,386.00	W280	11506030
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATION OF MISSING DOCUMENTS				
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald	3.60	1,782.00	W280	11506060
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11484975
	DISCUSSED CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT WITH F. DIMINICH.				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11485086

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFTED CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT.				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11484972
	DISCUSSED STOCK DISTRIBUTIONS WITH I. FROM.				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W280	11485080
	DISCUSSED MERGERS OF SUBSIDIARIES WITH P. LIBRETTA.				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W280	11484936
	REVIEWED T-3/A AND ARRANGED FOR FILING THEREOF.				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.00	445.00	W280	11485085
	REVIEWED TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT.				
03/31/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.20	74.00	W280	11532747
	REVIEW PLAN RESOLUTIONS PER REQUEST OF C. MARCUS (.1); E-MAIL TO C. MARCUS AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/31/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	10.50	3,465.00	W280	11491028
	REVIEW OF ANATEL, CADE AND TRANSFER OF LICENSE DOCUMENTS/FILINGS (2.0); DRAFTING OF AMENDMENT TO STOCK PURCHASE AGREEMENT (5.0); MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS WITH TEAMS REGARDING SAME (.9); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW OF REVISED BOARD MEMORANDUM (1.0); REVIEW OF CFF EXECUTIVE SUMMARY AND MEMORANDUM (1.0)				
03/31/04	Libretta, Paul	5.00	1,375.00	W280	11525360
	SPOKE WITH D. HOLZMAN ABOUT BEGINNING THE PROCESS OF EFFECTUATING THE WORLDOM MERGERS (.6) READ THROUGH E-MAILS FORWARDED BY D. HOLZMAN (.5) DETERMINED WHICH ENTITIES (AND IN WHICH JURISDICTIONS THEY RESIDE) WOULD HAVE MULTIPLE ENTITIES MERGED INTO THEM (2.5) BEGAN DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGER (1.4)				
03/31/04	Froim, Idit	10.30	3,811.00	W280	11493740
	CONTINUE WORKING ON NOTIFICATION TO THE DOJ AND FOLLOWED UP ON THE FCC FILING				
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11503291
	CONFER WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING LITIGATION MATERIALS IN PRODUCTION ROOM.				
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11500728
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING PRINTING OF NEW DOCUMENTS.				
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11500732
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING FILING AND PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11500729
	UPDATE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.				
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11500734
	CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING FIDUCIARY DUTIES UNDER GEORGIA LAW.				
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.70	175.00	W280	11500698
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, INDEXING AND ANNOTATIONS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW NEW REQUEST LIST.	0.70	175.00	W280	11500731
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING NEW DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST	0.80	200.00	W280	11500699
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.	1.60	400.00	W280	11500730
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	2.80	700.00	W280	11500727
03/31/04	Jamal, Sacha RESEARCH REGARDING FIDUCIARY DUTIES UNDER GEORGIA LAW.	3.20	800.00	W280	11500733
03/31/04	Thompson, Janice OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX AND J. DEL BIAGGIO REGARDING STORAGE OF BOXES OF DOCUMENTS.	0.10	16.50	W280	11491919
03/31/04	Cox, Sara INDEXING NEW DOCUMENTS (6.2); ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (4.0); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEXING AND PRODUCTION ROOM [.60]; CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING INDEXING AND PRODUCTION ROOM [.80].	11.60	1,102.00	W280	11504521
03/31/04	Joffrion, Karen PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (1.70); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRINTED EMAILS AND DOCUMENTS (.30); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING PRINTED EMAILS AND DOCUMENTS (.30); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING PRINTED EMAILS, DOCUMENTS AND DRAFTING INSERT FOR PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX (.50).	2.80	448.00	W280	11494459
03/31/04	Dapara1, Dapara1 OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING REQUIRED ASSEMBLEDGE OF GLOBAL NETWORK OPERATIONS AGREEMENT AND AMENDMENTS THERETO (.6); COMPILATION AND ASSEMBLEDGE OF THE EDS AGREEMENT AND AMENDMENTS AND PREPARATION OF SAME FOR FORWARDING TO PRODUCTION ROOM AND DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW (1.5); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (1.0)	3.10	434.00	W280	11515294
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W280 - CORPORATE/SECURITIES:		681.70	\$ 212,404.50		
03/01/04	Gold, Simeon CONFERENCE WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL POTENTIAL MCI TRANSACTIONS, ETC.	0.50	367.50	W300	11405896
03/01/04	Rubin, Steven MEETING AT P. WEISS REGARDING AVANTEL TRANSACTION.	4.40	2,948.00	W300	11437939
03/01/04	Bower, David REVIEW CHART AND MEMORANDUM REGARDING SALE	0.80	464.00	W300	11521603
03/01/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.70	3,082.00	W300	11452158

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MEETING WITH L. FIFE, B. BENJET REGARDING PREP FOR 3/2 MEETING WITH INVESTOR (.8); VARIOUS TELEPHONE CALLS, E-MAILS WITH CFF REGARDING VOTING ISSUES AND REVIEWED CFF MEMORANDA ON SAME (1.2); WORK ON DRAFT SPA AND REVIEWED BID IN PREP FOR INVESTOR MEETING (4.7)				
03/02/04	Fife, Lori	8.50	6,077.50	W300	11511411
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN MEETING WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, INVESTOR AND WILKIE REGARDING EMBRATEL (7.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WEBSTER AND LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0)				
03/02/04	Hirsch, Stuart	13.80	6,348.00	W300	11452160
	MEETINGS WITH INVESTOR, WILLKIE AT LAZARD (3.0); REVISED PURCHASE AGREEMENT AS PER MEETINGS AND DISTRIBUTED INTERNALLY FOR REVIEW (10.1); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH L. FIFE AND F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.7)				
03/03/04	Fife, Lori	4.20	3,003.00	W300	11513474
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM AND LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CAPELLAS REGARDING EMBRATEL (.7); REVIEW AND REVISE STOCK PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.4); CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TREPPER REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GRAFSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/03/04	Hirsch, Stuart	11.20	5,152.00	W300	11452162
	MULTIPLE REVISIONS TO SPA (INVESTOR) (7.8); MEETINGS WITH F. GREEN AND C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING SAME (1.5); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH D. BOSTON (INVESTOR COUNSEL) AND DISTRIBUTED DRAFT SPA TO BIDDER (1.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SPA (.7)				
03/03/04	Cohen, Scott	4.40	1,760.00	W300	11412636
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH F. GREENE & COMPANY REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.2) REVIEW STOCK PURCHASE AGREEMENT (2.5) CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING STOCK PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.7)				
03/03/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	3.90	1,287.00	W300	11449854
	MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH AND F. GREEN REGARDING SPA (.8); READING OF SPA IN LIGHT OF INVESTOR OFFER AND MEMORANDUM REGARDING STRUCTURE (3.1)				
03/04/04	Fife, Lori	1.20	858.00	W300	11507457
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
03/04/04	Hirsch, Stuart	8.40	3,864.00	W300	11452359
	MULTIPLE MEETINGS WITH F. GREEN AND C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING INVESTOR BID AND OTHER ISSUES (1.2); REVIEWED DRAFTS OF AIG NDA, MCI BOARD RESOLUTIONS, AMEND TO MCI/EMBRATEL NDA (3.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH AIG REGARDING NDA (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD REGARDING FOLLOW UP (1.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH INVESTOR COUNSEL REGARDING RESPONSE DRAFT OF SPA (1.3)				
03/04/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	9.40	3,102.00	W300	11449664
	MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING ASSETS (.5); DRAFTING/CREATING STRUCTURE CHART TO GIVE TO INVESTOR (2.0); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING RESOLUTIONS (.7); CALL WITH R. BEHM REGARDING MINUTES AND BOARD PRESENTATION AND RESOLUTIONS (1.0); DRAFTING OF LETTER AMENDING CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENTS (2.5); STRUCTURE CHART REVISIONS (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WILKIE FARR REGARDING NEGOTIATION OF SPA (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING WILKIE FARR CALL (.3); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN LIGHT OF NEGOTIATIONS TOMORROW (.6); DRAFTING OF SCHEDULES TO SPA (.6)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE REGARDING ASSET AGREEMENTS	0.60	465.00	W300	11617728
03/05/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW INVESTOR MARK-UP (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, F. GREEN REGARDING MARK-UP (1.0)	1.80	1,287.00	W300	11508923
03/05/04	Hirsch, Stuart MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS WITH MCI, BRAZILIAN COUNSEL, LAZARD REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES, PRODUCTION ROOM PLANS, MCI CHAPTER 11 ISSUES AND OTHER (6.0); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH WORKING GROUP AND WITH COUNSEL TO INVESTOR (3.0); REVIEWED INVESTOR COMMENTS TO SPA (2.2) AND FURTHER TELEPHONE CALLS WITH INVESTOR COUNSEL, F. GREEN AND LAZARD REGARDING SAME (1.0)	12.20	5,612.00	W300	11452375
03/05/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2); REVIEW EMBRATEL SALE AGREEMENT & CONFERENCE CALL (1.2)	1.40	560.00	W300	11433817
03/05/04	Fink, Jessica CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.7); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME (2.1)	2.80	1,190.00	W300	11530358
03/05/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH FOR THINGS TO DO REGARDING SIGNING (.7); CALL TO R. BEHM REGARDING SPA AND SCHEDULES (.6); CALL TO L. FIFE REGARDING CREDITOR'S COMMITTEE (.5); EMAIL TO D. WEBSTER WITH AMENDMENT TO NDA AND AIG NDA (.2); REVIEW OF SPA AND SCHEDULES IN ANTICIPATION OF SIGNING (1.5); CALL AND EMAIL TO N. MELTON AT LAZARD REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM SCHEDULES (.5); RESEARCH SEC FILINGS FOR PREFERRED SHARES AND 13D FILINGS BY MCI (3.0); REVIEW MEMORANDA REGARDING TAX BENEFITS OF EARLY TRANSACTION (.7); REVISE SCHEDULES TO SPA PURSUANT TO BOB LACEY'S EMAIL (1.0); REVIEW SPA BY INVESTOR (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI AND LAZARD REGARDING SPA WITH INVESTOR (1.0); MEETING WITH F. GREEN AND S. HIRSCH REGARDING NEGOTIATIONS (.7); CONFERENCE CALL TO WILKIE FARR TO NEGOTIATE SPA (.7)	12.10	3,993.00	W300	11450172
03/06/04	Green, Frederick EMBRATEL CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING DOCUMENTS AND NEGOTIATIONS (7.4) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, LAZARD AND WORLDCOM REGARDING SAME (.7)	8.10	6,277.50	W300	11521442
03/06/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW DRAFT EMBRATEL PURCHASE AGREEMENT (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LAZARD, WORLDCOM, F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.7)	2.00	1,430.00	W300	11509040
03/06/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING INVESTOR PROPOSALS/STRATEGY (3.0); WORK ON REVISIONS TO SPA (3.5); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS WITH F. GREEN AND C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING PROCESS AND REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (4.0); REVISED SAME AND DISTRIBUTED INTERNALLY (3.0); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL REGARDING RESPONSE DRAFT (2.0)	15.50	7,130.00	W300	11452384
03/06/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW EMBRATEL AGREEMENT	1.50	600.00	W300	11433825
03/06/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	15.40	5,082.00	W300	11450175

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING WILKIE FARR DRAFT OF SPA AND NEGOTIATIONS (2.0); TURNING WILKIE DRAFT OF SPA (11.3) CALL WITH L. FIFE REGARDING BANKRUPTCY IMPLICATIONS OF AGREEMENT (.7); CALL TO C. SANTOS REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND AMENDMENT TO CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENT (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING TURNING NEW DRAFT OF SPA (.7); COMMUNICATIONS WITH LOCAL COUNSEL REGARDING THEIR COMMENTS ON THE AGREEMENT (.2)				
03/07/04	Green, Frederick	7.20	5,580.00	W300	11521443
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (3.0); REVISIONS TO DOCUMENTS (2.0); DISCUSSIONS WITH INVESTOR REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WC, LAZARD, L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0)				
03/07/04	Fife, Lori	3.00	2,145.00	W300	11509074
	REVIEW REVISED EMBRATEL PURCHASE AGREEMENT (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEW NUMEROUS EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.7)				
03/07/04	Hirsch, Stuart	11.80	5,428.00	W300	11452385
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND STRATEGY (2.0); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH F. GREEN, C. TRAJTENBERG AND A. STERN REGARDING ISSUES IN PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND TIMING (1.2); REVISED PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND DISTRIBUTED TO BUYER'S COUNSEL (4.9); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. BOSTON (WILLKIE) REGARDING SAME AND MONDAY MEETINGS (.7); WORK ON MCI BOARD RESOLUTIONS (1.0); WORK ON CONFORMING BIDDER DRAFT OF PURCHASE AGREEMENT (2.0)				
03/07/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	12.00	3,960.00	W300	11449991
	REVIEW OF REVISED SPA IN ANTICIPATION OF CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM (6.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WEIL, LAZARD, MCI AND R. BARRETO AND WGM TEAM (1.5); TURNING OF DRAFT (4.5)				
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W300	11622765
	MEETING WITH F. GREEN AND L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
03/08/04	Fife, Lori	4.20	3,003.00	W300	11505863
	MEETING WITH F. GREEN AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL AND OTHER ISSUES (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE PURCHASE AGREEMENT (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD AND F. GREEN REGARDING DOCUMENTS (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH INVESTOR, WORLDCOM, LAZARD REGARDING DOCUMENTS (.5).				
03/08/04	Youdelman, Sharon	2.30	1,138.50	W300	11525648
	CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK & S. COHEN REGARDING POTENTIAL LATIN AMERICA SALE [0.3]; REVIEW DRAFT SALE AGREEMENT REGARDING SAME [2.0]				
03/08/04	Hirsch, Stuart	16.40	7,544.00	W300	11452398
	MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS, MEETINGS, TELEPHONE CALLS WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL, LAZARD, MCI REGARDING REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (REGULATORY ISSUES, ETC.) (5.0); REVISED MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF SAME AND DISTRIBUTED (6.4); WORK ON DRAFT BOARD RESOLUTIONS, NDA FOR CREDITORS COMMITTEE AND SCHEDULES TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (5.0)				
03/08/04	Cohen, Scott	2.70	1,080.00	W300	11433839
	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH L. FIFE (.5) & DISCUSSION WITH S. HIRCH (.5) & REVIEW AGREEMENT (1.7)				
03/08/04	Fink, Jessica	4.50	1,912.50	W300	11530195
	DEAL WITH ISSUES REGARDING MOTION TO SELL EMBRATEL, INCLUDING REVIEW DOCUMENTS, AGREEMENTS, ETC.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia COORDINATE FOR MEETING WITH BUYER (5.0); CALL TO A. YOON REGARDING DIP AND NEED FOR WAIVERS (1.0); MEETING WITH A. YOON REGARDING DIP SCHEDULES (1.0); REVIEW OF SPA IN PREPARATION OF NEGOTIATIONS AT 11AM MEETING (8.0)	15.00	4,950.00	W300	11449921
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING ASSET ISSUES	0.30	232.50	W300	11616819
03/09/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN, LAZARD, WORLDCOM REGARDING PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.3); REVIEW REVISED PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING NOA (.4)	1.60	1,144.00	W300	11512724
03/09/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH F. GREEN AND D. BOWER REGARDING TRANSFER OF MISCELLANEOUS ASSETS AND LIABILITIES OF HOLDING COMPANY FOR EMBRATEL (.3); CONFER WITH D. BOWER AND BRAZILIAN COUNSEL REGARDING SAME AND RELATED ISSUES (1.0)	1.30	929.50	W300	11434036
03/09/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING LATIN AMERICA SALE TRANSACTION [0.2]; CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, J. FINK & S. COHEN REGARDING SAME [0.7]; REVIEW REVISED DRAFT CONTRACT [0.7]	1.60	792.00	W300	11525649
03/09/04	Hirsch, Stuart MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS, TELEPHONE CALLS, MEETINGS WITH MCI GROUP, LAZARD, F. GREEN AND C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT, SCHEDULES AND VARIOUS OTHER ISSUES (7.8); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS WITH BRAZILIAN COUNSEL, S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX AND COD INCOME ISSUES (2.0); REVISED PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND DISTRIBUTED TO BUYER (5.0)	14.80	6,808.00	W300	11452400
03/09/04	Cohen, Scott MEETING REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH HLMZ, LAZARD & AKIN AND OTHER RELATED MATTERS (2.9); REVIEW EMBRATEL AGREEMENT (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH F. GREEN, S. HIRSCH, MCI REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); DISCUSSION WITH J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL (.4); MEETING WITH L. FIFE, S. YODELMAN & J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.9)	5.70	2,280.00	W300	11433249
03/09/04	Fink, Jessica CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE (.3); CONFER WITH L. FIFE, S. YODELMAN, S. COHEN REGARDING SALE OF EMBRATEL (.3); DRAFT MOTION FOR SALE OF EMBRATEL (2.3).	2.90	1,232.50	W300	11530202
03/09/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia DRAFTING OF SCHEDULE 2.01 (5.0); TURNING OF DOCUMENT (2.0); DRAFTING OF NDA (5.0); DRAFTING OF SELLERS' RESOLUTIONS (1.1); FOLLOW UP WITH S. COHEN (BANKRUPTCY) NAIR VERAYAS (LOCAL COUNSEL ISSUES) (.5); REVISIONS TO SCHEDULES (4.0); DRAFTING OF SCHEDULE (2.0)	19.60	6,468.00	W300	11450046
03/09/04	Taylor, David CONTINUE REVIEW OF PRODUCED DOCUMENTS.	4.00	1,160.00	W300	11521150
03/10/04	Green, Frederick ALL DAY AND EVENING FINALIZING DOCUMENTS WITH INVESTOR (11.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, WORLDCOM AND LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.1)	12.30	9,532.50	W300	11521465
03/10/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.1); REVIEW REVISED DOCUMENT (.7); REVIEW MEMORANDA REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6).	2.40	1,716.00	W300	11510710

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/10/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SALE OF EMBRATEL AND POSSIBLE CONTRIBUTION OF DEBT TO EQUITY	0.20	143.00	W300	11434452
03/10/04	Hirsch, Stuart WORK ON PURCHASE AGREEMENT DRAFTS (6.3); MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS, MEETINGS, E-MAILS WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL, MCI, LAZARD AND INTERNAL REGARDING DEAL TERMS, NEGOTIATIONS, AND VARIOUS ISSUES (3.0); MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND SCHEDULES (5.0); TELEPHONE CALL WITH C. SANTOS REGARDING SCHEDULE 6.02(E) (.6); MULTIPLE OTHER CALLS WITH MCI REGARDING SCHEDULES (2.0)	16.90	7,774.00	W300	11452428
03/10/04	Cohen, Scott REVISE EMBRATEL NDA (.9) & DISCUSSION WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (.6); CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH F. GREEN, S. HIRSCH (1.0); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH EMCGRADY AND OTHER COMMITTEE CORRESPONDENCE (.3); INTERNAL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3) INCLUDING DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.3) & DISCUSSION WITH S. HIRSCH (.4)	3.80	1,520.00	W300	11433305
03/10/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON SALE OF EMBRATEL (.4) INCLUDING REVIEW AGREEMENT (.8) CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.3)	1.50	637.50	W300	11530204
03/10/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia CALL WITH D. RICHARDS REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL SET UP (1.0); SUMMARY OF TERMS (12.1); COORDINATION WITH SAN PAULO FOR DILIGENCE CALL WITH C. SANTOS (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING SAME (1.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH WILLKIE OF SCHEDULES AND BLACKLINES (.5)	15.80	5,214.00	W300	11450239
03/10/04	Taylor, David CHECK ON STATUS OF OWNERSHIP REPORT WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL.	0.30	87.00	W300	11520750
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING EMBRATEL.	0.30	232.50	W300	11620483
03/11/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD AND F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL/INVESTOR TRANSACTION (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE, AKIN, HOULIHAN, LAZARD AND F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL/TELEX TRANSACTION (1.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING CALL WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE MATERIALS FOR BEARDON EMBRATEL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WORLDCOM AND LAZARD REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES S. COHEN AND S. YUDELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL MOTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AKIN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3).	4.10	2,931.50	W300	11506317
03/11/04	Youdelman, Sharon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE TRANSACTION [0.1]; NUMEROUS CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK & S. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [1.0]; REVIEW EMBRATEL SALE AGREEMENT [1.6]; REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING EMBRATEL MARKETING [0.8]; REVIEW & REVISE DRAFT EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [4.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LONGMIER & HANDLER REGARDING DRAFT EMBRATEL SALE ORDER [0.1]	7.80	3,861.00	W300	11525604
03/11/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONTINUED WORK ON REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (7.0); MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF SAME (4.8); FINALIZED AGREEMENT WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL AND SCHEDULES TO SAME (2.0); MULTIPLE CALLS WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL REGARDING DILIGENCE, PRODUCTION ROOM, AND OTHER ITEMS (2.0)	15.80	7,268.00	W300	11452403

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/11/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH S. HIRSCH (.2); CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH L. FIFE & MCI & LAZARD (.3); DISCUSSIONS WITH L. FIFE, J. FINK & S. YUDELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.5); REVIEW EMBRATEL MOTION & DISCUSSION WITH J. FINK (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE & POST-CALL WITH COMPANY (1.5); DISCUSSIONS WITH S. YUDELMAN AND J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL (.9); DRAFT INSERT TO EMBRATEL MOTION (.6) & DISCUSSION WITH S. YUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.4)	5.90	2,360.00	W300	11433327
03/11/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON EMBRATEL, INCLUDING REVIEW AGREEMENT (1.5), DRAFT ORDER APPROVING SALE (3.5), DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SALE (3.0)	8.00	3,400.00	W300	11530652
03/11/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia TURNING DRAFT (2.0); SUMMARY REVISIONS (1.0); REVIEW REVISED DRAFTS OF SPA (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH PATRICK FROM WILLKIE REGARDING SAME (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALEX FROM LAZARD REGARDING SAME (.7); SEVERAL CALLS WITH LOCAL COUNSEL REGARDING FINAL ISSUES OUTSTANDING WITH WILLKIE (2.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE (1.2); PRODUCTION ROOM COORDINATION WITH WILLKIE FARR (3.0)	11.90	3,927.00	W300	11450155
03/11/04	Taylor, David (WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM) PREPARE AND FORWARD SUMMARY OF PRODUCED DOCUMENTS TO P. FRIEDMAN AND A. STROCHAK (1.0); OVERSEE COPYING (.5)	1.50	435.00	W300	11522229
03/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW & REVISE DRAFTS OF EMBRATEL SALE ORDER [3.2]; CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.5]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BEHM & J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE TRANSACTION [0.1]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME [0.1]; REVIEW LAZARD MATERIALS REGARDING BIDS [0.5]; CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.2]; REVISE EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [1.8]; CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.2]	6.60	3,267.00	W300	11525681
03/12/04	Hirsch, Stuart MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS, CONFERENCE CALLS WITH MCI, LAZARD AND F. GREEN REGARDING STATUS OF OTHE BIDS, MCI BOARD MEETING, PRODUCTION ROOM PROGRESS, (INVESTOR) PRESS RELEASE AND OTHER ISSUES (3.1); REVIEWED CVM FILING AND TELEPHONE CALLS WITH CFF REGARDING SAME (2.0); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH WILLKIE REGARDING SPA CLEANUP AND EXCHANGE OF SIGNATURE PAGES (1.1); CLEANUP REVISIONS TO SPA (1.0)	7.20	3,312.00	W300	11452051
03/12/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW EMBRATEL MOTION (.3) AND DISCUSSION WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.50	200.00	W300	11433632
03/12/04	Fink, Jessica REVISE MOTION FOR SALE OF EMBRATEL	6.50	2,762.50	W300	11530666
03/12/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia COORDINATE DIP LENDER CONSENT OR LACK THEREOF WITH A. YOON (1.5); RESEARCH SEVERAL LAST MINUTE ISSUES WITH CFF (LITIGATION, SHARE PURCHASE AGREEMENT, ETC.) (3.0); MULTIPLE CALLS WITH CFF REGARDING DIFFERENT OUTSTANDING ISSUES (1.5); MULTIPLE CALLS REGARDING PRESS RELEASE, SIGNATURE PAGES, STATUS OF CALLS TO GOVERNMENTAL AUTHORITIES (3.0)	9.00	2,970.00	W300	11450165
03/13/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH LAZARD, MCI AND F. GREEN REGARDING PRESS RELEASE AND Q & A (1.0); REVIEWED MULTIPLE DRAFTS OF PRESS RELEASE (2.1)	3.10	1,426.00	W300	11452053
03/14/04	Hirsch, Stuart	2.80	1,288.00	W300	11452055

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEWED MULTIPLE DRAFTS TO CVM FILINGS (RELEVANT FACT) BY INVESTOR AND EMBRATEL (2.3); MULTIPLE E-MAILS WITH MCI, CFF REGARDING SAME AND PRESS RELEASE (.5)				
03/15/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W300	11620670
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
03/15/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.90	3,174.00	W300	11452215
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH MCI, LAZARD, CFF REGARDING REVISED BID FROM TELES AND STRATEGY (2.0); REVIEWED FORM OF 8-K ANNOUNCING DEAL (1.0); MULTIPLE E-MAILS, TELEPHONE CALLS WITH WILLKIE, MCI REGARDING PURCHASE PRICE DEPOSIT, PREP FOR REGULATORY FILINGS AND VARIOUS OTHER ISSUES (3.9)				
03/15/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W300	11451282
	DISCUSSION WITH S. YUDELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/15/04	Fink, Jessica	8.50	3,612.50	W300	11530772
	WORK ON MOTION FOR SALE OF EMBRATEL (.8) INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENT AND S. YUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.5) AND DRAFT MOTION (7.2).				
03/15/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	7.00	2,310.00	W300	11468202
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING NEW BID WITH MCI (.8); DRAFTING OF 8-K (3.0); RESEARCH ON FORMS (2.0); REVISIONS TO 8-K (.5); CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING PR AND TELES COUNTER OFFER (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. YUDELMAN AND J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/16/04	Fife, Lori	1.20	858.00	W300	11515649
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD AND F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL TRANSACTION (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. YUDELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL MOTION (.5)				
03/16/04	Youdelman, Sharon	7.40	3,663.00	W300	11525730
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING DRAFT EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [0.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME [0.1]; REVISIONS TO DRAFT EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [4.8]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WEBSTER, R. BEHM, WGM TEAM REGARDING DRAFT EMBRATEL MOTION & PRESS INQUIRIES [1.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK, STERN & R. BEHM REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE PROCESS [1.0]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING EMBRATEL PRESS INQUIRIES [0.1]				
03/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W300	11458093
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM L. FIFE AND F. GREEN REGARDING SALE OF INTEREST IN EMBRATEL INCLUDING POTENTIAL OBJECTIONS TO SALE				
03/16/04	Hirsch, Stuart	7.50	3,450.00	W300	11452111
	CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS MCI BOARD PRESENTATION AND SALE MOTION (2.0); REVIEWED DRAFTS OF SALE MOTION AND COMMENTS (3.5); TELEPHONE CALLS WITH A. TURTELTAUB (.5), R. BARRETTO (.5), F. GREEN (.5), AND C. TRAJTENBERG (.5) REGARDING REGULATORY FILINGS, COMPETING OFFER FROM TELES AND OTHER ISSUES				
03/16/04	Fink, Jessica	7.00	2,975.00	W300	11530775
	WORK ON SALE OF EMBRATEL, INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMPANY (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH POTENTIAL PURCHASER REGARDING PROPOSED ORDER (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED ORDER (2.0) REVISE MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SALE (1.8); CONFER WITH S. YUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.8)				
03/16/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	6.40	2,112.00	W300	11468641

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW BOARD UPDATE (.4); SEND BOARD RESOLUTIONS TO J. MCGAREY AND F. GREEN (.2); RESEARCH (3.2); CALL TO S. GOLDRING REGARDING INVESTOR'S OWNERSHIP INTEREST IN MCI POST-EMERGENCE (.5); COMMENTS ON MOTION IN COORDINATION WITH S. HIRSCH (.5); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING COMMENTS (.6); REVISION TO REVISED MOTION (1.0)				
03/17/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.10	71.50	W300	11450466
	CONFER WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING TREATMENT OF INTERCOMPANY NOTE OF EMBRATEL				
03/17/04	Youdelman, Sharon	8.10	4,009.50	W300	11525646
	REVIEW INVESTOR COMMENTS TO DRAFT EMBRATEL SALE ORDER [0.3]; CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.3]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE MILMOE REGARDING SALE MOTION [0.2]; REVISE DRAFT EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [2.9]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, S. HIRSCH, L. FIFE & LONGMIER REGARDING SAME [0.9]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WEBSTER, F. GREEN, R. BEHM, STERN, J. FINK ET AL REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [1.2]; FURTHER REVISIONS TO EMBRATEL SALE MOTION [2.0]; CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.3]				
03/17/04	Hirsch, Stuart	7.00	3,220.00	W300	11452282
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN AND S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING COMMENTS TO SALE MOTION (.8); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS WITH R. BEHM, A. MAZ AND C. NORTON REGARDING EC/CADE FILINGS (2.7); MULTIPLE OTHER TELEPHONE CALLS, CONFERENCE CALLS, E-MAILS REGARDING STRATEGY, 8-K FILING, TELES OFFER AND OTHER ISSUES (3.5)				
03/17/04	Fink, Jessica	7.50	3,187.50	W300	11530782
	WORK ON EMBRATEL SALE (4.9), INCLUDING REVISE MOTION FOR APPROVAL (2.0), VARIOUS CALLS AND NUMEROUS CONFERENCES WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.6)				
03/17/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	7.00	2,310.00	W300	11467928
	REVIEW OF EXECUTED SPA (1.0); REVIEW OF PRESS ARTICLES (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING SPA (1.0); REVIEW OF INFORMATION/FORM NEEDED FOR CADE AND ANATEL FILINGS (1.6); PROOFING/SLUGGING OF PRESS RELEASE AND SPA AGREEMENT (1.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BEHLM AND N. JONES REGARDING FILING OF THE 8-K (.3)				
03/18/04	Fife, Lori	1.80	1,287.00	W300	11515651
	REVIEW AND REVISE EMBRATEL MOTION (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING MOTION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING MOTION AND SERVICE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WEBSTER REGARDING SERVICE (.3)				
03/18/04	Youdelman, Sharon	10.80	5,346.00	W300	11525641
	CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK TO EMBRATEL SALE MOTION & ORDER (2.5) INCLUDING REVIEW OF & REVISIONS TO SAME (7.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE LONGMIER, HANDLER & J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.5]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WEBSTER, R. BEHM, L. FIFE REGARDING SAME [0.8]				
03/18/04	Hirsch, Stuart	8.50	3,910.00	W300	11502909
	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. MAZS, C. NORTON, R. BEHM REGARDING EC/CADE FILINGS AND BACKGROUND OF DEAL (1.0); REVIEWED DRAFTS OF SALE MOTION (1.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, J. FINK, S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (1.0); CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING PREP FOR BOARD CALL ON COMPETING BID (2.0); MCI BOARD CALL REGARDING COMPETING BID (2.0); CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REGULATORY MATTERS AND PRE-CLOSING ITEMS (1.0)				
03/18/04	Fink, Jessica	1.00	425.00	W300	11530784
	CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN AND L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE.				
03/18/04	Fink, Jessica	8.50	3,612.50	W300	11530789

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVISE MOTION / ORDER AND CHART FOR APPROVAL OF EMBRATEL (5.0); WORK ON SERVICE OF MOTION (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR PURCHASER (1.4); TELEPHONIC MEETING OF WORLDCOM BOARD OF DIRECTORS (.6).				
03/18/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	8.70	2,871.00	W300	11468632
	REVIEW WILLKIE COMMENTS ON SALE MOTION (1.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI REGARDING CADE AND ANATEL FILING FORMS (1.0); PROOFING OF REVISED EDGARIZED EXHIBITS (1.2); FILING OF 8-K (PROOFING, COORDINATION WITH NICOLE JONES AND HER ASSISTANT) (.5); RESEARCH ON TELES (2.0); SECOND CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING ANATEL AND CADE WITH BRAZILIAN LOCAL COUNSEL INVOLVED (CFF) (.8); BOARD CALL TO CONSIDER DECISION TO GO WITH INVESTOR (.6); REVIEW FINAL MOTION (1.0)				
03/19/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.20	143.00	W300	11450733
	CONFER WITH S. YUDELMAN REGARDING COMPLIANCE WITH TAX NOTICE REQUIREMENT IN EMBRATEL DEAL				
03/19/04	Youdelman, Sharon	8.20	4,059.00	W300	11525712
	FINALIZE EMBRATEL SALE MOTION, ORDER, NOTICES, INCLUDING REVIEW & REVISIONS (5.9) CONFERENCES WITH WGM TEAM, D. WEBSTER, B. BENJET, R. BEHM REGARDING SAME [2.0]; E-MAILS WITH LONGMEIR REGARDING SAME [0.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE MILMOE REGARDING FILING OF SALE MOTION [0.1]				
03/19/04	Skarda, Michael	0.80	368.00	W300	11452196
	EMAIL TO P. ESKILDSEN (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM AND STAFFING (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PROJECT (0.3).				
03/19/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.80	3,128.00	W300	11500515
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. BEHM, M. FILLIPONI, J. FINK REGARDING NOTICE OF SALE MOTION (1.3); PRODUCE RESPONSE TO N. JONES INQUIRIES ON EMBRATEL TRANSACTION (2.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. LACY REGARDING FILING OF SCHEDULES (1.0); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING REGULATORY APPROVAL PROCESS AND DILIGENCE MATTERS (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. SANTOS REGARDING SAME (.8)				
03/19/04	Cohen, Scott	0.80	320.00	W300	11450468
	DISCUSSION WITH S. YUDELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/19/04	Fink, Jessica	7.60	3,230.00	W300	11530791
	REVISE MOTION FOR SALE OF EMBRATEL (4.0); NOTICES OF MOTION (1.1); PREPARE FOR FILING (1.5); COORDINATE MAILING OF NOTICE WITH CLAIMS AGENT (1.0)				
03/21/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	8.00	1,120.00	W300	11460069
	CONTINUED ASSEMBLEDGE AND COMPILATION OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION AND SET UP OF PRODUCTION ROOM.				
03/22/04	Skarda, Michael	1.50	690.00	W300	11498490
	CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITAKER REGARDING DILIGENCE ROOM (0.4); CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING SAME (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL AND D. WHITAKER REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEW ANNOTATED DILIGENCE LIST (0.6).				
03/22/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	6.30	2,079.00	W300	11474766
	RESEARCH: EFFECT OF EARLY EMERGENCE ON THE CONDITIONS, RIGHTS AND OBLIGATIONS CONTAINED IN THE SPA				
03/22/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	5.70	798.00	W300	11456657

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT OF MISSING DUE DILIGENCE ITEMS MATRIX AND REVIEW (3.4); ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTATION INVENTORY AND ASSEMBLEDGE (1.3); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (1.0)				
03/23/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W300	11632600
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W300	11631936
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MILMOE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.4) AND FOLLOW-UP CALLS WITH L. FIFE, F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/24/04	Skarda, Michael	3.30	1,518.00	W300	11498519
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE STATUS (0.2); REVIEW ANNOTATED DILIGENCE LIST (0.8); REVIEW 2002 10-K (1.8); ASSIST WITH MATTERS RELATING TO MCI MEETING IN DALLAS (0.5).				
03/24/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	1.80	594.00	W300	11475144
	REVIEW OF SPA AND ALL CORRESPONDENCE TO FORMULATE CHECKLIST AND FOLLOW UP/COORDINATE ON FILINGS/FORMS ETC. THAT HAVE TO BE FILED (1.4); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING STATUS OF DEAL (.4)				
03/24/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	3.70	518.00	W300	11460068
	INDEXING OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION TO BE ADDED TO THE PRODUCTION ROOM (.9); DRAFT AND FORWARDING OF DOCUMENTATION INDEX INSERTS TO S. JAMAL FOR INCLUSION IN FINAL INDEX DOCUMENT (1.5); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING REQUIRED UPDATES AND INSERTIONS TO THE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTATION INDEX (.5); ASSISTANCE IN THE MONITORING OF THE PRODUCTION ROOM (.8)				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W300	11633152
	REVIEW EMBRATEL OFFER FROM CALAIS (.6) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/25/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.00	495.00	W300	11525600
	REVIEW CALAIS OFFER REGARDING EMBRATEL [0.8]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME [0.1]; CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.1]				
03/25/04	Skarda, Michael	0.50	230.00	W300	11498522
	CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE AND STAFFING MATTERS				
03/25/04	Hirsch, Stuart	7.30	3,358.00	W300	11502286
	REVIEWED BID MATERIALS FROM CALAIS (AGREEMENT, OPINIONS AND SUPPORTING MATERIALS) (3.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING CHECKLIST OF CLOSING ITEMS (.8); REVIEWED MATRIX COMPARING OFFERS FROM INVESTOR AND CALAIS PREPARED BY C. TRAJTENBERG (1.5); REVIEWED VARIOUS PRESS RELEASES, AND DECISION BY CADE REGARDING TELES PROPOSED OFFER (1.8)				
03/25/04	Fink, Jessica	3.40	1,445.00	W300	11530663
	REVIEW COMPETING OFFER FOR SALE OF EMBRATEL.				
03/25/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	5.80	1,914.00	W300	11486475
	DRAFTING MEMORANDUM COMPARING OFFERS (2.8); REVIEW OF LETTER, OPINIONS, MOTION, BID, ETC. (3.0)				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W300	11633852

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MILMOE (SKADDEN ARPS) REGARDING CALAIS PROPOSAL (.2) AND FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/26/04	Fife, Lori	2.80	2,002.00	W300	11507862
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLD.COM, F. GREEN, LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. YOUDELMAN AND J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.4); REVIEW OFFER FROM GEODEX (1.0).				
03/26/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.30	148.50	W300	11525723
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE & J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL OFFER [0.1]; CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME [0.2]				
03/26/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.10	2,806.00	W300	11500372
	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. METGE, J. EISNER REGARDING ANALYSIS OF EU FILING REQUIREMENTS (2.0); CONFERENCE CALLS W/DEAL TEAM REGARDING CALAIS OFFERS (1.5); REVIEWED PRESS REPORTS AND DRAFT REGULATORY FILINGS (2.6)				
03/26/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	3.00	990.00	W300	11486476
	REVIEW MATERIALS REGARDING TELES BID (2.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING TELES BID AND PREPARATION FOR NEXT COUPLE WEEKS (1.0)				
03/26/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.00	280.00	W300	11467355
	INDEXING OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION (1.0); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (1.0)				
03/27/04	Hirsch, Stuart	1.20	552.00	W300	11500738
	REVIEWED LATEST DRAFTS OF ANATEL FILING				
03/29/04	Gold, Simeon	0.50	367.50	W300	11480408
	CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE AND F. GREEN REGARDING POTENTIAL TRANSACTION.				
03/29/04	Fife, Lori	1.20	858.00	W300	11511507
	REVIEW EMBRATEL LEASE MATERIALS.				
03/29/04	Hirsch, Stuart	4.60	2,116.00	W300	11500792
	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. BOSTON, A. TURTELTAUB, B. LACY, R. BARRETTO AND OTHERS REGARDING MCIIB LICENSE TRANSFER AND ANATEL APPLICATION (1.5); REVIEWED DRAFTS OF ANATEL APPLICATION AND COMMENTS TO SAME (1.8); CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING STATUS AND REGULATORY ISSUES (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W/WGM BRUSSELS REGARDING ANALYSIS FOR EC FILING (.3)				
03/29/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	2.80	924.00	W300	11488184
	FOLLOW UP ON ALL MATTERS (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL TO BRUSSELS (JON G. FILIPEK) REGARDING EU FILING (.6); REVIEW PRESS RELEASES FROM BRAZIL REGARDING THE TRANSACTION (.8); DRAFTING OF SIDE LETTER REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/30/04	Skarda, Michael	0.50	230.00	W300	11498487
	CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM STATUS (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING STATUS (0.2).				
03/30/04	Hirsch, Stuart	9.20	4,232.00	W300	11502734

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALLS W/DEAL TEAM TO DISCUSS CALAIS BID AND REGULATORY ANALYSIS; PREPARED MEMORANDUM TO BOARD SUMMARIZING POSITION; MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES W/F. GREEN, C. TRANJTENBERG, BRAZILIAN COUNSEL REGARDING BOARD MEMORANDUM AND REGULATORY ISSUES; REVIEWED DRAFTS OF ANATEL APPLICATIONS REGARDING MCIIB LICENSE TRANSFER.				
03/30/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	5.20	1,716.00	W300	11486788
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD, CFF REGARDING TELES OFFER AND REGULATORY IMPLICATIONS (.6); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (.6); DRAFTING OF BOARD UPDATE (2.0); CALL WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING MEMORANDUM (.5); REVIEW REVISED MEMORANDUM (1.5)				
03/30/04	Grogan, James	0.80	292.00	W300	11502846
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. KOPPEL REGARDING CLOSING OF NEXTEL ASSET SALE AND VARIOUS RELATED ISSUES				
03/30/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	3.00	420.00	W300	11486148
	MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM, DOCUMENTATION INDEXING AND ASSEMBLEDGE FOR DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW.				
03/31/04	Rothman, Richard	1.20	882.00	W300	11503176
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.6)				
03/31/04	Fife, Lori	3.50	2,502.50	W300	11506558
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL AND EMAILS (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATEL BACKGROUND (1.0); REVIEW BRAZIL OPINION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. PEREZ REGARDING EMBRATEL AND KPMG (.4) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. ROTHMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6)				
03/31/04	Cohen, Adam	1.80	990.00	W300	11488665
	CONFER WITH L. FIFE, S.YOUDELMAN AND J. FINK REGARDING OBJECTION TO EMBRATEL DEAL (1.0), CONFER WITH R. ROTHMAN REGARDING SAME (0.1), REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO SAME (0.7).				
03/31/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.20	594.00	W300	11525716
	CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE TRANSACTION [0.2]; PREPARE FOR & ATTEND MEETING WITH L. FIFE, A. COHEN, J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING PREPARATION [1.0]				
03/31/04	Skarda, Michael	6.50	2,990.00	W300	11498526
	RESEARCH REGARDING DIRECTOR FIDUCIARY DUTIES UNDER GEORGIA LAW (5.8); CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING SAME (0.5).				
03/31/04	Hirsch, Stuart	10.80	4,968.00	W300	11502784
	REVIEWED DRAFTS OF ANATEL APPLICATION REGARDING MCIIB LICENSE AND COMMENTS TO CFF (.6); CONTINUED WORK ON BOARD MEMORANDUM (.6); REVIEWED DRAFTS OF AMENDMENT TO SPA (INCREASE DEPOSIT AND MCIIB LICENSE) (.6); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING BOARD MEETING, REGULATORY ANALYSIS AND VARIOUS OTHER ISSUES (.6); REVIEWED CFF REGULATORY ANALYSIS (.6)				
03/31/04	Fink, Jessica	1.00	425.00	W300	11530393
	MEETING WITH L. FIFE, S. YOUDELMAN, A. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE.				
03/31/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W300	11510722
	CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN AND M. LARSON REGARDING HEARING ON ASSET SALE AGREEMENT FOR CERTAIN TOWER ASSESTS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/31/04	Pullo, Christina	2.40	660.00	W300	11525114
	CONFER WITH J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL RESPONSE REGARDING STANDING OF DISAPPOINTED BIDDER (.4); REVIEW 363 MOTION FOR EMBRATEL SALE (.5); RESEARCH CASES REGARDING STANDING OF DISAPPOINTED BIDDER TO OBJECT TO 363 SALE (1.5)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W300 - ASSET DISPOSITIONS:		696.00	\$ 309,998.50		
03/01/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.40	120.00	W310	11414786
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. GLUCK REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS (.2); REVIEW MARYLAND BANKRUPTCY DOCKET REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS AGAINST INTERMEDIA (.2).				
03/02/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.20	85.00	W310	11499232
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CARSON REGARDING NOTICES				
03/02/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W310	11412633
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. KALEEN REGARDING WYOMING LEASES				
03/02/04	Larson, Michelle	0.20	89.00	W310	11410318
	CORRESPOND WITH CLIENT AND COUNSEL REGARDING NEW LEASE.				
03/02/04	Pullo, Christina	1.70	467.50	W310	11524447
	DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT OF FCC LICENSES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING STIPULATION EXTENDING TIME & PRESERVING 503(B) CLAIM FOR SKYTEL ABANDONMENT (.3); DRAFT STIPULATION REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
03/03/04	Pullo, Christina	1.90	522.50	W310	11524469
	DRAFT STIPULATION EXTENDING TIME & PRESERVING 503(B) CLAIM FOR SKYTEL ABANDONMENT				
03/04/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.10	30.00	W310	11428101
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND G. MITCHELL REGARDING 25 TOWERS MOTION				
03/05/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.10	37.00	W310	11429567
	CALL TO D. ROBINSON REGARDING STATUS OF VA RELEASE.				
03/05/04	Larson, Michelle	0.40	178.00	W310	11418921
	CORRESPOND WITH K. COX, B. FRIES AND D. AGEE REGARDING LIEN ISSUE (.3); CORRESPOND WITH L. CARSON REGARDING 560 LEXINGTON (.1).				
03/05/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.30	90.00	W310	11428104
	REVIEW NOTICE LIST FOR LANDLORDS ON 25 TOWERS (.1); REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN AND S. SIMPSON REGARDING ORDERS FOR 3.9.04 HEARING (.1).				
03/08/04	Strochak, Adam	0.10	55.00	W310	11489855
	REVIEW TELETECH STIPULATION REGARDING ABANDONMENT OF PERSONAL PROPERTY AT LEASEHOLD AND PHONE CALL FROM C. PULLO REGARDING SAME				
03/08/04	Larson, Michelle	0.10	44.50	W310	11421468
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. COX REGARDING SIOUX FALLS LEASE.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/04	Pullo, Christina REVISE TELETECH STIPULATION REGARDING ABANDONED PROPERTY	2.00	550.00	W310	11524770
03/08/04	Simpson, Kristin PREPARE PROPOSED ORDER ON LEASE TERMINATION FOR 3.9.04 HEARING AND SEND TO G. MITCHELL (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. SIMPSON AND J. JORDAN REGARDING PROPOSED ORDER FOR 3.9.04 HEARING ON LEASE TERMINATION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1).	0.30	90.00	W310	11434692
03/09/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING COMMISSION AGREEMENT	0.10	44.50	W310	11427214
03/09/04	Simpson, Kristin REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND L. LOCASCIO REGARDING 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1).	0.20	60.00	W310	11434696
03/10/04	Simpson, Stefanie TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CARSON REGARDING ADDRESSES (.1); CONFERENCE WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING SAME (.4).	0.50	212.50	W310	11461645
03/10/04	Pullo, Christina CALL WITH D. GUARD OF MCI REGARDING FCC LICENSES ABANDONMENTS (.2); CALL WITH A. JACKINS REGARDING TELETECH STIPULATION (.1); DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT (.5)	0.80	220.00	W310	11524864
03/10/04	Simpson, Kristin REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND L. LOCASCIO REGARDING 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1).	0.20	60.00	W310	11434697
03/11/04	Cohen, Scott TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. LEVINSON REGARDING RECTOR ST. LEASE	0.20	80.00	W310	11433328
03/11/04	Larson, Michelle CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION	0.30	133.50	W310	11434177
03/11/04	Pullo, Christina CONFER WITH A. JACKINS REGARDING TELETECH STIPULATION (.2); LEAVE VOICEMAIL FOR D. GUARD AT MCI REGARDING INTERMEDIA NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT (.1); DRAFT INTERMEDIA FCC LICENSES NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT (.3)	0.60	165.00	W310	11525543
03/11/04	Simpson, Kristin REVIEW VANGUARD LEASE (.3); REVIEW BROKER AGREEMENT WITH BRANDT COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES, INC. (.4); DRAFT APPLICATION FOR RETENTION OF BRANDT COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES, INC. (.2.4).	3.10	930.00	W310	11434761
03/11/04	Bartram, Lyle PREPARE NOTICE OF HEARING REGARDING MOTION TO ASSUME REAL PROPERTY LEASES IN WASHINGTON, OREGON, UTAH (.3); ELECTRONICALLY FILE MOTION AND NOTICE TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT AND ASSUME REAL PROPERTY LEASES (.7); ARRANGE FOR SERVICE OF SAME (.1) CONFERENCE WITH K. JOFFRIEN REGARDING ADDRESSES (.3)	1.40	217.00	W310	11477878
03/11/04	Joffrion, Karen	1.70	272.00	W310	11471506

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING BCT PARTNERSHIP ADDRESS (.4); REVISE ADDRESS LIST FOR NOTICES (.2); RESEARCH DATABASE TO LOCATE MISSING ADDRESSES (.8); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. BARTRAM REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/12/04	Larson, Michelle	0.50	222.50	W310	11434182
	WORK ON RETENTION AND LEASING ISSUES				
03/12/04	Simpson, Kristin	2.50	750.00	W310	11438727
	DRAFT, EDIT AND REVISE APPLICATION FOR RETENTION OF BRANDT COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES, INC.				
03/15/04	Pullo, Christina	1.80	495.00	W310	11524800
	CONFER VIA TELEPHONE WITH D. GUARD REGARDING INTERMEDIA NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT (.3); DRAFT EMAIL TO D. GUARD REGARDING DEPT OF GOVERNMENT REQUESTS THAT DEBTOR CONFIRM THE FCC LICENSES ABANDONED IN ACCORD WITH FCC REGULATIONS (.1); DRAFT EMAILS TO D. GUARD REGARDING NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT OF FCC LICENSES (.3); REVIEW REVISIONS OF TELETECH STIPULATION MADE BY A. JACKINS OF DUANE MORRIS (.2); REVISE TELETECH STIPULATION (.9)				
03/16/04	Cohen, Scott	0.40	160.00	W310	11450547
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. GLASMAN REGARDING LEASE QUERY (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. MURPHY REGARDING REAL ESTATE QUERY (.2)				
03/16/04	Larson, Michelle	1.00	445.00	W310	11446062
	CORRESPOND WITH D. AGEE REGARDING EXPIRED LEASES (.1); REVISE BRANDT RETENTION APPLICATION AND CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON AND S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING SAME (.9).				
03/16/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.00	300.00	W310	11448100
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING FILING OF 25 TOWERS MOTION (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING CURE COSTS IN 25 TOWER TRANSACTION (.1); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.1); REVISE BRANDT RETENTION (.6)				
03/17/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.50	450.00	W310	11448103
	REVISE APPLICATION TO RETAIN BRANDT (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. COX REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON AND J. FINK REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.3); REVISE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN, M. SCHNEIDER AND G. MITCHELL REGARDING FILING OF 25 TOWERS MOTION (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. GARCES REGARDING NEW SITES (.1); VERIFY THAT EXHIBIT C, MOTION AND EXHIBIT A TO PURCHASE CONTRACT CONTAIN SAME INFORMATION (.3).				
03/18/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W310	11450461
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. HOWLAND REGARDING REJECTS (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CARSON REGARDING LEASE ISSUE (.1)				
03/18/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.40	148.00	W310	11464279
	CONVERSATION WITH A. YOON REGARDING REAL ESTATE RELEASE CHECKLIST (.1); REVISIONS TO REAL ESTATE RELEASE CHECKLIST (.3).				
03/18/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.40	120.00	W310	11455032
	PREPARE 25 TOWERS MOTION FOR FILING (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. GARCES REGARDING ADDITIONAL TAXING JURISDICTIONS (.1).				
03/18/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.60	180.00	W310	11455036
	REVIEW EXHIBIT C TO 25 TOWERS MOTION AND VERIFY THAT PARTIES ARE ON NOTICE LIST				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/19/04	Simpson, Stefanie	1.00	425.00	W310	11496908
	TELEPHONE CALL TO A. PEREZ REGARDING STIPULATION (.2); SEVERAL TELEPHONE CALLS TO R. NORTON REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO L. CARSON REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CARSON AND N. BYNUM REGARDING MARVEC LEASE (.4).				
03/19/04	Larson, Michelle	0.40	178.00	W310	11454563
	CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING 25 TOWER MOTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. CORDRY REGARDING SAME (.3).				
03/19/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.10	330.00	W310	11460073
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FILING OF 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1); EDIT AND PROOFREAD 25 TOWERS MOTION FOR FILING (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. GARCES REGARDING TAXING JURISDICTIONS (.1); CAUSE 25 TOWERS MOTION TO BE FILED (.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. CORDRY REGARDING STAMP AND TRANSFER TAX LANGUAGE IN MOTION AND ORDER (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING LANGUAGE IN MOTION AND ORDER REGARDING STAMP AND TRANSFER TAXES (.2).				
03/22/04	Simpson, Stefanie	1.20	510.00	W310	11498110
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CARSON, N. BYNUM, R. MOLITOR AND J. THEBOLD REGARDING MARVEC LEASE (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. DENIGAN REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. NORTON REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW CASE LAW (.2).				
03/22/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W310	11465043
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. SOBEL REGARDING LEASES & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/22/04	Larson, Michelle	0.10	44.50	W310	11454744
	TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM HURON CONSULTING REGARDING LEASE CLAIMS				
03/22/04	Pullo, Christina	2.00	550.00	W310	11525338
	DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR FCC LICENSES (1.8); DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT OF EQUIPMENT IN LEXINGTON, KY (.2)				
03/23/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.60	297.00	W310	11525734
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH TYSON REGARDING RETURN OF SECURITY DEPOSIT [0.3]; E-MAIL TYSON REGARDING CONFERENCE DOCUMENTS [0.2]; CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME [0.1]				
03/23/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.70	297.50	W310	11498116
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. MOLITOR, L. CARSON, N. BYNUM, P. DUNIGAN, F. NEVILLE, J. THEBOLD AND B. TROSPER REGARDING MARVEC LEASE				
03/23/04	Larson, Michelle	0.80	356.00	W310	11459636
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO K. COX REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING LEASE CLAIMS (.2); DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO D. AGEE AND L. MCCOY REGARDING SAME (.3).				
03/23/04	Pullo, Christina	0.20	55.00	W310	11525001
	REVIEW NOTICES OF ABANDONMENT WITH S. COHEN (.1); CONFER WITH J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING FILING OF NOTICES (.1)				
03/23/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.40	120.00	W310	11465684
	CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. COX REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION AND UST POLICIES (.2).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/24/04	Simpson, Stefanie REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO G. WERNER (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO R. NORTON REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.30	127.50	W310	11496942
03/24/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH L. MCCOY AND D. OHLER REGARDING CURE PAYMENTS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE AND ADDITIONAL CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.4); PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO A. PEREZ AND ATTEND TO ISSUES RELATED TO SAME (.4).	1.20	534.00	W310	11470014
03/25/04	Simpson, Stefanie TELEPHONE CALL TO R. NORTON REGARDING SETTLEMENT MEETING	0.20	85.00	W310	11496945
03/25/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH L. MCCOY, D. OHLER AND D. AGEE REGARDING CURE ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. AGEE REGARDING SAME (.8); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING BRANDT (.2).	1.30	578.50	W310	11471522
03/26/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH D. OHLER REGARDING LEASE ISSUES & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DEWEY SQ. LEASE (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH K. TYSON REGARDING ENGLEWOOD LEASE & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.2)	0.90	360.00	W310	11527690
03/26/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH D. OHLER, D. AGEE ET AL. REGARDING CLAIMS AND CURE ISSUES.	0.10	44.50	W310	11471527
03/26/04	Simpson, Kristin CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADDRESSES ON NOTICE LIST (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND M. LARSON REGARDING ASSIGNMENT OF LEASES (.2).	0.30	90.00	W310	11478239
03/29/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING MARVEC & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE	0.20	80.00	W310	11527389
03/29/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING BRANDT (.2); REVIEW VANCOUVER LEASE AND CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. AGEE, D. OHLER AND L. MCCOY REGARDING CLAIMS ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISCHER REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUNGMAN REGARDING AND ANALYZE CURE ISSUES (.8).	3.00	1,335.00	W310	11475746
03/30/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH L. MCCOY REGARDING CURE ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING BRANDT (.2); REVIEW AND COMMENT UPON MARKET FRONT LEASE AMENDMENT (.4).	0.70	311.50	W310	11483610
03/30/04	Simpson, Kristin CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADDRESSES FOR NOTICE PARTIES (.1); VERIFY ADDRESSES FOR LANDLORDS ON 25 TOWERS IF RETURN OF SERVICE RECEIVED (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING UNITED STATES TRUSTEE REQUIREMENTS FOR APPLICATIONS TO RETAIN BROKERS (.1); REVISE APPLICATION TO EMPLOY BRANDT COMMERCIAL PROPERTIES (.4); DRAFT SUMMARY OF MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT MOTION (.3).	1.20	360.00	W310	11499881
03/31/04	Simpson, Stefanie CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CARSON AND K. KNIGHT REGARDING PROFFER	0.30	127.50	W310	11496996
03/31/04	Cohen, Scott MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REAL ESTATE	0.20	80.00	W310	11528450

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/31/04	Simpson, Kristin REVIEW MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT IN PREPARATION FOR DRAFTING PROFFER AND SUMMARY (.3); DRAFT K. KNIGHT PROFFER FOR HEARING ON MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (1.2); DRAFT SUMMARY OF MOTION TO APPROVE MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT (.8).	2.30	690.00	W310	11499803
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W310 - REAL PROPERTY LEASES:		48.40	\$ 16,270.00		
03/01/04	Baker, Sylvia CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING BP CONTRACT ISSUES.	0.30	154.50	W320	11419456
03/01/04	Perez, Alfredo WORK ON WELLS FARGO STIPULATION WITH B. BENJET AND R. WELLS (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH COMMITTEE AND PIPER REGARDING TELCOVE (.20)	0.60	402.00	W320	11418488
03/01/04	Wells, Renee REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM N. HIRSCH REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN AND T. MEINKEN REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.70	210.00	W320	11419961
03/01/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD, T. TAYLOR, P. LANGVILLE AND D. SHOPFNER REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.8); REVIEW DRAFT AMENDMENT TO SAME (.5); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING SAME (.3); DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION REGARDING SAME (1.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND A. PEREZ REGARDING BP CONTRACT (.1).	3.80	1,387.00	W320	11427500
03/02/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM S. ABRAMOWITZ (VINSON & ELKINS) AND N. BYNUM (MCI) REGARDING MISSISSIPPI POWER IRU AGREEMENT	0.30	165.00	W320	11518303
03/03/04	Wells, Renee REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM C. FLEMING REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.5); COORDINATE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING DISTRIBUTION OF NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (.2).	0.80	240.00	W320	11419970
03/03/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT (.8); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING STATUS OF BP CONTRACT NEGOTIATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING TIMING OF BP TRANSACTIONS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT ISSUES (.5); DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP CONTRACT (1.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING REVIEW OF BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT (.3).	4.50	1,642.50	W320	11428123
03/04/04	Wells, Renee FORWARD NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO TO VARIOUS PARTIES AND DRAFT EMAIL ADVISING OF EXPIRATION OF OBJECTION PERIOD REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM M. EVANS REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH NTS (.1).	0.20	60.00	W320	11420004
03/04/04	Grogan, James	4.60	1,679.00	W320	11428095

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (2.0); REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.7); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW BP CONTRACT BUSINESS CASE (.8); CORRESPOND WITH R. WELLS AND M. EVANS REGARDING STATUS OF NTS SETTLEMENT (.1); REVIEW SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO SAME (.2).				
03/05/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.20	103.00	W320	11419476
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING BP CONTRACT.				
03/05/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W320	11418462
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND J. GROGAN REGARDING PROPOSED SETTLEMENT WITH THE STATE OF INDIANA				
03/05/04	Grogan, James	9.30	3,394.50	W320	11428066
	CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK, S. BAKER AND S. BURNS REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH VOCALL (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. MITRICK REGARDING SAME AND WORLDCOM PLAN OF REORGANIZATION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. MOONEY AND B. BENJET REGARDING BP CONTRACT BUSINESS CASE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. MOONEY REGARDING PENDING SETTLEMENTS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT TIMING ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE AMENDMENT TO BP CONTRACT (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MOONEY, T. TAYLOR AND P. ABOOD REGARDING BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT (.7); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING STATUS OF BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT (.5); DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP CONTRACT (3.4); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING STIPULATION WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO SAME (.4); DRAFT AND REVISE STIPULATION RESOLVING MOTION OF STATE OF INDIANA (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS AND M. FISHER REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/08/04	Baker, Sylvia	3.40	1,751.00	W320	11424156
	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION SEEKING APPROVAL OF BP AMENDMENT (1.1); FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISE REVISED DRAFT OF BP AMENDMENT MOTION (.9); CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN AND P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.3); PARTIAL PARTICIPATION IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE'S PROFESSIONALS REGARDING BP AMENDMENT (.6); REVIEW, RESPOND TO AND DRAFT EMAILS REGARDING BP AMENDMENT (.3).				
03/08/04	Wells, Renee	0.20	60.00	W320	11437848
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING DE MINIMIS SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES				
03/08/04	Grogan, James	10.70	3,905.50	W320	11430629
	CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES PERTAINING TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME AND STATUS OF BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT (.5); REDACT AMENDED BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (1.6); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE REGARDING SAME (.8); REVIEW FINAL BUSINESS CASE REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SUMMARY OF AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.3); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES PERTAINING TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.2); DRAFT AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT OF BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (2.5); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (1.1); CORRESPOND WITH J. JACOBS REGARDING STATE OF INDIANA STIPULATION (.3); REVIEW STATE OF INDIANA'S MOTION TO EXTEND BAR DATE (.3); DRAFT AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH STATE OF INDIANA RELATED TO SAME (1.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND J. JACOBS REGARDING STIPULATION WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.2); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING DE MINIMIS SETTLEMENT PROCEDURES (.2).				
03/09/04	Wells, Renee	0.40	120.00	W320	11437803
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING TREATMENT OF UNDER UTILIZATION CHARGES IN PREVIOUS SETTLEMENTS AND REVIEW FILES REGARDING SAME				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/09/04	Grogan, James	4.30	1,569.50	W320	11430815
	REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (1.9); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM P. ABOOD REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES PERTAINING TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. JACOBS REGARDING STIPULATION WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH J. JACOBS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW COUNTER-OFFER OF SETTLEMENT FROM ALLSTATE CELLULAR AND CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ AND E. FAMATID REGARDING REJECTED CONTRACTS (.5).				
03/10/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.90	463.50	W320	11430883
	SEVERAL DISCUSSIONS WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING FINALIZING BP AMENDMENT AND MOTION (.4); PARTIAL PARTICIPATION IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. GROGAN AND P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION REGARDING SAME (.4).				
03/10/04	Grogan, James	5.90	2,153.50	W320	11430818
	CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CREDITORS' COMMITTEE APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.1); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING REVISIONS TO BP MOTION (.2); REVISE SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. CARR REGARDING BP MOTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFIT ISSUES PERTAINING TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.5); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS, J. CARR AND P. ABOOD REGARDING MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. KARTSONIS REGARDING HEARING DATE FOR BP MOTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING EXECUTION OF AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. LEHANE REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. LEHANE REGARDING DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. LEHANE REGARDING FORM OF ORDER TO BP MOTION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.1); REVISE FORM OF ORDER AND MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.5); CORRESPOND WITH P. ABOOD AND B. LEHANE REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ AND E. FAMATID REGARDING CONTRACT REJECTION ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. JACOBS REGARDING STIPULATION WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.6); REVISE STIPULATION WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. SWEENEY REGARDING STATE OF INDIANA STIPULATION (.1).				
03/11/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.30	154.50	W320	11430898
	SEVERAL BRIEF DISCUSSIONS REGARDING FINALIZING BP AMENDMENT AND MOTION.				
03/11/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W320	11458027
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS AND S. MOONEY REGARDING CHOICE ONE SETTLEMENT				
03/11/04	Wells, Renee	0.10	30.00	W320	11438228
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM M. EVANS REGARDING SETTLEMENTS WITH VTE OR NORTH TELECOMMUNICATIONS				
03/11/04	Grogan, James	9.80	3,577.00	W320	11430829

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. LEHANE REGARDING EXECUTION OF AMENDMENT TO BP CONTRACT AND SCHEDULES AND EXHIBITS TO SAME (2.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING STATUS OF BP MOTION, EXECUTION OF CONTRACT, HEARING DATES AND OTHER ISSUES RELATED TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (1.4); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL AND S. VACEK REGARDING FILING OF BP MOTION (.4); CORRESPOND SEVERAL TIMES WITH B. LEHANE REGARDING FINAL AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT, SCHEDULES AND EXHIBITS FOR EXECUTION (1.8); REVIEW MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDMENT TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.6); REVIEW CASE CALENDAR REGARDING HEARING ON BP MOTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND MULTIPLE TIMES WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING EXHIBIT C TO BP GLOBAL SERVICES AGREEMENT (.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING STATUS OF BP MOTION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH P. REYNOLDS, B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING CHOICE ONE SETTLEMENT (.4); REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH SAME (.2); DRAFT NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF INDIANA STIPULATION (.6); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/12/04	Wells, Renee	0.10	30.00	W320	11438230
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING DRAFTING MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH CHOICE ONE COMMUNICATIONS				
03/12/04	Grogan, James	0.40	146.00	W320	11430848
	CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING CHOICE ONE SETTLEMENT (.1); REVIEW SAME (.3).				
03/15/04	Wells, Renee	0.50	150.00	W320	11439480
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM M. EVANS REQUESTING COPIES OF VARIOUS SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS				
03/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.50	335.00	W320	11458094
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING VERIZON SETTLEMENT WITH M. HARTHUN AND OTHER MCI PERSONNEL (.20), REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING NEON FROM R. GRAHAM AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. WELLS, S. COHEN AND J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.20), REVIEW NOTICE OF TERMINATION RECEIVED FROM SBC (.10),				
03/16/04	Wells, Renee	0.90	270.00	W320	11443565
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM S. BUSCHART REGARDING NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND EMAILS REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH CHOICE ONE COMMUNICATIONS (.2); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT WITH NEON AND REVIEW NEON'S MOTION FOR CLARIFICATION OF ASSUMPTION OR REJECTION OF EXECUTORY CONTRACT (.5).				
03/17/04	Wells, Renee	0.10	30.00	W320	11443487
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM M. EVANS REGARDING REQUEST FOR INFORMATION REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH CTSI.				
03/18/04	Wells, Renee	0.80	240.00	W320	11455365
	REVIEW FILE REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH CHOICE ONE COMMUNICATIONS (.6); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAILS FROM M. EVANS REGARDING REQUESTS FOR COPIES OF EXECUTED SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.2).				
03/19/04	Wells, Renee	3.30	990.00	W320	11455367
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAILS FROM M. EVANS REGARDING REQUEST FOR COPIES OF VARIOUS SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.3); DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH CHOICE ONE COMMUNICATIONS (2.4); DRAFT EMAIL TO P. REYNOLDS REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MONROE REGARDING CREDITORS ABILITY TO AMEND PROOF OF CLAIM AND RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH K. CAPLAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/22/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W320	11474366
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING TOP 100 CONTRACTS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/22/04	Wells, Renee REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH CHOICE ONE COMMUNICATIONS (.3); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM P. REYNOLDS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CHART OF PENDING SETTLEMENTS (.2); REVIEW FILE REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH LAVA TRADING (.2); REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. MONROE REGARDING QUERIES RELATED TO PAETEC PROOF OF CLAIM AND POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MONROE REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM S. COHEN REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH NEON AND STATUS OF CONTRACTS AND REVIEW FILE REGARDING SAME (.5).	2.00	600.00	W320	11460147
03/22/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH P. REYNOLDS AND R. WELLS REGARDING CHOICE ONE SETTLEMENT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ AND R. WELLS REGARDING NEON SETTLEMENT (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM L. PROTOPAPAS AND S. MOONEY REGARDING ZURICH STIPULATION (.4).	0.90	328.50	W320	11465666
03/23/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS.	0.40	198.00	W320	11474339
03/23/04	Wells, Renee TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. WEBSTER REGARDING PAETEC PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RIGHT OF SETOFF (.6); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM D. WEBSTER AND REVIEW CLAIMS DATABASE REGARDING SAME (.8); CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME, AND REVIEW BANKRUPTCY CODE § 553 (.3).	1.70	510.00	W320	11474970
03/23/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING HEARING ON BP MOTION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING BRAXTON SETTLEMENT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. MOONEY AND T. MEINKEN REGARDING SETTLEMENT COMMITTEE MEETING (.1).	0.50	182.50	W320	11466381
03/24/04	Whittaker, Donald TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING GOVERNMENT CONTRACTS.	0.20	99.00	W320	11473964
03/24/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SOUTH BAY SETTLEMENT	0.30	109.50	W320	11466394
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH A&P REGARDING GOVERNMENT CONTRACTS.	0.20	99.00	W320	11474103
03/25/04	Whittaker, Donald MEETING WITH S&C REGARDING VARIOUS CONTRACTS, STRUCTURE, CHARTS, LITIGATION.	0.80	396.00	W320	11474104
03/25/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH D. DRORI AND E. MILLER REGARDING 9019 MOTION	0.20	134.00	W320	11469864
03/25/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. ABOOD REGARDING CLOSING ON BP CONTRACT AMENDMENT (.6); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND P. ABOOD REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING STATUS OF PT-1 MATTER AND TRANSCRIPT OF FEBRUARY 2, 2004 HEARING ON SAME (.3); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE STIPULATION (.1).	1.80	657.00	W320	11470401
03/26/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. YOON REGARDING ACCOUNTS	0.10	49.50	W320	11474071

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING TRANSCRIPT OF PT-1 HEARING (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL AND R. OLVERA REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE (.5); DRAFT AND REVISE SAME (3.0).	4.10	1,496.50	W320	11471487
03/29/04	Perez, Alfredo CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING NEON OPTICA	0.30	201.00	W320	11516924
03/29/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING OPTICA (.3) & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.2)	0.50	200.00	W320	11527388
03/29/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH J. RHODES REGARDING IFN CIRCUIT REJECTION (.5); REVIEW NEON ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CALL R. BAUMFIELD REGARDING NEON & RELATED TELEPHONE CALL J. TROFIMUK (.4)	1.20	480.00	W320	11529038
03/29/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW NEWENERGY CONTRACT FOR ANALYSIS OF FORWARD CONTRACT CLAUSES.	0.30	111.00	W320	11532195
03/29/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING PT-1 TRANSCRIPT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING CDI SETTLEMENT (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS AND J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.50	182.50	W320	11505042
03/30/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND C. MARCUS REGARDING REJECTION OF LAGUARDIA CONTRACT	0.20	134.00	W320	11517572
03/30/04	Cohen, Scott TELEPHONE CALL P. REYNOLDS REGARDING NEON & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE	0.40	160.00	W320	11527959
03/30/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW NEWENERGY CONTRACT FOR ANALYSIS OF FORWARD CONTRACT CLAUSES.	0.20	74.00	W320	11532197
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING CONTRACT FILES AND FRANCHISE AGREEMENTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11508399
03/31/04	Wells, Renee REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. EVANS REGARDING DRAFTING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH IDT WINSTAR	0.20	60.00	W320	11515583
03/31/04	Grogan, James CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MAHONEY REGARDING AMERICAN EXPRESS SETTLEMENT	0.20	73.00	W320	11510723
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W320 - EXECUTORY CONTRACTS:		86.20	\$ 32,597.50		
03/01/04	Strochak, Adam	0.50	275.00	W330	11489070

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM R. BERKOVICH, M. CHASTKA (MCI) REGARDING JMG MOTION FOR STAY RELIEF TO ALLOW CONVERSION OF PREFERRED SHARES TO COMMON (0.3); PHONE CALL FROM D. ELBAUM (SIMPSON THACHER) REGARDING REYNOLDS V. ALLEN CASE AND ASSERTION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.2)				
03/02/04	Strochak, Adam	3.80	2,090.00	W330	11518301
	PHONE CALL FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING APPLICATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY TO CLAIMS REGARDING CONDUCT THAT CONTINUES POST-PETITION (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH A. DINOS REGARDING RESEARCH AND MOTION TO ENFORCE STAY AS TO REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE ACTION (0.7); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING STAY OF DERIVATIVE CLAIMS (0.8); REVIEW LETTER FROM E. FEIG (REYNOLDS COUNSEL) REGARDING STAY OF REYNOLDS ACTION (0.5); DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE COTE IN RESPONSE (1.3)				
03/02/04	Dinos, Anthea	1.80	594.00	W330	11409668
	MEET WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION (.8); WORK ON MOTION TO ENFORCE AUTOMATIC STAY (1.0)				
03/03/04	Strochak, Adam	2.80	1,540.00	W330	11518307
	REVIEW GRAYSON LIFT STAY MOTION (0.4); PHONE CALL TO GRAYSON COUNSEL REGARDING SCHEDULING OF HEARING ON SAME (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING OPPOSITION TO GRAYSON LIFT STAY MOTION (0.5); REVISE AND FINALIZE LETTER TO JUDGE COTE REGARDING REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE ACTION AND APPLICABILITY OF STAY (0.7); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM D. ELBAUM (SIMPSON THACHER) AND BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.6); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM N. BYNUM (MCI) AND D. HANDZO (JENNER) REGARDING LOUISIANA RIGHT OF WAY CLAIMS (0.4)				
03/03/04	Dinos, Anthea	7.50	2,475.00	W330	11423935
	PREPARE REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION TO ENFORCE THE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
03/04/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W330	11518316
	CONFERENCE WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING GRAYSON LIFT STAY MOTION				
03/04/04	Dinos, Anthea	7.00	2,310.00	W330	11423938
	PREPARE REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION TO ENFORCE THE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
03/05/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W330	11519736
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM D. ELBAUM (SIMPSON) REGARDING REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE ACTION (0.3); REVIEW ORDER FROM JUDGE COTE REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE (0.1)				
03/05/04	Dinos, Anthea	5.90	1,947.00	W330	11423941
	MEET WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION (.7); PREPARE REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION TO ENFORCE THE AUTOMATIC STAY (5.2)				
03/05/04	Thompson, John	2.50	825.00	W330	11524291
	ATTENTION TO LAHTI-CAMBELL LIFT STAY AND LATE PROOF OF CLAIM MATTER (1.5); ATTENTION TO REVISED ORDER FOR CORD MOVING AND STORAGE (.5); CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/05/04	Sloane, Ann	1.50	232.50	W330	11498548
	RESEARCH REGARDING INDIVIDUAL ACTIONS OR CLAIMS AND DERIVATIVE ACTIONS OR CLAIMS AND SHAREHOLDERS IN STATES OF GEORGIA AND DELAWARE (.8) MANUAL RESEARCH IN LIBRARY ON THIS SUBJECT: DEFINITIONS OF, CHARACTERISTICS OF BOTH CASE LAW AND TREATISE MATERIALS (.7)				
03/08/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W330	11489854

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW CDI SETOFF STIPULATIONS (0.1); PHONE CALL TO J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (0.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM J. THOMPSON, S LOFTSPRING REGARDING RESOLUTION OF LAHTI AND CAMPBELL LIFT STAY MOTION (0.2)				
03/08/04	Dinos, Anthea	9.30	3,069.00	W330	11423459
	PREPARE REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION TO ENFORCE THE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
03/09/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W330	11516008
	REVIEW MOTION TO REINSTATE STAY WITH RESPECT TO SECURITIES LITIGATION DISCOVERY				
03/09/04	Dinos, Anthea	9.20	3,036.00	W330	11423461
	PREPARE REYNOLDS V. ALLEN MOTION TO ENFORCE THE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
03/09/04	Thompson, John	0.80	264.00	W330	11524035
	REVIEW LAHTI & CAMPBELL LATE CLAIM/LIFT STAY STIPULATION.				
03/10/04	Strochak, Adam	2.00	1,100.00	W330	11516435
	REVIEW DRAFT MOTION TO ENFORCE STAY WITH RESPECT TO REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE ACTION AND READ APPLICABLE CASE LAW (1.5); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. FELDERSTEIN (CALIFORNIA COUNSEL) REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF SETOFF DEMANDS (0.5)				
03/11/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W330	11516417
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM M. SHAIKEN (MORRISON STINSON) REGARDING SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP CLAIMS AND LIFT STAY APPLICATION				
03/11/04	Dinos, Anthea	6.10	2,013.00	W330	11437380
	REVISE REYNOLDS MOTION TO ENFORCE AUTOMATIC STAY.				
03/15/04	Thompson, John	0.20	66.00	W330	11523361
	ATTENTION TO SPECTRUM RESOURCES SETTLEMENT				
03/19/04	Dinos, Anthea	5.00	1,650.00	W330	11504276
	DRAFT REYNOLDS NOTICE OF HEARING (3.1); EDIT REYNOLDS MOTION TO ENFORCE AUTOMATIC STAY (1.5); CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING STATUS OF MOTIONS (.4)				
03/19/04	Thompson, John	0.30	99.00	W330	11523868
	TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH L. SOLOMON REGARDING CORD MOVING AND STORAGE SETTLEMENT.				
03/19/04	Riggs, Herbert	3.00	495.00	W330	11511505
	CITE CHECK AND REVIEW MOTION FOR AUTOMATIC STAY REGARDING REYNOLDS				
03/22/04	Thompson, John	0.90	297.00	W330	11523629
	ATTENTION TO CORD MOVING AND STORAGE MATTER				
03/23/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W330	11489663
	PHONE CALL FROM D. DRORI (DOJ) REGARDING MOTION TO ENFORCE AUTOMATIC STAY AS TO REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE LITIGATION (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. RHODES REGARDING IFN (.5)				
03/23/04	Rhodes, Jennifer	0.50	222.50	W330	11493338
	CALL WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING IFN				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/27/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT OBJECTION TO GRAYSON LIFT STAY MOTION	0.80	440.00	W330	11489626
03/31/04	Thompson, John TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. TRACHE REGARDING SPECTRUM RESOURCES	0.40	132.00	W330	11524123
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W330 - AUTOMATIC STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION:		74.40	\$ 26,602.00		
03/01/04	Goldring, Stuart PHONE CALL WITH G. BRAY OF MILBANK REGARDING CERBERUS CLAIMS (.5) AND WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (.4); PHONE CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.2) AND WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.2); MEETING WITH J. KELLER, T. BONIFACE AND R. CHAPPE OF KPMG AND M. HOENIG AND G. DEFRIES REGARDING EMEA INTERCOMPANY DEBT ISSUES (2.5); PHONE CALL WITH J. UFFNER OF STROOCK REGARDING 382(L)(5) QUALIFICATION NUMBERS (.4); FURTHER PHONE CALL WITH G. BRAY REGARDING CERBERUS CLAIMS AND EMAIL TO M. FRENCH, M. HOERNLEIN, M. GOLDSTEIN AND OTHERS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW/REVISE DRAFT EMAIL PREPARED BY M. HOERNLEIN TO BE SENT TO DTC REGARDING CHARTER RESTRICTION (.3); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO L. FIFE REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.2)	5.00	3,575.00	W400	11415624
03/01/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. COREN (COUNSEL TO SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP) REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF CLAIMS AND COUNTERCLAIMS (0.6); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING WELLS FARGO DISCOVERY (0.2)	0.80	440.00	W400	11489081
03/01/04	Baker, Sylvia BRIEF CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE AND GENERAL CLAIMS PROCEDURES.	0.10	51.50	W400	11419455
03/01/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH RMS AND G. JACOB AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATION WITH RMS (.3); REVISE THE DUN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND DUN & BRADSTREET'S ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME (.5); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH CDI'S ATTORNEY AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE CDI STIPULATION (.2).	1.40	581.00	W400	11422280
03/01/04	Friedman, Peter ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS	6.40	2,624.00	W400	11472340
03/01/04	Lyttle, Eric EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM	2.00	580.00	W400	11505976
03/01/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS OF ENTRY OF STIPULATIONS AND ORDERS, AND HEARING DATES ON REQUESTS FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES (.4); REVIEW DOCKET AND CALENDAR UPDATES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH I. LEEVE REGARDING STATUS OF 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH E. BOOTH REGARDING FINALIZING DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION AND PRESENTMENT (.5); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ AND B. UZE REGARDING SAME (.3); DRAFT NOTEHOLDER STIPULATION REGARDING DUPLICATIVE CLAIMS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF RESPONSE TO ATRS MOTION FOR RECONSIDERATION (.3) AND RESEARCH SAME (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH R. JACKSON REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF NOTEHOLDER CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING CISCO'S REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM AND REVIEW SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS (.5); RESEARCH SUBORDINATION ISSUES (.5).	5.00	1,625.00	W400	11401886
03/01/04	Watkins, Claire	0.90	297.00	W400	11436174

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTENTION TO BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION.				
03/01/04	Grogan, James	3.90	1,423.50	W400	11428150
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING WELLS FARGO AND ONVOY BILLING ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. LADOEN REGARDING ONVOY BILLING ISSUES (.3); REVIEW PROPOSED SETTLEMENT WITH WELLS FARGO (.3); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. NGUYEN REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE CALL LOG FROM CLAIMS HOTLINE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DEVINE REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH V. NGUYEN REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING OMNIBUS HEARING AND CASE CALENDAR (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS AND D. THOMAS REGARDING PUNITIVE DAMAGE CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. SANDERS REGARDING HEARING ON XEROX STIPULATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW SETTLEMENTS REGARDING VARIOUS PAY PHONE ISSUES (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MOORE REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/01/04	Devine, Kim	2.70	405.00	W400	11455978
	REVIEW AND FINALIZE TELEPHONE LOG FOR TRANSMITTAL TO V. NGUYEN (MCI) (2.5); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING LOG (.1); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.1).				
03/02/04	Strochak, Adam	4.00	2,200.00	W400	11518302
	REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN OPPOSITION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION ON SHEPHERD/GOLDFARB ERISA CLAIMS (3.5); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. COREN (SNUG COUNSEL) REGARDING MEDIATION OF CLAIMS (0.5)				
03/02/04	Billeck, Jason	0.70	290.50	W400	11422272
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH CDI'S COUNSEL AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE CDI STIPULATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH DETROIT AND SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S COUNSEL REGARDING THE DETROIT EDISON STIPULATION AND SOUTHERN EDISON STATUS (.2); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH MISSOURI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE WITHDRAWAL OF ITS SETOFF MOTION (.2).				
03/02/04	Friedman, Peter	4.80	1,968.00	W400	11473675
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO RELATED TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS				
03/02/04	Graham, Richard	0.70	259.00	W400	11447148
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH M. TOTH (MCI) AND SIMEONE (HERBERT'S COUNSEL) REGARDING HERBERT CLAIM AND INSURANCE COVERAGE THEREFOR (.1); SECOND CALL WITH M. TOTH REGARDING SAME (.2); CALL WITH S. HANTON (INSURANCE ADJUSTER) REGARDING SAME (.4).				
03/02/04	Lyttle, Eric	5.40	1,566.00	W400	11505666
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
03/02/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.50	1,462.50	W400	11411899
	CORRESPOND WITH R. JACKSON REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF NOTEHOLDERS' CLAIM OBJECTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. RICHTER REGARDING DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.3) AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FINALIZING SAME FOR PRESENTMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. ETKIN REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON ATRS MOTION (.3); REVIEW LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION AND CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING ENTRY OF AMENDED SUNTRUST STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF ATRS RESPONSE AND ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING (.2); RESEARCH RECONSIDERATION OF SUBORDINATED CLAIMS AND DRAFT RESPONSE TO ATRS MOTION (2.5).				
03/02/04	Watkins, Claire	2.10	693.00	W400	11436284
	ATTENTION TO BRIEF IN OPPOSITION OF CLASS CERTIFICATION.				
03/02/04	Grogan, James	8.40	3,066.00	W400	11427505

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. NGUYEN AND K. DEVINE REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. SANDERS REGARDING XEROX STIPULATION HEARING (.2); TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT HEARING ON XEROX STIPULATION (.6); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL, N. BEIZER, G. TEITELMAN AND C. MATHERS REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING PUNITIVE DAMAGE CLAIM ISSUES (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DAVIS, N. BEIZER AND G. TEITELMAN REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM ISSUES (1.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DAVIS REGARDING IMAGISTICS CONTRACTS (.4); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ, J. COAKLEY, E. SHAFFER AND S. KEYES REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ AND S. KEYES REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND SPREADSHEET REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM FROM G. TEITELMAN (.4); REVIEW LETTER FROM E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET CLAIM (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ, J. COAKLEY AND M. RAY REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING ISSUES PERTAINING TO IMAGISTICS CONTRACTS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. MOORE REGARDING SETTLEMENTS AND PAY PHONE ISSUES (.6); REVIEW SETTLEMENT REGARDING PAY PHONE ISSUES (.7); RESEARCH REGARDING FCC ORDERS PERTAINING TO PAY PHONE ISSUES (1.7); CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING STIPULATION WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.2); REVIEW PROOF OF CLAIM FILED BY TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS IN WIRELESS ONE CASE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ AND M. OWENS REGARDING SAME (.2).				
03/02/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.20	50.00	W400	11406850
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN ON RESEARCH ON SETOFF AND THE AUTOMATIC STAY FOR COUNTERCLAIM AGAINST ATN.				
03/02/04	Devine, Kim	0.40	60.00	W400	11455971
	TELEPHONE CALL TO L. NOWALSKY REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO J. RUBIN REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRY (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO J. COREY REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRY (.1); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.1).				
03/03/04	Strochak, Adam	2.20	1,210.00	W400	11518306
	PHONE CALLS TO/FROM R. SHEEDER (JENKINS & GILCHRIST) REGARDING SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB ERISA CLAIMS (0.5); REVIEW CONFIRMATION HEARING BRIEFS AND EXHIBITS IN PREPARATION FOR BRIEFING AND HEARING ON WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS OBJECTIONS (1.7)				
03/03/04	Baker, Sylvia	0.20	103.00	W400	11419467
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS PROCESS.				
03/03/04	Billeck, Jason	0.90	373.50	W400	11422585
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND G. JACOB REGARDING RMS'S OUTSTANDING BALANCE AND CLAIM (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND A. COSTA REGARDING NCR STIPULATION (.3); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH CDI'S ATTORNEY AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE CDI STIPULATION (.2).				
03/03/04	Friedman, Peter	6.80	2,788.00	W400	11473079
	REVIEW WELLS FARGO CLAIM ISSUES				
03/03/04	Graham, Richard	0.20	74.00	W400	11447113
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH C. MARCUS ABOUT HERBERT CLAIM AND INSURANCE COVERAGE THEREFOR.				
03/03/04	Lyttle, Eric	1.50	435.00	W400	11505670
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM (1.4); CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/03/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.70	552.50	W400	11411901

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. ETKIN AND K. DAVIS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON ATRS MOTION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. HOLMES REGARDING FINAL NETSOLVE STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. SERPE REGARDING STATUS OF LAW DEBENTURE STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING STATUS OF LAHTI LATE CLAIM MOTION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING CISCO ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM REQUEST (.2).				
03/03/04	Watkins, Claire	5.00	1,650.00	W400	11453959
	PREPARE FOR HEARING (1.0); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING QUITAM MOTION (.8); ATTENTION TO REVIEW OF GRAYSON'S MOTION (2.2); BEGIN RESEARCH (1.0)				
03/03/04	Grogan, James	4.00	1,460.00	W400	11428091
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. DAVIS REGARDING IMAGISTICS CONTRACTS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. MATHERS, J. DAVIS, G. TEITELMAN AND N. BEIZER REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM (1.2); REVIEW IMAGISTICS CLAIM AND OBJECTION TO PREPARE FOR SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING IMAGISTICS ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH L. TAYLOR REGARDING IMAGISTICS HEARING DATE (.2); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING STATUS OF WORLDCOM CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING CLAIM SUMMARIES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. MOORE REGARDING INTEREST CALCULATION ISSUES (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. RAY AND L. LASKOSKI REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET EQUIPMENT REQUESTS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS, S. BAKER, S. LOFTSPRING AND R. WELLS REGARDING CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION CONTACTS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. NORTON REGARDING STATUS OF LIEBERT CLAIMS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING STATUS OF LIEBERT CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH V. NGUYEN REGARDING CLAIMS HOTLINE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DEVINE REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/03/04	Lopez, Christopher	2.10	525.00	W400	11411135
	RESEARCH ON SETOFF UNDER SECTION 553 FOR J. GROGAN ON ATN CLAIM AGAINST WORLDCOM.				
03/03/04	Devine, Kim	0.80	120.00	W400	11514345
	DRAFT EMAIL TO V. NGUYEN REGARDING WGM RESPONSES TO VARIOUS CLAIMS INQUIRIES (.4); INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.4)				
03/04/04	Strochak, Adam	2.00	1,100.00	W400	11518315
	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MATERIALS FROM STATE OF ALABAMA REGARDING DISCHARGEABILITY OF SECURITIES RESTITUTION CLAIMS (1.5); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.5)				
03/04/04	Strochak, Adam	3.30	1,815.00	W400	11518313
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM L. FOSTER AND E. BANNIGAN (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING DISCOVERY AND HEARING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION (1.2); PREPARE SCHEDULING ORDER ON ABBOTT LITIGATION CLAIMS (0.5); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM B. BENJET (MCI) AND S. STRAUSS (SIMPSON THACHER) REGARDING SAME (0.3); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM M. SHAIKEN (STINSON MORRISON) REGARDING SHARED NETOWRK USERS GROUP CLAIMS (0.5); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM N. WESELY (SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB COUNSEL) REGARDING HEARING ON CLASS CERTIFICATION MOTION (0.3); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING RESOLUTION OF LAHTI AND CAMPBELL LATE CLAIM MOTION (0.5)				
03/04/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11433683
	TELEPHONE CALL D. CABRERA REGARDING IRVING COUNTY TAXES				
03/04/04	Lyttle, Eric	1.30	377.00	W400	11505701
	EDIT PRIVILEGE LOG REGRADING WELLS FARGO CLAIM (1.2); CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/04/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	5.10	1,657.50	W400	11418432

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. ETKIN REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING ON ATRS MOTION (.2) AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING RESETTING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME AND A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. SERPE REGARDING ENTRY OF LAW DEBENTURE STIPULATION (.3); REVIEW INTERNAL CLAIMS REVIEW LISTING (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); REVISE AGENDA (.2); CORRESPOND WITH L. FELD REGARDING STATUS OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION AND FINALIZE SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING STATUS OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING PRESENTMENT OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING UPCOMING HEARING ON LAHTI MOTIONS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. LOWRY REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING CISCO'S REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM, AND CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ AND M. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.7); REVISE NETSOLVE STIPULATION AND CORRESPOND WITH S. HOLMES REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. AGEE REGARDING ALLEGIANCE LATE CLAIM AND LANDOWNERS' ISSUES (.3); REVIEW LETTER FROM ALLEGIANCE REGARDING ASSERTION OF CLAIM (.2); REVIEW SUBORDINATION CASES (.5).				
03/04/04	Watkins, Claire	5.80	1,914.00	W400	11436292
	ATTENTION TO RESEARCH REGARDING GRAYSON'S QUI TAM MOTION.				
03/04/04	Taylor, David	1.20	348.00	W400	11519930
	SUMMARIZE PRODUCED DOCUMENTS AND FORWARD TO P. FRIEDMAN AND A. STROCHAK.				
03/04/04	Grogan, James	2.40	876.00	W400	11428063
	CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING 7TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.1); REVIEW EXHIBITS TO SAME PERTAINING TO STATUS OF LIEBERT CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. TAYLOR REGARDING HEARING ON IMAGISTICS CLAIM (.2); DRAFT AND REVISE NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT FOR SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH N. HELLER REGARDING ONVOY CLAIMS (.5); CORRESPOND WITH N. HELLER REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING PAY PHONE ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. MOORE REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING WIRELESS CLAIM SETTLEMENTS (.2).				
03/04/04	Devine, Kim	0.50	75.00	W400	11456275
	UPDATE FILE INDEX (.2); INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.3).				
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W400	11617782
	REVIEW MEMORANDUM FOR ALABAMA.				
03/05/04	Strochak, Adam	0.20	110.00	W400	11519734
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING VOCALL CLAIMS				
03/05/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W400	11519738
	E-MAIL TO J. DENNISTON (MCI) REGARDING HANDLING OF CLAIMS AT PUCS IN LIGHT IF DISCHARGE				
03/05/04	Strochak, Adam	1.20	660.00	W400	11519739
	REVIEW, REVISE AND FINALIZE SCHEDULING ORDER REGARDING ABBOTT LITIGATION CLAIMS (0.2); PHONE CALLS TO K. HULETT (ABBOTT COUNSEL) REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW REVOLVING CREDIT FACILITY LOAN AGREEMENT IN CONNECTION WITH OBJECTION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION (0.6)				
03/05/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11433818
	MISCELLANEOUS CREDITOR CALLS				
03/05/04	Friedman, Peter	3.40	1,394.00	W400	11473081
	ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS ISSUES				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/05/04	Graham, Richard TELEPHONE CALLS WITH G. TOTH ABOUT HERBERT CLAIM AND INSURANCE COVERAGE THEREFOR.	0.40	148.00	W400	11447114
03/05/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW AND SEND MEMORANDUM ON STATUS OF POSSIBLE RESTITUTION AND PENALTY CLAIMS OF ALABAMA.	0.40	148.00	W400	11447119
03/05/04	Loftspring, Sharon J TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING STATUS OF HEARING ON LAHTT'S MOTIONS (.3); REVIEW WILMINGTON TRUST NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING CISCO ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2).	0.70	227.50	W400	11418430
03/05/04	Watkins, Claire TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. WESELY REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER.	0.50	165.00	W400	11436345
03/05/04	Taylor, David CONTINUE REVIEW OF PRODUCED DOCUMENTS.	1.00	290.00	W400	11519420
03/05/04	Grogan, James CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING HELLER EHRMAN CLAIM OBJECTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.30	109.50	W400	11428067
03/05/04	Lopez, Christopher CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING RESEARCH ON TAX ISSUES FOR CLAIMS FILED BY TENNESSEE DEPT. OF REVENUE; CONNECTICUT DEPT. OF REVENUE; FLORIDA DEPT. OF REVENUE; AND COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS; AND VIRGINIA DEPT. OF TAXATION (.3); REVIEW CLAIMS FILED BY THE ABOVE MENTIONED CREDITORS (.8); PRELIMINARY CASE LAW RESEARCH ON TAX ISSUES RELATED TO PROOFS OF CLAIMS FILED BY THE ABOVE REFERENCE CREDITORS (1.0).	2.10	525.00	W400	11416968
03/06/04	Graham, Richard EMAIL C. MARCUS REGARDING HERBERT CLAIM AND INSURANCE COVERAGE THEREFOR.	0.20	74.00	W400	11447117
03/06/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW AND REPLY TO EMAIL OF WHITTAKER COUNSEL REGARDING DISCOVERY.	0.20	74.00	W400	11447817
03/06/04	Lopez, Christopher RESEARCH AND REVIEW CASE LAW ON TAX MATTERS IN CONNECTION WITH CLAIMS BY TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE	2.30	575.00	W400	11417639
03/07/04	Taylor, David ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO INTERMEDIA CLAIM (1.5); CONTINUE REVIEW OF PRODUCED DOCUMENTS (1.1)	2.60	754.00	W400	11521654
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING ERISA CLAIMS.	0.30	232.50	W400	11622843
03/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW REVISED ALABAMA BRIEF/MEMORANDUM.	1.00	775.00	W400	11618752
03/08/04	Strochak, Adam	5.60	3,080.00	W400	11489839

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW DRAFT BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF OBJECTION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (0.8); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING WELLS FARGO FRAUD CLAIM AND NEW YORK LAW ON OVERLAP WITH CONTRACT CLAIM (1.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. MARCUS, P. FRIEDMAN, C. PULLO REGARDING REVISIONS TO WELLS FARGO BRIEF (0.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH E. BANNIGAN AND L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING HEARING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIM OBJECTION AND EVIDENTIARY ISSUES (0.7); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM G. MITCHEL, N. WESELY (SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB COUNSEL), R. SCHEEDER (JENKENS & GILCHRIST), J. SPECTOR (MCI), C. WATKINS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF ARGUMENT ON SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB CLAIM CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, R. BERKOVICH REGARDING STATE OF ALABAMA CLAIMS AND SUBORDINATION ISSUES (0.5); LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING ALABAMA THREAT OF CRIMINAL LIABILITY AND EFFECT ON CLAIMS PROCESS (0.6); E-MAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
03/08/04	Fine, Lisa	6.20	2,542.00	W400	11515320
	RESEARCH REGARDING MANDATORY WITHDRAWAL OF REFERENCE TO BANKRUPTCY COURT (2.5); RESEARCH REGARDING TREATMENT OF PENALTIES ON STATE TAXES UNDER SECTION 507(A)(3)(3.7).				
03/08/04	Billeck, Jason	1.40	581.00	W400	11437616
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH G. MITCHEL AND THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE STATUS OF MISSOURI'S SETOFF MOTION (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK, G. MITCHEL AND CDI'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE CDI STIPULATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. COSTA REGARDING THE DRAFT NCR STIPULATION (.1); AND WORK ON THE NCR DRAFT STIPULATION (.8).				
03/08/04	Marcus, Christopher	7.00	2,975.00	W400	11420878
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK, P. FRIEDMAN AND C. PULLO REGARDING WELLS FARGO (.8) RESEARCH AND REVISE OBJECTION REGARDING SAME (3.0); RESEARCH REGARDING CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENTS (1.1) MET WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (1.1) DRAFT LETTER TO MELLON BANK REGARDING CONFIRMATION (.7)				
03/08/04	Friedman, Peter	3.70	1,517.00	W400	11473082
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS TO BE PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO RELATED TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS				
03/08/04	Graham, Richard	0.60	222.00	W400	11447821
	REVIEW ALABAMA REPLY MEMORANDUM ON ITS POSSIBLE RESTITUTION AND PENALTY CLAIMS.				
03/08/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.50	1,462.50	W400	11421029
	CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF LAHTI HEARING AND RESOLVING LATE CLAIM AND LIFT STAY ISSUES (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. LOWERY REGARDING SAME (.5); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF LAHTI HEARING (.2); PREPARE LAHTI STIPULATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. AGEE REGARDING ALLEGIANCE'S LATE CLAIM (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING CISCO'S REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.4); REVIEW CLAIM OBJECTION REPORTS PREPARED BY HURON AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH C. ADAMS REGARDING STATUS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.2); PREPARE RESPONSE TO LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (1.0).				
03/08/04	Watkins, Claire	8.60	2,838.00	W400	11436347
	ATTENTION TO RESEARCHING AND DRAFTING OPPOSITION TO GRAYSON'S QUI TAM MOTION.				
03/08/04	Grogan, James	0.60	219.00	W400	11430811
	REVIEW UPDATED CLAIM OBJECTION REPORTS FROM B. DAVIS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. SHAIKEN AND R. GRAHAM REGARDING MONIQUE GROSS CLAIMS (.3).				
03/08/04	Pullo, Christina	6.10	1,677.50	W400	11524601

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH C. MARCUS, A. STROCHAK AND P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING BRIEF FOR WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (.9); OUTLINE ARGUMENT FOR BRIEF REGARDING SAME (.8); REVISE WELLS FARGO BRIEF (2.5) RESEARCH "ECONOMIC LOSS"DOCTRINE FOR WELLS FARGO BRIEF (1.9)				
03/08/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.60	150.00	W400	11420610
	REVISE MODEL TO USE WHEN OBJECTING TO PROOF OF CLAIMS FOR J. GROGAN.				
03/08/04	Lopez, Christopher	4.80	1,200.00	W400	11420879
	RESEARCH ON TAX LAW ISSUES FOR CLAIMS FILED BY TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE (1.7); DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO J. GROGAN ANALYZING TAX LAW ISSUES AND CLAIMS FILED BY TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE (3.1)				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W400	11616152
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAILS REGARDING BANK OF AMERICA ISSUES.				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W400	11616419
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ERISA CLAIMS (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.70	1,317.50	W400	11616424
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING ALABAMA (.8) AND CONFERENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH REGARDING SAME AND REGARDING MEMORANDUM (.9)				
03/09/04	Strochak, Adam	2.80	1,540.00	W400	11516181
	REVIEW AND ANALYZE WELLS FARGO EXPERT REPORT ON CASH TRACING AND ACCOUNTING ISSUES (1.3); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM B. BENJET (MCI), L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS); C. MARCUS, P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING AND BRIEFING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION (1.5)				
03/09/04	Fine, Lisa	2.70	1,107.00	W400	11515337
	RESEARCH REGARDING MANDATORY WITHDRAWAL OF REFERENCE TO BANKRUPTCY COURT (1.9) CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING TREATMENT OF PENALTIES ON STATE TAXES UNDER 507(A) (.3); DRAFT E-MAIL MEMORANDUM REGARDING MANDATORY WITHDRAWAL OF REFERENCE (.5).				
03/09/04	Friedman, Peter	5.30	2,173.00	W400	11473061
	REVISE BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIM (2.1); REVIEW MATERIALS PRODUCED TO WELLS FARGO (2.4); REVIEW PRIVILEGE LOG (.8)				
03/09/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	2.40	780.00	W400	11426191
	CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. CHASTKA AND L. FELD REGARDING FILING OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION AND PRESENTMENT DATE (.4); REVISE LAHTI STIPULATION AND CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING SAME (.5); DRAFT OBJECTION TO LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING SAME (.3).				
03/09/04	Watkins, Claire	5.90	1,947.00	W400	11464346
	ATTENTION TO DRAFTING CLAIMS OBJECTION.				
03/09/04	Grogan, James	3.30	1,204.50	W400	11430413

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. RAY REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); REVISE EXHIBITS TO STIPULATION WITH MISSISSIPPI EDNET AND CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING NON-DEBTOR SUBSIDIARY CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BURNS REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH J. HOPKINS REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH G. TEITELMAN AND J. DAVIS REGARDING XEROX PROOFS OF CLAIM (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DAVIS AND G. TEITELMAN REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION ISSUES (.1); DRAFT CHART OF CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION ISSUES (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/09/04	Pullo, Christina	10.10	2,777.50	W400	11525246
	REVISE WELLS FARGO BRIEF				
03/09/04	Lopez, Christopher	5.00	1,250.00	W400	11423138
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE TAX CLAIMS (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN AND COUNSEL FOR COMPUSERVE REGARDING SAME (.3); DRAFT CHANGES TO MEMORANDUM TO J. GROGAN REGARDING ASSESSMENT OF TENNESSEE TAX CLAIMS (.5); REVIEW ADJUSTED TAX ASSESSMENT BY TENNESSEE DEPT. OF REVENUE IN LIGHT OF PRODIGY DECISION (.4); DRAFT OBJECTIONS TO PROOFS OF CLAIMS FILED BY CONNECTICUT DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE, MASSACHUSETTS DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE, VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF TAXATION AND FLORIDA DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE (3.6); CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W400	11622653
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET AND S. KELLY, ET AL. REGARDING CAUSES OF ACTION.				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W400	11622681
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING ERISA CLAIMS (.5) AND PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/10/04	Strochak, Adam	1.80	990.00	W400	11516433
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS (1.2); CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (0.6)				
03/10/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.00	670.00	W400	11458124
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH HOULIHAN AND MCI REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF CERTAIN CLAIMS BROUGHT BY A GOVERNMENTAL ENTITY				
03/10/04	Friedman, Peter	2.70	1,107.00	W400	11473678
	REVIEW SUMMARY OF TRIAL TESTIMONY PREPARED FOR N. GLUCKMAN RELATED TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (2.1) CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING BANK CLAIMS (.6)				
03/10/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.20	390.00	W400	11426192
	CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING OBJECTION DEADLINE FOR ATRS MOTION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ENTRY OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. BENJET REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY TAX CLAIM (.4); CORRESPOND WITH U. SOMMER REGARDING CISCO ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2).				
03/10/04	Watkins, Claire	3.70	1,221.00	W400	11464347
	ATTENTION TO OBJECTION REGARDING GRAYSON (1.2); RESEARCH WHETHER WELLS FARGO CAN BRING UNJUST ENRICHMENT CLAIM AGAINST INTERMEDIA (2.5)				
03/10/04	Grogan, James	1.20	438.00	W400	11430823

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER REGARDING WIRELESS CARRIER CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING COURT ORDERS RELATED TO SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING WESTERN WIRELESS CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW LETTER FROM ALLSTATE CELLULAR (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING DEEMED FILED CLAIMS (.1).				
03/10/04	Pullo, Christina REVISE WELLS FARGO BRIEF	1.50	412.50	W400	11525005
03/10/04	Lopez, Christopher REVIEW AND COMPARE TAX CLAIMS AND ADJUSTMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH CLAIMS ASSERTED BY TENNESSEE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE (.6); RESEARCH ON TAX LAW IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (.6).	1.20	300.00	W400	11428479
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia VOICEMAIL MESSAGE TO P. FERRILLO REGARDING ERISA CLAIMS.	0.10	77.50	W400	11620351
03/11/04	Strochak, Adam MEETING WITH B. BENJET, M. CHASTKA, M. BARRY (MCI), P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIMS AND HEARING ON OBJECTION (1.9); DRAFTING AND REVISING MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS AND PLAN OBJECTIONS (4.1); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. FELDERSTEIN (CALIFORNIA COUNSEL) REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF SETOFF DEMANDS (0.4) CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING ZINSMEISTER CLAIM (.3)	6.70	3,685.00	W400	11516300
03/11/04	Baker, Sylvia CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING MONITORING CLAIM OBJECTIONS, PREPARING REPORTS AND SIMILAR ISSUES REGARDING COORDINATION WITH CLIENT AND CO-COUNSEL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. VERMETTE AND J. GROGAN REGARDING GATHERING INFORMATION REGARDING LITIGATION CLAIMS (.2).	0.50	257.50	W400	11430897
03/11/04	Perez, Alfredo CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING TAX CLAIM	0.20	134.00	W400	11571588
03/11/04	Fine, Lisa RESEARCH REGARDING APPLICATION OF PENALTIES ON STATE TAX CLAIMS UNDER 507(A)(8)(1.7); DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING TREATMENT OF PENALTIES ON STATE TAX CLAIMS (.4).	2.10	861.00	W400	11515346
03/11/04	Marcus, Christopher TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING WELLS FARGO (.1) MET WITH C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.30	127.50	W400	11434302
03/11/04	Friedman, Peter PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH M. CHASTKA, M. BARRY AND B. BENJET REGARDING WELLS FARGO PROPOSED EXPERT TESTIMONY ON CLAIM (2.8); MEET WITH A. STROCHAK, B. BENJET, M. CHASTKA, AND M. BARRY IN PREPARATION FOR WF CLAIM (1.5); REVISE TRIAL BRIEF (4.2)	8.50	3,485.00	W400	11473648
03/11/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	5.00	1,625.00	W400	11430852

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING FINALIZING ERS STIPULATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH R. GARCES AND B. UZE REGARDING ENTRY OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES AND CALENDAR UPDATES (.4); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING PENDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND SANGAMON COUNTY MATTER (.8); REVISE OBJECTION TO LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH U. SOMMER AND S. CHONG REGARDING CISCO ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM AND REVIEW DOCUMENTATION REGARDING SAME (.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. HOLMES REGARDING NETSOLVE STIPULATION AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FINALIZING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING ENTRY OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION AND DUE DILIGENCE ON SANGAMON COUNTY TAX CLAIM (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH K. KNIGHT REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY TAX CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH V. CAUGHLIN REGARDING FORECLOSURE OF SANGAMON COUNTY TAX LIEN (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME AND REGARDING STIPULATION WITH WILMINGTON TRUST NOTEHOLDERS (.2); REVIEW OHIO TAXING AUTHORITY'S MOTION TO EXTEND BAR DATE AND CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE AND DOCUMENTS FROM K. KNIGHT REGARDING MINOOKA, ILLINOIS TAX ISSUE (.3).				
03/11/04	Thompson, John	0.90	297.00	W400	11524146
	TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH J. HARRINGTON OF JENNER AND BLOCK REGARDING ZINSMEISTER CLAIM AND THE MDL (.6); DISCUSSION WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/11/04	Grogan, James	1.20	438.00	W400	11430830
	CORRESPOND WITH J. DAVIS REGARDING IMAGISTICS CONTRACTS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH, B. BENJET AND S. MOONEY REGARDING VTE AND NORTH COMMUNICATIONS SETTLEMENTS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING REJECTION OF ALLSTATE CELLULAR CONTRACT (.6); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH AND J. KISKA REGARDING VTE AND NORTH TELECOMMUNICATIONS SETTLEMENTS (.2).				
03/11/04	Pullo, Christina	0.80	220.00	W400	11524478
	REVISE WELLS FARGO BRIEF				
03/12/04	Strochak, Adam	9.00	4,950.00	W400	11489596
	DRAFTING AND REVISING MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN OPPOSITION TO WELLS FARGO PLAN OBJECTION AND IN SUPPORT OF CLAIMS OBJECTION (6.5); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM P. FRIEDMAN, C. PULLO, C. MARCUS, B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SAME (2.5)				
03/12/04	Baker, Sylvia	1.10	566.50	W400	11452763
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING VARIOUS CLAIM OBJECTIONS IN PROCESS, INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO TAX CLAIMS AND INCLUDING BRIEF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SALZBURG REGARDING TAX CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.8); REVIEW, RESPOND TO AND DRAFT EMAILS REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION PROCESS (.3).				
03/12/04	Marcus, Christopher	1.10	467.50	W400	11434315
	REVISE WELLS FARGO OBJECTION				
03/12/04	Friedman, Peter	6.50	2,665.00	W400	11473651
	REVISE TRIAL BRIEF FOR WELLS FARGO CLAIM HEARING				
03/12/04	Graham, Richard	0.20	74.00	W400	11447820
	REVIEW AND REPLY TO EMAIL OF A. PEREZ REGARDING WHITTAKER CLAIM DISCOVERY.				
03/12/04	Graham, Richard	0.30	111.00	W400	11447822
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS WORLDCOM LITIGATION.				
03/12/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.10	357.50	W400	11430858

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH M. HARMON REGARDING MINOOKA, ILLINOIS TAX ISSUE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. CHONG REGARDING CISCO ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY TAX ISSUES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH V. CAUGHLIN REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SUMMARY REPORT OF PENDING LITIGATION CLAIMS (.3).				
03/12/04	Grogan, James	1.40	511.00	W400	11430833
	CORRESPOND WITH T. MEINKEN REGARDING VTE AND NORTH TELECOMMUNICATIONS SETTLEMENTS (.1); REVISE MOEN CLAIM OBJECTION AND CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.7); CONFER WITH S. BAKER REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIM ISSUES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING DISTRIBUTION ISSUES (.2).				
03/12/04	Pullo, Christina	6.30	1,732.50	W400	11525544
	REVISE WELLS FARGO BRIEF REGARDING 524(E) AND THIRD PARTY RELEASE SECTION				
03/14/04	Strochak, Adam	10.30	5,665.00	W400	11489233
	DRAFTING AND REVISING MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF OBJECTION TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS AND IN OPPOSITION TO PLAN OBJECTION (9.2); PHONE CALLS, E-MAILS, AND CONFERENCES WITH P. FRIEDMAN, C. MARCUS REGARDING SAME (1.1)				
03/14/04	Billeck, Jason	1.30	539.50	W400	11437624
	WORK ON REVISIONS TO TXU STIPULATION REGARDING CONTRACT ASSUMPTION (1.2) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/14/04	Marcus, Christopher	1.00	425.00	W400	11434318
	DRAFT RIDER TO WELLS OBJECTION (.7) REVIEW OBJECTION (.3)				
03/14/04	Friedman, Peter	3.40	1,394.00	W400	11472115
	ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO CLAIM				
03/15/04	Strochak, Adam	11.60	6,380.00	W400	11489591
	REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE MEMORANDUM OF LAW ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION AND PLAN OBJECTION (8.3); CONFERENCES WITH P. FRIEDMAN, M. REIFMAN REGARDING SAME (0.4); PHONE CALL FROM L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING SAME (0.2); PREPARATION FOR DEPOSITION OF N. GLUCKMAN (WELLS FARGO ACCOUNTING EXPERT) (2.3); E-MAIL TO P. FRIEDMAN, J. GUERRERA, C. WATKINS REGARDING ABBOTT LITIGATION CLAIMS AND PREPARATION OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (0.3); PHONE CALL FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING STATE OF CALIFORNIA CLAIMS AND RESOLUTION OF SETOFF ISSUES (0.1)				
03/15/04	Billeck, Jason	1.00	415.00	W400	11456193
	RECEIVE AND REVIEW SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S SETTLEMENT OFFER (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS REGARDING SAME (.1); WORK ON DRAFT STIPULATION WITH TXU ENERGY (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. SCHNEIDER AND TXU REGARDING SAME (.2); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH CYPRESS'S COUNSEL REGARDING ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ANSWER TO THE DEBTORS' ADVERSARY COMPLAINT (.1).				
03/15/04	Friedman, Peter	1.10	451.00	W400	11473656
	REVIEW FILES RELATED TO "ABBOTT" APPEAL				
03/15/04	Friedman, Peter	7.70	3,157.00	W400	11472108
	REVISE AND EDIT BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS				
03/15/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.10	357.50	W400	11434992

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH V. CAUGHLIN REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY TAX SALE (.4); CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING SERVICE OF BAR DATE NOTICE ON SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. HARMON REGARDING MINOOKA, ILLINOIS TAX CLAIM (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. ABRAHAMS REGARDING STATUS OF LEASE CLAIM (.2).				
03/15/04	Watkins, Claire	4.20	1,386.00	W400	11464361
	[GRAYSON] ATTENTION TO DRAFTING NOTICE AND ORDER (2.1); [ABBOTT] ATTENTION TO REVIEW OF MATERIALS (2.1)				
03/15/04	Taylor, David	1.10	319.00	W400	11519544
	(WELLS FARGO CLAIM) COMPLETE COLLECTING RELEVANT PRODUCED DOCUMENTS AT REQUEST OF P. FRIEDMAN.				
03/16/04	Jacoby, Mark	2.30	1,426.00	W400	11518558
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM H. RUMELD REGARDING SHARON DIXON 3/15 LETTER (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GRAHAM REGARDING RESEARCH ON SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS (.4); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SUBORDINATION ISSUE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION (0.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING MEDIATION (.3); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH P. GRUENBERGER REGARDING ETHICS ISSUE IN WITHDRAWAL OF COUNSEL (.5)				
03/16/04	Strochak, Adam	9.00	4,950.00	W400	11489587
	PREPARE FOR (2.7) AND TAKE (3.9) DEPOSITION OF N. GLUCKMAN (WELLS FARGO ACCOUNTING EXPERT) IN CONNECTION WITH HEARING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS; MEETING WITH E. BANNIGAN AND L. FOSTER (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING HEARING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (0.6); REVIEW AND ANALYZE WELLS FARGO BRIEF (1.2); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM P. FRIEDMAN, C. MARCUS REGARDING SAME (0.6)				
03/16/04	Cohen, Scott	1.30	520.00	W400	11451286
	DRAFT LITIGATION LETTER (.9) INCLUDING DISCUSSION WITH B. BENJET & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.4)				
03/16/04	Friedman, Peter	5.10	2,091.00	W400	11472110
	ATTENTION TO WELLS FARGO OBJECTIONS				
03/16/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W400	11446972
	REVIEW MOTION BY OHIO FOR EXTENDED BAR DATE AND E-MAIL TO A. PEREZ AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME.				
03/16/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W400	11446973
	REVIEW LETTER TO ATTORNEY OF D. MEYERS FOR REFERENCES TO BANKRUPTCY CODE AT REQUEST OF V. JOHNSON.				
03/16/04	Graham, Richard	0.50	185.00	W400	11447823
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY REGARDING SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNITY CLAIMS IN ERISA CLASS ACTION (.4); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM HIM ON SAME (.1).				
03/17/04	Strochak, Adam	0.60	330.00	W400	11489606
	PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. COHEN REGARDING PREPARATION OF FORM LETTER IN CONNECTION WITH NON-BANKRUPTCY LITIGATION CLAIMS DISCHARGED UNDER PLAN (0.5); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LETTER (0.1)				
03/17/04	Strochak, Adam	1.60	880.00	W400	11489608
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM C. MARCUS, P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIM OBJECTION				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/17/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING RMS SETTLEMENT TALKS.	0.30	124.50	W400	11456173
03/17/04	Marcus, Christopher TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING WELLS FARGO (.1) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING KPMG MOTION (.4)	0.50	212.50	W400	11444556
03/17/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING JURISDICTION LETTER	0.50	200.00	W400	11450512
03/17/04	Friedman, Peter PREPARE TRIAL EXHIBITS FOR WELLS FARGO CLAIM (2.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR ADMISSIBILITY AT TRIAL OF WELLS FARGO CLAIM (2.4); CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING STIPULATIONS FOR TRIAL (1.1); CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING TRIAL (.5); REVIEW BRIEF OF WELLS FARGO IN ANTICIPATION OF TRIAL (2.7)	8.90	3,649.00	W400	11473647
03/17/04	Watkins, Claire [GRAYSON] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. ADAMS REGRADING GRAYSON OBJECTION.	1.10	363.00	W400	11464274
03/17/04	Taylor, David CHECK ON STATUS OF APPLICATION TO ASSIGN LICENSES TO NORTHWEST PIPELINE.	0.40	116.00	W400	11521687
03/18/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT STIPULATIONS WITH WELLS FARGO BANK REGARDING EVIDENTIARY MATTERS FOR HEARING ON CLAIMS OBJECTION (0.6); E-MAILS TO/FROM L. FOSTER (WELLS FARGO) REGARDING SAME (0.1)	0.70	385.00	W400	11489610
03/18/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND ANALYZE WELLS FARGO TRIAL BRIEF IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON CLAIMS OBJECTION	2.30	1,265.00	W400	11489679
03/18/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. BENJET & RELATED ATTENTION TO LITIGATION MATTER	0.30	120.00	W400	11450519
03/18/04	Friedman, Peter WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIM: CORRESPOND WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING EVIDENTIARY OBJECTIONS TO USE OF DOCUMENTS AT HEARING (1.1); REVIEW PROPOSED EXHIBITS FOR ADMISSIBILITY (2.1); REVIEW WELLS FARGO BRIEF (1.1); PREPARE OUTLINE FOR CHASTKA DIRECT TESTIMONY (1.1); REVIEW CHASTKA DEPOSITION (1.4).	6.80	2,788.00	W400	11472105
03/18/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE W/ATTORNEY FOR GOLDMAN SACHS (C. GOLDSTEIN) REGARDING PROSECUTION OF CLAIM OF GOLDMAN SACHS.	0.10	37.00	W400	11533507
03/18/04	Lyttle, Eric RESEARCH INVOCATION OF FIFTH AMENDMENT PRIVILEGE BY NON-PARTY WITNESS AND NEGATIVE INFERENCES THEREBY TAKEN.	3.20	928.00	W400	11511294
03/18/04	Sloane, Ann LOCATE AND ACQUIRE COPIES OF SAB 31 & 40 AND ALSO EITF ABSTRACT 85-1 (.5) LOCATE AND ACQUIRE MULTIPLE CASES CITED IN A BRIEF FOR ADAM STROCHAK (.5)	1.00	155.00	W400	11498740
03/19/04	Strochak, Adam	3.60	1,980.00	W400	11489675

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MEETING WITH M. CHASTKA (MCI), P. FRIEDMAN TO PREPARE FOR TRIAL ON OBJECTION TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS (2.9); CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. BYNUM (MCI) AND D. HANDZO (JENNER) REGARDING MISSISSIPPI POWER CLAIMS FOR INDEMNIFICATION (0.7)				
03/19/04	Strochak, Adam	4.30	2,365.00	W400	11489674
	REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE MOTION TO ENFORCE AUTOMATIC STAY REGARDING REYNOLDS DERIVATIVE CLAIMS (3.7); CONFERENCES WITH A. DINOS (.3), M. REIFMAN (.3) REGARDING SAME				
03/19/04	Friedman, Peter	11.40	4,674.00	W400	11472103
	MEET WITH M. CHASTKA AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING WELLS FARGO CLAIM (2.9) REVIEW DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF N. GLUCKMAN (1.6) COORDINATE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING TRIAL EXHIBITS (.4) PREPARE OUTLINE OF TESTIMONY FOR M. CHASTKA (5.5) PREPARE FOR WELLS FARGO HEARING ON CLAIM (.7)				
03/19/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.60	520.00	W400	11451842
	CORRESPOND WITH B. ABRAHAMS, S. COHEN AND L. MCCOY REGARDING LEASE INQUIRY (.5); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING OHIO TAXING AUTHORITY MOTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS AND S. BAKER REGARDING STATUS OF LATE CLAIM MOTIONS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY'S NOTICE OF BAR DATE (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. KNIGHT REGARDING CONNECTICUT PROPERTY TAX CLAIM (.2).				
03/19/04	Watkins, Claire	0.40	132.00	W400	11464267
	[GRAYSON] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. PIERCE AND J. MCMILLAN REGARDING EXTENSION OF OUR OBJECTION.				
03/19/04	Taylor, David	0.80	232.00	W400	11519511
	DISCUSS APPLICATION STATUS WITH FCC ATTORNEY AND FORWARD UPDATE TO OPPOSING COUNSEL (.4); COORDINATE ANTENNA STRUCTURE PROCESS BETWEEN PARTIES (.4)				
03/21/04	Strochak, Adam	7.80	4,290.00	W400	11489637
	PREPARE CROSS-EXAMINATIONS OF S. MOLDOFF AND N. GLUCKMAN IN CONNECTION WITH TRIAL OF OBJECTION TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS (4.2); MEETINGS AND PHONE CALLS WITH P. FRIEDMAN, C. MARCUS REGARDING PREPARATION FOR WELLS FARGO HEARING (2.1); PREPARATION OF OPENING ARGUMENT AND EVIDENTIARY OBJECTIONS (1.5)				
03/21/04	Marcus, Christopher	4.30	1,827.50	W400	11453555
	PREPARATION FOR WELLS FARGO HEARING				
03/21/04	Friedman, Peter	5.20	2,132.00	W400	11473645
	PREPARE FOR TRIAL ON WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS				
03/21/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.40	148.00	W400	11533182
	CONFERENCES WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING ARGUMENTS AGAINST WELLS FARGO.				
03/22/04	Strochak, Adam	10.80	5,940.00	W400	11489633
	PREPARE FOR (2.5) AND PARTICIPATE IN TRIAL ON OBJECTION TO WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS (8.3)				
03/22/04	Baker, Sylvia	1.20	618.00	W400	11455557
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. FISHER, J. SMITH, G. MCMORRIS, E. DAVIS, E FAMATID AND J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS PROCESS AND PLANNING (.6); CONFERENCES WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING VARIOUS CLAIMS ISSUES (.3); REVIEW, RESPOND TO AND DRAFT EMAILS REGARDING CLAIMS (.3).				
03/22/04	Marcus, Christopher	10.60	4,505.00	W400	11454671

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARATION FOR WELLS FARGO HEARING (2.4) ATTEND HEARING (7.9) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE S GOLDRING REGARDING PLAN OF REORG (.3)				
03/22/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CLAIMS	0.20	80.00	W400	11465041
03/22/04	Friedman, Peter ATTEND TRIAL ON WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS	10.30	4,223.00	W400	11473644
03/22/04	Graham, Richard RESEARCH MANDATORY SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS BASED ON SECURITY FRAUD LITIGATION.	0.30	111.00	W400	11531517
03/22/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (.2); REVIEW REVISED BUSINESS OWNER MATRIX (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING LAHTI STIPULATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH V. CAUGHLIN REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY'S BAR DATE NOTICE (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING DOUGLAS COUNTY CLAIM OBJECTION (.2).	1.30	422.50	W400	11454331
03/22/04	Watkins, Claire [GRAYSON] PREPARE FOR (.3) AND CONDUCT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCMILLAN REGARDING MERITS OF GRAYSON MATTER (.8)	1.10	363.00	W400	11483557
03/22/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. RAY REGARDING SAME (.2); ATTEND TO CLAIMS FILED BY NEW YORK DEPARTMENT OF LABOR (.5); CORRESPOND WITH A. MCELMEEL, B. BENJET AND S. MOONEY REGARDING VARIOUS CLAIM STIPULATIONS (.4); CORRESPOND WITH J. SMITH AND S. BAKER REGARDING CLAIM ADMINISTRATION GROUP (.1); PREPARE AND REVISE CHART OF ALL CLAIM OBJECTIONS AND PROCEEDINGS RELATED TO LITIGATION MATTERS, REVIEW PLEADINGS AND THE CASE DOCKET FOR SAME (5.8); CONFER WITH J. HOPKINS AND S. BAKER REGARDING DIGEX CLAIMS (.6); CORRESPOND WITH J. SMITH AND S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING WIRELESS VENDOR CLAIM SETTLEMENTS (.2).	8.20	2,993.00	W400	11465668
03/23/04	Baker, Sylvia BRIEF DISCUSSION WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS.	0.10	51.50	W400	11495582
03/23/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH K. CALDWELL, M. LAWLESS, AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING THE CDI STIPULATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS, J. GROGAN, AND SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S ATTORNEY REGARDING SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S SETTLEMENT OFFER (.7); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH RMS AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING RMS'S SETTLEMENT OFFER (.2).	1.20	498.00	W400	11476451
03/23/04	Marcus, Christopher ATTN TO WELLS FARGO CLAIMS	0.30	127.50	W400	11461836
03/23/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW EXHIBITS AND CASES CITED BY OPPOSING SIDE IN WELLS FARGO TRIAL	2.10	861.00	W400	11473085
03/23/04	Berkovich, Ronit CONFERENCE WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING HEARING ON WELLS FARGO CLAIM.	0.20	74.00	W400	11533189
03/23/04	Graham, Richard	2.90	1,073.00	W400	11531470

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	RESEARCH MANDATORY SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS BASED ON SECURITY FRAUD LITIGATION.				
03/23/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.70	227.50	W400	11571594
	REVIEW DOUGLAS COUNTY'S RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION AND MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CLAIMS OBJECTION				
03/23/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W400	11472595
	CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING PROOFS OF CLAIM AND RIGHTS OF SETOFF				
03/23/04	Grogan, James	11.20	4,088.00	W400	11466380
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. RAY REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); REVISE STIPULATION AND EXHIBITS REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET CLAIMS (.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. SCHAFFER REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH V. JOHNSON, A. STROCHAK, T. TSEKERIDES AND S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING OBJECTION TO LITIGATION CLAIMS (.4); REVISE CHART SUMMARIZING SAME (2.7); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.4); DRAFT AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE REGARDING CLAIMS ISSUES (3.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING ACOSTA MOTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH C. BAILEY REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. BAILEY REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW ACOSTA MOTION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. FISHER AND J. SMITH REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. TROFIMUK REGARDING QWEST CLAIMS (.2); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON SETTLEMENT (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. BILLECK AND P. REYNOLDS REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF WIRELESS VENDOR CLAIMS (.1).				
03/24/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.40	248.00	W400	11518378
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH JUDGE DOLINGER REGARDING ERISA BOND CLAIM.				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W400	11631565
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. MARCUS, A. STROCHAK REGARDING WELLS FARGO BANK (.3)				
03/24/04	Strochak, Adam	0.50	275.00	W400	11489644
	PHONE CALL FROM E. BANNIGAN (MORGAN LEWIS) REGARDING WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS (0.4); E-MAIL TO B. BENJET (MC1) REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
03/24/04	Perez, Alfredo	6.50	4,355.00	W400	11469922
	MEETING WITH P. ESKILDSEN, B. BENJET AND M. DELDUCA REGARDING REVIEW OF CLAIMS AND CLAIM PROCESS				
03/24/04	Marcus, Christopher	1.00	425.00	W400	11464770
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING WELLS FARGO (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.3) MET WITH C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. EVERETT REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/24/04	Johnson, Virginia	0.30	99.00	W400	11460006
	CONFER WITH R. GRAHAM REGARDING SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS.				
03/24/04	Graham, Richard	10.50	3,885.00	W400	11531555
	RESEARCH MANDATORY SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS BASED ON SECURITY FRAUD LITIGATION (7.2); CONSTRUCT MEMORANDUM ABOUT SAME (3.0) CONFER WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.3)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/24/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING PROPERTY TAX ISSUES (.2); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING MDIP INQUIRY (.1); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING FINALIZING LAHTI STIPULATION AND CORRESPOND WITH J. LOWRY REGARDING SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING STATUS OF ERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. MATTINGLY REGARDING MINOOKA, ILLINOIS TAX ISSUE (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2).	1.40	455.00	W400	11461103
03/24/04	Watkins, Claire REVIEW J. GOLDFARB BRIEF FOR HEARING.	0.60	198.00	W400	11483085
03/24/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCCARROLL REGARDING DISSENTING BONDHOLDER COMMITTEE CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. BAILEY REGARDING ACOSTA MOTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. SHAIKEN REGARDING ACOSTA MOTION (.6); PREPARE DOCUMENTS RELATED TO SAME FOR M. SHAIKEN AND DRAFT LETTER TO M. SHAIKEN (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS AND P. ANDERSON REGARDING ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE CLAIMS (1.3); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE (.5); DRAFT AND REVISE SAME (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE STIPULATION (1.5); CORRESPOND WITH L. PROTOPAPAS AND S. MOONEY REGARDING SAME (4.); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. WHITE REGARDING CASE STATUS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. DAVIS REGARDING IMAGISTICS MOTION AND PROOF OF CLAIM (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. TAYLOR REGARDING SAME (.4); DRAFT LETTER TO L. TAYLOR REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW CLIENT CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING PENDING MOTIONS AND MATTERS SET FOR HEARING (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. ALBAUGH REGARDING HSBC CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BEVILLE REGARDING AD HOC TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JACKSON REGARDING MCI NOTEHOLDERS COMMITTEE CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. PALMER REGARDING MATLIN PATTERSON CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. SIEGEL REGARDING PLATINUM PARTNERS CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER AND G. TEITELMAN REGARDING J. GUECK INVOICE FOR XEROX MEDIATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING CURE PAYMENT ISSUES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. LARSON AND A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIM ADMINISTRATION AND CURE PAYMENTS (.3).	14.30	5,219.50	W400	11466384
03/25/04	Strochak, Adam PREPARE FOR HEARING ON OBJECTION TO SHEPHERD AND J. GOLDFARB CLAIMS REGARDING CLASS CERTIFICATION ISSUES (2.5); PARTICIPATE IN HEARING AND ARGUE OBJECTION TO CLASS CERTIFICATION OF SHEPHERD AND GOLDFARB ERISA CLAIMS (1.3); PHONE CALLS TO R. SHEEDER (JENKENS & GILCHRIST) AND J. SPECTOR (MCI) REGARDING SHEPHERD & GOLDFARB CLAIMS (0.6)	4.40	2,420.00	W400	11489639
03/25/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW CLAIMS ISSUES FOR IMPLEMENTATION POST-EMERGENCE WITH B. BENJET AND M. DELDUCA	5.00	3,350.00	W400	11469861
03/25/04	Billeck, Jason RECEIVE AND REVIEW RMS'S SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS, R. LOVE, AND D. BABIONE REGARDING SAME (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS, G. MITCHEL, AND L. HOWARD REGARDING BT CONCERTS SETOFF (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH TXU'S ATTORNEY AND M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING THE DRAFT TXU STIPULATION (.5); REVISE THE DRAFT TXU STIPULATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH K. CALDWELL AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE CDI STIPULATION (.2); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE HEARING DATE ON SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S MOTION (.1).	1.80	747.00	W400	11476452
03/25/04	Cohen, Scott MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CLAIMS	0.40	160.00	W400	11465048
03/25/04	Graham, Richard	2.50	925.00	W400	11531485

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	RESEARCH MANDATORY SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS BASED ON SECURITY FRAUD LITIGATION (2.0); CONSTRUCT MEMORANDUM ABOUT SAME (.5)				
03/25/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.20	390.00	W400	11475463
	CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF 8TH AND 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTIONS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING CISCO'S REQUEST FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. MATTINGLY REGARDING MINOOKA COUNTY TAX ISSUE (.3) AND CONFER WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2).				
03/25/04	Watkins, Claire	2.80	924.00	W400	11483086
	ATTEND HEARING WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SHEPERD (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING MATTER (.4); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. RHODES REGARDING HISTORY OF CASE (.4)				
03/25/04	Grogan, James	8.40	3,066.00	W400	11470400
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. TAYLOR REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM (.4); CORRESPOND WITH L. TAYLOR REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER TO IMAGISTICS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH G. TEITELMAN, J. DAVIS AND N. BEIZER REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH IMAGISTICS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING QWEST CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. TROFIMUK REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER AND B. DAVIS REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. EFROYMSON REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION AND EXHIBITS AND CONTRACT RELATED TO SAME (.9); CORRESPOND WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING DOCUMENTS RELATED TO INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION (.1); REVIEW CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES PREPARED BY B. DAVIS AND EDIT SAME (.4); REVISE CHART REGARDING LITIGATION CLAIMS AND CORRESPOND WITH G. MITCHEL, S. BAKER AND J. THOMPSON REGARDING SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SMITH REGARDING DIGEX CLAIMS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SUMMARY OF WORLDCOM CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.8); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER AND G. TEITELMAN REGARDING XEROX MEDIATION EXPENSES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH C. MORICE AND S. MOONEY REGARDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HOULIHAN LOKEY REGARDING SETTLEMENTS (.2); RESEARCH PERTAINING TO THE MOTION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM FILED BY INDY RACING LEAGUE (2.0); REVIEW NOTICE OF HEARING ON SAME (.1).				
03/26/04	Friedman, Peter	2.50	1,025.00	W400	11472726
	REVIEW BRIEF FILED BY WELLS FARGO POST-TRIAL RELATED TO STANDING ISSUES				
03/26/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.20	65.00	W400	11475465
	CORRESPOND WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING CISCO'S ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE CLAIM				
03/26/04	Watkins, Claire	2.30	759.00	W400	11483088
	REVIEW COMPLAINT AND RELATED MATERIALS REGARDING ABBOTT				
03/26/04	Grogan, James	4.40	1,606.00	W400	11471485
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BAKER REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING OBJECTION TO CLAIMS RELATED TO LITIGATION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL AND S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.6); REVISE CHART PERTAINING TO SAME (1.6); REVIEW REVISIONS TO LITIGATION CLAIM OBJECTION CHART PREPARED BY J. THOMPSON AND A. STROCHAK (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. VERMETTE REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. SHAIKEN REGARDING LATE CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIM RECONCILIATION GROUP AGENDA AND CLAIM ISSUES (.5); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. BEACH REGARDING VARIOUS WIRELESS CARRIER SETTLEMENTS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. JACOBS REGARDING SETTLEMENT WITH STATE OF INDIANA (.2).				
03/28/04	Baker, Sylvia	1.10	566.50	W400	11493837

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW CLAIM REPORTS GENERATED BY HURON AND PROVIDE COMMENTS AS TO FORM.				
03/29/04	Strochak, Adam	0.10	55.00	W400	11490875
	CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING ABBOTT LITIGATION CLAIMS AND PREPARATION OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION				
03/29/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W400	11527394
	CORRESPONDENCE S. POHL REGARDING DISTRIBUTORS & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
03/29/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.90	617.50	W400	11475471
	REVIEW CLAIMS SUMMARY FROM HURON (.5); CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. DOUCETTE REGARDING CISCO'S ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM AND SEND BILL OF SALE (.4); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING OBJECTION TO LOWE ENTERPRISE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (.2); REVISE NOTEHOLDERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. LOWRY REGARDING LAHTI STIPULATION (.2);				
03/29/04	Watkins, Claire	6.30	2,079.00	W400	11483091
	[GRAYSON] ATTENTION TO OBJECTION.				
03/29/04	Grogan, James	2.70	985.50	W400	11505044
	CORRESPOND WITH E. SHAFFER, M. RAY AND E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING SAME (.1); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. FISHER, J. SMITH AND M. LARSON REGARDING CLAIM RECONCILIATION GROUP ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW CASES RELATED TO INDY RACING LEAGUE MOTION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING XEROX PROOF OF CLAIM (.2); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER AND G. TEITELMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW VARIOUS LETTERS AND SETTLEMENT OFFERS PERTAINING TO ALLSTATE CELLULAR OF SAN DIEGO CLAIM (.9).				
03/30/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W400	11488959
	PHONE CALLS TO/FROM M. SUTTER (OHIO ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE) REGARDING OHIO MOTION FOR LEAVE TO FILE LATE CLAIM				
03/30/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W400	11488965
	PHONE CALLS FROM D. DORMONT (SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP COUNSEL) REGARDING SCHEDULING OF MOTION FOR ABSTENTION				
03/30/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W400	11516907
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND S. NEWELL REGARDING PAYMENT TO BLOCKBUSTER				
03/30/04	Billeck, Jason	1.70	705.50	W400	11509077
	PREPARE FOR CALL WITH M. LAWLESS, D. BABIONE, AND R. LOVE REGARDING DBRMS'S SETTLEMENT OFFER (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND D. BABIONE REGARDING DBRMS'S SETTLEMENT OFFER (.6); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE WEATHER CHANNEL'S SETOFF CLAIM (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S ATTORNEY AND P. REYNOLDS REGARDING SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S MOTION FOR SETOFF (.2); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH THE CREDITORS' COMMITTEE'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE CDI STIPULATION (.3).				
03/30/04	Friedman, Peter	1.40	574.00	W400	11482414
	REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO ABBOTT CLAIM				
03/30/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.40	455.00	W400	11479903

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING OBJECTION TO LOWE'S LATE CLAIM MOTION (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. FISHER REGARDING REVISIONS TO CLAIMS SUMMARY (.3); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF ATRS MOTION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING STATUS OF LAHTI AND LOWE RESPONSES AND UPCOMING HEARINGS (.3).				
03/30/04	Grogan, James	5.40	1,971.00	W400	11502847
	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BEACH, D. THOMAS AND M. PANASUK REGARDING ALLSTATE CELLULAR CLAIM (.5); REVIEW LETTER FROM M. ELIOPULOS REGARDING SETTLEMENT OFFER ON SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. ABOD, D. MARCO AND D. THOMAS REGARDING SAME (.4); RESEARCH REGARDING VARIOUS LEGAL ISSUES PRESENTED IN THE ALLSTATE CELLULAR CLAIM (1.7); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. MCLEMORE AND CONTRACT PERTAINING TO ALLSTATE CELLULAR CLAIM (1.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK AND R. JOHNSON REGARDING SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON CLAIM (.2); REVIEW LIQUIDATED DAMAGES RESEARCH PERTAINING TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON CLAIM (.3); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIM (.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM V. CULVER REGARDING AUDIT OF PT CABLE CLAIM (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. KETROW, G. TEITELMAN AND N. BEIZER REGARDING AUDIT OF XEROX CLAIMS (.2).				
03/31/04	Hickerson, David	2.50	1,450.00	W400	11492074
	REVIEW BACKGROUND MATERIALS (2.0); CONFER WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING STRATEGY (0.5).				
03/31/04	Strochak, Adam	0.60	330.00	W400	11490033
	PHONE CALL TO D. HANDZO (JENNER) REGARDING RIGHT OF WAY CLAIM SETTLEMENT ISSUES (0.3); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM C. WATKINS REGARDING AUDIOFAX SETTLEMENT (0.3)				
03/31/04	Friedman, Peter	2.30	943.00	W400	11522869
	DRAFT AND REVISE REPLY BRIEF TO WELLS FARGO BRIEF REGARDING CLAIMS AGAINST INTERMEDIA				
03/31/04	Friedman, Peter	4.70	1,927.00	W400	11523292
	REVIEW PAPERS RELATED TO ABBOTT PROOF OF CLAIM AND SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION				
03/31/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.60	195.00	W400	11495775
	CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF LOWE ENTERPRISE AND ATRS RESPONSES (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIMS SUMMARY (.2).				
03/31/04	Watkins, Claire	5.40	1,782.00	W400	11491191
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GOULD AT MCI REGARDING PREPAID CONTRACTS (.6); RESEARCH TARIFFS (2.5); EDIT MOTION (.2); ATTENTION TO MOTION APPROVING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT REGARDING AUDIO FAX (1.5); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.6)				
03/31/04	Grogan, James	6.10	2,226.50	W400	11510647
	EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. PANASUK AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SAME REGARDING FACTS RELATED TO ALLSTATE CELLULAR CLAIM (.5); RESEARCH AND REVIEW OF CASE LAW AND DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO SAME (3.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER AND B. DAVIS REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GUECK REGARDING FEES FOR XEROX MEDIATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIM SUMMARY REPORTS (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND OTHER EVIDENCE RELATED TO PT CABLE CLAIM (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CULVER REGARDING SAME (.1).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W400 - CLAIMS RESOLUTION & ADMINISTRATION:		594.60	\$ 245,218.00		
03/01/04	Thompson, John	0.90	297.00	W420	11524191

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTENTION TO POSTPONEMENT OF ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS FOR MOTOROLA AND ABN AMRO				
03/03/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.80	1,116.00	W420	11519643
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF IN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING (1.1); REVIEW REVISED MOTION AND MEMORANDUM TO FILE SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF (.5); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM ERIN RILEY REGARDING SUBPOENA FOR 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION OF THE WORLDCOM 401(K) SALARY SAVINGS PLAN (.2)				
03/03/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.50	1,102.50	W420	11412513
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MCGEE REGARDING STATUS (.4); REVIEWING LETTER FROM PLAINTIFFS COUNSEL (.4); INTERVIEW OF S. KELLY (.7)				
03/04/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.50	930.00	W420	11519438
	MEETING C. LEE (.8) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH SHARON DIXON REGARDING RESPONSE TO DEPOSITIONS, SUBPOENA AND DISCOVERY DISPUTES (.7)				
03/04/04	Thompson, John	2.80	924.00	W420	11523798
	ATTENTION TO MOTOROLA ADVERSARY PROCEEDING DISMISSAL (1.2); ATTENTION TO CORD MOVING AND STORAGE ORDER (1.6)				
03/04/04	Lee, Caroline	0.70	280.00	W420	11424380
	REVIEW SUBPOENAS AND COMPLAINT RELATED TO ERISA LITIGATION.				
03/04/04	Lee, Caroline	0.80	320.00	W420	11424467
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. JACOBY AND S. DIXON REGARDING DISCOVERY AND PRIVILEGE ISSUES IN ERISA LITIGATION.				
03/05/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.50	930.00	W420	11521625
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION (.9); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH H. RUMELD AND S. DIXON REGARDING SAME (.2); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. STEUBER REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF IN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE (.2); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING MEDIATION IN ERISA LITIGATION (.2)				
03/08/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W420	11489861
	PHONE CALLS TO/FROM P. DEIGNAN (SOMMERS, BARNARD, ACKERSON) REGARDING WEST ADVERSARY PROCEEDING AND MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO ELECT JURY TRIAL				
03/08/04	Thompson, John	1.40	462.00	W420	11524190
	ATTENTION TO ADJOURNMENT OF FOCAL ADVERSARY PROCEEDING PRETRIAL CONFERENCE (.7); ATTENTION TO MOTOROLA STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL FOR ADVERSARY PROCEEDING (.7)				
03/08/04	Lee, Caroline	1.20	480.00	W420	11501206
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO ERISA LITIGATION.				
03/08/04	Lee, Caroline	3.20	1,280.00	W420	11500107
	RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.				
03/09/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.50	930.00	W420	11521051
	OFFICE CONFERENCE C. LEE AND I. WILBUR REGARDING RESEARCH ON RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION NOTICE FOR PLAN (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD WITH C. LEE REGARDING S.DIXON SUBPOENA AND RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA (.4); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM SARA GERSTEIN REGARDING ASSIGNMENT OF WORLDCOM/ERISA CASE TO JUDGE COTE AND DOCKET HISTORY (.4)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/09/04	Lee, Caroline DISCUSS RESEARCH RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA WITH I. WILBUR.	0.50	200.00	W420	11502442
03/09/04	Lee, Caroline DISCUSS RESEARCH RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA WITH M. JACOBY AND I. WILBUR.	0.70	280.00	W420	11502443
03/09/04	Lee, Caroline CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. JACOBY, H. RUMSFELD, AND S. DIXON REGARDING DISCOVERY AND DEPOSITIONS IN ERISA LITIGATION.	1.50	600.00	W420	11503827
03/09/04	Lee, Caroline RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.	5.00	2,000.00	W420	11502430
03/09/04	Wilbur, Ian RESEARCHED ISSUES RELATING TO WHETHER NON-PARTIES TO A LAWSUIT MAY OBJECT TO DEPOSITIONS PURSUANT TO 30(B)(6);	7.00	1,925.00	W420	11472551
03/10/04	Lee, Caroline DISCUSS RESEARCH RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA WITH I. WILBUR.	0.30	120.00	W420	11502467
03/10/04	Lee, Caroline DRAFT LETTER TO NOTICING PARTY OBJECTING TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.	1.00	400.00	W420	11502468
03/10/04	Lee, Caroline RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.	4.60	1,840.00	W420	11502924
03/10/04	Wilbur, Ian ATTENTION TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA (.7) CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING SAME (.3)	1.00	275.00	W420	11472912
03/11/04	Jacoby, Mark E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF IN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING REGARDING ERISA BOND ISSUE.	0.40	248.00	W420	11518325
03/12/04	Jacoby, Mark DRAFT LETTER TO PLAINTIFFS COUNSEL REGARDING RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION OF PLAN (.3); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.50	310.00	W420	11517939
03/15/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. DIXON REGARDING DEPOSITION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING S. DIXON LETTER (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING MEDIATION (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GRAHAM REGARDING SUBORDINATION ISSUE (.3)	1.80	1,116.00	W420	11517828
03/15/04	Lee, Caroline RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.	0.50	200.00	W420	11500668
03/16/04	Lee, Caroline RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.	0.60	240.00	W420	11503620
03/17/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.60	372.00	W420	11516790

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. Q. DIXON REGARDING DOCUMENTS THAT HAVE BEEN PROVIDED TO PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING MEDIATION (.2)				
03/17/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	5.00	2,000.00	W420	11504755
03/18/04	Jacoby, Mark REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION.	0.20	124.00	W420	11518512
03/18/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	7.20	2,880.00	W420	11504928
03/19/04	Jacoby, Mark MEETING CAROLINE LEE REGARDING S.DIXON SUBPOENA AND PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS ISSUE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING MEDIATION (.2); REVIEW PRIVILEGE DOCUMENTS MATERIALS (.3); VOICE-MAIL WITH G.GOTTO REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION (.1)	0.90	558.00	W420	11516982
03/19/04	Lee, Caroline RESEARCH ISSUES RELATED TO RULE 30(B)(6) SUBPOENA.	0.70	280.00	W420	11504118
03/19/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	4.70	1,880.00	W420	11504380
03/19/04	Wilbur, Ian SPOKE WITH C. LEE REGARDING FURTHER RESEARCH ON ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE ISSUE IN ERISA CONTEXT (.4); REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE FROM ERISA COUNSEL (1.8); RESEARCHED ERISA ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE ISSUES (1.9)	4.10	1,127.50	W420	11473561
03/22/04	Mitchel, Gayle SEARCH DOCKET AND FORWARD CYPRESS COMMUNICATIONS ANSWER AND COUNTERCLAIM TO WORLDCOM COMPLAINT IN ADV. 04-2275 FOR J. BILLECK	0.30	48.00	W420	11456496
03/23/04	Jacoby, Mark REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DEPOSITION SCHEDULING AND INSURANCE CLAIMS.	0.30	186.00	W420	11518032
03/24/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	2.50	1,000.00	W420	11502997
03/24/04	Lee, Caroline DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES FOR M. JACOBY.	3.20	1,280.00	W420	11500628
03/25/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING MEDIATION (.2); REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM R. GRAHAM REGARDING MANDATORY SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO JUDGE DOLINGER REGARDING ERISA BOND CLAIM (.1); REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM C. LEE REGARDING PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS AND MEETING REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR MEDIATION SESSION ON 3/26/04 (.1)	0.80	496.00	W420	11516255
03/25/04	Rhodes, Jennifer MEETING WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING ABBOTT CLAIMS MATTER.	1.00	445.00	W420	11492183

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/04	Jacoby, Mark REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR COURT MEDIATION AND REPRESENT MCI AT SAME WITH H. RUMELD, J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO (2.5); REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM R. GRAHAM AND AUTHORITIES REGARDING MANDATORY SUBORDINATION OF INDEMNIFICATION CLAIMS (1.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. DIXON SCHEDULED FOR MONDAY, 3/29 (2.5)	6.30	3,906.00	W420	11506201
03/26/04	Rhodes, Jennifer COLLECTING ABBOTT DOCUMENTS FOR C. WATKINS	1.00	445.00	W420	11492225
03/26/04	Thompson, John CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK TO COMPLETE CHART FOR B. VERMETTE (.4); TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2); CHANGES TO ADVERSARY PROCEEDING STATUS CHART (1.2).	1.80	594.00	W420	11524336
03/26/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	0.20	80.00	W420	11504012
03/26/04	Lee, Caroline DISCUSS BY E-MAIL DISCOVERY ISSUES WITH M. JACOBY AND S. DIXON.	0.50	200.00	W420	11504006
03/29/04	Jacoby, Mark REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM KELLER ROHRBACK REGARDING 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION OF PLAN (.3); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. DIXON REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE WITH PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL REGARDING DIXON DEPOSITION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. DIXON WITH C. LEE REGARDING PRIVILEGE LOG AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD WITH C. LEE REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION (.5)	2.00	1,240.00	W420	11506073
03/29/04	Rhodes, Jennifer MET WITH S. COHEN REGARDING IFN AND OBJECTIONS TO REJECTIONS OF CERTAIN CIRCUITS	0.70	311.50	W420	11495672
03/29/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	0.50	200.00	W420	11504862
03/29/04	Lee, Caroline CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. JACOBY AND S. DIXON REGARDING PRIVILEGE LOG AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION.	1.30	520.00	W420	11500230
03/29/04	Ribaudo, Mark OBTAIN FROM SDNY ORDER IN WORLDCOM, ERISA FOR P. FERRILLO.	0.50	70.00	W420	11508087
03/30/04	Jacoby, Mark REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. CANNY TO J. LEWIS REGARDING SHARON DIXON DEPOSITION AND FORWARD TO TEAM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING ANALYSIS OF PRIVILEGE CLAIMS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE JEFF LEWIS OF LEWIS & FEINBERG REGARDING DEPOSITION OF SHARON DIXON AND DISPUTED PRIVILEGE ISSUES (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ISSUES (.5)	1.50	930.00	W420	11510466
03/30/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED ISSUES REGARDING UPMG WITH M. GOLDSTEIN	0.20	147.00	W420	11479054
03/31/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.20	744.00	W420	11514012

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM SIMPSON THACHER REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRODUCED ON BEHALF OF WORLD COM AND DONA MILLER (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/31/04	Lee, Caroline	0.30	120.00	W420	11500627
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. MURPHY AT SIMPSON THACHER REGARDING PREVIOUS DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND PRIVILEGE LOGS.				
03/31/04	Lee, Caroline	4.50	1,800.00	W420	11500203
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.				
03/31/04	Reith, David	1.00	125.00	W420	11499991
	RESEARCH STATE REGULATIONS DEALING WITH AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE AND ETHICS.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W420 - ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS:		99.50	\$ 43,079.50		
03/03/04	Strochak, Adam	0.50	275.00	W430	11518304
	REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL OF AT&T LEAST COST ROUTING LAWSUIT				
03/03/04	Reifman, Marli	2.70	351.00	W430	11492798
	REDACT AND COPY ITEMS FROM PRIVILEGE LOG FOR E. LYTTLE (2.0); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE FOR GOLDFARB RESPONSE (.7)				
03/03/04	Kyne, Stephanie	2.20	286.00	W430	11509481
	DOWNLOAD AND PRINT CASES FOR SHEPHERD GOLDFARB FILE				
03/04/04	Sloane, Ann	0.50	77.50	W430	11498735
	IDENTIFY, LOCATE AND ACQUIRE LOWER COURT RULING THAT HAS BEEN GRANTED CERTIFICATION BY THE SUPREME COURT REGARDING BANKRUPTCY CODE 106(A) AND SOVEREIGN IMMUNITY				
03/04/04	Kyne, Stephanie	3.20	416.00	W430	11509482
	COMPILE AND ORGANIZE SHEPHERD GOLDFARB BINDERS C. WATKINS				
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W430	11617734
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING LITIGATION				
03/05/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	5.30	689.00	W430	11503066
	BATES LABEL PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS, SCAN AND PREPARE DOCUMENTS FOR P. FRIEDMAN				
03/05/04	Reifman, Marli	2.40	312.00	W430	11492804
	ASSIST B. PHILPOTT TO BATES LABEL REDACTED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION				
03/05/04	Aschenbrenner, Jeffrey	4.10	594.50	W430	11415081
	REVIEWED DOCUMENTS PULLED SPECIFIC PRIVILEGED DOCUMENT FOR J. PEPPER				
03/08/04	Billeck, Jason	0.10	41.50	W430	11437389
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BRUNO REGARDING THE STAMPONE APPEAL.				
03/09/04	Billeck, Jason	0.20	83.00	W430	11437618

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. RODRIQUES AND R. BRUNO REGARDING THE STAMPONE APPEAL.				
03/11/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W430	11430832
	CORRESPOND WITH B. VERMETTE REGARDING PROGRESS REPORT ON LITIGATION CLAIMS				
03/12/04	Grogan, James	5.10	1,861.50	W430	11430834
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BERKOVICH AND R. GRAHAM REGARDING PENDING LITIGATION CLAIM OBJECTIONS TO SETTLEMENTS (.5); DRAFT CORRESPONDENCE TO WORLDCOM TEAM REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW DOCKET AND CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES PERTAINING TO LITIGATION CLAIMS (2.3); PREPARE PROGRESS REPORT FOR B. VERMETTE REGARDING SAME (1.5); CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK, A. STROCHAK, S. YOUDELMAN AND V. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME (.4).				
03/19/04	Reifman, Marli	2.50	325.00	W430	11491996
	REPLACE NON-RESPONSIVE DOCUMENTS FROM INTERMEDIA SEARCH FOR E. LYTTLE (.5); FILE AND SERVE REYNOLDS MOTION (2.0)				
03/26/04	Allerhand, Joseph	7.50	5,512.50	W430	11469356
	ATTENDING MEDIATION SESSION BEFORE MAGISTRATE DOLLINGER REGARDING ERISA CASE.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W430 - NON BANKRUPTCY LITIGATION:		36.70	\$ 11,052.50		
03/01/04	Gold, Simeon	3.40	2,499.00	W440	11405306
	TRADED E-MAILS (.3) AND CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE AND F. GREEN REGARDING CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE ISSUES (.7); TRADED E-MAILS WITH R. GIETZ (.3) CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER (.5) AND REVIEWED LAZARD PRESENTATION AND OTHER PREPARATION FOR 3/2 RISK MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (WITH LAZARD) (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH HOLZMAN AND TRADED E-MAILS WITH HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS, ANNOUNCEMENT OF ELECTION RESULTS, ETC. (0.6).				
03/01/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.90	1,396.50	W440	11402800
	MEETING WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING INVESTIGATION (.5) DISCUSSED INVESTIGATION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN (.3); MEETING WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.6)				
03/01/04	Green, Frederick	5.10	3,952.50	W440	11520650
	AVANTEL DEBRIEFING (1.6); EMBRATEL MEETING AT JFK WITH CLIENT, LAZARD & INVESTOR (2.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD, M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES (.7)				
03/01/04	Gietz, Raymond	0.40	286.00	W440	11419084
	REVIEW STATUS OF POISON PILL.				
03/01/04	Fife, Lori	1.00	715.00	W440	11506315
	MEETING WITH F. GREEN, M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLD REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES (.7) TRADED EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/01/04	Gregory, Holly	0.90	540.00	W440	11493683
	E-MAILS TO B. COOPER REGARDING FRIDAY MEETING WITH D. WEBSTER, AUDIT COMMITTEE AGENDA ITEMS, DOCUMENTS FOR AUDIT COMMITTEE AND TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. MCGAREY REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE (.6)				
03/01/04	Cooper, Bethany	7.80	3,315.00	W440	11499921

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTENTION TO STATUS OF ELECTION (2.3) REVIEW OF LAZARD PRESENTATION ON RIGHTS PLAN (2.0) AUDIT COMMITTEE ITEMS (2.0) DTC MATTER (1.0) CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING RISK MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL (.5)				
03/01/04	Goldfarb, James	3.50	1,487.50	W440	11406331
	MET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INTERVIEW, STATUS (.9); DRAFT INTERVIEW MEMOS (2.6)				
03/01/04	Nettleton, Stacy	8.50	2,805.00	W440	11419544
	MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STATUS OF INVESTIGATION (.6); PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW OF S. KELLY (1.8); DRAFT INTERVIEW SUMMARIES (4.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELEVANT TO INVESTIGATION (2.3)				
03/01/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	1.10	363.00	W440	11450373
	REVIEW OF MEMOS/EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING STRUCTURE (.6); REVIEW MEMORANDUM AND RESULTING CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING STRUCTURE (.5)				
03/01/04	Welty, William	1.50	412.50	W440	11503449
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO FORM T-3				
03/02/04	Gold, Simeon	3.70	2,719.50	W440	11410335
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN (.3) V-MAIL TO BINGLE (SILVER LAKE) (.1), PREPARATION (.3) AND ATTENDED RISK MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COOPER (1.0) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH R. GIETZ AND B. COOPER REGARDING MCI POISON PILL (.5); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED WG&M CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR EMERGENCE TEAM (1.1); REVIEWED M. HOERLEIN'S PROPOSED E-MAIL TO DTC REGARDING MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE AND E-MAIL TO HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (0.4).				
03/02/04	Allerhand, Joseph	0.70	514.50	W440	11412548
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN REGARDING ERISA (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING STATUS OF BEHM INVESTIGATION (.3)				
03/02/04	Green, Frederick	0.30	232.50	W440	11571581
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING RISK MANAGEMENT MEETING				
03/02/04	Gregory, Holly	0.50	300.00	W440	11491467
	E-MAIL TO BETHANY COOPER REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE AGENDA (.1); E-MAIL TO JENNIFER MCGAREY REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE AGENDA ITEMS AND DOCUMENTS (.3); E-MAIL TO B. COOPER REGARDING A. GOODMAN (.1)				
03/02/04	Cooper, Bethany	6.50	2,762.50	W440	11497782
	PREPARATION FOR RISK MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE CALL WITH LAZARD REGARDING RIGHTS PLAN AND CALL AND FOLLOW-UP (2.0); ATTENTION TO R. BEHM MATTER-AUDIT COMMITTEE AGENDA ISSUES (3.0); UPDATE EMERGENCE CHECKLIST (1.5)				
03/02/04	Goldfarb, James	3.70	1,572.50	W440	11414652
	REVIEW AND REVISE EMPLOYEE INTERVIEW MEMOS (3.0); MEETINGS WITH J. NEUWIRTH, S. NETTLETON REGARDING STATUS (.7)				
03/02/04	Nettleton, Stacy	4.20	1,386.00	W440	11419548
	DRAFT SUMMARIES OF INTERVIEWS (2.0); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN, J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INTERVIEWS (1.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELEVANT TO INVESTIGATION AND CASE MANAGEMENT (1.2)				
03/02/04	Welty, William	2.20	605.00	W440	11509349

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3				
03/03/04	Gold, Simeon	2.00	1,470.00	W440	11412685
	PREPARATION, ATTENDED EMERGENCY TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES ET AL (1.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES AND B. COOPER WITH RESPECT TO 3/2 RISK MANAGEMENT COMMITTEE REGARDING MCI POISON PILL (0.2); REVIEWED D. HOLZMAN/CHASTKA E-MAIL EXCHANGE REGARDING MCI COMMENCEMENT OF ELECTION RESULTS (0.2); FOLLOW-UP ON DTC ISSUES REGARDING MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (0.3).				
03/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W440	11544972
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. MONTROSE REGARDING MARCH BOARD MEETING.				
03/03/04	Gregory, Holly	0.30	180.00	W440	11492509
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND E-MAIL TO N. JONES REGARDING INTERVIEWS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.1)				
03/03/04	Cooper, Bethany	8.50	3,612.50	W440	11497825
	REVIEW THORNBURGH REPORTS AND INTERVIEW NOTES (6.7); EMERGENCY TEAM MEETING (1.5) CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD AND N. JONES REGARDING 312 MCI POISON PILL (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING INTERVIEWS (.1)				
03/03/04	Goldfarb, James	4.10	1,742.50	W440	11414848
	READ AND REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMOS (3.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON, S. KELLY (MCI) REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
03/03/04	Nettleton, Stacy	6.30	2,079.00	W440	11419551
	ATTEND INTERVIEW VIA TELEPHONE CONFERENCE OF S. KELLY WITH J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB (1.5); DRAFT PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE (4.8)				
03/03/04	Welty, William	4.00	1,100.00	W440	11509150
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3				
03/04/04	Gold, Simeon	1.10	808.50	W440	11438012
	EXCHANGED E-MAILS WITH M. HOERNLEIN ET AL. REGARDING DTC ISSUES WITH MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING REVISIONS TO WG&M CLOSING CHECKLIST FOR EMERGENCY TEAM (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER, ETC. (0.3).				
03/04/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.90	1,396.50	W440	11414629
	CONDUCT INTERVIEW OF S. KELLY (1.0); REVIEWING/REVISING AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION (.9)				
03/04/04	Gregory, Holly	2.70	1,620.00	W440	11493173
	REVIEW INTERVIEW MEMOS (1.0); DRAFT/EDIT POWERPOINT (.9); DISCUSS SAME WITH S. NETTLETON (.5); E-MAILS TO J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON REGARDING NANCY HIGGINS (.3)				
03/04/04	Cooper, Bethany	8.10	3,442.50	W440	11497861
	PREPARATION FOR MEETING AT MCI WITH D. RICHARDS (1.1); ATTENTION TO DTC/TRADING RESTRICTIONS MATTER (7.0)				
03/04/04	Goldfarb, James	1.40	595.00	W440	11414839
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON, J. EDGERTON, J. SPEAR REGARDING PRESENTATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON, S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.3); REVISE AND REVIEW SLIDES FOR AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION (.9)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/04/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVISE PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE (3.5); ATTEND INTERVIEW OF S. KELLY VIA TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, J. GOLDFARB (1.5)	5.00	1,650.00	W440	11419568
03/04/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3	5.20	1,430.00	W440	11509355
03/05/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION (.3) CONFERENCE CALL WITH DTC AND S. GOLDRING ET AL. (.6) AND EDITED E-MAIL TO N. JONES (.1) REGARDING DTC ISSUES WITH MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE; CONFERENCES (TWO) WITH HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.4).	1.40	1,029.00	W440	11438124
03/05/04	Allerhand, Joseph REVISING PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE REGARDING INVESTIGATION.	1.90	1,396.50	W440	11419351
03/05/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFERENCE CALL WITH DTC AND S. GOLD REGARDING IMPACT OF CHARTER ON DTC (.6); AND REVIEW AND REVISE EMAIL TO N. JONES REGARDING SAME (.3); CALL WITH D. GROPPER OF ELLIOT ASSOC REGARDING SECTION 382 QUESTIONS (.4); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO D. RICHARDS REGARDING TIMING OF SALE OF EMBRATEL (.2); CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) QUALIFICATION MODEL (.4); CALL WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING REFINEMENTS TO SAME (.4); CALLS WITH R. COX AND D. KILLUP REGARDING NOTE ELECTION ISSUES (1.0), AND MEETING WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.5)	3.80	2,717.00	W440	11415015
03/05/04	Gregory, Holly PREPARE FOR INTERVIEW OF D. WEBSTER WITH B. COOPER (.5); PARTICIPATE IN SAME (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING BOARD PRESENTATION/POWERPOINT (.5); CREATE E-MAIL TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.5)	3.00	1,800.00	W440	11492063
03/05/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS	0.40	178.00	W440	11571585
03/05/04	Cooper, Bethany MEETING WITH D. RICHARDS AND H. GREGORY (1.5) ATTENTION TO BOARD ISSUES (3.0)	4.50	1,912.50	W440	11497300
03/05/04	Goldfarb, James MET WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION SLIDES.	0.30	127.50	W440	11421355
03/05/04	Nettleton, Stacy REVISE AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION (2.5); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH H. GREGORY AND J. GOLDFARB REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEW MATERIALS PROVIDED BY INTERVIEWEES (1.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING BOARD PRESENTATION (.5)	5.00	1,650.00	W440	11419562
03/05/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3	4.00	1,100.00	W440	11506634
03/07/04	Allerhand, Joseph REVIEWING DRAFT PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE.	0.30	220.50	W440	11419409
03/07/04	Goldfarb, James REVIEW SLIDES FOR AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION.	0.20	85.00	W440	11421414
03/07/04	Nettleton, Stacy	2.50	825.00	W440	11419249

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT SUMMARIES OF INTERVIEWS.				
03/07/04	Welty, William	1.50	412.50	W440	11510251
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3				
03/08/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.50	1,102.50	W440	11423742
	REVISING PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE (.5); WGM TEAM MEETING REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
03/08/04	Gregory, Holly	3.90	2,340.00	W440	11493149
	REVIEW INTERVIEW NOTES AND DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR BOARD PRESENTATION (1.9); DISCUSS (TELEPHONE CONFERENCE) COMMENTS ON DRAFT POWERPOINT WITH S. NETTLETON (1.0); MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND AND S. NETTLETON TO PREPARE FOR BOARD PRESENTATION (.7); E-MAILS TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.3)				
03/08/04	Cooper, Bethany	0.50	212.50	W440	11497328
	REVIEW AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION REGARDING MATTER.				
03/08/04	Goldfarb, James	0.30	127.50	W440	11423115
	MET WITH J. ALLERHAND, S. NETTLETON REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION.				
03/08/04	Nettleton, Stacy	10.00	3,300.00	W440	11429426
	REVISE AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION (4.0); DISCUSS SAME WITH H. GREGORY AND J. ALLERHAND (1.0); DRAFT SUMMARIES OF INTERVIEWS (5.0)				
03/08/04	Welty, William	3.20	880.00	W440	11513877
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3				
03/09/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.00	735.00	W440	11423605
	FINALIZING PRESENTATION (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL REGARDING PRESENTATION (.5)				
03/09/04	Gregory, Holly	2.30	1,380.00	W440	11493069
	FURTHER EDIT PRESENTATION (.6); PREPARATION REGARDING SAME (.8); MEET WITH AND E-MAILS TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.7); E-MAIL TO J. MCGAREY REGARDING PRESENTATION (.2)				
03/09/04	Cooper, Bethany	7.30	3,102.50	W440	11497343
	DRAFT INTERVIEW MEMORANDUM FOR D. RICHARDS (5.8); UPDATE EMERGENCE CHECKLIST (1.5)				
03/09/04	Nettleton, Stacy	9.50	3,135.00	W440	11429233
	REVISE AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION (4.0); DISCUSS SAME WITH H. GREGORY AND J. ALLERHAND (.5); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY INTERVIEWEES (2.0); REVIEW RELEVANT SARBANES-OXLEY PROVISIONS (1.0); DRAFT SUMMARIES OF INTERVIEWS (2.0)				
03/09/04	Welty, William	5.20	1,430.00	W440	11514594
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3				
03/10/04	Gold, Simeon	2.10	1,543.50	W440	11438035
	PREPARATION (.2) CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. KELLY, MCGAREY, H. GREGORY AND B. COOPER (.8) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH H. GREGORY AND B. COOPER REGARDING MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION, COMMITTEE CHARTERS, ETC. (.2); REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING 3/12 MCI BOARD MEETING (0.5); TRADED E-MAILS WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING FORM T-3 AMENDMENT (0.4).				
03/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W440	11619407

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW MATERIAL FOR BOARD MEETING.				
03/10/04	Gregory, Holly	3.60	2,160.00	W440	11493536
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING BOARD ISSUES (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. HIGGINS REGARDING SAME; MEET WITH AND E-MAIL TO S. NETTLETON REGARDING BOARD PRESENTATION (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCGAREY AND S. KELLY REGARDING ARTICLE/BYLAW PROVISIONS (.8); E-MAIL TO N. HIGGINS REGARDING PRESENTATION (2)				
03/10/04	Cooper, Bethany	1.50	637.50	W440	11497381
	EMERGENCE TEAM CALL (.9); CALL WITH S. KELLY AND J. MCGAREY WITH S. GOLD AND H. GREGORY REGARDING CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION (.6)				
03/10/04	Goldfarb, James	1.30	552.50	W440	11427040
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE (.8); MET WITH S. NETTLETON REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/10/04	Nettleton, Stacy	10.80	3,564.00	W440	11429241
	REVISE PRESENTATION TO AUDIT COMMITTEE (6.4); DISCUSS SAME WITH WGM TEAM (1.4); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PROVIDED BY INTERVIEWEES (3.0)				
03/10/04	Welty, William	1.30	357.50	W440	11506818
	PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3				
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia	5.50	4,262.50	W440	11620414
	PREPARE FOR BOARD MEETING (3.0); MEETING WITH T. SAVAGE, L. GRAFSTEIN, F. GREEN REGARDING BOARD ISSUES (2.5)				
03/11/04	Allerhand, Joseph	7.00	5,145.00	W440	11429349
	PRESENTING REPORT TO AUDIT COMMITTEE REGARDING INVESTIGATION .				
03/11/04	Green, Frederick	6.90	5,347.50	W440	11521484
	PREPARE BOARD MATERIALS FOR EMBRATEL AND RIGHTS PLAN (2.0); REVIEW LAZARD MATERIALS (1.6); MEET WITH LAZARD TO PREPARE FOR PRESENTATION TO BOARD (1.5); REVIEW FINAL CHANGES TO RIGHTS PLAN MATERIALS (1.8)				
03/11/04	Gregory, Holly	3.00	1,800.00	W440	11505266
	PREPARE FOR (.5) AND PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING REGARDING ALLEGATIONS (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AND E-MAILS TO J. ALLERHAND REGARDING ALLEGATIONS (1.5)				
03/11/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.40	268.00	W440	11458033
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH RESTRUCTURE COMMITTEE TO DISCUSS STRATEGY AND STATUS				
03/11/04	Cooper, Bethany	0.40	170.00	W440	11498843
	CALL WITH DTC REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS				
03/11/04	Goldfarb, James	0.30	127.50	W440	11437796
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING PRESENTATION.				
03/11/04	Nettleton, Stacy	2.50	825.00	W440	11429256
	DISCUSS AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION WITH J. ALLERHAND, H. GREGORY AND J. GOLDFARB (1.5); CASE MANAGEMENT (1.0)				
03/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	9.00	6,975.00	W440	11622889

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTEND MCI BOARD MEETING AND MISCELLANEOUS CONFERENCES AT MCI				
03/12/04	Green, Frederick	6.10	4,727.50	W440	11521294
	ATTEND BOARD MEETING IN DC (4.0); PRESENTATION ON RIGHTS PLAN AND EMBRATEL TRANSACTION (1.1); CONFERENCE WITH LAZARD, WEBSTER, M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING BOARD MEETING (1.0)				
03/12/04	Fife, Lori	5.50	3,932.50	W440	11513488
	MEETING WITH LAZARD, WEBSTER, M. GOLDSTEIN AND F. GREEN REGARDING PREPARATION FOR BOARD MEETING (1.0); ATTEND BOARD MEETING REGARDING EMBRATEL, TAX ISSUES AND LEGAL UPDATE (4.5).				
03/12/04	Gregory, Holly	0.30	180.00	W440	11496710
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. DIXON REGARDING BOARD MEETING				
03/12/04	Nettleton, Stacy	0.80	264.00	W440	11456603
	DISCUSS AUDIT COMMITTEE PRESENTATION WITH J. ALLERHAND, H. GREGORY, J. GOLDFARB.				
03/15/04	Gold, Simeon	1.40	1,029.00	W440	11438220
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING FOLLOW-UP TO 3/12 MCI BOARD MEETING, ELECTION ISSUES, ETC. (0.5); CONFERENCES WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS AND ITALIAN/CONSOB ISSUES (0.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING MCI CHARTER REVISIONS, MCI LETTER TO DTC REGARDING STOCK CERTIFICATE, 3/10 EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL, ETC. (0.4).				
03/16/04	Gold, Simeon	2.70	1,984.50	W440	11442191
	REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED WG&M CLOSING CHECKLIST (.5) AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEWED D. HOLZMAN'S FORM T-3 AMENDMENT (.3) AND CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEWED VARIOUS E-MAILS AND ATTACHMENTS REGARDING DTC ISSUES CONCERNING MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (0.5); REVIEWED STB'S DRAFT OF SEC DISTRIBUTION PLAN (.3) AND CONFERENCE WITH B.COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER, ETC. (0.2).				
03/16/04	Cooper, Bethany	1.50	637.50	W440	11496458
	UPDATE EMERGENCE CHECKLIST (.5); DRAFT DTC LETTER REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (1.0)				
03/17/04	Gold, Simeon	3.20	2,352.00	W440	11446882
	EXCHANGED E-MAILS WITH N. JONES ET AL. (.1) CONFERENCES (TWO) WITH D. HOLZMAN (.6), AND PREPARATION FOR 3/18 CONFERENCE CALL (.5) REGARDING REVISIONS TO REGISTRATION RIGHTS AGREEMENT; PREPARATION, ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL, AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (1.3); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S DRAFT OF MCI LETTER TO DTC AND TAX COMMENTS THEREON (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.3)				
03/17/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.30	214.50	W440	11450474
	REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO DTC REGARDING CHARTER RESTRICTION				
03/17/04	Cooper, Bethany	4.60	1,955.00	W440	11496482
	EMERGENCE TEAM CALL (1.0); DRAFT AND DISTRIBUTE DTC LETTER REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (3.0) CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING SAME (.6)				
03/18/04	Gold, Simeon	4.20	3,087.00	W440	11446525

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARATION WITH D. HOLZMAN (.5) CONFERENCE CALL WITH DAVIS POLK, N. JONES AND D. HOLZMAN (.4) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH D. HOLZMAN (.4) REGARDING REVISIONS TO REGISTRATION RIGHTS AGREEMENT; TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. URQUHART, D. HOLZMAN, B. COOPER AND S. COHEN REGARDING ABOVE AND CLEARANCE OF PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS WITH VARIOUS CREDITORS' REPRESENTATIVES (1.6); REVIEWED CUMULATIVE REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER AND BY-LAWS (.2) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. HOLZMAN AND B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (0.3); VOICEMAIL TO AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING WG&M RECOMMENDATION REGARDING SAME (0.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER AND REVIEWED HER E-MAIL TO DTC REGARDING MCI LETTER TO DTC REGARDING MCI TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.2).				
03/18/04	Green, Frederick	3.90	3,022.50	W440	11521354
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (1.5) CONFERENCE CALLS TO ORGANIZE FOR BOARD MEETING (1.0); PRESENT AT BOARD MEETING (1.4)				
03/18/04	Fife, Lori	0.70	500.50	W440	11515687
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM BOARD REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
03/18/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.50	247.50	W440	11525642
	ATTEND TELEPHONIC BOARD MEETING				
03/18/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W440	11448898
	REVIEWED EMERGENGE CHECKLIST AND SENT RELATED EMAIL TO N. JONES.				
03/18/04	Cooper, Bethany	3.50	1,487.50	W440	11496517
	REVIEW REVISED EMERGENGE CHECKLIST SENT BY N. JONES (2.5); REVIEW CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BYLAWS (1.0)				
03/18/04	Goldfarb, James	0.10	42.50	W440	11445717
	RESPOND TO P. FRIEDMAN DOCUMENT REQUEST.				
03/19/04	Gold, Simeon	3.50	2,572.50	W440	11452944
	REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REDRAFT OF WG&M CLOSING CHECKLIST AND N. JONES' DOCUMENT/ACTION LIST (1.0) AND TELECONFERENCES WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCGAREY (.3) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH WGM TEAM (.6) REGARDING CIRCULATION OF CERTAIN PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENTS TO CERTAIN CREDITOR REPRESENTATIVES; WORK WITH S. GOLDRING, M. HOERNLEIN AND B. COOPER ON MCI LETTER TO DTC REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS, ETC. (0.8).				
03/19/04	Cooper, Bethany	5.50	2,337.50	W440	11496184
	REVISIONS TO BYLAWS (2.0); UPDATE EMERGENGE CHECKLIST (2.0); DTC LETTER REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (1.5)				
03/22/04	Gold, Simeon	4.70	3,454.50	W440	11459645
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER (.3) CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. KAM AND B. COOPER (.3) CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE (.3) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH N. JONES AND B. COOPER (.2) REGARDING VESTING PERIOD FOR RESTRICTED STOCK GRANTS; PREPARATION (.2) ATTENDED EMERGENGE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (1.0); WORK WITH S. GOLDRING AND B. COOPER ON MCI LETTER TO DTC REGARDING MCI TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.6); WORK WITH MCGAREY AND B. COOPER ON REVISIONS TO MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BY-LAWS (1.4); REVIEWED ITALIAN/CONSOB ORDER (0.4).				
03/22/04	Gregory, Holly	0.30	180.00	W440	11499886
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS BY-LAW/ARTICLES ISSUES.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/22/04	Cooper, Bethany EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (1.0); CALL WITH DTC REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (.8); WORK ON ISSUE REGARDING RESTRICTED STOCK/VESTING (3.0); REVISIONS TO CERTIFICATE OF INCORPROATION (1.3) CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING SAME (2.8) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING BY-LAW/ARTICLE ISSUES (.3)	9.20	3,910.00	W440	11496231
03/22/04	Welty, William PREPARATION OF AMENDMENT TO T-3 AND T-1	2.20	605.00	W440	11511916
03/23/04	Gold, Simeon WORK WITH B. COOPER ON MCI LETTER TO DTC REGARDING MCI TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN (.2) AND REVIEWED VARIOUS E-MAILS (.2) REGARDING ITALIAN/CONSOB ISSUES; VOICEMAIL TO AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCGAREY (.3) AND REVIEWED LATEST REVISIONS TO MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BY-LAWS (1.1); REVIEWED AND REPLIED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING RESTRICTED STOCK VESTING ISSUES (1.2).	3.50	2,572.50	W440	11470179
03/23/04	Gietz, Raymond TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING TIME LINE.	0.20	143.00	W440	11464336
03/23/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING ITALIAN/CONSOB ISSUES	0.20	89.00	W440	11571593
03/23/04	Cooper, Bethany REVIEW REVISED CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BYLAWS (4.0); REVISE STOCKHOLDER RIGHTS PLAN (4.0); DISCUSS ISSUE REGARDING RESTRICTED STOCK/VESTING WITH MCI (.8) CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING DTC (.5)	9.30	3,952.50	W440	11496280
03/24/04	Gietz, Raymond REVIEW REVISED DRAFT REGARDING GOVERNANCE	0.30	214.50	W440	11464376
03/24/04	Gregory, Holly TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING GOVERNANCE	0.30	180.00	W440	11503293
03/24/04	Cooper, Bethany REVISE STOCKHOLDER RIGHTS PLAN DOCUMENTS (2.7); DISCUSS RESTRICTED STOCK/VESTING ISSUE (2.0); REVIEW DTC LETTER REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (3.0) CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENT CHECKLIST (.5) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. GREGORY REGARDING GOVERNANCE (.3)	8.50	3,612.50	W440	11497805
03/25/04	Gold, Simeon WORK WITH B . COOPER (.8) AND REVIEWED AND REPLIED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS (.5) REGARDING REVISIONS TO MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BY-LAWS, B. COOPER'S LIST OF REVISIONS FOR MCI BOARD, ETC; CONFERENCES WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS AND ITALIAN/CONSOB ISSUES (0.8); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S E-MAIL TO CREDITORS' COUNSEL REGARDING REVISIONS TO MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BY-LAWS (0.1); EXCHANGED E-MAILS WITH JONES ET AL REGARDING 3/26 EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (0.4).	2.60	1,911.00	W440	11479323
03/25/04	Gietz, Raymond ATTENTION TO GOVERNANCE ISSUES	1.20	858.00	W440	11464393
03/25/04	Cooper, Bethany EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (1.2); REVIEW OF STOCKHOLDER RIGHTS PLAN (3.3)	4.50	1,912.50	W440	11499686

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/26/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMERGENCE SCHEDULE (.3); DISCUSS BOARD MEETINGS AND PRESENTATION ON RIGHTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LAZARD REGARDING BOARD MEETINGS (.2)	0.80	620.00	W440	11520365
03/26/04	Cooper, Bethany REVISIONS TO STOCKHOLDER RIGHTS PLAN AND CONVERSATIONS WITH BONY REGARDING ACTING AS RIGHTS AGENT, DRS CONFIRMS, ETC.	7.50	3,187.50	W440	11499706
03/29/04	Gold, Simeon WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS (0.8); CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING ELECTION RESULTS, ETC. (0.6); CONFERENCES AND TELECONFERENCES WITH B. COOPER REGARDING REVISIONS TO MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION AND BY-LAWS, AUDIT COMMITTEE CHARTER, ETC. (0.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING PREPARATION FOR 3/31 EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (0.7); CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE AND F. GREEN (.8) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN (.2) REGARDING 4/8 EMERGENCE ISSUES	3.70	2,719.50	W440	11480403
03/29/04	Goldfarb, James REVIEW AUDIT COMMITTEE MEETING MINUTES.	0.30	127.50	W440	11505013
03/30/04	Gold, Simeon WORK ON TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS WITH D. HOLZMAN (.5) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEWED LUCA'S CONSOB MEMORANDUM (.6) CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED CLOSING DOCUMENT CHECKLIST AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (1.0); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVIEWED DRAFTS OF POISON PILL DOCUMENTS AND EXCHANGED E-MAILS WITH F. GREEN AND R. GIETZ REGARDING SAME (1.8); WORK ON BANK/BONDHOLDER ELECTION RESULTS WITH N. JONES AND D. HOLZMAN (0.5).	5.30	3,895.50	W440	11486050
03/30/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO RIGHTS PLAN (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LAZARD REGARDING GOVERNANCE ISSUES (.5)	0.90	697.50	W440	11520441
03/30/04	Gietz, Raymond REVIEW RIGHTS PLAN REGARDING GOVERNANCE	0.50	357.50	W440	11502124
03/30/04	Gregory, Holly TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GOLDFARB REGARDING MINUTES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. HESSLER REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. COOPER REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.50	900.00	W440	11508687
03/30/04	Cooper, Bethany UPDATE EMERGENCE CHECKLIST	1.50	637.50	W440	11496877
03/31/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION, ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (1.2); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN (.5) V-MAIL TO N. JONES (.1) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES AND D. HOLZMAN (.7) REGARDING ITALIAN/CONSOB ISSUES; REVIEWED FINAL MCI STOCK CERTIFICATE (0.1) REVIEWED FINAL MCI LETTER TO DTC REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.1); FINALIZED TRUST INDENTURE ACT FILINGS WITH D. HOLZMAN (.6) REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING CARLOS SLIM/FTC OWNERSHIP ISSUES (.3) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.4)	4.00	2,940.00	W440	11511917
03/31/04	Green, Frederick	1.90	1,472.50	W440	11520447

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LACY ET AL REGARDING SAME (.7)				
03/31/04	Fife, Lori	1.60	1,144.00	W440	11511343
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, KOST REGARDING NOL/ELECTION ISSUES.				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W440	11485083
	DISCUSSED CONSOB AND FTC OWNERSHIP ISSUES WITH S. GOLD AND N. JONES.				
03/31/04	Cooper, Bethany	3.50	1,487.50	W440	11496880
	REVIEW RIGHTS PLAN/8-A (1.9); EMERGENCE TEAM CALL (1.1) AND FOLLOW-UP (.5)				
03/31/04	Goldfarb, James	0.40	170.00	W440	11500636
	MEET WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING AUDIT COMMITTEE MEETING MINUTES (.2); TRANSMIT SAME TO J. MCGAREY (MCI) (.2)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W440 - CORPORATE GOVERNANCE/BOARD:		366.80	\$ 189,349.00		
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W460	11622961
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SCHEELER REGARDING GOVERNMENT ISSUES				
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W460	11620208
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING GOVERNMENT ISSUES				
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W460	11620663
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING GOVERNMENT ISSUES				
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W460	11619503
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING GOVERNMENT COMMUNICATIONS (.3) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. PETREN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING GOVERNMENT COMMUNICATIONS (.3)				
03/26/04	Strochak, Adam	1.50	825.00	W460	11489629
	PREPARE RESPONSES TO REQUEST FOR VOLUNTARY PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS BY SEC				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	3.00	2,325.00	W460	11633426
	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING AT SEC.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W460 - GOVERNMENTAL/REGULATORY COMMUNICATIONS:		5.90	\$ 4,235.00		
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.80	1,395.00	W470	11545296
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING CREDITOR ISSUES (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING SAME (.4)				
03/01/04	Strochak, Adam	0.10	55.00	W470	11489087
	E-MAILS TO/FROM S. SATYAPRASAD AND N. HAZAN (AKIN GUMP) REGARDING JMG AND MESSAGEPHONE MOTIONS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING DISCUSSION WITH COMMITTEE MEMBERS REGARDING DEBT ALLOCATION.	0.60	465.00	W470	11544974
03/19/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL FROM J. MORSE (COMMITTEE CONFLICTS COUNSEL) REGARDING WELLS FARGO BANK CLAIMS OBJECTION	0.20	110.00	W470	11489664
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W470 - COMMITTEE COMMUNICATIONS/MEETINGS:		2.70	\$ 2,025.00		
03/01/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING INSIDER COMPLAINT [0.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING SAME [0.1]; REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME [0.2]	0.50	247.50	W500C	11525709
03/09/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCE WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING INSIDER COMPLAINT [0.4]; REVIEW PROPOSED COMMENTS REGARDING SAME [0.1]	0.50	247.50	W500C	11525647
03/15/04	Youdelman, Sharon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN & J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL BIDS	0.40	198.00	W500C	11525733
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W500C - AVOIDANCE ACTIONS:		1.40	\$ 693.00		
03/01/04	Youdelman, Sharon E-MAILS WITH R. BEHM REGARDING CLOSING OF DOUGLAS LAKE TRANSACTION	0.10	49.50	W505	11525650
03/01/04	Tsekerides, Theodore REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT COMPLAINT AGAINST EBBERS (1.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH V. JOHNSON REGARDING EBBERS COMPLAINT (0.3).	1.40	707.00	W505	11509396
03/01/04	Johnson, Virginia CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN AND T. TSEKERIDES REGARDING EBBERS COMPLAINT.	0.70	231.00	W505	11398700
03/02/04	Johnson, Virginia RESEARCH REGARDING LOANS TO INSIDERS AS FRAUDULENT CONVEYANCES (1.5); REVISE EBBERS COMPLAINT TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS OF T. TSEKERIDES (1.0); REVIEW 2002 BALANCE SHEET (1.0)	3.50	1,155.00	W505	11408103
03/05/04	Johnson, Virginia CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING EBBERS COMPLAINT.	0.20	66.00	W505	11415326
03/08/04	Johnson, Virginia RESEARCH REGARDING LOANS TO INSIDERS AS FRAUDULENT CONVEYANCES (1.0); REVIEW COMMENTS OF T. TSEKERIDES REGARDING EBBERS COMPLAINT (.5)	1.50	495.00	W505	11419855
03/09/04	Johnson, Virginia CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING EBBERS COMPLAINT.	0.60	198.00	W505	11422329
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W505	11634027

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. ALBANESE REGARDING EBBERS TRANSACTIONS					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W505 - EBBERS TRANSACTIONS:		8.20	\$ 3,056.50		
03/01/04	Graham, Richard RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS	0.20	74.00	W510B	11448003
03/02/04	Graham, Richard RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS	0.10	37.00	W510B	11448011
03/02/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CALL OF FORMER CUSTOMER OF WORLDCOM WHO IS THREATENING LITIGATION (.2); HANDLE CALL REGARDING NOTICE OF REJECTED LEASE AND SCHEDULE 8.01 (.3)	0.50	137.50	W510B	11524433
03/03/04	Cohen, Scott MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CREDITOR QUERIES	0.80	320.00	W510B	11412637
03/03/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL WITH C. GOLDSTEIN (ATTORNEY FOR GOLDMAN SACHS) REGARDING PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MANISHEWITZ (MOORE CAPITAL) REGARDING ELECTION DEADLINE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.40	148.00	W510B	11446682
03/03/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CALL OF CREDITOR REQUESTING INFORMATION ON WHEN DISTRIBUTIONS WILL BE MADE (.2); RESPOND TO CREDITOR ASKING WHEN ELECTION RESULTS ARE GOING TO BE RELEASED (.1)	0.30	82.50	W510B	11524468
03/04/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL COMMUNICATION WITH A. BENUS (JP MORGAN) REGARDING STATUS OF EFFECTIVE DATE.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11446534
03/04/04	Graham, Richard RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS (.1); CALLED M. CHASKA REGARDING QUIPS DIVIDENDS (.2)	0.30	111.00	W510B	11448014
03/04/04	Pullo, Christina RETURN SHAREHOLDER CALLS REGARDING NOTICE OF PRE-MERGER CLAIM STATUS (.3); RETURN CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING REJECTION OF CONTRACT (.3) AND ELECTION RESULTS (.2)	0.80	220.00	W510B	11524938
03/05/04	Graham, Richard RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11448015
03/05/04	Pullo, Christina CALL FROM CREDITOR REQUESTING THE OBJECTION WE FILED TO ITS CLAIM	0.50	137.50	W510B	11524939
03/08/04	Graham, Richard RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.	0.40	148.00	W510B	11448024
03/09/04	Graham, Richard RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11448025
03/09/04	Pullo, Christina	0.10	27.50	W510B	11525271

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALL REGARDING PRE-MERGER NOTICE				
03/10/04	Pullo, Christina	1.00	275.00	W510B	11524959
	HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALLS REGARDING THE PRE-MERGER NOTICE.				
03/11/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W510B	11448030
	RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.				
03/11/04	Pullo, Christina	1.50	412.50	W510B	11525391
	HANDLE CREDITORS CALL REGARDING THE EFFECTIVE DATE AND THE STATUS OF THEIR CLAIMS (.8); CONFER WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING CREDITOR INQUIRY REGARDING HIS PERSONAL INJURY CLAIM (.1); RETURN CALL TO LAWYER REPRESENTING CREDITOR WITH PERSONAL INJURY CLAIM (.3); EMAIL J. GROGRAN REGARDING CLAIM TRANSFER BAR DATE INQUIRY FROM CREDITOR (.1); HANDLE CALL OF ATTORNEY WHOSE CREDITOR CLIENT WANTS TO KNOW STATUS OF THEIR CONTRACT (IE REJECTED/ASSUMED) (.2)				
03/12/04	Graham, Richard	0.30	111.00	W510B	11448031
	RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.				
03/18/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W510B	11533502
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MANISCHEWITZ REGARDING KPMG MOTION.				
03/18/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W510B	11447949
	RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.				
03/19/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W510B	11447950
	RESPONDED TO CREDITOR/SHAREHOLDER/CONTRACT COUNTERPARTY CALLS.				
03/19/04	Graham, Richard	0.30	111.00	W510B	11447951
	REVIEW EMAIL FROM M. SCHNEIDER REGARDING FORWARD CONTRACTS PROVISIONS.				
03/22/04	Pullo, Christina	0.20	55.00	W510B	11525457
	HANDLE CALLS OF SHAREHOLDER CREDITORS REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE				
03/23/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.30	111.00	W510B	11533187
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITOR (R. FEINSTEIN, UBS) REGARDING EMERGENCE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/23/04	Pullo, Christina	0.20	55.00	W510B	11525000
	HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALLS REGARDING TIMING OF DISTRIBUTIONS				
03/25/04	Pullo, Christina	0.20	55.00	W510B	11525109
	HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALLS REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE				
03/26/04	Graham, Richard	0.30	111.00	W510B	11532132
	RESPOND TO CALLS FROM CREDITORS.				
03/29/04	Pullo, Christina	0.20	55.00	W510B	11524838
	HANDLE CALL OF GENERAL UNSECURED CREDITOR REGARDING DATE OF DISTRIBUTIONS (.1); HANDLE CALL OF STOCKHOLDER REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE (.1)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/31/04	Pullo, Christina RETURN SHAREHOLDER CALL REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE	0.10	27.50	W510B	11525426
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W510B - CREDITOR/VENDOR/CUSTOMER COMMUNICATIONS:		9.70	\$ 3,081.00		
03/01/04	Hoening, Mark INTERNATIONAL REORGANIZATION PLANNING.	2.00	1,430.00	W520B	11414924
03/29/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE T. LEESON REGARDING EMEA	0.50	200.00	W520B	11529115
03/31/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH E. WRIGHT REGARDING INT'L LICENSES ISSUES	0.20	99.00	W520B	11506312
03/31/04	Cohen, Scott REVIEW CLAIMS MEMORANDUM REGARDING FOREIGN SUBS (.3) INCLUDING DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.50	200.00	W520B	11527990
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W520B - INTERNATIONAL ISSUES:		3.20	\$ 1,929.00		
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN	0.30	232.50	W560	11544862
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN OF REORGANIZATION	0.60	465.00	W560	11544855
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW E-MAILS FROM M. PALMER, M. SAGE REGARDING RELEASE OF INFORMATION	0.70	542.50	W560	11544864
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. FIFE, ET AL. REGARDING DEBT ALLOCATION, NOL (.6) AND CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.4)	1.00	775.00	W560	11544854
03/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW E-MAILS, MEMOS FROM S. GOLDRING, S. KELLY, L. FIFE AND BACKGROUND DOCS REGARDING NEW DEBT ELECTIONS.	2.50	1,937.50	W560	11544859
03/01/04	Fife, Lori NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH AKIN, STROOCK REGARDING ELECTION ALLOCATION (1.4); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.6); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.7)	2.70	1,930.50	W560	11506132
03/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN ISSUES	0.60	465.00	W560	11544756
03/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE (.7) AND REVIEW E-MAILS (.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING (.8) REGARDING ELECTION/ALLOCATION ISSUES.	2.00	1,550.00	W560	11544565

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/02/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING AND R. COX REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.3); REVIEW LETTER TO COMMITTEE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTION (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING ELECTION PROCESS AND PLAN EFFECTIVENESS (1.2).	2.20	1,573.00	W560	11511491
03/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia MEETING IN NY WITH AKIN AND OTHER ATTORNEYS, ET AL REGARDING NOL ISSUES AND INTERNAL CONFERENCES REGARDING SAME (2.5); REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.7) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.6)	3.80	2,945.00	W560	11544977
03/03/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS CLOSING ISSUES AND EMBRATEL.	0.40	286.00	W560	11513688
03/03/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTION ALLOCATION ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.60	429.00	W560	11513689
03/03/04	Goldring, Stuart TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING ELECTION ALLOCATION	0.30	214.50	W560	11571582
03/03/04	Yoon, Andrew EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL.	0.40	170.00	W560	11415470
03/03/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. COHEN REGARDING STATUS OF PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND APPROVAL OF SAME BY PLATINUM PARTNERS.	0.10	44.50	W560	11419415
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN	0.50	387.50	W560	11621312
03/04/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN	0.50	387.50	W560	11621314
03/04/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILBANK, SHULTE AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTION ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.4); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6).	1.50	1,072.50	W560	11507548
03/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMERGENCE.	1.00	775.00	W560	11617788
03/05/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES.	0.60	429.00	W560	11508924
03/06/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES.	0.40	286.00	W560	11509073
03/07/04	Marcus, Christopher REVIEW AND REVISE WELLS FARGO OBJECTION	4.40	1,870.00	W560	11420685

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/08/04	Fife, Lori	2.60	1,859.00	W560	11508292
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING EMBRATL AND ALLOCATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CAPELLAS, T. SAVAGE AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING ALLOCATION ISSUE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, MATLIN, CERBERUS REGARDING TAX ISSUE (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE BREY REGARDING ELECTION/ALLOCATION ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTION/ALLOCATION ISSUES (.6); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.3).				
03/08/04	Goldring, Stuart	5.50	3,932.50	W560	11434025
	DISCUSS BACKGROUND OF CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENTS WITH C. MARCUS (.7); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH (.4) AND L. FIFE (.6) REGARDING SAME; CALL WITH T. SAVAGE (.2), M. GOLDSTEIN (.3), M. PALMER AND C. MARCUS (.3) AND R. COX (.4) REGARDING ELLIOT ASSOC, AND REVIEW EMAIL FROM ELLIOT ASSOC. (.2); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO T. SAVAGE AND OTHERS REGARDING NOLS (.3); CALL WITH T. SAVAGE, M. GOLDSTEIN AND M. CAPPELAS IN PREPARATION FOR BOARD CALL (.3); PARTICIPATE IN BOARD CALL REGARDING NOLS AND PLAN (1.0); CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) RESEARCH AND APPLICATION (.8)				
03/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W560	11616346
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN				
03/09/04	Fife, Lori	1.50	1,072.50	W560	11512673
	T/CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING ELECTION ALLOCATION ISSUES (.8); CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUDELMAN, J. FINK AND S. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATL (.7).				
03/09/04	Marcus, Christopher	5.70	2,422.50	W560	11434392
	REVIEW AND REVISE WELLS FARGO OBJECTION (3.9) MET WITH C. PULLO REGARDING SAME (.3) MET WITH AKIN GUMP AND STROOCK REGARDING PLAN/TAX ISSUES (1.5)				
03/09/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11427003
	DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. MCCARROLL REGARDING REVIEW OF THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS.				
03/10/04	Jacoby, Mark	0.40	248.00	W560	11517324
	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING RESEARCH ON RULE 30(B)(6) DEPOSITION OF PLAN.				
03/10/04	Fife, Lori	2.00	1,430.00	W560	11510592
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLD REGARDING ELECTION/ALLOCATION ISSUES (.6); MEETING WITH AKIN, STROOCK, OTHER CREDITORS REGARDING ELECTION/ALLOCATION ISSUES (.5); CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.4).				
03/10/04	Goldring, Stuart	11.20	8,008.00	W560	11434019
	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING FACTUAL BACKGROUND OF SECTION 382(L)(5) ANALYSIS (2.0); CALL WITH M. PALMER AND J. UFFNER AND, FOR PART, MARK FRENCH REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) ISSUES (.5); FURTHER CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (.1); DISCUSS WITH D. GOLDEN AT AKIN AND DISCUSS WITH M. SAGE AT STROOCK NEED FOR CREDITOR MEETING (.3); MEETING WITH M. HOENIG REGARDING SAME ISSUES (.3); RESEARCH REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) AND PREPARE SAME FOR CREDITOR MEETING (2.3); CALL WITH HOULIHAN, LAZARD, M. FRENCH AND P. COX REGARDING NOL VALUATION (.4); CALLS WITH M. HOFFENBERG REGARDING 382(L)(5) ISSUES (.9); MEETING WITH AKIN, CERBERUS AND ITS REPRESENTATIVES, ELLIOT AND ITS REPRESENTATIVES, STROOCK, M. GOLDSTEIN, M. HOENIG, M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME AND PLAN IMPLEMENTATION (2.3); FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSION REGARDING SAME WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.6); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO M. FRENCH REGARDING 382(L)(5) VARIATIONS (.3) CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND M. FRENCH REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) VARIATIONS AND RERUNNING MODEL (.7) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING ELECTION/ALLOCATION ISSUES (.5)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/10/04	Marcus, Christopher TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING REJECTION (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING WELLS FARGO (.2)	0.40	170.00	W560	11434282
03/10/04	Holzman, Daniel CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COOPER, N. JONES, M. SILVERIO, M. CHASTKA AND J. MCGAREY.	0.40	178.00	W560	11430393
03/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SEYMOUR LICHT (.4) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.70	542.50	W560	11619511
03/15/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM, F. GREEN, LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL TRANSACTION (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SAME (.4)	1.20	858.00	W560	11513691
03/15/04	Marcus, Christopher REVIEW WELLS FARGO OBJECTION (.8) DRAFT CHRONOLOGY MEMORANDUM FOR S. GOLDRING (1.4)	2.20	935.00	W560	11443992
03/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN ISSUES	0.20	155.00	W560	11621828
03/16/04	Perez, Alfredo TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING SECTION 6.04 OF THE PLAN	0.20	134.00	W560	11458096
03/16/04	Marcus, Christopher REVIEW WELLS FARGO OBJECTION (.9) RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.40	595.00	W560	11444540
03/17/04	Yoon, Andrew EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.	0.70	297.50	W560	11446254
03/17/04	Cohen, Scott MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMERGENCE (.1); EMERGENCE TEAM CALL WITH MCI (.8)	0.90	360.00	W560	11450501
03/17/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. COHEN REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.10); AND THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCCARROLL REGARDING HIS CLIENT'S FINAL REVIEW OF SAME (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCCARROLL REGARDING COMMENTS TO THE PLAN CLOSING ESCROW AGREEMENT AND THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE (.20); REVIEW REDLINES OF DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED BY J. MCCARROLL OF THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE AND THE ESCROW AGREEMENT AND THEN INCORPORATE RELEVANT REVISIONS TO SAME (.20).	0.60	267.00	W560	11443813
03/18/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING EMERGENCE & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.2); DISCUSSION WITH S. GOLD REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. LICHT & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. CHATSKA REGARDING EMERGENCE (.2)	1.00	400.00	W560	11450518
03/18/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.40	178.00	W560	11447015

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW THE REVISED VERSIONS OF THE PLAN ESCROW AND DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE AND FORWARD SAME TO J. MCCARROLL (.20); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. COHEN REGARDING LOGISTICS FOR MAKING DISTRIBUTIONS TO DISSENTING BONDHOLDERS AND TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE MEMBERS AND THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.20).				
03/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W560	11621865
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY, L. FIFE, T. SAVAGE REGARDING NEW DEBT ELECTIONS.				
03/19/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.20	143.00	W560	11450750
	CALL WITH B. COOPER, M. HOERNLEIN AND S. GOLD REGARDING DTC LETTER AND CHARTER RESTRICTION				
03/19/04	Marcus, Christopher	2.00	850.00	W560	11453541
	RESEARCH REGARDING WELLS FARGO (1.8) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK & P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/21/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W560	11451549
	DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. MCCARROLL REGARDING APPROVAL OF TERMS OF THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.10); DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO A. PEREZ REGARDING COLLECTION OF SIGNATURES NEEDED FOR THE WOLRDCOM CLOSING (.10).				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W560	11622007
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING EMERGENCE AND RELATED ISSUES.				
03/22/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.80	620.00	W560	11622045
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
03/22/04	Yoon, Andrew	1.10	467.50	W560	11458308
	EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.				
03/22/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.20	534.00	W560	11466286
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM TO DISCUSS CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS.				
03/22/04	Cohen, Scott	0.10	40.00	W560	11571592
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING PLAN				
03/22/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.30	133.50	W560	11455574
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE UNDER THE PLAN (.10); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. MCCARROLL REGARDING THE REVISED PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING EXECUTION OF THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND TERMS OF THE ESCROW AGREEMENT (.10).				
03/22/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.60	267.00	W560	11455572
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING ESTIMATED CLOSING DATE (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. MCCARROLL REGARDING FINAL APPROVAL OF THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING COLLECTING SIGNATURES ON THE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND RELEASES (.30); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SERIES OF E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. MCCARROLL REGARDING LANGUAGE INCLUDED IN THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE (.10).				
03/22/04	Grogan, James	3.10	1,131.50	W560	11465647

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (1.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. MCCARROLL REGARDING SAME (.5); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS AND A. PEREZ REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH VARIOUS CREDITORS REGARDING SAME (.2).				
03/23/04	Fife, Lori	1.40	1,001.00	W560	11514176
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.8).				
03/23/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W560	11466382
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCCARROLL REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS				
03/24/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W560	11632428
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING PLAN				
03/24/04	Fife, Lori	1.40	1,001.00	W560	11511445
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING FCC ISSUES (.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.5).				
03/24/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11462381
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN AND J. MCCARROLL REGARDING EXECUTION OF THE ESCROW AGREEMENT BY COUNSEL FOR THE COMMITTEES.				
03/24/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W560	11466392
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. DUBLIN REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS				
03/25/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W560	11633155
	CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING ISSUES ON TRADE COMMITTEE DISTRIBUTION (.3) AND REVIEW EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/25/04	Fife, Lori	2.80	2,002.00	W560	11511533
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, S. GOLDRING REGARDING FCC ISSUES AND PREPARATION FOR MEETING (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE TALKING POINTS (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM AND FCC REGARDING LICENSE ISSUES (1.0).				
03/25/04	Goldring, Stuart	2.80	2,002.00	W560	11472233
	CALL WITH R. WITT, N. JONES, L. SMITH, S. SCHEFFMAN, D. GUARD, F. DIMINICH, L. FIFE AND I. FROM REGARDING FCC INFORMATION REQUEST (1.3); CONFER WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TALKING POINTS FOR FCC MEETING (.3); REVIEW REVISION TO SAME (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH FCC REPRS. AND OTHERS REGARDING FOREIGN OWNERSHIP (.9)				
03/25/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	2.00	650.00	W560	11475464
	REVIEW PLAN, DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PROOF OF CLAIM.				
03/25/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W560	11470402
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PALAZOLLA REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS FOR PLAN OF REORGANIZATION (.1); CORRESPOND WITH P. DUBLIN REGARDING SAME (.1).				
03/26/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W560	11633821
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING PLAN OF REORGANIZATION				
03/26/04	Gietz, Raymond	2.10	1,501.50	W560	11500484

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW PLAN DOCUMENTS.				
03/26/04	Fife, Lori	0.80	572.00	W560	11507864
	CONFERENCE'S WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOL ISSUES.				
03/26/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W560	11469856
	REVIEW COMMUNICATION FROM S. POHL REGARDING NOES TO BE ISSUED				
03/26/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.60	255.00	W560	11466160
	EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.				
03/26/04	Marcus, Christopher	0.30	127.50	W560	11470747
	REVISE AND FILE CLEC CONSOLIDATION SPREADSHEET SUPPLEMENT				
03/26/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.50	222.50	W560	11477111
	EMERGENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, M. CHASTKA, F. DIMINICH, M. MEROLA, B. COOPER, A. YOON.				
03/29/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W560	11633902
	MEETING WITH L. FIFE, S. GOLD, ET AL REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
03/29/04	Fife, Lori	4.70	3,360.50	W560	11511506
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD AND J. GOLDENBERG REGARDING ELECTION/NOL ISSUES (1.8); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, F. GREEN AND S. GOLD REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES JONES AND OTHERS AT WORLDCOM REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6); REVIEW CLOSING ISSUES AND DOCUMENTS (.8).				
03/29/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.20	858.00	W560	11485089
	REVIEW DRAFT SUBMISSION TO FCC REGARDING 5% OWNERSHIP (.6) AND PROVIDE PRELIMINARY COMMENTS (.3); DISCUSS EXTENT OF OWNERSHIP WITH I. FROIM (.3)				
03/29/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.50	335.00	W560	11516925
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. KOTLER AND T. VOGEL REGARDING CLEC CONSOLIDATION				
03/29/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W560	11479662
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING CHANGE IN NOTICE PARTY FOR PLATINUM PARTNERS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING REVISIONS TO PLATINUM PARTNERS' NOTICE PARTY ON THE PLAN CLOSING ESCROW AGREEMENT (.10).				
03/29/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	3.00	975.00	W560	11475472
	PREPARE SUMMARY OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN.				
03/29/04	Grogan, James	1.90	693.50	W560	11505051
	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. MCCARROLL, D. ALBAUGH, S. BEVILLE, J. SAVIN, K. DAVIS, M. PALMER, R. JACKSON AND A. PALAZOLLA REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.2); REVIEW AND REVISE CERTAIN PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.5); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. MCCARROLL AND A. PALAZOLLA REGARDING SAME (.2).				
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W560	11632716
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE (IN LONDON), L. FIFE AND A. PEREZ REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
03/30/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.30	1,007.50	W560	11633580

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ AND S. COHEN REGARDING SEYMOUR LICHT (.8) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ AND SEYMOUR LICHT REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/30/04	Fife, Lori	4.60	3,289.00	W560	11511993
	CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLDRING, KOST, FRENCH REGARDING NOL/ELECTION ISSUES (2.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FRENCH, MCI, S. GOLDRING, KOST REGARDING NOL/ELECTION ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH STROOCK REGARDING ELECTION ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, T. SAVAGE AND KOST REGARDING NOL ISSUES (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE FCC LETTER (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOL ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES AND S. COHEN REGARDING PLAN OF RECOGNITION (.2).				
03/30/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.70	1,215.50	W560	11484116
	DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO D. PEARLSTEIN REGARDING CERTAIN CREDITOR OWNERSHIP REGARDING FCC (.1), AND TO L. FIFE REGARDING FRESH START ACCOUNTING (.2); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT LETTER TO FCC (1.4)				
03/30/04	Marcus, Christopher	0.60	255.00	W560	11487930
	ATTN TO EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES				
03/30/04	Cohen, Scott	3.30	1,320.00	W560	11527965
	DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUE (.3); STATUS CONFERENCE REGARDING LICHT & RELATED DISCUSSIONS (.8); DRAFT LICHT RESPONSE (2.2)				
03/30/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11483543
	CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING THE MATLINPATTERSON DISPUTE CONCERNING THE NOL ORDER.				
03/30/04	Grogan, James	1.20	438.00	W560	11502848
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GILL REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PALAZOLLA REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.1); REVIEW CLOSING DOCUMENTS FROM PLATINUM PARTNERS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. JACKSON AND J. SAVIN REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.5).				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W560	11632954
	CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W560	11632722
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W560	11632933
	REVIEW LICHT RESPONSE (.3) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING LICHT RESPONSE (.3)				
03/31/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W560	11632955
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
03/31/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.20	858.00	W560	11485081
	CALL WITH F. DIMINICH REGARDING CERTAIN CREDITOR OWNERSHIP REGARDING FCC FILINGS (.3), AND FOLLOW-UP (.2) DISCUSS SAME WITH I. FROIM (.2); DRAFT AND SEND EMAILS TO SAME, N. JONES, L. FIFE AND OTHERS REGARDING SAME (.5)				
03/31/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.80	480.00	W560	11489389

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING CALL				
03/31/04	Marcus, Christopher	2.10	892.50	W560	11499048
	RESEARCH REGARDING BANK CLASS 5 CLAIM (1.9) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. EVERETT REGARDING SAME (.2)				
03/31/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W560	11485082
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH EMERGENCE TEAM AND N. JONES TO DISCUSS EMERGENCE ITEMS.				
03/31/04	Cohen, Scott	1.00	400.00	W560	11528555
	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES (.3) & CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD REGARDING EMERGENCE (.7)				
03/31/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.60	267.00	W560	11513949
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING REQUESTED REVISION TO THE TRADE CLAIMS' COMMITTEE RELEASE AND THEN REVIEW RELEVANT FORM OF RELEASE (.20); REVIEW FURTHER E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING CARVE-OUT OF THE MERRILL LYNCH CLAIM (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BEVILLE AND J. GROGAN REGARDING EXECUTION OF RELEASE BY EACH OF THE MEMBERS OF THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE AND DRAFTING LETTER AGREEMENT REGARDING SAME (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING WHETHER THE ESCROW AGREEMENT HAS BEEN SIGNED (.10).				
03/31/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	2.50	812.50	W560	11495776
	PREPARE SUMMARY OF PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND MEMORANDUM REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO BOTH.				
03/31/04	Grogan, James	2.80	1,022.00	W560	11510646
	MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. SAVIN, J. MCCARROLL, S. BEVILLE, D. ALBAUGH, J. GILL AND R. JACKSON REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.3); REVIEW EXECUTED AGREEMENTS WITH AD HOC TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE (.4); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BEVILLE REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. BEVILLE REGARDING SAME (.5).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W560 - PLAN CONFIRMATION:		133.90	\$ 80,709.50		
03/01/04	Merola, Michael	1.00	475.00	W570	11517574
	ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING SUBSIDIARY GUARANTORS OF MCI.				
03/01/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.20	74.00	W570	11418959
	DRAFTED EMAIL TO D. ROBINSON AT TITLE CO. REGARDING RELEASE DOCUMENT FOR UUNET WAY, VA SITE				
03/02/04	Goldman, Jeremy	1.00	370.00	W570	11418620
	REVIEW OF RELEASE DOCUMENTS (.5); FILING OF DOCUMENTS RELATING TO THE DIP FINANCING, VA SUBDIVISION AND BANKRUPTCY EMERGENCE (.5).				
03/03/04	Merola, Michael	0.50	237.50	W570	11516865
	REVISIONS TO INDENTURE.				
03/04/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.30	111.00	W570	11429092
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH TITLE CO. REGARDING VA RELEASE.				
03/10/04	Merola, Michael	2.00	950.00	W570	11517266

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVISIONS TO INDENTURES.				
03/11/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.20	74.00	W570	11445145
	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH TITLE CO. REGARDING RECORDATION OF VA RELEASE (.1); EMAILED FINAL RECORDING INFORMATION TO R. CHOZICK (.1).				
03/17/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.20	74.00	W570	11446169
	ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES				
03/19/04	Merola, Michael	1.00	475.00	W570	11517579
	REVIEW OF 10-K.				
03/19/04	Merola, Michael	4.50	2,137.50	W570	11517575
	REVIEW OF INDENTURES AND E-MAIL TO CREDITORS COMMITTEE REGARDING CHANGES TO INDENTURES.				
03/19/04	Goldman, Jeremy	3.90	1,443.00	W570	11464312
	PREPARATION OF DRAFT EXECUTION COPIES OF RELEASES FOR CONFIRMATION BY S&S (2.9); DRAFTED COVER EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.4) AND REVISED CLOSING CHECKLIST (.6).				
03/22/04	Merola, Michael	1.00	475.00	W570	11517576
	ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING CLOSING.				
03/24/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.80	296.00	W570	11464858
	VA RELEASE ISSUES; CALLS TO ROBINSON REGARDING ORIGINAL RELEASE (.2); COMPLETED EXECUTION PACKAGE FOR EMERGENCE (.6).				
03/25/04	Yoon, Andrew	1.30	552.50	W570	11463374
	REVIEW WGM OPINION FOR EXIT FACILITIES.				
03/25/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.80	296.00	W570	11474034
	SEARCH OF FILES FOR GA SALE LEASEBACK DOCUMENTS PER D. AGEE REQUEST (.6); VA RELEASE ISSUES INCLUDING MAILING OF ORIGINAL (.1) AND TITLE CO. BILL (.1).				
03/26/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.30	180.00	W570	11467895
	DISCUSS OUTSTANDING CLOSING ITEMS ON LETTER OF CREDIT FACILITIES AND NEW NOTES INDENTURES WITH A. YOON				
03/26/04	Yoon, Andrew	1.30	552.50	W570	11466156
	REVISE WGM OPINION FOR EXIT LC FACILITIES (1.0) CONFERENCES WITH D. URQUHART REGARDING LETTER OF CREDIT FACILITIES (.3)				
03/26/04	Merola, Michael	1.00	475.00	W570	11517619
	EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING.				
03/30/04	Goldman, Jeremy	2.70	999.00	W570	11490815
	REVISED CLOSING CHECKLIST (.3); REVIEWED, COMPILED AND SENT EXECUTION COPIES OF RELEASE DOCUMENTS TO SHEARMAN & STERLING AND DRAFTED COVER EMAIL REGARDING SAME (1.2); DISCUSSED UCC-3 ISSUES WITH SCHELL (.1); REVIEW OF FILES AND RECORDS FOR GA SALE LEASEBACK DOCUMENTS (1.0) AND PDF'ED SAME TO AGEE (.1).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W570 - EXIT FINANCING:		24.00	\$ 10,247.00		

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/01/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET REPORT	0.10	36.50	W650	11427503
03/02/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET REPORT	0.10	36.50	W650	11427659
03/03/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET	0.10	36.50	W650	11428118
03/03/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11416938
03/03/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W650	11424135
03/04/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET (.1); CORRESPOND WITH C. CHEZEM REGARDING ALLEGIANCE CORRESPONDENCE (.2).	0.30	109.50	W650	11428094
03/04/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11416977
03/05/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO DRAWING ON LETTER OF CREDIT INCLUDING COMMUNICATIONS FROM B. BENJET AND J. GROGAN	0.20	134.00	W650	11418466
03/05/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ AND B. BENJET REGARDING ALLEGIANCE LETTER OF CREDIT	0.40	146.00	W650	11428065
03/08/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET	0.10	36.50	W650	11430813
03/09/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH C. CHEZEM REGARDING UNDER UTILIZATION CHARGES (.2); RESEARCH SAME (.9); CONFER WITH R. WELLS REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.40	511.00	W650	11430859
03/10/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING UNDER UTILIZATION ISSUES	0.30	109.50	W650	11430825
03/10/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.50	120.00	W650	11440498
03/11/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET (.1); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING UNDER UTILIZATION CHANGES (.2).	0.30	109.50	W650	11430827
03/11/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W650	11440441
03/12/04	Grogan, James	0.50	182.50	W650	11430860

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. CHEZEM REGARDING UNDER UTILIZATION CHARGES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING SAME (.2).				
03/12/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11432949
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/12/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W650	11440603
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/15/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11439916
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/17/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11441976
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/17/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W650	11451588
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/18/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11452093
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/19/04	Mitchel, Gayle	2.50	400.00	W650	11452272
	DOWNLOAD DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); HARD COPY DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, PLAN AND MOTION TO APPROVE FOR J. GROGAN AND C. LOPEZ, PDF, ZIP AND FORWARD TO J. A. MARTINEZ, S. HENDRICKSON, N. BANNISTER, C. SCHULTZ, B. BENJET, C. CHEZEM AND J. GROGAN, TELECOM FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING ABOVE (2.2).				
03/21/04	Lopez, Christopher	0.40	100.00	W650	11448981
	REVIEW PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OF ALLEGIANCE TELECOM IN CONNECTION WITH RESEARCH ON INTERMEDIA FOR J. GROGAN.				
03/22/04	Grogan, James	0.50	182.50	W650	11465670
	CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING ALLEGIANCE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET (.2).				
03/22/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11456495
	DOWNLOAD DOCKET AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/23/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.10	357.50	W650	11457346
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (.2); REVIEW SAME (.5); REVIEW DOCKET (.4).				
03/23/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11460233
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/24/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	2.00	650.00	W650	11461109
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN SUMMARY (.2); REVIEW DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, DOCKET AND PROOF OF CLAIM (1.8).				
03/24/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W650	11466393
	CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ALLEGIANCE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/25/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11466229
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
03/25/04	Jalomo, Chris	0.50	40.00	W650	11511776
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
03/26/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.20	390.00	W650	11475470
	REVIEW PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND CORRESPOND WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME.				
03/26/04	Grogan, James	1.50	547.50	W650	11471484
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PREPARE MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME (1.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET REPORT (.1);				
03/29/04	Grogan, James	2.70	985.50	W650	11505052
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE DOCKET REPORT (.2); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ALLEGIANCE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVIEW SAME AND PREPARE SUMMARY REGARDING SAME (2.3).				
03/29/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.70	112.00	W650	11476398
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); DOCKET AND ONLINE SEARCH FOR LEVEL 3 COMMUNICATIONS ORDER FOR S. LOFTSPRING (.4)				
03/30/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	3.80	1,235.00	W650	11479933
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (.5); PREPARE MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME (3.0); RESEARCH SUBSTANTIVE CONSOLIDATION ISSUE RAISED IN DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (.3).				
03/30/04	Grogan, James	1.90	693.50	W650	11502849
	CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ALLEGIANCE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5); REVIEW MEMORANDA AND CASE LAW RELATED TO SAME (.8); CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING INDENTURE TRUSTEE CLAIMS IN ALLEGIANCE (.4); REVIEW SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.1)				
03/30/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.30	208.00	W650	11483581
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); SEARCH FOR BANK OF NEW YORK, AS INDENTURE TRUSTEE PROOF OF CLAIM AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.1.0)				
03/30/04	Mitchel, Gayle	4.70	752.00	W650	11483727
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3) SEARCH FOR NOL ORDER REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS FOR J. GROGAN, TELEPHONE CALL REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK, SEARCH DOCKET AND PROVIDE COPY OF BLOCKBUSTER AGREEMENT AND ORDER APPROVING SAME TO S. NEWELL (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. BILLECK, DOCKET SEARCH AND TRANSMIT COPY OF CDI STIPULATION (.3); REGARDING-SERVE RETURNED 25 TOWERS MOTIONS TO UPDATED ADDRESSES (.5); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE FOR PLEADINGS FILED 3/29/04 (.5); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT REQUESTED PLEADINGS TO S. LOFTSPRING (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS REGARDING THE MOTIONS SCHEDULED FOR HEARING ON 4/20/04, REPLY TO S. COHEN EMAIL REGARDING AVAILABLE WORLDCOM HEARING DATES (.2); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE FOR FEE STATEMENTS FILED TODAY (.5); LOG IN HARD COPY OF 2/2/04 HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.1); DOCKET CHECK FOR FEE ORDER (.3); CODE CASE FILING (1.2).				
03/30/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W650	11512481
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/31/04	Grogan, James REVIEW ALLEGIANCE PLEADINGS REGARDING NORTEL SETTLEMENT, FEE APPLICATIONS AND LEVEL 3 AGREEMENT (.5); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET (.1);	0.60	219.00	W650	11510644
03/31/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11511211
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W650 - MCI/ALLEGIANCE:		38.90	\$ 9,393.50		
03/18/04	Strochak, Adam PREPARE LETTER TO JUDGE SWAIN REGARDING MCLAUGHLIN APPEAL	0.40	220.00	W670	11489611
03/19/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. STROCHAK AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING COURT'S INQUIRY ON STATUS OF THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE APPEAL AND THEN DRAFT E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.10); CONTACT JUDGE STEIN'S DEPUTY REGARDING STATUS OF APPEAL AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING DRAFTING SUMMARY OF STATUS (.20).	0.30	133.50	W670	11448285
03/19/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD DOCKET OF AD HOC TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE APPEAL FOR L. PROTOPAPAS AND FORWARD NAME AND TELEPHONE NUMBER OF JUDGE STEIN'S DEPUTY, STATUS LETTER TO JUDGE STEIN REGARDING PENDANCY OF CASE	0.80	128.00	W670	11452273
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W670 - APPEALS:		1.50	\$ 481.50		
03/01/04	Billeck, Jason RECEIVE AND REVIEW PRIOR SETTLEMENT AND MEMORANDUM REGARDING BAD DEBT OF ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC. (.7) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN AND N. BEIZER REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.90	373.50	W690	11422281
03/01/04	Grogan, James CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN PREPETITION SETTLEMENT (.1); REVIEW SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING PREPETITION ATN CLAIMS (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BANNISTER AND J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN PREPETITION SETTLEMENT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH N. BANNISTER REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.90	328.50	W690	11427499
03/02/04	Billeck, Jason RECEIVE AND REVIEW ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S INTERROGATORY RESPONSES (.3) AND DRAFT LETTER TO ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC. REGARDING SAME (1).	1.30	539.50	W690	11422283
03/02/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH A. QUACKENBUSH AND J. BILLECK REGARDING CYPRESS COMMUNICATION'S ANSWER DEADLINE	0.20	73.00	W690	11427660
03/03/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ATTORNEY, B. BENJET, B. TROSPER, AND J. GROGAN REGARDING ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S OUTSTANDING DISCOVERY RESPONSES, STATUS OF ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND AN AGREEMENT REGARDING SAME AND ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ANSWER TO THE ADVERSARY COMPLAINT.	1.30	539.50	W690	11422586

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
03/03/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH J. BILLECK, B. BENJET AND T. VOGEL REGARDING ATN DISCOVERY REQUESTS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. PARRISH AND J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN ANSWER (.2);	0.40	146.00	W690	11428122
03/03/04	Mitchel, Gayle ELECTRONICALLY FILE AFFIDAVITS OF PROCESS SERVERS ON CYPRESS COMMUNICATIONS AND ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK (.4); TRANSMIT COPY OF FILED COMPLAINT, SUMMONS AND AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE TO J. BILLECK (.2).	0.60	96.00	W690	11416939
03/04/04	Grogan, James CONFER WITH C. LOPEZ REGARDING ATN COMPLAINT AND THE AUTOMATIC STAY (.2); REVIEW CASES PERTAINING TO SAME (.3); CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. QUACKENBUSH REGARDING STIPULATION WITH CYPRESS IN ATN ADVERSARY PROCEEDING (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (.5); CORRESPOND WITH A. QUACKENBUSH REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.2).	2.00	730.00	W690	11428092
03/05/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH CYPRESS ATTORNEY AND J. GROGAN REGARDING ANSWER DATE AND RELATED STIPULATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC. AND CYPRESS (.3); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH VERESTAR'S ATTORNEY REGARDING THE WORLDCOM/VERESTAR STIPULATION (.2)	0.50	207.50	W690	11422584
03/05/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH A. QUACKENBUSH REGARDING CYPRESS ANSWER DATE	0.20	73.00	W690	11428064
03/09/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN AND J. PARRISH REGARDING ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK'S ANSWER DATE AND DISCOVERY RESPONSES.	0.40	166.00	W690	11437617
03/09/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. PARRISH REGARDING ATN ANSWER DEADLINE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET, T. VOGEL AND J. BILLECK REGARDING SAME (.3).	0.50	182.50	W690	11430817
03/17/04	Calles, Linda REVIEW AND CODE DOCUMENTS FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (3.5); UPDATE FILE OUTLINE (0.5).	4.00	580.00	W690	11456299
03/18/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S COUNSEL REGARDING ITS ANSWER.	0.70	290.50	W690	11455963
03/24/04	Lopez, Christopher DUE DILIGENCE ON DISCOVERY RECEIVED FROM J. PARISH (BANKRUPTCY COUNSEL FOR ATN)	0.40	100.00	W690	11462673
03/29/04	Grogan, James EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. BILLECK AND A. QUACKENBUSH REGARDING ATN ANSWER	0.20	73.00	W690	11505054
03/30/04	Grogan, James CONFER WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN DISCOVERY	0.30	109.50	W690	11502850
03/31/04	Billeck, Jason	1.50	622.50	W690	11509081

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PREPARE SCHEDULING ORDER FOR THE ADVERSARY PROCEEDING (1.0); COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET, ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ATTORNEY AND CYPRESS'S ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME (.2); AND DRAFT DEPOSITION NOTICE TO ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC. (.3)				
03/31/04	Calles, Linda	3.30	478.50	W690	11512260
	REVIEW AND CODE DOCUMENTS FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (3.0); UPDATE FILE OUTLINE (0.3).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W690 - ATN:		19.60	\$ 5,709.00		
03/01/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W710	11427504
	CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ, J. BILLECK AND T. RICHARDSON REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIM				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W710 - PT CABLE:		0.10	\$ 36.50		
GRAND TOTAL:		4,083.70	\$ 1,661,009.00		

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/01/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM COMPANY REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE.	0.40	\$ 286.00	W110	11612611
04/01/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET	0.10	49.50	W110	11621315
04/01/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE REGARDING FILINGS	0.20	80.00	W110	11537596
04/01/04	Grogan, James REVIEW WORLDCOM CASE DOCKET	0.10	36.50	W110	11536771
04/01/04	Long, Tom CREATE INDEX FOR CORRESPONDENCE AND PLEADINGS IN PREPARATION FOR ARCHIVING FILE.	1.30	97.50	W110	11538910
04/01/04	Reifman, Marli ORGANIZE EXHIBITS FROM WELLS FARGO HEARING FOR P FRIEDMAN	2.00	260.00	W110	11590699
04/01/04	Devine, Kim REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND CHART DUE DATES.	3.00	450.00	W110	11584572
04/01/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.7); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM N. VANDERHOOP, LAZARD FRERES, REGARDING LAZARD'S JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SOUTH FLORIDA RULE 2004 MOTION TO 5/11/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S. E. COHEN (.1); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM M. GOLDMAN, JENNER & BLOCK, REGARDING 4/6/04 HEARING AGENDA (.1); SEARCH DOCKET FOR RAUL ACOSTA OBJECTION AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO CONFIRM THE WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION HAS BEEN RECEIVED IN CHAMBERS WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO S. LOFTSPRING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN KIMBALL MATTERS TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO D. HANDZO, JENNER & BLOCK (.1); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT MMDS ORDER TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING 4/6/04 HEARING MATTERS (.2); CALL TO CHAMBERS TO CHECK ON AVAILABILITY OF 4/27 HEARING DATE, ADJOURN SPECTRUM RESOURCES MOTION TO 4/27/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. THOMPSON (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. GROGAN, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN IMAGISTICS CROSS-MOTION HEARING TO 5/4/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO L. TAYLOR, DUANE MORRIS, AND J. GROGAN (.1); SEARCH DOCKET TO CONFIRM CDI PRESENTMENT UNCONTESTED WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. BILLECK (.4); EMAIL 1/13/04 AND 2/2/04 HEARING TRANSCRIPT TO CHAMBERS AT REQUEST OF J. GROGAN (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. FISHER, HURON CONSULTING, REGARDING FEE STATEMENT (.1); SEARCH DOCKET FOR BSI RETENTION ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.3); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE OBJECTION TO MOTION OF LOWE ENTERPRISES FOR LATE CLAIM FILING, EMAIL FILING RECEIPT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.8); LATE DOCKET CHECK FOR OBJECTIONS TP 4/6/04 MOTIONS, DOWNLOAD AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, REVISIONS TO 4/6/04 AGENDA AND HEARING CHART (1.3)	5.20	832.00	W110	11528079
04/01/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn FILE OCP AFFIDAVITS (0.4); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (0.6).	1.00	150.00	W110	11548241
04/01/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W110	11536945
04/02/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET	0.10	49.50	W110	11620318
04/02/04	Strochak, Adam	2.10	1,155.00	W110	11621011

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH AUDIFAX (1.3); CONFERENCES WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING SAME (0.8)				
04/02/04	Cohen, Scott	1.60	640.00	W110	11537606
	DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING LICHT RESPONSE (1.3); MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMERGENCE (.3)				
04/02/04	Devine, Kim	5.00	750.00	W110	11584804
	RETRIEVE COPIES OF PLAN STIPULATIONS (1.0); REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND PREPARE CHART REGARDING DUE DATES (4.0).				
04/02/04	McGee, Betty	0.20	31.00	W110	11599537
	UPDATE DOCKET AND REVIEW SAME FOR RESPONSES TO SETTLEMENT MOTION WITH NORTHWEST PIPELINE AND REPORT FINDINGS				
04/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle	6.20	992.00	W110	11528083
	TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING BP INTERNATIONAL MOTION SET FOR HEARING 4/6/04 (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO VERITEXT REGARDING 1/12/04 HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.1); DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.2); SEARCH DOCKET FOR AND PROVIDE HARD COPY OF PLATINUM PARTNERS PLAN STIPULATION TO J. GROGAN (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. TAYLOR, DELOITTE & TOUCHE, REGARDING DELOITTE AND DELOITTE CONSULTING FEE STATEMENTS (.1); REPLY TO A. STROCHAK EMAIL REGARDING 4/20/04 HEARING DATE AVAILABILITY (.1); PREPARE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR 4/5/04, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE SAME (.8); SEARCH DOCKET FOR NOTICE FOR C. WATKINS (.3); EMAIL 4/6/04 HEARING CHART TO ATTORNEYS WITH OPEN MATTERS (.1); REPLY TO S.E. COHEN EMAIL REGARDING LICHT HEARING TIME CHANGE (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN OHIO CLAIM DATE EXTENSION HEARING TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK (.1); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN 6TH OMNIBUS HEARING TO 5/11/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO T. TSEKERIDES (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM V. GREENFIELD, GLOBAL DEBT SOLUTIONS, REQUESTING NAME OF DISBURSING AGENT (.1); TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM C. WATKINS REGARDING GRAYSON OBJECTION (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM C. WATKINS REGARDING AUDIOFAX RULE 9019 MOTION, PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE SAME WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO C. WATKINS (.8); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE OBJECTION TO GRAYSON LIFT STAY, WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO C. WATKINS AD C. PIERCE (1.2)				
04/02/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.60	690.00	W110	11548199
	FILE AND SERVE DEBTORS' RESPONSE TO LICHT MOTION (0.6); RETRIEVE AND E-MAIL J. RHODES NOTICES OF REJECTION REGARDING IFN (1.0); RETRIEVE AND E-MAIL S. COHEN ALL NOTICE AND MOTIONS REJECTING LEASES (3.0).				
04/02/04	Jalomo, Chris	0.50	40.00	W110	11536947
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
04/02/04	Jalomo, Chris	4.50	360.00	W110	11537032
	UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.5); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.5); REWRITE DELOITTE & TOUCHE AND DELOITTE CONSULTING FEE STATEMENT DOCUMENTS IN PDF FORMAT AS REQUESTED BY G. MITCHELL (1.5).				
04/02/04	Serrano, Jessica	0.30	43.50	W110	11589843
	ASSISTED J. DE LOS SANTOS WITH SERVICE MAILING OF RESPONSE TO LICHT MOTION				
04/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W110	11634511
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS.				
04/05/04	Strochak, Adam	1.10	605.00	W110	11621538

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALL FROM J. JACOBS (MCI) REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION ISSUES (0.3); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. LOFTSPRING, J. GROGAN, G. MITCHEL REGARDING PREPARATION FOR APRIL 6 HEARING ON VARIOUS CONTESTED MATTERS (0.8)				
04/05/04	Cohen, Scott	4.40	1,760.00	W110	11537557
	MOTION DECLARATORY JUDGMENT				
04/05/04	Wang, Shauin	4.60	690.00	W110	11535178
	VARIOUS E-MAILS TO AND FROM G. MITCHELL REGARDING HEARING PREP FOR 4/6/2004 (.6); 2 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. MITCHELL REGARDING SAME (.5) PREPARE AND ORGANIZE DOCUMENTS FOR HEARING (1.8) PREPARE ORDERS FOR JUDGE (.7) CREATE LABELS AND ORGANIZE FOR SAME (1.0)				
04/05/04	Mitchel, Gayle	10.20	1,632.00	W110	11530962
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.3); DOWNLOAD AND TRANSMIT 1/12/04 HEARING TRANSCRIPT TO S. TOMASHEFSKY, JENNER & BLOCK, AND J. GROGAN (.2); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT COMMITTEE'S JOINDER TO LOWE OBJECTION TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN TELCOVE MOTION TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO E. MILLER, PIPER RUDNICK (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO A. STROCHAK REGARDING 4/6/04 HEARING MATERIALS, TELEPHONE CALLS TO S. WANG TO COORDINATE TRANSMITTAL AND DELIVERY TO A. STROCHAK IN NEW YORK, EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK REGARDING OPEN ITEMS ON 4/6/04 AGENDA (.4); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM B. ELWOOD, PATTON BOGGS, REGARDING 3RD AND 4TH INTERIM FEE PERIODS (.1); EMAIL TO S.E. COHEN REGARDING TIME ESTIMATE ON LICHT MOTION (.1); TRANSMIT DRAFT OF 4/6/04 AGENDA TO F. GRESE, COMMITTEE PARALEGAL (.1); FILE EXHIBIT A TO DEBTORS' OBJECTION TO MOTION OF LOWE ENTERPRISES TO ALLOW LATE-FILED CLAIM INADVERTENTLY OMITTED FROM ORIGINAL FILING, SERVICE AND CONFIRMATION EMAIL TO S. LOFTSPRING (.5); PREPARE AGREED ORDER AND JOINT STIPULATION RESOLVING DEBTORS OBJECTION TO HOFFMAN CONSTRUCTION CO. PROOFS OF CLAIM FOR S. STOLTE, STINSON MORRISON, AND SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR SIGNATURE (.5); REPLY TO EMAIL OF L. SALOMON, HARRITY SNYDER, REGARDING ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS ABOUT FEE STATEMENTS AND APPLICATIONS (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN C.G. YOUNG MATTER TO 4/13/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO M. GOLDMAN, JENNER & BLOCK (.1); SEARCH U.S. DISTRICT CT., WESTERN DISTRICT OF WASHINGTON (TACOMA) FOR PT CABLE INC. V SPRINT COMMUNICATION, ET AL., PULL DOCKET AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.4); TRANSMIT COPY OF INFORMAL SEVERANCE RESPONSE TO MOTION TO APPROVE AMENDED BP INTERNATIONAL SERVICE AGREEMENT TO R. LEHANE AT REQUEST OF J. GROGAN (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON LIFT STAY HEARING TO 5/4/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO J. BILLECK (.1); TRANSMIT LAHTI ORDER AND PROPOSED PROOFS OF CLAIM TO S. WANG FOR A. STROCHAK 4/6/04 HEARING FOLDER AT REQUEST OF S. LOFTSPRING (.2); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.5); REVISIONS TO 4/6/04 AGENDA AND HEARING CHART, PREPARATION OF TIME GRID FOR JUDGE GONZALEZ, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS, INCORPORATE JUDGE'S REVISIONS, REGARDING-SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS, FILE, SERVE, FAX TO US TRUSTEE, FAX TO S. NETHERLAND AT REQUEST OF J. GROGAN (3.8); EMAIL FROM M. O'REILLY, GIBBONS DEL DEO, REGARDING AEGIS MATTER ON 4/6/04 AGENDA, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS, AMENDMENTS TO AGENDA, TELEPHONE CALL TO M. O'REILLY, FILE, SERVE, FAX TO US TRUSTEE, FAX TO S. NETHERLAND AT REQUEST OF J. GROGAN, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW SITE (1.0).				
04/06/04	Strochak, Adam	0.30	165.00	W110	11621593
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM C. WATKINS, D. SMORODIN (MCI) REGARDING REVIEW OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS				
04/06/04	Cohen, Scott	2.10	840.00	W110	11537563
	PREPARE FOR LICHT HEARING AND CONDUCT HEARING (1.8); MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CREDITOR QUESTIONS (.3)				
04/06/04	Devine, Kim	2.70	405.00	W110	11584809
	REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND PREPARE CHART DUE DATES.				
04/06/04	McGee, Betty	0.30	46.50	W110	11600157

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW EMAIL FROM K. SIMPSON (.1); REVIEW DOCKET FOR MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF PLAN CONFIRMATION AND DOWNLOAD AND TRANSMIT TO K. SIMPSON (.2)				
04/06/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.10	16.00	W110	11533400
	ONLINE DOCKET CHECK, EMAIL TO ATTORNEYS-NO PLEADINGS FILED 4/5/04				
04/06/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.50	240.00	W110	11533401
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE KPMG JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO FIRM				
04/06/04	Mitchel, Gayle	6.90	1,104.00	W110	11533402
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM P. CROSBY AND CHAMBERS, REGARDING DECISION TO BE RENDERED IN AEGIS, EMAIL TO P. CROSBY (.2); RESEARCH DEFAULT CURE PROCEDURE CHANGES, IF ANY, FROM ORIGINAL PLAN THRU ALL MODIFICATIONS, EMAIL TO J. BILLECK (2.0); RESEARCH FRCP, BANKRUPTCY RULES AND CODE FOR OBJECTION REPLY/RESPONSE PROCEDURE, TELEPHONE CALL TO C. WATKINS, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN GRAYSON MATTER TO 5/4/04 (.8); PREPARE AND SUBMIT AGREED ORDER REGARDING AMBER ELECTRICAL TO CHAMBERS AT REQUEST OF S. STOLTE, STINSON MORRISON (.5); NOON DOCKET CHECK FOR J. BILLECK (.3); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM A. MILLER, STINSON MORRISON, REGARDING PROCEDURE FOR SUBMITTING AGREED ORDER (.2); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.6); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. SHAIKEN REGARDING BAR DATE NOTICE SERVICE TO RAUL ACOSTA (.1); REGARDING-TRANSMIT CHOICE ONE AND WILMINGTON TRUST REAL ESTATE PURCHASE ORDERS TO CHAMBERS AT REQUEST OF DEPUTY CLERK (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO CHECK ON STATUS OF CDI ORDER FOR J. BILLECK (.1); LATE DOCKET CHECK FOR J. BILLECK, DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE ENTERED ORDERS TO R. WELLS, J. GROGAN (.4); BEGIN REVISIONS TO AGENDA FOR 4/8/04 AND 4/9/04 (.4).				
04/06/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.00	160.00	W110	11546778
	CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0).				
04/07/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11621934
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET				
04/07/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W110	11546924
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET				
04/07/04	Reifman, Marli	0.90	117.00	W110	11590490
	DOCKET SEARCH FOR A. STROCHAK				
04/07/04	Devine, Kim	3.10	465.00	W110	11584822
	RETRIEVE COPIES OF ENTERED STIPULATIONS (.1); REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS AND PREPARE CHART REGARDING DUE DATES (3.0)				
04/07/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.50	1,200.00	W110	11542512
	REPLY TO EMAIL FROM L. SALOMON, HARRITY & SNYDER, REGARDING NOTICE PROVISIONS AND PROCEDURES (.1), DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.0); SEARCH DOCKET FOR CDI ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO J. BILLECK (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR WILMINGTON TRUST CLAIM STIPULATION AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR HOFFMAN CONSTRUCTION STIPULATION AND AGREED ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO S. STOLTE, SINTON MORRISON (.3); UPDATE MASTER SERVICE LIST, EMAIL UPDATES TO M. REIFMAN AND J. DE LOS SANTOS (.5); UPDATE APRIL AND MAY CASE CALENDARS AND DISTRIBUTE TO WORKING GROUP (2.0); UPDATE 4/8/04 NOTICE OF AGENDA, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS, ELECTRONICALLY FILE, SERVE, FAX TO US TRUSTEE AND UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW SITE (.7); REVISE AND UPDATE 4/13/04 HEARING CHART, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO DISCUSS COURT'S ON-LINE CALENDAR FOR 4/13, BEGIN DRAFT OF 4/13/04 AGENDA (2.3).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/07/04	Serrano, Jessica	2.20	319.00	W110	11590942
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING FILING OF NOTICE (0.2) FILED AND SERVED NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING REGARDING TELEFONOS DE MEXICO (2.0)				
04/08/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.20	99.00	W110	11617304
	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET [0.1]; REVIEW CASE CALENDAR [0.1]				
04/08/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W110	11546932
	REVIEW WORLDCOM DOCKET				
04/08/04	Pasion, Luis	1.50	165.00	W110	11548004
	SUBMIT LETTER TO JUDGE GONZALEZ, USBC, SDNY FOR JESSICA SERRANO.				
04/08/04	Reifman, Marli	4.70	611.00	W110	11590493
	DOCKET SEARCH FOR A. STROCHAK (.7); FILE AND SERVE OBJECTIONS TO OHIO AND MASSACHUSETTS MOTIONS (4.0)				
04/08/04	Cox, Sara	9.70	921.50	W110	11571205
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/08/04	Mayes, Charlotte	0.20	31.00	W110	11555792
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING ASSISTING D. WHITTAKER WITH PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/08/04	Devine, Kim	3.20	480.00	W110	11584823
	RETRIEVE COPIES OF ENTERED STIPULATIONS (.3); REVIEW PLAN STIPULATIONS (1.5); REVISE PLAN STIPULATION CHART REGARDING DUE DATES (1.2). INTEGRATE DOCUMENTS INTO EXISTING FILES (.2).				
04/08/04	Joffrion, Karen	1.80	288.00	W110	11545672
	PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (1.70); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRINTED FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.10).				
04/08/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W110	11543356
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
04/08/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.50	1,360.00	W110	11543357
	RESPOND TO P. KONOPKA, STINSON MORRISON, EMAIL REGARDING R. GRAHAM CONTACT INFORMATION (.1); DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.2); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT AMBER ELECTRICAL ORDER TO S. STOLTE, STINSON MORIRSION (.2); TELEPHONE CALLS TO AND FROM D. KARTSONIS, JUDGE GONZALEZ' LAW CLERK, REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION STATUS CONFERENCE 4/9/04 (.4); PREPARE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR 4/9/04 HEARING, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, FILE, SERVE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE, AND UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW SITE (.8); SEARCH DOCKET FOR MASSACHUSETTS MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG, DEBTORS' RESPONSE AND COMMITTEE JOINDER AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE DEBTORS' RESPONSE TO C.G. YOUNG PLAINTIFFS' SURREPLY IN OPPOSITION TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO DISMISS FOR M. GOLDMAN, JENNER & BLOCK (1.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. FISHER, HURON, REGARDING NEXT FEE APPLICATION PERIOD (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. MCELMEEL, STINSON MORRISON, REGARDING INKA'S ADDITIONS (.2); WORK ON REVISIONS TO 4/13/04 HEARING CHART AND DRAFT OF 4/13 HEARING AGENDA (4.1).				
04/08/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11547106
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
04/08/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.50	120.00	W110	11547107

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS					
04/08/04	Serrano, Jessica	5.00	725.00	W110	11605800
RETRIEVE ADDRESSES FROM EXHIBIT C OF AFF OF SERVICE FROM JANE SULLIVAN REGARDING GOVERNMENT AGENCIES FROM J. FINK (2.5) PREPARE AND ELECTRONICALLY FILE NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT REGARDING TELEFONO DE MEXICO (1.0) SERVICE MAILING OF THE SAME (1.0) PREPARED COVER LETTER OF ORDER DENYING MOTION OF DR. LICHT TO COMPEL WORLDCOM TO DISCLOSE RESULTS OF VOTING FOR JUDGE GONALEZ (0.2) ATTENTION TO MATTERS REGARDING SAME (0.3)					
04/08/04	Kyne, Stephanie	4.20	546.00	W110	11611452
DOWNLOAD AND PRINT PROOFS OF CLAIMS AND FILINGS, COLLATE AND ASSEMBLE ABBOTT MOTION HEARING BINDER A. STROCHAK					
04/09/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.70	1,232.00	W110	11543359
DOWNLOAD AND DISTRIBUTE PLEADINGS TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.1); EMAILS FROM AND TO P. KONOPKA, STINSON MORRISON, REGARDING MONIQUE GROSS MATTER, TELEPHONE CALL TO D. KARTSONIS REGARDING SAME (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR ARKANSAS TEACHERS RETIREMENT SYSTEM MOTION AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN KIMBALL MATTERS TO 5/11/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. STROCHAK REGARDING 4/13/04 AGENDA MATTERS (.1); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT 3-TIERED SETTLEMENT ORDER TO C. LOPEZ (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. PEREZ REGARDING COURT CONFERENCING FOR KPMG MOTION STATUS CONFERENCE THIS AFTERNOON (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ARKANSAS TEACHERS RETIREMENT SYSTEM STIPULATION SIGNATURE PAGE (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN WEST STAR ELECTRICAL'S HEARING TO 6/1/04 WITH EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO M. SHAIKEN (.1); EMAIL FROM M. SHAIKEN, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN ALBERT ARNO HEARING TO 6/1/04 WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO M. SHAIKEN (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP LIFT STAY AND ABSTENTION MOTION HEARING TO 4/27, CONFIRMING EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK (.1); EMAIL TO M. SHAIKEN, STINSON MORRISON, REGARDING W.H. CANNON CLAIM 11164 (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN DYNAMIC CABLE HEARING TO 6/1/04 WITH EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO M. SHAIKEN, STINSON MORRISON (.1); REVISE HEARING CHART AND AGENDA FOR 4/13/04, CIRCULATE TO ATTORNEYS FOR APPROVAL (4.7)					
04/09/04	Jalomo, Chris	4.00	320.00	W110	11546445
UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (2.5); UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ (1.5).					
04/09/04	Serrano, Jessica	1.80	261.00	W110	11607127
PREPARE LIST OF PARTIES SERVED ON 4/7/04 AND 4/09/04 (0.3); PREPARE AND FILE NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO STOCK PURCHASE AGREEMENT (0.5) SERVE THE SAME (1.0)					
04/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.10	49.50	W110	11621243
REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET					
04/12/04	Strochak, Adam	1.70	935.00	W110	11620223
PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM G. MITCHEL, E. FEIG (ARENT FOX) REGARDING AGENDA FOR APRIL 13 HEARING (0.7); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT AGENDA (0.6); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (0.1); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM M. SUTTER (OHIO COUNSEL) REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF OHIO LATE CLAIMS MOTION (0.3)					
04/12/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.20	134.00	W110	11551896
COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING HEARINGS ON APRIL 13TH					
04/12/04	Fink, Jessica	1.50	637.50	W110	11635866
CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, S COHEN REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS AND EFFECTIVE DATE					

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/12/04	Reifman, Marli	2.50	325.00	W110	11590279
	PREPARE HEARING BINDER FOR A. STROCHAK (1.5); COORDINATE SERVING OF PPL COMPLAINT WITH JENNER (1.0)				
04/12/04	Mitchel, Gayle	8.40	1,344.00	W110	11547206
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. STROCHAK REGARDING OHIO MOTION HEARING PENDING ADJOURNMENT (.1); SEARCH FOR NCR CORP. PROOFS OF CLAIM AND TRANSMIT TO J. BILLECK (.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. GOLDMAN, JENNER & BLOCK, REGARDING TIMING OF C.G. YOUNG HEARING (.1); TELEPHONE CALL TO E. MILLER, PIPER RUDNICK, REGARDING TELCOVE, TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN TELCOVE HEARING TO 5/4/04 WITH EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO FIRM (.2); SEARCH DOCKET FOR ALLEGIANCE LIFT STAY AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM F. GRESE, AKIN GUMP, REGARDING 4/13/04 AGENDA (.1); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF PRESENTMENT OF STIPULATION AND ORDER WITH DUNN & BRADSTREETN (.9); REVISIONS TO HEARING CHART AND 4/13 AGENDA, PREPARE TIME GRID FOR JUDGE GONZALEZ, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, FILE, SERVE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE, FAX TO P. KONOPKA AND M. SHAIKEN AT MARRIOTT NY FINANCIAL CENTER HOTEL (4.3); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS, AMEND 4/13 AGENDA, RESUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, REGARDING-FILE, SERVE AND FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE, FAX TO P. KONOPKA AND M. SHAIKEN AT MARRIOTT NY FINANCIAL CENTER (.9)				
04/12/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	3.80	570.00	W110	11578788
	DRAFT AND FILE VARIOUS AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICES (2.0); FILE AND SERVE PLAN SUPPLEMENT (0.5); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.3).				
04/13/04	Strochak, Adam	1.30	715.00	W110	11620364
	PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM A. PEREZ, M. LAWLESS (MCI), B. BENJET (MCI), T. TSEKERIDES REGARDING STATUS OF PENDING MOTIONS AND ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS				
04/13/04	Fink, Jessica	1.00	425.00	W110	11635259
	WORK ON DISTRIBUTION ISSUES (.4) INCLUDING NUMEROUS CALLS WITH COUNSEL FOR INDENTURE TRUSTEES (.6)				
04/13/04	Reifman, Marli	1.70	221.00	W110	11590285
	COMPILE SET OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED TO THE EXAMINER FOR A STROCHAK				
04/13/04	Mitchel, Gayle	4.00	640.00	W110	11554818
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); WORK ON DRAFTS OF 4/15 AND 4/16/04 AGENDAS (.5); TELEPHONE CALL FROM P. CROSBY, H. EHRMAN, REGARDING GE GLOBAL ASSET MANAGEMENT SERVICES ADV. 03-92903 HEARING 4/15/04 (.1); PREPARE AND FILE SEVERAL AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (1.5); CHECK DOCKET FOR ORDERS ENTERED POST-HEARING AND TRANSMIT TO ATTORNEYS (.7); TELEPHONE CALL FROM D. STEUBER, H. SIMON REGARDING FILING MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT FOR APRIL 2004 (.1); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENTS OF DITTHAVONG AND SCULLY SCOTT TO R. BERKOVICH (.3).				
04/13/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	4.70	705.00	W110	11548223
	RETRIEVE ALL NOTICES, AFFIDAVITS AND MOTIONS REGARDING RETENTION OF PROFESSIONALS SINCE 2/29/2004 FOR R. BERKOVICH (0.4); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES INTO FILING SYSTEM (3.0); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.3).				
04/13/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11568989
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
04/13/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.50	200.00	W110	11568461
	CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.5).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/14/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W110	11620427
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT PAPERS RELATING TO TELNET MATTER (0.3); E-MAILS TO/FROM J. EPSTEIN (JENNER) REGARDING SAME (0.1); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (0.2); REVIEW CALENDAR REGARDING MATTERS SCHEDULED FOR APRIL 20 (0.1)				
04/14/04	Fink, Jessica	0.60	255.00	W110	11635287
	CONFER WITH LAW DEBENTURE, M. CHASTKA REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS (.3)				
04/14/04	Pasion, Luis	1.00	110.00	W110	11575679
	OBTAINED DOCUMENT# 9 - MEMORANDUM ENDORSED ENTERED 3-22-04 UNDER 03 CV 4517, USDC, SDNY.				
04/14/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	1.20	156.00	W110	11605795
	LOCATE AND RETRIEVE FILES FROM PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS FOR A. STROCHAK				
04/14/04	Calles, Linda	1.20	174.00	W110	11564385
	REVIEW AND CODE DOCUMENTS FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (0.8); UPDATE FILE OUTLINE (0.4).				
04/14/04	Devine, Kim	1.00	150.00	W110	11584008
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING UCC LIEN SEARCH (.1); CONDUCT UCC LIEN SEARCH VIA WESTLAW (MS SECRETARY OF STATE, TX SECRETARY OF STATE) (.3); CONDUCT UCC LIEN SEARCH (MS SECRETARY OF STATE WEBSITE) TO OBTAIN COPY OF UCC1 FINANCING STATEMENT (.3); DRAFT EMAIL TO J. GROGAN SUMMARY SEARCH RESULTS AND FORWARDING COPIES OF UCCS (.3).				
04/14/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W110	11554791
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
04/14/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.70	1,232.00	W110	11554790
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.8); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM H. EFROYMSON, ICE MILLER, REGARDING AVAILABLE MAY AND JUNE HEARING DATES (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN 4/15 HEARING TO 4/27, TELEPHONE CALLS TO P. CROSBY, HELLER EHRMAN, REGARDING ADJOURNMENT, REVISE 4/15 AGENDA, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS, ELECTRONICALLY FILE, FAX TO US TRUSTEE, SERVE AND UPLOAD TO ELAW PUBLIC WEBSITE (.8); REPLY TO M. AZELTINE, STINSON MORRISON, EMAIL REGARDING NEXT INTERIM PERIOD TIMING (.1); REPLY TO J. EPSTEIN EMAIL REGARDING FILING TELNET BRIEF (.1); PREPARE INDEX AND PLEADINGS FOR KPMB DISQUALIFICATION/DISGORGEMENT HEARING FOR A. PEREZ (3.2); REPLY TO A. MILLER, STINSON MORRISON, EMAIL REGARDING PROCEDURE FOR SUBMISSION OF AN AGREED ORDER, TRANSMIT REQUESTED MODIFIED ORDER TO CHAMBERS FOR FIRM (.2); FILE DEBTORS' NOTICE OF DECISION REQUIRING DISMISSAL OF TELNET'S "CLASS" PROOF OF CLAIM, CLAIM NO. 17421, FOR J. EPSTEIN, JENNER & BLOCK, WITH SERVICE AND EMAIL CONFIRMATION TO FIRM (.5); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN INDY SPEEDWAY HEARING TO 6/8/04, PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT OF MOTION OF INDIANAPOLIS MOTOR SPEEDWAY, LLC AND INDY RACING LEAGUE, LLC FOR ORDER ALLOWING AND DIRECTING DEBTORS TO PAY ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE AT DIRECTION OF J. GROGAN (.5).				
04/14/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	2.50	375.00	W110	11578766
	SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (1.0); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES (1.5).				
04/14/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.00	80.00	W110	11568552
	DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.				
04/14/04	Jalomo, Chris	3.00	240.00	W110	11568454
	UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.5); CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.5).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/14/04	Kyne, Stephanie DOWNLOAD AND PRINT CLAIMS, COLLATE AND ASSEMBLE KPMG MOTION HEARING BINDER C. WATKINS	5.20	676.00	W110	11611451
04/15/04	Fink, Jessica FOLLOW UP WITH S. COHEN REGARDING INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES, EMBRATTEL.	1.50	637.50	W110	11634841
04/15/04	Reifman, Marli ASSEMBLE SET OF DOCUMENTS PRODUCED TO EXAMINER FOR A STROCHAK	2.50	325.00	W110	11590240
04/15/04	McGee, Betty REVIEW EMAIL REQUEST FROM S. YOUNGMAN FOR COPY OF DOCKET SHEET IN CASE FILED BY COMM SOUTH (.1); RESEARCH CASE INFORMATION (.1); DOWNLOAD DOCKET AND TRANSMIT SAME TO S. YOUNGMAN (.2); REVIEW EMAIL REQUEST FOR PLEADING FROM S. YOUNGMAN (.1); DOWNLOAD PLEADING AND TRANSMIT SAME TO S. YOUNGMAN (.1)	0.60	93.00	W110	11599576
04/15/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); SET UP 4/16/04 CONFERENCE CALL FOR ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING FOR J. GROGAN, EMAILS TO AND FROM S. DUNPHY, BROWN RUDNICK BERLACK ISRAELS, CREDITORS COMMITTEE COUNSEL, REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL INFORMATION AND COST, TELEPHONE CALLS TO CONFERENCE COORDINATOR, EMAILS TO S. DUNPHY AND J. GROGAN REGARDING COST (.5)	0.80	128.00	W110	11554867
04/15/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.1); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE (.9); REVISE 4/16/04 AGENDA, SUBMIT TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, FILE AND SERVE SAME, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE AND FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE (1.0); TELEPHONE CALL FROM B. SHAH, LAW CLERK IN JUDGE GONZALEZ' CHAMBERS, REGARDING AGENDA FOR 5/19/03 HEARING ON DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, TRANSMIT SAME TO HER (.3); LOCATE SUGGESTION OF BANKRUPTCY FOR J. GROGAN (.5); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT LOWES ORDER TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3); TELEPHONE CALL TO CHAMBERS TO ADJOURN LEXINGTON INSURANCE COMPANY LIFT STAY HEARING TO 5/18/04 WITH EMAIL CONFIRMING SAME TO A. STROCHAK (.1); SEARCH DOCKET FOR ALL ORDERS REGARDING INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS AND ALL U.S. TRUSTEE OBJECTIONS, TRANSMIT SAME TO E. RICHARDSON (.6); PREPARE REVISED SCHEDULING ORDER FOR MCKENNEY'S INC. FOR SUBMISSION TO CHAMBERS (.5); PREPARE DRAFT OF 4/20/04 AGENDA (.7); PREPARE INITIAL 4/27/04 HEARING CHART (.4)	6.40	1,024.00	W110	11554794
04/15/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn RETRIEVE PLEADINGS AND E-MAIL INTERESTED PARTIES (0.4); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (2.0); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCES INTO FILING SYSTEM (2.6).	5.00	750.00	W110	11578290
04/15/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W110	11568462
04/15/04	Jalomo, Chris CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.5).	2.50	200.00	W110	11568468
04/16/04	Reifman, Marli CREATE INDEXES FOR WELLS FARGO DOCUMENTS AND COORDINATE SENDING BOXES OFF-SITE	2.50	325.00	W110	11590247
04/16/04	Shrestha, Christine SUBMIT CERTIFICATE OF MERGER FOR PRE-CLEARANCE TO DE STATE (.5) OBTAINED CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT FORMS FOR IA, IL, & OH STATES AS PER A. SIMON (.5)	1.00	165.00	W110	11558332

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Cox, Sara ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT	8.20	779.00	W110	11571208
04/16/04	Saleh, Sally PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.50	40.00	W110	11557683
04/16/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.6); REPLY TO EMAIL FROM F. CLARKE, SEARCH DOCKET FOR ORDER, TELEPHONE CALL TO P. HARRINGTON, IDAHO POWER COMPANY, REGARDING 25 TOWERS MOTION (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM J. DE LOS SANTOS REGARDING SHORTENED NOTICE MOTION SET FOR HEARING 4/19/04, EMAILS TO AND FROM S.E. COHEN REGARDING SAME, DRAFT AGENDA AND TRANSMIT TO S.E. COHEN (.5); DRAFT FEBRUARY 2004 COVER LETTER FOR WGM FEE STATEMENT FOR A. PEREZ REVIEW (.5); REVISE 4/20/04 AGENDA WITH ADJOURNMENTS (.5); UPDATE DRAFT OF 4/27/04 AGENDA (.2); BEGIN DRAFTS OF 5/4/04 AND 5/11/04 HEARING CHARTS (1.1); CODE DOCUMENTATION FOR FILING BY CASE CLERK (4.0); PREPARE SCHEDULING ORDER FOR EMPLOYMENT TERMINATION OF RAUL ACOSTA FOR P. KONOPKA, STINSON MORRISON, AND TRANSMIT TO CHAMBERS (.5).	7.60	1,216.00	W110	11560409
04/16/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn FILE AND SERVE MOTION REGARDING RESCISSION (1.0); FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF AGENDA (0.5); FILE AND SERVE NOTICE OF HEARING REGARDING SEC DISTRIBUTION PLAN (0.7);	2.20	330.00	W110	11578399
04/16/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W110	11568469
04/16/04	Jalomo, Chris CODE RECENTLY RECEIVED FILING FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (1.0); UPDATE PLEADINGS AND CORRESPONDENCE FOLDERS (1.0).	2.00	160.00	W110	11568472
04/19/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.3); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (0.2); E-MAILS TO/FROM M. JACOBY, S. COHEN REGARDING STATUS OF OBJECTION TO ERISA CLAIMS (0.2)	0.70	385.00	W110	11623089
04/19/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL FROM N. BYNUM (MCI) REGARDING DISCHARGE INJUNCTION (0.6); PHONE CALL FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.3)	0.90	495.00	W110	11623132
04/19/04	Marcus, Christopher TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. WOODMAN REGARDING SCHEDULE AMOUNT (.1) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. SUTTON REGARDING SAME (.1)	0.20	85.00	W110	11572039
04/19/04	Cohen, Scott TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. LICHT REGARDING CASE	0.20	80.00	W110	11569353
04/19/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. PULLO REGARDING STATUS OF EMERGENCE (.1); CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.20	74.00	W110	11636389
04/19/04	Berkovich, Ronit REVIEW CASE FILES FOR PREPARATION TO SEND TO RECORDS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH SECRETARY REGARDING SAME.	0.80	296.00	W110	11636442
04/19/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W110	11571913

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING REORGANIZED DEBTOR'S STOCK ISSUES					
04/19/04	Reifman, Marli	3.00	390.00	W110	11590515
	SERVE PPL COMPLAINT AND SUMMONS (1.0); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE FOR PPL COMPLAINT (1.0); GATHER DOCUMENTS THAT WERE PRODUCED TO EXAMINER FOR A. STROCHAK (1.0)				
04/19/04	Harings, Teresa	16.00	2,080.00	W110	11565517
	ASSISTED A. YOON AND J. LONGOBARDO AT CLOSING (4.0) SET UP DOCUMENTS, MADE COPIES AND PDFS, REVIEWED ORIGINAL STOCK CERTIFICATES AGAINST LISTS OF PLEDGED COLLATERAL (12.0)				
04/19/04	Shrestha, Christine	1.30	214.50	W110	11562773
	SUBMIT TWO CERTIFICATES OF INC. FOR MCI INC. TO DE STATE FOR PRE-CLEARANCE ON A TWO HOUR BASIS AS PER B. COOPER, SUBMITTED CERTIFICATE OF FORMATION OF LLC FOR INTERMEDIA COMMUNICATIONS LLC WITH NAME CONSENT FORM TO DE STATE FOR IMMEDIATE FILING, AS PER D. HOLZMAN				
04/19/04	Mitchel, Gayle	7.00	1,120.00	W110	11567324
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (1.0); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT COPY OF DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION TO S. LOFTSPRING (.2); SEARCH DOCKET AND TRANSMIT COPIES OF DITTHAVONG AND SCULLY, SCOTT FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENTS AND RECEIPTS TO R. BERKOVICH (.2); TELEPHONE CALL FROM A. STROCHAK REGARDING HEARING ON 4/16 AND EXPECTED ORDER (.1); SUBMIT 4/20/04 AGENDA TO CHAMBERS FOR APPROVAL, PREPARE, ELECTRONICALLY FILE AND SERVE SAME, UPLOAD TO PUBLIC ELAW WEBSITE, FAX TO U.S. TRUSTEE (.5); UPDATE APRIL AND MAY CASE CALENDAR (.6); WORK ON 4/27/04 HEARING CHART AND AGENDA DRAFTS (1.4); CODE FILING FOR CASE CLERK (3.0)				
04/19/04	Delossantos, Jocelyn	2.50	375.00	W110	11579356
	REVIEW DOCKET FOR ANY PLEADINGS CHANGING THE CONFIRMATION ORDER AND RETRIEVE DOCKET AND E-MAIL D. HOLZMAN (0.5); SCREEN CREDITORS' CALL (2.0).				
04/19/04	Preda, Gabriel	5.80	957.00	W110	11578665
	REVIEWED PRODUCTION OF DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM MERRILL LYNCH RELATING TO CORRESPONDENCE TO/FROM CREDITORS COMMITTEE TO S. DIXON, ESQ. (2.0); ARRANGED ALL MERRILL LYNCH DOCUMENTS IN CHRON ORDER, ORGANIZED BY YEAR AND DATE (2.0); CROSS REFERENCED BOX OF ALL DOCUMENT PRODUCTIONS FROM OTHER ENTITIES AGAINST THE MERRILL LYNCH DOCUMENTS MARKING ANY MATCHES OR ANY MISSING DOCUMENTS FROM THE MERRILL LYNCH PRODUCTION SET (1.8)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W110 - CASE ADMINISTRATION:		289.50	\$ 48,485.50		
04/01/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.40	224.00	W120	11528082
	PREPARE, REVISE, FILE AND SERVE WGM JANUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT, EMAIL FILING RECEIPT TO A. PEREZ, EMAIL STATEMENT, AS FILED, TO E. RICHARDSON				
04/04/04	Perez, Alfredo	3.00	2,010.00	W120	11552095
	REVISE FEBRUARY INVOICE				
04/16/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.80	128.00	W120	11560918
	DRAFT FEBURARY 2004 COVER LETTER FOR WGM FEE STATEMENT FOR A. PEREZ APPROVAL, PREPARE EXHIBITS FOR FILING				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W120 - WG&M RETENTION/BILLING/FEE APPLICATIONS:		5.20	\$ 2,362.00		

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG.	0.40	310.00	W130	11635200
04/01/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW DRAFT RESPONSE TO MASSACHUSETTS MOTION (.80), CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.20), CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING KPMG ISSUES AND PENDING MATTERS (.40), COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING THE RESPONSE AND STRATEGY (.40)	1.80	1,206.00	W130	11552094
04/01/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW AND REVISE OBJECTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG (1.2); REVIEW LETTERS TO CHAMBERS REGARDING KPMG DISCOVERY REQUESTS (1.3); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING MASS MOTIONS (.2)	2.70	1,147.50	W130	11634420
04/01/04	Grogan, James REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. BEIZER AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING BSI RETENTION ORDER	0.20	73.00	W130	11723337
04/01/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE PIPER RUDNICK'S FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.8); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE HURON CONSULTING GROUP LLC FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (1.0)	1.80	288.00	W130	11528081
04/01/04	Jalomo, Chris UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ (1.0); REWRITE HURON FEE STATEMENT DOCUMENTS IN PDF FORMAT AS REQUESTED BY G. MITCHELL (1.0).	2.00	160.00	W130	11536946
04/02/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS TO/FROM D. RICHARDS (MCI), D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT) REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.5); REVIEW DRAFT OBJECTION TO DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.8); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM J. FINK REGARDING SAME (0.3); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM T. HYATTE REGARDING AUDITOR INDEPENDENCE ISSUES (0.4)	2.00	1,100.00	W130	11621088
04/02/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS FROM A. STROCHAK (.20) AND B. BENJET (.30) REGARDING RESPONSE AND RELATED MATTERS	0.50	335.00	W130	11552103
04/02/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON KPMG ISSUES AND REVISE OBJECTION.	1.00	425.00	W130	11634423
04/02/04	Pullo, Christina REVIEW INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES FOR REASONABLENESS (4.2); CONFER WITH J. FINK REGARDING INDENTURE FEES (.5)	4.70	1,292.50	W130	11615388
04/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE DELOITTE & TOUCHE AND DELOITTE CONSULTING FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENTS WITH CONFIRMING EMAILS TO FIRM AND LOEB & LOEB (2.0); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE LAZARD FRERES & CO. FEBRUARY FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.5).	2.50	400.00	W130	11528854
04/03/04	Strochak, Adam DRAFTING AND REVISING OBJECTION TO KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (2.5); REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW ON DISQUALIFICATION OF PROFESSIONALS (1.7)	4.20	2,310.00	W130	11621009

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/04/04	Strochak, Adam DRAFTING AND REVISING OBJECTION TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG	7.30	4,015.00	W130	11621010
04/04/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING DISINTERESTEDNESS.	4.50	1,912.50	W130	11635263
04/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW DRAFT OBJECTION REGARDING KPMG.	1.00	775.00	W130	11634522
04/05/04	Strochak, Adam DRAFTING AND REVISING OBJECTION TO KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION	4.90	2,695.00	W130	11621537
04/05/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW RESPONSE TO MASSACHUSETTS MOTION	0.80	536.00	W130	11552042
04/05/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING DISINTERESTEDNESS (.3) AND CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.50	212.50	W130	11635280
04/05/04	Jalomo, Chris UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ	1.50	120.00	W130	11537124
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.20	155.00	W130	11635865
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING KPMG.	0.50	387.50	W130	11636066
04/06/04	Strochak, Adam CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.4); DRAFTING AND REVISING OBJECTION TO DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (2.1)	2.50	1,375.00	W130	11621591
04/06/04	Fink, Jessica TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. TOM, K. SIMPSON REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.4); REVIEW OF SAME (.6).	1.00	425.00	W130	11635293
04/06/04	Pullo, Christina RESEARCH THE LEGISLATIVE HISTORY BEHIND SECTION 101(14)(E) IN CONNECTION WITH THE OBJECTION TO KPMG'S RETENTION	2.10	577.50	W130	11615480
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT BRIEF REGARDING KPMG (2.0) REVIEW BRIEF PREPARED BY KPMG ATTORNEYS (.8) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH KPMG ATTORNEYS REGARDING SAME (.7)	3.50	2,712.50	W130	11634838
04/07/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OBJECTION TO KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (4.7); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM J. FINK REGARDING SAME (0.4)	5.10	2,805.00	W130	11621544
04/07/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET AND J. BYRNES REGARDING FEE EXAMINER	0.30	201.00	W130	11551937

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/07/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW AMENDED AFFIDAVIT AND FEE STATEMENT OF KPMG.	0.50	212.50	W130	11635825
04/07/04	Mitchel, Gayle PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE LAZARD FRERES & CO. FEBRUARY 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.5); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE HARRITY & SNYDER MARCH 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.5).	1.00	160.00	W130	11542511
04/08/04	Dixon, Catherine ATTENTION TO KPMG INDEPENDENCE ISSUE [MEMORANDUM] (1.0) RESEARCH, REVIEW OF T. HYATTE'S MEMORANDUM (1.5)	2.50	1,887.50	W130	11632671
04/08/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE OBJECTION TO KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (3.0); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM J. FINK, M. REIFMAN, M. GOLDSTEIN, B. BENJET (MCI), D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL), S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS), D. WAGNER (KPMG) REGARDING SAME (1.5); PHONE CALL TO J. O'CONNOR (MASSACHUSETTS) REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE ON DISCOVERY ISSUES (0.1); DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (1.2)	5.80	3,190.00	W130	11621475
04/08/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING KPMG, DR. LICHT AND RELATED MATTERS (.20), REVIEW KPMG RESPONSE (.50)	0.70	469.00	W130	11551902
04/08/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW AND REVISE KPMG OBJECTION (1.0) CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.7); REVIEW KPMG OBJECTION TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY (1.3)	3.00	1,275.00	W130	11635846
04/08/04	Jalomo, Chris UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ	1.50	120.00	W130	11723339
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia MEETINGS WITH B. BENJET (.6); A. STROCHAK (.4) REGARDING KPMG.	1.00	775.00	W130	11634985
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL HEARING WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS V. KPMG (1.4) FOLLOW UP CALLS WITH S. KELLY, A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.6)	2.00	1,550.00	W130	11635132
04/09/04	Dixon, Catherine KPMG INDEPENDENCE [MEMORANDUM REVIEW; RESEARCH].	3.00	2,265.00	W130	11631944
04/09/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW, REVISE, AND FINALIZE LETTER TO JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION AND DISCOVERY ISSUES (1.2); REVIEW AND COMMENT ON KPMG DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING DISCOVERY (0.5); PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS) REGARDING SAME (0.3); MEETING WITH B. BENJET (MCI) TO PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MASSACHUSETTS REQUEST FOR DISCOVERY ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (1.5); ATTEND HEARING ON DISCOVERY ISSUES (2.5); MEETING WITH T. WEBER (GREENBERG TRAURIG) REGARDING SAME (0.5)	6.50	3,575.00	W130	11621431
04/09/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.00	1,340.00	W130	11551898

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH A. STROCHAK, M. GOLDSTEIN AND B. BENJET REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING KPMG (.80), REVIEW FILINGS AND LETTERS FROM MASSACHUSETTS, KPMG AND THE DEBTORS (1.2)				
04/09/04	Jalomo, Chris	1.50	120.00	W130	11723338
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ				
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W130	11634395
	CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING RETENTION				
04/12/04	Mitchel, Gayle	1.30	208.00	W130	11547205
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE DITTHAVONG & CAROLSON, P.C. MARCH FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.5); PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE WILSON, ELSER, MOSKOWITZ, EDELMAN & DICKER, LLP MARCH 2004 FEE STATEMENT WITH CONFIRMING EMAIL TO FIRM (.8)				
04/13/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W130	11587487
	E-MAIL TO D. SMORODIN (WORLDCOM) REGARDING LIST OF PROFESSIONALS RETAINED IN CHAPTER 11 CASES.				
04/14/04	Strochak, Adam	3.40	1,870.00	W130	11620494
	PHONE CALLS TO/FROM S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS) REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (0.3); REVIEW ARTICLE AND SDNY CASE LAW ON SECTION 327 STANDARDS IN PREPARATION FOR ARGUMENT ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (3.1)				
04/14/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.30	1,541.00	W130	11615385
	START TO REVIEW MASSACHUSETTS MOTION, RESPONSES AND CASE LAW				
04/14/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.50	80.00	W130	11554792
	PREPARE, FILE AND SERVE HOWREY SIMON ARNOLD & WHITE FEE STATEMENT FOR MARCH 2004				
04/15/04	Strochak, Adam	7.70	4,235.00	W130	11623262
	MEETINGS WITH A. PEREZ, B. BENJET (MCI), C. SCHEELER (PIPER), A. WHITTEMORE (MCGUIRE WOODS), S. DABNEY (MCGUIRE WOODS), D. WAGNER (KPMG) REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (4.8); REVIEW CASES ON SECTION 327 STANDARDS AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (2.9)				
04/15/04	Perez, Alfredo	6.00	4,020.00	W130	11612540
	CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET, A. STROCHAK, C. SCHEELER, S. DABNEY, A. WHITTEMORE AND D. WAGNER TO PREPARE FOR THE KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION INCLUDING REVIEW OF RELEVANT PLEADINGS AND CASE LAW				
04/15/04	Jalomo, Chris	2.00	160.00	W130	11723340
	UPDATE PROFESSIONAL'S FEE CHART AS REQUESTED BY A. PEREZ				
04/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W130	11637231
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING KPMG HEARING AND SCHEDULE.				
04/16/04	Strochak, Adam	9.60	5,280.00	W130	11620577
	PREPARE FOR (2.8) AND ATTEND HEARING ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION (6.6)				
04/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	6.80	4,556.00	W130	11612523
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN KPMG DISQUALIFICATION HEARING (6.0), CONFERENCE CALLS WITH S. KELLY AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING STATUS (.80)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/19/04	Berkovich, Ronit E-MAIL TO J. MOST (WORLDCOM) REGARDING PAYMENT OF FEES TO SCULLY SCOTT AND DITTHAVONG LAW FIRMS.	0.10	37.00	W130	11636390
04/19/04	Berkovich, Ronit CONFERENCES WITH C. PULLO REGARDING FILING SUPPLEMENTAL RETENTION APPLICATION FOR GIBSON DUNN (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. GREER (GIBSON DUNN) REGARDING SAME (.1).	0.30	111.00	W130	11636443
04/19/04	Pullo, Christina CONFER WITH J. ATKINS OF GIBSON DUNN REGARDING APPLICATION TO EXPAND SCOPE OF RETENTION	0.90	247.50	W130	11613170
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W130 - RETENTION/FEE APPLICATIONS: OTHER PROFESSIONALS:		132.60	\$ 68,125.50		
04/03/04	Whittaker, Donald TRAVEL FROM DALLAS TO NEW YORK FOR MEETINGS	4.30	1,064.25	W180	11531165
04/04/04	Whittaker, Donald TRAVEL TO DALLAS FROM NEW YORK	4.80	1,188.00	W180	11531168
04/05/04	Grogan, James TRAVEL TO NEW YORK FOR OMNIBUS HEARING	2.50	456.25	W180	11546916
04/06/04	Strochak, Adam TRAVEL TO AND FROM NEW YORK FOR APRIL 6 HEARING	3.50	962.50	W180	11621592
04/06/04	Brill, Craig TRAVEL TO RICHMOND FROM NY	3.00	600.00	W180	11667216
04/06/04	Grogan, James TRAVEL FROM NY TO HOUSTON FOLLOWING OMNIBUS HEARING	3.00	547.50	W180	11546922
04/09/04	Strochak, Adam TRAVEL TO AND FROM NY FOR HEARING ON DISCOVERY ISSUES ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION	3.90	1,072.50	W180	11621432
04/10/04	Whittaker, Donald TRAVEL FROM DALLAS TO NEW YORK	4.00	990.00	W180	11543446
04/11/04	Whittaker, Donald TRAVEL FROM NEW YORK TO DALLAS	4.50	1,113.75	W180	11543452
04/12/04	Strochak, Adam TRAVEL TO NEW YORK FOR APRIL 13 HEARING	2.90	797.50	W180	11620357
04/13/04	Strochak, Adam TRAVEL FROM NY TO WASHINGTON AFTER APRIL 14 HEARING	4.50	1,237.50	W180	11620420
04/14/04	Perez, Alfredo	3.00	1,005.00	W180	11615384

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TRAVEL TO NEW YORK FOR KPMG HEARINGS				
04/15/04	Strochak, Adam	2.50	687.50	W180	11623233
	TRAVEL TO NEW YORK FOR HEARING ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION				
04/16/04	Strochak, Adam	2.30	632.50	W180	11620578
	TRAVEL FROM NY TO WASHINGTON AFTER HEARING ON KPMG DISQUALIFICATION MOTION				
04/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	3.00	1,005.00	W180	11612522
	TRAVEL FROM NEW YORK TO HOUSTON AFTER KPMG DISQUALIFICATION HEARING				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	4.40	1,089.00	W180	11637136
	TRAVEL FROM DALLAS TO NYC				
<hr/>					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W180 - NON WORKING TRAVEL:		56.10	\$ 14,448.75		
<hr/>					
04/01/04	Urquhart, Douglas	1.80	1,080.00	W200	11536768
	CALL WITH LAZARD REGARDING NEW NOTES PRICING AND MATURITIES (.6); CALL WITH HAMMILL REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW REVISED LETTER OF CREDIT REIMBURSEMENT AGREEMENTS AND LETTER OF CREDIT APPLICATIONS RECEIVED FROM BANK OF AMERICA (1.0)				
04/05/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.60	360.00	W200	11536851
	EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM HAMMILL RELATED TO NOTE MATURITIES (.2); DISCUSS SAME WITH A. YOON (.2)				
04/06/04	Urquhart, Douglas	1.20	720.00	W200	11537080
	CALLS WITH HAMMILL AND M. MEROLA REGARDING MATURITY DATES OF NEW NOTES (.4); DISCUSS WITH M. BLOCH REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW BANK OF AMERICA SIDE LETTER REGARDING LETTER OF CREDIT FACILITY (.4)				
04/06/04	Harings, Teresa	2.00	260.00	W200	11565130
	COMPARED SCHEDULES OF PLEDGED STOCK - WGM'S LIST AND SHEARMAN STERLING'S LISTS - FOR DISCREPANCIES PER REQUEST OF J. LONGOBARDO.				
04/07/04	Urquhart, Douglas	1.40	840.00	W200	11540648
	DISCUSS QUESTIONS ON EXTENSION OF MATURITIES OF NEW NOTES WITH M. HAMMILL, L. FIFE, M. MEROLA (.3) RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM DEFRIES ON SUBORDINATION OF INTERCOMPANY CLAIMS (.1); EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL PARTICIPANTS (1.0)				
04/08/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.50	300.00	W200	11541084
	REVIEW NOTE MATURITY ISSUES WITH STROOCK, L. FIFE, M. MEROLA				
04/13/04	Urquhart, Douglas	2.50	1,500.00	W200	11550497
	REVIEW FINAL ISSUES RELATED TO NEW NOTES INDENTURES (1.0); RESPOND TO EMAIL QUESTIONS FROM HAMILL ON NEW NOTES MATURITY DATES (.2); REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES ON LETTER OF CREDIT AGREEMENTS WITH A. YOON (.3); REVIEW AUTHORIZATION/OPINION ISSUES ON LETTER OF CREDIT AGREEMENTS WITH A. YOON (.3); REVIEW 2003 10K DISCLOSURE ON AMENDED DIP FACILITY AND DISCUSS WITH A. YOON (.3); REVIEW NOTE MATURITY ISSUE WITH AKIN GUMP (.2), CALL WITH PARKS REGARDING SAME (.2)				
04/13/04	Longobardo, John	1.50	412.50	W200	11556369
	PREPARING AND REVIEWING DOCUMENTS FOR CLOSING.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/14/04	Urquhart, Douglas REVIEW COMMENTS ON 2003 10K AMENDED DIP FACILITY DISCLOSURE WITH A. YOON	1.10	660.00	W200	11552227
04/15/04	Urquhart, Douglas RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM L. FIFE AND F. GREEN ON INCURRENCE OF DEBT AS PART OF EMBRATEL SALE, AND RELATED RESTRICTIONS UNDER DEBT DOCUMENTS (.5); DISCUSS WITH A. YOON AND M. MEROLA REGARDING SAME (.5); CALL WITH LAZARD REGARDING CHANGES TO NOTE TO REFLECT REDUCTION IN COUPON (.5) REVIEW FINAL CHANGES TO INDENTURE WITH M. MEROLA (.5)	2.00	1,200.00	W200	11556617
04/15/04	Longobardo, John PREPARING FOR CLOSING (1.0), DRAFTING OPINIONS TO BE DELIVERED AT CLOSING (2.0).	3.00	825.00	W200	11557422
04/15/04	Harings, Teresa MET WITH J. LONGOBARDO TO DISCUSS PREPARATIONS FOR CLOSING ON MONDAY/TUESDAY.	0.50	65.00	W200	11565511
04/16/04	Urquhart, Douglas EMERGENCE CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMPANY AND ADVISORS (1.0); REVIEW DTC SETTLEMENT ISSUES ON NEW NOTES WITH M. MEROLA (.4); REVIEW OUTSTANDING LETTER OF CREDIT AND PAYOFF ISSUES WITH A. YOON (.6)	2.00	1,200.00	W200	11557375
04/16/04	Longobardo, John REVIEWING CONTROL AGREEMENT TERMINATIONS UNDER DIP CREDIT AGREEMENT.	1.00	275.00	W200	11557447
04/19/04	Longobardo, John REVIEWING CLOSING DELIVERIES, CLOSING.	8.20	2,255.00	W200	11612578
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W200 - FINANCING/CASH COLLATERAL:		29.30	\$ 11,952.50		
04/01/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (3.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET. AL REGARDING SAME (.7)	3.70	2,479.00	W210	11621094
04/02/04	Green, Frederick EMBRATEL ISSUES REGARDING EXPERT WITNESS (2.3); T/CS WITH METKE ET AL REGARDING SAME (.6)	2.90	2,247.50	W210	11611597
04/02/04	Rubin, Steven ATTENTION TO TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (3.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET. AL REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.8)	4.20	2,814.00	W210	11616234
04/05/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES.	3.70	2,867.50	W210	11613512
04/05/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (1.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET. AL REGARDING SAME (.5)	2.30	1,541.00	W210	11616236
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL	0.20	155.00	W210	11636070

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/06/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL ISSUES (2.5) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.2)	2.70	2,092.50	W210	11612222
04/06/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (2.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET. AL REGARDING TERM SHEET (.5)	2.60	1,742.00	W210	11616238
04/07/04	Green, Frederick EMBRATEL CALLS ALL DAY (2.0); ATTENTION TO AMENDMENT WITH TELMEX (.9); DISCUSS CALL WITH HOULIHAN WITH LAZARD ET AL REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0)	3.90	3,022.50	W210	11611961
04/07/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD AND F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.8); CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK AND S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING (.3).	1.10	786.50	W210	11614847
04/07/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (2.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET. AL REGARDING TERM SHEET (.9)	3.40	2,278.00	W210	11616239
04/08/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL	1.40	1,085.00	W210	11611941
04/08/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING TERM SHEET (.8)	2.20	1,474.00	W210	11616240
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ WITH D. GOLDEN, I. DIZENGOFF, M. TOM, L. FIFE, S. YOUDELMAN, J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.3)	1.00	775.00	W210	11634981
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia MEETING WITH F. GREEN, J. CRANE, L. GRAFSTEIN, L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6); FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GOLDEN (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILMOE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.5)	1.50	1,162.50	W210	11635128
04/09/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WILKIE ET AL REGARDING SAME (1.0); ATTENTION TO AMENDMENT TO TELMEX DEAL (1.0)	4.20	3,255.00	W210	11615283
04/09/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING SAME (.6)	1.30	871.00	W210	11621045
04/11/04	Green, Frederick EU MERGER CONTROL ISSUES	0.90	697.50	W210	11615254
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN, L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING PREPARATION.	0.40	310.00	W210	11634392
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.50	1,162.50	W210	11634393

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MEETING WITH SHARON YOUDELMAN, L. FIFE, S. COHEN, A. COHEN, ET AL. REGARDING PREPARATION FOR EMBRATEL HEARING.				
04/12/04	Green, Frederick	2.40	1,860.00	W210	11615756
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL (.8); REVIEW LITIGATION ISSUES (.8); REVIEW AKIN GUMP QUESTIONS (.8)				
04/12/04	Rubin, Steven	1.20	804.00	W210	11621049
	DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING SAME (.5)				
04/13/04	Green, Frederick	3.30	2,557.50	W210	11612041
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SKADDEN REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LAZARD REGARDING FCC ISSUE (1.0) REVIEW FCC ISSUE (1.0)				
04/13/04	Rodriguez, Nicholas	0.50	230.00	W210	11601931
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE REGARDING PENDING MATTERS (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. RUBIN REGARDING SAME (.2) REVIEWED CORRESPONDENCE FROM MEMBERS OF THE WORKING GROUP (.1)				
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W210	11634953
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MILMOE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2)				
04/14/04	Green, Frederick	2.90	2,247.50	W210	11612506
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL (1.3); ATTENTION TO PROF COLHO OPINION ISSUES (1.0); ATTENTION TO BNDES ISSUES (.6)				
04/14/04	Rubin, Steven	2.40	1,608.00	W210	11621068
	DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (1.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING SAME (.7)				
04/15/04	Green, Frederick	5.30	4,107.50	W210	11611954
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL (2.8); CALLS WITH TELMEX REGARDING SAME (.8); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH TEAM AND CLIENT REGARDING SAME (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. RUBIN REGARDING AVANTEL (.5)				
04/15/04	Fife, Lori	0.70	500.50	W210	11615998
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN AND OTHERS REGARDING EMBRATEL.				
04/15/04	Rubin, Steven	2.40	1,608.00	W210	11621070
	DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING SAME (.7) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING AVANTEL (.5)				
04/15/04	Rodriguez, Nicholas	0.50	230.00	W210	11601800
	REVIEWED REVISED TERM SHEETS.				
04/15/04	Pullo, Christina	0.10	27.50	W210	11614767
	CONFER WITH J. FRIEDMANN IN LITIGATION REGARDING EMBRATEL DOCUMENTS				
04/16/04	Green, Frederick	6.80	5,270.00	W210	11611783
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH SKADDEN AND CLIENT REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS COMMITTEE (1.0); REVISED CALAIS OFFER (3.3); WORK WITH BRAZILIAN COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (1.5)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Rubin, Steven REVIEW TERM SHEET (2.5) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING SAME (.8)	3.30	2,211.00	W210	11621072
04/16/04	Rodriguez, Nicholas TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. RUBIN REGARDING THE REVISED TERM SHEET (.5) REVIEWED THE REVISED TERM SHEETS (.5)	1.00	460.00	W210	11603190
04/17/04	Green, Frederick EMBRATEL - BRAZILIAN LEGAL ISSUES REGARDING CRIMINAL MATTERS (1.5); NEED FOR PRIOR CASE APPROVAL (1.6); ABILITY TO PLEDGE SHARES (1.5); REVIEW OF CALAIS AGREEMENTS (1.6)	6.20	4,805.00	W210	11611708
04/18/04	Green, Frederick EMBRATEL - NEGOTIATIONS WITH TELMEX (1.1); CONF CALL WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE REPRESENTATIVES REGARDING SAME (1.1); CRIMINAL LAW CONSIDERATIONS (1.0); ISSUES REGARDING ABILITY TO PLEDGE SHARES (1.1); ATTENTION TO NEW CALAIS OFFER (1.2)	5.50	4,262.50	W210	11611712
04/19/04	Green, Frederick EMBRATEL - NEGOTIATIONS ALL DAY WITH TELMEX ON SECOND AMENDMENT (2.5); BOARD CALL ON NEW TELMEX OFFER (2.0); DRAFT TALKING POINTS (.7)	5.20	4,030.00	W210	11613155
04/19/04	Rubin, Steven DISCUSS TERM SHEET AND REVIEW (2.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. METGE, ET AL REGARDING SAME (1.0)	3.10	2,077.00	W210	11621074
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W210 - BUSINESS OPERATIONS:		98.60	\$ 72,256.50		
04/12/04	Graham, Richard RESEARCH ADVISABILITY OF FORWARD CONTRACTS CLAUSE IN UTILITY CONTRACTS.	0.20	74.00	W220	11622979
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W220 - UTILITY ISSUES (DEPOSITS, ETC.):		0.20	\$ 74.00		
04/01/04	Goldring, Stuart CALL WITH J. LONGMIRE OF WILKIE FARR REGARDING FV OWNERSHIP (.2); CONFER WITH R. KOST REGARDING NOTE ELECTION (.3); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING POSSIBLE INTERNAL MERGERS (.7); CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING SECTION 382 RELATED QUESTION (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH COMMITTEE ADVISORS, R. KOST, M FRENCH, A. KASHINSKAYA, J. THOREN AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5)(L)(6) VALUATION MODEL (2.3), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH M. FRENCH (.3); SUBSEQUENT CALL WITH R. COX REGARDING SAME (.4); AND L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2)	4.60	3,289.00	W230	11528516
04/01/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL TO M. SUTTER (OHIO ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE) REGARDING MOTION TO PERMIT LATE TAX CLAIM	0.20	110.00	W230	11620984
04/01/04	Hoernlein, Michael REVIEW SECTION 382(L)(5) VALUATION MODEL (2.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, J. THOREN, M. FRENCH, A. KASHLINSKAYA, P. COX, R. KOST, J. SAVIN, C. WILSON, P. LAINO, D. CULP REGARDING ALTERNATIVE MINIMUM TAX ASPECTS OF SECTION 382 VALUATION MODEL (2.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FRENCH AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (0.4).	4.90	1,813.00	W230	11526885
04/01/04	Grogan, James	0.10	36.50	W230	11536627

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CORRESPOND WITH J. FINK REGARDING PROPERTY TAX CLAIMS					
04/02/04	Goldring, Stuart	5.00	3,575.00	W230	11527960
CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. COX, M. FRENCH, R. KOST AND J. THOREN REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5)/(L)(6) VALUATION MODEL (.5); CONFER WITH R. KOST REGARDING NOTE ELECTION OUTCOME (.4) AND WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH F. DIMINICH REGARDING FRESH START ACCOUNTING TREATMENT (.4); CALL WITH R. KOST AND M. PALMER REGARDING COMPARATIVE MODEL (.3); FOLLOW-UP WITH R. KOST AND VOICE MAIL TO L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.4); CALL WITH L. FIFE (.2) AND M. HOENIG (.2) REGARDING TREATMENT OF NOTE ELECTIONS; CALL WITH M. PALMER, P. STOALES, R. KOST AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING COMPARATIVE MODEL (1.7); REVIEW AKIN GUMP MEMORANDUM REGARDING NOTE ELECTION (.7)					
04/02/04	Hoernlein, Michael	2.10	777.00	W230	11526881
TELEPHONE CALL WITH MATLINPATTERSON, M. PALMER, S. GOLDRING, P. SHOALS, AND R. KOST REGARDING SECTION 382(L)(5) VALUATION MODEL (1.2); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (0.4); TELEPHONE CALL WITH P. COX, S. GOLDRING, J. THOREN, M. FRENCH, R. KOST REGARDING 382(L)(5) VALUATION MODEL (0.5).					
04/04/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.60	429.00	W230	11537163
CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING IRS PLAN TREATMENT (.4), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH A. PEREZ BY EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.2)					
04/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11635656
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES					
04/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11634521
REVIEW LETTER FROM J. SPRAYREGEN (.3); DISCUSS SAME WITH L. FIFE (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SPRAYREGEN REGARDING SAME (.4)					
04/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.50	1,937.50	W230	11635654
MEETING WITH M. CAPELLAS AND S. KELLY, ET AL REGARDING TAX ISSUES					
04/05/04	Goldring, Stuart	3.80	2,717.00	W230	11537162
MEETING WITH M. CAPELLAS, S. KELLY, B. BLAKELY, D. RICHARDS, R. KOST, T. SAVAGE, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, D. MATLIN, M. PALMER, J. UFFNER AND SILVERLAKE REPS REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (2.8); FOLLOW-UP WITH M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.2); CALL WITH L. FIFE AND, FOR PART, S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE AND M. CAPELLAS REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS REGARDING MATLIN (.8)					
04/05/04	Hoernlein, Michael	1.50	555.00	W230	11539543
CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING MEETING REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATIONS (0.8); CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING MOTION FOR DECLARATORY JUDGMENT REGARDING MATLIN ELECTION AGREEMENTS (0.7).					
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11636067
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES					
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W230	11635864
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. PALMER REGARDING TAX ISSUES					
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W230	11636069
MEETINGS WITH S. COHEN ON PENDING MATTERS, INCLUDING DRAFTING RESCISSION MOTION.					
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.60	1,240.00	W230	11634779

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE (.4); D. GOLDEN (.4); S. KELLY (.4); M. CAPELLAS (.4) REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/06/04	Goldring, Stuart	0.20	143.00	W230	11536727
	CONFER WITH R. KOST REGARDING NOTE ELECTION STATUS				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11634844
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. DANILOW REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11635348
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. PALMER REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.60	465.00	W230	11635283
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.70	1,317.50	W230	11635284
	MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, S. COHEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.7) AND REVIEW DRAFT RESCISSION AGREEMENT (1.0)				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W230	11635261
	NUMEROUS CALLS WITH T. SAVAGE, M. CAPELLAS, M. PALMER, S. KELLY REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W230	11635455
	MEETING WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.8) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. DANILOW, L. FIFE, S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (1.2)				
04/07/04	Goldring, Stuart	6.00	4,290.00	W230	11537112
	CONFER WITH M. HOERNLEIN (.3) AND M. GOLDSTEIN (.2) REGARDING BAIN NOTE ELECTIONS; FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND R. KOST REGARDING SAME (.3); CONFER WITH D. HOLZMAN AND F. DIMINICH REGARDING POSSIBLE INTERNAL MERGERS AND TRANSFERS (.4); MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, S. COHEN AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING POSSIBLE RESCISSION OF ALLOCATION AGREEMENTS AND PROVIDE COMMENTS ON SAME (2.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. FIFE, D. PEARLSTEIN, N. JONES, F. DOMINICH AND OTHERS REGARDING FCC QUESTIONS (1.0); REVIEW FURTHER REVISIONS TO DRAFT RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (.3); REVIEW STROOCK EMAIL REGARDING PAST EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND DISCUSS WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND EMAIL M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
04/07/04	Cohen, Scott	6.90	2,760.00	W230	11546116
	CORRESPONDENCE R. GARCES REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.1); DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & L. FIFE (.7) INCLUDING CONFERENCE G. DANILOW (.4) REGARDING NOL ISSUES; DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT (4.0); MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLDRING & M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT (1.7)				
04/07/04	Hoernlein, Michael	4.10	1,517.00	W230	11539538
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, F. DIMINICH, N. JONES, D. PEARLSTEIN, R. WHITT REGARDING FCC REQUESTS FOR INFORMATION (1.0); REVIEW STROOCK EMAILS REGARDING SECTINO 382 ANALYSIS AND MATLINPATTERSON LETTER AGREEMENTS (.6); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING MATLINPATTERSON LETTER AGREEMENTS (0.7); REVIEW RESCISSION AGREEMENT (1.8).				
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.80	2,170.00	W230	11635615
	MEETING WITH L. FIFE AND S. COHEN REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT (1.0) MEMORANDUM FOR R. BREEDEN (1.2) AND CONFERENCES WITH BOTH REGARDING SAME (.6)				
04/08/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.00	715.00	W230	11549698

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING INTERNAL MERGERS, LIQUIDATIONS, ETC.				
04/08/04	Strochak, Adam	2.70	1,485.00	W230	11621477
	DRAFTING, REVISING, AND FINALIZING OBJECTION TO OHIO MOTION TO PERMIT LATE-FILED CLAIMS (2.1); PHONE CALLS AND E-MAILS TO/FROM B. BENJET (MCI) AND D. GRISWOLD (MCDERMOTT WILL) REGARDING SAME (0.6)				
04/08/04	Cohen, Scott	4.20	1,680.00	W230	11546129
	REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (0.5); DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & L. FIFE REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT MEMORANDUM (.7); DRAFT LETTER AGREEMENT MEMORANDUM (3.0)				
04/08/04	Hoernlein, Michael	1.30	481.00	W230	11539594
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, F. DIMINICH, D. PEARLSTEIN, S. O'CONNEL, L. SMITH, J. CARLYLE, F. GUTIEREZ REGARDING FCC REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (.8); CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATION MEMORANDUM FOR R. BREEDEN (0.5).				
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	3.00	2,325.00	W230	11635134
	CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, S. COHEN, S. GOLDRING (.8) AND REVIEW DRAFT MEMORANDUM FOR R. BREEDEN (2.2) REGARDING NOL/ELECTION ISSUES.				
04/09/04	Goldring, Stuart	7.20	5,148.00	W230	11549893
	TOGETHER WITH M. HOERNLEIN, REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT MEMORANDUM DESCRIBING CERTAIN ASPECTS OF NOTE ELECTION PROCESS (4.5); DISCUSS WITH M. HOERNLEIN FURTHER REVISIONS TO SAME (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE FURTHER DRAFT (2.3).				
04/09/04	Cohen, Scott	2.50	1,000.00	W230	11546137
	DISCUSSION WITH M. HOERNLEIN & S. GOLDRING REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT MEMORANDUM				
04/09/04	Hoernlein, Michael	8.50	3,145.00	W230	11539603
	REVIEW DRAFT MEMORANDUM FOR R. BREEDEN REGARDING TAX BENEFITS AND NOTE ALLOCATION LETTER AGREEMENTS (3.8), CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING AGREEMENTS (.5), COORDINATE TAX COMMENTS TO MEMORANDUM (1.5), CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING COMMENTS TO MEMORANDUM (.7) REVISE AND DISTRIBUTE MEMORANDUM (2.0)				
04/10/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.50	1,162.50	W230	11635917
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING NOL/ELECTION MEMORANDUM AND REVIEW UPDATES.				
04/10/04	Hoernlein, Michael	1.50	555.00	W230	11539605
	REVISE MEMORANDUM ON TAX BENEFITS AND NOTE ALLOCATION LETTER AGREEMENTS.				
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11634363
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING TAX ISSUE				
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11634398
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11634408
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, S. KELLY AND T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11634396
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. PALMER REGARDING STATUS, RESCISSION AGREEMENT.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. SAVAGE AND L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.50	387.50	W230	11634397
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING RESCISSION STATUS.	0.60	465.00	W230	11634297
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. COHEN, L. FIFE, ET AL. REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT, ETC.	2.00	1,550.00	W230	11634362
04/12/04	Danilow, Greg REVIEW TAX ISSUES	1.00	755.00	W230	11618777
04/12/04	Hoernlein, Michael REVIEW AND REVISE R. BREEDEN MEMORANDUM (0.6); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, S. COHEN REGARDING MEMORANDUM (0.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, D. PERLSTEIN, R. WHITT, R. MILKMAN, REGARDING FCC INQUIRY (0.8); CONFER WITH S. COHEN REGARDING REVISED BREEDEN MEMORANDUM (0.3); MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLD, L. FIFE, S. COHEN, B. COOPER, A. YOON, M. MEROLA REGARDING CLOSING CHECKLIST (1.2); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING NOTE ALLOCATION AGREEMENTS ISSUE (0.5).	3.90	1,443.00	W230	11557253
04/13/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW AND REVISE DOCUMENTS RELATING TO RESCISSION AGREEMENT, MOTION, ETC. (1.7); CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, S. COHEN, S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.8)	2.50	1,937.50	W230	11634413
04/13/04	Goldstein, Marcia WORK WITH J. ALLERHAND, G. DANILOW, L. FIFE REGARDING PREPARATION FOR RAKOFF HEARING (2.5) PREPARE STATEMENT FOR 4115 HEARING (1.9)	4.40	3,410.00	W230	11634849
04/13/04	Goldstein, Marcia NUMEROUS CALLS WITH M. PALMER (1.0); D. GOLDEN (.8); T. SAVAGE (1.1); D. GROPPER (.7); S. KELLY (.8); R. BREEDEN (1.1) REGARDING MATLIN PATTERSON AGREEMENTS, ETC.	5.50	4,262.50	W230	11634847
04/13/04	Hoernlein, Michael REVIEW STROOCK DRAFT OF RESCISSION AGREEMENT (0.5); MEETING WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE. S. COHEN, M. PALMER, D. GOLDEN, I. DIZENGOFF AND S. GOLD REGARDING RESCISSION OF NOTE ALLOCATION AGREEMENTS (4.0); REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (1.0) CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING AND S. COHEN REGARDING REVISIONS TO RESCISSION AGREEMENT (.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, M. FISHER AND P. OLSON REGARDING TREATMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (0.5); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING AND M. KAM REGARDING SAME (0.3); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (0.6).	7.40	2,738.00	W230	11557971
04/13/04	Lee, Christina RESEARCH ON TAX WITHHOLDING ON BACK PAY.	2.00	660.00	W230	11623342
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT	0.20	155.00	W230	11635458
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.30	232.50	W230	11634857
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. DANILOW REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.40	310.00	W230	11634858

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH J. ALLERHAND, G. DANILOW, L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH R. BREEDEN, S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE REGARDING SAME (1.0); PREPARE FOR HEARING (2.0); REVIEW AND REVISE STATEMENT FOR COURT (.7) REVIEW REVISED MOTION AND RESCISSION AGREEMENT (.5)	5.40	4,185.00	W230	11634963
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH B. ROBINSON REGARDING E&Y, LEHMAN, TAX	0.20	99.00	W230	11554514
04/14/04	Hoernlein, Michael REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENT BASED ON DISCUSSIONS AND CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING AND S. COHEN REGARDING REVISIONS TO RESCISSION AGREEMENT (6.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, M. PLAMER, D. GOLDEN, J. SAVIN, R. WEISS REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT (3.0); FURTHER REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENT BASED ON DISCUSSIONS (2.0); DRAFT SILVER LAKE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (1.0) CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SILVER LAKE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (.5) AND REVISE SILVER LAKE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (.6).	13.80	5,106.00	W230	11557972
04/15/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. PACELLE FROM WALL STREET JOURNAL REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.50	387.50	W230	11637006
04/15/04	Goldstein, Marcia NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING TAX ISSUES	0.60	465.00	W230	11637021
04/15/04	Goldstein, Marcia PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING BEFORE JUDGE RAKOFF (3.8) NUMEROUS CALLS WITH S. KELLY, M. CAPELLAS, B. BURNS, ET AL REGARDING TAX ISSUES (4.2)	8.00	6,200.00	W230	11637005
04/15/04	Hoernlein, Michael REVIEW MOTION TO RESCIND NOTE ALLOCATION AGREEMENTS (1.2) CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.6) AND REVISE SAME (.7); FINALIZE RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (1.7) INCLUDING TELEPHONE CALLS WITH S. GOLDRING, S. GOLD, M. PLAMER, D. GOLDEN REGARDING SAME (1.3) REVISING RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (1.5); CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING AND S. COHEN REGARDING COURT HEARING REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (0.3).	7.30	2,701.00	W230	11557628
04/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ WITH COMMITTEE, ET AL. REGARDING NOTICES, ETC. FOR HEARING ON RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (1.5) AND FOLLOW UP MEETINGS WITH S. COHEN, L. FIFE REGARDING DRAFT MOTION TO BANKRUPTCY COURT (.7) FOLLOW UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE (.8)	3.00	2,325.00	W230	11637252
04/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia NUMEROUS CONFERENCES AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN (.5); L. FIFE (.4); A. PEREZ (.7); S. KELLY (.6); M. CAPELLAS (.5); B. BURNS (.8) REGARDING RAKOFF HEARING.	3.50	2,712.50	W230	11637023
04/16/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL TO M. SUTTER (OHIO COUNSEL) REGARDING RESOLUTION OF LATE CLAIMS MOTION	0.40	220.00	W230	11623288
04/16/04	Hoernlein, Michael CONFER WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING MERGERS ON EFFECTIVE DATE AND NOTE ALLOCATION AGREEMENTS.	0.60	222.00	W230	11556498
04/17/04	Goldstein, Marcia WORK ON PLEADINGS FOR HEARING BEFORE JUDGE GONZALEZ (1.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN, L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (1.0)	2.00	1,550.00	W230	11637265

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/18/04	Goldring, Stuart	1.40	1,001.00	W230	11566034
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON INTERMEDIA MERGER REPS (.4); EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING REMOVAL OF TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (.4), AND CONFER FURTHER WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2); EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH D. RICHARDS REGARDING SAME (.2), AND CONFER FURTHER WITH D. RICHARDS REGARDING SAME (.2)				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W230	11637046
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SPRAYREGEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W230	11637047
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. DANILOW REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W230	11637064
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.50	387.50	W230	11637065
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH PACELLE (WSJ), BECKER REGARDING TAX ISSUES				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	5.50	4,262.50	W230	11636933
	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING BEFORE JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENTS.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W230 - TAX ISSUES:		176.40	\$ 105,028.00		
04/01/04	Ferrillo, Paul	1.00	530.00	W240	11522765
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM R. ALENSTEIN AN F. SAGAT ON STATUS OF ERISA MEDIATION (0.5); FOLLOW-UP TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO D. STEUBER ON ERISA MEDIATION (0.2); DRAFTED MEMORANDUM TO J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY ON DISCUSSION WITH SAGAT AND ALENSTEIN (0.3).				
04/01/04	Johnson, Virginia	1.20	396.00	W240	11507159
	CONFER WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SUBJECT MATTER JURISDICTION ISSUES, PROPOSAL TO WITHDRAW REFERENCE TO SDNY (.4); GATHER RELEVANT DOCUMENTS FOR P. CURNIN (.8)				
04/02/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.90	477.00	W240	11548194
	REVIEW RESPONSES FROM EXCESS CARRIERS ON BOND CLAIM (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND, M. JACOBY AND D. STEUBER ON SETTLEMENT PROPOSAL (.2); E-MAIL TO J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY ON BOND CLAIM (.2).				
04/02/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W240	11537229
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE				
04/05/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.80	424.00	W240	11548238
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. MOONY, D. STEUBER ON D&O ISSUES				
04/06/04	Strochak, Adam	0.10	55.00	W240	11621595
	E-MAIL TO P. FERRILLO REGARDING TWIN CITIES INSURANCE LITIGATION CASE				
04/06/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11534232
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING PAYMENT OF CLAIMS BY ZURICH AND DRAW ON PERTINENT LETTER OF CREDIT.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/06/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH L. PROTOPAPAS AND S. MOONEY REGARDING ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE STIPULATION	0.30	109.50	W240	11546923
04/07/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL FROM J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY REGARDING TWIN CITIES INSURANCE LITIGATION	0.20	110.00	W240	11621594
04/07/04	Ferrillo, Paul DRAFTED SHORT MEMORANDUM ON HEALTHSOUTH DECISION FOR J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY	1.00	530.00	W240	11548367
04/07/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING ZURICH'S PAYMENT OF WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIMS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING ZURICH'S QUESTIONS CONCERNING RETROSPECTIVE PREMIUMS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING REVISIONS TO THE WORLDCOM/ZURICH STIPULATION SUBMITTED BY ZURICH (.10); REVIEW FURTHER E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING FUNDING OF WORKERS' COMPENSATION CLAIMS (.10).	0.40	178.00	W240	11538167
04/07/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MOONEY REGARDING ZURICH STIPULATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANDERSON REGARDING ZURICH STIPULATION (.9); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH ZURICH (2.1); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING ZURICH STIPULATION (.3); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. BURNS; R. KOPPELL, J. COAKLEY, R. CONRAD AND M. RAY REGARDING LEASE ASSIGNMENTS AND CURE ISSUES RELATED TO SAME (1.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. CONRAD REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. MOONEY REGARDING ZURICH STIPULATION (.1).	5.60	2,044.00	W240	11546925
04/08/04	Ferrillo, Paul 2 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY ON APPLICATION OF HEALTHSOUTH DECISION	0.50	265.00	W240	11548413
04/08/04	Protopapas, Lydia CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING THE TERMS OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION.	0.20	89.00	W240	11540644
04/08/04	Watkins, Claire REVIEW NOTES ON SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. SMORODIN REGARDING RESULTS OF REVIEW OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS (.4)	0.80	264.00	W240	11558091
04/09/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND REVISE THE ZURICH STIPULATION.	1.50	667.50	W240	11541964
04/09/04	Grogan, James REVIEW AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE (1.7); CORRESPOND WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.2).	1.90	693.50	W240	11546936
04/12/04	Ferrillo, Paul TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MARSH AND D. STEUBER ON D&O ISSUES	0.40	212.00	W240	11551326
04/12/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND REVISE THE ZURICH STIPULATION.	0.50	222.50	W240	11546092
04/14/04	Ferrillo, Paul	1.30	689.00	W240	11552355

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PARTICIPATE IN 2 CONFERENCE CALLS ON ERISA SETTLEMENT ISSUES (0.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO D. STEUBER ON D&O ISSUES (0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM S. MOONEY ON D&O ISSUES (0.3).				
04/14/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W240	11553341
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN TO P. ANDERSON REGARDING THE REVISED FORM OF THE ZURICH STIPULATION.				
04/14/04	Grogan, James	0.50	182.50	W240	11569911
	REVIEW AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE				
04/15/04	Ferrillo, Paul	0.60	318.00	W240	11556702
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. PETREN, M. JACOBY, S. MOONEY ON ERISA SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS.				
04/15/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.30	133.50	W240	11562783
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY REGARDING THE REVISED ZURICH STIPULATION (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING PAYMENT OF DEDUCTIBLES UNDER INTERNATIONAL POLICY (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE POLICIES AND ENTITIES COVERED BY SUCH POLICIES (.10).				
04/15/04	Grogan, James	1.50	547.50	W240	11571748
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS AND P. ANDERSON REGARDING STIPULATION WITH ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE (.8); CORRESPOND WITH S. MOONEY, B. BENJET AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.7).				
04/16/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W240	11562657
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. MOONEY AND P. BROWN REGARDING CLAIMS PAID BY CNA/CONTINENTAL (.10); AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. GARRETT REGARDING SAME (.10).				
04/19/04	Jacoby, Mark	2.20	1,364.00	W240	11626135
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH J. ALLERHAND AND H. RUMELD REGARDING INSURANCE (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. GOTTO AND L. SARKO REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RACHEL OF WOLF, BLOCK REGARDING SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OFFICE OF G. RIDGE REGARDING WORLDCOM MEETING SCHEDULED FOR 4/20/04 (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.4)				
04/19/04	Ferrillo, Paul	1.70	901.00	W240	11568359
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FROM M. JACOBY ON STATUS (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO MARSH ON STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS WITH CARRIERS (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO S. MOONEY ON STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS WITH CARRIERS (0.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE TO S. ANDERSON ON STATUS OF DISCUSSIONS WITH CARRIERS (0.4); MEETING WITH J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY ON SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (0.5).				
04/19/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W240	11564807
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM P. BROWN REGARDING CNA'S DRAW ON THE LETTER OF CREDIT AND PAYMENT OF CLAIMS (.10); AND THEN CONTACT G. HIRSCH, COUNSEL FOR CNA, REGARDING SAME (.10).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W240 - INSURANCE ISSUES:		26.20	\$ 11,742.50		
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W260	11635849
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MCGAREY REGARDING EMPLOYEE STOCK PLAN.				
04/06/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.50	335.00	W260	11585192

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HIRREL, VERVEER REGARDING CARSO STOCKHOLDINGS					
04/06/04	Margolis, Steven	0.60	330.00	W260	11598486
CONFER WITH F. GREEN AND D. WHITTAKER REGARDING REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE ISSUES ON SAME					
04/07/04	Margolis, Steven	3.10	1,705.00	W260	11598488
CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE ISSUES (0.3); REVIEW PUBLIC DUE DILIGENCE (2.4); REVISE DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST (0.4)					
04/08/04	Margolis, Steven	1.70	935.00	W260	11598357
REVIEW OF PUBLIC DUE DILIGENCE MATERIALS (1.3); REVIEW NEW CHECKLIST FROM D. WHITTAKER FOR DUE DILIGENCE ISSUES (0.4)					
04/09/04	Margolis, Steven	1.20	660.00	W260	11598362
CONFER WITH F. GREEN REGARDING PRIOR AGREEMENTS AND REVIEW STRATEGY (0.3); REVIEW ATT/CINGULAR AGREEMENT AND SUMMARY OF EMPLOYEE ISSUES (0.9)					
04/09/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.40	693.00	W260	11623852
TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & M. JACOBY REGARDING ERISA PLAINTIFFS CLAIMS [0.2]; REVIEW MEMORANDA REGARDING SAME [1.2]					
04/09/04	Lee, Christina	5.00	1,650.00	W260	11567059
REVIEWING PUBLIC FILINGS REGARDING REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE.					
04/12/04	Kam, Michael	0.20	128.00	W260	11627203
SPOKE WITH S. MARGOLIS REGARDING EMPLOYEE ISSUES					
04/12/04	Margolis, Steven	0.90	495.00	W260	11598417
CONFER WITH M. KAM AND F. GREEN REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE (0.3); REVIEW KERP AND RELATED DOCUMENTS FOR CHANGE IN CONTROL (0.4); CONFER WITH A. GRANT REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE (0.2)					
04/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.30	643.50	W260	11622747
PREPARE (.6) & ATTEND MEETING WITH M. JACOBY, J. ALLERHAND & BAER REGARDING ERISA CLAIMANTS & OBJECTION [.7]					
04/12/04	Lee, Christina	2.00	660.00	W260	11622216
REVIEWING SBC PUBLIC FILINGS REGARDING DILIGENCE.					
04/13/04	Kam, Michael	0.50	320.00	W260	11637572
SPOKE WITH S. GOLDRING AND M. HORNLEIN REGARDING WITHHOLDING (.3); SPOKE WITH M. HORNLEIN ON WITHHOLDING (.2)					
04/13/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.30	148.50	W260	11616957
CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN & A. STROCHAK REGARDING OBJECTION TO ERISA PLAINTIFFS CLAIMS					
04/14/04	Margolis, Steven	1.20	660.00	W260	11598473
PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF DRAFT AGREEMENT FROM M. SKARDA					
04/19/04	Kam, Michael	1.10	704.00	W260	11627564

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	SPOKE WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING OPTION PRICE (.2); CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.6); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (0.3).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W260 - EMPLOYEES/UNION ISSUES:		21.20	\$ 10,222.00		
04/01/04	Green, Frederick	3.70	2,867.50	W280	11611273
	REVIEW DUE DILIGENCE OPEN ISSUES (.8); PRECEDENT DEALS (.6); REVIEW GEORGIA LAW (.5); COLLARS ISSUE (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LAZARD REGARDING SAME (.7) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING DILIGENCE (.1)				
04/01/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.40	268.00	W280	11585109
	EMAILS WITH I. FROIM REGARDING CARSO SHARE TOTAL (.2); EMAILS WITH WILLKIE REGARDING SHARE TOTAL (.2)				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11527061
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. PETERSON REGARDING MUNICIPAL FRANCHISE AGREEMENTS				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11527109
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING DOCUMENT REQUEST				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11527453
	PHONE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING SCHEDULE, STATUS, DOCUMENT MANAGEMENT				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11527939
	PHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING DILIGENCE, SCHEDULE				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11527941
	PHONE CALL WITH M. SKARDA, S. JAMAL REGARDING SCHEDULING, STAFFING				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11527017
	PHONE CALL WITH B. PETERSON REGARDING PRODUCTION BASE MANAGEMENT				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11528164
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING LITIGATION AND REGULATORY DOCUMENTS				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11528175
	CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION, COMPLIANCE ISSUES				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11528779
	PREPARATION FOR MEETING REGARDING ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11527008
	CONFERENCES WITH C. COX REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS (.3) COPYING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (.3) INDEXING FOREIGN SUBS (.2)				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11528791
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEXING, ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST, REVISIONS TO MEMORANDUM				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.30	643.50	W280	11527738

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MEETING WITH B. ROBINSON, S. FERIA, S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATED DOCUMENT REQUEST LIST				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.00	990.00	W280	11527938
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	3.70	1,831.50	W280	11527921
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/01/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.90	400.50	W280	11528074
	REVIEWED CERTIFICATE OF MERGER (.6) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH P. LIBRETTA (.3)				
04/01/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.00	445.00	W280	11528057
	REVIEWED TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT (.6) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH M. CHASTKA (.4)				
04/01/04	Holzman, Daniel	3.70	1,646.50	W280	11528042
	DRAFTED REPLY LETTER TO CONSOB (2.8), PHONE CALL WITH L. PICONE TO DISCUSS CONSOB ISSUES (.5) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH S. GOLD (.4)				
04/01/04	Libretta, Paul	5.80	1,595.00	W280	11528267
	CONTINUED DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGERS FOR VARIOUS JURISDICTIONS/ENTITIES.				
04/01/04	Froim, Idit	10.00	3,700.00	W280	11612832
	WORKED ON NOTICE TO DOJ REGARDING SHARE IN MCI (4.0) COMMUNICATED WITH MCI, LAZARD AND WITH WGM TEAM (1.5) PREPARED MCI KEY CONTACT SHEET , A SUMMARY OF THE KNOWN FACTS AND A FIRST DRAFT OF A NOTICE LETTER (4.5)				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559544
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559831
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559833
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. SKARDA AND D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559829
	CONFER WITH M. LOSICK REGARDING FIDUCIARY RESEARCH.				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559830
	REVIEW AND PROVIDE COMMENTS TO M. SKARDA (.2); EMAIL WITH SUMMARY OF PRELIMINARY RESEARCH RESULTS REGARDING FIDUCIARY DUTIES (.1)				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.60	150.00	W280	11559547
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.90	225.00	W280	11559545
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.				
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559828
	CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING FIDUCIARY DUTY RESEARCH.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.	1.30	325.00	W280	11559543
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.	1.70	425.00	W280	11559548
04/01/04	Jamal, Sacha CONTINUE RESEARCHING GEORGIA LAW ISSUE.	2.10	525.00	W280	11559546
04/01/04	Cox, Sara ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (8.7); CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM (.3)	9.00	855.00	W280	11571367
04/01/04	Joffrion, Karen RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM	0.50	80.00	W280	11545405
04/01/04	Dapara1, Dapara1 FINAL PREPARATION AND FORWARDING OF EDS AGREEMENT AND AMENDMENT DOCUMENTATION TO PRODUCTION ROOM FOR DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW (2.4); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING STATUS OF EDS DOCUMENTATION, REQUIRED REVIEW AND PRODUCTION OF FRANCHISE DOCUMENTATION, ASSISTANCE WITH INDEX UPDATING AND ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF VARIOUS DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION AND INDEXING OF SAME (.6); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (2.0)	5.00	700.00	W280	11512612
04/02/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES	0.90	697.50	W280	11611599
04/02/04	Pearlstein, Debra TELEPHONE CONFERENCE LONGMIRE, VERVEER REGARDING TELMEX SHAREHOLDINGS (.7); REVIEWING DRAFT NOTIFICATION (.7)	1.40	938.00	W280	11585114
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION	0.10	49.50	W280	11529977
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. SINGLE REGARDING CONSENT DECREES	0.10	49.50	W280	11529979
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH S. JAMAL AND M. SKADA REGARDING DILIGENCE	0.10	49.50	W280	11530065
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION ISSUES	0.20	99.00	W280	11529976
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SILLIMAN REGARDING INT'L DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11529978
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING EDS	0.20	99.00	W280	11529980
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11529982

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING SCHEDULING, EDS, COPIES				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11530066
	PHONE CALLS WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING ADDITIONAL MATERIALS				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11529981
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING INDEXING DOCUMENTS, SCHEDULES, COPIES				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11530068
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11530070
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING ADDITIONAL MATERIALS				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11530063
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING STATUS, SCHEDULES, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX, ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11530064
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM, REVISE DUE DILIGENCE				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11530069
	CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.30	643.50	W280	11530067
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/02/04	Whittaker, Donald	3.20	1,584.00	W280	11529983
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/02/04	Hirsch, Stuart	3.80	1,748.00	W280	11541196
	VARIOUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES W/LITIGATORS REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION IN PREPARATION FOR 4/13 HEARING (TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LAZARD, MCI) (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH R. BARRETTO AND OTHER BRAZILIAN COUNSEL REGARDING REGULATORY FILINGS (1.6)				
04/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11527224
	DISCUSSED MERGERS WITH P. LIBRETTA REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11527260
	COORDINATED EXCHANGE OF SIGNATURE PAGES TO TRANSFER AGENT AGREEMENT AND REVIEWED THE SAME.				
04/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W280	11527227
	DISCUSSED CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT WITH N. JONES AND K. HENESSY.				
04/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W280	11527228
	REVIEWED 8-A AND COMMENTS THERETO.				
04/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.70	311.50	W280	11527261

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEWED 10-K.				
04/02/04	Holzman, Daniel	4.10	1,824.50	W280	11527222
	CALL WITH S. GOLD AND L. PICONE TO DISCUSS CONSOB (.4) CALL WITH S. GOLD AND N. JONES TO DISCUSS THE SAME (.7) AND DRAFTED REPLIES REGARDING CONSOB'S REQUEST (3.0)				
04/02/04	Davis, Pierre	3.90	1,560.00	W280	11638009
	CONFER WITH A. COHEN AND L. BRAUN REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (3.1); CALL J. FINCHER AT LAZARD REGARDING DOCUMENT COLLECTION (.8)				
04/02/04	Libretta, Paul	9.20	2,530.00	W280	11528038
	CONTINUED DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGER FOR WORLDCOM (8.3) SPOKE WITH F. DIMINICH, WHO WILL BE DRAFTING THE REST OF THE DE COM'S (.9)				
04/02/04	Froim, Idit	4.00	1,480.00	W280	11613132
	CONT. WORKING ON THE NOTIFICATION TO THE DOJ ISSUE (1.5) FINALIZED DRAFT NOTIFICATION AND SUMMARY OF FACTS (1.0) PARTICIPATED IN A CONFERENCE CALL WITH WILLKIE REGARDING COMMUNICATION WITH THE DOJ (.8) ORGANIZED THE FILE (.7)				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559761
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING EDS AMENDMENT EMAIL.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559762
	FOLLOW-UP REGARDING EDS AMENDMENT EMAIL.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559775
	EMAIL M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING INDEX.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559779
	REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559800
	CONFER WITH J. WATSON REGARDING CHART.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559777
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM M. DAVIDIAN.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559778
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING RISK FACTORS FOR STRAUSS' INDUSTRY GENERALLY/REVERSE DILIGENCE.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559784
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559773
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAILS.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559774
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND LITIGATION BOX.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559785

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA AND F. GREEN REGARDING PROJECT AND NEXT STEPS.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559799
	MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING STATUS AND PLAN FOR THE FOLLOWING WEEK.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11559783
	CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING PROJECT.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.60	150.00	W280	11559801
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559328
	RESEARCH SECURITIES FILINGS AND SEARCH FOR RISK FACTORS				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559776
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.40	350.00	W280	11559782
	RETRIEVE SEC FILINGS PER D. WHITTAKER.				
04/02/04	Cox, Sara	10.20	969.00	W280	11571369
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (9.5); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER (.4); CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL (.3) REGARDING SAME				
04/02/04	Joffrion, Karen	0.80	128.00	W280	11545410
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.60); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRINTED FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.20).				
04/02/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.00	280.00	W280	11527768
	INDEXING OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION AND FORWARDING OF SAME TO PRODUCTION ROOM FOR DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW.				
04/03/04	Green, Frederick	0.80	620.00	W280	11611526
	REVIEW DEAL (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SAME (.3)				
04/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11531167
	MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. PETRIE, P. ESKILDSEN				
04/03/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11531166
	REVIEW REVISED 4/2 PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX, REVISIONS				
04/03/04	Skarda, Michael	0.70	322.00	W280	11542958
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING PROJECT (0.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO AND FROM F. GREEN AND P. ESKILDSEN (0.4).				
04/03/04	Libretta, Paul	7.30	2,007.50	W280	11527797
	CONTINUED DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGER FOR WORLDCOM.				
04/03/04	Froim, Idit	0.50	185.00	W280	11616017

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPONDED WITH S. COHEN AND D. PEARLSTEIN REGARDING THE ESTIMATE OF THE NUMBER OF MCI STOCK THAT WILL BE ISSUED UPON EMERGENCE AND DISCLOSING SUCH INFORMATION TO THE DOJ.				
04/03/04	Cox, Sara	3.00	285.00	W280	11566857
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (1.5); INDEX DOCUMENTS (1.5)				
04/04/04	Gold, Simeon	2.70	1,984.50	W280	11534865
	TWO CONFERENCE CALLS WITH PICONE (ITALIAN COUNSEL) AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES (.7) AND REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (.5); COMMENCED MY REVIEW OF JONES' DRAFTS OF CLIENTS SEC DOCUMENTS (1.5).				
04/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11531170
	CORRESPONDENCE R. PETERSON REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/04/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11531169
	CORRESPONDENCE FROM P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/04/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11528392
	DISCUSSED LETTER TO CONSOB WITH S. GOLD AND L. PICONE.				
04/04/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.90	400.50	W280	11528393
	REVIEWED 10-Q.				
04/04/04	Hyatte, Theresa	4.00	1,740.00	W280	11624886
	DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING INDEPENDENCE ISSUES (2.5) REVIEW ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE (1.5)				
04/04/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559804
	CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING DEVELOPMENTS (.1); FOLLOW-UP REGARDING BANKRUPTCY PLAN (.4).				
04/05/04	Dixon, Catherine	1.00	755.00	W280	11632614
	KPMG INDEPENDENCE ISSUE -- DISCUSSION WITH T. HYATTE OF MEMORANDUM, RESEARCH, REVIEW OF T. HYATTE'S DRAFT.				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11533137
	PHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING REVERSE DILIGENCE, SCHEDULES, CONTRACT DILIGENCE				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11533480
	PHONE CALL WITH R. PETERSEN REGARDING INTERCONNECTION AGREEMENTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11533487
	PHONE CALL WITH C. PETREN REGARDING LITIGATION UPDATES				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11533489
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. ROBINSON REGARDING IT AND FINANCIAL UPDATES				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11533491
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. BATES REGARDING IT UPDATES				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11556083

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING COPYING, FRANCHISE AGREEMENTS, HR DOCUMENTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533136
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. HACKERSON REGARDING IT BINDERS AND MIS REPORTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533138
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SILLIMAN REGARDING INTERNATIONAL REGULATORY ISSUES				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533139
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. PETREN REGARDING ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533140
	CONFERENCE WITH P. BATES REGARDING IT INFORMATION				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533147
	PHONE CALLS WITH C. COX REGARDING INTERNATIONAL DOCUMENTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533479
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM UPDATES				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533488
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ROBERTSON REGARDING HR CATALOG AND PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11533490
	PHONE CALL WITH E. HACKERSON REGARDING IT INFORMATION				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11556079
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, COPYING, INT'L DOCUMENTS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11556090
	REVIEW RISK FACTORS IN SEC FILINGS				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11533145
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE ANNOTATION, NEW DOCUMENTS, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.60	297.00	W280	11533144
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING REVISIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST ANNOTATION				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.30	643.50	W280	11533142
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.40	693.00	W280	11533141
	REVISE REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST				
04/05/04	Whittaker, Donald	3.80	1,881.00	W280	11556088
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/05/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.40	178.00	W280	11539272

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSIONS WITH S. GOLD AND L. PICONE REGARDING CONSOB.				
04/05/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.80	356.00	W280	11539273
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, S. GOLD, B. COOPER, A. YOON AND M. MEROLA TO DISCUSS EMERGENCE ITEMS.				
04/05/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.40	623.00	W280	11539274
	REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON MERGER DOCUMENTS.				
04/05/04	Holzman, Daniel	2.20	979.00	W280	11539275
	REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON 10-QS AND 10-K.				
04/05/04	Libretta, Paul	6.60	1,815.00	W280	11541824
	CONTINUED DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGER (5.5) SPOKE WITH D. HOLZMAN ABOUT TAX CLEARANCE ISSUES (.6) SPOKE WITH F. DIMINICH ABOUT DRAFTING ISSUES (.5)				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559564
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. MENCHACA REGARDING NEW FINANCIAL INFORMATION AVAILABLE IN PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559565
	CONFER WITH D. ANDERSON REGARDING BACKUP OF CDS.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559554
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING NEW DOCUMENTS.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559555
	ASSIST K. JOFFRION WITH PRINTING FINANCIAL CHARTS AND COORDINATE WITH IT DEPARTMENT.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559563
	MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS, EMAILS AND CONTRACT REVIEW CHART.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.60	150.00	W280	11559559
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING NEW DOCUMENTS AND REVISIONS TO ANNOTATIONS.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.30	575.00	W280	11559562
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.80	700.00	W280	11559560
	REVIEW EMAILS AND NEW DOCUMENTS AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS ACCORDINGLY.				
04/05/04	Cox, Sara	10.60	1,007.00	W280	11570848
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/05/04	Joffrion, Karen	9.60	1,536.00	W280	11545717
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (9.2); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.1); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRINTED FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.3).				
04/05/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.50	350.00	W280	11529531

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISTRIBUTION OF MATERIALS TO S. FEIRA (1.5); REVIEW OF MCI EMPLOYMENT BENEFITS MATRIX (1.0)				
04/06/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO DEAL (1.0); DUE DILIGENCE ISSUES (1.4)	2.40	1,860.00	W280	11612218
04/06/04	Dixon, Catherine 2003 10-K AND 10-Q REVIEW (1.0); DISCUSSION WITH P.J. HIMELFARB REGARDING SAME (.5)	1.50	1,132.50	W280	11632617
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. PETREN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM UPDATES	0.10	49.50	W280	11537143
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE	0.10	49.50	W280	11537144
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. COOK REGARDING IT	0.10	49.50	W280	11537145
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING COPYING DOCUMENTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11537397
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM SCHEDULES AND UPDATES	0.20	99.00	W280	11537142
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM QUESTIONS	0.20	99.00	W280	11537150
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11537152
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN, M. SKARDA REGARDING SCHEDULE, STAFFING, DILIGENCE, CONTRACT.	0.20	99.00	W280	11537372
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. BATES REGARDING IT DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11537374
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING INT'L DOCUMENTS, REGULATORY AUTHORIZATIONS, SCHEDULE, DOCUMENT STATUS	0.20	99.00	W280	11537379
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE FROM N. JONES	0.20	99.00	W280	11537390
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSEN	0.20	99.00	W280	11537392
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11537398
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11536718

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVISE DUE DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11537154
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION, FOREIGN SUBS				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11537394
	REVIEW DILIGENCE DOCUMENTS AND PROCESS				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11537375
	REVIEW AND INDEX IT DOCUMENTS				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11537153
	PHONE CALLS WITH C. SILLIMAN REGARDING INT'L DOCUMENTS				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11537146
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM FOLLOW-UP, ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS, ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11537147
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DILIGENCE FOLLOW-UP, ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11537383
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.30	643.50	W280	11537382
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.80	1,386.00	W280	11537393
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/06/04	Himelfarb, P.	1.10	506.00	W280	11628063
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PROPOSED DISCLOSURE.				
04/06/04	Libretta, Paul	11.50	3,162.50	W280	11541680
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM (2.0) CONTINUED DRAFTING DOCUMENTS FOR MERGER (9.5)				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559578
	CONFER WITH K. MALMAY REGARDING PRINTING.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559582
	CONFER WITH C. MCGUIRE REGARDING BACKING UP CDS.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559579
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559581
	SEARCH FOR ELECTRONIC CUSTOMER CONTRACTS AND EMAIL THE SAME TO A. RAVI.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559583

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH J. CARRADINE REGARDING PROBLEMS WITH READING DVDS.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559569
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAILS AND NEW DOCUMENTS.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559570
	REVIEW AND UPDATE INDEX.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559580
	REVIEW AND SORT COUNTRY BREAKDOWN DOCUMENTATION.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.10	275.00	W280	11559574
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS AND ANNOTATIONS.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.50	375.00	W280	11559575
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.50	375.00	W280	11559576
	REVIEW EMAILS AND NEW DOCUMENTS AND UPDATE INDEX.				
04/06/04	Jamal, Sacha	3.20	800.00	W280	11559577
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/06/04	Cox, Sara	10.90	1,035.50	W280	11571370
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT (10.3); CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER (.3); CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL (.3) REGARDING SAME				
04/06/04	Joffrion, Karen	5.00	800.00	W280	11545721
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (4.70); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRINTED FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.30).				
04/06/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.00	280.00	W280	11534769
	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF MCI EMPLOYMENT BENEFITS MATRIX AGAINST DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION INDEX (1.0); COMPILATION OF MISSING DOCUMENTATION LISTING (1.0)				
04/07/04	Green, Frederick	1.80	1,395.00	W280	11611964
	ATTENTION TO DEAL (.5); DUE DILIGENCE ISSUES AND POTENTIAL LIST OF DILIGENCE QUESTIONS (.9); REVIEW SAME WITH D. WHITTAKER (.4)				
04/07/04	Dixon, Catherine	1.50	1,132.50	W280	11632626
	DISCUSSIONS WITH BETHANY COOPER, PJ HIMELFARB REGARDING DISCLOSURE CONTROLS AND PROCEDURES, OTC TRADING AND DISCLOSURE.				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11541257
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING MISSING DOCUMENTS				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11541258
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING DOCUMENT INDEX AND ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11541046

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11541235
	PHONE CALL WITH S. MARGOLIS REGARDING REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11541252
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. PETREN REGARDING ANNOTATION				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11541253
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING HR DOCUMENTS				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11541259
	CONFERENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING COPYING, ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS, SCHEDULE, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11541260
	REVISIONS TO REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11541028
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM COPIES, PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11541025
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM, ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11541236
	CONFERENCE WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SCHEDULES				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11541026
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST, DILIGENCE, REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.10	544.50	W280	11541027
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING REVIEW OF ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM, PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.50	742.50	W280	11541030
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.80	1,386.00	W280	11541029
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/07/04	Margolis, Jonathan	7.90	3,515.50	W280	11565751
	RESEARCH REGARDING ELECTION AND DISTRIBUTION OF SECURITIES				
04/07/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.60	267.00	W280	11538832
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, J. MCGAREY AND WGM TEAM REGARDING EMERGENCE ITEMS.				
04/07/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.80	356.00	W280	11539067
	RESEARCHED 8-A RULES (.4) AND DISCUSSED 8-A WITH D. CHAMBERS OF DAVIS POLK (.4)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/07/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED MERGER DOCUMENTS	1.40	623.00	W280	11538831
04/07/04	Himelfarb, P. FURTHER REVISE COMMENTS ON PROPOSED DISCLOSURE	0.30	138.00	W280	11628065
04/07/04	Hurson, Daniel REVIEW NUMEROUS SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS WITH C. WATKINS, D. TAYLOR AND A. DINOS AT MCI/WORLDCOM IN WASHINGTON, D.C. (5.9) AND CATEGORIZE ONGOING AND FUTURE OBLIGATIONS OF MCI/WORLDCOM, FOR REVIEW BY MCI/WORLDCOM IN HOUSE COUNSEL (0.8).	6.70	2,211.00	W280	11613926
04/07/04	Dinos, Anthea DUE DILIGENCE: REVIEW SETTLEMENT PROVISIONS WITHIN WORLDCOM SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS.	10.50	3,465.00	W280	11544054
04/07/04	Libretta, Paul CONTINUED DRAFTING CERTIFICATES OF MERGER.	8.10	2,227.50	W280	11541611
04/07/04	Ravi, Aparna REVIEWED CUSTOMER CONTRACTS OF WORLDCOM FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, ASSIGNMENT, CHANGE OF CONTROL AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.	10.00	2,750.00	W280	11538975
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559597
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER AND M. SKARDA REGARDING EVENTS GOING FORWARD.	0.20	50.00	W280	11559592
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. MALMAY REGARDING PRINTING AND REDLINES.	0.20	50.00	W280	11559593
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha RESPOND TO REQUESTS FROM D. KIM	0.20	50.00	W280	11559604
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.30	75.00	W280	11559455
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW EMAILS AND RESPOND TO REQUESTS.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559598
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND DILIGENCE.	0.50	125.00	W280	11559591
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.50	125.00	W280	11559600
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW REAL ESTATE CDS.	0.70	175.00	W280	11559596
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559590

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.				
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.50	375.00	W280	11559595
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.				
04/07/04	Cox, Sara	7.00	665.00	W280	11571331
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/07/04	Mayes, Charlotte	0.40	62.00	W280	11555797
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON, C. COX, S. SALEH AND J. ENGLISH REGARDING ASSISTING WITH PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/07/04	Joffrion, Karen	3.50	560.00	W280	11545668
	MEETING WITH J. THOMPSON, J. ENGLISH, C. COX, C. MAYES, AND S. SALEH REGARDING COVERAGE OF PRODUCTION ROOM (.20); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRINTED FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (.10); PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (3.20).				
04/07/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.00	280.00	W280	11534775
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING MISSING MCI EMPLOYEE BENEFITS DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION (.5); ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF MCI EMPLOYEE BENEFITS MATRIX TO ASCERTAIN STATUS OF VARIOUS DOCUMENTATION BASED ON ATTORNEY COMMENTS (.5); DRAFT OF MISSING EMPLOYEE BENEFITS DOCUMENTATION LISTING AND FORWARDING OF SAME TO D. WHITTAKER FOR FURTHER REVIEW AND NECESSARY ACTION(S) (.5); MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (.5)				
04/07/04	Saleh, Sally	0.50	40.00	W280	11541247
	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH C. COX, J. ENGLISH, J. THOMPSON, C. MAYES AND K. JOFFRION REGARDING PARALEGAL ASSISTANCE IN PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W280	11635634
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. SANDLER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES				
04/08/04	Green, Frederick	6.30	4,882.50	W280	11611906
	ATTENTION TO DEAL (2.3); REVIEW OTHER DEALS (2.0); REVIEW OTHER RECENT DEALS WITH FOCUS ON MAE (1.0); PARTICIPATE IN BUSINESS CALL (1.0)				
04/08/04	Fife, Lori	2.60	1,859.00	W280	11614921
	CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. COHEN REGARDING NOL/ELECTION MEMORANDA (1.8); NUMEROUS EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.8).				
04/08/04	Pearlstein, Debra	2.30	1,541.00	W280	11585202
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FCC AND FCC COUNSEL REGARDING DISCLOSURE ISSUES (1.5); EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.8)				
04/08/04	Dixon, Catherine	1.50	1,132.50	W280	11632663
	RESPONSES ON DRS QUESTIONS REGARDING BANK OF NEW YORK				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542757
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542760

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	PHONE CALLS WITH A. RAVI REGARDING DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542779
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING STAFFING				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542781
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542786
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM UPDATE				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542797
	PHONE CALL WITH N. JONES REGARDING OPEN DILIGENCE ITEMS				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11542814
	CORRESPONDENCE TO F. GREEN REGARDING REVISED REVERSE DILIGENCE CHECKLIST				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11542787
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING ADDITIONAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS AND ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11542798
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, ORGANIZATION OF DOCUMENTS				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11542809
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11542813
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. NOLAN REGARDING FINANCIAL DOCUMENTS				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11542770
	REVIEW DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11542796
	PHONE CALLS WITH R. PETERSEN REGARDING REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, RIGHT OF WAY AGREEMENTS				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11542808
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENT REVISIONS, DILIGENCE, REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11542806
	REVISIONS TO ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.00	495.00	W280	11542807
	REVISIONS TO PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.10	544.50	W280	11542788
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. NOLAN REGARDING TREASURY DOCUMENTS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATION OF DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM	1.50	742.50	W280	11542759
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS	2.60	1,287.00	W280	11542815
04/08/04	Margolis, Jonathan RESEARCH REGARDING ELECTION AND DISTRIBUTION OF SECURITIES	8.20	3,649.00	W280	11565323
04/08/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED AND COMMENTED ON MERGER DOCUMENTS.	2.40	1,068.00	W280	11538886
04/08/04	Avalos, Ginessa CONFER WITH S. JAMAL AND D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PROJECT BACKGROUND AND DILIGENCE (0.9); REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (7.1); CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING PUBLIC DISCLOSURES ON INDUSTRY TRENDS (3.3).	11.30	3,390.00	W280	11539353
04/08/04	Libretta, Paul DRAFTED RESOLUTIONS FOR CORPORATIONS IN JURISDICTIONS THAT DO NOT ALLOW MERGERS PURSUANT TO THE AUTHORITY OF A BANKRUPTCY COURT/REORGANIZATION.	5.60	1,540.00	W280	11541625
04/08/04	Ravi, Aparna CONTINUED REVIEW OF CUSTOMER CONTRACTS OF WORLDCOM FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, ASSIGNMENT, CHANGE OF CONTROL AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.	10.50	2,887.50	W280	11538980
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING DILIGENCE.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559609
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING PRINTING.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559612
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP REGARDING ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559615
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH A. RAVI REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACT DILIGENCE.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559754
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.30	75.00	W280	11559607
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE VENDOR DILIGENCE TEMPLATE.	0.30	75.00	W280	11559616
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SECURITIES FILINGS RESEARCH.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559760
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.80	200.00	W280	11559755
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.90	225.00	W280	11559606

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFER WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING PROJECT BACKGROUND AND DILIGENCE.				
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559610
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS AND INDEXING.				
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559753
	REVIEW VENDOR CONTRACTS AND INCLUDE INFORMATION ON VENDOR CHART.				
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.00	250.00	W280	11559759
	RESEARCH REGARDING COMPANIES FILINGS.				
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.20	300.00	W280	11559757
	PREPARE LIST OF OUTSTANDING ISSUES AND CROSS-REFERENCE WITH RESPONSIBLE PERSON.				
04/08/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.40	350.00	W280	11559756
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.				
04/08/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	2.50	350.00	W280	11537820
	REVIEW OF ELECTRONIC PRODUCTION SYSTEMS CONTRACT TO ASCERTAIN STATUS OF SAME (1.0); PRODUCTION ROOM MONITORING AND DOCUMENTATION REVIEW, ASSEMBELDGE AND CONSOLIDATION (1.5)				
04/08/04	Rafferty, Joe	0.80	152.00	W280	11636467
	CONFERENCE WITH D. PEARLSTEIN REGARDING HSR FILING				
04/09/04	Pearlstein, Debra	2.40	1,608.00	W280	11605138
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH GUARD (.5) WAITT (.4) AND REVISING POSITION PAPERS (1.4); MESSAGE WITH WILKIE REGARDING HSR INFORMATION (.1)				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543386
	PHONE CALL WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING STATUS, STAFFING, SCHEDULING				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543428
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING DILIGENCE				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543429
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. HACKENSON REGARDING IT ISSUES				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543430
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING OPEN PRODUCTION ROOM ITEMS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543443
	CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543444
	PHONE CALL WITH A. RAVI REGARDING DILIGENCE				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11543414
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. PETREN REGARDING OPEN ISSUES				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11543427

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11543435
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SILLIMAN REGARDING INT'L DOCUMENTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11543438
	CONFERENCE WITH D. KIM REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11543445
	REVIEW DILIGENCE MEMOS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11543425
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSEN REGARDING CONTRACTS, IT, NETWORK				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11543426
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH WITH JAMAL REGARDING OPEN PRODUCTION ROOM ITEMS, CONTRACTS, FINANCE DOCUMENTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11543431
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DULDUCA REGARDING LITIGATION DOCUMENTS, COPY REQUESTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11543440
	CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH AND C. COX REGARDING FOREIGN SUBSIDIARIES, PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11543404
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MATERIALS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11543415
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING OPEN PRODUCTION ROOM ISSUES, CONTRACTS				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11543403
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATED DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11543439
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11543402
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.00	495.00	W280	11543436
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.60	792.00	W280	11543437
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/09/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11539268
	READ EXCHANGE OF EMAILS REGARDING CONSOB.				
04/09/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.60	267.00	W280	11539271

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSED MERGER DOCUMENTS WITH PAUL LIBRETTA.				
04/09/04	Avalos, Ginessa	8.10	2,430.00	W280	11540387
	CONFER WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE (0.2); REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (7.8); CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING SAME (0.1).				
04/09/04	Libretta, Paul	6.80	1,870.00	W280	11541810
	REVIEWED FILING REQUIREMENTS FOR ALL JURISDICTIONS WITH COURT (1.0) CREATED CHART TO KEEP TRACK OF FILING REQUIREMENTS IN 14 JURISDICTIONS (1.3) MADE REVISIONS TO SEVERAL DOCUMENTS THAT HAD BEEN RECOMMENDED BY D. HOLZMAN (1.5) UPDATED RESOLUTIONS (3.0)				
04/09/04	Ravi, Aparna	2.20	605.00	W280	11538984
	CONTINUED DILIGENCE REVIEW OF CUSTOMER CONTRACTS FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, ASSIGNMENT, CHANGE OF CONTROL AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559909
	REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559914
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. COOK REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559915
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. RAVI REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559901
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING MATERIALS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559902
	CONFER WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING DILIGENCE.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559904
	CONFER WITH K. MALMAY REGARDING LOGISTICS/PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559906
	CONFER WITH S. SALEH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559908
	FOLLOW UP REGARDING YESTERDAY'S SECURITIES FILINGS RESEARCH.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559903
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING NEW EMAILS.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559911
	PREPARE AND SEND EMAILS TO D. WHITTAKER AND MCI RESPONSIBLE PERSONS REGARDING OPEN ITEMS.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11559912
	REVIEW RESPONSES TO EMAILS AND INCORPORATE SAME INTO ANNOTATIONS.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.80	200.00	W280	11559913

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.90	225.00	W280	11559910
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS.				
04/09/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.50	375.00	W280	11559900
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.				
04/09/04	Cox, Sara	6.50	617.50	W280	11571333
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/09/04	Joffrion, Karen	2.50	400.00	W280	11545665
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS WITH ATTACHED DOCUMENTS (.60); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ORACLE EMAIL (.20); REVIEW ALL EMAILS TO OBTAIN ORACLE EMAIL (1.70).				
04/09/04	Dapara1, Dapara1	4.50	630.00	W280	11539202
	MONITORING OF PRODUCTION ROOM (2.0); ORGANIZATION OF DUE DILIGENCE DOCUMENTATION (2.5)				
04/09/04	Saleh, Sally	1.50	120.00	W280	11587713
	OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH D. WHITTAKER AND C. COX REGARDING MONITORING PRODUCTION ROOM (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT MATTERS (.6)				
04/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543450
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS				
04/10/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11543451
	CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING IT DESK				
04/10/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.10	44.50	W280	11539743
	DISCUSSED SUBSIDIARY MERGER DOCUMENTATION WITH S. GOLD.				
04/10/04	Libretta, Paul	1.10	302.50	W280	11541818
	DRAFTED FORM MERGER AGREEMENT WITH COMMENTS FROM D. HOLZMAN				
04/11/04	Green, Frederick	4.40	3,410.00	W280	11615216
	NOL MEMORANDUM TO BREEDEN (1.7); REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING MAE DEFINITION (1.5); REVIEW DRAFT AGREEMENT (1.2)				
04/11/04	Pearlstein, Debra	1.20	804.00	W280	11604675
	REVIEWING FCC TALKING POINTS				
04/11/04	Holzman, Daniel	2.00	890.00	W280	11552690
	REVISED MERGER AGREEMENT.				
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.40	1,085.00	W280	11636138
	REVIEW REVISED NOL/ELECTION MEMORANDUM, DRAFTS (.9) AND CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.5)				
04/12/04	Green, Frederick	1.80	1,395.00	W280	11615763

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING 10-K (.6); REVIEW 10-K DISCLOSURE REGARDING AVANTEL/EMBRATEL (.6); REVIEW MEMORANDUM TO R. BREEDEN REGARDING ELECTION (.6)				
04/12/04	Pearlstein, Debra	2.20	1,474.00	W280	11604677
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL REGARDING STOCK OWNERSHIP (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FCC COUNSEL GROUP REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11550187
	CORRESPONDENCE TO F. GREEN REGARDING DILIGENCE, STAFFING SCHEDULES				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11550190
	PHONE CALL WITH A. RAVI REGARDING DILIGENCE, CUSTOMER CONTRACTS				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11550199
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. PETREN REGARDING CARRIER AGREEMENTS				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11549936
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING CONTRACTS, IT				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11549939
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING NETWORK INFORMATION, FINANCIALS, CARRIER AGREEMENTS				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550180
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING CARRIER AGREEMENTS, NETWORK PRODUCTION				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550186
	PHONE CALL WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING STAFFING, SCHEDULES, DILIGENCE, CONTRACT				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550191
	PHONE CALL WITH E. WRIGHT REGARDING INT'L LICENSES				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550192
	PHONE CALL WITH M. RYAN REGARDING INT'L LICENSES				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11550182
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING FOREIGN LICENSES, REAL ESTATE LEASES				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11550194
	PHONE CALL WITH M. NGUYEN REGARDING INT'L LICENSES, INT'L LITIGATION, REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, CARRIER AGREEMENTS				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11550183
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING CARRIER AGREEMENTS, ANNOTATED DILIGENCE LIST, REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.00	495.00	W280	11550185
	CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS, FOREIGN LITIGATION, INT'L LICENSES, ANNOTATED DILIGENCE LIST				
04/12/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.20	594.00	W280	11550200

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND REVISE DILIGENCE REQUEST ANNOTATION				
04/12/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11552698
	REVISED CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT.				
04/12/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.20	89.00	W280	11552701
	DISCUSSED DISTRIBUTIONS WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING ELECTION ISSUES				
04/12/04	Holzman, Daniel	0.60	267.00	W280	11552699
	REVIEWED AND COMMENTED UPON MERGER DOCUMENTS.				
04/12/04	Avalos, Ginessa	7.00	2,100.00	W280	11552532
	CONFER WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE (0.4); CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING SAME (0.1); REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (6.5).				
04/12/04	Libretta, Paul	5.00	1,375.00	W280	11556938
	REVIEWED AND SENT MORE DOCUMENTS TO CT IN ORDER TO OBTAIN PRECLEARANCE IN VARIOUS JURISDICTIONS.				
04/12/04	Ravi, Aparna	4.50	1,237.50	W280	11579570
	REVIEW OF CUSTOMER CONTRACTS OF WORLDCOM FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, CHANGE OF CONTROL, ASSIGNMENT AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559273
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM M. NGUYEN OF A&P.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559275
	REGARDING-SEND SCANNED FOREIGN LICENSES TO M. RYAN.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559280
	CONFER WITH A. RAVI REGARDING DILIGENCE.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11559921
	CONFER WITH LINDA FROM IT REGARDING PRODUCTION ON CDS.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559279
	CONFER WITH C. MAYES REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT & PRINTOUTS.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11559918
	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING INFORMATION FOR PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559276
	QUICK REVIEW OF FOREIGN DOCUMENTS TO BE SENT VIA FEDEX TO E. WRIGHT.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559277
	CONFER WITH J. CARRADINE REGARDING READING ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION OFF OF CDS.				
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11559917
	CONFER WITH S. SALEH REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha SORT FOREIGN LICENSE AGREEMENTS AND AUTHORIZATION COPIES.	0.30	75.00	W280	11559926
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW SCANNED FOREIGN LICENSES AND EMAIL THE SAME TO E. WRIGHT.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559274
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING DILIGENCE AND COMPILING MASTER CHART.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559278
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING NEW EMAILS AND COPIES AND SCANNING.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559920
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW NEW DOCUMENTS AND INDEX THE SAME.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559922
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.	0.50	125.00	W280	11559923
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha COORDINATE WITH J. CARRADINE AND A. HIJJ REGARDING PROBLEMS WITH DOCUMENTS	0.60	150.00	W280	11559270
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.60	150.00	W280	11559271
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW CDS RECEIVED FROM J. COOK.	0.60	150.00	W280	11559272
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH J. CARRADINE REGARDING PROBLEMS WITH ACCESSING DOCUMENTS	0.70	175.00	W280	11559925
04/12/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND ANNOTATIONS.	1.90	475.00	W280	11559919
04/12/04	Mayes, Charlotte ASSIST D. WHITTAKER AND S. JAMAL WITH THE MONITORING OF THE PRODUCTION ROOM.	3.50	542.50	W280	11556116
04/12/04	Joffrion, Karen RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS (2.30); CONTINUE SEARCH TO LOCATE MISSING ORACLE DOCUMENT (.30); SCAN NUMEROUS DOCUMENTS AND FORWARD SAME TO S. JAMAL BY EMAIL (2.10); OFFICE CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRINTED DOCUMENTS, ORACLE DOCUMENT AND SCANNED DOCUMENTS (.40).	5.10	816.00	W280	11558939
04/12/04	Saleh, Sally ASSIST D. WHITTAKER AND S. JAMAL IN PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	5.00	400.00	W280	11546464
04/13/04	Green, Frederick 10-K DISCLOSURE (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING SAME (.6)	1.30	1,007.50	W280	11612045
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11550215

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. HACKERSON REGARDING IT ISSUES				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11550220
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING HR, INDEXES				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11550225
	PHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN AND M. SKARDA REGARDING STATUS				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550211
	CONFERENCES WITH M. NYGUEN REGARDING COMPLIANCE DOCUMENTS, CONTRACTS				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550216
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING CAPITAL EXPENSES				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550221
	PHONE CALL WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING COMPLIANCE, FOREIGN SUBSIDIARIES, PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11550228
	CONFERENCE WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING DILIGENCE				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11550209
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING IT, REAL ESTATE, ANNOTATION				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11550218
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. NOLAN REGARDING FINANCIAL DILIGENCE				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11550226
	PHONE CALLS WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SCHEDULES, CONTRACTS, STAFFING				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11550214
	CONFERENCES WITH A. HADJI REGARDING REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, RIGHT OF WAY ISSUES, IRUS, SUBMARINE AGREEMENTS				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11550206
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ANNOTATION, REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS, CARRIER AGREEMENTS				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11550208
	CONFERENCES WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE MEMORANDUM, DILIGENCE REQUEST ANNOTATION, REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.80	396.00	W280	11550222
	REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.90	445.50	W280	11550223
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald	2.50	1,237.50	W280	11550224
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/13/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED RESTRUCTURING DOCUMENTS.	0.60	267.00	W280	11552717
04/13/04	Holzman, Daniel DRAFTED RESPONSE LETTER TO CONSOB.	0.80	356.00	W280	11552711
04/13/04	Holzman, Daniel CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. MCGAREY, M. FRENCH OF KPMG, F. DIMINICH, P. LIBRETTA, A. SIMON AND A. COHEN TO DISCUSS MERGERS AND PREPARATION FOR SUCH CALL.	2.10	934.50	W280	11552714
04/13/04	Avalos, Ginessa CONFER WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE (0.1); REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (6.8).	6.90	2,070.00	W280	11552626
04/13/04	Libretta, Paul CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT (1.0) CONTINUED FINALIZING DOCUMENTS (3.8) REVISED CORRECTIONS MADE BY STATES ON PRECLEARED DOCUMENTS (2.5)	7.30	2,007.50	W280	11557531
04/13/04	Cohen, Amanda CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, KPMG AND WGM REGARDING POST-EMERGENCE MERGERS (.6); MEETING WITH D. HOLZMAN, P. LIBRETTA, F. DIMINICH AND A. SIMON REGARDING POST-EMERGENCE MERGERS (.5); RESEARCHED STATE STATUTES REGARDING WHETHER AMENDMENT TO CHARTER CAN BE MADE IN A CERTIFICATE OF MERGER (.6).	1.70	467.50	W280	11571734
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING DILIGENCE.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559287
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING SWITZERLAND LICENSE AND NEW DOCUMENTS.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559288
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha SEPARATE DILIGENCE OPEN ISSUES BY RESPONSIBLE PERSON.	0.10	25.00	W280	11559670
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING M. DAVIDIAN'S QUESTIONS	0.10	25.00	W280	11559672
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING RIGHT OF WAY AGREEMENTS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11559286
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha FOLLOW UP REGARDING M. DAVIDIAN'S QUESTIONS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11559671
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha DISCUSS NEW DOCUMENTS WITH M. NGUYEN AND A. HAJJ	0.20	50.00	W280	11559673
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559284
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.40	100.00	W280	11559289

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE ANNOTATIONS TO DUE DILIGENCE LIST.	0.50	125.00	W280	11559291
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS AND DOCUMENTS IN PRODUCTION ROOM.	0.60	150.00	W280	11559285
04/13/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.80	200.00	W280	11559675
04/13/04	Cox, Sara ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT	10.70	1,016.50	W280	11571328
04/13/04	Joffrion, Karen RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM (1.70); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DOCUMENTS PRINTED (.10).	1.80	288.00	W280	11558557
04/13/04	Saleh, Sally PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.50	40.00	W280	11548522
04/14/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO DEAL (1.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CLIENT & BANKERS REGARDING SAME (1.5); DISCLOSURE FOR 10-K AND DISCUSSIONS WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (2.0)	5.10	3,952.50	W280	11612481
04/14/04	Pearlstein, Debra REVIEWING AND CIRCULATING WILLKIE LETTER	0.50	335.00	W280	11606490
04/14/04	Dixon, Catherine DISCUSSION OF DRS ISSUES WITH BONY AND B. COOPER.	0.80	604.00	W280	11622757
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. COOK REGARDING IRU'S, ROW'S	0.10	49.50	W280	11554243
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING STATUS, REVERSE DUE DILIGENCE	0.10	49.50	W280	11554471
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SCHEDULE	0.10	49.50	W280	11554516
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING COMPLIANCE DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11554239
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING OPEN DILIGENCE ITEMS	0.20	99.00	W280	11554469
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM VISIT	0.20	99.00	W280	11554470
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH A. HADJI REGARDING RIGHT OF WAYS, FOREIGN LEASES, CARRIER AGREEMENTS	0.30	148.50	W280	11554241

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH N. JONES, P. ESKILDSEN, REGARDING JOINT VENTURES	0.30	148.50	W280	11554248
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH L. HARTKOPF REGARDING DILIGENCE ANNOTATION REQUEST AND MISSING DOCUMENTS	0.40	198.00	W280	11554240
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN, P. TROSPER REGARDING ENVIRONMENTAL ASURANCE, FOREIGN LEASES	0.40	198.00	W280	11554246
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH J. COOK, A. HADJI, K. LARSON REGARDING RIGHT OF WAYS SUBMARINE AGREEMENTS, IRUS, FIBER AGREEMENTS, CARRIER CONTRACTS	0.50	247.50	W280	11554242
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING FOREIGN REAL ESTATE LEASES, CONTRACTS, COMPLIANCE, COPIES	0.60	297.00	W280	11554518
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DILIGENCE REQUEST LIST	0.90	445.50	W280	11554245
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX	1.80	891.00	W280	11554244
04/14/04	Holzman, Daniel REVIEWED OPINION AND BACK-UP ITEMS.	0.50	222.50	W280	11552738
04/14/04	Holzman, Daniel DRAFTED MMDS DISCLOSURE FOR 10-K.	1.00	445.00	W280	11552737
04/14/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS (5.0) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH F. DIMINICH AND P. LIBRETTA (1.0)	6.00	2,670.00	W280	11552720
04/14/04	Avalos, Ginessa CONFER WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE (0.2); REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (0.3).	0.50	150.00	W280	11552181
04/14/04	Libretta, Paul CONTINUED DRAFTING MERGER DOCUMENTS.	7.60	2,090.00	W280	11557551
04/14/04	Ravi, Aparna REVIEWED CUSTOMER CONTRACTS OF WORLDCOM FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, ASSIGNMENT, CHANGE IN CONTROL AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.	1.80	495.00	W280	11580080
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ON CDS.	0.10	25.00	W280	11563552
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11563972

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. HAJJ.				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11563553
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11563554
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM A. HAJJ				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11563556
	ATTEND PART OF TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER, A. HAJJ, T. POZEN AND J. COOK REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11563970
	ASSIST IN LOCATING DOCUMENTS.				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11563973
	REVIEW PRODUCTION ON CDS.				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11563974
	CONFER WITH L. WEEAMS REGARDING HIDDEN PRODUCTION ON CD.				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11563971
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/14/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11563551
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/14/04	Cox, Sara	8.40	798.00	W280	11571329
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/14/04	Joffrion, Karen	1.50	240.00	W280	11558624
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS				
04/15/04	Green, Frederick	4.80	3,720.00	W280	11612455
	ATTENTION TO MERGER AGREEMENT (1.5); ATTENTION TO DILIGENCE ISSUES (1.5); DISCUSS ISSUES REGARDING MATLIN AND SILVER LAKE RECESSION AGREEMENT (.9); DISCUSS 10-K LANGUAGE WITH N. JONES (.9)				
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11554433
	PHONE CALL WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING EXPORT CONTROL DOCUMENTS				
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11554533
	PHONE CALL WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING CONTRACT, SCHEDULE				
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11554431
	PHONE CALLS WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, RIGHT OF WAY ISSUES, DILIGENCE				
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11554434
	PHONE CALLS WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING COMPLIANCE DOCUMENTS, COPYING				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. NGUYEN REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS, ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11554439
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DELDUCA REGARDING RIGHT OF WAY CONFERENCE CALL	0.20	99.00	W280	11554530
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING REAL PROPERTY DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11554531
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATED DUE DILIGENCE REQUEST	0.20	99.00	W280	11554537
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH E. SCHULZE AND R. ZUBIETA REGARDING FINANCIAL ACCOUNTING AND LITIGATION DOCUMENTS	0.30	148.50	W280	11554443
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING COPY REQUESTS, PROPERTY ISSUES, ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.30	148.50	W280	11554532
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH J. COOK REGARDING RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS	0.40	198.00	W280	11554430
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH A. HADJI REGARDING RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS, REAL ESTATE ISSUE	0.40	198.00	W280	11554435
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS, INTERCARRIER AGREEMENTS, SUBMARINE CONTRACTS, FIBER CONTRACTS	0.40	198.00	W280	11554456
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.50	247.50	W280	11554462
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMORANDUM, RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS, INVENTORY/CONTROL DOCUMENTS	0.70	346.50	W280	11554460
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING COMPLIANCE DOCUMENTS, COPY REQUESTS, JOINT VENTURES	1.00	495.00	W280	11554438
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX	2.60	1,287.00	W280	11554535
04/15/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS	3.90	1,930.50	W280	11554536
04/15/04	Holzman, Daniel PARTICIPATED IN CHAPTER 11 EMERGENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, J. MCGAREY, M. CHASTKA, S. GOLD, B. COOPER, M. MEROLA AND A. YOON.	1.40	623.00	W280	11552688

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/15/04	Holzman, Daniel DRAFTING AND REVISING CORPORATE RESTRUCTURING DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING MERGER AGREEMENTS, KEEP WELL AGREEMENT AND CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT.	11.60	5,162.00	W280	11552685
04/15/04	Avalos, Ginessa CONFER WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE (0.2); REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (7.5).	7.70	2,310.00	W280	11554998
04/15/04	Libretta, Paul CONTINUED DRAFTING MERGER DOCUMENTS.	9.60	2,640.00	W280	11557552
04/15/04	Ravi, Aparna REVIEWED CUSTOMER CONTRACTS OF WORLDCOM FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, ASSIGNMENT, CHANGE OF CONTROL AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.	2.00	550.00	W280	11580091
04/15/04	Cohen, Amanda REVIEWED LEGAL NAMES OF SUBSIDIARIES (.8); DRAFTED CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT TO CERTIFICATES/ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION FOR EACH OF MCI'S SUBSIDIARIES (3.3).	4.10	1,127.50	W280	11572053
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH J. CARRADINE REGARDING IT ISSUES.	0.10	25.00	W280	11564050
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha COORDINATE RETRIEVAL OF ADDITIONAL CDS (RIGHT OF WAY) FROM J. COOK.	0.10	25.00	W280	11564054
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha TRANSMITTAL MEMORANDUM TO B. PETERSON.	0.10	25.00	W280	11564057
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS.	0.10	25.00	W280	11564060
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha RESPOND TO REQUEST FROM M. DAVIDIAN.	0.10	25.00	W280	11564064
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH J. WATSON REGARDING DOCUMENT REVIEW	0.10	25.00	W280	11564069
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING PRINTING AND NEW DOCUMENTS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11564047
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING REVISIONS TO PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX AND EMAIL J. WATSON REGARDING THE SAME.	0.20	50.00	W280	11564049
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH J. CARRADINE REGARDING BACKING UP CDS.	0.20	50.00	W280	11564052
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha PREPARE PACKAGE FOR TRANSMITTING DUPLICATIONS TO B. PETERSON.	0.20	50.00	W280	11564056
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11564059

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	EXCERPT INFORMATION FROM EMAILS FOR INCORPORATION IN PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11564063
	REVIEW NEW ATTACHMENTS FROM EMAILS.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11564067
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11564048
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11564061
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM T. POZEN.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11564062
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT WITH RESPECT TO BANKERS.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11564055
	REVIEW PACKAGE FROM J. COOK AND COORDINATE BACKUP OF PRODUCTION.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11564066
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING LITIGATION.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11564046
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING REVISIONS TO INDEXING.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11564065
	REVIEW OLD EMAILS AND UPDATE ANNOTATIONS ACCORDINGLY.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.50	125.00	W280	11564072
	REVIEW AND UPDATE INDEX.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.70	175.00	W280	11564044
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT AND NEW DOCUMENTS.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.70	175.00	W280	11564058
	ASSIST T. POZEN AND A. HAJJ WITH ACCESSING RIGHT OF WAY CONTRACTS ON CDS.				
04/15/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.30	575.00	W280	11564051
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/15/04	Cox, Sara	12.80	1,216.00	W280	11571330
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/15/04	Joffrion, Karen	4.80	768.00	W280	11559092
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS (2.80); PREPARE INDEX INSERT OF COUNTRY CONTRACTS (1.90); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING INDEX INSERT (.10).				
04/16/04	Green, Frederick	4.20	3,255.00	W280	11611847

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ATTENTION TO DEAL ISSUES (1.0); DISCUSS PROPOSED DISCLOSURE FOR 10-K (1.0); ATTENTION TO DILIGENCE LIST (2.2)				
04/16/04	Dixon, Catherine CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING DRS	0.30	226.50	W280	11622717
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J.COOKE RE: RIGHT-OF-WAY ISSUES	0.10	49.50	W280	11670596
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DULDUCA RE: RIGHT OF WAY ISSUES	0.10	49.50	W280	11670626
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH R. PETERSON RE: REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, RIGHT OF WAY ISSUES, DILIGENCE	0.20	99.00	W280	11670595
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN RE COPY REQUESTS, PROPERTY ISSUES, ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.20	99.00	W280	11670628
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH J. COOK RE: RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS	0.30	148.50	W280	11670594
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH P. ESKILDSEN RE: COMPLIANCE DOCUMENTS, COPYING, AFRICAN DOCUMENTS	0.30	148.50	W280	11670597
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH A. HADJI RE: RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS, REAL ESTATE ISSUES	0.30	148.50	W280	11670686
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH N. NGUYEN RE: CUSTOMER CONTRACTS	0.30	148.50	W280	11670688
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSON RE: VENDOR CONTRACTS, REAL PROPERTY DOCUMENTS, NETWORK MAPS	0.40	198.00	W280	11670627
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL RE: ADDITIONAL PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS	0.60	297.00	W280	11670625
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL RE: RIGHT OF WAY DOCUMENTS, INTERCARRIER AGREEMENTS, SUBMARINE CONTRACTS, FIBER CONTRACTS	0.70	346.50	W280	11670689
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL RE: DILIGENCE REQUEST MEMO, REAL ESTATE DOCUMENTS, INVENTORY/CONTROL DOCUMENTS	0.90	445.50	W280	11670690
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN RE: COMPLIANCE DOCUMENTS, COPY REQUESTS, AFRICAN, MINUTES, NEW DOCUMENTS	1.20	594.00	W280	11670687
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald	1.70	841.50	W280	11670629

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/16/04	Whittaker, Donald	4.00	1,980.00	W280	11670630
	MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS				
04/16/04	Holzman, Daniel	1.20	534.00	W280	11557586
	PARTICIPATED IN EMERGENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, D. URQUHART, B. COOPER, A. YOON, S. KELLY, N. JONES, J. MCGAREY AND M. CHASTKA.				
04/16/04	Holzman, Daniel	9.30	4,138.50	W280	11557587
	REVISED EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS (8.5) AND DISCUSSED THE SAME WITH S. GOLDRING (.8)				
04/16/04	Avalos, Ginessa	2.00	600.00	W280	11557861
	REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME				
04/16/04	Libretta, Paul	8.10	2,227.50	W280	11557092
	DRAFTED RESOLUTIONS FOR MERGER.				
04/16/04	Ravi, Aparna	1.50	412.50	W280	11579709
	REVIEWED CUSTOMER CONTRACTS OF WORLDCOM FOR CONFIDENTIALITY, ASSIGNMENT, CHANGE OF CONTROL AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS.				
04/16/04	Cohen, Amanda	5.10	1,402.50	W280	11571756
	DRAFTED CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT TO CERTIFICATES/ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION FOR MCI SUBSIDIARIES IN PREPARATION OF POST-EMERGENCE MERGERS (4.6). PHONE CALL WITH F. DIMINICH REGARDING PREPARATION OF CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT (.5).				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564077
	REDLINES FOR M. DAVIDIAN AND D. WHITTAKER.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564079
	EMAIL TO D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564081
	REVIEW AND UPDATE INDEX.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564088
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. GWINN.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564091
	EMAIL REVISED ANNOTATIONS TO GROUP.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564092
	CONFER WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING STATUS.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11564094
	CONFER WITH J. WATSON REGARDING INDEX.				
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11564074
	CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING INDEXING.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha PREPARE LIST OF CAPITAL LEASES BASED ON EARLIER EMAIL.	0.30	75.00	W280	11564078
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha RESEARCH BACKGROUND INFORMATION ON TELECOMMUNICATIONS INDUSTRY.	0.30	75.00	W280	11564082
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.40	100.00	W280	11564076
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha UPDATE INDEX.	0.40	100.00	W280	11564089
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha MEETING WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING ANNOTATIONS.	0.50	125.00	W280	11564075
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.	0.90	225.00	W280	11564087
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha REVISE AND REVIEW ANNOTATIONS.	1.00	250.00	W280	11564090
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha REGARDING-SORT CAPITAL LEASES WITH K. JOFFRION BASED ON NEW INFORMATION.	1.60	400.00	W280	11564083
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING INVESTMENTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11637132
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING FOREIGN SUBS	0.10	49.50	W280	11637133
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEAR REGARDING CHINA AND INDIA DOCUMENTS	0.10	49.50	W280	11637135
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW SOUTH AFRICAN JV DOCUMENTS (.4); AFRICAN ORGANIZATIONAL DOCUMENTS (.4)	0.80	396.00	W280	11637131
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW FOREIGN AUTHORIZATION AND LICENSES (.8); REVIEW CHART (.6)	1.40	693.00	W280	11637130
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS, SOUTH AFRICAN JV, FOREIGN SUBSIDIARIES, HR DOCUMENTS, MOZART 3RD PARTY INVESTMENTS.	1.60	792.00	W280	11649985
04/17/04	Whittaker, Donald MANAGE PRODUCTION ROOM PROCESS	2.70	1,336.50	W280	11637134
04/17/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS.	1.00	445.00	W280	11557582
04/19/04	Pearlstein, Debra	2.20	1,474.00	W280	11607187

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
CONFERENCE FROM REGARDING CARSO OWNERSHIP ISSUES					
04/19/04	Urquhart, Douglas	4.20	2,520.00	W280	11570082
	PRE CLOSING OF NEW NOTES INDENTURES (.5); REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES WITH M. MEROLA (.8); REVIEW CLOSING DOCUMENTS FOR LETTER OF CREDIT AGREEMENTS AND DIP PAYOFF (1.2); PRE CLOSING MEETING WITH MCI (.7); REVIEW FINAL QUESTIONS RELATING TO NOTE ALLOCATION AND DTC ISSUES WITH HAMMILL, M. CHATSKA, M. MEROLA, S. COHEN, S. GOLD AND D. HOLZMAN (1.0)				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11637138
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING COMPLIANCE BINDERS				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11637142
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. KIM REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM SCHEDULE				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11637145
	PHONE CALL WITH M. SKARDA REGARDING SCHEDULE				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11637146
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING NEW PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS. FOREIGN SUBS				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W280	11637147
	PHONE CALL WITH C. COX REGARDING FOREIGN SUBS				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11637140
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSON REGARDING REAL ESTATE				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W280	11637141
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. DAVIDIAN REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W280	11637144
	PHONE CALLS WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.40	198.00	W280	11637139
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN FOREIGN SUBS AND MINORITY INVESTMENTS, HR, SOUTH AFRICA				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.50	247.50	W280	11637137
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX, ANNOTATED REQUEST LIST, PRODUCTION ROOM DOCUMENTS				
04/19/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.70	346.50	W280	11637143
	REVIEW AND REVISE PRODUCTION ROOM INDEX				
04/19/04	Avalos, Ginessa	5.70	1,710.00	W280	11572197
	REVIEW CONTRACTS, SUMMARIZE CONFIDENTIALITY, CHANGE OF CONTROL AND ASSIGNMENT PROVISIONS AND COMPLETE MATRIX IN CONNECTION WITH SAME				
04/19/04	Lee, Caroline	1.40	560.00	W280	11579477
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.				
04/19/04	Pullo, Christina	0.20	55.00	W280	11611215

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	FIND WORLDCOM'S BYLAWS IN MY FILES FOR B. COOPER				
04/19/04	Libretta, Paul	4.10	1,127.50	W280	11564000
	WENT THROUGH CERTIFICATES OF MERGER AND RESOLUTIONS TO CORRECT PROBLEMS (2.8) UPDATED STATUS CHARTS (1.3)				
04/19/04	Ravi, Aparna	1.80	495.00	W280	11598608
	REVIEWED CONFIDENTIALITY, CHANGE OF CONTROL, ASSIGNMENT AND TERM/TERMINATION PROVISIONS IN CUSTOMER CONTRACTS				
04/19/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo	3.30	907.50	W280	11573884
	DRAFTING FOR CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT FOR ILLINOIS, IOWA, AND NEW YORK SUBSIDIARIES.				
04/19/04	Cohen, Amanda	1.60	440.00	W280	11571801
	DRAFTED CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT TO CERTIFICATES/ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION FOR MCI SUBSIDIARIES IN PREPARATION OF POST-EMERGENCE MERGERS				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.10	25.00	W280	11575881
	EMAILS TO J. WATSON REGARDING INDEX.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11575620
	CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING EMAILS.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11575876
	UPDATE INDEX.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11575879
	PREPARE EMAILS REGARDING OPEN ITEMS.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11575880
	EMAILS TO D. WHITTAKER REGARDING QUESTIONS.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.20	50.00	W280	11575882
	ASSIST D. KIM				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11575874
	REVIEW DILIGENCE ARTICLE WHILE IN PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.30	75.00	W280	11575877
	ELABORATE AND REVISE CAPITAL LEASE MEMORANDUM (.2); EMAIL AND REGARDING SEND TO D. WHITTAKER (.1)				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11575618
	TELEPHONE CALLS WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT, ANNOTATIONS, INDEXING AND STATUS.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11575873
	PREPARE EXPLANATION OF CURRENT STATUS OF CAPITAL LEASES AND EMAIL THE SAME TO D. WHITTAKER.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11575875

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	RESPOND TO QUESTIONS FROM D. KIM.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11575878
	SEARCH FOR DOCUMENTS THAT ARE MISSING FROM PRODUCTION ROOM.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.40	100.00	W280	11575883
	REVIEW MINUTES OF MEETINGS.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	0.60	150.00	W280	11575619
	CONFER WITH C. COX REGARDING PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	1.40	350.00	W280	11575872
	REVIEW EMAILS, FOLLOW UP, INDEX AND REVISE ANNOTATIONS.				
04/19/04	Jamal, Sacha	2.10	525.00	W280	11575629
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
04/19/04	Cox, Sara	9.90	940.50	W280	11571209
	ASSIST WITH PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT				
04/19/04	Joffrion, Karen	1.40	224.00	W280	11580167
	RECEIVE AND PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS FOR PRODUCTION ROOM				
04/19/04	Saleh, Sally	0.70	56.00	W280	11579469
	PRODUCTION ROOM MANAGEMENT.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W280 - CORPORATE/SECURITIES:		776.50	\$ 261,780.00		
04/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W300	11635173
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE, J. FINK, F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL				
04/01/04	Rothman, Richard	1.30	955.50	W300	11559726
	MEETING WITH A. COHEN, L. FIFE ET AL REGARDING BRAZILIAN ASSET SALE.				
04/01/04	Fife, Lori	2.70	1,930.50	W300	11611425
	MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MILAMO AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING CALAIS OFFER (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH GREEN AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING CORP. ISSUES (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6).				
04/01/04	Cohen, Adam	8.00	4,400.00	W300	11519266
	REVIEW MOTION PAPERS REGARDING TELMEX SALE AND RELATED MATERIALS (6.5), INTERNAL MEETING REGARDING SAME (1.5).				
04/01/04	Youdelman, Sharon	5.40	2,673.00	W300	11616841
	ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL SALE HEARING (2.0) REVIEW CASELAW (.9) PREPARE (1.3) & ATTEND MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING PRAPARATION FOR HEARING [1.2]				
04/01/04	Skarda, Michael	6.30	2,898.00	W300	11542955
	RESEARCH GEORGIA LAW REGARDING DIRECTOR DUTIES IN CHARGE OF CONTROL TRANSACTIONS (3.2); DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (3.1)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/01/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING REGULATORY ISSUES AND STRATEGY ON COMPETING BIDS (1.5); WGM INTERNAL MEETING REGARDING LITIGATION STRATEGY AND CALAIS BID (1.0); PULLED DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR 4/13 HEARING (1.9); VARIOUS OTHER TASKS, CORRESPONDENCE W/CLIENT (1.4)	5.80	2,668.00	W300	11541059
04/01/04	Davis, Pierre REVIEW MOTION (1.1) PREPARATION FOR (.4) AND ATTEND MEETING WITH ENTIRE TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0)	2.50	1,000.00	W300	11638129
04/01/04	Fink, Jessica CONFERENCE WITH LITIGATION TEAM, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, S. YODELMAN REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE.	2.40	1,020.00	W300	11634421
04/01/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH EMBRATEL SALE REGARDING ADVICE OF COUNSEL, BUSINESS JUDGMENT (4.4); CONFER WITH L. FIFE, S. YODELMAN, C. PULLO REGARDING STANDING (.6).	5.00	2,125.00	W300	11634418
04/01/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia REVIEW OF RICARDO'S FINAL MEMORANDUM (1.0); REVIEW OF BOARD PACKAGE (.7); FINISH REVIEW OF CALAIS PACKET (RESUMES) (1.2); REVISIONS TO AMENDMENT TO SPA (1.2); STRATEGIC MEETING WITH WGM BANKRUPTCY, LITIGATION AND CORPORATE DEPARTMENTS (1.7); COLLECTION AND COORDINATION OF DOCUMENTS FOR LITIGATION DEPARTMENT IN PREPARATION FOR APRIL 13, 2004 HEARING (2.3)	8.10	2,673.00	W300	11540110
04/01/04	Pullo, Christina RESEARCH STANDING OF A DISQUALIFIED BIDDER (6.2); CONFER WITH S. YODELMAN AND J. FINK REGARDING SAME (.7); ATTEND MEETING WITH LITIGATION AND CORPORATE GROUP REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE (2.0); DRAFT OUTLINE OF BRIEF REGARDING STANDING (1.5)	10.40	2,860.00	W300	11611908
04/01/04	Friedmann, Jared READ BRIEF IN PREPARATION FOR MEETING (1.2); RESEARCH ON EXPERT TESTIMONY REGARDING FOREIGN LAW (0.9); MEET W/WORLDCOM TEAM (1.3); REVIEW BIDDER PROPOSALS AND BRAZILIAN LEGAL OPINIONS (2.6).	6.00	1,650.00	W300	11538424
04/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3) PREPARE FOR BOARD MEETING (.2)	0.50	387.50	W300	11635789
04/02/04	Fife, Lori MEETINGS REGARDING EMBRATEL (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL (.8)	1.20	858.00	W300	11612688
04/02/04	Cohen, Adam REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON EMBRATEL TRANSACTION MOTION.	5.20	2,860.00	W300	11528357
04/02/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL RESPONSE	0.10	49.50	W300	11616714
04/02/04	Oswell, Dennis DISCUSS WITH B. METGE AND C. SILLIMAN HOW TO MOVE FORWARD WITH MERGER CONTROL FILING ANALYSIS IN THE PROPOSED SALE OF EMBRATEL (.5); TALK WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL REGARDING COORDINATING MERGER CONTROL REVIEW (.3); DRAFT NOTE TO CLIENT (.6)	1.40	504.00	W300	11570741

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/02/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. LACY REGARDING STRATEGY AND STATUS (.3); MULTIPLE CALLS WITH S. HIRSCH AND DISCUSSIONS REGARDING PROCESS (.6); CALL TO PAULO WITH B. LACY REGARDING ACCESS TO FILINGS FOR WGM LITIGATION TEAM (.4); REVIEW OF REVISED FILINGS (1.0); COMPILATION/COORDINATION OF DOCUMENTS FOR LITIGATION TEAM IN PREPARATION OF HEARING (.5); REVIEW REVISED AMENDMENT (1.0)	3.80	1,254.00	W300	11540256
04/02/04	Pullo, Christina RESEARCH STANDING ISSUE IF DISAPPOINTED BIDDER BUYS A CLAIM AND BECOMES A CREDITOR FOR EMBRATEL SALE MOTION	1.30	357.50	W300	11612429
04/02/04	Friedmann, Jared CONTINUE READING AND ANALYZING OPINIONS OF BRAZILIAN COUNSEL REGARDING CALAIS BID AND PRESS ARTICLES.	7.10	1,952.50	W300	11538426
04/03/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.	0.50	387.50	W300	11634468
04/03/04	Friedmann, Jared READ AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS REGARDING VARIOUS BIDS AND REGULATORY APPROVAL.	3.70	1,017.50	W300	11538427
04/04/04	Davis, Pierre BACKGROUND RESEARCH/READING ON EMBRATEL MATTER	3.50	1,400.00	W300	11638012
04/04/04	Friedmann, Jared READ AND ANALYZE DOCUMENTS REGARDING VARIOUS BIDS AND REGULATORY APPROVAL.	6.20	1,705.00	W300	11538428
04/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING ASSET ISSUES	0.70	542.50	W300	11635655
04/05/04	Goldstein, Marcia CALL WITH BOARD REGARDING EMBRATEL.	1.00	775.00	W300	11634528
04/05/04	Rothman, Richard TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. COHEN REGARDING ASSET AGREEMENT	0.10	73.50	W300	11559619
04/05/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH BRAZILIAN COUNSEL, WORLD COM REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.20	858.00	W300	11612740
04/05/04	Braun, Lynda READ EXPERT OPINIONS AND ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	3.00	1,485.00	W300	11594935
04/05/04	Cohen, Adam TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH RICARDO BARRETO (2.0); PREPARATION FOR APRIL 13 HEARING, INCLUDING REVIEW OF MATERIALS AND INTERNAL COMMUNICATIONS REGARDING SAME (5.5).	7.50	4,125.00	W300	11529915
04/05/04	Youdelman, Sharon CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK (.2) & TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING [0.2]; REVIEW E-MAILS REGARDING EMBRATEL RESPONSE [0.1]	0.50	247.50	W300	11623462

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/05/04	Skarda, Michael REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF BOARD BOOKS AND MATERIALS PREPARED BY LAZARD (4.1); CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL (0.1); CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER (0.1); REVIEW PRECEDENT FOR TRANSACTION (1.8).	6.30	2,898.00	W300	11542959
04/05/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH A. COHEN, R. BARRETTO, L. FIFE REGARDING PREPARATION FOR 4/13 SALE HEARING AND DELAY OF HEARING DATE (1.6); MISCELLANEOUS EMAILS (.6) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING STRATEGY ON SALE HEARING AND CALAIS BID (1.0)	3.20	1,472.00	W300	11540783
04/05/04	Gambino, Louis REVIEW ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR CLOSING OBLIGATIONS	2.20	935.00	W300	11573864
04/05/04	Oswell, Dennis NOTE TO OSCAR PETERSON REGARDING TURNOVER PRODUCTION REQUEST (.3); DISCUSS PRODUCTION SHARING WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL (.2)	0.50	180.00	W300	11570754
04/05/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW BRIEF REGARDING STANDING ISSUES RELATING TO SALE OF EMBRATEL.	0.70	297.50	W300	11635279
04/05/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING BURDEN OF PROOF UNDER SECTION 363(B) AND DRAFT BRIEF MEMORANDUM.	1.00	425.00	W300	11635281
04/05/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING WAIVER OF PRIVILEGE AND DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME.	6.50	2,762.50	W300	11635264
04/05/04	Pullo, Christina DRAFT OBJECTION RESPONSE REGARDING STANDING OF DISAPPOINTED BIDDER AND BUYING A CLAIM TO GAIN STANDING (2.5); CONFER WITH J. FINK (.3); RESEARCH BUSINESS JUDGMENT RULE AND RELIANCE ON OPINION OF COUNSEL IN DETERMINATION OF WHETHER TO APPROVE 363 SALE (2.6)	5.40	1,485.00	W300	11612910
04/05/04	Friedmann, Jared RESEARCH USE OF TRANSLATED DOCUMENTS AS EVIDENCE IN FEDERAL COURT (1.7); PHONE CALL WITH R. BARRETTO, A. COHEN AND P. DAVIS (0.8); RESEARCH REGARDING ADVICE OF COUNSEL DEFENSE AND WHETHER PRIVILEGE WAIVED WHERE PRIOR ATTORNEY TESTIFIES AND WHERE ATTORNEY IS CALLED AS AN EXPERT (3.3); MEETING WITH A. COHEN AND P. DAVIS REGARDING STRATEGY PLAN (1.0).	6.80	1,870.00	W300	11538429
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW NEW CALAIS OFFER (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MILMOE AT SKADDEN REGARDING SAME (.3)	0.60	465.00	W300	11635856
04/06/04	Rothman, Richard MEETING WITH AND TELEPHONE CALL TO A. COHEN.	0.60	441.00	W300	11559626
04/06/04	Cohen, Adam PREPARATION FOR APRIL 13 HEARING REGARDING EMBRATEL TRANSACTION, INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH B. LACY (0.6), F. COELHO (0.1), R. BARRETO (0.2), D. WEBSTER (0.2) AND S. FINCH AND S. PEARL (0.2), CONFER AND EMAIL WITH R. ROTHMAN, M. GOLDSTEIN, F.GREEN, P.DAVIS AND S.HIRSCH (1.5), REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND PREPARE ARGUMENT AND EXAMINATION OUTLINES (5.2).	8.00	4,400.00	W300	11532328

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/06/04	Youdelman, Sharon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF EMBRATEL HEARING [0.1]; CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK REGARDING EMBRATEL RESEARCH [0.2]	0.30	148.50	W300	11624310
04/06/04	Skarda, Michael EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO AND FROM P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING TRANSACTION (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN AND D. WHITTAKER REGARDING SAME (0.4); RESEARCH AND REVIEW PRECEDENT FOR TRANSACTION (3.0); DRAFT TRANSACTION AGREEMENT (6.5).	10.20	4,692.00	W300	11543337
04/06/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH A. COHEN, F. GREEN, B. LACY REGARDING SALE HEARING AND POSSIBILITY OF DELAY (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. TRAJTENBERG, F. GREEN REGARDING CALAIS BID MATERIALS (.8)	1.60	736.00	W300	11540799
04/06/04	Gambino, Louis DRAFT AND REVISE CLOSING DELIVERIES	2.10	892.50	W300	11573865
04/06/04	Brill, Craig REVISION AND DISTRIBUTION OF MASTER CLOSING CHECKLIST AND CASH AND NONCASH MOVEMENT CHART (2.0) CALL REGARDING GECC AND GE RESOLUTIONS WITH MACALEVEY ET AL (1.0) PREPARATION FOR RICHMOND MEETING (3.5) CALLS WITH LEBEOUF REGARDING SAME (.6)	7.10	2,840.00	W300	11542508
04/06/04	Fink, Jessica REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING TAX OBJECTIONS WITH REGARDS TO EMBRATEL SALE.	0.30	127.50	W300	11635311
04/06/04	Fink, Jessica CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING BUSINESS JUDGMENT, GOOD FAITH, SALE PROCESSES (2.5); DRAFT RESPONSE IN SUPPORT OF EMBRATEL SALE (3.0); CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING SALE ISSUES (.5); CONDUCT RESEARCH REGARDING WAIVER OF PRIVILEGE (2.0)	8.00	3,400.00	W300	11635345
04/06/04	Pullo, Christina REVISE BRIEF SECTION REGARDING STANDING TO INCORPORATE J. FINK'S COMMENTS	0.70	192.50	W300	11612550
04/07/04	Rothman, Richard REVIEW LETTER FROM CALAIS REGARDING REVISED OFFER	0.80	588.00	W300	11559857
04/07/04	Braun, Lynda CONTINUED READING EXPERT BINDER (.6); EMAILS, TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.6); EMAILS WITH P. DAVIS REGARDING PRIVILEGE ISSUES (.3)	1.50	742.50	W300	11594713
04/07/04	Cohen, Adam CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMBRATEL TRANSACTION (0.8); INTERNAL EMAILS REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON EMBRATEL TRANSACTION (1.5).	2.60	1,430.00	W300	11535099
04/07/04	Youdelman, Sharon TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN & T. SAVAGE (.7) AND CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE & J. FINK (.9) REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF EMBRATEL HEARING; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING SAME [0.1]; REVIEW TELES REVISED EMBRATEL PROPOSAL [0.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. WEBSTER AND WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE TRANSACTION [0.7]; REVIEW & REVISE NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT OF EMBRATEL HEARING [0.7]; CONFERENCES WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME [0.2]; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME [0.2] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. COHEN REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF HEARING [0.1]; REVIEW DRAFT AMENDMENT TO EMBRATEL AGREEMENT [0.3]	4.10	2,029.50	W300	11624311

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/07/04	Skarda, Michael REVIEW PUBLIC COMPANY AGREEMENT PRECEDENT (1.8); PREPARE LIST OF AGREEMENT SCHEDULES (0.9); CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER AND S. JAMAL (0.4); DRAFT AGREEMENT (8.0).	11.10	5,106.00	W300	11543339
04/07/04	Hirsch, Stuart TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING AMENDMENT TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND DELAY OF SALE HEARING.	1.50	690.00	W300	11540814
04/07/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON SALE OF EMBRATEL (.5) INCLUDING CONFER WITH S. YODELMAN, L. FIFE, A. COHEN (.3); DRAFT NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT (.2)	1.00	425.00	W300	11635821
04/07/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON SALE OF EMBRATEL, INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE, S. YODELMAN (.7); REVISE AND FILE NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT (.7).	1.40	595.00	W300	11635827
04/07/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia REVIEW FINAL ANATEL FILINGS FROM 4/2/04 (1.0); REVIEW CALAIS REVISED OFFER (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH GROUP REGARDING CALAIS REVISED OFFER (.5); RESEARCH FOR TELES SPA (3.0); MULTIPLE CALLS TO R. BARRETO REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL AT 3PM (.5); DRAFT TELES SPA (3.0); DRAFTING OF AMENDMENT CHANGING DATES (.5); MULTIPLE CALLS TO WILLKIE FARR TO SET UP MEETING REGARDING BNDS MATTER (.5); CONFERENCE CALL TO B. LACY WITH F. GREEN REGARDING AMENDMENT TO SPA (.5)	9.90	3,267.00	W300	11540255
04/07/04	Pullo, Christina CONFER WITH J. FINK REGARDING WAIVER OF PRIVILEGE IN CONTEXT OF BUSINESS JUDGMENT RULE (.2); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (4.1)	4.30	1,182.50	W300	11615450
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MILMOE REGARDING CALAIS.	0.40	310.00	W300	11635896
04/08/04	Braun, Lynda READ EXPERT REPORTS	0.80	396.00	W300	11594856
04/08/04	Cohen, Adam EMAILS AND REVIEW OF ASSOCIATED DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH EMBRATEL TRANSACTION	0.80	440.00	W300	11543912
04/08/04	Youdelman, Sharon REVIEW REVISED AMENDMENT TO & RELEVANT PROVISIONS OF EMBRATEL SALE AGREEMENT	0.20	99.00	W300	11622117
04/08/04	Skarda, Michael CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN (0.2); PARTICIPATE IN MEETING TO DISCUSS REGULATORY ISSUES (5.1); MEMORANDUM TO F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (0.5); DRAFT AGREEMENT (5.5); RESEARCH PUBLIC COMPANY DISCLOSURE REGARDING CONSOLIDATION (2.3); CONFERENCE WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING SAME (0.5); MEMORANDUM TO F. GREEN AND S. GOLD REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE (0.4); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING SECURITIES FILINGS RESEARCH (0.4).	15.20	6,992.00	W300	11543340
04/08/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALL WITH TELMEX COUNSEL REGARDING BNDES MATTER (.7); EMAIL SUMMARY OF SAME (.3); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING SUMMARY OF CHANGES TO CALAIS' REVISED OFFER (.7)	1.70	782.00	W300	11540823
04/08/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	10.40	3,432.00	W300	11542131

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CALL TO R. LACY REGARDING AMENDMENT (.5); REVIEW OF BOB LACY'S DESCRIPTION (1.0); REVISIONS AND CALL FROM B. LACY (.7); REVIEW PRESS ITEMS (1.0); REVIEW NOTICE OF ADJOURNMENT (1.2); REVIEW TERMINATION RIGHTS (1.3); CALL WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL (.3); CALL FROM B. LACY REGARDING BOARD APPROVAL OF AMENDMENT (.5); CALL TO F. GREEN TO DISCUSS STATUS OF AMENDMENT AND BNDS MATTER (.5); REVIEW STUART'S EXCERPT ON BNDS CONFERENCE CALL (1.0); CALL WITH F. GREEN REGARDING MEMORANDUM (.4); CALL WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING MEMORANDUM (.3); DRAFTING OF MEMORANDUM (1.7)				
04/08/04	Taylor, David ATTENTION TO MCI NETWORKS	0.20	58.00	W300	11589745
04/09/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ REGARDING EMBRATEL (.3); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH WORLDCOM, S. YODELMAN, S. HIRSCH AND F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.6); CONF WITH WORLDCOM, F. GREEN, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL STRATEGY (1.0).	2.90	2,073.50	W300	11615832
04/09/04	Cohen, Adam INTERNAL TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING EMBRATEL TRANSACTION.	0.30	165.00	W300	11543914
04/09/04	Youdelman, Sharon ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL SALE TRANSACTION, INCLUDING ATTENDANCE AT TELEPHONIC COURT CONFERENCE (.7) REVIEW OF PURCHASE AGREEMENT AMENDMENT & NOTICE (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN & LONGMEYER REGARDING SAME [.4]	1.30	643.50	W300	11623851
04/09/04	Skarda, Michael REVIEW MCI 2003 10-K DRAFT AND 2002 10-K REGARDING CERTAIN DISCLOSURES (0.8); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (0.5); CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING TRANSACTION AND DRAFT AGREEMENT (0.3); DRAFT AGREEMENT (5.9); EMAIL TO F. GREEN REGARDING SAME (0.2).	7.70	3,542.00	W300	11543372
04/09/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING CALAIS' REVISED OFFER, MCI BOARD MEETING AND TELMEX FOLLOWUP (1.1); WORK ON LETTER TO EMBRATEL REGARDING CVM INQUIRY (1.0); VARIOUS OTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, EMAILS REGARDING FILING OF AMENDMENT TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND OTHER MATTERS (2.5)	4.60	2,116.00	W300	11540842
04/09/04	Fink, Jessica CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, J. LONGMIRE REGARDING EMBRATEL (.8); STATUS CONFERENCE WITH J. GONZALEZ REGARDING SAME (.5); DRAFT AND FILE NOTICE OF AMENDMENT TO SALE AGREEMENT (.7)	2.00	850.00	W300	11635847
04/09/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia COORDINATION OF EXECUTION OF AMENDMENT (1.0); REVIEW OF TERMINATION PROVISIONS AND MEMORANDUM (1.0); REVIEW OF CALAIS NEW BID (1.0); DRAFTING OF LETTER TO EMBRATEL REGARDING SAME (1.0)	4.00	1,320.00	W300	11541658
04/11/04	Hirsch, Stuart REVIEWED REVISED LETTER TO EMBRATEL REGARDING CVM INQUIRY (.4); REVISIONS TO SAME (.4); VARIOUS EMAILS REGARDING SAME (.4)	1.20	552.00	W300	11540727
04/11/04	Oswell, Dennis ANALYZE TURNOVER PRODUCTION OF EMBRATEL IN THE EUROPEAN UNION (.8); DISCUSS PRELIMINARY CONCLUSIONS WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL (.9); DRAFT NOTE TO CLIENT WITH CONCLUSIONS REGARDING MERGER CONTROL FILING REQUIREMENTS (.8)	2.50	900.00	W300	11570760
04/12/04	Rothman, Richard	0.20	147.00	W300	11559352

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. COHEN REGARDING ASSET ISSUES				
04/12/04	Fife, Lori	2.10	1,501.50	W300	11612373
	MEETING WITH WGM TEAM ON EMBRATEL (.8); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WORLDCOM AND WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.3).				
04/12/04	Cohen, Adam	7.80	4,290.00	W300	11543807
	IN CONNECTION WITH APRIL 27TH HEARING, CONFER WITH R.ROTHMAN (0.2), CONFER WITH TEAM INTERNALLY (0.7), TELEPHONE CONVERSATION R.BARRETO (BRAZILIAN COUNSEL) REGARDING PREPARATION FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING (0.5), TELEPHONE CONVERSATION B.METGE REGARDING SAME (0.5), VARIOUS INTERNAL TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME (1.0), REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS AND OTHER PREPARATION FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING (4.9).				
04/12/04	Youdelman, Sharon	1.10	544.50	W300	11622746
	MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL COMPETING OFFER (.4) & PREP FOR HEARING [0.4]; REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME [0.3]				
04/12/04	Skarda, Michael	4.80	2,208.00	W300	11564018
	CONTINUE DRAFT OF FORM TRANSACTION AGREEMENT (2.2); REVIEW PRECEDENT FOR SIMILAR TRANSACTIONS (2.6).				
04/12/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.70	3,082.00	W300	11562753
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. METGE, F. GREEN, L. FIFE, C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING SALE HEARING, AND CALAIS' STRATEGY (1.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN, C. TRAJTENBERG, P. DAVIS REGARDING PREPARATION FOR SALE HEARING (1.5); MEETINGS WITH C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND PREPARATION OF MEMORANDA ON BNDES DISPUTE (1.0); REVIEWED BNDES NOTICES TO AMERICAN MOVIL (2.8)				
04/12/04	Fink, Jessica	1.00	425.00	W300	11635249
	WORK ON SALE OF EMBRATEL (.6) INCLUDING CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, S. YODELMAN, S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (.4)				
04/12/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	8.60	2,838.00	W300	11556652
	DRAFTING OF MEMORANDUM FOR A. COHEN REGARDING COMPARISON OF OFFERS AND PREPARATION FOR HEARING (4.0); CALL WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SECOND MEMORANDUM (.5); DRAFTING OF SECOND MEMORANDUM REGARDING ADVANTAGES OF TELMEX OFFER (4.1)				
04/12/04	Taylor, David	0.30	87.00	W300	11589735
	(MCI NETWORKS) DISCUSS APPROVAL STATUS WITH FCC ATTORNEY (.1); FORWARD UPDATE TO S. SIMPSON (.2)				
04/12/04	Grogan, James	2.30	839.50	W300	11569903
	REVIEW SPREADSHEET OF MMDS CURE CLAIMS (.7) AND CONFER WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING SAME (.5); REVIEW AND REVISE SCHEDULE OF PROPOSED MMDS CURE AMOUNTS (.5); REVIEW DOCKET AND STIPULATIONS PERTAINING TO SAME (.6).				
04/12/04	Pullo, Christina	0.60	165.00	W300	11614781
	RESEARCH THE SCOPE OF PRIVILEGE FOR EMBRATEL RESPONSE				
04/13/04	Fife, Lori	2.00	1,430.00	W300	11614119
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WILKIE, S. HIRSCH REGARDING EMBRATEL (.5).				
04/13/04	Cohen, Adam	7.50	4,125.00	W300	11547919

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM, R. BARRETTO AND WORLDCOM PERSONNEL REGARDING EMBRATEL MATTER (1.0); PREPARING FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING, INCLUDING REVIEWING OF MATERIALS (6.5).				
04/13/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.90	454.50	W300	11548917
	MEETING WITH A. COHEN REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE (0.5); REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN EMBRATEL (0.4).				
04/13/04	Skarda, Michael	0.70	322.00	W300	11564020
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN AND D. WHITTAKER REGARDING TRANSACTION STATUS (0.3); VARIOUS EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING DRAFT AGREEMENT (0.4).				
04/13/04	Hirsch, Stuart	6.20	2,852.00	W300	11562671
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING CALAI'S OFFER AND STRATEGY (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WILLKIE REGARDING SALE HEARING, FIDUCIARY OUT, AND OTHER MATTERS (1.3); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN, C. TRAJTENBERG REGARDING PREPARATION FOR SALE HEARING, DOCUMENT REQUESTS, SUMMARY OF COMPETING OFFERS (1.7); REVIEWED OPINION OF BRAZILIAN EXPERT AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN REGARDING SAME (1.5); VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING STRATEGY AND COMPETING BIDS (.7)				
04/13/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	10.60	3,498.00	W300	11556913
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. WEBSTER, B. METGE, LAZARD AND WGM REGARDING TELMEX (1.3); UPDATING THE MEMOS FOR LITIGATION TEAM (1.2); SENDING FIRST AND SECOND MEMOS TO A. COHEN FOR HIS REVIEW (.3); REVIEW REGULATORY OPINION RECEIVED YESTERDAY (1.0); DRAFTING OF THIRD MEMORANDUM FOR A. COHEN (3.0); MEETING WITH S. HIRSCH TO GO OVER THIRD MEMORANDUM (.3); REVISIONS TO THIRD MEMORANDUM (.5); SEND THIRD MEMORANDUM TO A. COHEN (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WILLKIE REGARDING REQUEST TO UP THEIR OFFER (.8); CALL WITH D. WEBSTER, LAZARD AND WEIL TO GO OVER SEPARATE CONVERSATIONS WITH TELMEX COUNTERPARTS (1.3); DILIGENCE OF CORRESPONDENCE THROUGHOUT DEAL FOR LITIGATION TEAM (.8)				
04/13/04	Friedmann, Jared	6.70	1,842.50	W300	11568774
	RESEARCH REGARDING TRANSLATED DOCUMENTS, WAIVER OF A/C AND W/P WHEN LEGAL EXPERTS TESTIFY				
04/13/04	Shrestha, Christine	0.50	82.50	W300	11549268
	PROVIDE ANSWERS TO QUESTIONS ABOUT HANDLING OF MERGER CERTIFICATE & CORPORATE DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL BY DE SECRETARY OF STATE AS PER A. YOON, D. HOLZMAN				
04/14/04	Fife, Lori	0.80	572.00	W300	11615281
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING EMBRATEL (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SKADDEN REGARDING SAME (.4)				
04/14/04	Cohen, Adam	6.50	3,575.00	W300	11550774
	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION B. METGE IN PREPARATION FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING (0.5); OTHER PREPARATION FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING, INCLUDING INTERNAL COMMUNICATIONS, REVIEW OF RELEVANT MATERIALS AND PREPARATION OF WITNESS EXAMINATIONS (6.0).				
04/14/04	Youdelman, Sharon	0.30	148.50	W300	11616958
	CONFERENCES WITH J. FINK & L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE TRANSACTION				
04/14/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	1.80	909.00	W300	11597943
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE (0.6); REVIEW MOTION PAPERS TO APPROVE SALE OF EMBRATEL SHARES (0.4); REVIEW MEMORANDUM REGARDING SALE OF EQUITY INTEREST IN EMBTATEL (0.1); REVIEW LETTER REGARDING REGARDING CALAIS PROPOSAL (0.3); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING STRATEGY ON 363 SALE (0.4).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/14/04	Skarda, Michael CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING DRAFT OF AGREEMENT (0.3); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF BANKER DILIGENCE QUESTIONNAIRE AND AGENDA (1.2).	1.90	874.00	W300	11564022
04/14/04	Hirsch, Stuart MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN, C. TRAJTENBERG, P. DAVIS, L. FIFE REGARDING PREPARATION FOR SALE HEARING, DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND MEMORANDA (2.0) AND REVIEWED DRAFTS OF SAME (2.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. TSEKERIDES REGARDING SALE HEARING, COMPETING BIDS AND BACKGROUND (.5); VARIOUS EMAILS REGARDING COMPETING BIDS AND SALE HEARING (1.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. KUJAWSKI REGARDING BNDES DISPUTE AND E-MAIL TO D. BOSTON (WILLKIE) (.6)	7.30	3,358.00	W300	11562816
04/14/04	Fink, Jessica DRAFT MOTION TO WITHDRAW MOTION TO APPROVE SALE OF EMBRATEL.	0.20	85.00	W300	11635297
04/14/04	Fink, Jessica CONFER WITH S. YOUDELMAN AND L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL.	0.50	212.50	W300	11635286
04/14/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia DOCUMENT REQUEST FOR LITIGATION IN PREPARATION OF HEARING (5.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH BRAZIL LOCAL COUNSEL AND S. HIRSCH REGARDING BNDS (1.0); DRAFTING OF MEMORANDUM (3.5)	9.50	3,135.00	W300	11556436
04/14/04	Taylor, David (MCI NETWORKS) LEAVE MESSAGE FOR FCC ATTORNEY.	0.10	29.00	W300	11589610
04/14/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. KOPPEL REGARDING MMDS ASSET SALE (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. SETO REGARDING CURE AMOUNT SUMMARY FOR MMDS ASSETS (.2); REVIEW CURE AMOUNT PRODUCTION PREPARED BY E. SETO REGARDING MMDS ASSET SALE (.5).	1.00	365.00	W300	11569912
04/14/04	Friedmann, Jared REVIEW DOCUMENTS (3.0); RESEARCH REGARDING INTERPRETERS AS TRANSLATORS IN SAME CASE (4.1)	7.10	1,952.50	W300	11569029
04/15/04	Cohen, Adam CONFERENCE CALLS WITH CLIENT AND LAZARD (1.5), CONFER WITH TEAM INTERNALLY (1.2), TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH PROFESSOR COELHO (BRAZILIAN COUNSEL) (0.3), REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS AND PREPARATION (4.2), ALL IN CONNECTION WITH APRIL 27TH HEARING ON EMBRATEL TRANSACTION.	7.20	3,960.00	W300	11553239
04/15/04	Tsekerides, Theodore REVIEW BACKGROUND DOCUMENTS REGARDING EMBRATEL SALE (0.8); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING NEW CALAIS OFFER (0.2);	1.00	505.00	W300	11597708
04/15/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALL WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING CALAIS' REVISED OFFER (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, EMAILS WITH TELMEX COUNSEL REGARDING BNDES DISPUTE (.9); REVIEWED ALL BID MATERIALS FROM CALAIS AND CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (2.0); PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM ON COMPARISON OF TELMEX/CALAIS (.9); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LITIGATORS REGARDING BACKGROUND AND REGULATORY RISK (.8)	5.90	2,714.00	W300	11562817
04/15/04	Cohen, Scott	0.80	320.00	W300	11568404

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE REGARDING EMBRATEL & REGARDING LATED CORRESPONDENCE (.3); CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE & M. GOLDSTEIN (.3)				
04/15/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	9.40	3,102.00	W300	11556729
	REVIEW PRESS RELEASES (.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD AND WGM REGARDING STRATEGY AND CALAIS REVISED OFFER (1.2); CALL TO L. FIFE AND M. GOLDSTEIN (.7); CALL TO SKADDEN REGARDING CALAIS REVISED OFFER (.6); CALL TO D. BOSTON REGARDING TIMING AND NEED FOR REVISED TELMEX OFFER (.5); DRAFTING MEMORANDUM (3.0); RESEARCH ON TELMEX SHAREHOLDERS (2.0); SEND DOCUMENTS TO A. COHEN (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD, CFF AND WGM REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
04/15/04	Buchweitz, Yehudah	7.00	2,310.00	W300	11590741
	SEVERAL CONFERENCES WITH A. COHEN, T. TSEKERIDES, J. FRIEDMAN REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (1.3); EXTENSIVE BACKGROUND READING (3.0); REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS AND ARTICLES (2.7)				
04/15/04	Taylor, David	0.20	58.00	W300	11589941
	(MCI NETWORKS) TELEPHONE CALL TO FCC REGARDING ISSUES (.1); CONFER WITH D. GUARD AND S. SIMPSON REGARDING ISSUES (.1)				
04/15/04	Taylor, David	3.10	899.00	W300	11589939
	(ABBOTT CLAIM) REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR WORLD ACCESS INVOICES.				
04/15/04	Friedmann, Jared	6.70	1,842.50	W300	11568664
	WRITE DISCOVERY REQUESTS FOR HEARING (2.0); MEET WITH Y. BUCHWEITZ REGARDING SAME (.7); REVIEW DOCUMENTS (3.0); SELECT DOCUMENTS FOR TRANSLATION CERTIFICATION (1.0)				
04/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W300	11637256
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MILMOE REGARDING SALE AGREEMENT				
04/16/04	Fife, Lori	1.80	1,287.00	W300	11612777
	REVIEW EMBRATEL OFFER AND MEMORANDA (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, S. HIRSCH, T. TSEKERIDES AND OTHERS REGARDING SAME (.6).				
04/16/04	Cohen, Adam	4.20	2,310.00	W300	11556609
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND CONFER WITH WGM AND BRAZILIAN COUNSEL IN PREPARATION FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING.				
04/16/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	5.80	2,929.00	W300	11597071
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. STERN REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING (0.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. GRAFSTEIN REGARDING EMBRATEL HEARING (0.2); REVIEW MEMORANDUM REGARDING BRASILIAN COUNSEL OPINION (0.4); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING PROCESS FOR EMBRATEL SALE (0.3); REVIEW REVISED OFFER (0.3); DISCUSSIONS WITH Y. BUCKWEITZ REGARDING STATUS (0.2); MEETING WITH A. COHEN AND Y. BUCHWEITZ (0.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. STERN (0.5); REVIEW ORDER REGARDING MOTION REQUIREMENT IF SEEK TO WITHDRAW EMBRATEL SALE MOTION (0.1); REVIEW AND ANALYZE MEMORANDUM REGARDING RISKS ON NEW OFFER (0.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING MEMORANDUM ON RISKS (0.2); REVIEW FURTHER REVISED OFFER FROM CALAIS (0.2); REVIEW REVISED MEMORANDUM ANALYZING RISKS OF CALAIS OFFER (0.2); ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING WAIVER OF PRIVILEGE (0.5); REVIEW LAZARD PRESENTATIONS TO BOARD AND PROCESS MATERIALS (0.9)				
04/16/04	Skarda, Michael	3.50	1,610.00	W300	11564026
	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT (0.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN, F. GREEN AND M. KAM REGARDING DRAFT AGREEMENT (1.7); SUBSEQUENT CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN (0.1); DRAFT ISSUES LIST FOR ANTITRUST COUNSEL (1.0); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO AND FROM T. EPSTEIN (0.2).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Hirsch, Stuart CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING REVISED CALAIS OFFER, BOARD MEETING AND SALE HEARING (2.0); PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM ON RISKS ASSOCIATED WITH CALAIS DEAL (2.5); MEETINGS WITH F. GREEN, C. TRAJTENBERG (.6) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH T. TSEKERIDES, Y. BUCHWEITZ REGARDING COMMENTS TO SAME (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CFF REGARDING REGULATORY MATTERS AND RISKS WITH CALAIS BID (1.0); VARIOUS CORRESPONDENCE, EMAILS REGARDING CALAIS BID, ANTITRUST RISK AND OTHER MATTERS (1.5)	8.40	3,864.00	W300	11562818
04/16/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH M. TOM REGARDING EMBRATEL CONFERENCE & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE INCLUDING ATTENTION TO WITHDRAWAL ORDER (.4); ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL MOTION (.3)	0.70	280.00	W300	11568777
04/16/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING STATUS OF TRANSACTION AND CALAIS' REVISED BID (1.1); DRAFTING OF MEMORANDUM TO BOARD WITH S. HIRSCH (2.0); REVISIONS TO PRIOR MEMOS (.7); REVIEW OF EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM CFF REGARDING LIABILITY, PLEDGE, ETC. (.5); REVIEW OF MOTION TO WITHDRAW (2.0); SETTING UP CALLS FOR THIS WEEKEND (.4); REVIEW REVISED OFFER FROM CALAIS (1.3); CALL WITH T. TSKEKERIDES REGARDING REVISED OFFER (.6)	8.60	2,838.00	W300	11556991
04/16/04	Buchweitz, Yehudah REVIEW OF MATERIALS IN PREPARATION FOR EMBRATEL HEARING (1.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ALL NECESSARY PARTIES (1.0); DIRECTION OF ORGANIZATION OF DOCUMENTS FOR USE AT TRIAL (1.2); REVIEW OF DRAFT MEMORANDUM ASSESSING RELATIVE RISK (1.0); E-MAIL COMMENTS REGARDING SAME (.2); BEGAN DRAFT OF WEBSTER OUTLINE (1.0); REVIEW OF BARRETO OUTLINE (1.0)	7.00	2,310.00	W300	11590315
04/16/04	Taylor, David TELEPHONE CALL TO FCC ATTORNEY REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	0.10	29.00	W300	11589665
04/16/04	Friedmann, Jared REVIEW DOCUMENTS WITH Y. BUCHWEITZ (5.5); PREPARE AND SELECT DOCUMENTS FOR WITNESS PREPARATION AND HEARING (3.0)	8.50	2,337.50	W300	11568676
04/17/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH METGE AND BRAZILIAN LAWYERS REGARDING EMBRATEL LEGAL ISSUES (2.0); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING EMBRATEL (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, BRAZILIAN LAWYERS REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0).	3.60	2,574.00	W300	11612865
04/17/04	Cohen, Adam CONFERENCE CALLS WITH BRAZILIAN COUNSEL AND CLIENT REGARDING EMBRATEL TRANSACTION AND APRIL 27TH HEARING (2.2); REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH SAME (3.2).	5.40	2,970.00	W300	11557190
04/17/04	Tsekerides, Theodore CONFERENCE CALLS TO DISCUSS EMBRATEL SALE WITH CLIENT, WEIL TEAM AND BRAZILIAN CRIMINAL LAWYER (1.6); CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS STRATEGY ON EMBRATEL SALE (0.8); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING RISKS ATTENDANT WITH CALAIS SALE (0.2); ANALYZE STRATEGY FOR GRAFSTEIN TESTIMONY AND REVIEW OF LAZARD DOCUMENTS (0.5).	3.10	1,565.50	W300	11586695
04/17/04	Hirsch, Stuart MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM REGARDING CALAIS OFFER, TELMEX TRANSACTION, ANTITRUST RISK AND VARIOUS OTHER MATTERS (4.0); REVIEWED PURCHASE AGREEMENTS FROM CALAIS COUNSEL (STOCK AND NOTES) (8.0); PREPARED MARKUPS OF SAME (3.8); VARIOUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES, EMAILS REGARDING OPEN ISSUES WITH CALAIS BID (2.0)	17.80	8,188.00	W300	11562820
04/17/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	10.50	3,465.00	W300	11556638

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW PRESS RELEASES (3.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM AND B. METGE REGARDING SAME (1.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH CRIMINAL ATTORNEY FROM BRAZIL (.8); REVIEW CALAIS DOCUMENTS (3.8); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CALLS WITH S. HIRSCH REGARDING SAME (1.0); CALL WITH S. HIRSCH AND F. GREEN REGARDING TO DO LIST (.7)				
04/17/04	Buchweitz, Yehudah	1.20	396.00	W300	11590281
	REVIEW OF MATERIALS EXCHANGED OVER LAST DAY REGARDING COPIES/TELMEX -- MCI TRANSACTIONS.				
04/18/04	Fife, Lori	4.40	3,146.00	W300	11612897
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD AND BRAZILIAN LAWYERS REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.8); NUMEROUS EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD REGARDING EMBRATEL(1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LONGMIRE REGARDING SAME (.2) REVIEW AND REVISE TALKING POINTS REGARDING EMBRATEL (.2).				
04/18/04	Cohen, Adam	2.00	1,100.00	W300	11557193
	EMAILS WITH BRAZILIAN COUNSEL AND CONFER WITH WGM TEAM AND REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH EMBRATEL TRANSACTION AND APRIL 27TH HEARING.				
04/18/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	1.10	555.50	W300	11586446
	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING STATUS OF TELMEX AND CALAIS OFFERS (0.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH Y. BUCHWEITZ REGARDING CALAIS AND TELMEX OFFER ISSUES (0.2); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING LITIGATION STRATEGY FOR SUPPORT OF TELMEX OFFER (0.5); REVIEW TELMEX OFFER (0.1);				
04/18/04	Hirsch, Stuart	9.30	4,278.00	W300	11562684
	MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS WITH DEAL TEAM (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN, L. FIFE AND OTHERS REGARDING STRATEGY FOR COMPETING BIDS AND PREPARATION FOR 4/19 BOARD MEETING (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. PARKS (AKIN) REGARDING UPDATE ON CALAIS/TELMEX BIDS (1.3); PREPARATION OF TALKING PTS MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD MEETING (4.5)				
04/18/04	Cohen, Scott	1.00	400.00	W300	11568784
	DRAFT EMBRATEL MOTION				
04/18/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	8.60	2,838.00	W300	11560270
	TURNING OF CALAIS DOCUMENTS (1.0); REVIEW BLACKLINES (1.0); REVIEW OF CFF MEMORANDA (.5); REVIEW OF CALAIS OFFER (.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD, CFF AND WEIL (1.2); REVIEW CALAIS REVISED OFFER (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI, LAZARD, WEIL, CFF REGARDING COMPETING BIDS (1.5); REVIEW CFF MEMORANDUM ON RISK ASSESSMENT (.6); REVIEW S. HIRSCH'S BULLET POINT OUTLINE (.6)				
04/18/04	Buchweitz, Yehudah	6.10	2,013.00	W300	11590290
	REVIEW OF NEW CALAIS AND TELMEX AGREEMENTS				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W300	11636932
	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE (.8) AND PARTICIPATE IN BOARD CONFERENCE CALL (1.2) REGARDING EMBRATEL				
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia	2.00	1,550.00	W300	11637340
	CHAMBERS CONFERENCE REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ, COMMITTEE COUNSEL.				
04/19/04	Fife, Lori	7.20	5,148.00	W300	11612937

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WGM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL (.5); PREPARE FOR BOARD CALL (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM BOARD REGARDING EMBRATEL AND MISCELLANEOUS (2.5); PARTICIPATE IN CHAMBERS CONFERENCE REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.5); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WILKIE, WORLDCOM TEAM REGARDING EMBRATEL (2.2).				
04/19/04	Urquhart, Douglas	0.40	240.00	W300	11570074
	REVIEW REVISED OFFER LETTER REGARDING SALE OF EMBRATEL TO CALAIS (.2); REVIEW COVENANTS IN NEW NOTES INDENTURES REGARDING SAME (.2)				
04/19/04	Cohen, Adam	9.00	4,950.00	W300	11561352
	PREPARATION FOR APRIL 27TH HEARING, INCLUDING CONFERENCE CALLS WITH CLIENT (2.0), EMAILS AND INTERNAL CONFERENCES WITH WGM TEAM (2.0), TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH BRAZILIAN COUNSEL (0.5), ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE GONZALEZ (2.0), REVIEW AND PREPARE RELEVANT MATERIALS FOR WITNESS EXAMINATIONS (2.5).				
04/19/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	5.90	2,979.50	W300	11601452
	CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS STRATEGY ON EMBRATEL SALE AND PRESENTATION TO BOARD (0.8); REVIEW AND ANALYZE REVISED MEMORANDA ON TALKING POINTS (0.4); MEETING TO DISCUSS OPEN ISSUES ON CALAIS SALE WITH CORPORATE TEAM, LITIGATION TEAM AND D. WEBSTER (0.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOARD REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING DEFENSE OF PROCESS (0.4); REVIEW RISKS IDENTIFIED BY BRAZILIAN COUNSEL (0.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. COHEN REGARDING MEETING WITH JUDGE (0.1); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING EXPERT REPORTS FOR HEARING (0.2); REVIEW AND ANALYZE DRAFT BOARD MINUTES (0.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH Y. BUCHWEITZ REGARDING STATUS (0.1); REVIEW MEMORANDUM REGARDING POTENTIAL RISKS OF CALAIS OFFER (0.4); REVIEW MORGAN STANLEY ANALYSIS (0.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING DEFENSE OF TELMEX DEAL (0.3); ANALYZE ARGUMENTS IN SUPPORT OF SALE TO CALAIS V. TELMEX (0.3); ATTENTION TO ISSUE REGARDING DIRECT EXAMINATION OF LAZARD (0.7).				
04/19/04	Skarda, Michael	5.70	2,622.00	W300	11612432
	VARIOUS EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE (0.4); RESEARCH AGREEMENT PRECEDENT OF REGULATED INDUSTRY (3.6); DRAFT ANTI-TRUST RELATED ISSUES LIST IN PREPARATION FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH T. EPSTEIN (1.0); CONFERENCE WITH D. WHITTAKER (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL (0.2); CONFERENCE WITH A. TARAR (0.2).				
04/19/04	Hirsch, Stuart	15.60	7,176.00	W300	11562767
	MULTIPLE CONFERENCE CALLS IN PREPARATION FOR BOARD CALL (2.0); BOARD CALL (2.0); NEGOTIATIONS WITH TELMEX REGARDING BREAKUP FEE AND COURT APPROVAL (3.0); E-MAILS REGARDING SAME (2.0); REVIEWED AMENDMENT TO SPA FROM TELMEX AND FURTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING SAME (6.6)				
04/19/04	Trajtenberg, Cinthia	12.50	4,125.00	W300	11569106
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING BOARD POINTS AND PRESENTATION (1.0); REVIEW DAN CRAWFORD'S MEMORANDUM (.8); REVIEW CFF COMMENTS (.7); REVIEW BOB LACY MEMORANDUM REGARDING MINORITY RISK (1.0); REVIEW CALAIS CURRENT OFFER MATERIALS AND DRAFT MEMORANDUM OUTLINING POINTS WHICH CALAIS NEEDS TO CONCEDE IN ORDER TO MAKE OFFER VIABLE (4.0); MULTIPLE CALLS WITH LAZARD REGARDING SAME (2.0); NEGOTIATIONS WITH TELMEX (3.0)				
04/19/04	Buchweitz, Yehudah	13.90	4,587.00	W300	11590369
	CONFERENCE CALL TO PREP FOR DOWD MEETING (1.2); REVIEW OF MATERIALS (3.5); SPOKE WITH EXPERT WITNESSES (4.0); DRAFTED OUTLINE OF TESTIMONY (5.2)				
04/19/04	Taylor, David	0.30	87.00	W300	11589668
	(MCI NETWORKS) CONFER WITH B. TURNBULL REGARDING DELAYS (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO FCC ATTORNEY REGARDING SAME (.1)				
04/19/04	Pullo, Christina	3.70	1,017.50	W300	11611092

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DRAFT DE MINIMIS SALE REPORT				
04/19/04	Friedmann, Jared	16.80	4,620.00	W300	11568678
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR TRANSLATION (3.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WGM TEAM AND BOARD REGARDING SAME (1.5); MEET WITH Y. BUCHWEITZ AND T. TSEKERIDES TO DISCUSS PLAN OF ACTION (.8); SET UP TRANSLATION SERVICES AND COURT INTERPRETER (1.0); RESEARCH REGARDING ADMISSION OF EXPERT OPINION WITHOUT EXPERT (8.0); CREATE TIME LINE FOR SALE OF EMBRATEL (2.0)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W300 - ASSET DISPOSITIONS:		646.40	\$ 275,372.00		
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W310	11527097
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES				
04/01/04	Larson, Michelle	0.60	267.00	W310	11521405
	ATTEND CLAIMS CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. FISCHER, D. AGEE, L. MCCOY, J. GROGAN ET AL. REGARDING CURES (.5); CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING 25 TOWER MOTION (.1).				
04/01/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.20	60.00	W310	11531857
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. YAKYM REGARDING 25 TOWERS TRANSACTION AND TOWERS FOR SALE (.1); CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING R. YAKYM'S INQUIRY (.1).				
04/02/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W310	11537608
	DISCUSSION WITH J. SANTOS REGARDING REJECTIONS				
04/02/04	Larson, Michelle	0.10	44.50	W310	11527906
	CORRESPOND WITH D. AGEE REGARDING POST-EMERGENCE LEASES.				
04/02/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.30	390.00	W310	11531903
	REVISE PROFFER OF K. KNIGHT (.7); REVISE SUMMARY OF MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT (.6).				
04/05/04	Larson, Michelle	0.10	44.50	W310	11530679
	CORRESPOND WITH K. COX AND K. SIMPSON REGARDING BRANDT.				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.10	49.50	W310	11537148
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W310	11537156
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. PETERSEN REGARDING VENDOR CONTRACTS, REAL ESTATE				
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W310	11537371
	PHONE CALL WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES				
04/06/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.20	85.00	W310	11619684
	CORRESPONDENCE TO L. CARSON REGARDING STATUS				
04/06/04	Larson, Michelle	1.20	534.00	W310	11533699
	CONFERENCES WITH K. SIMPSON AND J. FINK REGARDING BRANDT (.4); REVISE EMAIL TO K. COX REGARDING SAME (.3); REVISE BRANDT MOTION (.5).				
04/06/04	Simpson, Kristin	2.40	720.00	W310	11549295

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.1); CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK AND M. TOM REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.2); CONFERENCE WITH M. LARSON REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.3); REVISE BRANDT APPLICATION (1.6); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON, K. COX AND B. FRIES REGARDING BRANDT RETENTION (.2).				
04/07/04	Larson, Michelle	0.50	222.50	W310	11535973
	CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING AND REVISE BRANDT APPLICATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. AGEE REGARDING EMERGENCE (.1); TELEPHONE CALL FROM M. LEVIN REGARDING SAN FRANCISCO LEASE (.1).				
04/07/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.50	150.00	W310	11549303
	REVISE BRANDT APPLICATION (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. GLUCK REGARDING TRANSFER TAXES AND ORDER CONFIRMING PLAN (.2); VERIFY THAT NO OBJECTIONS HAVE BEEN FILED TO THE 25 TOWERS MOTION (.1)				
04/08/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.60	255.00	W310	11622578
	PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. SNARR, P. MURPHY, T. MITCHELL, J. PETERSEN, R. WALSH, L. CARSON AND K. KNIGHT (.5); CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.1).				
04/08/04	Larson, Michelle	0.30	133.50	W310	11541220
	CORRESPOND WITH M. LEVIN REGARDING SAN FRANCISCO LEASE (.1); CORRESPOND WITH D. AGEE REGARDING REJECTION ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING BRANDT (.1).				
04/08/04	Simpson, Kristin	1.20	360.00	W310	11549481
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. SIMPSON, L. CARSON, S. SNARR, P. MURPHY REGARDING CLOSING OF MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT (.2); UPDATE EXHIBITS TO MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SETTLEMENT FOR CLOSING (.8); CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON AND K. COX REGARDING BRANDT APPLICATION (.2).				
04/09/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.20	99.00	W310	11543322
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES				
04/09/04	Cohen, Scott	0.10	40.00	W310	11546136
	MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REAL ESTATE LEASE				
04/09/04	Larson, Michelle	0.10	44.50	W310	11542933
	CORRESPOND WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING 25 TOWERS HEARING SUMMARY				
04/09/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.70	210.00	W310	11555904
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH A. PEREZ AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING HEARING ON 25 TOWERS MOTION (.3); REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER GRANTING 25 TOWERS MOTION FOR CORRECT 1146(C) LANGUAGE (.1); REVISE MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS (.2); CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. SIMPSON REGARDING MCI/NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.1).				
04/12/04	Simpson, Stefanie	0.50	212.50	W310	11623407
	CIRCULATE EXECUTION COPIES OF NORTHWEST SETTLEMENT DOCUMENTS.				
04/12/04	Larson, Michelle	1.20	534.00	W310	11545217
	RESEARCH REGARDING FEE SHARING ISSUES (.8); CORRESPOND WITH K. COX AND K. SIMPSON REGARDING SAME (.4).				
04/12/04	Simpson, Kristin	0.30	90.00	W310	11551697
	CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LARSON AND K. COX REGARDING BRANDT APPLICATION				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING DILIGENCE, REAL ESTATE ISSUES, RIGHT OF WAYS	0.20	99.00	W310	11550219
04/14/04	Simpson, Stefanie TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CARSON REGARDING TOWER SITE.	0.30	127.50	W310	11622508
04/14/04	Larson, Michelle ANALYZE ISSUES WITH RESPECT TO EFFECTIVE DATE AND LEASES.	0.20	89.00	W310	11551390
04/15/04	Simpson, Stefanie CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. SNARR, L. CARSON AND J. PETERSON REGARDING REAL PROPERTY MATTERS.	0.40	170.00	W310	11617258
04/15/04	Larson, Michelle CORRESPOND WITH K. COX REGARDING SAN FRANCISCO LEASE (.1); CONFERENCE WITH K. SIMPSON REGARDING BRANDT (.1).	0.20	89.00	W310	11555106
04/16/04	Cohen, Scott TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. WALSH REGARDING AKELER & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE	0.30	120.00	W310	11568779
04/16/04	Pullo, Christina DRAFT NOTICE OF ABANDONMENT FOR SELLERSVILLE (.3); DRAFT EMAIL TO L. CARSON AT MCI REGARDING SAME (.1); REVISE NOTICE (.1)	0.50	137.50	W310	11615861
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH K. JOFFRION REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES.	0.10	25.00	W310	11564080
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES.	0.20	50.00	W310	11564073
04/16/04	Jamal, Sacha ORGANIZE COPIES OF CAPITAL LEASES SO THAT THEY COULD BE SENT BY FEDEX TO N. JONES.	0.20	50.00	W310	11564093
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W310 - REAL PROPERTY LEASES:		15.80	\$ 5,879.50		
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH J. ENGLISH REGARDING EDS CONTRACT, INDEXING, PHONE CALL WITH P. ESKILDSEN REGARDING SCHEDULE, STATUS, DOCUMENT MANAGEMENT	0.10	49.50	W320	11527013
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11527104
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11527470
04/01/04	Grogan, James REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH AMERICAN EXPRESS CORPORATION (.4); PREPARE NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH G. MAHONEY REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING PT-1 TRANSCRIPT (.3).	1.20	438.00	W320	11536630

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/02/04	Skarda, Michael REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF AGREEMENT AND DRAFT SUMMARY (4.4); CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN AND S. JAMAL (0.3); CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL (0.4).	5.10	2,346.00	W320	11542957
04/02/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND P. ABOOD REGARDING HEARING ON BP MOTION (.3); REVIEW DOCKET FOR OBJECTIONS TO SAME (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (2.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING PT-1 HEARING TRANSCRIPT (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING QWEST STIPULATION (.4).	3.10	1,131.50	W320	11537004
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha CONFER WITH D. WHITTAKER REGARDING TEMPLATE SPREADSHEET FOR REVIEW OF CUSTOMER AND VENDOR CONTRACTS.	0.10	25.00	W320	11559781
04/02/04	Jamal, Sacha PREPARE TEMPLATE SPREADSHEET FOR REVIEW OF CUSTOMER AND VENDOR CONTRACTS.	0.40	100.00	W320	11559780
04/05/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW NEWENERGY CONTRACT FOR ANALYSIS OF FORWARD CONTRACT CLAUSES.	0.20	74.00	W320	11532199
04/05/04	Grogan, James EXCHANGE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH G. MITCHEL AND S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING HEARING TRANSCRIPT FOR PT-1 MATTER (.4); REVIEW OBJECTION OF G. KARVOUNAKIS TO BP MOTION (.4); MULTIPLE TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH P. ABOOD AND D. SHOPFNER REGARDING SAME AND REGARDING MOTION TO APPROVE BP AMENDMENT (1.4); MULTIPLE CONFERENCES WITH S. BAKER REGARDING SAME (.5); PREPARE ARGUMENTS AND EXHIBITS FOR HEARING ON SAME (1.5); EXCHANGE AND REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. BAKER, A. STROCHAK AND P. ABOOD REGARDING HEARING ON BP MOTION (.7).	4.90	1,788.50	W320	11546808
04/05/04	Pullo, Christina CONFER WITH L. FIFE AND S. COHEN REGARDING RESEARCH IN CONNECTION WITH TERMINATING A POSTPETITION AGREEMENT THAT NO LONGER BENEFITS THE ESTATE (.4); RESEARCH REGARDING SAME (1.8)	2.20	605.00	W320	11614096
04/05/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW AND REVISE CUSTOMER CONTRACT REVIEW CHART.	0.90	225.00	W320	11559561
04/06/04	Grogan, James CONFER WITH P. ABOOD AND D. SHOPFNER REGARDING BP MOTIONS AND ISSUES RAISED IN OBJECTION TO SAME (2.6); ATTEND HEARING ON BP MOTION AND ATN ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (2.5); CORRESPOND WITH R. LEHANE REGARDING BP MOTION AND ORDER (.2); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. CARRICK AND G. MAHONEY REGARDING AMERICAN EXPRESS CORPORATION SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.4).	5.70	2,080.50	W320	11546918
04/06/04	Pullo, Christina RESEARCH THE APPLICATION OF SECTION 503(B)(1)(A) TO A POSTPETITION AGREEMENT THAT IS NO LONGER BENEFICIAL TO THE ESTATE.	3.20	880.00	W320	11615888
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH D. KIM REGARDING CUSTOMER AND VENDOR CONTRACTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11541043
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH M. SKARDA AND S. JAMAL REGARDING STAFFING, SCHEDULES, CONTRACT, DILIGENCE	0.20	99.00	W320	11541044

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH APURNA RAVI REGARDING DILIGENCE ON CUSTOMER CONTRACTS	0.30	148.50	W320	11541045
04/07/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS FROM P. GEIMER (MCI) REGARDING REJECTION OF SOFTWARE LICENSE	0.40	220.00	W320	11621543
04/07/04	Grogan, James REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH WITH MULLINS, D. CARRICK AND G. MAHONEY REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT WITH AMERICAN EXPRESS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING QWEST STIPULATION (.4).	0.70	255.50	W320	11546926
04/07/04	Jamal, Sacha REVIEW EMAILS TO IDENTIFY ELECTRONIC CUSTOMER CONTRACTS AND FORWARD THE SAME TO A. RAVI.	0.60	150.00	W320	11559599
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALLS WITH G. AVALOS REGARDING VENDOR CONTRACT DILIGENCE	0.10	49.50	W320	11542778
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH G. AVALOS AND S. JAMAL REGARDING DILIGENCE ON VENDOR CONTRACTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11542771
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. KIM REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS, LITIGATION ISSUES	0.30	148.50	W320	11542758
04/08/04	Whittaker, Donald REVIEW XO, ALLTELL, WILLIAMS CONTRACTS	0.30	148.50	W320	11542761
04/08/04	Grogan, James REVIEW AND REVISE QWEST STIPULATION (.9); CORRESPOND WITH S. PARKER REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SOUTH BAY SETTLEMENT (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. TOMASHEFSKY REGARDING PT-1 STATUS CONFERENCE (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE AMERICAN EXPRESS SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.8); CORRESPOND WITH D. CARRICK AND G. MAHONEY REGARDING SAME (.1); DRAFT AND REVISE NOTICE OF SETTLEMENT WITH AMERICAN EXPRESS (1.2).	3.70	1,350.50	W320	11546931
04/12/04	Cohen, Scott DISCUSSION WITH M. BEACH REGARDING NEON	0.40	160.00	W320	11568977
04/13/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. SPEARS REGARDING CUSTOMER CONTRACTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11550217
04/14/04	Whittaker, Donald PHONE CALL WITH J. COOK REGARDING IRU'S, RIGHTS OF WAYS, FIBER AGREEMENTS, CARRIER CONTRACTS	0.20	99.00	W320	11554513
04/14/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING INTEGRAL SETTLEMENT (.2); REVISE STIPULATION WITH QWEST REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF CLAIMS (.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. PARKER REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.30	474.50	W320	11569914
04/15/04	Grogan, James	0.90	328.50	W320	11571747

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. RHOADS REGARDING SETTLEMENTS WITH SOUTH BAY AND WIRELESS NOW (.3); REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS WITH SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. RHOADS AND M. BEACH REGARDING SETTLEMENTS, AND REVIEW RELEVANT DOCUMENTATION (.4).				
04/16/04	Grogan, James	4.60	1,679.00	W320	11571755
	EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING SETTLEMENT AND SETOFF ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. TROFIMUK REGARDING QWEST STIPULATION (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. FREIDMAN, J. TROFIMUK AND A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.8); REVIEW PRODUCTION IN SUPPORT OF QWEST CLAIMS (1.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. PARKER REGARDING SAME (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. TROFIMUK REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE EXHIBIT A TO QWEST STIPULATION (.6).				
04/19/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W320	11620939
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM M. BOSS REGARDING CIRCUIT REJECTIONS.				
04/19/04	Graham, Richard	0.50	185.00	W320	11620941
	REVIEW CIRCUIT REJECTIONS.				
04/19/04	Graham, Richard	0.60	222.00	W320	11621962
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM C. BAILEY REGARDING WHITTAKER DISCOVERY.				
04/19/04	Grogan, James	2.60	949.00	W320	11571910
	ATTEND TO EXECUTION OF STIPULATION WITH QWEST, INCLUDING FINAL REVISIONS TO THE STIPULATION AND EXHIBITS				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W320 - EXECUTORY CONTRACTS:		45.90	\$ 16,942.00		
04/01/04	Thompson, John	1.00	330.00	W330	11589650
	ATTENTION TO SPECTRUM RESOURCES SETTLEMENT OF CLAIM (.5); TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH SPECTRUM COUNSEL D. TRACHE REGARDING SAME (.5)				
04/02/04	Strochak, Adam	3.40	1,870.00	W330	11621034
	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OBJECTION TO GRAYSON LIFT STAY MOTION (2.6); CONFERENCES WITH C. WATKINS REGARDING SAME (0.8)				
04/02/04	Thompson, John	0.40	132.00	W330	11589766
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH A. STROCHAK AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS AND SCHEDULING FOR MATTERS ON TUESDAY HEARING				
04/06/04	Thompson, John	0.50	165.00	W330	11589794
	ATTENTION TO SPECTRUM RESOURCES ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE MOTION				
04/09/04	Strochak, Adam	0.70	385.00	W330	11621463
	REVIEW OBJECTION TO GRAYSON STAY ENFORCEMENT MOTION				
04/09/04	Thompson, John	1.10	363.00	W330	11589913
	ATTENTION TO SETTLEMENT OF CORD MATTER (.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. KEELING REGARDING SAME (.3); ATTENTION TO SETTLEMENT OF SPECTRUM RESOURCE ADMINISTRATIVE RENT CLAIM (.3)				
04/12/04	Strochak, Adam	2.90	1,595.00	W330	11620359
	PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO ENFORCE STAY AGAINST RICHARD REYNOLDS				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/12/04	Thompson, John TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH B. BOWLIN REGARDING SPECTRUM AND SPECTRASITE MATTERS	0.60	198.00	W330	11589805
04/13/04	Strochak, Adam PREPARE FOR (1.5) AND ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION TO ENFORCE STAY AGAINST RICHARD REYNOLDS AND OTHER UNCONTESTED MATTERS (3.1)	4.40	2,420.00	W330	11620361
04/13/04	Pullo, Christina DRAFT EMAIL TO A. STROCHAK REGARDING MOTION TO LIFT AUTOMATIC STAY BY SPRINGCREEK INVESTMENTS LLC (.2); CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.40	110.00	W330	11611965
04/14/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL TO C. GOLDSTEIN (LEXINGTON INSURANCE COUNSEL) REGARDING LEXINGTON MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY (0.5); REVIEW AND ANALYZE LEXINGTON MOTION (0.4); PHONE CALL TO M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.2)	1.10	605.00	W330	11623280
04/15/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALLS TO/FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI), C. GOLDSTEIN (LEXINGTON INSURANCE COUNSEL) REGARDING LEXINGTON INSURANCE LIFT STAY MOTION	0.70	385.00	W330	11623267
04/15/04	Thompson, John TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. BOWLIN REGARDING SPECTRASITE DEMAND FOR ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. KEELING REGARDING CORD MOVING AND STORAGE (.1)	0.40	132.00	W330	11590037
04/16/04	Cohen, Scott TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CARSON REGARDING FLORIDA STAY ISSUE	0.20	80.00	W330	11568778
04/16/04	Thompson, John CALL TO SPECTRASITE REGARDING ADMINISTRATIVE RENT FAX	0.10	33.00	W330	11589818
04/19/04	Berkovich, Ronit TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND AND M. JACOBY REGARDING STATUS OF LAWSUITS AFTER EMERGENCE (.2); REVIEW PLAN AND ORDER MODIFYING PLAN REGARDING SAME (.3); E-MAILS TO J. ALLERHAND, M. JACOBY, P. FERRILLO, AND C. MARCUS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING SAME (.2).	0.90	333.00	W330	11636446
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W330 - AUTOMATIC STAY/ADEQUATE PROTECTION:		18.80	\$ 9,136.00		
04/01/04	Hickerson, David REVIEW PLEADINGS, DOCUMENTS, BACKGROUND MATERIALS REGARDING ABBOT LAWSUIT (5.0); ANALYSIS, STRATEGY REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (2.5).	7.50	4,350.00	W400	11533255
04/01/04	Strochak, Adam CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING ABBOTT LITIGATION CLAIMS (0.3) AND REPLY BRIEF ON STANDING ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS (0.3)	0.60	330.00	W400	11620986
04/01/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE STATE OF MISSOURI'S SURETY BOND REQUEST (.2); COMMUNICATIONS WITH CDI'S ATTORNEY, G. MITCHEL, AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE CDI PRESENTED STIPULATION (.3); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH P. REYNOLDS REGARDING COUNTER-OFFER TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON (.3).	0.80	332.00	W400	11531142

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/01/04	Friedman, Peter RESEARCH AND DRAFT REPLY BRIEF IN WELLS FARGO CLAIM	1.50	615.00	W400	11620232
04/01/04	Friedman, Peter CONFER WITH COUNSEL IN PRE-PETITION ABBOTT PLAINTIFFS' CLAIM CAUSE OF ACTION (1.5); REVIEW FILINGS IN PRE-PETITION ABBOTT CLAIM (4.3); REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS OF DEPOSITION TESTIMONY IN SAME (1)	6.80	2,788.00	W400	11620231
04/01/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING ERS STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING LOWE OBJECTION AND FINALIZE SAME FOR FILING (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING STATUS OF LOWE AND LAHTI MOTIONS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. LOWRY REGARDING STATUS OF LAHTI STIPULATION AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FINALIZING SAME (.3); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING NOTEHOLDERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. GARCES, S. COHEN AND A. PEREZ REGARDING FAIRFAX COUNTY'S SECURED LIEN STATUS (.5); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM D. AGEE REGARDING SUN TRUST CENTER OFFICE LATE CLAIM (.3); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF ATRS RESPONSE (.1).	3.10	1,007.50	W400	11519913
04/01/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. TAYLOR AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF IMAGISTICS HEARING (.2); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH N. BEIZER REGARDING PENDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. COSTA REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BENTON REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CULVER REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIM (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND RECORDS PERTAINING TO SAME (.6).	1.90	693.50	W400	11536772
04/02/04	Hickerson, David ANALYSIS REGARDING ABBOT COMPLAINT (2.5); CONFER WITH P. FRIEDMAN AND B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (0.5); REVIEW PLEADINGS (2.0).	5.00	2,900.00	W400	11533257
04/02/04	Billeck, Jason PREPARE FOR CALL WITH J. GROGAN AND V. CULVER REGARDING PT CABLE'S CLAIM (.6) AND PARTICIPATE IN CALL WITH J. GROGAN AND V. CULVER REGARDING PT CABLE'S CLAIM (1.4).	2.00	830.00	W400	11531145
04/02/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW TRANSCRIPTS RELATED TO ABBOTT PLAINTIFFS PROOFS OF CLAIM	1.10	451.00	W400	11620235
04/02/04	Friedman, Peter DRAFT REPLY BRIEF TO IN WELLS FARGO CLAIM LITIGATION	2.20	902.00	W400	11620234
04/02/04	Loftspring, Sharon J TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. LOWERY REGARDING TERMS OF LAHTI STIPULATION AND SETTLEMENT OF CLAIM (.5); CORRESPOND WITH J. THOMPSON REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW HEARING SUMMARY AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2).	1.20	390.00	W400	11527825
04/02/04	Watkins, Claire [ABBOTT] OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN AND D. HICKERSON REGARDING REVIEW OF BOXES (.9); ATTENTION TO REVIEW OF BOXES (6.0); READ AND SUMMARIZE DEPOSITIONS (5.6); [GRAYSON] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GOULD REGARDING OBJECTION (.6); EDIT OBJECTION AND FILE WITH COURT (3.8); [AUDIOFAX] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BYNUM REGARDING MOTION (.7); ATTENTION TO EDITING AND FILING MOTIONS (1.3)	18.90	6,237.00	W400	11558075

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/02/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH V. CULVER AND J. BILLECK REGARDING PT CABLE CLAIMS (1.3); REVIEW CONTRACTS AND IRU'S RELATED TO PT CABLE (.4).	1.80	657.00	W400	11537005
04/04/04	Pullo, Christina RESEARCH STANDING OF A DISQUALIFIED BIDDER AND BIDDER WHO PURCHASES A CLAIM TO GAIN STANDING (4.7); DRAFT OBJECTION RESPONSE REGARDING SAME (4.2)	8.90	2,447.50	W400	11612888
04/05/04	Hickerson, David READ AFFIDAVITS, DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS AND DOCUMENTS REGARDING ABBOT CLAIMS (4.0); REVIEW MEMORANDUM TO CLIENT (0.5).	4.50	2,610.00	W400	11533261
04/05/04	Perez, Alfredo PREPARE AND PARTICIPATE IN LONG CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET, S. BURNS AND D. LEWIS REGARDING CLAIMS ISSUES (2.4), REVIEW MATERIALS RELATED TO CLAIMS (.30)	2.90	1,943.00	W400	11552043
04/05/04	Billeck, Jason WORK ON LETTER TO THE STATE OF MISSOURI REGARDING ITS CLAIM UNDER A SURETY BOND (1.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING SAME (.4); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S ATTORNEY, P. REYNOLDS, AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS OF SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON'S SETOFF MOTION (.3).	2.00	830.00	W400	11548618
04/05/04	Friedman, Peter REVIEW SUMMARIES OF TRANSCRIPTS PREPARED BY CLAIRE WATKINS RELATED TO ABBOTT CLAIMS LITIGATION (1.1); PREPARE MEMORANDUM FOR B. BENJET REGARDING OUTLINE OF ABBOTT LITIGATION STRATEGY (1.1)	2.20	902.00	W400	11620239
04/05/04	Friedman, Peter DRAFT AND REVISE REPLY BRIEF IN WELLS FARGO CLAIM TRIAL (4.2); COORDINATE WITH PARALEGAL STAFF REGARDING EXHIBITS FROM WELLS FARGO TRIAL (1.2)	5.40	2,214.00	W400	11620237
04/05/04	Loftspring, Sharon J TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. ACKER REGARDING NOTEHOLDERS' STIPULATION (.2) AND CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (1); PREPARE RESPONSE TO ATRS MOTION TO RECONSIDER (1.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. THOMPSON AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING STATUS OF LAHTI STIPULATION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. LOWERY REGARDING REVISIONS TO SAME AND SETTLEMENT TERMS (.5); REVIEW REVISED LAHTI STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING BACKGROUND OF LOWE LATE CLAIM (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION AND CORRESPOND WITH L. FELD REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING APPROVAL OF ERS STIPULATION (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); REVIEW CLAIMS STATUS SUMMARY PREPARED BY HURON (.3); PREPARE LAHTI ORDER AND CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FINALIZING SAME (.4).	4.60	1,495.00	W400	11530793
04/05/04	Watkins, Claire [ABBOTT] SUMMARIZE DEPOSITIONS AND EDIT INDICES.	5.00	1,650.00	W400	11558077
04/05/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. BENTON REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. NORTON REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BEACH REGARDING ALLSTATE CELLULAR OF SAN DIEGO SETTLEMENT OFFER (.8); RESEARCH REGARDING REJECTIONS DAMAGES CLAIMED BY ALLSTATE CELLULAR OF SAN DIEGO (1.4); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING APRIL 6, 2004 OMNIBUS HEARING (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. MITCHEL AND A. STROCHAK REGARDING SAME (.6).	4.10	1,496.50	W400	11547389

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/05/04	Reifman, Marli COMPILE LIST OF EXHIBITS USED IN WELLS FARGO HEARING FOR P FRIEDMAN	1.50	195.00	W400	11590731
04/06/04	Hickerson, David ANALYSIS REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.	2.30	1,334.00	W400	11570164
04/06/04	Strochak, Adam PREPARE FOR (1.8) AND ATTEND (3.7) HEARING ON LOWE ENTERPRISES, CAMPBELL AND LAHTI CLAIMS MOTIONS AND OTHER UNCONTESTED MATTERS	5.50	3,025.00	W400	11621590
04/06/04	Tsekerides, Theodore REVIEW PLAINTIFF'S SUBMISSION TO DISTRICT COURT AND ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.7); REVIEW STIPULATION IN BANKRUPTCY COURT LIFTING STAY (0.1).	0.80	404.00	W400	11550728
04/06/04	Billeck, Jason WORK ON LETTER TO STATE OF MISSOURI REGARDING SURETY BOND REQUEST (.4); COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING SAME (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH D&B'S ATTORNEY AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE D&B DRAFT STIPULATION (.2); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE STATUS OF THE CDI STIPULATION (.2).	1.10	456.50	W400	11548615
04/06/04	Cohen, Scott CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. BURNS, J. SMITH REGARDING CLAIMS & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.3); TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. TROSPER & D. OHLER REGARDING CLAIMS (.6); TELEPHONE CALL S. BEVILLE REGARDING AD HOC CLAIMS (.2)	1.10	440.00	W400	11537561
04/06/04	Loftspring, Sharon J REVIEW LAHTI PROOFS OF CLAIM (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING LOWE ENTERPRISE'S HISTORY, RESULTS OF HEARING ON LOWE AND LAHTI, SUBMISSION OF LAHTI ORDER, AND ATRS RESPONSE (.8); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING ATRS RESPONSE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH L. FELD REGARDING STATUS OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING RESULTS OF 4/6 HEARING AND STATUS OF ORDERS (.2); PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (1.5); CORRESPOND WITH S. HOLMES REGARDING STATUS OF NETSOLVE STIPULATION (.3); REVISE NOTEHOLDERS' STIPULATION (.3).	3.70	1,202.50	W400	11535813
04/06/04	Watkins, Claire [ABBOTT] REVIEW AND INDEX BOXES.	5.70	1,881.00	W400	11558082
04/06/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING PT CABLE MATTER (.1); REVIEW LETTER FROM H. EFROYMSON REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BENTON REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING DISTRIBUTION ISSUES (.1); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS AND S. COHEN REGARDING CURE PAYMENT ISSUES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. BEACH REGARDING SCHEDULED CLAIMS AND OBJECTIONS TO SAME (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. JOHNSON REGARDING LETTER FROM H. EFROYANSON PERTAINING TO INDY RACING LEAGUE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. EFROYMSON REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.70	620.50	W400	11546920
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY AND J. ALLERHAND REGARDING ASSET AGREEMENT	0.40	310.00	W400	11635288
04/07/04	Hickerson, David	1.50	870.00	W400	11570173

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	ANALYSIS REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.				
04/07/04	Strochak, Adam	3.70	2,035.00	W400	11621545
	DRAFTING OBJECTION TO OHIO LATE CLAIM MOTION (3.5); PHONE CALL FROM K. DAVIS (AKIN GUMP) REGARDING SAME (0.2)				
04/07/04	Billeck, Jason	1.00	415.00	W400	11548613
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING CDI STIPULATION (.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH D&B'S ATTORNEY, A. PEREZ AND M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE D&B STIPULATION (.5); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE DRAFT LETTER TO MISSOURI ABOUT ITS SEEKING PAYMENT UNDER A SURETY BOND (.2).				
04/07/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W400	11546117
	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. DINNER REGARDING CLAIM QUERY (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING CLAIMS & EMERGENCE (.1)				
04/07/04	Friedman, Peter	5.00	2,050.00	W400	11620240
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH ABBOTT CLAIMS (3.2); PREPARE FOR CALL WITH IN HOUSE COUNSEL AND OTHERS IN CONNECTION WITH FACTUAL DEVELOPMENT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (1.8)				
04/07/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.40	148.00	W400	11587566
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES W/A. STROCHAK REGARDING STIPULATIONS WITH TAXING AUTHORITIES TO EXTEND TIME TO FILE PROOF OF CLAIM (.2); REVIEW STIPULATIONS PER REQUEST OF A. STROCHAK (.2).				
04/07/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.90	617.50	W400	11535816
	CORRESPOND WITH L. FELD AND M. CHASTKA REGARDING ENTRY OF WILMINGTON TRUST STIPULATION (.4); CONFER WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING RESULTS OF LOWE HEARING, ATRS RESPONSE AND LATE CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK AND M. ETKINS REGARDING ATRS STIPULATION (.2) AND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. ACKER REGARDING NOTEHOLDERS' STIPULATION (.2).				
04/07/04	Watkins, Claire	0.20	66.00	W400	11558086
	[ABBOTT] ATTENTION TO INDICES.				
04/07/04	Grogan, James	2.10	766.50	W400	11546927
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BENTON REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. NORTON REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. RHOADS REGARDING ENEX CLAIM (.2); REVIEW LETTER FROM ENEX PERTAINING TO SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING CITY OF CHICAGO WARRANTS (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH E. EFROYMSON REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. TELSAR REGARDING CITY OF CHICAGO WARRANTS (.3).				
04/08/04	Hickerson, David	2.00	1,160.00	W400	11570177
	ANALYSIS REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.				
04/08/04	Strochak, Adam	1.50	825.00	W400	11621536
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT REPLY BRIEF ON STANDING ISSUE IN CONNECTION WITH WELLS FARGO CLAIMS OBJECTION (1.3); PHONE CALL FROM M. SHAIKEN (STINSON MORRISON) REGARDING SHARED NETWORK USERS GROUP CLAIMS (0.1); PHONE CALL FROM B. BENJET (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
04/08/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	1.40	707.00	W400	11550485

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW PETITION FILED BY PLAINTIFFS IN STATE COURT (0.7); CONFERENCE CALL WITH P. DUNICAN REGARDING BYRD (0.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL IN STATE COURT PROCEEDING ON INMATE CALLING PLAN (0.1); DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL REGARDING VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.2); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.3);				
04/08/04	Davis, Pierre	3.60	1,440.00	W400	11638141
	MEET WITH M. JACOBY REGARDING ERISA RESEARCH (.6); RESEARCH UTLRA VIRES ISSUES (3.0)				
04/08/04	Friedman, Peter	2.20	902.00	W400	11620241
	REVISE REPLY BRIEF IN WELLS FARGO CLAIMS LITIGATION				
04/08/04	Friedman, Peter	4.70	1,927.00	W400	11621638
	REVIEW TRANSCRIPT OF STEVE RUBIO DEPOSITION IN CONNECTION WITH ABBOTT LITIGATION (3.2); RESEARCH SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ISSUES (1.5)				
04/08/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.00	1,300.00	W400	11537870
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. ACKER REGARDING REVISIONS TO NOTEHOLDER STIPULATION (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTION INFORMATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING ATRS STIPULATION (.2); PREPARE SAME (1.0); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND M. ETKIN REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW UPDATED CASE CALENDARS AND DOCKET (.4); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ AND J. GROGAN REGARDING ATRS STATUS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH V. CAUGHLIN, D. GABB, AND COUNTY CLERK REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY'S SALE IN ERROR ORDER (.7); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING LATE CLAIM OBJECTIONS (.2); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING TAXING AUTHORITIES' VIOLATION OF STAY (.2).				
04/08/04	Watkins, Claire	6.40	2,112.00	W400	11558089
	[ABBOTT] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING PROOFS OF CLAIM (.4); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS AND PROOFS OF CLAIM (4.0); READ AND SUMMARIZE RUBIO DEPOSITION (2.0)				
04/08/04	Grogan, James	3.90	1,423.50	W400	11546930
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. BEACH AND J. SMITH REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO WIRELESS AGENT CLAIMS (1.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND CORRESPONDENCE RELATED TO SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BEVILLE REGARDING TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SMITH REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. BEACH AND S. RHOADS REGARDING ENEX SETTLEMENT OFFER (.5); REVIEW DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO ALL STATE CELLULAR CLAIM (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BEVILLE REGARDING MERRILL LYNCH CLAIM ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. TESLER REGARDING CITY OF CHICAGO WARRANTS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. BENTON REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.2).				
04/08/04	Philpott, Elizabeth	0.80	104.00	W400	11605797
	LOCATE AND RETRIEVE PRODUCED DOCUMENTS, CREATE ONE EXTRA SET OF DOCUMENTS FOR A. STROCHAK				
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W400	11635130
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY (.1) CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUDELMAN (.2) REGARDING ERISA CLAIMS.				
04/09/04	Hickerson, David	2.00	1,160.00	W400	11570184
	ANALYSIS REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (1.5); CONFERENCE WITH L. SNOW REGARDING CONTRACT ISSUES (0.5).				
04/09/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.80	404.00	W400	11597685

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. BENJET REGARDING STATE COURT ACTION COMMENCED BY CLAIMANTS (0.1); DRAFT EMAIL TO D. SMORODIN AND B. BENJET REGARDING LETTER TO COUNSEL ADVISING OF VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.2); REVISE LETTER TO COUNSEL ADVISING OF VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.1); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING AUTOMATIC STAY VIOLATION (0.4).				
04/09/04	Billeck, Jason	1.60	664.00	W400	11548293
	REVIEW HISTORY OF THE WEATHER CHANNEL CONTRACTS RELATED TO ITS CLAIM OF SETOFF.				
04/09/04	Friedman, Peter	0.80	328.00	W400	11621687
	FINALIZE BRIEF RELATED TO WELLS FARGO CLAIM AND FILE SAME				
04/09/04	Friedman, Peter	4.50	1,845.00	W400	11621690
	REVIEW FACTS RELATED TO ABBOTT CLAIMS (3.0); REVISE DRAFT OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF IN SAME (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH HURON CONSULTING RELATED TO ABBOTT CLAIMS (.9)				
04/09/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.10	357.50	W400	11549024
	CORRESPOND WITH M. ETKIN REGARDING REVISIONS TO ATRS STIPULATION AND REVISE SAME (.5); CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING FINALIZING SAME FOR PRESENTMENT (.2); CORRESPOND WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF ATRS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. GAB REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY'S TAX SALE (.2).				
04/09/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W400	11546938
	CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND M. FISHER REGARDING CLAIMS RECONCILIATION GROUP CALL				
04/09/04	Reifman, Marli	5.80	754.00	W400	11590278
	REVIEW WELLS FARGO BRIEF FOR P. FRIEDMAN (1.3); FILE AND SERVE WELLS FARGO BRIEF (2.5); FILE PPL ADVERSARY COMPLAINT (1.0); FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE FOR WELLS FARGO BRIEF (1.0)				
04/10/04	Davis, Pierre	2.90	1,160.00	W400	11638178
	ULTRA VIRES ERISA RESEARCH.				
04/11/04	Davis, Pierre	2.50	1,000.00	W400	11638184
	ULTRA VIRES ERISA RESEARCH				
04/11/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.20	65.00	W400	11549027
	CONFER WITH G. MITCHEL REGARDING STATUS OF ATRS STIPULATION				
04/12/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.30	151.50	W400	11602201
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL IN INMATE CALLING CLAIM CONCERNING STATE COURT PROCEEDING (0.1); ANALYZE ISSUES REGARDING PETITION IN STATE COURT PROCEEDING AND VIOLATION OF AUTOMATIC STAY (0.2).				
04/12/04	Billeck, Jason	1.90	788.50	W400	11563071
	WORK ON DRAFT NCR STIPULATION (1.3); COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND K. CALDWELL REGARDING CDI STIPULATION (.4); AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING THE D&B STIPULATION (.2).				
04/12/04	Friedman, Peter	7.80	3,198.00	W400	11621746
	REVIEW FACTUAL RECORD IN ABBOTT CLAIMS LITIGATION				
04/12/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W400	11622998

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VOICEMAIL OF D. SIMEONE REGARDING RELIEF FROM STAY/DISCHARGE INJUNCTION.				
04/12/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.10	357.50	W400	11549028
	CORRESPOND WITH S. BAKER AND S. COHEN REGARDING SUBORDINATION ISSUES (.4); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF L. HOLLAND'S CLAIM (.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. POKRZYRVA REGARDING SUN TRUST CENTER'S LATE CLAIM (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIM OBJECTION (.2).				
04/12/04	Watkins, Claire	5.60	1,848.00	W400	11558093
	[ABBOTT] ATTENTION TO SUMMARIZING RUBIO TRANSCRIPT (3.0); REVIEW ADDITIONAL BOXES AND UPDATE INDEX (2.6)				
04/12/04	Grogan, James	3.10	1,131.50	W400	11569955
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. FISHER AND B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF CLASS 6 CLAIMS (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE CHART OF SAME (.3); REVIEW REVISED CLAIM OBJECTION SUMMARIES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISHER, J. SMITH, S. BAKER, AND G. MCMORRIS REGARDING CLAIM OBJECTIONS, EMPLOYMENT RELATED CLAIMS AND OTHER CLAIM RELATED ISSUES (.9); REVIEW SETTLEMENT OFFER TO SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KEYES AND M. MANGOLD REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. MARTINEZ REGARDING SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ AND M. RAY REGARDING EQUIPMENT TRANSFER TO MISSISSIPPI EDNET (.2); CORRESPOND WITH M. HOERNLEIN AND M. FISHER REGARDING PAYROLL CLAIMS (.2).				
04/13/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.10	67.00	W400	11611853
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING THE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM FILED BY INDY RACEWAY				
04/13/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.10	67.00	W400	11611855
	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM M. LAWLESS AND T. TSEKERIDES REGARDING CLAIMS BROUGHT BY BYRD PLAINTIFFS				
04/13/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.20	101.00	W400	11549075
	ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING BYRD CLAIM				
04/13/04	Billeck, Jason	0.30	124.50	W400	11563411
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING CSX STIPULATION AND THE DUN & BRADSTREET STIPULATION.				
04/13/04	Cohen, Scott	0.50	200.00	W400	11568563
	DISCUSSION WITH S. YOUDELMAN REGARDING 510(B) AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE				
04/13/04	Davis, Pierre	1.20	480.00	W400	11637805
	ERISA ULTRA VIRES RESEARCH (.8); MEETING WITH M. JACOBY TO DISCUSS RESULTS OF RESEARCH (.4)				
04/13/04	Friedman, Peter	7.80	3,198.00	W400	11621695
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS IN CONNECTION WITH ABBOTT CLAIMS				
04/13/04	Watkins, Claire	2.00	660.00	W400	11593518
	[ABBOTT] UPDATE INDICES (1.0); ORGANIZE PLEADINGS (1.0)				
04/13/04	Grogan, James	1.80	657.00	W400	11569908

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH J. DAVIS REGARDING IMAGISTICS CLAIM (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. EFROYMSON REGARDING INDY RACING LEAGUE CLAIM (.2); ATTEND TO ADJOURNMENT OF SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. DAVIS REGARDING ADJOURNMENT OF SAME (.1); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ AND M. RAY REGARDING STATUS OF MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING CYPRESS COMMUNICATIONS CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING PAYROLL CLAIM (.1); EXCHANGE CORRESPOND WITH S. RHOADS REGARDING CLAIM ISSUES (.2); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. RHOADS REGARDING CONVENIENCE CLAIMS (.3).				
04/14/04	Strochak, Adam	3.10	1,705.00	W400	11620492
	REVIEW CALIFORNIA CONTRACTS AND SETOFF DEMANDS (0.9); DRAFT SETTLEMENT STIPULATION WITH CALIFORNIA (2.1); E-MAIL TO M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING SAME (0.1)				
04/14/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.30	201.00	W400	11611544
	REVIEW COMMUNICATION FROM T. TSEKERIDES ATTACHING A LETTER FROM THE BYRD PLAINTIFFS REGARDING NEW CASES FILED				
04/14/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.30	151.50	W400	11597654
	REVIEW LETTER FROM PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL IN BYRD RELATED ARTICLE 78 PROCEEDING (0.1); EMAIL TO M. LAWLESS, A. STROCHAK AND A. PEREZ REGARDING LETTER FROM COUNSEL AND STRATEGY (0.2).				
04/14/04	Cohen, Scott	0.20	80.00	W400	11569004
	TELEPHONE CALL D. BABIONE REGARDING CLAIMS				
04/14/04	Friedman, Peter	6.20	2,542.00	W400	11621691
	DRAFT EXTENSION OF TIME STIPULATION RELATED TO ABBOTT CLAIMS LITIGATION AND CONFER WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.8); REVIEW FACTUAL MATERIALS RELATED TO ABBOTT CLAIMS (3); RESEARCH LEGAL ISSUES RELATED TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT CLAIM (1.9); CONFER WITH COUNSEL FOR WORLDCOM IN WORLDACCESS BANKRUPTCY PROCEEDINGS RELATED TO SAME (.5)				
04/14/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.30	1,397.50	W400	11551098
	REVIEW OBJECTION STATUS REPORT PREPARED BY HURON (.3); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING L. HOLLAND'S CLAIM (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. POKRZYRVA REGARDING SUN TRUST CENTER BUILDING'S LATE CLAIM AND CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING SAME (.6); CORRESPOND WITH K. KNIGHT AND R. GARCES REGARDING SANGAMON COUNTY'S SALE IN ERROR ORDER (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH F. MOSS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE, AND CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.5); PREPARE OBJECTION TO ATRS CLAIM (.5); PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (1.5); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING ENTRY OF ATRS STIPULATION (.2).				
04/14/04	Grogan, James	1.90	693.50	W400	11569913
	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. RHOADS REGARDING CONVENIENCE CLAIM SETTLEMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. SHAFFER REGARDING MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. MARTINEZ REGARDING STATUS OF MISSISSIPPI EDNET STIPULATION (.3); ATTEND TO ADJOURNMENT OF INDY RACING LEAGUE ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM MOTION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH D. BABIONE AND S. BENTON REGARDING LIEBERT CLAIMS (.1); CORRESPOND WITH R. KOPPEL REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF REJECTION DAMAGES CLAIMS AND REVIEW FILE DOCUMENTS PERTAINING TO SAME (.4).				
04/15/04	Hickerson, David	0.80	464.00	W400	11572319
	CONFERENCE WITH L. SNOW (HURON) (0.4); ANALYSIS REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (0.4).				
04/15/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.30	151.50	W400	11596902

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
ATTENTION TO ISSUES REGARDING BYRD CLAIM AND STATE COURT ACTION					
04/15/04	Billeck, Jason	0.60	249.00	W400	11563057
COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS AND A. COSTA REGARDING RMS, CRX, THE WEATHER CHANNEL AND NCR STIPULATIONS/NEGOTIATIONS.					
04/15/04	Cohen, Scott	0.30	120.00	W400	11568403
TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. BABIONE REGARDING CLAIMS					
04/15/04	Friedman, Peter	8.60	3,526.00	W400	11621748
DRAFT AND REVISE SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF ON ABBOTT CLAIMS LITIGATION					
04/15/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	4.10	1,332.50	W400	11556631
CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING REVISIONS TO ERS STIPULATION AND REVIEW PROPOSED LANGUAGE (.3); REVIEW PROPOSED REVISIONS TO NOTEHOLDER STIPULATION (.2) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. ACKER REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING ATRS RESPONSE (.3); REVIEW LOWE ENTERPRISE ORDER REGARDING LATE CLAIM (.2); PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (2.5); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.2).					
04/15/04	Watkins, Claire	7.40	2,442.00	W400	11595090
[ABBOTT] REVIEW BOXES FOR INVOICES (4.9); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. SNOW, P. FRIEDMAN AND D. HICKERSON REGARDING INVOICES (.9); DRAFT E-MAIL TO P. FRIEDMAN REGARDING OFFSETS (.3); REVIEW SIMPSON THATCHER MEMORANDUM (1.3)					
04/15/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W400	11571749
EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH M. FISHER REGARDING CALL ON CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION					
04/16/04	Hickerson, David	1.50	870.00	W400	11572328
ANALYSIS REGARDING SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (0.5); REVIEW OUTLINE OF MOTION (1.0).					
04/16/04	Perez, Alfredo	1.40	938.00	W400	11612524
REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO CLAIMS WITH D. LEWIS AND B. BENJET (.80), VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN, J. FRIEDMAN, S. PARKER, J. TROFIMUK AND M. BEACH REGARDING QWEST TLA'S (.60)					
04/16/04	Tsekerides, Theodore	0.40	202.00	W400	11597001
CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. LAWLESS AND T. EPSTEIN REGARDING BYRD CLAIM					
04/16/04	Billeck, Jason	0.40	166.00	W400	11563051
COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING THE CSX AND WEATHER CHANNEL SETOFF CLAIMS.					
04/16/04	Cohen, Scott	0.40	160.00	W400	11568780
TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. TROSPER REGARDING REJECTION DAMAGES & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE					
04/16/04	Friedman, Peter	6.50	2,665.00	W400	11621749
REVIEW AND REVISE ABBOTT CLAIMS SUMMARY JUDGMENT BRIEF					
04/16/04	Graham, Richard	0.10	37.00	W400	11623055
DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO H. RUMELD REGARDING WHITTAKER DISCOVERY.					

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CORRESPOND WITH H. MORRIS REGARDING PROPOSED REVISIONS TO ERS STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING NOTICE TO SUNTRUST CENTER AND REVIEW DOCUMENTATION REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH L. RICHARD REGARDING DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION (.2); CORRESPOND WITH R. SARUBI REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING STATUS OF CLAIMS SUBJECT TO 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (.2).	1.10	357.50	W400	11556633
04/16/04	Watkins, Claire [ABBOTT] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BRIODY REGARDING PRODUCTION (.5); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH P. FRIEDMAN AND D. HICKERSON REGARDING STATUS AND DECLARATIONS (.8)	1.30	429.00	W400	11593522
04/16/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH D. BABIONE REGARDING TRANSFERRED CLAIMS (.1); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. GOLDRING REGARDING PAYROLL CLAIM ISSUES (.1).	0.20	73.00	W400	11571753
04/19/04	Strochak, Adam PHONE CALL FROM M. LAWLESS (MCI) REGARDING BROWN UNIVERSITY CLAIM (0.4); PHONE CALL TO M. FISHER (HURON) REGARDING CLAIMS SUBJECT TO GARNISHMENT (0.5); E-MAILS AND PHONE CALLS TO/FROM C. MARCUS REGARDING CLASS 3A DISTRIBUTIONS TO BANKS (0.5); REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLEADINGS ON ABBOTT CLAIMS LITIGATION IN PREPARATION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION (2.5)	3.90	2,145.00	W400	11623133
04/19/04	Billeck, Jason COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. LAWLESS REGARDING STIPULATIONS FOR CSX, RMS, AND NCR.	0.60	249.00	W400	11585600
04/19/04	Cohen, Scott CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING NEON	0.10	40.00	W400	11569352
04/19/04	Hurson, Daniel REVIEW BOXES OF DOCUMENTS FOR TELECOM COMPANY INVOICES SENT TO WORLDCOM (1.5). DRAFT NOTES ON FINDINGS (0.1).	1.60	528.00	W400	11613935
04/19/04	Graham, Richard REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL TO FROM C. BAILEY REGARDING WHITTAKER DISCOVERY.	0.40	148.00	W400	11623071
04/19/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. STRAIN REGARDING DOUGLAS COUNTY STIPULATION AND TRANSMIT SAME (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FRUKTER REGARDING HSBC DISTRIBUTION UNDER THE PLAN (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW DOCKET UPDATES (.2); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM D. POKZRVA REGARDING SUNTRUST CENTER'S CLAIM AND CORRESPOND WITH G. TOTH REGARDING SAME (.4); CORRESPOND WITH E. FAMATID REGARDING SAME (.2); CONDUCT DILIGENCE ON CLAIMS IDENTIFIED BY B. DAVIS AND CORRESPOND WITH B. DAVIS REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. RUSSE REGARDING VOLUSIA COUNTY STIPULATION AND TRANSMIT SAME (.3); PREPARE MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF 14TH OMNIBUS OBJECTION (2.0).	4.70	1,527.50	W400	11562097
04/19/04	Watkins, Claire [ABBOTT] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. SNOW REGARDING ANALYSIS (1.5); REVIEW NEW BOXES FROM SIMPSON THATCHER AND INDEX CONTENTS (5.3)	6.80	2,244.00	W400	11593330
04/19/04	Taylor, David (ABBOTT CLAIM) CONTINUE DOCUMENT REVIEW.	3.10	899.00	W400	11589667

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/19/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH A. STROCHAK AND M. FISHER REGARDING JP MORGAN CLAIMS (.3); CORRESPOND WITH D. HARTIE AND REVIEW PRODUCTION FROM D. HARTIE REGARDING PSP CONVENIENCE CLAIMS (.3).	0.60	219.00	W400	11571912
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W400 - CLAIMS RESOLUTION & ADMINISTRATION:		294.70	\$ 117,063.00		
04/01/04	Allerhand, Joseph CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF ERISA CASE.	0.50	367.50	W420	11540672
04/01/04	Watkins, Claire [AUDIOFAX] E-MAIL N. BYNUM REGARDING SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. BYNUM REGARDING SAME (1.1); [GRAYSON] READ TARIFF INFORMATION (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. GOULD REGARDING OBJECTION (.5); EDIT OBJECTION TO REFLECT GOULD'S COMMENTS (1.0) [ABBOTT] TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. BROADY REGARDING BOXES (.5); ATTENTION TO COMPLAINT (.6)	6.20	2,046.00	W420	11558172
04/01/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	3.60	1,440.00	W420	11534991
04/02/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSION (.6); REVIEW PLEADINGS AND SUPPLEMENTAL AUTHORITIES (.6) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH J. ALLERHAND, P. FERRILLO AND D. STEUBER REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES AND STRATEGY FOR PENDING BANKRUPTCY COURT PROCEEDING (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD AND J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STRATEGY (.6)	3.20	1,984.00	W420	11628984
04/02/04	Allerhand, Joseph CONFERENCE CALLS WITH P. CURNIN, M. JACOBY AND H. RUMELD REGARDING ERISA SETTLEMENT.	1.50	1,102.50	W420	11540519
04/02/04	Braun, Lynda READ AND REVIEW MOTION PAPERS	0.80	396.00	W420	11595114
04/02/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	7.10	2,840.00	W420	11534979
04/05/04	Jacoby, Mark MEETING WITH C. LEE REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION AND DOCUMENTS PRODUCTION (1.0); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM ANTOINETTE DECAMP AT GIBSON DUNN REGARDING COMMUNICATIONS BETWEEN ML AND S. DIXON REGARDING DESIGNATION OF CERTAIN DOCUMENTS TO BE PRIVILEGED (.4); REVIEW ML DOCUMENTS (.1) AND OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING RESEARCH TO DETERMINE SCOPE OF AGENT'S CLAIM OF PRIVILEGE (.5); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SECOND CIRCUIT POSITION ON BAR ORDERS (.2)	2.20	1,364.00	W420	11629824
04/05/04	Davis, Pierre CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. BARRETO REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS (.7); CONTINUE REVIEW OF BACKGROUND MATERIALS (5.5); DISCUSS AND REVIEW ATTY/EXPERT RESEARCH WITH J. FRIEDMANN (2.0)	8.20	3,280.00	W420	11638202
04/05/04	Lee, Caroline TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. DIXON REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES (.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. MURPHY AT SIMPSON THACHER REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES (.2)	0.30	120.00	W420	11534910

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/05/04	Lee, Caroline DISCUSS DISCOVERY ISSUES WITH M. JACOBY.	1.00	400.00	W420	11534900
04/05/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	4.20	1,680.00	W420	11534984
04/06/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. KING REGARDING DISCOVERY FOLLOW-UP (.8); REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. LEWIS REGARDING DEPOSITION OF S. DIXON AND FORWARD TO TEAM (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING SAME (.7)	2.50	1,550.00	W420	11627068
04/06/04	Davis, Pierre CALL WITH SNDY INTERPRETER'S OFFICE (.5); REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE (.5); CALL J. FINCHER AT LAZARD REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS (.6); RESEARCH BARETTO VISA ISSUE (3.7); DRAFT LETTER TO U.S. EMBASSY IN SAO PAULO (1.0); CONFER WITH L. BRAUN REGARDING ATTY AS EXPERT ISSUE (.4)	6.70	2,680.00	W420	11638203
04/06/04	Lee, Caroline CORRESPOND WITH S. DIXON REGARDING DISCOVERY ISSUES AND CONFERENCE CALL.	0.30	120.00	W420	11534784
04/06/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	4.90	1,960.00	W420	11534810
04/07/04	Jacoby, Mark OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. DIXON AND C. LEE REGARDING REVIEW OF PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. CURNIN AND J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STATUS OF SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.6); RESEARCH/REVIEW CASE REGARDING HEALTHSOUTH CORP. INSURANCE LITIGATION (2.5); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE J.LOUIS REGARDING S.DIXON DEPOSITION (.2); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.2)	4.50	2,790.00	W420	11627429
04/07/04	Allerhand, Joseph CONFERENCE CALLS WITH P. CURNIN AND M. JACOBY REGARDING ERISA SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS.	0.30	220.50	W420	11540562
04/07/04	Davis, Pierre REVIEW DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING FOR BARRETTO DIRECT OL	6.10	2,440.00	W420	11638211
04/07/04	Lee, Caroline DRAFT SUPPLEMENT TO PRIVILEGE LOGS.	1.00	400.00	W420	11555413
04/07/04	Lee, Caroline CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. DIXON AND M. JACOBY REGARDING PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.	1.20	480.00	W420	11555412
04/07/04	Lee, Caroline REVIEW DOCUMENTS FROM MERRILL LYNCH FOR PRIVILEGE.	3.10	1,240.00	W420	11556177
04/08/04	Jacoby, Mark	5.80	3,596.00	W420	11626796

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING STATUS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE LYNN SARCO'S OFFICE REGARDING SCHEDULING (.3); MEETING PIERRE DAVIS CONCERNING RESEARCH REGARDING LIABILITY ISSUES (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. STUEBER, P. FERRILLO AND J. ALLERHAND REGARDING INSURANCE ISSUES (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. DIXON AND C.LEE REGARDING REVIEW OF PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS (.7) REVIEW GLOBAL CROSSING STIPULATION OF SETTLEMENT (1.0); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SUPPLEMENT TO PRIVILEGE LOGS (.3); REVIEW AND COLLATE PRIVILEGE/NON-PRIVILEGE DOCUMENTS (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. WALSH REGARDING GLOBAL CROSSING ERISA SETTLEMENT.				
04/08/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.00	735.00	W420	11541148
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH OPPOSING COUNSEL REGARDING SETTLEMENT OF ERISA CLAIMS (.6); DISCUSSED SAME WITH M. JACOBY AND P. FERRILLO (.4)				
04/08/04	Lee, Caroline	5.50	2,200.00	W420	11555410
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.				
04/09/04	Jacoby, Mark	6.50	4,030.00	W420	11626394
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. LEE AND MEETING REGARDING S. DIXON SUBPOENA AND PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS (1.0); E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REVIEW OF PRIVILEGE LOGS AND PLAINTIFFS ASSERTIONS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS/FILES REGARDING SAME (2.0); REVIEW AND FINALIZE LETTER TO JEFFREY LEWIS REGARDING SHARON DIXON AND WITHHOLDING OF PRIVILEGED DOCUMENTS AND PRIVILEGE LOGS (.7); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. BAER REGARDING ENRON 510(B) PROCEEDING (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH LOUDEN REGARDING SAME (.4); REVIEW PLEADINGS FILED IN ENRON 510(B) PROCEEDING AND DISTRIBUTE SAME TO TEAM AND CLIENT (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING ENRON 510(B) PROCEEDING AND IMPLICATIONS FOR WORLDCOM CASE (.6)				
04/09/04	Davis, Pierre	4.10	1,640.00	W420	11638163
	ULTRA VIRES ERISA RESEARCH FOR M. JACOBY				
04/09/04	Lee, Caroline	0.50	200.00	W420	11556113
	DISCUSS PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES WITH M. JACOBY.				
04/09/04	Lee, Caroline	1.00	400.00	W420	11555341
	DRAFT LETTER TO PLAINTIFFS' COUNSEL REGARDING SUPPLEMENT TO PRIVILEGE LOG.				
04/09/04	Lee, Caroline	4.00	1,600.00	W420	11555833
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.				
04/12/04	Jacoby, Mark	3.20	1,984.00	W420	11626324
	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. YOUDELMAN AND L. BAER REGARDING SECTION 510(B) ISSUES IN LIGHT OF ENRON CASE (.5); REVIEW 4/9 LETTER FROM J. CANNY TO G. GOTTO REGARDING DIXON SUBPOENA AND DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING STATUS SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS AND 510(B) ISSUES (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SAME (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATION STRATEGY (.8); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH P. DAVIS REGARDING RESEARCH CONCERNING LIABILITY ISSUES (.3); REVIEW RESEARCH MATERIALS REGARDING LIABILITY ISSUES (.2)				
04/12/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.10	808.50	W420	11545586
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. STROCHAK REGARDING KPMG MOTION AND ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY REGARDING ERISA CASES (.2); MEETING WITH M. JACOBY AND S. YOUDELMAN TO DISCUSS ERISA ISSUES (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING SAME (.3)				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/12/04	Davis, Pierre CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. BARRETTO, S. HIRSCH, B. METGE REGARDING ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS	1.00	400.00	W420	11637792
04/12/04	Davis, Pierre ERISA ULTRA VIRES RESEARCH	9.00	3,600.00	W420	11637791
04/12/04	Wilbur, Ian RESEARCHED ISSUES RELATING TO THE ASSERTION OF THE ATTORNEY CLIENT PRIVILEGE BY A THIRD PARTY OF THE CLIENT.	4.30	1,182.50	W420	11583964
04/13/04	Jacoby, Mark REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING P. CURNIN CONCERNING INSURANCE SETTLEMENT (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.2)	0.40	248.00	W420	11626335
04/13/04	Allerhand, Joseph MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND G. DANILOW REGARDING R. BREEDEN ISSUES (DEBT/EQUITY DISTRIBUTORS).	1.20	882.00	W420	11548481
04/13/04	Davis, Pierre DOCUMENT ORGANIZATION MEETING WITH J. FRIEDMAN (1.0); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ENTIRE INSIDE AND OUTSIDE TEAM (.8)	1.80	720.00	W420	11637807
04/13/04	Graham, Richard TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. JACOBY REGARDING ERISA (.1); ASSEMBLE AND SEND HIM ERISA SUBORDINATION RESEARCH MATERIALS (.2).	0.30	111.00	W420	11623022
04/13/04	Wilbur, Ian CONDUCTED RESEARCH REGARDING THE ABILITY OF PENSION PLAN TRUSTEE TO ASSERT PLAN ADMINISTRATOR'S ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE.	2.40	660.00	W420	11584498
04/14/04	Jacoby, Mark TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. BLANKENSTEIN REGARDING INFORMATION REQUESTS FOR EXPERTS (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH H. RUMELD, WITH J. ALLERHAND AND P. FERRILLO REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS (.8); FURTHER TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING INFORMATION REQUESTS (.5); RESEARCH ON BAR ORDERS IN PARTIAL SETTLEMENTS (1.1)	3.50	2,170.00	W420	11626919
04/14/04	Allerhand, Joseph DISCUSSED D&O ERISA ISSUES WITH M. JACOBY (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. FERRILLO REGARDING SAME (.3)	1.00	735.00	W420	11553449
04/14/04	Strochak, Adam REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT STIPULATED FACTS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION IN DUANE WEST ADVERSARY PROCEEDING	0.50	275.00	W420	11620426
04/14/04	Davis, Pierre ATTENTION TO BARRETTO DEP OL (2.0); CALLS REGARDING INTERPRETER AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME (1.0); LOA WITH INTERPRETER (1.5); CONFER WITH J. FRIEDMANN REGARDING DOCUMENT COLLECTION (1.0)	5.50	2,200.00	W420	11637818
04/14/04	Lee, Caroline	0.30	120.00	W420	11579042

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSS PRIVILEGE RESEARCH ISSUES WITH I. WILBUR.				
04/15/04	Jacoby, Mark	1.50	930.00	W420	11625963
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.4); CONFERENCE CALL CAROL PETRON, ET AL., REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH G. GOTO AND L. SARCO REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. LEWIS REGARDING S. DIXON DEPOSITION (.3)				
04/15/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.80	1,323.00	W420	11602856
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH ALL COUNSEL AND CLIENTS REGARDING ERISA SETTLEMENT (.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL FOR PLAINTIFF (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. JACOBY REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.4); DRAFTING E-MAIL REGARDING SETTLEMENT (.5)				
04/15/04	Davis, Pierre	4.30	1,720.00	W420	11637829
	ATTENTION TO ERISA CLAIMS				
04/16/04	Jacoby, Mark	3.50	2,170.00	W420	11626894
	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING PROPOSED DATES FOR DEPOSITION OF S. DIXON (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH H. RUMELD REGARDING ML INFORMATION REQUESTS (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. LEE REGARDING REVIEW OF ML DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR TOM ECKERT DEPOSITION (.4) AND MEETING WITH IAN WILBUR REGARDING RESEARCH ON SCOPE OF PRIVILEGE CLAIM BY AGENT OF PRINCIPAL (.6); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE J. ALLERHAND REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS AND SECTION 540(B) ISSUES (.5)				
04/16/04	Allerhand, Joseph	1.50	1,102.50	W420	11601131
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH H. RUMELD (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH ERISA PLAINTIFF COUNSEL (.6); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH INSURERS' COUNSEL (.3)				
04/16/04	Davis, Pierre	4.10	1,640.00	W420	11637834
	BARRETTO DIRECT OL				
04/16/04	Lee, Caroline	0.60	240.00	W420	11578999
	DISCUSS PRIVILEGE RESEARCH ISSUES WITH M. JACOBY AND I. WILBUR.				
04/16/04	Lee, Caroline	5.70	2,280.00	W420	11579034
	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO PRIVILEGE LOG ISSUES.				
04/16/04	Wilbur, Ian	2.70	742.50	W420	11584610
	RESEARCHED WHETHER SHARING COMMUNICATIONS WITH TRUSTEE DESTROYS THE ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE OF THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR (2.1); MET WITH M. JACOBY AND C. LEE TO DISCUSS FINDINGS OF RESEARCH AND DEVELOP PLAN FOR CREATION OF A PRIVILEGE LOG (0.6).				
04/19/04	Allerhand, Joseph	2.00	1,470.00	W420	11602956
	CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING ERISA LITIGATION AND SETTLEMENT WITH CLIENTS, CO-COUNSEL (1.5) AND MEETING WITH M. JACOBY REGARDING SAME (.5)				
04/19/04	Strochak, Adam	0.40	220.00	W420	11623097
	REVIEW DECISION OF JUDGE BATTLE IN SNUG LITIGATION RELATING TO ADVERSARY PROCEEDING (0.3); E-MAIL TO M. SHAIKEN (STINSON MORRISON) REGARDING SMAE (0.1)				
04/19/04	Wilbur, Ian	4.60	1,265.00	W420	11583669

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
RESEARCHED ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE AND REVIEWED LEGAL CASES AND TREATISES (4.1); DRAFTED INSERT REGARDING ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGE FOR USE IN LETTER TO ERISA TRUSTEE (0.5).					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W420 - ADVERSARY PROCEEDINGS:		166.00	\$ 76,500.50		
04/02/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.10	37.00	W430	11587429
REVIEW PLEADINGS FROM MOTION TO APPOINT COMMITTEE AT REQUEST OF J. FINK REGARDING INFORMATION PERTINENT TO MOTION TO DISQUALIFY KPMG.					
04/06/04	Berkovich, Ronit	0.20	74.00	W430	11587822
REVIEW E-MAIL FROM O.FRIEDMANN (WORLDCOM) REGARDING IMPROPER MARKETING OF MCI PRODUCTS AND E-MAIL TO B. BENJET (WORLDCOM) REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH A. STROCHAK AND J. FINK REGARDING PROFESSIONALS RETAINED POST- EFFECTIVE DATE (.1).					
04/12/04	Billeck, Jason	0.30	124.50	W430	11563391
COMMUNICATIONS WITH R. BRUNO AND B. RODRIGUES REGARDING THIRD CIRCUIT NOTICE TO STAMPONE REGARDING COSTS (.2) AND READ NOTICE (.1).					
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W430 - NON BANKRUPTCY LITIGATION:		0.60	\$ 235.50		
04/01/04	Gold, Simeon	0.30	220.50	W440	11531257
CONFERENCES WITH F. GREEN REGARDING POTENTIAL TRANSACTION.					
04/01/04	Gold, Simeon	2.90	2,131.50	W440	11531256
REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING EMERGENCE TASKS, INCLUDING REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER AND BY-LAWS (1.2); TELECONFERENCES WITH LUCA PICONE (ITALIAN COUNSEL) AND N. JONES (.7) AND REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS (1.0) REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES (.7)					
04/01/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.70	542.50	W440	11667215
REVIEW BOARD MATERIALS					
04/01/04	Green, Frederick	1.10	852.50	W440	11611296
CHANGES TO CHEWABLE FEATURE OF PLAN (.3); REVISIONS TO LAZARD SECTION OF BOARD PACKAGE (.5) CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLD REGARDING MCI TRANSACTION (.3)					
04/01/04	Green, Frederick	2.80	2,170.00	W440	11611254
EMBRATEL - REVIEW BOARD MATERIALS (2.0); INTERNAL CONFERENCE REGARDING LITIGATION STRATEGIES (.8)					
04/01/04	Cooper, Bethany	4.50	1,912.50	W440	11609327
REVIEW LAZARD'S RIGHTS PLAN PRESENTATION (1.0); WORK WITH BONY ON DRS (2.0) REVIEW QUESTIONNAIRE (1.0) AND TRANSACTION ADVICE (.5)					
04/02/04	Gold, Simeon	4.40	3,234.00	W440	11531262

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	MANY CONFERENCES WITH D. HOLZMAN (.5) TELECONFERENCES WITH L. PICONE (ITALIAN COUNSEL) (.5) CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES AND D. HOLZMAN (.5) AND REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS (.6) REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES; REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED DRAFT OF CLOSING DOCUMENT CHECKLIST (.8) AND CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER (.4) REGARDING SAME; WORK WITH B. COOPER AND S. GOLDRING ON DTC/TRANSFER RESTRICTION ISSUES (0.3); V-MAIL FROM (.1) AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH PARKS (AKIN), B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN (.7) REGARDING AKIN COMMENTS ON MCI CHARTER AND BY-LAWS				
04/02/04	Cooper, Bethany	3.70	1,572.50	W440	11609938
	CONVERSATIONS WITH DTC REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (.7); CALL WITH AKIN GUMP REGARDING STATUS (.8); DRAFTING DRS ADVICE/CONFIRM (2.2)				
04/05/04	Gold, Simeon	5.80	4,263.00	W440	11534866
	WORK WITH PICONE (ITALIAN COUNSEL) AND D. HOLZMAN ON LETTER TO CONSOB REGARDING ELECTION AND BRIEFED JONES REGARDING SAME (1.3); COMPLETED MY REVIEW OF JONES' DRAFTS OF CLIENT'S SEC DOCUMENTS (2.7); PREPARATION, ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (.8), AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN (.5) REGARDING SAME; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN (.3) AND REVIEWED VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING SUBSIDIARY MERGERS, ETC. (0.2).				
04/05/04	Green, Frederick	1.80	1,395.00	W440	11611483
	REVIEW LAZARD BOARD BOOKS - COMMENTS TO LAZARD (1.4); UPDATE PILL SUMMARY (.4)				
04/06/04	Gold, Simeon	0.20	147.00	W440	11535064
	CONFERENCE WITH F. GREEN REGARDING TRANSACTION.				
04/06/04	Gold, Simeon	3.90	2,866.50	W440	11535029
	WORK ON WG&M COMMENTS TO JONES' DRAFTS OF CLIENT'S SEC DOCUMENTS (1.8); REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES (0.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCGAREY REGARDING NASDAQ LISTING ISSUES (0.2); PREPARATION, CONFERENCE CALL WITH JONES ET AL (1.0) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH LIBRETTA REGARDING SUBSIDIARY MERGERS (.3).				
04/06/04	Cooper, Bethany	6.20	2,635.00	W440	11610456
	COORDINATE AND DISTRIBUTE COMMENTS TO 10-K/10-QS.				
04/07/04	Gold, Simeon	4.10	3,013.50	W440	11541875
	CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING HER REVISION OF CLOSING DOCUMENT CHECKLIST FOR EMERGENCE TEAM (0.6); ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (.7) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING EMERGENCE TASKS, ETC. (.5); REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES (0.5); REVIEWED WG&M COMMENTS ON CLIENT'S SEC DOCUMENTS (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING ELECTION/TAX ISSUES (0.3); BRIEFED F. GREEN REGARDING ABOVE (0.1); TRADED V-MAILS WITH GANZ (GEORGIA COUNSEL) REGARDING GEORGIA-DELAWARE REINCORPORATION (0.2).				
04/08/04	Gold, Simeon	2.40	1,764.00	W440	11546037
	WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON CONSOB ISSUES (0.6); REVIEWED SKARDA'S MATERIALS REGARDING MCI'S DISCLOSURE OF CONSOLIDATION, ETC. (1.2); REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING TAX/TRANSFER RESTRICTION ISSUES (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING NASDAQ AND ISSUES REGARDING MCI CHARTER AND BY-LAWS (0.3).				
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W440	11634946
	MEETING REGARDING STRATEGY WITH S. KELLY, M. CAPELLAS.				
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	4.00	3,100.00	W440	11634460
	MEETING WITH S. KELLY, M. CAPELLAS, T. SAVAGE AND ATTEND BY PHONE MCI BOARD MEETING.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/08/04	Fife, Lori MEETINGS WITH M. CAPELLAS, S. KELLY, BLAKLEY, T. SAVAGE, GRAFSTEIN, M. GOLDSTEIN, F. GREEN REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES.	1.40	1,001.00	W440	11614910
04/08/04	Cooper, Bethany DRS-REVIEW Q&A AND TRANSACTION ADVICE (2.0); COORDINATION OF BOARD MEETING/CLOSING (1.3)	3.30	1,402.50	W440	11608050
04/09/04	Gold, Simeon CONFERENCES WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES (0.8); REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING TAX/TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (0.3); REVIEWED B. COOPER'S REVISED CLOSING DOCUMENT CHECKLIST (0.7); TRADED E-MAILS WITH F. GREEN AND M. SKARDA REGARDING FORM 10-K DISCLOSURES OF INDUSTRY CONSOLIDATION, ETC. (0.3).	2.10	1,543.50	W440	11545881
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY, L. FIFE REGARDING BOARD MEETING (1.0) AND ATTEND BOARD MEETING BY PHONE (2.5)	3.50	2,712.50	W440	11634961
04/09/04	Green, Frederick ATTEND BOARD MEETING (2.0); ADDRESS DISCLOSURE CONSIDERATIONS & RIGHTS PLAN & EMBRATEL STATUS (2.9)	4.90	3,797.50	W440	11615286
04/09/04	Fife, Lori PARTICIPATE IN BOARD MEETING.	1.60	1,144.00	W440	11615791
04/09/04	Cooper, Bethany UPDATE EMERGENCE CHECKLIST AND DISTRIBUTE (1.5); DRAFT CAPITALIZATION TABLE (2.0)	3.50	1,487.50	W440	11609720
04/12/04	Gold, Simeon WORK ON CONSOB ISSUES WITH N. JONES, PICONE, M. GOLDSTEIN, F. GREEN AND D. HOLZMAN (0.8); REVIEWED JONES' REVISED DRAFT OF CLIENT'S 2003 FORM 10-K AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JONES REGARDING SAME (2.2); TELECONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND B. COOPER REGARDING STATUS OF EMERGENCE TASKS, ETC (1.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. CHASTKA AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING TAX/ELECTION/TRANSFER RESTRICTION ISSUES (0.3); REVIEWED GREEN'S DRAFT OF "INDUSTRY CONSOLIDATION" DISCLOSURE (0.1); CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCGAREY AND B. COOPER REGARDING NASDAQ ISSUES REGARDING MCI CHARTER/BY-LAWS (0.4); CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. GIETZ AND B. COOPER REGARDING MCI POISON PILL (0.3).	5.90	4,336.50	W440	11547872
04/12/04	Cooper, Bethany COORDINATION OF COMMENTS TO REVISED 10-K (1.9); CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION (ISSUE REGARDING TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS) (1.9); INTERNAL EMERGENCE MEETING (1.9); REVIEW ITEMS FOR EMERGENCE (1.9)	7.60	3,230.00	W440	11610330
04/13/04	Gold, Simeon PREPARATION AND ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING CLOSING PREPARATIONS (1.3); FOLLOW-UP WITH D. HOLZMAN, B. COOPER AND S. COHEN ON GEORGIA-DELAWARE MERGER TIMING, CAPITALIZATION TABLE FOR NASDAQ, FINAL REVISIONS TO MCI CHARTER AND BY-LAWS, ETC. (1.7); CALLED PICONE (ITALIAN COUNSEL) (.3) AND REVIEWED WG&M OPINION LETTER (.2) REGARDING CONSOB ISSUES	3.50	2,572.50	W440	11549348
04/13/04	Green, Frederick NOL ELECTION MEMORANDUM REVIEW (.4); REVIEW DEAL ISSUES (2.7)	3.10	2,402.50	W440	11612069
04/13/04	Cooper, Bethany	5.00	2,125.00	W440	11610352

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COORDINATE COMMENTS TO REVISED 10-K				
04/14/04	Gold, Simeon	3.10	2,278.50	W440	11555122
	PREPARATION FOR 4/15 EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN (0.9); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON WG&M LETTER TO CONSOB (0.3); WORK WITH S. COHEN AND B. COOPER ON MCI CAPITALIZATION TABLE FOR NASDAQ (0.8); REVIEWED YOON'S MARK-UP OF DIP DESCRIPTION IN FORM 10-K (1.1).				
04/14/04	Cooper, Bethany	5.20	2,210.00	W440	11610676
	COORDINATION REGARDING CLOSING (3.1); CALL WITH C. DIXON AND BONY REGARDING DRS (QUESTIONNAIRE AND TRANSACTION ADVICE) AND FOLLOW-UP (.8); CAPITALIZATION TABLE (DRAFT AND DISTRIBUTE) (1.3)				
04/15/04	Gold, Simeon	3.80	2,793.00	W440	11555134
	REVIEWED AND EDITED S. KELLY'S CLOSING CHECKLIST (.4) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO VARIOUS E-MAILS REGARDING SUBSIDIARY MERGERS (0.6); TELECONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, D. HOLZMAN AND N. JONES REGARDING STOPPAGE OF TRADING IN OLD SECURITIES (0.6); PREPARATION (.2) ATTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (1.0) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH B. COOPER AND D. HOLZMAN REGARDING EMERGENCE TASKS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES (.1) AND CONFERENCE WITH H. DICKER AND B. COOPER REGARDING POISON PILL MECHANICS (0.2)				
04/15/04	Cooper, Bethany	8.40	3,570.00	W440	11608805
	EMERGENCE CALL (.7); COORDINATION OF CLOSING/SIGNATURE PAGES (2.7); ATTENTION TO CAPITALIZATION TABLE (2.0); REVIEW RIGHTS PLAN (3.0)				
04/15/04	Rao, Vijayendra	5.00	650.00	W440	11562585
	MADE FOLDERS AND PREPARED FOR CLOSING.				
04/16/04	Gold, Simeon	4.70	3,454.50	W440	11563118
	FOLLOW-UP WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE AND S. COHEN REGARDING MATLIN-SILVERLAKE RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (0.8); PREPARATION (.2) ATTENDED EXTENDED EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (1.0) AND FOLLOW-UP REGARDING EMERGENCE TASKS (.5); WORK WITH D. HOLZMAN ON SUBSIDIARY MERGERS (0.6); TRADED E-MAILS WITH N. JONES, S. GOLDRING ET AL. REGARDING TAX TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS IN MCI CHARTER (0.6); COORDINATED WITH GEORGIA COUNSEL AND DELAWARE SERVICE COMPANY REGARDING PARENT INCORPORATION MERGER (0.6); GAVE INTERVIEW TO C. STERN OF WASHINGTON POST REGARDING EMERGENCE LEGAL WORK (0.4).				
04/16/04	Green, Frederick	2.10	1,627.50	W440	11611848
	MEMORANDUM FOR BOARD (1.0); RIGHTS PLAN REVISIONS (1.1)				
04/16/04	Cooper, Bethany	10.50	4,462.50	W440	11609450
	RIGHTS PLAN-DISCUSSION WITH DELAWARE COUNSEL AND REVISIONS TO DOCUMENTS (DELETION OF SUMMARY OF RIGHTS) (1.9); EMERGENCE CALL (1.2); REVIEW OF 8-A (3.1); COORDINATION OF PRINTING 10-K (.4); DRAFTING DRS ADVICE AND DISCUSSIONS WITH BONY (3.1); PRE-CLOSING COORDINATION (.8)				
04/17/04	Gold, Simeon	1.50	1,102.50	W440	11563124
	REVIEWED AND RESPONDED TO MANY E-MAILS REGARDING TAX TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS, CERBERUS REGISTRATION RIGHTS, SUBSIDIARY MERGERS AND OTHER EMERGENCE TASKS (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING SAME (0.3).				
04/18/04	Cohen, Scott	0.90	360.00	W440	11568783
	DRAFT RAKOFF AFFIDAVIT				
04/18/04	Cooper, Bethany	0.50	212.50	W440	11609457

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	COORDINATION OF PRINTING OF 10-K.				
04/19/04	Gold, Simeon	4.90	3,601.50	W440	11569936
	PRE-CLOSED EMERGENCE WITH JONES, MCGAREY, M. MEROLA, A. YOON, D. HOLZMAN AND B. COOPER (2.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH N. JONES, S. KELLY, D. RICHARDS ET AL AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING TAX/TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (1.2); FINALIZED MCI CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION WITH MCGAREY AND B. COOPER (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. JONES REGARDING NOTE ROUNDING ISSUE (0.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COOPER REGARDING MCI POISON PILL (0.3).				
04/19/04	Cooper, Bethany	8.60	3,655.00	W440	11609482
	PRE-CLOSING-REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS (3.0); COORDINATION (1.1); COORDINATION REGARDING PAYMENT OF FEE FOR MERGER CERTIFICATE (2.0) CONFERENCES WITH WGM REGARDING SAME (1.5) CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING SAME (1.0)				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W440 - CORPORATE GOVERNANCE/BOARD:		154.40	\$ 90,327.50		
04/01/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W460	11526170
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. HOLZMAN REGARDING FILING OF THE CONSOB MOTION, EXECUTION OF SAME AND ENFORCEMENT ACTION FILED BY THE ITALIAN GOVERNMENT				
04/08/04	Fife, Lori	0.70	500.50	W460	11614895
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, FCC, D. PEARLSTEIN, S. GOLDRING REGARDING LICENSE ISSUES.				
04/09/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.30	232.50	W460	11635180
	CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING FCC ISSUES.				
04/09/04	Fife, Lori	1.80	1,287.00	W460	11615822
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH S. GOLDRING, WORLDCOM AND D. PEARLSTEIN REGARDING FCC ISSUES.				
04/09/04	Rafferty, Joe	1.90	361.00	W460	11636468
	CONFERENCES WITH D. PEARLSTEIN ET AL REGARDING HSR REVIEW (1.0); PREPARE DOCUMENTS (.5) REGARDING HSR REVIEW (.4)				
04/11/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W460	11635925
	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING FCC TALKING POINTS AND LETTER.				
04/13/04	Pearlstein, Debra	1.10	737.00	W460	11606019
	REVIEW EMAIL REGARDING FCC SUBMISSION (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CARSO COUNSEL REGARDING SAME (.9)				
04/16/04	Pearlstein, Debra	0.30	201.00	W460	11606611
	EMAILS FCC COUNSEL REGARDING LETTERS REGARDING CARSO OWNERSHIP STRUCTURE				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W460 - GOVERNMENTAL/REGULATORY COMMUNICATIONS:		7.20	\$ 4,138.50		
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.40	310.00	W470	11635614
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING COMMITTEE ISSUES				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/08/04	Goldstein, Marcia ATTEND CREDITORS COMMITTEE MEETING.	4.00	3,100.00	W470	11634958
04/08/04	Fife, Lori PARTICIPATE IN CREDITORS' COMMITTEE MEETING.	1.50	1,072.50	W470	11614896
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN AND I. DIZENGOFF REGARDING MCI ISSUES	0.50	387.50	W470	11634867
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W470 - COMMITTEE COMMUNICATIONS/MEETINGS:		6.40	\$ 4,870.00		
04/02/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALL.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11532202
04/06/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CALL OF CREDITOR TO LIFT STAY (.1); HANDLE CALL OF CREDITOR WHOSE CONTRACT WAS REJECTED (.1)	0.20	55.00	W510B	11615889
04/07/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALLS.	0.30	111.00	W510B	11620278
04/07/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALL REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS UNDER THE PLAN.	0.10	27.50	W510B	11614561
04/08/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CALL OF WORLDCOM EMPLOYEE (.2); RETURN CALLS OF WORLDCOM SHAREHOLDERS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE, DISTRIBUTIONS, STATUS OF CASE (.4)	0.60	165.00	W510B	11614691
04/12/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALLS.	0.10	37.00	W510B	11623012
04/12/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING THE MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE, STATUS OF CASE, AND DISTRIBUTIONS (.6); REVIEW FAX SENT BY CREDITOR REQUESTING TO LIFT THE AUTOMATIC STAY (.2)	0.80	220.00	W510B	11614539
04/13/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CREDITOR CALLS REGARDING THE MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE, STATUS OF CASE, STOCK STATUS AND DISTRIBUTIONS	0.50	137.50	W510B	11614506
04/14/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALL REGARDING MCI PRE-MERGER NOTICE	0.10	27.50	W510B	11614926
04/15/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALLS.	0.30	111.00	W510B	11620403
04/15/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CALL OF CREDITOR WHO RECEIVED A CHECK FROM WORLDCOM DATED 1.5 YEARS AGO AND BANKS WON'T CASH IT (.1); HANDLE SHAREHOLDER CALL REGARDING STOCK STATUS (.2)	0.30	82.50	W510B	11611706

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALLS.	0.50	185.00	W510B	11620467
04/16/04	Pullo, Christina HANDLE CALL OF BONDHOLDER REGARDING DISTRIBUTION	0.10	27.50	W510B	11614669
04/19/04	Graham, Richard RESPOND TO CREDITOR CALLS.	0.20	74.00	W510B	11623072
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W510B - CREDITOR/VENDOR/CUSTOMER COMMUNICATIONS:		4.20	\$ 1,297.50		
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE TO C. SILLIMAN REGARDING FOREIGN LICENSES	0.10	49.50	W520B	11527107
04/01/04	Whittaker, Donald CONFERENCE WITH E. WRIGHT REGARDING INT'L REGULATORY ISSUES	0.10	49.50	W520B	11527943
04/06/04	Whittaker, Donald CORRESPONDENCE WITH C. SILLIMAN REGARDING INT'L SERVICES	0.10	49.50	W520B	11537157
04/08/04	Cohen, Scott TELEPHONE CALL WITH G. DEFRIES REGARDING EMEA	0.20	80.00	W520B	11546130
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W520B - INTERNATIONAL ISSUES:		0.50	\$ 228.50		
04/01/04	Fife, Lori NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, WORLDCOM REGARDING NOL/ALLOCATION ISSUES (2.1); CONF WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING NOL ISSUES (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE KELLY REGARDING NOL ISSUE (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO LICHT MOTION (.5).	3.00	2,145.00	W560	11611412
04/01/04	Perez, Alfredo COMMUNICATIONS WITH M. KOTLER REGARDING CLEC CONSOLIDATION	0.10	67.00	W560	11552092
04/01/04	Protopapas, Lydia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING AGREEMENT TO BE PROVIDED BY S. BEVILLE AND SIGNATURES DELIVERED BY THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE MEMBERS (.10); REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING LETTER REQUEST CONCERNING THE PLAN RELEASES (.10); REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. POHL REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT RELATING TO TRADE COMMITTEE RELEASES (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. POHL REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT TO BE PROVIDED BY THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING PROVISIONS OF THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE STIPULATION RELATING TO EXECUTION OF RELEASE IN SUBSTANTIALLY THE FORM OF THE ONE ATTACHED TO THE AGREEMENT (.10).	0.50	222.50	W560	11526169
04/01/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. POHL REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.4); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. MCCARROLL, J. SAVIN, D. ALBAUGH, R. JACKSON AND J. GILL REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.6).	1.10	401.50	W560	11536629

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING PLAN	0.30	232.50	W560	11635793
04/02/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW REVISED LICHT RESPONSE.	0.50	387.50	W560	11635796
04/02/04	Fife, Lori NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING, M. GOLDSTEIN, T. SAVAGE REGARDING NOL'S AND ALLOCATION (2.3); REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE TO LICHT MOTION (.7); CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH B. BENJET, D. HOLZMAN, JONES REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GOLDEN REGARDING NOL ISSUE (.2).	4.80	3,432.00	W560	11612666
04/02/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO PAYMENT OF THE INDENTURE TRUSTEES' FEES UNDER THE PLAN (.30), REVIEW VARIOUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN AND J. SAVIN REGARDING RELEASES TO AND FROM INDENTURE TRUSTEES (.40)	0.70	469.00	W560	11552102
04/02/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY THE INDENTURE TRUSTEE CONCERNING THE RELEASE (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING INCLUSION OF THE INDENTURE TRUSTEE IN THE RELEASE AND THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SAVIN REGARDING SAME (.20).	0.40	178.00	W560	11526540
04/02/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON ISSUES REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS, INCLUDING INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES (1.5) CONFER WITH C. PULLO (.4) DRAFT EMAIL (.5) REGARDING CONCLUSIONS AND BREAK DOWN OF FEES.	2.40	1,020.00	W560	11635253
04/02/04	Grogan, James REVIEW REVISED CREDITORS' COMMITTEE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS, A. PEREZ, J. SAVIN AND B. PARLIN REGARDING SAME (1.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.1); REVIEW PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS FROM HSBC (.3).	1.90	693.50	W560	11537003
04/04/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM AKIN REGARDING NOL ISSUE (.5); REVIEW SEC DISTRIBUTION MEMORANDUM (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND EMAILS REGARDING NOL ISSUE (.4).	1.30	929.50	W560	11612714
04/05/04	Fife, Lori PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND MEETING WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, MATLIN, SILVERLAKE AND RESPECTIVE ATTORNEYS REGARDING NOL/ALLOCATION ISSUES (3.5); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GOLDEN, S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE, PALMER REGARDING NOL/ALLOCATION ISSUES (2.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. BREEDEN, S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE, BLAKELY REGARDING NOL/ALLOCATION ISSUES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLDRING, T. SAVAGE AND M. KOST REGARDING NOL/ALLOCATION (1.7).	7.80	5,577.00	W560	11612739
04/05/04	Yoon, Andrew EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.	0.70	297.50	W560	11536803
04/05/04	Cooper, Bethany COORDINATION OF CLOSING (2.0); EMERGENCE TEAM CALL (1.5) REVIEW 10-K COMMENTS (1.0)	4.50	1,912.50	W560	11610438
04/05/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11531949

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING LETTER AGREEMENT RELATING TO MERRILL LYNCH RELEASE.				
04/06/04	Goldstein, Marcia	5.00	3,875.00	W560	11635246
	PREPARE FOR (1.1) AND ATTEND COURT HEARING WITH S. COHEN REGARDING DR. SEYMOUR LIGHT (2.2) NUMEROUS DISCUSSIONS WITH S. COHEN AFTER HEARING (1.0) TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY, ET AL REGARDING SAME (.7)				
04/06/04	Marcus, Christopher	1.30	552.50	W560	11541298
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. EVERETT REGARDING SAME (.3) DRAFT EMAIL TO BANK OF AMERICA REGARDING SAME (.7)				
04/06/04	Cohen, Scott	1.50	600.00	W560	11537562
	MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING LIGHT & RELATED MATTERS (.5) INCLUDING TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. PEREZ (.5) AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH T. SAVAGE REGARDING SAME (.5)				
04/06/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W560	11534231
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. BENJET REGARDING MERRILL LYNCH'S CLAIMS (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE FROM THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE RELATING TO RELEASES (.10).				
04/06/04	Fink, Jessica	0.20	85.00	W560	11635310
	DEAL WITH DISTRIBUTION ISSUES.				
04/06/04	Grogan, James	1.30	474.50	W560	11546919
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. BEVILLE, J. MCCARROLL, J. GILL, R. JACKSON, AND J. SAVIN REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.0); REVIEW LETTER AGREEMENT FROM S. POHL REGARDING MERRILL LYNCH CLAIMS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1).				
04/07/04	Goldstein, Marcia	0.20	155.00	W560	11634845
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. KORNBERG REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
04/07/04	Green, Frederick	0.80	620.00	W560	11611983
	REVIEW RIGHTS PLAN CHANGES.				
04/07/04	Danilow, Greg	0.30	226.50	W560	11618599
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING PLAN				
04/07/04	Fife, Lori	6.40	4,576.00	W560	11614045
	CONF WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING NOL/ALLOCATION ISSUES, EMBRATEL AND OTHER EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (1.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. COHEN AND G. DANILOW REGARDING SECURITIES LAWS ISSUES (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. MARCUS REGARDING BANK OF AMERICA ISSUES (.4); CONF WITH S. COHEN REGARDING ALLOCATION ISSUES (.2); NUMEROUS EMAILS REGARDING FCC ISSUES (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, LAZARD, F. GREEN, BRAZIL ATTORNEYS REGARDING EMBRATEL (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING PREPARATION FOR MEETING WITH FCC (1.0)				
04/07/04	Pearlstein, Debra	1.00	670.00	W560	11585201
	PLANNING CALL REGARDING FCC INQUIRY				
04/07/04	Whittaker, Donald	0.30	148.50	W560	11541042
	CONFERENCE WITH S. FERIA REGARDING SCHEDULE, ACCESS, COPIES, IT, CORPORATE STRUCTURE				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/07/04	Yoon, Andrew EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.	0.60	255.00	W560	11536818
04/07/04	Marcus, Christopher REVIE 10K AND 10Q (1.7) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTAK REGARDING BANK OF AMERICA (.3) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. FIFE REGARDING SAME (.2) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. BENJET REGARDING SAME (.2) RESEARCH AND REVISE MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME (.8)	3.20	1,360.00	W560	11541005
04/07/04	Cohen, Scott DRAFT LICHT ORDER (.3); EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL (.5)	0.80	320.00	W560	11546118
04/07/04	Cooper, Bethany EMERGENCE TEAM CALL (1.8); COORDINATE COMMENTS TO 10-K/10-QS (2.5); UPDATE EMERGENCE CHECKLIST (1.5); COORDINATION FOR BOARD MEETING/EMERGENCE (2.0)	7.80	3,315.00	W560	11608013
04/07/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON DISTRIBUTIONS (.1) INCLUDING TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CHASTKA AND D. HAUEISEN REGARDING SAME (.2)	0.30	127.50	W560	11635836
04/07/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON DISTRIBUTION ISSUES (.3) INCLUDING CONFER WITH B. COOPER (.3); CONFER WITH UST, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE REGARDING INDENTURE TRUSTEE FEES (.4)	1.00	425.00	W560	11635823
04/07/04	Watkins, Claire ATTENTION TO REVIEW OF SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS AT MCI.	18.00	5,940.00	W560	11558087
04/07/04	Taylor, David (MCI NETWORKS) CALLS TO FCC ATTORNEYS.	0.20	58.00	W560	11589749
04/07/04	Taylor, David REVIEW SETTLEMENT AGREEMENTS AT MCI	9.10	2,639.00	W560	11589747
04/07/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. MCCARROLL, J. SAVIN, B. PARKIN AND R. JACKSON REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.6); CORRESPOND WITH S. BURNS REGARDING CLAIM TRANSFER ISSUES (.2).	0.80	292.00	W560	11546929
04/08/04	Marcus, Christopher REVIEW WELLS FARGO POST TRIAL BRIEF	0.60	255.00	W560	11541123
04/08/04	Cohen, Scott DRAFT LICHT ORDER	0.30	120.00	W560	11546128
04/08/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH D. MOORE REGARDING PAY PHONE PROVIDERS AND CONVENIENCE CLASS ISSUES (.2); DRAFT SPREADSHEETS OF PSP CLAIMANTS FOR J. SULLIVAN RELATED TO SAME (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. SULLIVAN REGARDING SAME (.4).	2.00	730.00	W560	11546935
04/09/04	Green, Frederick ATTENTION TO CONSOB ISSUES (.5); REVIEW MEMORANDUM (.3)	0.80	620.00	W560	11611818

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/09/04	Danilow, Greg REVIEW PLAN ISSUES	0.80	604.00	W560	11619024
04/09/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM REGARDING NOL (.9); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING SAME (.9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH HAMILL REGARDING INDENTURE (.5); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES AND KPMG (.8).	3.10	2,216.50	W560	11615816
04/09/04	Goldring, Stuart RESPOND TO REQUEST FROM R. WITT FOR COPIES OF MATERIALS RELATING TO TRADING ORDER (.4); REVIEW DRAFT CHART OF CERTAIN STOCK OWNERSHIP FOR FCC (.3) AND DISCUSS WITH M. HOERNLEIN (.3), M. FIFE (.2), M. HOERNLEIN AND M. FRENCH (.3), M. HOERNLEIN, M. FRENCH AND R. WITT (.4); DRAFT AND SEND EMAIL TO L. FIFE REGARDING CHARTER RESTRICTIONS (.2), AND DISCUSS SAME WITH L. FIFE (.2); PARTICIPATE IN EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH R. WITT, L. FIFE AND OTHERS REGARDING FCC REQUEST (.3).	2.60	1,859.00	W560	11549894
04/09/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING CLAIMS WHICH MERRILL LYNCH IS SEEKING TO PREVENT FROM BEING RELEASED.	0.10	44.50	W560	11541965
04/09/04	Fink, Jessica WORK ON DISTRIBUTION ISSUES.	0.70	297.50	W560	11635848
04/10/04	Goldring, Stuart DRAFT/SEND EMAILS TO D. HOLZMAN AND M. FRENCH REGARDING CERTAIN CLAIM OWNERSHIP (.3); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME AND EXTENT OF POTENTIAL OWNERSHIP BY CERTAIN CREDITORS (.6); REVIEW SUBSEQUENT EMAIL FROM M. FRENCH REGARDING SAME (.4); DRAFT/SEND EMAIL TO R. MILKMAN REGARDING FILING BY FINANCIAL VENTURES UNDER THE TRADING ORDER (.6)	1.90	1,358.50	W560	11550112
04/11/04	Danilow, Greg TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING PLAN	3.00	2,265.00	W560	11618736
04/11/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFER WITH G. DANILOW REGARDING COMMENTS ON DRAFT MEMORANDUM REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MEMORANDUM, AND REDISTRIBUTE (5.3); CONFER FURTHER WITH G. DANILOW REGARDING REVISIONS (.2); REVIEW F. GREEN REVISIONS TO MEMORANDUM, REPLY TO HIS COMMENTS, AND INCORPORATE HIS AND G. DANILOW'S COMMENTS (1.3); CONFER BY EMAIL AND PHONE WITH R. MILKMAN REGARDING EXTENT OF POTENTIAL OWNERSHIP BY CERTAIN CREDITORS (.9).	8.10	5,791.50	W560	11550083
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GOLD REGARDING PLAN OF REORGANIZATION	0.20	155.00	W560	11634391
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia MEETING WITH L. FIFE, B. COOPER, S. GOLD, S. COHEN REGARDING EMERGENCE STATUS.	1.00	775.00	W560	11634394
04/12/04	Goldstein, Marcia REVIEW EMAILS (.5) AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN, L. PROTOPAPAS, S. GOLD REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS EMERGENCE ISSUES (.5)	1.00	775.00	W560	11636140
04/12/04	Green, Frederick REVIEW CONSOB ISSUES (.1); DISCUSS SAME WITH S. GOLD (.2)	0.30	232.50	W560	11615773

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/12/04	Fife, Lori TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLD REGARDING NOL MEMORANDUM (.5); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM, D. PEARLSTEIN, S. GOLDRING REGARDING FCC ISSUES (.7); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SEC DISTRIBUTION PLAN (.5); MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (.7); MEETING WITH WGM TEAM REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (1.5); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS FROM COMPANY REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (.8).	6.20	4,433.00	W560	11612372
04/12/04	Goldring, Stuart CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. FIFE, M. GOLDSTEIN, S. COHEN AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO CORPORATE MONITOR REGARDING NOTE ELECTION (.6); CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. FIFE, M. HOERNLEIN, R. MILKMAN, R. WHITT, D. PEARLMAN AND OTHERS REGARDING COMPANY'S PREPARATION FOR FCC CALL (.6)	1.20	858.00	W560	11549714
04/12/04	Yoon, Andrew WGM EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE AND S. GOLD.	1.50	637.50	W560	11551488
04/12/04	Marcus, Christopher REVIEW 10K (.9) TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. FINK REGARDING PLAN (.3)	1.20	510.00	W560	11547669
04/12/04	Cohen, Scott REVISE LETTER AGREEMENT MEMORANDUM (1.2) INCLUDING DISCUSSION M. HOERNLEIN, S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE AND M. GOLDSTEIN (.8); MULTIPLE DISCUSSIONS J. GROGAN & L. PROTOPAPPAS REGARDING EMERGENCE (1.0); DISCUSSION B. COOPER REGARDING EMERGENCE & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (4); DISCUSSION M. GOLDSTEIN & L. FIFE REGARDING RELEASES (.8); TELEPHONE CALLS D. GROPPER REGARDING RELEASES (.5); EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (1.5); DISCUSSION J. SAVIN REGARDING RELEASE (.3) & DISCUSSION M. GOLDSTEIN (.3) & RELATED DISCUSSION WITH J. GROGAN (.2) REGARDING SAME; DISCUSSIONS M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NOL & EMERGENCE (.3)	7.30	2,920.00	W560	11568976
04/12/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. BEVILLE REGARDING THE FORM OF THE LETTER AGREEMENT RELATING TO THE TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE RELEASE AND THE MERRILL LYNCH RELEASE (.10); REVIEW THE TWO LETTER AGREEMENTS SUBMITTED BY S. POHL REGARDING THE MERRILL LYNCH AND OTHER RELEASES TO BE DELIVERED UNDER THE PLAN (.20); AND THEN CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING RESPONDING TO S. BEVILLE'S INQUIRY REGARDING SAME (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN AND J. GROGAN REGARDING FURTHER STEPS THAT NEED TO BE TAKEN IN ORDER TO GET THE CLOSING DOCUMENTS FROM THE VARIOUS PARTIES (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. GREENBERG REGARDING THE WORLDCOM EMERGENCE MEETING AND FORM OF RELEASE (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. COHEN REGARDING REQUEST SUBMITTED BY D. GROPPER RELATING TO THE RELEASES (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM B. COOPER REGARDING THE MCI EMERGENCE CHECKLIST (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. COHEN REGARDING REVISIONS TO THE PLAN RELEASE REQUESTED BY D. GROPPER OF ELLIOTT MANAGEMENT (.10); REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING THE REVISED FORM OF THE PLAN CLOSING RELEASES (.10); PARTICIPATE IN THE EMERGENCE TEAM MEETING (.70); REVIEW THE TERMS OF THE REVISED RELEASES (.50); CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING THE REVISED TERMS OF THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDER RELEASE (.20); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING REVISIONS REQUESTED BY ELLIOTT MANAGEMENT AND THE TERMS OF THE RELEASES APPENDED TO THE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.20).	2.80	1,246.00	W560	11546091
04/12/04	Grogan, James	5.90	2,153.50	W560	11569902

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BEVILLE REGARDING TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE AGREEMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. SAVIN, S. BEVILLE, S. POHL, J. MCCARROLL, D. ALBAUGH, N. SABADO AND R. JACKSON REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.5); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING STATUS OF PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); CONFER WITH L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. SAVIN AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING PROPOSED CHANGES TO PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN AND L. PROTOPAPAS REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING SAME (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN REGARDING ISSUES RAISED BY D. GROPPER (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MCI EMERGENCE TEAM REGARDING VARIOUS PLAN ISSUES (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.1).				
04/13/04	Gold, Simeon	5.30	3,895.50	W560	11549347
	CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN ET AL REGARDING AGREEMENT (0.4); REVIEWED STROOCK'S DRAFT OF MATLIN-SILVERLAKE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (0.5); LONG CONFERENCE WITH PALMER, M. GOLDSTEIN ET AL REGARDING SAME (4.2) AND BRIEFED S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (0.2).				
04/13/04	Danilow, Greg	1.00	755.00	W560	11623221
	REVIEW TAX ISSUES (.5); MEETING WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING PLAN ISSUES (.5)				
04/13/04	Fife, Lori	0.50	357.50	W560	11614161
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING DISCLOSURE.				
04/13/04	Fife, Lori	7.60	5,434.00	W560	11614160
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORLDCOM AND WGM TEAM REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES (1.5); MEETING WITH STROOCK, AKIN AND WGM TEAM REGARDING RECISSION AGREEMENTS (1.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME (2.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.8); EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH WORLDCOM REGARDING INDENTURE (.6); NUMEROUS MEETINGS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES (1.3).				
04/13/04	Goldring, Stuart	12.00	8,580.00	W560	11549725
	REVIEW REVISED MEMORANDUM TO CORPORATE MONITOR REGARDING NOTE ELECTIONS (1.4); FOLLOW-UP WITH M. HOERNLEIN (.2) AND M. GOLDSTEIN (.1) REGARDING SAME; CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. FISHER AND P. OLSON REGARDING WITHHOLDING ON PAYMENT OF EMPLOYEE CLAIMS (.3); FOLLOW-UP WITH M. HOERNLEIN (.3) AND M. KAM (.2) REGARDING SAME; FOLLOW-UP ON REVISIONS TO NOTE ELECTION MEMORANDUM (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. RICHARDS AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING STATE TAXES (.3); LEAVE SUBSTANTIVE VOICE MAIL FOR P. COX OF AKIN GUMP REGARDING STATE TAX CLAIMS (.2); CONFER WITH D. HOLZMAN AND M. FRENCH REGARDING INTERNAL MERGERS/TRANSFERS (.7); MEETING WITH D. PALMER, D. ROSNER, D. GOLDEN, I. DIZENGOFF, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, S. COHEN, S. GOLD AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING NEGOTIATION OF RECISSION AGREEMENT (4.5); REVIEW AND REVISE SAME WITH S. COHEN AND M. HOERNLEIN (3.3)				
04/13/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.70	469.00	W560	11611822
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. COHEN AND J. GROGAN REGARDING THE FORM OF RELEASE FOR THE CLOSINGS				
04/13/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.80	340.00	W560	11551496
	EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.				
04/13/04	Holzman, Daniel	4.80	2,136.00	W560	11552719
	REVISED EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS.				
04/13/04	Cohen, Scott	11.70	4,680.00	W560	11568990

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DISCUSSIONS WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING RELEASES (.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING RELEASES & RELATED DISCUSSION (.3); REVISE NOL MEMORANDUM (.5); DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT & RELATED ISSUES (.4); DISCUSSION WITH B. COOPER & S. GOLD REGARDING EMERGENCE & PREPARE SPREADSHEET (.5); REVIEW RESCISSION AGREEMENT & MEETING WITH COMMITTEE, M. PALMER, M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLDRING, L. FIFE, M. HOERNLEIN, S. GOLD (4.5); REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (5.0)				
04/13/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.30	133.50	W560	11550492
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING THE REVISED RELEASE AGREEMENTS AND THEN REVIEW SAME (.20); AND THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING AGREEMENT TO REVISE SAME (.10).				
04/13/04	Grogan, James	3.00	1,095.00	W560	11569909
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GROPPER AND S. COHEN REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.7); REVISE AND REDISTRIBUTE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS TO ALL PARTIES (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GROPPER AND S. COHEN REGARDING PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.7); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW AND PREPARE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS FOR EXECUTION (.4); CORRESPOND WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING D. GROPPER COMMENTS TO CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.2); CORRESPOND WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING TERMS OF TRADE CLAIMS SETTLEMENT AND BONDHOLDER SETTLEMENT (.2).				
04/13/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo	1.00	275.00	W560	11556092
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH D. HOLZMAN AND BACKGROUND ON DEAL				
04/13/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo	1.70	467.50	W560	11556100
	REVIEW OF MATERIALS, SPREADSHEETS AND ANALYSIS OF SEQUENCE OF SUBSIDIARY MERGERS				
04/13/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo	3.70	1,017.50	W560	11556097
	RESEARCH ON STATE LAW IN ORDER TO EFFECTUATE MERGERS OF SUBSIDIARIES IN VARIOUS JURISDICTIONS				
04/14/04	Gold, Simeon	2.80	2,058.00	W560	11555028
	CONFERENCE CALLS WITH AKIN, STROOCK AND M. GOLDSTEIN ET AL. REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (1.0); REVIEWED DRAFTS OF SAME AND FOLLOW-UP WITH S. COHEN AND M. HOERNLEIN (1.8).				
04/14/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W560	11634865
	CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, S. GOLDRING, S. COHEN, M. PALMER, ET AL REGARDING PLAN ISSUES				
04/14/04	Danilow, Greg	0.30	226.50	W560	11622605
	ATTENTION TO TAX ISSUES (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING PLAN OF REORGANIZATION (.2)				
04/14/04	Fife, Lori	5.80	4,147.00	W560	11615248
	REVIEW AND REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (1.5); CONFERENCES WITH S. COHEN, S. GOLD AND S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.8); NUMEROUS TELECONFERENCES WITH WGM TEAM AND CREDITORS COMMITTEE AND STROOCK REGARDING SAME (2.5); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (1.0).				
04/14/04	Goldring, Stuart	11.80	8,437.00	W560	11560604

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW REVISED RESCISSION AGREEMENT AND EXHIBIT (1.1), AND DISCUSS WITH M. HOERNLEIN (.3) AND L. FIFE (.4); REVIEW FURTHER REVISIONS (.5); MEETING/CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. GOLDSTEIN, M. HOERNLEIN, S. COHEN, M. PALMER, AND REPRS. OF AKIN GUMP AND MATLIN REGARDING NEGOTIATION OF RESCISSION AGREEMENT (3.0), AND FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSIONS/CALLS WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND L. FIFE REGARDING SAME AND THURSDAY HEARING (1.0); REVIEW/REVISE FURTHER DRAFTS OF RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (1.3); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH AND D. HOLZMAN (FOR PART) REGARDING INTERNAL MERGERS AND TRANSFERS (.5); PROVIDE TO D. HOLZMAN SAMPLE FORM OF SUBSCRIPTION AGREEMENT (.2); CONFER WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING UPCOMING HEARING ON RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (.2); REVIEW CHANGES TO RESCISSION AGREEMENT FOR SILVER LAKE VERSION (.7); REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (2.2); RESEARCH WITHHOLDING OBLIGATIONS AS TO PAYMENTS TO WAGE CLAIMANTS (.4)				
04/14/04	Cohen, Scott	13.40	5,360.00	W560	11569003
	DRAFT MUTUAL RELEASE & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE & REVISE RESCISSION AGREEMENT (2.9); DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE REGARDING RELEASE (.3); DRAFT PRESS RELEASE (.6); ATTENTION TO CAPITALIZATION TABLE AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.4); DISCUSSION WITH M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING AGREEMENT MOTION & DRAFT SAME (4.4); CONFERENCE CALL W/STROOCK, AKIN, M. GOLDSTEIN, S. GOLDRING & M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT (2.1); DISCUSSION WITH M. HOERNLEIN & S. GOLDRING REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT AND REVIEW SAME (2.5); DISCUSSION WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING RELEASE (.2)				
04/14/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11553342
	REVIEW THE CLOSING CHART COMPILED BY J. GROGAN REFLECTING STATUS OF RECEIPT OF CLOSING DOCUMENTS.				
04/14/04	Grogan, James	2.40	876.00	W560	11569916
	DRAFT AND REVISE CHART REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENT STATUS (1.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH PARTIES TO PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS REGARDING EXECUTION OF SAME (.8).				
04/15/04	Gold, Simeon	2.80	2,058.00	W560	11555132
	REVIEWED REVISED DRAFTS OF RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (.7) CONFERENCE CALLS WITH AKIN, STROOCK, S. GOLDRING ET AL. REGARDING OPEN POINTS (1.2), DRAFTED E-MAIL TO S. KELLY ET AL (.4) AND FOLLOW-UP WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. GOLDRING (.5) REGARDING SAME				
04/15/04	Fife, Lori	10.70	7,650.50	W560	11615979
	REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (2.4); CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.8); FINALIZE RESCISSION AGREEMENTS AND PREPARE FOR HEARING (1.6); ATTEND HEARING BEFORE JUDGE RAKOLL ON RESCISSION AGREEMENTS (4.5); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO NUMEROUS EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING EMBRATTEL HEARING (.2).				
04/15/04	Goldring, Stuart	7.70	5,505.50	W560	11565317
	REVIEW TAX-FREE MERGER REPS WITH J. THOREN FOR WORLDCOM REINCORPORATION (.5) AND INTERMEDIA MERGER (1.3); REVIEW, REVISE, NEGOTIATE, FINALIZE RESCISSION AGREEMENTS WITH MATLIN, SILVER LAKE AND CREDITORS COMMITTEE (4.3); CONFER WITH M. HOENIG REGARDING SAME (.2); CONFER WITH S. COHEN (.3) AND M. GOLDSTEIN (.3) REGARDING HEARING ON SAME; CONFER WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING INTERNAL MERGERS AND TRANSFERS (.3); CALL WITH J. UFFNER REGARDING DISTRIBUTION OF NOTES (.3) AND WITH R. KOST (.2)				
04/15/04	Yoon, Andrew	1.30	552.50	W560	11558165
	EMERGENCY TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.				
04/15/04	Marcus, Christopher	0.70	297.50	W560	11556667
	MET WITH L. FIFE REGARDING TAX ISSUES (.2) EMAIL TO S. GOLDRING REGARDING SAME (.5)				
04/15/04	Cohen, Scott	9.80	3,920.00	W560	11568402

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVISE RESCISSION MOTION (4.3) INCLUDING DISCUSSION WITH L. FIFE & M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.7); PREP FOR & ATTEND HEARING WITH RAKOFF REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT (4.3); POST-HEARING MATTERS AND PREPARE MOTION & NOTICE (.5)				
04/15/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.20	89.00	W560	11562782
	REVIEW VOICE MESSAGE FROM J. SAVIN REGARDING THE PERIODS COVERED BY THE PLAN RELEASES (.10); AND THEN TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.10).				
04/15/04	Grogan, James	3.30	1,204.50	W560	11571750
	REVISE PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE REGARDING SAME (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SAME (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE, MATLIN PATTERSON, DISSENTING BONDHOLDERS COMMITTEE AND TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE REGARDING CLOSING AGREEMENTS (1.7)				
04/15/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo	6.30	1,732.50	W560	11556105
	PREPARATION OF CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENT FOR VARIOUS SUBSIDIARIES				
04/16/04	Goldstein, Marcia	1.00	775.00	W560	11637056
	CONFERENCE CALL TO DISCUSS EMERGENCE ITEMS.				
04/16/04	Danilow, Greg	0.50	377.50	W560	11622091
	ATTENTION TO TAX ISSUES (.2); REVIEW DISCLOSURE AGREEMENT (.3)				
04/16/04	Fife, Lori	4.00	2,860.00	W560	11612773
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COURT REGARDING MOTION ON NOL (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. KELLY REGARDING SAME (.2); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES AND CONFERENCES REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE ISSUES (1.4); RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE MOTION ON NOL (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. GOLDSTEIN AND S. COHEN REGARDING SAME (.5).				
04/16/04	Goldring, Stuart	6.90	4,933.50	W560	11564978
	CALLS WITH R. KOST REGARDING DISTRIBUTION ALLOCATIONS (.3); DRAFT/SEND EMAIL TO P. OLSON REGARDING WITHHOLDING ON WAGE CLAIMS (.7); CALL WITH S. COHEN REGARDING DISTRIBUTION ALLOCATIONS (.2); REVIEW AND REVISE SUBSCRIPTION AGREEMENTS AND DISCUSS WITH D. HOLZMAN AND M. FRENCH (.9); REVIEW AND REVISE TAX-FREE MERGER REPS REGARDING KPMG AUDIT (.7); REVIEW AND DISCUSS COMMENT TO SUBSIDIARY MERGER AGREEMENT WITH D. HOLZMAN (.8) AND M. FRENCH (.3); REVISE SAME (1.0); GO OVER INTERMEDIA MERGER AGREEMENTS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS WITH D. HOLZMAN (1.3); DISCUSS SUBSCRIPTION AGREEMENTS FURTHER WITH D. HOLZMAN AND M. FRENCH (.7)				
04/16/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.80	340.00	W560	11557750
	EMERGENCE TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH MCI.				
04/16/04	Cohen, Scott	6.50	2,600.00	W560	11568450
	MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING INDENTURE TRUSTEE DISTRIBUTIONS (.6) INCLUDING DISCUSSIONS WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING SAME (.3); DISCUSSION WITH S. KELLY & M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING EMERGENCE ISSUES (.7); DRAFT NOTICE/MOTION/ORDER REGARDING RESCISSION AGREEMENT (3.1); TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. LOWRY REGARDING SEC FILINGS & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.5); MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING AUDITOR ISSUES (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH M. CHASTKA & INDENTURE TRUSTEES (.2); DRAFT PLAN SUPPLEMENT DOCUMENT (.2); DISCUSSION WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING RELEASES & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (.6)				
04/16/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.10	44.50	W560	11562656
	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM S. POHL AND J. GROGAN REGARDING PLAN RELEASES.				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/16/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. COHEN REGARDING STATUS OF CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH D. GROPPER REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE REGARDING SAME (.7); EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH CO-COUNSEL AND PARTIES TO CLOSING DOCUMENTS REGARDING EXECUTION OF SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. POHL REGARDING TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE RELEASE (.2); CORRESPOND WITH J. SAVIN REGARDING STATUS OF PLAN CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.1); REVIEW AND REVISE SIGNATURE BLOCKS FOR MATLIN PATTERSON AND SILVER LAKE LLC (.7); CORRESPOND WITH N. SABADO REGARDING SAME (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH N. SABADO REGARDING SAME (.4).	3.10	1,131.50	W560	11571751
04/16/04	Simon Jr., Alfredo DRAFTING OF CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENTS FOR SUBSIDIARIES IN VARIOUS JURISDICTIONS	6.70	1,842.50	W560	11556109
04/16/04	Rao, Vijayendra MADE CHANGES TO CLOSING FOLDERS AND SET UP CLOSING ROOM.	7.00	910.00	W560	11562586
04/16/04	Harings, Teresa CREATED LABELS AND PLACED ON FOLDERS, BROUGHT TO J. LONGOBARDO PER HIS REQUEST (.5) CHECKED IN WITH J. REGARDING PREPARATIONS FOR MONDAY CLOSING (.5)	1.00	130.00	W560	11565356
04/16/04	Joffrion, Karen PRINT EMAILS AND ATTACHED DOCUMENTS (2.10); PROOF REVISED CLOSING INDEX (.60); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH C. COX REGARDING REVISED CLOSING INDEX (.10); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH S. JAMAL REGARDING CAPITAL LEASES (.10); PREPARE INDEX INSERT FOR DOCUMENTS LISTED ON CD FOR CONTRACTS (.80); BEGIN SORTING CAPITAL LEASES (1.20); REGARDING-SORT CAPITAL LEASES WITH S. JAMAL BASED ON NEW INFORMATION (1.60).	6.50	1,040.00	W560	11560478
04/16/04	Petropoulos, Christine MEET WITH TEAM REGARDING CASE STATUS, TO DO LIST, HEARING ISSUES, COPY OF DOCUMENTS	0.60	99.00	W560	11606408
04/17/04	Fife, Lori REVIEW AND RESPOND TO NUMEROUS EMAILS REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE.	0.60	429.00	W560	11612867
04/17/04	Goldring, Stuart EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH M. FRENCH REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE AGREEMENTS AND REPRESENTATIONS FOR WORLDCOM/INTERMEDIA MERGERS	1.50	1,072.50	W560	11566033
04/17/04	Protopapas, Lydia REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. PEREZ AND S. POHL REGARDING EXECUTION OF RELEASES.	0.10	44.50	W560	11563166
04/18/04	Holzman, Daniel REVISED EMERGENGE DOCUMENTS.	4.00	1,780.00	W560	11557584
04/19/04	Goldstein, Marcia NUMEROUS CALLS REGARDING EMERGENGE ISSUES (1.5); CALLS WITH S. KELLY, R. BREEDEN, P. CURNIN REGARDING SAME (2.5) CONFERENCE CALL WITH JUDGE RAKOFF REGARDING VALUATION OF STOCK IN SEC SETTLEMENT (.5)	4.50	3,487.50	W560	11637045
04/19/04	Danilow, Greg REVIEW STATUS REGARDING EMERGENGE	0.50	377.50	W560	11622340
04/19/04	Fife, Lori	9.00	6,435.00	W560	11611214

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES REGARDING EFFECTIVE DATE (1.0); PARTICIPATE IN HEARING ON RECISSION AGREEMENTS (2.0); MEETING WITH N. JONES REGARDING CLOSING (1.5); NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE, R. BREEDEN, M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING STOCK VALUE (3.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH RAKOF, SEC, T. SAVAGE REGARDING SEC SETTLEMENT (1.0); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. CAPELLAS, S. KELLY, T. SAVAGE AND M. GOLDSTEIN REGARDING SEC SETTLEMENT (.5).				
04/19/04	Goldring, Stuart	6.10	4,361.50	W560	11565996
	REVIEW AND COMMENT ON PROPOSED REVISIONS OF CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT BY M. FRENCH (.3); REVISE DRAFT CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT(1.2); DISCUSS SAME WITH M. HOENIG (.2) REVIEW AND COMMENT ON DRAFT INTERCOMPANY NOTE (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, L.FIFE, M. GOLDSTEIN AND M. HOERNLEIN REGARDING REMOVAL OF TRANSFER RESTRICTIONS (.3); CONFERENCE CALL WITH S. GOLD, S. KELLY, B. BLAKELY, N. JONES AND D. RICHARDS REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW KPMG COMMENTS ON DRAFT MERGER AGREEMENT FOR SUBSIDIARIES AND DISCUSS SAME BY EMAIL (.4); REVIEW MCI DRAFT LETTER TO FCC AND GIVE COMMENTS TO D. PEARLSTEIN (.2); MAKE FURTHER REVISIONS TO DRAFT CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT (.9); CONFER WITH M. FRENCH AND J. THOREN REGARDING TERMS OF CONTRIBUTION AGREEMENT (.3); DISCUSS EFFECTIVE DATE AGREEMENTS FURTHER WITH M. FRENCH (.6) AND D. HOLZMAN (.6); REVIEW LETTERS FROM MATLIN AND SILVER LAKE (.4) AND DISCUSS WITH L. FIFE AND M. GOLDSTEIN (.2)				
04/19/04	Perez, Alfredo	2.50	1,675.00	W560	11620829
	NUMEROUS COMMUNICATIONS WITH COMMITTEE, J. GROGAN, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE AND S. COHEN REGARDING RELEASES FOR CLOSING (1.5), REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO THE RELEASES WITH L. PROTOPAPAS AND J. GROGAN (1.0)				
04/19/04	Holzman, Daniel	10.80	4,806.00	W560	11596931
	ATTENDED PRE-CLOSING AND REVISED EMERGENCE DOCUMENTS.				
04/19/04	Cohen, Scott	12.30	4,920.00	W560	11569351
	PREPARE DISTRICT COURT AFFIDAVITS & RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (2.4); DRAFT BOARD DESIGNATION (.2); PREPARE FOR RESCISSION AGREEMENT & ATTEND HEARING (2.5); TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. HOLLANDER REGARDING WILMINGTON TRUST (.3); DISCUSSION WITH I. FROM REGARDING DISTRIBUTIONS (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. CHASTKA REGARDING DISTRIBUTION (.3); MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING EMERGENCE AND ATTENTION TO EMERGENCE ISSUES (3.0); MISCELLANEOUS CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING RELEASES INCLUDING DISCUSSION J. GROGAN (.5); DISCUSSION WITH R. BAUMFIELD REGARDING NEON (.2); ATTENTION TO EMBRATEL INCLUDING INTERNAL CORRESPONDENCE (.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH RAKOFF CHAMBERS WITH T. SAVAGE, M. GOLDSTEIN, L. FIFE, P. CURNIN, R. BREEDEN REGARDING SAME (1.0); POST CALL WITH M. CAPELLAS & S. KELLY, L. FIFE & M. GOLDSTEIN (.5); CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMBRATEL WITH S. HIRSCH & L. FIFE (.7)				
04/19/04	Merola, Michael	7.00	3,325.00	W560	11615158
	CLOSING FOR MCI EMERGENCE.				
04/19/04	Goldman, Jeremy	4.10	1,517.00	W560	11566252
	ATTENTION TO PRE-CLOSING PREPARATIONS AND ISSUES (1.6); SET-UP OF CLOSING FOLDERS AND DOCUMENTS (1.0); REVIEW OF EXECUTED RELEASE DOCUMENTS (1.5)				
04/19/04	Hoernlein, Michael	2.50	925.00	W560	11576130
	TEND TO FINALIZING DOCUMENTS FOR EMERGENCE.				
04/19/04	Protopapas, Lydia	0.30	133.50	W560	11564806
	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM J. GROGAN REGARDING REVISIONS TO SIGNATURE BLOCKS REQUESTED BY STROOCK ON BEHALF OF MATLIN AND SILVERLAKE (.10); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ AND J. GROGAN REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND THEN REVIEW THE CONDITIONS TO THE EFFECTIVE DATE AND THE TERMS OF THE STIPULATIONS WITH THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDERS AND TRADE CLAIMS COMMITTEE (.20).				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/19/04	Grogan, James	7.80	2,847.00	W560	11571909
	ATTEND TO FINAL EXECUTION OF CLOSING DOCUMENTS (3.8) INCLUDING NUMEROUS TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH THE CREDITORS' COMMITTEE, MATLIN PATTERSON INVESTORS, WGM TEAM, S. POHL, S. BEVILLE AND THE DISSENTING BONDHOLDERS COMMITTEE (3.0) AND DISTRIBUTING EXECUTED DOCUMENTS TO CO-COUNSEL (1.0).				
04/19/04	Froim, Idit	6.80	2,516.00	W560	11614931
	FOLLOWED UP ON CURRENT ESTIMATES REGARDING THE AMOUNT OF SHARES ISSUED UPON EMERGENCE (1.2) THE CARSO ENTITIES' PERCENTAGE OF OWNERSHIP AND THE TIME FRAME FOR DISTRIBUTION UPON EMERGENCE (2.1) REVISED THE DRAFT LETTER TO THE DOJ (3.5)				
04/19/04	Rao, Vijayendra	9.50	1,235.00	W560	11578896
	ATTENTION TO CLOSING ISSUES				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W560 - PLAN CONFIRMATION:		412.10	\$ 209,210.00		
04/01/04	Merola, Michael	1.00	475.00	W570	11613671
	CALL REGARDING MATURITY DATE OF BONDS.				
04/01/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.40	148.00	W570	11555755
	MEETING WITH J. LONGOBARDO REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.2); REVIEW OF UCC DOCUMENTS (.2).				
04/05/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.70	297.50	W570	11536804
	REVIEW REVISED LC FACILITY DOCUMENTS.				
04/06/04	Yoon, Andrew	2.10	892.50	W570	11536677
	REVIEW REVISED LC FACILITY DOCUMENTS.				
04/07/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.80	340.00	W570	11536681
	REVIEW REVISED LC FACILITY DOCUMENTS.				
04/07/04	Merola, Michael	1.50	712.50	W570	11615069
	CALLS REGARDING MATURITY DATE FOR INDENTURES.				
04/08/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.80	340.00	W570	11536828
	PREPARE CLOSING DELIVERIES FOR LC FACILITY AGREEMENTS.				
04/08/04	Merola, Michael	5.00	2,375.00	W570	11611750
	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING EMERGENCE (1.0) REVISIONS TO NOTES AFTER CALL WITH TRUSTEE AND TRUSTEE'S COUNSEL (4.0)				
04/09/04	Merola, Michael	2.50	1,187.50	W570	11613546
	PREPARATION FOR EMERGENCE (1.5) PREPARATION OF NOTES AND CALLS WITH DTC AND COMPANY REGARDING INDENTURES (1.0)				
04/12/04	Yoon, Andrew	1.00	425.00	W570	11551487
	REVIEW REVISED EXIT FACILITY DOCUMENTS.				
04/13/04	Yoon, Andrew	4.90	2,082.50	W570	11551492

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	REVIEW AND PREPARE COMMENTS TO EXIT FINANCING AGREEMENTS.				
04/13/04	Merola, Michael	6.00	2,850.00	W570	11615251
	MEETINGS FOR MCI EMERGENCE (2.5) PREPARATION OF NOTES AND GUARANTEES FOR SIGNATURE (2.5) COORDINATION WITH DTC FOR CLOSING (1.0)				
04/14/04	Yoon, Andrew	1.70	722.50	W570	11551498
	REVIEW AND PREPARE COMMENTS TO EXIT FINANCING AGREEMENTS.				
04/14/04	Merola, Michael	2.00	950.00	W570	11615252
	REVISIONS TO NOTES REGARDING EXIT FINANCING				
04/15/04	Yoon, Andrew	2.60	1,105.00	W570	11558164
	REVIEW EXIT FACILITY CLOSING DELIVERIES.				
04/15/04	Goldman, Jeremy	0.50	185.00	W570	11560045
	CLOSING PREPARATIONS.				
04/16/04	Yoon, Andrew	0.40	170.00	W570	11557748
	REVIEW EXIT FINANCING CLOSING DELIVERIES.				
04/16/04	Merola, Michael	7.50	3,562.50	W570	11615212
	CALL WITH TRUSTEE'S COUNSEL REGARDING EMERGENCE CLOSING (1.5) PREPARATION OF OFFICER'S CERTIFICATE, AUTHENTICATION ORDER AND WGM OPINION FOR CLOSING (4.5) EMERGENCE MEETINGS (1.5)				
04/19/04	Yoon, Andrew	9.80	4,165.00	W570	11561497
	CLOSING OF LETTER OF CREDIT FACILITY AT WGM.				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W570 - EXIT FINANCING:		51.20	\$ 22,985.50		
04/01/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	2.00	650.00	W650	11519356
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING TREATMENT OF CLAIMS UNDER PLAN AND GROUNDS TO OBJECT TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT AND PLAN (1.5); REVISE MEMORANDUM REGARDING SAME (.3); REVIEW BACKGROUND PLEADINGS REGARDING AUCTION AND ASSET SALE (.2).				
04/01/04	Grogan, James	4.80	1,752.00	W650	11536770
	REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET (.1); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE SETTLEMENT WITH LEVEL 3 COMMUNICATIONS (.2); DRAFT AND REVISE SUMMARY OF ALLEGIANCE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SAME (.2).				
04/01/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.60	96.00	W650	11528080
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR LEVEL 3 COMMUNICATIONS ORDER AND TRANSMIT TO S. LOFTSPRING (.3)				
04/02/04	Grogan, James	1.40	511.00	W650	11537230
	REVISE SUMMARY OF ALLEGIANCE PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0) AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS RELATED TO SAME (.4)				
04/02/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11528853
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
04/05/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.20	32.00	W650	11530963
04/05/04	Jalomo, Chris DOWNLOAD VIA PACER COURT EMAILS AND CASE PLEADINGS.	1.00	80.00	W650	11537123
04/06/04	Loftspring, Sharon J RESEARCH SUBSTANTIVE CONSOLIDATION.	0.40	130.00	W650	11535814
04/07/04	Grogan, James CONFER WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING OBJECTIONS TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.4); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET AND PLEADINGS (.5).	0.90	328.50	W650	11546928
04/07/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); SEARCH DOCKET FOR FIRST OMNIBUS OBJECTION AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (.2)	0.50	80.00	W650	11542510
04/08/04	Loftspring, Sharon J CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.4); PREPARE SAME (1.0).	1.40	455.00	W650	11537788
04/08/04	Grogan, James TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND RESEARCH VARIOUS LEGAL ISSUES IN SUPPORT OF SAME (.8); REVIEW ALLEGIANCE CASE DOCKET (.1).	1.10	401.50	W650	11546933
04/09/04	Loftspring, Sharon J PREPARE OBJECTION TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.0); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.3).	1.30	422.50	W650	11549025
04/09/04	Grogan, James CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	0.20	73.00	W650	11546937
04/09/04	Mitchel, Gayle DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET	0.30	48.00	W650	11543358
04/11/04	Loftspring, Sharon J PREPARE OBJECTION TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.0); CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.3).	4.30	1,397.50	W650	11549026
04/12/04	Perez, Alfredo REVIEW MEMORANDUM AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING ALLEGIANCE'S PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	0.20	134.00	W650	11551884
04/12/04	Loftspring, Sharon J REVISE PLAN OBJECTION	1.00	325.00	W650	11549029
04/12/04	Grogan, James	1.20	438.00	W650	11569904

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	CORRESPOND WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2); REVISE SUMMARY AND PROPOSED OBJECTIONS TO SAME, AND CIRCULATE SAME TO CLIENT (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.3); REVIEW DRAFT OF ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTION (.3).				
04/12/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11547204
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
04/13/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.50	335.00	W650	11611857
	REVIEW AND REVISE OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT				
04/13/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.80	585.00	W650	11549030
	PREPARE OBJECTION TO PLAN AND DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (1.1) AND CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.7)				
04/13/04	Grogan, James	5.50	2,007.50	W650	11569907
	DRAFT AND REVISE OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (4.2); CONFER WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.3); CORRESPOND WITH S. COHEN AND S. LOFTSPRING REGARDING SUBORDINATION OBJECTIONS (.4); ATTEND TO SERVICE OF OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT ALLEGIANCE HEARING (.3).				
04/13/04	Mitchel, Gayle	3.10	496.00	W650	11554817
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET (.3); REVISE OBJECTION TO ALLEGIANCE MOTION TO APPROVE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT, ELECTRONICALLY FILE, PERFORM SERVICE AND FAX TO KIRKLAND & ELLIS, AKIN GUMP STRAUSS HAUER & FELD, U.S. TRUSTEE AND PAUL, HASTINGS, JANOFSKY & WALKER, DOWNLOAD DISCLOSURE STATEMENT OBJECTIONS AND TRANSMIT TO J. GROGAN (1.9); ARRANGE TELEPHONE CONFERENCE FOR ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING 4/16/04 FOR CHAMBERS (.4); PREPARE AND FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE TO OBJECTIONS TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.5).				
04/14/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	0.20	65.00	W650	11551099
	CONFER WITH J. GROGAN REGARDING UPCOMING HEARING ON OBJECTION TO DISCLOSURE STATEMENT.				
04/15/04	Perez, Alfredo	0.40	268.00	W650	11612541
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. GROGAN AND B. BENJET REGARDING ALLEGIANCE ISSUES				
04/15/04	Grogan, James	2.20	803.00	W650	11571745
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH C. ADAMS AND S. DUNPHY REGARDING TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE AT ALLEGIANCE HEARING (.3); REVIEW VARIOUS CREDITOR OBJECTIONS TO ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH P. ANKER REGARDING SAME (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. PEREZ REGARDING SAME (.2); REVIEW TRADE CREDITOR PROPOSAL REGARDING ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.3).				
04/16/04	Loftspring, Sharon J	1.00	325.00	W650	11556632
	PARTICIPATE TELEPHONICALLY IN DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING.				
04/16/04	Grogan, James	4.00	1,460.00	W650	11571754
	APPEAR AT ALLEGIANCE HEARING ON DEBTOR'S DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (3.8); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND A. PEREZ REGARDING STATUS OF ALLEGIANCE DISCLOSURE STATEMENT (.2).				
04/16/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.50	80.00	W650	11560407

ITEMIZED SERVICES - 81793.0004 - BANKRUPTCY

DATE	TIMEKEEPER/DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	TASK	TIME ID
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS (.3); ARRANGE CONTINUATION OF DISCLOSURE STATEMENT HEARING CONFERENCE CALL WITH COORDINATOR FOR J. GROGAN (.2)				
04/19/04	Mitchel, Gayle	0.30	48.00	W650	11567323
	DOWNLOAD PLEADINGS AND DISTRIBUTE TO ATTORNEYS, UPDATE MASTER DOCKET SHEET				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W650 - MCI/ALLEGIANCE:		42.90	\$ 13,922.50		
04/01/04	Billeck, Jason	0.30	124.50	W690	11531135
	COMMUNICATIONS WITH ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC.'S ATTORNEY, CYPRESS'S ATTORNEY, A. STROCHAK, AND G. MITCHEL REGARDING THE SCHEDULING ORDER.				
04/01/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W690	11536628
	REVIEW AND EXCHANGE CORRESPONDENCE WITH J. BILLECK, J. PARRISH AND A. QUACKENBUSH REGARDING SCHEDULING ORDER FOR ATN COMPLAINT				
04/01/04	Calles, Linda	0.20	29.00	W690	11535021
	PRINT E-MAILS AND CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING CASE.				
04/02/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W690	11537201
	CORRESPOND WITH J. PARRISH, J. BILLECK AND A. QUACKENBUSH REGARDING ATN COMPLAINT SCHEDULING ORDER				
04/02/04	Calles, Linda	2.70	391.50	W690	11535023
	REVIEW AND CODE DOCUMENTS FOR INTEGRATION INTO FILE (2.2); UPDATE FILE OUTLINE (0.5).				
04/05/04	Grogan, James	1.00	365.00	W690	11546917
	REVIEW PLEADINGS AND PREPARE STATEMENT RELATED TO SCHEDULING ORDER AND STATUS CONFERENCE ON ATN ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIMS (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING VARIOUS CLAIM ISSUES AND EXECUTORY CONTRACT ISSUES (.4).				
04/06/04	Grogan, James	0.20	73.00	W690	11546921
	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. BILLECK REGARDING STATUS CONFERENCE ON ATN CLAIM				
04/08/04	Grogan, James	0.30	109.50	W690	11546934
	REVIEW ANSWER TO COMPLAINT FILED BY ATN				
04/12/04	Billeck, Jason	0.60	249.00	W690	11563390
	WORK ON DEPOSITION NOTICE TO ADVANCED TELECOMMUNICATION NETWORK, INC. (.4) AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH B. BENJET, B. TROSPER AND J. GROGAN REGARDING SAME (.2).				
04/12/04	Grogan, James	0.90	328.50	W690	11569905
	REVIEW PROPOSED DEPOSITION NOTICE TO ATN (.2); CORRESPOND WITH B. BENJET AND J. BILLECK REGARDING ATN DISCOVERY (.7).				
SUBTOTAL TASK CODE W690 - ATN:		6.70	\$ 1,852.50		
GRAND TOTAL:		3,485.60	\$ 1,456,438.25		