

David M. Friedman (DF4278)  
Richard F. Casher  
KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
Counsel To The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors  
1633 Broadway  
New York, New York 10019  
(212) 506-1700

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

-----X  
In re :  
 :  
 :  
SUNBEAM CORPORATION, : Chapter 11  
 : Case No. 01-40291 (AJG)  
 :  
Debtor. :  
 :  
 :  
-----X

**APPLICATION FOR FIFTH MONTHLY ALLOWANCE  
OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES OF  
KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP, COUNSEL  
FOR THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS**

Name of Applicant:	Kasowitz, Benson, Torres & Friedman LLP
Authorized to Provide Services to:	Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors
Date of Retention:	February 6, 2001
Compensation Sought as Actual, Reasonable and Necessary:	\$201,775.50 (less 20% holdback amount)
Expense Reimbursement Sought as Actual, Reasonable & Necessary:	\$17,892.58
Prior Fee Applications filed by Applicant:	Application for First Monthly Allowance was filed on May 9, 2001. Application for Second Monthly Allowance was also filed on May 9, 2001. Application for Third Monthly Allowance was filed on May 15, 2001. Application for Fourth Monthly Allowance was filed on July 6, 2001.

**SUMMARY BY PROFESSIONALS**

	<b>YEAR ADMITTED</b>	<b>RATE PER HOUR</b>	<b>NUMBER OF HOURS</b>	<b>TOTAL INVESTMENT</b>
David M. Friedman Partner	1982	\$595	91.0	\$54,145.00
Richard F. Casher Partner	Admitted in Connecticut 1976	\$500	88.1	\$44,050.00
Andrew K. Glenn Associate	1995	\$315	169.0	\$53,235.00
Alan S. Lungen Associate	1999	\$275	56.4	\$15,510.00
Lisa G. Laukitis Associate	2000	\$185	153.5	\$28,397.50
Craig S. Hueneke Paralegal	N/A	\$105	15.9	\$1,669.50
Jerome Brown Paralegal	N/A	\$85	40.50	\$3,442.50
Evelyn Rodriquez Paralegal	N/A	\$105	1.5	\$157.50
Lana Z. Rafael Paralegal	N/A	\$95	12.3	\$1,168.50
		<b>TOTALS:</b>	<b>628.2</b>	<b>\$201,775.50</b>

**EXPENSE SUMMARY**

<b><u>Expense Category</u></b>	<b><u>Total Expenses</u></b>
Transcripts	\$796.00
Travel Expenses	\$399.80
Local Transportation	\$225.80
Business Meals	\$271.53
Automated Research	\$7,011.38
Document Reproduction	\$6,035.21
Document Delivery	\$339.16
Telephone	\$2,691.15
Facsimile Transmission	\$9.11
Mailing Charges	\$113.44
<b>TOTAL:</b>	<b>\$17,892.58</b>

David M. Friedman (DF4278)  
Richard F. Casher

KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
Counsel To The Official Committee Of Unsecured Creditors  
1633 Broadway  
New York, New York 10019  
(212) 506-1700

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

-----X  
In re :  
 :  
SUNBEAM CORPORATION, : Chapter 11  
 : Case No. 01-40291 (AJG)  
Debtor. :  
 :  
-----X

STATE OF NEW YORK )  
 ) ss:  
COUNTY OF NEW YORK )

David M. Friedman, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

1. I am a member of the firm of Kasowitz, Benson, Torres & Friedman LLP (“KBT&F”), counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors herein.
2. I have read the foregoing Application for the Fifth Monthly Allowance of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of KBT&F, counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Application”) and know the contents thereof. The same are true to the best of my knowledge, except as to matters therein alleged to be upon information and belief, and as to those matters, I believe them to be true. I have personally observed the legal services rendered by KBT&F and am familiar with all work performed on behalf of the Committee by the attorneys and paralegals in the firm.
3. The Application, to the best of my knowledge, complies with the mandatory

guidelines set forth by this Court in the Order Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals (the “Order”). Furthermore, to the best of my knowledge, information and belief, the fees and disbursements sought within the Application fall within the guidelines set forth in the Order and are billed at rates and in accordance with practices customarily employed by KBT&F and generally accepted by KBT&F’s clients.

4. All parties entitled to receive service of this Application, asset forth in the Order, have been served with such.

3. In accordance with Bankruptcy Rules 2016(a) and § 504 of the Bankruptcy Code, no agreement or understanding exists between the Applicant and any other person for the sharing of compensation to be received in connection with the within cases.

/s/ David M. Friedman  
David M. Friedman

Sworn before me this  
16<sup>th</sup> day of August, 2001.  
/s/ Lana Rafael  
Notary Public

Lana Rafailova  
Notary Public, State of New York  
No. 01RA6042271  
Qualified in Kings County  
Commission Expires May 22, 2002

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180001  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

TRANSCRIPTS	796.00
TRAVEL EXPENSES	399.80
LOCAL TRANSPORTATION	225.80
BUSINESS MEALS	271.53
AUTOMATED RESEARCH	7,011.38
DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION	6,035.21
DOCUMENT DELIVERY	339.16
TELEPHONE	2,691.15
FACSIMILE TRANSMISSION	9.11
MAILING CHARGES	113.44

TOTAL COSTS \$ 17,892.58

TOTAL FEES AND COSTS \$ 17,892.58

KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
1633 BROADWAY  
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10019-6799

Federal I.D. # 13-3720397

JUNE 30, 2001

06180004  
Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
Case Administration

DATE	ATTORNEY OR ASSISTANT	HOURS
06/02/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of pending pleadings.	1.60
06/04/01	ANDREW GLENN Calls with committee members and Chanin re: access to reports, information.	.50
06/04/01	LANA Z. RAFAEL Chron 9 boxes of documents.	4.80
06/05/01	LANA Z. RAFAEL Chron Sunbeam set of documents.	2.50
06/11/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review pleadings.	.30
06/12/01	LANA Z. RAFAEL Update Sunbeam Service List.	3.00
06/13/01	JEROME BROWN Review sort Sunbeam docs.	8.00
06/14/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review DIP objection to Galveston plaintiffs stay relief motion.	.50
06/14/01	JEROME BROWN Review sort Sunbeam docs.	8.00
06/15/01	JEROME BROWN Review sort Sunbeam docs.	8.00
06/17/01	JEROME BROWN Review sort Sunbeam docs.	5.00

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180004  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/18/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of confirmation stay motion (.4); review of pleadings received (.6); review of documents (.6).	1.60
06/18/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Online retrieval of case documents.	.70
06/20/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Case administration; review of documents.	2.50
06/21/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Online retrieval of statement of financial affairs. (.30); scan and file Channin May fee statement. (1.80).	2.10
06/22/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review various pleadings.	.30
06/22/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Organization of documents and discovery.	1.50
06/28/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Prep stipulation for service and forward to chambers.	1.50
	TOTAL HOURS	52.40

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180004  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

	HOURS	AMOUNT
PARTNER		
RICHARD F. CASHER	1.10	550.00
ASSOCIATE		
ANDREW GLENN	0.50	157.50
LISA G. LAUKITIS	7.20	1,332.00
PARALEGAL		
JEROME BROWN	29.00	2,465.00
CRAIG HUENEKE	4.30	451.50
LANA Z. RAFAEL	10.30	978.50
TOTAL FEES		\$ 5,934.50
TOTAL COSTS		\$ .00
TOTAL FEES AND COSTS		\$ 5,934.50

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180004  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
1633 BROADWAY  
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10019-6799

Federal I.D. # 13-3720397

JUNE 30, 2001

06180006  
Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
Fee Application

DATE	ATTORNEY OR ASSISTANT	HOURS
06/20/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review time entries.	1.00
06/22/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of documents.	.60
06/22/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Serve Channin fee statement for the month of May.	1.80
06/22/01	LANA Z. RAFAEL File and Serve Channin fee apps.	2.00
06/25/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Revisions to time entries.	.60
06/26/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Draft of fee app and revision of time entries.	2.10
	TOTAL HOURS	8.10

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180006  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

	HOURS	AMOUNT
ASSOCIATE		
LISA G. LAUKITIS	4.30	795.50
PARALEGAL		
CRAIG HUENEKE	1.80	189.00
LANA Z. RAFAEL	2.00	190.00
TOTAL FEES		\$ 1,174.50
TOTAL COSTS		\$ .00
TOTAL FEES AND COSTS		\$ 1,174.50

KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
1633 BROADWAY  
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10019-6799

Federal I.D. # 13-3720397

JUNE 30, 2001

06180007  
Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
Plan and Disclosure Statement

DATE	ATTORNEY OR ASSISTANT	HOURS
06/01/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Instructions by e-mail to LGL re revision of confirmation objections.	.70
06/01/01	ANDREW GLENN Calls with Brendan O'Leary and Matt Yu re DIP financing issues in valuation.	.40
06/02/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review Harnischfeger decision re valuation.	.40
06/03/01	RICHARD F. CASHER O/c w/LGL re objections to plan.	.20
06/03/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS O/c with RFC re plan objections (.2); review of Harnischfeger article (.4); revisions to plan objection (.8).	1.40
06/04/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN O/c RFC re confirmation, discovery and claims.	1.40
06/04/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Draft e-mail to LGL re confirmation objections (.1); mtg. w/DMF re confirmation hearing issues, discovery, potential claims vs Morgan Stanley (1.4); review revised Chanin report (.4).	1.90
06/04/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Drafting of objection to plan confirmation and revisions.	1.50

06/06/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Attention to confirmation objections status (.1); analysis re discovery docs., theories raised by docs., good faith issues, litigation strategy (2.0); o/c LGL re objection (.2).	2.30
06/06/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS T/c w/RFC re objection (.2); t/cs w/Hueneke re same (.3).	.50
06/07/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS O/c w/C. Hueneke re opinion and schedules (.2); legal research re best interest of creditors and no premium rule (7.4).	7.60
06/08/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Research re best interests of creditors (1.5); drafting and revisions to objection to plan confirmation (3.5).	5.00
06/11/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review and revise revised draft of confirmation objections and related legal analysis (4.2); conf. w/ASL re "best interests" issues and instructions to ASL re legal research (.3); conf. w/LGL re confirmation objections (1.2).	5.70
06/11/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS O/c with RFC re objection (1.2); review and revisions to objection (1.0).	2.20
06/11/01	ALAN LUNGEN O/c RFC re "best interest" issues.	.30
06/12/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN O/c RFC and AKG re case status and discovery.	1.30
06/12/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Revise draft combination objections and related review (1.0), analysis of plan, disclosure statement (1.0), review of schedules, pertinent case law, discovery docs. (4.1); confs. w/DMF, AKG re same (1.3).	7.40
06/12/01	ANDREW GLENN O/c RFC and DMF re plan and disclosure statement and discovery.	1.30

06/13/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Revise draft confirmation objections and related analysis of applicable authorities (8.1); related confs. w/LGL (.4), ASL (.3); review discovery docs. relevant to confirmation objections (.3).	9.10
06/13/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS O/c w/RFC re objection (.4); additional research re same (1.2); revision to objection (.8); review of Harnishfeger decision (.9).	3.30
06/13/01	ALAN LUNGEN O/c RFC re confirmation objections.	.30
06/14/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Revise draft confirmation objections (3.0); attention to pertinent case law (2.0), review of plan disclosure statement, media articles, discovery documents, PWC complaint and other background materials (4.0).	9.00
06/14/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review correspondence regarding confirmation discovery (.2); instructions to L. Laukitis regarding further legal research regarding confirmation objections and revision of draft objections (.8).	1.00
06/14/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Additional research re objection (.6); research and review of cases regarding objection, draft of objection, review of docs (7.1); o/cs w/RFC re same (.8).	8.50
06/15/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Attention to discovery documents (2.3); review pertinent case law and revise draft confirmation objections (3.9).	6.20
06/15/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Research and revisions to objection.	1.50
06/16/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of cases re releases.	1.50
06/17/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of cases re good faith (1.5); review of objection (.6); revision and redraft of release section (1.5).	3.60

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180007  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/18/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review doc. discovery (2.5); review Chanin valuation analysis (.2); attention to objections to confirmation (3.8); o/c LGL re same (.2).	6.70
06/18/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Revisions to objection (2.5); o/c w/RFC re same (.2).	2.70
06/19/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Revise draft confirmation objections (1.7), review pertinent case law (1.0).	2.70
06/19/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare for Levin deposition, including extensive research and document review (7.0); review Hartman deposition transcript (1.3).	8.30
06/20/01	RICHARD F. CASHER T/c w/M. Yu re valuation issue (.2); revise confirmation objections and attention to pertinent case law (3.3); t/c LGL re objection (.2).	3.70
06/20/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare for and attend deposition of Jerry Levin, including preparation and review of documents, exhibits.	7.70
06/20/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Draft of good faith memo (1.2); research re good faith (.5); research re objection (1.0); revisions to objection (2.0); t/c with RFC re objection (.2).	4.90
06/21/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Revise draft confirmation objections and related legal analysis re UFCA and UFTA (6.3); t/c w/G. Davis re conf. objection due date (.2); o/cs with LGL re objection (.6).	7.10
06/21/01	ANDREW GLENN E-mail to Committee re status of investigation, confirmation issues (1.2); calls with Mo Marx re same (.3).	1.50
06/21/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of cases re subordination (1.5); o/c w/RFC re objection (.6); o/cs RFC re objection (.2).	2.30

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180007  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/22/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Revise draft confirmation objections (1.1); t/c M. Yu re valuation issues (.2); instructions to L. Laukitis re draft confirmation objections (.2); review email from G. Davis's secretary and draft reply to G. Davis re confirmation objection due date (.6).	2.10
06/22/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS O/c RFC re objection.	.20
06/25/01	RICHARD F. CASHER O/c LGL re objection.	.20
06/25/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Revisions to objection (1.5); o/c w/DMF re objection (.2).	1.70
06/27/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Cite check objection (1.2); review of schedules and statements (.6); revisions to objections (1.3); review of Levin depo (1.2).	4.30
06/28/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Revisions to objection to confirmation draft of section on equitable subordination complaint.	1.30
06/29/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Draft of stay section, revisions to objection (3.6); review of case law re stay (3.5).	7.10
	TOTAL HOURS	150.00

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180007  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE 6

	HOURS	AMOUNT
PARTNER		
RICHARD F. CASHER	66.40	33,200.00
DAVID M. FRIEDMAN	2.70	1,606.50
ASSOCIATE		
ANDREW GLENN	19.20	6,048.00
LISA G. LAUKITIS	61.10	11,303.50
ALAN LUNGEN	0.60	165.00

TOTAL FEES \$ 52,323.00

TOTAL COSTS \$ .00

TOTAL FEES AND COSTS \$ 52,323.00

KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
1633 BROADWAY  
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10019-6799

Federal I.D. # 13-3720397

JUNE 30, 2001

06180010  
Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
Discovery and Investigation

DATE	ATTORNEY OR ASSISTANT	HOURS
06/01/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Document review and due diligence re investigation (3.8); conference call w/ committee members re same and valuation issues (1.8); discovery correspondence (.8).	6.40
06/01/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review Porat deposition transcript.	.70
06/01/01	ANDREW GLENN Review discovery materials for claims analysis.	2.00
06/01/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of documents.	7.50
06/01/01	ALAN LUNGEN Diligence; review of documents.	6.90
06/03/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Attending to discovery issues (.5); o/c w/HWS re letter to Polovoy (.2); draft of letter to Polovoy, sending MT same (.5); o/c's with ASL re documents (.3); review of documents (1.4); review of documents from Sunbeam and First Union (4.0); review of Porat and Strong depos re exhibits (.9).	7.80
06/04/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Discovery correspondence and continue document review (3.1); conf call w/Committee (.9).	4.00
06/04/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review Sunbeam press releases.	.30

06/04/01	ANDREW GLENN	4.20
	Letters to Diane Harvey & Ted Gewertz re discovery issues (1.8); calls with Gewertz, Harvey re same (.5); review discovery strategy (.5); e-mails with Alan Lungen re transcripts of various depositions in Sunbeam litigation (.5); calls with lawyers for Kersh & Dunlap re same (.5); o/c ASL and LGL re documents (.4).	
06/04/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS	11.20
	Review of documents (2.7); o/c w/ASL re documents (.3); o/c's with C. Hueneke, L. Rafael, DMF, AKG re documents (.9); attending to Porat & Strong exhibits (2.5); review of documents (4.4); o/cs with AKG and ALS re same (.4).	
06/04/01	ALAN LUNGEN	8.80
	Due diligence (8.1), t/c w/Skadden re docs. (.2); t/c w/Weil re same (.1); o/c AKG and LGL re same (.4).	
06/05/01	RICHARD F. CASHER	.40
	Attention to docs. review status (.1); review background docs. (.3).	
06/05/01	ANDREW GLENN	4.30
	Continue review of discovery materials (3.6); o/c ASL and LGL re documents (.7).	
06/05/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS	13.20
	Review of documents (12.5); o/c's with ASL, AKG re same (.7).	
06/05/01	ALAN LUNGEN	11.70
	Diligence at Weil (7.5); review docs./diligence (3.0); draft short memo re Morgan fees (.5); o/c AKG, LGL re same (.7).	
06/06/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN	5.40
	Review of Chanin report (.6); calls w/opposing counsel (.5); further document review (2.1); work on certification objections (2.0); o/c AKG, RFC, LGL re same (.2).	
06/06/01	RICHARD F. CASHER	.20
	O/c AKG, DMF, LGL re documents.	

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/06/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue analysis of discovery materials (1.3); calls with counsel to David Fannin (.7); review e-mails from DMF re Morgan Stanley issues, chronology (.3); o/c DMF, RFC, LGL re same (.2).	2.50
06/06/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of documents (8.9); o/c w/AKG, RFC and DMF re same (.2).	9.10
06/06/01	ALAN LUNGEN Diligence at Weil (3.7); review additional docs. (3.0); draft time line memo (2.0); review collateral docs. and public filings (.4); draft short memo (.7).	9.80
06/06/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Review and sort collate hot documents for deposition matters.	1.90
06/07/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review chronology of events and attention to doc. production status.	.50
06/07/01	ANDREW GLENN Drafted subpoena for discovery materials in other Sunbeam litigation.	.90
06/07/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue review of discovery materials (2.8); begin preparing for depositions of bank and debtor witnesses (1.4); t/c LGL re documents (.2); t/c ASL re time line (.2).	4.60
06/07/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS T/c with AKG re documents (.2); o/c's w/C. Hueneke and J. Brown re same (.3).	.50
06/07/01	ALAN LUNGEN T/c w/AKG re time line.	.10
06/08/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Calls w/opposing counsel (.3); continued fact investigation re bank group (2.4).	2.70
06/08/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review docs. re Morgan Stanley (.2); analysis re Morgan Stanley's duties as underwriter (.2); attention to equitable subordination issues,	1.20

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

confirmation hearing delays, potential  
settlement, best interests of creditors  
analysis (.6); t/c ASL re research (.2).

06/08/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue preparation for depositions, including extensive document review and analysis (6.5); legal research re due diligence obligations of underwriters (1.4).	7.90
06/08/01	ALAN LUNGEN Legal research re UCC's and claims review article (.1); mailing for RFC (.1); t/c w/ RFC re research and mailing (.2).	.40
06/10/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue review of "hot documents."	3.70
06/10/01	ALAN LUNGEN Review diligence docs.	.80
06/11/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Prepare for depositions of Michael Hart; document review (8.5); o/c AKG re same (.5).	9.00
06/11/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review discovery "hot" docs. (1.6); review bank privilege logs (.2); o/c ASL re research (.3).	2.10
06/11/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue preparations for Michael Hart deposition (6.0); calls with DMF re same (.5); prepare subpoena to Arthur Anderson (.5); o/c LGL re exhibits (.4); o/c ASL re document production (.3).	7.70
06/11/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of bank documents received (1.6); o/cs w/AKG re exhibits for deposition (.4).	2.00
06/11/01	ALAN LUNGEN Legal research and draft memorandum re tort claims (3.7); confs. w/C. Hueneke and AKG re doc. production (.3); conf. w/RFC re research (.3).	4.30
06/12/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Conduct deposition of Michael Hart and related preparations.	8.50

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/12/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare for and attend deposition of Michael Hart.	7.50
06/12/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Attendance at and preparation for deposition of Michael Hart.	3.10
06/12/01	ALAN LUNGEN Legal research re UCC liens.	1.00
06/12/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Retrieve case documents and prep for duplication as exhibits to depositions.	1.30
06/13/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN O/c RFC re discovery.	.50
06/13/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Debrief DMF re deposition and discovery (.5); o/c ASL re research (.4).	.90
06/13/01	ANDREW GLENN Letter to John Walsh re Arthur Anderson production (.9); several calls with John Walsh re same (.7); review Hart deposition transcript (.9); continue review of discovery materials (4.0); letter to Diane Harvey re transcripts in other Sunbeam litigation (.5); o/c LGL re documents (.3).	7.30
06/13/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS O/c with AKG re documents.	.30
06/13/01	ALAN LUNGEN Legal research re breach of contract, draft short memo (2.0); review docs./discovery (2.0); confs. w/RFC re research and diligence (.4); revise lien memo (.3).	4.70
06/14/01	ANDREW GLENN Review SEC complaint (1.0); begin drafting complaint against banks (2.9); research & review re: same (2.8).	6.70
06/14/01	ALAN LUNGEN Legal research re fraud transfers and trusts; draft portion of objection.	2.30
06/14/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Prepar exhibits for depositions.	2.20

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/15/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Preparation for Jenkins v. Levin depositions, document review.	3.20
06/15/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Conference with A. Glenn regarding fraudulent transfer claim regarding banks and setoff.	.30
06/15/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue working on Morgan Stanley complaint (5.4); continue review of exhibits, discovery materials, AA transcripts (3.3); o/c RFC re same (.3).	9.00
06/15/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of documents.	5.50
06/15/01	ALAN LUNGEN Review diligence documents.	.30
06/16/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue work on Morgan Stanley complaint.	4.70
06/17/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review discovery documents.	.80
06/17/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue work on Morgan Stanley complaint.	3.00
06/18/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Depo prep, calls w/opposing counsel, work on confirmation objection.	2.70
06/18/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue drafting and revising complaint (6.5); review background materials on Dunlap (3.0).	9.50
06/18/01	ALAN LUNGEN Review and revise lien memo (.4); conf. w/C. Hueneke re confirmations, review filings (.6).	1.00
06/19/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Prepare for Levin deposition (2.0); related document review (1.0); prepare for Wheelock deposition (2.6).	5.60
06/19/01	ANDREW GLENN Calls with John Walsh re: AA document production, confidentiality (.3); continue work on complaint (1.5).	1.80

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/19/01	JEROME BROWN Prepare Sunbeam docs for Deposition.	3.50
06/20/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Prepare for and conduct deposition of Jerry Levin (8.3); calls w/clients (.6); prepare for Wheelock deposition (1.9).	10.80
06/20/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Prep. for and participation in deposition of J. Levin.	8.30
06/20/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue work on complaint (2.1); calls with counsel to Arthur Anderson re production issues, confidentiality (.5); o/c LGL re depos. (.8).	3.40
06/20/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Assist in assembling Levin depo exhibits (.5); review of documents (2.5); o/c with AKG re Levin depo and B of A depo (.8); preparation of exhibits for B of A depo (2.1).	5.90
06/20/01	ALAN LUNGEN Review schedules and diligence documents from Weil.	2.70
06/20/01	JEROME BROWN Prepare Sunbeam docs for Deposition.	8.00
06/20/01	CRAIG HUENEKE Prep case documents for deposition matters.(2.40); Online research of UCC filings in Florida. (1.50); meet with UCC service rep in effort to obtain UCC filings in a timely manner. (.50).	4.40
06/21/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Conduct deposition of Pete Wheelock and related preparation.	7.50
06/21/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue research & review re: complaint (1.7); continue drafting and revising complaint (2.5).	4.20
06/21/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Attending to deposition preparations (1.8); o/cs with K. Sicklick and B. Giannasio re depo (.4); attendance at deposition (3.9).	6.10

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/21/01	ALAN LUNGEN Review diligence documents	1.00
06/22/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Work on confirmation objection.	1.80
06/22/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Review discovery documents.	1.70
06/22/01	ANDREW GLENN Review Arthur Anderson materials (3.0); continue work on complaint (7.2).	10.20
06/23/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Conf. A. Glenn re discovery documents and draft email to A. Glenn.	.40
06/23/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue drafting and revising Morgan Stanley complaint (2.5); continue document review re: same (2.1).	4.60
06/24/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue work on complaint.	2.00
06/25/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Work on confirmation objections (2.8); prep re deposition of Dierdra Doyle (2.0).	4.80
06/25/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare for and attend deposition of Deirdre Doyle (7.0); continue work on complaint (1.5); continue research on former Morgan Stanley employees (.4); call with former Morgan Stanley employee (.5); call with Dan Gropper re same (.4); t/c LGL re Doyle depo (.2).	10.00
06/25/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS T/c from AKG re Doyle depo (.2); review of documents received (1.2).	1.40
06/26/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Prepare for and conduct deposition of Dierdra Doyle.	6.50
06/26/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue work on complaint (7.9); continue research re: former Morgan Stanley employees (1.2).	9.10

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE

06/26/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Participation in Doyle depo (3.0); prep for same (.4).	3.40
06/27/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Work on confirmation objections (2.4); t/c AKG and Gewertz re complaints (.2).	2.60
06/27/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare and revised stipulation extending time to file complaint (.5); calls with DMF and Ted Gewertz re: same (.2); continue work on complaint (5.1).	5.80
06/27/01	EVELYN RODRIGUEZ Contact CT Corp. re: UCC filings	.50
06/28/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Discovery review re bank investigation and objections to confirmations.	4.20
06/28/01	ANDREW GLENN Continue drafting and revising complaint against banks (5.9); research & review re: same (2.1).	8.00
06/28/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Review of Levin depo.	1.10
06/28/01	EVELYN RODRIGUEZ Contact CT Corp. re: UCC filings, follow up with e-mail to Craig Hueneke.	1.00
06/29/01	DAVID M. FRIEDMAN Work on confirmation objection.	2.10
06/29/01	ANDREW GLENN O/c LGL re Levin transcript (.1); o/c LGL re complaint (.1).	.20
06/29/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS T/cs Cruz, Hueneke, AKG re Levin transcript (.3); o/c AKG re complaint (.2); review of complaint (1.0).	1.50

TOTAL HOURS

409.10

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180010  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE 1

	HOURS	AMOUNT
PARTNER		
RICHARD F. CASHER	17.80	8,900.00
DAVID M. FRIEDMAN	88.30	52,538.50
ASSOCIATE		
ANDREW GLENN	144.80	45,612.00
LISA G. LAUKITIS	79.60	14,726.00
ALAN LUNGEN	55.80	15,345.00
PARALEGAL		
JEROME BROWN	11.50	977.50
CRAIG HUENEKE	9.80	1,029.00
EVELYN RODRIGUEZ	1.50	157.50

TOTAL FEES \$ 139,285.50

TOTAL COSTS \$ .00

TOTAL FEES AND COSTS \$ 139,285.50

KASOWITZ, BENSON, TORRES & FRIEDMAN LLP  
1633 BROADWAY  
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10019-6799

Federal I.D. # 13-3720397

JUNE 30, 2001

06180012  
Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
Meeting of Creditors

DATE	ATTORNEY OR ASSISTANT	HOURS
06/01/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Participate in Committee conf. call.	1.50
06/01/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare for and attend conference call/meeting with Committee re status of case.	2.00
06/03/01	LISA G. LAUKITIS Committee call.	1.30
06/04/01	RICHARD F. CASHER Participate in conf. call w/committee.	1.30
06/26/01	ANDREW GLENN E-mails with committee members re conference call, agenda.	.50
06/28/01	ANDREW GLENN Prepare for and attend conference call with Committee.	2.00
	TOTAL HOURS	8.60

Sunbeam Corporation Creditors Committee  
FILE NUMBER: 06180012  
INVOICE NO.: \*\*\*\*\*

Jun 30, 2001

PAGE 2

	HOURS	AMOUNT
PARTNER		
RICHARD F. CASHER	2.80	1,400.00
ASSOCIATE		
ANDREW GLENN	4.50	1,417.50
LISA G. LAUKITIS	1.30	240.50
TOTAL FEES		\$ 3,058.00
TOTAL COSTS		\$ .00
TOTAL FEES AND COSTS		\$ 3,058.00