

08/08/03 PLH	E-mails regarding amended plan and disclosure statement (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same and voting procedures (.5); prepare order and exhibits on voting procedures (1.0); address balloting issues (1.3); prepare confirmation timeline and task list (.7); e-mails with attorney for Congress Financial (.4)	4.40
08/08/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding disclosure statement (.2); respond to D. Wanlass memorandum regarding 1114 and plan (.2)	.40
08/08/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden and D. Swan regarding timing and disclosure approval	.20
08/08/03 DIS	Review contract procedure order (.2); review and revise voting procedure order (.5); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding orders (.3); letter to Judge Howard (.2); coordinate submission of blackline disclosure statement and orders to judge (.3); numerous telephone calls with K. Wilson (.5)	2.00
08/11/03 PLH	Review orders entered by court regarding disclosure statement (.4); telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues and procedures (.3); e-mails regarding plan issues (.4)	1.10
08/11/03 RGS	Telephone conference with A. Eckstein (.3); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.3); telephone conference with D. Wanlass (.2); telephone conference with J. O'Leary (.4); telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding USWA and plan issues (.2)	1.40
08/11/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding board meeting, labor and plan	.20
08/11/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding plan and labor issues (.3); e-mail to various parties regarding conference call on labor and plan issues (.3)	.60
08/11/03 DIS	Telephone conference with K. Wilson regarding status of disclosure statement approval and related orders	.10

08/11/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding implications of labor issues on pending disclosure statement approval	.30
08/11/03 HRH	Transmit amended disclosure statement to R. McDonald upon attorney's request	.20
08/12/03 PLH	Conference call regarding plan issues (1:0); call with Donlin regarding solicitation (.5); prepare documents for solicitation (2.0)	3.50
08/12/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. Crouch (.1); prepare for conference call including list of open items (.3); telephone conference with R. Dropkin regarding open items (.1)	.50
08/12/03 RGS	Participate in conference call with D. Wanlass, R. Dropkin, P. Hayden, R. Crouch, J. O'Leary and E. Wodarczyk regarding labor and pension issues	1.20
08/12/03 RGS	Conference with R. Crouch and D. Swan regarding timing and planning (.3); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding timing on plan (.2); telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding service of 1114 motion (.1)	.60
08/12/03 RGS	Telephone conference with C. Jones (.2); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.2); telephone conference with D. Wanlass (.3); telephone conference with R. Dropkin (.3); revise USWA letter (1.4)	2.40
08/12/03 DIS	E-mail correspondence with C. Dickson of Donlin Recano regarding voting agent agreement	.10
08/12/03 SBB	Review DTC position list regarding ballot and solicitation materials (.1); telephone call to P. Hayden regarding same and related ballot solicitation issues (.3)	.40
08/12/03 JEV	Research objections and reclassifications to claims for voting purposes issues	1.30
08/12/03 JEV	Research balloting and solicitation issues	.60

08/13/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding voting procedures and issues (.5); prepare solicitation materials (2.5); telephone call with Donlin Recano regarding DTC (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan issues (.3)	3.60
08/13/03	RGS	Telephone conference with A. Eckstein regarding plan issues and labor	.20
08/13/03	RGS	Review ballot and other matters to be enclosed with ballot package	.30
08/13/03	DIS	Disclosure statement exhibits to Donlin Recano	.10
08/14/03	PLH	E-mails with committee regarding plan support letter (.4); e-mails with R. Sable regarding plan confirmation issues (.4); telephone call and e-mail to Donlin Recano regarding plan solicitation issues (.7); prepare stipulation on 1114 motion and disclosure statement (.8)	2.30
08/14/03	RGS	Review letter and provides changes to D. Wanlass	.30
08/14/03	RGS	Review and analyze stipulation	.30
08/14/03	RGS	Review e-mail from C. Gottschalk and e-mail to D. Wanlass	.30
08/14/03	RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden (.3); telephone conference with P. Hayden and G. Schaaf regarding 1114 and plan (.3); telephone conference with C. Jones (.2); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.1); telephone conference with C. Gottschalk's office (.2); review retiree stipulation and discuss with P. Hayden (.3)	1.60
08/14/03	RGS	Telephone conference with C. Gottschalk (.3); letter to Rosenberg, et al. regarding status (.4); telephone conference with J. O'Leary regarding USWA issues (.2)	.90
08/15/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding modification of dates under voting procedures order (.7); review pleadings regarding same (.5); modify plan notices regarding voting procedures (.5); address solicitation issues (1.0)	2.70

08/15/03	RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding claims issues and voting (.3); telephone conference with R. Dropkin regarding USWA (.2)	.50
08/15/03	DIS	Telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding plan confirmation time line and various scheduling issues	.50
08/15/03	MJA	Review all recent correspondence regarding plan and disclosure statement; begin indexing into summation and chronological order for inclusion into existing files	5.00
08/16/03	PLH	E-mails regarding plan confirmation issues (.2); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.2); review solicitation procedures (.5)	.90
08/17/03	PLH	Prepare confirmation hearing notice (.3); e-mail to Donlin regarding plan (.3)	.60
08/18/03	PLH	Review and proof solicitation materials (2.0); telephone conference with V. Batey about solicitation issues (.7); prepare instructions for solicitation materials (1.0); telephone conference with D. Swan about voting classes and related issues (.5); address solicitation issues (1.3)	5.50
08/18/03	DIS	Review overview of voting procedures prepared by Donlin Recano	.20
08/18/03	DIS	Revise voting agent agreement and send to C. Donlin	.20
08/18/03	DIS	Two telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding voting procedures	.40
08/19/03	PLH	Prepare solicitation materials (3.0); telephone call with C. Donlin regarding same (.7); telephone call with Bowne regarding same (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding voting register (1.3)	5.30
08/19/03	RGS	Telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.1); telephone conference with A. Eckstein regarding plan issues (.3); conference with D. Swan regarding voting procedures and notice issues (.3)	.70
08/19/03	DIS	Telephone conference with Nona and service of disclosure statement exhibits to W. Wyatt	.20

08/19/03	TMC	Gather and send requested documents to W. Wyatt per the request of D. Swan	.50
08/20/03	PLH	Address solicitation issues (2.5); review and proof solicitation materials (1.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.5); prepare confirmation timeline (.5)	5.00
08/20/03	AKS	Telephone conference with M. Miller regarding UCC searches (.2); attention to prior UCC searches (.3); telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding UCC searches (.2); telephone conference with R. Berger regarding closing issues (.2)	.90
08/20/03	RGS	Telephone conference with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues	.30
08/20/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding solicitation package mailing	.20
08/20/03	DIS	Review revised voting procedures overview and voting register	.20
08/20/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding voting package issues and committee issues	.60
08/21/03	PLH	Prepare solicitation of plan materials (3.0); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan issues (.4); telephone call with D. Swan regarding solicitation (.8)	4.20
08/21/03	PLH	Telephone call with J. O'Leary regarding PBGC issues	.30
08/21/03	RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding Chapter 11 mailing and committee letter	.30
08/21/03	DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding status of solicitation package preparation	.20
08/21/03	DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding list of equity holders	.20
08/21/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding details of solicitation package mailings and DTC listings	.60
08/22/03	PLH	Attention to plan solicitation issues (1.5); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan issues (.3)	1.80

08/22/03	RGS	Review D. Wanlass' letter to USWA and forward (.3); telephone conference with D. Wanlass and J. Hensler regarding PBGC and sale alternatives (.3); telephone conference with M. Richards regarding plan, preference and committee issues (.4)	1.00
08/22/03	RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden (.2); telephone conference with M. Richards regarding USWA and stipulation (.2)	.40
08/22/03	DIS	Supervise mailing of solicitation package; travel to and from New York	6.00
08/22/03	DIS	Two telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding solicitation package mailing and upcoming deadlines on other matters	.50
08/22/03	DIS	Two telephone calls with H. Hickman regarding plan service issues	.20
08/23/03	PLH	Review solicitation procedures and materials (.6); prepare for confirmation hearing (.4)	1.00
08/25/03	PLH	Telephone call with V. Batey regarding solicitation issues (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan supplement and confirmation issues (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.4); prepare and review issues for confirmation (1.5); e-mails regarding same (.4)	3.10
08/25/03	RGS	Review plan supplement agenda and pension changes with P. Hayden	.70
08/25/03	RGS	Telephone conference with M. Richards (.3); telephone conference P. Hayden regarding plan and labor status (.4)	.70
08/25/03	RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding plan logistics and voting issues	.30
08/25/03	DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding plan solicitation mailing and DTC issues	.20
08/25/03	DIS	Telephone conference with R. Sable and P. Hayden regarding plan supplement documents	.30
08/25/03	DIS	E-mail correspondence with P. Hayden regarding plan confirmation hearing notice	.10

08/25/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding stockholder notice issues	.30
08/26/03 PLH	Conference call regarding status of plan issues (1.0); telephone call with D. Swan regarding plan solicitation issues (.5); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan supplement documents (.3); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding same (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding plan supplement (.3)	2.40
08/26/03 RGS	Telephone conference with C. Jones (.3); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg regarding USWA and further action (.2)	.50
08/26/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement notes (.2); conference with D. Swan regarding claims and notice issue (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding schedule (.2)	.60
08/26/03 DIS	Review plan confirmation timeline, issues and plan supplement list	.20
08/26/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement documents	.30
08/26/03 DIS	Review stock option list and agreement and examine service issue (.5); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan service and conference with R. Sable (.5)	1.00
08/26/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding plan supplement documents	.20
08/27/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding plan supplement documents (.4); telephone call with L. Anutta regarding registration rights agreement (.3); e-mails regarding plan supplement documents (.4); review requirements for plan supplement documents (1.0); telephone call with D. Swan regarding solicitation issues (.3)	2.40
08/27/03 RGS	Work on preparation for hearing on 1113 and 1114 (.6); telephone conference with C. Jones regarding hearing and voting (.2); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding stipulation (.2)	1.00

08/27/03	RGS	Telephone conference with M. Richards (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden (.2); e-mail to D. Wanlass regarding stipulation (.2)	.60
08/27/03	RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding notices (.2); review preference update and discuss with J. Van Horn (.4)	.60
08/27/03	DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding stock option holders	.20
08/27/03	DIS	Telephone conference with L. Recano regarding costs of stock option plan notice (.2); two telephone calls and e-mail correspondence with C. Dickson (.3)	.50
08/27/03	DIS	E-mail correspondence and telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan notice issues and other matters	.50
08/27/03	MJA	Copy and e-mail plan and disclosure statement with all appendices to M. Selit per D. Swan's request; continue with review and chronological order of all recent correspondence and miscellaneous documents for this matter number; index in summation database	2.00
08/28/03	PLH	E-mails regarding plan supplement documents (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding solicitation regarding option holders (.5); review notice regarding same (.3); telephone call with stockholders regarding inquiry on plan (.4)	1.70
08/28/03	DIS	E-mail correspondence to P. Hayden regarding commitment letter exhibit	.10
08/28/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding stockholder notice issue	.20
08/28/03	DIS	Telephone conference with C. Dickson regarding notice to option holders	.10
08/28/03	DIS	Prepare proposed notice to option holders and telephone conference with P. Hayden	.60
08/28/03	DIS	Telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding option holder notice motion and local procedure	.20



08/29/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding solicitation issues (.5); review and revise memorandum on option holders (.5); e-mails regarding plan issues (.4)	1.40
08/29/03	AKS	Attention to lien search summaries	.20
08/29/03	DIS	Prepare motion to revise notice and objection procedure for option holders (2.1); telephone conference with P. Hayden (.2); revise motion (.2); telephone conference with K. Wilson to arrange filing (.2)	2.70
08/30/03	PLH	Prepare notices and plan supplement materials	3.00

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Patrick L. Hayden	\$430.00	94.9	\$40,807.00
Robert G. Sable	\$410.00	28.3	\$11,603.00
Alan K. Sable	\$265.00	1.1	\$291.50
David I. Swan	\$235.00	40.4	\$9,494.00
Sarah B. Boehm	\$210.00	0.4	\$84.00
James E. Van Horn	\$170.00	1.9	\$323.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$110.00	0.8	\$88.00
Thomas Matthew Collins	\$110.00	0.5	\$55.00
Mary Jo Albright	\$105.00	7.0	\$735.00
		175.3	\$63,480.50
	TOTAL FEES		

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2035688-0013

\$63,480.50

**Re: Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization****Our File No. 2035688-0013****For Services Rendered Through Sep 30, 2003**

09/01/03	PLH	E-mails with B. Shaw regarding plan supplement documents	.30
09/02/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding issues on plan solicitation (.4); review issues on brief in support of confirmation (.5); telephone call with R. Schuler regarding amended corporate organizational documents (.6)	1.50
09/02/03	AKS	Attention to lien search summary	.70
09/02/03	RWS	Conference with P. Hayden; review bylaw and certificate mark-ups	2.90
09/02/03	DIS	Telephone conference with C. Dickson regarding option holder mailing	.10
09/02/03	DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding stockholder notice issues	.20
09/02/03	DIS	Review correspondence from G. Schaaf and DTC listing (.1); facsimile to P. Hayden (.1)	.20
09/02/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding scheduling issues, stockholder issues and plan brief	.40
09/02/03	DIS	Correspondence to L. Recano regarding option holder notices (.1); motion to R. Sable (.1); telephone conference with K. Wilson (.1)	.30
09/02/03	HRH	Transmit amended plan and disclosure statement to attorney upon request	.20
09/03/03	PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding exit facility documents (.5); review plan supplement documents (.8); prepare amended corporate documents (1.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.5)	3.30
09/03/03	AKS	Attention to lien search summaries	.30
09/03/03	RWS	Review and revisions of articles, bylaws, IL company question	2.70

---

09/03/03 LJA	Review new disclosure statement and draft of registration rights agreement	3.20
09/03/03 DIS	Review equity list and telephone conference with L. Recano regarding DTC proxy list; facsimile to L. Recano	.30
09/03/03 DIS	Review Bartholomew's objection to Chapter 11 plan	.20
09/03/03 DIS	Review voting reports from Donlin Recano	.20
09/03/03 DIS	Telephone conference with K. Wilson regarding hearing on option holders notice (.1); telephone conference with C. Dickson of Donlin Recano regarding order (.1)	.20
09/03/03 DIS	Multiple telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding various pending issues with case administration and plan confirmation	1.10
09/03/03 DIS	Review DTC listings (.2); telephone conference with V. Batey to discuss shareholder notice (.3)	.50
09/04/03 PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding plan confirmation issues (.4); review and revise notice on contract assumption (.7); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding plan supplement documents (.4); telephone call with R. Berger regarding same (.5); telephone call with M. Miller regarding same (.3); prepare plan supplement documents (.8); e-mail S. Siegel regarding same (.3); e-mail R. McDonald regarding same (.3)	3.70
09/04/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding voting and preparation for confirmation	.30
09/04/03 LJA	Revise registration rights agreement and forward to P. Hayden	1.80
09/04/03 LJA	Telephone call from P. Hayden regarding draft of registration rights agreements	.20
09/04/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding service issues; send list	.30
09/04/03 DIS	Telephone conference with C. Dickson regarding option holder notice	.10

09/04/03 DIS	Discussion with R. Sable regarding plan issues, brief in support and labor issues	.20
09/04/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding developments	.30
09/04/03 DIS	Review ADP and DTC listings (.2); telephone conference with V. Batey (.3)	.50
09/05/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding plan confirmation issues (.3); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding plan supplement (.3); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding plan supplement issues (.6); telephone call with S. Siegel regarding same (.3); telephone call with P. Winters regarding same (.4); telephone call with M. Miller regarding same (.3); e-mail to S. Siegel regarding registration rights agreement (.3); e-mail B. Shaw regarding same (.3); prepare plan supplement documents (1.0); telephone call with D. Swan regarding contract assumption notice (.4); review issues on DTC solicitation (.7); telephone call with R. Sable regarding confirmation issues (.3)	5.20
09/05/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan, supplement creditor committee and confirmation (.3); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg regarding plan and labor issues (.2)	.50
09/05/03 DIS	Telephone conference with S. Walthall's office regarding plan supplement and follow-up e-mails with S. Walthall and G. Schaaf	.20
09/05/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding ADP service (.2); review list (.3); and telephone calls with P. Hayden (.6)	1.10
09/07/03 PLH	Prepare notice of plan supplement documents (.7); e-mail to R. Sable regarding officers and directors (.3); prepare plan supplement documents (.5)	1.50
09/08/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan confirmation issues (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.4); telephone call with M. Miller regarding plan supplement issues (.4); telephone call with P. Winters regarding same (.2); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding same (.3); prepare plan supplement notices (1.5)	3.10

09/08/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement and confirmation issues (.3); review e-mail from P. Hayden (.2); telephone conference with M. Richards (.3); telephone conference with A. Eckstein regarding committee issues, labor and confirmation (.2)	1.00
09/08/03 DIS	Review updated voting report	.10
09/08/03 DIS	Telephone conference with D. Bleck regarding Liberty Mutual ballot (.2); review Liberty Mutual claims (.3); discuss categorization issues with V. Batey (.2) and L. Recano (.2)	.90
09/08/03 DIS	Review list of plan supplement documents and proposed notice	.20
09/08/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding Liberty Mutual, plan brief and other matters	.40
09/08/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement issues	.30
09/08/03 DIS	Various e-mails and telephone calls with K. Wilson and others to arrange for filing of plan confirmation hearing notices and affidavits of service	.90
09/09/03 PLH	Prepare list of officers and directors (.7); e-mail to D. Wanlass regarding same (.1); prepare plan supplement documents (1.5); e-mails regarding same (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.3); review balloting and proposal ballot report (.4)	3.30
09/09/03 RGS	Telephone conference with J. O'Leary (.3); telephone conference with C. Jones (.1); review information on USWA vote and issues (.3)	.70
09/09/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.3); review e-mails and plan supplement issues (.6); telephone conference with P. Hayden (.3); telephone conference with P. Hayden and A. Eckstein regarding plan documents including notes and security documents (.5)	1.70
09/09/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues	.30
09/09/03 DIS	Review objection to plan filed by R. Tallent	.20

---

09/09/03 DIS	Telephone conference with B. Swakus of Greenville Metals regarding Chapter 11 plan	.20
09/09/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding various matters including W. Castledine and Liberty Mutual	.30
09/09/03 DIS	Telephone conference with S. Walthall regarding plan issues and insurance issues	.30
09/09/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding various plan and plan supplement issues	.40
09/09/03 DIS	Review updated voting report	.10
09/09/03 DIS	Exchange e-mail correspondence with C. Dickson regarding various affidavits of service	.10
09/09/03 DIS	Review Donlin & Recano vote declaration form	.20
09/09/03 JEV	Research plan confirmation support issues	.30
09/10/03 PLH	Review and prepare ballot certification (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan supplement documents (.3); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding same (.3); telephone call with S. Siegel regarding same (.3); telephone call with P. Winters regarding same (.4); review term sheets on post-petition debt (1.0) review revised by-laws (.5); telephone call with R. Schuler regarding same (.3); e-mail to T. Solomon regarding same (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.4); prepare plan supplement documents (1.5)	5.70
09/10/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan confirmation, vote and objections, including Liberty Mutual and claim objection issues	.70
09/10/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden (.2); telephone conference with S. Siegel regarding plan and plan supplement issues (.2)	.40
09/10/03 RWS	Review of debtor's counsel draft of bylaws and charter	1.90
09/10/03 DIS	Conference with R. Sable regarding voting reports	.20
09/10/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding voting certification and other matters	.20

09/10/03 DIS	E-mail correspondence with C. Dickson and K. Wilson regarding Donlin & Recano's service affidavit	.10
09/11/03 PLH	Conference calls regarding term sheet for second lien note (2.0); review and revise same (1.0); prepare amended bylaws and certificates of incorporation for plan supplement (2.0); telephone call with J. Tinkelman regarding registration rights agreement (.3); telephone call with L. Anutta regarding same (.3); prepare list of officers and directors (1.5); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding plan supplement documents (.3)	7.40
09/11/03 DMJ	Conference with L. Anutta regarding comments on registration rights agreement	.30
09/11/03 RWS	Review A-1 articles; conference with P. Hayden	.90
09/11/03 DIS	E-mail correspondence with G. Schaaf and V. Batey regarding Grimes ballot	.10
09/11/03 DIS	Review e-mail from P. Hayden and ADP's request (.1); inquire with Donlin Recano (.1)	.20
09/11/03 DIS	Draft memorandum of law in support of Chapter 11 plan	2.20
09/12/03 PLH	Prepare second lien note term sheet (2.5); telephone calls with R. McDonald and B. Shaw regarding same (1.5); telephone call with M. Miller regarding same (.7); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding plan supplement documents (.3); telephone call with P. Winters regarding same (.4); e-mails regarding registration rights agreement (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding confirmation issues (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.3)	6.40
09/12/03 RGS	Review and respond to P. Hayden's correspondence on plan and plan supplement	.30
09/12/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding confirmation issues	.30
09/12/03 DIS	Telephone conference with M. Bloomenfield of GE Commercial Finance regarding Chapter 11 plan terms	.20

09/12/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement documents	.40
09/12/03	DIS	Review objection to plan filed by Texas Taxing Authorities; e-mail correspondence to K. Winters	.30
09/12/03	DIS	Telephone conference with J. Stulegraso regarding USWA ballot	.10
09/12/03	DIS	Brief in support of plan	3.00
09/12/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan objection	.20
09/12/03	MJA	Review docket for objections, begin assembly of all objections filed to date for creating hearing binders	1.00
09/13/03	PLH	Review and revise Class 6A note and trust agreement (1.5); e-mails regarding status of plan supplement documents (1.0); review registration rights agreement (.4); prepare plan supplement documents (1.0)	3.90
09/14/03	PLH	Prepare plan supplement documents (1.0); e-mails regarding same (.5); prepare confirmation order (.5)	2.00
09/14/03	DIS	Work on brief in support of plan confirmation	3.20
09/15/03	PLH	Prepare plan supplement documents for filings (5.0); telephone call with P. Winters regarding plan supplement (.7); telephone call with T. Solomon regarding same (.5); telephone call with M. Miller regarding same (.5); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding same (.3); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding same (.5); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding same (.5); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (1.0); e-mails with V. Batory regarding ballot issues (.3)	9.80



---

09/15/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding claim status and action (.3); review and respond to e-mails from Dean and D. Wanlass (.4); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding bank items on plan (.2); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg regarding officers (.2); telephone conference with L. Thompson regarding plan supplement and open items (.1); telephone conference with P. Hayden and D. Swan regarding preparation for confirmation (.5)	1.70
09/15/03 RGS	Letter to G. Schaaf (.2); letter to R. Crouch (.2); review objections to confirmation (.9); conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding confirmation objections (.8)	2.10
09/15/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass (.2); telephone conference with A. Eckstein (.2); review 6A note documents and term sheet (.7)	1.10
09/15/03 RGS	Review plan supplement and suggest process in telephone conference with P. Hayden	.80
09/15/03 DIS	Brief in support of plan confirmation	.90
09/15/03 DIS	Review various objections to plan filed (1.1); e-mail to client (.1)	1.20
09/15/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding plan objections	.30
09/15/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden and R. Sable regarding plan objections	.50
09/15/03 DIS	Review vote declaration and telephone conference with V. Batey	.20
09/15/03 DIS	Multiple telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement (1.8); revise notice (.2) and other documents (.3); organize and arrange exhibits and prepare filing (1.5)	3.80
09/15/03 TMC	Edit, prepare, scan, upload and e-file plan supplement documents with Bankruptcy Court	5.80
09/15/03 MJA	Create plan and disclosure statement and objection outline; assemble all relevant pleadings and objections for creation of hearing binders for R. Sable and D. Swan	7.50

---

09/16/03 PLH	Conference call with client regarding confirmation issues (1.0); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan supplement documents (.4); prepare list of officers and directors and e-mail to B. Rosenberg (1.0); review plan objections (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.5); telephone call with R. Cox regarding plan objections (.3); e-mails regarding plan supplement (.7); prepare certification of voting results (1.0); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding second lien note term sheet (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding plan issues (.3)	6.00
09/16/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding open items and preparation for conference call	.30
09/16/03 RGS	Conference call with D. Wanlass, B. Dropkin, J. O'Leary, B. Shaw, D. Swan, P. Hayden and G. Schaaf regarding labor and other open items for confirmation	.80
09/16/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement items (.3); telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding Inco and Ludlow (.3); respond to C. Jones on plan supplement (.3)	.90
09/16/03 RGS	Telephone conference with L. Thompson regarding plan developments, officers, etc. (.2); letter to L. Thompson with plan supplements (.2); conference with P. Hayden and D. Swan regarding objections and tally (.3); telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding notes and employee issues (.2); telephone conference with G. John regarding update on confirmation (.3)	1.20
09/16/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Jury (.2); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.2); e-mail to P. Hayden regarding directors and officers (.3)	.70
09/16/03 LJA	Review revised by-laws	.30
09/16/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. Sable and P. Hayden regarding plan supplement documents	.20
09/16/03 DIS	Review objection to plan filed by PBGC	.30

09/16/03 DIS	Conference call with company and professionals regarding plan confirmation issues; follow-up with R. Crouch	1.00
09/16/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding plan voting results	.20
09/16/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden and with R. Sable regarding plan objections	.80
09/16/03 DIS	Review vote tabulation and e-mail to client (.1); e-mail to bank and committee counsel (.1)	.20
09/16/03 DIS	E-mail plan objections to bank and committee counsel	.20
09/16/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding issues for plan brief	.30
09/16/03 DIS	Analyze issues involved in insurance company plan objections (4.6); research (.7); conference with J. Van Horn to identify issues for research (.4)	5.70
09/16/03 RAC	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding research on confirmation issues	.20
09/16/03 JEV	Review insurance company objections to plan for background to research	.90
09/16/03 JEV	Conference with D. Swan regarding insurance issues for response to plan objections	.40
09/16/03 JEV	Begin to research insurance issues for response inclusion in brief	2.20
09/16/03 TMC	Research service issues for plan supplement filings; organize with E. Brown	1.20
09/16/03 TMC	Draft certificates of services for plan filings	.80
09/16/03 TMC	Update files with recently filed documents	.80
09/16/03 MJA	Update and complete hearing binders for upcoming plan and disclosure statement hearing; review docket for any new filings and objections	1.00

---

09/17/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. Cox regarding response to plan objections (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding Class 6A note (.5); draft Class 6A note (2.0); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding second lien note term sheet (.3); revise same (1.5); e-mail to M. Miller regarding same (.3); telephone call with T. Solomon regarding list of officers and directors (.4); prepare amended plan supplement (1.0); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding plan issues (.3); prepare vote certification (.4)	7.00
09/17/03 RGS	Telephone conference with A. Eckstein regarding confirmation issues and note documents	.30
09/17/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan documents and 6A note	.30
09/17/03 RGS	Telephone conference with B. Rosenberg regarding 6A note (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding note (.2); telephone conference with D. Wanlass and J. O'Leary regarding plan documents and 6A note (.3)	.70
09/17/03 RGS	Telephone conference with S. Siegel regarding PBGC and plan confirmation issues	.20
09/17/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding objections and plan supplement	.30
09/17/03 DIS	Prepare brief in support of plan confirmation	4.40
09/17/03 DIS	Research SPM case and PBGC issues (.6); confer with R. Cox (.2)	.80
09/17/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. Sable and P. Hayden to overview plan objections	.30
09/17/03 RAC	Review objections (.6); telephone conference with P. Hayden (.2); telephone conference with D. Swan (.2); begin review of law regarding unfair discrimination (1.0)	2.00
09/17/03 JEV	Review insurance company's objection (.7); research case law in support of response (3.5)	4.20
09/17/03 JEV	Research case law supporting response to insurance company objections to plan	2.50

09/18/03 PLH	Conference call with R. Sable regarding plan confirmation issues (.7); prepare class 6A note (1.9); prepare second lien term sheet (.5); prepare list of officers and directors (1.0); prepare notice of amended plan supplement (0.7); prepare vote certification (1.0); telephone call with M. Miller regarding second lien term sheet (.4); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding plan supplement (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding confirmation (.3); e-mails to parties regarding plan supplement documents (.7); prepare for confirmation hearing (1.0)	8.50
09/18/03 RGS	Review and further analysis of objections to confirmation (.8); conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding objections to confirmation (1.4)	2.20
09/18/03 RGS	Review data from J. Gillespie and discuss with B. Dropkin	.80
09/18/03 RGS	Telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding KERP and confirmation issues (.4); respond to R. McDonald regarding Cabell County taxes (.3); conference with D. Swan regarding Cabell County taxes and financial information (.3)	1.00
09/18/03 RGS	Review and comment on plan supplement with P. Hayden	.60
09/18/03 DIS	Continue work on brief in support of plan	1.60
09/18/03 DIS	Call with R. Sable and P. Hayden regarding strategy in response to plan objections	1.00
09/18/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey and review vote declaration changes	.30
09/18/03 DIS	Conference with J. Van Horn regarding various insurance issues in plan objections	.60
09/18/03 DIS	Conference with R. Sable and review credit facility analysis	.30
09/18/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding credit facility, insurance premium issues and other matters	.20

09/18/03 DIS	Multiple telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement disputes, plan objections and other matters	1.30
09/18/03 RAC	Review case law cited in brief filed by PBGC objecting to confirmation (2.0); legal research on issues of Unfair Discrimination (3.0); legal research on issues raised in U.S. Trustee's objection (2.0)	7.00
09/18/03 JEV	Conference with D. Swan regarding insurance issues for plan confirmation brief	.60
09/18/03 JEV	Continue research support for responses to objections to plan for inclusion in brief in support of confirmation	4.50
09/18/03 JEV	Begin to draft responses to objections to plan	3.60
09/19/03 PLH	Conference call regarding confirmation of plan (.8); telephone call with T. Solomon regarding plan supplement documents (.5); telephone call with P. Winters regarding class 6A note and term sheet on second lien note (.5); review and revise brief in support of confirmation (1.0); prepare for confirmation hearing (1.5); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding plan supplement documents (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.4)	5.00
09/19/03 RGS	Review projections, financial reports, PBGC information and prepare for conference call on bankruptcy issues	1.60
09/19/03 RGS	Conference call with D. Wanlass, B. Dropkin, R. McDonald, J. O'Leary, D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding financing issues and confirmation	1.40
09/19/03 RGS	Review e-mail from D. Wanlass, P. Hayden and B. Rosenberg, including revised 6A note	1.50
09/19/03 RGS	Telephone conference with Goldberger regarding insurance (.1); telephone conference with G. Schaaf and P. Hayden regarding U.S. Trustee's objections (.3); telephone conference with R. Crouch regarding confirmation preparation (.2)	.60
09/19/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan (.3); conference with J. Van Horn regarding confirmation brief (.2)	.50

09/19/03	RGS	Respond to B. Dropkin regarding PBGC's confirmation issues	.20
09/19/03	DIS	Meetings with J. Van Horn (.3) and R. Sable (.2); continue work on brief in support of plan confirmation (1.4)	1.90
09/19/03	DIS	Review final vote declaration (.1); telephone conference with K. Wilson (.1); arrange for filing (.1)	.30
09/19/03	DIS	Conference call with management and professionals regarding plan confirmation issues	.90
09/19/03	DIS	Telephone conference with R. Cox; review brief sections on PBGC and U.S. Trustee	.30
09/19/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan brief, plan supplement and other matters	1.10
09/19/03	RAC	Draft response to objection to PBGC's objection	3.60
09/19/03	RAC	Draft response to objection by trustee	3.30
09/19/03	RAC	Telephone conference with D. Swan regarding memorandum in support of confirmation	.40
09/19/03	JEV	Conference with D. Swan regarding insurance issues for brief	.20
09/19/03	JEV	Continue to draft and make multiple revisions to brief in support of plan confirmation	5.50
09/19/03	JEV	Conference with staff to retrieve pleadings filed in cases cited in objections to plan (.2); review same as background to address objections in brief (2.2)	2.40
09/19/03	JEV	Proof section of brief (.3); outline remaining issues to address (.3)	.60
09/19/03	MJA	Update disclosure statement binders	.40
09/20/03	PLH	Review plan objections (1.0); prepare response on U.S. Trustee's objection (1.0); prepare response on PBGC's objection (.7); prepare confirmation order (2.0)	4.70

09/20/03 RGS	Prepare for confirmation, including review and revisions to brief (.8); conference with D. Swan regarding insurance company's issues and objections (.5); conference with D. Swan regarding insurance and other issues (.8)	2.10
09/20/03 RGS	Extensive review and revisions to insurance part of confirmation brief (1.3); prepare documents for confirmation (.8)	2.10
09/20/03 DIS	Meetings with J. Van Horn and R. Sable (.3); work on plan brief (2.5)	2.80
09/20/03 DIS	Correspondence to S. Moskol regarding insurance company's plan objections	.30
09/20/03 JEV	Research case law on remaining issues to address in brief supporting plan confirmation	1.80
09/20/03 JEV	Conference with D. Swan and R. Sable regarding brief issues	.30
09/20/03 JEV	Multiple revisions to brief in support of plan confirmation	3.70
09/21/03 PLH	Prepare confirmation order (2.0); prepare class 6A note (.5); prepare list of officers and directors (.3); prepare response to U.S. Trustee's objection (.4)	3.20
09/21/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding brief (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding 6A note and other confirmation issues (.4); telephone conference with G. Stubenhofer regarding PBGC (.1); telephone conference with K. Batik regarding memorandum on PBGC alternatives (.2)	.90
09/22/03 PLH	Prepare brief on support of confirmation (1.5); prepare confirmation order (1.0); telephone call with P. Winters regarding class 6A note (.3); telephone call with A. Eckstein regarding same (.3); prepare class 6A note (.7); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding Credit Lyonnais term sheet (.3); prepare modifications regarding U.S. Trustee's objection (1.0); telephone call with S. Siegel regarding same (.3); prepare for confirmation hearing (1.0)	6.40



09/22/03 AKS	Multiple telephone conferences with P. Hayden regarding confirmation order (.2); telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding schedules to loan agreement (.2)	.40
09/22/03 RGS	Review and rewrite brief on confirmation (1.2); conference with J. Van Horn regarding revisions to brief and insurance issues (.3); conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding tax and other issues (.5); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding confirmation issues (.3); telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding confirmation indemnity (.3)	2.60
09/22/03 RGS	Telephone conference with M. Richards regarding confirmation scheduling	.40
09/22/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan and R. McDonald regarding Huntington taxes and Cabel County	.20
09/22/03 RGS	Review case law and prepare for call with insurance company's attorney (.8); participate in conference call with insurance company's lawyer (.5); e-mail to B. Rosenberg, et al. regarding insurance alternative (.4)	1.70
09/22/03 RGS	Prepare for confirmation	.70
09/22/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding open issues (.4); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding PBGC (.2); review B. Howley's calculation and D. Austin's memorandum (.5)	1.10
09/22/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding PBGC's objection (.3); telephone conference with A. Eckstein regarding settlement with PBGC (.2)	.50
09/22/03 RGS	Rewrite portion of brief (.7); review brief and discuss with D. Swan (.4); conference with P. Hayden and D. Swan regarding class 6A note and term sheet (.5); prepare for confirmation hearing with D. Swan and P. Hayden (.8); telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding preparation for confirmation (.4)	2.80
09/22/03 DIS	Telephone calls with J. Dillman of Texas Taxing Authorities regarding plan objection	.40
09/22/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement documents	.20

09/22/03 DIS	Analyze insurance company objections and conference call with insurance company representatives	1.20
09/22/03 DIS	Conference with R. Sable and P. Hayden regarding confirmation hearing	.20
09/22/03 DIS	Telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding plan supplement and confirmation order	.40
09/22/03 DIS	Continue work on memorandum of law in support of plan confirmation	6.20
09/22/03 RAC	Telephone conference with D. Swan regarding revisions to PBGC's objection	.30
09/22/03 RAC	Review and revise response to objection of PBGC	4.40
09/22/03 RAC	Review and revise response to objection by trustee	3.00
09/22/03 RAC	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding comments to response to objection by PBGC	.50
09/22/03 JEV	Additional research to support responses in brief supporting plan confirmation (1.8); review, edit and make multiple revisions to same (3.8)	5.60
09/22/03 JEV	Multiple conference with R. Sable and D. Swan regarding brief revisions	.50
09/22/03 JEV	Research post-petition tax claim issues	.70
09/22/03 JEV	Make additional revisions to brief in support of plan confirmation	1.80
09/23/03 PLH	Prepare plan supplement documents (2.0); telephone call with P. Winters regarding same (.5); telephone call with M. Miller regarding same (1.7); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding same (.5); address U.S. Trustee's objection plan (.4); telephone call with S. Siegel regarding same (.3); telephone call with R. Dropkin regarding same (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding confirmation issues (.7); prepare confirmation brief (.8); prepare confirmation order (2.0); prepare for confirmation hearing (1.0)	10.30

09/23/03	AKS	Analyze issues regarding litigation schedules to loan agreements (.2); telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding schedule (.1); telephone conference with M. Miller regarding UCC searches (.1); office conference with L. Wigton regarding UCC searches (.2)	.60
09/23/03	RGS	Review and analyze draft of confirmation order	.60
09/23/03	RGS	Telephone conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding PBGC and insurance company issues and confirmation preparation	.40
09/23/03	DIS	Plan supplement documents and supplemental notice (1.5); telephone calls with P. Hayden to coordinate (.4)	1.90
09/23/03	DIS	Telephone conference with S. Walthall regarding Utica Alloys plan objection	.30
09/23/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden, R. Sable and G. Schaaf regarding plan confirmation strategy	.50
09/23/03	DIS	Brief in support of plan confirmation, finalize, file, and serve	5.90
09/23/03	RAC	Review draft of response to trustee's objection (.2); check case cites in draft and review of cases (.5); telephone conference with D. Swan regarding comments (.2)	.90
09/23/03	JEV	Draft additional responses to plan objections	1.20
09/23/03	JEV	Proof and edit brief and make multiple revisions	3.90
09/23/03	JEV	Additional proofing and revising of brief	1.10
09/23/03	JEV	Conference with D. Swan to make and review additional brief revisions	.40
09/23/03	JEV	Draft transmittal letter for service of brief (.2); coordinate service issues with staff (.4)	.60
09/23/03	HRH	Coordinate service of memorandum in support of confirmation of debtor's amended plan and related pleading (1.5); telephone conferences with IKON regarding service of same (.2)	1.70

09/23/03 TMC	Prepare, scan, upload and e-file plan supplement documents with Bankruptcy Court	.80
09/23/03 TMC	Prepare certificate of service and mailing of memorandum of law; prepare and e-file all documents with court	2.10
09/24/03 PLH	Travel to Lexington, KY for confirmation hearing (4.0 hours billed at 50%)	2.00
09/24/03 PLH	Prepare for confirmation hearing (5.0); prepare confirmation order (2.0); prepare plan supplement documents (2.0); telephone call with M. Miller regarding term sheet (.5); telephone call with P. Winters regarding term sheet (.4); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding term sheet (.3)	10.20
09/24/03 AKS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding title issues and confirmation order (.2); telephone conference with C. Burdick regarding confirmation order issues (.2); analyze issues regarding confirmation order (.5); review and revise confirmation order (.4); e-mail R. McDonald regarding confirmation order and assumed leases (.1)	1.40
09/24/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding confirmation (.3); telephone conference with D. Wanlass and J. O'Leary regarding confirmation and PBGC (.5); telephone conference with D. Swan and P. Hayden regarding insurance objections and preparation (.4)	1.20
09/24/03 RGS	Travel to Lexington, KY for confirmation hearing (4.0 hours billed at 50%)	2.00
09/24/03 RGS	Conference with M. Richards regarding confirmation issues	.50
09/24/03 DIS	Travel to Lexington, KY for plan confirmation hearing (4.2 billed at 50%)	2.10
09/24/03 DIS	Review brief in support of plan confirmation filed by creditors committee	.30
09/24/03 DIS	Review plan confirmation order	.50

09/24/03 DIS	Telephone conference with T. Grundemeier and telephone conference with C. Davis to work out Texas Taxing Authorities' objection (.5); telephone conference with D. Wanlass (.1); review proposed stipulation and comment (.2)	.80
09/24/03 DIS	Telephone conference with S. Walthall (.5) and telephone conference with J. Glass (.3) regarding Utica Alloys' objection to plan	.80
09/24/03 DIS	Telephone calls and confer with J. Van Horn, S. Edison and R. Sable regarding insurance issues	.50
09/24/03 DIS	Conference call with D. Wanlass, J. O'Leary and P. Hayden regarding plan confirmation issues	.60
09/24/03 DIS	Prepare for plan confirmation hearing and objection issues	3.80
09/24/03 SEE	Review Century Insurance Company's complaint	.60
09/24/03 SEE	Review memorandum in support of plan and cases	1.10
09/24/03 SEE	Review related Combustion Engineering pleadings	.60
09/24/03 SEE	Conference with R. Sable and R. Crouch regarding Century Insurance Company's complaint	.60
09/24/03 SEE	Research regarding Century Insurance Company's complaint	2.30
09/24/03 SEE	Conference with D. Swan regarding Century Insurance Company's complaint	.50
09/24/03 JEV	Telephone conversation with D. Swan regarding Century Indemnity complaint for declaratory judgment issues	.10
09/24/03 JEV	Review Century Indemnity complaint for declaratory judgment (.3); research anticipatory breach issues (1.8)	2.10
09/24/03 JEV	Multiple telephone conversations with D. Swan regarding confirmation hearing issues (.4); research outstanding issues in preparation for confirmation hearing (2.8)	3.20
09/24/03 JEV	Telephone conversation with K. Wilson regarding brief issues for court clerk (.1); review and gather documentation and forward to K. Wilson (.4)	.50

09/24/03 JEV	Conferences with S. Edison (.2); gather and review documents related to insurance issues and Century Indemnity complaint (.3)	.50
09/24/03 MLW	Telephone calls with J. Montague of Fidelity National Title regarding update of UCC, judgment and lien searches	.20
09/24/03 TMC	Prepare certificates of service for plan memorandum of law and plan supplement documents; coordinate mailing and service	1.00
09/25/03 PLH	Prepare for confirmation hearing (3.0); confirmation hearing on plan of reorganization (4.5); e-mails regarding confirmation hearing and plan (.5); address post-confirmation issues (2.5)	10.50
09/25/03 PLH	Travel from Lexington, KY (4.0 hours billed at 50%)	2.00
09/25/03 AKS	Analyze issues regarding confirmation order (.2); review and revise confirmation order (.2); telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding leased real property (.2)	.60
09/25/03 RGS	Prepare for confirmation hearing	2.50
09/25/03 RGS	Attend confirmation hearing	3.50
09/25/03 RGS	Travel to Pittsburgh, PA from Lexington, KY (6.0 hours billed at 50%)	3.00
09/25/03 LJA	Telephone call from J. Tinkelman regarding revisions to bylaws	.10
09/25/03 DIS	Prepare for (3.0) and attend (3.5) confirmation hearing	6.50
09/25/03 DIS	Travel from Lexington, KY to Pittsburgh, PA after confirmation hearing (6.0 billed at 50%)	3.00
09/25/03 DIS	Telephone conference with T. Grundemeier regarding Texas tax stipulation	.20

09/26/03 PLH	Prepare confirmation order (1.5); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.4); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding confirmation (.3); e-mails regarding confirmation issues (.7); e-mail to J. Tinkelman regarding plan supplement (.3); address issues on plan supplement (.5); letter to G. Schaaf regarding ballot certification (.3)	4.30
09/26/03 AKS	Analyze issues regarding confirmation order	.20
09/26/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding confirmation order (.2); prepare comments on confirmation order (.7)	.90
09/26/03 RGS	Respond to J. O'Leary regarding PBGC and confirmation	.20
09/26/03 RGS	Review KERP and confirmation issues	.50
09/26/03 DIS	Revise Texas tax stipulation (.1); facsimile to T. Grundemeier (.1); telephone call to T. Grundemeier (.1)	.30
09/26/03 DIS	Review amended confirmation order and revise	.40
09/26/03 DIS	Conference with J. Ludwikowski regarding plan confirmation and litigation issues	.20
09/26/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding revised plan confirmation order	.30
09/26/03 DIS	Correspondence to R. McDonald regarding response to W. Castledine and insurance motion filed	.20
09/26/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding post-confirmation issues	.20
09/26/03 JEV	Telephone conversation with D. Wehrle of FTI regarding employee-related issues and pleadings	.20
09/27/03 PLH	Prepare confirmation order (.5); address issues for consummation of plan (.7)	1.20
09/27/03 DIS	Confirmation order distribution list to P. Hayden	.10

---

09/29/03 PLH	Finalize confirmation order (2.0); telephone call with G. Schaaf regarding same (.3); e-mails to parties regarding second amended plan (.5); e-mails regarding confirmation order (.5); telephone call with M. Miller regarding consummation issues and confirmation order (.7); e-mails regarding plan supplement documents (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding confirmation issues (.3)	4.60
09/29/03 AKS	E-mail C. Burdick regarding confirmation order (.2); telephone conference with C. Burdick regarding judgment searches (.1); e-mail R. McDonald regarding lien searches (.1)	.40
09/29/03 RGS	Review and discuss changes in confirmation order and process for entry of order with P. Hayden	.50
09/29/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden (.3); telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.2); review additional language to confirmation order (.5); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding B. Rosenberg's comments and additions to order (.2); final review of confirmation order (.6); telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding order and service (.2); e-mail to company regarding entry of confirmation order and service (.3)	2.30
09/29/03 RGS	Review e-mail from B. Dropkin regarding tort claims (.2); discuss with J. Ludwikowski and D. Swan (.3)	.50
09/29/03 DIS	Review final version of plan confirmation order (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden to discuss (.2)	.40
09/29/03 DIS	E-mail correspondence to S. Moskol and D. Bleck regarding confirmation order	.10
09/29/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding entry of plan confirmation order	.20
09/29/03 DIS	Review plan notice; conference with A. Sable and discuss tax claims	.50



09/30/03 PLH	Telephone call with B. Shaw regarding exit financing issues (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding same (.3); review confirmation order regarding notices (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.3); prepare confirmation notices (.4)	1.60
09/30/03 RGS	Work on plan for resolution of open issues on consummation, including drafting of proposal	1.20
09/30/03 DIS	Telephone conference with T. Grundemeier regarding Texas tax stipulation	.10
09/30/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan confirmation notices and post-confirmation issues	.50
09/30/03 MLW	Examine title commitments from First American (.6); reconcile lien, judgment and UCC information with information already collected (.5); update summary accordingly (.5); telephone call with J. Montague of Fidelity National Title regarding status of UCC (.2), judgment and lien update (.3); prepare title commitment binder and index thereto (.9)	3.00

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Patrick L. Hayden	\$430.00	144.6	\$62,178.00
Robert G. Sable	\$410.00	62.9	\$25,789.00
D. Michael Jones	\$370.00	0.3	\$111.00
Lucile J. Anutta	\$370.00	5.6	\$2,072.00
Ronald W. Schuler	\$315.00	8.4	\$2,646.00
Alan K. Sable	\$265.00	4.6	\$1,219.00
David I. Swan	\$235.00	95.4	\$22,419.00
Robert A. Cox Jr.	\$230.00	25.6	\$5,888.00
Sally E. Edison	\$215.00	5.7	\$1,225.50
James E. Van Horn	\$170.00	56.1	\$9,537.00
Martha Lynn Wigton	\$120.00	3.2	\$384.00
Heather Rajoppi Hickman	\$110.00	1.9	\$209.00
Thomas Matthew Collins	\$110.00	12.5	\$1,375.00
Mary Jo Albright	\$105.00	9.9	\$1,039.50
		436.7	\$136,092.00
TOTAL FEES			

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2035688-0013

\$136,092.00

**Re: Disclosure Statement and Plan of Reorganization**  
**Our File No. 2035688-0013**  
**For Services Rendered Through Oct 31, 2003**

10/01/03 PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding exit financing (.3); e-mail from M. Miller regarding same (.3)	1.20
10/01/03 AKS	Analyze issues regarding judgment searches (.2); analyze issues regarding tax certifications (.1); analyze issues regarding Pennsylvania corporate income tax (.2)	.50
10/01/03 RGS	Telephone conference with J. Gillespie	.50
10/01/03 RGS	Prepare settlement proposal for plan consummation	.80
10/01/03 RGS	Review trial exhibits and calculation for plan consummation (.6); finalize draft comments to B. Dropkin and D. Wanlass (.9)	1.50
10/01/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding post-confirmation issues	.30
10/02/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. Sable regarding consummation issues (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.4); prepare for exit facility closing (.7); prepare confirmation notices (.8); e-mails regarding confirmation order (.4)	2.60
10/02/03 RGS	Review D. Wanlass' comments and make changes (.4); telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding proposal (.2)	.60
10/02/03 RGS	Review settlement proposal and discuss with B. Dropkin and D. Wanlass (.2); telephone conference with R. Rosenberg (.4); letter to D. Wanlass, B. Dropkin and J. O'Leary (.3)	.90
10/02/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding consummation issues	.30
10/02/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding various closing obligations	.50

10/02/03 DIS	E-mail correspondence with J. Gardiner regarding Utica Alloys	.10
10/02/03 DIS	Draft notice of confirmation order and rejection damage claim bar date	1.30
10/02/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding plan confirmation notice	.20
10/02/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding closing obligation numbers	.20
10/03/03 PLH	Prepare information on items to be paid at consummation (1.0); e-mails to R. Schuler regarding corporate matters for plan consummation (.3); e-mails regarding consummation issues (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding plan consummation issues (.3)	2.00
10/03/03 AKS	Attention to UCC and lien search updates	.20
10/03/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding board meeting and open tasks	.30
10/03/03 RGS	Conference with R. Crouch (.2); conference with G. Stubenhofer (.3); review and revise motion for expedited appeal and discuss with R. Crouch (.6); telephone conference with R. Rosenberg regarding appeal tactics and board action issues (.2)	1.30
10/03/03 DIS	Telephone conference with T. Grundmeier regarding Texas tax authorities stipulation	.20
10/04/03 DIS	Finalize confirmation notice, rejection claim bar date notice and e-mail to V. Batey	.40
10/06/03 PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation issues (.3); prepare and determine costs for consummation (.5); review second lien note credit agreement (.5)	1.30
10/06/03 RWS	Closing list for P. Hayden and review articles	.70
10/06/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding plan confirmation notice and service thereof	.20
10/06/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding confirmation order notice and other post-confirmation matters	.40

10/07/03 PLH	Conference call regarding plan consummation issues (.5); review Credit Lyonnais term sheet (.3); telephone call with J. Chenard regarding same (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding same (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding consummation issues (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding consummation issues (.3)	2.00
10/07/03 DIS	Telephone conference with V. Batey regarding plan confirmation notice (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding same and other pending issues (.2)	.40
10/08/03 PLH	Review insurance companies' appeals of confirmation order (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding consummation issues (.3); review documents on second lien notes (.4); review e-mails regarding confirmation issues (.4)	1.90
10/08/03 RGS	Conference with P. Hayden regarding closing and related issues	.30
10/08/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan (.2); review appeal information from insurance analysis (.3)	.50
10/08/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding appeals to plan confirmation; e-mail notice of appeals to principal parties	.50
10/09/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding issues on exit financing (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding appeals of confirmation order (.5); review appeals (.3); review docket (.3); address issues on exit financing (.5)	2.10
10/09/03 RGS	Organize open matters, including review of current information	.80
10/09/03 RGS	Review e-mail from P. Hayden (.2); letter to R. Rosenberg and response regarding Congress Financial (.2)	.40
10/09/03 RGS	Telephone conference with A. Eckstein regarding confirmation status	.20

10/09/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. Crouch regarding motion to expedite (.1); letter to D. Wanlass with request (.2); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding confirmation (.2)	.50
10/09/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding appeals to plan confirmation	.20
10/09/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding appeals and related issues	.40
10/09/03 DIS	Receive and review Travelers' appeal	.10
10/09/03 DIS	Conference with R. Sable regarding appeals, INCO and PBGC	.20
10/10/03 PLH	Prepare estimates of expenses for consummation (.5); e-mail regarding same (.2); telephone call with D. Swan regarding status of confirmation issues (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.3)	1.40
10/10/03 RGS	Prepare open items memorandum and revise (1.2); telephone conference with R. Rosenberg regarding settlement status (.2); conference with D. Swan regarding Cabell County and other issues (.4)	1.80
10/10/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding plan appeals and other matters	.40
10/11/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. Sable and D. Swan regarding confirmation and appeal issues	.80
10/11/03 RGS	Review P. Hayden's calculation fund necessary to consummate	.30
10/11/03 RGS	Conference with P. Hayden and D. Swan regarding open confirmation items (.8); revise and add to memorandum (.5); respond to P. Hayden's e-mail (.3); review and respond to R. McDonald's memorandum on Congress Financial appeal issue (.4)	2.00
10/12/03 PLH	Review memorandums on plan confirmation issues (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding stock certificates (.3)	.60

10/13/03 PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding confirmation status issues (.5); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding corporate issues on confirmation (.3); telephone call with R. Schuler regarding same (.3); e-mails regarding pending confirmation issues (.8); e-mail to P. Winters regarding closing (.3); e-mail to Greenebaum regarding confirmation order (.3); review issues on insurance appeal (1.0)	3.50
10/13/03 RGS	Respond to e-mail from R. Crouch regarding appeal	.20
10/13/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald and attorney M. Miller regarding appeal	.40
10/14/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding closing issues (.3); prepare memorandum on outstanding issues (1.0); telephone call with R. Sable regarding closing items (.3); e-mails from Congress Financial and Credit Lyonnais regarding closing documents (.5); review issues on record date (.8); e-mail to R. Sable regarding same (.3); e-mails with A. Eckstein regarding plan consummation (.3)	3.50
10/14/03 DIS	Draft insurance company appeal summary for Congress Financial certificate	.30
10/14/03 VLC	Conferences with R. Crouch regarding insurance company appeals (.3); review, analyze and index documentation per R. Crouch regarding insurance company appeals (4.6)	4.90
10/15/03 PLH	Prepare schedule of closing payments (.6); e-mails regarding same (.2); telephone call with R. McDonald and R. Berger regarding same and closing issues (.7); telephone call with R. Sable regarding closing issues and PBGC (.3); e-mails regarding closing issues (.4); telephone call with D. Swan regarding consummation issues (.3)	2.50
10/15/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. Rosenberg regarding plan amendment (.3); letter to P. Hayden regarding amendment (.2); review consummation cash summary and discuss with P. Hayden (.4)	.90

10/15/03 MLW	Telephone call to J. Montague of Fidelity to follow-up to status of UCC searches (.2); telephone call to T. Bennett at Otterbourg firm regarding same (.1)	.30
10/15/03 MJA	Run extranet search for Travelers appeal and forward to R. McDonald per D. Swan's instructions	.40
10/16/03 PLH	Telephone call with B. Shaw regarding closing issues (.6); telephone call with D. Swan (.3); e-mails regarding record date (.5)	1.40
10/16/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald (.3); e-mail to R. McDonald regarding open items (.2); review and analyze open list (.5)	1.00
10/16/03 RWS	Correspondence with R. McDonald regarding stock certificates (.4); conference with P. Hayden (.2); prepare charters and bylaws (.8)	1.40
10/16/03 MLW	Receive and review updated UCC search results; correspondence to T. Bennett of Otterbourg firm transmitting copies of search results (.6); update summary to reflect new search results (.4)	1.00
10/17/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding closing issues (.3); e-mail to B. Dropkin (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding closing and appeals issues (.4); review retiree committee's motion (.3); review Century Indemnity's statement on appeal (.3)	1.60
10/17/03 RGS	Conference call with D. Wanlass and J. O'Leary regarding resolution of open issues and bank's position (.8); telephone conference with R. Rosenberg (.2); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding conference call (.2)	1.20
10/17/03 RGS	Conference call with D. Wanlass, R. Rosenberg, J. Van Essche and J. O'Leary regarding PBGC and plan consummation issues (1.1); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding further steps (.2); telephone conference with G. Stubenhofer regarding motion for expedited appeal (.2)	1.50
10/17/03 RGS	Exchange e-mails with P. Hayden and R. Rosenberg regarding record date	.40

---

10/17/03	RGS	Telephone conference with K. Batik (.3); telephone conference with J. Van Horn (.2); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding discharge of PBGC's claim (.2)	.70
10/17/03	DIS	Review Century Indemnity designation of record and statement of issues (.2); telephone conference with R. McDonald (.1)	.30
10/19/03	PLH	Review amounts to be paid at closing (.8); prepare notice on record date (.7); telephone call with R. Sable regarding consummation and appeal issues (.5)	2.00
10/19/03	RGS	Conference with K. Batik regarding dischargability of PBGC post-confirmation; review research and memorandum and discuss with K. Batik	.90
10/19/03	RGS	Conference with P. Hayden regarding insurance company's appeals and other consummation issues	.70
10/19/03	RGS	Review and respond to P. Hayden and B. Dropkin's e-mails	.80
10/20/03	PLH	Office conference with R. Schuler regarding corporate documents (.3); telephone call with Credit Lyonnais regarding record date (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding appeals (.4); prepare payments at closing (.7); prepare bankruptcy opinion letter (1.0); telephone call with D. Swan regarding consummation and appeal issues (.5)	3.20
10/20/03	RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding open items for consummation (.5); conference with D. Swan regarding open items on consummation, appeals and claims (.7); review pleadings on agenda and schedules and transmittal to clients (.8); conference with R. Crouch regarding appeal strategy and briefing, including issues on insurance companies (.5)	2.50
10/20/03	RGS	Review insurance analysis and insurance appeals	.60
10/20/03	RGS	Work on consummation, including review of K. Batik's memorandum	.70
10/20/03	DIS	Two telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding various post-confirmation issues	.80



10/20/03 DIS	Conference with R. Sable regarding insurance appeals	.20
10/20/03 MJA	Scan and forward District Court scheduling orders to R. Dropkin per R. Sable's request	1.00
10/21/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding consummation issues (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding appeal issues (.4); prepare list of items to be paid at closing (.8) telephone call with Credit Lyonnais regarding record date (.3)	1.80
10/21/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding bank meeting and consummation	.50
10/21/03 RGS	Review Y. Messina information	.30
10/21/03 RGS	Telephone conference with D Wanlass (.3); telephone conference with R. McDonald (.4); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding PBGC, insurance companies and other consummation issues (.2)	.90
10/21/03 RGS	Conference with R. Crouch and K. Batik regarding PBGC's appeals and issues (.8); conference with D. Swan and J. Van Horn regarding insurance issues and memorandum (.7); review and revise memorandum on open issues (.6); telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding Inco and Congress Financial issues (.2)	2.30
10/21/03 DIS	Conference with R. Sable and J. Van Horn regarding insurance appeal summary for Congress Financial	.20
10/21/03 DIS	Review Travelers and Liberty Mutual's statement of issues and e-mail to client	.30
10/21/03 JEV	Conference with D. Swan and R. Sable regarding insurance appeal issues (.4); research case law on mootness issues (.8)	1.20
10/21/03 MLW	Telephone calls with T. Bennett of Otterbourg firm regarding status of updated UCC, judgment and lien searches; compile list of outstanding updates (.4); receive and review correspondence from T. Bennett regarding outstanding updates (.2); revise summary of search results (.1)	.70

10/22/03	AKS	Analyze issues regarding UCC and lien search updates	.30
10/22/03	RGS	Telephone conference with R. Rosenberg (.2); telephone conference with J. O'Leary regarding PBGC issues and update (.3); work on PBGC resolution (.4)	.90
10/22/03	RGS	Telephone conference with B. Dropkin regarding employee issues and claim issues (.3); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding claim issues (.2); review e-mail from R. McDonald (.2); conference with D. Swan regarding insurance issues (.3); conference with R. Crouch regarding PBGC's memorandum (.2)	1.20
10/22/03	RGS	Further discussions with D. Wanlass (.3); conference with R. Crouch and D. Swan regarding PBGC and insurance issues (.2)	.50
10/22/03	DIS	Conference with J. Van Horn regarding insurance appeal and mootness issue	.20
10/22/03	JEV	Research Sixth Circuit Court case law on appeals issues and legal standards relating to mootness issues	1.80
10/22/03	JEV	Conference with staff regarding retrieving pleadings from docket (.1); review pleadings as background for memorandum addressing insurance company's appeals (.5); conference with D. Swan regarding research results on mootness issues of law (.2); draft section of memorandum addressing mootness and related issues from insurance companies appeals (1.4); conference with D. Swan to review (.2)	2.40
10/22/03	JEV	Make revisions to memorandum addressing insurance company appeals	.90
10/23/03	RGS	Organize tasks and open items (.7); telephone conference with R. Rosenberg regarding various issues and confirmation (.2)	.90
10/23/03	RGS	Respond to R. McDonald on PBGC	.20
10/23/03	RGS	Telephone conference with J. O'Leary regarding PBGC (.2); review draft brief on PBGC appeal and research and memorandum on PBGC issues (1.3)	1.50

10/23/03 DIS	Prepare summary of insurance company appeals for Congress Financial	1.50
10/23/03 JEV	Draft and revise memorandum addressing insurance companies' appeals	1.80
10/24/03 RGS	Telephone conference with J. O'Leary numerous times (.9); review incoming pleadings, including PBGC brief (.7); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding PBGC, bank meeting and plan issues (.4)	2.00
10/27/03 PLH	Prepare and file notice on record date (.4); e-mail regarding same (.3); review insurance appeals regarding designation of the record on appeal (.7); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.3); review worker's compensation provision (.5)	2.20
10/27/03 RGS	Conference call with D. Wanlass, C. Van Essche and R. Rosenberg regarding PBGC and other plan issues (1.0); follow-up memorandum and e-mail regarding open issues (.5); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding Inco, PBGC issues and further steps (.3)	1.80
10/27/03 DIS	Prepare counter designation to Century appeal and telephone calls with P. Hayden to discuss contents	1.40
10/28/03 PLH	Telephone call with B. Shaw regarding closing issues (.2); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding closing issues (.5)	.70
10/28/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. Sable regarding consummation issues (.3); review memorandums regarding appeals (.3); e-mails with G. Schaaf regarding plan notice (.4)	1.00
10/28/03 AKS	Attention to lien search updates (.5); e-mail R. McDonald regarding searches (.1)	.60
10/28/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding opinion and other closing issues (.2); letter to P. Hayden with memorandum (.2)	.60

10/29/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald and M. Miller regarding consummation issues (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.3); e-mail to D. Swan regarding issuance appeal (.2); e-mail on appeal issues (.3); attention to opinion letter issues (.8)	2.00
10/29/03 RGS	Telephone conference with J. O'Leary (.4); telephone conference with D. Wanlass (.4); telephone conference with R. Rosenberg (.5); telephone conference with R. McDonald (.3); review memorandum regarding PBGC (.3); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding opinion letter (.2); conference call with D. Wanlass and J. O'Leary regarding bank and PBGC (.5)	2.60
10/29/03 RGS	Review and revise memorandum on PBGC issues, including economic analysis sections (1.5); letter to R. Rosenberg, D. Wanlass and R. McDonald, et al. (.4); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding issues and opinion (.3)	2.20
10/29/03 DIS	Telephone conference with A. Semani of insurance company plan appeal and declaratory judgment action	.30
10/29/03 DIS	Review insurance company's appeal stay issue and bankruptcy appellate rules; e-mail to P. Hayden	.30
10/29/03 MLW	Compile updated search results to be sent to R. Berger of Bond, Schoeneck, et al. (.3); letter to R. Berger regarding same (.1)	.40
10/30/03 PLH	Attention to opinion letter issues (1.0); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding consummation issues (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding same (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding insurance appeals (.3); telephone call with B. Shaw regarding administrative expenses (.2); telephone call with J. Spradlin regarding same (.2); e-mails regarding same (.2); telephone call with M. Miller regarding closing issues (.3)	2.80
10/30/03 AKS	Telephone conference with T. Bennett regarding lien searches (.2); attention to Huntington Alloys and other lien searches (.1)	.30

10/30/03	RGS	Telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding PBGC, Inco and other consummation issues	.20
10/30/03	RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding opinion and closing issues (.2)	.40
10/30/03	DIS	Prepare counter-designation of record in Travelers' appeal	.80
10/30/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding record counter-designation	.20
10/30/03	MLW	Telephone call with T. Bennett (Otterbourg) regarding searches on Huntington Alloys (.2); telephone call with and correspondence to J. Montague (Fidelity) regarding same (.1)	.30
10/31/03	PLH	Telephone call with J. Spradlin regarding administrative expense claims (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding same (.3); telephone call with R. Sable regarding information for Congress Financial (.3); prepare same (.5); telephone call with M. Miller regarding cash collateral and closing issues (.5); attention to issues on opinion letter (.3)	2.20
10/31/03	RGS	Letter to P. Hayden and R. McDonald regarding letter to Congress Financial (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding delivery of letter to Congress Financial (.2)	.40
10/31/03	RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding PBGC and other closing issues (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding letter to Congress Financial (.1)	.30
10/31/03	RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald (.2); telephone conference with P. Hayden (.4); telephone conference with D. Wanlass regarding PBGC issues and process (.2)	.80
10/31/03	RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding Congress Financial's letter and memorandum	.30

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate/HR</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Patrick L. Hayden	\$430.00	46.3	\$19,909.00
Robert G. Sable	\$410.00	46.3	\$18,983.00
Ronald W. Schuler	\$315.00	2.1	\$661.50

Alan K. Sable	\$265.00	1.9	\$503.50
David I. Swan	\$235.00	12.8	\$3,008.00
James E. Van Horn	\$170.00	8.1	\$1,377.00
Martha Lynn Wigton	\$120.00	2.7	\$324.00
Vicki L. Curfman	\$110.00	4.9	\$539.00
Mary Jo Albright	\$105.00	1.4	\$147.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
TOTAL FEES		126.5	\$45,452.00

TOTAL FOR MATTER 2035688-0013

\$45,452.00

---

11/10/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding appeal issues and opinion letter issues (.8); review insurance appeal issues (.3)	1.10
11/10/03	DIS	Telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding insurance company's appeals	.20
11/10/03	DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding insurance appeals and reasoned opinion letter	.50
11/10/03	DIS	Review materials (.4); begin draft of reasoned opinion letter (.7)	1.10
11/10/03	MLW	Telephone calls to J. Montague (Fidelity) and T. Bennett (Otterbourg) regarding status of UCC, judgment and lien searches (.3); receive and review search results from J. Montague (.2); forward same to T. Bennett (.1)	.60
11/11/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding resolution of claims under the plan (.7); review issues regarding same (.5)	1.20
11/11/03	PLH	Prepare opinion letter for closing	.40
11/11/03	RGS	Review correspondence and e-mails on Hereford and PBGC	1.50
11/11/03	RGS	Telephone conference with B. Dropkin (.2); letter to B. Dropkin regarding plan and PBGC (.2)	.40
11/11/03	DIS	Telephone conference with D. Bleck and S. Moskol regarding insurance company's plan appeal issues and claims	.30
11/11/03	DIS	Telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding insurance company's appeal issues	.40
11/11/03	MLW	Telephone call with T. Bennett (Otterbourg) regarding status of searches (.2); correspondence to J. Montague regarding same (.1)	.30
11/12/03	PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding appeals issues (.3); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding closing issues (.3)	.60
11/12/03	RGS	Conference call with J. Gillespie, D. Wanlass, R. McDonald and J. O'Leary regarding PBGC, Inco and other closing issues	1.50

11/12/03 DIS	Conference with K. Batik regarding PBGC and appeal issues	.30
11/12/03 MLW	Telephone call with A. LaBarge of BSK regarding status of UCC, judgment and lien searches	.10
11/13/03 PLH	E-mails regarding appeals issues	.30
11/13/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding update on closing and effectiveness	.30
11/13/03 RGS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald (.2); telephone conference with M. Miller regarding closing (.2)	.40
11/13/03 RGS	Further revisions to PBGC and Inco agreements (.5); e-mail to D. Wanlass, B. Dropkin, R. McDonald and J. O'Leary (.3)	.80
11/13/03 DIS	Review motion to dismiss insurance appeals and send to R. McDonald	.30
11/13/03 DIS	Telephone conference with S. Moskol and D. Bleck regarding insurance appeal procedural issues (.3); memorandum to D. Wanlass, B. Dropkin and B. Rosenberg regarding proposed briefing schedule (.3)	.60
11/14/03 PLH	Conference calls regarding status of appeals and consummation issues (2.0); e-mails regarding closing issues with Congress Financial (.5); telephone call with D. Swan regarding opinion letter (.3); telephone call with R. Cox regarding opinion letter (.4)	3.20
11/14/03 RGS	Review e-mails, including D. Wanlass' issues list (.5); prepare for open items meeting with D. Swan, R. Crouch and K. Batik regarding adversary actions and process (.7); telephone conference with G. Schaaf regarding scheduling issues (.3); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding Inco and related matters (.2)	1.70
11/14/03 RGS	Conference call with D. Wanlass, B. Dropkin, R. McDonald, J. Gillespie and P. Hayden regarding closing issues	1.00
11/14/03 RGS	Conference with D. Swan regarding open tasks (.3); telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding 9019 motion (.2)	.50



---

11/14/03 DIS	Two telephone calls with P. Hayden regarding reasoned opinion on insurance company appeals	.40
11/14/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding settlements and 9019 motion	.20
11/14/03 DIS	Review action items memorandum from D. Wanlass and telephone conference with R. McDonald regarding various closing issues	.40
11/14/03 RAC	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding issue of mootness of appeal	.30
11/15/03 PLH	Telephone call with D. Swan regarding issues on insurance companies appeals (.3); e-mails with R. McDonald and R. Berger regarding issues on avoidance actions under the plan (.5); prepare opinion letter on insurance appeals (1.5)	2.30
11/15/03 RGS	Respond to D. Wanlass' e-mails; review P. Hayden's e-mails	.50
11/15/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding Congress Financial and preference questions	.20
11/15/03 DIS	Correspondence to S. Moskol and D. Bleck regarding insurance appeal brief schedule and Century Indemnity Corporation amended issues	.20
11/16/03 RGS	Review R. McDonald's draft on insurance (.6); review M. Miller's e-mail and send to D. Wanlass (.3)	.90
11/17/03 PLH	Telephone call with M. Miller regarding Inco agreement and opinion letter (1.0); telephone call with R. McDonald regarding same (.8); office conference with B. Iselin regarding intercreditor agreement with Inco and Congress Financial (.4); telephone call with R. Sable regarding closing issues (.3); telephone call with D. Swan regarding opinion issues (.4); telephone call with R. Cox regarding opinion issues (.5); e-mails regarding closing (.4)	3.80
11/17/03 RGS	Review and revise insurance opinion (.4); conference with D. Swan regarding comments (.2)	.60
11/17/03 RGS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding requested opinion letter from Congress Financial	.30

---

11/17/03 DIS	Review and revise motion to extend insurance appeal briefing schedule (.5); telephone calls with S. Moskol (.2)	.70
11/17/03 DIS	Review loan schedule on insurance appeals and discuss with R. Sable	.50
11/17/03 DIS	Telephone conference with R. McDonald and telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding insurance appeal opinion letter	.50
11/17/03 DIS	Outline insurance appeal summary for loan schedule	.30
11/17/03 DIS	Telephone conference with P. Hayden regarding disposition of Congress Financial's request for opinion on insurance appeals	.40
11/17/03 RAC	Legal research and draft memorandum regarding mootness of appeal	7.00
11/17/03 JEV	Review and revise tax exhibit to closing schedule	.20
11/17/03 MLW	Telephone call with J. Montague of Fidelity regarding status of searches (.2); telephone calls with A. LaBarge (BSK) and T. Bennett (Otterbourg) regarding same (.4); review most recent search results and reconcile with list of outstanding documents (1.1); update summary of searches(1.0)	2.80
11/18/03 PLH	Telephone call with R. McDonald regarding closing issues (.3); address issues on Inco intercreditor agreement (.5)	.80
11/18/03 RGS	Telephone conference with B. Rosenberg (.2); conference call with D. Wanlass, J. O'Leary, B. Dropkin and others regarding PBGC and closing issues (1.3)	1.50
11/18/03 BBI	Draft intercreditor agreement for International Nickel Company lien	5.40
11/18/03 DIS	Prepare insurance appeal description for loan schedule	1.10
11/18/03 DIS	Modifications to briefing schedule (.2); follow-up e-mails (.2); telephone conference with S. Moskol (.2)	.60