

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

**In Re:**

**SILICON GRAHICS, INC., ET AL.**

**Debtors.**

**Chapter 11  
Case No. 06-10977 (BRL)  
Jointly Administered**

**FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION OF CRA INTERNATIONAL, INC.  
AS INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY VALUATION CONSULTANTS  
TO SILICON GRAPHICS, INC.  
FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED  
AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FROM  
MAY 8, 2006 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 19, 2006**

Name of Applicant:	<u>CRA International, Inc.</u>
Authorized to Provide Professional Services to:	<u>Silicon Graphics, Inc.</u>
Date of Retention:	<u>July 19, 2006, <i>nunc pro tunc</i> to May 8, 2006</u>
Period for which Compensation and reimbursement are sought:	<u>May 8, 2006 – September 19, 2006</u>
Amount of Compensation sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	<u>\$693,712.00</u>
Total Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought as actual, reasonable, and necessary:	<u>\$17,827.44</u>

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

**In Re:**

**SILICON GRAHICS, INC., ET AL.**

**Debtors.**

**Chapter 11  
Case No. 06-10977 (BRL)  
Jointly Administered**

**FIRST APPLICATION OF CRA INTERNATIONAL, INC.  
AS INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY VALUATION CONSULTANTS  
TO SILICON GRAPHICS, INC.  
FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED  
AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FROM  
MAY 8, 2006 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 19, 2006**

CRA International, Inc. ("CRA"), consultants to Silicon Graphics, Inc. ("SGI") and certain of its direct and indirect subsidiaries in the above-referenced Chapter 11 cases (collectively, the "Debtors") and Morgan, Lewis & Bockius LLP, special intellectual property counsel to the Debtors ("counsel for SGI"), hereby submits its application (the "Application"), pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330 and 331, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), the Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases adopted by the Court on June 24, 1991 and amended April 21, 1995 (together, the "Local Guidelines"), the United States Trustee Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330 effective January 30, 1996 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines"), and the Administrative Order, Pursuant to Sections 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 2016(a) Establishing Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated May 31, 2006, for the allowance of interim compensation for

professional services rendered from May 8, 2006 through and including September 19, 2006 (“the Compensation Period”), and for reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with such services, and in support thereof respectfully represents as follows:

## I. INTRODUCTION

### A. Background

1. Bankruptcy Filing. Beginning on May 8, 2006, and, in some instances, periodically thereafter (the "Petition Date"), Silicon Graphics, Inc. and certain of its affiliated entities filed voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of title 11 of the United States Code, 11 U.S.C. §§ 101-1330 (as amended, the "Bankruptcy Code").

2. Jurisdiction. This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §157 and § 1334. This matter is a core proceeding within the meaning of 28 U.S.C. § 157(b). Venue of the Debtors’ chapter 11 cases and this Application is proper under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. The statutory predicates for the relief sought herein are sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code. Pursuant to the Local Guidelines, a certification regarding compliance with the Local Guidelines is attached hereto as Exhibit A.

### B. Retention of CRA and Billing History

1. Authorization for CRA’s Retention. On July 19, 2006, pursuant to the Order Authorizing Employment and Retention of CRA International, Inc., Nunc Pro Tunc, to the Commencement Date (the “Retention Order”), the Court authorized CRA’s retention as intellectual property valuation consultant for SGI and counsel for SGI in these cases effective as of May 8, 2006 (Order attached as Exhibit B). The Retention Order authorized compensation to CRA pursuant to the procedures set forth in the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of

Bankruptcy Procedure, the Local Guidelines, the U.S. Trustee Guidelines and the local rules and orders of this Court.

2. This Application is CRA's first and final application for approval and allowance of compensation and reimbursement of expenses. CRA makes this interim application for approval and allowance of compensation and reimbursement of expenses pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code. No prior application has been made to this or any other court for the relief requested herein.

3. In accordance with the Administrative Order, Pursuant To Sections §§ 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 2016(a) Establishing Procedures for Interim Monthly Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals, dated May 31, 2006 (the "Interim Compensation Order"), CRA submitted monthly fee statements to SGI seeking interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses. During the Compensation Period, CRA submitted the following fee statements:

- (1) On July 21, 2006, pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, CRA filed and served its first fee statement for the period from May 8, 2006 through and including June 30, 2006 (the "First Fee Statement"). The First Fee Statement sought an allowance of \$498,281.50 as compensation for services rendered and the reimbursement of \$7,410.46 in expenses. As of the date hereof, CRA has received 80% of its fees and 100% of its expenses requested pursuant to the First Fee Statement.
- (2) On August 4, 2006 pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, CRA filed and served its second fee statement for the period from July 1, 2006 through and including July 31, 2006 (the "Second Fee Statement"). The Second Fee Statement sought an allowance of \$171,037.50 as compensation for services rendered and the reimbursement of \$8,465.69 in expenses. As of the date hereof, CRA has received 80% of its fees and 100% of its expenses requested pursuant to the Second Fee Statement.
- (3) On September 27, 2006 pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, CRA filed and served its third fee statement for the period from August 1, 2006 through and including August 31, 2006 (the "Third Fee Statement"). The Third Fee Statement sought an allowance of \$12,041.50 as compensation for services rendered and the

reimbursement of \$486.61 in expenses. As of the date hereof, CRA has received 80% of its fees and 100% of its expenses requested pursuant to the Third Fee Statement.

- (4) On October 10, 2006, pursuant to the Interim Compensation Order, CRA filed and served its fourth fee statement for the period from September 1, 2006 through and including September 19, 2006 (the "Fourth Fee Statement"). The Fourth Fee Statement sought an allowance of \$12,351.50 as compensation for services rendered and the reimbursement of \$1,464.68 in expenses. As of the date hereof, CRA has received 80% of its fees and 100% of its expenses requested pursuant to the Fourth Fee Statement.

4. CRA has not entered into any agreement, express or implied, with any other party for the purpose of fixing or sharing fees or other compensation to be paid for professional services rendered in these cases.

5. No promises have been received by CRA or any member thereof as to compensation in connection with these cases other than in accordance with the provisions of the Bankruptcy Code.

## **II. APPLICATION**

1. By this Application, CRA is seeking allowance of (a) compensation for professional services rendered by CRA, as intellectual property valuation consultants to SGI, during the Compensation Period and (b) reimbursement of expenses incurred by CRA in connection with such services during the Compensation Period.

2. CRA seeks approval of the sum of \$693,712.00 for services rendered on behalf of SGI during the Compensation Period, and \$17,827.44 for reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services, for a total award of \$711,539.44. Pursuant to the Fee Orders, CRA has already received payment of \$554,969.60, representing eighty percent (80%) of CRA's fees for consulting services rendered during the Compensation Period, and reimbursement of \$17,827.44, representing one hundred percent (100%) of CRA's

expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of such services. In addition, CRA received from SGI a retainer in the amount of \$25,000. Therefore, CRA seeks payment of \$113,742.40 (total invoiced amount during Compensation Period minus amounts paid on invoices minus retainer) pursuant to this Application, which amount represents the portion of CRA's fees for professional services rendered and expenses incurred during the Compensation Period not previously paid to CRA pursuant to the Fee Orders.

3. The fees sought by the Application reflect an aggregate of 2,425.50 hours of consultant time spent and recorded in performing services for SGI during the Compensation Period, at a blended average hourly rate of \$286.

4. CRA rendered to SGI all services for which compensation is sought solely in connection with these cases, in furtherance of the duties and functions of SGI.

5. CRA maintains computerized records of the time expended in the rendition of the professional services required by SGI. For the convenience of the Court and parties in interest, a billing summary for the Compensation Period is attached as Exhibit C, setting forth the name and title of each consultant and employee for whose work on these cases compensation is sought, the aggregate of the time expended by each consultant, the hourly billing rate for each consultant and an indication of the individual amounts requested as part of the total amount of compensation requested. The compensation requested by CRA is based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in matters not under the Bankruptcy Code.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit D are time entry records broken down in tenths of an hour, based on the U.S. Trustee Guidelines, setting forth a detailed description of services performed by each consultant or employee on behalf of SGI.

7. CRA also maintains computerized records of all expenses incurred in connection with the performance of professional services. A summary of the amounts and categories of expenses for which reimbursement is sought, as well as a breakdown of expenses by category and detailed descriptions of these expenses, are attached hereto as Exhibit E.

### **III. SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED**

1. The following overview is intended to highlight the services rendered by CRA, and it is not meant to be a detailed description of all of the work performed. Detailed descriptions of the day-to-day services provided by CRA and the time expended performing such services in each project billing category are fully set forth in Exhibit D hereto. Such detailed descriptions show that CRA was heavily involved in the performance of services for SGI on a daily basis, including night and weekend work, often under extreme time constraints to meet the needs of SGI, its outside counsel (including both Weil Gotshal & Manges and Morgan, Lewis & Bockius) and deadlines set by the Court.

2. To provide an orderly and meaningful summary of the services rendered on behalf of SGI, CRA categorized work performed under the various technology buckets identified by CRA and the Company. These technology buckets are as follows:

- Scalability
- Compilers
- Digital Media
- FPD
- Graphics
- Mechanisms
- Multiple Processor
- Operating Systems Software
- Other Technology
- PCI
- Scalability
- Storage
- System Design
- Thermal Management

- Vizserver
- Windancer

Additionally, the following general categories were used to describe work spanning across multiple technology buckets.

- LGE Objection
- Portfolio - General
- Main Report
- Comparable Transactions

3. The following overview is intended to highlight a number of the engagement activities undertaken by CRA for which a considerable number of hours have been expended on behalf of SGI, and it is not meant to be a detailed description of all of the work performed.

**A. Coordination of Efforts with Counsel**

1. During this Compensation Period, CRA conducted phone conferences with counsel to coordinate activities and provide status updates to ensure the needs of the Company were met. Regular internal discussions were held to coordinate activities across the CRA team, as well as to evaluate status of work activities and delegate responsibilities to various members of the CRA team.

**B. Technology Valuation**

1. During this Compensation Period, CRA was asked to provide valuation opinions for a number of discrete technology buckets. At a high level, this involved reviewing the SGI patents grouped into the technology bucket; conducting independent research on the relevant industry and companies in the industry; conducting independent research on the patent activity related to the technology; participating in conference calls with Subject Matter Experts from SGI to better understand the technology; development of a valuation model based upon a



variety of factors related to the technology and the industry; development of a written report describing the valuation methodology, the information relied upon, and the valuation result; and quality control of the valuation model and report.

**C. Comparable Transactions**

1. As part of its efforts to determine the value of the SGI technology, CRA independently researched and reviewed comparable transactions to develop additional data points supporting the technology valuation. CRA was able to successfully identify a number of comparable transactions to better support the valuation opinion.

**D. Patent Analytics**

1. CRA also performed work commonly described as “patent analytics” to understand the patent landscape related to the various technology buckets and to better assess the strength of the SGI patents. This analysis helped to identify other companies that may be potentially infringing the SGI patents and also to identify technology trends in the industry.

**E. LGE Objection**

1. CRA assisted counsel for SGI with various issues relating to LGE’s objection.

**IV. ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION**

1. The professional services rendered by CRA have required a high degree of professional competence and expertise to address, with skill and dispatch, the numerous issues requiring evaluation and action by SGI and its counsel. CRA respectfully submits that the services rendered to SGI and its outside counsel were performed efficiently, effectively and economically.

2. The allowance of interim compensation for services rendered and reimbursement of expenses in bankruptcy cases is expressly provided for in section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code:

Any professional person . . . may apply to the court not more than once every 120 days after an order for relief in a case under this title, or more often if the court permits, for such compensation for services rendered . . . as is provided under section 330 of this title.

11 U.S.C. § 331.

3. With respect to the level of compensation, section 330(a)(1) of the Bankruptcy Code provides, in pertinent part, that the Court may award to a professional person, "reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered." Section 330(a)(3)(A), in turn, provides that:

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including –

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issues or task addressed; and
- (E) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.

11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3)(A).

4. The congressional policy expressed above provides for adequate compensation in order to continue to attract qualified and competent professionals to bankruptcy cases. See In re Busy Beaver Bldg. Ctrs., Inc., 19 F.3d 833, 850 (3d Cir. 1994) ("Congress rather

clearly intended to provide sufficient economic incentive to lure competent bankruptcy specialists to practice in the bankruptcy courts.") (citation and internal quotation marks omitted); In re Drexel Burnham Lambert Group, Inc., 133 B.R. 13, 18 (Bankr. S.D.N.Y. 1991) ("Congress' objective on requiring that the market, not the Court, establish attorneys' rates was to ensure that bankruptcy cases were staffed by appropriate legal specialists.").

5. The total time spent by CRA consultants and employees during the Compensation Period was 2,425.50 hours and has a fair market value of \$693,712.00. As shown by this Application and supporting exhibits, CRA's services were rendered economically and without unnecessary duplication of efforts. In addition, the work involved was carefully assigned in consideration of the experience and expertise required for each particular task.

#### V. EXPENSES

1. CRA has incurred a total of \$17,827.44 in expenses in connection with representing SGI during the Compensation Period. CRA records all expenses incurred in connection with the performance of professional services. A summary of these expenses, as well as a detailed descriptions of these expenses, is annexed hereto as Exhibit E.

2. In connection with the reimbursement of expenses, CRA's normal policy is to charge its clients for expenses associated with things such as travel, outside photocopying, data acquisition, overtime meals and transportation at cost. That policy has been adhered to in this case.

3. Normally, miscellaneous expenses for telephone, facsimile, on-site copying, online information resources, courier service, shipping, postage and supplies are allocated on a pro rata basis and are billed by CRA across all projects at a rate of \$13.54 per labor hour incurred on a specific project. However, given the Court's rules regarding

reimbursement of expenses, CRA is seeking reimbursement of only those expenses for which it has documentation showing the actual expense incurred.

4. Because it cannot be documented, CRA is not seeking reimbursement from the Debtors for on-site photocopying, supplies, telephone (other than conference call services) and online information resources. As mentioned in the above paragraph, CRA normally charges its clients \$13.54 per labor hour for such expenses. By electing to forego its normal charge for these items, CRA has voluntarily written off \$32,841.27 during the Compensation Period (2,425.50 hours X \$13.54 per hour).

5. CRA normally charges its clients a standard fee of \$16.00 per labor hour incurred on a project for use of computer hardware, software, support and network services. Given the Court's rules regarding reimbursement of expenses, CRA has elected not to seek reimbursement on this case for such expenses. By electing to forego its normal charge for these items, CRA has voluntarily written off \$38,808.00 during the Compensation Period (2,425.50 hours X \$16.00 per hour).

6. Thus, CRA has voluntarily written off a total of \$71,649.27 that it would normally charge its clients in a non-bankruptcy setting. This represents a voluntary write off of approximately 10% of the total fees and expenses incurred by CRA during the Compensation Period.

## **VI. CONCLUSION**

WHEREFORE, CRA respectfully requests the Court to enter an order, (a) allowing CRA (i) interim compensation for professional services rendered as intellectual property valuation consultants for SGI during the Compensation Period in the amount of \$693,712.00 and (ii) reimbursement of expenses incurred in connection with rendering such

services in the aggregate amount of \$17,827.44, for a total award of \$711,539.44; and,  
(b) authorizing and directing the Debtors to pay to CRA \$113,742.40, which is an amount equal to the difference between (i) this \$711,539.44 award and (ii) the total of all amounts that the Debtors have paid to CRA, including payments made pursuant to the Fee Orders for services rendered and expenses incurred during the Compensation Period and the unapplied retainer amount.

CRA INTERNATIONAL, INC.

By: Michael E. Tate  
Michael E. Tate  
Vice President  
January 4, 2007

101 N. Wacker Drive  
Suite 1600  
Chicago, Illinois 60606  
(312) 357-1000

**Exhibit A**

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

**In Re:**

**SILICON GRAHICS, INC., ET AL.**

**Debtors.**

**Chapter 11  
Case No. 06-10977 (BRL)  
Jointly Administered**

**CERTIFICATION UNDER GUIDELINES FOR DISBURSEMENTS FOR  
PROFESSIONALS IN RESPECT OF FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION OF  
CRA INTERNATIONAL, INC., INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY  
VALUATION CONSULTANTS FOR SILICON GRAPHICS, INC. AND CERTAIN OF  
ITS DIRECT AND INDIRECT SUBSIDIARIES  
FOR INTERIM ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED  
AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED FROM  
MAY 8, 2006 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 19, 2006**

---

Pursuant to the Guidelines for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases adopted by the Court on June 24, 1991 and amended April 21, 1995 (together, the "Local Guidelines"), and the United States Trustee Guidelines for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 U.S.C. § 330, adopted on January 30, 1996 (the "U.S. Trustee Guidelines" and, together with the Local Guidelines, the "Guidelines"), the undersigned, a Vice President with the firm CRA International, Inc. ("CRA"), intellectual property valuation consultants to Silicon Graphics, Inc. ("SGI") and certain of its direct and indirect subsidiaries in the above-captioned cases (collectively, the "Debtors"), hereby certifies with respect to CRA's first and final application for interim allowance of compensation for services rendered and for reimbursement of expenses, dated January 4, 2007 (the "Application"), for the period May 8, 2006 through and including September 19, 2006 as follows:

1. I am the professional designated by CRA in respect of compliance with the Guidelines.
2. I make this certification in support of the Application, for interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for the Compensation Period, in accordance with the Local Guidelines.
3. In respect of section B.1 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that:
  - a. I have read the Application.
  - b. To the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements sought fall within the Local Guidelines.
  - c. Except to the extent that fees or disbursements are prohibited by the Guidelines, the fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates in accordance with practices customarily employed by CRA and generally accepted by CRA's clients.
  - d. In providing a reimbursable service, CRA does not make a profit on that service, whether the service is performed by CRA in-house or through a third party.
4. In respect of section B.2 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that CRA has provided, on a monthly basis, statements of CRA's fees and disbursements accrued during the previous month, by filing and serving monthly statements in accordance with the Fee Orders (as defined in the Application).
5. In respect of section B.3 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that copies of the Application are being provided to (a) counsel for the Debtors, (b) counsel to the official committees, and (c) the Office of the United States Trustee in accordance with the Fee Orders (as defined in the Application).



*Michael E. Tate*

---

***Michael E. Tate***  
Vice President  
CRA International  
January 4, 2007

**Exhibit B**

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

-----X  
In re :  
 : Chapter 11 Case No.  
 :  
 :  
 SILICON GRAPHICS, INC., *et al.*, : 06-10977 (BRL)  
 :  
 :  
 Debtors. : (Jointly Administered)  
 :  
 :  
-----X

**ORDER AUTHORIZING THE EMPLOYMENT AND  
RETENTION OF CRA INTERNATIONAL, INC.  
AS CONSULTANTS NUNC PRO TUNC TO THE COMMENCEMENT DATE**

Upon the application, dated June 22, 2006 (the "Application"), of Silicon Graphics, Inc. and certain of its direct and indirect subsidiaries in the above-referenced chapter 11 cases, as debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors"), pursuant to sections 327(a) and 328(a) of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code") and Rule 2014(a) of the Federal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), for authorization for the employment and retention of CRA International, Inc. ("CRA") as consultants by Morgan, Lewis & Bockius LLP ("Morgan Lewis"), special intellectual property counsel to the Debtors, *nunc pro tunc* to the commencement date of the Debtors' chapter 11 cases, all as more fully set forth in the Application; and upon the affidavit of Jonathan D. Yellin, Vice President and General Counsel of CRA, in support of the Application (the "Yellin Affidavit"); and the Court having jurisdiction to consider the Application and the relief requested therein pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and the Standing Order of Referral of Cases to Bankruptcy Court Judges of the District Court for the Southern District of New York, dated July 19, 1984 (Ward, Acting C.J.); and consideration of the Application and the relief requested

therein being a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b); and venue being proper before this Court pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; and due and proper notice of the Application having been served on (i) the Office of the U.S. Trustee for the Southern District of New York, (ii) counsel to Wells Fargo Foothill, Inc., the Debtors' prepetition secured lender, (iii) counsel to the *ad hoc* committee of the Debtors' senior noteholders, (iv) counsel to U.S. Bank National Association, indenture trustee for the Debtors' senior noteholders, (v) counsel to JPMorgan Chase Bank, indenture trustee for the Debtors' subordinated noteholders, (vi) the creditors holding the five largest secured claims against the Debtors' estates (on a consolidated basis), (vii) counsel to the statutory committee of unsecured creditors, (viii) counsel to Morgan Stanley Senior Funding, Inc., the agent for the Debtors' postpetition credit facility, (ix) CRA International, Inc., and (x) those parties entitled to notice pursuant to this Court's order dated May 31, 2006 establishing notice procedures in the Debtors' chapter 11 cases; and the Court being satisfied, based on the representations made in the Application and Yellin Affidavit, that CRA does not represent or hold any interest adverse to the Debtors or to their estates as to the matters upon which CRA has been and is to be employed, and that CRA is a "disinterested person" as such term is defined in section 101(14) of the Bankruptcy Code, as modified by section 1107(b) of the Bankruptcy Code, and as required under section 327(a) of the Bankruptcy Code; and the Court having determined that the relief requested in the Application is in the best interests of the Debtors, their estates and creditors, and all parties in interest; and the Court having determined that the legal and factual bases set forth in the Application establish just cause for the relief granted herein; and upon all of

the proceedings had before the Court; and after due deliberation and sufficient cause appearing therefor, it is

ORDERED that the Application is approved; and it is further

ORDERED that pursuant to sections 327(a) and 328(a) of the Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 2014(a), the employment and retention of CRA by Morgan Lewis as consultants is authorized, all as contemplated by the Application; and it is further

ORDERED that, as described in the Application, CRA will render professional services to the Debtors for matters relating to intellectual property valuation; and it is further

ORDERED that CRA shall apply for compensation and reimbursement in accordance with the procedures set forth in sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of New York, the guidelines established by the Office of the United States Trustee, and such other procedures as may be fixed by order of this Court; and it is further

ORDERED that notice of the Application as provided herein and therein shall be deemed good and sufficient notice of the Application; and it is further

ORDERED that the requirement pursuant to Local Rule 9013-1(b) that the Debtors file a separate memorandum of law in support of the Motion is deemed satisfied.

Dated: July 19, 2006  
New York, New York

/s/Burton R. Lifland  
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

Exhibit C

Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.

CRA INTERNATIONAL  
SUMMARY OF HOURS AND FEES BY PROFESSIONAL  
FOR THE PERIOD MAY 8, 2006 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 19, 2006

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Title</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Oliver, Brian	Senior Consultant	\$450	164.9	\$74,205
Daniel, Brian	Vice President	\$450	75.8	\$34,110
Koppel, Lew	Vice President	\$480	9.1	\$4,368
Tate, Mike	Vice President	\$480	90.2	\$43,296
Goldman, Bob	Principal	\$350	272.0	\$95,200
Newell, Mike	Principal	\$350	5.3	\$1,855
Snell, Jeff	Principal	\$400	169.2	\$67,680
Frizzell, Brian	Associate Principal	\$325	181.3	\$58,923
Lennox, Katie	Associate Principal	\$375	146.5	\$54,938
Phillips, Eric	Associate Principal	\$300	105.6	\$31,680
Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Senior Associate	\$275	88.2	\$24,255
Kirr, Erich	Senior Associate	\$275	15.5	\$4,263
Manning, Joe	Consulting Associate	\$225	36.0	\$8,100
Porter, Steve	Associate	\$215	165.4	\$35,561
Rakiec, Michelle	Associate	\$215	58.0	\$12,470
Resch, Jessica	Associate	\$175	5.5	\$963
Ringgenberg, Matt	Associate	\$175	139.9	\$24,483
Frecka, Ted	Associate	\$185	3.7	\$685
Vold, Matt	Associate	\$215	100.2	\$21,543
Wilson, Erika	Associate	\$185	5.2	\$962
Bailey, Kevin	Analyst	\$160	17.9	\$2,864
Dolloff, Jessica	Analyst	\$160	2.0	\$320
Becker, Josh	Analyst	\$160	205.3	\$32,848
Hannah, Brad	Analyst	\$160	300.9	\$48,144
Koycheva, Denica	Analyst	\$160	7.2	\$1,152
Leonhard, Nate	Analyst	\$160	47.2	\$7,552
Pendery, Danny	Analyst	\$185	2.0	\$370
Borden, Eric	Analyst	\$160	1.5	\$240
Robak, Michael	Director of Research	\$200	1.0	\$200
Cronin, Chris	Director of IT	\$190	2.0	\$380
Just, Jan	Support	\$105	1.0	\$105
		<b>Total</b>	<u>2,425.5</u>	<u>\$693,712</u>

Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.

CRA International

SUMMARY OF OUT OF POCKET EXPENSES  
FOR THE PERIOD MAY 8, 2006 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 19, 2006

Meals	\$435.96
Shipping	\$486.61
Research	\$11,733.75
Photocopies	\$921.50
Travel	\$2,502.84
Telephone	<u>\$1,746.78</u>
<b>Total</b>	<b><u>\$17,827.44</u></b>



**Exhibit D**

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
08-May-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of preliminary research and testimony outline in preparation for potentially testifying to the court related to the value of the FPD technology.
08-May-06	1.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Review of Materials	Review of bankruptcy filings in support of development of a valuation model.
09-May-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of preliminary research and testimony outline in preparation for potentially testifying to the court related to the value of the graphics technology.
10-May-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Preparation to potentially provide testimony to the court related to the value of non-core assets related to the FPD technology.
11-May-06	2.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Preparation to potentially provide testimony to the court related to the value of the graphics technology.
12-May-06	2.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Preparation to potentially provide testimony to the court related to the value of the FPD technology.
15-May-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) to discuss additional non-core Graphics and Human Computer Interface patents to identify SMEs at SGI.
15-May-06	0.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) discussing additional work plan to form value opinion for additional non-core assets.
15-May-06	0.1	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Prepare redacted sample of work product for discussion with Weil and Morgan.
15-May-06	0.2	Goldman, Bob	Research	Researched to identify consolidated list of inventors on additional Graphics and Human Computer Interface patents to identify potential SMEs still at SGI.
15-May-06	3.7	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, M. Ringgenberg (CRA) to discuss project plan and next actions in support of the valuation of non-core patents.
15-May-06	0.2	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) discussing additional work plan to form value opinion for additional non-core assets.
15-May-06	0.1	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Preparation for meeting to review testimony to the court related to the value of the graphics technology.
15-May-06	3.7	Ringgenberg, Matt	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, M. Ringgenberg (CRA) to discuss project plan and next actions in support of the valuation of non-core patents.
16-May-06	3.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research into FPD technology SGI patents using Delphion.
17-May-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Prep for and call with B. Goldman (CRA), G. Kelakos (Kelakos Advisors), representative for Intellectual Ventures, to discuss obtaining an offer for SGI IP portfolio. Sent NDA to G. Kelakos for IV to sign.
17-May-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of additional documents relating to additional Graphics and HCI non-core patents.
17-May-06	0.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	SGI patent summary file formatting and initial QC
17-May-06	4.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	SGI Patent summary file creation
17-May-06	2.3	Kirr, Erich	Research	Research into applications, uses, and competitors for the HCI technology in support of the valuation analysis.
17-May-06	3.7	Kirr, Erich	Research	Research into applications, uses, and competitors for the graphics technology in support of the valuation analysis.
17-May-06	0.3	Kirr, Erich	Review of Materials	Review of research material for the HCI technology in support of the valuation analysis.
17-May-06	1.7	Kirr, Erich	Review of Materials	Review of research material for the graphics technology in support of the valuation analysis.
17-May-06	3.7	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Patent analytics research using Delphion to analyze SGI patent portfolio.
17-May-06	2.3	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further patent analytics research using Delphion to analyze SGI patent portfolio.
17-May-06	2.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Review of Materials	Review of research into FPD technology SGI patents using Delphion.
17-May-06	3.0	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of patents in SGI portfolio, Delphion research materials in support of valuation
18-May-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Composed draft outline for preliminary reports of FPD and Graphics technology packages.
18-May-06	0.9	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Formatting of SGI patent summary file
18-May-06	1.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	SGI Patent summary file creation and updates
18-May-06	1.6	Kirr, Erich	Research	Further research into applications, uses, and competitors for the HCI technology in support of the valuation analysis.
18-May-06	0.8	Kirr, Erich	Review of Materials	Further review of research material for the graphics technology in support of the valuation analysis.
18-May-06	3.6	Kirr, Erich	Review of Materials	Review of research material for the HCI technology in support of the valuation analysis.
18-May-06	3.5	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further patent analytics research using Delphion to analyze SGI patent portfolio.
18-May-06	3.0	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Development of valuation report for the FPD technology.
18-May-06	1.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Development of valuation report for the FPD technology.
18-May-06	1.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research into patent histories and detailed patent records and assimilation of pertinent information for the FPD technology.
18-May-06	1.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research into patent histories and detailed patent records and assimilation of pertinent information for the graphics technology.
18-May-06	2.9	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research into graphics technology SGI patents using Delphion.
18-May-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Further review of patents in SGI portfolio, Delphion research materials in support of valuation, USPTO research.
19-May-06	1.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), B. Weinert (SGI), S. Youngman (Weil), and D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) re: status of Intellectual Venture offer, preliminary non-core report (Graphics, FPD), and additional potential explicit valuations of Graphics and HCI patents.
19-May-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Kirr, B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: results of research on non-core technology buckets.
19-May-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Additional work on draft outline of preliminary non-core report.
19-May-06	1.7	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of preliminary Graphics portion of non-core report.
19-May-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of preliminary FPD portion of non-core report.
19-May-06	1.5	Kirr, Erich	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Kirr, B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: results of research on non-core technology buckets.
19-May-06	2.7	Leonhard, Nate	Report Writing	Development of summary schedule for delphion patent analytics research.
19-May-06	2.1	Leonhard, Nate	Report Writing	Development of explanatory text for delphion patent analytics research.
19-May-06	1.3	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), B. Weinert (SGI), S. Youngman (Weil), and D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) re: status of Intellectual Venture offer, preliminary non-core report (Graphics, FPD), and additional potential explicit valuations of Graphics and HCI patents.
19-May-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Kirr, B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: results of research on non-core technology buckets.
19-May-06	1.2	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Development of valuation report for the FPD technology.
19-May-06	3.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the FPD technology
19-May-06	2.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research and collation of source material for graphics valuation report in preparation for review by B. Oliver.
20-May-06	2.7	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of background and methodology section of preliminary non-core report.
20-May-06	1.6	Leonhard, Nate	Report Writing	Development of summary schedule for delphion patent analytics research.
20-May-06	2.9	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further patent analytics research using Delphion to analyze SGI patent portfolio.
21-May-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of technology overview section of Graphics portion of preliminary non-core report.
21-May-06	2.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of technology overview section of FPD portion of preliminary non-core report.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
21-May-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Reviewed file histories for FPD patents explicitly valued.
21-May-06	1.9	Leonhard, Nate	Report Writing	Development of explanatory text for delphion patent analytics research.
21-May-06	3.8	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further development of patent summary containing all SGI patents based upon Derwent/Delphion information as part of evaluation of Intellectual Ventures offer.
21-May-06	2.5	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the FPD technology
22-May-06	2.8	Becker, Josh	Review of Materials	Reviewed the graphics model to ensure consistency and accuracy in formatting
22-May-06	3.2	Becker, Josh	Review of Materials	Reviewed the FPD model to ensure consistency and accuracy in formatting
22-May-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), D. Evanicky (SGI/Information Interaction) re: claims on adaptive gamma, adjustable white balance.
22-May-06	2.0	Leonhard, Nate	Report Writing	Development of summary schedule for delphion patent analytics research.
22-May-06	2.2	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further development of patent summary containing all SGI patents based upon Derwent/Delphion information as part of evaluation of Intellectual Ventures offer.
22-May-06	2.9	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of valuation model for the graphics technology
22-May-06	3.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the FPD technology
22-May-06	3.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the graphics technology
23-May-06	2.1	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Analysis of FPD model.
23-May-06	1.9	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting and review of FPD analysis section for FPD portion of preliminary non-core report.
23-May-06	1.2	Leonhard, Nate	Quality Control	Gathering of sources cited as part of patent analytics research.
23-May-06	2.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of valuation model for the graphics technology
23-May-06	3.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of valuation model for the FPD technology
23-May-06	1.5	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report and exhibits for the graphics technology
23-May-06	2.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the FPD technology
24-May-06	2.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting and review of Graphics analysis section for FPD portion of preliminary non-core report.
24-May-06	3.7	Leonhard, Nate	Quality Control	Further gathering of sources cited as part of patent analytics research and verification of schedules against sources to ensure accuracy.
24-May-06	1.6	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Quality control of graphics model to ensure accuracy
24-May-06	3.1	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Quality control of FPD model to ensure accuracy
24-May-06	3.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the graphics technology
24-May-06	3.9	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report and exhibits for the FPD technology
25-May-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of additional documents relating to additional Graphics patents prior to discussion with client.
25-May-06	1.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Confirmation and research of specific patent involved in litigation
25-May-06	2.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the FPD technology.
25-May-06	3.7	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the graphics technology.
26-May-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Weinert and E.L. Goh (SGI), D. Crisman, J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) re: additional non-core Graphics and Human Computer Interface patents.
26-May-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of additional documents relating to additional Human Computer Interface patents prior to discussion with client.
26-May-06	0.5	Just, Jan	Other	Development of fee estimate at the request of client.
26-May-06	1.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the graphics technology.
26-May-06	3.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the FPD technology.
29-May-06	3.0	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of FPD report and supporting exhibits to ensure accuracy
29-May-06	2.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the graphics technology.
30-May-06	3.0	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review of FPD report and edits to report
30-May-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of graphics report and supporting exhibits to ensure accuracy
30-May-06	2.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the FPD technology.
31-May-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review of graphics technology report and edits to report
31-May-06	2.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of valuation report and exhibits for the FPD technology.
01-Jun-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Further review and editing of graphics technology report
02-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Other	Preparation of scope of work description for entire IP portfolio for transmission to D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis).
02-Jun-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Other	Further development of work plan for portfolio valuation analysis.
02-Jun-06	4.0	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Further review and editing of FPD technology report
05-Jun-06	0.5	Just, Jan	Other	Project administration including fee estimate and report on collections.
06-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), D. Crisman and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) regarding Intellectual Ventures offer status, timeline and scope of completing entire IP portfolio valuation.
06-Jun-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), D. Crisman and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) regarding Intellectual Ventures offer status, timeline and scope of completing entire IP portfolio valuation.
06-Jun-06	0.2	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Preparation for conference call regarding Intellectual Ventures offer status, timeline and scope of completing entire IP portfolio valuation.
07-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), D. Crisman, Jim Bollinger (Morgan Lewis), G. Holtzer (Weil), and B. Weinert (SGI) regarding scope of work and scheduling of preliminary conversation with Dr. Goh re portfolio categorization.
07-Jun-06	1.6	Goldman, Bob	Research	Research and analysis of patent analytic information in preparation for discussion with SGI SME.
07-Jun-06	2.4	Hannah, Brad	Model Development	Initial patent ratings / rankings overview and methodology strategy
07-Jun-06	3.7	Hannah, Brad	Model Development	Development of patent ratings and rankings model in support of the valuation.
07-Jun-06	0.6	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), D. Crisman, Jim Bollinger (Morgan Lewis), G. Holtzer (Weil), and B. Weinert (SGI) regarding scope of work and scheduling of preliminary conversation with Dr. Goh re portfolio categorization.
07-Jun-06	1.4	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of patents and portfolio categorization in preparation for conference call.
07-Jun-06	1.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Review of Materials	Review of material on SGI patent portfolio file in support of the valuation of the portfolio.
08-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Other	Initial staffing planning for entire portfolio. Composition of email to Chicago staff to request availability for work on portfolio valuation.
08-Jun-06	3.9	Hannah, Brad	Model Development	Further development of patent ratings and rankings model in support of the valuation.
08-Jun-06	2.8	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Patent ratings / rankings formatting and preliminary QC
08-Jun-06	2.0	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Created patent summary containing all SGI patents based upon Derwent/Delphion information as part of evaluation of Intellectual Ventures offer.
08-Jun-06	1.7	Oliver, Brian	Other	Preparation of retention letter and schedule development for engagement.
08-Jun-06	3.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research and development of patent portfolio ratings in support of the development of the valuation model.
08-Jun-06	1.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Review of Materials	Review of material related to patents ratings in support of the development of the valuation model.
09-Jun-06	3.9	Bailey, Kevin	Research	Created summary binder on SGI's background and product selection in preparation for meeting with SGI personnel.
09-Jun-06	4.0	Bailey, Kevin	Research	Reviewed public information related to SGI's background and product selection in preparation for meeting with SGI personnel.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
09-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), J. Amster (Intellectual Ventures) regarding timing and requirements of written offer for SGI patent portfolio.
09-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), G. Kelakos (Kelakos Advisors), representative for Intellectual Ventures, regarding Intellectual Venture offer for SGI patent portfolio.
09-Jun-06	2.4	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) to discuss SGI's docket system and key inventors for IP analytics assessment of portfolio.
09-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Other	Initial staffing discussions with M. Tate (CRA).
09-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Research	Research request briefing with K. Bailey for basic SGI background briefing binder preparation.
09-Jun-06	2.4	Goldman, Bob	Research	Research and analysis of preliminary ranking and weighting for portfolio analytics. Discussions with M. Ringenberg and B. Hannah (CRA).
09-Jun-06	3.7	Goldman, Bob	Research	Research and analysis of patent analytic information using ranking of inventors to prepare preliminary technology buckets for discussion with SGI CTO.
09-Jun-06	2.3	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of portfolio analytics and rankings in advance of conference call with SGI CTO.
09-Jun-06	4.0	Hannah, Brad	Model Development	Further development of patent ratings and rankings model in support of the valuation.
09-Jun-06	1.9	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Patent ratings / rankings formatting and preliminary QC
09-Jun-06	2.7	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Patent ratings / rankings methodology overview
09-Jun-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of patent analytics research and development of portfolio categorization strategy.
09-Jun-06	2.1	Ringenberg, Matt	Model Development	Development of portfolio analytics analysis as part of the valuation for review by senior team members.
09-Jun-06	3.9	Ringenberg, Matt	Research	Research into patent rankings in support of portfolio analytics analysis as part of the valuation.
09-Jun-06	3.6	Ringenberg, Matt	Review of Materials	Review of patent rankings and development of portfolio analytics analysis as part of the valuation.
09-Jun-06	1.0	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of SGI binder containing background research in preparation for meeting with SGI personnel.
11-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Prep for and call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) to prepare agenda for conference call with Dr. Goh (SGI)
11-Jun-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), B. Weinert and E.L. Goh (SGI), J. Bollinger and P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), S. Youngman and G. Holtzer (Weil) re: initial discussion of categorization into technology buckets and identification of SME resources at SGI.
11-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of SGI patent portfolio analytic information in advance of conference call with Dr. Goh (SGI).
11-Jun-06	1.6	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review background briefing material on SGI and SGI products, services and white papers.
11-Jun-06	0.6	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Prep for and call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) to prepare agenda for conference call with Dr. Goh (SGI)
11-Jun-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), B. Weinert and E.L. Goh (SGI), J. Bollinger and P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), S. Youngman and G. Holtzer (Weil) re: initial discussion of categorization into technology buckets and identification of SME resources at SGI.
11-Jun-06	1.4	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of patent analytics research and analysis in preparation for conference call re: portfolio categorization into technology buckets.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.
12-Jun-06	2.5	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research to help define the Enterprise hardware market, this included finding out who the players in the market were, what they produced and their financials.
12-Jun-06	2.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on the High performance computing market, this included the market size, players in the market, expected growth in the market, market participants, etc.
12-Jun-06	1.5	Daniel, Brian	Research	Review binder background materials regarding SGI, industry, and patent portfolio.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.
12-Jun-06	1.8	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Researched potential competitors to determine potential for infringement of SGI IP by competition to determine if more detailed valuation would be required.
12-Jun-06	2.9	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Researched patent references using Delphion to determine potential activity in related technology to determine if more detailed valuation would be required.
12-Jun-06	2.3	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Reviewed patent background and claims for 8 patents in the digital media bucket to determine if more detailed valuation would be required.
12-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and J. Bolinger and D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) concerning agenda for upcoming call with SGI technologists.
12-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call and debrief with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); D. Crisman, J. Bollinger and P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Youngman (Weil); and G. Thorson, E.L. Goh, and T. McCan (SGI) regarding review of SGI patent portfolio to identify preliminary technology bundles for further review by additional SGI SMEs.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.
12-Jun-06	1.9	Goldman, Bob	Other	Staffing and planning of teams for technology bundle review and valuation.
12-Jun-06	2.7	Goldman, Bob	Research	Preparation of technology bundle spreadsheets for review by SGI SMEs.
12-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of materials re: opportunity identification process and subsequent valuations.
12-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Reviewed materials regarding product specifications for Multiple Processor technology package market participant.
12-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of materials for mechanical technology bundles with team.
12-Jun-06	1.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Market research into highly forward citing companies
12-Jun-06	2.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Patent summary file creation
12-Jun-06	3.4	Hannah, Brad	Research	Patent analytic forward citation analysis
12-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re available time to assist on SGI project and potential role on the engagement.
12-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and J. Bolinger and D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) concerning agenda for upcoming call with SGI technologists.
12-Jun-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call and debrief with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); D. Crisman, J. Bollinger and P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Youngman (Weil); and G. Thorson, E.L. Goh, and T. McCan (SGI) regarding review of SGI patent portfolio to identify preliminary technology bundles for further review by additional SGI SMEs.
12-Jun-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Further review of patent analytics research and analysis in preparation for conference call to identify technology bundles.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.
12-Jun-06	1.1	Porter, Steve	Research	Background research on the High Performance Computing market
12-Jun-06	3.9	Porter, Steve	Research	Background research on Cray, Inc. - Vector supercomputing
12-Jun-06	3.9	Porter, Steve	Research	Background research on vector supercomputing technology
12-Jun-06	2.0	Rakiec, Michelle	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
12-Jun-06	2.1	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched MIPS 10-Ks and financials
12-Jun-06	2.9	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched MIPS' competitors, studied MIPS' products and competitors' products
12-Jun-06	1.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research in support of valuation model development for the FPD technology.
12-Jun-06	0.3	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re available time to assist on SGI project and potential role on the engagement.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.
12-Jun-06	3.2	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of research on HPC market to identify potentially overlooked areas in support of the technology valuation.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, M. Tate, M. Vold, J. Becker, S. Porter, M. Rakiec (CRA) regarding case background and tasks to complete moving forward.
12-Jun-06	2.0	Vold, Matt	Review of Materials	Review RoyaltySource report generated from search performed by M. Ringgenberg to select license agreements for technologies comparable to the patents to be included in analyses.
13-Jun-06	0.3	Becker, Josh	Research	Summarized the market research on the HPC and enterprise hardware markets.
13-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Continued research on the HPC market.
13-Jun-06	0.7	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, B. Oliver (CRA) discussing results of the digital media portfolio review and potential candidates to review technology in more detail to determine applicability in the digital media market.
13-Jun-06	1.8	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell (CRA) discussing results of the digital media portfolio review and next actions.
13-Jun-06	1.6	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Further research of competitor technologies in the digital media market to determine potential for technology value.
13-Jun-06	3.0	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Further research of standards and related technologies in the digital media market to determine potential for technology value.
13-Jun-06	3.4	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Further research of patent references using Delphion to determine potential activity in related technology to determine if more detailed valuation would be required.
13-Jun-06	1.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah, K. Lennox, B. Oliver, M. Tate, L. Koppel (CRA); J. Bollinger, D. Crisman, P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Ellman, B. Mannel, E.L. Goh, B. Weinert (SGI) regarding HPC and Enterprise server market information.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Kick off meeting with team including K. Lennox, B. Goldman, M. Tate, L. Koppel, B. Hannah and S. Porter (CRA) discussing case background, project plan, and deliverables.
13-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Internal conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding strategy and upcoming call with SGI marketing personnel.
13-Jun-06	1.8	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell (CRA) discussing results of the digital media portfolio review and next actions.
13-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, B. Oliver (CRA) discussing results of the digital media portfolio review and potential candidates to review technology in more detail to determine applicability in the digital media market.
13-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Research	Strategy formation for royalty rate research and comparable transaction research.
13-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Research	Prepare portfolio analytics for additional SME discussions and dissemination to project teams.
13-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of materials related to Multiple Processor technology package and strategy formation for analysis team.
13-Jun-06	1.7	Hannah, Brad	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah, K. Lennox, B. Oliver, M. Tate, L. Koppel (CRA); J. Bollinger, D. Crisman, P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Ellman, B. Mannel, E.L. Goh, B. Weinert (SGI) regarding HPC and Enterprise server market information.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Hannah, Brad	Internal Meeting	Kick off meeting with team including K. Lennox, B. Goldman, M. Tate, L. Koppel, B. Hannah and S. Porter (CRA) discussing case background, project plan, and deliverables.
13-Jun-06	0.9	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Formatting and preliminary QC of patent summary file
13-Jun-06	0.3	Hannah, Brad	Research	IP acquisitions overview for legal and business opportunity classifications
13-Jun-06	0.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Initial market research into AMD
13-Jun-06	1.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	Recategorizing patents into new technology bundles
13-Jun-06	1.7	Koppel, Lew	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah, K. Lennox, B. Oliver, M. Tate, L. Koppel (CRA); J. Bollinger, D. Crisman, P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Ellman, B. Mannel, E.L. Goh, B. Weinert (SGI) regarding HPC and Enterprise server market information.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Koppel, Lew	Internal Meeting	Kick off meeting with team including K. Lennox, B. Goldman, M. Tate, L. Koppel, B. Hannah and S. Porter (CRA) discussing case background, project plan, and deliverables.
13-Jun-06	0.6	Koppel, Lew	Review of Materials	Review of SEC 10-K filing, and draft of valuation report for flat panel display technology.
13-Jun-06	0.8	Koppel, Lew	Review of Materials	Review of draft valuation report for graphic processor technology.
13-Jun-06	1.7	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah, K. Lennox, B. Oliver, M. Tate, L. Koppel (CRA); J. Bollinger, D. Crisman, P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Ellman, B. Mannel, E.L. Goh, B. Weinert (SGI) regarding HPC and Enterprise server market information.
13-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re role on engagement following call with SGI and counsel.
13-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, S. Porter (CRA) re conducting research on SGI's competitors in preparation for conducting analyses on the Scalability technology bundle.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Kick off meeting with team including K. Lennox, B. Goldman, M. Tate, L. Koppel, B. Hannah and S. Porter (CRA) discussing case background, project plan, and deliverables.
13-Jun-06	1.2	Lennox, Katie	Research	Review of articles on high performance computing industry in preparation for conducting analyses on the Scalability technology bundle.
13-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Research	Identification of SGI's competitors based on call with SGI personnel (S. Ellman (SGI), B. Mannel (SGI), E. Goh (SGI), D. Crispin (SGI), B. Weindard (SGI)) and SGI's 10-K. (1.4 hours). Also, preparation of work plan for analysis to conduct research on such competitors. (1.3 hours).
13-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of SGI's 10-K and article on SGI in preparation for call with SGI and counsel regarding SGI's competitors, market segment and product lines.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further development of patent summary containing all SGI patents based upon Derwent/Delphion information as part of evaluation of Intellectual Ventures offer.
13-Jun-06	1.7	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah, K. Lennox, B. Oliver, M. Tate, L. Koppel (CRA); J. Bollinger, D. Crisman, P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Ellman, B. Mannel, E.L. Goh, B. Weinert (SGI) regarding HPC and Enterprise server market information.
13-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, B. Oliver (CRA) discussing results of the digital media portfolio review and potential candidates to review technology in more detail to determine applicability in the digital media market.
13-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Internal conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding strategy and upcoming call with SGI marketing personnel.
13-Jun-06	1.1	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials related to SGI competitors and industry in support of valuation development for scalability technology.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
13-Jun-06	0.3	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, S. Porter (CRA) re conducting research on SGI's competitors in preparation for conducting analyses on the Scalability technology bundle.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Kick off meeting with team including K. Lennox, B. Goldman, M. Tate, L. Koppel, B. Hannah and S. Porter (CRA) discussing case background, project plan, and deliverables.
13-Jun-06	1.7	Porter, Steve	Research	Research into Cray, Inc. - SGI intellectual property agreements - Vector supercomputing
13-Jun-06	1.8	Porter, Steve	Research	Research into available market data for the supercomputer market - Vector supercomputing
13-Jun-06	1.3	Porter, Steve	Review of Materials	Review of the MIPS - SGI intellectual property agreement
13-Jun-06	0.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, M. Tate (CRA) to provide update on research of MIPS license agreement.
13-Jun-06	1.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched MIPS' competitors, competitor products, competitor royalties
13-Jun-06	1.6	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched royalty rates for MIPS products
13-Jun-06	1.0	Rakiec, Michelle	Review of Materials	Read MIPS and Intel license agreement
13-Jun-06	1.7	Tate, Mike	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah, K. Lennox, B. Oliver, M. Tate, L. Koppel (CRA); J. Bollinger, D. Crisman, P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); S. Ellman, B. Mannel, E.L. Goh, B. Weinert (SGI) regarding HPC and Enterprise server market information.
13-Jun-06	0.2	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, M. Tate (CRA) to provide update on research of MIPS license agreement.
13-Jun-06	0.3	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re role on engagement following call with SGI and counsel.
13-Jun-06	1.5	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Kick off meeting with team including K. Lennox, B. Goldman, M. Tate, B. Daniel, L. Koppel, B. Hannah, M. Vold, J. Snell, J. Becker and S. Porter (CRA) discussing case background, project plan, and deliverables.
13-Jun-06	0.3	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of research on MIPS technology to identify potentially overlooked areas in support of the technology valuation.
13-Jun-06	2.3	Vold, Matt	Research	Review CRA internal licensing agreement database to select license agreements for technologies comparable to the patents to be included in analyses.
13-Jun-06	2.6	Vold, Matt	Research	Perform searches for publicly available information regarding additional comparable license agreements not located in the CRA internal license agreement database or the results from the RoyaltySource results.
13-Jun-06	3.9	Vold, Matt	Research	Perform searches to locate source information for comparable license agreements found in RoyaltySource search to ensure accuracy of information reported by RoyaltySource.
13-Jun-06	1.2	Vold, Matt	Review of Materials	Review RoyaltySource report generated from search performed by M. Ringgenberg to select license agreements for technologies comparable to the patents to be included in analyses.
14-Jun-06	1.5	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Finalized the preliminary valuation and prepared questions for the technical experts
14-Jun-06	2.3	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Constructed a preliminary valuation model to determine the potential size of the market and the potential royalty base.
14-Jun-06	1.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on SGI's competitors in the HPC market.
14-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on the major vendors in the server market to determine their market share, revenues, profitability, product line ups, company expectations, and analyst expectations.
14-Jun-06	3.2	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered all of the relevant sources for the licensing agreements that were sourced in the Royalty Source data.
14-Jun-06	3.7	Becker, Josh	Research	Reviewed HPC research and started similar research on the multiple processor market
14-Jun-06	2.3	Daniel, Brian	Research	Review binder background materials regarding SGI, industry, and patent portfolio.
14-Jun-06	2.9	Daniel, Brian	Research	Review technical aspects of patent portfolio in preparation for call with Tim McCann
14-Jun-06	0.5	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Review of research material and summary of interesting results as part of digital media portfolio review.
14-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and J. Bollinger, D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) regarding timing and format of deliverables.
14-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding report outline and structure.
14-Jun-06	1.7	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Preparation of detailed report outline.
14-Jun-06	2.4	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Preparation of Appendix report template.
14-Jun-06	1.7	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of patent analytic information for mechanical bundles (thermal, mechanisms, mechanical interconnect).
14-Jun-06	2.2	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of patent analytic information for upcoming SME calls for circuit design, Computer System Architecture, System Software, Compiler and Application Software technology bundles.
14-Jun-06	2.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Formatting and preliminary QC of patent analytic files
14-Jun-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Research	Continued AMD market research
14-Jun-06	2.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	Merging patents into portfolio summary file
14-Jun-06	3.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Entire portfolio rank by Derwent Manual Code
14-Jun-06	3.4	Hannah, Brad	Research	Initial bankruptcy patent acquisition research
14-Jun-06	2.2	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Review of inputs required for a 1-phase litigation model for the Multiple Processor analysis and information available to obtain such inputs.
14-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Review of 3-phase litigation model used in FPD analysis in order to determine how to it could be revised for use in a 1-phase litigation model for the Multiple Processor analysis.
14-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Research	Follow up research regarding SGI's competitors in order to expand list of competitors to research in preparation for conducting analyses on the Scalability technology bundle
14-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of research prepared by M. Vold (CRA) re SGI's competitors in preparation for conducting analyses on the Scalability technology bundle.
14-Jun-06	1.7	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Further development of patent summary containing all SGI patents based upon Derwent/Delphion information as part of evaluation of Intellectual Ventures offer.
14-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and J. Bollinger, D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis) regarding timing and format of deliverables.
14-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding report outline and structure.
14-Jun-06	0.8	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of research materials related to the scalability technology to ensure proper valuation methodology.
14-Jun-06	1.7	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of various portfolio materials to verify valuation methodology and inputs in preparation for conference call.
14-Jun-06	2.6	Porter, Steve	Research	Company financials research and company synopsis write-ups - Channel Interconnect
14-Jun-06	2.7	Porter, Steve	Research	SIC code analysis of competitors in the Channel Interconnect space
14-Jun-06	3.1	Porter, Steve	Research	Competitor analysis in the Channel Interconnect space
14-Jun-06	0.5	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Copied relevant pages for various SIC codes from Ibbotsons
14-Jun-06	2.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Development of one-stage valuation model for the FPD technology.
14-Jun-06	1.6	Vold, Matt	Other	Draft summary of results from research for comparable royalty agreements to be used in various valuation analyses.
14-Jun-06	3.2	Vold, Matt	Other	Draft summary of results from research for comparable royalty agreements to be used in various valuation analyses.
14-Jun-06	3.0	Vold, Matt	Research	Prepare a template summarizing relevant competitor information found during market research to ensure consistent information is located and presented.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
14-Jun-06	3.6	Vold, Matt	Research	Research SGI competitors and draft summary of results in connection with researching the market for interconnect technologies.
15-Jun-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), J. Becker, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing the Multiple Processor technology
15-Jun-06	0.2	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re issues to be addressed in preparing the Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	0.3	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), and J. Becker (CRA) re approach to use in preparing the Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Gathered the information for and created schedules calculating the 25% rule for potential infringing companies.
15-Jun-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated the Multiple processor model and organized the patent portfolio schedules.
15-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated the Multiple processor model, and created schedules to determine patent protection and comparable licensing agreements
15-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered segment data for companies that would fall within the Scalability package's market
15-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered information on companies operating in the interconnect market.
15-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Determined the patent coverage and the lives of the patents included in the package.
15-Jun-06	1.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered WACC information and relevant financial information on Cray, Inc.
15-Jun-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Research	Researched companies product line ups to determine potential infringing products, this included looking at white papers and web page schematics.
15-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered relevant information pertaining to the Multiprocessor patents and the other patents in the portfolio.
15-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Researched and Quantified the foreign coverage of patents in this portfolio
15-Jun-06	0.4	Daniel, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of miscellaneous mechanical technologies.
15-Jun-06	0.5	Daniel, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Mechanisms bundle.
15-Jun-06	0.7	Daniel, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Goldman, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Thermal Management bundle.
15-Jun-06	1.8	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Draft valuation model for Mechanical Interconnect.
15-Jun-06	2.3	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Draft valuation model for Thermal Management.
15-Jun-06	2.4	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Draft valuation model for Mechanisms.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Daniel, Brian	Other	Create summary of conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), M. Vold (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Thermal Management bundle.
15-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), J. Becker, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing the Multiple Processor technology
15-Jun-06	0.1	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with B. Goldman, R. Altanier (SGI) to discuss Application SW evaluation process and schedule follow-up call.
15-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) and G. Holtzer (Weil) regarding status of valuations.
15-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with S. Reinhardt (SGI) to discuss System SW evaluation process and schedule follow-up call.
15-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with G. Pirocane (SGI) to discuss Compiler evaluation process and schedule follow-up call.
15-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Goldman, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Thermal Management bundle.
15-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA) and L. Koppel (CRA) re follow up issues regarding Multiple Processor technology, including related patents and further description of the technology, in order to prepare Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) and K. Lennox, B. Goldman (CRA) re Multiple Processor technology, including the benefits of the technology and who infringes the '698 patent, in order to prepare Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), and J. Becker (CRA) re approach to use in preparing the Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) re: status of SME review calls and Multiple Processor analysis strategy.
15-Jun-06	1.6	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Review of material related to Multiple Processor to provide input for valuation model and approach.
15-Jun-06	1.9	Goldman, Bob	Other	Staffing and team management.
15-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Research	Prepare and send portfolio analytic spreadsheets to SGI SMEs in anticipation of review conference calls.
15-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of information in advance of SME calls for SCA, Compiler, and System SW bundles.
15-Jun-06	2.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Patent analytics and patent summary file work
15-Jun-06	2.6	Hannah, Brad	Research	Reconciling original technology buckets to new SME technology bundles
15-Jun-06	3.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Researching new transactions and preliminary QC of bankruptcy IP transactions
15-Jun-06	4.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Microprocessor litigation landscape research
15-Jun-06	0.8	Koppel, Lew	Conference Call	Conference call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA) and L. Koppel (CRA) re follow up issues regarding Multiple Processor technology, including related patents and further description of the technology, in order to prepare Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	0.2	Koppel, Lew	Review of Materials	Review of materials used as sources in multiple processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Conference call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA) and L. Koppel (CRA) re follow up issues regarding Multiple Processor technology, including related patents and further description of the technology, in order to prepare Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) and K. Lennox, B. Goldman (CRA) re Multiple Processor technology, including the benefits of the technology and who infringes the '698 patent, in order to prepare Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	0.2	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re issues to be addressed in preparing the Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), and J. Becker (CRA) re approach to use in preparing the Multiple Processor analysis.
15-Jun-06	1.8	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of Multiple processor model prepared by J. Becker (CRA) and identification of revisions to be completed.
15-Jun-06	2.8	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of Multiple processor model prepared by J. Becker (CRA), including review of market research and market comparables relied upon as inputs in the model.
15-Jun-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) and G. Holtzer (Weil) regarding status of valuations.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) re: status of SME review calls and Multiple Processor analysis strategy.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
15-Jun-06	2.1	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of multiple processor materials prepared by J. Becker (CRA) to review valuation methodology and inputs.
15-Jun-06	2.8	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Schedule creation of competitors in the Channel Interconnect space
15-Jun-06	3.3	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Schedule creation showing analyst growth rates and WACC for Channel Interconnect competitors
15-Jun-06	1.5	Ringgenberg, Matt	Research	Research specifically to identify design patents in support of the valuation model.
15-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of miscellaneous mechanical technologies.
15-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Mechanisms bundle.
15-Jun-06	0.7	Vold, Matt	Conference Call	Conference call with M. Vold, B. Goldman, B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Thermal Management bundle.
15-Jun-06	2.8	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Draft valuation model for Mechanisms.
15-Jun-06	2.9	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Draft valuation model for Mechanical Interconnect.
15-Jun-06	3.0	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Draft valuation model for Thermal Management.
15-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Other	Develop work plan for the valuation of the Mechanisms bundle.
15-Jun-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Other	Develop work plan for the valuation of the Thermal Management bundle.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Vold, Matt	Other	Create summary of conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Thermal Management bundle.
15-Jun-06	1.1	Vold, Matt	Other	Create summary of conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), B. Daniel (CRA), and T. McCann (SGI) re: technical aspects of the Mechanisms bundle.
15-Jun-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Review of Materials	Review and revise summary of comparable royalty agreements
16-Jun-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI) and K. Lennox (CRA) re Scalability technology, including follow up questions regarding interconnect technology in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	2.2	Becker, Josh	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), B. Goldman (CRA), L. Koppel (CRA), J. Becker (CRA), K. Lennox (CRA) re Scalability technology, including the benefits of the technology and description of "A" patents, in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	0.5	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) to discuss work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, S. Porter, and J. Becker (CRA) to discuss work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	1.7	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered research on the importance on scalability in the HPC market
16-Jun-06	2.4	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered PDF version of rated patents and ensured the proper placement within the portfolio schedules.
16-Jun-06	2.9	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered sources and verified information contained in the liquidation sales of IP portfolios schedule
16-Jun-06	1.1	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle
16-Jun-06	1.2	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
16-Jun-06	2.1	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.5	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
16-Jun-06	0.6	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
16-Jun-06	1.2	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Begin drafting Mechanisms report.
16-Jun-06	1.8	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Begin drafting Thermal Management report.
16-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), J. Stair regarding instructions for reviewing MIPS and Microprocessor Architecture patents and schedule call for additional discussions.
16-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with B. Goldman (CRA), S. Reinhardt (SGI) to discuss System SW patents and mapping of his preliminary assessment of results to three new technology bundles (Operating Systems, Storage, System Design) and schedule call for additional discussions.
16-Jun-06	2.2	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), B. Goldman (CRA), L. Koppel (CRA), J. Becker (CRA), K. Lennox (CRA) re Scalability technology, including the benefits of the technology and description of "A" patents, in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	2.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with S. Porter, B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) and G. Pirocanac (SGI) discussing the market for the compiler technologies and additional background related to the patent portfolio
16-Jun-06	1.8	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) and Intellectual Ventures regarding valuation and usage of technology and potential offers for acquisition.
16-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, S. Porter, and J. Becker (CRA) to discuss work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	1.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding project status and analysis strategy.
16-Jun-06	1.4	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Updated patent analytic information based on feedback from SGI SMEs. Prepared additional patent analytic information in advance of upcoming SME conference calls.
16-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of materials in advance of discussion with G. Thorson regarding Computer System Architecture / Scalability patent portfolio.
16-Jun-06	2.9	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Creating and preliminary QC of new technology bundles
16-Jun-06	0.9	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Separating original Graphics report from original FPD report
16-Jun-06	3.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Merging SME ranking and bundling results with patent summary file
16-Jun-06	3.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	Organizing patent information for SME calls
16-Jun-06	2.2	Koppel, Lew	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), B. Goldman (CRA), L. Koppel (CRA), J. Becker (CRA), K. Lennox (CRA) re Scalability technology, including the benefits of the technology and description of "A" patents, in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	0.3	Koppel, Lew	Review of Materials	Preparation for call re Scalability technology, including the benefits of the technology and description of "A" patents, in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	1.0	Koppel, Lew	Review of Materials	Review of patents related to the compiler technology in order to better understand technology and claims in support of the valuation.
16-Jun-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI) and K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re Scalability technology, including follow up questions regarding interconnect technology in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	2.2	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), B. Goldman (CRA), L. Koppel (CRA), J. Becker (CRA), K. Lennox (CRA) re Scalability technology, including the benefits of the technology and description of "A" patents, in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
16-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re work plan and availability of staff to complete analyses of identified technology bundles.
16-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) to discuss work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, S. Porter, and J. Becker (CRA) to discuss work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Other	Preparation for call with G. Thorson (SGI) and K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re Scalability technology, including outline of questions and review of spreadsheet identifying patents to be discussed.
16-Jun-06	0.7	Lennox, Katie	Other	Revision to work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology following discussion with J. Becker (CRA).



**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
16-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Other	Developed work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of reports prepared for FPD and GPU to use as template for preparing report on Multiple Processor.
16-Jun-06	1.8	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) and Intellectual Ventures regarding valuation and usage of technology and potential offers for acquisition.
16-Jun-06	1.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding project status and analysis strategy.
16-Jun-06	0.6	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of portfolio materials in preparation for call with Intellectual Ventures.
16-Jun-06	2.3	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Conference call with S. Porter, B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) and G. Pirocanac (SGI) discussing the market for the compiler technologies and additional background related to the patent portfolio
16-Jun-06	1.7	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
16-Jun-06	1.8	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Review patent background and claims for 4 "A" patents in the compiler bucket.
16-Jun-06	3.0	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Review of SGI analyses and report previously filed for purposes of engagement background, analyses concepts, and report content procedures.
16-Jun-06	2.3	Porter, Steve	Conference Call	Conference call with S. Porter, B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) and G. Pirocanac (SGI) discussing the market for the compiler technologies and additional background related to the patent portfolio
16-Jun-06	0.8	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, S. Porter, and J. Becker (CRA) to discuss work plan for preparing model for Scalability technology bundle.
16-Jun-06	2.4	Porter, Steve	Research	Research on Compilers products in support of Compiler valuation model development
16-Jun-06	3.4	Porter, Steve	Research	General background research on Compilers technology in support of Compiler valuation model development.
16-Jun-06	3.4	Porter, Steve	Research	Research on Compilers producers and company financials in support of Compiler valuation model development.
16-Jun-06	1.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of valuation model for the graphics technology
16-Jun-06	0.5	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re work plan and availability of staff to complete analyses of identified technology bundles.
16-Jun-06	0.7	Tate, Mike	Model Development	Review of research on compilers technology to identify potentially overlooked areas in support of the technology valuation.
16-Jun-06	0.8	Tate, Mike	Model Development	Review of research on scalability technology to identify potentially overlooked areas in support of the technology valuation.
16-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle
16-Jun-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
16-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
16-Jun-06	0.7	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
16-Jun-06	2.1	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Begin drafting Thermal Management report.
16-Jun-06	2.5	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Begin drafting Mechanisms report.
16-Jun-06	1.0	Vold, Matt	Research	Perform market research related to the royalty base for Mechanisms bundle.
16-Jun-06	1.3	Vold, Matt	Research	Perform market research related to the royalty base for Thermal Management bundle.
17-Jun-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re market research and what data to use in the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re relevant segment of market to address in the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	1.0	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re research on high performance computing industry to be completed in preparing the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered the relevant PDF versions of the patents in the portfolio and researched companies within the market.
17-Jun-06	3.0	Becker, Josh	Research	Research on the scalability of servers, potential adoption rates, penetration rates, the importance of latency and the importance of bandwidth.
17-Jun-06	0.9	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
17-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, B. Goldman (CRA) re work plan for analysis of the Scalability technology bundle.
17-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Reorganized and updated Compiler patent analytic information based on results of call with SGI SME.
17-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Strategy and development of portfolio analytic exhibits for Main Report.
17-Jun-06	3.9	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of main report.
17-Jun-06	2.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Full portfolio patent analytics
17-Jun-06	4.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Patent analytic graphs and charts by patent status, application date, and technology bucket
17-Jun-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re market research and what data to use in the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	0.6	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re relevant segment of market to address in the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re research on high performance computing industry to be completed in preparing the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	1.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, B. Goldman (CRA) re work plan for analysis of the Scalability technology bundle.
17-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Other	Prepared revised work plan for developing analysis of the Scalability technology bundle following discussion with B. Goldman (CRA).
17-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared description of patent portfolio at issue in the Multiple Processor technology bundle.
17-Jun-06	1.5	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of research prepared by J. Becker (CRA) on the high performance computer market in connection with the analyses of the Scalability technology bundle.
17-Jun-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of work plan and preliminary research related to the Scalability analysis.
17-Jun-06	1.0	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, S. Porter (CRA) discussing research and analyses for compiler technology.
17-Jun-06	2.9	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
17-Jun-06	1.1	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
17-Jun-06	1.0	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, S. Porter (CRA) discussing research and analyses for compiler technology.
17-Jun-06	2.3	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Schedule creation - cost approach to valuation in support of Compiler valuation model development.
17-Jun-06	3.4	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Schedule creation - relief from royalty valuation approach in support of Compiler valuation model development.
17-Jun-06	0.9	Porter, Steve	Research	Research into specific data items required for relief from royalty valuation, including industry growth rates, discount rates, and company revenues in support of Compiler valuation model development.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
18-Jun-06	0.5	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re revised work plan for analysis of the Scalability technology bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, J. Becker and B. Goldman (CRA) re status of analysis of Scalability technology bundle and plan for completing same.
18-Jun-06	0.5	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Reviewed and corrected model 1
18-Jun-06	2.1	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Developed model 2 for the scalability model
18-Jun-06	2.2	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Developed model 1 for the scalability model
18-Jun-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Research	Researched market share data for the hpc and server market.
18-Jun-06	1.5	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered expiration dates of patents and determined coverage based on the docket numbers
18-Jun-06	0.6	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle
18-Jun-06	3.3	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.7	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
18-Jun-06	0.8	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
18-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); S. Youngman and H. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn, D. Crisman and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) regarding Intellectual Venture's offer, status of report and valuation, open items, and timeline for completion.
18-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, J. Becker and B. Goldman (CRA) re status of analysis of Scalability technology bundle and plan for completing same.
18-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding feedback on offer from Intellectau Ventures and status review in advance of upcoming conference call, and debrief and action plan post-conference call.
18-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review of portfolio analytics schedules for main report.
18-Jun-06	2.8	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of main report.
18-Jun-06	2.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	Individual bundle characteristics analytics
18-Jun-06	3.4	Hannah, Brad	Research	Full portfolio formatting and rebundling of patents
18-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re revised work plan for analysis of the Scalability technology bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Call with K. Lennox, J. Becker and B. Goldman (CRA) re status of analysis of Scalability technology bundle and plan for completing same.
18-Jun-06	1.7	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of publicly available information re benchmark license agreements pulled by M. Vold (CRA) to determine whether any could be used as comparable agreements in the analysis of the Multiple Processor technology bundle.
18-Jun-06	1.8	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of IDC data provided by SGI to identify relevant inputs for the analysis of the Scalability technology bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.9	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); S. Youngman and H. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn, D. Crisman and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) regarding Intellectual Venture's offer, status of report and valuation, open items, and timeline for completion
18-Jun-06	1.2	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding feedback on offer from Intellectau Ventures and status review in advance of upcoming conference call, and debrief and action plan post-conference call.
18-Jun-06	0.4	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of research materials supporting valuation analyses
18-Jun-06	1.4	Porter, Steve	Research	Review of potentially comparable license agreements to those that would have been consummated between SGI and licensees for Conoilers technology
18-Jun-06	0.3	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
18-Jun-06	0.3	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
18-Jun-06	1.4	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Begin drafting Mechanical Interconnect report.
18-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Research	Research foreign patent status for the Thermal Management bundle and update table in the reports for the same.
18-Jun-06	0.6	Vold, Matt	Research	Research foreign patent status for the Mechanisms bundle and update table in the reports for the same.
18-Jun-06	0.7	Vold, Matt	Research	Research foreign patent status for the Mechanical Interconnect bundle and update table in the reports for the same.
19-Jun-06	3.6	Bailey, Kevin	Research	Reviewed public information relating to comparable technology transactions in support of valuation.
19-Jun-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re status of Scalability analysis.
19-Jun-06	2.3	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Changed the models according to the discussion at the meeting
19-Jun-06	2.2	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Reviewed the scalability model and the multiple processor models and updated.
19-Jun-06	2.9	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Reformatted models and prepared for the team meeting
19-Jun-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered industry wacc and profit margin information for relevant companies.
19-Jun-06	1.6	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered relevant company wacc and profit margin information.
19-Jun-06	0.8	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status and additional work to be performed on Thermal Management bundle.
19-Jun-06	0.9	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status and additional work to be performed on mechanisms bundle.
19-Jun-06	2.3	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	0.2	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.
19-Jun-06	1.6	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
19-Jun-06	1.7	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
19-Jun-06	1.2	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanical Interconnect report.
19-Jun-06	1.6	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
19-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Steve Reinhardt (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Steve Reinhardt (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Steve Reinhardt (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	2.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Prep for and conference call with B. Goldman, M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), Eric Fromm, Jim Stair, and Tim Fu (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
19-Jun-06	2.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
19-Jun-06	1.4	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of Microprocessor Architecture bucket analytics in advance of conference call with Fromm, Stair and Fu (SGI).
19-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of materials pre- and post- call for Storage, System Design and OS SW discussions with SGI SME.
19-Jun-06	2.3	Hannah, Brad	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	2.5	Hannah, Brad	Research	Full portfolio patent analytics
19-Jun-06	3.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundling of certain patents in portfolio
19-Jun-06	4.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Individual bundle characteristics analytics
19-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re work plan and availability of staff to complete analyses of additional identified technology bundles.
19-Jun-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re status of Scalability analysis.
19-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	0.7	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted section of report discussing key patents for the Multiple Processor technology bundle.
19-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Developed outline for draft report on the Multiple Processor technology bundle.
19-Jun-06	1.5	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of Scalability technology bundle analysis prepared by J. Becker (CRA).
19-Jun-06	2.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Further development of main report draft
19-Jun-06	1.5	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for Compilers technology
19-Jun-06	2.3	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	1.2	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
19-Jun-06	3.7	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of compiler technology bucket.
19-Jun-06	1.2	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
19-Jun-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Review of SGI license agreement received regarding compiler technologies.
19-Jun-06	1.5	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for Compilers technology
19-Jun-06	1.7	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Implementation of revisions into Compilers analyses
19-Jun-06	2.4	Porter, Steve	Report Writing	Drafting of valuation report - Compilers premise of value
19-Jun-06	3.1	Porter, Steve	Report Writing	Drafting of valuation report - Compilers design portfolio assets
19-Jun-06	3.9	Porter, Steve	Report Writing	Drafting of valuation report - Compilers valuation analysis
19-Jun-06	2.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), Eric Fromm, Jim Stair, and Tim Fu (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	0.3	Rakiec, Michelle	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA) about valuations to be completed for system design and system storage
19-Jun-06	2.5	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Continued to research processor market, especially system area networks and storage markets in the US, researched BLS
19-Jun-06	3.8	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched processor patent companies, competitors, 10-Ks, sales, and market growth projections
19-Jun-06	1.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Review of Materials	Reviewed high priority processor patents
19-Jun-06	2.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Daniel, E. Phillips, J. Becker, M. Ringgenberg, B. Hannah (CRA) to discuss status of report.
19-Jun-06	1.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Organization of valuation report and supporting exhibits to ensure consistent presentation for the graphics report.
19-Jun-06	3.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Organization of valuation report and supporting exhibits to ensure consistent presentation for the FPD report.
19-Jun-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Steve Reinhardt (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Steve Reinhardt (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	0.7	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Steve Reinhardt (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	2.7	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), Eric Fromm, Jim Stair, and Tim Fu (SGI) discussing relevant patents, applicable markets, alternative technologies, additional related assets, and estimated implementation efforts.
19-Jun-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA) about valuations to be completed for system design and system storage
19-Jun-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Operating Systems Software patents and related Derwent summaries in preparation for a conference call with SGI SMEs.
19-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of System Design patents and related Derwent summaries in preparation for a conference call with SGI SMEs.
19-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of notes, patents, and Derwent summaries for Microprocessor Architecture patents.
19-Jun-06	0.8	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Storage patents and related Derwent summaries in preparation for a conference call with SGI SMEs.
19-Jun-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Microprocessor Architecture patents and related Derwent summaries in preparation for a conference call with SGI SMEs.
19-Jun-06	0.3	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re work plan and availability of staff to complete analyses of additional identified technology bundles.
19-Jun-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of materials related to technology bundle classifications in preparation for meeting.
19-Jun-06	0.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of microprocessor architecture technology materials in support of valuation methodology and inputs.
19-Jun-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status and additional work to be performed on Thermal Management bundle.
19-Jun-06	0.9	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status and additional work to be performed on mechanisms bundle.
19-Jun-06	2.7	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.

Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
19-Jun-06	2.9	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
19-Jun-06	3.1	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
19-Jun-06	1.2	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanical Interconnect report.
19-Jun-06	1.3	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
20-Jun-06	2.0	Bailey, Kevin	Research	Helped build comparable transaction Matrix based upon research of public information relating to comparable technology transactions in support of valuation.
20-Jun-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re revisions to make to the Scalability analysis.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re patents included in the Scalability portfolio and follow up questions regarding technology to ask in call with G. Thorson (SGI).
20-Jun-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re patents included in Scalability portfolio in order to identify follow up issues to discuss in call with G. Thorson (SGI).
20-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Reviewed models to make additional changes discussed after the meeting
20-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated models one and two to become one model
20-Jun-06	2.1	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated scalability portfolio to include additional buckets.
20-Jun-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Gathered descriptions of key technology bundles.
20-Jun-06	3.3	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	First draft of the report
20-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Researched patents applicable to the HPC market
20-Jun-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Research	Determined foreign coverage of additional patents, using the docket numbers.
20-Jun-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered and evaluated potentially comparable licensing agreements
20-Jun-06	0.1	Daniel, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with T. McCann (SGI), M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: market for Mechanisms patents.
20-Jun-06	0.2	Daniel, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with T. McCann (SGI), M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: market for Thermal Management patents.
20-Jun-06	0.2	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status of work performed on Thermal Management bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.6	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status of work performed on Mechanisms bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.1	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.5	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.
20-Jun-06	1.0	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.7	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
20-Jun-06	1.4	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
20-Jun-06	1.9	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanical Interconnect report.
20-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and P. Hirschhorn re: status, review of asset classes, open items and project timeline.
20-Jun-06	1.4	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA) and Eric Fromm (SGI) regarding the Microprocessor patents, alternative technologies, and related competitive advantages.
20-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with J. Snell, Bob Goldman (CRA) regarding potential value propositions for relevant Microprocessor Architecture patents.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding drafting of Main Report and Appendices.
20-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re patents included in Scalability portfolio in order to identify follow up issues to discuss in call with G. Thorson (SGI).
20-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, B. Goldman, J. Snell (CRA) to review system design technology patents in support of the development of the valuation model.
20-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
20-Jun-06	3.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of main report.
20-Jun-06	2.0	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Formatting patent summary file
20-Jun-06	0.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundle certain patents and check summary statistics
20-Jun-06	1.1	Hannah, Brad	Research	Review SGI docket for foreign coverage and compare to Delphion patent family
20-Jun-06	1.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Merge, format, and check Systems Software bundles into master patent summary file
20-Jun-06	1.4	Hannah, Brad	Research	Merge, and format, and check Microprocessor Architecture bundle into master patent summary file
20-Jun-06	2.4	Hannah, Brad	Research	Review IP acquisitions and search for additional relevant IP acquisitions
20-Jun-06	2.5	Hannah, Brad	Research	Summarizing confidential license agreements
20-Jun-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re revisions to make to the Scalability analysis.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re patents included in the Scalability portfolio and follow up questions regarding technology to ask in call with G. Thorson (SGI).
20-Jun-06	0.9	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re patents included in Scalability portfolio in order to identify follow up issues to discuss in call with G. Thorson (SGI).
20-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Other	Preparation for call with G. Thorson (SGI) including review of "A" patents included in Scalability portfolio.
20-Jun-06	0.9	Lennox, Katie	Other	Review of notes on Scalability technology from calls on 6/16/06 with G. Thorson (SGI) in preparation for follow up call with G. Thorson.
20-Jun-06	1.8	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of Multiple Processor assets for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
20-Jun-06	1.9	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of market overview for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
20-Jun-06	2.0	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of premise of value for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of license agreement provided by SGI to determine whether it had relevance to the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
20-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and P. Hirschhorn re: status, review of asset classes, open items and project timeline.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding drafting of Main Report and Appendices.
20-Jun-06	1.3	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Further development of main report draft
20-Jun-06	1.3	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of preliminary valuation analyses in preparation for writing of main report.
20-Jun-06	0.4	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of preliminary valuation analyses in preparation for conference call.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for Compilers technology
20-Jun-06	1.3	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket
20-Jun-06	3.6	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of compiler technology bucket.
20-Jun-06	0.8	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for Compilers technology
20-Jun-06	2.1	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Valuation model updates - Compilers technology
20-Jun-06	2.2	Porter, Steve	Report Writing	Editing and revision work to report - Compilers technology
20-Jun-06	2.1	Porter, Steve	Research	Research into foreign patent protection - Compilers technology

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
20-Jun-06	1.1	Porter, Steve	Review of Materials	Review of SGI license agreement for Compilers technology
20-Jun-06	0.6	Rakiec, Michelle	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA) re: system design patents and relevant valuation methods
20-Jun-06	1.1	Rakiec, Michelle	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, B. Goldman, J. Snell (CRA) to review system design technology patents in support of the development of the valuation model.
20-Jun-06	1.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Development of valuation model for system design technology.
20-Jun-06	3.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Development of valuation model for storage technology.
20-Jun-06	0.1	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched software engineer salaries in support of system design valuation model.
20-Jun-06	1.9	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Researched system design market, particularly one company, its products, 10-K
20-Jun-06	0.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of amortization schedules for the GPU valuation model.
20-Jun-06	0.9	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of amortization schedules for the multi-processor valuation model.
20-Jun-06	1.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of amortization schedules for the FPD valuation model.
20-Jun-06	1.4	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA) and Eric Fromm (SGI) regarding the Microprocessor patents, alternative technologies, and related competitive advantages.
20-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with J. Snell, Bob Goldman (CRA) regarding potential value propositions for relevant Microprocessor Architecture patents.
20-Jun-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA) re: system design patents and relevant valuation methods
20-Jun-06	1.1	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, B. Goldman, J. Snell (CRA) to review system design technology patents in support of the development of the valuation model.
20-Jun-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Determination of valuation approach to use to value System Design technology.
20-Jun-06	1.9	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Determination of valuation approach to use to value Storage technology.
20-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Determination of valuation approach to use to value Operating Systems Software technology.
20-Jun-06	0.7	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of notes and research regarding Operating Systems Software technology.
20-Jun-06	2.3	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of notes and research regarding Storage technology.
20-Jun-06	2.8	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of research materials in support of the valuation of the compilers technology
20-Jun-06	2.4	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of research materials in support of the valuation of the system design technology
20-Jun-06	0.1	Vold, Matt	Conference Call	Conference call with T. McCann (SGI), M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: market for Mechanisms patents.
20-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Conference Call	Conference call with T. McCann (SGI), M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: market for Thermal Management patents.
20-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status of work performed on Thermal Management bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.6	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Internal meeting with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) to discuss status of work performed on Mechanisms bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanical Interconnect bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.7	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
20-Jun-06	1.0	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
20-Jun-06	0.3	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
20-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanical Interconnect report.
20-Jun-06	0.9	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
20-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Research	Research market data related to the Mechanisms bundle valuation model.
20-Jun-06	0.6	Vold, Matt	Research	Research market data related to the Mechanical Interconnect bundle valuation model.
20-Jun-06	0.9	Vold, Matt	Research	Research market data related to the Thermal Management bundle valuation model.
21-Jun-06	1.0	Becker, Josh	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re follow up questions regarding the "A" patents in the Scalability portfolio and benefits of the technology in order to prepare analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re call with G. Thorson (SGI) about patents included in Scalability portfolio and new action items for completing the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
21-Jun-06	0.3	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Model updates
21-Jun-06	1.6	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Reviewed models and updated with changes.
21-Jun-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Reviewed draft and updated changes.
21-Jun-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Drafted sections 4 and 5 of the report.
21-Jun-06	1.7	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Updated report and models for changes
21-Jun-06	2.4	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Completed first draft.
21-Jun-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Research	Determined Cray's involvement in with the patents in the scalability portfolio.
21-Jun-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on PCISix and SGI's Involvement in the group.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on PCI and PCI-Express, which included the advisory board and who belongs to the board. Also included a review of the bylaws for licensing rights.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Continued research on PCI and PCI-Express
21-Jun-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Research	Gathered the key documents and sources for the scalability model and report.
21-Jun-06	1.1	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on I/O and Channel interconnect to determine the potential royalty base for the interconnect technology.
21-Jun-06	0.5	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of operating systems design software valuation model.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of storage software valuation model.
21-Jun-06	3.2	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Research	Research on industry structure for storage technology in support of development of valuation model for storage software.
21-Jun-06	3.5	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Review of Materials	Reviewed patent background and research on industry structure for storage technology in support of development of valuation model for storage software.
21-Jun-06	0.3	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: additional patents classified to the Mechanisms patent portfolio and work to be performed in connection therewith.
21-Jun-06	2.1	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Daniel, M. Ringgenberg (CRA) to discuss results and next actions for the FPD valuation.
21-Jun-06	0.4	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
21-Jun-06	0.4	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanical Interconnect report.
21-Jun-06	1.9	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
21-Jun-06	2.8	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Daniel, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials re: draft valuation models for the FPD bundle.
21-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Eric Fromm (SGI) discussing relevant patents, alternative technologies, and competitive advantages.
21-Jun-06	1.8	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), D. Evanicky (SGI/Information Interaction) regarding assessment of additional patents contained in the FPD package that were not already reviewed.
21-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding additional FPD patents and potential implications for existing valuation models.
21-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research and analyses for compiler technology.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
21-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding PCI-Express patent and potential infringement analysis.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding main report, project status, and analysis review.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re call with G. Thorson (SGI) about patents included in Scalability portfolio and new action items for completing the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
21-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Prepared SME analytic worksheet for review by D. Evanicky (SGI / Information Interaction).
21-Jun-06	1.8	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
21-Jun-06	3.9	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Preparation of exhibits, tables and figures for main report.
21-Jun-06	3.7	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafting of main report.
21-Jun-06	1.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Updating rankings for flat panel and preliminary QC
21-Jun-06	1.5	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Updating main report and exhibits
21-Jun-06	3.9	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Writing main report technology package summaries
21-Jun-06	0.5	Hannah, Brad	Research	Update full portfolio analytics charts and graphs for new information
21-Jun-06	0.6	Hannah, Brad	Research	Adding additional SGI agreement to summary
21-Jun-06	0.8	Hannah, Brad	Research	Updating Microprocessor Architecture bundle rankings
21-Jun-06	1.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Finish summarizing confidential agreements
21-Jun-06	1.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Identify unbundled patents, compose lists of patents, and organize for teams
21-Jun-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Research	Updating and formatting IP acquisitions file
21-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re follow up questions regarding the "A" patents in the Scalability portfolio and benefits of the technology in order to prepare analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re call with G. Thorson (SGI) about patents included in Scalability portfolio and new action items for completing the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
21-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Other	Preparation for call with G. Thorson (SGI) including review of "A" patents included in Scalability portfolio and review of notes on follow up questions.
21-Jun-06	1.2	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of licensing effort for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of applicable market revenue for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
21-Jun-06	1.8	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of costs of litigation for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
21-Jun-06	2.1	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of decision tree results for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
21-Jun-06	2.2	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of discounted cash flow analysis for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
21-Jun-06	2.5	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of valuation analysis for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio
21-Jun-06	1.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, M. Ringgenberg (CRA) to review results of the valuation model and discuss report for the FPD technology.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding main report, project status, and analysis review.
21-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding PCI-Express patent and potential infringement analysis.
21-Jun-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding additional FPD patents and potential implications for existing valuation models.
21-Jun-06	0.1	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of material related to the PCI technology in preparation for internal meeting.
21-Jun-06	0.5	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Conference call with E. Phillips (CRA), G. Pirocanac (SGI) discussing the market for the compiler technologies and additional background related to the patent portfolio.
21-Jun-06	0.5	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research and analyses for compiler technology.
21-Jun-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for Compilers technology
21-Jun-06	1.1	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
21-Jun-06	1.7	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
21-Jun-06	3.2	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of compiler technology bucket, regarding CRA's valuation analyses.
21-Jun-06	3.3	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of compiler technology bucket, regarding background and premises of value.
21-Jun-06	1.4	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
21-Jun-06	0.7	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for Compilers technology
21-Jun-06	1.2	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of schedules - Compilers technology
21-Jun-06	1.2	Porter, Steve	Research	Work on research into software engineer compensation rates for the cost approach valuation method - System Design technology
21-Jun-06	2.3	Porter, Steve	Research	Royalty rate research on comparables for Compilers technology
21-Jun-06	1.1	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Further development of valuation model.
21-Jun-06	1.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Further development of valuation model.
21-Jun-06	1.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Further development of valuation model.
21-Jun-06	1.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Research on system design, software engineer salaries and model design/approach.
21-Jun-06	1.4	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Finished online research and printed hard copies of documents relied upon
21-Jun-06	2.4	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Research into market acceptance and opportunity for the technology in support of the valuation model.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, M. Ringgenberg (CRA) to review results of the valuation model and discuss report for the FPD technology.
21-Jun-06	2.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Daniel, M. Ringgenberg (CRA) to discuss results and next actions for the FPD valuation.
21-Jun-06	3.8	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of the litigation risk model for the FPD technology.
21-Jun-06	2.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of the valuation report for the FPD technology.
21-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Discussion with J. Snell (CRA), Steve Reinhardt (SGI) regarding competitive advantages of SGI's storage replication patent.
21-Jun-06	1.0	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with J. Snell, B. Goldman, (CRA), Phil Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), and Eric Fromm (SGI) discussing relevant patents, alternative technologies, and competitive advantages.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
21-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of operating systems design software valuation model.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of storage software valuation model.
21-Jun-06	0.9	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Development of valuation framework for the system design technology.
21-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Development of valuation framework for the storage technology.
21-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Development of valuation framework for the operating systems technology.
21-Jun-06	1.3	Snell, Jeff	Report Writing	Preliminary drafting of System Design technology report.
21-Jun-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Report Writing	Preliminary drafting of Operating System Software report.
21-Jun-06	2.5	Snell, Jeff	Report Writing	Preliminary drafting of Storage technology report.
21-Jun-06	0.8	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation framework and report draft for the system design technology.
21-Jun-06	0.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation framework and report draft for the operating systems technology.
21-Jun-06	1.4	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation framework and report draft for the storage technology.
21-Jun-06	0.3	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: additional patents classified to the Mechanisms patent portfolio and work to be performed in connection therewith.
22-Jun-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI) and K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re Scalability technology, including patents not previously discussed with SGI technical experts in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
22-Jun-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re call with G. Thorson (SGI) about patents not previously addressed by SGI technical experts and action plan for including them in the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
22-Jun-06	1.5	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated models and created document index for the models
22-Jun-06	2.3	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Reformatted Multiple Process models and the Scalability models.
22-Jun-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Other	Pulled patents relevant to the U/O discussion and PCI-Express and formulated question for the SME.
22-Jun-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Read over the main report to ensure consistent wording across all reports.
22-Jun-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Reviewed and updated the draft
22-Jun-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Worked on the draft reports to ensure accuracy and consistency across reports.
22-Jun-06	0.6	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of system design valuation model.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of storage software valuation model.
22-Jun-06	1.5	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of operating systems design software valuation model.
22-Jun-06	2.0	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Snell, C. Cronin and S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding technical background on storage replication technologies and how they apply to SGI's storage replication patent.
22-Jun-06	1.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Model Development	Began creating estimated revenues for storage software in support of development of valuation model for storage software.
22-Jun-06	1.8	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Research	Continued research on industry structure for storage technology in support of development of valuation model for storage software.
22-Jun-06	2.0	Cronin, Chris	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Snell, C. Cronin and S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding technical background on storage replication technologies and how they apply to SGI's storage replication patent.
22-Jun-06	0.6	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Mechanisms bundle.
22-Jun-06	1.2	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Review and revise draft valuation models for Thermal Management bundle.
22-Jun-06	2.1	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
22-Jun-06	2.5	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding open items and schedule.
22-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research and analyses for compiler technology.
22-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) re: timing and go-forward plan for completing open items.
22-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re call with G. Thorson (SGI) about patents not previously addressed by SGI technical experts and action plan for including them in the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
22-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman (CRA) re status of Multiple Processor draft report.
22-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Review and analysis for System SW and Microprocessor Architecture packages.
22-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
22-Jun-06	1.6	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Editing and changes to Main Report based on comments from B. Oliver.
22-Jun-06	2.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Format patent summary file for printing
22-Jun-06	2.2	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC patents in more than one bundle for correct rankings in each
22-Jun-06	1.7	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Write de minimis report section and gather detail from each Appendix
22-Jun-06	0.8	Hannah, Brad	Research	Merge and rebundle Systems and Computer Systems Architecture unbundled and unranked patents
22-Jun-06	0.8	Hannah, Brad	Research	Update all patent analytic charts, tables, and graphs
22-Jun-06	0.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	Build new patent analytic tables for main report
22-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI) and K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re Scalability technology, including patents not previously discussed with SGI technical experts in order to prepare Scalability analysis.
22-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman (CRA) re status of Multiple Processor draft report.
22-Jun-06	1.2	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Becker (CRA) re call with G. Thorson (SGI) about patents not previously addressed by SGI technical experts and action plan for including them in the analysis of the Scalability technology portfolio.
22-Jun-06	0.6	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Preparation of spreadsheet identifying sources used in completing model for the Multiple processor portfolio.
22-Jun-06	1.9	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Identification of sources used in completing model for the Multiple Processor portfolio.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Other	Prepared for call with G. Thorson (SGI) by reviewing spreadsheet of patents not previously addressed with SGI technical experts.
22-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of conclusions in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Prepared draft discussion of market approach for inclusion in report on Multiple Processor portfolio.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Reviewed and edited draft report on Multiple Processor portfolio before passing on to B. Oliver (CRA) for his review.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Preparation of spreadsheet identifying sources used in completing draft report on the Multiple processor portfolio.
22-Jun-06	2.2	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Identification of sources used in completing draft report on the Multiple Processor portfolio.
22-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of Multiple Processor model to identify follow up points in completing analysis.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) and P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding open items and schedule.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
22-Jun-06	0.9	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) re: timing and go-forward plan for completing open items.
22-Jun-06	1.1	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Further development of main report draft
22-Jun-06	1.2	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of exhibits and preliminary valuation for the storage technology.
22-Jun-06	0.4	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research and analyses for compiler technology.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
22-Jun-06	3.8	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of compiler technology bucket.
22-Jun-06	0.6	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure, technology, and comparable transactions in support of development of valuation model for the compiler technology bucket.
22-Jun-06	3.8	Porter, Steve	Other	Implementation of changes to Compilers model and report
22-Jun-06	1.7	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Source document compilation for Compilers report
22-Jun-06	3.2	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of schedules and report - Compilers technology
22-Jun-06	0.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA) about updates to storage valuation model.
22-Jun-06	0.5	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Updated models with changes from J. Snell re: processors
22-Jun-06	0.5	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Updated model with change from J. Snell re: system design models
22-Jun-06	0.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Changed model according to J. Snell, updated cost approach time line and discount rate
22-Jun-06	2.1	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Preparation for discussion with SGI subject matter expert related market acceptance and opportunity for the technology.
22-Jun-06	2.8	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Development of document index listing all sources reviewed and relied upon for the graphics technology in support of the valuation report.
22-Jun-06	3.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Development of document index listing all sources reviewed and relied upon for the FPD technology in support of the valuation report.
22-Jun-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Call with J. Snell (CRA), E. Fromm (SGI) regarding Microprocessor Architecture technology.
22-Jun-06	0.2	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Rakiec, J. Snell (CRA) about updates to storage valuation model.
22-Jun-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of system design valuation model.
22-Jun-06	0.8	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of storage software valuation model.
22-Jun-06	1.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of operating systems design software valuation model.
22-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Snell, C. Cronin and S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding technical background on storage replication technologies and how they apply to SGI's storage replication patent.
22-Jun-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and related inputs for the storage technology.
22-Jun-06	0.9	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and related inputs for the system design technology.
22-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and related inputs for the operating systems software technology.
22-Jun-06	0.3	Vold, Matt	Other	Create index of documents reviewed and or relied upon for the Mechanisms report and exhibits.
22-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Other	Create index of documents reviewed and or relied upon for the Thermal Management report and exhibits.
23-Jun-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Made final changes to the report
23-Jun-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Built patent chart for the multiprocessor model and report.
23-Jun-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Read over corrections in the report and made appropriate corrections
23-Jun-06	1.7	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Updated the scalability report
23-Jun-06	2.7	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Updated both the multiprocessor model and the report
23-Jun-06	2.3	Becker, Josh	Research	Conducted research on the server market size and future growth rates.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of storage valuation model.
23-Jun-06	0.9	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding Operating System Software valuation model.
23-Jun-06	2.0	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Model Development	Completed development of draft of valuation model for storage software.
23-Jun-06	4.0	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Research	Research on industry structure for operating systems software in support of development of valuation model for operating systems design software.
23-Jun-06	2.1	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Review of Materials	Reviewed patent background and research on industry structure for operating systems software in support of development of valuation model for operating systems design software.
23-Jun-06	0.1	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: work to be performed to prepare Thermal Management report and exhibit for client's review.
23-Jun-06	0.1	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: work to be performed to prepare Mechanisms report and exhibit for client's review.
23-Jun-06	1.9	Daniel, Brian	Quality Control	Compile source documents for Mechanisms quality control binder to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
23-Jun-06	2.0	Daniel, Brian	Quality Control	Compile source documents for Thermal Management quality control binder to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report - footnotes.
23-Jun-06	0.6	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report - footnotes.
23-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Hannah, M Tate (CRA); P. Hirschhorn and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis); G. Holtzer (Weil); and B. Weinert (SGI) to discuss status and schedule of deliverables.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology.
23-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding project status and status of Appendices.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Methodology development for including Global Request Mechanism patents into Scalability package.
23-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
23-Jun-06	1.9	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and draft of Multiple Processor Appendix.
23-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of additional information provided by S. Reinhardt (SGI) regarding Storage package.
23-Jun-06	1.0	Hannah, Brad	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Hannah, M Tate (CRA); P. Hirschhorn and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis); G. Holtzer (Weil); and B. Weinert (SGI) to discuss status and schedule of deliverables.
23-Jun-06	0.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Checking report certain for language
23-Jun-06	0.8	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC of preliminary Appendix B - Exhibit 1.0
23-Jun-06	2.0	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Building QC binders and gathering sources
23-Jun-06	2.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Checking, formatting, and sources for microprocessor / chip sample litigation summary
23-Jun-06	0.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundle and rerank certain patents and adjust analytic tables accordingly
23-Jun-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Hannah, M Tate (CRA); P. Hirschhorn and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis); G. Holtzer (Weil); and B. Weinert (SGI) to discuss status and schedule of deliverables.
23-Jun-06	0.6	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding project status and status of Appendices.



**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
23-Jun-06	1.6	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Further development of main report draft
23-Jun-06	0.4	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
23-Jun-06	0.5	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Snell, E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analysis on PCI technology.
23-Jun-06	1.1	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on potentially comparable transactions in support of development of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
23-Jun-06	2.6	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
23-Jun-06	0.4	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
23-Jun-06	1.9	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Creation of preliminary schedules - PCI valuation
23-Jun-06	1.4	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	OC binder clean-up - Compilers technology
23-Jun-06	2.9	Porter, Steve	Research	Background research - PCI Express
23-Jun-06	2.8	Porter, Steve	Review of Materials	Review of potential data sources for PCI valuation approaches
23-Jun-06	0.3	Rakiec, Michelle	Model Development	Review of updated model to ensure high quality.
23-Jun-06	2.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of valuation model for the graphics technology
23-Jun-06	2.9	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of valuation model for the FPD technology
23-Jun-06	1.5	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the FPD technology
23-Jun-06	1.7	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Further development of valuation report for the graphics technology
23-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding preliminary research results in support of development of storage valuation model.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Snell, E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analysis on PCI technology.
23-Jun-06	0.9	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding Operating System Software valuation model.
23-Jun-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of storage technology valuation report.
23-Jun-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation report for the operating systems software technology.
23-Jun-06	1.0	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and related inputs for the system design technology.
23-Jun-06	2.2	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and related inputs for the operating systems software technology.
23-Jun-06	2.8	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and related inputs for the storage technology.
23-Jun-06	1.0	Tate, Mike	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, B. Hannah, M Tate (CRA); P. Hirschhorn and J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis); G. Holtzer (Weil); and B. Weinert (SGI) to discuss status and schedule of deliverables.
23-Jun-06	0.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of materials in preparation for conference call to discuss status and schedule of deliverables.
23-Jun-06	0.1	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: work to be performed to prepare Thermal Management report and exhibit for client's review.
23-Jun-06	0.1	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: work to be performed to prepare Mechanisms report and exhibit for client's review.
23-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise Thermal Management exhibits footnotes.
23-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Review and revise Mechanisms exhibits footnotes.
23-Jun-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Compile source documents for Thermal Management quality control binder to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
23-Jun-06	0.9	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Compile source documents for Mechanisms quality control binder to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
23-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report footnotes.
23-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report footnotes.
24-Jun-06	0.1	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding draft valuation model for system design.
24-Jun-06	1.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding draft valuation model for operating systems design software.
24-Jun-06	1.6	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding draft valuation model for storage software.
24-Jun-06	2.8	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Model Development	Completed development of draft of valuation model for operating systems design software.
24-Jun-06	2.2	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Research	Continued research on industry structure for operating systems software in support of development of valuation model for operating systems design software.
24-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, J. Snell (CRA) regarding analysis for PCI-E and Global Request Mechanism litigation risk models.
24-Jun-06	2.2	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and editing of thermal management Appendix.
24-Jun-06	0.6	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
24-Jun-06	2.6	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
24-Jun-06	0.6	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
24-Jun-06	0.6	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
24-Jun-06	1.7	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Preparation of PCI model for use in litigation risk analysis
24-Jun-06	3.9	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Schedule creation - PCI relief from royalty valuation model
24-Jun-06	0.1	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding draft valuation model for system design.
24-Jun-06	1.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding draft valuation model for operating systems design software.
24-Jun-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding draft valuation model for storage software.
24-Jun-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, J. Snell (CRA) regarding analysis for PCI-E and Global Request Mechanism litigation risk models.
24-Jun-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of System Design valuation model.
24-Jun-06	1.5	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Operating System Software valuation model.
24-Jun-06	1.8	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Storage valuation model.
25-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Litigation risk model timing review.
25-Jun-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of FPD Appendix.
25-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Graphics Appendix.
25-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Scalability Appendix.
25-Jun-06	1.4	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Multiple Processor Appendix.
25-Jun-06	0.4	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and editing of FPD Appendix.
25-Jun-06	1.2	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and editing of Graphics Appendix.
25-Jun-06	1.1	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and editing of Scalability Appendix.
25-Jun-06	1.8	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and editing of Multiple Processor Appendix.
25-Jun-06	0.8	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
25-Jun-06	2.8	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of PCI technology bucket.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
25-Jun-06	1.8	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on potentially comparable transactions in support of development of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
25-Jun-06	0.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further updates to FPD model to populate desired notification dates in the valuation model.
25-Jun-06	2.1	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of timing of decision node payoffs in support of the PCI technology valuation.
25-Jun-06	2.8	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of 3-stage decision tree model template in support of the PCI technology valuation.
25-Jun-06	3.2	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of the determination of potential royalty revenue related for the subject PCI technology.
25-Jun-06	3.9	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Incorporating the royalty revenue model into the 3-stage decision tree model template.
26-Jun-06	2.7	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Assisted with creation of draft of report on system design technology.
26-Jun-06	2.9	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Assisted with creation of draft of report on operating systems design software.
26-Jun-06	3.4	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Assisted with creation of draft of report on storage software.
26-Jun-06	0.8	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
26-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah (CRA); J. Etra (Morgan Lewis) and C. Golson (SGI) regarding Digital Media package.
26-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); S. Youngman and G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) and B. Weinert (SGI) regarding status of report, open items, identification of resource for Digital Media, and need for core v. non-core breakout in report.
26-Jun-06	1.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), T. McGee (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Oliver (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), J. Snell (CRA), E. Phillips (CRA), and re explanation of the PCI technology and benefits in order to prepare analysis of PCI technology bundle.
26-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding status and digital media review.
26-Jun-06	1.4	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Review of PCI model.
26-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
26-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Additional table preparation on modifications to main report.
26-Jun-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Compiler Appendix
26-Jun-06	1.1	Hannah, Brad	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Hannah (CRA); J. Etra (Morgan Lewis) and C. Golson (SGI) regarding Digital Media package.
26-Jun-06	0.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Checking over and formatting SGI agreements
26-Jun-06	0.5	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Checking over analytic tables
26-Jun-06	1.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Look up sources and make changes to Compiler model
26-Jun-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Make changes to Scalability model and create source binder
26-Jun-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Pull sources for main report QC to ensure accuracy
26-Jun-06	0.4	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Updating main report sections and tables
26-Jun-06	1.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Discussion with Bob Goldman (CRA) about updating bundles and rankings and updating the files
26-Jun-06	2.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Identify unranked patents and create files for SME review
26-Jun-06	1.6	Lennox, Katie	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), T. McGee (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Oliver (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), J. Snell (CRA), E. Phillips (CRA), and re explanation of the PCI technology and benefits in order to prepare analysis of PCI technology bundle.
26-Jun-06	0.9	Lennox, Katie	Other	Preparation for call with G. Thorson (SGI) including reviewing list of unranked patents, reviewing notes from prior calls, and outlining questions.
26-Jun-06	1.6	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Revised Scalability report to incorporate changes from B. Goldman (CRA).
26-Jun-06	2.5	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Revised Multiple Processor report to incorporate changes from B. Oliver (CRA)
26-Jun-06	1.9	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of market share information provided by SGI in order to determine its applicability to Scalability model.
26-Jun-06	2.0	Lennox, Katie	Review of Materials	Review of market share information provided by SGI in order to determine its applicability to Multiple Processor model.
26-Jun-06	1.6	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), T. McGee (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Oliver (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), J. Snell (CRA), E. Phillips (CRA), and re explanation of the PCI technology and benefits in order to prepare analysis of PCI technology bundle.
26-Jun-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); S. Youngman and G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) and B. Weinert (SGI) regarding status of report, open items, identification of resource for Digital Media, and need for core v. non-core breakout in report.
26-Jun-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding status and digital media review.
26-Jun-06	1.9	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of research materials and valuation model for the multiple processor technology bundle.
26-Jun-06	1.6	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), T. McGee (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Oliver (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), J. Snell (CRA), E. Phillips (CRA), and re explanation of the PCI technology and benefits in order to prepare analysis of PCI technology bundle.
26-Jun-06	1.2	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
26-Jun-06	3.0	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
26-Jun-06	1.5	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of PCI technology bucket, regarding PCI background.
26-Jun-06	2.7	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of PCI technology bucket, regarding premises of value and valuation analyses.
26-Jun-06	1.2	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
26-Jun-06	3.1	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Review of PCI litigation risk model
26-Jun-06	1.8	Porter, Steve	Research	Blade server market share and comparables research for PCI valuation model
26-Jun-06	3.6	Porter, Steve	Review of Materials	Review of data sources used in PCI analyses
26-Jun-06	1.2	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Update to FPD valuation model based upon revised notification dates in the valuation model.
26-Jun-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Call with G. Thorson (SGI), T. McGee (SGI), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), K. Lennox (CRA), B. Oliver (CRA), B. Goldman (CRA), J. Snell (CRA), E. Phillips (CRA), and re explanation of the PCI technology and benefits in order to prepare analysis of PCI technology bundle.
26-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Creation of one-stage license-litigate valuation model for the scalability technology.
26-Jun-06	2.8	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of PCI technology valuation model structure.
26-Jun-06	3.2	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Continued development of PCI technology valuation model.
26-Jun-06	3.2	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of PCI technology valuation model inputs.
26-Jun-06	2.3	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report draft for the system design technology.
26-Jun-06	1.8	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report draft for the storage technology.
26-Jun-06	1.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report draft for the operating system software technology.
26-Jun-06	2.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report draft for the PCI technology.
26-Jun-06	1.0	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Preliminary quality control thermal management report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
26-Jun-06	1.0	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Preliminary quality control analysis of mechanisms exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
26-Jun-06	2.1	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Preliminary quality control thermal management exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
26-Jun-06	1.8	Wilson, Erika	Quality Control	Quality control of report to ensure accuracy of analysis for the mechanisms technology
26-Jun-06	2.4	Wilson, Erika	Quality Control	Quality control of report exhibits to ensure accuracy of analysis for the mechanisms technology

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
27-Jun-06	0.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding status of draft report for system design.
27-Jun-06	0.4	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding status of draft report for storage software.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding status of draft report for operating systems design software.
27-Jun-06	1.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Model Development	Assisted with development of valuation model for system design technology.
27-Jun-06	1.7	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Began quality control of valuation model for storage software.
27-Jun-06	1.9	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Continued assisting with creation of draft of report on storage software.
27-Jun-06	2.4	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Continued assisting with creation of draft of report on operating systems design software.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: revisions to report and models for thermal management.
27-Jun-06	0.4	Daniel, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: revisions to report and models for mechanisms.
27-Jun-06	0.2	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Revise thermal management exhibits based on changes from quality control
27-Jun-06	0.3	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Revise mechanisms exhibits based on changes from quality control
27-Jun-06	1.1	Daniel, Brian	Quality Control	Review quality control of thermal management report and exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
27-Jun-06	1.3	Daniel, Brian	Quality Control	Review quality control of mechanisms report and exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding identification of additional SGI SMEs.
27-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn, J. Bollinger and D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rimland (Bear Stearns) regarding status and preliminary results of non-core and core valuation, and remaining open items.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman and J. Snell (all CRA) re work plan for preparing reasonableness analysis based on litigation risk model for the Scalability technology portfolio.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Snell (CRA) re work plan for preparing additional analysis for the Scalability portfolio based on a litigation risk analysis.
27-Jun-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, J. Snell (CRA) regarding Global Request Mechanism and PCI valuation and report and Appendices status.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team management.
27-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of PCI Appendix.
27-Jun-06	3.6	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Main Report, Exhibit B, and preparation of tables for main report.
27-Jun-06	1.4	Goldman, Bob	Research	Review and analysis of preliminary comments regarding Graphics package patents from S. Moffitt (SGI).
27-Jun-06	0.3	Hannah, Brad	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	3.7	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Formatting report appendices
27-Jun-06	1.9	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Adding / editing technology package overviews (section 7 of report)
27-Jun-06	0.3	Hannah, Brad	Research	Update patent rankings and comments based on further SME comments
27-Jun-06	1.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Update Graphics rankings
27-Jun-06	2.0	Hannah, Brad	Research	Update and format for printing Appendix C items
27-Jun-06	1.8	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Review of report
27-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman and J. Snell (all CRA) re work plan for preparing reasonableness analysis based on litigation risk model for the Scalability technology portfolio.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Snell (CRA) re additional analyses to complete in support of the Scalability model.
27-Jun-06	1.0	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Snell (CRA) re work plan for preparing additional analysis for the Scalability portfolio based on a litigation risk analysis.
27-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Review of assumptions used regarding market definition for analysis of Scalability technology portfolio.
27-Jun-06	1.4	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Revision to Scalability report to address conclusions from litigation risk analysis.
27-Jun-06	1.5	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted discussion of Scalability to be included in main report.
27-Jun-06	3.6	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted new section of Scalability report on reasonableness of conclusions based on litigation risk analysis.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Newell, Mike	Quality Control	Review of financial models to ensure accuracy and consistency of analyses.
27-Jun-06	1.3	Newell, Mike	Quality Control	Review of financial models to ensure accuracy and consistency of analyses.
27-Jun-06	1.4	Newell, Mike	Quality Control	Review of financial models to ensure accuracy and consistency of analyses.
27-Jun-06	2.1	Newell, Mike	Quality Control	Review of financial models to ensure accuracy and consistency of analyses.
27-Jun-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn, J. Bollinger and D. Crisman (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rimland (Bear Stearns) regarding status and preliminary results of non-core and core valuation, and remaining open items.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman and J. Snell (all CRA) re work plan for preparing reasonableness analysis based on litigation risk model for the Scalability technology portfolio.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, J. Snell (CRA) regarding Global Request Mechanism and PCI valuation and report and Appendices status.
27-Jun-06	2.8	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of PCI research materials and valuation model.
27-Jun-06	2.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of storage technology research materials and valuation model.
27-Jun-06	2.6	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of scalability technology research materials and valuation model.
27-Jun-06	1.1	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
27-Jun-06	0.3	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	1.9	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of analyses in support of valuation model for the PCI technology bucket.
27-Jun-06	3.1	Phillips, Eric	Report Writing	Drafting of expert report sections for valuation of PCI technology bucket.
27-Jun-06	1.1	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Porter and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing research and analyses for PCI technology
27-Jun-06	0.3	Porter, Steve	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Rinzenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	2.9	Porter, Steve	Model Development	PCI valuation model updates
27-Jun-06	3.2	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of PCI valuation model schedules

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
27-Jun-06	3.2	Porter, Steve	Report Writing	PCI report work - review, revisions, drafting of short summary
27-Jun-06	0.3	Ringgenberg, Matt	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Ringgenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	0.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Update to graphics valuation model based upon revised notification dates in the valuation model.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding status of draft report for system design.
27-Jun-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding status of draft report for storage software.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with S. Chandrasekhara, J. Snell (CRA) regarding status of draft report for operating systems design software.
27-Jun-06	2.0	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with B. Goldman, B. Oliver, J. Snell (CRA) regarding Global Request Mechanism and PCI valuation and report and Appendices status.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Team meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, E. Phillips, S. Porter, B. Hannah, B. Daniel, and M. Ringgenberg (CRA) re status of report and plan for completing same.
27-Jun-06	1.0	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, B. Goldman and J. Snell (CRA) re work plan for preparing additional analysis for the Scalability portfolio based on a litigation risk analysis.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Snell (CRA) re additional analyses to complete in support of the Scalability model.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Oliver, B. Goldman and J. Snell (all CRA) re work plan for preparing reasonableness analysis based on litigation risk model for the Scalability technology portfolio.
27-Jun-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of one-stage license-litigate valuation model structure.
27-Jun-06	0.7	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Valuation model changes for the storage technology model.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Valuation model changes for the operating systems software technology model.
27-Jun-06	1.7	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Valuation model changes for the system design technology model.
27-Jun-06	1.8	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Continued development of PCI technology valuation model.
27-Jun-06	1.7	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of valuation model inputs for the scalability technology.
27-Jun-06	1.7	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and draft report with exhibits in support of valuation of the mechanisms technology.
27-Jun-06	2.6	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and draft report with exhibits in support of valuation of the scalability technology.
27-Jun-06	2.3	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and draft report with exhibits in support of valuation of the thermal management technology.
27-Jun-06	1.2	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and draft report with exhibits in support of valuation of the operating system software technology.
27-Jun-06	0.5	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Further review of valuation model and report draft for the system design technology.
27-Jun-06	0.3	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: revisions to report and models for thermal management.
27-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Internal Meeting	Discussion with M. Vold, B. Daniel (CRA) re: revisions to report and models for mechanisms.
27-Jun-06	0.6	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Revise thermal management exhibits based on changes from quality control
27-Jun-06	0.9	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Revise mechanisms exhibits based on changes from quality control
27-Jun-06	0.2	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of mechanisms report and exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
27-Jun-06	0.4	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Quality control of thermal management report and exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
27-Jun-06	1.0	Wilson, Erika	Quality Control	Further quality control of report to ensure accuracy of analysis for the mechanisms technology
28-Jun-06	2.6	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Continued quality control of valuation model for storage software.
28-Jun-06	2.0	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Continued assisting with creation of draft of report on storage software.
28-Jun-06	2.4	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Report Writing	Continued assisting with creation of draft of report on operating systems design software.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Update thermal management model for adjustment in date of licensing.
28-Jun-06	0.7	Daniel, Brian	Model Development	Update mechanism models for adjustment in date of licensing.
28-Jun-06	0.3	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Thermal Management report.
28-Jun-06	0.6	Daniel, Brian	Report Writing	Review and revise Mechanisms report.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding Application SW patent claims and interpretation of existing license agreement.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); B. Weirnt (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rimland (Bear Stearns) regarding status and preliminary results of non-core and core valuation, and remaining open items.
28-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), S. Moffitt (SGI) regarding assessment of patents in Graphics portfolio, including identification of Vizserver as a new "A" graphics opportunity for valuation.
28-Jun-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), S. Moffitt (SGI) regarding Vizserver package to obtain information required to perform valuation.
28-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), R. Altmaier (SGI) regarding patents originally included in Application SW bucket.
28-Jun-06	1.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), C. Ray (SGI) regarding assessment of patents in Digital Media package.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding Income Approach timing to include liquidation time frame.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding Application SW assessment.
28-Jun-06	2.1	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, J. Snell, and call with B. Oliver (all CRA) regarding Vizserver technology and action plan for analyzing same.
28-Jun-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Discussions with all teams regarding inclusion of liquidation time period in income approach models.
28-Jun-06	1.6	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Recategorization and updating of Application SW patent analytics information in Appendix B.
28-Jun-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Main Report and Exhibit B.
28-Jun-06	1.3	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review claims for patent identified in Application SW potentially being infringed, and review of existing license agreement to determine if licensee already has rights to said patent.
28-Jun-06	2.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Format, check, and PDF appendices
28-Jun-06	0.8	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Edit and update section 7 of report
28-Jun-06	1.2	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Update analytic tables
28-Jun-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Edit and format market approach report sections
28-Jun-06	2.2	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Create tables for IP portfolio transactions and add to applicable reports
28-Jun-06	2.4	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Write applicable market approach report sections
28-Jun-06	0.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Preliminary Microsoft market research
28-Jun-06	1.1	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundle certain patents and update all applicable sections
28-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Snell (CRA) re results of litigation risk analysis prepared for Scalability technology portfolio.
28-Jun-06	2.1	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, J. Snell, and call with B. Oliver (all CRA) regarding Vizserver technology and action plan for analyzing same.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
28-Jun-06	0.3	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Revised Scalability model to incorporate changes from B. Goldman (CRA).
28-Jun-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Model Development	Revised Multiple Processor model to incorporate changes from B. Goldman (CRA).
28-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Revised Scalability report to incorporate changes from B. Oliver (CRA).
28-Jun-06	2.2	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted section of Scalability report on reasonableness of conclusions based on litigation risk analysis. Discussed conclusions of analysis.
28-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted section of Scalability report on reasonableness of conclusions based on litigation risk analysis. Discussed overview of analysis.
28-Jun-06	3.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Revised discussion of patented technology in the System Design appendix to make it more consistent with other appendices.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rimland (Bear Stearns) regarding status and preliminary results of non-core and core valuation, and remaining open items.
28-Jun-06	2.1	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, J. Snell, and call with B. Oliver (CRA) regarding Vizserver technology and action plan for analyzing same.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding Income Approach timing to include liquidation time frame.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding Application SW assessment.
28-Jun-06	3.9	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Updates to main report.
28-Jun-06	2.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials supporting valuation models to ensure consistency and accuracy.
28-Jun-06	3.9	Porter, Steve	Model Development	Implementation of changes to PCI valuation model
28-Jun-06	2.2	Porter, Steve	Report Writing	Implementation of changes to PCI report
28-Jun-06	2.7	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further updating of valuation model confirming revised notification dates for the FPD technology.
28-Jun-06	3.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further updating of valuation model confirming revised notification dates for the graphics technology.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Snell (CRA) re results of litigation risk analysis prepared for Scalability technology portfolio.
28-Jun-06	2.1	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, B. Goldman, J. Snell, and call with B. Oliver (all CRA) regarding Vizserver technology and action plan for analyzing same.
28-Jun-06	2.1	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Continued development of valuation model for the PCI technology.
28-Jun-06	2.1	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Review of valuation model inputs and making necessary changes.
28-Jun-06	2.4	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Creation of valuation model for the vizserver technology.
28-Jun-06	0.7	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report for the system design technology.
28-Jun-06	1.2	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report for the storage technology.
28-Jun-06	1.2	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model and report for the operating systems technology.
28-Jun-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Update thermal management model for adjustment in date of licensing.
28-Jun-06	0.7	Vold, Matt	Model Development	Update mechanism models for adjustment in date of licensing
29-Jun-06	1.0	Chandrasekharā, Sheela	Report Writing	Assisted with creation of draft of report on system design technology.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), S. Moffitt (SGI) regarding development time and costs for Vizserver.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rimland (Bear Stearns) regarding status and preliminary results of non-core and core valuation, and remaining open items.
29-Jun-06	2.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) and E.L. Goh (SGI) regarding Human Computer Interface, Clip Mapping / Terrain Visualization, Windancer, Digital Media.
29-Jun-06	0.4	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) re: open issues.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding assessment of Human Computer Interface, Clip Mapping / Terrain Visualization, Windancer and Digital Media packages, and assessment of 2 offers for all or portions of SGI's patent portfolio.
29-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research related to terrestrial visualization patent and potential valuation.
29-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	Incorporation of feedback from SME into cost approach.
29-Jun-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Other	Preparation of detailed open issue matrix.
29-Jun-06	2.4	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Updated Appendix B and Main Report to reflect new information from SMEs and Vizserver Appendix.
29-Jun-06	1.0	Hannah, Brad	Other	PDF drafts on certain appendices
29-Jun-06	0.6	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Check number of patents to each appendix
29-Jun-06	2.5	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Format and change certain items in each appendix, including taking off draft, changing date, and changing specific text
29-Jun-06	0.4	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Make instructed changes to main report
29-Jun-06	1.1	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Add market approach write-up to all applicable sections
29-Jun-06	0.6	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundle / rerank certain patents and make necessary adjustments
29-Jun-06	3.1	Hannah, Brad	Research	Check Cerian agreement patents to determine which bundles each fell into
29-Jun-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re status of overall report and staffing requirements for completing same.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, E. Phillips (CRA) re research to be completed on terrestrial visualization patent and potential valuation.
29-Jun-06	0.9	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted appendix on Vizserver technology, including discussion of market approach.
29-Jun-06	1.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted appendix on Vizserver technology, including discussion of technology and market overview.
29-Jun-06	2.3	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Drafted appendix on Vizserver technology, including discussion of valuation analysis.
29-Jun-06	1.7	Lennox, Katie	Research	Research on market for terrestrial visualization patent to be incorporated into potential valuation analysis.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rimland (Bear Stearns) regarding status and preliminary results of non-core and core valuation, and remaining open items.
29-Jun-06	2.6	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) and E.L. Goh (SGI) regarding Human Computer Interface, Clip Mapping / Terrain Visualization, Windancer, Digital Media.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding assessment of Human Computer Interface, Clip Mapping / Terrain Visualization, Windancer and Digital Media packages, and assessment of 2 offers for all or portions of SGI's patent portfolio.
29-Jun-06	0.4	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) re: open issues.
29-Jun-06	0.9	Oliver, Brian	Model Development	Development of approach to Windancer valuation.
29-Jun-06	2.4	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials related to and supporting offers for all or portions of SGI's patent portfolio.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, E. Phillips (CRA) re research to be completed on terrestrial visualization patent and potential valuation.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
29-Jun-06	1.0	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with E. Phillips, B. Goldman (CRA) discussing research related to terrestrial visualization patent and potential valuation.
29-Jun-06	1.8	Phillips, Eric	Model Development	Development of and review of preliminary analyses in support of valuation model for the terrestrial visualization bucket.
29-Jun-06	1.4	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research and review of litigation and related pleadings regarding other terrestrial visualization technologies, including Google Earth, in support of potential valuation of terrestrial visualization patent.
29-Jun-06	1.9	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on industry structure and technology in support of development of potential valuation model for the terrestrial visualization bucket.
29-Jun-06	2.4	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of PCI report
29-Jun-06	3.2	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Compilation of PCI source documentation
29-Jun-06	1.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Report Writing	Compilation of the FPD technology report with support for review by senior team members.
29-Jun-06	2.1	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Completion of Vizserver valuation model.
29-Jun-06	2.7	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Incorporation of valuation model changes across all technology valuations.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of System Design valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	1.1	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Operating System Software valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	1.2	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of Storage valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	0.5	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, M. Tate (CRA) re status of overall report and staffing requirements for completing same.
29-Jun-06	1.4	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of PCI valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	0.7	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of vizserver valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	0.8	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of system design valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of storage valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	0.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of Operating System Software valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	1.2	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of thermal management valuation report and model.
29-Jun-06	1.6	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of mechanisms valuation report and model.
30-Jun-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rinland (Bear Stearns) regarding final value range opinion and remaining items (digital media, Windancer).
30-Jun-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Manning, B. Goldman (CRA) to review Windancer technology and valuation plan.
30-Jun-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Modifications to Main Report.
30-Jun-06	2.8	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Check number of patents to each appendix as part of quality control process
30-Jun-06	1.5	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundle / rerank certain Graphics patents and make necessary adjustments
30-Jun-06	2.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Rebundle / rerank certain application software patents and make necessary adjustments
30-Jun-06	1.0	Manning, Joe	Internal Meeting	Meeting with J. Manning, B. Goldman (CRA) to review Windancer technology and valuation plan.
30-Jun-06	2.5	Manning, Joe	Model Development	Development of Windancer technology valuation model
30-Jun-06	0.5	Manning, Joe	Review of Materials	Review of SGI Windancer business plan and financial forecasts in preparation for performing the valuation.
30-Jun-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA); G. Holtzer (Weil); P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis); B. Weinert (SGI); A. Samett and E. Rinland (Bear Stearns) regarding final value range opinion and remaining items (digital media, Windancer).
30-Jun-06	1.8	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of main report as part of assessment of final range opinion.
30-Jun-06	1.3	Phillips, Eric	Quality Control	Quality control of draft expert report for valuation of PCI technology bucket.
30-Jun-06	1.8	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of PCI valuation report and model including supporting materials
30-Jun-06	1.5	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of vizserver valuation report and model including supporting materials
30-Jun-06	0.8	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of system design valuation report and model including supporting materials
30-Jun-06	1.3	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of storage valuation report and model including supporting materials
30-Jun-06	0.6	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of Operating System Software valuation report and model including supporting materials
30-Jun-06	0.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of thermal management valuation report and model including supporting materials
30-Jun-06	1.2	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of mechanisms valuation report and model including supporting materials.
03-Jul-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Review of Materials	Reviewed Scalability Package report and models
03-Jul-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Review of Materials	Reviewed Multiple Processor Package report and models
03-Jul-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Modifications to Main Report.
03-Jul-06	2.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Editing and changes to Vizserver Appendix.
03-Jul-06	1.4	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Composing QC checklist and preparing items for QC
03-Jul-06	3.0	Hannah, Brad	Model Development	Preliminary draft OpenGL analysis
03-Jul-06	2.9	Lennox, Katie	Quality Control	Review of quality control procedures issues to be addressed in Vizserver appendix to ensure consistency of analyses.
03-Jul-06	3.1	Lennox, Katie	Quality Control	Review of quality control procedures issues to be addressed in Multiple Processor appendix to ensure consistency of analyses.
03-Jul-06	3.5	Lennox, Katie	Quality Control	Review of quality control procedures issues to be addressed in Scalability appendix to ensure consistency of analyses.
03-Jul-06	0.2	Manning, Joe	Model Development	Review of Windancer model in preparation for discussion with B. Oliver.
03-Jul-06	0.3	Manning, Joe	Conference Call	Call with J. Manning, B. Oliver (CRA) to discuss Windancer valuation model.
03-Jul-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Call with J. Manning, B. Oliver (CRA) to discuss Windancer valuation model.
03-Jul-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Model Development	Review of Windancer model to ensure proper approach to valuation model
05-Jul-06	0.5	Becker, Josh	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re quality control considerations for the Scalability analysis to be addressed to ensure accuracy.
05-Jul-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated the multiple processor model with the reasonableness check
05-Jul-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Gathered Documents for the QC of the multiple processor model
05-Jul-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Numbered pages for the QC of the scalability model
05-Jul-06	1.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Gathered Documents for the QC of the scalability model
05-Jul-06	1.6	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd the scalability report
05-Jul-06	1.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Created quality control binder in preparation for quality control of final system design technology report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
05-Jul-06	2.0	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Created quality control binder in preparation for quality control of final storage software report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
05-Jul-06	2.4	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Completed quality control of final system design technology report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
05-Jul-06	3.5	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Began quality control of final storage software report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
05-Jul-06	0.4	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate, K. Lennox, B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analyses.
05-Jul-06	1.2	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of report and exhibits for FPD technology to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
05-Jul-06	1.6	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Development of quality control review procedures to ensure consistency and accuracy across all technology valuations.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
05-Jul-06	1.7	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of report and exhibits for system design technology to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
05-Jul-06	2.4	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Further development of quality control review procedures to ensure consistency and accuracy across all technology valuations.
05-Jul-06	1.0	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Call with B. Goldman, J. Manning (CRA) , Stephen Moffitt (SGI) related to benefits and uses of the Windancer technology in support of the valuation.
05-Jul-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Windancer Appendix.
05-Jul-06	2.4	Goldman, Bob	Quality Control	Oversight of QC of main report and Appendices.
05-Jul-06	0.9	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Create QC binder for Appendix C
05-Jul-06	2.6	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC Appendix C
05-Jul-06	2.7	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Create QC binders for Appendix B
05-Jul-06	3.2	Hannah, Brad	Research	Additional research and appropriate changes to Appendix C
05-Jul-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate, K. Lennox, B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analyses.
05-Jul-06	0.4	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Snell (CRA) re quality control considerations to be addressed in the Scalability analysis to ensure accuracy.
05-Jul-06	0.5	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Becker (CRA) re quality control considerations for the Scalability analysis to be addressed to ensure accuracy.
05-Jul-06	1.0	Manning, Joe	Conference Call	Call with B. Goldman, J. Manning (CRA) , Stephen Moffitt (SGI) related to benefits and uses of the Windancer technology in support of the valuation.
05-Jul-06	1.2	Manning, Joe	Model Development	Modifications to Windancer technology valuation model based on discussions with SGI subject matter expert.
05-Jul-06	1.3	Manning, Joe	Research	Research on Intel's roadmap for multi-core CPUs in support of the development of the valuation model.
05-Jul-06	1.5	Manning, Joe	Research	Computer Graphics market research to gain an understanding of the graphics market size in support of the development of the valuation model.
05-Jul-06	4.0	Manning, Joe	Report Writing	Writing of Windancer technology valuation report
05-Jul-06	1.2	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and editing of Windancer Appendix.
05-Jul-06	0.6	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Quality control of updated schedules for PCI model
05-Jul-06	3.6	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of PCI computational schedules
05-Jul-06	3.7	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of PCI front schedules (summary and logical schedules)
05-Jul-06	0.7	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Organization of FPD technology binder in manner consistent with other QC binders to allow ease of use.
05-Jul-06	1.1	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Organization of Graphics technology binder in manner consistent with other QC binders to allow ease of use.
05-Jul-06	0.4	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with K. Lennox, J. Snell (CRA) re quality control considerations to be addressed in the Scalability analysis to ensure accuracy.
05-Jul-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Quality Control	Determination of quality control procedures for license-litigate valuation models.
05-Jul-06	0.4	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate, K. Lennox, B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analyses.
05-Jul-06	0.4	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate, K. Lennox, B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analyses.
05-Jul-06	2.3	Tate, Mike	Quality Control	Review of recently QC'd sections of report to ensure accuracy
05-Jul-06	0.6	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Thermal Management report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
06-Jul-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Report Writing	Updated Report with Changes made
06-Jul-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated scalability technology models with changes
06-Jul-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd exhibits 6-10 of the scalability model
06-Jul-06	2.2	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Re - QC'd exhibits 10-16 of the GRM/scalability model
06-Jul-06	2.3	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd exhibits 1-9 of the GRM/scalability model
06-Jul-06	2.4	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd exhibits 1-5 of the scalability model
06-Jul-06	0.2	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding valuation assumptions and support for the system design technology.
06-Jul-06	0.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding valuation assumptions and support for the operating system technology.
06-Jul-06	0.3	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding valuation assumptions and support for the storage technology.
06-Jul-06	2.6	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Created quality control binder in preparation for quality control of final operating systems design software report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
06-Jul-06	3.0	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Completed quality control of final storage software report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
06-Jul-06	3.1	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Completed quality control of final operating systems design software report, valuation model and supporting schedules.
06-Jul-06	0.9	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, M. Tate and B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analysis and status of project.
06-Jul-06	1.8	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of scalability technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
06-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of storage technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
06-Jul-06	2.9	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of operating systems software model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
06-Jul-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review and editing of Windancer Appendix.
06-Jul-06	1.2	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Update of main report based on comments from B. Oliver.
06-Jul-06	1.7	Goldman, Bob	Quality Control	Oversight of QC of main report and Appendices.
06-Jul-06	0.4	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Assist in QC for scalability technology to ensure accuracy of analysis.
06-Jul-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Create QC binder for Appendix B containing all source material in preparation for QC to ensure accuracy.
06-Jul-06	1.5	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Finalize QC for Appendix C
06-Jul-06	1.5	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	PDF draft of report to send to counsel for review.
06-Jul-06	3.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC Appendix B consisting of patent analytics of entire portfolio and summary schedules to ensure accuracy.
06-Jul-06	1.7	Koycheva, Denica	Quality Control	Quality control of scalability valuation model to ensure accuracy of analysis.
06-Jul-06	2.3	Koycheva, Denica	Quality Control	Further quality control of scalability valuation model to ensure accuracy of analysis.
06-Jul-06	0.9	Lennox, Katie	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, M. Tate and B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analysis and status of project.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
06-Jul-06	1.9	Lennox, Katie	Quality Control	Review of quality control procedures identified by B. Frizzell (CRA) to ensure consistency of analyses.
06-Jul-06	2.0	Manning, Joe	Quality Control	Quality control of Windancer valuation model.
06-Jul-06	2.0	Manning, Joe	Report Writing	Further writing of Windancer valuation report.
06-Jul-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review and development of Taurus requirements in support of valuation of digital media technology bundle.
06-Jul-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Quality Control	Quality control of draft expert report and analyses for valuation of compiler technology bucket.
06-Jul-06	1.1	Porter, Steve	Other	PDF creation of Compilers report and schedules
06-Jul-06	1.2	Porter, Steve	Other	PDF creation of PCI report and schedules
06-Jul-06	1.2	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of Compilers report and schedules
06-Jul-06	1.9	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	QC of PCI summary schedules
06-Jul-06	0.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Research	Searched for Vizserver report source documents
06-Jul-06	0.9	Rakiec, Michelle	Quality Control	Quality controlled PCI report
06-Jul-06	1.4	Rakiec, Michelle	Quality Control	Quality controlled Vizserver report and exhibits
06-Jul-06	2.1	Rakiec, Michelle	Quality Control	Quality controlled compilers report and exhibits
06-Jul-06	0.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Organization of FPD technology binder in manner consistent with other QC binders to allow ease of use.
06-Jul-06	1.4	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Update of FPD QC to account for changes implemented in model.
06-Jul-06	2.0	Ringgenberg, Matt	Model Development	Further development of FPD model to make changes necessary for accurate analysis based on items found during quality control process.
06-Jul-06	0.5	Robak, Michael	Research	Docket research for E. Phillips (CRA) in support of the valuation of the PCI technology.
06-Jul-06	0.2	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding valuation assumptions and support for the system design technology.
06-Jul-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding valuation assumptions and support for the operating system technology.
06-Jul-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Discussion with J. Snell, S. Chandrasekhara (CRA) regarding valuation assumptions and support for the storage technology.
06-Jul-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Quality Control	Resolution of valuation assumptions regarding license-litigate valuation models.
06-Jul-06	0.9	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with K. Lennox, M. Tate and B. Frizzell (CRA) to discuss necessary quality control procedures to capture desired information and ensure consistency of analysis and status of project.
06-Jul-06	2.3	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of recently QC'd sections of report to ensure accuracy
06-Jul-06	1.0	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Mechanisms report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
06-Jul-06	1.1	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Thermal Management report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
06-Jul-06	1.5	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Mechanisms exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
06-Jul-06	2.6	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Thermal Management exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
07-Jul-06	0.2	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Made PDF versions of Vizserver model and report.
07-Jul-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Updated changes to Vizserver model and report.
07-Jul-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Gathered the final and corrected sources for the Multiple processor report and model.
07-Jul-06	1.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd FPD model exhibits 11-17.
07-Jul-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Re-tick and tied all of the relevant pages that were changed in the QC process
07-Jul-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Corrected the models for changes made in the QC process
07-Jul-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Made final changes to the Scalability report and models, and PDF the final version.
07-Jul-06	3.1	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Completed quality control of Exhibit A - Schedules 1-6 of FPD valuation model.
07-Jul-06	3.6	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Completed quality control of Exhibit A - Schedules 10 and 11 of FPD valuation model.
07-Jul-06	3.8	Chandrasekhara, Sheela	Quality Control	Completed quality control of Exhibit A - Schedules 7, 8 and 9 of FPD valuation model.
07-Jul-06	0.5	Daniel, Brian	Other	Time reporting schedule
07-Jul-06	1.7	Frecka, Ted	Quality Control	QC of schedules from appendix B - Portfolio analytics
07-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of PCI technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
07-Jul-06	2.5	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of FPD model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
07-Jul-06	2.6	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Further review of quality control of FPD model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
07-Jul-06	3.1	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of compilers technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
07-Jul-06	1.2	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Format and finalize Appendix C
07-Jul-06	1.3	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC Appendix B consisting of patent analytics of entire portfolio and summary schedules to ensure accuracy.
07-Jul-06	3.0	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Further QC of Appendix B consisting of patent analytics of entire portfolio and summary schedules to ensure accuracy.
07-Jul-06	3.4	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC Main Report to ensure accuracy.
07-Jul-06	1.4	Koycheva, Denica	Quality Control	Further quality control of graphics technology report exhibits to ensure accuracy of analysis.
07-Jul-06	1.8	Koycheva, Denica	Quality Control	Quality control of graphics technology report exhibits to ensure accuracy of analysis.
07-Jul-06	2.5	Lennox, Katie	Quality Control	Review and resolution of quality control issues for the Scalability analysis.
07-Jul-06	3.1	Lennox, Katie	Report Writing	Revisions to the Vizserver appendix to incorporate changes from B. Oliver (CRA) and prepared appendix to be finalized.
07-Jul-06	1.5	Leonhard, Nate	Quality Control	Quality control of the graphics technology model to ensure accuracy.
07-Jul-06	3.3	Manning, Joe	Quality Control	Quality control of Windancer valuation model and report.
07-Jul-06	2.1	Phillips, Eric	Quality Control	Quality control of draft expert report and analyses for valuation of compiler technology bucket.
07-Jul-06	2.1	Phillips, Eric	Quality Control	Quality control of draft expert report and analyses for valuation of PCI technology bucket.
07-Jul-06	1.9	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Further QC of PCI summary schedules
07-Jul-06	2.2	Porter, Steve	Quality Control	Further QC of Compilers summary schedules
07-Jul-06	2.7	Rakiec, Michelle	Other	Entered time according to case rules and coordinated meeting times with coworkers
07-Jul-06	2.6	Ringgenberg, Matt	Quality Control	Manage QC process for the FPD model based upon questions and changes from senior management.
07-Jul-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of QC binder for the system design technology.
07-Jul-06	1.3	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of QC binder for the operating system technology.
07-Jul-06	1.4	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of QC binder for the storage technology.
07-Jul-06	0.7	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Mechanisms report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
07-Jul-06	0.8	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Thermal Management report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.



**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
07-Jul-06	2.0	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Mechanisms exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
08-Jul-06	1.4	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of thermal management model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
08-Jul-06	1.8	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of mechanisms technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
09-Jul-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Finished the QC of the Multiple processor models
09-Jul-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	corrected Multiple Processor model and re tick and tied relevant pages
09-Jul-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd revised FPD model exhibits 10-12
09-Jul-06	1.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Corrected FPD model exhibits 13-17 and re tick and tied relevant pages
09-Jul-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Corrected FPD models and re tick and tied changes
09-Jul-06	1.5	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd revised FPD model exhibit 9
09-Jul-06	1.6	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd revised FPD model exhibits 1-8
09-Jul-06	1.9	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd GPU model exhibits 10-17
09-Jul-06	2.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd GPU model exhibits 1-9
09-Jul-06	2.3	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of graphics technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
09-Jul-06	2.4	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of revised quality control of FPD model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
10-Jul-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Corrected the report for changes made in the QC process and re-tick and tied relevant pages.
10-Jul-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Corrected the report for changes made in the QC process and re-tick and tied relevant pages.
10-Jul-06	1.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	PDF'd the final versions of the models
10-Jul-06	1.3	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Made final changes to the graphics models and report and re-tick and tied them.
10-Jul-06	2.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	QC'd the graphics report and made relevant changes.
10-Jul-06	2.9	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Made universal changes to all reports and models, based on comments provided by the attorneys.
10-Jul-06	2.0	Frecka, Ted	Quality Control	QC of schedules from appendix F - Multiple processor technology
10-Jul-06	0.6	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of changes to graphics technology report exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
10-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of quality control of multiple processor technology model exhibits to ensure consistency and accuracy of analysis.
10-Jul-06	2.6	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of universal changes to all report exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
10-Jul-06	2.9	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Further review of universal changes to all reports to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
10-Jul-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Research	Research into VC funding of comparable stage graphics companies.
10-Jul-06	2.0	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Review of research materials for the windancer technology.
10-Jul-06	2.8	Hannah, Brad	Research	Research into VC comparables for the windancer technology.
10-Jul-06	3.1	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Review of quality control binder for the windancer valuation.
10-Jul-06	2.3	Rakiec, Michelle	Quality Control	Quality controlled FPD report and numbered source document pages
10-Jul-06	1.4	Resch, Jessica	Quality Control	QC of multiple processor technology model exhibits 3-5
10-Jul-06	1.9	Resch, Jessica	Quality Control	QC of multiple processor technology model exhibits 6-10
10-Jul-06	2.2	Resch, Jessica	Quality Control	QC of multiple processor technology model exhibits 11-15
10-Jul-06	1.4	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Thermal Management report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
10-Jul-06	1.7	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Mechanisms exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
11-Jul-06	1.6	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Double checked to ensure the accuracy of the PDF versions on the reports and models.
11-Jul-06	1.7	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Re-QC'd both the model and the report.
11-Jul-06	2.3	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Made several changes to the vizserver model and the report, based on updated information.
11-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Review of changes to vizserver technology report exhibits to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
11-Jul-06	2.8	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Reconciliation of detailed time entries to ensure consistent descriptions and participants on internal meetings.
11-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding qc status and Windancer analysis
11-Jul-06	2.3	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Drafted new sections related to two offers received for all or portions of SGI's patent portfolio.
11-Jul-06	1.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Research into VC comparables for the windancer technology.
11-Jul-06	3.2	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Update tables in main report based on QC results and other revisions.
11-Jul-06	1.7	Manning, Joe	Review of Materials	Review of SGI financial model for windancer
11-Jul-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA) regarding qc status and Windancer analysis
11-Jul-06	0.4	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of recently drafted sections of valuation report.
12-Jul-06	1.8	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further reconciliation of detailed time entries to ensure consistent descriptions and participants on conference calls.
12-Jul-06	3.8	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further reconciliation of detailed time entries to ensure consistent descriptions and participants on internal meetings.
12-Jul-06	2.0	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Final revisions to report, Vizserver Appendix and Offers Received sections of report.
12-Jul-06	1.4	Hannah, Brad	Other	SGI time entry for billing requirements in detail.
12-Jul-06	3.3	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Further updates to the main report and exhibits based upon QC changes.
12-Jul-06	1.7	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review of final revisions to report, Vizserver Appendix and Offers Received sections of report, further modifications to report following review.
12-Jul-06	0.5	Vold, Matt	Quality Control	Perform quality control analysis of Thermal Management report to ensure accuracy and consistency of analysis.
13-Jul-06	2.5	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further review of all detailed time entries to ensure consistency in meeting entries and that times match up in order to adhere to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
13-Jul-06	3.9	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Review of all detailed time entries to ensure consistency in meeting entries and that times match up in order to adhere to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
13-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), P Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding status of Taurus retention for Digital Media technical review and instructions for submitting final report.
13-Jul-06	2.0	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Final review, formatting and organization of all the QC binders.
13-Jul-06	1.6	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research related to LGI existing lawsuits related to its PCI patents.
13-Jul-06	1.2	Tate, Mike	Time Entry	Review of May and June bill to ensure adherence to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
14-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Entry of personal time records for detailed billing purposes.
14-Jul-06	2.8	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC of the main report
14-Jul-06	2.9	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	QC of the windancer report
14-Jul-06	0.3	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research related to LGI existing lawsuits related to its PCI patents.
14-Jul-06	0.9	Tate, Mike	Time Entry	Further review of May and June bill to ensure adherence to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
17-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further review of all detailed time entries to ensure consistency in meeting entries and that times match up in order to adhere to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
17-Jul-06	2.5	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Entry of detailed expenses for the final bill.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
17-Jul-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Time Entry	Further review of all detailed time entries to ensure consistency in meeting entries and that times match up in order to adhere to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
17-Jul-06	2.0	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of research materials related to the LGE objection
18-Jul-06	1.7	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further entry of detailed expenses for the final bill.
18-Jul-06	3.6	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Final review of all detailed time entries to ensure consistency in meeting entries and preparation of summary schedules for the final bill to adhere to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
18-Jul-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Other	Discussions and correspondence with B. Goldman (CRA), S Bechtel (Taeus) and separate discussions with P Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding payment for and transmittal of TaeusWorks report on Digital Media patents.
18-Jul-06	0.7	Tate, Mike	Other	Arrangement of payment to TAEUS in order to gain access to the TAEUS report.
18-Jul-06	3.4	Tate, Mike	Time Entry	Final review of all detailed time entries to ensure consistency in meeting entries and preparation of summary schedules for the final bill to adhere to bankruptcy court guidelines for time records.
19-Jul-06	2.0	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Updated and Re-QC'd Multiple processor valuation models and Report
19-Jul-06	0.2	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss analysis plan for Digital Media patent based on Taeus report.
19-Jul-06	0.3	Frizzell, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA); and S Bechtel and B Bauer (Taeus) regarding work done by Taeus in forming their opinion of the '336 patent.
19-Jul-06	2.4	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of the TAEUS report covering investigation into 2 patents in support of the valuation of the digital media bucket.
19-Jul-06	3.0	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of research in companies identified in the TAEUS report in support of the valuation of the digital media bucket.
19-Jul-06	3.8	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Research into companies identified in the TAEUS report in support of the valuation of the digital media bucket.
19-Jul-06	0.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA) regarding Taeus status and delivery of final valuation report.
19-Jul-06	0.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss analysis plan for Digital Media patent based on Taeus report.
19-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA); and S Bechtel and B Bauer (Taeus) regarding work done by Taeus in forming their opinion of the '336 patent.
19-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Research	Performed research into products that may be using the '336 patent based on information contained in Taeus report.
19-Jul-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), P Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding Taeus report and '336 patent.
19-Jul-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Review of TaeusWorks report on Digital Media patents.
19-Jul-06	3.7	Hannah, Brad	Other	Printing, formatting, and binding main report and appendices for production
19-Jul-06	0.2	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA) regarding Taeus status and delivery of final valuation report.
19-Jul-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of TaeusWorks report on Digital Media patents.
19-Jul-06	1.4	Porter, Steve	Research	Research into the multimedia asset management market and companies in the market.
19-Jul-06	3.2	Porter, Steve	Research	Research into the SCM market and competitors in that space.
19-Jul-06	0.1	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of TaeusWorks report on Digital Media patents.
19-Jul-06	0.2	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss analysis plan for Digital Media patent based on Taeus report.
19-Jul-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA); and S Bechtel and B Bauer (Taeus) regarding work done by Taeus in forming their opinion of the '336 patent.
19-Jul-06	0.8	Snell, Jeff	Research	Performed independent research on potentially infringing products.
19-Jul-06	0.9	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of license/litigation valuation templates.
20-Jul-06	0.6	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Update scalability model and report based upon QC results.
20-Jul-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Re-QC'd relevant changes in the Graphics report and models
20-Jul-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Re-QC'd Scalability model and Report
20-Jul-06	0.9	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Gathered information relating to the LCD and Flat Panel display market. The research included such information as market size, by both volume and revenue, market shares of individual firms, penetration rates of technologies, current events within the market, etc.
20-Jul-06	3.1	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Tab out final binders for shipment
20-Jul-06	0.3	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss analysis approach for Digital Media valuation.
20-Jul-06	0.5	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, B Oliver (CRA) regarding status of Digital Media valuation.
20-Jul-06	1.1	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model for the digital media technology.
20-Jul-06	1.7	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Development of background section of digital media valuation report.
20-Jul-06	2.0	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Development of technology section of digital media valuation report.
20-Jul-06	2.4	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials related to SCM and multimedia asset management market.
20-Jul-06	2.6	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Research into size of multimedia asset management market and the related software configuration market.
20-Jul-06	2.7	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Research into SCM market growth rates market share.
20-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss analysis approach for Digital Media valuation.
20-Jul-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell (CRA) regarding modeling and research required for Digital Media package valuation.
20-Jul-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, B Oliver (CRA) regarding status of Digital Media valuation.
20-Jul-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference calls with B. Goldman (CRA), P Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis) regarding Digital Media package valuation status, '336 patent and timing for delivery of final report.
20-Jul-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Quality Control	QC oversight for PCI Express and Graphics Appendices (models)
20-Jul-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Reviewed '336 patent specifications and claims, IBM and Microsoft agreements for rights to '336 patent, and verification of no foreign patent rights associated with '336 patent.
20-Jul-06	2.5	Hannah, Brad	Other	Creation of final work product for production
20-Jul-06	2.7	Hannah, Brad	Other	Printing, formatting, and binding main report and appendices for production.
20-Jul-06	3.2	Hannah, Brad	Report Writing	Updates to the main report for QC related changes.
20-Jul-06	3.4	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Re-QC of main report for minor changes
20-Jul-06	0.7	Manning, Joe	Quality Control	Quality control of PCI valuation model
20-Jul-06	0.8	Manning, Joe	Quality Control	Quality control of Graphics valuation model
20-Jul-06	1.0	Manning, Joe	Research	Research on comparable company WACCs
20-Jul-06	1.0	Manning, Joe	Research	Research on comparable company operating margins
20-Jul-06	1.0	Manning, Joe	Research	Review of market research information in order to gather data for the Digital Media valuation
20-Jul-06	3.5	Manning, Joe	Model Development	Construction of digital media valuation model

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
20-Jul-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Goldman, B. Frizzell, B Oliver (CRA) regarding status of Digital Media valuation.
20-Jul-06	0.6	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of digital media research materials in support of valuation work.
20-Jul-06	2.7	Porter, Steve	Research	Research Serena and Merant in the SCM market and compilation of data sources
20-Jul-06	0.3	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss analysis approach for Digital Media valuation.
20-Jul-06	0.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell (CRA) regarding modeling and research required for Digital Media package valuation.
20-Jul-06	1.3	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of research related to inputs to the valuation model.
20-Jul-06	2.7	Snell, Jeff	Research	Performed independent research on potentially infringing products.
20-Jul-06	3.4	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Determination of the appropriate valuation construct and evaluation of inputs.
20-Jul-06	1.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of research materials related to the digital media portfolio in order to ensure consistency with the valuation model.
20-Jul-06	2.2	Tate, Mike	Model Development	Review of valuation model for the digital media portfolio to verify assumptions are valid.
21-Jul-06	1.5	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, B. Frizzell, J. Manning (CRA) to review the digital media research results, and valuation model.
21-Jul-06	1.6	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Further research into financials and market trends for potentially infringing companies in the digital media sector.
21-Jul-06	1.7	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Further development of background section of digital media valuation report.
21-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Further research into SCM market growth rates market share.
21-Jul-06	2.4	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Development of valuation methodology section of digital media valuation report.
21-Jul-06	3.8	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Development of TAEUS section of digital media valuation report.
21-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Final review of main report, update statement of limiting conditions and assumptions.
21-Jul-06	0.5	Goldman, Bob	Other	Team status conversations and management.
21-Jul-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Quality Control	Quality control oversight - Main Report and Appendices
21-Jul-06	1.5	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, B. Frizzell, J. Manning (CRA) to review the digital media research results, and valuation model.
21-Jul-06	3.6	Hannah, Brad	Other	Creation of final binders of the main report (6 copies) for production.
21-Jul-06	3.8	Hannah, Brad	Other	Creation of final binders of the exhibits (6 copies) for production.
21-Jul-06	2.0	Manning, Joe	Research	Review of additional research information in support of the digital media valuation model construction.
21-Jul-06	3.5	Manning, Joe	Model Development	Construction of digital media valuation model
21-Jul-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review and updates to the draft digital media valuation report.
21-Jul-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, B. Frizzell, J. Manning (CRA) to review the digital media research results, and valuation model.
21-Jul-06	3.3	Rakiec, Michelle	Quality Control	Quality controlled PCI market model
21-Jul-06	1.5	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, B. Goldman, J. Snell, B. Frizzell, J. Manning (CRA) to review the digital media research results, and valuation model.
21-Jul-06	2.4	Snell, Jeff	Research	Performed research on Bureau of Labor and Statistics for numbers of workers in the United States that might have reason to use potentially infringing products.
21-Jul-06	3.9	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of digital media valuation model.
21-Jul-06	3.9	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of digital media research material, report, and valuation model.
22-Jul-06	1.1	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of research materials in support of the development of the valuation report.
22-Jul-06	3.1	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Further writing of digital media valuation report.
23-Jul-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review and update of digital media valuation model.
23-Jul-06	2.8	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of digital media report draft.
23-Jul-06	3.3	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Revised portions of the valuation model.
24-Jul-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Built model for the potential royalties owed by LG for the Handsets in the mobile phone market
24-Jul-06	1.1	Becker, Josh	Research	Research on LG Market Share in the US LCD TV Market
24-Jul-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Built model for the potential royalties owed by LG for their LCD Monitors
24-Jul-06	1.4	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Built Model for the potential royalties owed on their LCD TVs based on their US revenues and market share.
24-Jul-06	1.7	Becker, Josh	Research	Research on LG Market Share in the US LCD monitor Market
24-Jul-06	0.7	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss Perforce sales and marketing information and approach to establishing final range of value.
24-Jul-06	1.1	Frizzell, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss additional research into market information, model status and parameters and open items for valuation and Appendix draft.
24-Jul-06	2.9	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of research materials in support of the development of the valuation report.
24-Jul-06	3.6	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Research targeted at identifying the amount of Perforce sales and growth rate.
24-Jul-06	3.8	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Further writing of digital media valuation report.
24-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Review of Materials	Obtained and reviewed LGE objection
24-Jul-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss Perforce sales and marketing information and approach to establishing final range of value.
24-Jul-06	0.9	Goldman, Bob	Other	Staffing for review of LGE products to determine LGE potential exposure
24-Jul-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss additional research into market information, model status and parameters and open items for valuation and Appendix draft.
24-Jul-06	1.1	Goldman, Bob	Research	Research into LitAlert, Pacer, Correspondence from FPD re: LGE tear downs
24-Jul-06	1.7	Goldman, Bob	Model Development	LGE Market share research for models (Cell, LCD TV, Monitors)
24-Jul-06	2.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	LG flat panel market research.
24-Jul-06	3.3	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Review of LG flat panel market research.
24-Jul-06	3.7	Hannah, Brad	Research	Research into comparable license agreements in support of the digital media valuation.
24-Jul-06	0.5	Leonhard, Nate	Research	Research into comparable license agreements in support of the LGE objection investigation.
24-Jul-06	1.2	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review of digital media valuation report and model, updates made to the digital media valuation report.
24-Jul-06	1.1	Phillips, Eric	Research	Research on LGI products that relate to PCI technologies and if such products are sold in the U.S.
24-Jul-06	0.7	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss Perforce sales and marketing information and approach to establishing final range of value.
24-Jul-06	1.1	Snell, Jeff	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, J Snell and B Frizzell (CRA) to discuss additional research into market information, model status and parameters and open items for valuation and Appendix draft.
24-Jul-06	1.3	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of digital media valuation model.
24-Jul-06	1.5	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of digital media valuation model.
24-Jul-06	1.6	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of digital media valuation report.
24-Jul-06	2.3	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Revised portions of the valuation model.
24-Jul-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of the updated digital media research material, report, and valuation model.
25-Jul-06	0.3	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated LG valuation models
25-Jul-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Research	Contacted Display search and reviewed information sent
25-Jul-06	0.8	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated LG Models and created summary of the three analyses

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
25-Jul-06	2.6	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Further writing of digital media valuation report.
25-Jul-06	3.5	Frizzell, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of the valuation model structure and results.
25-Jul-06	3.7	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Further writing of digital media valuation report.
25-Jul-06	0.1	Goldman, Bob	Research	Review DisplaySearch report contents for potential acquisition
25-Jul-06	0.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Internal Meeting with B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA) re: status on model and report
25-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Research	Review of available data to quantify LGE share of handsets
25-Jul-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference Call with B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA), G Holtzer & S Youngman (Weil) re: prelim findings and go-forward plan
25-Jul-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Review of Appendix Q (Digital Media) valuation report draft
25-Jul-06	1.9	Hannah, Brad	Research	LG citation analysis as part of research for the LGE objection.
25-Jul-06	2.4	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Gathered all sources and put together binders for the QC of the digital media report and exhibits.
25-Jul-06	3.5	Hannah, Brad	Model Development	Updates to the main report for digital media related changes.
25-Jul-06	0.6	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference Call with B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA), G Holtzer & S Youngman (Weil) re: prelim findings and go-forward plan
25-Jul-06	0.7	Oliver, Brian	Report Writing	Review of Appendix Q (Digital Media) valuation report draft
25-Jul-06	1.9	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of the valuation report.
25-Jul-06	3.5	Snell, Jeff	Review of Materials	Review of valuation model.
26-Jul-06	0.4	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated LG valuation models
26-Jul-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Model Development	Updated SGI Models re FPD valuation
26-Jul-06	1.9	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Re-PDFd and shipped SGI reports and exhibits
26-Jul-06	2.0	Dolloff, Jessica	Quality Control	Quality control review of the digital media report for grammar and references.
26-Jul-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Preparation of report and model for QC.
26-Jul-06	2.9	Frizzell, Brian	Report Writing	Final review and updates to the appendix Q of the report.
26-Jul-06	3.3	Frizzell, Brian	Research	Further research into the SCM and multimedia asset management market to ensure no material information was missed.
26-Jul-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference Call with S Youngman (Weil), A Samett (Bear Sterns), D. Crisman & P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA) re: Final Results including Dig Media and delivery schedule
26-Jul-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, E Phillips (CRA) re: data availability for quantifying PCI market
26-Jul-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Report Writing	Final report changes for PDFing
26-Jul-06	2.7	Goldman, Bob	Quality Control	Updating all license/litigate models' licensing outcomes
26-Jul-06	2.4	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Update and QC of main report for digital media and other exhibit changes.
26-Jul-06	2.5	Leonhard, Nate	Model Development	Review of quality control results and updates to the report and exhibits based on QC results.
26-Jul-06	3.9	Leonhard, Nate	Quality Control	Quality control of pieces of the Digital Media exhibits and report.
26-Jul-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference Call with S Youngman (Weil), A Samett (Bear Sterns), D. Crisman & P. Hirschhorn (Morgan Lewis), B. Goldman, B Oliver (CRA) re: Final Results including Dig Media and delivery schedule
26-Jul-06	0.8	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials related to the LGE objection.
26-Jul-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, E Phillips (CRA) re: data availability for quantifying PCI market
26-Jul-06	0.2	Rakiec, Michelle	Other	Reviewed previous time reports and created time summary in accordance with bankruptcy standards
26-Jul-06	0.6	Snell, Jeff	Quality Control	Assistance in the quality control process.
26-Jul-06	2.6	Snell, Jeff	Model Development	Revised portions of the valuation model.
26-Jul-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Review of the final main report and supporting exhibits.
27-Jul-06	1.2	Bailey, Kevin	Quality Control	Quality control review of the Digital media report.
27-Jul-06	3.2	Bailey, Kevin	Quality Control	Quality control review of the Digital media model (first half).
27-Jul-06	1.4	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Update of final report language across all appendices based upon comments learned during QC process.
27-Jul-06	2.2	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of the digital media report QC marks and updates to report based on the QC results.
27-Jul-06	3.2	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Review of the digital media model QC marks and updates to the model based on the QC results.
27-Jul-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Quality Control	Final QC review of the main valuation report.
27-Jul-06	0.5	Robak, Michael	Research	CAFC research related to the LGE objection.
28-Jul-06	3.5	Frizzell, Brian	Quality Control	Final review of the report and model to ensure accuracy and consistency.
01-Aug-06	0.7	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Quality control of LGE objection models.
01-Aug-06	2.8	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Consolidation of all detailed time entries to prepare July bill.
02-Aug-06	2.4	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further consolidation of detailed time entries to prepare July bill.
02-Aug-06	2.1	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Verification of meeting times and participant descriptions to ensure consistency in support of July bill preparation.
03-Aug-06	1.7	Frizzell, Brian	Time Entry	Further verification of meeting times and participant descriptions to ensure consistency in support of July bill preparation.
03-Aug-06	0.8	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Gathering of case materials from various consultants and organizing materials in a logical manner to support analyses.
03-Aug-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Time Entry	Review of august bill, including detailed time entry descriptions.
04-Aug-06	1.9	Hannah, Brad	Review of Materials	Further gathering of case materials from various consultants and organizing materials in a logical manner to support analyses.
07-Aug-06	0.7	Frizzell, Brian	Fee Application	Preparation of work description section of the interim fee application.
07-Aug-06	0.2	Oliver, Brian	Review of Materials	Review of materials in preparation for conference call with counsel.
07-Aug-06	1.1	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Further review of final report and supporting materials to ensure proper organization.
08-Aug-06	0.8	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), G. Holtzer, S. Youngman (Weil), B. Weinart (SGI) to discuss LGE's potential exposure to te SGI patent portfolio.
08-Aug-06	0.8	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), G. Holtzer, S. Youngman (Weil), B. Weinart (SGI) to discuss LGE's potential exposure to te SGI patent portfolio.
10-Aug-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Oliver (CRA), G. Holtzer, S. Youngman (Weil) and Paul Hastings re: exposure from LGE's claims.
10-Aug-06	3.3	Tate, Mike	Fee Application	Drafting of initial fee application for the june through august time period.
11-Aug-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: additional work required to quantify exposure to LGE's claims.
11-Aug-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussion with B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: additional work required to quantify exposure to LGE's claims.
16-Aug-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman (CRA), J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) to discuss the market size used in the valuation model.
23-Aug-06	0.9	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Preparation for and conference call with counsel re: status of work on LGE claims quantification.
23-Aug-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Discussions with counsel re: LGE objection and claims.
23-Aug-06	1.1	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Review of PCI report and analyses in preparation for discussion with counsel.
24-Aug-06	1.9	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Assistance to counsel regarding the LGE document requests.
24-Aug-06	0.5	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing LGE claims to understand analyses and set appropriate deliverable goals.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed time records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

Date	Hours	Professional	Task	Description
24-Aug-06	0.8	Phillips, Eric	Research	Public domain research re: LGE licensing activity and patent acquisition
24-Aug-06	0.5	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing LGE claims to understand analyses and set appropriate deliverable goals.
25-Aug-06	1.8	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Assistance to counsel regarding the LGE document requests.
25-Aug-06	0.3	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Further assistance to counsel regarding the LGE document requests.
28-Aug-06	0.5	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Conference call with E. Phillips (CRA), R. Lemieux re: LGE documents and claims.
29-Aug-06	0.7	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) re: status of analysis and deliverables for LGE claim assistance.
29-Aug-06	0.1	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA), B. Weinart (SGI) to discuss unit volume data in support of LGE claim analysis.
29-Aug-06	0.7	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) re: status of analysis and deliverables for LGE claim assistance.
29-Aug-06	0.3	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing analyses re: LGE claims.
29-Aug-06	0.1	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA), B. Weinart (SGI) to discuss unit volume data in support of LGE claim analysis.
29-Aug-06	0.2	Tate, Mike	Review of Materials	Further review of materials re: LGE claims to understand analyses and provide direction on the analyses.
29-Aug-06	0.3	Tate, Mike	Internal Meeting	Meeting with M. Tate and E. Phillips (CRA) discussing analyses re: LGE claims.
30-Aug-06	0.6	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) re: status of analysis and deliverables for LGE claim assistance.
30-Aug-06	0.4	Phillips, Eric	Review of Materials	Preparation for conference call re: LGE objection.
30-Aug-06	0.4	Phillips, Eric	Conference Call	Conference call with E. Phillips (CRA), R. Lemieux re: LGE documents and claims and deliverables
30-Aug-06	0.6	Phillips, Eric	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Goldman, E. Phillips (CRA) re: status of analysis and deliverables for LGE claim assistance.
05-Sep-06	0.1	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: schedule for testimony prep and placing call to counsel.
05-Sep-06	0.1	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Meeting with B. Oliver, B. Goldman (CRA) re: schedule for testimony prep and placing call to counsel.
06-Sep-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), G Holtzer, S. Youngman, M. Chaisanguanthum (Weil), and P. Hirschhorn, J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) re: requirements for confirmation hearing.
06-Sep-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), G Holtzer, S. Youngman, M. Chaisanguanthum (Weil), and P. Hirschhorn, J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) re: requirements for confirmation hearing.
07-Sep-06	1.0	Tate, Mike	Fee Application	Development and review of fee application discussion.
08-Sep-06	1.7	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Updated relevant QC reports in preparation for bankruptcy hearing testimony.
08-Sep-06	1.2	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Gathered and organized relevant reports and supporting schedules for QC.
08-Sep-06	2.8	Becker, Josh	Quality Control	Performed quality control on reports and supporting schedules.
08-Sep-06	1.5	Borden, Eric	Quality Control	Performed quality control on reports and supporting schedules
08-Sep-06	3.1	Hannah, Brad	Quality Control	Help with quality control of certain appendices of report.
08-Sep-06	2.0	Pendery, Danny	Quality Control	Performed quality control on reports and supporting schedules.
11-Sep-06	3.4	Hannah, Brad	Bankruptcy Hearing	Collecting and organizing all team materials in preparation for bankruptcy testimony.
12-Sep-06	0.3	Goldman, Bob	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), S. Youngman, M. Chaisanguanthum (Weil), and P. Hirschhorn, J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) re: discussion of affidavit.
12-Sep-06	0.3	Oliver, Brian	Conference Call	Conference call with B. Goldman, B. Oliver (CRA), S. Youngman, M. Chaisanguanthum (Weil), and P. Hirschhorn, J. Bollinger (Morgan Lewis) re: discussion of affidavit.
12-Sep-06	0.5	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for call with counsel re: bankruptcy hearing affidavit.
13-Sep-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
14-Sep-06	1.0	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
15-Sep-06	0.5	Frizzell, Brian	Fee Application	Preparation of detailed time entry supporting detail for the fee application.
15-Sep-06	1.5	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
17-Sep-06	2.5	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
18-Sep-06	1.2	Hannah, Brad	Bankruptcy Hearing	PACER research for documents publicly filed in SGI matter in preparation for bankruptcy hearing testimony.
18-Sep-06	3.0	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
18-Sep-06	3.0	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
19-Sep-06	0.2	Goldman, Bob	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Oliver, B Goldman (CRA) re: preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
19-Sep-06	2.0	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for and attendance at bankruptcy hearing.
19-Sep-06	2.8	Oliver, Brian	Bankruptcy Hearing	Preparation for and attendance at bankruptcy hearing.
19-Sep-06	0.2	Oliver, Brian	Internal Meeting	Discussions with B. Oliver, B Goldman (CRA) re: preparation for testimony at bankruptcy hearing.
<b>Total</b>	<b>2,425.5</b>			

## Exhibit E

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed expense records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Type</u>	<u>Description</u>
18-May-06	\$6.13	Meals	Dinner for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late.
19-May-06	\$7.94	Meals	Dinner for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late.
23-May-06	\$7.94	Meals	Dinner for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late.
09-Jun-06	\$7.94	Meals	Dinner for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late.
12-Jun-06	\$5.93	Meals	Dinner for B. Frizzell (CRA) due to working late.
14-Jun-06	\$4.91	Meals	Dinner for B. Goldman (CRA) due to working late.
14-Jun-06	\$8.73	Meals	Dinner for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late.
15-Jun-06	\$5.29	Meals	Dinner for B. Goldman (CRA) due to working late.
16-Jun-06	\$6.66	Meals	Dinner for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late.
19-Jun-06	\$70.34	Meals	Dinner for B. Daniel and other project consultants (CRA) due to working late.
21-Jun-06	\$8.73	Meals	Dinner for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late.
21-Jun-06	\$7.12	Meals	Dinner for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late.
20-Jun-06	\$5.92	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
21-Jun-06	\$7.16	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
28-Jun-06	\$6.90	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
29-Jun-06	\$8.90	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
07-Jun-06	\$6.90	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
14-Jun-06	\$25.63	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
16-Jun-06	\$7.82	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
18-Jun-06	\$5.79	Meals	Dinner for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
12-Jun-06	\$7.49	Meals	Dinner for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late.
18-Jun-06	\$8.23	Meals	Dinner for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late.
16-Jun-06	\$9.32	Meals	Dinner for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late.
17-Jun-06	\$16.54	Meals	Dinner for J. Becker, B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
13-Jun-06	\$9.98	Meals	Dinner for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late.
19-Jun-06	\$9.84	Meals	Dinner for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late.
24-May-06	\$2,528.75	Research	File History Product - Download of PDF from Derwent.
08-Jun-06	\$600.00	Research	Data Extract - Derwent Information
08-Jun-06	\$600.00	Research	Data Extract - Derwent Information
08-Jun-06	\$105.00	Research	Data Extract - Derwent Information
23-Jun-06	\$300.00	Research	Database research from Royalty Source PO1050
26-Jun-06	\$250.00	Research	Database research from Royalty Source
19-May-06	\$151.23	Telephone	Intercall usage fee for hosting conference calls.
11-Jun-06	\$46.81	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
12-Jun-06	\$82.89	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
13-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
13-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
13-Jun-06	\$53.15	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
15-Jun-06	\$51.69	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
16-Jun-06	\$175.54	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
16-Jun-06	\$16.58	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
16-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
16-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
16-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
18-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
18-Jun-06	\$172.61	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
19-Jun-06	\$222.83	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
19-Jun-06	\$75.58	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
19-Jun-06	\$129.70	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
20-Jun-06	\$15.90	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
21-Jun-06	\$87.28	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
22-Jun-06	\$56.56	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
26-Jun-06	\$127.26	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
28-Jun-06	\$46.32	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
28-Jun-06	\$45.83	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
28-Jun-06	\$38.03	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
28-Jun-06	\$55.59	Telephone	Intercall conference call charges.
12-May-06	\$35.00	Travel	Reservation fee for Colpitts travel to book travel for project for B. Oliver (CRA).
19-May-06	\$82.60	Travel	Car rental for B. Oliver (CRA) due to working late at office.
23-May-06	\$14.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late at the office.
07-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
09-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late at the office.
09-Jun-06	\$40.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Goldman (CRA) due to working late at the office.
12-Jun-06	\$56.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Frizzell (CRA) due to working late at the office.
12-Jun-06	\$18.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
12-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late at the office.

**Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.**  
**Detailed expense records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006**

<u>Date</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Type</u>	<u>Description</u>
13-Jun-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late at the office.
14-Jun-06	\$26.00	Travel	Parking for B. Oliver (CRA) due to driving into the office to meet with CRA consultants.
14-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late at the office.
14-Jun-06	\$9.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working late at the office.
14-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
14-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late at the office.
14-Jun-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late at the office.
15-Jun-06	\$19.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late at the office.
15-Jun-06	\$17.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
15-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late at the office.
16-Jun-06	\$20.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late at the office.
16-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
16-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late at the office.
16-Jun-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late at the office.
17-Jun-06	\$18.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working at the office on a weekend.
17-Jun-06	\$17.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
18-Jun-06	\$18.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working at the office on a weekend.
18-Jun-06	\$17.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
18-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late at the office.
18-Jun-06	\$24.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working on the weekend.
19-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late at the office.
19-Jun-06	\$19.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late at the office.
19-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
19-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Vold (CRA) due to working late at the office.
19-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late at the office.
20-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
20-Jun-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late at the office.
21-Jun-06	\$19.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Daniel (CRA) due to working late at the office.
21-Jun-06	\$14.00	Travel	Taxi for M. Ringgenberg (CRA) due to working late at the office.
21-Jun-06	\$9.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working late at the office.
21-Jun-06	\$18.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
21-Jun-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late at the office.
22-Jun-06	\$9.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working late at the office.
24-Jun-06	\$9.25	Travel	Parking for J. Snell (CRA) due to working on the weekend.
26-Jun-06	\$26.00	Travel	Parking for B. Oliver (CRA) due to driving into the office to meet with CRA consultants.
26-Jun-06	\$40.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Goldman (CRA) due to working late at the office.
26-Jun-06	\$9.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working late at the office.
27-Jun-06	\$31.00	Travel	Parking for B. Oliver (CRA) due to driving into the office to meet with CRA consultants.
27-Jun-06	\$18.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
28-Jun-06	\$20.00	Travel	Parking for B. Oliver (CRA) due to driving into the office to meet with CRA consultants.
28-Jun-06	\$9.00	Travel	Taxi for K. Lennox (CRA) due to working late at the office.
28-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
29-Jun-06	\$15.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late at the office.
06-Jul-06	\$6.05	Meals	Dinner for J. Becker (CRA) due to working late.
07-Jul-06	\$14.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Hannah (CRA) due to working late.
09-Jul-06	\$9.32	Meals	Lunch for J. Becker (CRA) due to working on the weekend.
09-Jul-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) from home to CRA due to working on the weekend.
09-Jul-06	\$12.00	Travel	Taxi for J. Becker (CRA) from CRA to home due to working on the weekend.
18-Jul-06	\$5,100.00	Research	Payment to TAEUS to obtain access to the digital media report in support of the valuation.
19-Jul-06	\$56.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Frizzell from CRA to Hinsdale due to working late.
19-Jul-06	\$7.82	Meals	Dinner for B. Frizzell (CRA) at McDonalds due to working late.
20-Jul-06	\$56.00	Travel	Taxi for B. Frizzell from CRA to Hinsdale due to working late.
21-Jul-06	\$2,000.00	Research	IDC research report on the SCM market used in support of the digital media valuation.
21-Jul-06	\$250.00	Research	RoyaltySource research in support of digital media valuation.
25-Jul-06	\$21.00	Meals	Dinner for B. Frizzell (CRA) at Siam Rice due to working late.
27-Jul-06	\$921.50	Photocopies	Aloha Photocopying charge for reproduction of final report and exhibit binders for production, 5 copies.
14-Jun-06	\$34.76	Shipping	FedEx shipping charges
26-Jul-06	\$114.05	Shipping	FedEx shipping charges for June Bill
02-Aug-06	\$223.75	Shipping	FedEx shipping charges for sending valuation report
16-Aug-06	\$114.05	Shipping	FedEx shipping charges for July Bill
18-Sep-06	\$418.60	Travel	Round-trip airfare from O'Hare to LaGuardia for B. Oliver (CRA) for bankruptcy hearing testimony.
18-Sep-06	\$774.39	Travel	One night's lodging (50% of total bill) at Park Central hotel for B. Oliver
18-Sep-06	\$42.00	Travel	Cab fare from CME to O'Hare for B. Oliver.
20-Sep-06	\$42.00	Travel	Cab fare from O'Hare to CME for B. Oliver.



Intellectual Property Consulting Services on Behalf of Silicon Graphics, Inc.  
Detailed expense records for the period 05/08/2006 - 09/19/2006

<u>Date</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Type</u>	<u>Description</u>
18-Sep-06	\$30.00	Travel	Cab fare + toll + tip for B. Oliver from LaGuardia to hotel.
19-Sep-06	\$6.00	Travel	Cab fare + tip for B. Oliver for travel in NYC
20-Sep-06	\$33.00	Travel	Cab fare + tip for B. Oliver for travel to LaGuardia.
18-Sep-06	\$95.38	Meals	Dinner at Redeye Grill for B. Oliver
18-Sep-06	\$12.31	Meals	Lunch for B. Oliver at Burrito Beach
19-Sep-06	\$11.00	Travel	Cab fare + tip for B. Oliver for travel in NYC
<b>Total</b>	<u>\$17,827.44</u>		