

70	HANEY	03/10/04	B	B310	0.40	Review new claims information,
70	HANEY	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Review response to bradley objection
70	HANEY	03/11/04	B	B310	1.40	Review status report, claims objections for next omnibus objection
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.10	Correspond w/ GRS re: omnibus objections
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ SH re: objection prep
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ GRS re: 24th omnibus objection
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.40	Correspondence w/ EP re: claim objections
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ SH re: oakwood objection prep
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ SH re: status sheet, filing
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.40	Confer w/ JGM re: claim objections
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.20	Correspond w/ GRS re: claims objections
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.60	Update status report
70	HANEY	03/12/04	B	B310	0.30	Confer w/ GRS re: omnibus objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.30	Confer w/ GRS re: objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.40	Confer w/ JGM re: objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ DOH, GRS re: omnibus objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.90	Reviewed, revised order re: 24th omnibus objection
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ GRS re: claim objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	1.30	Review claims re: omnibus objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.70	Call to B. Hall re: EE omnibus objections
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.10	Correspondence re: winford claim
70	HANEY	03/15/04	B	B310	0.20	Revise, edit omnibus order re: 24th objection
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.30	Confer w/ GRS re: objections
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ jgm re: objections
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.20	Correspondence re: claims objections
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ DLC re: objections
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.40	Call to/from, to W. H. Gifford re: objections
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.10	Review status re: claim objections
70	HANEY	03/16/04	B	B310	0.20	Correspond w/ GRS re: objections
70	HANEY	03/17/04	B	B310	0.30	Prepare, revise, order and exhibits
70	HANEY	03/17/04	B	B310	0.30	Revise status report
70	HANEY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.30	Review, prepare re: winford response
70	HANEY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.10	Call to W. Gifford re: conf call status
70	HANEY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.30	Confer w/ WOL re: oakwood call
70	HANEY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ DLC re: conference call
70	HANEY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.10	Call to WOL re: conference call
70	HANEY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.10	Call from W. Gifford re: conference call
70	HANEY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.40	Call to WOL re: conference call
70	HANEY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.40	Correspondence re: winford, lee claims
70	HANEY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.40	Review file re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.10	Review correspondence from C. Ward
70	HANEY	03/22/04	B	B310	0.10	Call from/to WOL re: oakwood call
70	HANEY	03/24/04	B	B310	0.30	Confer w/ WOL re: call to WHG
70	HANEY	03/24/04	B	B310	0.30	Confer w/ LB re: status report
70	HANEY	03/24/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ GRS re: call to WHG
70	HANEY	03/25/04	B	B310	0.20	Correspondence re: oakwood call re: keys claims
70	HANEY	03/25/04	B	B310	0.10	Call to W. Gifford re: keys
70	HANEY	03/26/04	B	B310	0.10	Review file re: hill
70	HANEY	03/26/04	B	B310	0.10	Correspondence from B. Pardue re: claims objections
70	HANEY	03/30/04	B	B310	1.10	Correspondence w/ GRS, DLC, WOL re: winford, lee claims
70	HANEY	03/30/04	B	B310	0.60	Call to W.H. Gifford re: winford/lee claims; hill claim; other s. keys claims
70	HANEY	03/30/04	B	B310	0.30	Review file re: winford, lee

70	HANEY	03/30/04 B	B310	0.20	Call to B. Pardue re: hill
70	HANEY	03/30/04 B	B310	0.50	Review file, objection re: hill
70	HANEY	03/30/04 B	B310	0.30	Confer re: conference call re: winford/lee
70	HANEY	04/02/04 B	B310	0.10	Received correspondence from B Pardue re: hill, winford and lee claims
70	HANEY	04/05/04 B	B310	0.80	Confer w/ GRS re: winford/lee/hill objections
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.70	Review files re: winford, lee, hill claims
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ JGM re: winford, lee claims
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.40	Review, prepare materials re: winford, lee, hill
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ WOL re: winford/ lee
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.90	Confer w/ GRS re: winford, lee, hill
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.10	Review file re: winford/lee
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.40	Review claim, reply re: alfred hill
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ GRS re: claims objections
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.10	Review pleadings, objections re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/07/04 B	B310	0.50	Confer w/ JGM, review materials fwd to co-counsel re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/08/04 B	B310	0.40	Call w/ GRS to co-counsel in mississippi re: winford, lee claims
70	HANEY	04/09/04 B	B310	0.10	Confer w/ GRS re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/09/04 B	B310	1.30	Meet w/ WOL re: winford, lee, hill claims
70	HANEY	04/12/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ JGM re: lee, add'l objections
70	HANEY	04/12/04 B	B310	2.60	Draft objections to claims
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	1.80	Correspondence w/ RJD re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.80	Confer w/ GRS, WOL, RJD re: winford, lee, objection status
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.40	Confer w/ co-counsel re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.10	Correspondence w/ GRS re: winford, lee (G. Fair)
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.10	Return call to G. Fair re: winford, lee claims
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.10	Call from G. Fair re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ GRS re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Forward correspondence to D. Candeub re: winford, lee
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.50	Confer w/ WOL re: winford, lee objections
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	1.60	Draft reply re: winford, lee objections
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ JWH re: claims reply
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ WOL re: winford, lee claims
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.50	Call to WH Gifford re: claims objections
70	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Review materials, prep call to WH Gifford re: litigation claims
370	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Correspondence w/ GRS re: winford/lee
370	HANEY	04/13/04 B	B310	0.50	Meet w/ WOL re: winford, lee claims
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ WOL re: winford, lee, hill
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ RJD re: claims objections
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.10	Correspondence w/ BP re: claims
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.80	Correspondence w/ WOL, GRS, re: winford, lee
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.50	Confer w/ GRS, WOL re: winford, lee
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.20	Review materials re: winford, lee claims
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ GRS re: winford, lee, hill
370	HANEY	04/15/04 B	B310	0.80	Confer w/ GRS re: litigation claims; call to WH Gifford
370	HANEY	04/15/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ GRS re: litigation claims; call to BP
370	HANEY	04/15/04 B	B310	0.20	Confer w/ GRS re: claims information bradley, dougherty
370	HANEY	04/15/04 B	B310	0.30	Review, file correspondence re: claims
371	HARBOUR	03/11/04 B	B310	0.30	Call with co-counsel re : claims objections issues
371	HARBOUR	04/13/04 B	B310	0.20	Mtg with SH re claims obj matters
370	HARBOUR	03/02/04 B	B310	0.10	Research re: April Jester claim

389	BUTZ	03/02/04	B	B310	0.10	Email to BSI re: April Jester claim
389	BUTZ	03/02/04	B	B310	0.10	Email to GRS re: April Jester claim
389	BUTZ	03/02/04	B	B310	0.10	Review April Jester claim
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	Conf with GRS re: omnibus objection to claims
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Msg from lawyer re: litigation claim
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Conf with and email from GRS re: NDH claims
389	BUTZ	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Email from co-counsel re: omnibus objections
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	Emails from K Pamenter re: omnibus orders
394	KELLY	03/17/04	B	B310	0.80	Conf w/ G. Saydah re omnibus objections
394	KELLY	03/17/04	B	B310	1.40	Drafting 31st omnibus objection
394	KELLY	03/17/04	B	B310	1.70	Drafting 30th Omnibus Objection to Claims
394	KELLY	03/17/04	B	B310	0.90	Editing and filing 29th Omnibus Objection to Claims
394	KELLY	03/17/04	B	B310	0.90	Drafting 33rd objection to claims
394	KELLY	03/17/04	B	B310	0.40	Preparing NOM for 29th Omnibus Objection
394	KELLY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.80	Drafting 32nd omnibus objection
394	KELLY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.90	Editing omnibus objections
394	KELLY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.60	Preparing omnibus objections 30-33 for filing
394	KELLY	03/18/04	B	B310	0.10	Email to C. Ward re Omnibus Objections 30-33
394	KELLY	03/19/04	B	B310	0.60	Researching ability to exclude punitive damages from allowed claims
394	KELLY	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	PC w/ Regus Capital re purchase of claim
546	FUSCO	03/01/04	B	B310	0.10	Prep service of notices of submission
546	FUSCO	03/01/04	B	B310	0.30	Efile notices of submission
546	FUSCO	03/01/04	B	B310	0.40	Put together binder re 27th omn obj poc's
546	FUSCO	03/01/04	B	B310	0.40	Draft notices of submission re 24, 27 & 28 omn objs
546	FUSCO	03/04/04	B	B310	0.30	Send change of address to BSI
546	FUSCO	03/05/04	B	B310	0.10	Send change of address to BSI
546	FUSCO	03/08/04	B	B310	0.40	Srch BSI website re Kimberly Adams claims
546	FUSCO	03/10/04	B	B310	0.30	Efile BSI affidavits of service re claims orders
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Efile cno re LaSalle claim motion
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Efile cno re 26th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Draft cno re 26th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Srch dkt re obj to LaSalle motion
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Srch dkt re obj to Williams motion
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Draft cno re 28th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Draft cno re 27th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Em to GRS re omni responses
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Efile cno re 27th claims obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Efile cno re 28th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.20	Srch dkt re withdrawal of poc's of Corina & Gregory Turner & em to E Lyle @ Oakwood re same
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Efile cno re Marion Williams claim motion
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.20	Srch dkt re obj to 28th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Draft cno re LaSalle motion
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Draft cno re Williams motion
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Srch dkt re obj to 26th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/11/04	B	B310	0.10	Srch dkt re obj to 27th omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/16/04	B	B310	0.30	Efile withdrawal of poc re Dominguez
546	FUSCO	03/17/04	B	B310	0.30	Draft notice & cos re 33rd omn obj
546	FUSCO	03/17/04	B	B310	0.60	Draft nom's re 29, 30, 31 & 32 omn objs
546	FUSCO	03/18/04	B	B310	0.40	Edit notices re omn objs
546	FUSCO	03/19/04	B	B310	0.20	Efile 33rd omn obj to claims
546	FUSCO	03/19/04	B	B310	0.50	Prep omn obj docs for GRS
546	FUSCO	03/19/04	B	B310	0.30	Send omn objs to C Murray & C Ward for service

ATE:06/28/04 12:06:35
AKWOOD HOMES
8132-DIP

PRO FORMA 61774 AS OF 04/28/04 INVOICE# 38044

DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
46	FUSCO	0.20
46	FUSCO	0.30
46	FUSCO	0.20
46	FUSCO	0.30
46	FUSCO	0.30
46	FUSCO	0.20
46	FUSCO	0.40
46	FUSCO	0.30
46	FUSCO	0.20
46	FUSCO	0.10
83	DOOLING	5.90
83	DOOLING	0.70
94	CONWAY	0.10

File 31st omn obj
File 30th omn obj
File 32nd omn obj to claims
Prep withdrawals of poc's for filing with court
File withdrawals of poc's
Download & print claims re 29th omn obj
PREP BINDER RE 29TH OMN OBJ POC'S
DRAFT NOT OF SUBMISS OF POC'S
Efile notice of submission re 29th omn obj
Send 21 omn order to C Ward
Downloading claims for 3/17/03 objection deadline
Downloading claims
Discuss efilng aff re: order re 28th omn obj. to claims w/MF

Total Task: B310 228.20 67159.50

Plan and Disclosure Statement

DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT	DETAILS
180	JOHNSTON	0.40	Stock issuance issues
190	PULSIFER	3.00	Review of documents-VOTING TRUST
190	PULSIFER	0.20	Consultation with Client/Associates-CONFERENCE WITH TODD A. FLUBACHER
209	DEHNEY	1.00	Review plan supp. docs.
209	DEHNEY	0.10	Discuss plan confirmation w/DBB
209	DEHNEY	0.10	Discuss additional debtors to the plan w/DBB
209	DEHNEY	0.10	Discuss plan supp docs. w/DBB
209	DEHNEY	0.20	Discuss plan w/DBB
209	DEHNEY	0.40	Call w/PP/DBB re: plan
209	DEHNEY	1.80	Review case issues & plan supp. docs.
209	DEHNEY	1.20	Work on plan docs.
209	DEHNEY	1.40	Review plan supp. docs.
209	DEHNEY	0.10	DBB e-mail re: spe first day
209	DEHNEY	0.10	Discuss plan w/DBB
209	DEHNEY	0.30	Discussions w/PP re: remic issues.
209	DEHNEY	1.50	Review revised plan supp. docs. & e-mails re: same
209	DEHNEY	1.00	Review voting trust agreement & e-mails re: same
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail to/from DBB re: voting information
209	DEHNEY	2.00	Review Plan supp. docs., trust issues
209	DEHNEY	1.50	SPE plan & pleadings review.
209	DEHNEY	3.90	Prep for plan confirmation; work on docs., issues for brief
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: plan confirmation
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail DBB re: 7.11 of plan
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail from DBB re: APA, etc.
209	DEHNEY	2.40	Review plan supp. docs, confirmation prep & resolve objections
209	DEHNEY	1.50	Review objection documents received
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail DBB re: settlement
209	DEHNEY	0.10	DBB e-mail re: timing on remic settlement
209	DEHNEY	0.10	Discuss objections to plan w/DBB;
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: voting
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail DBB re: voting
209	DEHNEY	0.10	Discuss plan w/DBB
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail from DBB re: Tunnell attorney
209	DEHNEY	0.10	E-mail DBB re: confirmation date

AKWOOD HOMES
8132-DIP

09	DEHNEY	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: babson and tunnell objections to plan
09	DEHNEY	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: call to chambers re confirmation date
09	DEHNEY	03/16/04	B	B320	0.20	E-mails w/DBB re: confirmation date
09	DEHNEY	03/16/04	B	B320	0.30	E-mail w/DBB re: tunnell objection
09	DEHNEY	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: LLC objection
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: confirmation brief
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: objections
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: confirmation objections
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.40	Discuss plan issues with DBB/Rstark
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.20	Discuss confirmation brief and order w/ABK
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: objections to plan and MTO knowledge
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.20	E-mails to DBB re: Babson bjection response
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.20	Discussions w/DBB re: brief
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Discuss confirmation brief w/DBB
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: draft director objection to plan
09	DEHNEY	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: FHA and GNMA objection to plan
09	DEHNEY	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: Babson objection
09	DEHNEY	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mails to DBB re: mediators
09	DEHNEY	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: tax authorities relief
09	DEHNEY	03/18/04	B	B320	2.00	Work on Confirm. brief
09	DEHNEY	03/18/04	B	B320	0.30	E-mails w/DBB re: US Attorney objection
09	DEHNEY	03/18/04	B	B320	0.30	E-mails w/DBB re: brief
09	DEHNEY	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: trustees and officers under plan
09	DEHNEY	03/20/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: voting classes
09	DEHNEY	03/20/04	B	B320	0.20	E-mails w/DBB re: trust agreement
09	DEHNEY	03/21/04	B	B320	0.30	E-mail w/DBB re: comments on brief
09	DEHNEY	03/21/04	B	B320	1.00	Work on plan amendment
09	DEHNEY	03/21/04	B	B320	3.50	Review/revise confirm. brief; e-mails w/DBB/co-counsel
09	DEHNEY	03/22/04	B	B320	0.20	E-mails w/Ilevee re: conf. order
09	DEHNEY	03/22/04	B	B320	0.20	E-mails w/TW re: NDH obj.
09	DEHNEY	03/22/04	B	B320	0.50	E-mails w/AD/DC re: Finova
09	DEHNEY	03/22/04	B	B320	0.50	Review rejection resolutions from MReed & e-mails re: same
09	DEHNEY	03/22/04	B	B320	0.80	Discuss edits to Liquidation Trust Agreement. w/CRR/GRS/DBB/TAF
09	DEHNEY	03/23/04	B	B320	2.00	Review/revise brief
09	DEHNEY	03/23/04	B	B320	2.00	Review/revise confirmation order
09	DEHNEY	03/23/04	B	B320	6.50	Mtgs. w/client/co-counsel
09	DEHNEY	03/24/04	B	B320	10.00	Prep for and attend confirmation hearing
09	DEHNEY	03/25/04	B	B320	3.50	Work on/discuss confirm. issues w/client/co-counsel, etc.
09	DEHNEY	03/25/04	B	B320	6.00	Work on Order
09	DEHNEY	03/25/04	B	B320	0.20	Discuss GNMA/FHA issues w/DCA
09	DEHNEY	03/25/04	B	B320	0.10	Mtg. w/DCA re: GNMA/FHA issues
09	DEHNEY	03/26/04	B	B320	3.50	Prep for and attend confirmation hrg (part II)
09	DEHNEY	03/26/04	B	B320	3.00	Work on confirmation order
09	DEHNEY	03/27/04	B	B320	1.00	Review RS's comments/e-mails w/staff re: same
09	DEHNEY	03/28/04	B	B320	2.50	Review confirm. order comments; e-mails w/DBB re: same
09	DEHNEY	03/28/04	B	B320	3.00	Calls w/co-counsel, etc. re: confirm order
09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B320	0.30	Discussions & e-mails w/DBB re: order
09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: emergency motion
09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail DBB re: order to SCousins
09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B320	0.20	E-mails w/DBB re: Babson language
09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B320	1.20	Conf call re: order
09	DEHNEY	03/30/04	B	B320	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: negotiations with Babson
09	DEHNEY	03/30/04	B	B320	0.10	DBB e-mail re: I levee acceptance of confirmation order

Line	Date	Account	Description	Amount
209	03/30/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: sufficiency of notice provision in order	0.10
209	03/30/04	B320	E-mails w/DBB/GRS re: transcripts and orders	0.10
209	03/30/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: notice of order	0.10
209	03/30/04	B320	E-mails w/DBB/RS/GRS re: language	0.60
209	03/30/04	B320	E-mails w/DBB re: DIP payout in order	0.10
209	03/30/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: objections to order	0.10
209	03/30/04	B320	Mtg. w/DCA re: FHA/GNMA issue	0.10
209	03/31/04	B320	Discuss SPE assignment orders w/DBB	0.10
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mail from DBB re: assumption order	0.10
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mails w/ DBB re: escrow and trust and task lists	0.10
209	03/31/04	B320	DBB e-mail re: REMIC orders	0.10
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: WIP	0.10
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mails w/DBB re: publication of notice	0.20
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mails w/DBB/CRP etc., re: confirmation order	0.80
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mails/calls w/DM re: US Bank billing issues	1.00
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mails w/TW/DBB/BS/JS/JA re: loan payoff & confirm. order	0.50
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mails w/DM/PP re: REMIC settlement	0.50
209	03/31/04	B320	E-mail w/JIL; review WTC proposal	0.50
209	03/31/04	B320	Review BONY's proposal to serve as escrow agent	0.30
209	03/31/04	B320	Discuss confirmation issues w/DBB/GRS	0.20
209	04/05/04	B320	Discuss New Dimension status w/DBB	0.10
209	04/05/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: liquidation trust call	0.10
209	04/06/04	B320	DBB e-mail re: 8-K revisions	0.10
209	04/06/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: trust agreement	0.10
209	04/07/04	B320	E-mail DBB re: A&M discussions regarding the trust agreement	0.10
209	04/07/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: trust agreement revisions by A&M	0.10
209	04/07/04	B320	E-mails to DBB re: trust agreement	0.10
209	04/07/04	B320	E-mail DBB re: section 5.1 and 5.2 of the trust agreement	0.10
209	04/07/04	B320	E-mails to TW/DBB/KB re: discussions on revisions to trust	0.10
209	04/08/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: trust agreement negotiations	0.10
209	04/08/04	B320	On call re: DOF escrow agreement	0.50
209	04/08/04	B320	E-mails to DBB re: DOF agreement	0.10
209	04/08/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: trustee positions	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	DBB e-mail re: settlement agreement and fees paid under it	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: Settlement agreement	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	DBB e-mail re: NDH and dismissal	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: hearing on dismissal motion	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: trust agreement language	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: stipulation for Wachovia situation	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: SPE Dismissal motion	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	E-mail from DBB re: section 2.5 of the trust agreement	0.10
209	04/09/04	B320	Discuss SPE dismissal motion w/DBB	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: Berkshire Settlement Agreement	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: Wachovia stip.	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mail from DBB re: closing tasks	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mail DBB re: SPE dismissal motion	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	On call w/IGH/DBB/GRS/CRP/DAH re: closing checklist	1.30
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: Wachovia stip.	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mails to DBB re: Wachovia stip.	0.10
209	04/12/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: closing tasks	0.10
209	04/13/04	B320	DBB e-mail re: Wachovia stip changes	0.10
209	04/13/04	B320	Call w/DBB re: analysis of NDH language in APA	0.40
209	04/13/04	B320	DBB e-mail re: NDH language in APA	0.10
209	04/13/04	B320	E-mail to DBB re: NDH language in APA	0.10

DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
09	DEHNEY 04/13/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/14/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/14/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/14/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/14/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/14/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/14/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/15/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/15/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/15/04 B	0.10
09	DEHNEY 04/15/04 B	0.30
09	DEHNEY 04/15/04 B	0.20
09	DEHNEY 04/16/04 B	0.20
09	DEHNEY 04/19/04 B	0.40
322	ABBOTT 03/10/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/11/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/11/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/12/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/15/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/15/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/17/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/17/04 B	0.30
322	ABBOTT 03/17/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/17/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/17/04 B	0.30
322	ABBOTT 03/17/04 B	0.40
322	ABBOTT 03/19/04 B	0.40
322	ABBOTT 03/19/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/22/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/22/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/22/04 B	0.30
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.30
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.70
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.40
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.30
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	1.00
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.30
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.20
322	ABBOTT 03/23/04 B	0.10
322	ABBOTT 03/24/04 B	2.50
322	ABBOTT 03/24/04 B	0.50

LINE	NAME	DATE	AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION
12	ABBOTT	03/24/04 B	0.10	same (.1); call to Milano re: same (.1); call to Harvey re: same (.1); revise and distribute GNMA/FHA insert language (.1)
12	ABBOTT	03/24/04 B	0.20	Mtg w/ Ward re: GNMA/FHA claims
12	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.20	Tc w/ Franck re: GNMA/FHA language(.1); tc w/ Harvey re: same(.1)
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.20	Mtg w/ RJD re: GNMA/FHA issues(.1); tc w/ DBB re: reorganized entities (.1)
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.20	Tc w/ Harvey re: GNMA/FHA issues
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.10	Tc w/ Doug Franck re: language
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.20	Mtg w/ RJD re: GNMA/FHA issues
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.10	Mtg/ DBB re: govt issues re: plan
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.10	Call to Harvey re: HUD issues
22	ABBOTT	03/25/04 B	0.60	Tc w/ Harvey re: government issues
22	ABBOTT	03/26/04 B	3.60	Confirmation hearing
22	ABBOTT	03/26/04 B	0.10	Call to Brodsky
22	ABBOTT	03/26/04 B	0.10	Negotiate resolution of GNMA/FHA issues
22	ABBOTT	03/26/04 B	2.80	Call to Slights re: GNMA issues
22	ABBOTT	03/29/04 B	0.10	Call to Harvey
22	ABBOTT	03/29/04 B	0.10	Tc w/ Slights re: GNMA/FHA language
22	ABBOTT	03/30/04 B	0.20	M,tg w/ RJD re: FHA/GNMA issue
22	ABBOTT	03/30/04 B	0.10	Call to Slights re: status w/ GNMA/FHA reserve issues
22	ABBOTT	03/31/04 B	0.10	Tc w/ Slights re: GNMA, FHA issues
22	ABBOTT	03/31/04 B	0.10	Tc w/ Julie Belcher re: OAC issues
22	ABBOTT	03/31/04 B	0.20	Tc w/ Herbert Deskins re: claim by Williamson's v. My Mortgage Pro(.2); review claim database re: same (.1); tc w/ Deskins re: same and dist petition (.1)
22	ABBOTT	04/02/04 B	0.40	Call to Slights re: FHA/GNMA issues
22	ABBOTT	04/06/04 B	0.10	Receive and review confirmation objection from Texas taxing authorities
146	BUSENKELL	04/15/04 B	0.10	Discuss classification of claims with DBB
146	BUSENKELL	03/01/04 B	0.10	Receive and respond to corr. from P. Edmundson re plan supplement documents
146	BUSENKELL	03/01/04 B	0.10	Telephone call with J. Silverman re Babson reply
346	BUSENKELL	03/09/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of Carolina First to plan
346	BUSENKELL	03/09/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection to plan by Riverside County
346	BUSENKELL	03/09/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of Wachovia to plan
346	BUSENKELL	03/10/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of Espinos to confirmation
346	BUSENKELL	03/10/04 B	0.20	Telephone call with E. Slights re plan and FHA
346	BUSENKELL	03/10/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection to plan filed by Arkansas class action plaintiffs
346	BUSENKELL	03/11/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection to plan filed by Textron
346	BUSENKELL	03/11/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objections of Associates and Carolina First to plan
346	BUSENKELL	03/12/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of United States to plan
346	BUSENKELL	03/12/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of IOS capital to plan
346	BUSENKELL	03/12/04 B	0.10	Receive and review limited response of committee to plan confirmation
346	BUSENKELL	03/14/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of Aegon to plan confirmation
346	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of Tunnell to plan confirmations
346	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of local Texas taxing authorities to plan confirmation
346	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	0.10	Receive and review objection of Pacific Life to confirmation

46	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	B320	0.10	Receive and review objection of Babson to plan confirmation
46	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	B320	0.10	Discuss hearing with GRS
46	BUSENKELL	03/18/04 B	B320	0.10	Receive and review ARC objection to plan
46	BUSENKELL	03/20/04 B	B320	0.10	Receive and review corr. from Pima County re confirmation hearing
46	BUSENKELL	03/22/04 B	B320	0.20	Telephone call with D. Muir re Carolina First objection
46	BUSENKELL	03/31/04 B	B320	0.10	Telephone call with J. Jacobs of Prime shares re confirmation order
46	BUSENKELL	04/14/04 B	B320	0.10	Respond to corr. from R. Hendricks re Oakwood confirmation and effective date
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04 B	B320	0.10	EM RJD re confirmation.
81	DONILON	03/24/04 B	B320	0.10	Review notice of filing of plan documents.
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PWC re: plan supp docs
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: voting
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from P Edmondson re: exec contracts
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.20	Conf with TAF re: trust edits
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.20	Review Textron objection ltr
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: Textron email
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from MGW re: SPE debtor motions
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from MGW re: comments on SPE motions
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from MGW re: SPE debtors
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: SPE conf call
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with GRS re: SC secured claim
89	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with Ash Geddes re: SC secured claim treatment under plan
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.30	Review petitions
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with P Edmondson re: exec contract schedule and 9.1 of the Plan
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from P Edmondson re: SC secured claim under plan
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to LGH, RJD and DAH re: Clayton APA
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to D Muir re: petitions
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: petitions
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	1.60	SPE and Plan Supp conf call
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with D Muir re: SPE petitions
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to Malloy Evans re: petitions
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with DAH re: APA amendment
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: plan confirmation
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: additional debtors
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to Partee and CRR re: additional debtors
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: additional debtors
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: additional debtors
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: additional debtors to the plan
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Mitch re: Lotus trust
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.90	Draft non-material modifications to the plan
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to group re: non-material modifications to the plan
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.60	Review the SPE first day motion
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: plan supp docs
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to committee, buyer and co-counsel re: plan supp docs
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Emails to TAF re: trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to MAD re: trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with TAF re: trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: OSHC & DIP
389	BUTZ	03/02/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: OSHC and tranche subs

89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from P Edmondson re: SPE issues
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: trust
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from TAF re: trust
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: trust
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from CRR re: disputed ownership fund and oversight board
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.90	Call with CRR re: plan supplement and SPEs
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from P Edmondson re: SPEs
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.20	Conf with TAF re: trust
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from P Partee re: SPEs
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from P Edmondson re: SPE listings
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: confirmation cases and brief
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: confirmation issues
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from P Edmondson re: plan Supp Docs
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.50	Call with P Edmondson re: plan supp and petitions
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to P Edmondson re: OIF, OFC and OSHC petitions
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Call to and from CRR re: plan
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: petitions and spes
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: SPE petitions
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to P Edmondson re: SPE debtor petitions
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: SPE debtors
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with and email to TAF re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.50	Plan amendments
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	1.90	Revise SPE first day motion
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to buyer, committee co-counsel and RJD re: SPE first day motion
89	BUTZ	03/04/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to buyer, PWC, committee, co-counsel and RJD re: edits to plan
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from TAF re: trust
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with TAF re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Mitch re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from MGB re: Seller's Disclosure statement
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.90	Research for confirmation brief
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	1.00	Conf call re: status
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with TAF re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from MGW re: motion to shorten
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from TAF re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from Stark re: comments to trusts
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Review motion to shorten
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to MGW re: motion to shorten
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: trustee in plan
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.30	Conf with TAF re: trust
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.20	Call with MGW re: motions
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	3.00	Prep petitions (2.0); prep first day motions (1.0)
89	BUTZ	03/05/04	B	B320	0.80	Organize plan supp docs for filing
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails to D Muir re: petitions
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: liquidating trust agreement

39	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to D Muir re: liquidating trust agreement
39	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from E Malloy re: bankruptcy filing
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails to E Malloy re: SPE filing
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: checklist
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: first days SPEs
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: SPE petitions
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.20	Call with E Slight re: IRS and petitions
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Call to CRR re: first days
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from P Partee re: first day motions
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Partee re: first day relief
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: first day SPE relief
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with RF re: hrg
89	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.30	Email from MGW re: SPE first days (.1); call to MGW re: same (.1); email to MGW, Partee and RJD re: SPE first days (.1)
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: first days and Walper
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with Partee and MGW re: first days
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with Partee and MGW and RJD re: first days
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.20	Call with M Kenney (UST) re: 5 SPEs
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Call from Stark re: plan supp and SPEs
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Stark re: SPEs
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Stark re: plan supplement documents
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: SPE borrowers
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: SPE borrowers
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Partee re: SPE borrowers under DIP
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: SPE borrowers
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: balloting activity
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: OFC and OIC as borrowers
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS and call to BSI re: balloting
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.20	Review voting information (.1); emails with RJD re: voting information (.1)
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: 2A voting
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Review taxes tax authorities objection to plan
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.50	Confirmation brief
389	BUTZ	03/08/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: schedule 1.09
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to P Edmondson re: 10.9 of the APA
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: notice of hearing
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to CRR re: notice of hearing
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: plan confirmation
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: section n 9.1 and Textron
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: trust agreement revisions
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: trust agreement revisions
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PWC re: Lotus transactions
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: committee trust revisions
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from MGW re: APA
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: verification for Muir re: first days; conf with RJD re: Muir as witness
389	BUTZ	03/09/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from RJD re: claims and confirmation brief
389	BUTZ	03/10/04	B	B320	0.30	Conf with Partee and RJD re: first days
389	BUTZ	03/10/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to group re: GNMA language for order
389	BUTZ	03/10/04	B	B320	0.10	Call from E Slight re: FHA/GNMA language for order
389	BUTZ	03/10/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from and conf with MGB re; E Slight comments on confirmation order

89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: designations
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: designations
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call from MGB re: recoveries under plan
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call from MGB re: claims trading
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from DER re: designation
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from WOM re: designation
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.20	Call from attorney representing New Dimension Homes of Long Neck, LLC re: plan and sale to Clayton Neck, LLC
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD, client and co-counsel re: apa and NDH of long neck, LLC
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.40	Review objections to plan
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to E Slights re: GNMA language
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with DCA re: GNMA language
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: LLC agreement
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: LLC agreement
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from E Slight re: tax liability
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Stark re: plan supp docs
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: designation and first days
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.20	Call with committee counsel re: plan and voting issues
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: ARC claims
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Skadden re: ARC claims
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with attorney re: 7.11 in the plan
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: 7.11 of plan
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call from attorney re: 7.11 of plan
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call from creditor re: voting on the plan
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with Partee re: first day order; revise first day order
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with GRS re: convenience class ballots
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: convenience class ballots
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with RJD re: convenience class ballots
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with D Muir re: first day hrs
89	BUTZ	03/10/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with D Muir re: first days
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: BSI website
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from BSI re: info on website
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from DCA re: 7.11 of plan
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: LLC agreements
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.20	Call from USDOJ re: GNMA
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Call from TX taxing authorities re: language
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from DAH re: APA
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.20	Email to Skadden re: arc claims
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PWC re: plan supp docs
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: Berkshire ballots and Lotus trust docs
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: extension
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: Trust and ballots
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to GRS re: Berkshire ballots
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Review APA; send disclosures to interested party
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from client re: LLC agreements
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PDE re: LLC agreements
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS and Walper re: lotus trust and remic settlement
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: APA
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: LLC agreements
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: LLC agreements
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from attorney re: cures under plan
89	BUTZ	03/11/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Skadden re: arc claims

389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	re: spe first day motion (.1)
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: spe motion hrg
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to CRR and RJD re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.40	Review new objection to plan
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: objections to plan
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RF and GRS re: objections to plan
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: review of objections to plan
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: Partee response to Lotus trust
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: objections to company
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: amendment to trust docs for Lotus settlement
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: plan objections
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Mitch re: Put and other lotus problems
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: Babson objection
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to GRS re: voting count
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: vote count
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to GRS re: Mitch (PWC) comments on Put option
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: PoC for Put
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: objection deadline for committee and berk
389	BUTZ	03/15/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to GRS re: objection deadline for berk and committee
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: Babson and Tunnell objections to plan
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: Tunnell objection
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: Tunnell attorney
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: LLCs and the Tunnell objection
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: LLC agreement brief
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: Tunnell objection
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: CNO for first day
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with MGB re: CNO for first day; call to RJD re: same
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with MGB re: first day relief
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.20	Revise first day order
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: voting
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: D Muir comments to trust
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: LLC agreements
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with T Walper re: 9019 Motion
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Call from Walper re: 9019 motion and stark email re: voting
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to co-co-counsel, Walper, Partee and opposing counsel re: 9019 motion
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Stark re: voting and balloting
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from GRS re: voting and balloting
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: secured tax objections
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Alves re: settlement
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: first day relief at hrg
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: revised motion
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: settlement motion
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/16/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: settlement agreement filed on Thursday

LINE	DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: settlement agreement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: spe debtors in plan	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from MGB re: spe debtors; email to Walper Stark and Partee re: spe debtors	0.10
389	BUTZ	Review ACE objection; conf with RF re: same	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: settlement timing	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: confirmation hearing date	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: April 6	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: settlement motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: confirmation extension	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: push confirmation date	0.10
389	BUTZ	Draft revisions to 9019 motion	0.60
389	BUTZ	Conf with MGB re: Texttron objection	0.10
389	BUTZ	Review emails from Fisco, Partee, Stark, and Mitch (.2); revise 9019 motion based on emails from Fisco, Alves, Partee and Mitch (.6)	0.80
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: amendment to Lotus trust for settlement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from CRR re: 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Walper re: 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email to Walper re: from 4 of the 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: 6004 in 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email to RJD re: 6004 in 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: 6004 in 9019 motion (regarding revised language)	0.10
389	BUTZ	Emails from Partee re: revisions to 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Call with M Fisco re: 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Alves re: 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email to Alves re: 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Work on 9019 motion	0.50
389	BUTZ	Call with Walper and Partee re: settlement motion	0.30
389	BUTZ	Email from CRR re: 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Alves re: revisions to motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Walper re: Settlement Agreement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Seward and Kissel re: Lotus amendment	0.10
389	BUTZ	Emails from Walper re: settlement agreement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Emails from RJD re: settlement agreement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Emails from Partee re: revisions to 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Work on settlement agreement	0.20
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: call to chambers re confirmation date	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: confirmation date	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Stark re: comments to settlement motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Partee re: stark comments to 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Muir re: LLC agreement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: conf call on settlement	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from D Muir re: APA	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Stark re: settlement motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Stark re: voting REMICS	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from RJD re: LLC objection	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from C Ryan re: comments on 9019 motion	0.10
389	BUTZ	Conf call re: confirmation issues	1.00
389	BUTZ	Email from PBE re: LLC transfer	0.10
389	BUTZ	Email from Muir re: LLC agreements	0.10

9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: LLC agreements
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: APA and LLC agreements
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.90	Call with Walper and Partee re: settlement
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: language for 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Mitch re: 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: PWC comments to 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from M Aeder re: comments to 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to Walper re: release provision for 9109 motion
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: discharge under the plan
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: discharge and the Lotus Trust
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Mitch re: Lotus Trust issues
9	BUTZ	03/16/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: discharge under the plan
9	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Alves re: 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Alves re: 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Emails with Partee re: 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from and conf with MGB re: spe retention
9	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Stark re: 9019 motion
9	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from McIndoe re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.80	Draft history section of confirmation brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: 9019 motion
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: 9019 motion
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: objections
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Emails to CRR and PBE re: objections
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RF re: objections
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Call with Stark and RJD re: plan supplement and settlement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.40	Issues (.2); conf with RJD re: objections to plan (.2)
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: confirmation order
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from CRR re: objections
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: objections to plan and MTO knowledge
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	thereof
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: Babson objection response
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: FHA and GNMA objection to plan
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: Babson objection response
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: Babson objection response
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from Hunton associate re: Babson response
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from and conf with MGB re: OAC foreclosure question
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to D Muir re: OAC foreclosure question
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Review draft objection of d&o's
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: confirmation brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: confirmation objections
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE, LGH TAF et al re: liquidating trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from D Muir re: OAC foreclosure
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from LGH re: liquidating trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.20	Call with LGH re: trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: liquidating trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: RCD Bruno's case memo
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RF re: agenda
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: draft director objection to plan
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: liquidating trust call
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: confirmation brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04 B	B320	0.10	Call and email from creditor re: notice of confirmation

89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	hearing
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from TAF re: liquidating trust
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: liquidating trust
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from TAF re: liquidating trust and liens
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: voting of secured classes
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with SLS re: question with liens in assets of liquidating trust
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: mtg on trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Partee re: waiver for plan question
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails to Partee re: trustee indemnification obligations
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from Partee re: indemnification obligations
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: trust mtg
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: 9019 motion
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to D Muir re: 9019 motion
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	2.10	Work on confirmation brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.50	Review example confirmation order
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: confirmation brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	1.70	Work on brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	1.50	Research for brief
89	BUTZ	03/17/04	B	B320	1.90	Confirmation brief drafting
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	1.40	Conf with LGH and TAF re: liquidating trust agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from Walper re: ?
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with RJD re: brief
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: lotus settlement order
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: settlement order
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails from Stark re: mediator
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: mediators
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: tax authorities relief
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: US Attorney objection
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: us attorney objection
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: US Attorney objection
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: ballot info
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE and CRR re: list of duties for trustee
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: trust duties
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: trust duties
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: timing issue under APA
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: timing issue on APA
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: Babson objection
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: closing tasks list
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Stark re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.20	Review ARC objection
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: Babson objection
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from BSI re: balloting
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	2.20	Drafting brief
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	1.40	Research for brief
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	1.00	Review current form of brief
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with LGH re: liquidation trust
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Call from T Walper re: settlement agreement
89	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Walper re: settlement agreement

389	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: trust
389	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: escrow agreement
389	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with PBE re: escrow agreement
389	BUTZ	03/18/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: liquidation trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Review 9019 order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with RJD re: brief and settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Review FHA and GNMA claims
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to RJD re: GNMA claims
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.20	Conf with GRS and L Carter re: taxing authorities
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: list
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to TAF re: trustee duties list
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.60	Conf with GRS and C Ward re: GNMA and FHA claims
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Work on 9019 order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with Walper re: 9019 order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to group re: settlement order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.20	Conf with ABK re: settlement order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: escrow agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from TAF re: trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to P Edmondson re: trustee duties
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.70	Walk through and clean up confirmation brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Fisco re: settlement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Partee re: settlement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: confirmation
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: confirmation
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Emails form GRS re: confirmation
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from and conf with TAF re: liquidating trust issues
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: REMIC Rs
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to PBE re: REMIC Rs
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from Fisco re: fees for US Bank in settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from RJD re: US Bank fees in settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with GRS re: confirmation order
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: notice of filing for Berkshire settlement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with PBE re: escrow agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.30	Work on confirmation brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Conf with ABK re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with RJD re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email to Partee, Walper et al re: settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from C Ryan re: settlement agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: brief
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.20	Conf with TAF re: liquidating trust
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Call with Walper re: settlement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: trust agreement
389	BUTZ	03/19/04	B	B320	0.10	Email from PBE re: brief