

46	BUSENKELL	04/07/04 B	B185	0.10	Telephone call to B. Norcom re lease assignments
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04 B	B185	0.20	Telephone call with M. Vigger of Deloitte & Touche re lease assignments
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04 B	B185	0.10	Telephone call with J. Marshall re Austin lease
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04 B	B185	0.10	Telephone call with DBB re Austin lease
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04 B	B185	0.20	Telephone calls with J. Marshall re AUSton lease assumption
46	BUSENKELL	04/09/04 B	B185	0.50	Prepare Austin lease cure stipulation
46	BUSENKELL	04/13/04 B	B185	0.30	Revise and edit Austin/Alberfeldy stipulation
46	BUSENKELL	04/13/04 B	B185	0.10	Review and edit Alberfeldy cure stipulation
359	SAYDAH	04/14/04 B	B185	0.10	Prepare corr. to J. marshal re Aberfeldy cure claim
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04 B	B185	0.10	TC from Ray at Pachulski re Peoplesoft contracts.
359	SAYDAH	04/01/04 B	B185	0.20	TC with L. Carter re lease rejection issues.
381	DONILON	04/01/04 B	B185	0.10	EM L. Carter re notice for rejected leases.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Meet with MGB re: motions to assume/assign leases.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Review emails from MGB re: notices of lease assumption.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Review email from L. Carter re: notice of lease assumption.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	T/c with MGB re: assumption/assignment notices.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	1.30	Prepare notices of intent to assume and assign leases.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Email to L. Carter re: cure amounts on leases to be assumed and assigned.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Email to L. Carter re: Smith Family Trust lease.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Review email from L. Carter re: Smith Family Trust lease.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Review email from L. Carter re: cure amount for Smith Family Trust lease.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Meet with MGB re: finalized notices of assumption/assignment.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.30	Meet with MGB re: assumption/assignment of leases.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.70	Coordinate filing/service of notices of assumption/assignment.
381	DONILON	03/25/04 B	B185	0.10	Review voicemail from B. Norcom re: lease issues.
381	DONILON	03/30/04 B	B185	0.20	Meet with MGB re: lease/cure amount issues.
381	DONILON	03/30/04 B	B185	0.30	Email to L. Carter re: lease assumption/assignment procedures.
389	BUTZ	04/05/04 B	B185	0.10	Call from lessor re: termination of lease under APA
389	BUTZ	04/05/04 B	B185	0.10	Email from MGB re: leases
389	BUTZ	04/05/04 B	B185	0.10	Email to MGB re: APA leases assumed
389	BUTZ	04/05/04 B	B185	0.10	Call from landlord re: outstanding rent
389	BUTZ	04/06/04 B	B185	0.10	Email from L. Carter re: Gelco lease
389	BUTZ	04/07/04 B	B185	0.20	Conf with MGB re: GMAC leases
389	BUTZ	04/07/04 B	B185	0.30	Call with L. Carter re: GMAC, Gelco and Landlord
389	BUTZ	04/07/04 B	B185	0.10	Call from L. Carter re: GMAC lease/loans
389	BUTZ	04/13/04 B	B185	0.10	Email from L. Carter re: Gelco
389	BUTZ	04/13/04 B	B185	0.10	Email from W Wright re: Gelco lease
389	BUTZ	04/13/04 B	B185	0.10	Email to L. Carter re: Gelco lease
389	BUTZ	04/14/04 B	B185	0.30	Call from L. Carter; call to L. Carter re: Gelco and Lease rejections
394	KELLY	03/24/04 B	B185	1.20	Drafting notice of additional executory contracts
546	FUSCO	03/01/04 B	B185	0.10	UPDATE LEASE REJECTION TABLE
546	FUSCO	03/01/04 B	B185	0.20	Send 50th lease rejection notice to L Carter
546	FUSCO	03/16/04 B	B185	0.10	Update lease rejection chart
546	FUSCO	03/31/04 B	B185	0.10	Send 48th lease rejection notice to L Carter
594	CONWAY	03/25/04 B	B185	0.70	Draft cos' for lease rejection notices (4) (.5); discuss w/GD (.1); discuss efilng and svc w/WP (.1)

Total Task: B185 28.10 9300.00

Other Contested Matters

209	DEHNEY	03/22/04 B	B190	0.10	Discuss Carolina First adversary w/MGB
209	DEHNEY	04/04/04 B	B190	0.40	E-mails w/PP/DM re: U.S. Bank /Jp Morgan litigation settlement
209	DEHNEY	04/07/04 B	B190	1.50	Review/comment on draft of objection to JPM motion.
209	DEHNEY	04/08/04 B	B190	1.00	Review/comment on draft of objection to JPM Motion.
209	DEHNEY	04/12/04 B	B190	1.70	Conf. call w/counsel for committee and buyer.
346	BUSENKELL	03/02/04 B	B190	0.10	Receive and review Boyd complaint
346	BUSENKELL	03/04/04 B	B190	0.10	Receive and review corr. from J. Silverman re stipulation extending Babson briefing schedule
346	BUSENKELL	03/04/04 B	B190	0.10	Telephone call to B. Gifford re Davison complaint
346	BUSENKELL	03/04/04 B	B190	0.10	Telephone call with B. Gifford re Davison complaint
346	BUSENKELL	03/04/04 B	B190	0.10	Telephone call with B. Gifford re Davis complaint
346	BUSENKELL	03/09/04 B	B190	0.10	Telephone call with J/. Silverman re Babson
346	BUSENKELL	03/09/04 B	B190	0.20	Review and finalize Babson reply memorandum
346	BUSENKELL	03/19/04 B	B190	0.10	Review and edit notice of completion of briefing
346	BUSENKELL	03/22/04 B	B190	0.10	Discuss Carolina First adversary with RJD
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04 B	B190	0.10	EM JH re tsinigini order.
359	SAYDAH	04/07/04 B	B190	4.70	Draft objection to JPM motion.
359	SAYDAH	04/08/04 B	B190	3.60	Draft and revise objection to JPM Motion.
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04 B	B190	1.70	CC with counsel for committee and buyer.
363	HARRIS	03/03/04 B	B190	0.10	Conf w/ GRS re litig settlement.
370	HANEY	04/12/04 B	B190	0.10	Call from WOL re: winford, lee objections
370	HANEY	04/14/04 B	B190	0.30	Confer w/ WOL re: winford, lee, hill
370	HANEY	04/15/04 B	B190	0.20	Fwd correspondence to WOL re: winford, lee
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B190	0.10	Email from B Norcom re: Orem
389	BUTZ	03/01/04 B	B190	0.10	Email to B Norcom re: Orem
546	FUSCO	03/11/04 B	B190	0.40	Obt WARN settlement docs for MGB

Total Task: B190 17.10 5805.50

Employee Benefits/Pensions

359	SAYDAH	03/19/04 B	B220	0.10	EM C. Ward re KERP payments.
-----	--------	------------	------	------	------------------------------

Total Task: B220 0.10 28.00

Financing/Cash Collections

209	DEHNEY	04/13/04 B	B230	0.10	E-mail to DBB re: payment of DIP lenders and funding of DOF escrow
389	BUTZ	04/13/04 B	B230	0.10	Emails from RJD re: payment of DIP lenders and funding of DOF escrow

Total Task: B230 0.20 73.50

Tax Issues

346	BUSENKELL	03/11/04 B	B240	0.10	Receive and review corr. from M. Wilson e repo taxes
346	BUSENKELL	03/16/04 B	B240	0.10	Telephone call with R. Smith re Channelview taxes
346	BUSENKELL	03/16/04 B	B240	0.10	Telephone call to R. Smith re tax liens on Channelview property

Total Task: B240 0.30 108.00

	Real Estate	04/13/04 B	B250	2.00	
.70	ISKEN				Conferences with Steve from First American Title Insurance Company, Rick Rayburn, Pat Edmondson, Barbara Norcross, Rachel Dwares and Linda Murray
L70	ISKEN	04/13/04 B	B250	1.40	Reviewed documents (deeds, land inventory schedules)
L70	ISKEN	04/14/04 B	B250	0.30	Confered with Rachel Dwares
L70	ISKEN	04/14/04 B	B250	0.80	Reviewed land schedules
303	DWARES	04/13/04 B	B250	0.70	Conference call with DNI and Pat Edmondson; t/c with Pat Edmondson; t/c with Steve from title company
303	DWARES	04/13/04 B	B250	2.30	Research properties owned by companies, land inventory
303	DWARES	04/13/04 B	B250	1.50	Draft deeds
303	DWARES	04/13/04 B	B250	1.50	Follow up regarding deeds, issues regarding land inventory
303	DWARES	04/14/04 B	B250	2.70	Discuss Sale of Real Estate w/ MGB
327	HARRIS	03/01/04 B	B250	0.30	Prepare deeds
505	MURRAY	04/13/04 B	B250	1.50	

Total Task: 5223.00

Claims and Plans

209	DEHNEY	03/05/04 B	B300	2.50	Review and revise documents, motions and petitions.
209	DEHNEY	03/08/04 B	B300	0.10	Discuss senior note holder request w/GRS
209	DEHNEY	03/09/04 B	B300	0.40	Discuss REMIC hearing and voting issues w/GRS
209	DEHNEY	03/09/04 B	B300	0.10	E-mails to DBB re: claims and confirmation brief
209	DEHNEY	03/10/04 B	B300	0.10	E-mail DBB re: ARC claims
209	DEHNEY	03/11/04 B	B300	0.30	Discuss extension for ARC to vote and object w/GRS/DBB
209	DEHNEY	03/12/04 B	B300	0.40	Revised settlement motion re OMRT.
209	DEHNEY	03/15/04 B	B300	0.10	REMIC settlement call w/PP
209	DEHNEY	03/15/04 B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re: balloting for notes.
209	DEHNEY	03/15/04 B	B300	0.10	E-mail DBB re: 9019 Berkshire REMIC motion
209	DEHNEY	03/16/04 B	B300	1.20	Review/comment on REMIC settlement motion
209	DEHNEY	03/16/04 B	B300	1.50	E-mails/calls w/PP/GRS/DBB/MGB re: REMIC settlement & hrg.
209	DEHNEY	03/19/04 B	B300	0.10	E-mail from DBB re: GNMA claims
209	DEHNEY	03/20/04 B	B300	0.30	GRS e-mail re: classes of voters.
209	DEHNEY	03/20/04 B	B300	0.30	E-mails w/GRS re: order and brief.
209	DEHNEY	03/20/04 B	B300	0.10	Discuss confirmation order w/GRS
209	DEHNEY	03/20/04 B	B300	3.50	Review confirmation brief.
209	DEHNEY	03/21/04 B	B300	2.50	Review/revise/comment on confirmation order.
209	DEHNEY	03/22/04 B	B300	5.00	Draft/revise confirmation order.
209	DEHNEY	03/22/04 B	B300	0.30	Discuss settlement letter w/GRS
209	DEHNEY	03/22/04 B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re: Babson and Laurie Silverstein.
209	DEHNEY	03/23/04 B	B300	4.00	Review JP Morgan mtg. and draft response.
209	DEHNEY	03/23/04 B	B300	2.50	Mtgs. w/PP/TW/GRS etc. re: documents
209	DEHNEY	03/23/04 B	B300	2.00	Review AEGON mtg. and work on response.
209	DEHNEY	03/24/04 B	B300	2.50	Revise JPMorgan objection.
209	DEHNEY	03/25/04 B	B300	2.00	Review/revise affidavit
209	DEHNEY	03/25/04 B	B300	3.00	Revise affidavit and prep for hearing.
209	DEHNEY	03/26/04 B	B300	3.00	Review/revise MStandish declaration; prep for hearing.
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	1.00	Review/revise edits to confirmation order.
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	0.50	E-mails w/staff/co-counsel re: case issues
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	2.80	Draft Cert of Counsel and prepare exhibits to Confirmation Order.
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re: insurance issues.
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	1.00	Prep/review exhibits for filing confirmation order.
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re: issues.
209	DEHNEY	03/29/04 B	B300	1.00	Review/revise Notice of Confirmation.

09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B300	3.50	Conf. calls re: edits to confirmation order.
09	DEHNEY	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re: insurance issues.
09	DEHNEY	03/30/04	B	B300	3.00	Revise Tunnell and Babson language for order.
09	DEHNEY	03/30/04	B	B300	0.10	Review revised Tunnell language.
09	DEHNEY	03/30/04	B	B300	0.70	Revise Babson language.
09	DEHNEY	03/30/04	B	B300	1.40	Final edits to confirmation notice.
09	DEHNEY	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	Discuss documents & closing issues w/GRS
09	DEHNEY	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	E-mail GRS re: status of docs.
09	DEHNEY	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	Discuss issues with the escrow docs and RS w/GRS
09	DEHNEY	04/08/04	B	B300	1.50	Review supplement to amended JPM Motion.
09	DEHNEY	04/12/04	B	B300	1.40	Meeting re closing docs and outstanding to do list items.
09	DEHNEY	04/12/04	B	B300	1.00	Review/comment on objection to JPM reserve motion.
09	DEHNEY	04/12/04	B	B300	0.40	Conf. call w/counsel re Tunnell/NDH.
09	DEHNEY	04/12/04	B	B300	1.50	On call re surety issues.
09	DEHNEY	04/12/04	B	B300	0.50	On call re outstanding closing issues.
09	DEHNEY	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	Discuss additional edits to response w/GRS
09	DEHNEY	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	E-mail from GRS re: revised JPM response
09	DEHNEY	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re: status of closing docs.
09	DEHNEY	04/13/04	B	B300	0.50	On call re outstanding APA issues.
09	DEHNEY	04/14/04	B	B300	0.10	Discuss Tunnell w/GRS
09	DEHNEY	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re status of omni hearing.
09	DEHNEY	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re effective date and hearing tomorrow.
09	DEHNEY	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	GRS e-mail re reserve amount for JPM motion.
09	DEHNEY	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with DBB re plan Supplement.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	B300	0.30	Research class of Carolina First Bank.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	B300	0.10	TC to R. Palacio re voting packages for Carolina.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	B300	0.20	Confer with DBB re voting report.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Forward VM to DBB re plan issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	B300	0.10	TC from Ashby re ballots for first bank.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with DBB re 3018 motions.
359	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B	B300	0.10	EM DBB re creditors receiving solicitation packages.
359	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B	B300	0.60	TC with Judith Lurie re lifting the stay.
359	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B	B300	0.20	TC from Derek Jerina of Libertas Partners.
359	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B	B300	0.40	Confer with DBB and research on designation of votes.
359	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with DBB re research on designation of votes.
359	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B	B300	0.10	Review voting report.
359	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B	B300	0.10	EM RF docs filed under seal by US Bank.
359	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B	B300	0.10	TC with M. Wilson and P. Partee re exact names of entities.
359	SAYDAH	03/05/04	B	B300	0.10	Assist with filing of additional debtors; review and revise documents, motions and petitions.
359	SAYDAH	03/05/04	B	B300	2.40	TC with C. Ward re windown issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/05/04	B	B300	0.20	EM S. Serpe re stip for 17th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.10	TC with Note holder re master balloting.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.20	TC with J. Lane, senior note holder.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.20	Confer with DBB re plan and votes of secured creditors.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with DBB re status of plan vote.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.10	TC to J. Lane re committee info.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.10	TC with K. Biron of K&S re update of creditor information.
359	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with RJD re senior note holder request.
359	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B300	0.10	EM C. Ward re pushed confirmation hearing.
359	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B300	0.10	TC to J. Hofmann re agenda for new debtors.
359	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B300	0.10	TC with Ursula Williams re status of case.
359	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B300	0.10	TC with DBB re disbursement under Plan.
359	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B300	0.10	TC to J. Madura re ballots.

Line	Description	PRO FORMA	Value	Date	Notes
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.40	03/09/04 B	Confer with RJD re REMIC hearing and voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.20	03/10/04 B	TC with R. Maguait re JD Edwards agreement.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/11/04 B	TC with K. LaMaina re possible objection to plan.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/11/04 B	EM J. Hofmann re OMRT ballots.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/11/04 B	Confer with DBB re extension to file objection for ARC.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/11/04 B	EM K. LaMaina re extension to file objection for ARC.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/11/04 B	Confer with RJD and DBB re extension for ARC to vote and object and TC with K. LaMaina.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/12/04 B	TC to C. Murray re voting report.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/12/04 B	TC to B. Gallerie re voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	1.30	03/12/04 B	Confer with counsel from Committee, US Bank, and Clayton re settlement agreement and voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.20	03/12/04 B	TC with D. Jerina re events at hearing.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.40	03/12/04 B	TC with C. Ward re various voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	1.00	03/12/04 B	TC with B. Gallerie and C. Ward re voting report issues, review subsequent report and distribute.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.40	03/12/04 B	Revise settlement motion re OMRT.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/12/04 B	TC with DBB re 9019 motion.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/12/04 B	TC from L. Gretchko re confirmation hearing.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/12/04 B	TC to Hunt Brown re Golden Eagle.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC to P. Partee re REMIC settlement.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	Confer with DBB re voting research.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC with B. Gallerie re lists of 4C Claimants.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM BSI re junior and senior note balloting.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM RJD and DBB re balloting for notes.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM R. Stark unofficial voting report.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC with R. Stark re voting.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC to B. Gallerie re voting report.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC to C. Murray re parties voting and not.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM RF re copies of objections to Company.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM DBB re figuring out who didn't vote.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.20	03/15/04 B	EM DBB re POC's on the Put.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM DBB re extended objection deadline.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC with R. Stark re REMIC voting.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	EM R. Stark re REMIC voting.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	Confer with DBB re voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC to B. Gallerie re voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/15/04 B	TC to C. Murray re voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.40	03/16/04 B	Review strange letter from Arkansas Insurance Dept re balloting.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.40	03/16/04 B	CC with Stark re voting.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/16/04 B	EM SPH re amended order.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.20	03/16/04 B	TC with K. LaMaina re plan and objection issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.70	03/16/04 B	Review outline on estimation.
59	SAYDAH	B300	2.80	03/16/04 B	Draft motion to estimate claims for reserve purposes.
59	SAYDAH	B300	1.40	03/16/04 B	Research motion to estimate claims for reserve purposes under a plan.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.20	03/17/04 B	Confer with DBB re voting issues.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/17/04 B	TC from K. LaMaina re objection to confirmation.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/18/04 B	EM C. Ward re final voting report.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/18/04 B	EM C. Murray re final voting report.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/18/04 B	TC with DBB re REMIC tally.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/18/04 B	EM BSI re error on REMIC tally.
59	SAYDAH	B300	0.10	03/18/04 B	File 33rd omni objection.

DATE: 06/28/04 12:06:35  
AKWOOD HOMES  
3132-DIP

PRO FORMA 61774 AS OF 04/28/04 INVOICE# 38044

LINE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	AMOUNT	REMARKS
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	2.10	Review and revise confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.20	Confer with DBB re confirmation.
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	Confer with DBB re confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	TC with DBB re voting affidavit.
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	TC to R. Stark re REMIC voting.
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	EM R. Stark re REMIC voters.
59	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.30	TC with K. LaMaina re plan and REMIC issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	0.10	Confer with RJD re confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	0.10	EM RJD re review of confirmation brief.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	0.10	EM RJD re order and brief.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	0.10	EM RJD re classes of voters.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	0.30	Research acceptance or rejection of plan under 1126 for
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	2.30	classes that did not vote.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	4.80	Review confirmation brief.
59	SAYDAH	03/20/04	0.80	Draft confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/21/04	0.10	TC to DBB re filing of SPEs.
59	SAYDAH	03/21/04	2.90	Review confirmation brief.
59	SAYDAH	03/21/04	6.90	Draft and revise confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	TC with B. Gallerie re voting certification.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.20	TC with P. Partee re Babson.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	EM BSI re error on voting report.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	TC with C. Murray re edits to affidavit.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	TC with M. Kenney re proposed confirmation order in Oakwood.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	EM A. Conway re filing service docs from BSI.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	Make additional edits to voting affidavit to fix errors and
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.30	EM to BSI.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	3.70	Draft and revise confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	EM RJD re Babson and Laurie Silverstein.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	TC with L. Silverstein re resolution of Babson objections.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	Arrange CC for tomorrow morning on assumption/assignment
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	motion.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	EM M. Wilson re D. Franck.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	Distribute draft of confirmation order.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.70	Review additional edits to ballot certification and prep
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.30	for final filing.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.40	Make CRR edits to docs.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.30	Confer with RJD re comments to docs.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.60	Confer with RJD re settlement letter
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	1.60	Review ballot certification, edit and return to BSI.
59	SAYDAH	03/22/04	2.00	Revise and file agenda.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.10	TC with RJD re status of docs.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.30	Confer with RJD, P. Partee and T. Walper re docs.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.10	Confer with CRR re status of docs.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.10	EM J. Hofmann re Tsinigini.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.10	Review motion of AEGON to continue hearing on settlement
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	2.90	and draft response.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	4.40	Review motion of JP Morgan to determine holdback and draft
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	2.30	response.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.30	Confer with A. Conway re paper filed docs.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.10	TC with L. Johnson of PJW's chambers.
59	SAYDAH	03/24/04	0.10	EM from RJD re edits to objections.
59	SAYDAH	03/24/04	0.10	TC with K. LaMaina re ARC claims and their objection.

359	SAYDAH	03/24/04	B	B300	2.50	Revise JPMorgan objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/24/04	B	B300	6.80	Prep for hearing and attend confirmation hearing.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	0.20	Confer with DBB re status of order.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	0.10	EM G. Nelson re affidavit.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	0.20	TC with G. Nelson re telephonic appearance at hearing and proceedings.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	0.10	EM insert to DBB re Nelson declaration.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	0.10	File Nelson affidavit.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	4.20	Revise affidavit and prep for hearing.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	0.30	Confer with P. Partee and assist M. Malard with execution of docs.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	2.80	Draft and revise Nelson declaration.
359	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B300	5.40	Draft and revise affidavit.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	0.10	EM K. LaMaina re order status.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	0.10	TC to PJW chambers re postponing hearing.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	1.50	Attend confirmation hearing, part 1.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	0.10	EM DBB re mailing interim draft to Laurie Silverstein.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	0.10	Distribute dial-in information for calls on Sunday.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	0.70	Report to Court re status of order.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	3.40	Revise confirmation notice.
359	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B300	2.40	Review and revise standish declaration and prep for hearing.
359	SAYDAH	03/27/04	B	B300	0.10	EM L. Silverstein re order.
359	SAYDAH	03/28/04	B	B300	0.10	EM Order to L. Silverstein.
359	SAYDAH	03/28/04	B	B300	1.00	Second CC re edits.
359	SAYDAH	03/28/04	B	B300	0.60	Confer with DBB re edits.
359	SAYDAH	03/28/04	B	B300	3.10	Revise order and check edits for second CC.
359	SAYDAH	03/28/04	B	B300	3.10	1st conference call re order.
359	SAYDAH	03/28/04	B	B300	1.30	Third CC re edits to order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM plan amendments to Walper and PED.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	Set up 5th CC on Conf. order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM PED re executory contract schedule.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.80	4th CC re edits to Confirmation Order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with DBB re edits to COC.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM C. Murray re exhibits for upcoming VM's.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.20	TCs with Cherie of PJW's chambers re submission of orders.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM P. Partee re SPE orders.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.50	CC re edits to confirmation order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM group re CC at 4PM.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM Cousins latest version of conf. order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM RJD and CRR re insurance issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	Review Babson language from Laurie and EM RJD, P. Partee and CRR re issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	1.40	Revise Notice of Confirmation.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	1.10	CC re final edits to confirmation order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	1.20	Prep exhibits for filing confirmation order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	1.30	CC re edits to confirmation order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.80	Draft SPE COC.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	Confer with M. Wilson re SPE motions.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	1.10	5th CC re edits to confirmation order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	2.80	Draft Cert of Counsel and prepare exhibits to Confirmation Order.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM Babson language to Stark and Cousins.
359	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B300	0.10	EM P. Partee re edits to REMIC Sale Motion order.
359	SAYDAH	03/30/04	B	B300	0.10	EM Committee re Babson language.





359	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B300	0.80	estimation issues. Review edits to response, finalize and distribute for comments. EM counsel for JPMorgan regarding response. Research motion to dismiss SPE Debtors. Draft motion to dismiss SPE Debtors. EM CRR re motion to dismiss SPE debtors. EM M. Aeder and P. Partee re dismissal of SPE's motion. TC to M. Akins and KCLH re status of TM and patent docs. Distribute dial-in info for conference calls. EM RJD re call info. EM M. Askins re distribution parties for IP docs. CC with Tunnell folks re stipulated order. TC to M. Askins re further turns of docs tonight. EM DBB re status of docs. Research issue of how plan and order address liabilities. All hands CC re surety issues. CC with counsel re Tunnell/NDH. Conference call regarding deed issues. Prep copy of confirmation order for CRR and B. Smith. Edit objection to JPM reserve motion. Meeting re closing docs and outstanding to do list items. Arrange second CC re outstanding issues. EM DBB comments on notice of refiling of plan supplement. EM markup to Stark for CC. Distribute revised liq. Trust Agreement to all parties. EM revised JPM response to RJD and D. Muir. Review agenda for filing tomorrow. EM RJD re status of closing docs. TC with D. Muir re amendments to response. TC with RJD re additional edits to response. Assist with closing documents. Incorporate D. Muir comments into response. CC re outstanding APA issues. CC re outstanding issues for closing. Incorporate RJD's comments into JPM response. All hands CC re outstanding APA issues. Confer with RJD re Tunnell. EM RJD re reserve amount for JPM motion. EM RJD re status of omni hearing. TC with RJD re omni hearing tomorrow morning. EM RJD re effective date and hearing tomorrow. EM T. Walper order re confirmation of NDH Homes. TC with T. Walper re earlier effective date for NDH homes. EM from L. Carter re contract of NDH. TC to L. Carter re outstanding leases with NDH. TC with L. Carter re outstanding NDH contracts and notices to lessees. TC from D. Harris re effective date for NDH homes. EM group at large re effective date for NDH homes. EM R. Stark re NDH Homes effective date notice. EM Stark and Walper re effective date notice for NDH Homes. EM Walper re effective date for NDH homes.
359	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B300	0.80	
359	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B300	1.50	
359	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B300	3.60	
359	SAYDAH	04/10/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.80	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.50	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	1.40	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	1.50	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.40	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.80	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	0.30	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	3.20	
359	SAYDAH	04/12/04	B	B300	1.40	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	0.40	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	0.50	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	1.40	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	1.40	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	1.60	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	2.00	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	1.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B300	3.70	
359	SAYDAH	04/14/04	B	B300	0.50	
359	SAYDAH	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/15/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/16/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/20/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/21/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/21/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/21/04	B	B300	0.20	
359	SAYDAH	04/23/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/23/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/26/04	B	B300	0.20	
359	SAYDAH	04/27/04	B	B300	0.10	
359	SAYDAH	04/27/04	B	B300	0.10	

359	SAYDAH	04/27/04	B	B300	1.10	Finalize effective date notice for NDH.
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.30	Work on bar date motion
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from BSI re: notice of confirmation
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails from GRS re: notice of confirmation
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to BSI and GRS re: notice of confirmation
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Conf with GRS re: admin bar date
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.10	Review admin bar date notice
389	BUTZ	04/01/04	B	B300	0.20	Conf with GRS re: admin bar date (.1); review prepetition bar date motion
389	BUTZ	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from BSI re: notice of confirmation
389	BUTZ	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	Review published notice of confirmation
389	BUTZ	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails with GRS re: notice of confirmation
389	BUTZ	04/02/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from Mitch re: disputed claims reserve in trust agreement
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Msg from GMAC attorney re: collateral
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from CRR re: amendment to plan for 8-K
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to Kennedy Covington the order and plan for the 8-k
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails from GVO re: 8-K and the confirmed plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to GVO re: modifications made to the confirmed plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from Kennedy Covington (GVO) re: order and plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails from K Biron re: plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to K Biron re: plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to K Biron re: confirmed plan vs. filed plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to JViris and A&M re: confirmation order and confirmed plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from Walper re: plan amendments
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to Walper re: plan amendments
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from J Viris re: confirmation order and exhibits
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from K Biron re: modified plan
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from GVO re: plan filed with SEC
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to GVO and D Muir re: plan filed with SEC
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from Muir re: plan filed with SEC
389	BUTZ	04/06/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails with K Biron re: section 9.14 of the plan
389	BUTZ	04/07/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from K Biron re: confirmation order
389	BUTZ	04/07/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to K Biron re: confirmation order
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email and call from H Johnson re: confirmation order for deeds
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from R Smith re: effective-date restructuring
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails from LGH and TAF re: comparison of 2.5 of the trust agreement to the plan
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.20	Review claims against NDH
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to Walper re: NDH
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from CRR re: confirmed plan
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to CRR re: confirmed plan
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to PBE re: workers' compensation claims
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from CRR re: confirmed plan
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email from GVO re: implementation of the Effective Date
389	BUTZ	04/08/04	B	B300	0.10	Email to GVO re: implementation of the plan on the Effective Date
389	BUTZ	04/09/04	B	B300	0.10	Calls from TAF re: NDH and Effective Date
389	BUTZ	04/12/04	B	B300	0.10	Emails from GRS re: Tunnell resolution
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B300	0.30	Conf with GRS and participate in Plan Supp filing
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B300	0.10	Conf with RJD re: plan supplement
389	BUTZ	04/14/04	B	B300	0.20	Emails from CRR re: plan supp and amendment (.1); email to

89	BUTZ	04/14/04 B	B300	0.10	CRR re: plan supp
89	BUTZ	04/14/04 B	B300	0.10	Conf with MGB re: distributions under the plan
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.40	Confirmation of filing of plan supp
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Review NDH stip
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to group re: conf call on NDH issues
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Call with Walper re: NDH issues
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Call to Walper re: NDH
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Emails to RJD re: Tunnell and NDH
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.60	Draft NDH stipulated confirmation order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Conf call re: NDH resolution
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to group re: NDH confirmation order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email from Jaffe re: revisions to order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.50	Revision stipulated order for NDH confirmation
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email from RJD re: NDH order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Quick revisions of NDH confirmation order (.1);email of
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.20	confirmation order to Tunnell counsel, Kuhn counsel, Walper, Stark and RJD (.1)
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.60	Conf call with Tunnell and Kuhn re: NDH order (.4); call with Walper re: NDH order (.2)
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Call from Skadden attorney re: effective date
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Msg from GVO re: Effective Date
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Call with GVO re: effective date
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email from RJD re: NDH order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to Walper, Kuhn and Tunnell re: redline of NDH order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to Kuhn, Tunnell, Walper and Stark re: stipulated confirmation order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.60	Final conf call re: NDH (.4); revise NDH confirmation order (.2)
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to group re: NDH confirmation order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Emails with Stark re: confirmation order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Emails from Walper re: redline of confirmation order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Emails from MAT and Walper re: signatures for NDH agreement
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Emails from Walper re: signature for order
89	BUTZ	04/15/04 B	B300	0.10	Emails from Jaffe re: signature for order
89	BUTZ	04/20/04 B	B300	0.10	Email from R Stark re: NDH effective date
89	BUTZ	04/20/04 B	B300	0.10	Email to DAH re: NDH confirmation order
394	KELLY	03/18/04 B	B300	1.00	Researching punitive damages in context of an allowed claim
394	KELLY	03/19/04 B	B300	0.40	Drafting notice for Stipulation Agreement and Order for JPMorgan agreement
394	KELLY	03/19/04 B	B300	0.20	Editing notice of settlement agreement
394	KELLY	03/31/04 B	B300	0.10	pc w/ R. Stern re transfer of claim
394	KELLY	03/31/04 B	B300	0.20	Conf w/ GDS re transfer of claims
394	KELLY	03/31/04 B	B300	0.10	Message w/ R. Stern re transfer of claims
Total Task:				244.00	80910.00
125	LAMOTTE, III	03/24/04 B	B310	0.30	Claims Administration and Objections
125	LAMOTTE, III	03/26/04 B	B310	0.20	Conference with S. Haney re: large claims.
125	LAMOTTE, III	04/09/04 B	B310	1.50	Conference and email with Haney re: status. Review with S. Haney claims at issue in hearing on 4/16/04, and preparation of defenses.
125	LAMOTTE, III	04/13/04 B	B310	0.30	Teleconference with claimant's counsel re: matters to be heard at 4/16/04 hearing.
125	LAMOTTE, III	04/13/04 B	B310	0.30	Conference with S. Haney re: 4/16/04 hearing.

LINE	NAME	DATE	PRO FORMA	AMOUNT	DESCRIPTION
25	LAMOTTE, III	04/13/04 B	B310	1.80	Document review re: 4/16/04 hearing.
25	LAMOTTE, III	04/14/04 B	B310	1.40	Preparation for litigating substantive claims at 4/16/04 hearing.
303	CULVER	03/03/04 B	B310	0.20	Conf w/GRS re Bloomquist
303	CULVER	03/15/04 B	B310	0.20	Conf w/ Haney re objections
303	CULVER	03/15/04 B	B310	0.20	Conf w/ Saydah re objections
303	CULVER	03/16/04 B	B310	0.20	Email and conf w/Haney re Winford/Lee claims
303	CULVER	03/30/04 B	B310	0.20	Conf w/Haney re Keys claims
303	CULVER	04/07/04 B	B310	0.30	Conf w/GRS and SPH re Keys claims objection
309	DEHNEY	03/02/04 B	B310	0.10	Discuss expert reports on REMICS w/GRS
309	DEHNEY	03/02/04 B	B310	1.10	Review Remic pleadings
309	DEHNEY	03/04/04 B	B310	0.80	Review and revise exhibit for stip with JPMorgan.
309	DEHNEY	03/04/04 B	B310	3.50	Review/revise stip from S. Serpe re: REMIC claims.
309	DEHNEY	03/05/04 B	B310	0.30	Review/revise stip with JPMorgan Chase on C. Ward comments.
309	DEHNEY	03/08/04 B	B310	0.30	Review order from tie-down litigation.
309	DEHNEY	03/09/04 B	B310	1.40	Review and update WIP List.
309	DEHNEY	03/10/04 B	B310	0.20	Discuss hearing on Friday w/GRS/PP
309	DEHNEY	03/10/04 B	B310	0.10	Review GRS e-mail to Committee re ADR of Williams' claims.
309	DEHNEY	03/10/04 B	B310	0.10	Review GRS e-mail to Committee re settlements.
309	DEHNEY	03/10/04 B	B310	0.10	Review WIP
309	DEHNEY	03/10/04 B	B310	0.50	Review/revise agenda for REMIC hearing.
309	DEHNEY	03/11/04 B	B310	1.50	Discussions w/Twalper re: possible settlement.
309	DEHNEY	03/11/04 B	B310	0.10	Review GRS e-mail to Committee re additional settlement.
309	DEHNEY	03/15/04 B	B310	1.80	Prep for tomorrow's hrg.
309	DEHNEY	03/15/04 B	B310	1.20	Attend hearing.
309	DEHNEY	03/16/04 B	B310	0.10	Discuss estimation motion w/GRS
309	DEHNEY	03/17/04 B	B310	0.10	GRS e-mail re: attys representing Oakwood in Woodall litigation.
309	DEHNEY	03/17/04 B	B310	0.20	Discuss mediation of cases w/GRS
309	DEHNEY	03/18/04 B	B310	1.00	Review draft objection and motion to compel mediation.
309	DEHNEY	03/18/04 B	B310	0.70	Discuss objection/mediation motion w/GRS/MGB
309	DEHNEY	03/18/04 B	B310	0.50	Review/comment on Adams 9019 motion
309	DEHNEY	03/22/04 B	B310	0.80	Discuss status of claims resolutions w/MGB/DBB/GRS
309	DEHNEY	03/23/04 B	B310	0.10	GRS e-mail re: claims against New Dimension.
309	DEHNEY	03/31/04 B	B310	0.50	Discuss status of objections and preference issues w/DBB/DLC/GRS
309	DEHNEY	03/31/04 B	B310	0.30	Admin claims bar date conf. call w/CW/DBB/GRS
309	DEHNEY	03/31/04 B	B310	0.30	Mtg. w/DOH/DLC re: prefs and claims.
309	DEHNEY	04/08/04 B	B310	0.20	Discuss remic objection w/GRS
309	DEHNEY	04/08/04 B	B310	0.10	GRS e-mail re corpus of liquidation trust.
309	DEHNEY	04/15/04 B	B310	0.50	Review/comment on stip w/JPMorgan re 17th omni objection.
309	DEHNEY	04/15/04 B	B310	1.00	On call w/RS/SV/MK/DM/GRS re status of agenda, claims objections and REMIC motion.
322	ABBOTT	03/16/04 B	B310	0.30	Mtg w/ DLC re: claims and preference resolution issues
322	ABBOTT	03/16/04 B	B310	0.10	Tc w/ Ward re: payments to financial institutions net of new value, need for backup
322	ABBOTT	03/16/04 B	B310	0.10	Call to Carter re: 90 day wire transfer payments
322	ABBOTT	03/16/04 B	B310	0.30	Mtg w/ DLC re: preferential payments
322	ABBOTT	03/17/04 B	B310	0.10	Call to Carter re: wire transfers
322	ABBOTT	03/17/04 B	B310	0.50	Tc w/ Carter re: status
322	ABBOTT	03/18/04 B	B310	0.10	CORRESP. W/ CARTER RE: WIRE TRANSFERS
322	ABBOTT	03/22/04 B	B310	0.90	Review wire transfer info
322	ABBOTT	03/22/04 B	B310	0.20	Review wire data.
338	WERKHEISER	04/12/04 B	B310	0.20	Telephone conference with WOL regarding claims objection.

LINE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	PRO FORMA	AMOUNT
46	BUSENKELL	03/01/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/01/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/01/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/02/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/02/04 B	B310	0.30
46	BUSENKELL	03/02/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/02/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/03/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/03/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/03/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/04/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/04/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/05/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/08/04 B	B310	0.30
46	BUSENKELL	03/08/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/08/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/09/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/10/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/10/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/10/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/11/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/12/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/15/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/16/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/16/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/16/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/18/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/18/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/18/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/18/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/19/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/22/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/22/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/22/04 B	B310	0.30
46	BUSENKELL	03/22/04 B	B310	0.10
46	BUSENKELL	03/23/04 B	B310	0.40
46	BUSENKELL	03/23/04 B	B310	0.20
46	BUSENKELL	03/24/04 B	B310	0.50

Telephone call with M. Gilles re Adams settlement  
Telephone call with K. Biron re LaSalle stipulation  
Telephone call with K. Biron re LaSalle Bristol claim  
Review and edit corr. to South Coast Air Quality Mgt District re claim  
Telephone call with B. Gifford re Tyler/Windham claim and South Coast  
Telephone call to B. Gifford re Tyler/Windham claim  
Discuss lease rejection claims with GRS  
Discuss WARN act claims with S. Haney  
Receive and respond to corr. from B. Gifford re T. West matter  
Receive and respond to corr. from B. Gifford re m. Webster setoff  
Telephone call to D. Whitley re Davison complaint  
Receive and review corr. from M. Weyker re quality resin systems  
Receive and review response to claims objection from A. Couch  
Review and edit Adams settlement agreement  
Respond to corr. from E. Lyle re payment of arbitrator  
Revise and edit Adams settlement agreement  
Receive and review motion to reconsider filed by R. Baker  
Receive and review corr. from B. Gifford re South Coast Air Quality  
Respond to corr. from M. Watkins re LaSalle stipulation  
Receive and review corr. from E. Lyle re Dominguez claim  
Receive and review response of Bradley to claims objection  
Telephone call with MW re tax claims  
Telephone call with R. Randall re claim  
Receive and review response of Owner's Choice to claims objection  
Receive and review response of Doughertys to claims objection  
Prepare corr. to M. Weyker and C. Ward re Triple Mobile claim  
Prepare corr. to B. Gifford re Hale County stay relief  
Receive and review corr. from Arkansas Ins. Comm.  
Telephone call to K. Pak re Chateau administrative claim  
Receive and review corr. and settlement agreement from R Loftis re Adams litigation  
Respond to corr. from M./ Watkins re LaSalle stipulation  
Discuss motion to compel mediation with GRS  
Discuss mediation and arbitration procedures with GRS  
Discuss Dimick claim with GRS  
Prepare Adams 9019 motion  
Telephone call with C. Kunz re Lacial Thomas claim  
Receive and review analysis from C. unz re L. Thomas claim  
Respond to corr. from L. Carter re L. Thomas claim  
Review and edit Adams 9019 motion and order  
Prepare corr. to R. Stark and G. Gordon re Adams claim  
Conf. call with R. Smith and E&Y re tax claims  
Review and finalize K. Adams 9019 motion  
Telephone call with S. Davis and N. Flagg re objections to

Line	Client	Date	Code	Value	Description
6	BUSENKELL	03/24/04	B	0.10	tax claims
6	BUSENKELL	03/25/04	B	0.10	Telephone call with C. Kunz re L. Thomas claim
6	BUSENKELL	03/26/04	B	0.10	Receive and review proof of cure claim by JP Morgan
6	BUSENKELL	03/30/04	B	0.30	Receive and review objection of K. Allen to ADR designation
6	BUSENKELL	03/30/04	B	0.30	Telephone call with Cory Menneet re Baker/Hoovy claims and TRO
6	BUSENKELL	03/31/04	B	0.20	Telephone call with R. Smith re Continental Estates indemnification claim
16	BUSENKELL	03/31/04	B	0.20	Telephone call with B. Gifford re punitive damage claims
16	BUSENKELL	03/31/04	B	0.10	Telephone call with P. Vlokas re S. Powers claim
16	BUSENKELL	04/05/04	B	0.10	Telephone call to L. Carter re L. Thomas claim
16	BUSENKELL	04/06/04	B	0.10	Telephone call to C. Kunz re Lecil Thomas claim
16	BUSENKELL	04/07/04	B	0.30	Telephone call with L. Carter re L. Thomas claim and GECC equipment
46	BUSENKELL	04/07/04	B	0.10	Telephone call to C. Kunz re L. Thomas claim
46	BUSENKELL	04/07/04	B	0.20	Telephone call with K. Velhuis re GMAC treatment
46	BUSENKELL	04/07/04	B	0.30	Telephone call with C. Ward and M. Weyker re payment of administrative claims
46	BUSENKELL	04/07/04	B	0.20	Telephone call with C. Kunz re L. Thomas claim
46	BUSENKELL	04/07/04	B	0.20	Receive and review amortization schedule of L. Thomas claim
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04	B	0.10	Respond to corr. from B. Hendricks re Universal Forest reclamation claim
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04	B	0.10	Telephone call to A. Riley re tax claims
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04	B	0.10	Telephone call to A. Riley re tax claims
46	BUSENKELL	04/08/04	B	0.10	Prepare corr. to C. Kunz re Lecil Thomas claim
46	BUSENKELL	04/13/04	B	0.20	Receive and respond to corr. from R. Smith re affidavit for tax claims objections
46	BUSENKELL	04/13/04	B	0.10	Revise and edit corr. to NAMG re administrative claim
46	BUSENKELL	04/14/04	B	0.10	Telephone call to B. Gifford re litigation claims
46	BUSENKELL	04/14/04	B	0.30	Telephone call with B. Gifford re objection/liquidation of administrative claims
354	MCWILLAN	03/03/04	B	1.00	Review litigation claims
354	MCWILLAN	03/09/04	B	0.30	Review litigation claims
354	MCWILLAN	03/10/04	B	0.10	Review litigation claim
354	MCWILLAN	03/11/04	B	0.80	Review litigation claims
354	MCWILLAN	03/12/04	B	0.60	Review litigation claims
354	MCWILLAN	03/15/04	B	0.60	Review litigation claims
354	MCWILLAN	04/07/04	B	0.30	Review litigation claims
354	MCWILLAN	04/12/04	B	0.20	Confer w/ S Haney re Linda Lee litigation claim
354	MCWILLAN	04/14/04	B	0.10	E-mails to & from B Pardue re Eubanks litigation claims
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	TC to Audrey Weeks re claim.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	1.10	Finalize letter to Amy Brown re Stanfield.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	EM BSI re Carolina ballots.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	Review Pitre letter from Gifford.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	EM B. Norcum re Stanfield letter.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	Review submission of POC for 24th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	Review submission of POC for 27th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	Review submission of POC for 28th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	EM BSI re mailing of ballots for 2E
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	0.10	EM L. Carter and B. Norcum re info for Double Eagle.
359	SAYDAH	03/01/04	B	3.70	Research golden eagle claim and research relevant case law.
359	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B	0.10	EM dismissal to K. Welch in Berry Case.
359	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B	0.40	Research Saldana claim.

LINE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	PRO FORMA	AMOUNT	DETAILS
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.30	EM B. Gifford re contact info for attys.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	EM MGB re revised letter to vendors.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	Confer with RJD re expert reports on REMICS.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	EM expert report to Hunton folks.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	EM L. Lyle re additional ADR folks.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re conversion of data to excel for exhibits.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.30	TC with R. Saldana oversees re evidence and representation by counsel.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.60	Revise letter from company to vendors re admin claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	EM DBB re final admin bar date.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	Research claim of NW Justice Project.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	Review 502(b)(6) calculation with MGB.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.30	EM L. Carter and B. Norcum re Golden Eagle.
59	SAYDAH	03/02/04	B310	0.10	Review Lawrence claim and reduction thereof.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	1.10	Review stip for Jp Morgan to resolve omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	TC with S. Serpe re stip.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	TC to C. Simpson re Saldana.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.20	Review and research Robert Reed Plywood claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re purchased cross case dupes and objections thereto.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM J. Lurie re settlement offer for NW Justice claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM SPH re WARN distributions.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	Confer with SPH re analysis of litigation claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re zero dollar claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM K. Gerber re objecting to zero dollar claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.40	TC with J. Miller re terms of settlement, confer with DLC and DOH re new value and EM co-counsel.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.40	Review settlement agreement with Oakwood.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	TC with JGM re Saldana situation.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.70	Research mediation of ADR claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.20	Confer with MGB re letter to vendors.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.20	TC with C. Simpson re Saldana claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.50	TC to M. Gilles re Saldana claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.80	Review and research Saldana claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM from M. Gilles re Saldana.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM M. Gilles re getting docs on Saldana.
59	SAYDAH	03/03/04	B310	0.10	EM BSI re errors in database and fixing them.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM J. Miller re alleged admin claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	TC from R. Silberglied re docs filed under seal.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM Committee re settlement of certain claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	TC to R. Silberglied re copies of docs filed earlier in the case.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	TC to A. Wilkerson re docs filed under seal in Feb.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.20	EM A Brown re Stanfield and pushing off hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re quality resin claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM A. Brown re pushing the dates for stanfield until april.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM RF re extension of bar date for any brown and stanfields for 25th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.30	TC with C. Ward re various claims issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re objections to duplicate cross-case claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re nature of objections to zero dollar claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM E. Lyle re 4th round of ADR claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re substantive consolidation.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B310	0.10	Confer with P. Partee re remic issues.

59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with C. Simpson re Saldana claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B	B310	0.10	TC to Cameron Simpson.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B	B310	3.60	Review and revise stip from S. Serpe re REMIC claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/04/04	B	B310	0.80	Review and revise exhibit for stip with JPMorgan.
59	SAYDAH	03/05/04	B	B310	0.30	Revise stip with JPMorgan Chase on C. Ward comments.
59	SAYDAH	03/05/04	B	B310	0.30	TC with C. Ward and C. Murray re claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/05/04	B	B310	0.30	TC to
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM BSI re problem with website
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	TC to SPH re Ada Couch.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	TC to JGM re Ada Couch.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM BSI and C. Ward re updated creditor information.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	TC from JGM re Ada Couch.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM E. Lyle re appeal of tie-down order.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Gifford re settlement of Langston claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Gifford re S. Keys claimants.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Wright re State Farm claims and hearing on motion.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM JGM and SPH re Bryant claims void ab initio.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	1.50	Prep of spreadsheet for top 10 litigation claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re amendment of an allowed claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM BSI and C. Ward re objecting to allowed claim when amended by claimant.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM S. Serpe re stip with JPMorgan.
59	SAYDAH	03/08/04	B	B310	0.30	Review order from tie-down litigation.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	1.30	Draft spreadsheet for major litigation resolution.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM from B. Gifford re settling Langston claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with DOH re exhibits for upcoming omnis.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM RJD and DCA re REMIC hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.30	TC with creditor re status of case and possible schedule of payments.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM MGB re motion to reconsider.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with PJW chambers re evidentiary hearing and notice requirements therefor.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.40	TC with J. Galban re REMIC agenda and issues related thereto.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	Review letter from NW Justice Project.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.60	Review and revise agenda for REMIC hearing and distribute to relevant parties.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with S. Brady re Molina arbitration.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	1.40	Review and update WIP List.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re docs on litigation claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM E. Lyle re motion for reconsideration and appeal of SC tie down summary judgment.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM Committee re settlements.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM K. Welch re committee approval of settlements.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with J. Galban re agenda for REMIC hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re Espinoza response to 24th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM C. Kunz re stip and ADR.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM Committee re ADR of Williams' claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with K. Lamaina re balloting issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM from K. Lamaina re ARC votes.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.10	EM BSI re ARC votes.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.40	TC with K. Lamaina re specifics of service on her clients for voting packages.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	B	B310	0.30	EM BSI re info appearing on website.



LINE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	AMOUNT	STATUS	REMARKS
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.30	B310	TC with C. Ward re JD Edwards agreements and various other claims issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.20	B310	Review Latham response and POC.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.50	B310	TC with K. LaMaina re ARC.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	TC with Pachulski re additional JD Edwards agreements.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM C. Ward re Latham letter to Court.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM C. Ward re basis for objection to claims of Latham.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM WIP to team.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.50	B310	Revise agenda for REMIC hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.30	B310	Review claims of Marion Williams and stip and EM B. Gifford re situation.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.40	B310	Research re objections to PI claims.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM RF re filing affidavits for service of omni orders.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM from M. Fisco re REMIC hearing on Friday.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	TC to D. Muir re REMIC hearing on Friday.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	TC to D. Muir re hearing Friday.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.20	B310	Confer with RJD and P. Partee re hearing on Friday.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM B. Gifford re Williams claim and ADR.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	EM B. Gifford re ADR of PI claims.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	TC from B. Gifford re Williams and ADR of PI claims.
359	SAYDAH	03/10/04	0.10	B310	TC from L. Lyle re withdrawal of POCs.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	EM BSI re voting packages.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	TC with K. LaMaina re amount of ARC claims on ballots and various plan issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	TCS from K. LaMaina re compression of claims on ballots.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM claims group re Textron.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	TC with D. Jerina of Libertas partners re hearing information.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	TC with K. LaMaina re ARC claims and plan objection resolution.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	TC to K. Gerber re issues with website.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM Committee re additional settlement.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM PED re terms of Textron order.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM RF re Textron order.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.30	B310	TC with K. Gerber re website and voting issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM JGM and SPH re status of Eubanks claims.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	EM B. Wright re putting off the omni stuff until April.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	EM C. Ward re changes to objection codes.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	File withdrawal of CNO for 26th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.20	B310	TC with K. LaMaina re execution of ballot.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	TC with K. LaMaina re timing for extension.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM RF re withdrawing CNO to 26th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	Review CNO for 26th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	Review CNO for 27th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	Review CNO for 28th omni.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	TC with K. LaMaina re extension on filing objection to plan.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	EM RF re pending omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	TC from K. Gerber re ARC claims.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	2.40	B310	Work with T. Walper on possible settlement.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	1.70	B310	Prep for and participate in WIP call.
359	SAYDAH	03/11/04	0.10	B310	TC from Hunt Brown.
359	SAYDAH	03/12/04	0.10	B310	TC from B. Drantell re claims issue.
359	SAYDAH	03/12/04	0.10	B310	TC to E. Battista re agenda.
359	SAYDAH	03/12/04	0.10	B310	EM C. Murray re errors on voting report.

AKWOOD HOMES 8132-DIP

PRO FORMA	61774	AS OF 04/28/04	INVOICE# 38044
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	Attend REMIC Hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	Prep for hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	EM RF re agenda for C. Ward.
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	TC with Donna Culyer re preference and other claims issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	TC from Lawrence in Navasota, TX re admin claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	EM DOH and SPH re upcoming omnis.
59	SAYDAH	03/12/04 B	Confer with SPH re 24th omni issues and future omni issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	EM DOH re omni objections.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	TC to C. Ward re Little claim.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	EM B. Pardue re CC on S. Keys claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	Confer with SPH re revised order for 24th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	TC with C. Ward re Little claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	EM SPH and DOH re additional objections.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	EM BSI re claims of Fred Toms.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	Confer with SPH re 24th omni and other claims issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	EM SPH re revised order for hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	TC to PJW chambers re telephonic appearances and 27th omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	Review REMIC ballots.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	TC to E. Drantell re claims objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	Review response of Little & Dranttel.
59	SAYDAH	03/15/04 B	Hearing prep for hearing tomorrow morning.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Prep revised order for 27th omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Prep revised order for 26th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Prep amended order for 25th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Confer with SPH re pro se attendees at the hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	TC with M. Velez re final fee app.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Review letter from A. Brown re Stanfield's claims and counteroffice.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	EM C. Murray re ballot certification.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	EM A. Brown re counter offer.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	EM L. Carter and B. Norcum re Stanfield counter offer.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Confer with DBB re REMIC votes.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	TC to B. Gallerie re voting process.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	CC with DBB and K. laMaina re objection deadline.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Review EM from L. Carter re Stanfield counteroffer.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Confer with RF re notification of persons on the omni hearing agendas.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	TC with M. Lawrence of Navasota, TX re order on 27th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	TC with C. Ward re convenience class.
59	SAYDAH	03/16/04 B	Attend and participate in omni hearing.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	EM C. Murray re updated exhibits.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	EM ABK re revised omni exhibits.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	TC with ABK re revision of DOH's omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	EM BSI re timing of filing omni objections.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	EM C. Murray re further edits to omni objection exhibits.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Confer with WP re service of omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Review edits to 29th omni.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Review 30th omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	TC with C. Ward re claims to pull from omnis.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Review 31st omni objection.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Confer with A. Kelly re claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Confer with RJD re mediation of cases.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	Confer with ABK re omni objections.
59	SAYDAH	03/17/04 B	

LINE	DESCRIPTION	DATE	AMOUNT	STATUS	REMARKS
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	EM BSI re edits to voting report.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	Confer with RF re notices for omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	EM BSI re services lists.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	Confer with RF re service of omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	EM BSI re service of omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	EM RJD re attys representing Oakwood in Woodall litigation.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	TC with B. Pardue re attys representing Oakwood in Woodall.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	Confer with RJD re estimation motion.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	Confer with ABK re hearing for upcoming omnis.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.10	B	EM C. Murray re edits to omni exhibits.
359	SAYDAH	03/17/04	0.20	B	TC with C. Kunz re ADR of Williams claim.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.20	B	EM B. Gifford re ADR or Williams claim.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	EM T. Naimoli re filing omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	EM C. Murray re 33rd omni headings.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	File 30th omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	EM BSI re service of omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	EM B. Gifford re langston claims.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	TC with C. Ward re 9th omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	Review 33rd omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.80	B	Review 32nd omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.20	B	Review 30th omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.40	B	TC with C. Murray.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	Research history of claims and draft objection and motion to compel mediation.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	4.60	B	EM DBB re late ballot info.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	EM BSI re versions of voting report.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.20	B	Confer with MGB re mediation motion.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.20	B	TC with C. Ward re claims objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.70	B	Confer with MGB and RJD re objection/mediation motion.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	Review 31st omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	Review 32nd omni objection.
359	SAYDAH	03/18/04	0.10	B	EM C. Ward re filing of omni objections.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	EM R. Stark re settlement of claim.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.40	B	CC with R. Smith and D. Butz re tax claims and plan issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	Confer with DBB re order on settlement.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	Confer with DBB re claims of US Govt.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	CC with C. Ward, M. Weyker and DBB re claims of US Govt.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.50	B	EM BSI re claims checking.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	Lawrence letter re claim.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	EM C. Ward re 9th omni issues.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	EM DOH re 29th omni exhibit.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	TC with Ark. Dept. of Ins.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.20	B	EM RF re affidavit of service for filing.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	Confer with SPH re CC with Gifford.
359	SAYDAH	03/19/04	0.10	B	TC from R. Stark re REMIC voting.
359	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	B	EM from MGB re presentation in court.
359	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	B	EM R. Stark re REMIC voting report.
359	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	B	TC with Patrick re claim of FX5.
359	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	B	TC to J. Silverman re Babson.
359	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.10	B	Confer with RJD, MGB and DBB re status of claims resolutions.
359	SAYDAH	03/22/04	0.80	B	Confer with DBB re status of docs in Oakwood.
359	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.20	B	EM RJD re claims against New Dimension.
359	SAYDAH	03/23/04	0.20	B	TC with Pia Gallegos re Tsinigini.

JTE:06/28/04 12:06:35  
AKWOOD HOMES  
1132-DIP

PRO FORMA 61774 AS OF 04/28/04

INVOICE# 38044

59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Gifford re tie down claimants.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	B	B310	0.10	EM D. Muir re AEGON objection to REMIC settlement.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with C. Ward re Toms Claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/23/04	B	B310	0.10	EM P. Boyette re Toms' Claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/25/04	B	B310	0.10	EM S. Serpe re edits to stip.
59	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B310	0.10	EM A. Taylor re city of perris taxes.
59	SAYDAH	03/26/04	B	B310	0.10	EM K. LaMaina re status of order.
59	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B310	0.10	EM the Committee re another settlement.
59	SAYDAH	03/29/04	B	B310	0.40	Review comments from Serpe on stip with JPMorgan re REMIC POCs and email S. Serpe.
59	SAYDAH	03/30/04	B	B310	0.10	EM SPH and DLC re CC with B. Gifford.
59	SAYDAH	03/30/04	B	B310	1.20	Revise Notice of Confirmation.
59	SAYDAH	03/30/04	B	B310	0.20	CC with C. Ward re edits to exhibits.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	TC from MGB re the Baker & Hovey.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.20	EM M. Storms re status of REMIC stuff.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.30	CC with C. Ward, RJD and DBB re admin claims bar date.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	TC to Corey Mennet re Baker & Hovey.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.50	Confer with DLC, DBB and RJD re status of objections and preference issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with C. Ward re admin bar date issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer with C. Ward re effective date.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with C. Ward re Hovey.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with DBB re claims issues.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	EM Draft of notice of confirmation to C. Ward.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer with A. Kelly re transferred claims.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.30	Research Baker & Hovey situation.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.20	Draft revised admin POC form.
59	SAYDAH	03/31/04	B	B310	0.10	File notice of submission of POCs.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with M. Lawrence of Navasota, TX re POC form.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.20	Review Order on Lawrence claim.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with J. Hofmann re Lawrence claim.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Gallerie re edits to admin bar date notice.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with B. Gallerie re bar date printing.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Gallerie admin claim form.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Gallerie re additional notice parties.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Johnson re BOA claims
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM L. Carter re amended claim for Cisco.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.20	Call atty for BOA.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	2.30	Revise admin bar date form.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM RF re updating WIP list for omni objections.
59	SAYDAH	04/01/04	B	B310	0.10	EM List of adr claims to committee for approval.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Pardue re ADR claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	TC from E. Lyle re status of ADR folks.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	Review notices of claims to submit to ADR.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	EM K. Welch re status of automatic stay violation.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	TC from B. Johnson re BOA claim.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with C. Ward re claims issues for upcoming omnis.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	EM R. Stark re additional ADR parties.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.10	EM E. Lyle re approval from Committee of ADR folks.
59	SAYDAH	04/02/04	B	B310	0.60	Confer with SPH re claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/05/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with DOH re BOA claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/05/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with Bruce Johnson re BOA claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/05/04	B	B310	0.10	EM S. Serpe re comments on stip.
59	SAYDAH	04/05/04	B	B310	0.70	CC with DOH and B. Johnson re BOA and Greenpoint claims.

59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with A. Wilkinson re US Bank response to JPM.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with RJD re response to JPM Motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with DCA re review of claims online.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with creditor re docs received and convenience class.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	1.60	Review JPMorgan amended motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with creditor from Doffin Capital re leases.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	1.20	Draft response to JPMorgan revised motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with creditor re admin POC form.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.10	Research the requirements for a stay pending appeal.
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	1.50	Review pleadings of JPMorgan re REMIC litigation and
59	SAYDAH	04/06/04	B	B310	0.90	guarantees.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re additional exhibits to omnis.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	EM C. Ward re additional claims and whether or not to
						object at this time.
						TC with H. Veldhuis re BOA claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Johnson re continuation of claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with JGM re objections and going forward.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	TC to J. Galban re proposed settlement numbers.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with SPH re Winford and Lee claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/07/04	B	B310	0.90	TC with creditor from Regent Capital in NYC re service of
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	papers on purchased claim.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with D. Muir re Deloitte numbers for REMICs.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM JPM supplement to A. Wilkinson at Faegre.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM RJD and DBB re corpus of liquidation trust.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM D. Muir re corpus of liquidation trust.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with B. Pardue re Winford & Lee docs.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM SPH re winford and lee representation.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with DBB re claims against New Dimension.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM DBB spreadsheet re New Dimension claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with DBB re claims against NDH.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	EM J. Galban re changes to REMIC numbers.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	TC from C. Ward re 2nd and 3rd omnis.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with A. Brown re extension of objection deadline.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.10	Review settlement docs from Sewkis.
59	SAYDAH	04/08/04	B	B310	0.20	Confer with RJD re remic objection.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM A. Wilkinson re exhibit B to the supp to the JPM motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM A. Wilkinson re supplement to JPM motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	TC from J. Dougherty re hearing on Friday.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM D. Muir re calculation of estimation motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM D. Muir a draft of our response.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with Peter Vaden re admin claim and case against Oakwood
						currently pending.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.20	TC with J. Galban re filing objection to JPMorgan response.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	EM P. Partee re bankruptcy court approval for merging SPES
						into OSHC.
						Send settlement agreement to D. Muir.
59	SAYDAH	04/09/04	B	B310	0.10	Revise objection to JPM Motion.
59	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B310	1.80	EM M. Shelky re Conroe issue.
59	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	TC with J. Pearson re status of admin claim.
59	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B310	0.10	Confer with SPH, WOL and RJD re pending litigation issues.
59	SAYDAH	04/13/04	B	B310	0.70	EM Hunt Brown re settlement of claim.
59	SAYDAH	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	EM B. Wright re State Farm motion and continuance.
59	SAYDAH	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	EM A. Wilkinson re status of agreed order.
59	SAYDAH	04/14/04	B	B310	0.10	EM R. Stark re ADR of Dougherty and Bradley claims.
59	SAYDAH	04/14/04	B	B310	0.20	

TE:06/28/04 12:06:35  
KWOOD HOMES  
132-DIP

PRO FORMA 61774 AS OF 04/28/04 INVOICE# 38044

LINE	DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
59	04/14/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/14/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	1.00
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.20
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	1.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	3.30
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.30
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.20
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	1.80
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/15/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/21/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
59	04/26/04	SAYDAH B	0.10
63	03/04/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	03/08/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	03/08/04	HARRIS B	0.20
63	03/09/04	HARRIS B	1.30
63	03/09/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	03/09/04	HARRIS B	0.20
63	03/10/04	HARRIS B	0.20
63	03/15/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	03/17/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	03/17/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	03/17/04	HARRIS B	1.10
63	03/19/04	HARRIS B	0.30
63	03/31/04	HARRIS B	0.30
63	04/05/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	04/05/04	HARRIS B	0.90
63	04/13/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	04/13/04	HARRIS B	0.10
63	04/15/04	HARRIS B	0.30
370	03/02/04	HANEY B	0.20
370	03/02/04	HANEY B	0.30
370	03/03/04	HANEY B	0.90
370	03/03/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/03/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/03/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/03/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/05/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/09/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/09/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/09/04	HANEY B	0.50
370	03/10/04	HANEY B	0.10
370	03/10/04	HANEY B	0.20
370	03/10/04	HANEY B	0.40
370	03/10/04	HANEY B	0.30

TC from creditor re proposed deal.  
TC from Hunt Brown re Golden Eagle and continuance.  
CC with RJD, R. Stark, S. Varner, M. Kvarda and D. Muir re status of agenda, claims objections and REMIC motion.  
CC with C. Ward and S. Varner regarding upcoming claims objections.  
TC to S. Serpe re status of stip on 17th omni.  
File CNO for first interim fee app of E&Y.  
Draft 35th omni objection.  
Draft 34th omni objection to claims.  
CC with SPH and B. Gifford re pending and continued litigation issues.  
TC with Carol Bradley re status of proofs of claim.  
TC with B. Pardue re pending litigation issues.  
Revise stip with JPMorgan re 17th omni objection.  
TC to S. Serpe re parties to stip on 17th omni.  
EM from D. Muir re NDH.  
TC to R. Stark re effective date for NDH Homes.  
TC to B. Gifford re indem claims.  
TC w/ D. Surette re indem claims.  
Draft and send email to B. Gifford re claims obj.  
Revise 29th omni and draft exhibits.  
Corresp w/ B. Gifford re exhibits to 29th.  
Revise exhibits to 29th obj.  
TC w/ B. Gifford re indem claims.  
Mult corresp w/ GRS and SPH re claims objs.  
TC w/ rmf re service of 33d omni.  
Review/sign notices re 33d omni.  
TC w/ E. Lyle re 33d omni dec.  
Finalize 33d omni and exhibits.  
Review indem claims and conf w/ GRS re same.  
Conf w/ RJD and DLC re prefs and claims.  
TC w/ GRS re 29th omni.  
TC w/ B. Johnson and GRS re 29th omni claims.  
Conf w/ GRS re claims hrg.  
Conf w/ SPH re claims hrg.  
Revise order re 29th omni and conf w/ GRS re same.  
Correspondence from C. Ward re: litigation claims  
Correspondence from W. Gifford re: claim objection; review file, confer w/ JGM  
Review claim information re: employee claims  
Confer w/ GRS re: employee claims  
Confer w/ MGB re: employee claims  
Confer w/ C. Ward re: employee claims  
Correspondence w/ C. Ward re: employee claims  
Correspondence re: objections  
Fwd new claim materials to cd for prep  
Correspondence re: response to couch claim  
Correspondence re: updated litigation claims for objections  
Correspondence re: bradley claim  
Confer w/ CD and GRS re: claim objections  
Revise status report, correspondence re: 24th omni objections  
Correspondence re: espino claim