

EXHIBIT D

EXHIBIT D
Sorted by Fee Code

Name of Professional	Position	Rank	Description	Date Incurred	Hourly Billing Rate	Hours	Total Compensation	Billing Code	Billing Code Description
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Discussion with Nancy Flagg of Ernst & Young regarding the Oakwood Homes Plan of Liquidation	4/9/2004	275	0.8	220.00	101	Internal Meetings of Staff
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Update of claims objections status to Mike Johnson of Ernst & Young in preparation for conversation with Randlelle Smith of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	525	0.3	157.50	101	Internal Meetings of Staff
Johnson, Michael R.	Senior Managers	21	Discussions with Shawn Smith and Seth Davis related to the status of all claims and work with Oakwood Homes Corporation for purposes of discussion with Administrator of the Liquidation Trust.	4/15/2004	525	2.0	1,050.00	101	Internal Meetings of Staff
Totals for Code 101 - Internal Meetings of Staff							3.1	1,427.50	
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randlelle Smith of Oakwood Homes requesting a review of the property tax objections for the completed jurisdictions	4/6/2004	275	0.5	137.50	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randlelle Smith of Oakwood Homes regarding her availability to review finalized objections upon completion	4/9/2004	275	0.4	110.00	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Flagg, Nancy A.	Senior Managers	21	Email of Wall Street Journal article regarding \$95 million to Randlelle Smith of Oakwood Homes	4/9/2004	525	0.3	157.50	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randlelle Smith of Oakwood Homes for her review of the finalized basis for objections spreadsheet	4/14/2004	275	1.1	302.50	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Totals for Code 104 - General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee							2.3	707.50	
Johnson, Michael R.	Senior Managers	21	Bankruptcy Hearing Conference Call relating to Quarterly Fee Applications	4/15/2004	525	1.0	525.00	106	Prepare for and Attend Court Hearings
Totals for Code 106 - Prepare for and Attend Court Hearings							1.0	525.00	
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Discussion with Steve Terno of Latham and Watkins regarding the Oakwood Homes Plan of Liquidation	4/9/2004	275	0.3	82.50	204	Meetings with Other Parties
Totals for Code 204 - Meetings with Other Parties							0.3	82.50	
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Gb Saydah of Morris Nichols regarding fee application questions	4/6/2004	275	0.5	137.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Discussion with Gb Saydah of Morris Nichols regarding the March Interim Fee Application for Ernst & Young and final fee application	4/6/2004	275	0.7	192.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Johnson, Michael R.	Senior Managers	21	Determination regarding billing and invoice issues for final billing upon movement to liquidating trust	4/9/2004	525	2.0	1,050.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of attachment detail and initial preparation of March Interim Fee Application for Ernst & Young	4/22/2004	275	6.0	1,650.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Finalization of preparation of March Interim Fee Application of Ernst & Young	4/28/2004	275	6.8	1,870.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Reviewed March interim fee application for Ernst & Young's services provided to Oakwood Homes.	4/28/2004	575	0.5	287.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Initial draft of Final Fee Application of Ernst & Young	6/7/2004	275	3.2	880.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of attachment detail and initial preparation of Final Fee Application for Ernst & Young	6/8/2004	275	3.1	852.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of attachment detail and initial preparation of Final Fee Application for Ernst & Young	6/9/2004	275	2.1	577.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Finalization of preparation of Final Fee Application of Ernst & Young	6/10/2004	275	3.4	935.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Totals for Code 300 - Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications							28.3	8,432.50	
Buchbinder, Elizabeth N	Partners, Principals & Directors - National	11	Conference call with Randlelle Smith of Oakwood Homes and Mike Johnson of Ernst & Young regarding reimbursement of COBRA premiums	4/9/2004	650	1.0	650.00	614	Assistance with All Employment Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds

Name of Professional	Position	Rank	Description	Date Incurred	Hourly Billing Rate	Hours	Total Compensation	Billing Code	Billing Code Description
Lowery, Kristie L	Senior Managers	21	Discussions with Mike Johnson of Ernst & Young regarding procedure issues with carryover of FICA wages. Prepared documentation regarding transfer of payroll tax liens and emailed to Randelle Smith of Oakwood Homes	4/9/2004	625	2.1	1,102.50	614	Assistance with All Employment Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Totals for Code 614 - Assistance with All Employment Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds									
Grossman, Marc T.	Managers	32	Initial draft of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum regarding sales and use tax implications of repairs to Manufactured homes prior to January 1, 2000.	4/12/2004	385	2.0	770.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Research relating to sales and use tax implications of repairs to manufactured homes prior to January 1, 2000 and review of initial memorandum draft by Marc Grossman of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	575	1.2	680.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Grossman, Marc T.	Managers	32	Finalization of draft of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum following discussion with Frank DeLuca of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	385	0.5	192.50	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Brown, Kimberly V	Managers	32	Review Ohio sales and use tax memorandum as prepared by Marc Grossman of Ernst & Young and related discussion regarding the issue with Marc Grossman and Frank DeLuca of Ernst & Young	4/14/2004	385	7.0	2,695.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Review of draft of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum as prepared by Marc Grossman of Ernst & Young	4/14/2004	575	1.3	747.50	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Review of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum as prepared by Kimberly Brown of Ernst & Young	4/14/2004	575	2.6	1,495.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Additional research and related revisions to Ohio sales and use tax memorandum in preparation for delivery to the Ohio Department of Revenue	4/15/2004	575	4.2	2,415.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Finalization of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum in preparation for delivery to the Ohio Department of Revenue	4/15/2004	575	1.7	977.50	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Totals for Code 616 - Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds									
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randelle Smith of Oakwood Homes regarding an issue relating to property tax issues embedded in the Grimes County, TX, claim	4/6/2004	275	0.8	220.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review of objection drafts prepared in anticipation of meeting with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young in order to quantify objections for the remaining jurisdictions	4/6/2004	275	2.7	742.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Update of objections spreadsheet after analysis of Bexar Co., TX and Elkhart Co., IN property tax claims with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/7/2004	275	1.4	385.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Bexar Co., TX and Elkhart Co., IN Property Tax Claims and determination of objection basis with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/7/2004	275	5.2	1,430.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Determination of objection basis for property tax claims in Bexar Co., TX and Elkhart Co., IN with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/7/2004	525	5.2	2,730.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of objections spreadsheet and analysis prepared by Seth Davis of Ernst & Young for Grimes Co., TX and Hill Co., TX	4/7/2004	575	2.7	1,552.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Property Tax Claims in Umatilla Co., OR, Rooke Co., KS, and Ellis Co., TX and modification of claims basis for Elkhart Co., IN with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/8/2004	275	2.9	797.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds

EXHIBIT D
Sorted by Fee Code

Name of Professional	Position	Rank	Description	Date Incurred	Hourly Billing Rate	Hours	Total Compensation	Billing Code	Billing Code Description
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Update of objections spreadsheet after analysis of the Umatilla Co, OR, Rocks Co, KS, and Ellis Co, TX property tax claims and formatting of spreadsheet for delivery to Oakwood Homes	4/8/2004	275	3.2	880.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Flagg, Nancy A	Senior Managers	21	Review of claims objection language used in spreadsheet in a call with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/8/2004	525	0.4	210.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Modification of claims basis for Elkhart Co, IN and preparation of objections basis for property taxes in Umatilla Co, OR, Rocks Co, KS, and Ellis Co, TX with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/8/2004	525	3.1	1,627.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of objections spreadsheet prepared by Seth Davis of Ernst & Young related analysis of Umatilla Co, OR and Basco Co., TX property tax claims objections	4/8/2004	575	2.3	1,322.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Bell County, TX property tax claim filed with the bankruptcy court	4/9/2004	275	2.5	687.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review of Bell County, TX property tax claim and property appraisals in preparation for meeting with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/9/2004	275	3.0	825.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of Ellis Co, TX and Rocks Co., KS objections basis spreadsheet	4/9/2004	575	2.1	1,207.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Bell County, TX claim with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young and determination of basis for objection to claim	4/12/2004	275	1.7	467.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of final basis of objections spreadsheet prior to final review	4/12/2004	275	5.7	1,567.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review of Property tax objections verbiage with Nancy Flagg of Ernst & Young and related changes based on her suggestions	4/12/2004	275	1.1	302.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Flagg, Nancy A	Senior Managers	21	Review of verbiage used in the basis for objections and related changes with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	525	0.8	420.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Johnson, Michael R.	Senior Managers	21	Review of property tax objections listing prepared by Seth Davis and Charlie Long of Ernst & Young and discussion with Handelle Smith of Oakwood Homes.	4/12/2004	525	3.9	2,047.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Review of Bell Co., TX 2002 Personal Property Values and determination of objection basis with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	525	1.7	892.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of Bell Co., TX basis for objections prepared by Seth Davis and Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	575	0.5	287.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Finalization of analysis of Bell County, TX claim basis for objection after review by Shawn Smith of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	275	2.6	715.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review and final changes to basis of objections spreadsheet prior to final review before sending to Oakwood Homes	4/13/2004	275	4.7	1,282.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of finalized basis for objections spreadsheet prepared by Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	575	1.3	747.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Totals for Code 625 - Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds							61.5	23,357.50	

EXHIBIT D
Sorted by Professional

Name of Professional	Position	Rank	Description	Date Incurred	Hourly Billing Rate	Hours	Total Compensation	Billing Code	Billing Code Description
Brown, Kimberly V	Managers	32	Review Ohio sales and use tax memorandum as prepared by Marc Grossman of Ernst & Young and related discussion regarding the issue with Marc Grossman and Frank DeLuca of Ernst & Young	4/14/2004	385	7.0	2,695.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Total for Kimberly V Brown						7.0	2,695.00		
Buchbinder, Elizabeth N	Partners, Principals & Directors - National	11	Conference call with Randalie Smith of Oakwood Homes and Mike Johnson of Ernst & Young regarding reimbursement of COBRA premiums	4/9/2004	650	1.0	650.00	614	Assistance with All Employment Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Total for Elizabeth N Buchbinder						1.0	650.00		
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randalie Smith of Oakwood Homes requesting a review of the property tax objections for the completed jurisdictions	4/6/2004	275	0.5	137.50	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Gib Saydah of Morris Nichols regarding fee application questions	4/6/2004	275	0.5	137.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Discussion with Gib Saydah of Morris Nichols regarding the March Interim Fee Application for Ernst & Young and final fee application	4/6/2004	275	0.7	192.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randalie Smith of Oakwood Homes regarding an issue relating to property tax issues embedded in the Grimes County, TX claim	4/6/2004	275	0.8	220.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review of objection drafts prepared in anticipation of meeting with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young in order to quantify objections for the remaining jurisdictions	4/6/2004	275	2.7	742.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Update of objections spreadsheet after analysis of Bexar Co., TX and Elkhart Co., IN property tax claims with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/7/2004	275	1.4	385.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Bexar Co., TX and Elkhart Co., IN Property Tax Claims and determination of objection basis with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/7/2004	275	5.2	1,430.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Discussion with Nancy Flagg of Ernst & Young regarding the Oakwood Homes Plan of Liquidation	4/8/2004	275	0.8	220.00	101	Internal Meetings of Staff
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Property Tax Claims in Umatilla Co., OR, Rooks Co., KS, and Ellis Co., TX and modification of claims basis for Elkhart Co., IN with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/8/2004	275	2.9	797.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Update of objections spreadsheet after analysis of the Umatilla Co., OR, Rooks Co., KS, and Ellis Co., TX property tax claims and formatting of spreadsheet for delivery to Oakwood Homes	4/8/2004	275	3.2	880.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Randalie Smith of Oakwood Homes regarding her availability to review finalized objections upon completion	4/9/2004	275	0.4	110.00	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Discussion with Steve Tero of Latham and Walkers regarding the Oakwood Homes Plan of Liquidation	4/9/2004	275	0.3	82.50	204	Meetings with Other Parties
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Bell County, TX property tax claim filed with the bankruptcy court	4/9/2004	275	2.5	687.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review of Bell County, TX property tax claim and property appraisals in preparation for meeting with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/9/2004	275	3.0	825.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Analysis of Bell County, TX claim with Charlie Long of Ernst & Young and determination of basis for objection to sale	4/12/2004	275	1.7	467.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of final basis of objections	4/12/2004	275	5.7	1,587.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review of Property Tax objections verbiage with Nancy Flagg of Ernst & Young and related changes based on his suggestions	4/12/2004	275	1.1	302.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Finalization of analysis of Bell County, TX claim basis for objection after review by Shawn Smith of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	275	2.6	715.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Review and final changes to basis of objections spreadsheet prior to final review before sending to Oakwood Homes	4/13/2004	275	4.7	1,292.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds

EXHIBIT D
Sorted by Professional

Name of Professional	Position	Rank	Description	Date Incurred	Hourly Billing Rate	Hours	Total Compensation	Billing Code	Billing Code Description
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Email to Rendelle Smith of Oakwood Homes for her review of the finalized basis for objections spreadsheet	4/14/2004	275	1.1	302.50	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of attachment detail and initial preparation of March Interim Fee Application for Ernst & Young	4/22/2004	275	6.0	1,650.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Finalization of preparation of March Interim Fee Application of Ernst & Young	4/28/2004	275	6.8	1,870.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Initial draft of Final Fee Application of Ernst & Young	6/7/2004	275	3.2	860.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of attachment detail and initial preparation of Final Fee Application for Ernst & Young	6/8/2004	275	3.1	862.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Formatting of attachment detail and initial preparation of Final Fee Application for Ernst & Young	6/9/2004	275	2.1	577.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Davis, Seth W	Seniors	42	Finalization of preparation of Final Fee Application of Ernst & Young	6/10/2004	275	3.4	935.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Total for Seth W Davis						66.4	18,260.00		
Total for Frank R DeLuca						11.0	6,325.00		
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Research relating to sales and use tax implications of repairs to manufactured homes prior to January 1, 2000 and review of initial memorandum draft by Marc Grossman of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	575	1.2	690.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Review of draft of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum as prepared by Marc Grossman of Ernst & Young	4/14/2004	575	1.3	747.50	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Review of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum as prepared by Kimberly Brown of Ernst & Young	4/14/2004	575	2.6	1,495.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Additional research and related revisions to Ohio sales and use tax memorandum in preparation for delivery to the Ohio Department of Revenue	4/15/2004	575	4.2	2,415.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
DeLuca, Frank R	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	13	Finalization of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum in preparation for delivery to the Ohio Department of Revenue	4/15/2004	575	1.7	977.50	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
Total for Frank R DeLuca						11.0	6,325.00		
Flagg, Nancy A	Senior Managers	21	Review of claims objection language used in spreadsheet in a call with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/8/2004	525	0.4	210.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Flagg, Nancy A	Senior Managers	21	Email of Wall Street Journal article regarding 505 motions to Rendelle Smith of Oakwood Homes	4/9/2004	525	0.3	157.50	104	General Communications with Debtor / Management Company / Debtor's Counsel / Creditor Committee
Flagg, Nancy A	Senior Managers	21	Review of verbiage used in the basis for objections and related changes with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	525	0.8	420.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Total for Nancy A Flagg						1.5	787.50		
Grossman, Marc T	Managers	32	Initial draft of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum regarding sales and use tax implications of repairs to Manufactured Homes prior to January 1, 2000.	4/12/2004	385	2.0	770.00	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
Grossman, Marc T	Managers	32	Finalization of draft of Ohio sales and use tax memorandum following discussion with Frank DeLuca of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	385	0.5	192.50	616	Assistance with State and Local Tax Audits / Notices / Claims/ Refunds
Total for Marc T Grossman						2.5	962.50		
Johnson, Michael R	Senior Managers	21	Determination regarding billing and invoice issues for final billing upon movement to Insulating Trust	4/9/2004	525	2.0	1,050.00	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Johnson, Michael R	Senior Managers	21	Review of property tax objections listing prepared by Seth Davis and Charles Long of Ernst & Young and discussion with Rendelle Smith of Oakwood Homes	4/12/2004	525	3.9	2,047.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Johnson, Michael R	Senior Managers	21	Discussions with Shawn Smith and Seth Davis related to the status of all claims and work with Oakwood Homes Corporation for purpose of discussion with Administrator of the Liquidation Trust	4/15/2004	525	2.0	1,050.00	101	Internal Meetings of Staff
Johnson, Michael R	Senior Managers	21	Bankruptcy Hearing Conference Call relating to Quarterly Fee Applications	4/15/2004	525	1.0	525.00	106	Prepare for and Attend Court Hearings
Total for Michael R Johnson						8.9	4,672.50		

EXHIBIT D
Sorted by Professional

Name of Professional	Position	Rank	Description	Date Incurred	Hourly Billing Rate	Hours	Total Compensation	Billing Code	Billing Code Description
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Determination of objection basis for property tax claims in Bexar Co., TX and Elkhart Co., IN with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/7/2004	525	5.2	2,730.00	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Modification of claims basis for Elkhart Co., IN and preparation of objections basis for property taxes in Umatilla Co., OR, Rooks Co., KS, and Ellis Co., TX with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/9/2004	525	3.1	1,627.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Update of claims objections status to Mike Johnson of Ernst & Young in preparation for conversation with Randle Smith of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	525	0.3	157.50	101	Internal Meetings of Staff
Long, Charles A	Senior Managers	21	Review of Bell Co., TX 2002 Personal Property Values and determination of objection basis with Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	525	1.7	892.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Total for Charles A Long						10.3	5,407.50		
Lowery, Kristie L	Senior Managers	21	Discussions with Mike Johnson of Ernst & Young regarding procedural issues with carryover of FICA wages/bases. Prepared documentation regarding transfer of payroll tax items and emailed to Randle Smith of Oakwood Homes	4/9/2004	525	2.1	1,102.50	614	Assistance with All Employment Tax Audits / Notices / Claims / Refunds
Total for Kristie L Lowery						2.1	1,102.50		
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of objections spreadsheet and analysis prepared by Seth Davis of Ernst & Young for Grimes Co., TX and Hill Co., TX	4/7/2004	575	2.7	1,552.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of objections spreadsheet prepared by Seth Davis of Ernst & Young and related analysis of Umatilla Co., OR and Bexar Co., TX property tax claims objections	4/8/2004	575	2.3	1,322.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of Ellis Co., TX and Rooks Co., KS objections basis spreadsheet	4/9/2004	575	2.1	1,207.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of Bell Co., TX basis for objections prepared by Seth Davis and Charlie Long of Ernst & Young	4/12/2004	575	0.5	287.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Review of finalized basis for objections spreadsheet prepared by Seth Davis of Ernst & Young	4/13/2004	575	1.3	747.50	625	Assistance with Property Tax Audits/Notices/Claims/Refunds
Smith, William Shawn	Partners, Principals & Directors - Local	11	Reviewed March interim fee application for Ernst & Young's services provided to Oakwood Homes	4/26/2004	575	0.5	287.50	300	Preparation of Fee / Expense Applications
Total for W Shawn Smith						9.4	5,405.00		