

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries
October 20 through October 31, 2003

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/20/2003	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	110	Retention Matters	Drafted A&M Retention Application and supporting documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/20/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	130	Case Strategy	Participated in status conference call w/ Committee
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/21/2003	1.0	\$ 550	\$ 550.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Participated in conference call re: revised liquidity projection
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/21/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	210	Business Plan	Performed analysis re: Monthly financial results verses projected results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/23/2003	1.8	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	220	Financing	Prepared analysis re: projected liquidity and covenant compliance under the proposed financing
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/24/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	210	Business Plan	Discussed diligence on Performa September Balance Sheet w/ M. Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/24/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference call w/ MBLY re: status of M&A process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/27/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	300	M&A	Reviewed and discussed September BS with D. Muir and MBLY
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/27/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	300	M&A	Performed analysis re: revised estimate of value distributable to creditors based on revised BS
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/27/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	300	M&A	Reviewed analysis re: whole loans and impact on estimated value distributable to creditors
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/28/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	310	Valuation	Outline process to updated valuation analysis w/ M. Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/28/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	310	Valuation	Reviewed updated valuation analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/29/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	310	Valuation	Discussed updated valuation analysis w/ M. Western and K. Simon
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/30/2003	1.5	\$ 550	\$ 825.00	310	Valuation	Reviewed revised draft of valuation analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/30/2003	0.9	\$ 550	\$ 495.00	310	Valuation	Discussed updates to revised valuation analysis w/ M. Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/30/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	210	Business Plan	Reviewed draft operating results for September
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/30/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	230	Creditors Claims	Participated in status call w/ R. Stark re: REMIC claim
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/31/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	310	Valuation	Participated in call w/ M. Western re: Updated comp analysis and market research
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	10/31/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Reviewed weekly cash flow and liquidity report
			<u>22.8</u>					
					<u>\$12,540.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION Detailed Time Entries - Steven G. Varner November 1 through November 30, 2003

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/3/2003	2.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,265.00	230	Creditors Claims	Reviewed financial analysis re: REMIC Claim
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/3/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	230	Creditors Claims	Reviewed legal analysis re: REMIC claim
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/4/2003	7.5	\$ 550	\$ 4,125.00	230	Creditors Claims	Attend meeting re: REMIC Claim
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/4/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	230	Creditors Claims	Attend meeting re: status of M&A process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/4/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Attend meeting re: plan confirmation issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/5/2003	2.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,265.00	210	Business Plan	Reviewed analysis re: September operating results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/5/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	300	M&A	Reviewed analysis re: valuation of bids and discussed same w/ Miller Buckfire
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/7/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Reviewed of the weekly operating performance
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/7/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	210	Business Plan	Performed an Analysis re: Incentive Bonus
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/7/2003	3.6	\$ 550	\$ 1,980.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed and Analyzed the recovery to creditors under various restructuring alternatives
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/10/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	130	Case Strategy	Status calls w/ M Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/10/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	210	Business Plan	Finalized analysis re: incentive comp
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/10/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference call discussions w/ Miller Buckfire re: M&A process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/10/2003	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	300	M&A	Performed a analysis re: the proposed structure for the Warburg bid
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/11/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	210	Business Plan	Reviewed updated analysis of the revised business plan
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/11/2003	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	300	M&A	Reviewed draft of Clayton APA and prepare issues list
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/11/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	300	M&A	Prepared analysis re: valuation of proposed bid by Clayton
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/11/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	300	M&A	Prepared analysis re: valuation of proposed bid by Warburg/Palm Harbor
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/12/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	300	M&A	Received latest version of the asset purchase agreement. Discussed requirements with M. Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/12/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	300	M&A	Reviewed revise comp. analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/12/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference call w/ MBL Y
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/13/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Reviewed weekly liquidity analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/13/2003	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	210	Business Plan	Reviewed reports re: monthly operating results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/13/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	220	Financing	Reviewed an updated exit financing proposal with M. Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/13/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference calls re: M&A status
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/14/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	130	Case Strategy	Participated in conference call w/ committee members re: case status
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/14/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	210	Business Plan	Reviewed weekly ops information received from FTI and the Debtors
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/14/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	210	Business Plan	Reviewed updated month financial forecast received from the Debtors and FTI.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/14/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	230	Creditors Claims	Receipt and review of further claims updates from FTI.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/17/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Received and reviewed draft weekly report and advised M. Western re: changes.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/17/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	210	Business Plan	Received and reviewed preliminarily September actual results of the Debtors.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/17/2003	3.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,815.00	300	M&A	Received updated version of the asset purchase agreement. Discussed analytical requirements with M. Western. Reviewed the latest version of the MBL Y analysis relative to the agreement.

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION Detailed Time Entries - Steven G. Varner November 1 through November 30, 2003

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/17/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	300	M&A	Received various schedules from the Debtors and MBLY on proposed attached disclosure statements for the asset purchase agreement.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/18/2003	0.4	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Discussed various matters related to the schedules with M. Western and the Debtors.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/18/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	230	Creditors Claims	Conference call re: liquidity issues with K Simon and M. Western Call with FTI to discuss further updates to the Claims analysis and processes.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/18/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	230	Creditors Claims	Follow up to Claims call - discussed follow up items with M. Western on Claims and various financial schedules attached to the asset purchase agreement.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/18/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference call with the Committee re: the proposed asset purchase agreement.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/18/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	300	M&A	Performed analysis re: MBLY valuation of the warrant to equity MBLY.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	130	Case Strategy	Participated in conference call w/ Committee call re asset sale, and management bonus.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	210	Business Plan	Participated in conference call w/ Debtor re: proposed management bonus
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	220	Financing	Received and reviewed updated proposed covenant schedules from FTI and the Debtors proposed to be attached to the exit financing agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	220	Financing	Discussed revised exit financing covenants w/ M. Western
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	230	Creditors Claims	Reviewed additional revisions to claims analysis and schedules. Received and reviewed draft analysis of the MBLY warrant analysis. Discussed with D&T valuation team and made suggestions for updates.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further updates received to the warrant analysis and discussed same w/ M. Western and K Simon.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/19/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Discussions with MBLY, FTI and Doug Muir over various conference calls to discuss specific items on the asset roll forward, and various matters requiring attention.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/20/2003	2.6	\$ 550	\$ 1,430.00	130	Case Strategy	Received roll forward estimate for asset values at 3/31/04. Discussed various issues and analytical requirements re: APA w/ M. Western.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/20/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference call with the Committee re: the proposed asset purchase agreement.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/20/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	300	M&A	Performed analysis of various elements of the asset and distributable value roll forward analysis identifying a range of ultimate distributable values on consummation of a sale of the business.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/20/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	310	Valuation	Performed analysis re: revised liquidity analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/21/2003	2.4	\$ 550	\$ 1,320.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Performed analysis re: revised business plan
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/21/2003	3.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,760.00	210	Business Plan	Participated in conference calls re: proposed bid procedures
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/21/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	300	M&A	Reviewed proposed bid procedures
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/21/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference calls re: revised Schedules to Clayton APA
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/21/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	300	M&A	

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries - Steven G. Varner
November 1 through November 30, 2003

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/22/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	300 M&A	Reviewed revised draft of the Clayton APA	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/22/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	300 M&A	Participated in conference calls re: revised Clayton APA	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/22/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	300 M&A	Participated in conference calls re: revised bid procedures	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/23/2003	3.6	\$ 550	\$ 1,980.00	300 M&A	Reviewed revised draft of the Clayton APA	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/23/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	300 M&A	Performed analysis re: revised Clayton APA	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/23/2003	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	300 M&A	Participated in conference call re: revised Clayton APA	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/24/2003	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	300 M&A	Prepared for status conference call w/ Committee	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/24/2003	1.9	\$ 550	\$ 1,045.00	300 M&A	Participated in status conference call w/ Committee	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/24/2003	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	300 M&A	Participated in conference call w/ Debtor's IB and counsel	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/24/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	300 M&A	Reviewed revised schedules to Clayton APA	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/25/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	130 Case Strategy	Participated in conference call w/ Committee counsel re: case status and	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/25/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	300 M&A	Conference call w/ Debtor and MBL re: M&A issues	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/25/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	300 M&A	Participated in conference call re: Bid procedure issues	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/26/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	130 Case Strategy	Conference call w/ counsel re: case calendar issues	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	11/26/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	320 Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed revised POR and Disclosure Statement	
			<u>118.4</u>		<u>\$ 65,120.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries - Steven G. Varner
December 1 through December 31, 2003

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/1/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Reviewed draft weekly report for the Committee considering cash flow, borrowing base, operating performance and other matters for the week. Made edits.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/1/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Telephone conversation with M. Western re: liquidity and operating performance position. Discussed latest business sale, and disclosure statement with K. Simon and M. Western. Discussed matters relating to residual Debtor entity and required return to equity pursuant to NC laws.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/1/2003	0.4	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Received and reviewed cash variance reports for the previous week. Contacted FTI and Bob Smith to discuss various matters pertaining to the liquidity position of the Debtors. Conference call with M. Western re various matters relating to cash receipts an Reviewed weekly operating report.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/2/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Discussed various alternative re: newco structure w/ Miller-Buckfire Conference call re "Paramount" proposal regarding return to OHC legacy equity with Bill Taylor, McCarter & English, and M. Western. Considered structure of the proposal and other considerations.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/2/2003	0.4	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Participated in Committee conference call.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/2/2003	0.4	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	210	Business Plan	Received and reviewed weekly borrowing base and loan availability information.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/2/2003	2.9	\$ 550	\$ 1,595.00	310	Valuation	Performed review and analysis re: proposing a revised DIP/Exit financing structure offered by Greenwich Capital. Had Call w/ M. Western to discuss next steps and required analyses.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/2/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed analysis re: exit financing alternatives
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/3/2003	1.8	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	130	Case Strategy	Received updated agreement and updated side by side comparison schedules and discussed w/ M. Western and K. Simon.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/3/2003	0.2	\$ 550	\$ 110.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Further review and discussion of liquidity implications and proposed covenants under the proposed DIP/Exit financing structure considered with M. Western and K. Simon.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/3/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	220	Financing	Discussed latest side by side DIP/Exit cost schedule with M. Western.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/3/2003	1.0	\$ 550	\$ 550.00	220	Financing	Reviewed analysis sent to Committee regarding latest status of DIP/Exit financing negotiations.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/3/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	310	Valuation	Received and reviewed weekly key performance indicator information from the Debtors.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/4/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Discussed latest draft of Exit/DIP financing w/ M. Western and K. Simon.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/4/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	220	Financing	Further discussion re draft covenants suggested. Discussed the matter with the Debtors and its advisors.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/4/2003	0.3	\$ 550	\$ 165.00	220	Financing	Conference call w/ FTI and the Debtors re provision of a revised 13 week cash forecast. Received revised forecast, and performed review and analysis of the cash forecast to the Debtors model.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/5/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Reviewed weekly operating report.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/5/2003	1.9	\$ 550	\$ 1,045.00	220	Financing	Performed analysis CSFB warehouse arrangements and proposed Greenwich with D. Muir and M. Western re: revised financing proposal.
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/5/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	220	Financing	Prepared for status conference call w/ CC and Committee counsel
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/8/2003	1.5	\$ 550	\$ 825.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Participated in conference call w/ CC and Committee call
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/8/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Reviewed draft of Amended DIP Financing Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/8/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	220	Financing	Participated in conference call re: issues and changes to the draft Amended DIP. Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/9/2003	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	130	Case Strategy	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/9/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	130	Case Strategy	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/9/2003	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	220	Financing	
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/9/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	220	Financing	

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Steven G. Varner
 December 1 through December 31, 2003

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/9/2003	2.6	\$ 550	\$ 1,430.00	220	Financing	Participated in conference call re: issues and changes to the draft Amended DIP Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/10/2003	1.9	\$ 550	\$ 1,045.00	210	Business Plan	Prepared analysis re: October results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/10/2003	2.8	\$ 550	\$ 1,540.00	220	Financing	Reviewed revised draft of Amended DIP Financing Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/10/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	220	Financing	Participated in conference calls re: issues and changes to the draft Amended DIP Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/10/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	220	Financing	Prepared analysis re: covenants in Amended DIP Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/10/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	220	Financing	Participated in discussion w/ Lender re: Revised DIP Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/11/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	210	Business Plan	Participated in conference call re: October results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/11/2003	1.8	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	220	Financing	Reviewed draft Exit Financing Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/11/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	220	Financing	Participated in conference call re: issues and changes to the draft Amended DIP Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/11/2003	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	220	Financing	Participated in conference call re: issues and changes to the draft Exit Financing Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/11/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	220	Financing	Performed analysis re: BB and covenants for revised Amended DIP
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/11/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	310	Valuation	Discuss status of valuation analysis w/ Debtors' IB
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/12/2003	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	220	Financing	Participated in conference calls Re: amended DIP and Exit Financings
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/12/2003	1.8	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	220	Financing	Performed review of revised DIP and Exit financing agreements
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/12/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	300	M&A	Participated in discuss re: proposed sale of corporate shell
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/15/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	210	Business Plan	Analysis re: operating results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/15/2003	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	300	M&A	Performed analysis re: transfer of Oakwood corporate shell
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/15/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Discussed window plan and operating issues w/ Debtor's management
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/16/2003	0.4	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	130	Case Strategy	Participate in conference call w/ Committee counsel re: case milestones
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/16/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	300	M&A	Participated in conference call w/ Miller/Buckfire re: status update
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/16/2003	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	310	Valuation	Participated in conference call w/ Debtors management re: status update
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/16/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analysis and discussion re: proforma Recovery Analysis based on actual results for October
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/18/2003	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference call w/ Debtor re: Window Plan
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/18/2003	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Review and discussion re: post confirmation Trustee
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/19/2003	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	220	Financing	Analysis and discussion re: Amended DIP
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/19/2003	1.1	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference call w/ Debtor and Committee counsel re: Window Plan and Revised POR issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/19/2003	0.6	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analysis and discussion re: Revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/22/2003	1.4	\$ 550	\$ 770.00	210	Business Plan	Analysis and discussion re: operating results
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/22/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	220	Financing	Analysis and discussion re: Amended DIP
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/23/2003	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Analysis and discussion re: cash flow and liquidity
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/24/2003	2.6	\$ 550	\$ 1,430.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference call re: Revised POR and M&A status
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	12/31/2003	1.8	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference call re: Revised POR
								<u>\$ 44,165.00</u>
								<u>80.3</u>

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Steven G. Varner
 January 1 through January 31, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/7/2004	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed review of the Debtor's Windown Analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/8/2004	2.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,265.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed revised Debtor's revised POR and Windown Analysis Prepare for and participated in committee conference call re: the Debtor's resent operating results and revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/12/2004	1.8	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepare for and participated in committee conference call re: the Debtor's resent operating results and revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/13/2004	2.6	\$ 550	\$ 1,430.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed review and analysis of monthly operating performance
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/14/2004	2.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,265.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/18/2004	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared Monthly Billing for November
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/18/2004	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	120	Billing/Fee Applications	Participated in conference call w/ Committee counsel re: POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/24/2004	1.2	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Finalized Monthly Billing for November
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/29/2004	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	120	Billing/Fee Applications	Participated in conference calls and performed analysis re: revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/30/2004	4.6	\$ 550	\$ 2,530.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference calls and performed analysis re: revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/31/2004	3.7	\$ 550	\$ 2,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference calls and performed analysis re: revised POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	1/31/2004	2.7	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in conference calls and performed analysis re: revised POR
			<u>28.4</u>		<u>\$ 15,620.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries
February 1 through February 28, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/3/04	1.7	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	200	Cash Flow and Liquidity	Performed analysis re: Weekly Cash Flow
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/4/04	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	220	Financing	Performed analysis re: Exit Financing
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/9/04	3.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,815.00	210	Business Plan	Performed review and analysis re: operating performance
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/10/04	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	120	Billing/Fee Applications	Prepared Monthly Billing for December
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/13/04	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	210	Business Plan	Performed analysis and participated in conference calls re: POR and wind down issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/16/04	0.7	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed analysis and participated in conference calls re: POR and wind down issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/17/04	1.5	\$ 550	\$ 825.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed analysis and participated in conference calls re: POR and wind down issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/18/04	1.3	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed analysis and participated in conference calls re: POR and wind down issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/19/04	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analysis and conference calls re: POOR and wind down issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	2/24/04	2.2	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed analysis and participated in conference calls re: POR exhibits
			<u>17.4</u>		<u>\$ 9,570.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION

Detailed Time Entries

March 1, 2004 through March 31, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/2/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze recent version of Disclosure Statement re: Liquidation Trust issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/2/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed and resided draft of Liquidation Trust Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/3/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed review and analysis of Financial exhibits to the POR
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/17/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed review of Disclosure Statement and exhibits
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/18/04	0.9	\$ 550	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a meeting with M. Kvarda (A&M) and M. Western (Deloitte) re: various issues related to recovery analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/18/04	2.3	\$ 550	\$ 1,265.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a meeting with M. Kvarda (A&M) and D. Muir (Oakwood) re: various issues related to the recovery analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/18/04	0.8	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with R. Smith (Oakwood) re: various issues related wind down
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/18/04	1.6	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed work plan of various activities to complete prior to closing based on discussions with Oakwood management
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/18/04	0.9	\$ 550	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Kvarda (A&M) and M. Western (Deloitte) to further discuss various issues related to the recovery analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/18/04	2.1	\$ 550	\$ 1,155.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with various Oakwood management personnel re: windown process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/19/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,815.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with various Oakwood management personnel re: windown process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/19/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,430.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with various Oakwood senior management personnel re: windown process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	3/26/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed and edited Liquidation Trust documents
			<u>22.6</u>		<u>\$ 12,430.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries
April 1, 2004 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/2/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 935.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Outline Trust cash management issues
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/2/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 275.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed draft of Trust employment agreements
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/5/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised and revised the Trust Agreement
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/5/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed window staffing plan
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/6/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in teleconference with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing of sale to Clayton
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/6/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the closing of the sale to Clayton
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/6/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in discussions with counsel to the Trust (Cromin & Vris) re: revisions to various closing documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/7/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed the latest version of the Disputed Ownership Funds Escrow and noted various comments thereo
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/7/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed draft of the amendment to the Clayton Asset Purchase Agreement and noted various comments thereo
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/7/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with M. Kvarda (A&M) re: current status of the case
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/7/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed revised Liquidation Trust employment agreements and employment letters
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/8/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with M. Kvarda (A&M) re: current status of the case
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/8/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 165.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed strategy for resolving various employee litigation matters
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/8/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed the latest version of the Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted various comments thereo
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/8/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 220.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed latest draft of COBRA Escrow Agreement and noted various revisions thereo
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/9/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 165.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed work plan for following week re: various pre-closing activities
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/9/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed latest drafts of various closing documents and noted various issues thereo
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/9/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 385.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a teleconference with M. Kvarda (A&M) and D. Muir (Oakwood) re: latest version of recover analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/9/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed various analyses related to just completed teleconference re: latest version of recover analysis
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/13/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple teleconferences with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/13/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 330.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the sale to Clayton
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/13/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with M. Kvarda (A&M) re: current status of the case
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/13/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 605.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed final versions of various closing documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/13/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple teleconferences with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/14/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,265.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to implementing the Liquidation Trust
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/14/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 995.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the sale to Clayton
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/14/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,815.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed final versions of various closing documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/14/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,485.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple teleconferences with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing documents
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/15/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to discuss various post-closing analyses to be completed
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/15/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 715.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) re: closing process
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/15/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 1,210.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various correspondence from King & Spalding attorneys and replied accordingly re: closing of sale of Clayton
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/15/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 660.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Standish (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to the sale to Clayton

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries
 April 1, 2004 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/15/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with B. Smith (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to the recovery of various assets
Steven G. Varner	Managing Director	4/15/04	### #####	\$ 550	\$ 880.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Murr (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to the recovery of various liability issues
			<u>37.2</u>		<u>\$ 20,460.00</u>			

Exhibit C
OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Matthew E. Kvarda
 March 1 through March 31, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/3/2004	3.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,530.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed FTI recovery analysis and wind-down budget and noted issues for further discussion and analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/4/2004	2.2	\$ 450	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed draft of Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted revisions and issues for further discussion
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/5/2004	2.2	\$ 450	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed wind-down activity list prepared by Oakwood and noted various issues thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/8/2004	2.1	\$ 450	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed draft of Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted comments and questions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/9/2004	1.9	\$ 450	\$ 855.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed recent version of Disclosure Statement relative to issues raised in Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/10/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze recent version of Disclosure Statement relative to issues raised in Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/10/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed 01/04 recovery analysis prepared by FTI and noted questions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/11/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze 01/04 recovery analysis prepared by FTI and noted questions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/11/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared workplan re: further analyzing key components of recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/12/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to prepare workplan re: further analyzing key components of recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/12/2004	1.6	\$ 450	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed recent SEC filings relative to issues raised in Disclosure Statement and recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/15/2004	3.7	\$ 450	\$ 1,665.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed the Clayton Asset Purchase Agreement and noted various questions for discussion with Oakwood management
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/15/2004	2.6	\$ 450	\$ 1,170.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed the most recent version of the Plan of Reorganization and noted various questions for discussion with Oakwood management
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/15/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further analyzed the most recent version of the Disclosure Statement relative to issues identified in the Clayton Asset Purchase Agreement and the Plan of Reorganization
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/16/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Western (Deloitte) to review various issues prior to meeting with Oakwood management
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/16/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to the FTI recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/16/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with C. Ward (Oakwood) to review various wind-down action items and parties responsible for such tasks
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/16/2004	3.2	\$ 450	\$ 1,440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze the recovery analysis relative to issues discussed with Oakwood management
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/16/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Western (Deloitte) to debrief on issues discussed with Oakwood management
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/17/2004	1.6	\$ 450	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) to discuss various balance sheet issues related to recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/17/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with J. Burczkowski (Oakwood) to discuss various insurance related issues related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/17/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Gilles (Oakwood) to discuss various employee litigation matters related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/17/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with W. Gifford (Oakwood) to discuss various general litigation matters related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/17/2004	2.1	\$ 450	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with B. Smith (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/17/2004	1.1	\$ 450	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to the FTI recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/18/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a meeting with S. Varner (A&M) and M. Western (Deloitte) re: various issues related to recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/18/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a meeting with S. Varner (A&M) and D. Muir (Oakwood) re: various issues related to the recovery analysis

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries - Matthew E. Kvarda
March 1 through March 31, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/18/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with R. Smith (Oakwood) re: various issues related tax matters incorporated into the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/18/2004	3.1	\$ 450	\$ 1,395.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared workplan of various activities to complete prior to closing based on discussions with Oakwood management
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/18/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with S. Varner (A&M) and M. Western (Deloitte) to further discuss various issues related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/19/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with W. Gifford (Oakwood) to further discuss various general litigation matters related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/19/2004	1.8	\$ 450	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various supporting information received from J. Buczkowski (Oakwood) re: insurance estimates contained in the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/19/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various supporting information received from M. Gillies (Oakwood) re: insurance estimates contained in the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/19/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) to further discuss various balance sheet issues related to recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/19/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a meeting with D. Muir and B. Smith (both of Oakwood) re: various issues related to the recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/21/2004	2.9	\$ 450	\$ 1,305.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared various recovery analyses and list of questions thereto in preparation for Disclosure Statement hearing
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/22/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further analyzed Clayton Asset Purchase Agreement in preparation for meeting with debtor and committee counsel the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/22/2004	2.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,080.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further analyzed Disclosure Statement in preparation for meeting with debtor and committee counsel the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/22/2004	2.1	\$ 450	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further analyzed Plan of Reorganization in preparation for meeting with debtor and committee counsel the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/22/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Drafted additional revisions to Liquidation Trust Agreement in preparation for meeting the debt and committee counsel the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/23/2004	1.1	\$ 450	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with committee counsel to review current status of case and issues related to liquidation trust agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/23/2004	2.7	\$ 450	\$ 1,215.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in various meetings with debtor's counsel re: issues related to the Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/23/2004	3.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,485.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in various meetings with committee counsel re: issues related to the Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/23/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to revise the Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/24/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared for Bankruptcy Court hearing later in the day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/24/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with Oakwood management to discuss variety of open issues
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/24/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared workplan for following week re: various pre-closing activities
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/24/2004	3.6	\$ 450	\$ 1,620.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in Bankruptcy Court hearing and various side discussions during intermissions
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/25/2004	3.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,485.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in various meetings with committee counsel to attempt to resolve a variety of open issues prior to confirmation hearing the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/25/2004	1.9	\$ 450	\$ 855.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in various meetings with Oakwood management to attempt to resolve a variety of open issues prior to confirmation hearing the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/25/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to revise the Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/25/2004	2.1	\$ 450	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in various meetings with debtor and committee counsel to attempt to resolve a variety of open issues prior to confirmation hearing the following day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/26/2004	2.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,080.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared for confirmation hearing later in the day
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/26/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in confirmation hearing and various side discussions during intermissions

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Matthew E. Kvarda
 March 1 through March 31, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/26/2004	2.9	\$ 450	\$ 1,305.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Worked with committee counsel to attempt to resolve a variety of open issues related to the confirmation of the plan
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/26/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Worked with debtor's counsel to try and resolve a variety of open issues related to the Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/29/2004	1.6	\$ 450	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared workplan for staff re: various tasks to be completed prior to closing of sale with Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/29/2004	2.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,080.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed the debtor's current bank account structure and developed workplan for transferring accounts to the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/29/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed the various components of secured debt in the debtor's plan of reorganization and noted issues and comments thereo
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/29/2004	2.1	\$ 450	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed outstanding worker's compensation liabilities and noted areas for further analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) to discuss role with the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with W. Gifford (Oakwood) to discuss role with Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with R. Smith (Oakwood) to discuss role with Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with C. Ward (Oakwood) to discuss role with Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.4	\$ 450	\$ 180.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Weyker (Oakwood) to discuss role with Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with L. Carter (Oakwood) to discuss role with Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to implementing the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with T. Wall (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to the debtor's bank accounts
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/30/2004	2.2	\$ 450	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed schedule prepared by D. Muir (Oakwood) and noted comments and issues for further discussion thereto re: transition of bank accounts
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/31/2004	2.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,080.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held various follow-up discussions with members of Oakwood wind-down team re: various roles and responsibilities with the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/31/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with W. Gifford (Oakwood) to discuss various open general litigation settlement offers and strategy for resolving same going forward
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/31/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Gilles (Oakwood) to discuss the strategy for resolving various employee litigation matters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/31/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with J. Buczkowski (Oakwood) to discuss the strategy for resolving various worker's compensation litigation matters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/31/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a meeting with D. Muir and T. Wall (both of Oakwood) re: bank account transition issues
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	3/31/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with B. Smith (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to the recovery analysis
			<u>128.5</u>					
					<u>\$ 57,825.00</u>			

Exhibit C
OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Matthew E. Kvarda
 April 1 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/1/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to review various projects to be completed prior to the closing of the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/1/2004	1.8	\$ 450	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various components of liabilities not subject to compromise and developed strategies for resolving same
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/1/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held a discussion with Wachovia representatives re: opening of Liquidation Trust bank accounts
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/1/2004	1.9	\$ 450	\$ 855.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to discuss various components of liabilities not subject to compromise
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/1/2004	2.2	\$ 450	\$ 990.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Standish (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/2/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a follow-up meeting with D. Muir and T. Wall (both of Oakwood) re: bank account transition issues
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/2/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed various analyses prepared by M. Arko (A&M) and noted issues for further analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/2/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held a follow-up discussion with Wachovia representatives re: opening of Liquidation Trust bank accounts
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/2/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Began to prepare draft Liquidation Trust employment agreements for various Oakwood management personnel
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/2/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze key components of recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/2/2004	1.1	\$ 450	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held a follow-up meeting with D. Muir (Oakwood) to review various projects to be completed the following week
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/4/2004	1.8	\$ 450	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed latest draft of Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted various revisions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/4/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further analyzed conformation order and noted various reserves and treatment of specific claims detailed therein
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed the further revised version of the Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted additional comments thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed draft of employment letter for Liquidation Trust wind-down team and noted various revisions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared for teleconference with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: status of various closing documents
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in teleconference with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: status of various closing documents
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with various Oakwood senior management personnel to discuss a variety of transition issues
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with J. Buczkowski (Oakwood) to discuss a variety of insurance related matters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/5/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed a further revised version of the Disputed Ownership Funds Escrow and noted various additional comments thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/6/2004	0.4	\$ 450	\$ 180.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Discussed the abandonment of various properties with K. Biron, Esq. (King & Spalding)
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/6/2004	1.1	\$ 450	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with B. Smith (Oakwood) to discuss the abandonment of various properties
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/6/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared for a teleconference with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing of sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/6/2004	1.6	\$ 450	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in teleconference with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing of sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/6/2004	2.3	\$ 450	\$ 1,035.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various closing documents with respect to the responsibilities of the Trust and noted various comments and revisions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/6/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the closing of the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the closing of the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	1.1	\$ 450	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed a further revised draft of the Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted various comments and revisions thereto

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries - Matthew E. Kvarda
April 1 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with counsel to the Trust (Cromin & Vris) re: revisions to various closing documents
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir to further discuss resolving open issues related to the transition of the bank accounts
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held a further discussion with Wachovia representatives re: establishing new bank accounts for the Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed the latest version of the Disputed Ownership Funds Escrow and noted various comments thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed draft of the amendment to the Clayton Asset Purchase Agreement and noted various comments thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with S. Varner (A&M) re: current status of the case
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/7/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Further revised Liquidation Trust employment agreements and employment letters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to review various open issues related to the closing of the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	1.6	\$ 450	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the closing of the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.8	\$ 450	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with S. Varner (A&M) re: current status of the case
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.4	\$ 450	\$ 180.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared for meeting with all proposed employees of the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with all proposed employees of the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Gilles (Oakwood) to further discuss the strategy for resolving various employee litigation matters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with W. Gifford (Oakwood) to discuss various general litigation matters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed the latest version of the Disputed Ownership Funds Escrow and noted various comments thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed the latest version of the Liquidation Trust Agreement and noted various comments thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to revise the Liquidation Trust Agreement
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/8/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed latest draft of COBRA Escrow Agreement and noted various revisions thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/9/2004	1.6	\$ 450	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with Oakwood management to discuss variety of open issues
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/9/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared workplan for following week re: various pre-closing activities
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/9/2004	2.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,080.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed latest drafts of various closing documents and noted various issues thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/9/2004	0.7	\$ 450	\$ 315.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in a teleconference with S. Varner (A&M) and D. Muir (Oakwood) re: latest version of recover analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/9/2004	2.6	\$ 450	\$ 1,170.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared various analyses related to just completed teleconference re: latest version of recover analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/9/2004	0.9	\$ 450	\$ 405.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to revise Liquidation Trust employment agreements and employment letters
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/11/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to review latest drafts of various closing documents and note various issues thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/11/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to prepare various analyses related to latest version of recovery analysis
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/12/2004	3.2	\$ 450	\$ 1,440.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed latest drafts of various closing documents and note various issues thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/12/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Finalized discussions with Oakwood management re: Liquidation Trust employment agreements
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/12/2004	3.9	\$ 450	\$ 1,755.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple teleconferences with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing documents
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/12/2004	2.7	\$ 450	\$ 1,215.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the sale to Clayton

Exhibit C
OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Matthew E. Kvarda
 April 1 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/12/2004	1.8	\$ 450	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with S. Varner (A&M) re: current status of the case
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Finalized employment letters for Liquidation Trust employees
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	3.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,530.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple teleconferences with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing documents
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	1.9	\$ 450	\$ 855.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	1.1	\$ 450	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held multiple discussions with S. Varner (A&M) re: current status of the case
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with various Oakwood employees to discuss various wind-down issues
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	2.4	\$ 450	\$ 1,080.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Reviewed final versions of various closing documents and signed where appropriate
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/13/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to outline strategy for resolving various remaining open issues related to the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/14/2004	2.7	\$ 450	\$ 1,215.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple teleconferences with debtor, creditor and purchaser representatives re: closing documents
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/14/2004	1.8	\$ 450	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to implementing the Liquidation Trust
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/14/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Participated in multiple discussions with King & Spalding representatives re: various issues related to the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/14/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Finalized bank account transition issues with Wachovia and D. Muir (Oakwood)
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/15/2004	1.7	\$ 450	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to discuss various post-closing analyses to be completed
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/15/2004	1.2	\$ 450	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) to analyze various liability line items and estimate ultimate exposure related thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/15/2004	0.6	\$ 450	\$ 270.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various correspondence from King & Spalding attorneys and replied accordingly re: closing of sale of Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/15/2004	1.4	\$ 450	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with M. Standish (Oakwood) to discuss various issues related to the sale to Clayton
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/15/2004	1.3	\$ 450	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with T. A. Wall (Oakwood) to review various analyses related to the transition of the back accounts to the Trust and noted various follow-up items thereto
Matthew E. Kvarda	Senior Director	4/15/2004	1.8	\$ 450	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with B. Smith (Oakwood) to further discuss various issues related to the recovery of various assets
			<u>106.2</u>		<u>\$ 477,900.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
 Detailed Time Entries - Michael Arko
 March 1 through March 31, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	3/30/2004	2.2	\$ 225	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed Asset Purchase Agreement and noted items for follow-up related to assets not purchased by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	3/30/2004	3.9	\$ 225	\$ 877.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze Asset Purchase Agreement and note items for follow-up related to assets not purchased by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	3/30/2004	3.9	\$ 225	\$ 877.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed bank account data provided by Oakwood relative to trial balance data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	3/31/2004	4.2	\$ 225	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze bank account data provided by Oakwood relative to trial balance data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	3/31/2004	3.9	\$ 225	\$ 877.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared preliminary exception report re: analysis of bank account data provide by Oakwood relative to trial balance data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	3/31/2004	2.9	\$ 225	\$ 652.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze bank account data provided by Oakwood relative to trial balance data
			<u>21.0</u>		<u>\$ 4,725.00</u>			

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries - Michael Arko
April 1 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/1/2004	2.8	\$ 225	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze bank account data provided by Oakwood relative to trial balance data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/1/2004	1.7	\$ 225	\$ 382.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) to resolve exceptions re: analysis of bank account data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/1/2004	1.6	\$ 225	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with T. A. Wall (Oakwood) to resolve exceptions re: analysis of bank account data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/1/2004	0.9	\$ 225	\$ 202.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to resolve exceptions re: analysis of bank account data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/5/2004	3.8	\$ 225	\$ 855.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised exception report based on meeting with Oakwood management re: bank account analysis
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/5/2004	1.6	\$ 225	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed 04/01/04 payments to vendors and noted issues for follow-up with Oakwood management
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/5/2004	3.2	\$ 225	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held a follow-up meeting with T. A. Wall (Oakwood) to resolve exceptions re: analysis of bank account data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/5/2004	3.2	\$ 225	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Drafted employment letters for Trust employees
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/6/2004	3.9	\$ 225	\$ 877.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised draft of the employment letter for Trust employees
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/6/2004	1.1	\$ 225	\$ 247.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed 04/05/04 payments to vendors and noted issues for follow-up with Oakwood management
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/6/2004	3.4	\$ 225	\$ 765.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised exception report to reflect additional data obtained re: bank account analysis
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/6/2004	3.6	\$ 225	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze bank account data provided by Oakwood relative to trial balance data
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/7/2004	3.7	\$ 225	\$ 832.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed trial balance data related to assets left behind
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/7/2004	3.8	\$ 225	\$ 855.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed various pre-closing vendor payments and noted various issues for follow-up with Oakwood management
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/7/2004	0.4	\$ 225	\$ 90.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze trial balance data related to assets not purchased by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/7/2004	1.6	\$ 225	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir & T. Wall (both Oakwood) re: cash accounts
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/7/2004	4.7	\$ 225	\$ 1,057.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to revise and prepare the employment letters for the approximately 90 Trust employees (including, salary, severance and COBRA information for each individual employee)
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/8/2004	3.6	\$ 225	\$ 810.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to revised draft of the employment letter for Trust employees
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/8/2004	2.3	\$ 225	\$ 517.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) to discuss trial balance data related to assets and liabilities not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/8/2004	1.9	\$ 225	\$ 427.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with T. A. Wall (Oakwood) to discuss trial balance data related to certain assets not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/8/2004	3.2	\$ 225	\$ 720.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze trial balance data related to assets not purchased by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/8/2004	2.6	\$ 225	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared senior management compensation matrix
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/12/2004	4.3	\$ 225	\$ 967.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Analyzed trial balance data related to liabilities not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/12/2004	2.8	\$ 225	\$ 630.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared exception report related to trial data balance for assets not purchased by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/12/2004	2.3	\$ 225	\$ 517.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared exception report related to trial data balance for liabilities not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/12/2004	1.7	\$ 225	\$ 382.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) re: liabilities not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/12/2004	0.9	\$ 225	\$ 202.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Held a follow-up meeting with A. Stroud (Oakwood) re: assets and liabilities not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/12/2004	2.1	\$ 225	\$ 472.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised liquidation trust employment agreements for key employees per revisions from M. Kvarda (A&W)
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/13/2004	4.1	\$ 225	\$ 922.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared employment letters for various Liquidation Trust employees
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/13/2004	1.6	\$ 225	\$ 360.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with A. Stroud (Oakwood) re: trial balance data related to liabilities not assumed by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/13/2004	4.2	\$ 225	\$ 945.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze trial balance data related to assets not purchased by Clayton

Exhibit C

OAKWOOD HOMES CORPORATION
Detailed Time Entries - Michael Arko
April 1 through April 15, 2004

Name	Title	Date	Time	Hourly Rate	Fees	Project Category	Project Description	Time Entry
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/14/2004	2.3	\$ 225	\$ 517.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Continued to analyze trial balance data related to assets not purchased by Clayton
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/14/2004	2.4	\$ 225	\$ 540.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised exception report related to trial data balance for assets not purchased by Clayton to reflect additional data obtained from Oakwood management
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/14/2004	2.2	\$ 225	\$ 495.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised exception report related to trial data balance for liabilities not purchased by Clayton to reflect additional data obtained from Oakwood management
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/14/2004	2.7	\$ 225	\$ 607.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Performed analyses related to the transition of bank accounts to the Liquidation Trust
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/15/2004	2.6	\$ 225	\$ 585.00	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared analysis of various estimated adjustments to the purchase price at Closing
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/15/2004	1.9	\$ 225	\$ 427.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Met with D. Muir (Oakwood) to review analysis of various estimated adjustments to the purchase price at closing
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/15/2004	3.1	\$ 225	\$ 697.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Prepared a revised recovery analysis based on closing data trial balance information obtained to date
Michael Arko	Senior Analyst	4/15/2004	0.9	\$ 225	\$ 202.50	320	Plan/Disclosure Statement Matters	Revised draft of key employee Liquidation Trust employment agreements per further review comments from M. Kvarda (A&M)
			<u>100.7</u>		<u>\$ 22,657.50</u>			