TO SECOND SUPPLEMENTAL AFFIDAVIT

EXHIBIT 2

Note: Search Results in addition to those incorporated into the Prior Affidavits are in bold face type.

ENTITY CONNECTION WITH THE CASES C'ONNECTION WITH
D.A. Stuart Company Top 50 Trade Creditor Client
General Electric Company Parent Company of Top 50 Trade Clicnt
Creditor and Major Lessor GE Capital
Corporation and of Secured Creditor
Heller Finuneial, Ing.
GE Capital Corporation Top 50 Trade Creditor Client
Skadden, Arps Counsel to Debtors Client
Primary Energy Parent Company of Top 50 Trade Client
Creditor Portside Energy
Builington Northemn Santa Fe Parent Company of Top 50 Trade Clicnt
Corporation Creditor Burlington Narthern Santa Fe
Railroad
Air Products and Chemicals Parent Company of Top 50 Trade Client
Creditor Air Products Manufacturing
Corp.
Carmeuse North America Parent Compuny of Top 50 Trade Client
Creditor Detroit Lime Co.
Caterpillar, Tne, Parent Company of Top 50 Trade Client
Creditor Caterpillar World Trading
Corp.
Sequa Corporation Pargnt Company of Top 50 Trade Client
Creditor Midwest Metal Coatings LLC
CIT Group, Inc. Parent Company of Sceurcd Creditor Client
The CIT Group/Bus:iress Credit
Citigraup, Inc, Parent Company of Secured Creditor Clhient
Citicorp USA, Inc. and Agent under
i Credit Iacility Salomon Smith Barney
FleetBoston Financial Caorp. " Parent Company of Secured Creditor Client
Fleet Capital Corpuration
General Motors Comoralion Purent Company of Secured Creditor Client

GMAC Business Credit




HSBC Holdings PLC

Bond Trustee

Client

TP Morgan Chase & Company |Parent Company of Bond Trustee Chuse Client
Manhattan Bank

Shinsho American Corp. Subsidiary or Affiliatc of Other Party in Client
Interest United States Steel Corp.

U.8. Steel Irving Warks Subsidiary or Affiliate of Other Party in Client
Interest United States Steel Corp.

U.S. Steel Mining Company  { Subsidiary or Affiliate of Other Party in Client
Intcrest United States Steel Corp.

ABRN AMRO Holding N.V. Purent Company of Major Lessor La Client

Sulle National Leusing Corporation
IBM Corporation Parent Company of Major Lessor [BM Client
Credit Corporation
Itochu Coporali on Patenl Company of Major Lessor Client
Enprotech Corporation

Rudd Equipment Company Major Lessor Former Client

Wilmington Trust Compuny Major Lessor Client

Diamond Lease Company Parent Company of Major Lessor New Client

Ltd. England Capital Corporation

Fitth Third Bancorp Parent Company of Major Lessor Old Client

Kent Financial Services

J.P, Morgan Chase & Co. Major Lessor Client

Royal Bank of Canada Parcnt Company of Major Lessor Client
Tucker Federal Savings & Loan

Association

Dimensional Fund Advisors, Major Stockholder Clicnt

Inc.

Ernst & Young International  [Parent Company of Profeasional Ernst & Client

Young Corporation Finance LLC

CITI 10538695.2




CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

1, Jermifer M. McManus, a non-attorney, do hereby certify tha! [ caused a true and correct
copy of each of the Notice of Filing and the Sceond Supplemental Affidavit of William J.
Factor in Support of Application for Order Authorizing Retroactive Retention and
Employment of Scyfarth Shaw as Counsel to the Official Committee of Retired Employees,
to be served upon cach of the entitics listed on the attached Master Service List and each of the
entities listed on the attached Rule 2002 List, by depositing the same into the United States Mail
chute located at 55 East Monroe Street, Chicago, Illinois 60603, in propetly-addressed envelopes
with sufficient first-class postage prepaid, before the hour of 5:00 p.m. on this st day of August

2003,

Qepncder . Meagnid

(ylnifcr M[chManus

Subscribed and Sworn to before
me this 1st day of August, 2003.

W (ﬂﬁ' dﬁz(l&‘z@a_,_

Notary Public

SFFICIAL SEAL "

WANDA D. WILLIARNG .
Wit "G, STATE OF INO
Mycoy ITYMRed vk




MASTER SERVICE LIST

Stephen G. Wolfe

(Office of the 1.5, Truslee
Suite 3350

227 West Monroe Strect
Chicapo, 1L 60606

Richard P. Krasnow

Robert J. Lemons

Weil Gotshal & Manges, 1.1d.
767 Fifth Avenue

New York, NY 10153

Bryan E, Miner

Katten Muchin Zavis
Suite 1600

525 West Monroe Strect
Chicago, 11, 60661-36%3

Blanic] A. Zazove
Karen G, Kranbuehl
Kaye Scholer LLP
Suite 4100

70 West Madison Sireet
Chicago, IL 60602

Timothy R, Pohl

Skadden Alps Slate Meagher & Flom
Suite 2100

333 West Wacker Drive

Chicago, IL 60606

Giary P. Cullen

Skadden Arps Slate Meagher & Flom
Suite 2100

333 West Wacker Drve

Chicago, IL 604506

Sonia U, Chae

United Stales and Exchange Commission
175 West Jackson Bowlevard

Suite 900

Chicago, Illineis 60604

Kirk Sobecki

Ronald J. Werhnyak
National Steel Corporation
4100 Ldison Lakes Parkway
Mishawaka, IN 46545

Victoria 5, Crosley
Mayer Silber

Internal Revenuc Service
Suite 2300

200 West Adams Street
Chicago, IL 60606

J. Mark Fisher

J. Jeffrey Patton

Jagon M. Torf

Schiff Hardin & Waite
6600 Sears Tower
Chicago, IL 60606-6473

Melanie Rovaer Cohcn
Hrandy A. Sargent
Altheimer & Gray
Suite 4000

10 South Wacker Drive
Chicago, 11. 60606

Richard M., Seltzer

Coehn Weiss and Simon LLP
330 West 42nd Strect

New York, NY 10036-6976

Paul M. Singer

Eric Schafer

Reed Smith

435 Sixth Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15219

Dean C. Gramlich
Mohsin N. Khambati
MecDermott Will & Emery
227 West Monroe Stree(
Chicago, IL 60606




Kurt M. Carlson

Tishler & Wald, TAdd.
Suijte 2600

200 South Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60606

William D. Brejcha, Stephen A, Oakley
Andrew K. Light, Jay P. Kennedy
Scopelitis Crarvin Light & Hanson
Suite 1700

120 South LaSallc Street

Chicago, 1L 60603

Ronald L. Rosc
Dykema Gossett PLLC
Suite 3050

55 FEasl Monroe Street
Chicago, IL 60603

Joshua [J, Sheffer, Richard . Boonstra
Bruce I. Van ITeukelem, Kevin J. Todd
Hoogendoorn & Talbot

Suite 1220

122 South Michigan Avenus

Chicago, 1. 60603-6107

Jan Bond

Diekemper, Hammond, Shinners,
Turcotte and Larrew, P.C.

Suite 200

7730 Cabondelet Avenuc

81, Louis, MO 63105

Steve B, Towbin

Shaw Gussis Fishman Glantz
Wolfson & Towbin, 1.1.C

Suitc 2600

111 East Wacker Drive

Chicago, I1. 60601

H. Rey Stroube, I1I

Henry I. Kaim

Akin, Gump, Strauss,
Huaer & LFeld LLP

Suite 1900

711 Louisiana Siree(

Houslon, TX 77002

Claudia Springer

Matt Tashman

Reed Smith

Cne Liberty Place

25th Floor
Philadelphia, PA 19103

Nathaniel Rayle

Office of the General Counsel
Pension Benefit Guaranty Corporation
Suite 340

1200 K Streel, N.W.

Washington, DC 20005-4026

Michae] L. Sherman
Sherman & Sherman
120 8. LaSalle Street
Suite 1460

Chicago, IL 60603

Fugene J. Geekie, Ir.
Schiff, Hardin & Waitc
sears Tower

233 8. Wacker Drive
Suile 6600

Chicago, IL 60606-6473

Christopher T. Sheean
Kelley Drye & Warren LLTI*
Suite 1400

303 West Madison Street
Chicagp, LL 60606

Mark L. Banc, Mark Somerstein,
James 8. Carr, David E. Raller,

Keith H. Wotlord, Christopher Sheean
Kelley Drye & Warren LLP

101 Park Avenue

New York, NY 10178

Kathryn A, Pamenter
Andrew R, Cardonick
Goldberg, Kohn. Bell, Black,
Rosenbloom & Moritz, Lid.
Suite 3700

55 East Monroe Sireel
Chicago, IL 60603




Kathleen M. Logan
Patricia McCoul

Togan & Company

546 Valley Road

Upper Montelair, NJ 07043

Sitrick and Company

Alln: Anila Marie Hill Suite 800
1840 Century Park

Los Angeles, CA 90067

Chad H. Gelleman
Matthew M. Martin
Adelman, Gettleman, Merens,
Berish & Carter, Ld.
533 West Jackson Boulevard Suite 1050
Chicapo, 1L 60604

Todd A, Burgess

Quarles & Brady Streich Lang LLP
Renaissance One

Two North Central Avenue
Phoenix, AZ 95004-2391

Jeffrey M. Schwartz
Gardner, Carton & Douglas
Suite 3700

191 North Wacker Drive
Chicago, I 60606-1698

Thomas D. williamson
Deloitte Consulting

180 Noril Sietson Avenuye
Chicago, 1T, 60601-6779

Robert Wuyjlowicr

Ernst & Youny Corporate Finance LLC
233 South Wacker Drive

Chicago, IL 60606

Robert B, Millner
Sennenschein Nath & Roscenthal
8000 Sears Tower

233 South Wacker Drive
Chicago, 1L 60606

CHI 165396341

Lisa Beckerman

Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld L1.P
22nd Floor

590 Madison Avenue

New York, NY 10022

Deryck A. Palmer

Weil Gotshal & Manges LIP
767 Fifth Avenue

New York, NY 13153

Andrew M. Troop

BPeryck A, Palmer

Joseph S. Allerhand

Weil, Gotshal & Manges LLP
101 Federal Street

Boston, MA 02110

Robert M. Stanton

Assistant General Counsel
United States Stcel Corporation
Law Depariment

600 Grant Street

Pittsburgh, PA 15219-2800

Richard J. Toder

Andrew D. Gottfried

Morgan Lewis & Bockius LLP
101 Park Avenue

New York, NBC 10178-0060

Marlee §. Mycrs

Morgan Lews & Rockius LLP
301 Granr Street

Pittsburgh, PA 15219

Brian [ Swett

Jenner & Block LLC

One I1BM Plaza

Chicago, IL 601511-7603




2002 SERVICE LIST

James 8, Carr

Keith H. Wofford

Kelley Dryc & Warren LLP
101 Park Avenue

MNew York, NY 10178

Larry I, McClatchey
Kegler Brown Hill & Ritter
Suite 1800

65 Last State Street
Columbus, OH 43215

Ellen T. Hannon

VP and General Counscl
Metallurg Inc./Shieldalloy
12th Floor

6 Fast 43rd Sireel

New York, NY 10017

John . Dillman
Linebarger Goggan Blair
Pena & Sampson, LLP

P.O. Box 3064
Hougton, TX 77253-3064

Sidley Austin Brown & Wood LLP
Attn: Craig Wolfe

787 Seventh Avenue

New York, NY 10019

Sleven J. Reisman

Curtis, Mallet-Prevost, Colt & Mosle LLP
101 Park Avenue

New York, NY 10178-0061

Lynne A. Richardson

Air Products and Chemicals Inc.
Air Products Manufacturing Corp.
7201 Hamilton Boulevard
Allentown, PA 18195

James M. Peck

Schulte Roth & Zahel LILP
219 Third Avenue

New York, NY 10022

Kerry 5. Kehoe
David (3. Sobol
Holland & Knight
Suite 1200

10 8t. James Avenue
Boston, MA 02116

Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison
Attn; Stephen J. Shimshak and

Curtis J. Weidler

Maria T. Vullo

Stacey A. Shortall

12835 Avenue of the Americas

New York, NY 10019-6064

Jamcs M. Malley
Angelo, Gordon & Co.
26th Floor

245 Park Aveaue
New York, NY 10167

James Conlon

Stein, Ine.

1929 East Royalion Road
Broadvicw Heights, OH 44147

Holly H. Wilhelmus
Bowers Harrison, LLP

25 N.W. Riverside Drive
B.O. Box 1287

Fvansville, IN 47706-1287

Hodgson Russ LLP

Attn: Cheryl R, Stone

One M&T Plaza, Suite 2000
Buffalo, NY 14203

Henry A. Efroymson
Ben T, Caughey

Ice Miller

One American Square
Box 82001
Indianapolis, IN 46282




Glenn M., Reisman
Twao Corporale Drive
Suite 636

P.O. Box 861

Shelton, CT 06484-0841

Richard M. Beheler

Blackwell Sanders Peper Martin, LLP
2300 Mam Sireet, Suie 1000

P.O, Box 419777

Kansas City, MO 64108

William D. Brejcha, Stephen A. Oakley
Andrew K. Light

Scopelitis Garvin Light & Hanson

10 West Market Strect, Suite 1500
Indianapodis, IN 46204-2968

Jay P. Kennedy

Kroger Gardis & Reguas, LLP
Suite 900

111 Monumeni Cargle
Indianapclis, IN 46204-3125

Philip D. Anker

Andrew J. Currie

Wilmer Cutler & Pickcting
2445 M Steect, NJW,
Washingion, TXC 20037-1420

Allan 8, Brilliant

Craig P. Druchl

George 8. Canelios

Milbank, Tweed, [Iadley & McCloy LLP
1 Chasc Manhattan Plaza

New York, NY 10005

Eli Knivosha, Ir.
Twa Gateway Centet
Swile 775

Pittsburgh, PA 15222

N, Theodore Zink, Jr.
Richard Sonkin
Chadbourne & Parke LLP
30 Rockefeller Pl
New York, NY 10012

[

Michael R. Enright
Robinson & Cole LLP
280 Trumbull Strect

Hartford, CT 06103

Rose A, Houk

Assistant Attorney General
Workers' Compensation Division
P.O. Box 30217

Lansing, MT 45909

Louis P, Rochkind

Alicia 8. Schehr

Juffee, Raiu, Heuver & Weiss, PC
Suite 2400

(One Woodward Avenuc

Detroit, M1 48226

Earls [. Erman

Craig E. Zucker

Erman, Tcicher, Miller
Zucker & Freedman, P.C.

Suite 333

100 CGalleria Officentre

Souhtield, M] 48034

Gregg E. Szilagyi

Christopher L. Rexroat
Ungaretti & Harris

3500 Three First National Plaza
Chicugo, I, 60602

John Koerber

Bennett Management Corp.
2 Stamford Plaza, Suite 1501
281 Tresser Boulevard
Stamlord, CT (6901

Jay E. Loeb

Olim & Loeb LLP

Suitc 480

6100 Lake Forrest Drive
Atlanta, GA 30328




Andrea Sheehan

Law offices of Robert L. Luna, P.C.
4411 North Central Expressway
Dallas, TX 75205

Richardo I. Kilpatrick
Leonota K. Baughman
Kilpatrick & Associates, P.C.
615 Griswold, Suite 1004
Detroit, MT 48226-3985

Tom Vyvyan

Direcior ol Finance

ME lobal, Inc.

3901 University Avenue, NE
Minneapolis, MN 55421

Diane P, Furr

Poyner & Spruill LLP
Suite 4000

100 North Tryon Street
Charlotte, NC 28202-4010

Mark D. Plevin

Alexandre De Gramont

Crowcll & Moring, T.LP

1001 Pennsylvania Avenug, NW
Washington, D.C. 20004-2595

Steven A, Ginther

Special Assistant Auorney General
Missouri Department o Revenue
Creneral Counsel’s Office

301 West High Street, Room 670
P.O. Box 475

Jefferson City, MO 651035-0475

Diana M. Thimmig

Arter & Hadden

1100 Huntington Building
025 Euclid Avenuc
Cleveland, OH 44115-1475

Kim Y. Jefterson

Attorney for Commissioner of Revenue
Ligal Scrvices, 27th Iloor

312 8th Avenue Nocth

Nashville, TN 37243

Michael Reed

McCreary Veselka Bragg & Allen PC
P.O, Box 26990

Austin, TX 78755

Cary P, Lightman

Glenn A. Manochi

Iightman, Manochi & Christensen
Twelfth Floor

1520 Locust Street

Philadelphia, PA 13102-4401

Joel A, Kunin

Carr Korein Tillery

412 Missouri Avenue LEast
St. Louis, IL 62201

Lewigville Independent School Distnct
c/o Sherrel K, Knighiton

Law Officcs of Robert E. Puna, PC
4411 North Central Expressway
Dallas, TX 75203

Deborah L. Thorne
Fagelhaber LLC

Suite 4000

58 Fast Monroe Street
Chicago, [L 60603

Benjamin C, Ackerly, Esquire
Peter 8. Partee

Robert 8, Weslermann
Hunton & Williams
Riverfront Plaza, East Tower
51 Last Byrd Strect
Richmond, VA 23219




Christine M. Kassak Smith
Oifice of the Solicilor
U.S. Department of Labor
Roon 844

233 South Dearborn
Chicago, I1. 60604

Tames E. Coston, Gary E. Green,

Bonnic Michael, Patricia F. Radcmacher
Coston & Lightman

Swite 600

407 South Dearborn Street

Chicago, IL 60603

Timothy Buink

Jeffrey A. Chadwick
Lard, Bissell & Brook
Suite 3100

115 South LaSalle Strect
Chicago, 1L 60603

Jonathan W, Young

T. Kellan Grant

Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon
Suite 3000

225 West Wacker Drive

Chicago, [L 60606-12.29

Holler Finaneial, Inc.
C/o Brian Bene

500 West Montoe Street
Chicago, IL 60661

Lawrence Clancy
Cook & Frank, 5.C,
660 East Masen Street
Milwaukee, W1 53202

Michael 1., Molinarn
Neal Gerber & Eisenberg
2 North LaSalle Strect
Chicago, IL 60602

Katherine 8. Dedrick
David H. Levitt
Hinshaw & Culbertson
222 North LaSalle Street
Suite 300

Chicago, IL 60601

RS Elecironics

Michelle Ross, Credit Manager
34443 Schooleratt

Livonta, MI 48150

Holly L. Tomchey

Navid . Fischer

Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon
Suite 2800

225 West Wacker Drive

Chicago, IL 60606.

Mary Mitt Kilgore

Union Pacific Railroad Company
Room 830

1416 Dodge Street

Omaha, NE 68179

Elizabeth V. Holler

Gaoldenberg, Miller, Ileller & Antognoli,
p.C.

2227 South State Route 157

P.O. Box 939

Edwardsville, IL 62023

Peler 8. Partes, Esq.

Robert §. Westermann, Esqg.
Hunton & Williams
Riverfront Plaza - East Tower
951 Last Byrd Strect
Richmond, Virginia 23219

Joseph M. Kim
Alexander Tetras
Quarles & Brady
200 West Madison Street
Sulle 3500
Chicago, IL 60661




Albert Rundall Knopt

Holtkamp, Licse, Childress & Schultz, P.C.

Suite 400 Pennsylvania Building
217 North 10th Street
Si. Louis, MO 63101

Ronald R. Paterson
Jenner & Block, LLC
One IBM Plaza
Chicago, 1L 60611

Thomas M. Walz

[1ahn, Walz and Knepp

509 West Washington Avenue
South Bend, IN 46601

Dick Mackie

Vail Rubber Works, Inc,
P.O. Box 64

St, Joseph, M1 49085

David L. Gore, Sr.
Gare & Gore
Suite 1332

53 West Jackson
Chicago, 1L 60604

Lori Gruver Robertson
Linebarger Goggan Blair
Pena & Sampson, LLP
1949 South LH. 35 (78741)
P.Q). Box 17428

Austin, TX 78760

Michael J. Baughman
Cohn &. Baughman
Suite 350

525 West Monroe Street
Chicago, IL 60661

David Rosen

Houlihan Lokey Howard & Zukin Capilal
123 N. Wacker, 4th Floor

Chicago, IL 60606

Dan Brennen P3C Metals, Ine,
20521 Chagrin Boulcvard
Cleveland, (OH 44122

Junathan Sokolow

Assistant Genersl Counsel

UMWA Health & Retirement Funds
Office of the General Counsel

2121 K Street, N.W., Suite 350
Washington, DC 20037-1879

Peter G, Swam

Timothy I'. Jacobs
Emalfarb, Swan & Bain
440 Central Avenue
Highland Park, 1L 60035

John A. Peea

Climaco, Lefkowitz, Peca,
Wiicox & Garofolh Co., L.P.A.

Suite 900

1228 Buelid Avenue

Cleveland, OH 44115

Alan 8. Kopit/Roceo 1. Debitetto
Michael P. Shuster/Lawrence [, Oscar
Hahn Loeger & Parks LLP

3300 BP Tower

200 Public Square

Cleveland, OH 441142301

R. Bcott Alsterda

Grepe E. Szilagyi

Christopher L. Rexroat

James M. McArdle

Ungaretti & Harris

3500 Three First National Plaza
Chicago, 1L 60602

William Vermette

Associate Litigation Counsel
WorldCom

11335 159th Street, NW
Washington, DC 20036

Myron K. Cunninpham
Kerr-McGee Chemical LLLC
Kerr-MeGee Center

P.0O. Box 25861

Oklahoma City, OK 73125




$heldon E. Richic

Richie & Guerninger, P.C.

100 Congress Avenue, Suite 435
Austin, TX 78701

Michael C. Rupe

Michelle Morgan Iamer
Jones, Day, Reavis & Pogue
77 West Wacker

Chicago, IL 60601

CSX Transportation
Attn: Jerry Cavainolo
500 Water Strest,
Suite J180
Jacksonville, FL. 32202

Fitzgerald & Dakmak, P.C,
Raoberl A. Peurach, Fsq.
Suite 600 Ford Building
615 Griswold

Detroit, M 48226

Jeffrey C. Torres
McGuireWoods LLP
Suite 4400

77 Wast Wacker Drive
Chicago, 11. 60601

Frederic 8. Lane, Esquue

Robbins, Schwartz, Nicholas,
Lifton & Taylor, Ltd.

20 North Clark Street, Suite 900

Chicago, IL. 60602

Brace Moore

Burkart Law Offices
4401 Highway 162
Granite City, [1. 62040

Robert Weiss

Honigman Milter Schwartz & Cobn LLF
660 Woodward Avenue

2290 First Nanonal Building

Detroit, M1 48226

William 'I". Visher

Gray, Plant, Mooty, Mooty & Bennett, P.A.
Suite 3400

33 South Sixth Street

Minneapalis, MN 35402

Stephen W. Ragland
Bass, Berry & Suns, PLC
Suite 900

100 Pecabody Place
Memphis, TN 38103

Robert M. Fishman

Shaw Gussis Fishman Glantz & Wolfson
LLC

Suite 200

1144 West Fulton Street

Chicago, 1L 60607

David A. Wargula
Askounis & Borst, P.C.
Suite 1000

303 East Wacker Drive
Chicago, IL 60601

Peter Janovsky

Zeichner Ellman & Krause LLP
575 Lexington Avenue

MNow York, NY 10022

Robert . Johnson

Robert B, Millner

Donna J. Vobornik

Patrick C. Maxey

Thomas A. LaBuda, Jr.
Sonnenschein Nath.& Rosenthal
8000 Sears Tower

Chicago, IL 60606

Gary P. Lightman

Glenn A. Munochi

Lightman, Manochi & Shristensen
12th Floor

1520 T.ovus! Street

Philadelphia, PA 19102




Lawrence D, Mishikin

Mason, Silver, Wenk & Mishkin, LLC
Suite 250 ‘
1033 Skokie Boulevard

Morthbrook, IL 00062

Brian E. McGovern

McCarthy, Loonard, Kacnmerer,
Owen, Lamkin & McGovern, LC

Suite 300

16141 Swingley Ridge Road

Chesterfield, MO 63017

Donald F. Neiman

Suite 3700

801 Grand Avenue

Des Moines, TA 50309-2727

Andrew [lerenstein
Quadrangle Group LLC

375 Park Avenus, |4th Floar
New York, NY 10152

Richard W, ITillsberg

Lester A. Ottenheimer L1

Kelly A, Samdon

Kovitz Shifrin Nesbit

750 Lake Cook Road, Suite 350
Buffalo Grove, T 60089

Heather Thayer
William L Kohn
Patricia J. Ernshwiller
Sehiff Hardin & Waite
6600 Scars 'I'owet
Chicago, 11, 60606-6473

Michael P. Shuster
Lawrence E, Oscar

Hahn Loeser & Parks LLP
3300 BP Tower

200 Public Square
Clevcland, OR 44114-2301

James E. Coston
Gary E. Green
Bonnie Michael
Caoston & Lichtman

Suile 600
407 South Dearborn
Chicago, IL 60604

Randall .. Hagen

Jeffrey E. Schmitt

Ohber, Kaler, Grimes & Shriver
120 East Baltimore Street
Baltimore, M1Y 21202-1643

Kurt M. Carlson

Tishler & Wald, Lid.
Suite 3000

200 South Wicker Drive
Chicago, IL 60606

Andrew D. Golliried

Richard 8. Toder

Morgan, Lewis and Bockius LLP
101 Park Avenue

New York, NY 10178

Richatd M. Sclztcr

Cohen, Weiss and Simons, LLP
330 W. 42nd Street

New York, NY 10036

Dravid E. Flowers

Minnesota Attorney General

445 Minnegota Street, Suite 1100
St. Paul, MN 55101

Thamas C. Smith

lee Miller

135 §. LaSalle Street, Suile 4100
Chicago, TL 60603

Lisa 5. Mcyer

Nathan P, Eimer

Eimer Stahl Klevom &, Solberg

224 8. Michigan Avenue, Suite 1100
Chicage, IL 60604




Marina L.C. Tully

Robbing, Schwartz, Nicholas,
Lifton & Taylor, Lul

Suite 200

20 North Clark Street

Chicago, IL 60611

Nicole Y. Lamb-Hale
Dykema Gosselt PLLC
400 Rcnaissance Center
Detroit, Michigan 48243

Mark A, Berkoll

David N. Missner

Piper Rudnick

203 North LaSalle Street
Suite 1800

Chicage, L 60601

United States Environmental
Protection Agency

Region V

77 West Jackson Boulevard

Chicago, IL 60604

Indiana Department of
Environmental Management

P.0. Box 6015

Indianapoliz, TN 46206-60135

Michigan Depariment of
Environmental Quality

P.O. Box 30473

Lansing, Ml 48964-7973

[llinois Environmental
Protection Agency

1021 North Grand Avenue

East Springtield, 1L 62702

Minnesota Pollution Control Agency

520 Lafaverte Road
St. Paul, MN 55155-4194

Heller Financial, Inc.
c/o Brian Benz

500 West Monroe Streel
Chicago, 1L 60661

Landmark

Adtn: Eric B. Singer

Suite 500

308 West Randolph Street
Chicago, 1. 60606

Keith Adam Simon

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom
(Illinois)

333 West Wacker Drive

Suite 2100

Chicago, IL 60606

Terry Savage

Lazard Freres & Co. LLC
Suite 2200

200 West Madison Street
Chicago, IT. 60606

Lazard Freres
Andrew Yearly

I'rank A. Savage
Terry Savage

30 Rockefeller Plaza
New York, NY 10020

Andrew M, Troop

Weil Gotshal & Mangos LLP
101 Federal Street

Boston, MA 02110

10539514




EGS JUL T 7 2003 -
e TN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS
EASTERN DIVISION

In rc: Case No. 02-08699

(Jointly Administered)
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, Chapter 11
etal.,

Honarable John H. Squires

v vt ot omart” o ot

Debtor.

ORDER AUTHORIZING RETROACTIVE RETENTION
AND EMPLOYMENT OF SEYFARTH SHAW AS COUNSEL
TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF RETIRED EMPLOYEES

Upon the Application (the “Application”) for an Order Authorizing the Retroactive
Retention and Employment of Seyfarth Shaw (“Seyfarth™) as Counsel to the Official Committee
ol Retired Employees (the "Committee™) in the above-captioned cases; due and adequate notice
of the Application having been provided and no other or further notice being required; and after
due deliberation and sufficicnt cause appearing therefore,

1T 15 HEREBY ORDERED that the Application is granted; and

IF IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Commiitee’s retention and employment of Seyfarth
as its counsel to perform all services referenced in the Application is authorized and approved

retroactive to June 2, 2003, lor all purposes,

Dated: July L3, 2003




goD MG 11200

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS
EASTERN DIVISION

In re: Case No, 02-08699
(Jointly Administered)
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, Chapter 11

etal,
Honorable John H. Squires
Debtor.

e

FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF SEYFARTH SHAW, COUNSEL
TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF RETIRED EMPLOYEES, PURSUANT
TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER UNDER 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) AND 331
ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR PERIODIC COMPENSATION
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES OF PROFESSIONALS

Seyfarth Shaw (“Scyfarth™), as counsel to the Official Committee of Retired Employees
{the “Retirees’ Committee™), hereby files its First Monthly Fee Statement {the “Monthly Fee
Statement”) for the period of June 2, 2003, through June 30, 2003 (the “Statement Period™), and
in support hereof, respectfully states as follows:

1. On March 6, 2002 (the "Pelition Date™), the Debtors commenced these cases by
filing their voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 relief under the Bankruptey Cede.

2. On Macch 7, 2002, this Court entered that certain Administrative Order under 11
U.8.C. §§ 105(x) and 331 Fslablishing Procedures for Periodic Compensation and
Reimbursement of Expenscs of Professionals (the “Administrative Order™).

3. On April 24, 2003, (his Court ordered the appointment of the Retirees’ Committee
pursuant to Section 1114(d} of the Bankruptey Code.

4, Pursuant Lo a Joint Report of the United States Trustee and the Debtors of

Proposed Retirees’ Comminee Members, on May 13, 2003, this Court nppoirﬁﬂtnbesxﬁ b&nﬁ_ E
NORTHERN i %’:T?EE OURT
“LINQI
AVG § § 2y
KE&WE?TH 5
8 .
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the Retirees’ Committee.




5 On June 2, 2003, (he Retirees’ Committec approved the engagement of Seyfarth
to act as its counscl.

6. On July 15, 2003, this Couri entered that certain Order authorizing the Retirees’
Committee to retain and employ Seyfarth retroactive to June 2, 2003.

7. In accordance with the Administrative Order, Seyfarth hereby respectfully
submits this Monthly Fee Statement, a copy of the time detail for which is attached hereto as
Exhibit A.

8. During the Statemnent Period, Seyfarth rendered 457.40 hours of legal scrvices to
the Retirees” Committee for which ﬂumpens#lion is sought in the 1otal amount of $86,024.50 (the
“Requesied Fees™).

9, Pursuant to the Administrative Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has
been given to cack of the Notice Parties, ns that term is defined in the Administrative Order.

10.  Unless any Notice Party objects to the Monthly Fee Statement, in wholg or in
part, and pursuant to the objection procedure enumerated in the Administrative Order, on or
before twenly (20) days from the date of service of this Monthly Fee Statement, the Debtory shall
be authorized to pay the Requested Fees to Seyfarth in accordance with the terms of the
Administrative Order without further order of the Court.

11,  Seyfarih reserves the right to correct, amend, or supplement the Monthly Fee
Statement until such time as final compensation and reimbursement are sought from the Debtors’

bankruptoy estates.




Dated: August 8, 2003 Respecifully submitted,

SEYFARTH SIIAW

By:
Williani J. Factor TIL 6205675)
Charles 8. Riecke (11, 90785186)
55 East Monroe Street, Suite 4200
Chicago, 1llinois 60603-5803
Tel.: (312) 346-8000

-and-

William J. Hanlon

World Trade Center East

Two Seaport Lane, Suite 300
Boston, Massachusetts 02210-2028
Tel.: (617)946-4800

Counsel to the Official Commuites
of Retired Employees




FIRST MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF

SEYFARTH SHAW

fnt re NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, ET AL,,

Bankr. Case No. 02 B 03699 (Jointly Administered)
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10 CASE ADMINISTRATION AND NON-COMMITTEE COMMUNICATIONS

DATE DES PTIC) ATTORNEY HOURS VYALUE
06/02/03  Telephone to and letter to Debtor’s ¢ounscl, arange W, Hanlon S0 175.00

for overview meating.

06/03/03  Follow-up call and strategy scssion with Bill Factor ~ W. Hanlon 80 280.00
particularly examining other solutions, applicable
case law and communications to committce,

06/03/03  Adltention W initial pleadings, scrvice list W. Hanlon 40 140.060
requijrements.

06/03/03  Conference call with Felicia Gerber Parlman, Rena W, Hanloa 1.30 455,00
Samole, Steve Christenholz, Claudia Springer, Btll
Factor and Peter Miller regarding overview of case,
sale of assets, division of proceeds, class sizes,
proccdural status, onion BBA status and dug
diligence.

06/03/03  Conference call with debtor's counsel on bankruptey P Miller 1.00 350,00
estate and retiree medical issues.

06/06/03  Telephone from F. Perlman regarding Debtor’s olfer W, Hanlon 30 105.00
under 1114,

06/09/03 Telephone conference with Debtor’s counsel J. MchManus 1.00 144,00
regarding service lists ((20); prepare 2002 ist and
master list (80

06/10/03 Review information request letter to debtot™s counsel P, Miller 20 T0.00
regarding same.

06/10/03  Letter to Debtor’s counsel regarding due diligence W, Hanlon A0 140.00
items, emails regarding same to P. Miller and W,
["actor,

06/10/03 Office conference with ). McManns regarding C. Riecke A0 23.50
service list.

06/11/03 Emails regarding inguiry by SERP plan participant. W, Hanlon 20 70.00

056/12/03 Email Deblor’s counsel regarding proposal and due W, Hanlon 20 70.00
diligence,

06/12/03  Email F. Perlman regarding proposal. W. Hanlon 40 140.00

06/13/03 Prepare request to debtor to be added (o secvice list,  C. Riecke A0 70.50

06/16/03 Telephone from F. Perlman regarding proposal. W. Hanlon 10 35.00

CH1 10564455.) - Ketiooss of Natlonal Steel Com. Junc Monthly Stacincnt




DATE

06/17/03

06/18/03

06/1%/03

06/19/03

06/20/03

06/20/03

(6/23/03

06/23/03

06/24/03

06/25/03

(46/25/03

0&/25/03

06/25/03

06/27/03

06/30/03

DESCRIPTION AITORNEY HOURS
70

Conferenee with W. Factor regarding moving for W. Hanlon
emgrgency compliance with section 1114,

Emails to Debtor’s counsel regarding conference call 'W. Hanlon
and notice of cancellation.

Prepare certificates of service for two motions for C.  J. McManus
Riceke; assemble exhibits regarding same: rovise
2002 and master service lists.

Conference call with W_11anlon and NEBC( and B. Miller
Debtor’s counsel regarding NEBCO proposal and
continucd heahh coverage alternatives.

Letter to F. Pertman regarding due diligence requests. W. Hanlon

Letter to Debtor's counsel regarding service list W. Faclor
addition (.30); review cotrespondence regarding
retires 1ssues (.20)

Email C. Fietce regarding service list - receipl of W. Hanlon
pleadings.

Conference call with Retiree Committes on NEBCO P, Miller

and various matters.

Attention to W. Hanlon service list request (10); drafl C. Riecke
letter to 5. Christenholz regarding same (.20); draft

letter to F. Perlman (.20).

Review docket. W. Hanlon

Email commiltee regarding meeting schedule. W. Hanlon

(On-line search for pleadings and retricval of same for ). McManus
. Riecke.

On-linc scarch [or plexdings; consult with document  J, McManus
service regarding same.

Docket document search {.2); review diselosure . Riccke
statement (8); memorandum to P. Miller regarding
same [2); review plan ((2).

Review e-mails and documents filed during week of W, Factor

6/23 (.30); telephone conference wilh relative of
retires regarding status (. 10)

CH1 10564435,1 - Retirees of Mational Stee] Corp, June Monthly Statement

30

1.50

1.00

50

.30

.20

1.60

S0

20

20

80

A0

40

YALUE

245.00

105.00

210.00

340.00

175.00

160.00

70.00

544,00

117.50

70.00

70.00

112.00

70.00

326.00

128.00



RATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VAL

06/30/03  ‘Yelephone conference with W. Hanlon regarding W, Factor 30 96.00
relitee coverage issues

TOTAL 17.80 $5,105.50
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DATE

D6/02/03

06/02/03

06/02/03

06/03/03

06/03/03
06/03/03

06/03/03

06/03/03
06/04/03
06/04/03

06/04/03
06/04/03

06/04/03

06/05/03

06/05/03

20 COMMITTEE MEETINGS, MINUTE:!

Phone conlerence

NESCRIPTION ATTORNEY

with Retiree Committce regarding P Miller

same; review court documents on establishment of
comumittes regarding Section 1114,

Prepare for and conduct retirec committee meeting, ~ W. Hanlon

dictate minutes.

Conference call with retirement comnutiee members W, Factor
(1.2); follow-up communications with W. Hanlon, P.

Miller and C. Riecke regarding contact with debior

and undertaking representation (.3)

Attention to emails regarding tax benetits for Cobra W, Hanlon
extension, committes lists and communications,

Draft memerandum to committes framing issues. W. Hanlon

Review and comment on draft retiree notice letter of P, Miller

Committee,

Call with debtor and committee regarding case slalus W, Factor
and propasal to retirees (1.2); follow-up analysis on
issues raised during call (.50)

Dictate committee minutes, W. Hanlon

Review proposed

press release, W, Hanlon

Review and revise Memo to Committes, W. Hanlon

Review memo prepared by W. Hanlon to committee W, Factor
and forward comments on same.

Emails regarding

minutes and memorandurm, W. Hanlon

Review various comespondence with W, Hanlonon P Miller
commitiee minutes and conference with debtor's

counsel for same,

Fmails regarding

minutes and Debtor report. W. Hanlon

Review various correspondence with W, Hanlonon  P. Miller
commillee minules and conference with debtor's

counsel.

CHI 10564455,1 - Retimes of National Stcel Corp. June Monthiy Statcment

D COMMITTEE COMMUNIC

HOURS

2.00

2.60

1.50

A

1.40

1.70

A0
20
1.90

20

50
20

A0

30

VALUE

700.00

210,00

480.00

140.00

450.00

70.00

544.00

175.00
70.00
665.00

64 (0
175.00

70.00

140,00

105.00




DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE
06/06/03  Preparation of communication for Retiree Committee P Miller .20 70.00
on HCTC.
06/06/3  Finalize memorandum for delivery to committes J. Crawford 0 140.00
(.50%; conference with P, Miller regarding HCTC
(20).
06/08/03  Outline issues for committec mecting, W. Hanlon 50 175.00
06/09/03  Prepare for and conduct committee meeting, W. llanlon 2.00 700,00
Q6/05/03 Revise fune 2nd minutes, draft June Sth minutes, W. Hanlon .80 280.00
06/09/03  Phone conference with W. Hanlon on Retiree P. Miller 70 245.00

Committee,

06/10/03  E-matl correspondence from attomey for retivee and W, Factor A0 128.00
follow- up on same (.20); review materizls on
Section 1114 issues (.20)

06/10/03  Telephone from W, Factor regarding committee W. Hazlon 20 70,00
meeting, research.

06/12/03  Email contmillee regarding same and change W, Hanlon 20 70.00
meeting.

06/12/03  Carrespond with committee members. W, Hanlon 20 70.00

06/13/03  Telephone conference with W. Hanlon regarding W, Fugtor 50 160.00
letter rom debtor and other matters.

06/16/03  Mesting minutes. W. Hanlon 40 140.00

06/16/03  Commitlee conference call {.90); review W. Fagtor 1.10 352.00
corrpspondence on pending issues (.20)

06/16/03  Committee meeting and preparation for same, W. Hanlon 2.00 700.00
especially review of NEBCO material.

06/16/03  Reliree Committes conference call, B, Miller 1.00 350.00

06/17/03  Drall and circulate press release. W. Hanlon 30 105.00

06/17/03  Research on 1114 issues W. Faclor .50 160.00

06/17/03  Telephone to W. Faclor regarding press release. W. Hanlon 10 35.00

06/17/03  Review emails regarding 1114 proposal. W. Hanlon A0 280.00
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DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOU} YALUE

06/17/03  Review and revise press relense regarding formal W_lianlon 40 140.00
proposal.

06/17/03  Telephone conferences with W. Hanlon regarding W. Factor A0 96.00
pending maliers.

06/17/03  Confercnee with R, Coffee regarding response to W. Hanlon .50 175.00
saine, impact on talks with alternative providers.

06/18/03  Emails to commiliee regarding meeling. W. Hanlon 20 70.00

06/18/03  Muliiple emails regarding press release and telephone W. Hanlon S50 175.00
to PR firm regarding same,

06/18/03  Review correspondence regarding pending matters W, Faclor 30 96.00

06/18/03  Final committce comments oh initial response to W. Hanlon 0 315.00

Debtor's proposal and press release.

06/18/03  Various conferences and correspondence with W, P. Miller 1.50 525.00

Hanlon, J. Crawlord and Retiree Commiitee
members on Debtor's proposal and NEBCO benefit

plan issues (1.20); review draft press release for
Retiree Committee regarding same {.30).

06/159/03 Conterciice call with W, Hanlon and Retliree P. Miller 1.00 350.00
Commitiee on various retirce medical 1ssues and
NEBC() plan and Debtor's proposal.

06/19/03  Prepare forward lead, conference ¢all with committee W. Hanlon 2.00 700,00
regarding press release, NTRCO proposal, coverage
continuation, COBRA v. New Plan, tax credit

availability, employce organizations.

06/20/03  Tclephone conference call with W, Hanlon and P, Miller 1.00 350.00
Retiree Committece, NEBCO and Debtor's counsel
regarding NEBCOQ plan and Debtor's proposal.

06/20/03  Draft minutes of June 19th meeting. W. Hanlon

06/20/03  Follow-up calls with committee chair and discussion W, Hanlon
of various COBRA/new plan altematives.

06/23/03  Altention to numerous emails regarding proposed W. Hanlon
plan and structure,

CII1 i0464455.1 - Retinees of Maional Steel Corp, June Monthly Statcinent




DATE
06/23/03

06/23/03

06/23/03

06/23/03

06/24/03

06/24/03

06/25/03

06/26/03

Conference call with W, Hanlon and Debtor's counse! P, Miller
regarding NEBCO plan and Debtor's propasal (1.20;

various conferences and carrespondence with W,

Hanlon regarding NEBCQ plan and Debtor's

proposal (1.10); review and revision of draft

settlement order tor NERCO plan and Tebrtor's

proposal (1.70); phone conference with W, 1lanlon

and R. Coffec regarding NEBCO plan and Debior's

proposal (30).

Prepare for and conduct committee meeting, W. Hanlon
particular focus on compelling compliance with

1114, Debtor's reaction to conference calls,

alternalives to Medicare supplements, availability of

tax credit for individual plans ang stralegy moving

forward.

Committee communications regarding extension and W, Hanlon
progress.

Minutes of committee meeting. W. Hanlon

Prepare for and conduct committes mecting W. Hanlon
regarding COBRA rates, proposed settlement, HCTC
test case, COBRA eligibility.

Conference call with Retiree Committee on NEBCO, P, Miller
Debtar's proposal, dratt Settlement Agreement and

varipus matters {2.10); review of revised settlement

agrecment for same {.40); various comespondence

with Retirce Committee mermbers, and various

correspondence and phone conferances with W,

Hanlon regarding settlement agreement, NEBCO

proposal and related health coverage matters (1.80).

Preparation [or conference call with Retiree P. Miller
Committee and NEBCO (.80); review

cerrespondence and questions for NEBCO from

Committee members (40); conference call with

Retiree Committes and NEBCO representatives

regarding various NEBCO medical coverage issues

(1.80).

Attention to varicus emails regarding union deal, W. Hanlon
exlension letter.

CH1 10564455, . Retirees ol Nytinna Skee] Clorp. Jung Muonthly Stalement

DESCRIPTION RNEY

HOURS VALUE
4,30 1,203.00
2.50 875.00

.80 280.00
.50 175.00
3.00 1,050.00
4.3 1,505.00
3.10 1,085.00
30 105.00




PATE DESCRIPTION

06/26/03  Phone conferences with W. Hanlon regarding Retiree P. Miller 240 840.00
Committee negotiations {.40); review extension of
benelits leler from Debtor's counsel (.20); review
correspondenee on medical plan design from
NEBCQ and eorrespondence with Retiree Committec
members for same (60 preparation of Committee
Minutes for prior Committes meeting (1.20).

06/26/03  Telephone confersnce with P, Miller regarding W. Hanlon 30 105.00
conference with NEBCQ),

06/26/03  Telcphone [rom 8. Sisti regarding status, W. Hanlon 50 175.00

06/27/03  Review materials regarding HCTC in preparation for  I'. Singerman 2.00 780,00
Retirees' Committee meeting; attend retirees’
committee mecting concerning benefil proposal.

06/27/03  Preparation for National Stee] Hetiree conference calt P. Miller 6.30 2,205 .00
{ .60); conferences with I, Singerman regarding IRS
clarification issue for same {.40): conference call
with Retirce Committee and F. Singermun regarding
varigus retiree, NEBCO and due diligence issues on
NEBC({2.30); conferences with W. Hanlon
regarding call for same (.30); phone conferences with
W. Hanlon and R, Coffee regarding same (2.40);
conferences with J. Crawflord regarding Tux Credit
and related due diligence issues for same (30).

06/30/03  Telephone to W, Factor regarding status and creditor  W. Hanlon 70 245.00
06/30/03 Legal research and analysis regarding business T. Kugla 3.00 645.00
acquisition rules related to COBRA continuation
coverage.
06/30/03  Fmail committec reparding status of negotiations, W. Hanlon 1.30 455.00

especially negotiating variables,
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DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/30/63  Conferences with J. Crawlord regarding preparation P, Miller 4.40 1,540.00
of due diligence book for NEBCO (.50); phone
conference with W, Hanlon and F. Singerman
regarding various igsues (1.60%; review various
correspondence with NEBUO regarding comments
on setllement agreement (40); reyiew
cortcspondence with W. Hanlon regarding retires
issues and negotiations for same {.30); conferences
with T, Kuska regarding rescarch of COBRA case
law on buyer liability for COBRA (.20); phone
conference with W. lanlon and R. Coffee rogarding
settliement agreement and NEBCO reactions {1.40),

TOTAL 244,70 $26,115.00
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30 BENEFIT PLAN ANALYSISAEGAL RESEARCH

DATE DESCRIFPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALVUE
06/02/03  Review Section 1114 requircments on retiree medical P. Miller 70 245.00

benelits and modifications for same (.70).

06/03/03  Conferences with J. Crawford regarding research of  P. Miller 1.10 385.00
Tax Adjustment Act and tax credits for COBRA
regarding same (.50); research Section 1114 rejection
requirenents (.60),

06/03/03  Conference with P. Miller regarding Trade Act of 1. Crawtord 90 180.00
2002 and Health Coverage Tax Credit (.20); legal
research regarding same (.70),

06/04/03  Research regarding health coverage tax credit, PRBC W, Hanlon 2.10 735.00
information regarding pension plans & interaction of
Lax eredit.

06/04/03  Conferences with J. Crawford regarding researchon P Miller 1.10 385.00

Tax Adjustment Act and tax credits for COBRA
regarding same (.40); review Tax Adjustment Act for
same (.70},

06/04/03  l.egal research regarding the Health Coverage Tax ). Crawford .70 540,00
Credit as it relates 10 persons receiving hencfits paid
by the Pension Benefit Guaranty Corporation (2.40);
telephone conlerence with HCTC Customer Contact
Center regarding the federal tax credit program ((3)).

06/05/03  Conference with P. Miller regarding Health Coverage J. Crawford 4.50 900.00
Tax Credit program and status of legal research (.20);
further legal research and review of guidance related
10 tux eredit (2.30): tclephone conference with HCTC
Customer Contact Center regarding confirmation of
certain details of the program (.40); preparation of
memarandumn outlining the tax credit and the
procedure for obtaining it (1.60).

06/05/03  Review retiree medical plan documents received F. Miller 1.80 630.00
from debtor's counsel.

06/06/03  Further preparation ol memorandum providing J. Crawford 2.40 480.00
overview of tax credit program (1.0); turther legal
research and review of materials and guidance
relating to HCTC, including review of HCTC
program kit sent to eligible individuals (1.10); legal
rescarch and review of cffect of nlternative health
insurance oplions under HCTC program (30).
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DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/06/03  Conferences with J. Crawford regarding Health Care P Miller 1.60 560,00
Tax Credit (.40); review and revision of
memorandum to Retiree Commitlee on HCTC for
same (1,20}

06/08/03  Review all pleadings relating to 1114 motion in W, Hanlon 3.00 1,050.00
Bethlehem Steel cuse, nole issues.

06/09/03  Conterence with P. Miller regarding bankruptcies ). Crawford 2.70 540.00
involving other large steel companies and related
legal rescarch issues (L30); revicw of Bethlchem Stecl
pleadings and decisions from the court (40); legal
rescarch and review of case law pertaining 1o LTV
bankruptey filed in Youngstown, Ohlo federal court

(2.0).

06/09/03  Conference with C. Riecke regarding research on 7th W, Hanlon 50 175.00
Circuil standard For 1174 cases.

06/09/03  Tmails with P. Miller regarding plans and rescarch; W, Hanlon i 245.00
NEBCO contract.

06/09/03 Review Section 1114 requirements on Comimitiee P. Miller 1.40 490.00

inquiry on amendment rights (.30); review
Bethlshem Steel materials on bankruptcy and retiree
issues (.60).

06/09/03  Auention to research 1114 issuas (40); Lexis C. Riecke .60 141.00
rescarch regarding same (20).

06/10/03  Office conference with W. Factor regarding Section  C. Riecke J0 23.50
L 114 rescarch.

06/10/03  Conferences with J. Crawford regarding COBRA and P. Miller 60 210.00
Tax Credit issucs (.30%; conferences with I. Crawford
regarding review of other bankruptoy case pleadings
and conferences with NEBCO regarding new benefit
plans (.30}

06/10/03  Further roview of LTV pleadings, docket sheet, and T, Crawford S0 [30.00
published decisions of the Northern District of (Ghio
bankruptey court (. 703 conference with P, Miller
reparding same (.20).

06/11/03  Conferences with 1. Crawford regarding COBRA, P. Miller A0 14(1.00
Tax Credit issues and related steel company
bankruptey issnes.
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DATE

06/11/03

06/12/03

06/12/03

06/13/03

06/13/03

DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

Further legal research and review of pleadings related J. Crawford 2.80
to Bethlehem Steel and L'V bankruptcies (2.0);

conference and email correspondence with P. Miller

regarding Bethlehem Steel and LTV (.50);

conference with $. Janusek of 1Jocket Department

regarding the obtaining of other similar bankruptcy

cases (.30).

Further legal research and review of LTV Steel J. Crawford 3.10
hankrupicy {.50); telephone conference with S. Sisli
of NEBCO regarding alternative health care
arrangements for retirces and status of proposal
before Mational Stecl from NEBCO (.50); conference
with F. Miller regarding ahove (.20); preparation of
email to 1. Miller regarding substance of telephone
conversation with 8. Sisti (.50); follow-up email
correspondence with S. Sisti of NEBCO (.20); legal
research regarding general COBRA provisions and
what eonstitutes COBRA continuation coverage
(1.20),

Various conferences with 1. Crawford regarding P. Miller 60
COBRA, Tax Credit issues, related steel company

bankruplcy issues and NEBCO continued health plan

coverage.

Review of LTV docket sheel as to pleadings and J. Crawford 3.50
orders from the court relating to issues the Naticnal
Steel Retiree Commiuee is facing (.50); conference
and email correspondence with S. Janusek of Docket
Department regarding obtaining of materials (40);
emai)] correspondence with P. Miller regarding
WEBCO and 8. Sisti (.40); telephone conference with
P. Miller regarding conversation with 5. Sisti and
follow-up issucs (.40); telephone conlerence with S.
Sisti regarding obtaining of the NEBCO proposal
given to National Steel (.30}, legal research rogarding
the duration of the tax credit under the HCTC
program (1.30); telephone conterence with HCTC
(Customer Contact Center regarding duration of tax
eredit (.20).

Review confidentiality agreement, modify same, W. Hanlon 70

telephone to D. Colfee regarding authority to enter,
revise, execute and fax same to NEBCO.
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DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS  VALUE

06/13/03  Various correspondence with W_ Hanlon on Retiree P, Miller 1.70 595.00
representation matters (.30); various conferences with
J. Crawlord regarding NEBCO continued health plan
coverage (40%; review correspondence of 1L
Crawford regarding NEBCQ proposals for same
(.30); phone conferences wilh W, Hanalon and 8. Sisu
of NEBCO regarding various retiree medical options
Jor Wational Steel retiree group (.70).

06/13/03  Conference with P. Miller and $. Sisti of NEBCO W_1lanlon 1.00 350,00
regarding conversion/iermination of National Steel
Plan, timing COBRA, issucs.

06/13/03  Anention to emails regarding termination of certain W, Hanlon , 40 140,00
benefits und communications with committee
members.

06/16/03  Lcgal research and review of materials relating to 1. Crawford 1.90 380.00

COBRA continuation coverage.

06/16/03  Varous coulerences with ). Crawford regarding P. Miller 2.00 700.00
COBRA and Tax Credit issues and NEBCO
cantinued health plan coverage (.20); review and
analysis of Debtars proposal letter ((30); review and
analysis of medical plan documents relating to
termination anthority (.30); review and analysis of
NEBCO medical coverage proposal (1.00).

06/17/03  Legal research regarding HCTC and interplay with 1. Crawlord 1.80 360.00
COBRA.
06/18/03  Legal research and review of cascs involving J. Crawlord 1.50 300.00

unilateral termination of benefits pursuant to plan
terms (1.30); conference with P. Miller regarding
same (.20).

06/18/03 Rescarch ERISA notice requirements on termination P, Miller .10 335.00
of health coverage (.60); review of response letter to
debtor's counsel regarding debtor's proposal on
termination of benefits (.50},

06/19/03  Conference with W. Factor regarding emergency W. Hanlon A0 140.00
relief, scope of represcntation.

06/19/03  Conference with C. Riecke reparding preparation for W, Hanlon 40 140.00
emcrpcney relief.
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DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS YALUE

06/19/03 | Conference with P. Miller regarding additional issues 1. Crawford 3.90 780.00
to research (.30); telephone conference with advance

law seetion of IRS regarding COBRA continuation

coverage and Health Coverage Tax Credit (HCTC)

{1.0); further legal rescarch regarding COBRA

continualion coverage and HCTC (2.60).

06/19/03 | Conlerences with J. Crawford regarding COBRA P, Miller .60 204.00
continnation and Tax Credit issues for same and 114
case law research.

06/20/03 | Conference with C. Riecke regarding content of W, Hanlon 50 175.00
cmergency motion Lo compel compliance with 1114,

06/22/03 | Conference with C. Rieckd regarding motion to W. Hanlon J0 105.00
compel compliance with 1114

06/23/03 | Feview drafi motion to compel compliance with W, Hanlot 2.30 805.00
1114 motion, edit same regarding duc

diligence/completeness of proposal and email C,

Eiecke regarding same.

06/24/03 | Conlerence with C. Riecke regarding service list W. Hanlon 30 105.00
issues, research regarding National forge settlement.

06/24/03 | Telephonc conference with W. Hanlon regarding C. Riecke 1.20 282.00
| 1114 malter (.20Y; docket document search (50);
bankrupicy court docket document search (.50).

TOTAL 61.80  $16,515.50
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30 1114 PROPOSAL/NEGOTIATION

DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS YALUE
06/16/03  Conferences with P. Miller regarding tax credit, 1. Crawford 2.80 560.00

COBRA, and NEBCO proposal {.50); review of
NEBCO proposal to National Steei Retiree
Committes (1.0); formulate follow-up questions for
NEBCO based on proposal (1.0); review of propasal
from National Steel (300

06/16/03  Prepace for NEBCO mecling. W. Hanlon H0 210.00

06/16/03 Emails from committee members regarding W. Hanlon A0 280.00
numerous questions for NEBCO and Mationat Stesl,

D6/16/03  Bricf teview of formal proposal, email to Committee W, Hanlon 1.80 630.00

regarding same and email to C. Riecke regarding
research and 1, Miller regarding plan terms.

06/16/03  Conference with P. Miller ragarding meeting with W. Hanlon .60 210.00
NEBCOQ, telephone [rom S. Fleet and . Sisti
regarding samc, sct up meeting.

06/16/03  Contact other providers regarding alternative plans. ~ W. Hanlon 1.30 435.00

06/16/03  Telephone to Marsh USA regarding insurance W. Hanlon 1.20 420.00
platforms and alternatives.

0617703 Revise lelter o F. Perlman, circulate same for W. Hanion B0 315.00
comment and make futther revisions,

06/17/03  Telephone to F. Perlman regarding allermatives to W, Hanlun 1.30 455.00
proposal and organize call with Debtor's counsel.

06/17/03 Review medical plan summaries of National Steel P Milter 4.20 1,470.00
medical plans regarding unilateral tenmination rights
and netice procedures and correspondence with W,
Hanlon rigarding same (1.10); various conferences
with J. Crawford regarding COBRA and Tax Credit
isgues and NEBCO continued health plan coverage
{.70); conference call with W. Hanlon, R. Coffee and
NEBCO health plan provider regarding potential
hcalth plan allematives (2.00); review Retiree
Committee ¢orrespondence on NEBCO proposal and
debtor counsel's proposal regarding same (.40),

06/17/03  Conference with D. Coffee regarding negotiating W. Hanlon A0 140.00
approach to Dehtors,
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PATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/17/03  Dratt initial response to Debtor's formal 1114 W, lanlon 2.60 910.00
proposal,
06/17/03  Meet with 8. Feet and 8. Sisti regarding alternative W, Hanlon 2.50 375.00

benefit platform, conference with committee chair, P,
Miller and outside caunsel for NEBCO regarding,
siruciural and organizational elements of alternative
benefit plan, Nationa) $teel Corporation and interplay
with federal tax laws, state insurance programs and
federal benefits,

0617703 Offiee conference with W, Factor regarding 1114 C. Riecke 1.90 446.50
cases (.20); to/and/from omnibus hearing (.80Y;
follow-up memo regarding same (.20); Lexis
research regarding eaze cited by Judge Squires (.10}
revise pro hac vice motlion (30); telephone
conference with W, Hanlon regarding motions to file
{.20).

06/17/03  Office conference with P, Miller reginding NEBCQ ], Crawlord 1.50 300,00
proposal (303, telephone conference with IRS
regarding Health Coverage 'T'ax Credit (HC'TC) and
CUIBRA continuation soverage (.70); welephone
conference with HCTC program and eligibility and
duration jssues (.50).

06/18/03 Phane conference with W, Hanlon and Debtor's P. Miller 80 280.00
counsel regarding 1114 proposal and NEBCO benefit
plan 1ssues.

06/18/03  Telephane to F. Perlman regarding due diligence. W. Hanlon 30 105.00

06/18/03  Conference with C, Riecke regarding motion to W. Hanlon 20 70.00
compel, compliance with 1114,

06/18/03  Prepare tor and call Debtor's counsel regarding W. Hanlon R0 280.00
NEBCQ proposal,

06/18/03 Set-up conference call for benefits personnel and W, Hanlon 50 175.00

counsel for June 19h, circulale proposal.
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DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/18/03  Office conference with W. Factor regarding 1114 C. Riecke 1.20 282.00
motion (.10}, office canference with W, Factor
regarding motion notice on non-omni date {.10);
WEBPACER docket documenc search (.60); respond
to W. Hanlon inquiry regarding same (.10); tolephone
conferchce with W. Factor regarding Commitles
conference call (.10); telephone conference with W.
Hanlon regarding motion and committee (.20).

06/18/03  Telephone to NEBCQ regarding call with Debtor's W. Hanlon A0 [75.00
counscl and points to cover.

06/19/03  Conference call with NEBCO, . Sisti, 0. Trudeau, W. Hanlon 1.00 350.00
3. Fleet, Skadden Benefits Attorneys, M. Lawson, D.
MecFarlane, Retires counsel, . Miller regarding
mechanics of adopting and transferring new plan,
assuring COBRA tax credit, benefit levels, state level
approval, maintenance of group plan for active
employees, continuation of benefits through July

Jlst,

06/18/03  Follow-up call with NEBCO reparding COBRA W. Hanlon 90 315.00
cO3ts, transition issucs.

06/19/03  Draft Jetter regarding additional due diligence W. Hanlon 80 280.00
requests,

06/26/03  Prepare for and conduct conference call with W. Hanlon 1.50 525.00

Skadden, NSL, NEBCO & committce chair regarding
offering alternaiive affordable health care plan,
limiting NSC liability regarding same.

06/20/03  DBcegin preparation of 1114 mation. C. Riecke 40 94.00

06/21/03  Prepare molion to compel compliance with C. Riecke 8.70 2,044.5¢
1114(7.60); Lexis research regarding same (1.10).

06/22/03  Preparc motion 1o compei compliance with 1114 C. Riecks 5.70 1,339,50
{4.70), CM/ECF document search regarding same
(-30) Lexis research regarding same (.40); telephone
conference with W. Hanlon regarding motion (30).

06/23/03  Email commitiee regarding proposed term sheet. W. Hanlon 30 105.00

06/23/03  Email P. Miller regatding insurance coverage and W. Hanlon 30 105.00
IRS inquiries.
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DATE DESCRIFTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/23/03  Conterence with R. Coffee and P, Miller regarding ~ W. Hanlon &0 210.00
SAIMe.

06/23/03  Continue edits on term sheet, especially regarding W, Hanlon 1.60 560.00
bankruptcy court approval of COBRA continuation.

06/23/03  Conference with F. Perfman regarding extending W. Hanlon 060 210.00
deadline, getting 1o settlement, gencral terms of
setilement.

06/23/03  Conferenee call with T, Freeman, M. Lawson, D. W. Hanlon 1.00 350.00

McFarlanc, Simon, F. Perlman, P. Miller and W,
Hanlon regarding Debtor's position on extending
benefits, allernative coverages, education of retirecs
regarding same, requests for proposal.

06/23/03  Prepare 1114 motion (4.80); participate in telephone  C. Riecke 5.50 1,292.50
cotllerence with committee (.20); telephone
vonferchee with W. Hanlon regarding mation
revisions (500,

06/23/03  Legal rescarch regarding Heulth Coverage Tax Credit J. Crawford .60 120.00
and what constitutes qualified health insurance (40);
smail correspondence with P Miller reparding same

(.20},
06/23/03  Draft settlement terin sheet, W. Hanlon 1.80 630.00
06/24/03  Review of cligibility requirements for the Health ). Crawford 20 40.00

Coverage Tax Credit {(.10); correspondence with P.
Miller regarding same ( 10).

06/24/03  l.etter from F, Petlman regarding fulure retirees, W. Hanlon 50 175.00
request for information regarding same.

06/24/03  Revise settlement terms. W. Haalon 1.50 525.00

06/24/03  Conference with NERCO regarding proposed W. Hanlon 1.40 490.00

scilement, set up conference with NEBCO and
commillee, emails regarding same, especially agenda

items.

06/25/03  Conference with D. Coffes regarding meeling with ~ W. Hanlon 50 175.00
NEBCO.

06/25/03  Two office conferences with J, McManus regarding  C. Riecke 40 70.50

National Forge documents {.20%; follow-up with W.
Hanlon regarding same (. 10).
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DATE
06/26/03

06/26/03

06/26/03

06/27/03

06/27/03

06/27/03

06/27/03

06/30/03

06/30/03

06/30/03

DESCR ATTORN, HOURS
Telephone conference with F. Perlman regarding W. Manlon J0
union deal.
Conference call with D, McFaran, M. Lawson, F. W. Hanlon 1.50

Perlman, 1. Furfato, K. Simon, T. Freeman and P.
Miller regarding scttlement term sheet, especially
timing, costs, access to information.

Negotiations confercnce with W, Hanlon and P. Miller 1.50
Debtor's counsel on Settlement Agreement {1.20);
conferences with W, Hanlon regarding same (L300

Conference with P. Miller regarding Health Coverage J. Crawdord 1.40
Tax Credit and relevant file materials (.20); review of

file materials and those pertinent materials available

an the Tnjernet which offer guidance on the Health

Coverage Tax Credit (1.0); email correspondence

with F. Singerman regarding same (.20).

Telephone ta 8. Sisti regarding same and Spencer W. Hanlon 80
report.
Telephone from F. Perlman regarding COBRA costs W, Hanlon 70

and capturing benefit,

Conference calls with P, Miller and D). Coffee W. Hanlon 1.00
regarding varialions on coverage, IRS approval,

concurrent vs. sequential coverage, real money in

exchange tor COBRA coverage.

Revicw and evaluate ramifications of settlement F. Singenman 2.00
agreement and revise proposed agreement; brief

rescarch on impact under IRC Section 4930B

regulations; confercnce with W, Hanlon and P. Miller

regarding same.

Conference call with P. Miller und F. Singerman W. Hanlon 1.50
regarding response W Skadden term sheet, especially

successor liability, approval rights regarding VEBA

trust and retiree committee plan, designation of

adrministrator, and mirror itmage liability disclaimers:

rovise settlement to incorporate same,

Review NEBCO comments on Skadden redline and W, Hanlon 50
clean.
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245.00

525.00

315.00

280,00

280.00

245.00

350.00

780.00

525.00

175.00




DATE DESCRIPT ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/30/03  Conference with D. Coffee and P. Miller regarding ~ W. anlon 1.50 630.00
changes to NSC proposal and plan structure,
especially concurrent v. scquential COBRA options.

06/30/03  Telephone from F. Perlman regarding changes to W. Hanlon 70 245.00
NSC proposal, negotiation status and emails
regarding same,

06/30/03  Review Skadden redline and clean of drafl settlement W, Hanlon 120 420.00

term shect,

06/30/03  Review roll-out issues and summarize status for W. Hanlon .80 280.00
commitiee.

06/30/03  Telephone from F. Singerman reparding review of W, Hanlon B0 280.00

pravisions in settlement agreement, background to
same. ‘Task Sublotal

TOTAL 81.30 $24,834.50
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DATE

06/30/03

60 SETTLEMENT IMPLEMENTATION

DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS  VALUE
Contercnce with P, Miller regarding due diligence . Crawford 4.10 820.00

activitics relating to NEBCO and American
Wholesale Insurance Group Company (,30); research
and review of malerials relating to NEBCQ and its
parent available on the Internet (3.40); research
relating to information on state insurance
depariments (.40),

TOTAL 4.10 $820.00
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0 ENGAGEMENT/YEE APTL

DATE DESCRIPFTION ATTORNEY HOURS VALUE
06/02/03  Attention to and memo to conllicts department (20); C. Riccke 3.90 916.50

two office confercnces with W, Factor regarding
sama (., 10); WEBPACER docket document search
{(.20); preparc affidavit of disinterestedness (.60),
telephone conferences with W. Hanlon regarding
application and affidavit (.20); WEBPACER docket
search for interim order (.20); prepare mation for
admission pro hac vice and notice, order (1.70);
review local rules regarding same (.70).

06/02/03  Telephone to P. Miller and W. Factor regarding copy  W. Hanlon i 24500
and additional miganizational issues, tompile and
calculate commitiee list,

06/02/03  Telephone to C. Reike regarding application, W. Hanlon 50 175.00
conflicts, interim fees, pro hac vice admission.

06/02/03  Confercnees with W, Fuctor and W. Hanlon P. Miller 60 210.00
regarding representation of retirce committee under
National Steel bankruptcy, |

06/03/03  Attention to interim compensation procedures and W. Ilanlon 40 140,00
task codes,
06/03/03 Document and rule search on N.D. lllincis website . Riccke 00 211.50

(.20Y; revisc motion to appear pro hac vice (.60);
prepare memo to W. Hanlon regarding same with
attachments (. 10)

06/04/02  Office conference with F. Sweet regarding conflicts  C. Riecke 10 23.50
(.10).
06/05/03  Prepare retention application (5.50); prepare affidavit C. Riecke 7.50 1,762.50

of dizinterestedness (2,00),

06/06/03  Prepare Seyvtarth retention application (.30}, prepare  C. Riecke 310 728.50
and revise Seyfarth affidavit of disinterestedness
(2.30).

06/09/03  Conference with C. Reicke reparding application for W, Hanlon 70 245.00

cmployment, conflict issues.

06/0%/03  Various correspondence with W. Hanlon reparding P Miller 30 105.00
various representation matters,
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06/09/03

06/10/03

06/10/03

06/11/03

06/11/03

06/11/03
06/12/03

06/12/03

06/12/03

06/13/03

06/13/03

DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOURS

VALUE

Three telephone conferences with conflicts C. Rigcke 1.30
departmcut regarding search (.30); two telephone

conferences with W. Hanlon regarding same (.40);

office conferences with W, Factor regarding same

(.20); pull administrative orders in National Stee]

{-20); review same (,20).

Memo to D. Crowley regarding retention information €. Riecke 50
for aftidavit (.20); review Section 1114 research

(.20); follow up with F. Sweet regarding conflicts

check (.10}

Correspondence with W. Factor and W, Hanlonon P, Miller 30
representation malters.

Corrcspondence with W. Factor and W. Hanlonon P, Miller 30
Retiree representation matters.

Prepare conflicts memo (30); two office conterences  C. Riecke 1.50
with W, Faclor regarding eonflicts (10): two office

conferences with F. Sweet regarding conflicts check

(.10); edit retention application (.30); cdit affidavit of

disinterestedness (.30); attention to conflicts check

{40).

Attention to conflict reports for disclosure purposes.  W. Hanlon. 20
Attention to condlicts and disclosure issucs. W. Henlon. A0
Otfice confercnce with W, Factor regarding conflicts  C. Riecke. 40

search {.10); attention to/process conflicts
Information (.30}

Various correspondence with W, Factor and W. F. Miller. a0
Hanlon on Retirec representation matters,

Telephonc to W. Factor regarding employment W. Hanlon., 50
application, telephene to C. Riecke regarding
confhicts check.

Telephone to Debtor's counsel regarding proposal W. Hanlon. 50
and due diligence,
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105,00

332,30

70.00

140.00
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DATE DESCRIPTION AILTORNEY HOURS VALUE

06/13/03  Preparc affidavit and conflicts attachments (1.20); C. Riecke 3.30 775.50
preparc retention application and notice, order,
certificate of service, minute order (.80); telephone
conference with W, Factor reparding same and memo
10 B. Hanlen regarding same (.10); telephone
conferences with B, Hanlon regarding filing {10);
perform and atrention (o conflicts check (.60);
telephone conference with W, Factor and B, Hanlon
regarding motion and conflict search (.20): prepare
further conflicts memo (20); WEBPACER docket
search regarding pro hac application (.10),

06/13/03  Altention to retention issues. W. Factar. 50 160.00

06/16/03  Discussions with W, Hanlon and then with C. Riscke W. Factor. 20 64.00
regarding retention,

06/16/03  Various correspondence with W, Hanlon on Retirce 1. Miller. 30 105.00
representation matters,

06/16/03  Conference with W. Factor and C. Riccke regarding W, Ianlon. 40 140.00
reteition papers, omnibus meeting procedurcs,

06/16/03  Process confliets information (. 80); bankruptey court  C. Riecke 5.30 1,245.50
website search regarding nexi omnibus date (. 10);
telephone conference with W, Hanlon regarding
application and conflicts information (.10); office
confercnee with W, Factor regarding filings (.10);
prepure atfidavit and attachment for retention (1 60);
telephene conference with W. Hanlon and W. Factor
regarding pleadings, strategy (.30).

06/17/03  Telephone to €. Riecke regarding rescarch, status of W, Hanlon. 40 140,00
employment application.

06/17/03  Revisions to retention materials, W. Factor, 30 160.00

06/18/03  Revise affidavit (.60); revise application (,30) C, Riecke 1.00 23500

multiple e-mails to W. Hanlon and W, Factor
regarding affidaviz and application (.10).

06/18/03  Review affidavit, email C. Riecke regarding same. W, Hanlon. 30 105.00
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DATE
06/19/03

06/20/03

Q6/20/03

06/24/03

06/26/03

06/26/03

DESCRIPTION TORNEY

Prepare pleadings for filing (1.00); edit application  C. Riecke
{.30): three oftice confercnees with J. McManns

regarding same (.20); two office conferences with W.

Factor regarding application (.10); telephone

conterence with W. Hanlon and W. Factor regarding

Section 1114 motion issues (.20).

Telephone conferences with T. Ponds regarding .. Riecke
application (.1 0); edit application (.50); office

conference with W, Factor regarding same {.10);

office conference with W. Factor regarding hearing

date and tclephone conference with W. Hanlon

tegarding same (.20); telephone conference with W,

Factor and W, Hanlon reparding 1114 motion and

application (.30); revisc retention application {.40);
revise pro hac vice motion (,10); commitice
telephone conference with Skadden (.60); telephone
conference with D. Coffee and W, Hanlon {.20);
telephone conference with D. Coffee regarding
retention application (.10Y; two office conferences
with L. McManus regarding filing (.20).

Telephone to W._ Factor regarding retention W. lHanlon,
application, atlention to scope of work reparding
same.

Follow-up with F. Sweet regarding conflicts (.10),  C. Riecke.
two telephone conference with 5, Wolfe regarding

retention application (.10); two memos to M. Lies

regarding WS Steel (.20).

Telephone conference with B. Hanlon regarding C. Riecke
document request {1); lelephone confercnce with

Fran Sweet regarding conflict cheek (.2):; sccond

follow-up with J. McMarus regarding document

request (1); process conflict results with

memorandums to attorncys regarding same (.7)

follow-up correspondence to 8. Christenbok and F.

Perlman regarding service list (1),

Telephanc conference with C. Riecke regarding W. Hanlon.
further disclosures, cliends on creditor list,

TOTAL
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HOURS VALUE
1.80 423,00
2.80 658.00

elt] 245.00
AQ 94,00
1.20 282.00
30 105.00
44.30 $11,444.00



90 TRAVEL

DATE DESCRIPTION ATTORNEY HOUR VALUE
06/17/03  Travel to and from meeting with NEBCO. W. Hanlon 3.40 1.190.00
TOTAL 340 51,190.00
TOTAL FEES

386,024.50
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W. Faclor

P. Miller

P. Miller

F. Singerman
J. Crawford
T. Kuska

. Riccke

J. McManus
W. Hanlon

Parther
Pariner
Partner
Partner
Associate
Associate
Asgociate
Paralegal
Partner |

8.90
56.80
3.20
4.00
43.90
3.00
62.90
3.80
102.60

hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
hours
honrs

at
at
at
al
at
at
at
at
at

$320.00
$350.00
$340.00
$390.00
$200.00
8215.00
£235.00
$140.00
$350.00
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:ERTIFI

TE OF SERVICE
I, Charles 8. Riecke, an uttorney, do hereby certify that I caused a true and correct copy
of each of the Notice of Filing and First Monthly Fee Statement of Seyfarth Shaw, Counsel
to the Officinl Committee of Retired Employces, Puryuant to the Administrative Order
under 11 U.S.C, §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Periodic Compensation and
Reimbursemcent of Expenses of Professionals, 1o be served upon the entities listed on the
attached Service List by causing the same to be deposited, in properly-addressed envelopes with
sufficient first-class postage prepaid, into the United States Mail chute located al 55 East Monroe

Street, Chicago, [linols 60603, on this 8th day of August 2003, before the hour of 5:00 p.m.

O afl .

Charles 8. Riecke
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT .,
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLIN%‘D}-D s

EASTERN DIVISION Uilitgy! ,’ff Y ""’fﬁu
vl F]br
OF 41y, 50U
In re; ) Cage No, 02- 08 M”\ 2 L’”a“ﬂ
) (Jointly Admmls
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, ) Chapter 11 Rp
etal, ) TEAM : tt:-‘v EQ Clary
) Honorable John I1. Squires
Debtors. )
)

AMENDED SECOND MONTHLY FEE STATEMENT OF SEYFARTH SHAW LLP,
COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF RETIRED EMPLOYEES,
PURSUANT TO THE ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER UNDER 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a)
AND 331 ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR PERIOMMC COMPENSATION

AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES OF PROFESSIONALS

Seylarth Shaw LLP (“Seyfarth™), as counsel to the Official Committee of Retired

Employees (the “Retirees’ Committee™), hereby files its Amended Second Monthly Fee
Statement (the “Monthly Fee Statement”) for the period of July 1, 2003, through July 31, 2003
{the “Statement Periad”), and in support hereof, respectfully states as follows:

i On March 6, 2002 (the “Petition Daie™), the Debtors commenced these cases (the
“Cases™ by filing their voluntary petitions for Chapter 11 relief under the Bankruptcy Code.

2. On March 7, 2002, this Court entered that certain Administrative Order under 11
10.5.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedurcs for Periodic Compensation and
Reimbursement of Expenses of Protessionals (the “Administrative Ordet™).

3. On April 24, 2003, this Court ordered the appointment of the Retirees’ Committee
pursuant to Scction 1114(d) of the Bankruptcy Code.

4. Pursuant to a Joint Report of the United States Trustee and the Debtors of
Proposed Retirees” Committce Members, on May 13, 2003, this Court appointed the members of

the Retirees” Committee.
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5. On June 2, 2003, the Retirees’ Committee approved the engagement of Sevfarth
1o act as its counsel.

6. On July 15, 2003, this Court entered that certain Order authorizing the Retirees’
Committee {o retain and employ Seyfarth retroactive 1o June 2, 2003,

7. On August 8, 2003, Seyfarth filed its First Monthly Fee Stalement as Counsel (o
the Official Comminee of Retired Employees (the “First Monthly Fee Statement™.

3. On August 26, 2003, Seyfarth filed its Second Monthly Fee Statement as Counsel
to the Official Committee of Retired Employees (the “Second Monthly Fee Statement™).

g, T'his Monthly Fec Statement, a copy of the time detail for which is altached hereto
as Exhibit A, amends and supplements the Second Monthly Fee Statement.

10.  During the Statement Period, Seyfarth rendered 338.40 hours of legal services to
the Retirees’ Commilles for which compensation is sought in the total amount of $93,345.00 (the
“Requested Fees'™).

11.  During the Statement Period, Seyfarth incurred expenses for which
reimbursement is sought in the total amount of $1,569.32 (the “Requested Expenses™).

12. Pursuant to thc Administrative Order, notice of this Monthly Fee Statement has
been given to gach of the Notice Parties, as that term 15 defined in Paragraph 4 of the
Administrative Order.

13, Unless any Notice Party objects to the Monthly Fee Statement, in whole or in
part, and pursuant fo the objection procedure enumerated in the Administrative Order, on or
before twenty (20) days from the date of service of this Monthly Fee Statement, the Debtors shall
be authorized to pay the Requested Fees and Expenses to Scyfarth in accordance with the terms

of the Administrative Order without further order of the Court,

CIIl 1057334061




14, The following table and statement provide a summary statement of the status of

Seyfarth’s First Monthly Fee Statement in these Cases:

3/8/03 6/2/03 - | $86,02450 |  $0.00 $77,422,05 None $0.00

[Dacket Mo. 6/30/03
2763]
TOTAL | $86,024.50 50.00 $77,422.05 None $0.00

Pursuant to Paragraphs 5 and 6 of the Administrative Qrder, the Amount of Fees to Be
Authorized for Payment, as listed in the above-table, will presumably be authorized for payment
to Seyfarth, assuming that no objcction (o the First Monthly Fee Statement is filed with the Court
on or by August 29, 2003,

15.  Seyfarth reserves the right to correct, amend, or supplement the Maonthly Fee
Statement until such time as final compensation and reimbursement are sought from the Debtors’
bankruplcy estates,

[Remainder of Page Left Intentionally Blank, Following Page is Signature Page.]
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