IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS (EASTERN DIVISION)

In re:)	Case No. 02-08699
)	(Jointly Administered)
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION,)	Chapter 11
et al.,)	Hon. John H. Squires
 .)	
Debtors.)	

FINAL APPLICATION OF BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR, P.C. ("BCCZ") FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS SPECIAL COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS FOR THE PERIOD MARCH 6, 2002 THROUGH DECEMBER 19, 2003

AND NOW, comes Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C. ("BCCZ"), special counsel to the Debtors, and respectfully makes application to this Court as follows:

- 1. The Debtors voluntarily placed themselves into a Chapter 11 case on March 6, 2002.
- 2. On April 2, 2002, this Court authorized the Debtors to engage BCCZ as special counsel, effective March 6, 2002. Marked as Exhibit A, attached hereto and made a part hereof is a true and correct copy of said Order.
- 3. On August 30, 2002, BCCZ filed its First Interim Fee Application in this matter requesting fees for professional services in the amount of \$438,823.00 and reimbursement for expenses totaling \$34,782.84. See Docket No. 1257. All authorized fees and expenses requested in this First Interim Fee Application were approved by this Court and subsequently paid to BCCZ. BCCZ's First Interim Fee Application (and related supplement) is hereby incorporated by reference.
- 4. On December 24, 2002, BCCZ filed its Second Interim Fee Application in this matter requesting fees for professional services in the amount of \$317,059.50 and reimbursement for expenses totaling \$20,924.82. See Docket No. 1730. All authorized fees and expenses requested in this Second Interim Fee Application were approved by this Court and subsequently paid to BCCZ. BCCZ's Second Interim Fee Application is hereby incorporated by reference.
- 5. On April 25, 2003, BCCZ filed its Third Interim Fee Application in this matter requesting fees for professional services in the amount of \$330,188.00 and reimbursement for expenses totaling \$19,514.21. See Docket No. 2321. This Court approved all requested fees and expenses in the Third Interim Fee Application with the exception of \$348.18 in travel expenses (BCCZ subsequently waived its right to collect this amount from the Debtors). All authorized fees and expenses requested in the Third Interim Fee Application have been paid to BCCZ. BCCZ's Third Interim Fee Application is hereby incorporated by reference.

- 6. On August 27, 2003, BCCZ filed its Fourth Interim Fee Application in this matter requesting fees for professional services in the amount of \$219,712.50 and reimbursement for expenses totaling \$11,968.11. See Docket No. 2839. This Court approved all requested fees and expenses in the Fourth Interim Fee Application with the exception of \$7,937.27 in legal research costs and travel expenses which was denied without prejudice (BCCZ is resubmitting these expenses for approval in this Final Fee Application). BCCZ's Fourth Interim Fee Application is hereby incorporated by reference.
- 7. Pursuant to Order of this Court, BCCZ did not file a Fifth Interim Fee Application but is instead requesting approval for services rendered to the Debtors and expenses reimbursed on behalf of the Debtors during the period August 1, 2003 through December 19, 2003 in this Final Fee Application.
- 8. On March 13, 2003, BCCZ filed Supplemental Bankruptcy Rule 2014 Affidavit of Special Counsel Chester R. Babst III of Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C. addressing issues related to a \$68,189.77 retainer which BCCZ received from the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors. This filing, which is incorporated herein, is attached hereto as Attachment B.
- 9. At this time, BCCZ is seeking final approval, to the extent not already paid, payment of compensation equal to \$1,358,938.00 in fees, for professional services rendered by BCCZ during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003 as special counsel to the Debtors. This amount is derived solely from the applicable hourly billing rates of the firm's personnel who rendered such services to the Debtors.
- 10. BCCZ also requests final approval and reimbursement, to the extent not already paid, of one hundred percent of the actual and necessary out-of-pocket disbursements made and charges incurred by BCCZ during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003 as special counsel to the Debtors, equal to \$89,564.02.³
- 9. All services performed by BCCZ during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003 were performed by professionals and para-professionals of BCCZ on behalf of the Debtors. BCCZ submits that the legal services rendered to the Debtors during this Chapter 11 case was necessary and beneficial to the Debtors, their creditors and their estates. During its engagement as special counsel to the Debtors, BCCZ assisted the Debtors, in conjunction with other counsel to the Debtors, in multiple matters of varying degrees of sensitivity and complexity. BCCZ's activities included analysis, research, negotiations and litigation. BCCZ believes that the services it contributed brought significant value to the Debtors.
- 10. BCCZ rendered legal services to the Debtors in the following four general areas during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003: (1) Corporate/Commercial Matters; (2) Pension and Labor Matters; (3) Environmental Health, Safety and Regulatory Matters; and (4) Environmental Litigation.

³ BCCZ is writing off \$11.08 in travel expenses incurred during the Fourth Interim Fee Period (hence the total amount requested in this Final Application is \$89,552.94).

- 11. Specifically, during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003, BCCZ rendered legal services to the Debtors in the following eighteen categories:
 - a. Category 1 (Contract General): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$18,507.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on interpreting various contracts entered into by the Debtors and advising the Debtors regarding the legal language contained in such contracts.
 - b. Category 2 (Corporate General): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$12,874.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on a wide variety of general corporate matters. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent in assisting representatives of the Debtors with various business transactions.
 - c. Category 3 (Merger and Acquisitions): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$8,566.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on mergers and acquisitions. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent working on a bond forfeiture action at the Isabella Mine Site in Isabella, Pennsylvania. While working on this action, BCCZ assisted the Debtors in complying with a Consent Order at the Isabella Mine Site and consulted with various parties regarding duties and obligations under the Consent Order.
 - d. Category 4 (Corporate General Counsel): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$9,015.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on corporate matters. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on corresponding with representatives of the Debtors on Securities and Exchange Commission matters.
 - e. Category 5 (Environmental General): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$639,153.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on a wide variety of general environmental matters. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: reviewing newly adopted environmental regulations for applicability to operations conducted by the Debtors, reviewing and revising correspondence between the Debtors and government representatives, consulting with representatives of the Debtors on general environmental matters, engaging in negotiations with government representatives and conducting various investigations into the environmental matters of the Debtors. Additionally, time billed in this Category represents the time spent on handling various bankruptcy matters on behalf of the Debtors (such as due diligence work and preparation of court orders).
 - f. Category 6 (OSHA): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$9,149.50 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on issues governed by the Occupational Safety and Health Act

- ("OSHA), 29 U.S.C. § 651 et seq. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on advising the Debtors on various OSHA requirements including hazard safety communication and emergency response plan requirements.
- g. Category 7 (Air Pollution): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$204,973.50 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents advice given to the Debtors with respect to air pollution matters at the federal and state level. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: reviewing correspondence received by federal and state representatives regarding air issues at facilities operated by the Debtors, assisting the Debtors with the preparation of various federal and state air permits, reviewing and commenting on proposed rules which would impact air emissions at facilities operated by the Debtors and examining various air-emission data and air-emission related incident report forms.
- h. Category 8 (Water Pollution): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$49,826.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents advice given to the Debtors with respect to water pollution matters at the federal and state level. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: reviewing correspondence received by federal and state representatives regarding water issues at facilities operated by the Debtors, assisting the Debtors with the preparation of various federal and state water permits, reviewing and commenting on proposed rules which would impact water discharges at facilities operated by the Debtors and examining various discharge data.
- i. Category 9 (RCRA): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$86,708.50 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling issues governed by the Resource Conservation and Recovery Act ("RCRA"), 42 U.S.C. § 6901 et seq. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: researching regulatory and judicial interpretations of various RCRA provisions, communicating with federal and state representatives regarding RCRA-related issues, drafting correspondence to federal and state representatives regarding RCRA-related issues and examining whether or not facilities operated by the Debtors are in compliance with RCRA requirements where applicable.
- j. Category 10 (TSCA): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$3,035.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time in this Category represents time spent on handling issues governed by the Toxic Substances Control Act ("TSCA"), 15 U.S.C. § 2601 et seq. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on advising the Debtors with respect to various PCB matters.
- k. Category 11 (Superfund): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$10,972.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling issues governed by the Comprehensive Environmental Recovery and Liability Act ("CERCLA"), 42 U.S.C. § 9601 et seq.

Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: conducting conferences with federal and state agency representatives regarding release issues, drafting correspondence to the Debtors and to governmental representatives regarding CERCLA-related matters and advising the Debtors on how to best proceed in cleanup actions and/or settlement negotiations.

- Category 12 (SDWA): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$1,852.50 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling matters pertaining to the Safe Water Drinking Act ("SDWA"), 42 U.S.C. § 300f et seq. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on advising the Debtors on underground injection control matters.
- m. Category 13 (Audits): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$768.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time in this Category represents audits performed on behalf of the Debtors. Specifically, in this Category, BCCZ responded to audit requests made to the Debtors.
- n. Category 14 (LUST): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$8,242.50 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling issues relating to leaking underground storage tanks. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: discussing underground storage tank issues with representatives of the Debtors, advising representatives of the Debtors on underground storage tank financial assurance requirements, researching underground storage tank issues and reviewing newly adopted regulations relating to underground storage tanks.
- o. Category 15 (Labor General): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$54,683.50 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling general labor issues. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent by members of BCCZ on: advising representatives of the Debtors on how to best handle employment related issues, corresponding with representatives of the Debtors and the National Labor Relations Board on employment-related issues and researching employment-related issues.
- p. Category 16 (Employee Benefit Litigation): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$11,483.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling employee benefit litigation matters. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: advising representatives of the Debtors on pension plan options and researching various matters related to employee pension plans and withdrawal liability.
- q. Category 17 (Litigation Tort): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$257.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling various tort claims filed against the Debtors. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on:

reviewing court orders and related pleadings, conducting research in preparation for trial, engaging in settlement negotiations with federal and/or state representatives, participating in conference calls relating to settlement matters, responding to motions by opponents, preparing for and attending meetings with opposing counsel on settlement matters, drafting various trial pleadings, updating and maintaining case files for matters involving the Debtors and conducting pre-trial review of relevant documents.

- r. Category 18 (Litigation Environmental): Total fees associated with this Category equal \$228,872.00 for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003. Time billed in this Category represents time spent on handling various environmental claims filed against the Debtors. Specifically, time billed in this Category represents time spent on: reviewing court orders and related pleadings, conducting research in preparation for trial, engaging in settlement negotiations with federal and/or state representatives, participating in conference calls relating to settlement matters, responding to motions by opponents, preparing for and attending meetings with opposing counsel on settlement matters, drafting various trial pleadings, updating and maintaining case files for matters involving the Debtors and conducting pre-trial review of relevant documents.
- 12. To date, BCCZ has received \$1,430,611.45 for services rendered and expenses incurred while representing the Debtors during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003 in accordance with the April 2, 2002 Order. With respect to the fees and expenses incurred from March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003, note the following (this information is summarized on the tables attached to the cover sheet of this application):
 - a. During the period, fccs totaled \$1,358,938.00. Of this total: (1) \$18,507.00 represents fees for Category 1 (Contract General) services; (2) \$12,874.00 represents fces for Category 2 (Corporate General) services; (3) \$8,566.00 represents fces for Category 3 (Merger and Acquisitions) services; (4) \$9,015.00 represents fees for Category 4 (Corporate General Counsel) services; (5) \$639,153.00 represents fees for Category 5 (Environmental General) services; (6) \$9,149.50 represents fees for Category 6 (OSHA) services; (7) \$204,973.50 represents fees for Category 7 (Air Pollution) services; (8) \$49,826.00 represents fees for Category 8 (Water Pollution) services; (9) \$86,708.50 represents fees for Category 9 (RCRA) services; (10) \$3,035.00 represents fees for Category 10 (TSCA) services; (11) \$10,972.00 represents fees for Category 11 (Superfund) services; (12) \$1,852.50 represents fees for Category 12 (SDWA) services; (13) \$768.00 represents fees for Category 13 (Audits) services; (14) \$8,242.50 represents fees for Category 14 (LUST) services; (15) \$54,683.50 represents fees for Category 15 (Labor General) services; (16) \$11,483.00 represents fees for Category 16 (Employee Benefit Litigation); (17) \$257.00 represents fees for Category 17 (Litigation Tort) services; and (18) \$228,872.00 represents fees for Category 18 (Litigation Environmental) services.
 - b. During the period, expenses totaled \$89,564.02. Of this total: (1) \$4,319.33 is for delivery services (billed at cost); (2) \$204.00 is for filing fees (billed at cost); (3)

\$33,220.44 is for photocopics (billed at 0.20 cents per page); (4) \$542.94 is for postage (billed at cost); (5) \$2,364.55 is for telecopies (billed at 0.50 cents per page if incoming and 0.75 cents per page if outgoing); (6) \$984.88 is for telephone charges (billed at cost); (7) \$14,086.53 is for legal research charges (billed at cost); (8) \$27,607.95 is for travel expenses (billed at cost); (9) \$3,635.31 is for conference call charges (billed at cost); and (10) \$197.51 is for document retrieval costs (billed at cost); and (11) \$2,400.58 for other expenses (billed at cost).

- 13. As noted above, BCCZ did not file a Fifth Interim Fee Application but is instead requesting in this Final Application that this Court approve fees incurred by BCCZ in representing the Debtors from August 1, 2003 through December 19, 2003 and expenses incurred by BCCZ on behalf of the Debtors during this same period. Attachment C, which is hereby incorporated herein, provides a detailed breakdown of the fees and expenses incurred from August 1, 2003 through December 19, 2003 (this attachment includes a summary of services rendered from August 1, 2003 through December 19, 2003 by professional and paraprofessional). With respect to the fees and expenses incurred during from August 1, 2003 through December 19, 2003, note the following (this information is summarized in the tables in Attachment C):
 - a. During the period, fees totaled \$55,133.00. Of this total, \$54,776.00 represents fees for Category 5 (Environmental General) services and \$357.00 represents fees for Category 16 (Employee Benefit Litigation) services.
 - b. During this period, expenses totaled \$2,722.22. Of this total: (1) \$474.61 is for delivery services (billed at cost); (2) \$2,034.10 is for photocopies (billed at 0.20 cents per page); (3) \$73.17 is for postage (billed at cost); (4) \$43.05 is for telecopies (billed at 0.50 cents per page if incoming and 0.75 cents per page if outgoing); (5) \$36.59 is for telephone charges (billed at cost); (6) \$21.91 is for legal research charges (billed at cost); and (7) \$38.79 is for document retrieval costs (billed at cost).
 - c. The legal research costs of \$21.91 were incurred while obtaining pleadings relevant to this matter from PACER.
- 14. In addition to the fees and expenses incurred during the Fifth Interim Fee Period, BCCZ is also seeking approval of \$7,926.19 in expenses incurred during the Fourth Interim Fee Period which this Court denied without prejudice (specifically, this Court denied without

⁴ BCCZ is writing off \$11.08 in travel expenses incurred during the Fourth Interim Fee Period (hence the total amount requested in this Final Application is \$89,552.94).

⁵ Note that although the invoices provided in Attachment C are for the entire month of December, BCCZ is only seeking approval in this Final Application for services rendered through December 19, 2003 and expenses incurred through December 19, 2003.

prejudice all amounts relating to legal research and travel).⁶ Attachment D contains the documentation required by this Court in order to approve these expenses.

- 15. Attached hereto as Attachment E are biographies for all professionals and paraprofessionals who rendered services to the Debtors during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003.
- 16. The fees charged by BCCZ for services rendered in accordance with the April 2, 2002 Order are the same as those charged to clients not subject to the protections and restrictions of the United States Bankruptcy Code.
- 17. The expenses incurred by BCCZ in representing the Debtors in accordance with the April 2, 2002 Order are expenses for which BCCZ routinely seeks and receives reimbursement from clients not subject to the protections and restrictions of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 18. No agreement exists between BCCZ and any third person for the sharing of compensation received by BCCZ in this case, except as allowed by the exception set forth in Bankruptcy Code Section 504 and Bankruptcy Rule 2016 with respect to the sharing of compensation among members of BCCZ.
- 19. Attached hereto as Attachment F is the Affidavit of Chester R. Babst III attesting to the accuracy of the information contained herein.
- 20. Attached hereto as Attachment G is a proposed order allowing final compensation to BCCZ as special counsel to the Debtors for the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003.

WHEREFORE, for the reasons set forth above, BCCZ respectfully requests final approval and payment, to the extent not already paid, of compensation for professional services rendered as special counsel to the Debtors during the period March 6, 2002 through December 19, 2003 in the sum of \$1,358,938.00, plus reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the case period in the sum of \$89,552.94 and that this Court grant such other and further relief as is just and proper.

⁶ This Court actually denied \$7,937.27 without prejudice. However, BCCZ is waiving its right to collect \$11.08 of this amount and hence is only seeking reimbursement for legal research costs and travel expenses totaling \$7,926.19 for the Fourth Interim Fee Period.

Date: January 28, 2004

BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR, P.C. Special Counsel to the Debtors

BY:

Chester R. Baler/BOC Chester R. Babst III, Esquire

Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C. Two Gateway Center, 8th Floor Pittsburgh, PA 15222

(412) 394-5407

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS (EASTERN DIVISION)

In re:)	Case No. 02-08699 (Jointly Administered)
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, et al.,)	Chapter 11 Hon. John H. Squires
Debtors.)	

ATTACHMENT A

APRIL 2, 2002 ORDER APPOINTING BCCZ AS SPECIAL COUNSEL TO THE DEBTORS

Chester R. Babst III
Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C.
Two Gateway Center, 8th Floor
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
(412) 394-5407

Special Counsel to the Debtors

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS EASTERN DIVISION

In Re:)	Case No. 02-08699
		ं (Johnly Administered) * * * * * *
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION,)	Chapter 11
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·) [†]	Hon. John H. Squires
Debtors.	· j	Hearing Date: 04/02/02
)	Hearing Time: 8:30 a.m.
	í	Objection Deadline: 03/29/02
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	,	

ORDER PURSUANT TO SECTION 327(c) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE AUTHORIZING DEBTORS TO RETAIN CHESTER R. BABST, III AND BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS & ZOMNIR, P.C., AS SPECIAL COUNSEL FOR DEBTORS-IN-POSSESSION

This cause coming to be heard upon the Debtors' Application To Retain Chester R.

Babst, III and Babst, Calland, Clements & Zomnir, P.C., as Special Counsel (the "Motion"); proper
notice having been given; the Court having reviewed the Motion; heard the arguments of counsel;
and otherwise having been advised fully in the premises;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT:

- A. Debtors are authorized to retain Chester R. Babst, III and Babst, Calland, Clements & Zomnir, P.C., as special counsel with respect to certain corporate/commercial matters, certain pension and labor matters, certain environmental, health, safety, and regulatory matters, as well as general litigation related to the aforementioned environmental, health, safety, and regulatory matters, nunc pro tune to the Petition Date, as more fully set forth in the Motion.
- B. Any awards of compensation or reimbursement of expenses shall be made pursuant to the Administrative Order under 11 U.S.C. §§ 105 and 331 Establishing Procedures for Periodic Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals, entered by this Court on or about March 6, 2002.

C. The Motion and the entry of this Order constitute a core proceeding, and this Order.

is a final order as those terms are used in 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 158.

ENTERE

Dated: Chicago, Illinois -April 2, 2002 ENTERED:

APR - 2 2002

John II. Squies Bankrepley Ju wented states manuscriptives

United States Bankruptcy Judge

Order Prepared By:

Mark A. Berkoff (ARDC #06194787)
David N. Missner (ARDC #01928988)
Mark P. Naughton (ARDC #06196286)
PIPER MARBURY RUDNICK & WOLFE
203 North LaSalle Street, Suite 1800
Chicago; Illinois 60601
(312) 368-4000

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS (EASTERN DIVISION)

In re:)	Case No. 02-08699 (Jointly Administered)
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, et al.,)))	Chapter 11 Hon. John H. Squires
Debtors.)	

ATTACHMENT B

SUPPLEMENTAL BANKRUPTCY RULE 2014 AFFIDAVIT OF SPECIAL COUNSEL CHESTER R. BABST III OF BCCZ

Chester R. Babst III
Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C.
Two Gateway Center, 8th Floor
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
(412) 394-5407

Special Counsel to the Debtor

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FILE D FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOISNORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS (EASTERN DIVISION)

MAR 13 2003

In te: NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, ct al.,) Case No. 02-08699 ENNETH S. QA!) (Jointly Administered) PS REF) Chapter 11) Hon. John H. Squires)	idner, cler. ?. - Ai
Debtors.)	

SUPPLEMENTAL BANKRUPTCY RULE 2014 AFFIDAVIT OF SPECIAL COUNSEL CHESTER R. BABST III OF BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR, P.C.

AND NOW, comes Chester R. Babst III of Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C. ("BCCZ"), special counsel to the Debtors, and respectfully states the following:

- The Debtors filed voluntary Chapter 11 cases on March 6, 2002. 1.
- On April 2, 2002, the Honorable John Squires of the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Illinois--Eastern Division (the "Court") authorized the Debtors to engage BCCZ as special counsel, effective March 6, 2002. Marked as Exhibit A, attached hereto and made a part hereof is a true and correct copy of the Order authorizing such. Prior to and subsequent to its engagement as special counsel to the Debtors, BCCZ has rendered legal services to the Debtors, in accordance with the aforementioned Order, in the following four areas: (1) corporate/commercial matters; (2) pension and labor matters; (3) environmental, health, safety and regulatory mattes; and (4) general litigation matters.
- On February 12, 2002, BCCZ received \$100,000 from the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors with the understanding that this amount would be utilized to ensure that all of BCCZ's pre-Chapter 11 invoices to the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors were paid, with the balance to serve as a post-Chapter 11 special counsel retainer, assuming BCCZ was so engaged.
- As of February 21, 2002, BCCZ had ten invoices issued and outstanding to the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors totaling \$16,761.41 and ranging from \$6.80 to \$9,685.64. Of the ten invoices, one was dated February 7, 2002 (\$2,451.16), five were dated February 21, 2002 (\$9.08, \$40.80, \$651.75, \$3,557.75 and \$9,685.64) and the remaining four were for "older" periods. All but the four "older" invoices were for current services.
- The four aforementioned "older" invoices, totaling \$365.23, were dated January 31, 1997 (\$6.80), February 29, 2000 (\$20.00), May 31, 2000 (\$81.93) and December 11, 2000 (\$256.50). BCCZ has already "written off" the amounts associated with these "older" invoices and is hereby confirming its waiver of its right to collect from the Debtors that \$365.23.



- On March 4, 2002, BCCZ forwarded to the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors invoices 6. totaling \$31,810.23. These new invoices, which resulted from work performed in the latter part of February, 2002 and the first few days of March, 2002 (just prior to the Chapter 11 filing), were paid from the \$100,000 retainer which BCCZ received from the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors on February 12, 2002 (thereby reducing this retainer amount to \$68,189.77). Payment of these invoices from the retainer amount was approved by the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors and was consistent with the mutual goal of the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors and BCCZ that BCCZ be fully paid prior to the Chapter 11 filings and have special counsel retainer remaining.
- Due to an internal administrative error prior to the Chapter 11 filings, BCCZ did 7. not apply, and has never applied, the retainer funds to the \$16,761.41 of invoices referenced in Paragraph 4 hercof, less the "written off" \$365.23 of "older" invoices referenced in Paragraphs 4 and 5 hereof, for a net of \$16,396.18. Were it not for BCCZ's internal error, these invoices totaling \$16,396.18 would have been paid from the retainer prior to the Chapter 11 filings, as was intended by the pre-Chapter 11 Debtors.
- In its next Interim (or Final) Fee Application, BCCZ will be asking the Court for permission to pay the \$16,396.18 of pre-Chapter 11 invoices from the \$68,189.77 of retainer funds it has been holding since the Chapter 11 cases commenced which, if permitted by the Court, would reduce BCCZ's retainer funds being held to \$51,793.59. BCCZ has conferred with the Debtors concerning this matter and understands that its clients will have no objection, since the retainer was provided prior to the Chapter 11 with the intent that BCCZ would be paid from it for pre-Chapter 11 services.
- BCCZ will be pleased to provide copies of the unpaid pre-Chapter 11 invoices to parties-in-interest upon request.

Date: March 11, 2003

BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR, P.C.

Special Counsel to the Debtors

BY: (

Chester R. Babst III, Esquire

PA ID No. 17232

Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C.

Two Gateway Center, 8th Floor

Pittsburgh, PA 15222

(412) 394-5407

Sworn to and subscribed before me this 11th

day of March 2003. g. Irdd

Noterial Seal Kathleen J. Tordd, Notary Public Pittsburgh, Allegheny County My Commission Expires July 18, 2004

Member, Pennsylvaria descontion of Notaries

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS EASTERN DIVISION

In Re:	Case No. 02-08699
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION,	(Jointly Administered) Chapter 11
· Debtors, ·)	Hon. John H. Squires Hearing Date: 04/02/02
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	Hearing Time: 8:30 a.m. Objection Deadline: 03/29/02

ORDER FURSUANT TO SECTION 327(a) OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE AUTHORIZING DEBTORS TO RETAIN CHESTER R. BABST, III AND BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS & ZOMNIR, P.C. AS SEECIAL COUNSEL FOR DEBTORS IN POSSESSION

This cause coming to be heard upon the Debtors' Application To Retain Chester R. Babet, III and Babet, Calland, Clements & Zomnir, P.C., as Special Counsel (the "Motion"); proper notice having been given; the Court having reviewed the Motion; heard the arguments of counsel; and otherwise having been advised fully in the premises;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED THAT:

- A. Debtors are authorized to retain Chester R. Babst, III and Babst, Calland, Clements & Zonnir, P.C., as special counsel with respect to certain corporate/commercial matters, certain pension and labor matters, certain environmental, health, safety, and regulatory matters, as well as general litigation related to the aforementioned environmental, health, safety, and regulatory matters, nume pro tune to the Petition Date, as more fully set forth in the Motion.
- B. Any awards of compensation or reimbursement of expenses shall be made pursuant to the Administrative Order under 11 U.S.C. §§ 105 and 331 Betablishing Procedures for Periodic Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals, entered by this Court on or about March 6, 2002.

CHECOLOGISCOP.



C. The Motion and the entry of this Order constitute a core proceeding, and this Order.

is a final order as those terms are used in 22 U.S.C. 56 157 and 158,

ENTERED

Dated: Chicago, Illinois -April 2, 2002 ENTERED:

APR - 2 2002

Join II. Squas Backrestry Judge warten states bankrester count

United States Bankruptcy Judge

Order Prepared By:

Mark A. Berkoff (ARDC #06194787)
David N. Missner (ARDC #01928988)
Mark P. Naughton (ARDC #06196286)
PIPER MARBURY RUDNICK & WOLFE
203 North LaSalle Street, Suite 1800
Chicago; Illinois 60601
(312) 368-4000

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that I caused a true and correct copy of the foregoing Supplemental Bankruptcy Rule 2014 Affidavit to be served by first class mail, postage pre-paid, upon the parties identified on the attached service list this 11th day of March, 2003.

Chester R. Babst, III

Stephen G. Wolfe Office of the U.S. Trustee Suite 3350 227 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60606

Bryan E. Minier Katten Muchin Zavis Rosenman Suite 1600 525 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60661-3693

Timothy R. Pohl Skadden Arps Slate Meagher & Flom Suite 2100 333 West Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606

Richard P. Krasnow Robert J. Lemons Weil Gotshal & Manges, Ltd. 767 Fifth Avenue New York, NY 10153

Kirk Sobecki Ronald J. Werhnyak National Steel Corporation 4100 Edison Lakes Parkway Mishawaka, IN 46545 Mark A. Berkoff
David N. Missner
Mark P. Naughton
Piper Rudnick
203 North LaSalle Street, Suite 1800
Chicago, IL 60601

Daniel A. Zazove Karen G. Kranbuehl Kaye Scholer LLP Suite 4100 70 West Madison Street Chicago, IL 60602

Gary P. Cullen Skadden Arps Slate Meagher & Flom Suite 2100 333 West Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606

Sonia U. Chae United States and Exchange Commission 175 West Jackson Boulevard Suite 900 Chicago, Illinois 60604

Victoria S. Crosley Mayer Silber Internal Revenue Service Suite 2300 200 West Adams Street Chicago, IL 60606 J. Mark Fisher
J. Jeffrey Patton
Jason M. Torf
Schiff Hardin & Waite
6600 Sears Tower
Chicago, TL 60606-6473

Mclanie Rovner Cohen Brandy A. Sargent Altheimer & Gray Suite 4000 10 South Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606

Indiana Department of
Environmental Management
P.O. Box 6015
Indianapolis, IN 46206-6015

Illinois Environmental
Protection Agency
1021 North Grand Avenue East
Springfield, IL 62702

Richard M. Seltzer Coehn Weiss and Simon LLP 330 West 42nd Street New York, NY 10036-6976 Nathaniel Rayle
Office of the General Counsel
Pension Benefit Guaranty Corporation
Suite 340
1200 K Street, N.W.
Washington, DC 20005-4026

United States Environmental Protection Agency Region V 77 West Jackson Boulevard Chicago, IL 60604

Michigan Department of Environmental Quality P.O. Box 30473 Lansing, MI 48909-7973

Minnesota Pollution Control Agency 520 Lafayette Road St. Paul, MN 55155-4194

Claudia Springer Matt Tashman Reed Smith One Liberty Place 25th Floor Philadelphia, PA 19103 Paul M. Singer Eric Schafer Reed Smith 435 Sixth Avenue Pittsburgh, PA 15219

Kurt M. Carlson Tishler & Wald, Ltd. Suite 2600 200 South Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606

Ronald L. Rose Dykoma Gossett PLLC Suite 3050 55 East Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60603

Jan Bond
Diekemper, Hammond, Shinners,
Turcotte and Larrew, P.C.
Suite 200
7730 Cabondelet Avenue
St. Louis, MO 63105

II. Rey Stroube, III
Henry J. Kaim
Lisa Beckerman
Akin, Gump, Strauss,
Huaer & Feld LLP
Suite 1900
711 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX 77002

Dean C. Gramlich Mohsin N. Khambati McDermott Will & Emery 227 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60606

William D. Brejcha, Stephen A. Oakley Andrew K. Light, Jay P. Kennedy Scopelitis Garvin Light & Hanson Suite 1700 120 South LaSalle Street Chicago, IL 60603

Joshua D. Sheffer, Richard D. Boonstra Bruce J. Van Heukelem, Kevin J. Todd Hoogendoorn & Talbot Suite 1220 122 South Michigan Avenue Chicago, IL 60603-6107

Steve B. Towbin
Jeremy C. Kleinman
D'Ancona & Pflaum, LLC
Suite 2800
111 East Wacker Drive
Chicago, 1L 60601

Kathryn A. Parmenter Andrew R. Cardonick Goldberg, Kohn, Bell, Black, Rosenbloom & Moritz, Ltd. Suite 3700 55 East Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60603 Heller Financial, Inc. c/o Brian Benz 500 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60661 Sitrick and Company Attn: Anita-Marie Hill Suite 800 1840 Century Park Los Angeles, CA 90067

Landmark Attn: Eric B. Singer Suite 500 308 West Randolph Street Chicago, IL 60606 Mark I. Bane, James S. Carr, David E. Retter, Keith H. Wofford, Christopher Sheean Kelley Dryc & Warren LLP 101 Park Avenue New York, NY 10178

Todd A. Burgess Quarles & Brady Streich Lang LLP Renaissance One Two North Central Avenue Phoenix, AZ 95004-2391 Chad H. Gettleman Matthew M. Martin Adelman, Gettleman, Merens, Berish & Carter, Ltd. 53 West Jackson Boulevard Suite 1050 Chicago, IL 60604

Jeffrey M. Schwartz Gardner, Carton & Douglas Suite 3700 191 North Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606-1698 Thomas D. Williamson Deloitte Consulting 180 North Stetson Avenue Chicago, IL. 60601-6779

Keith Adam Simon Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom (Illinois) 333 West Wacker Drive Suite 2100 Chicago, IL 60606 Terry Savage Lazard Frercs & Co. LLC Suite 2200 200 West Madison Street Chicago, IL 60606 Robert Wujtowicz Ernst & Young Corporate Finance LLC 233 South Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606

Robert B. Millner Sonnenschein Nath & Rosenthal 8000 Sears Tower 233 South Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606

James S. Carr Keith H. Wofford Kelley Dryc & Warren LLP 101 Park Avenue New York, NY 10178

Ellen T. Harmon
VP and General Counsel
Metallurg Inc./Shieldalloy
12th Floor
6 East 43rd Street
New York, NY 10017

Sidley Austin Brown & Wood LLP Attn: Craig Wolfe 787 Seventh Avenue New York, NY 10019 Lazard Freres
Andrew Yearly
Frank A. Savage
Terry Savage
30 Rockefeller Plaza
New York, NY 10020

Lisa Beckerman Akin, Gump, Strauss, Hauer & Feld LLP 22nd Floor 590 Madison Avenue New York, NY 10022

Larry J. McClatchey Kegler Brown Hill & Ritter Suite 1800 65 East State Street Columbus, OH 43215

John P. Dillman Linebarger Goggan Blair Pena & Sampson, LLP P.O. Box 3064 Houston, TX 77253-3064

Steven J. Reisman Curtis, Mallet-Prevost, Colt & Mosle LLP 101 Park Avenue New York, NY 10178-0061 Lynne A. Richardson
Air Products and Chemicals Inc.
Air Products Manufacturing Corp.
7201 Hamilton Boulevard
Allentown, PA 18195

James M. Peck Schulte Roth & Zabel LLP 919 Third Avenue New York, NY 10022

Kerry S. Kehoe David G. Sobol Holland & Knight Suite 1200 10 St. James Avenue Boston, MA 02116 Paul, Weiss, Rifkind, Wharton & Garrison Attn: Stephen J. Shimshak and Curtis J. Weidler 1285 Avenue of the Americas New York, NY 10019-6064

James M. Malley Angelo, Gordon & Co. 26th Floor 245 Park Avenue New York, NY 10167 James Conlon Stein, Inc. 1929 East Royalton Road Broadview Heights, OII 44147

Holly H. Wilhelmus Bowers Harrison, LLP 25 N.W. Riverside Drive P.O. Box 1287 Evansville, IN 47706-1287 Hodgson Russ LLP Attn: Cheryl R. Storic One M&T Plaza, Suite 2000 Buffalo, NY 14203

Michael C. Azar Noble Metal Process 20101 Hoover Detroi,t MI 48205 Glenn M. Reisman Two Corporate Drive Suite 636 P.O. Box 861 Shelton, CT 06484-0861 Richard M. Beheler Blackwell Sanders Peper Martin, LLP 2300 Main Street, Suite 1000 P.O. Box 419777 Kansas City, MO 64108 William D. Brejcha, Stephen A. Oakley Andrew K. Light Scopelitis Garvin Light & Hanson 10 West Market Street, Suite 1500 Indianapolis, IN 46204-2968

Jay P. Kennedy Kroger Gardis & Regas, LLP Suite 900 111 Monument Circle Indianapolis, IN 46204-5125 Philip D. Anker Andrew J. Currie Wilmer Cutler & Pickering 2445 M Street, N.W. Washington, DC 20037-1420

Allan S. Brilliant Craig P. Druehl Milbank, Tweed, Hadley & McCloy LLP I Chase Manhattan Plaza New York, NY 10005 Eli Krivosha, Jr. Two Gateway Center Suite 775 Pittsburgh, PA 15222

N. Theodore Zink, Jr. Richard Sonkin Chadbourne & Parke LLP 30 Rockefeller Plaza New York, NY 10012 Michael R. Enright Robinson & Cole LLP 280 Trumbull Street Hartford, CT 06103

Rose A. Houk Assistant Attorney General Workers' Compensation Division P.O. Box 30217 Lansing, MI 48909 Louis P. Rochkind Alicia S. Schehr Jaffee, Raitt, Heuer & Weiss, PC Suite 2400 One Woodward Avenue Detroit, MI 48226 Earle I. Erman Craig E. Zucker Erman, Teicher, Miller Zucker & Freedman, P.C. Suite 333 100 Galleria Officentre Southfield, MI 48034 Christopher T. Sheean Kelley Drye & Warren LLP Suite 1400 303 West Madison Street Chicago, IL 60606

Gregg E. Szilagyi Christopher L. Rexroat Ungaretti & Harris 3500 Three First National Plaza Chicago, IL 60602 John Koerber Bennett Management Corp. 2 Stamford Plaza, Suite 1501 281 Tresser Boulevard Stamford, CT 06901

Jay E. Loeb Olim & Loeb LLP Suite 480 6100 Lake Forrest Drive Atlanta, GA 30328 Andrea Sheehan Law offices of Robert E. Luna, P.C. 4411 North Central Expressway Dallas, TX 75205

Richardo I. Kilpatrick Kilpatrick & Associates, P.C. 615 Griswold, Suite 1004 Detroit, MI 48226-3985 Tom Vyvyan Director of Finance ME lobal, Inc. 3901 University Avenue, NE Minneapolis, MN 55421

Dianc P. Furr Poyner & Spruill LLP Suite 4000 100 North Tryon Street Charlotte, NC 28202-4010 Mark D. Plevin Alexandre De Gramont Crowell & Moring, LLP 1001 Pennsylvania Avenue, NW Washington, D.C. 20004-2595 Steven A. Ginther
Special Assistant Attorney General
Missouri Department of Revenue
General Counsel's Office
301 West High Street, Room 670
P.O. Box 475
Jefferson City, MO 65105-0475

Diana M. Thimmig Arter & Hadden 1100 Huntington Building 925 Euclid Avenue Cleveland, OH 44115-1475

Kim Y. Jefferson Attorney for Commissioner of Revenue Legal Services, 27th Floor 312 8th Avenue North Nashville, TN 37243 Michael Reed McCreary Veselka Bragg & Allen PC P.O. Box 26990 Austin, TX 78755

Gary P. Lightman Glenn A. Manochi Lightman, Manochi & Christensen Twelfth Floor 1520 Locust Street Philadelphia, PA 19102-4401 Joel A. Kunin Carr Korein Tillery 412 Missouri Avenue East St. Louis, IL 62201

Lewisville Independent School District c/o Sherrel K. Knighton Law Offices of Robert E. Puna, PC 4411 North Central Expressway Dallas, TX 75205 Deborah L. Thorne Fagelhaber LLC Suite 4000 55 East Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60603

Benjamin C. Ackerly, Esquire Peter S. Partee Robert S. Westermann Hunton & Williams Riverfront Plaza, East Tower 951 East Byrd Street Richmond, VA 23219 Christine M. Kassak Smith Office of the Solicitor U.S. Department of Labor Room 844 233 South Dearborn Chicago, IL 60604 Gary E. Green
Patricia E. Rademacher
Coston & Lichtman
Suite 600
407 South Dearborn Street
Chicago, IL 60605

Stanton L. Cave Law Office of Stan Cave & Associates P.O. Box 910457 Lexington, KY 40591-0457

Lawrence Clancy Cook & Frank, S.C. 660 East Mason Street Milwaukee, WI 53202

Katherine S. Dedrick David H. Levitt Hinshaw & Culbertson 222 North LaSalle Street Suite 300 Chicago, IL 60601

Holly L. Tomchey David J. Fischer Wildman, Harrold, Allen & Dixon Suite 2800 225 West Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60606 Timothy Brink Jeffrey A. Chadwick Lord, Bissell & Brook Suite 3100 115 South LaSalle Street Chicago, IL 60603

Heller Financial, Inc. C/o Brian Benz 500 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60661

Michael L. Molinaro Neal Gerber & Eisenberg 2 North LaSalle Street Chicago, IL 60602

RS Electronics Michelle Ross, Credit Manager 34443 Schoolcraft Livonia, MI 48150

Mary Ann Kilgore Union Pacific Railroad Company Room 830 1416 Dodge Street Omaha, NE 68179 Elizabeth V. Heller Goldenberg, Miller, Heller & Antognoli, P.C. 2227 South State Route 157 P.O. Box 959 Edwardsville, IL 62025

Joseph M. Kim Alexander Terras Quarles & Brady 500 West Madison Street Suite 3500 Chicago, IL 60661

Ronald R. Peterson Jenner & Block, LLC One IBM Plaza Chicago, IL. 60611

Dick Mackie Vail Rubber Works, Inc. P.O. Box 64 St. Joseph, MI 49085

Lori Gruver Robertson Linebarger Goggan Blair Pena & Sampson, LLP 1949 South I.H. 35 (78741) P.O. Box 17428 Austin, TX 78760 Poter S. Partee, Esq.
Robert S. Westermann, Esq.
Hunton & Williams
Riverfront Plaza — East Tower
951 East Byrd Street
Richmond, Virginia 23219

Albert Randall Knopf Holtkamp, Liese, Childress & Schultz, P.C. Suite 400 Pennsylvania Building 217 North 10th Street St. Louis, MO 63101

Thomas M. Walz Hahn, Walz and Knepp 509 West Washington Avenue South Bend, IN 46601

David L. Gore, Sr. Gore & Gore Suite 1332 53 West Jackson Chicago, IL 60604

Michael J. Baughman Cohn & Baughman Suite 550 525 West Monroe Street Chicago, IL 60661 David Rosen Houlihan Lokey Howard & Zukin Capital 123 N. Wacker, 4th Floor Chicago, IL 60606 Dan Brennen PSC Metals, Inc. 20521 Chagrin Boulevard Cleveland, OH 44122

Jonathan Sokolow Assistant General Counsel UMWA Health & Retirement Funds Office of the General Counsel 2121 K Street, N.W., Suite 350 Washington, DC 20037-1879 Peter G. Swan Timothy F. Jacobs Emalfarb, Swan & Bain 440 Central Avenue Highland Park, IL 60035

John A. Peca Climaco, Lefkowitz, Peca, Wilcox & Garofoli Co., L.P.A. Suite 900 1228 Euclid Avenue Cleveland, OH 44115 Dawn De Keyser Dollar Clausen Miller PC 10 South LaSalle Street Chicago, IL 60603

R. Scott Alsterda
Gregg E. Szilagyi
Christopher L. Rexroat
James M. McArdle
Ungaretti & Harris
3500 Three First National Plaza
Chicago, TL 60602

William Vermette Associate Litigation Counsel WorldCom 1133 19th Street, NW Washington, DC 20036

Myron K. Cunningham Kerr-McGee Chemical LLC Kerr-McGee Center P.O. Box 25861 Oklahoma City, OK 73125 Sheldon E. Richie Richie & Gueringer, P.C. 100 Congress Avenue, Suite 455 Austin, TX 78701 Michael C. Rupe Michelle Morgan Harner Jones, Day, Reavis & Pogue 77 West Wacker Chicago, IL 60601 CSX Transportation Attn: Jerry Cavainolo 500 Water Street, Suite J180 Jacksonville, FL 32202

Fitzgerald & Dakmak, P.C. Robert A. Peurach, Esq. Suite 600 Ford Building 615 Griswold Detroit, MI 48226 Brent D. Stratton McGuireWoods LLP Suite 4400 77 West Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60601

Frederic S. Lane, Esquire Robbins, Schwartz, Nicholas, Lifton & Taylor, Ltd. 20 North Clark Street, Suite 900 Chicago, IL 60602 Bruce Moore Burkart Law Offices 4401 Highway 162 Granite City, IL 62040

David B. Kahng Brent D. Stratton McGuireWoods LLP 77 West Wacker Drive Suite 4400 Chicago, IL 60601 William J. Fisher Gray, Plant, Mooty, Mooty & Bennett, P.A. Suite 3400 33 South Sixth Street Minneapolis, MN 55402

Stephen W. Ragland Bass, Berry & Sims, PLC Suite 900 100 Peabody Place Memphis, TN 38103 Robert M. Fishman Shaw Gussis Fishman Glantz & Wolfson LLC Suite 200 1144 West Fulton Street Chicago, IL 60607 David A. Wargula Askounis & Borst, P.C. Suite 1000 303 East Wacker Drive Chicago, IL 60601 Peter Janovsky Zeichner Ellman & Krause LLP 575 Lexington Avenue New York, NY 10022

Robert C. Johnson Robert B. Millner Donna J. Vobornik Sonnenschein Nath & Rosenthal 8000 Sears Tower Chicago, IL 60606 Gary P. Lightman Glenn A. Manochi Lightman, Manochi & Shristensen 12th Floor 1520 Locust Street Philadelphia, PA 19102

Lawrence D. Mishkin Mason, Silver, Wenk & Mishkin, LLC Suite 250 1033 Skokic Boulevard Northbrook, IL 60062 Brian E. McGovern McCarthy, Leonard, Kaenmerer, Owen, Lamkin & McGovern, LC Suite 300 16141 Swingley Ridge Road Chesterfield, MO 63017

Donald F. Neiman Suite 3700 801 Grand Avenue Des Moines, IA 50309-2727 Andrew Herenstein Quadrangle Group LLC 375 Park Avenue, 14th Floor New York, NY 10152

Richard W. Hillsberg Lester A. Ottenheimer III Kelly A. Saindon Kovitz Shifrin Nesbit 750 Lake Cook Road, Suite 350 Buffalo Grove, IL 60089 Alan S. Kopit/Rocco I. Debitetto Michael P. Shuster/Lawrence E. Oscar Hahn Locser & Parks LLP 3300 BP Tower 200 Public Square Cleveland, OH 44114-2301 Heather Thayer Fredrikson & Byron, PA 4000 Pillsbury Center 200 South Sixth Street Minneapolis, MN 55402

Henry A. Efroymson Ben T. Caughey Ice Miller One American Square Box 82001 Indianapolis, IN 46282

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS (EASTERN DIVISION)

In re:)	Case No. 02-08699 (Jointly Administered)
NATIONAL STEEL CORPORATION, et al.,))	Chapter 11 Hon. John H. Squires
Debtors.)	

ATTACHMENT C

TIME SUMMARIES BY PERIOD AND BILLING BREAKDOWN FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST 1, 2003 THROUGH DECEMBER 19, 2003

Chester R. Babst III
Babst, Calland, Clements and Zomnir, P.C.
Two Gateway Center, 8th Floor
Pittsburgh, PA 15222
(412) 394-5407

Special Counsel to the Debtors

SUMMARY OF SERVICES RENDERED BY PROFESSIONAL AND PARA-PROFESSIONAL (AUGUST 1, 2003 THROUGH DECEMBER 19, 2003)

Name	Current Title	Hours	Fees
Chester R. Babst	Shareholder	98.40	\$27,060.00
Mark D. Shepard	Shareholder	1.60	\$352.00
David J. Laurent	Shareholder	1.90	\$399.00
Norman E. Gilkey	Shareholder	0.20	\$52.00
Michele M. Gutman	Sharcholder	4.00	\$1,000.00
Colleen Grace Donofrio	Shareholder	54.10	\$12,172.50
Donald C. Bluedorn	Shareholder	5.50	\$1,292.50
Brandon D. Coneby	Associate	48.60	\$6,075.00
Joseph S. Koscinski	Senior Associate	0.80	\$140.00
Maureen A. Shannon	Associate	29.80	\$4,023.00
Matthew I. Moses	Associate	0.20	\$29.00
Denise D. Moore	Paralegal	7.00	\$560.00
TOTAL		221.10	\$53,155.00

COMPENSATION BY CATEGORY (AUGUST 1, 2003 THROUGH DECEMBER 19, 2003)			
Category	Category Description	Fees	
5	Environmental General	\$52,798.00	
16	Employee Benefit Litigation	\$357.00	
	TOTAL	\$53,155.00	

EXPENSE SUMMARY (AUGUST 1, 2003 THROUGH DECEMBER 19, 2003)		
Expense	Total	
Delivery Services	\$474.61	
Photocopies	\$2,034.10	
Postage	\$73.17	
Telecopics	\$43.05	
Telephone	\$36.59	
Computer Research (these costs relate to access of the PACER System by DDM in order to obtain pleadings relevant to this matter)	\$21.91	
Document Retrieval (FOIA request)	\$38.79	
TOTAL	\$2,722,22	

ENVIRONMENTAL GENERAL

BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR A Professional Corporation Two Gateway Center Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania 15222 Federal ID #25-1523683 412-394-5400

The Hanna Furnace Corporation Account No. : 09121 Invoice Date: 11/19/03 Invoice No. : 1037558 Chester R. Babst, III

Case No.: 09121-0022501

Re: Site Investigation - Hanna Furnace

REGULAR ACCOUNT ACTIVITY

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

10/07/03 DCB	Review proposed agreement (0.8); discussion with R. Palumbo (0.5); draft e-mail re document (0.4).	1.70	399.50
10/14/03 DCB	Discussion with J. Olashuk (0.4) and follow-up re same (0.2).	.60	141.00
10/28/03 DCB	Review (0.2) and respond to e-mail (0.2) re amendment to escrow agreement.	.40	94.00
10/31/03 DCB	Discussion with J. Olashuk re amendment to agreement.	. 50	117.50
	TOTAL SERVICES RENDERED		\$752.00
	TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES		\$752.00
	AMOUNT DUE	=====	\$752.00

RATE	AMOUNT	HOURS	ı	ATTORNEY
_ = = = = =	-			
235.00	752.00	3.20	Donald C. Bluedorn	
	752.00	3.20	TOTAL	

BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR A Professional Corporation Two Gateway Center Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania 15222 Federal ID #25-1523683 412-394-5400

National Steel Corporation

Account No. : 09147 Invoice Date: 09/18/03 Invoice No. : 1036139 Chester R. Babst, III

Case No.: 09147-0022511 Re: Bankruptcy Issues

REGULAR ACCOUNT ACTIVITY

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

08/01/03 CRB	Telephone conferences with J. Olashuk (0.4); review DWSD letter and make modifications (0.5); review Madison County Notice of Violation and draft response (0.4); telephone conference with D. Baker of U.S. Steel (0.3);	2.10	577.50
08/04/03 CRB	draft and send e-mail to D. Baker (0.5). Telephone conferences with J. Olashuk (0.3);	3.00	825.00
	review abandonment and liquidating trust issues		

- 08/04/03 CRB Telephone conferences with J. Olashuk (0.3); 3.00 825.00 review abandonment and liquidating trust issues (1.1); telephone conference with D. Baker of U.S. Steel (0.3); telephone conferences with CGD (0.2); review certified operator issue in Illinois (0.4); review Department of Justice letter re reorganization plan (0.7).
- 08/04/03 CGD Receive and print out photographs from J. 1.10 247.50 Olashuk via C. Mowl (1.0); telephone call from CRB re request for telephone call to J. Olashuk re certified operator issues (0.1).
- 08/05/03 CRB Prepare for and participate in telephone 1.40 385.00 conference with Skadden and NSC representatives re abandonment issues (1.2); telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.2).
- 08/05/03 DCB Prepare for (0.7) and participate in discussion 1.10 258.50 with R. Werhnyak re Hanna Furnace matters (0.4).

2

National Steel Corporation Bankruptcy Issues

- 08/05/03 CGD Review file re certified operator issue and 2.20 495.00 telephone call to J. Olashuk re same (0.4); e-mail latest Section I Landfill and Eastend abandonment discussions to J. Olashuk and CRB in advance of discussions with Skadden Arps (0.2); e-mail Granite City photographs to J. Olashuk (0.1); receive, retrieve, reconcile and file photograph descriptions from J. Olashuk (1.5).
- 08/06/03 CRB Two telephone conferences with J. Olashuk 1.20 330.00 (0.4); telephone conference with D. Baker (0.2); research re certified operator issue (0.7).
- 08/06/03 CGD Telephone call from CRB re certified operator .10 22.50 signatory discussions with J. Olashuk.
- 08/06/03 BDC Review various bankruptcy pleadings and .20 25.00 bankruptcy docket.
- 08/07/03 CRB Prepare for and participate in conference with 5.50 1512.50 USEPA and Justice Department re demand for proof of claim (1.8); telephone conferences with J. Olashuk and J. Heintz (0.7); telephone conferences with Justice Department to get clarification of claim (0.5); assign tasks to begin preparation of counterproposal (0.7); begin evaluation of air claims (1.8).
- 5.80 1305,00 08/07/03 CGD Participate in a conference call with DOJ, EPA Region 5, J. Olashuk and CRB re DOJ summary of pre and post petition civil penalty assessments (0.3); telephone conference with J. Olashuk, CRB and MS re plans to discuss specific claims (0.2); telephone call from J. Olashuk re inability to find Humbug Marsh information and request for search re same (0.1); retrieve and provide J. Olashuk with the link and e-mail same to CRB (0.2); review the proposed civil penalty claims against the specific proofs of claim in advance of the internal conference call (1.8); participate in a conference call with J. Olashuk, J. Heintz, CRB and MS re strategy for assessment of the appropriate civil penalties under the various proofs of claim (0.4): review the RCRA civil penalty policy for application to the Granite City, Great Lakes' and Midwest proofs of claim and start to apply same (2.8).

3

- 837,00 6,20 08/07/03 MS Conference call with DOJ re proofs of claim (0.3); conference with J. Olashuk re issues to contest with proofs of claim (0.3); review proofs of claim documents (1.7); review EPA penalty policies for various statutory programs (3.5); conference with J. Olashuk and J. Heintz re strategy for proceeding with proof of claim negotiations (0.4).
- 3.50 962.50 08/08/03 CRB Work on evaluation of Department of Justice Claims (1.4); telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.3); review research on waste issues (0.7); review penalty policies (1.1).
- 08/08/03 CGD Continue to work on reconstructing a proposed 7.20 1620.00 RCRA penalty assessment for Granite City, Great Lakes and Midwest proofs of claim issues and e-mail draft counter proposals to J. Olashuk and CRB for consideration (4.8); review and start to apply the UST penalty policy to Great Lakes' proof of claim (1.4); discuss open claim issues with J. Olashuk (0.2); telephone call with CRB re SPCC, PCB and EPCRA penalty assessment coverage (0.1); review the PCB penalty policy and start to reconstruct an assessment for Great Lakes' PCB proof of claim (0.7)
- 5.20 702.00 08/08/03 MS Review bankruptcy code for provisions discussing priority of pre-petition claims (1.4); review specific proofs of claim and compare to EPA penalty policy to determine proposed penalty amounts (3.8).
- 385.00 08/11/03 CRB Telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.3); 1.40 review DOJ claims (1.1).
- 08/11/03 CGD Assemble and forward specific information to J. 1.30 292.50 Olashuk with a request for additional information re PCB Transformer No. 982 area clean-up and continue to work on the PCB proof of claim assessment (0.5); create the PCB proof of claim assessment form and start to complete same with available information (0.4); start to work on the Great Lakes and Granite City EPCRA proofs of claim assessments (0.4).
- 08/12/03 CRB Review Proof of Claim and penalty calculations 5.10 1402.50 (2.5); prepare for and participate in conference call with J. Olashuk, MS and CGD re penalty and bankruptcy issues (1.4); begin preparation of memo summarizing demand and counterproposal (1.2).

Case No.: 09147-0022511

08/12/03 CGD	Continue to work on the EPCRA proofs of claim assessments (1.0); create and complete penalty calculation work sheets for Great Lakes and Granite City release reporting incidents (3.5); e-mail Great Lakes' release reporting penalty calculation worksheets to J. Olashuk and CRB (0.1); telephone call from CRB re National Steel Pellet waste tire, drum and wood allegations by U.S. Steel (0.1); retrieve the civil penalty policy for SPCC violations and review same (0.7); e-mail Granite City's release reporting penalty calculation worksheets to J. Olashuk and CRB (0.1); telephone call with J. Olashuk re Great Lakes' PCB cleanup area, revise PCB penalty calculation accordingly and e-mail same to J. Olashuk and CRB (0.3); participate in a conference call with J. Olashuk, CRB and MS re proofs of claim penalty issues (0.6); outline Granite City and Great Lakes NPDEs and SPCC proofs of claims and start to work on a proposed civil penalty assessment for the SPCC claims (0.8); start to review the NPDES penalty policy for assessment of Granite City and Great Lakes' civil penalties (0.3).	7.50	1687.50
08/12/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket.	.10	12.50
08/12/03 MS	Research caselaw discussing priority of environmental penalties in bankruptcy (2.1); conference with J. Olashuk, CRB and CGD re proofs of claim (0.5); draft justifications for reduction of proof of claim settlement amounts (2.7).	5.30	715.50
08/13/03 CRB	Finalize memo re demand and counterproposal (2.5); telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.2).	2.70	742.50
08/13/03 DJL	Telephone conference with R. Werhnyak and A. Woodard re Coal Act issues.	.20	42.00
08/13/03 CGD	Revise the Great Lakes POC # 11 proposed penalty calculation to reflect the correct multi-day penalty designation and forward corrected information to J. Olashuk and CRB (0.2); review files re documentation of NPDES	3.80	855.00

exceedances and other violations under Great Lakes POC # 18 and 19 and Granite City POC # 25 and documentation of UST allegations under Great Lakes POC # 15 (1.5); telephone call to C. Mowl re Great Lakes POC # 15 UST allegations

Page

violations (0.5); work on completing the SPCC POC penalty assessment calculations for Granite City and Great Lakes (0.4); receive and review the draft DOJ POC demand letter from CRB to J. Olashuk, revise same and telephone call to CRB re specific comments (0.5); e-mail support for Great Lakes POC # 20 SPCC containment penalty to J. Olashuk and CRB (0.1); outline a note to the file re outstanding penalty calculation analyses (0.6). 621.00 08/13/03 MS Review Section 726 (a) (4) for applicability to 4.60 Chapter 11 liquidation (0.4); research caselaw discussing priority and equitable subordination in bankruptcy for environmental civil penalties (4.2).08/14/03 CRB Telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.3); .70 192.50 telephone conference with J. Olashuk and R. Werhnyak (0.2); review NSPC issue (0.5). .10 12.50 08/14/03 BDC Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket. 486.00 08/14/03 MS Further research into caselaw distinguishing 3.60 priority for environmental civil penalties in Chapter 7 and Chapter 11 cases. 08/15/03 CGD Telephone call from J. Olashuk re status of .20 45.00 NPDES exceedance penalty assessments and re status of Granite City property abandonment work. 25.00 08/15/03 BDC Review various bankruptcy pleadings and .20 bankruptcy docket (0.1); draft correspondence to N. Taylor of Piper Rudnick re interim fee application requirements (0.1). 08/18/03 CRB Telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.3); two . 90 247.50 telephone conferences with D. Baker (0.3); review NOV response from Madison County (0.3). 08/19/03 CRB Telephone conference with D. Baker and D. Minot 3.30 907.50 re landfill issues (0.4); telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.2); draft letter to USS re NSPC claim (0.6); telephone conference with S. Himmelhoch (0.3); discussion with BDC re research into GCD waste permit (0.2); review

proof of claim bankruptcy issues (1.0).

and information on the alleged leak detection

6

National Steel Corporation Bankruptcy Issues

08/19/03	BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.3); continue preparation of statement of services rendered for July 2003 (0.3).	.60	75.00
08/20/03	CRB	Telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.4); review landfill closure issues (0.2); draft letter to USS (0.5); review proof of claim priority issue (1.2).	2.30	632.50
08/20/03	BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.2); begin preparation of Fourth Interim Fee Application (covering April 1, 2003 through July 31, 2003) (0.7).	.90	112.50
08/21/03	BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.2); continue preparation of statement of services rendered for July 2003) (1.8); continue preparation of Fourth Interim Fee Application (covering April 1, 2003 through July 31, 2003) (3.8); research refinancial assurance requirements for Section IV Granite City Landfill (0.4).	6.20	775.00
08/21/03	DDM	Assist in the preparation of the Quarterly Fee Application.	7.00	560.00
08/22/03	CRB	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with J. Olashuk and K. Sobiecki (0.5); review bankruptcy issue (0.7).	1.20	330.00
08/22/03	BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.4); review and revise statement of services rendered for July 2003 (0.7); continue preparation of Fourth Interim Fee Application (covering April 1, 2003 through July 31, 2003) (2.1); review and revise Fourth Interim Fee Application (covering April 1, 2003 through July 31, 2003) (1.0); telephone call with J. Olashuk re financial assurance requirements for Section IV Granite City Landfill (0.2); complete research re financial assurance requirements for Section IV Granite City Landfill (0.3); meet with CRB re issues associated with fee applications and Section IV Granite City Landfill (0.1).	4.80	600.00
08/25/03	MMG	Review correspondence re completion of work; advise CRB; complete form for TLI.	,20	50.00
08/26/03	CRB	Telephone conference with J. Olashuk and discussions with MDS re Dober Mine issues.	.50	137.50

Case No.: 09147-0022511

\$24,944.25

AMOUNT DUE

08/27/03 CRB	Research into possible bankruptcy priority claim for penalties (1.4); telephone conference with Skadden Arps (0.3); telephone conference with J. Olashuk (0.4); begin review of 104(e) request (0.5).	2.60	715.00
08/27/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.3); correspondence with M. Fenton of Piper Rudnick re issues associated with the sale of Isabella Mine.	.40	50.00
08/28/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket.	.40	50.00
08/29/03 CRB	Telephone conference with D. Baker (0.2); draft letter re NSPC issues (0.3).	- 50	137.50
08/29/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket.	.50	62.50
	TOTAL SERVICES RENDERED	\$2 3	3,064.50
COSTS ADVANC	ED		
05/07/03	Telecopy received from J. Heintz - CRB.		7.50
08/01/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - CRB.		2.00
08/18/03	Air Courier charges incurred re Federal Express delivery to D. Dorgan, Jr., CPG on 07/14/03 (CGD).		26.18
08/18/03	Air Courier charges incurred re Federal Express delivery to M. Beroff on 07/24/03 (BDC).		12.25
08/18/03	Air Courier charges incurred re Federal Express delivery to C. Cannon on 07/24/03 (CGD).		21.78
08/18/03	Air Courier charges incurred re Federal Express delivery to D. Dorgan, JRr. on 07/16/03 (CGD).		63.50
08/18/03	Air Courier charges incurred re Federal Express delivery to R. Werhnyak, Esquire on 07/29/03 (DCB).		12.25
08/20/03	Other cost incurred re telephone charges in the month of May, 2003 (CGD).		2.80
08/22/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - BDC.		4.50
08/25/03	Charges for photocopies through August 31, 2003.	-	,711.20
08/27/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - CRB.		8.50
08/29/03	Telephone charges through May 31, 2003.		7.29
	TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED	\$:	L,879.75
	TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	\$24	1,944.25

Case No.: 09147-0022511

__=========

ATTORNEY	-	HOURS	TUUOMA	RATE
BDC	Brandon D. Coneby	14.40	1,800.00	125.00
CGD	Colleen Grace Donofrio	29.20	6,570.00	225.00
ĊRB	Chester R. Babst, III	37.90	10,422.50	275.00
DCB	Donald C. Bluedorn	1.10	258.50	235.00
DDM	Denise D. Moore	7.00	560.00	80.00
DJL	David J. Laurent	0.20	42.00	210.00
MMG	Michele M. Gutman	0.20	50.00	250.00
MS	Maureen A. Shannon	24,90	3,361.50	135.00
		.		
	TOTAL	114.90	23,064.50	

BABST, CALLAND, CLEMENTS AND ZOMNIR A Professional Corporation Two Gateway Center Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania 15222 Federal ID #25-1523683 412-394-5400

National Steel Corporation

Account No. : 09147 Invoice Date: 10/15/03 Invoice No. : 1036965 Chester R. Babst, III

Case No.: 09147-0022511 Re: Bankruptcy Issues

REGULAR ACCOUNT ACTIVITY

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PROFESSIONAL	SERVICES RENDERED		
09/02/03 CRB	Prepare for negotiations with DOJ (0.8); telephone call to Region V re 104(e) request (0.3).	1.10	302.50
09/02/03 CGD	Receive and review the Section IV Landfill groundwater increase information and set up a file for tracking these issues.	,20	45.00
09/02/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket.	.40	50.00
09/03/03 CRB	Two telephone conferences with J. Olashuk (0.4); prepare for and participate in negotiations with DOJ on Proof of Claim (1.1); discussion with MDS and telephone conference with Michigan Attorney General's Office re Dober Mine water permit and review of potential claims against M.A. Hanna (1.5); discussion with MMG re potential Buck Mine responsibility (0.2).	3.20	880,00
09/03/03 MDS	Prepare for and participate in telephone conferences with J. Stropkai and B. Monroe from Michigan DEQ re Dober Mine NPDES permit.	.80	176.00
09/03/03 MMG	Conference with CRB re Buck Mine status.	.10	25.00
09/03/03 CGD	Request from J. Olashuk for participation in a conference call to discuss the game plan for the Section IV Landfill meeting with Illinois EPA (0.1); review permit notification requirements re groundwater in advance of the	1.30	292.50

·	conference call (0.6); participate in a conference call with J. Olashuk and with D. Dorgan and S. Niehoff of Weaver Boos re discussion of topics for a meeting with Illinois EPA on the Section IV closure and Section III and IV post-closure work (0.6).		
09/04/03 MDS	Draft e-mail to J. Stropkai of Michigan's Attorney General Office re Dober Mine matter.	.10	22.00
09/05/03 CRB	Prepare for and participate in telephone conference with J. Olashuk and K. Sobiecki (0.6); telephone call to Region V re 114(e) request (0.2).	.80	220.00
09/05/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket.	.30	37.50
09/08/03 CRB	Draft letter to Region 5 re 104 (e) request (0.6); telephone call with J. Olashuk (0.3); review IEPA letter re Section IV Landfill and outline response (0.4); telephone conference with Department of Justice re counter offer for POC settlement (0.4).	1.70	467.50
09/09/03 CRB	Finalize letter to Region 5 (0.5); telephone conference with attorney from Region 5 (0.3); telephone conversation with J. Olashuk (0.3); review letter to Madison County (0.2); review DOJ objections to the Liquidation Plan.	2.00	550.00
09/10/03 MDS	Telephone conference with J. Stropkai of Michigan Attorney General's Office re Dober Mine remediation system.	.10	22.00
09/10/03 CGD	Receive and review an e-mail from L. Colpaert of Indiana DEM re Agreed Orders for signature (0.8); forward documentation to J. Olashuk and CRB in advance of discussing same (0.1); telephone call from J. Olashuk re coordination of a conference call with CRB (0.1).	1.00	225.00
09/10/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.3); begin preparation of statement of services rendered for August 2003 (0.2).	.50	62.50
09/10/03 MIM	Conference with R. Castor (Beldon & Blake) re need to revise insurance provision of Oil and Gas Lease Agreement with Beldon & Blake Corporation.	,20	29.00

247.50

Case No.: 09147-0022511

National Steel Corporation Bankruptcy Issues

09/11/03 CRB Prepare for and participate in conference call 3.20 880.00 with J. Olashuk and CGD re Indiana proposed orders (0.8); review draft orders and Proof of Claim (1.2); telephone calls with Skadden Arpo re IDEM orders and DOJ comments on Liquidation Plan (0.5); telephone call and e-mails with J.Olashuk re IEPA letters re Section IV Landfill (0.7).

450.00 09/11/03 CGD Telephone call from L. Colpaert of Indiana DEM 2.00 re request for feedback on the draft joint waste orders for Midwest (0.3); participate in a conference call with J. Olashuk and CRB re same (0.4); retrieve the proof of claim provided by Indiana DEM and forward same to J. Olashuk and CRB and provide CRB with draft comments on the latest joint orders (0.7); receive and review DOJ's comments on the liquidation plan (0.1); e-mail L. Colpaert re plans to call once CRB discusses open settlement issues with bankruptcy counsel (0.2); receive and forward reply e-mail from L. Colpaert to J. Olashuk (0.1); telephone call from J. Olashuk re same (0.2).

09/12/03 CRB Review Dober Mine background documents. 1.00 275.00

09/12/03 CGD Review the waste violations file re
identification of post-bankruptcy filing open
noncompliance items (0.7); telephone call from
CRB re preliminary discussions with Skadden on
unsecured claim language and final
documentation preference (0.1); telephone call
to L. Colpaert of Indiana DEM re discussions
with Bankruptcy Counsel and re plans to proceed
(0.3).

09/15/03 CRB Prepare for and participate in negotiations 2.90 797.50 with DOJ re Proofs of Claim (1.1); telephone conversation with J. Olashuk (0.3); review Dober Mine documents (1.5).

09/16/03 CRB Review Dober Mine agreements and history of 1.90 522.50 M.A. Hanna indemnity (1.2); review abandonment documents (0.7).

09/16/03 MDS Telephone conference with J. Stropkai, Michigan .20 44.00 Assistant Attorney General, re Michigan's proposed plans re Dober Mine NPDES permit.

09/17/03 CRB Outline options to terminate permittee status 1.00 275.00 at Dober Mine.

09/17/03 CGD	Receive and review an e-mail from L. Colpaert of Indiana DEM re revised Agreed Order language (0.4); forward same to CRB with a request for comments (0.1); telephone call from CRB re specific comments (0.2).	. 70	157.50
09/18/03 CRB	Redraft ACO with IDEM and telephone conference with CGD re same (0.7); outline Dober Mine settlement options (0.4).	1,10	302.50
09/18/03 CGD	Review recent DOJ settlement language for consistency with recent versions of the two Indiana DEM waste agreed orders (2.2); e-mail redlined documents to CRB for final review and approval (0.1); telephone call from CRB re specific comments on the Agreed Orders (0.1); incorporate comments and e-mail same to J. Olashuk for final review (0.3).	2.70	607.50
09/18/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.2); review recent Order re allowance of interim compensation and reimbursement of expenses for third quarter and meet with CRB re same (0.2).	.40	50.00
09/19/03 CRB	Begin review of Dober Mine Consent Decree and begin to draft letter to MDEQ re removal of NSC from permit status.	2.10	577.50
09/19/03 CGD	Telephone call from J. Olashuk re concurrence to forward Midwest Agreed Orders' comments to L. Colpaert of Indiana DEM (0.1); retrieve the comments and forward same to L. Colpaert (0.2).	.30	67.50
09/19/03 BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.2).	.20	25.00
09/22/03 CRB	Telephone conference with DOJ attorney and review draft Consent Decree (1.1); review abandonment documents (1.0).	2.10	577.50
09/22/03 MMG	Review files for documents re Hanna indemnity issue (0.3); review index for more relevant documents (0.2); review additional documents (0.3); conference with CRB (0.1).	. 90	225.00
09/22/03 CGD	Receive and review an e-mail from CRB containing the draft DOJ settlement agreement.	.60	135.00
09/23/03 CRB	Two telephone conferences with J. Olashuk (0.3); review settlement agreement with DOJ (0.6); review River Rouge Proof of Claim (0.2); discussion with SBM (0.2).	1.30	357.50

Case No.: 09147-0022511

09/23/03	NEG	Strategy discussion with BDC re Fee Application matters.	.20	52.00
09/23/03	BDC	Review various bankruptcy pleadings and bankruptcy docket (0.4); telephone conference with S. Pistorious re expenses re Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.2); meet with CRB and DMY re same (0.2); meet with NEG re issues re revisions to Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.2); review and revise fee application (0.8).	1.80	225.00
09/24/03	CRB	Review and revise USA settlement agreement.	.50	137.50
09/24/03	BDC	Complete review of and revisions to Fourth Interim Fee Application (0.9); draft statement of services rendered to August 2003 (1.2); draft correspondence to M. Berkoff re same (0.2); review various bankruptcy pleadings and docket (0.2); draft correspondence to J. Olashuk re payment of fees and expenses covered in the fee application (0.6).	3.10	387.50
09/25/03	CRB	Discussion re abandonment motion (0.5); revise Dober Mine letter (0.5); review potential modifications to DOJ settlement (0.6).	1.60	440.00
09/30/03	CRB	Telephone conference with J. Olashuk and letter to State of Michigan.	1.00	275.00
09/30/03	CGD	Receive and review an e-mail and voice-mail from L. Colpaert of Indiana DEM re final revisions to the Midwest Agreed Orders for alleged waste violation.	.20	45.00

TOTAL SERVICES RENDERED \$11,542.50

COSTS ADVANCED

07/10/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - CRB.	3.00
08/11/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - CRB.	0.50
08/18/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - CRB.	3.00
09/05/03	Telecopy received from J. Olashuk - CRB.	5.50
09/10/03	Charges for postage through August 31, 2003.	19.80
09/15/03	Other cost incurred re Pitney Bowes on 08/22/03	6.00
	re binds over 250 (BDC).	
09/18/03	Other costs incurred re telephone charges in	9.47
	the month of August, 2003 (FJC).	
09/18/03	Air Courier charges incurred re Federal Express	20.49
	delivery to R. Werhnyak, Esquire on 08/14/03	
	(JSK).	