

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Leases (Real Property)

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1085318

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
PERLMAN F	11/15/05	0.40	ATTENTION TO LEASE ISSUES (0.4).
PERLMAN F	11/16/05	0.30	ATTENTION TO LEASE ISSUES (0.3).
		0.70	
<b>Total Partner</b>		<b>0.70</b>	
KARPUK BP	11/18/05	0.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS RE: REJECTION OF LEASE IN LOS ANGELES (0.7).
KARPUK BP	11/21/05	3.60	RESEARCH RE: CLAIMS ASSERTED BY REJECTED LANDLORDS (3.6).
KARPUK BP	11/28/05	0.60	WORK RE: PROOFS OF CLAIM FILED WITH RESPECT TO REJECTED LEASES (0.6).
		4.90	
MURPHY MM	11/07/05	0.70	ATTENTION TO ISSUES RE: REAL PROPERTY LEASE AND TERMINATION THEREOF (0.7).
MURPHY MM	11/10/05	0.80	TELECONFERENCES WITH COUNSEL TO LANDLORDS WITH REJECTED LEASES (0.8).
		1.50	
<b>Total Associate</b>		<b>6.40</b>	
MIRKOVIC M	11/01/05	1.30	PREPARE LEASE REJECTION NOTICE AND RELATED EXHIBITS (1.3).
MIRKOVIC M	11/16/05	1.10	PREPARE EXHIBIT BINDER RELATING TO LEASE REJECTION MOTION AND ORDER (1.1).
		2.40	
<b>Total Legal Assistant</b>		<b>2.40</b>	
WORSHECK TM	11/01/05	3.40	EDIT AND PREPARE SERVICE LISTS FOR DISTRIBUTION/MAILING RE: LEASE REJECTION NOTICE (2.6); PREPARE AND ASSEMBLE DOCUMENTS FOR DISTRIBUTION/MAILING RE: LEASE REJECTION NOTICE (0.8).
		3.40	
<b>Total Legal Assistant Support</b>		<b>3.40</b>	
<b>TOTAL TIME</b>		<b><u>12.90</u></b>	

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Leases (Real Property)

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1091183

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
PERLMAN F	12/06/05	1.60	ATTENTION TO LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS (1.6).
PERLMAN F	12/14/05	0.60	ATTENTION TO LEASE CLAIMS (0.6).
		2.20	
<b>Total Partner</b>		2.20	
KARPUK BP	12/02/05	1.60	DRAFT LETTERS TO LEASE REJECTION CLAIMANTS WHO WERE PAID INADVERTENTLY (1.6).
KARPUK BP	12/05/05	0.30	WORK RE: LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS (0.3).
KARPUK BP	12/06/05	3.80	ATTENTION TO RESOLVING LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS (3.8).
KARPUK BP	12/07/05	2.10	WORK RE: RESOLUTION OF LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS (2.1).
KARPUK BP	12/08/05	3.70	DRAFT LETTERS TO VARIOUS LEASE REJECTION CLAIMANTS RE: CLAIMS (3.7).
KARPUK BP	12/09/05	0.30	WORK RE: SETTling LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS (0.3).
KARPUK BP	12/14/05	1.90	WORK RE: SETTLEMENT OF LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS.
KARPUK BP	12/15/05	1.10	WORK RE: LEASE REJECTION CLAIMS (1.1).
		14.80	
KREBS PE	12/15/05	1.30	REVIEW MATERIALS ON VILLAGE OF BERKELY LEASE AND CORRESPONDENCE RELATED THERETO (1.3).
		1.30	
<b>Total Associate</b>		16.10	
MIRKOVIC M	12/05/05	0.60	REVIEW AND PREPARE LETTERS TO VARIOUS CLASS 6 LEASE CLAIM LANDLORDS RE: RENT PAYMENT (0.6).
		0.60	
<b>Total Legal Assistant</b>		0.60	
<b>TOTAL TIME</b>		<u>18.90</u>	

SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Leases (Real Property)

Bill Date: 01/31/06  
Bill Number: 1093039

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
KREBS PE	01/04/06	1.10	REVIEW CITY OF BERKELEY LEASE INFORMATION AND RELATED CORRESPONDENCE (0.7); DRAFT EMAIL TO A. ADAMS AT ALVAREZ AND MARSAL RE: CITY OF BERKELEY LEASE (0.4).
		1.10	
Total Associate		1.10	
TOTAL TIME		<u>1.10</u>	

SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Leases (Real Property)

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1085318

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Telephone Expense	11/23/05	Telecommunications, D	1.00
		<b>TOTAL TELEPHONE EXPENSE</b>	<b>\$1.00</b>
Westlaw	11/28/05	Karpuk BP	98.00
		<b>TOTAL WESTLAW</b>	<b>\$98.00</b>
		<b>TOTAL MATTER</b>	<b>\$99.00</b>