

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Utilities

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1085318

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
PERLMAN F	11/09/05	0.30	ATTENTION TO SBC (0.3).
PERLMAN F	11/11/05	3.90	ATTENTION TO SBC RULE 59 MOTION AND REQUEST FOR ADEQUATE ASSURANCE (3.9).
PERLMAN F	11/12/05	6.90	WORK ON SBC OBJECTIONS (6.9).
PERLMAN F	11/13/05	5.90	WORK ON SBC OBJECTIONS (5.9).
PERLMAN F	11/14/05	4.70	WORK ON RESPONSE TO AND ANALYZE ISSUES RE: SBC MOTION (4.7).
PERLMAN F	11/15/05	2.70	ATTENTION TO SBC MOTION (2.7).
PERLMAN F	11/16/05	1.90	ATTENTION TO SBC MATTER (1.9).
PERLMAN F	11/17/05	1.10	ATTENTION TO SBC (1.1).
PERLMAN F	11/18/05	2.90	ATTENTION TO SBC MOTION AND DEBTORS OBJECTION (2.9).
PERLMAN F	11/21/05	2.50	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SBC HEARING (1.9); FOLLOW UP ON SBC MOTION (0.6).
PERLMAN F	11/22/05	1.00	CONTINUED ATTENTION TO SBC (0.4); ATTENTION TO QWEST REQUEST (0.6).
PERLMAN F	11/23/05	0.50	ATTENTION TO SBC DISCOVERY (0.5).
PERLMAN F	11/25/05	0.60	EVALUATE QWEST ISSUES (0.6).
PERLMAN F	11/28/05	2.50	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SBC HEARING (2.1); ATTENTION TO QWEST (0.4).
PERLMAN F	11/29/05	0.60	WORK ON SBC (0.6).
PERLMAN F	11/30/05	0.90	ANALYSIS OF ADEQUATE ASSURANCE ISSUES (0.9).
		<b>38.90</b>	
POHL TR	11/10/05	2.00	ATTENTION TO UTILITY ISSUES (2.0).
POHL TR	11/11/05	4.00	ATTENTION TO SBC MATTERS (4.0).
POHL TR	11/13/05	4.50	ATTENTION TO SBC MATTERS (4.5).
POHL TR	11/14/05	7.50	ATTENTION TO SBC MATTERS (7.5).
POHL TR	11/15/05	5.00	ATTENTION TO SBC MATTERS (5.0).
POHL TR	11/16/05	6.50	ATTENTION TO SBC MATTERS (6.5).
POHL TR	11/21/05	4.50	ATTENTION TO QWEST ISSUES (2.5); ATTENTION TO SBC ISSUES (2.0).
POHL TR	11/22/05	4.50	ATTENTION TO QWEST AND SBC ISSUES (4.5).
POHL TR	11/23/05	4.50	ATTENTION TO SBC AND QWEST ISSUES (4.5).

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

POHL TR	11/28/05	9.50	ATTENTION TO SBC AND QWEST MATTERS (9.5).
		52.50	
<b>Total Partner</b>		<b>91.40</b>	
KARPUK BP	11/09/05	0.40	WORK RE: SBC'S WITHHOLDING OF PAYMENT (0.4).
KARPUK BP	11/11/05	2.70	WORK RE: RESPONSE TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUEST (2.7).
KARPUK BP	11/12/05	10.30	DRAFT RESPONSE TO SBC'S MOTION FOR ADEQUATE ASSURANCE AND MOTION TO RECONSIDER UTILITIES ORDER (10.3).
KARPUK BP	11/13/05	7.50	DRAFT RESPONSE TO SBC'S MOTION FOR ADEQUATE ASSURANCE AND MOTION TO RECONSIDER UTILITIES ORDER (7.5).
KARPUK BP	11/14/05	8.60	REVISE RESPONSES TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUEST (8.6).
KARPUK BP	11/15/05	9.60	REVISE RESPONSES TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUESTS (9.6).
KARPUK BP	11/16/05	9.10	REVISE RESPONSES TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUEST (9.1).
KARPUK BP	11/17/05	4.10	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUEST (4.1).
KARPUK BP	11/28/05	6.80	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC REQUEST FOR ADEQUATE ASSURANCE AND RECONSIDER UTILITY ORDER (6.8).
KARPUK BP	11/29/05	12.60	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC REQUEST FOR ADEQUATE ASSURANCE AND RECONSIDER UTILITY ORDER (12.6).
KARPUK BP	11/30/05	7.30	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC REQUEST FOR ADEQUATE ASSURANCE AND RECONSIDER UTILITY ORDER (7.3).
		79.00	
KREBS PE	11/08/05	2.20	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO VARIOUS INQUIRIES BY CENTURYTEL AND COORDINATE RESPONSE BY MCLEODUSA (1.9); TELECONFERENCE WITH R. RAINACH RE: CENTURYTEL INQUIRY (0.3).
KREBS PE	11/09/05	1.60	CONTINUE TO REVIEW AND RESPOND TO INQUIRIES BY CENTURYTEL AND INFORMATION PROVIDED BY MCLEODUSA (1.6).
KREBS PE	11/10/05	2.80	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM COUNSEL FOR CENTURYTEL AND COORDINATE RESPONSE WITH MCLEOD (2.1); REVIEW MOTION OF SBC FOR RECONSIDERATION OF UTILITIES ORDER (0.7).

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

KREBS PE	11/12/05	10.10	REVIEW SBC MOTION SEEKING TO ALTER/AMEND THE UTILITIES ORDER (0.9); REVIEW SBC MOTION SEEKING ADDITIONAL ADEQUATE ASSURANCE (1.4); BEGIN TO DRAFT EMERGENCY OBJECTION TO PROPOSED SBC MOTION REQUESTING EMERGENCY HEARING ON ADEQUATE ASSURANCE (7.8).
KREBS PE	11/13/05	6.20	CONTINUE TO DRAFT EMERGENCY OBJECTION TO PROPOSED SBC MOTION REQUESTING EMERGENCY HEARING ON ADEQUATE ASSURANCE (3.3); DRAFT AFFIDAVIT RE: SAME (1.7); DRAFT LETTER TO COUNSEL FOR SBC RE: DEMAND DEPOSIT (1.2).
KREBS PE	11/14/05	3.80	CONTINUE TO REVISE OBJECTION TO MOTION OF SBC REQUESTING EMERGENCY HEARING TO DETERMINE ADEQUATE OF ASSURANCE (3.2); CONTINUE TO REVISE LETTER TO A. HAMMER OF FREEBORN & PETER'S RE: DEMAND FOR DEPOSIT (0.6).
KREBS PE	11/16/05	3.80	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CENTURYTEL AND COORDINATE WITH MCLEODUSA RE: DEPOSIT REQUEST (0.9); REVIEW SBC FILINGS REQUESTING ADDITIONAL ADEQUATE ASSURANCE AND DEPOSIT (2.3); RESPOND TO INQUIRY FROM T. HOLCROFT AT CINCINNATI BELL AND COORDINATE WITH MCLEODUSA (0.6).
KREBS PE	11/17/05	0.60	CONTINUE TO REVIEW INQUIRIES RE: BANKRUPTCY FILING FROM VARIOUS UTILITY PROVIDERS AND COORDINATE WITH MCLEOD (0.6).
KREBS PE	11/27/05	1.10	REVIEW DISCOVERY AND INTERROGATORY REQUEST FROM SBC (0.7); RESEARCH TIME REQUIREMENTS FOR DISCOVERY RESPONSES (0.4).
KREBS PE	11/29/05	0.60	REVIEW INQUIRIES RECEIVED FROM CINERGY, COLUMBIA GAS AND CONSUMERS ENERGY (0.6).
KREBS PE	11/30/05	2.60	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. TAYLOR RE: INQUIRY BY CINERGY (0.4); TELECONFERENCE WITH M. NELSON RE: INQUIRY BY CONSUMERS ENERGY (0.3); TELECONFERENCE WITH R. THORTON RE: INQUIRY BY COLUMBIA GAS OF OHIO (0.3); REVIEW AND REVISE SBC RESPONSE BRIEF (1.6).
		35.40	
<b>Total Associate</b>		<b>114.40</b>	
ETTRICK M	11/11/05	8.00	PRIVILEGE AND RESPONSIVENESS DETERMINATION OF MCLEODUSA EMAILS AND ATTACHMENTS (8.0).
		8.00	

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

Total Staff Attorney/Staff      8.00  
Law Clerk

TOTAL TIME                              213.80

CLIENT TOTAL                            713.30

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Utilities

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1091183

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
PERLMAN F	12/01/05	0.70	ATTENTION TO SBC MOTION AND DISCOVERY (0.7).
PERLMAN F	12/02/05	0.80	ATTENTION TO UTILITY ISSUES (0.8).
PERLMAN F	12/05/05	4.30	ATTENTION TO SBC RESPONSE (1.6); PREPARE CONFIRMATION BRIEF, ORDERS AND AFFIDAVITS (2.3); ATTENTION TO REGULATORY APPROVALS (0.4).
PERLMAN F	12/06/05	1.40	WORK ON SBC ISSUES (1.4).
PERLMAN F	12/09/05	0.90	EVALUATE QWEST AND SBC ISSUES (0.9).
PERLMAN F	12/12/05	3.40	ATTENTION TO SBC CURE ISSUES (3.4).
PERLMAN F	12/13/05	3.10	WORK ON SBC RESPONSE (3.1).
PERLMAN F	12/14/05	8.50	WORK ON SBC RESOLUTION (6.3); TELECONFERENCE WITH SBC RE: SETTLEMENT (1.4); TELECONFERENCE WITH BANKS RE: SETTLEMENT (0.8).
PERLMAN F	12/15/05	1.90	WORK ON SBC RESOLUTION (1.9).
PERLMAN F	12/16/05	1.80	ATTENTION TO SBC AGREEMENT AND ESCROW (1.8).
PERLMAN F	12/19/05	1.80	ATTENTION TO SBC ESCROW (1.8).
		<b>28.60</b>	
POHL TR	12/01/05	5.00	ATTENTION TO QWEST AND SBC (5.0).
POHL TR	12/02/05	7.50	ATTENTION TO SBC AND QWEST ISSUES (7.5).
POHL TR	12/03/05	6.00	ATTENTION TO SBC OBJECTION (6.0).
POHL TR	12/04/05	5.50	ATTENTION TO SBC OBJECTION (5.5).
POHL TR	12/05/05	7.50	ATTENTION TO SBC OBJECTION (7.5).
POHL TR	12/06/05	4.00	ATTENTION TO QWEST AND SBC ISSUES (4.0).
POHL TR	12/07/05	4.50	ATTENTION TO QWEST SETTLEMENT AND SBC ISSUES (4.5).
POHL TR	12/08/05	4.50	ATTENTION TO QWEST SETTLEMENT (4.5).
POHL TR	12/09/05	2.00	ATTENTION TO QWEST SETTLEMENT (2.0).
POHL TR	12/11/05	3.50	ATTENTION TO DISPUTES (3.5).
		<b>50.00</b>	
<b>Total Partner</b>		<b>78.60</b>	

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

BRESNAHAN AW	12/02/05	4.50	REVIEW AND MARKUP OF RESPONSE TO SBC AND RESEARCH RE: SAME (3.3); RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF QWEST INTERROGATORIES AND EMAIL RE: SAME (0.4); RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF SBC OBJECTION (0.8).
BRESNAHAN AW	12/05/05	4.40	REVISIONS TO RESPONSE TO SBC OBJECTION AND RESEARCH, TELECONFERENCES, AND EMAILS RE: SAME (3.5); REVIEW OF SBC FILINGS (0.9).
BRESNAHAN AW	12/08/05	0.90	REVIEW OF FILING, VERIZON PRECEDENT (0.9).
BRESNAHAN AW	12/13/05	1.80	RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF NEW SBC PLEADINGS (1.8).
		<b>11.60</b>	
<b>Total Counsel</b>		<b>11.60</b>	
KARPUK BP	12/01/05	7.10	REVIEW AND REVISE RESPONSE SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE (4.3); WORK RE: QWEST OBJECTIONS (2.8).
KARPUK BP	12/02/05	9.40	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUESTS (9.4).
KARPUK BP	12/03/05	6.20	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUESTS (6.2).
KARPUK BP	12/04/05	7.80	REVISE RESPONSE TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUESTS (7.8).
KARPUK BP	12/05/05	9.10	REVISE AND FILE RESPONSE TO SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUEST (9.1).
KARPUK BP	12/06/05	2.60	WORK RE: RESPONSE TO SBC OBJECTIONS (2.6).
KARPUK BP	12/07/05	4.30	RESEARCH RE: SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE REQUEST (4.3).
KARPUK BP	12/09/05	3.20	RESEARCH RE: SBC ADEQUATE ASSURANCE DEMAND (3.2).
KARPUK BP	12/15/05	2.20	RESPOND TO REQUESTS OF VARIOUS UTILITIES (0.4); WORK RE: SBC SETTLEMENT (1.8).
KARPUK BP	12/16/05	1.60	WORK RE: SBC SETTLEMENT (1.6).
KARPUK BP	12/19/05	3.20	WORK RE: SBC SETTLEMENT (3.2).
KARPUK BP	12/20/05	5.30	WORK RE: 366 SETTLEMENT WITH SBC (2.4); RESEARCH RE: SBC CURE CLAIM (2.9).
KARPUK BP	12/21/05	5.80	RESEARCH RE: SBC CURE CLAIM (5.8).
KARPUK BP	12/22/05	2.60	RESEARCH RE: SBC CURE CLAIM (2.6).
KARPUK BP	12/27/05	6.70	RESEARCH RE: RESPONSE TO SBC CURE CLAIM (6.7).

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

KARPUK BP	12/29/05	7.10	RESEARCH RE: RESPONSE TO SBC CURE CLAIM (7.1).
		84.20	
KREBS PE	12/01/05	5.40	BEGIN TO DRAFT DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REQUEST FOR QWEST (2.4); BEGIN TO STRATEGIZE RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REQUEST AND INTERROGATORIES FROM SBC AND DOCUMENT REQUEST FROM QWEST (1.8); TELECONFERENCE WITH J. CERYANEC, S. SPRINGEL, J. THOMPSON RE: CONFIRMATION HEARING STRATEGY (0.7); TELECONFERENCE WITH J. THOMPSON, T. SPOCOGEE RE: DISCOVERY FOR QWEST AND SBC (0.5).
KREBS PE	12/02/05	8.80	COORDINATE DOCUMENT PRODUCTION WITH RESPECT TO QWEST REQUEST FOR DOCUMENTS (2.6); REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRIVILEGE AND OTHER SENSITIVE INFORMATION (2.7); BEGIN TO DRAFT/RESEARCH RESPONSE TO PROPOSED QWEST OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION (3.1); REVIEW CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENT DRAFT (0.4).
KREBS PE	12/03/05	4.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRIVILEGE AND OTHER SENSITIVE INFORMATION (4.7).
KREBS PE	12/04/05	4.50	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRIVILEGE AND OTHER SENSITIVE INFORMATION (3.1); CONTINUE TO DRAFT/RESEARCH RESPONSE TO PROPOSED QWEST OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION (1.4).
KREBS PE	12/05/05	9.60	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRIVILEGE AND OTHER SENSITIVE INFORMATION WITH RESPECT TO QWEST DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (2.7); CONTINUE TO DRAFT/RESEARCH RESPONSE TO PROPOSED QWEST OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION (3.6); REVIEW QWEST PAYMENT TRENDING AND DISPUTE HISTORY (0.5); REVISE DRAFT CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENT (0.6); CONTINUE TO REVISE DISCOVERY MATERIALS TO SBC (0.8); BEGIN TO STRATEGIZE RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION TO SBC (0.5); DRAFT EMAIL TO A. HAMMER, COUNSEL FOR SBC RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION AND INTERROGATORIES TO BE COMPLETED BY SBC (0.4); TELECONFERENCE WITH J. FRANKEL OF SWIDLER RE: DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (0.5).

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

KREBS PE	12/06/05	3.70	REVIEW DOCUMENTS FOR PRIVILEGE AND OTHER SENSITIVE INFORMATION WITH RESPECT TO QWEST DOCUMENT PRODUCTION (1.6); REVISE AND REVIEW CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENT TO INCORPORATE COMMENTS OF A. SHERMAN, COUNSEL FOR QWEST (0.8); FINALIZE CONFIDENTIALITY AGREEMENT (0.2); CONTINUE TO REVISE DEBTORS' RESPONSES TO QWEST AND SBC DOCUMENT PRODUCTION REQUESTS (1.1).
KREBS PE	12/07/05	0.90	RESEARCH RE: WHETHER SBC IS A UTILITY UNDER SECTION 366 OF THE BANKRUPTCY CODE (0.9).
KREBS PE	12/08/05	0.90	REVIEW REPRESENTATIVE ICA AGREEMENTS FOR DEPOSIT, ADR AND OTHER PERTINENT PROVISIONS RE: SBC DEPOSIT DISPUTES (0.9).
KREBS PE	12/09/05	0.80	REVIEW INQUIRY FROM CENTENNIAL COMMUNICATIONS (0.3); TELECONFERENCE WITH REPRESENTATIVE OF CENTENNIAL COMMUNICATIONS RE: DEPOSIT INQUIRY (0.3); DRAFT EMAIL TO T. SPOCOGEE RE: ACCOUNT NUMBERS FOR CENTENNIAL COMMUNICATIONS (0.2).
KREBS PE	12/12/05	12.20	BEGIN TO RESEARCH ISSUE RE: TO DRAFT RESPONSES TO SBC LIMITED OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION AND CURE CLAIM (2.8); BEGIN TO DRAFT RESPONSES TO SBC LIMITED OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION AND CURE CLAIM (3.9); REVIEW AMENDED CURE CLAIM FILED BY SBC ENTITIES (0.5); REVIEW CHART OF SBC ICA'S TO DETERMINE WHICH STATES HAVE/DO NOT HAVE DEPOSIT AND DISPUTE RESOLUTION PROCEDURES (0.8); REVIEW SBC WEBSITE FOR STATE TARIFFS (0.5); REVIEW ILLINOIS STATE TARIFFS FOR DEPOSIT REQUIREMENTS (0.6); RESEARCH RE: IPSO FACTO CLAUSES (0.8); RESEARCH RE: RIDE-THROUGH DOCTRINE (2.3).
KREBS PE	12/13/05	8.60	CONTINUE TO DRAFT RESPONSE TO SBC LIMITED OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION AND CURE CLAIM (3.2); CONTINUE TO RESEARCH ISSUES RE: TO DRAFT RESPONSES TO SBC LIMITED OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION AND CURE CLAIM (4.7); REVIEW EMAIL FROM J. KIDOO OF SWIDLER BERLIN RE: FCC STATEMENT AND POLICY (0.7).



SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES

KREBS PE	12/14/05	7.60	DRAFT AND REVISE STIPULATION WITH SBC (1.4); REVIEW SBC ICA (1.1); REVIEW MOTION FROM J. KIDOO OF SWIDLER BERLIN, PERTINENT TO SBC OBJECTION (0.7); REVIEW SBC TARIFFS SENT BY T. SPOCOGEE (0.9); REVIEW CASE LAW CITED BY SBC IN SUPPORT OF SBC PLEADINGS (2.2); PREPARE MATERIALS RE: SECTION 366 FOR CONFIRMATION HEARING (1.3).
		67.70	
<b>Total Associate</b>		<b>151.90</b>	
MIRKOVIC M	12/06/05	0.40	PREPARE AND FILE NOTICE OF FILING RE: OBJECTION TO SBC'S MOTION RE: UTILITIES (0.4).
		0.40	
<b>Total Legal Assistant</b>		<b>0.40</b>	
<b>TOTAL TIME</b>		<b><u>242.50</u></b>	
<b>CLIENT TOTAL</b>		<b><u>1114.35</u></b>	

SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Utilities

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1091302

NAME	DATE	HOURS	DESCRIPTION
PERLMAN F	01/06/06	1.00	ATTENTION TO QWEST SETTLEMENT. (.4) ATTENTION TO SBC SETTLEMENT. (.6).
		1.00	
Total Partner		1.00	
TOTAL TIME		<u>1.00</u>	
CLIENT TOTAL		<u>240.35</u>	

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Utilities

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1091302

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
Local Travel	11/15/05	Karpuk BP	6.00
Local Travel	11/15/05	Karpuk BP	7.00
Local Travel	11/21/05	Perlman F	11.00
		<b>TOTAL LOCAL TRAVEL</b>	<b>\$24.00</b>
		<b>TOTAL MATTER</b>	<b>\$24.00</b>
		<b>TOTAL CLIENT</b>	<b>\$8,441.00</b>

**SKADDEN, ARPS, SLATE, MEAGHER & FLOM LLP AND AFFILIATES**

McLeodUSA Incorporated (DIP II)  
Utilities

Bill Date: 01/16/06  
Bill Number: 1091183

Disbursement	Date	Vendor/Employee/Dept.	Amount
In-house Reproduction	12/02/05	Copy Center, D	72.25
In-house Reproduction	12/06/05	Copy Center, D	2.00
In-house Reproduction	12/09/05	Copy Center, D	8.98
In-house Reproduction	12/16/05	Copy Center, D	4.29
In-house Reproduction	12/19/05	Copy Center, D	39.12
In-house Reproduction	12/20/05	Copy Center, D	70.36
		<b>TOTAL IN-HOUSE REPRODUCTION</b>	<b>\$197.00</b>
Telephone Expense	12/29/05	Telecommunications, D	14.92
Telephone Expense	12/29/05	Telecommunications, D	0.08
		<b>TOTAL TELEPHONE EXPENSE</b>	<b>\$15.00</b>
Lexis/Nexis	12/14/05	Krebs PE	199.00
		<b>TOTAL LEXIS/NEXIS</b>	<b>\$199.00</b>
Westlaw	12/01/05	Karpuk BP	8.88
Westlaw	12/02/05	Karpuk BP	215.12
Westlaw	12/03/05	Karpuk BP	8.88
Westlaw	12/04/05	Karpuk BP	52.36
Westlaw	12/07/05	Karpuk BP	440.49
Westlaw	12/08/05	Karpuk BP	106.69
Westlaw	12/13/05	Karpuk BP	165.58
		<b>TOTAL WESTLAW</b>	<b>\$998.00</b>
Messengers/ Courier	12/09/05	Straightline Courier	31.74
Messengers/ Courier	12/12/05	Dist Serv/Mail/Page, D	10.26
		<b>TOTAL MESSENGERS/ COURIER</b>	<b>\$42.00</b>
		<b>TOTAL MATTER</b>	<b>\$1,451.00</b>
		<b>TOTAL CLIENT</b>	<b>\$13,324.00</b>