

EXHIBIT A**SUMMARY OF COZEN O'CONNOR FEES
APRIL 1, 2002 THROUGH MAY 31, 2002**

Name of Professional	Position, Year Assumed	Hourly Rate	Total Hours Billed	Total Compensation
Frederick B. Rosner	Joined firm as a Senior Member in 2001. Member of the Delaware and New York Bars.	\$320.00	1.50	\$480.00
Jennifer L. Scoliard	Joined firm as an Associate in 2001. Member of the Delaware and Georgia Bars.	\$210.00	5.40	\$1,134.00
Shelley A. Kinsella	Joined firm as an associate in 2001. Member of the Delaware Bar.	\$195.00	23.50	\$4,582.50
Pamela A. McGuoirk	Joined firm as a Paralegal in 2001. Paralegal since 1998.	\$125.00	.10	\$12.50
Gretchen A. Bellamy	Joined firm as a Paralegal in 2001. Paralegal since 2000.	\$105.00	12.40	\$1,302.00
Grand Total:			42.90	\$7,511.00
Blended Rate		\$175.08		

COMPENSATION BY PROJECT CATEGORY

Project Category (Examples)	Total Hours	Total Fees
Asset Analysis and Recovery		
Asset Disposition	5.90	\$1,200.50
Business Operations		
Case Administration	6.00	\$1,263.00
Claims Administration and Objections	.20	\$39.00
Employee Benefits/Pensions		
Fee/Employment Applications	19.80	\$2,809.50
Fee/Employment Objections		
Financing		
Litigation	10.40	\$2,082.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement		
Relief from Stay Proceedings	.60	\$117.00
Tax Issues		
Valuation		
Other/Review of Pleadings and Docket/Attendance at Hearing/Conference with Staff regarding Case Issues		
GRAND TOTAL	42.90	\$7,511.00

%!
(disburse.jdt) STARTLM

June 27, 2002

MARTIN BUNIN, ESQ.
THELEN, REID & PRIEST, LLP
40 WEST 57TH STREET
NEW YORK, NY 10019

RE: CREDITORS' COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE

OUR FILE NO.: 117939.001

FEEES FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: \$7,511.00
EXPENSES INCURRED: \$2,608.82
TOTAL AMOUNT OF INVOICE NO: ***** \$10,119.82

-----TIME AND FEE SUMMARY-----			
-----TIMEKEEPER-----	RATE	HOURS	FEEES
P.A. MCGUOIRK	125.00	.10	12.50
J L SCOLIARD	210.00	5.40	1134.00
F.B. ROSNER	320.00	1.50	480.00
G.C. BELLAMY	105.00	12.40	1302.00
S.A. KINSELLA	195.00	23.50	4582.50
TOTALS		42.90	7511.00

SPECIAL COPY	304.89
COURIER SERVICE	2123.33
DUPLICATING	177.60
FAX CHARGES	3.00

EXPENSES INCURRED \$2,608.82

GRAND TOTAL \$10,119.82

INVOICE NO.: *****

INVOICE DATE: Jun 27, 2002

00650.7157.000 COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
117939.001 CREDITORS' COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES		HOURS
DATE		DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES	CODE	HOURS
ASSET DISPOSITION				
04/02/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE: CASCADES PURCHASE.	BKD311	.10
04/12/02	SAK	REVIEW MOTION AUTHORIZING SALE OF TRANSFERRED ASSETS.	BKD311	.40
04/15/02	FBR	REVIEW LIMITED OBJECTION TO SALE.	BKD311	.40
04/15/02	SAK	TELECONFERENCE CALL RE: BRASCAN SALE AND OTHER COMMITTEE MATTERS.	BKD311	1.00
04/22/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM B. GROHSGAL RE: TIME OF AUCTION, FORWARD TO A. MILES.	BKD311	.10
05/02/02	SAK	EMAIL TO F. ROSNER RE AUCTION, REVIEW RESPONSE.	BKD311	.20
05/02/02	SAK	TELEPHONE CALL AND EMAIL TO C. FREEMAN AND M. BUNIN RE AUCTION; EMAILS TO AND FROM F. ROSNER RE SAME.	BKD311	.30
05/02/02	SAK	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH C. FREEMAN RE AUCTION AND UPCOMING HEARING.	BKD311	.20
05/03/02	SAK	REVIEW PWC'S 7TH MONTHLY FEE APP.	BKD311	.20
05/09/02	SAK	REVIEW 1ST SOURCE BANK'S MOTION TO ASSUME/REJECT EQUIPMENT LEASE.	BKD311	.20
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION FOR ORDER APPROVING SALE PROCEDURES.	BKD311	.40

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 3

05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW MOTION TO APPROVE SALE PROCEDURES	BKD311	.30
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW MOTION TO APPROVE SALE OF ASSETS CLEAR OF LIENS & ENCUMBRANCES	BKD311	.20
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW ORDER APPROVING SALE OF ASSETS CLEAR OF LIENS AND ENCUMBRANCES	BKD311	.30
05/20/02	SAK	REVIEW AMERICAN PAPER CORPS OBJECTION TO SALE MOTION.	BKD311	.30
05/23/02	SAK	REVIEW ORDER RE MOTION TO SHORTEN TIME FOR SALE MOTION.	BKD311	.10
05/23/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL OF APPEARANCE; FORWARD TO ASST. FOR REVISION TO SERVICE LIST.	BKD311	.10
05/23/02	SAK	REVIEW SALE MOTION RE DEBTORS' WINCHESTER ASSETS.	BKD311	.40
05/23/02	SAK	REVIEW ORDER RE R&D BUILDING CONVEYANCE.	BKD311	.10
05/29/02	SAK	REVIEW MOTION TO SHORTEN TIME RE: STIPULATION FOR DISBURSEMENT OF SALE PROCEEDS.	BKD311	.10
05/29/02	SAK	REVIEW LIMITED OBJECTION BY NBT BANK TO SALE MOTION.	BKD311	.20
05/29/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE TO ABANDON CITICAPITAL EQUIPMENT.	BKD311	.10
05/30/02	SAK	REVIEW NEW YORK'S OBJECTION TO SALE.	BKD311	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 4

05/30/02 SAK REVIEW NOTICE TO REJECT GECC'S
EQUIPMENT LEASE.

BKD311 .10

TOTAL ASSET DISPOSITION

5.90 \$1200.50

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 5

CASE ADMINISTRATION

04/02/02	GCB	CASE MANAGEMENT	BKD313	.10
04/02/02	FBR	REVIEW CASE STATUS E-MAIL FROM CO-COUNSEL.	BKD313	.10
04/09/02	GCB	CASE MANAGEMENT	BKD313	.10
04/12/02	FBR	REVIEW DOCKET.	BKD313	.10
04/12/02	FBR	EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL.	BKD313	.10
04/15/02	FBR	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH MISCELLANEOUS CREDITORS RE: STATUS OF BAR DATE.	BKD313	.20
04/15/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR 4/17/02 HEARING.	BKD313	.20
04/16/02	FBR	REVIEW LIMITED OBJECTION FILED BY COMMITTEE.	BKD313	.20
04/17/02	FBR	EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: 5/3 AUCTION.	BKD313	.10
04/17/02	FBR	REVIEW AMENDED AGENDA.	BKD313	.10
04/17/02	SAK	EMAIL TO C. FREEMAN RE ATTENDANCE AT AUCTION SCHEDULED FOR 05/03/02.	BKD313	.10
04/17/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF SECOND AMENDED AGENDA.	BKD313	.10
04/19/02	GCB	FORWARDING AS FILED COPY OF CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF COZEN TO C. FREEMAN	BKD313	.10
04/22/02	SAK	REVIEW MOTION FOR ENTRY OF STIPULATION AND AMENDED FINAL ORDER RE BRASCAN DIP FINANCING.	BKD313	.30

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 6

04/22/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM F. ROSNER RE: AUCTION TIME; FORWARD INQUIRY TO DEBTOR'S COUNSEL.	BKD313	.20
04/22/02	GCB	REVIEWING DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD313	.10
04/23/02	SAK	REVIEW NUTEMPS MOTION TO COMPEL PAYMENT	BKD313	.20
04/23/02	FBR	REVIEW DOCKET.	BKD313	.20
04/24/02	GCB	FORWARDING COPY OF CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN TO C. FREEMAN	BKD313	.10
05/03/02	SAK	TELEPHONE CALL TO COUNSEL FOR DEBTOR RE ATTENDING VIDEO CONFERENCE; LEFT MESSAGE.	BKD313	.10
05/03/02	SAK	REVIEW FEBRUARY OPERATING REPORT.	BKD313	.20
05/03/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF AGENDA.	BKD313	.10
05/03/02	SAK	REVIEW STIPULATION AUTHORIZING DIP TO OBTAIN FINANCING.	BKD313	.20
05/06/02	SAK	REVIEW DEBTORS' RESPONSE TO EMERGENCY MOTION OF AMERICAN PAD & PAPER.	BKD313	.20
05/06/02	SAK	REVIEW GREENWICH INSURANCE CO. OBJECTION; FAX FROM S. KORTANEK.	BKD313	.20
05/06/02	SAK	REVIEW SECOND AMENDED AGENDA.	BKD313	.10
05/09/02	SAK	REVIEW CONNECTICUT GENERAL'S RESPONSE TO AM. PAD & PAPERS MOTION.	BKD313	.20

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 7

05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW DEBTORS' OBJECTION TO SAGE CAPITAL CORP'S MOTION TO COMPEL.	BKD313	.10
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW ORDERS RE AM. PAD & PAPER'S MOTION; SHORTEN NOTICE RE SAME	BKD313	.20
05/13/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE UPCOMING VIDEO CONFERENCE: CONFERENCE WITH J. SCOLIARD RE SAME.	BKD313	.20
05/14/02	SAK	REVIEW AMENDED NOTICE OF AGENDA.	BKD313	.10
05/15/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL FROM A. MILES RE PAYMENT OF FEES.	BKD313	.10
05/16/02	SAK	REVIEW CNO RE MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF COMPROMISE WITH NEW HAMPSHIRE.	BKD313	.10
05/17/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL FROM F. ROSNER RE TELEPHONE CONFERENCE; RESPOND.	BKD313	.10
05/17/02	JLS	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COMMITTEE RE: OBJECTION TO DEBTORS' SALE.	BKD313	.40
05/20/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR UPCOMING HEARING.	BKD313	.10
05/20/02	SAK	REVIEW CITY OF CALEXICO'S LIMITED OBJECTION TO SALE MOTION.	BKD313	.10
05/20/02	SAK	REVIEW AMENDED ORDER APPROVING RELIEF FROM STAY FOR NEW HAMPSHIRE.	BKD313	.10
05/21/02	JLS	REVIEW AGENDA.	BKD313	.10
05/29/02	PAM	RETRIEVE COPY OF THE DOCKET PER THE REQUEST OF MARK FELGER	BKD313	.10
05/31/02	SAK	CONFERENCE WITH MEF RE: CASE STATUS.	BKD313	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 8

05/31/02 SAK TELEPHONE CALL TO DEBTOR'S COUNSEL BKD313 .10
RE: UPCOMING HEARING DATES.

TOTAL CASE ADMINISTRATION 6.00 \$1263.00

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 9

CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS

05/07/02 SAK REVIEW AMPLICON MOTION TO COMPEL BKD314 .20
PAYMENT.

TOTAL CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS .20 \$39.00

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 10

FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

04/01/02	GCB	FINALIZING NOTICE RE: 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/01/02	SAK	REVIEW REVISED COZEN FIFTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION NOTICE, EXECUTE (.1); REVIEW REVISED FEE APPLICATION MOTION, EXECUTE (.1); REVISED CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE, EXECUTE (.1).	BKD316	.30
04/01/02	GCB	REVISING 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.10
04/01/02	GCB	FILING 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.30
04/01/02	GCB	FINALIZING EXHIBIT B RE: 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/01/02	GCB	SERVING 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.30
04/01/02	GCB	FINALIZING 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/02/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM F. ROSNER RE: PAYMENT OF FEES; FORWARD INSTRUCTIONS TO PARALEGAL.	BKD316	.20
04/02/02	GCB	SENDING BILLING REQUEST TO B. MEYER IN ACCOUNTING DEPT.	BKD316	.10
04/04/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM ACCOUNTING RE: WIRE TRANSFER.	BKD316	.10
04/04/02	SAK	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO ACCOUNTING FEE APPLICATION INQUIRY.	BKD316	.20
04/04/02	GCB	TC TO J. INTRIERI RE: PAYMENT OF FEES	BKD316	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 11

04/08/02	GCB	FINALIZING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF THELEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/08/02	GCB	SERVING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.20
04/08/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE: CNO FOR THELEN'S FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APP.; FORWARD TO PARALEGAL WITH INSTRUCTIONS.	BKD316	.20
04/08/02	GCB	PREPARING COS RE: CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF THELEN REID	BKD316	.10
04/08/02	GCB	FILING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.20
04/08/02	SAK	REVIEW CNO RE: THELEN REID'S FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APP. AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE.	BKD316	.20
04/08/02	GCB	SENDING COPY OF CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF THELEN TO C. FREEMAN	BKD316	.10
04/08/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL CONFIRMING ELECTRONIC FILING OF THELEN REID'S FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION.	BKD316	.10
04/09/02	GCB	FINALIZING CNO RE: 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/09/02	GCB	FINALIZING COS RE: CNO RE: 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/09/02	GCB	SENDING COPY OF CNO RE: 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP OF COZEN TO C. FREEMAN	BKD316	.10
04/09/02	GCB	FILING CNO RE: 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.20

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 12

04/09/02	GCB	REVISING ORDER RE: COZEN'S 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.10
04/09/02	GCB	SERVING CNO RE: 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.30
04/09/02	GCB	REVIEWING DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO COZEN'S 1ST QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.10
04/16/02	GCB	REVIEWING DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.10
04/16/02	GCB	PREPARING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.20
04/17/02	GCB	FORWARDING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE TO C. FREEMAN FOR HIS REVIEW	BKD316	.10
04/17/02	SAK	REVIEW AND EDIT DELOITTE'S FEE APP CNO; INSTRUCT PARALEGAL TO FORWARD TO C. FREEMAN.	BKD316	.10
04/17/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL FROM PARALEGAL RE DRAFTING FEE APP CNO, RESPOND.	BKD316	.10
04/17/02	GCB	REVISING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.10
04/17/02	GCB	PREPARING 6TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.70
04/18/02	GCB	DRAFTING 6TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.50
04/18/02	GCB	PREPARING CNO RE: 6TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/18/02	GCB	PREPARING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 13

04/19/02	GCB	FILING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.20
04/19/02	GCB	SERVING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.20
04/19/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE CNO FOR D&T'S 4TH FEE APPLICATION; INSTRUCTIONS FOR FILING	BKD316	.20
04/19/02	GCB	FINALIZING CNO RE: 4TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/22/02	GCB	FINALIZING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/23/02	SAK	REVIEW CNO RE COZEN'S 5TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE	BKD316	.10
04/23/02	SAK	REVIEW KUGMAN'S FIRST QUARTER FEE APPLICATION	BKD316	.20
04/23/02	SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF FILING KUGMAN'S 1ST QUARTER FEE APPLICATION	BKD316	.10
04/23/02	GCB	REVIEWING EMAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE: CNO FOR FEE APPS	BKD316	.10
04/23/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE THELEN REID AND DELOITTE'S FEE APPLICATIONS	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	FORWARDING COPY OF CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF THELEN TO C. FREEMAN	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	FILING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.20

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 14

04/24/02	GCB	FINALIZING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF THELEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL TO C. FREEMAN RE FEE APPLICATION	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	SAK	REVIEW CNO RE THELEN'S FIFTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	SAK	REVIEW CNO RE DELOITTE'S 5TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION AND CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	FINALIZING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	PREPARING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	PREPARING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	SERVING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.20
04/24/02	GCB	SERVING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.20
04/24/02	GCB	REVIEWING DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO 5TH MONTHLY FEE APPS OF DELOITTE AND THELEN	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	FORWARDING COPY OF CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE TO C. FREEMAN	BKD316	.10
04/24/02	GCB	FILING CNO RE: 5TH FEE APP OF DELOITTE	BKD316	.20

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 15

04/25/02	GCB	FORWARDING LETTER TO J. INTRIERI RE: PAYMENT OF FEES FOR 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.10
04/25/02	GCB	PREPARING LETTER TO J. INTRIERI RE: PAYMENT OF FEES	BKD316	.10
04/25/02	GCB	REVIEWING PLEADINGS RE: PAYMENT OF FEES FOR 5TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.10
04/30/02	GCB	FORWARDING NEW BANKRUPTCY FILING PROCEDURES TO CO-COUNSEL	BKD316	.10
04/30/02	SAK	REVIEW COZEN'S 6TH MONTHLY FEE APP	BKD316	.30
04/30/02	GCB	PREPARING 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS	BKD316	1.00
04/30/02	GCB	RESEARCHING DOCKET RE: FEE APPS OF THELEN REID FOR 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.30
04/30/02	GCB	REVISING 6TH FEE APP OF COZEN FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
04/30/02	GCB	RESEARCHING DOCKET RE: FEE APPLICATIONS OF DELOITTE & TOUCHE FOR 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.30
04/30/02	GCB	SENDING MESSAGE TO CO-COUNSEL RE: 6TH FEE APPS OF DELOITTE AND THELEN	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	TC TO C. FREEMAN RE: 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	MEETING WITH F. ROSNER RE: 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	TC TO K. SIMON RE: 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP (DELOITTE)	BKD316	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 16

05/01/02	GCB	FILING 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	FINALIZING 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	REVISING 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS	BKD316	.20
05/01/02	GCB	REVISING 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS	BKD316	.30
05/01/02	GCB	MEETING WITH S. KINSELLA RE: 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.20
05/01/02	SAK	REVIEW MANDEL RESNIK'S 7TH INTERIM FEE APP.	BKD316	.30
05/01/02	GCB	FORWARDING COPY OF 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS TO C. FREEMAN AND M. BUNIN	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	SERVING 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP OF PROFESSIONALS	BKD316	.20
05/01/02	SAK	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM C. FREEMAN RE QUARTERLY FEE APPLICATION; CONFERENCE WITH PARALEGAL RE SAME.	BKD316	.20
05/01/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL NOTICE CONFIRMING FILING OF 2ND QUARTER FEE APPLICATION.	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	SAK	REVIEW REVISED COMMITTEE FEE APPLICATION.	BKD316	.10
05/01/02	GCB	REVIEWING 6TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 17

05/01/02	SAK	REVIEW COMMITTEE'S 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APPLICATION AND ATTACHMENTS, EDIT.	BKD316	.20
05/09/02	SAK	REVIEW MANDEL RESNIK'S 1ST QTR. FEE APP.	BKD316	.20
05/09/02	SAK	REVIEW MANDEL RESNIK'S 2ND QTR. FEE APP.	BKD316	.10
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW CNO RE WALKER TRUESDELL'S 6TH MONTHLY FEE APP.	BKD316	.10
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW PACHULSKI'S 7TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	BKD316	.20
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW THIRD INTERIM FEE APP FILED ON BEHALF OF KUGMAN ASSOC.	BKD316	.20
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW AMENDED 2ND QTR. FEE APP FOR COMMITTEE.	BKD316	.20
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW WALKER TRUESDELL'D 7TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	BKD316	.20
05/10/02	SAK	REVIEW PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPER'S 2ND QTR FEE APP.	BKD316	.30
05/10/02	GCB	FINALIZING AMENDED 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP FOR FILING	BKD316	.10
05/10/02	GCB	SERVING AMENDED 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.20
05/10/02	GCB	FORWARDING COPY OF CNO RE: 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP TO C. FREEMAN	BKD316	.10
05/10/02	GCB	FILING AMENDED 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APP	BKD316	.20
05/14/02	GCB	MEETING WITH A. MILES RE: PAYMENT OF FEES LETTERS	BKD316	.10

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 18

05/17/02	GCB	REVIEWING DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO 6TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.10
05/17/02	GCB	REVIEWING DOCKET RE: OBJECTIONS TO COZEN'S 6TH FEE APP	BKD316	.10
05/17/02	GCB	REVISING CNO RE: 6TH FEE APP OF COZEN	BKD316	.10
05/17/02	GCB	PREPARING CNO RE: 6TH FEE APP OF THELEN	BKD316	.10
05/20/02	SAK	REVIEW E-MAIL FROM C. FREEMAN/F. ROSNER RE: COMMITTEE'S FEE APP.	BKD316	.10
05/21/02	JLS	DRAFT ORDERS ON QUARTERLY FEE APPS.	BKD316	.30
05/22/02	JLS	PREPARE ORDER ON 2ND QUARTERLY FEE APPLICATION FOR COMMITTEE PROFESSIONALS; DRAFT LETTER TO JUDGE RE: SAME	BKD316	.60
05/23/02	SAK	REVIEW EMAIL NOTICE OF CNO FILED RE COMMITTEE'S FEE APPLICATION AND AMENDED FEE APPLICATIONS.	BKD316	.10
05/23/02	SAK	REVIEW ROBERT C. GOTTLIEB'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APP.	BKD316	.20
05/27/02	SAK	REVIEW ORDER RE KUGMAN'S 1ST QTR. FEE APP.	BKD316	.10
05/27/02	SAK	REVIEW KUGMAN'S 2ND QTR. FEE APP (PARTS I & II)	BKD316	.20
05/27/02	SAK	REVIEW MOTION TO EMPLOY PROFESSIONALS.	BKD316	.20
05/27/02	SAK	REVIEW MANDEL RESNIK'S 8TH MONTHLY FEE APP.	BKD316	.30

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 19

05/28/02 SAK	REVIEW CNO RE PWC'S 6TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION.	BKD316	.10
05/28/02 SAK	REVIEW THELEN'S SEVENTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION.	BKD316	.10
05/29/02 JLS	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CO-COUNSEL RE: DELOITTE & TOUCHE FEE APPLICATION; PREPARE CNO FOR SAME	BKD316	.40

TOTAL FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS		19.80	\$2809.50
-----------------------------------	--	-------	-----------

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 20

LITIGATION

04/03/02	SAK	ATTEND OMNIBUS HEARING.	BKD319	1.90	
04/17/02	SAK	ATTEND TELEPHONIC HEARING.	BKD319	2.20	
05/06/02	SAK	ATTEND HEARING RE: BRASCAN SALE ORDER.	BKD319	2.50	
05/22/02	JLS	ATTEND HEARING ON BIDDING PROCEDURES FOR SALE TO CASCADE AND OTHER MATTERS	BKD319	3.60	
05/29/02	SAK	REVIEW SAGE'S REPLY TO OBJECTION TO COMPLY WITH STIPULATION.	BKD319	.20	
TOTAL LITIGATION				10.40	\$2082.00

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 21

RELIEF FROM STAY PROCEEDINGS

04/11/02 SAK	REVIEW FACTORY MUTUAL INSURANCE COMPANY'S MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY AND ATTACHMENTS.	BKD321	.20	
04/22/02 SAK	REVIEW FACTORY MUTUAL INSURANCE CO.'S OPPOSITION FOR REQUEST FOR EVIDENTIARY HEARING AND COPY OF LETTER TO JUDGE RE SAME.	BKD321	.10	
05/01/02 SAK	REVIEW NOTICE OF WITHDRAWAL RE PFSA 362 MOTION.	BKD321	.10	
05/23/02 SAK	REVIEW CITY OF BERLIN'S WITHDRAWAL OF LIMITED RESPONSE TO CITICAPITAL'S RELIEF FROM STAY MOTION.	BKD321	.10	
05/29/02 SAK	REVIEW ORDER GRANTING CITICAPITAL'S RELIEF FROM STAY MOTION.	BKD321	.10	
TOTAL RELIEF FROM STAY PROCEEDINGS			.60	\$117.00

COMMITTEE / AMERICAN TISSUE
FILE NUMBER: 117939.001
INVOICE NO.: *****

Jun 27, 2002

PAGE 22

ACTIVITY RECAP

	HOURS	AMOUNT
ASSET DISPOSITION	5.90	1,200.50
CASE ADMINISTRATION	6.00	1,263.00
CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS	.20	39.00
FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS	19.80	2,809.50
LITIGATION	10.40	2,082.00
RELIEF FROM STAY PROCEEDINGS	.60	117.00
TOTALS	<u>42.90</u>	<u>7,511.00</u>

%%EOF