

# BABCHIK & YOUNG

|            |      |          |  |
|------------|------|----------|--|
| 03/02/2000 | 1255 | No Image | Application By Debtor Greate Bay Hotel and Casino, Inc. To Employ Special Counsel (Babchik and Young, LLP) For Post-Petition Personal Injury Actions and Other Matters, <b>Nunc Pro Tunc To 1/21/00</b> , filed by James N. Lawlor, Esquire. [Date Entered: 03/03/2000, By: jpp] |
|------------|------|----------|--|

|            |      |          |   |
|------------|------|----------|---|
| 07/28/2000 | 1560 | No Image | Application By Babchik and Young, LLP (Special Counsel) For Allowance Of Compensation (Fees: <b>\$1,771.00</b> ) For The Period From 2/11/00 Through 6/13/00. [Date Entered: 07/31/2000, By: jpp] |
|------------|------|----------|---|

LABCHIK & YOUNG, LLP  
342 MADISON AVENUE  
NEW YORK, NEW YORK 10173  
TEL 212 681-8551 FAX 212 681-8553

Invoice #99720

07/17/00

Sands Hotel & Casino  
Indiana Avenue and Brighton Park  
Atlantic City NJ 08401  
Attn: Phyllis LeTart, Esq.

RE: Robert Fede v. Sands Hotel Casino  
D/I : 10/9/98  
Oliver File NO.: SAN 98-576  
-----

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED:

|          |  | <u>Hours</u> |
|----------|--|--------------|
| 02/11/00 | JB Receive and review summons and complaint - new assignment   | 0.10         |
|          | JB Prepare answer to the complaint   | 0.80         |
|          | JB Correspondence to Sands and Oliver acknowledging the retainer and request information on Rule 1.9 information | 0.20         |
|          | JB Review medical records and investigations and prepare chronology[ize]   | 1.50         |
| 02/15/00 | JB Review and summerize hospital records and reports   | 1.00         |
|          | JB Review Bd of Health investigation and reports   | 0.30         |
| 02/16/00 | JB Prepare interrogatories and other notices and demands   | 1.00         |
| 02/22/00 | JB Correspondence from Oliver & Co., regarding settlement  | 0.10         |
|          | JB Correspondence from plaintiff's attorney regarding conference   | 0.10         |
| 02/29/00 | JB Telephone call from Oliver & Co., regarding underlying liability and settlement value                         | 0.20         |
| 05/09/00 | JB Telephone call to Sands regarding conference, exposure and settlement authorization                           | 0.10         |

1560.

|                       |   | <u>Hours</u> |                             |
|-----------------------|---|--------------|-----------------------------|
| 05/09/00              | JB Telephone call from plaintiff's attorney regarding conference  | 0.10         |                             |
|                       | JB Review file and medical records - prepare for conference   | 0.30         |                             |
| 05/10/00              | JB Court appearance EDNY Mag-Judge Azrack for conference  | 2.30         |                             |
|                       | JB Report to Sands and Oliver & Co.,  | 0.20         |                             |
|                       | JB Telephone call from Sands regarding conference and further handling of the action  | 0.10         |                             |
| 05/11/00              | HET Telephone call to plaintiff's attorney regarding medical authorizations   | 0.20         |                             |
|                       | HET Receive and review plaintiff's responses to defendant's first set of interrogatories  | 0.60         |                             |
| 05/25/00              | JB Receive and review order from and rules of court regarding arbitration   | 0.20         |                             |
| 05/30/00              | HET Receive and review notice setting arbitration hearing from Arbitration Clerk USDC/EDNY  | 0.10         |                             |
|                       | HET Receive and review notice designating case for court annexed arbitration from Arbitration Clerk USDC/EDNY   | 0.20         |                             |
|                       | HET Correspondence to Arbitration Clerk regarding notice setting arbitration hearing  | 0.30         |                             |
| 05/31/00              | HET Telephone call from plaintiff's attorney regarding medical and hospital authorizations  | 0.10         |                             |
| 06/04/00              | JB Correspondence to Sands regarding arbitration  | 0.10         |                             |
| 06/13/00              | GTO Draft correspondence including authorizations to Drs. Daw, Sack-Berg, Sokal, O'Lear, Genevese Pharmacy, Medical Arts and Dr. Bernling to obtain copies of plaintiff's medical records | 0.70         |                             |
| TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES: |   | 10.90        | <u>Amount</u><br>\$1,771.00 |
| TOTAL BALANCE DUE:    |   |              | <u>\$1,771.00</u>           |