

Exhibit B  
Docket #: 1016

# **EXHIBIT B**

**FOCAL COMMUNICATIONS CORP., INC., et al.,**  
**EXHIBIT "B" SUMMARY SHEET**  
 June 1, 2003 Through and Including June 30, 2003

<b>PROJECT BILLING CATEGORY</b>	<b>HOURS</b>	<b>VALUE</b>
Asset Disposition	12.4	\$5,138.00
Case Administration	24.0	\$5,542.50
Claims Administration	12.1	\$5,128.00
Other Professionals Fee/Employment Applications	13.7	\$3,663.00
Fee - Employment Objections	0.4	\$168.50
Litigation	6.7	\$2,459.00
Meeting of Creditors	2.6	\$1,005.00
Plan and Disclosure Statement	32.4	\$12,945.00
Klett Rooney Fee Applications	6.0	\$975.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	110.3	\$37,024.00

<b>TOTAL COMPENSATION DUE:</b>	\$37,024.00
<b>TOTAL HOURS:</b>	110.3
<b>BLENDED RATE:</b>	\$335.67

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-003  
INVOICE :      159653

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      ASSET DISPOSITION

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO ASSUME/REJECT REAL PROPERTY LEASES.	.20
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO REJECT CERTAIN AT&T, SOUTHERN CAL AND TIME WARNER CONTRACTS.	.20
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW 4TH NOTICE OF REJECTION OF SBC CIRCUITS.	.10
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW 4TH NOTICE OF REJECTION OF VERIZON CIRCUITS.	.10
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' THIRD NOTICE OF REJECTION OF CIRCUITS.	.10
06/02/03	TC	REVIEWED INITIAL OBJECTION OF ILLINOIS BELL ET AL TO MOTION TO REJECT CIRCUITS	.50
06/02/03	TC	REVIEWED BELLSOUTH OBJECTION TO MOTION TO REJECT CIRCUITS	.40
06/03/03	MFC	REVIEW SBC INITIAL OBJECTION TO REJECTION MOTION.	.10
06/03/03	MFC	REVIEW ILLINOIS BELL INITIAL OBJECTION TO 2ND NOTICE OF REJECTION.	.20
06/04/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO ASSUME AMENDED REAL PROPERTY LEASES IN CHICAGO, DETROIT, NEW YORK AND DALLAS.	.20
06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW NORTEL'S OBJECTION TO SALE OF SURPLUS ASSETS.	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-003  
INVOICE :      159653

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      ASSET DISPOSITION

06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO REJECT QWEST PRICING PLAN CONTRACT.	.20
06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW TELELEC OBJECTION TO SALE OF GATEWAY ASSETS	.10
06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO REJECT CERTAIN BELLSOUTH CONTRACTS.	.40
06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO REJECT BELLSOUTH PRICING PLAN CONTRACT.	.20
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO AUTHORIZE REJECTION OF BELLSOUTH CONTRACTS	.40
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO REJECT QWEST CONTRACTS	.30
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED SETTLEMENT WITH SBC ILEC	.50
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO REJECT BELLSOUTH CONTRACTS	.40
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED CALIFORNIA EDISON OBJECTION TO REJECTION MOTION	.30
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED TEKELEC OBJECTION TO MOTION TO SELL ASSETS	.30
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED NORTEL OBJECTION TO MOTION TO SELL ASSETS	.40
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW SOUTHERN CAL. OBJECTION TO MOTION TO SHORTEN NOTICE OF REJECTION MOTION.	.20
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW OHIO BELL OBJECTION TO 4TH REJECTION NOTICE.	.10
06/10/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO APPROVE VERIZON STIPULATION	.40

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-003  
INVOICE :      159653

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      ASSET DISPOSITION

06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW AMENDED NOTICE OF 365(D) (4) MOTION.	.10
06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW MOTION RE VERIZON SETTLEMENT AND CONTRACT ASSUMPTIONS.	.30
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER REJECTING EXECUTORY CONTRACTS	.20
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED PROPOSED SETTLEMENT WITH NTFC	.30
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER RE REJECTION OF LEASES	.20
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED INITIAL OBJECTION OF OHIO BELL TO REJECTION NOTICES	.40
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED NOTICE OF STIPULATION WITH KINCO REDHILL	.20
06/13/03	TC	SETTLEMENT STIPULATION WITH AT&T	.30
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED SETTLEMENT WITH QWEST FILED UNDER SEAL	.40
06/16/03	MFC	REVIEW STIP WITH SOUTHERN CAL RE REJECTION OF CERTAIN CONTRACTS.	.20
06/16/03	MFC	REVIEW SEMEX RESPONSE TO 365(D) (4) MOTION.	.10
06/16/03	TC	REVIEWED STIPULATION WITH SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON	.40
06/16/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO EXTEND TIME TO ASSUME OR REJECT LEASES	.40
06/17/03	MFC	REVIEW QUEST OBJECTION TO REJECTION MOTION.	.30
06/17/03	TC	REVIEWED OBJECTION OF QWEST TO MOTION TO REJECT QWEST CONTRACTS	.40

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-003  
INVOICE :      159653

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      ASSET DISPOSITION

06/17/03 TC	REVIEWED RESPONSE OF SEMEX TO MOTION FOR ORDER EXTENDING TIME TO ASSUME OR REJECT LEASES	.40
06/24/03 MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO APPROVE ASSUMPTION OF CERTAIN BELL SOUTH CONTRACTS.	.30
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER AUTHORIZING DEBTOR TO AMEND ASSUMED LEASES	.10
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER EXTENDING TIME TO ASSUME OR REJECT LEASES AND CONTRACTS	.10
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED STIPULATION RESOLVING TEKELEC DISPUTES OVER EQUIPMENT	.50
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING SALE OF MISCELLANEOUS SURPLUS ASSETS	.20
06/30/03 MFC	REVIEW CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL RE MOTION TO SELL CERTAIN ASSETS TO INFORAMP.	.20

## T I M E   S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	4.00	1400.00
T CURRIER	445.00	8.40	3738.00
TOTALS		12.40	5138.00

TOTAL FEES :      5,138.00

TOTAL DUE :      5,138.00

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-005  
INVOICE :      159654

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CASE ADMINISTRATION

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NOTICES RECEIVED.	.20
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO.	.10
06/02/03	RTT	UPDATE AND CIRCULATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.30
06/02/03	RTT	UPDATE DOCKET	.10
06/03/03	MFC	REVIEW AGENDA FOR FOR 6/9 HEARING.	.20
06/04/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. GOLD RE TOMORROW'S HEARING AND UST'S OBJECTION TO CTA.	.10
06/04/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NOTICES RECEIVED.	.10
06/04/03	RTT	SET UP EMAIL NOTIFICATION WITH BANKRUTPCY COURT RE AFERANTE@AKINGUMP.COM	.20
06/05/03	MFC	CONFERENCE WITH R. TAYLOR RE 6/9 HEARING BINDER.	.10
06/05/03	RTT	UPDATE AND REVIEW DOCKET	.20
06/05/03	RTT	DONWLOAD, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE NOTICE OF AGENDA FOR MATTERS SCHEDULED ON 6/9/03 AT 2:00 P.M.	.30
06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW PLEADINGS IN PREPARATION FOR MONDAY'S HEARING.	.50
06/06/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NTOICES RECEIVED.	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-005  
INVOICE :      159654

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CASE ADMINISTRATION

06/06/03	RTT	REVIEW SEVERAL EMAIL NOTIFICATIONS	.20
06/06/03	RTT	PREPARE HEARING FILE RE 6/9/03 HEARING AND DISTRIBUTE TO M.CALOWAY	1.70
06/06/03	RTT	REVIEW EMAIL NOTIFICATIONS	.20
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED AGENDA FOR HEARING 6/9	.30
06/08/03	TC	REVIEWED AGENDA FOR FOCAL HEARING 6/9	.40
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW AMENDED AGENDA FOR TODAY'S HEARING.	.10
06/09/03	MFC	ATTEND OMNIBUS HEARING.	1.60
06/09/03	MFC	TRAVEL TO AND FROM PHILA. HEARING (HALF TIME).	1.00
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO.	.10
06/09/03	RTT	REVIEW SEVERAL E-FILING NOTIFICATIONS	.20
06/09/03	RTT	REVIEW INCOMING PLEADINGS	.10
06/09/03	RTT	UPDATE DOCKET	.10
06/09/03	RTT	UPDATE AND CIRCULATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.60
06/09/03	RTT	DOWNLOAD AND REVIEW AMENDED AGENDA RE 6/9/03 HEARING	.20
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NOTICES RECEIVED.	.10
06/10/03	PJD	REVIEW AND CONSIDER RECENTLY FILED PLEADINGS	1.00
06/10/03	RTT	FILE MAINTENANCE	.40
06/11/03	RTT	REVIEW SEVERAL EMAIL NOTIFICATIONS	.20



# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-005  
INVOICE :      159654

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CASE ADMINISTRATION

06/12/03	MFC	EMAILS FROM AND TO J. GOLD RE TODAY;S TELEPHONIC HEARING (.1); REVIEW LETTER TO JUDGE AND CALL IN INSTRUCTIONS FOR SAME (.1).	.20
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW OMNIBUS NOTICE RE 6/19 HEARING.	.10
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NOTICES RECEIVED.	.10
06/12/03	MFC	E-MAILS FROM AND TO J. GOLD RE MONDAY'S TELEPHONIC HEARING.	.10
06/12/03	RTT	DOWNLOAD NOTICE OF HEARING RE LOCATION OF 6/19/03 HEARING	.10
06/16/03	MFC	E-MAILS FROM AND TO J. GOLD AND DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE TODAY'S TELEPHONIC STATUS HEARING.	.20
06/16/03	MFC	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO.	.10
06/16/03	MFC	REVIEW UST OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO DEBTORS' MOTION TO FILE STIPS UNDER SEAL.	.20
06/16/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NOTICES RECEIVED.	.20
06/16/03	PJD	CORRESPONDENCE RE HEARING CONVERGENCE (.2); REVIEW PLEADINGS GOING FORWARD (.8).	1.00
06/16/03	RTT	UPDATE AND REVIEW DOCKET	.20
06/16/03	RTT	UPDATE AND CIRCULATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.30
06/17/03	MFC	REVIEW AGENDA FOR 6/19 HEARING.	.20
06/17/03	MFC	REVIEW AGENDA FOR 6/23 HEARING.	.10
06/17/03	RTT	UPDATE AND REVIEW DOCKET	.20

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-005  
INVOICE :      159654

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CASE ADMINISTRATION

06/17/03	RTT	DONWLOAD, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE AGENDA FOR 6/23/03	.20
06/17/03	RTT	FILE MAINTENANCE	.40
06/17/03	RTT	REVIEW EMAIL NOTIFICATIONS	.10
06/17/03	RTT	DONWLOAD, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE AGENDA FOR 6/19/03	.20
06/17/03	TC	REVIEWED AGENDA NOTICE FOR HEARINGS 6/19 AND 6/20	.50
06/18/03	PJD	REVIEW AND CONSIDER CORRESPONDENCE FROM INTERESTED PARTIES REGARDING HEARING	.20
06/18/03	RTT	UPDATE AND REVIEW DOCKET	.20
06/18/03	RTT	PREPARE HEARING FILE RE 6/19/03 HEARING (.8); DISCUSSION WITH T.CURRIER RE SAME (.2)	1.00
06/18/03	RTT	REVIEW EMAIL FROM T.CURRIER RE COVERAGE OF FOCAL HEARINGS FOR THE WEEK OF 6/16/03	.10
06/18/03	RTT	REVIEW E-FILING NOTIFICATIONS	.10
06/18/03	TC	STAFFING ATTENDANCE AT HEARINGS	.30
06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED HEARING AGENDA FOR MONDAY'S HEARING	.40
06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO FILE BELL SOUTH DEAL UNDER SEAL	.20
06/19/03	PJD	CONFERENCES AND CORRESPONDENCE TO INTERESTED PARTIES RE: HEARING COVERAGE	.20
06/19/03	RTT	REVIEW E-FILING NOTIFICATIONS	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-005  
INVOICE :      159654

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CASE ADMINISTRATION

06/19/03	RTT	DONWLOAD, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE AMENEDED AGENDA RE 6/19/03 HEARING	.30
06/20/03	PJL	CORRESPONDENCE RELATING TO 6/20 HEARING	.10
06/20/03	RTT	DISCUSSION WITH P.DUHIG RE MATTERS NEED FOR HEARING RE 6/23/03	.10
06/20/03	RTT	ASSIST IN PREPARATION OF HEARING FILE FOR 6/23/03	.40
06/23/03	PJL	ATTEND HEARING (1.0); REVIEW AND CONSIDER MATTERS GOING FORWARD (.7).	1.70
06/23/03	RTT	REVIEW SEVERAL E-FILING NOTIFICATIONS	.20
06/23/03	RTT	UPDATE AND REVIEW DOCKET	.20
06/23/03	RTT	UPDATE AND DISTRIBUTE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.20
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO.	.10
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW AGENDA FOR 6/23 HEARING.	.10
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO FILE CERTAIN BELL SOUTH STIP UNDER SEAL.	.20
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND ENOTICES RECEIVED.	.20
06/25/03	MFC	REVIEW AKIN MEMORANDUM RE CASE STATUS.	.20
06/25/03	RTT	REVIEW E-FILING NOTIFICATIONS	.20
06/26/03	RTT	REVIEW E-FILING NOTIFICATIONS	.20
06/30/03	MFC	REVIEW UPDATED CRITICAL DATES MEMO.	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-005  
INVOICE :      159654

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CASE ADMINISTRATION

06/30/03	MFC	REVIEW SIGNED ORDERS RECEIVED FROM DEBTORS' COUNSEL.	.20
06/30/03	MFC	REVIEW MISCELLANEOUS PLEADINGS AND E-NOTICES RECEIVED.	.20
06/30/03	RTT	UPATE AND REVIEW DOCKET	.10
06/30/03	RTT	UPDATE AND CIRCULATE CRITICAL DATES MEMO	.30
06/30/03	RTT	REVIEW SEVERAL E-FILING NOTIFCATIONS	.20

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

-----

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	7.10	2485.00
P J DUHIG	190.00	4.20	798.00
R T TAYLOR	125.00	10.60	1325.00
T CURRIER	445.00	2.10	934.50
TOTALS		24.00	5542.50

TOTAL FEES :      5,542.50

TOTAL DUE :      5,542.50

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-006  
INVOICE :      159655

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION & OBJECTIONS

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW NOTICES OF SUBMISSION OF PROOFS OF CLAIM IN CONNECTION WITH OMNIBUS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS.	.10
06/02/03	TC	REVIEWED CABLE AND WIRELESS RESPONSE TO SUBSTANTIVE CLAIMS OBJECTIONS	.30
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE MASSACHUSETTS OBJECTION TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS	.30
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED OBJECTION TO CLAIM OF BELLSOUTH	.40
06/08/03	TC	REVIEWED TEXAS COMPTROLLER RESPONSE TO CLAIMS OBJECTION	.30
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW RESPONSE FROM M. STEVENS RE CLAIM OBJECTION.	.30
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW B. GLATT RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW COUNTY OF SANTA CLARA'S RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.20
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW MASS. DEPT. OF REVENUE RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW GEORGIA DEPT. OF REVENUE RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED WORLDCOM RESPONSE TO CLAIMS OBJECTION	.40
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW DALLAS COUNTY RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-006  
INVOICE :      159655

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION & OBJECTIONS

06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW SOUTHWEST BELL'S RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW STARNET RESPONSES TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.20
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW TEXAS COMPTROLLER'S SECOND RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED STARNET RESPONSE TO CLAIMS OBJECTION	.30
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED TEXAS COMPTROLLER SECOND RESPONSE TO CLAIMS OBJECTION	.30
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED JOINT RESPONSE OF TEXAS COUNTIES TO CLAIMS OBJECTIONS	.30
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED STIP WITH AT&T	.30
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED SANTA CLARA RESPONSE TO CLAIMS OBJECTION	.20
06/13/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF QWEST SETTLEMENT AND FILE SAME UNDER SEAL.	.30
06/13/03	MFC	REVIEW IRS RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/13/03	MFC	REVIEW M. FERANDEZ RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/13/03	MFC	REVIEW COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA'S RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/13/03	MFC	REVIEW UNIVERSAL SERVICE ADMINISTRATIVE COMPANY'S MOTION FOR ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM.	.30
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED CLAIMS OBJECTION RESPONSE FILED BY MICHAEL STEVENS FOR LOST WAGES	.40

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-006  
INVOICE :      159655

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION & OBJECTIONS

06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED UNIVERSAL MOTION FOR IMMEDIATE PAYMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE CLAIM	.40
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED GEORGIA DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE'S RESPONSE TO DEBTORS' CLAIM OBJECTION	.30
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED UNITED STATES RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION OF GOVERNMENTAL UNITS	.30
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED NOTICE OF MOTION RE QWEST SETTLEMENT	.40
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED MANUEL FERNANDEZ LETTER	.30
06/13/03	TC	REVIEWED COMMONWEALTH DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE RESPONSE TO 5TH CLAIM OBJECTION	.30
06/15/03	TC	REVIEWED STIP RESOLVING CLAIM OF SOUTHERN EDISON	.40
06/16/03	MFC	REVIEW PROOFS OF CLAIM RECEIVED.	.30
06/16/03	TC	REVIEWED BARBARA GLATT INFORMAL OBJECTION	.20
06/16/03	TC	REVIEWED OBJECTION OF THE UNITED STATES TO SEAL MOTION WITH SBC AND REJECTION MOTIONS	.30
06/17/03	MFC	REVIEW W. CHIONIS RESPONSE TO CLAIM OBJECTION.	.10
06/17/03	TC	REVIEWED RESPONSE OF WILLIAM CHIONIS TO 6TH CLAIM OBJECTION	.30
06/24/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING VERIZON SETTLEMENT	.20
06/24/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING REJECTION OF SBC ILECS CONTRACTS	.10
06/24/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING COMMONWEALTH OF PA STIPULATION	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-006  
INVOICE :      159655

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION & OBJECTIONS

06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED DUGAN STIPULATION	.10
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED UNIVERSAL SERVICE ORDER	.10
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED GO2CALL SETTLEMENT	.20
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING BELLSOUTH SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT	.20
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER GRANTING 7TH CLAIM OBJECTION	.20
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED STIPULATION OF SOUTHERN CALIFORNIA EDISON	.40
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER GRANTING 4TH CLAIM OBJECTION	.20
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER GRANTING 6TH CLAIM OBJECTION	.20
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING AT&T STIPULATION	.20
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED STIPULATION RESOLVING ADEQUATE ASSURANCE OBJECTION OF QWEST	.20
06/26/03 TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING CLAIMS OBJECTIONS AS TO GOVERNMENTAL UNITS	.30

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	2.70	945.00
T CURRIER	445.00	9.40	4183.00
TOTALS		12.10	5128.00



# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-006  
INVOICE :      159655

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION & OBJECTIONS

TOTAL FEES :      5,128.00

TOTAL DUE :      5,128.00

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-008  
INVOICE :      159656

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW AND EXECUTE AKIN'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION REQUEST.	.10
06/02/03	RTT	E-FILE AND SERVE AKIN GUMP'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION REQUEST	.60
06/02/03	RTT	EMAIL TO AND FROM M.CALOWAY RE FILING OF AKIN GUMP'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION REQUEST	.10
06/03/03	MFC	REVIEW NOTICE OF FILING OF THIRD AMENDED EXHIBIT TO ORDINARY COURSE PROFESSIONAL MOTION.	.20
06/03/03	MFC	E-MAILS FROM AND TO J. GOLD RE AKIN FEE APP ISSUES.	.20
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW PSZYJW MARCH FEE APPLICATION.	.30
06/16/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO TERESA CURRIER AND R. TAYLOR RE CNO FOR AKIN AND KRLS FEE APPLICATIONS.	.10
06/16/03	RTT	EMAIL FROM M.CALOWAY RE CNO'S AKIN AND KRLS FEE APPLICATIONS	.10
06/16/03	TC	REVIEWED PACHULSKI FEE APPLICATION	.30
06/17/03	MFC	REVIEW SWIDLER BERLIN APRIL FEE APPLICATION.	.30
06/17/03	TC	REVIEWED SWIDLER BERLIN APPLICATION	.30
06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED MILLER BUCKFIRE FEE APPLICATION	.40
06/20/03	RTT	REVIEW DOCKET FOR OBJECTIONS TO FEE APPLICATIONS	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-008  
INVOICE :      159656

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

06/20/03	RTT	EMAIL TO T.CURRIER RE OBJECTION DEADLINE TO FEE APPLICATIONS	.10
06/20/03	RTT	PREPARE AND E-FILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE RE NO ORDER CERTIFICATES OF NO OBJECTIONS FILED TO KRLS THIRD AND AKIN'S THIRD AND FOURTH FEE APPLICATIONS	.50
06/20/03	RTT	DRAFT NO ORDER REQUIRED CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTIONS TO AKIN GUMP'S THIRD AND FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	.60
06/20/03	RTT	E-FILE AND SERVE NO ORDER REQUIRED CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTIONS TO AKIN GUMP'S THIRD AND FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS	.80
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW E&Y MARCH FEE APPLICATION.	.30
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW VALUATION RESEARCH CORP.'S APRIL/MAY FEE APPLICATION.	.30
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW MILLER BUCKFIRE APRIL FEE APPLICATION.	.30
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW PSZYJW APRIL FEE APPLICATION	.30
06/24/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER RETAINING DELOITTE	.10
06/25/03	MFC	REVIEW VALUATION RESEARCH'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	.20
06/25/03	MFC	REVIEW KIRKLAND'S APRIL FEE APPLICATION.	.30
06/25/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO M. STAMER RE AKIN'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION REQUEST.	.10
06/25/03	RTT	REVIEW EMAIL FROM M.CALOWAY RE OBJECTION DEADLINE TO AKIN'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION REQUEST	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-008  
INVOICE :      159656

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

06/26/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. STAMER RE AKIN'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION.	.10
06/26/03	MFC	REVIEW NOTICE OF FIRST QUARTERLY FEE APPLICATION HEARING.	.20
06/26/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE NOTICE OF FEE APPLICATION HEARING.	.10
06/26/03	RTT	DONWLOAD, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE NOTICE OF FIRST QUARTERLY FEE HEARING (.2); DISCUSSION WITH M.CALOWAY RE SAME (.1)	.30
06/26/03	RTT	DRAFT CERTIFICATION OF NO OBJECTION TO AKIN GUMP'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.40
06/26/03	RTT	REVIEW DOCKET RE OBJECTION D/L TO AKIN'S FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLICATION	.10
06/26/03	TC	REVIEWED VALUATION RESEARCH FEE APPLICATION	.30
06/27/03	MFC	REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT CTA FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION AND PREPARE ANCILLARY DOCUMENTS (2.4); NUMEROUS EMAILS FROM AND TO J. GOLD RE SAME (.3).	2.70
06/27/03	MFC	REVIEW AMENDED NOTICE OF QUARTERLY FEE APPLICATION HEARING.	.20
06/27/03	RTT	PREPARE E-FILING RE FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION OF CTA	.60
06/27/03	RTT	DISCUSSION WITH M.CALOWAY RE FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION OF CTA	.10
06/27/03	RTT	EMAIL FROM M.CALOWAY RE ORDER APPROVING CTA RETENTION APPLICATION	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-008  
INVOICE :      159656

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS

06/30/03	MFC	EMAILS FROM AND TO J. GOLD RE CTA'S FINAL FEE APPLICATION.	.20
06/30/03	RTT	CALENDAR OBJECTION DEADLINE RE CTA'S FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION	.10
06/30/03	RTT	DOWNLOAD, REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE ORDER APPROVING AMENDED NOTICE OF FIRST QUARTERLY FEE HEARING	.30
06/30/03	TC	REVIEWED AMENDED INTERIM FEE NOTICE, NOW INCLUDING KLETT ROONEY	.20
06/30/03	VM	PREPARE AND E-FILE AFFIDAVITS OF SERVICE REF. CTA'S FIRST AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION	.60

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	6.50	2275.00
R T TAYLOR	125.00	5.00	625.00
T CURRIER	445.00	1.60	712.00
V MINOR	85.00	.60	51.00
TOTALS		13.70	3663.00

TOTAL FEES :      3,663.00

TOTAL DUE :      3,663.00

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-009  
INVOICE :      159657

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      FEE/EMPLOYMENT OBJECTIONS

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
06/03/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO J. GOLD RE STATUS OF CTA RETENTION APP.	.10
06/03/03	TC	REVIEWED USTRUSTEE OBJECTION TO JOINT APPLICATION TO RETAIN CTA	.30

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
M F CALOWAY	350.00	.10	35.00
T CURRIER	445.00	.30	133.50
TOTALS		.40	168.50
TOTAL FEES :			168.50
TOTAL DUE :			168.50

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-011  
INVOICE :      159658

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      LITIGATION

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/02/03	MFC	TELEPHONIC HEARING ON DISCOVERY DISPUTES.	.60
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW BELLSOUTH NOTICE OF SERVICE OF DISCOVERY RESPONSES.	.10
06/03/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' OBJECTION TO ATX DEFENDANTS' MOTION TO COMPEL AND EXTEND TIME.	.20
06/05/03	MFC	TELEPHONIC HEARING ON VERIZON DISCOVERY DISPUTES AND STATUS UPDATE..	.30
06/05/03	MFC	REVIEW FAX FROM J. GOLD RE TODAY'S TELEPHONIC DISCOVERY DISPUTE HEARING.	.10
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION FOR APPROVAL OF SBC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT.	.30
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW SBC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (FILED UNDER SEAL) .	.40
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO FILE SBC SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT UNDER SEAL.	.20
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW SUMMARY ADJUDICATION PLEADINGS FILED IN ATX LITIGATION.	.70
06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW ADDITIONAL PLEADINGS FILED IN CONNECTION WITH ATX LITIGATION.	.50
06/11/03	TC	BRIEFLY REVIEWED FOCAL PLEADINGS IN PA SUMMARY JUDGMENT ACTION	.50

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-011  
INVOICE :      159658

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      LITIGATION

06/13/03 MFC	REVIEW NOTICE OF OMNIBUS STIPULATION WITH BELLSOUTH RE PRODUCTION AND USE OF CONFIDENTIAL MATERIALS.	.20
06/13/03 MFC	REVIEW STIP WITH AT&T RESOLVING CERTAIN DISPUTES.	.20
06/13/03 MFC	REVIEW STIP WITH KINCO REALTY RESOLVING CERTAIN DISPUTES AND E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO DEBTORS' COUNSEL RE SAME.	.20
06/13/03 TC	REVIEWED OMNIBUS STIPULATION WITH BELLSOUTH RE PROCEDURES	.40
06/24/03 MFC	REVIEW PLEADINGS FILED IN ATX LITIGATION.	.40
06/24/03 TC	REVIEWED FOCAL ILLINOIS OBJECTIONS TO MOTION TO STRIKE AFFIDAVIT OF KAUSHIK BHADNDEI	.30
06/27/03 MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO M. STAMER RE APPEAL STATUS.	.10
06/27/03 MFC	EMAILS FROM AND TO M. STAMER AND R. JOHNSON RE DISMISSAL OF APPEAL.	.20
06/27/03 MFC	CALL WITH JUDGE JORDAN'S CHAMBERS RE DISMISSAL OF APPEAL.	.10
06/30/03 MFC	DRAFTING STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL FOR MILLER BUCKFIRE APPEAL.	.60
06/30/03 MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO R. JOHNSON RE STIPULATION OF DISMISSAL OF APPEAL.	.10



# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-011  
INVOICE :      159658

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C  
RE:      LITIGATION

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	5.50	1925.00
T CURRIER	445.00	1.20	534.00
TOTALS		6.70	2459.00
TOTAL FEES :			2,459.00
TOTAL DUE :			2,459.00

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-012  
INVOICE :      159659

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C  
RE:      MEETINGS OF CREDITORS

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/04/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. FERRANTO RE TOMORROW'S COMMITTEE MEETING.	.10
06/05/03	MFC	MORE E-MAILS RE TODAY'S COMMITTEE MEETING CONFERENCE CALL.	.20
06/06/03	TC	CALENDARED COMMITTEE MEETING ON TUESDAY	.20
06/10/03	MFC	COMMITTEE MEETING CONFERENCE CALL.	1.20
06/17/03	MFC	E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM AKIN RE TOMORROW'S COMMITTEE MEETING.	.10
06/17/03	TC	SCHEDULED COMMITTEE MEETING TOMORROW	.20
06/18/03	TC	ATTENDED FOCAL COMMITTEE MEETING	.60

## T I M E   S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	1.60	560.00
T CURRIER	445.00	1.00	445.00
TOTALS		2.60	1005.00

TOTAL FEES :      1,005.00

TOTAL DUE :      1,005.00

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-013  
INVOICE :      159660

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      PLAN & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	.50
06/02/03	MFC	REVIEW MEMORANDUM FROM AKIN GUMP RE PLAN LITIGATION STATUS AND SUMMARY OF PROPOSES NTFC SETTLEMENT.	.30
06/02/03	TC	REVIEWED PLAN SUPPLEMENT	.70
06/04/03	MFC	REVIEW DEBTORS' MOTION TO APPROVE PLAN MODIFICATIONS.	.30
06/05/03	MFC	RESPOND TO CREDITOR INQUIRIES RE PLAN.	.20
06/06/03	TC	REVIEWED DEBTORS' MOTION TO ASSUME AMENDED LEASES	.40
06/08/03	TC	REVIEWED OBJECTION OF THE UNITED STATES TO PLAN CONFIRMATION	.40
06/08/03	TC	REVIEWED AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT	.50
06/09/03	MFC	REVIEW IRS OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION.	.10
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW UNIVERSAL SERVICE'S CONFIRMATION OBJECTION.	.10
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW TEXAS COMPTROLLER'S PLAN OBJECTION.	.10
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW UST'S CONFIRMATION OBJECTION.	.20
06/10/03	MFC	REVIEW BELL SOUTH CONFIRMATION OBJECTION.	.20
06/10/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO APPROVE TECHNICAL MODIFICATIONS TO PLAN	.50

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-013  
INVOICE :      159660

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      PLAN & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW SOUTHWEST BELL PROTECTIVE OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION.	.10
06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW MOTION TO APPROVE TECHNICAL MODIFICATIONS TO PLAN.	.20
06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW KINCO REDHILL PLAN OBJECTION.	.10
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED SECOND AMENDED PLAN	.70
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED KINCO REALTY OBJECTION TO PLAN CONFIRMATION	.30
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED SOUTHWESTERN BELL OBJECTION TO PLAN	.50
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED USTRUSTEE OBJECTION TO PLAN	.40
06/11/03	TC	REVIEWED LIMITED OBJECTION TO PLAN FILED BY UNIVERSAL SERVICE ADMINISTRATION	.30
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW SECOND AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	2.00
06/12/03	MFC	REVIEW TEXAS COMPTROLLER'S PLAN OBJECTION.	.10
06/12/03	MFC	ATTEND TELEPHONIC HEARING ON STATUS OF CONFERENCE HEARING.	.50
06/12/03	MFC	DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO AKIN RE TODAY'S TELEPHONIC HEARING ON CONFIRMATION.	.40
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED REPORT ON TODAY'S HEARING	.30
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED THIRD AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT	.70
06/12/03	TC	REVIEWED OMNIBUS STIPULATION WITH BELLSOUTH RE PROCEDURES	.50

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-013  
INVOICE :      159660

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      PLAN & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

06/12/03 TC	REVIEWED NOTICE OF ISSUES ON FOR APPROVAL AT NEXT WEEK'S HEARING	.30
06/13/03 MFC	REVIEW THIRD AMENDED PLAN SUPPLEMENT.	.60
06/17/03 MFC	REVIEW LENDERS' RESPONSE TO UST'S CONFIRMATION OBJECTION.	.30
06/17/03 MFC	REVIEW E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM AKIN ENCLOSING PROSPECTIVE BOARD MEMBER C.V.	.20
06/17/03 TC	REVIEWED RESPONSE OF THE SENIOR LENDERS TO THE USTRUSTEE OBJECTION TO CONFIRMATION	.70
06/18/03 MFC	EMAILS FROM AND TO TERESA CURRIER AND PJ DUHIG RE CONFIRMATION HEARING.	.10
06/18/03 MFC	REVIEW MEMO OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION.	.50
06/18/03 MRO	REVIEW OF TWO HEARING AGENDAS (.3). RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF E-MAIL FROM M. CALOWAY (.1). RECEIPT AND REVIEW OF E-MAIL FROM T. CURRIER (.2).	.60
06/18/03 TC	REVIEWED MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION	.80
06/18/03 TC	REVIEWED AFFIDAVIT OF JAY SINDER IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION	.40
06/18/03 TC	COMMUNICATION WITH TEAM RE LATE FILED CONFIRMATION OBJECTION	.20
06/18/03 TC	REVIEWED OBJECTION BY PLAINTIFFS' EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE	.30
06/18/03 TC	REVIEWED FAZAL AFFIDAVIT IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION DIRECT TESTIMONY	.40

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-013  
INVOICE :      159660

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      PLAN & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED HARTFORD AFFIDAVIT	.80
06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED CERTIFICATION OF VOTING	.30
06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED MOTION TO APPROVE SETTLEMENT WITH BELL SOUTH AS PART OF THE PLAN, AND MOTION TO FILE SETTLEMENT UNDER SEAL	.50
06/18/03	TC	REVIEWED WITHDRAWAL OF PLAINTIFFS' EXECUTIVE COMMITTEE OBJECTION	.20
06/19/03	MRO	REVIEW OF MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF CONFIRMATION (2.1). E-MAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM PJ DUHIG (.1).	2.20
06/19/03	TC	ATTENDED FOCAL CONFIRMATION HEARING	10.00
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW ORDER APPROVING TECHNICAL MODIFICATIONS TO PLAN.	.10
06/24/03	TC	REVIEWED ORDER APPROVING TECHNICAL MODIFICATIONS TO THE PLAN	.20
06/25/03	TC	REVIEWED MEMO TO COMMITTEE RE CONFIRMATION ISSUES AND POST CONFIRMATION ISSUES	.40
06/27/03	MFC	EMAILS FROM AND TO R. TAYLOR RE CONFIRMATION ORDER.	.20
06/27/03	MFC	REVIEW FINAL SIGNED CONFIRMATION ORDER.	.40
06/27/03	RTT	REVIEW EMAIL FROM M.CALOWAY RE CONFIRMATION ORDER	.10

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-013  
INVOICE :      159660

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      PLAN & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

-----

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	7.80	2730.00
M R OWENS	195.00	2.80	546.00
R T TAYLOR	125.00	.10	12.50
T CURRIER	445.00	21.70	9656.50
TOTALS		32.40	12945.00

TOTAL FEES :      12,945.00

TOTAL DUE :      12,945.00

# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-017  
INVOICE :      159661

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      KRLS FEE APPLICATIONS

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES RENDERED	HOURS
----	----	-----	-----
06/10/03	RTT	REVIEW KRLS PRE-BILLS FOR THE MONTH OF MAY 2003	.40
06/11/03	MFC	REVIEW AND EDIT MAY PRE-BILLS.	.40
06/11/03	RTT	DISTRIBUTE KRLS PREBILLS TO M.CALOWAY FOR MAY 2003 FOR KRLS FEE APPLICATION	.10
06/11/03	RTT	REVIEW/EDIT CHANGES TO FOCAL TEMPLATE	.40
06/11/03	RTT	REVIEW/EDIT PREBILLS FOR THE MONTH OF MAY 2003	.60
06/13/03	RTT	REVIEW AND COMPARE PREBILLS FOR THE MONTH OF MAY 2003	.60
06/19/03	RTT	PREPARATION OF KRLS FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	1.00
06/20/03	RTT	E-FILE AND SERVE NO ORDER REQUIRED CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO KRLS THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.40
06/20/03	RTT	DRAFT NO ORDER REQUIRED CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO KRLS THIRD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.30
06/20/03	RTT	EMAIL TO P.DUHIG RE ADMISSION INFORMATION	.10
06/23/03	RTT	PREPARE EXHIBIT C CHART TO KRLS FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.40
06/24/03	MFC	REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT KRLS MAY FEE APPLICATION.	.60
06/24/03	RTT	REVISIONS TO KRLS FOURTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	.30



# KLETT ROONEY LIEBER & SCHORLING

A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION  
40TH FLOOR, ONE OXFORD CENTRE  
PITTSBURGH, PENNSYLVANIA 15219-6498  
TELEPHONE (412) 392-2000  
FACSIMILE (412) 392-2128  
WWW.KLETTROONEY.COM

---

OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF      DATE :      JULY 9, 2003  
MATTER :      F4491-017  
INVOICE :      159661

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH: 06/30/03      T C

RE:      KRLS FEE APPLICATIONS

06/25/03 RTT      PREPARATION OF E-FILING RE KRLS FOURTH MONTHLY      .40  
FEE APPLICATION (.3); CALENDAR OBJECTION  
DEADLINE RE SAME (.1)

## T I M E      S U M M A R Y

	RATE	HOURS	TOTALS
	----	-----	-----
M F CALOWAY	350.00	1.00	350.00
R T TAYLOR	125.00	5.00	625.00
TOTALS		6.00	975.00

TOTAL FEES :      975.00

TOTAL DUE :      975.00