UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURTNORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS EASTERN DIVISION

OCT 0.9 2003

KENNETH S. GARDNER, CLERK TEAM - A

In re:) Chapter 11
CONSECO, INC. et al.,1) Case No. 02-B 49672) (Jointly Administered)) Honorable Carol A. Doyle
Debtors.	Objection Deadline: October 29, 2003

VERIFIED APPLICATION OF FRIED, FRANK, HARRIS, SHRIVER & JACOBSON, AS CO-COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF THE HOLDING COMPANY DEBTORS, FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED DURING THE PERIOD FROM AUGUST 1, 2003 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 9, 2003

Pursuant to sections 328, 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (as amended, the "Bankruptcy Code"), Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016 (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), rule 607 of the Bankruptcy Rules for the United States District Court and the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Illinois (the "Local Bankruptcy Rules"), the Retention Order (as defined below) and that certain Administrative Order Under Sections 105(a) and 331 of the

The Debtors are the following entities: (i) Conseco, Inc., CIHC, Incorporated, CTIHC, Inc., Partners l Health Group, Inc. (collectively, the "Holding Company Debtors"), (ii) Conseco Finance Corp., Conseco Finance Servicing Corp. (collectively, the "CFC Initial Debtors"), (iii) Conseco Finance Corp. - Alabama, Conseco Finance Credit Corp., Conseco Finance Consumer Discount Company, Conseco Finance Canada Holding Company, Conseco Finance Canada Company, Conseco Finance Loan Company, Rice Park Properties Corporation, Landmark Manufactured Housing, Inc., Conseco Finance Net Interest Margin Finance Corp. I, Conseco Finance Net Interest Margin Finance Corp. II, Green Tree Finance Corp. - Two, Conseco Agency of Nevada, Inc., Conseco Agency of New York, Inc., Green Tree Floorplan Funding Corp., Conseco Agency, Inc., Conseco Agency of Alabama, Inc., Conseco Agency of Kentucky, Inc., and Crum-Reed General Agency, Inc. (collectively, the "CFC Subsidiary Debtors," and with the CFC Initial Debtors, the "CFC Debtors").

Bankruptcy Code Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Professionals and Committee Members (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson ("FFHS&J"), counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Holding Company Debtors (the "Committee") in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases (the "Chapter 11 Cases"), hereby applies (the "Application") for (i) interim compensation for professional services rendered on behalf of the Committee in the amount of \$402,769.35, which represents 90% of the \$447,521.50 in services billed (the "Fees"), and (ii) reimbursement in the amount of \$30,835.62 for the actual and necessary expenses that FFHS&J incurred (the "Expenses"), in each case for the period from August 1, 2003 through September 9, 2003 (the "Eighth Monthly Fee Period"). The detailed billing records for the Fees and Expenses sought in this Application are attached as Exhibits A and B, respectively. In support of this Application, FFHS&J respectfully states as follows:

å

<u>Background</u>

- 1. On December 17, 2002 (the "Petition Date"), each of the Debtors filed its respective voluntary petition for relief under the Bankruptcy Code.²
- 2. On January 3, 2003, the United States Trustce appointed the members of the Committee at the Committee formation meeting (the "Committee Formation Meeting"). On that date, the Committee proceeded to retain, subject to Bankruptcy Court approval, FFHS&J and Mayer, Brown, Rowe & Maw ("Mayer Brown") as its co-counsel, and Houlihan Lokey Howard & Zukin and Greenhill & Co., LLC as its financial advisors.
- 3. By this Court's order dated February 12, 2003, the Committee was authorized to retain FFHS&J as their counsel, effective as of January 3, 2003, with regard to the

On the Petition Date, the Debtors' Chapter 11 Cases were consolidated for administrative purposes only.

representation of the Committee during the Chapter 11 Cases and all related matters (the "Retention Order"). The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate FFHS&J at FFHS&J's hourly rates charged for services of this type and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses incurred, subject to application to this Court in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, all applicable local rules, and orders of this Court.

4. On September 9, 2003, the Bankruptcy Court confirmed the Holding Company Debtors' Sixth Amended Plan of Reorganization (the "Plan") and on September 10, 2003, the Holding Company Debtors consummated the Plan.

Previous Applications for Compensation and Expenses in these Chapter 11 Cases

- 5. On April 2, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of January in the amount of \$933,332.49.3
- 6. On May 12, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of February in the amount of \$762,861.53.
- 7. On June 23, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of March in the amount of \$1,020,812.60.
- 8. On June 30, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of April in the amount of \$787,718.63,

In accordance with the Interim Compensation Order, the monthly fee applications filed by FFHS&J only requested 90% of the total fees incurred during each month. FFHS&J requested the remaining "held back" 10% from each month in its quarterly fee application, filed on August 15, 2003.

and an application for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of May in the amount of \$913,382.95.

- 9. On September 18, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of June in the amount of \$596,996.45.
- 10. On September 18, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of July in the amount of \$534,027.63.
- 11. On August 15, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim approval and allowance of compensation and expenses incurred as contained in the monthly fee applications filed in the period from April 1, 2003 through June 30, 2003 (the "First Quarterly Fee Application"). The First Quarterly Fee Application sought \$4,463,951.00 in fees and \$400,552.31 in expenses, which is 100% of the fees and expenses requested in the monthly fee applications filed between April 1, 2003 and June 30, 2003.

Fees

its legal services on an hourly basis in accordance with its ordinary and customary rates for Bankruptcy Court authorized engagements in effect on the date the services are rendered, and submits that such rates are reasonable. In the normal course of business, FFHS&J revises its hourly rates from time to time. FFHS&J's hourly rates for professional services rendered by bankruptcy and restructuring partners, "of counsel," and "special counsel" in non-Bankruptcy Court authorized and approved engagements are higher than the hourly rates charged by such professionals in connection with section 1103 engagements. The hourly rates for partners, "of

counsel," and "special counsel" who are not bankruptcy and restructuring professionals are not so adjusted. FFHS&J's bankruptcy and restructuring associates and legal assistants have one hourly rate for all engagements. Because FFHS&J's fees: (a) are based on hourly rates and will correspond to the degree of effort expended on the Committee's behalf, and (b) are FFHS&J's usual and customary rates for services of this nature, FFHS&J believes that these rates are reasonable.

•

13. The FFHS&J attorneys who rendered professional services in these Chapter 11 Cases, their respective hourly billing rates, total hours billed, and total fees during the Eighth Monthly Fee Period are:

Name of Professional Person	Position with the Applicant and Year	Department	Hourly Billing Rate ⁴	Total Billed Hours	Total Fees
Alan Resnick	Of Counsel since 1989; Law School Class of 1972	Bankruptcy	\$725	6.9	\$5,002.50
Richard A. Steinwurtzel	Partner since 1983; Law School Class of 1975	Corporate	\$705	0.2	\$141.00
Brad Eric Scheler	Partner since 1984; Law School Class of 1977	Bankruptcy	\$700	61.5	\$43,050.00
Kenneth R. Blackman	Partner since 1973; Law	Corporate	\$675	3.1	\$2,092.50
Robert C. Schwenkel	School Class of 1965 Partner since 1989; Law	Сотрогате	\$675	32.5	\$21,937.50
Bonnie K. Steingart	School Class of 1982 Partner since 1986; Law School Class of 1979	Bankruptcy/ Litigation	\$675	83.9	\$56,632.50
David Golay	Partner since 1986; Law School Class of 1977	Corporate	\$675	24.1	\$16,267.50
Donald Carleen	Partner since 1987; Law School Class of 1983	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$675	3.5	\$2,362.50
Jack L. Jacobson	Partner since 1989; Law School Class of 1982	Tax	\$675	20.8	\$14,040.00
Paul H. Falon	Partner since 1997; Law	Corporate	\$625	5.0	\$3,125.00
Jessica Forbes	School Class of 1983 Partner since 1999; Law School Class of 1988	Corporate	\$590	9.7	\$5,723.00

As set forth in FFHS&J's retention application, in the normal course of business, FFHS&J revises its hourly rates from time to time. In that regard, on September 1, 2003, the hourly rates for certain attorneys were revised.

Name of Professional Person	Position with the Applicant and Year	Department	Hourly Billing Rate ⁴	Total Billed Hours	Total Fees
Jonathan F. Lewis	Partner since 2002; Law School Class of 1994	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$565	10.5	\$5,932.5
Michael A. Levitt	Partner since 2001; Law School Class of 1993	Corporate	\$565	26.0	\$14,690.0

Eric H. Queen	Special Counsel; Law	Antitrust	\$520	2.0	\$1,040.00
	School Class of 1976			1703	\$64,740.50
Vivek Melwani	Partner since 2003; Law School Class of 1995	Bankruptcy	\$475/\$565	128.3	
Walid Khuri	Associate; Law School Class of 1996	Corporate	\$465	6.5	\$3,022.50
Brian D. Pfeiffer	Associate; Law School Class of 1999	Bankruptcy	\$395/\$420	134.4	\$53,975.50
John R. Ingrassia	Associate; Law School Class of 1995	Antitrust	\$385	30.6	\$11,781.00
Evan Pilchik	Associate; Law School Class of 1999	Corporate	\$385/\$410	28.0	\$11,270.00
Eli Weiss	Associate; Law School Class of 1999	Tax	\$385/\$410	46.3	\$18,283.00
Arik Preis	Associate; Law School Class of 2000	Bankruptcy	\$375/\$395	85.1	\$32,096.50
Alon Ziv	Associate; Law School Class of 2000 (LL.M.)	Bankruptcy	\$375	8.0	\$3,000.00
Sean Feller	Associate; Law School Class of 2000	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$365	12.7	\$4,635.50
John P. McGuinness	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Bankruptcy	\$320	15.4	\$4,928.00
Stephanie Mai	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Bankruptcy	\$320	0.1	\$32.00
Adam Scoll	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$320	0.9	\$288.00
Babar Sattar	Associate; Law School Class of 2002 (LL.M.)	Corporate	\$320	17.0	\$5,440.00
Katie Hughes Bednark	Associate; Law School Class of 2002	Bankruptcy	\$275/\$320	26.9	\$7,483.00
Andrew Schoulder	Associate; Law School Class of 2002	Bankruptcy	\$275/\$320	79.4	\$23,419.00

14. The para-professionals of FFHS&J who rendered services in these Chapter 11 Cases, their respective hourly billing rates, total hours billed, and total fees during the Eighth Monthly Fee Period are:

Name of Para- Professional Person	Position with the Applicant and Years	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Fees
LL016221011tt I draw	of Experience		\$205	0.1	\$20.50
Varren Gordon	Manager, 26 years experience with	Library	3203	0	
	FFHS&J		\$205	0.9	\$184.50
	Research Specialist and	Corporate Resources	\$203	\	
Daniel Ferro	Acting Manager, 8		١		ļ
	years experience with		}	·	1
	FFHS&J, 5 years other		, \	Ï	
	experience		\$195	0.2	\$39.00
	Technical Librarian, 8	Library	\$195	0.2	
Angela Rose	years experience with		ļ		1
	FFHS&J 9 years other		<u> </u>		
	experience		6105	1.5	\$292.50
	Research Specialist, 29	Corporate Resources	\$195	1.5	
Allan Wallen	years experience at		1	ļ	
	FFHS&J		<u> </u>	0.6	\$102.00
	Coordinator, 7 years	Corporate	\$170	0.0	
Patricia Delia	experience with]	1	
İ	FFHS&J, 27 years		1	1	
	other experience			8.0	\$1,360.00
	Research Analyst, 7	Corporate Resources	\$170	0.0	, -, -
Michael S. Weintraub	years experience with	_	\		
t I	FFHS&J, 6 years other		1	}	
	experience			7.0	\$1,155.00
<u></u>	Paralegal, 2 years	Antitrust	\$165	7.0	,,·
Tyra L. Boyce	experience with	}	1		
	FFHS&J, 8 years other	,	}	ļ	l.
	experience	·	 -	5.2	\$806.00
	Paralegal, 3 years	Corporate	\$155	2.د	
Pratibha Patel	experience with		\ \	}	
	FFHS&J, 8 years other	r		\	
	experience	<u> </u>		1.5	\$232.50
	Paralegal, 3 years	Corporate	\$155	1.5	
Laurence F. Weeks	experience with			l	
	FFHS&J, 22 years		1	1	\
	other experience			0.5	\$75.0
	Paralegal, 2 years	Corporate	\$150	\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \	
Opal Taylor	experience with				
	FFHS&I, 4 years oth	er	ļ		
	experience	\			

		T	\$145	1,4	\$203.00
Joseph Cerullo	Research Analyst, 2½ years experience with	Corporate Resources	φ1+3		
	FFHS&J, 1 year other experience				+440 00
Jin Kim	Paralegal, 4 months experience with	Bankruptcy	\$145	1.6	\$232.00
	FFHS&J		\$145	1.0	\$145.00
Matthew Bergman	Paralegal, 3 months experience with	Bankruptcy	\$143	1.0	
	FFHS&J	Bankruptcy	\$140	44.5	\$6,230.00
Christina Choi	Paralegal, 11 months experience with	Banktupusy			
	FFHS&J	Library	\$135	0.1	\$13.50
Dagfinn H. Senturia	Intern, 1½ years experience with	Library			
	FFHS&J, 3½ years other experience				<u> </u>

- 15. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, FFHS&J believes that the amount of Fees and Expenses requested in this Application are fair and reasonable given the time expended, the complexity and size of the Chapter 11 Cases, the issues encountered and resolved, and the results obtained.
- Matter (as defined below), describes each activity or service that each individual performed, and states the number of hours (in increments of one-tenth of an hour) spent by each individual providing the services. Each numbered tab in Exhibit A corresponds to the matter number that FFHS&J assigned to the Subject Matter. If a Subject Matter does not appear, FFHS&J did not bill time or expenses for that Subject Matter during the Eighth Monthly Fee Period.

Subject Matters

17. The professional services that FFHS&J rendered during the Eighth

Monthly Fee Period are grouped into the numbered and titled categories of the subject matters

(the "Subject Matters") described in Paragraphs 18 through 26.

18. Matter 3: Employment Matters (Fees: \$42,130.50, Hours; 81.5)

This Subject Matter describes time spent in the negotiation, preparation and review of certain management incentive plans that formed part of the Plan. In addition, this Subject Matter describes time spent in discussions, analysis, and review of all matters relating to a settlement with Gary Wendt, including claims and pleadings related thereto.

19. Matter 4: Tax Planning (Fees: \$41,916.50, Hours: 87.3)

This Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, discussing and researching tax issues related to the Debtors' restructuring, tax planning, tax sharing agreement, and an economic settlement with the Official Committee of Conseco Trust Originated Preferred Debt Holders (the "TOPrS Committee"). In addition, this Subject Matter describes time spent reviewing and commenting on the tax aspects of the Debtors' reorganization, including tax issues related to CFC that had a potential effect on the Holding Company Debtors. Finally, this Subject Matter includes the review of any and all pleadings filed in the Chapter 11 Cases that concern tax-related issues.

20. <u>Matter 5: Plan and Disclosure Statement (Fees: \$221,194.00, Hours: 433.8)</u>

This Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, and discussing the various pleadings, motions, statements, and briefs filed in these Chapter 11 Cases and with respect to settlements with various parties and confirmation of the Plan. Additionally, this Subject Matter includes time spent analyzing, reviewing, and negotiating revisions and open issues with respect to the Plan, and reviewing, analyzing, discussing, and negotiating the various documents that were filed as part of the Plan Supplement. This Subject matter also includes time spent negotiating, analyzing, and discussing terms of a settlement with the TOPrS Committee, and documenting such settlement. In this regard, FFHS&J reviewed and commented upon all the

documents related to such settlement, including the Plan modifications, the settlement notices, and the warrants.

21. Matter 6: CFC (Fees: \$4,586.50, Hours: 8.3)

This Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing and analyzing revisions to the CFC Debtors' Plan, proposed confirmation order, and notices regarding releases.

22. <u>Matter 8: General Official Committee Matters (Fees: \$869.00, Hours: 2.7)</u>

This Subject Matter describes time spent by various FFHS&J lawyers in their communication with the Committee and its individual members responding to their questions and providing them with updates with respect to these Chapter 11 Cases. Finally, this Subject Matter describes time spent researching, preparing, revising and discussing general issues related to the Chapter 11 Cases that do not fall into the more specific categories set forth in this Application.

23. Matter 9: Litigation Matters (Fees: \$74,383.50, Hours: 193.3)

This Subject Matter includes time spent preparing for and attending or participating in various Bankruptcy Court hearings related to the Debtors' restructuring. In preparation for the various hearings conducted by this Court, this Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, discussing, and responding to various pleadings and other Bankruptcy Court filings related to the Debtors' restructuring and preparing a statement in support of the settlement reached with the TOPrS Committee.

24. <u>Matter 10: Communications with Non-Committee Creditors</u> (Fees: \$1,041.00, Hours: 2.8)

This Subject Matter includes time spent discussing the Debtors' Chapter 11 Cases' status with and responding to inquiries regarding the Debtors' restructuring from various creditors who are not members of the Committee.

25. Matter 11: Regulatory Matters (Fees: \$28,883.00, Hours: 76.4)

This Subject Matter includes time spent participating in weekly conference calls with respect to insurance subsidiary and regulatory issues with the Debtors and communications with the Committee regarding the same. In addition, this Subject Matter includes time spent working and communicating with special counsel in connection with the required regulatory filings to be made by Committee members as part of the Debtors' restructuring. This Subject Matter also includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, and discussing the proposed consent order and researching, discussing, and preparing correspondence with respect to the Texas Department of Insurance's access to certain employment research.

26. Matter 12: Fee Application (Fees: \$32,517.50, Hours: 97.3)

This Subject Matter includes time spent preparing, revising, reviewing and discussing fee applications submitted to this Court for FFHS&J's fees and expenses associated with these Chapter 11 Cases, as well as coordinating the filing of a Certificate of No Objection to each fee application. This Subject Matter also includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, and discussing the U.S. Trustee's proposed fee guidelines.

Professional Services Rendered

27. Subject to this Court's approval, FFHS&J has charged the Committee for its legal services on an hourly basis in accordance with its ordinary and customary rates for Bankruptcy Court authorized engagements in effect on the date the services are rendered, and

submits that such rates are reasonable. In the normal course of business, FFHS&J revises its hourly rates from time to time. FFHS&J's hourly rates for professional services rendered by bankruptcy and restructuring partners, "of counsel," and "special counsel" in non-Bankruptcy Court authorized and approved engagements are higher than the hourly rates charged by such professionals in connection with Bankruptcy Code section 1103 engagements. The hourly rates for partners, "of counsel," and "special counsel" who are not bankruptcy and restructuring professionals are not so adjusted. FFHS&J's bankruptcy and restructuring associates and legal assistants have one hourly rate for all engagements. Because FFHS&J's fees: (a) are based on hourly rates and have corresponded and will continue to correspond to the degree of effort expended on the Committee's behalf, and (b) are FFHS&J's usual and customary rates for services of this nature, FFHS&J believes that these rates are reasonable.

attend a hearing, meeting, or conference call. FFHS&J makes every effort to ensure that each and every individual who attends such activity is necessary and provides a benefit to the estate. FFHS&J senior professionals who attend such sessions do not merely passively supervise the junior professionals' work, nor do junior professionals bill the estate for time dedicated to observing a senior professionals' review of the junior associates' work product. While FFHS&J does not believe that the amount of time billed in this Application for intra-office conferences, "meet and confer time," multiple attendees at hearings, meetings, depositions, or conferences is more than 5% of FFHS&J's fees contained in this Application, it is FFHS&J's position that to the extent such time does exceed 5%, it is beneficial to the estate and should be reimbursed in full. Of course, FFHS&J does not bill the estate for professional or para-professional time spent carrying out clerical tasks, such as scheduling, making travel arrangements, or faxing.

29. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, FFHS&J believes that the amount of Fees and Expenses requested in this Application are fair and reasonable given the time expended, the complexity and size of the Chapter 11 Cases, the issues encountered and resolved, and the results obtained.

Actual and Necessary Expenses

- including photocopying charges, long distance telephone calls, facsimile transmissions, messengers, courier mail, computer and data bank time, word processing, secretarial overtime and temporary employees, overtime meals, overtime and late night transportation, travel, lodging, meal charges for business meetings, postage, printing, transcripts, filing fees, document retrieval, and similar items. Subject to this Court's approval, FFHS&J requests reimbursement of all such charges incurred on behalf of the Committee.
 - Chapter 11 Cases required FFHS&J attorneys and other employees to devote substantial amounts of time during evenings and weekends to providing professional services on the Committee's behalf. In virtually every instance, these extraordinary services were essential to meet deadlines imposed by the Court, the Bankruptcy Code, and at times, the necessities of the Debtors' businesses, the administration of the estates, or critical litigation. As a consequence, FFHS&J was required to incur overtime secretarial charges to discharge its professional responsibilities. FFHS&J attempts to reduce overtime secretarial charges and to limit them to necessary instances by encouraging its attorneys to use a secretarial "mini-center." If a secretary is not needed at the attorney's desk for the entire evening, the attorney is required to bring his or her work to a cluster of secretaries. The client is only charged for the word processing charges associated with

the document, rather than charging the client for an evening of secretarial overtime, whether or not such secretary was used for the entire time. Similarly, overtime charges of administrative employees, such as research and document specialists, were incurred when necessary to discharge FFHS&J's professional responsibilities and provide the most cost-effective legal services to the Committee.

- are reimbursed for their reasonable meal costs and their costs for transportation home. Such transportation costs are necessary expenses because it is FFHS&J's policy to ensure safe transportation for its attorneys during the hours that public transportation cannot be deemed safe. In light of FFHS&J's location at the southern tip of Manhattan, it is often times very difficult to find a taxicab late in the evening, and as such, FFHS&J provides for its attorneys and employees to make use of a private car service. The cost of private car rides, while greater than the cost of a taxicab ride, is a necessary and beneficial expense to the estate, as it allows FFHS&J attorneys the ability to stay late in the evening hours to complete necessary tasks without the apprehension of worrying about finding quick, reliable, and safe transportation home in the evening. It is FFHS&J's regular practice to charge its clients for these and other out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the rendition of professional services on the client's behalf.
 - page for outgoing telecopier transmissions (plus related toll charges). FFHS&J does not charge its clients for incoming telecopier transmissions. FFHS&J has negotiated a discounted rate for Westlaw computer assisted legal research, which is approximately \$125/hour of online use of the standard Westlaw databases. Computer assisted legal research is used whenever the researcher determines that using Westlaw is more cost effective than using traditional (non-computer

assisted legal research) techniques. In addition, because certain key parties to these Chapter 11 Cases are located outside of New York, FFHS&J incurred long distance telephone charges, and when necessary, overnight delivery charges. FFHS&J made every effort to minimize such disbursements by using electronic mail and facsimile when possible. The expenses incurred in the rendition of professional services were necessary, reasonable, and justified under the circumstances and enabled FFHS&J to serve the needs of the Committee to the benefit of all creditors.

34. Exhibit B is a detailed itemization and description of the disbursements made by FFHS&J on the Committee's behalf during the Eighth Monthly Fee Period. All of these disbursements comprise the requested sum for FFHS&J's Expenses, totaling \$30,835.62. The following is a list of FFHS&J's Expenses, grouped by type of Expense:

Service Description	Total Expenses
Photocopying (@ \$0.12/page)	\$2,949.96
Telecommunications: Telephone (Long Distance) Telecopier (@ \$1.25/page)	\$9,815.96 \$111.25
Outside Messenger Services/Couriers	\$207.37
Court Reporting	\$3,020.55
Computerized Research	\$2,401.29
Word Processing, Secretarial and Other Staff Services	\$1,104.89
Transportation for Late Night and Other Exigencies	\$3,194.79
Working Meals	\$753.78
Out of Town Expenses: Transportation (including Airfare) Meals, Lodging ⁵	\$3,382.52 \$3,893.26

35. Although every effort has been made to include all Fees and Expenses incurred in the Eighth Monthly Fee Period in this Application, some Fees and Expenses might

Pursuant to the directive of the U.S. Trustee announced at the Committee Formation Meeting, charges for hotel accommodations have been capped at \$250 per night in Chicago. These adjustments have led to FFHS&J reducing the Expenses requested in this Application by \$1,376.88.

not be included in this Application due to delays caused by accounting processing procedures. FFHS&J reserves the right to make further application to this Court for allowance of such Fees and Expenses not included herein. In addition, certain Fees and Expenses incurred during the previous fee periods that were not included in the previous fee applications have been included in this Application. Subsequent fee applications will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, Local Bankruptcy Rules, and the Interim Compensation Order.

WHEREFORE, FFHS&J requests that it be allowed and paid interim compensation for its Fees and Expenses in the total amount of \$433,604.97 consisting of (a) \$402,769.35, which is 90% of the Fees for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered by FFHS&J in the amount of \$447,521.50, and (b) \$30,835.62 for actual and necessary Expenses incurred on behalf of the Committee. FFHS&J further requests that the total amount of \$433,604.97 be paid as an administrative expense of the estates.

Dated: October 9, 2003

New York, NY

Respectfully submitted,

FRIED, FRANK, HARRIS, SHRIVER & JACOBSON

Bonnie Steingart

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson (A Partnership

Including Professional Corporations)

One New York Plaza

New York, NY 10004

(212) 859-8000 (telephone)

(212) 859-4000 (facsimile)

Co-Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Holding Company Debtors

446774

EXHIBIT A

alp_132: Matter Detail (babetam/187267)
Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:37

Pried, Frank, Marris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

7679640 7679641	620.50 146.00	1.70	08/09/03 09/08/03 09/08/03	PARTMER S ASSOCIATE	MELMANI, VIVEK 35 Feller, sean 26	3 2
7712181	950,00	3	08/08/03 Disc. with working group and natherward approaches: Wendt, equity issues (.5); reviewed approaches: and Wendt arrangements (1.3).	PARTNER	Lenis, Jonathan F. 26	E
7679131	337.50 1,017.00	1.80		PARTHER	CARLEEN, DOWALD 26	ē.
7706173 7708036 7708041	1,750.00 118.50 197.50	0,50 0,50	incentive plan (1.0). 08/07/03 Conf. w/V. Welwani re: Wendt Bettlement. 08/07/03 Review draft Wendt term sheet. 08/07/03 Conference call with Pried Frank team re:	ASSOCIATE	PFEIFPER, BRIAN D 35	'ਹ 'ਗ
7706168	1,050.00	1.50	OB/07/03 Review and analyze terms of mettlement w/Wendt 08/07/03 Review and analyze terms of management (1.5); review and analyze terms of management	PARTNER	MELMANI, VIVEK 35 SCHELER, BRAD B. 35	8 C
7679120 7712172	621.50 855.00	1.10 1.80			LEWIS, JOHATHAN F. 26	L 5
7697021	472.50	0,70	08/07/03 Conf. call w/B. Scheler, et al re: Henuc resuce (.6); TC with J. Lewis re: Same (.2). 08/07/03 Conference call with B. Scheler, V. Welwani, D.	PARTHER	CARLEEN, DOSALD 26	2
7681734 7673492	540.00 540.00	O. 80	incentive plan (1.2). 08/06/03 Review Wendt termsheet and discuss same with V. Welwani.	PARTNER	STRINGART, BORNIE K. 35	S
7706166	2,800.00			PARTMER	SCHELER, BRAD E. 35	SCI
7676723 7 ⁷ 06164	2,800.00	0.30	08/05/03 Review Wendt term sheet and changes (.5); telephone call with A. Huber (R&E) re: eame (.6). (.6). 08/05/03 Review of emails re: equity plan.	PARTNER PARTNER ASSOCIATE	MELHANI, VIVEK 35 STEINGART, BORNIE K. 35	S181
7665607 7710440 77817729	197.50 113.00 475.00	0.20 1.00		PARTNER	Z. ¥	5 3
7474007 7603567	2,810.50 237.00	7.70	03/31/03 Call with Company and Committee Members re: Employment Agreements. Discuss same with D. Carleen, J. Lewis and B. Scheler. 04/39/03 Prepare for and participate in DKO subcommittee	AGROCIATE	EAN .	*9 80 81
index Number	Amount	Hours	Work Date Description	DETAIL Position	UNBILLED TIKE Dept	p ⊏ 6 z
(00397)	Proforma: 1948513 Status: B		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	11:02:37 COME CREDITORS MACTERS	Rum Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:37 Client: 030792 COMMITTES COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS	

alp_132: Matter Detail (babatan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:38

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

; ! !	ļ è		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER		Proforma: 1948513	(00397)
Citent: 030792 COMMITTEE CANS CH Nather: 00003 ENPLOYMENT MATTERS	87 E	COMMITTEE CARE CREATIONS SIPLOYNEST MATTERS	Responsible Prt: BRAD E.		Status: B	
UNSILLED TI Employee Name	Dept.	D B T A I L Position	Work Date Description	Hours	Amount	Index Number
PREIS, ARIK	25	ASSOCIATE	09/08/01 Calls with Mirkland & Ellis, J. Lawis and V. Helwani re: management incentive plan and	1.50	562.50	7671649
STREET MICHAEL S.	10	1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000 100	Nendt. 08/08/03 Research and obtain SERP plan and agreement for	0.50	85.00	7694306
		•		1.00		7679137
LEWIS, JONATHAN F.	26	PARTHER	na/11/01 Review and analyze wendt issues and e-mails	0.80	452,00	7679141
			(.6); diace, with working group	·	300	7710452
	,		08/11/03 Mtgs, and calls re Wendt.	0.50	N 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00	7708058
	ט נ ט מ	The table		0.20	200	0629696
PPEIFFER, BRIAN D	N 4	ASSOCIATE		0.30	90.00	
	ť	Salva ea	valuation emails 08/12/03 Disc. with J. Lewis re: Wendt settlement	.D.20	135.00	7682599
CARLERON, DORBALD				0,20	113.00	7679149
LEWIS, JONATHAN F.	26	PARTHER		1.30	617.50	7710459
HELMANI, VIVEX	ᅜ	PARTNER	OB/LE/OS Calle to mother southerman.	0.30	118.50	7708004
PESIFFER, BRIAN D	LA U	*080C1510	materials.	5	760.00	7712183
UPLEANT CIUME	Ų.	PARTHER	08/13/03 T/c & mtg. re incentive plan.	> t	900,000	7680756
LENIS, JOHNTHAM F.	26	PARTHER		6		
i 1))	-	10° refuse 10° Projers. Wendt settlement	D. 20	79.00	1700001
Perifer, Brian D	ى <u>.</u> ئ	ASSOCIATE		0.60	237.00	1408077
			V . Welcont is: saw: (\cdot, \cdot) .	1.20	474.00	7708093
	n n	DA DATE P	08/15/03 Discs. with working group and review re:	1.60	904.00	7660760
LENIS, JOSEPHINS 4.	P.		equity plan issues.	1,10	742.50	7681751
	; ;;	PARTMER	08/15/03 Review equity incorrect pross for Temper (Appaloosa) re-	0.30	118.50	7708103
SERTIFICATION, COLUMN C.	3	ļ		ტ. ტი	237.00	7708104
			08/15/03 Telephone calls with J. Lewis Te: management	0.30	118.50	7708145
				0. 4 0	158.00	7708106
				,	79 00	7708109
			08/15/03 Telephone calls to K&E re: management	C . A C	*****	
TOWNSHIP TOWNSHIP	36	PARTNER	incentive plan 08/18/03 Discs. with Kirkland, committee and working	1.70	960.50	7680763
	!			0.60	285.00	7710472
MELNAMI, VIVEX	55	PARTMER	CO/LOFGO AFO MANAGEMENT COMPANY.	•		

Incentive Plan.

alp_132: Watter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:38

Pried, Prank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Billing Prt : BRAD R. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD R. SCHELER Proforma: 1948513 Status: B (00397)

Macter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS	MATTERS	Responsible Prt: BRAD R. SCHELER		SCHOUS: B	
UNBILLED TINE Employee Name Dept	ME DETAIL Dept Position	Work Date Description	Hours	Amount	Index Mumber
		or trains to the transpose of the particular training of the t	0.40	190.00	7710473
		plan.	:	170 50	7702601
Coxu	ARSOCIATE	09/18/03 Review correspondence re: option plan.	0.40	1 C	7679725
SEAM		Prepare pleading re: Gary Wendt.	1.00	375.60	10111111
	5 ASSOCIATE		0.30	96.00	7704336
SCOUTTY, ACRES			•	226. DO	1680771
9	A PARTMER	08/19/03 Discs. with V. Welwani re: equity plan.		л 10 00 00 00	7710481
ENTS, JOSETHAN F. FO			1.26	n 2 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0	7710485
MECHANI, VIVES			1.10	u 6	
			,	8 7 7 S	7681760
	e pharman	08/19/03 Review Wendt settlement documents.		10 · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	7702609
STRIBUGACA, BORRARO S. CA			, c	1 125.00	7179827
posto parx 35			3 ·	13.50	7691167
MAPINA H.		08/19/03 Research for J. Levis.	0.40	226.00	7690472
	6 PARTMER	Review equit	0.40	146.00	7702615
	6 ASSOCIATE		ė. 50	337.50	7697294
OMNIE K.		08/21/03 Review Adams separated agreement of	0.40	226.00	7690493
LEWIS, JONATHAN F. 26	6 PAKINSK	restricted stock (.1); discs. with V. Melveni.			
		9. Feller re: Bame (.3).	•	180.00	7710459
	5 PARTHER	08/22/03 T/c re Wendt and settlement.	2 0	540,00	7697302
CHETACART PONNIE E. 35		08/22/03 Review Kroll report regarding directors.	1.00	365.00	7702629
			:		
Philips, Corts			0.80	380.00	7710506
MRIMANI, VIVEK 3	35 PARTMER	08/25/03 T/C w/Lewis and Tepper (Apparound) and terror	,		
		documents re management incentive press.	0.70	255.50	7702641
FELLED SEAN 2	26 ASSOCIATE	08/26/03 Review Wendt Battlement motion.	0.30	118.50	7708124
D ANT		08/26/03 Review correspondence re: management incentive	0.10	39.50	7708126
			5	237,00	7708129
		08/26/03 Draft email re: DWO issues and review related		:	
			0 .50	337.50	7697315
STRINGLET, BORNIE K. 3	35 PARTMER	08/27/03 Review Committee Franky on sector Ferri	9.80	\$40.00	7697316
			0.50	282.50	7770006
MELMANI, VIVER 3	35 PARTMER	09/02/03 T/C W/Secoy is members to management incentive	0.40	226.00	7770007
			0 40	280.00	7779657
SCHELER, BRAD E. 1)5 PARTHER	09/02/03 Tel. conf. w/committee re: management incentive	:		
			P P D	337,50	7747050
7	15 PARTNER	09/02/03 Review issues regarding equity incentive plan.	9.50	282.50	7770021
		09/03/03 Email re: classified board to committee.	1.30	734.50	7770036
		09/04/03 T/c re emp. issues and closing commictons.			

alp_132: Matter Detail (babetan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:39

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS

Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thin: 09/09/03

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

> Proforma: 1948513 Status: B

> > (00397)

CETTIEND Natter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS CARLESSI, DOMESTO BLUCTOWN, KENNETH R. Employee Hause MECHANII, VIVEN PPEIFFER, BRIAN D 1 1 2 1 ä in in Dept Position 5 DETAIL ASSOCIATE PARTNER PATION PARTNER Work Date Description 09/08/03 Review Plan documents 09/09/03 Review Stock Plan. 09/08/03 Research re: non-executive chairman (.8); disc w/ D. Golay and B. Scheler (.3). 09/07/03 Review Hilliard agreement. 09/05/03 Conference w/D. Golay re: non-assecutive chairman (.1); Review employment agreement 09/05/03 T/c D. Golay ra: employment issued. • Macter Total 100 81.50 81.50 3.20 0.80 0.50 1,20 0.30 0.50 E THO 42,130.50 42, 130.50 1,344.00 810.00 337.50 202.50 337.50 inount Index Sumber 7729523 7729525 7718227 7770057 7766036 7729528

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
Hatter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT NATIERS

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02-19

Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

7697042	2,700.00	1.50 4.00	08/17/03 Reviewed Kirkland memo. 08/18/03 Review of K48 memo.	PARINER	N O	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7701165	n (1,76	Reviewed memo from Jacobson.	ASSOCIATE	20	WEISS, ELI
7697038	270.00	0.40		PARTNER	2	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7701139 7701155 7697037	192.50 1,578.50	0.50	08/13/03 Call w/A. Mukamar (Drw) on options. 08/13/03 Reviewed Toprs economic settlement motion. 08/13/03 Reviewed K&E memo.			
7701137	115.50	D. 30 0	Conf. w/J. Jacobson and transaction and opinion			
7701131	\$ 50 0.50 50 0.50	1 30	09/12/03 Calls w/Dayis Polk and Kirkland on CHC transaction and opinion.	ASSOCIATE	20	WEISS, ELI
7697031	540.00	0.80				
7697028 7697029	270.00 270.00	0.40	(DPM), T. Maymes (KEE) Fe: KEE Opinion. 08/12/03 Conference with E. Heiss re: KEE Opinion.			
7697027	540.00	0.80				
7697026	405.00	0.60		PARTNER	20	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7697025	270.00	0.40				
7701113	115.50	0.30	08/11/03 Call w/A. Mukamal (DPW) on Flan.			
7701111	154.00	0.40	Reviewed			
7701103 7701109	108.00	, o	<pre>w/E. Pilchik on credit agreement (1.0). no/11/03 Reviewed filings and emails.</pre>			
			08/07/03 meramon (DPH), calle w/O Loy (KEE) and calls			
7711071	577.50	1.50				
				1	;	### BO #
	847.00	2.20	08/07/03 Conterence with a assume tax sharing agreement 08/07/03 Reviewed motion to assume tax sharing agreement	PARTNER ASSOCIATE	2 20	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7697020	135.00	0.20		***************************************	Š	WEISS, ELI
7708149	346.50	0.90	08/05/03 Conference with K. Weißk Is: 'S Isolay. (.6):	10001100	3	
7697012	202.50	0.30	08/05/03 Review of docs re: G. reorg.	PARTHER	20	TACOBSON, JACK L.
7697007	270.00	;			;	301-00 00 01-00 00 1-00 1-00 1-00 1-00 1
	604.50	1.70	08/04/03 Reviewed and revised plan and TOPES settlement	ASSOCIATE	22	
7724247 7696997	1,350.00	3.00 0.30	08/04/01 Research re: attribute reduction.	DARTHER	20	JACOBBON, JACK L.
Index Mumber	Amount	Hours	work Date Description	D B T A I L Position	Dept I	DEBILLED T
{00397}	Proforma: 1948514 Statum: B		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	DUS CREDITORS	TANNING	Run Date # 12me: 10/09/09 11:04-13 Cilent: 930792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: 90004 TAX PLANMING

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS MAtter: 00004 TAX PLANNING

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:39

Pried, Frank, Harrie, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

7720385	328.00	0 N 90	09/01/03 Various calls re tax situation and CPC. $09/03/03$ Research on new regs. and conferred w/J . Jacobson.	ASSOCIATE	20	MEISS, ELI
7770016	1 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2 2) c			ţ	METMONI' ATANY
7770015	578.00 736.00	1.20	09/03/03 Call re new tax regulation.		ž	
		•	09/03/03 Conference with 8. Welse Te: Activous	PARTHER	220	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7756040	270.00	0 ·				
7720383	1,230.00	3. 8				
7720383	82.00	0.20				
7720379	205.00	0.50	09/02/03 Conferred w/J . Jacobson and V. Welwani on new			
			Call w/O.			April 6
7720378	205,00	> 0 A 6	09/02/03 Call w/D. Tepper (Appaloosa) on new regs.	ASSOCIATE	N C	VOTOD RIT
7720377	164.00		w/Kirklan			
	P	N. 60			ť	MECHANI, FIRE
7770009	1 130 00) ¢.	09/02/0) T/c re cases w/Eli Meiss.	SENTER	ņ	
7770005))	•	reduction.			
7756038	1,012.50	1.50	ce/my/of paying requestion.			
			C MIND IN MARKE BASE AS THE PROPERTY.	PARTNER	20	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7756034	202.50	0.30				
7710543	190.00	0.40	08/29/03 Review DeO loan transfer agreement.			
7710542	237.50	0.50	09/25/03 T/C to discuss tax issue.	PARTHER	ü	MRIMANI, VIVEK
7710511	360.00	0 0				
			A. Mukamal	į	;	MEISS, SLL
,	9	1.50	Calls w/J. Jacobson, T. Maynes, V. Melward	RIVINOST	3	
7708152	474.50	0,70	08/22/03 Conference with 8. Weiss re: Mas opinion.	PRETARK	N G	JACOBBON, JACK L.
7697052	540.00	0.80	opinion.			
			C. Jacoppon on Meno and at the second			٠
7701209	308.00	0.80		ASSOCIATE	20	WEISS, ELI
7701207	423.50	1.10				
7697049	270.00	0.40	08/21/03 Conference with E. Heiss re: KAB opinion.	PARTNER	20	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7697048	337.50	9 8				
	M	0.60				
7701193	2200				ķ	海吹作位位。 2017年
7701187	115.50			ASSOCIATE	3 ;	CACCORDER, CACE II.
7701185	3 6 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7	, ,		PARTMER	Š	TOTAL
7697045	207.50		08/18/03 Research on dash 47.			
7701179	577,50	, , , ,	08/18/01 Heviewed Kirkland memo.	ASSOCIATE	6	ERIOS EL
7701169	808.50		08/18/03 Analyze plan tax issue.	PARTME	35	MELMANI VIVEK
7710476	217.50	n S				
Index Number	Asount	Hours	L Work Date Description	Position	Dept B	UNBILLED T
					2001100	Matter: 00004 TAK FLANKING
(0000)	Proforma: 1918514 Status: B		S Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	NS CREDITOR	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
orono.					00/00	Run Dece & Time: 10/05/05 it:uk:ss

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMM CHEDITORS Matter: 00004 TAX PLANDING

alp_132: Matter Detail (babatan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:40

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
Matter: 00004 TAX PLANNING

Billing Prt. : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

Proforma: 1948514 Status: B

(7,6500)

WISS.EL. LEE TIME Dept No. Dept Machine No.	Matter: 00004 TAX PIDEMING	SHITHER			•		
### ASSOCIATE 89/03/13 Calls w/O. Loy (KAR) on new regs. and beais 0.80 338.00 ### ASSOCIATE 89/03/81 Reviewed mesons for Committee call. 1.00 410.00 ### ASSOCIATE 99/03/81 Reviewed mesons and regs. and conferred w/J. 0.50 337.50 ### ASSOCIATE 99/03/81 Reviewed mesons and regs. and conferred w/J. 2.90 1.139.00 ### ASSOCIATE 99/03/81 Reviewed mesons and regs. and conferred w/J. 2.90 1.139.00 ### ASSOCIATE 99/03/81 Calls and canlyze immes to taxes related to 1.00 1.00 ### ASSOCIATE 99/03/81 Calls and canlyze immes to taxes and related open 0.50 202.50 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Calls w/O. Loy (KAR) or caxes and related open 0.50 202.50 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Calls w/O. Loy (KAR) or character else planting 0.50 1.120.00 ### ASSOCIATE 99/03/81 Calls w/O. Loy (KAR) or confirmation 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Conference with w. Nelvoni re: CPC tax issues 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Canls w/O. Loy (KAR) or confirmation 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Canls w/O. Loy (KAR) or confirmation 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Canls w/O. Loy (KAR) or cax issues 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Canls w/O. Loy (KAR) or cax issues 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Revision colls with R. Higgins (KAR) and W. 0.50 1.120.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Revision colls with R. Higgins (KAR) and W. 0.50 1.220.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Revision of CPC tax issues 0.50 0.50 1.220.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Revision of CPC tax issues 0.50 0.50 1.220.00 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Revision of CPC tax issues 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 ### PARTMER 99/03/81 Revision of CPC tax issues 0.50	NSILLED T		T A I	Work Date Description	Hours	Amount	Index Number
### ASSOCIATE 09/03/10 Reviewed memors for Committee call. 20 PARTHER 09/04/8 Conderance decide No. 10.00 410.00				09/03/03 Calls w/O. Loy (KaE) on new regs. and basis	D. 60	328.00	7720386
20 PARTHER 99/04/03 Conditions Committee menting w/V. Melanni. R. 0.50 237.50 200 PARTHER 99/04/03 Contented with B. Noise re. KER Opinion. 0.30 202.50 209/04/03 Enviseed memors and regis, and conferred w/J. 2.90 1.189.00 250 250 250 250 250 250 250 250 250 2	1	3	3417000		1.00	410.00	7720387
## ## ## ## ## ## ## ## ## ## ## ## ##	MEISS, KLI	2 5	PARTHER	Creditors Committee meeting w/V. Helwani,	0.50	337,50	7.00000
20 ASSOCIATE 09/04/68 Environed memors and rogs. and conferred w/J. 2.90 1.389.09 15 PARTMER 09/05/69 Calls and analyze issues related to 1.80 1.007.00 15 PARTMER 09/05/69 Calls and analyze issues related to 1.80 1.007.00 15 ASSOCIATE 09/05/37 T/c w/Sachugs and other documents relating 1.50 1.120.00 15 PARTMER 09/05/13 Newley of tax related documents relating 1.50 1.120.00 15 PARTMER 09/05/13 T/c w/Sachugs and other documents relating 1.50 1.120.00 15 PARTMER 09/05/13 T/c w/Sachugs and Nirkland re tax issues 09/09/13 Conference with T. Malwani re: CFC tax issue. 0.40 1.64.00 15 PARTMER 09/09/13 Conference with T. Malwani re: CFC tax issue. 0.50 1.37.50 16 PARTMER 09/09/13 Conference with T. Malwani re: CFC tax issue. 0.50 1.00 1.64.00 17 PARTMER 09/09/13 T/c w/Sathy (MEE) re taxes and related documents 1.00 0.60 405.00 18 PARTMER 09/09/13 T/c w/Sathy (MEE) re taxes and related documents 1.00 0.60 405.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 T/c w/Sathy (MEE) re taxes and related documents 1.00 0.60 405.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 T/c w/Sathy (MEE) re taxes and related documents 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 T/c w/Sathy (MEE) re taxes and related documents 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 19 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/13 Relwant re: tax issue 1.00 0.50 250.00 10 PARTMER 09/09/					0.30	202.50	7756048
15 PARTNER 09/05/03 Jacobson. 1.80 1.00	WRISS, ELI	20	ASSOCIATE		73, 90	1, 189.00	7 - M-00-04
### 15 ASSOCIATE 09/06/03 T/C #/Sathly (KLE) re taxes and related Open 0.50 292.50		i			1.80	1,017.00	7770039
Segment Segm	METHODAT, ATARA	t			0.50	282.50	7770045
REW 35 ASSOCIATE 09/66/3 Review pleadings and chors. L. 20 PARTHER 09/08/01 Heview of the predictions. 20 ASSOCIATE 09/08/01 T/C w/Jacobson and Kirkland re tax issues. 21 ASSOCIATE 09/08/01 T/C w/Jacobson and Kirkland re tax issues. 22 ASSOCIATE 09/08/01 Cadi w/O. Loy (KAE) on confirmation. 23 DARTHER 09/09/03 Cardetone with V. Melvani re: CFC tax issue. 24 Op/09/03 Cardetone Committee call w/V. Melvani et al. 25 DARTHER 09/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani re: CFC tax issue. 26 Op/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani re: CFC tax issue. 27 Op/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani re: CFC tax issue. 28 Op/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani re: CFC tax issue. 29/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani re: CFC tax issue. 29/09/03 T/C w/Sathy (KKE) re taxes and related documents 29/09/03 Telephone call with R. Hispani via committee. 29/09/03 Telephone call with R. Hispani via committee. 20/09/03 Telephone call with R. Hispani via committee. 20/09/03 Telephone call with R. Hispani via committee. 20/09/03 Research on CFC related tax issues. 20/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani re: bax issues. 20/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani and J. Jacobson on tax 20/09/03 Cadi w/S. Melvani and J. Jacobson on tax 20/09/03 Cammittee call re: confirmation.				129068.	Э	1,120.00	7718694
L. 20 PARTMER 09/08/03 T/c w/Jacobson and Kirkland re tax issues. 2.00 1.130.00 15 PARTMER 09/08/03 T/c w/Jacobson and Kirkland re tax issues. 2.00 1.130.00 164.00 20 PARTMER 09/08/03 Call w/J. (AEE) on confirmation. 2.00 0.40 164.00 0.40 09/09/03 Candersnice with v. Nelwanni re: CFC tax issue. 0.50 405.00 09/09/03 Candersnice with v. Nelwanni re: CFC tax issue. 0.50 405.00 09/09/03 Candersnice with v. Nelwanni re: CFC tax issue. 0.50 405.00 09/09/03 Candersnice with B. Reiss re: CFC tax issue. 0.50 405.00 09/09/03 Tcd sphone call with B. Reiss re: CFC tax issue. 0.40 270.00 09/09/03 Tcd sphone call with R. Higgins (KLE) and E. 0.50 282.00 169/09/03 Tcd sphone call with R. Higgins (KLE) and E. 1.80 756.00 126.00 162.00 1	SCHOULDER, ANDREW	35	ASSOCIATE	to Debtor's tax planning.	» (237 50	7756059
PARTMER 09/08/03 T/c w/Jacobsom and Killadia to CAX Associate 09/08/03 Call w/E. Welson 09/08/03 Call w/E. Welson 09/08/03 Candia conference with V. Melwani re: CPC tax issue. 0.60		N P	PARTHER		9 : 9 :	1,130.00	7770051
20 ASSOCIATE 09/08/03 Conference with V. Medwani re: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Conference with E. Welseni te: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Conference with E. Welseni te: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Conference with E. Welseni te: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Conference with E. Welse re: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Conference with E. Welse re: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and velated issues. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and V. 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); email V. 09/09/03 Research on CPC Telephilities. 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation.	MELMANI, VIVEK	35	PARTHER		0.40	164.00	7720404
DARTINER OP/DAY/OF CONTENENCE WALLE PROCESS. DARTINER OP/DAY/OF CAME AND TELEVAL ISSUES. DARTINER OP/DAY/OF CAME AND TELEVAL ISSUES. DARTINER OP/DAY/OF WALLEY FOR CAME AND TELEVAL ISSUES. DARTINER OP/DAY/OF THE PROCESS. DARTINER OP/DAY/OF THE TOWN THE CAME AND TELEVAL ISSUES. DARTINER OP/DAY/OF WALLEY THE TOWN THE	WEISS, ELI	20	ASSOCIATE		0.50	337.50	7756061
### PARTINER 09/09/03 Conference with Early Welse re tax issue 09/09/03 09/09/03 09/09/03 Newtown related issues 0.50 0	JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTMEN		0.60	405.00	7756062
09/09/03 Conference with B. Reiss re: CPC tax issue. 09/09/03 Call w/E. Weiss re: tax situation. 09/09/03 Call w/E. Weiss re: tax situation. 09/09/03 Review tax issues and related documents 09/09/03 Review tax issues 09/09/03 Relaphone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and W. 09/09/03 Relaphone calls with A. Sathy (KEE) and W. 09/09/03 Relaphone calls with A. Sathy (KEE) and W. 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); email V. 09/09/03 Research on CFC related tax issues 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Calls withold Maynes (KEE), A. Mukamal (DDW) and 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 70tal Matter Total 41,916.50					Q. 80	540.00	2756066
### D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 T/c w/Sathy (Kis) re taxe situation. #### D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 T/c w/Sathy (Kis) re taxes and related issues. #### D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (Kis) and E. #### 15 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Review Tax issues #### 15 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); cmail V. ##### 15 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Research on CFC related tax issues. #### 09/09/03 Research on CFC related tax issues. #### 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. relwani and J. Jacobson on tax #### 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. #### 1.50 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation.					2 C. 40	452.00	7770061
### ### ##############################	MELWANI, VIVEK	35	PARTNER		0.50	282.50	7770062
### ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Telephone call with R. Higgins (KEE) and E. 0.30 126.00 ### Weiss re: tax issues 09/09/03 Telephone calls with A. Sathy (KEE) and V. 0.30 126.00 ### Weiss re: tax issues 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); email V. 1.70 544.00 ### Weissur re: tax issue 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); email V. 1.70 544.00 ### Weissur re: tax issue 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); email V. 1.70 544.00 ### Weissur re: tax issues 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani re: same (.3). ### Option Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 0.50 205.00 #### Option Committee call re: confirmation. 0.50 205.00 ##### Agreement (1.4); email V. 1.70 41,916.50 ####################################		!			1.80	756.00	7766050
NATURERW 15 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Telephone calls with A. Sathy (KEE) and V. 0.30 126.00	PPSISPER, BRIAN D	u U	ASSOCIATE		0.30	126.00	7766052
##elwani re: tax issue AMDREW 15 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Review Tax Sharing Agreement (1.4); email V. 1.70 544.00 ##elwani re: same (.3). ##elwani re: same (.3). ##elwani re: same (.3). ##esearch on CFC related tax issues. 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. ##elwani and J. Jacobson on tax 1880c Interview (RAE) on tax issue. 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 1.00 410.00 0.50 205.00 ##elwani re: tax issue. 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 87.30 41,916.50				Weiss re: tax issues Telephone calls with A. Sathy (XLE)	0.30	126.00	7766054
Melwani re: mame (3). 20 ASSOCIATE 09/09/03 Research on CFC related tax issues. 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Calls and CFC liabilities. 09/09/03 Calls w/Todd Maynes [KEE], A. Mukamal (DPM) and 0. Loy (KEE) on tax issue. 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 205.00 Natter Total Natter Total 87.30 41,916.50	SCHOULDER, AMDREW	Ří Li	ASSOCIATE		1.70	544.00	7719403
09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 09/09/03 Conferred w/V. Melwani and J. Jacobson on tax 188ues and CFC liabilities. 09/09/03 Calls w/Todd Maynes [KEE], A. Mukamal (DPM) and 1.00 410.00 0. Loy (KEE) on tax issue. 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 0.50 205.00 09/09/03 Committee call re: confirmation. 87.30 41,916.50 Natter Total	: :	,	and Local		3.80	1,558.00	7720406
Issues and CFC liabilities. Calls w/Todd Maynes (KLE), A. Mukamal (DPW) and 1.00 410.00 C. Loy (KEE) on tax issue. Committee call re: confirmation. Total 87.30 41,916.50 Natter Total 87.30 41,916.50	MELICO, BLI	ţ		Conferred w/V. Melwani and J.	2.00	820.00	7.0000
O. Loy (K&E) on tax issue. 0.50 205.00 Commuttee call re: confirmation. 87.30 41,916.50 Natter Total 87.30 41,916.50				Calls w/Todd Maynes (XEE), A.	1.00	410.00	7720408
87.30 87.30				O. Loy (KEE) on tax Committee call re:	0.50	205.00	7720409
87.30				Joeal	87.30	41 ,916.50	
				Marter Total	87.30	41,916.50	

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00004 TAX PLANMING

5

.

alp_132: Natter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:41

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS

Billing Prt: : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

(00397)

UNBILLED Hatter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATISHENT PILCHIK, EVAN PERIFFER, BRIAN D MAI, STEPHUNIE RESINICK, ALAE Employee Kame MCGUINDESS, JOHN RESMICK, ALAM SCHELKR, BRAD S. COLAY, DAVID MEINTRAUB, MICHAEL S. 10 PPEIFFER, BRIAN D SCHELER, BRAD E. MELHANI, VIVEK PFEIFFER, BRIAN D STEINGART, BORNIE K. MELMANI, VIVER 1 + I K 2 띪 ä 3 ü ä 9 5 ü 55 ü ω ω 5 5 Pep. TRIAIL Position W180 ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ABBOCIATE ASSOCIATE COUNSEL COUNSEL PARTHER PARTNER PARTNER PARTNER PARTHER Nork Date Description 05/29/03 Phone calls w/D. Golay, D. Timmer (KEE) re: 04/29/03 Neet with V. Melwani re: plan and disclosure 03/11/03 T/C w/Viv Melwani re: postpetition interest. 04/09/03 Neeting with Arik Preis regarding 08/01/03 Telephone call with S. Gill (DPW) re: warrants 08/01/03 Telephone calls with Houlihan re: plan 08/01/03 Review amended Plan mark up. 08/01/03 Tel. confs. w/KEE, et al. re: TOPES' 08/01/03 Various calls re documentation of settlement. 08/01/03 Calls w/A. Sathy (KsE) re plan modifications 08/01/03 Call w/Vivek Melwani re: settlement of TOPTH 05/30/03 Research Amended Joint Plan of Reorganization 08/02/03 Review notices re: settlement. 08/02/03 Revise amended plan. 08/02/03 Review plan and notices and discuss same w/V08/02/03 Review notices and Plan re settlement. 08/01/03 Telephone calls with V. Melwani and A. Sathy 08/01/03 Meet with V. Welwani re: plan process. 08/01/03 Emails to A. Sathy (KLE) re: settlement. 08/01/03 Review draft 9019 statement re: TOPr6. 08/01/03 Telephone conference with Vivek Melwani 08/01/03 Review draft of 5th Amended CNC plan. 08/01/03 Review draft orders and documents. 04/30/03 Telephone calls with V. Melwani and A. Sathy 04/29/01 Review draft pleading and cover letter reregarding implementation of TOPrS settlement. tel. in status hearing (.5). (.3); review warrant terms (.7). for Walter Industries and related stockholders exchange/unexchange notes. (KAE) re: plan process (.4); Participate via process. settlement and documentation. agreement. documents (1.0). Plan corp. docs (1.0); prepared memo re: Corp. (KEE) re: open plan issues. #Editement (.2); review bank warrant (.2). 3.50 1.60 2.00 1.80 0.60 1.50 1,30 0.20 0.40 0.30 0.80 2.60 0.30 1.30 1.30 2,00 2.00 0,60 . 00 1.00 0.40 0.40 0.10 House Proforma: 1948515 Status: B 1,382.50 1,400.00 1,050.00 1,900.00 632.00 355,50 \$13.SO 118.50 217.50 877.50 950.00 285.00 675.00 170.00 770.00 158.00 711.00 237.00 290.00 158.00 256.00 832.00 877.50 32.00 79.00 Amount Index Number 7531416 7603571 7603563 2489466 7382836 7710430 7668138 7548045 7603581 7708006 7665336 7710431 7708003 7707999 7707997 7665986 7665984 7671310 7665344 7665342 7665335 7710428 7708007 7708005 7708004

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS MACKET: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:41 alp_132: Matter Detail (babetan/187267)

Fried, Frank, Barris, Shriver & Jacobson Nork Date Thru: 09/09/03

(00397)

UNBILLED Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECEGNIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS SCHELER, BRAD E. RESNICK, ALAN SCHELER, BRAD E. MELMONI, VIVER PFEIFFER, BRIAN D STRINGART, BORNIE K. MELMANI, VIVEK PREIS, ARIK COLAY, DAVID NALLEN, ALLAN SCHOULDER, ANDREW PREIS, ARIX PILCHIK, BYAN 11 I I I I I 5 3 Ğ ij 35 ß ü ä Dept. ۳ ۵ 5 5 5 Position MI SC ASSOCIATE PARTHER 139MDCO PARTHER ASSOCIATE PARTMER PARTMER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE Work Date Description 08/03/03 Reviewed draft notice of Rule 9019 settlement 08/03/03 Tel. conf. w/XAB re: TOPrS' settlement (.5); 08/03/03 T/c w/Resnick re open issues. 08/02/03 Review revised draft of plan and comment 08/04/03 Review email correspondence re: TOPrS 08/03/03 Telephone conference with Vivek Melwani 08/03/03 Calls w/A. Sathy (KLE) re settlement. 08/04/03 Review draft confirmation order (.6); telephone 08/04/03 Conf. w/PF team re: 08/04/03 Calls re settlement issues. 08/04/03 E Pilchik Research Re: Warrants 08/04/03 Review Plan supplement re: retained actions 08/04/03 Reviewed Warrant Agreement revised to include 08/04/03 Meet with A. Preis re: 9019 notices: 08/04/03 Telephone call with D. Trucano (HLHE) re: 08/04/03 Telephone call w/V. Melwani and A. Sathy (KiE) 08/04/03 Review Davis Polk comments to plan. 08/04/03 08/04/03 Meet w/B. Scheler and V. Melwani xe: TOPxS 08/04/03 Review notices re: TOPIS settlement. CO/10/BD 08/05/03 Calls and emails re: TOPre pfd. terms sheet 08/04/03 Review of TOPrS Settlement documents 08/04/03 08/04/03 Review plan supplement re: preferences. Emmails ro releases. regarding procedural issues relating to TOPIS review and analyze plan and notices and prepare thereon (1.5); correspondence with V. Melwani Telephone call with J. Anderson (DPW) re: Meet with V. Melwant re: plan comments. notices, plan supplements, and warrants and Rule 9019 settlement and plan modification. re: same (.5). prepare comments (4.7). and analyze proposed confirmation order. of TOPES claims. comments (1.0). preference. gettlement. re: plan: connents. mettlement. mettlement. call with A. Buher (KaS) re: same (.7). Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER settlement (.3); review 0.00 0.40 0.40 0.40 0.60 1.50 2. DO 0.20 0.30 0,70 0.40 0.30 0.30 0.10 1.30 0.50 0,30 0.20 0.20 Bandi 0.70 자. 양 1.30 Proforma: 1948515 Status: B 1.050.00 3,500.00 285.00 142.50 360 DO 290.00 290.00 190.00 750.00 500.50 118.50 118.50 276.50 118.50 877.50 877.50 192.50 750.00 158.00 118.50 79.00 Amount 97.50 79.00 39.50 79.00 Index Number 7681726 7706156 7710435 7710434 1671314 7671313 7710433 7710432 7665967 7708017 7708014 7708012 7708011 7708009 7708008 7665339 7688757 7708016 7708013 7708010 7668145 7693790 7666022 7711322 7708018

Client: 030792 COMMITTER COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECRUMIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:41 alp_132: Matter Detail (babatan/187267)

Fried, Frank, Barris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS

GOLAY, DAVID RESNICK, ALAN MELWANI, VIVEK SCHOULDER, ANDREW PREIS, ARIK PILCHIK, EVAN PPRIFFER, BRIAN D STEINGART, BORNIE E. KELMANI, VIVER COLAY, DAVID WALLEN, ALLEM SCHOULDER, ANDREW PREIS, ARIK PILCHIK EVAN MCCCULLANGUSS, JOHN RESNICK, ALAN STEINGART, BONNIE K. . 35 SCHELER, BOAD E. Employee Name Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECREANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT MELMANI, VIVEK H K K 8 8 ř 35 35 50 ü ä 5 쑶 ŭ š 9 Pegr DETAIL PARTMER Position MISC PARTNER COUNSEL PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE COUNSEL PARTHER PARTHER PARTME PARTMER Work Date Description 08/05/03 Review and revise amendments to Plan and 08/05/03 Review and comment on revised forms of Plan. 08/05/03 Purther revise warrant agreement to include 08/05/03 Review Kirkland & Bilis revised plan and 08/05/03 Review revised plan and draft notices and Fried 08/07/03 08/07/03 Review and revise settlement documents 08/07/03 Review TOPES warrant agreement [1.0]; call re: 08/06/03 Review and revise Release and Settlement 08/06/03 08/06/03 08/06/03 08/06/03 08/06/03 E0/96/80 08/06/03 08/05/03 Analyze TOPrs Notices. 08/06/03 Various calls re TOPrS prfd. stock & TOPrs 08/06/03 Calls and emails re: TOPrs pfd stock (1.0); 00/05/03 E Pilchik Research Re: Warrant Agreements 08/05/03 Email to Committee re: 08/05/03 T/c w/Vivek Melwani re: issues raised by TOPrS 08/05/03 Reviewed revised plan, TOPES settlement 08/05/01 Review TOPIS warrant termsheet. 08/05/03 Review and analyze TOPrS' warrant terms. OB/05/03 Review revised Plan and prepare comments. 08/05/03 Revise Plan. Reviewed notices re: plan amendments, releases. Review and comment on draft notices and letters Revise Credit Agreement. Telephone call with A. Sathy (K4E) re: plan. Review notices re: TOPrS settlement. Review cradit agreement revisions. Meet with V. Melwani re: notices. Review plan comments. ваше [.6]. Motices for Plan. to go with revised Plan. aettlement. review and markup term sheet (2.4). Motices. Motices of settlement. notices and release notices. TOPRO proposed notices settlement, revised and notices to lenders and proposal, and notices to lenders and TOPrS Prant comments. settlement proposal, proposed notices. Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELZR Billing Prt amendments to Plan and BRAD B. SCHRLER 0.50 2.10 1.60 2.70 2.50 0.70 0.10 0.30 0.80 1.50 0.70 2 90 3.40 0.30 3.00 2 20 . 6 0.80 0.80 0. 80 1.80 ... 含 3,40 2.00 2.50 Hours 1.30 Proforma: 1948515 Status: B 1,080.00 2,295.00 1,125.00 1,215.00 1,400.00 1,750.00 580.00 617.50 362.50 997.50 742.50 937.50 269.50 276.50 592.50 540.00 427.50 195.00 935,00 847.00 768.00 580.00 337.50 118.50 950.00 82.50 39.50 Amount Index Number 7712171 7712164 7681730 7668855 7708026 7708025 7679817 7665970 7671323 7706162 7680673 7681127 7688765 7708027 7701190 7681733 7712165 7668147 7693794 7679B18 7688762 7665990 7671322 7681727 7706158 7710441 (00397)

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS

and opt out of TOPrS settlement.

Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECREANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstam/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:42

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
WATTER: 00005 PLAN OF RECRGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BEAD E. SCHELER Proforms: 1948515 Status: 8 (00397) Mumber

0.40 150.00 0.40 150.00 0.30 82.50 0.30 82.50 0.90 427.50 0.90 197.50 0.20 197.50 1.20 1,750.00 2.50 1,750.00	Revised read. 08/10/03 Revise and respond to various emails re: TOPrS pettlement. 08/11/03 Calls re: anti-dilution protection for rights offerings in the TOPrS' warrants (.8); review	PARTNER		
	Review and respond to various emails re:		10	GOLAY, DAVID
· · · .			;	School of the second
	correspondence with Xirkland & Mills is: some. 08/09/03 Review and analyze revised notices, warrant,	PARTMER	با اگا	COUNTRY BRAD R.
		ASSOCIATE	35	PROIS, ARIK
	08/08/03 West with V. Welwani and A. Preis re: notices.			
		ASSOCIATE	Į.	PERIFFER BRIAN D
	08/08/03 Seviewed revisions to justo mortee of	TISSINDOO	ş	RESNICK, ALAN
e e				
v		PARTNER	35	MECHANI, VIVEK
	David on American and		;	
· .	08/07/03 Review potential preference actions wer total			
· .	Review amended notices for Flan.	ASSOCIATE	35	SCHOOLDER, ANDREW
٠.				
	08/07/03 Draft correspondence with Kirkland & Ellis Te:			
	Jacobson re: numerous open issues.			
	08/07/03 Internal call with B. Scheler, J. Lewis, D.			
2.00 750.00	08/07/03 Call with FF, Kirkland & Ellie, Jenner & Block			
	abondance aich vatvienn m naves eco			
		ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIX
1.00 375.00	credit agreement			
F. 60				
	08/07/01 Prepare new warrant term sheet	ASSOCIATE	10	OTTOWER RUNN
346.50				
0.50				
	08/07/03 Conference call with TOPIS re: mettlement.			
0.30 118.50				
1.60 632.00	Review portions re: settleme	2000	V	PERIOR DATA
0.10 19.50	ng/ny/or voicement.	LOCAL PROPERTY		
	CO/OT/DO CONTRACTOR MARK OF THE PROPERTY OF TH	MASOCIATE	35	PERIFFER, BRIAN D
0.10 19.50	on/AT/O: Wolchmail with C. Lambrianskod (Kelly Drye) re:		;	
	Work Date Description	Position	Dept	Employee Mame
Hours Amount		DRIAIL	H ■	

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Natter: 00005 PLAN OF RECREMIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstan/187267) Rum Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:42

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTE COME CHEDITORS
Hatter: 00005 PLAN OF REDECAMIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1948515 Status: B (00397)

		BRIAN D	erusias, baad s. 35			MELMANI, VIVEK 35	GOLAY, DAVID 10			PREIS. ARIK 35								PREIFFER, BRIAN D 35	RESPICE, ALLOW		STRINGART, BONNIE K. 35	SCHELEX BOOK BY		,	MELMANI, VIVEK 35			UNBILED TIME
																												 y o
		ASSOCIATE	PARTHER			PARTHER	PARTKER			AGSOCIATE								ASSOCIATE	1		PARTNER	•	DARTHER		PARTNER			Position
	138488. 08/12/03 Meet wi	08/12/03 Conference (Melwani re:	08/12/03 Various			08/12/03 Various)(2.5); (2.5);		notices. 08/11/03 Call with	08/11/03 Review and c				08/11/03 Meet Wi			08/11/03 Telepho	08/11/03 Telepho		08/11/03 Reviews			os/11/03 Tel. conf.	08/11/03 Cont. co				Nork Date Description
Wendt settlement. Telephone call with C. Lambrianakos (Kelly Drys) re: settlement.	issues. Meet with V. Welvani re: TOPKS settlement and	Conference calls with A: Sacny (Awa) and v. Melwani re: notices, TOPYS settlement, Wendt	Various calls re: Hendt and TOPIS settlements.	Calle re: tax opinion and related issues.	Coviews wells w/DPW to Plan and settlement.	Various calls re TOPra settlement (3.0);	(2.5); calls and emails re: same (.6).	to the Addition term of TOPES warrants	notices. Call with V. Melwani, Debtors and TOPES re:	Review and comment on revised Plan and form of		TOPES settlement. Telephone calls with Davis Polk re: plan	settlement. Telephone calls with D. Trucano (HLHZ) re:	Meet with V. Helwani and A. Preis re: TOPES	Review notices.	Helwani re: settlement process and notices.	Telephone calls with A. Sathy (X4E) and V.	CD D. Tepper Inflorous.	settlement and plan americant.	Reviewed revised notices regarding TOPES	Review blackline TOPES Houses.	(.5); various tel. calls re: sattlement (2.5).	w/Company, TOPES, et al. re:	Tel. conf. w/A. Sathy (KEE) et al. re:	ř	Review Cerms of warrants.		tion.
0.10	0,80	!	1,00	0.80	0.40	4.90		3.10	0.50	3.00	3.20	0.30	0.30	0.50	0.60	0.80	0,60	·	0.10	0.20	0.80	0.80	3.00	1.50	0.90	P :	0.40	Hours
39.50	316.00		513,50 00,000	380.00	190.00	F	1 800 00	2,092.50	187.50	1,125.00	1,264.00	118.50	118,50	197.50	237.00	316.00	237.00		39.50	163.00	540.00	540.00	2,100.00	712,50	427.50	855.00	190.00	Amount
7708069	7798068		7708067	005011	7710457		7710456	7680683	7672841	1672798	7708062	7708961	7708060		7708055	7708052	7.00001	1100051	7708049		7681741	7681739	7706183	1710451	7710450	7710449	7710448	Index Number

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
WALTER: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:43

Pried, Frank, Harrie, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CHEDITORS
Natter: 00005 FLAN OF RECREANIEATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD B. SCHELER Proforms: 1948515 Status: B

(00397)

2	b 8	SOH		PRE!	LS-Std		SCHE	WO C		PREL								PFE1	MELA		79.0	1 202								13.4d			1110			<u> </u>	!			ISH		1000	=
SCHELER, SRUD B.	bacts ARIK	SCHELER, BAND E.		PREIS, ARIK	PYSIFFER, BRIAN D		SCHELER, BRAD B.	MELMANI, VIVER		PREIS, ARIX								PERIFFER, BRIAN U	HELMANI, VIVER		Company and the company	ALDIK							·	PERIFFER, BRIAN D			STEINGHRI, BORNING N.	A SIMULE TRACES	4	MALERALL VIVEX	,	GOLAY, DAVID		PRBIS, ARIK			UNBILLED T
Ω ω	υ U	35		35	35		ü	ij	;	u Ç	,								, ,	ř	;	بيا اکا				•				ú	;			<u>,</u>		j.		10		Ņ		Dept	女
PARTNER	ASSOCIATE	PARTHER		ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE		PARTHER	PARTAGE		ESSOCIATE.								HE SOUTH AND	TOPOGO TOPOGO	SCHOOL STORY		ASSOCIATE								STATISTICS	10000			PARTHER		PARTUER		PARTMER		ASSOCIATE		Position	DETAIL
	08/16/03	08/16/03		08/15/03			co /cr /00		10/31/00	00/14/00				08/14/03		08/14/03				09/14/03			08/13/03		08/13/03		08/13/03		00/61/00			0.01.1.03			08/13/03	08/13/03		08/13/03		50/21/80		Work Date	
E 3111s re: same. Review and analyze settlement documents.	Review of Plan and correspondence with Kirkland	Review various emails re: TOPrS' settlement,	re: notices and Plan.	trown Davis Polk and internal Fried Frank team	KENTE CO COMINCION FOR TOTAL CONTROL OF THE PROPERTY OF THE PR		+ff+. (C:+ (C:+	7-1 conf. w/Committee members re: 10915	Carions calls re thresholds for TOPrs.	Adams of the Kirkland & Ellis and V. Welward	profess of revised Plan of Reorganization and	TOPES settlement thresholds	Telephone calls with Committee members re:	Email correspondence re: sectionate thrematum	Bectlement	G. SCHREET SLOW A. MICHAELS AT	Secretary of the secretary secretary that the secretary	(Bofs) and C. Freedgood (JPNorgan) re: TOPES	Telephone calls with Davis Polk, B. Garavalia	Pres for hearing on TOPrs and Wendt Settlement.	by Debtors.	Review form of motion, plan and notices filed	Meet with A. Preis re: plan comments		Voicemail to A. Biber (Kas) re: press		Telephone call with b. Goley was	TOPIN BETTIEBERT		-	Meet with V. Melwani re: Notices and releases	Review blackline credit agreement.	mettlemest.	Review motion regarding TOPrS economic	Revise settlement documents.	1/c w/Committee members to lurgs sectioned.	reviewed revised Warrant Agreement (Calls w/Doug Times about forte wertene trond	Plan and notices.	THE REPORT OF THE PERSON NAMED IN THE PERSON N	or the term and the second of	Nork Date Description	
1.50	0.30	1,50			2.00	ů.40		1.00	1,30		1.00		6.06	9 9 9 1	2		0.80		0.40	2.00	! !	1.00		5	;	0.10		0.20		0.30	0.50	0.50	?	1.10		2 1	2	1	1.30		1,30	-	Ности
1,050.00	112.50	1,000.00	200		750,00	158.90		700.00	617.50		#35. CC	1		141 80	118.50		316.00	•	158.00	, vi c. c.	9	L 74	326 00	118.50		39.50		79.00		118.50	197.00	, u	777 50		877 50	427.50	190.00	•	877.50		487.50		Jacount
7706207	7679718		7706206		7679716	7708110		1079177	7710469		0	161615		7708099	7708098		7708095		1 10000	77.0000	7710466		7679709	7708082		7708060		7708078		0000	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	2500000	7681748		7681746	7712185	7712184		7680687		7673992		Index Number

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
MATTER: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Natter Detail (babetan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:43

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAM OF RECREANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BEAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BEAD E. SCHELER Proforms: 1948515 Status: B (00397)

legends.		,			STEINGART, BORNIE K. 35 PARTNER 08/21/03 review district of the province minimum and the state of the province minimum and the state of	00/11/00		35 marage 08/21/03		35 ASSOCIATE 08/20/03	BONNIE K. 35 PARTNER 08/20/03 Review 9019 motion papers rec		erurus BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 08/20/03 Confer with Sprayregan (XAS) re: Fian and		DATEL PRATIENA M. 10 PARALEGAL 08/19/03 Research re: rejected contracts per a		DORIG ARIK 15 ASSOCIATE 08/19/03 Calls with V. Mclwani and Kitkland a still a co-	08/19/03 Review additional documents on telecome		Control Court after C. Source Court	STRINGART, BONNIE K. 35 PARTNER US/19/03 ROYLEW SIN IMPOUNDED FOR STRINGART, BONNIE K. 35 PARTNER US/19/03 ROYLEW		To Company of the Com	Unitary of service and service revised Plan, notices,		10/01/30 adminstra 10/01/01			08/19/03 T/cs w/committee members re proposed UST		08/19/03	25 premies 08/19/03		10 PARALEGAL 08/18/03	08/18/03 Review of revised Plan.			08/18/03 Calls w/each committee member re 7	35 PARTHER 08/18/03	STRINGST, BORDIE R. 35 PARTIER 08/17/03 Review Jorg Rectificate Cartematic Ca		Employme Water Dept Position Work Date Description
	1.00		2.00	1.30		1,30	0.50	2.50	;		1 30	1, 10		1.00	1	1 30		90	0.80			1.60			+ ,00	2.00	1.50		1.50		1.30	0.40	•	0.20	0.00	5	A. 00	. ·	2 4 2 5	1.30	ė. 80	Hours
	590.00		1,400.00	877.50		877.50	267.00	20.70			330.00	742.50	:	700.00		201.50		1.125.00	540.00			1,215.00			2,800.00	1,400.00	712.50	3	712.50	1	0 F 7 . U E	\ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \			11 00	187.50		150.00	1.425.00	617.50	540.00	Amount
	7693515		7706231	7697296		7671691	1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	311040	7710441		7681139	7681768		7706220		7685525		7681036	7681761			7681759			7.700	310001	1	3710484		7710403		7710482	7710480		7679204	7679724		7679719	7710475	7710474	7681754	TIMBA MOREST

Client: 030792 COMMITTES CONS CREDITORS
NATURY: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:44

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS MALLEY: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1948515 Status: B

(00397)

MELNANI, VIVEK 35	LEVITT, MICHABL 10	BLACTOWAN, KERRESTE R. 10 GOLAY, DAVID 10		VIVEK L, ROBERT		PREIS, ARIX SCHOULDER, ANDREW 35	ROSE, ANGELA 80 HELMANI, VIVEK 35 PFEIFFER, BRIAN D 35	HELMANI, VIVEK 15 PTELFTER, BRIAN D 15 PILCHIK, EVAN 10 SCHOULDER, ANDREW 15	SCHELER, BRAD B. 35 STELMCART, BONNIE K. 35 PREIS, ARIX 35	mployee Mame BWIS, JOHATHAN F.	CHBILLED TIME
PARTNER	PARTHER	PARTHER	ASSOCIATE	PARTNER PARTNER	PARTNER ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE	admin Partner Associate	PARTHER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	Partner Partner Associate	POSITION PARTNER PARTNER	DETAIL
(.6). 09/02/03 Review 6th amended Plan. 09/02/03 Htg. w/Preis re Plan. 09/02/03 T/c re listing & legending w/Committee members.	09/02/03 Conf. w/K. Blackman re: securities issues (.2); tel. conf. w/Committee re: NYSE listing			08/29/03 T/cs and meetings re stock listing. 08/29/03 Calls re stock listing. 08/29/03 Confs re: closing of plan and filing	(Nendt and TOPXS Settlement). 08/28/03 T/c w/Kirkland re status and open issues. 08/28/03 Discussion w/ S. Pfeiffer re stock legend	agreement and nearing. 08/27/03 Discussion with Kirkland & Ellis re: CIEC deemed amount motion. 08/27/03 Review and revise statement in support of Plan	(Hendt and TOPES Settlement). 08/26/03 Research case for V. Melwani. 08/27/03 Review Hill fee issues. 08/27/03 Meet with V. Kelwani re: registration rights	08/26/03 T/c re Plan releases and GM plan. 08/26/03 T/c w/A. Sathy (KEE) re: Plan open issues. 08/26/03 Meet with V. Melwani re: Plan consummation 08/26/03 Reviewing emails, changes to security agreement 08/26/03 Review and revise statement in support of Plan		Work Date Description 08/25/03 Disc. with D. Tepper (Appaloose), V. Helwani re: transfer restrictions. 08/25/03 Call w/DPM and J. Forbes re listing & laggerito.	
1.70 0.70 1.00	0.80	0.20 1.80	2.00 0.40	0.50 0.40	0.60	1.00	0.20 0.50	20000	1.30 0.50 1.00 0.80	0.30	
960.50 395.50 565.00	452.00	135.00 1,215.00	790.00 150.00	380.00 237.50 270.00	285.00 38.50	375.00 605.00	39.00 237.50 197.50	285.00 118.50 77.00	617.50 237.50 700.00 540.00 300.00	3400000E	Towns of W
7770003 7770004 7770010	7734412	7718226 7776116	7708145 7708146	7710538 7710540 7720606	7710533	7711339 7732755	7701032 7710523 7708137	7710514 7708125 77088804 7708532	771.0509 771.0510 770.6234 7697307 7685631	Index Number 7690507 7710508	tudes Breigt

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CUNS CREDITORS Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (Dabstan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:44

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1948515 (00397)

co Gordon) re open plan ce re: MYSS listing issues. re: aame (.2). no f reorganization. open plan issues. re: Committee statement, open plan issues. v. Melwani and T. Atteberry plan issues y/Fresh Start issue. cap and related issues. cap and related issues. cap and related issues. cap and related issues. committee statements. committee statements. committee statement o.50 plan issues proposed changes v. Melwani and R. Maiman or confirmation order. cap and related issues. cap and related issues. li lopen issues and it agt. trage and MYSS. itli open issues and it agt. calls w/Committee members sues (2.2). and committee members sues (2.2). nd telephone call with plan confirmation. 0.50 0.70 4.00 1.30 0.80 0.70 1.30 0.70 0.70 0.70 1.30 0.70 0.70 0.70 1.30 0.80 0.70	Client: 010792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS	38	MS CREDITORS	Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER NTOSHER STATEMENT Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER		Protorma: 1948515 Statum: 8	(16500)
Dupt Position Work Pace Description Description Work Pace Description Description Stription Work Pace Description Description Stription Stripti	THE T. I. R. D. T. T.	X M					. ·
Dec. 35 Partners Dec.		Dept		Work Date Description	Hours	Anount	index sensoer
Dec. 35 Pairmone Dec.					0.30		7770011
DRECT 10 PARTNERS 09/02/00 Th.1. COCK. *V/Commalther Fet HRESE Library a Learners 1.00 PARTNERS 09/02/00 Th.1. COCK. *V/Commalther Fet HRESE Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/00 Th. COCK. *V/Commalther Fet HRESE Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The commanded plan cock comments. 1.00 12/02/01 The cock *V/Commalther Fet Library on HRESE 1.20 1.00 12/02/01 The committee Commanded plan cock comments. 1.00 12/02/01 The committee Commanded plan cock comments. 1.00 12/02/01 The committee Commanded plan cock comments. 1.00 12/02/01 The committee Commanded plan cock cock cock cock cock cock cock coc					3	200 00	7779658
### 10 PARTER: 09/02/6 Perlament revised plan of recognition order: 0.000 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0	SCHELER, BEAD B.	35	PASTNER		3 5	810.00	7725522
10	SCHWENKEL, ROBERT	5	PARTHER		1.40	6	
SCOUNSEL 09/02/03 Reviewed Arrivated plant of reorganization order: 09/02/03 r/c w/r/s /resis rat comments on proposed 0.70 0					2	£35.00	7718339
1988 15 1880CLIATE 09/02/03 Revised natic of Continuation of Proposed 0.50 145.00	RESNICK, ALAM	35	COUNSEL		0.70	507.50	7718342
10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10					0.20	145.00	7718343
ASSOCIATE 09/02/03 Mest with Y. Melwani zer Statement. 0.20 84.00					5	210.00	7765990
Conditivation Corder, Open plan Lisues 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and T. Atteberry 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone call with V. Melisani and Telephone 0.20 09/02/03 Telephone 0.20 0.2	PERIFFER, BRIAN D	35	ASSOCIATE		6,04	•	
10 ASSOCIATE 09/02/03 Telephone call with v. Melvani and K. Meison 0.20					0.20	84.00	7765991
### 10 ASSOCIATE 09/02/03 Replace the plant issues ### 10 PARTNER					0.20	B4.00	7765992
## 10 ASSOCIATE 09/02/03 Reg Rights Agreement; treated issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Calls re NTSE is insting issues. #### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Calls re Clic claims cap and related issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re NTSE is listing issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re NTSE is listing issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re ENTSE is listing issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re ex NTSE is inting issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re ex NTSE is stating issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re ex NTSE is stating issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re ex NTSE is stating issues. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review and comments. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review and calls re listing and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review calls re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review calls re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review calls re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review calls re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review call re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review call re is lating and XFSE. ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review call re is lating and review members ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review call re is lating and review members ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review data confirmation committee members ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review data confirmation committee members ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review data confirmation committee members ### 10 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review data confirmation committee. ### 10 PART					2	656, QQ	7749357
Description Continue Contin	PILCHIK, EVAN	10	ASSOCIATE	09/03/03 Calls re: NYSS listing issues proposed changes	2.80	1,890,00	7776118
15 PARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re NYSE Listing issues. 2.10 1.186.50	GOLAY, DAVID	ŧ	PART LABOR	to pid. stock etc (2.0); review changed pages			
### PARTNER 109/03/03 Calls re CIEC claims cap and related issues 1.90 1.073.50 ####################################			!		2.10	1,186.50	7770017
TARTNER 10 TARTNER 09/03/03 Various calls re: NYSE listing issues. 0.80 540.00	MELMANI, VIVEK	ŭ.	PARTMEN		1.90	1,073.50	7770019
TER. 15 PARTNER 09/03/03 Review amended plan and comments. 1.80	SCHWENEST SOMEST	5	PARTNER		0.80	. 540.00	13067
### D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/03/03 Neetings with V. Melwani re: hearing and 0.50 ##################################		is i	PARTNER		1.80	1, 315.00	7 7 4 5 0 0 c
### ### ### ### ######################		ž	ASSOCIATE		0.50		
10 ASSOCIATE 09/03/03 Review and comment on Confirmation order. 35 ASSOCIATE 09/03/03 Review and comment on Confirmation order. 10 MISC 09/03/03 Review and comment on Confirmation order. 10 MISC 09/04/03 Analyze DAO Transfer program. 35 PARTMER 09/04/03 Various calls re listing and MYSE. 09/04/03 Committee call re: all open issues and effective date. 15 PARTMER 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 16 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 17 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 18 PARTMER 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 19 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 10 09/04/03 Review MYSE issues and telephone call with effective members 10 09/04/03 Review MYSE issues and telephone call with 1.30 877.50 10 135 PARTMER 09/04/03 Review draft confirmation order and committee members 10 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee. 10 09/04/03 Prepare call re: Plan confirmation. 10 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee. 10 09/04/03 Prepare call re: Plan confirmation.					0.60	246.00	7749360
ASSOCIATE D9/03/03 Review and communities of confirmation. ASSOCIATE D9/03/01 Review confirmation order. 10 MISC 09/03/01 Research SEC filings. 35 PARTMER 09/04/03 Analyze D40 Transfer program. 09/04/03 Various calls re listing and MYSE. 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 09/04/03 Conf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation (1.0); conf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation (1.0); conf. w/v. Melwani re: MYSE listing 1 seview for instance (2.2). 15 PARTMER 09/04/03 Review Arait confirmation order and committee 1 po 35 ASSOCIATE 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 0.80 540.00 877.50 877.50 877.50 877.50 877.50 877.50 877.50 877.50	PILCHIK, BYAN	10	ASSOCIATE		1.00	395.00	7771295
IN 35 ASSOCIATE 09/03/03 Research SEC [11] age. 10 MISC 09/04/03 Research SEC [11] age. 35 PARTNER 09/04/03 Analyze D&O Transfer program. 0.90 508.50 0.90 09/04/03 Various calls re listing and MYSE. 0.90 09/04/03 Committee call re: all open issues and 0.90 1.10 0.90 0.90 0.90 0.90 0.90 0.90 0.90	PREIS, ARIK	i id	ASSOCIATE		0.40	128.00	7716784
partner 09/04/03 Analyze D40 Transfer program. 0.90 1.10	SCHOULDER, AMERICA	Š	ASSOCIATE		0.90	130.50	7735052
09/04/03 Various calls re listing and NYSE. 09/04/03 Committee call re: all open issues and effective date. 09/04/03 Comf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation (1.0) conf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation (1.0); conf. w/v. Welward re: NYSE listing issues (.8); various calls w/Committee members re: confirmation issues (2.2). NIE K. 35 PARTNER 09/04/03 Review NYSE issues and telephone call with Welward re: same. 09/04/03 Review draft confirmation order and commands. 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 0.80 540.00 540.00 640.00 640.00 640.00 640.00	CERULLO, d'OREA	و بر کار	PARTHER		0.90	508.50	7770025
09/04/03 Committee call re: all open issues and 1.00 200.00 effective date. 09/04/03 Review revised credit agt. 09/04/03 Conf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation 4.00 2,800.00 (1.0): conf. w/V. Welwani re: NYSE listing issues (.0): various calls w/Committee members re: confirmation issues (2.2). PARTNER 09/04/03 Review NYSE issues and relephone call with 1.30 877.50 Welwani re: masse. 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 1.00 540.00 ASSOCIATE 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 1.00 420.00					1.10	6 A I . U C	7770079
effective date. op/04/03 Review revised credit agt. op/04/03 Conf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation 4.00 2,800.00 (1.0); conf. w/V. Welwani re: WYSE listing issues (.8); various calls w/Committee members re: confirmation issues (2.2). partner op/04/03 Review NYSE issues and relephone call with 1.30 877.50 Helwani re: mane. op/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 1.30 540.00 ASSOCIATE D9/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee conference call re: Plan confirmation.					1.00	565.00	1110041
1.0) op/04/03 Conf. call w/Committee re: Plan confirmation 4.00 2,800.00 (1.0); conf. w/V. Melwani re: MYSE listing issues (.0); various calls w/Committee members re: confirmation issues (2.2). 35 PARTNER 09/04/03 Review MYSE issues and telephone call with 1.30 877.50 Melwani re: mame 09/04/03 Review draft confirmation order and comments. 0.80 540.00 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 1.00 420.00 conference call re: Plan confirmation.					0.70	395.50	7770032
(1.0); conf. w/v. Welwani re: NYSE listing issues (.8); various calls w/Committee members re: confirmation issues (2.2). re: confirmation issues and relephone call with 1.30 877.50 Melwani re: mame. 09/04/03 Review Areit confirmation order and comments. 0.80 540.00 35 ASSOCIATE 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee conference call re: plan confirmation.		J)	PARTMER	Conf. call w/Committee re:	±.00	2,800.00	7775934
re: confirmation issues (2.2). 35 PARTNER 09/04/03 Review NYSE issues and relephone call with 1.30 877.50 Welwani re: mame. 09/04/03 Review draft confirmation order and comments. 0.80 540.00 35 ASSOCIATE 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 1.00 420.00 conference call re: Plan confirmation.	Contraction of the second	,					
35 PARTNER 09/04/03 Review MYSE issues and telephone Call with A. Fr. 1977 Helward research confirmation order and comments. 0.80 540.00 640.					3	977.50	7747071
09/04/03 Review draft confirmation order and comments. 0.80 540.00 BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in committee 1.00 420.00 conference call re: Plan confirmation.	STEINGART, BONNIE K.	35	PARTNER)))	1
ERIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/04/03 Prepare for and participate in Commiscee						420.00	7766018
		ŭ,	ASSOCIATE			***	

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babetan/187267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:45

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Nork Date Thru : 09/09/03

(00397)

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
MATTER: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLUSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1946515 Status: B

			09/06/03 Review final draft of committee statement in support of confirmation.			
7747086 7747089	540.00	0.80	enalls re: same (1.5). 09/06/03 Review draft motion on DEO loan transfer fee agreement.	PARTNER	ω. UI	STEINGART, BORNIE K.
7725541	4,387.50	6.50	09/06/03 Conf. w/N. Levitt re: securities (1.0); review and analyze docs re: same (4.0); various	PARTME	5	SCHWENKEL, KOBERT
•		:	09/06/03 Tol. CONE. W/K. Bischman in: Gothernoon (.6): CONE. NAR. Bothernoon in: same (1.0):	PARTMER		LEVITT, MICHAEL
7718228 7734431	405.00 3,107.50	5.50 0.50		PARTMER		BLACKMAN, KENNETH R.
7758059	340.00	2.00	09/05/03 Research re: Form 3 and Schedule 13D 09/05/03 Continuation of research regarding NYSE companies that have preferred stock with	ASSOCIATE MISC	S. 10	PILCHIK, EVAN MEINTRAUB, MICHAEL S.
7766029	84.00	0.20	agreement. 09/05/03 Telephone calls with R. Kwasteniet (KAE) re: Plan			ļ
7779830 7766025	135.00 84.00	0.20	support of Plan. 09/05/03 Continue review of confirmation order draft . 09/05/03 Review correspondence re: DGO transfer	ASSOCIATE	ម ហ	PESTRESS, BRIAN D
7747077 7747078 7779628	877.50 540.00 135.00	1.30 0.80 0.20	docs. re: same (1.0). 09/05/03 Review D&O losn transfer agreement. 09/05/03 Review revised credit agreement. 09/05/03 Review draft motion of official committee in	PARTHER		STEINGART, BONNIE K.
7725537	1,822.50	2.70	09/05/03 Review revised conf. Other: 09/05/03 Varoius calls re: MYSE listing issues and director and compensation issues (1.7); review	PARTMER	5	SCHWENKEL, ROBERT
7770077 7770038	452.00 452.00	0.80 80		PARTHER	<u>35</u>	MELMANI, VIVER
7776122	1,147.50	1.70	plichick Request: Research re: consent of Calls re: MYSE listing issue (.5); call comp. committee and independent director	PARTHER	\$. 10	NEINTRAUB, MICKAEL (GOLAY, DAVID
7720395 7722945 7758056	123.00	• 0.50 • 60	09/04/03 Research securities matters.	ASSOCIATE	20	
7716786	320.00	1.00	09/04/03 Conference call with Committee re: Plan	ASSOCIATE	3 5	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
7766020 7749364	1,435.00	3,50		ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	16	PIEIPER, BRIAN D
Index Number 7766019	Amount 84.00	Hours 0.20	Work Date Description 09/04/03 Taleobone calls with E. Pilchik re: listing	Position	I M E Dept	THBILLED T Smployee Name

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
NATURE: 00005 PLAN OF REDROMMIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babstam/187267) Rum Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:45

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

MELMANI, VIVEK 15	TEALLY MICHYET 10	GOLAY, DAVID 10	FALON, PAUL H. 10	BLACIONAM, KENERTH R. 10	PREIS, ARIK 35	RESNICK, ALAN 35	SCHWENKEL, ROBERT 10	MELWANI, VIVEX 15	ELACIOUN, KENNETH R. 10 LEVITT, MICHAEL 10	PREIS, ARIK 15	RESHICK, ALAN 35	UNBILLED TIME Employee Name Dept	KIR DECE & LINE: 1077770 CHISTORS Client: D30792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: D0005 PLAN OF RECREMNIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
Partner	Parther	PARTHER	PARTHER PARTHER	PARTNER	ASSDCIATE	COUNSEL	PARTHER	PARTHER	PARTHER	ASSOCIATE	COUNSEL	DETAIL Position	COMS CREDITORS
call w/Committee re: same (.5); cont. w/J. Golay re: NYSE listing (10). 09/08/03 review distribution issues w/ELHZ. 09/08/03 T/c w/Appaloosa re closing conditions. 09/08/03 Calls re listing and Plan modifications related b9/08/03 Calls re listing and Plan modifications related	revised cert. of designation (1.7). o9/08/03 Confs. w/ R. Schwenkel, M. Levitt, et al. res securities and securities issues (1.0); research and analysis research (5.0); conf.		09/08/03 Voice mail from V. Melwani re: securities related documents (.i); call with J. Porbes. conference with M. Khuri re: same (.5). 09/08/03 Assistance to members of countities in	issues 09/08/03 Discussions w/Schwenkel, Levitt, Golay, Forbes. Steinwurtzel re securities issues	09/07/03 Review of Confirmation order and internal correspondence re: wame. 09/07/03 Internal correspondence re: confirmation	(8.5). 09/07/D3 Telephone conference with Vivak Melwani regarding securities issues.	og/07/03 Codis. w/N. Levitt re: securities isdues (9/07/03 Codis. w/N. Levitt re: securities isdues (1.5); review related docs and emails (.5); research securities issues and analyse same	(3.0). (3.0) Various calls re stock and related securities	09/07/03 tati systemate (1) 09/07/03 Various confe. w/R. Schwenkel re: securities 09/07/03 Varies (1.5); research and analysis re: same	<pre>pettlement. 09/06/03 Internal correspondence and calls re: confination issues. confination issues. confination issues.</pre>	09/06/03 heviewed draft statement in support of the plan, the TOPES sattlement and the Wendt	Work Date Description	Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER RESPONSIBLE Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER
1.00 0.40 1.50	7.50	 	. 80	1.00	D. 50	0.30 40 40	10.50	3.00	£.50	0.30 1.50	0.20	Hour#	
565,00 226.00 847,50	4,237.50	2,160.00	2, 632.00	675.00 375.00	197.50	217.50 316.00	7,087.50	1,695,00	2,542.50	592,50 202,50	145.00	Amount	Proforms: 1948515 Status: B
7770048 7778049 7778050	7734438	7776123	7777530	7718905	7771315	7747264	7725542	7770046	7779637	7771308	7747262	Index Number	(90397)

Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:46 alp_132: Matter Detail (babetan/187267)

> Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Nork Date Thru : 09/09/03

Matter: 00005 FLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1948515 Bratus: B

(00397)

1 2 3 1 1 1 1 2 P T BEDNARK, KATIE HUGHES 35 STEINGART, BONNIE K. SCHWENKEL, ROBERT SCHELER, BRAD E. MELJAMI, VIVER Employee Name SCHOULDER, ANDREW PFEIFFER, BRIAN D KHURI, WALID STEINMURTEEL, RICHARD 10 BLACIOUN, KENNISTH R. SATTAR, BABAR PILCHIK, EVAN PORDES, JESSICA FALOR, PAUL H. TIME DETAIL 3 3 Ë 8 8 ö 6 5 35 15 5 5 Position PARTMER ASSOCIATE PARTNER PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTHE PARTMER PARTMER ASSOCIATE PARTHER PARTNER **ASSOCIATE** ASSOCIATE Work Date Description 09/08/03 Confs. w/M. Levitt, K. Blackman, J. Forbes, D. 09/08/03 Committee call addressing closing issues. 09/08/03 Review management plan (.3); telephone calls 09/08/03 Telephone conferences with P. Palon and J. 09/08/03 Review news articles re: Conseco confirmation 09/08/03 Discussion with K. Blackman re: securities 09/08/03 Conference call with committee re: listing 09/08/03 Review issues with respect to bondholder sales. 09/08/01 Conf. call w/Committee re: securities issues 09/08/03 Review securities law issues and issue re stock 09/09/03 Assistance to members of committee in 09/09/03 Conference w/Levitt re: securities issues with 09/08/03 Prepare for and participate in conference call 09/08/03 Research re: securities issues. 09/08/03 Research re: securities issues (.7); 09/08/03 Emails re: COM 09/08/03 Telephone calls with V. Melwani and K&E rs: 09/08/03 Committee conference call re: listing issues 09/08/03 Meetings with V. Welwani re: listing issues 09/09/03 E-mails, calls with J. Forbes, M. Mhuri re: conf. call w/Committee members re: same (.5) $_I$ with Committee re: Plan confirmation. Porbes (.4); review agreements (2.1). issues (.5); review related documents and stock research Collow up issues (3.2). (1.2); calls re: NYSE listing issues (1.0); Golay, R. Steinwurtzel re: securities issues call (1.5). (.5); review related docs in preparation for for Committee. conference call re: NYSE listing issues (.6). Confirmation issues confirmation order issues. with S. Feller re: same (.2) and emergence. question. certificates. connection with implementation and confirmation egreements. common shares. limitations based on convertible preferred and management incentive plan, statement, 1.10 2.30 ... 90 0,80 2,00 2 8 0.50 2.50 0.20 . 20 FOLIS 0,50 0.80 8.00 0.30 3.80 0.50 1.40 3.90 0.30 1.30 1,400.00 1,130.00 2,301.00 1,162.50 1,552.50 3,982.50 2,560.00 1,596.00 452.00 533.00 210.00 586.00 210.00 141.00 742.50 107.50 337.50 256.00 126.00 64.00 Mount Index humber 7725544 7747091 7775947 7770054 7770053 7751993 7720508 7718289 2747093 7777537 7759076 7718921 7718701 9151917 7749370 7766045 7766042 7766041 7766040 7766039

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMM CRADITORS Maller: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

of chapter it plan.

alp_132: Watter Detail (babstan/187367) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:46

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

	221,194.00	433.80	Total			
	•	9.	09/09/03 Research closing related documents.	MISC	5	FERRO, DANIEL
7725731	61.50	5	09/09/03 Review and edit closing talence committee .	PARALECAL	10	WEEKS, LAURENCE F.
7726129	232.50	1.50	44 (44 (44	Management	10	TAYLOR, OPAL
7728574	75.00	0.50	of plan. of plan.		;	
		. 00	09/09/03	ASSOCIATE	35	SATTAR, SABAR
7719400	2,680.00	, .e	open issues of . Commission.	resoct the	ś	
		. !	Calls and correspondence with Deptots is:			
7771331	316.00 237.00	0.60	09/09/03 Review of revised Confirmation order.			
	197.30	0.50	09/09/03 Committee conference call re: Confirmation	ASSOCIATE	ŭ	PREIS, ARIX
7771327	# 60 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00 00	11.40	09/09/03 Reviewing new drafts of preferred stock,	ASSOCIATE	5	PILCHIK, EVNN
7749373	4 674 00	;	confirmation issues.			
7.700000	462.00	1.10	09/09/03 Review Fiam supplement working outstanding			
7766058	462,00	1,10				
7766057	210.00	0.50				
	•	6.90	Meet with V. Melwani re; plan issues; l			
7766053	378.00	,,				
7766051	310.00	, N	ng/ng/ng melephone call with D. Trucano (HLHZ) re: Plan			
7766049	378.00	0.90	plan issues order	•		
Crosse		,	09/09/03 Telephone calls with R. Evasteniet (Aka) +=:	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIFFER, BRIAN D
7766046	126.00	0	J. Forbes re: same.	ASSOCIATE	10	KHURI, WALID
7751997	1,860.00	4.00	related review of doos and research (3.3).		. :	SCHAPENDAY MAGAZIA
Ì	4.00	4.50		PARTHER	10	CONSTRUCT DOUGHT
7725550	3 27 50	1.50	09/09/03 1/C to exists for effective date.			
7770065) N N O	0.40	T/C to total of:			
7770064	282.50	0.50		PARTNER	36	MELWANI, VIVEK
7770058	508.50	0.90				
			some (6.2); conf. w/R. Schwenkel re: same			
			related issues (.5); follow up research rea	MACTORIA	5	TEALLY, HICHORY
	4,000	7,00	ne/he/or that, w/k. Blackman re: securities law and		;	
7734443		1	_	NAME OF STREET	10	COLAY, DAVID
7776126	1,060.00	1.60	ostopios untima calle re: revised securities docs			
Index Number	Amount	Hours	Work Date Description	Position L	Dept R R	UNBILLED T Employee Hame
•			Maghana *** ***	MHIZATION/DI	P RECRG	Matter: 90005 FLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT
(46500)	Proforma: 1948515 Status: B			WE CREDITORS	17EE 83	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMM CREDITORS
(0000)			SOLD DEPO SOLD - TOTAL -	1:02:46	09/03 1	Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:46

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
HATTER: 00005 PLAN OF REGREMATIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babetan/187267) Rum Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:47

Fried, Frank, Harrie, Shriver & Jacobson Nork Date Thru: 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTER COMB CHEDITORS
Natter: 00005 PLAN OF RECOGNIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

(00397)

Proforma: 1948515 Status: B

DRSILLED Employee Hame TINE DETAIL Dept Position Nork Date Description HOUTH **Jacous**t Index Number

Matter Total 433.80 221,194.00

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
MARKET: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp_132: Matter Detail (babatan/167267) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:47

Fried, Frank, Barris, Striver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMM CREDITORS Watter: 00006 CFC

TYORS

Billing Prt : BRAD S. SCHELER
Responsible Prt: BRAD S. SCHELER

Proforma: 1948516 Status: 8

(00397)

	Perieter, Stringart	EIV, ALOS PPEIFFER, STEINGART	PPRIFER, BAIAN D	UNBILLED Employee Name
	PFEIFFER, BRIAN D 35 STEINGART, BORNIE K. 35	IIV, ALOS PPRIFFES, BRIAN D STEINGART, BOUNIE X.	BALAN D	1-3
	. 4 4	3 5 5	Ü	1 M R
	ASSOCIATE PARTMER	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTNER	ABSOCIATE	D B T A I L Position
Total Hetter Total	08/06/03 Review pleading filed in CFC case. 08/20/03 Review CFC 5th Amended plan. 08/21/03 Review amended plan. CFC. 09/06/03 Review Sample-Lackey motion and briefs. 09/08/03 Review CFC confirmation issues and order.	OFC issue 05/06/03 Reviewing proposed CFC settlement. 08/01/03 Review CFC confirmation order and plan. 08/05/03 Notices to CFC creditors concerning consent to release.	04/29/03 Review and comment on CFC Plan and Dischosure 04/30/03 Voice mail with J. Carr (Bakers & Daniel) re-	Work Date Description
8.30 8.30	0.10 0.80 0.80	000 W	0.10	Вошта
4,586.50	540.00 540.00	150.00 316.00 337.50	39.50	Amount
	7681766 7697295 7747088 7747094	7554141 7708002 7681728	7603562 76035 94	Index Mumber

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CERDITORS Matter: 00006 CFC alp_132: Watter Detail (babstam/187257) Run Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:47

Pried, Frank, Harris, Bhriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Proforma: 1948518 Status: B

(00397)

170ex Number 7691896 7708053 7710590 7741070 7741070	Proforma: 1948518 Status: 2 Amount 72.50 79.00 170.00 84.00 137.50 126.00 869.00	1.00 0.50 0.20 0.20 0.30 0.30 0.30 0.30 0.30 0.3	WORK Date Description of the property of the percent of the percen	OPPICIAL COMMITTES M E D E T A I L Dept Position 10 MISC 15 ASSOCIATE 15 ASSOCIATE 15 ASSOCIATE 35 ASSOCIATE 35 ASSOCIATE	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS MARLER: 00008 GENERAL OPFICIAL COMMITTEE NATTERS U N B I L E D I I N E D E T A I L EMPLOYEE MARKE DESCRIPTION WORK DATE EMPLOYEE MARKE DESCRIPTION WORK DATE EMPLOYEE MARKE 10 MISC 08/05/0 PPEIPPER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/03/0 PTEINTRAUB, MICHAEL 8. 10 MISC 09/03/0 PTEINTRAUB, MICHAEL 8. 35 PARTMER 09/03/0 PTEINTRAUB, SONNIE K. 35 PARTMER 09/04/0 PPEIFPER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 09/04/0
	969.00 869.00	2.70 2.70	Total Matter Total		
7691896 7708853 7710590 7766007 774,970 7766034	72.50 79.00 170.00 84.00 337.50	0.20 0.20 0.20 0.30	·		CERUILLO, JOSEPH 10 PPEIPPER, BRIAN D 35 WELNISAUS, MICHAEL S. 10 PPEIPPER, BRIAN D 35 STEINGART, SONNIE K. 35 PPEIPPER, BRIAN D 35
Index Number	Amount	Hours			+ 1
(14,600)	Proforma: 1948518 Status: B		e matters	FICIAL CREDIT	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COME CREDITORS
MARKET: 00008 GENERAL OFFICIAL COMMITTEE MATTERS

9

•

.

.

1

.

alp_132: Matter Detail (babetan/187267) Rum Date 4 Time: 10/09/03 11:02:51

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

	CHO1. CHRISTIMA V. 35 PARALEGEME 00/00/00 Openeda	7,7,7,11,11,1	08/04/03	ANDREW 35 ASSOCIATE 08/04/03		20/10/80	PARALISMAL VOLUME	to the month of the terms	36 DAMAIRAN 08/01/01	08/01/03 Partic		PFEIFFER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 08/01/03 Confere	08/110/80		CONTRACTOR CONTRACTOR	The property of the territory	14 PARTWER 08/01/03		STRINGART BONNIE K. 35 PARTNER 05/19/03 Working		05/15/03 Review		ZIV ALON 35 ASSOCIATE 05/15/03 Review	,	MONTOINNESS, JOHN 35 ABSOCIATE 05/07/03 Review		04/30/03 Telepho						04/30/03 Corresp	with O	04/30/03 Prepare	06/30/03 Revise	documen	04/30/03 Telepho			terebox	PERIFER, BRIAND 35 ASSOCIATE 04/29/03 DESCRIP	co/co/ro memorals of	to the state of the second	Suployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description	-	Matter: 00009 MISCELLANBOUS LITIGATION	The Court of the C
and Andrew Schoulder	Research docket items as per John McGuinness	heard on August 20.	Review and summarize motions achequied to be		Review Charc Corni of Doctoos	Opposite Transferon princes.	CAL SCHOOL BUSINESS OF THE CALL THE CALL	Possesson inches inches se per John McGridhess.	Research docket items per J. McGuirmess.	Participate in bearing.	and A. Sathy (KEB) re: hearing.	-	House sing .	the the second of Mearing.	Comment for Mearing.	Conference call with court.	Participate in Hearing	ripts.	Morking travel to New York: review deposition	Remore: game (1.5).	Reviewing P. Namert objection (1.2); prepare	prepare meno re: same (1.4).	Reviewing pension funds objections (1.3);	[1.0]; emoil Kirkland & Ellis re: same (.3)	-		Telephone calls with A. Month (wayer promut to:	Beview presentings filter by force.	MONTH TORONTO THE CONTRACT OF	THE STATE OF THE S	The state of the s	pariou elegations for hearing	Correspondence with Company and Houliban re:	with Committee/Company re: GM Suilding	Prepare for and participate in conference carr	Revise cover letter re: document production	document production.	Telephone calls with subjects tectpresses to:	RESIDENCE OF CIRCUITATE AND	TO A STATE OF THE PROPERTY OF	telephone call with B. actingate to: power	THE PROPERTY OF LOCATED BOTH AND THE PROPERTY AND THE PROPERTY OF THE PROPERTY	ements and applicable of the company (.2):	Pearwarch docket item as per M. Hoobes.	pelon		Responsible From Error E. SCHELER	
	0.90	3.10		2 1		1.00	0.80	1.30	0.20	0.50	5 7		0.30	0.20	0.20	Ф. 50	1.20		3.20		2.70	,		3		1	į	0.20	20	D. 90	0.60	1.20	0.30	:	-	2 6	<u>د</u>		9	1.20		;	0.#0	0.70		ii ii		
	126.00	434.00		1.100.00	385.00	375.00	112.00	182.00	29.00	10.00	197.50		118.50	64.00	64.00	337.50	570.00	:	N, #60.00		T, CTM. OC	1 710 55		1 012-50	1	416.00	,	79.00	237.00	355.50	237.00	474.00	119.30	4 9		*95. DD	11B.50	1	3,555.00	474.00			158.00	101.50	į	Amount	ocacus: o	** - * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
	7674049	7674046		7666020	7724248	7665969	7666017	7666014	200007	1000000	7707998		7707995	2665983	7665982	100004	リングラング	200		1110611		755177		7554169		7549983		7603588	7603586	7603585	7603582	7603580		7602578		7603577	7603575		7603574	7603566			7603565	7471478		Index Number		

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CHEDITORS
Matter: 05009 MISCRILANBOUS LITIGATION

alp_j32: Matter Detail (babstan/187267) Rum Date & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:52

Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 09/09/03

Proforma: 1948519

(90397)

		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER		Proforma: 1948519	(00397)
Client: 030792 CAMPILIES CARS CREATION Matter: 00009 MISCRIANGOUS LITIGATION	8 LITIGATION	Responsible Prt: BRAD K.		Status: B	
UNBILLED TIME Employee Nume Dept	DETAIL Position	Work Date Description	Боштв	Amount	Index Number
			1	475.00	7710439
	PARTHUR	ne/ne/na beview and summarise motions achemiled to be	2.10	577.50	7679815
SCHOULDER, ANDREW 35	ASSOCTATE	heard on August 20.		, 133 153	3679816
		on/os/os Review docket and update calendar accordingly.	0.70		7074000
	DADA I BOAL		1.70	Nue. 00	7674052
CHOI, CHRISTINA 1. 53			0.60	742.50	7681732
STATE SOUNTS E 35	PARTMER		1.10		
	;		0.10	39.50	7708020
PFEIFFER, BRIAN D 35	ASSOCIATE	08/06/03 Review Conseco meaning Calculat.	1.50	562.50	766B856
PREIS, ARIK 35	VINCTATE	Bankruptcy Court for team members.	:	185 20	7681124
SCHOOL BROKEN 35	ASSOCIATE	08/06/03 Update litigation calendar.	0.90	247.50	7681125
		08/06/03 Review and revise submarine or morrors			
		eminator chart appointingly.			3508400
į	PER INCOME	08/06/03 Review deemed arguments motion and summary.	2.20	10.00	7674057
NOT PRINTER V. 35	PARALEGAL		3 E	23 A C C C	7674060
			0.90	130.50	7686695
	PARALEGAL	Respecting Confidence and analyses UST issues.	2.80	1,330.00	7712182
•	PARTMER.		0.40	, ya. 00	7671655
CHOI, CHRISTIAN I	ASSOCIATE		, c	168-00	7679788
PARTS TRESTINA Y. 35	PARALEGAL		5 F	380.00	7710461
!	PARTHER) . () ()	1,215.00	7681742
NIB X.	PARTNER	08/12/03 Attend court contenence by putter (-3), reserve	:		
	100001	ng/19/Al Participate in bearing.	0.50	147.50	770001
PRIFFER, BRIAN D 30	1000C1010		0.30	118.50	7701222
			0.20	23.00	
		re: bearing.	1.00	375.D0	7673993
PREIS, ARIK 35	ASSOCIATE	tollow up correspondence to team and committee			
		re: some (.4).	8	247.50	7682372
SCHOULDER, ANDREW 35	ASSOCIATE	08/12/03 Review docket; review and review August Av	;		
			2,10	294.00	7679797
CHOI, CHRISTINA Y. 35	PARALEGAL		1.90	902.50	7712186
MELMANI, VIVEK 35	PARTHER	08/13/03 mtg. to prop the sources. 08/13/03 m/c re UST objection and potential resolution.	2,10	997.50	1712107
Periffer, Brian D 35	ASSOCIATE	06/13/03 Participate in bearing	Q. 50	197.50	7708079
			,	30 00	7708086
		08/13/03 Conference call with V. Welwani and co-counsel	0.20	79.66	
		re: nearthy			

alp_132: Watter Detail (babstan/187267) Run Dete & Time: 10/09/03 11:02:52

Fried, Frank, Marris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 09/09/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CHEDITORS Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1948519 Status: B dex Number (00397)

Client: 00009 MISCELLANBOUS LITIGATION	SOCIAL CO	ROLLYBLLITE	Responsible Fit: BRAD E. SCHELER		Status: B	
UNBILLED TI	I. K. B.	DETAIL Position	Work Date Description	Hours	Amount	Index Number
PREIS, ARIK	ξ.	ASSOCIATE	08/13/03 Attendance at Court bearing by telephone (2.2);	3.00	1,125.00	7679707
SCHOOLDER, ANDREW	35	ASSOCIATE	correspondence to team re: same (.8). 08/13/01 Monitor bearing telephonically and draft, review and revies summary of hearing for	2.60	715.00	7704767
	, ,	TAPATARAG	os/13/03 Research docket items as per A Schoulder.	0.60	84.00	7679808 7710467
CHOI, CHRISTINA Y.	ָּטְילָ עַרָּ	PARTNER		2.00	316.00	7708096
MELITATE DETAIL D	5	ASSOCIATE		9 C	300.00	7679712
TRATAL PRIN	S :	ASSOCIATE			137.50	7704771
SCHOULDER, ANDREW	3	ASSOCIATE		1,60	224.00	7679809
CHOI, CHRISTINA Y.	36	TYDETYBAG	09/14/03 Repearch coolinger: Livings as per A: President	0.30	118.50	7708107
PPSIFFER, BRIAN D	(1) (7)	NSSOCIAL B	08/15/03 Participate in hearing	0.50 20	197.50 300.00	7679717
PREIS, ARIK	Ϋ́	ASSOCIATE	related follow up correspondence with Fried			
	í		os/17/03 Review motions for Omnibus bearing (1.1);	1,50	1,012.50	7681752
Sibilitati, Decimal in	, ,	ARSOCIATE	review TOPTS notice issues (-4) . 08/18/03 Review of agenda for August 20 hearing and	0.50	187.50	7679728
SCHOULDER, ANDREW	i.	ASSOCIATE	discussions with A. Schoulder re: same. 08/18/03 Review Specialty Planners sais motion and draft, review and revise email summarizing	1.10	302.50	7704774
			<pre>same. 08/18/03 Review chart re: summaries of motions scheduled for August 20 (.3); draft email re:</pre>	0.40	110.00	7704775
CHOI, CHRISTINA Y.	35	PARALBGAL	same (.1). 08/18/03 Organization of files, obtaining docket items	1.10	154.00	7704713
STRINGART, BORNIE K.		PARTNER		2.80	1,890.00	7681758
CONTINUE ANDREW	Çî Çî	ASSOCIATE	on $8/20$. On $8/20$. On $8/20$.	0.20	55.00	7704777
	;			0.80	220.00	7704779
				1.00	275.00	7704781
CHOT CHRISTINA Y.		PARALECAL	08/19/03 Organization of mail correspondences and	1.20	168.00	7704720
ETEINGARI, DOMNIE K.	5	PARTNER	research docket items as per and received to the continue hearing.	2.30	1,552.50	7681765 7681767
			08/20/03 Review issues regarding arranged the second specialty planners.			

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00009 MISCELLANBOUS LITTERATION