### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS EASTERN DIVISION

In re:		)	Chapter 11
CONSECO, IN	C. <u>et</u> <u>al</u> .,¹	) ) )	Case No. 02-B 49672 (Jointly Administered) Honorable Carol A. Doyle
	Debtors.	) ) )	Objection Deadline: July 7, 2003

VERIFIED APPLICATION OF FRIED, FRANK, HARRIS, SHRIVER & JACOBSON, AS CO-COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF UNSECURED CREDITORS OF THE HOLDING COMPANY DEBTORS, FOR INTERIM COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED DURING THE PERIOD FROM MARCH 1, 2003

THROUGH MARCH 31, 2003

Pursuant to sections 328, 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (as amended, the "Bankruptcy Code"), Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2016 (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), rule 607 of the Bankruptcy Rules for the United States District Court and the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Northern District of Illinois (the "Local Bankruptcy Rules"), the Retention Order (as defined below) and that certain Administrative Order Under Sections 105(a) and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and Reimbursement of

The Debtors are the following entities: (i) Conseco, Inc., CIHC, Incorporated, CTIHC, Inc., Partners Health Group, Inc. (collectively, the "Holding Company Debtors"), (ii) Conseco Finance Corp., Conseco Finance Servicing Corp. (collectively, the "CFC Initial Debtors"), (iii) Conseco Finance Corp. - Alabama, Conseco Finance Credit Corp., Conseco Finance Consumer Discount Company, Conseco Finance Canada Holding Company, Conseco Finance Canada Company, Conseco Finance Loan Company, Rice Park Properties Corporation, Landmark Manufactured Housing, Inc., Conseco Finance Net Interest Margin Finance Corp. I, Conseco Finance Net Interest Margin Finance Corp. II, Green Tree Finance Corp. – Two, Conseco Agency of Nevada, Inc., Conseco Agency of New York, Inc., Green Tree Floorplan Funding Corp., Conseco Agency, Inc., Conseco Agency of Alabama, Inc., Conseco Agency of Kentucky, Inc., and Crum-Reed General Agency, Inc. (collectively, the "CFC Subsidiary Debtors", and with the CFC Initial Debtors, the "CFC Debtors").

Expenses for Professionals and Committee Members (the "Interim Compensation Order"), the law firm of Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson ("FFHS&J"), counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Holding Company Debtors (the "Committee") in the above-captioned chapter 11 cases (the "Chapter 11 Cases"), hereby applies (the "Application") for (i) interim compensation for professional services rendered on behalf of the Committee in the amount of \$881,446.50, which represents 90% of the \$979,385.00 in services billed (the "Fees"), and (ii) reimbursement in the amount of \$139,366.11 for the actual and necessary expenses that FFHS&J incurred (the "Expenses"), in each case for the period from March 1, 2003 through March 31, 2003 (the "Third Monthly Fee Period"). The detailed billing records for the Fees and Expenses sought in this Application are attached as Exhibits A and B, respectively. In support of this Application, FFHS&J respectfully states as follows:

### **Background**

- 1. On December 17, 2002 (the "Petition Date"), each of the Holding Company Debtors filed its respective voluntary petition for relief under the Bankruptcy Code.<sup>2</sup> The Holding Company Debtors are operating their businesses and managing their property as debtors in possession pursuant to sections 1107(a) and 1108 of the Bankruptcy Code throughout the Chapter 11 Cases.
- 2. On January 3, 2003, the United States Trustee appointed the members of the Committee at the Committee formation meeting (the "Committee Formation Meeting"). On that date, the Committee proceeded to retain, subject to Bankruptcy Court approval, FFHS&J and Mayer, Brown, Rowe & Maw ("Mayer Brown") as its co-counsel, and Houlihan Lokey Howard & Zukin and Greenhill & Co., LLC as its financial advisors.

On the Petition Date, the Debtors' Chapter 11 Cases were consolidated for administrative purposes only.

3. By this Court's order dated February 12, 2003, the Committee was authorized to retain FFHS&J as their counsel, effective as of January 3, 2003, with regard to the representation of the Committee during the Chapter 11 Cases and all related matters (the "Retention Order"). The Retention Order authorizes the Debtors to compensate FFHS&J at FFHS&J's hourly rates charged for services of this type and to be reimbursed for actual and necessary out-of-pocket expenses incurred, subject to application to this Court in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, all applicable local rules, and orders of this Court.

### Previous Applications for Compensation and Expenses in these Chapter 11 Cases

- 4. On April 2, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of January in the amount of \$933,332.49.
- On May 12, 2003, FFHS&J submitted an application to this Court for interim compensation and expenses incurred in the month of February in the amount of \$762,861.53.

### <u>Fees</u>

6. Subject to this Court's approval, FFHS&J will charge the Committee for its legal services on an hourly basis in accordance with its ordinary and customary rates for Bankruptcy Court authorized engagements in effect on the date the services are rendered, and submits that such rates are reasonable. In the normal course of business, FFHS&J revises its hourly rates from time to time. FFHS&J's hourly rates for professional services rendered by bankruptcy and restructuring partners, "of counsel," and "special counsel" in non-Bankruptcy Court authorized and approved engagements are higher than the hourly rates charged by such

professionals in connection with section 1103 engagements. The hourly rates for partners, "of counsel," and "special counsel" who are not bankruptcy and restructuring professionals are not so adjusted. FFHS&J's bankruptcy and restructuring associates and legal assistants have one hourly rate for all engagements. Because FFHS&J's fees: (a) are based on hourly rates and will correspond to the degree of effort expended on the Committee's behalf, and (b) are FFHS&J's usual and customary rates for services of this nature, FFHS&J believes that these rates are reasonable.

7. The FFHS&J attorneys who rendered professional services in these Chapter 11 Cases, their respective hourly billing rates, total hours billed, and total fees during the Third Monthly Fee Period are:

Name of Professional Person	Position with the Applicant and Year	Department	Hourly Billing Rate <sup>3</sup>	Total Billed Hours	Total Fees
Brad Eric Scheler	Partner since 1984; Law School Class of 1977	Bankruptcy	\$700	77.50	\$54,250.00
Alan Resnick	Of Counsel since 1989; Law School Class of 1972	Bankruptcy	\$725	23.60	\$17,110.00 
Bonnie K. Steingart	Partner since 1986; Law School Class of 1979	Bankruptcy/ Litigation	\$675	201.20	\$135,810.00
David Golay	Partner since 1986; Law School Class of 1977	Corporate	\$675	76.70	\$51,097.50
Donald Carleen	Partner since 1987; Law School Class of 1983	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$675	25.30	\$17,077.50
Jack L. Jacobson	Partner since 1989; Law School Class of 1982	Tax	\$675	28.70	\$19,348.50
Kevin Keyes	Partner since 1998; Law School Class of 1983	Tax "	\$675	3.00	\$2,025.00
Paul Falon	Partner since 1997; Law School Class of 1983	Corporate	\$625	136.00	\$85,000.00
Jonathan F. Lewis	Partner since 2002; Law School Class of 1994	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$565	37.50	\$21,187.50
Vivek Melwani	Associate; Law School Class of 1995	Bankruptcy	\$475	130.30	\$61,892.50
Walid Khuri	Associate; Law School Class of 1996	Corporate	\$450	7.50	\$3,375.00

In the normal course of business, FFHS&I revises its hourly rates from time to time.

Name of Professional Person	Position with the Applicant and Year	Department	Hourly Billing Rate <sup>3</sup>	Total Billed Hours	Total Fces
Andrew Silberstein	Associate; Law School Class of 1997	Corporate	\$435	6.00	\$2,610.00
Brian D. Pfeiffer	Associate; Law School Class of 1999	Bankruptcy	\$395	158.00	\$63,646.00
John R. Ingrassia	Associate; Law School Class of 1995	Antitrust	\$385	11.10	\$4,273.50
Evan Pilchik	Associate; Law School Class of 1999	Corporate	\$385	53.30	\$20,520.50
Eli Weiss	Associate; Law School Class of 1999	Tax	\$385 	83.20	\$32,032.00
Arik Preis	Associate; Law School Class of 2000	Bankruptcy	\$375 	192.90	\$72,337.50
Jennifer Rodburg	Associate, Law School Class of 2000	Bankruptcy	\$375 	0.50	\$187.50
Alon Ziv	Associate; Law School Class of 2000 (LL.M.)	Bankruptcy	\$375	126.00	\$47,480.50
Sean Foller	Associate; Law School Class of 2000	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$365	56.70	\$20,695.50
Harel Locker	Associate; Law School Class of 2001 (LL.M.)	Tax	\$365	5.70	\$2,080.50
Chaim Stern	Associate; Law School Class of 2000	Tax	\$365	7.80	\$2,847.00
John P. McGuinness	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Bankruptcy	\$320	91.50	\$29,280.00
Adam Scoll	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$320	40.90	\$13,088.00
Stephanie Mai	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Bankruptcy	\$320	82.60	\$26,432.00
Ilan Scharf	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Bankruptcy	\$320	79.50	\$25,440.00
Deborah Vaughn	Associate; Law School Class of 2001	Bankruptcy	\$320	80.90	\$25,888.00
Katic Hughes	Associate; Law School Class of 2002	Bankruptcy	\$275	123.70	\$34,017.50
Andrew Schoulder	Associate; Law School Class of 2002	Bankruptcy	\$275	97.60	\$26,840.00

<sup>8.</sup> The para-professionals of FFHS&J who rendered services in these Chapter

<sup>11</sup> Cases, their respective hourly billing rates, total hours billed, and total fees during the Third Monthly Fee Period are:

Name of Para- Professional Person	Position with the Applicant and Years of Experience	Department	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Fees
Bill Bernthal	Paralegal, 7 years experience with FFHS&J, 7 years other experience	Executive Compensation & Employee Benefits	\$205	2.90	\$594.50
Daniel Ferro	Research Specialist and Acting Manager, 8 years experience at FFHS&J, 5 years other experience	Corporate Resources	\$205	2.10	\$430.50
Angela Rose	Technical Librarian, 7½ years with FFHS&J, 9 years other experience	Library	\$195	3.70	\$721.50
Craig Osbern	Paralegal; 7½ years experience with FFIIS&J, 17 years other experience	Corporate	\$195	22.80	\$4,446.00
Daniel Levine	Paralegal Coordinator, 7½ years experience with FFHS&J, 11 years other experience	Corporate	\$195	20.70	\$4,036.50
Scott Leyse	Paralegal, 5½ years experience with FFHS&J, 12 years other experience	Corporate	\$185	8.50	\$1,572.50
Harriet Bossong	Paralegal, 4½ years experience with FFHS&J, 18 years	Corporate	\$185	10.80	\$1,998.00
Tom Moody	other experience Paralogal, 3 years experience with FFHS&J, 13 years other experience	Corporate	\$180	8.00	\$1,440.00
Michael S. Weintraub	Research Analyst, 7 years experience with FFHS&I, 6 years other experience	Corporate Resources	\$170	5.70	\$969.00
Francis Hegarty	Paralegal, 14 years experience with FFHS&J, 2½ years other experience	Corporate	\$170	9.80	\$1,666.00
Bonita McDuffie	Administrative Coordinator, 13½ years experience with FFHS&I, 16 years other experience	Corporate	\$165	9.50	\$1,567.50
Jeffrey Eigen	Paralegal, 4 years experience with FFHS&J, 20 years other experience	Corporate	\$155	7.00	\$1,085.0

**Total Fees** Total Hourly Department Position with the Name of Para-Billed Billing **Applicant and Years Professional Person** Hours Rate of Experience \$4,185.00 27.00 \$155 Corporate Paralegal, 3 years Lucretia E. Denson experience with FFHS&J, 5 years other experience \$930.00 6.00 \$155 Corporate Paralegal, 2 years Susan Devine experience with FFHS&J, 6 years other experience \$675.00 4.50 \$150 Corporate Resources Research Analyst, 3 Brett Kaplan years experience with FFHS&J, 6 years other experience \$12,223.50 \$145 84.30 Bankruptcy Paralegal, 4 months Jin Kim experience with FFHS&J \$8,056.00 57.60 \$140 Bankruptcy Paralegal, 1 1/2 years Thomas S. Lee experience with FFHS&J \$19,369.00 138.40 \$140 Paralegal, 11 months Bankruptcy Christina Choi experience with FFHS&J

- 9. In accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, FFHS&J believes that the amount of Fees and Expenses requested in this Application are fair and reasonable given the time expended, the complexity and size of the Chapter 11 Cases, the issues encountered and resolved, and the results obtained.
- Matter (as defined below), describes each activity or service that each individual performed, and states the number of hours (in increments of one-tenth of an hour) spent by each individual providing the services. Each numbered tab in Exhibit A corresponds to the matter number that FFHS&J assigned to the Subject Matter. If a Subject Matter does not appear, FFHS&J did not bill time or expenses for that Subject Matter during the Third Monthly Fce Period.

### Subject Matters

- 11. The professional services that FFHS&J rendered during the Third Monthly Fee Period are grouped into the numbered and titled categories of the subject matters (the "Subject Matters") described in Paragraphs 12 through 20.
  - 12. Matter 3: Employment Matters (Fees: \$116,785.50; Hours: 249.90)

This Subject Matter describes time spent in the negotiation, preparation, and review of all key executive employment agreements. In addition, this Subject Matter describes time spent in the discussions, analysis, and review of all matters relating to the Senior Key Employee Retention Program, including any and all pleadings related thereto. Finally, this Subject Matter describes time spent in the negotiation and preparation of any separation agreements, and any related pleadings.

13. Matter 4: Tax Planning (Fees: \$53,080.50; Hours: 115.50)

This Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, discussing, and researching the tax issues related to the Debtors' restructuring and tax planning, and the implications thereof. In addition, this Subject Matter describes time spent reviewing and revising the tax aspects of the Debtors' plan of reorganization (the "Plan") and related disclosure statement (the "Disclosure Statement"). In addition, this Subject Matter includes the review of any and all pleadings filed in the Chapter 11 Cases that concern tax-related issues.

14. <u>Matter 5: Plan and Disclosure Statement (Fees: \$252,266.00; Hours: 519.90)</u>

During the month of March, the Debtors filed their amended Plan and Disclosure Statement. In addition, during March, the Bankruptcy Court approved the adequacy of the Disclosure Statement. As such, this Subject Matter describes time spent reviewing, analyzing, discussing, negotiating, and documenting the Plan and Disclosure Statement. This Subject

Matter also includes time spent negotiating the various Plan related documents that were filed as part of the Plan Supplement. In preparation for and participation at the Disclosure Statement hearing, time was spent reviewing, analyzing, and negotiating objections to the Disclosure Statement, which time is also included in this Subject Matter. Finally, this subject matter also includes time addressing various Plan - related issues as well as time spent researching priority, classification, and other issues.

### 15. Matter 6: CFC (Fees: \$41,313.00; Hours: 89.00)

This Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing pleadings regarding CFC and reviewing, analyzing, and discussing issues related thereto. This Subject Matter also describes time spent analyzing various intercompany issues between CFC and Conseco. Additionally, during the month of March, the sale of substantially all of the assets of the CFC Debtors was approved by the Bankruptcy Court. As such, this Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing issues related to the CFC sale, including, *inter alia*, analyzing the Asset Purchase Agreement and related agreements, reviewing bids for the purchase of the CFC assets, and attending and monitoring the CFC sale hearing. Finally, this Subject Matter includes time spent analyzing various issues relating to CFC's debtor in possession financing and various amendments and modifications thereto.

### 16. <u>Matter 8: General Official Committee Matters (Fees: \$44,481.50; Hours: 85.50)</u>

This Subject Matter includes time spent preparing for and attending general meetings with Committee members, financial advisors, counsel to various parties, and other relevant parties regarding the Chapter 11 Cases. In addition, this Subject Matter describes time spent researching, preparing, revising, and discussing general issues related to the Chapter 11 Cases that do not fall into the more specific categories set forth in this Application. This Subject

Matter also describes time spent by various FFIIS&J lawyers in their communication with the Committee and its individual members in responding to their questions and providing them with updates with regard to these Chapter 11 Cases.

### 17. Matter 9: Litigation Matters (Fees: \$297,305.50; Hours: 1,027,50)

This Subject Matter includes time spent preparing for and attending or participating in various Bankruptcy Court hearings related to the Debtors' restructuring. This Subject Matter also includes time spent reviewing, analyzing, discussing, and responding to various pleadings and other Bankruptcy Court filings related to the Debtors' restructuring. In addition, this Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing as well as preparing pleadings regarding the Debtors' proceedings concerning the GM Building. Finally, this Subject Matter includes time spent reviewing and responding to various motions and objections filed by certain parties in the Chapter 11 Cases, including the review of numerous documents produced by the Debtors and their advisors in response to document requests of the Official Committee of Trust Originated Preferred Securities.

### 18. <u>Matter 10: Communications with Non-Committee Creditors</u> (Fecs: \$564.00; Hours: 1.60)

This Subject Matter includes time spent discussing the Debtors' restructuring status with and responding to inquiries regarding the Debtors' restructuring from various creditors who are not members of the Committee.

### 19. Matter 11: Regulatory Matters (Fees: \$150,030.00; Hours: 307,00)

This Subject Matter includes time spent participating in weekly conference calls with respect to insurance subsidiary and regulatory issues with the Company and communication with the Committee regarding the same, as well as various regulatory agencies. In addition, this

Subject Matter includes time spent researching, analyzing, and addressing various regulatory issues that arose from time to time, including communications with the regulatory agencies.

20. Matter 12: Fee Application (Fces: \$23,559.00; Hours: 78.60)

This Subject Matter includes time spent preparing, revising, reviewing, and discussing Fee Applications submitted to this Court for FFHS&J's fees and expenses associated with these Chapter 11 Cases.

### Actual and Necessary Expenses

- 21. FFHS&J customarily charges its clients for all ancillary services incurred, including photocopying charges, long distance telephone calls, facsimile transmissions, messengers, courier mail, computer and data bank time, word processing, secretarial overtime and temporary employees, overtime meals, overtime and late night transportation, travel, lodging, meal charges for business meetings, postage, printing, transcripts, filing fees, document retrieval, and similar items. Subject to this Court's approval, FFHS&J requests reimbursement of all such charges incurred on behalf of the Committee.
- Chapter 11 Cases required FFHS&J attorneys and other employees to devote substantial amounts of time during evenings and weekends to providing professional services on the Committee's behalf. In virtually every instance, these extraordinary services were essential to meet deadlines imposed by the Court, the Bankruptcy Code, and at times, the necessities of the Debtors' businesses, the administration of the estates, or critical litigation. As a consequence, FFHS&J was required to incur overtime secretarial charges to discharge its professional responsibilities. FFHS&J attempts to reduce overtime secretarial charges and to limit them to necessary instances by encouraging its attorneys to use a secretarial "mini-center." If a secretary is not needed at the

attorney's desk for the entire evening, the attorney is required to bring his or her work to a cluster of secretaries. The client is only charged for the word processing charges associated with the document, rather than charging the client for an evening of secretarial overtime, whether or not such secretary was used for the entire time. Similarly, overtime charges of administrative employees, such as research and document specialists, were incurred when necessary to discharge FFHS&J's professional responsibilities and provide the most cost-effective legal services to the Committee.

- 23. FFHS&J's attorneys and other employees who work late into the evenings are reimbursed for their reasonable meal costs and their costs for transportation home. Such transportation costs are necessary expenses because it is FFHS&J's policy to ensure safe transportation for its attorneys during the hours that public transportation cannot be deemed safe. It is FFHS&J's regular practice to charge its clients for these and other out-of-pocket expenses incurred during the rendition of professional services on the client's behalf.
- page for outgoing telecopier transmissions (plus related toll charges). FFHS&J does not charge its clients for incoming telecopier transmissions. FFHS&J has negotiated a discounted rate for Westlaw computer assisted legal research, which is approximately \$125/hour of online use of the standard Westlaw databases. Computer assisted legal research is used whenever the researcher determines that using Westlaw is more cost effective than using traditional (non-computer assisted legal research) techniques. In addition, because certain key parties to these Chapter 11 Cases are located outside of New York, FFHS&J incurred long distance telephone charges, and when necessary, overnight delivery charges. FFHS&J made every effort to minimize such disbursements by using electronic mail and facsimile when possible. The expenses incurred in

the rendition of professional services were necessary, reasonable, and justified under the circumstances and enabled FFHS&J to serve the needs of the Committee to the benefit of all creditors.

25. Exhibit B is a detailed itemization and description of the disbursements made by FFHS&J on the Committee's behalf during the Third Monthly Fec Period. All of these disbursements comprise the requested sum for FFHS&J's Expenses, totaling \$139,366.11. The following is a list of FFHS&J's Expenses, grouped by type of Expense:

Service Description	Total Expenses
Photocopying (@ \$0.12/page)	\$67,641.60
Telecommunications: Telephone Telecopier (@ \$1.25/page)	\$26,035.32 \$838.25
Outside Messenger Services  Computerized Research	\$693.35 \$11,614.90
Word Processing, Secretarial and Other Staff Services Transportation for Late Night and Other Exigencies	\$8,235.94 \$10,290.98
Working Meals Secretarial Overtime	\$2,909.56 \$2,132.50
Administrative Overtime Filing Fees	\$4,477.50 \$-72.00
Out of Town Expenses:  Transportation (including Airfare) <sup>4</sup> Meals, Lodging <sup>5</sup>	\$3,718.22 \$817.57
Other	\$32.42

26. Although every effort has been made to include all Fccs and Expenses incurred in the Third Monthly Fee Period in this Application, some Fees and Expenses might not be included in this Application due to delays caused by accounting processing procedures.

Pursuant to the directive of the U.S. Trustee announced at the Committee Formation Meeting, charges for air travel are charged at the highest coach class rate on the day of travel. In addition, non-working travel time is charged at one half the time actually spent traveling. These adjustments have led to FFHS&J reducing this Application by \$684.64.

Pursuant to the directive of the U.S. Trustee announced at the Committee Formation Meeting, charges for hotel accommodations have been capped at \$250 per night. These adjustments have led to FFHS&J reducing this Application by \$36.67.

FFHS&J reserves the right to make further application to this Court for allowance of such Fees and Expenses not included herein. In addition, certain Fees and Expenses incurred during the previous fee periods that were not included in the previous fee applications have been included in this Application.<sup>6</sup> Subsequent fee applications will be filed in accordance with the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, Local Bankruptcy Rules, and the Interim Compensation Order.

WHEREFORE, FFHS&J requests that it be allowed and paid interim compensation for its Fees and Expenses in the total amount of \$1,020,812.60 consisting of (a) \$881,446.50, which is 90% of the Fees for reasonable and necessary professional services rendered by FFHS&J in the amount of \$979,385.00, and (b) \$139,366.11 for actual and necessary Expenses incurred on behalf of the Committee. FFHS&J further requests that the total amount of \$1,020,812.60 be paid as an administrative expense of the estates.

Dated: June 13, 2003 New York, NY Respectfully submitted,

FRIED, FRANK, HARRIS, SHRIVER & JACOBSON

Bonnie Steingart (BS-1252)

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson (A Partnership

Including Professional Corporations)

One New York Plaza

New York, NY 10004

(212) 859-8000 (telephone)

(212) 859-4000 (facsimile)

Co-Counsel for the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of the Holding Company Debtors

Due to late-filed and incorrect time entries, the Third Monthly Fee Period includes the application for \$927.45 in fees for services which were performed during January and February.

### EXHIBIT A

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791)
Rum Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:23

# Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

	PREIS, ARIK	FELLER, SEAN	STEINGART, BONNIE K.	LEWIS, JONATHAN F.	CARLEGN, DONALD	SCHOULDER, ANDREW		PREIS, ARIX	MELMANI, VIVER		FI.AN	SCHRLER, BRAD E.	LEWIS, JONATHAN F.	PALON, PAUL H.	MELMANI, VIVEK CARLEEN, DONALD	UNSILLED TI Employee Name	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS
	25	26	30	26	25 6	ίn Ω		ين اکا	35		ש	ដ	96	10 -	26 1	ME D	EE CONS
	ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE	PARTNER	Parther	Partner	ASSOCIATE		ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE	TREMOO	PARTNER	PARTNER	PARTNER	ASSOCIATE PARTNER	DETAIL Position	CREDITORS
	D. Carlean(1.3). 03/04/03 Reviewing and commenting on separation agreement(1.1). calls with D. Carleen and J.		03/04/03 Review employment issues and related documents.	A, Preis re; seperation agreement(.5). A, Preis re; seperation agreement(.5).  memo(1.7); discs. w/ D. Carleen, S. Peller, B.  Scheler re; same(.5); review of separation	Oj/09/03 Disc. with V. Done on the revise summary of agreements (1.0); review separation compensation proposals (1.0); review separation agreement (5); TC with T. Rowe (.5); Disc. with		agreements.  03/03/03 Review of meparation agreement(.6); calls re: same(.4); discuss same with J. Lewis(.3).	comment on same(.5). 03/03/03 Meet with B. Scheler, D. Carleen, J. Lewis, S. Peller and V. Melwani re: employment	prepare memo re: employment agreement proposal(2.6). 03/03/03 Review DEO transfer issues and agt. 03/03/03 Review employment agreements & term sheet(.5);		comp. 03/03/03 Reviewed and revised Separation Agreement.	agreement(.4). 03/03/03 Various calls in connection with management	review Committee e-mail correspondence(.j/. 03/03/03 Review and drafting re: compensation proposals(1.0); review of separation	03/03/03 Review latest revisions to separation agreement(.3); e-mail comments to A. Preis(.2);	<pre>03/01/03 Review emails re DEO loan transfer program. 03/03/03 Review separation agreement(0.6); meeting w/B. Scheler, J. Lewis, V. Melwani and A. Pries(.9).</pre>	Mork Date Description	Billing Prt : BRAD B. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD B. SCHELER
0.40	1.40	÷	1 1 1 0 0 C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C	2.60		1.50 3.50	1.30	0.80	0.70 1.00	₽. 90	0.20	3.00	1.80	0.80	1,50	Hours	
150.00	525.00	b	877.50 877.50	1,469.00		412.50 2,362.50	487,50	300.00	332,50 475,00	T, 314-00	145.00	2,100.00	1,017.00	500.00	1,012.50	Amount	Proforma: 1839420 Statue: B
7424318	7424312		7379006 7399931	7388789		7381564	7424310	7424309	7418852 7418854	0	7376799	7423085	7388784	7405668	7381563	Index Number	(00397)

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Watter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS

# Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

RAID E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839420

		1	03/06/03 Conference call with Committee re: empioyment Agreements	ASSOCIATE	ω o	PPEIPPER, BRIAN D
7420854	395.00	1.00	Review employment agreement.			
7504138	285.00	0.60	03/06/03 Review and comment on separation agreement.	ASSOCIATE	υ V	MRIMANI, VIVEK
7418868	522.50	1 10		į	,	
	F-8-13-30	3.50	03/06/03 Discuss with J. Lewis equity incentive	ASSOCIATE	2	
7199917	U	· !		COOMPET	3.5	RESNICK, ALAN
7382819	296.00	0.40	or/or/or perhaps and revised draft of motion regarding		¦	
			executive benefit of an adocuments (1.7).			
			05/06/03 Testephone cate with a review long term	PARTNER	30	STEINGART, BONNIE R.
7379012	1,687.50	2.50	comp. legues(1.9).			
			s and Johnson re: amproyment and			
			Usfusfus review of sections of the confer with Shear	PARTMER	35	SCHELER, BRAD 8.
1460000	2,100.00	3.00				
1407051	1,186,50	2.10	andred to begin and sheet term sheet.			
1	1					
				PARTNER	٨.	LEWIS, JOHATHAN S.
730000+	2,938.00	5.20	$p_{1000}$ and $p_{1000}$ and $p_{1000}$ $p_{100}$ $p_{$	2000000	1	
7189901	)		plan and memo(9).			
			Lewis re: Shea term sheet(.3); review equity			
					ķ	CARLEBN, COMBLO
	6 1 1	3.90	03/06/03 Review Shea term sheet $(1.0)$ ; Committee conf.	DER TWEE	h	Carried County
7381577	2 425.00	,	agreement[.2].			
			review of and motion to approve separation			
		•	03/05/03 Review of Conseco employment agreements			
7379726	128.00	4	03/05/03 Review and markup of proposed touseco with	ASSOCIATE	<u>ي</u> 8	
7379725	96.00	0.10	03/05/03 Review of separation agreement and motion.	ASSOCIATE	'n	
7424322	750.00	2.00	Review draft equity incentive	ASSOCIATE	726	FELLER, SEAM
7399935	328.50	0.90				
			Co/Co/Co SCHOOL POTESHEDT [.5]: t/c s/Brin Preis we:	COORDER	Ü	RESNICK, ALAN
0.4001.07	507.50	0.70		STATE		STRINGART, BUNNIE R.
10 M P 1 M	1 4 6 6	0.80	03/05/03 Review deparation motion.			
7779010		! !			į	
	#	T. 40	03/05/03 Reviewed equity incentive plan and separation	PARTNER	n o	Tento Tomardan P
7388798	1 071 50	3	Plan(1.0).			
			<pre>fewis re: fTIP(.3); review Equity incentive</pre>			
		1	03/05/03 TC with B. Scheler resultifical; it with o	PARTNER	20	CARLEEN, DONALD
7381572	1,012.50	1.50	Conseco LT			
			03/04/03 Adminiscracive ellores relaced to access	PARALEGAL	Ŋ	BERNTHAL, BILL
7399336	123.00	0.60		ASSOCIATE	26	SCOLL, ADAM
7379723	1,792.00	5,60				
			Work Date memorificion	Position	рерс	Employee Name
Index Number	Asount	Hours		DETAIL	H 33 €1	UNBILLED T:
			Responsible Pro: BRAD A. Schaum.	ATTERS	MENT N	Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS
	Status: B		BRAD E.	ONS CREDITORS	TIEE O	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
(70 £00)				(A. 00 . 60	CARET	Sun Date & Time: Ob/13/03
			MCH2 EDIC MERT	3 7 3 . 3 . 3 . 1		1

alp\_132: Marter Detail (babstan/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/D3 12:53:28

## Fried, Frank, Karris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

7388826	1,243.00	2 2 0	re: term sheets(.3). 03/11/03 Reviewed term sheets(1.0); tel. conf. w/ committee re: same(1.2).	PARTNER	26	LEWIS, JONATHAN F.
809.RFX	2,160.00	3.20	<pre>03/11/03 Comm. call re: management compensation(1.2); review term sheets(1.7); Disc. with S. Feller</pre>	PARTHER	8	CARLEEN, DONALD
7424596	225.00	0.60	03/10/03 Correspondence with Committee re: employment	ASSOCIATE	끍	PREIS, ARIK
7387056	82.54	0.30	03/10/03 Preparation for management compensation tel.	ASSOCIATE	<u>5</u>	HUCHES, KATIE
7399941	182.50	0.50	adjustment agreement(, u). 03/10/03 Call with Houlihan, D. Carleen and J. Lewis re:	Associate	26	feller, seam
7381734	1,215.00	1.80	management agmt81.3/ 03/10/03 Review D&O loan reduction plan(.5); telephone call with Tom Kiriakos re: same(.6); revise	PARTNER	. 30	STEINGART, BONNIB K.
7388816	960.50	1.70	review compensation materials. 5); 03/10/03 Houlihan tel. conf. re: compensation(.5); discs. w/ Geer and Carleen re: incentive plan,	Partner	9	LEWIS, JONATHAN F.
4001004	1,012,50	1.50	03/10/03 plac. with J. Lewis re: compensation(05); TC with B. Geer and J. Lewis re: compensation(05);	PARTNER	<b>ស</b> ต	CARLEEN, DONALD
7379729	1,984.00	6,20	agreement 03/07/03 Markup of LTIP(3.5; mark-up ofemployment agreement term sheets(2.7)	ASSOCIATE	P	SCOLL, ADAK
7420875	79.00	0. 20 20	03/07/03 Review Mgt. Agts and incentive plan. 03/07/03 Telephone calls with J. Lewis re: employment	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	355	MELMANI, VIVER PEBIFPER, BRIAN D
7422102	380 DO	o p			;	TENTE COMMERCIAL
7502848 7388808	1,056.00 2,034.00	3,30	03/05/03 Reviewed and revised term sheets and equity	PARTNER	N Sh	TOWNS TOWNS F
7379728	1,856.00	5.80	employment agreements for Shea, Bullis and Johnson(1.0); review of agreements(.6).			
7379727	512.00	1.60	Kirkland & Ellis re: mamme(.3).  Since Committee call re: the LTIP and	ASSOCIATE	ស ភ	SCOLL, ADAM
7424328	825.00	2-20	Committee(1.0); review of agreements(.4).  03/06/03 Review motion and order re: separation appreciately.9); correspondence and calls with	ASSOCIATE	ry Fi	PREIS, ARIK
7424326	525.00	1.40	03/06/03 Conference call re: management employment	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIK
Index Number	Amount	Hours	Work Date Description	R E T A I L Position	I M E	UNBILLED T Employee Name
(00397)	Proforma: 1839420 Status: S		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS	TIBE CO	Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:30

### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Rork Date Thru : 03/31/03

MUTH COLD & TAME: 50) FO	1					
Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS	ENT MAT	S CREDITORS	Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER		Proforma: 1839420 Statue: B	(00397)
ONBILLED TI Employee Name	Dept B	DETAIL Position '	Work Date Description	Hours	Amouat	Index Number
STEINGART, BONNIE K.	30	PARTNER	03/11/03 Telephone call with committe regarding executive benefits package(1.0); review of Houlihan memo re: same(.2); review revised term	1.50	1,012.50	7395937
FELLER, SEAN	en en	ASSOCIATE	sheet(.3).  03/11/03 Revise term sheets(4.4); call with Committee	5.60	2,044.90	7399945
MCGUINNESS, JOHN	<u>در</u> 55	ASSOCIATE	re: management agreements(1.2). 03/11/03 Committee conference call with Don Carleen, J. Lewis et al. re: management employment	0.80	256.00	7407771
PREIS, ARIK	35	ASSOCIATE	contracts.  03/11/03 Call re: management employment agreements with  Committee members	0.60	225.00	7424356
SCOLL, ADAM	พ ย	ASSOCIATE	03/11/03 Conf. call re: Benior management employment arresonants and the equity incentive plan.	1,00	320.00	7385852
			03/11/03 Research re: restricted stock. 03/11/03 Review of new employment agreement term sheets.	1.20 1.70	384.00 544.00	7385854 7502849
CARLESM, DONALD	8	Partner	03/11/03 Mark-up of equity incentive plan. 03/12/03 Review Shea term sheet(.4); Disc. with 8.	0.60	405.00	7387171
FBLLER, SEAN	D B	ASSOCIATE	03/12/03 Discuss with D. Carleen term sheet(.3); revise	1.00	365-00	7399947
MELWANI, VIVEK	35	ASSOCIATE	03/12/03 Discussions w/D. Carleen & J. Lewis re: term sheet(1.5); review of term sheet(1.5); review of	3,20	1,520.00	74 N N N N N
SCOLL, ADAM	26	ASSOCIATE	equity incentive plant	2.70	864.00 547.50	73.85856 73.99948
FELLER, SEAN	26	ASSOCIATE	03/13/03 Review equity incentive plan. 03/13/03 Review Long term Incentive Plan.	0.80 0.00	380.D0	7422133
SCOLL, ADAM	26 1	ASSOCIATE		0.30	317.50 00.00	7395959 7395959
STEINGART, SCHWIE K. PREIS, ARIK	35 35	PARTMER ASSOCIATE	03/15/03 Review revised Shea & Bullis term Barets. 03/17/03 Various calls with bondholders and Houlihan Lokey re: employment agreement updates and	1.10	412.50	7424375
LEWIS, JONATHAN F.	22 60	PARTNER	Board search.  3/18/03 Reviewed S. Peller memo re: term sheets.	0,50 5.80	282.50 2,117.00	7388850 7399956
FELLER, SEAN Lewis, Jonathan F.	20 <b>6</b> 6	PARTHER	O3/19/03 Reviewed and revised cover memo and chart re:	3.20	1,808.00	7388856
				1.30	877.50	7395974
STEINGART, BONNIE K.	35	PARTHER	03/19/03 Review revised Cerm sheet for size, prepare	5 I	2,336.00	7399957
FELLER, SEAN	N O	ASSUCIATE	US/13/US ROTARE FRANCISCO DE: SAME 3.4).	1.20	246.00	7399382
BERNTHAL, BILL	ស	TASSETSBAT	03/15/03 MB318t att tokenstad memo ess erem			

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 09003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS

### Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:32 alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) CETTIEND LEMIS, JONATHAN F. CARLEEN, DOMALD STEINGART, BONNIE K. FRILES SEAN LENIS, JONATHAN F. CARLEEN, DONALD Employee Name Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT HATTERS STEINGART, BONNIE K. SCHELER, BRAD E. HUCHES, KATIE RESNICK, ALAN MELWANI, VIVER FELLER. SERV TIME DETAIL ö ä Ŋ 25 ы 24 8 8 Sep. υ υ υ 3 ÿ Position PARTMER PARTMER PARTNER COUNCEL PARTNER PARTNER PARTMER PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE

03/24/03 Review Georgakopoulos employment agreement(.6):

review

3d 55

call with Carlsen et al re: LG(.8); telephone

correspondence re: LG(.5); telephone

03/24/03 Various calls researchive compensation issues

reviewed committee email re: LG(.3).

03/24/03 T/c w/Brian Pfeiffer re: review of letter and

0,60

435,00

7404225

0.80

540.00

7404013

1.60

1,215.00

7404012

2.30 1.50

1,552.50 1,050.00

7404011 750752B

employment agreements.

priorities(.3), reviewed correspondence re: Liz

notice of lien regarding severence pay and

03/24/03 Telephone call with V. Melwani et al concerning

Carleen re: same(.3).

issues regarding potential motion regarding

03/24/03 Review messo regarding employment term sheets

call with A. Resnick re: LG(.4).

re: Bullis, Shea(1.5); telephone call with

03/24/03 Research and obtain documents describing

functions of Conseco Services LLC (for L.

03/24/03 Review caselaw, shepardize same, and prepare

Georgakopoulos memo).

memo re: severance payments(4.8); conf w/A.

03/24/03 Correspondence re: LG.

Georgekopoulos matter(.3).

03/24/03 Discussions re: HL/Greenhill retention

1.10

522.50 190.00

7497032 7497030 5,20

1,430.00

7401954

0.80 0.20

220.00

7401953 7399967

73.00

Preis re: same(.4).

03/24/03 Call re: George Kapoulos departure

03/24/03 Discs.w/ D. Carleen, B. Kirsch, and working

1.20

678.00

7396246

1.00 08.0 3 60 1.20

1,324.00

678.00

540.00 675.00

7395750 7395980 7399959 7396229

same (.2).

group re: Georgakopolous termination(.9);

03/24/03 TC with B. Kirsch re: LG(.2); Disc. with B. 03/21/03 Review long term equity incentive plan for

employees.

Scheler re: Georgakopoulos(.3); Disc. with J.

Lewis re: LG(.3); review proposed response re:

Work Date Description

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson

Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

; BRAD E. SCHELER

Proforma: 1839420 Status: B

(76 (00)

Billing Prt

03/20/03 Review term sheets(.6); review memo to

1.20

810.00

7395738

Hours

Amount

Index Number

Committee(.3); Disc. with S. Feller re: term

03/20/03 Review Management Term Sheets(1.0); revise

Summary Memo re: same(2.6).

03/20/03 Reviewed and revised term sheet memo and

gheets(.3).

chart(.9); discs. w/ S. Feller(.3).

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS

Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS

### alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Pun Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:33

### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS MATTER: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS Silling Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839420 Status: B 176 [00]

Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS	MATTERS	Responsible PIC: BRAD & SCHEDER		9	
CRBILLED TIME	3 DETAIL			i i	Indov Windher
mployee Name	t Positian	Work Date Description	Hours		TIMES IN COMME
operace paramin 15	ASSOCIATE	03/24/03 Meet with B. Steingart re: employment	0.40	158.00	7420982
1		issues(.2); review L. Georgakopoulos			
PREIS, ARIK 35	ASSOCIATE	03/24/03 Research and review of codes re: post-petition	3.50	1,312.50	7424392
	ļ		J M ⊃	1 687 50	7400606
CARLEEN, DONALD 26	PARTNER	03/25/03 Review Georgakopoulos materials(1.2); comf.	60 G	F, 007.04	- pi
		Pries re: LG(.3).	3	B04 00	7396254
LENIS, JONATHAN F. 26	PARTNER	03/25/03 Discs. and review of documents to:			
			1	877.50	7404015
STEINGART, BONNIE K. 30	PARTHER	03/25/03 Telephone call with D. Carleen and A. Resmick vectories Ceorgakonomics employment(.9);	1.00	4	,
		telephone call with company regarding			
		Georgakopoulos (.4).	,	2	7404338
RESNICK, ALAN 35	COUNSEL	03/25/03 Conference call with Bonnie Steingart, Don	0.40	200.00	
		Cultifold! Artic Lights and the control of the cont			
		claims.  Grains Carleen, Arik Preis, Bill Kirsch and	0.90	652.50	7404229
		03/25/03 T/c w/Vivek Melwani, Don Carleen and others re:	0.30	00-019	, , ,
		Georgekopolous claims.	3	192_50	7401956
HUGHES, KATIE 35	ASSOCIATE	03/25/03 Erepare for internal conf. re: L	6		;
		Georgakapoulos terminacion, incidumy terres de relevant documents.			
		03/25/03 Conf. w/ J. Lewis, D. Carleen, A. Preis, A.	0.50	157.50	30190
			٠ ٢	357.50	7401960
		Carleen, J. Lewis, A. Resnick, A. Preis Te: 4.			
		Georgakapoulos termination background and			
			0.70	192.50	7401962
		03/25/03 COME. W/ A. Figis is: small mailtion issues.			
	SECTIONS	03/25/03 Correspondence w/Company re: employment and Liz	1.00	375.00	26547164
PACIS. ARIX			•	4	7424796
		03/25/03 Various calls w/ team re: Georgakopolous(2.8);	3.50	1,316.30	
		Georgakopolous(.4), review of documents re:			
		game(.3).	0.30	96.00	7396670
SCOLL, ADAM 26	ASSOCIATE	03/25/03 Review of new management compensation	•		
		materials.	0.30	202.50	7400610
CARLEEN, DONALD 26	PARTNER	03/26/03 Disc. with A. Scott re: compensation issues.			
,					

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS

,

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791)
Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:33

# Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

			discuss with D. Carleen re: same (1.2).			
7467041	3,248.50	8.90	03/31/03 Review employment agreements (7.0); call with	ASSOCIATE	25	FELLER, SEAN
7507526	\$30.00	0.90	03/31/03 Calls with members of the committee in	PARTHER	35	SCHELER, BRAD S.
			03/31/03 Tel. conf. re: Hasadychicht altergrand 1997.  drafted email to committee re: mgmt.  agreements(1.0); reviewed chart re: mgmt.	PARTNER	26	LEWIS, JONATHAN F.
7410331	1,921.00	3 40	chart re: S		į	CARLEDON, CONTROL
7408942	2,700.00	4.00		DARTMER	, ,	
7423174	1,400.00	2.00		PARTMER	لم: n	oruging anali s
7410328	452.00	0.80	03/30/03 Reviewed prior committee presentation re:	ASSOCIATE PARTNER	26.6	FELLER, SEAN
7399978	365.00	1,00		PARTNER	35	SCHELER, BRAD E.
7423172	3.400.00	3	employment materials.	раканыаан	N O	BERNTHAL, BILL
7399416	225.50	1.10	employment agreements.		) '	
7424408	300.00	0.80	prepare summary re: management 03/28/03 Various internal calls re: management	ASSOCIATE	ω Մ	PREIS, ARIK
,	A, A40.00	6.10	03/28/03 Review management employment agreements(2.0);	ASSOCIATE	26	FELLER, SEAM
7100000	3 3 3 5 5 7 6 7 6	1.40	03/28/03 Review amployment agreements regarding Johnson, Bullis et al and memo regarding same.	PARTNER	. 30	STBINGART, BONNIE K.
7404625	0 1 1 7		same(.4).			
				2 ACCUTATION	0	BRIS, JONATHAN F.
7405300	2,147.00	3.80	Pilchik.  01/79/03 Reviewed new contracts(1.5); reviewed term		2	
7423282	675.00	1.00	re: same{.3}. 03/28/03 Review Reg. Rights Agreement; cail w/Evan	PARTHER	5	GOLAY, DAVID
		,	03/28/03 Review employment agreements: **; ** ** ** ** ** ** chart(.4); Disc. with J. Lewis and S. Feller	PARTNER	26	CARLEEN, DOMALD
7408939	1,012.50	1.50	MEATURE THE CHARLE AND ALCOHOLD	BARTERS	26	LEWIS, JONATEAN F.
7405296	226.00	0,40		ASSOCIATE	ور دي	
7396671	7 <b>5</b> 04 00	<u>.</u>	seorganopouros (a.a., ovincepouros "remos same (.8).			
	1 to	0.00	03/26/03 Various calls w/ team & Kirkland re:	ASSOCIATE	35 5	PREIS, ARIK
7424400	1 125 00	9	Freis re: Bame.			
7397111	169.50	0.30	03/26/01 Reviewed committee email; re: LG and diec. A.	PARTNER	<u>ა</u>	LEWIS, CONATHAN F.
Index Number	Amount	Houre	Work Date Description	DETAIL Position	I M E	UNBILLED T Employee Name
(00397)	Proforma: 1839420 Status: B		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	030792 COMMITTED COMS CREDITORS	M LASKO	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CR Matter: 05003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS
					100	MAIN PROPERTY AND

alp\_112: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:34

### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Billing Prt

Proforma: 1839420

(00397)

UNBILLED TIME DETAIL
Employee Name Dept Position Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS MATTERS PREIS, ARIK PERIFFER, BRIAN D PERIFERR, BRIAN D 35 Ç 35 ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE Work Date Description agreement pleadings.
03/31/03 Conference call with Committee members re: 03/31/03 Revise e-mail memo re: KERP and service 03/31/03 Conference call re: Employment Issues. 03/31/03 Review of pleadings re: KERP and separation 03/31/03 Review of employment agreement summaries. employment issues agreement; summary thereof. Matter Total Total 249.90 249.90 2.00 1.40 1.00 0.80 1.10 Hours Status: B 116,785.50 116,785.50 525.00 375.00 434.50 750.00 316,00 Amount Index Number 7421043 7424417 7424415 7424412 7421035

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00003 EMPLOYMENT MATTERS

### Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:34	3/03 1	2:53:34	MOTU PROFILE THE A SECTION OF		Description 1838421	(1,6500)
Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS MALLEY: 00004 TAX FLANNING	MNING	NS CREDITORS	Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER		Statue: B	
TE CSTRIBAN		DETAIL	Work Date Description	Hours	Аточас	Index Number
Subtoyee Raine	, c		•			
			and the second of the second o	0.80	516.00	7282614
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTNER	01/02/03 Review of doos.; researchie. ve tax pleadings	0.20	79.00	7420826
PERIFFER, BRIAN D	36	ASSOCIATE	03/03/03 Review email correspondence is: 'was primarily	1.50	577.50	7377341
WEISS, BLI	20	ASSOCIATE	<pre>GJ(01/03 REVIEWED SIMI COMMISSION OF THE CONTEST OF THE CONTE</pre>			
			mark-up(.3).	) )	200	73.77342
			03/02/03 Reviewed emails on conversion notes.	1 50	1 013 50	7389534
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTHER		A 50	197.50	7424311
PREIS, ARIX	G,	ASSOCIATE		9	•	
			convert to LDC.	6.60	2,541.00	7412599
WHISS, EL1	N C	#000CT77FP	motion(1.0); confer w/A. Mukamal on motion(.3);			
			confer $w/J$ . Jacobson.on motion(.7); confer $w/A$ .			
			Preis on motion and lending licenses (1.2).			
			Confer w/Olga Loy on tax sharing			
			confer w/A. Mukamal re: agreement (.9); drafted			
			summary e-mail for Jack Jacobson (1.0).	5	1_012.50	7389536
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTNER		5.40	2,079.00	7412604
WEISS, ELI	20	ASSUCTATE	licenses(.8); conferred w/S. Snelson re:			
			lending licenses (.5); conferred w/D. Trucano			
			re: tax agreement(.4); conferred W/R. Ledig or			
			DC office re: tim (1.6); Research on IIM Issues			•
			(2.1).	0.40	375.00	7507515
FALOK, PAUL H.	10	PARINGR	issues in reorganization.	·	000	7389539
TARONEON TACK I.	Š	PARTNER	03/05/03 Conference with B. Weiss re: tin(.3); review of	0.60	400	
Catomate comment	!			2.20	847-00	7412607
WEISS, SLI	20	ASSOCIATE	03/05/03 Conferred w/J. Jacobson re: Cin(.4; Conferred			
			w/P. Falon on regulatory resource that accepton on			
			indemnity(.3); Conferred w/Houliban and			
			reviewed e-mails re: tax meeting (.4).	4.80	1,848.00	7507519
			03/05/03 Conferred w/AC re: DIP indemnity (1.0/)			
			Jacobson on indemnity (1.0); conferred w/Olga			
			Loy re: indemnity (.8).	3.50	2,362.50	7389545
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTNER	03/06/03 conference with E. Weiss and V.			
			Helwani re: above(.5); review of docs. re:			
			above(1.0); contergue were above(1.2).  5. Clemons and E. Weiss re: above(1.2).			

# Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839421 (40397)

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00004 TAX PLANNING U N B I L L E D T I M E D E T A I L Employee Name Dept Position	TEE COX	IS CREDITORS D B T A I L Position	Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Work Date Description	Hours	Status: 3	Index Nutber
WEISS, ELI	ಬ	ASSOCIATE	03/06/03 Conferred w/Houlihan on attributes; Conferred w/K&B on motion.	9.00	0.00	7507522
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTNER	03/07/03 Review of docs. re: attributes (.7); conference with E. Weiss re: plan (.7).	1.40	945.00	1 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4 (4
WEISS, ELI	20	ASSOCIATE	<pre>03/07/03 Reviewed tax sharing agreement(1.0); Conferred w/J. Jacobson re: same[.4].</pre>	1,40	539.00	1
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTHER	03/10/03 Conference with E. Weiss re: tax issues[.8];	2.60	1,755.00	7389549
WEISS, ELI	20	ASSOCIATE	review of docs.(1.8).  03/10/03 Conference call with DPN and Kirkland re: plan (1.5); conferred w/J. Jacobson re: follow-up to call (1.0); reviewed agreements (1.8)	4 30	1,655.50 1,417.50	7416841 7389556
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTNER	03/11/03 Conference with V. Melwani re: plan tax issues (1.0); conference with B. Weiss re: plan tax issues (1.1).	2.10	# F.	707506
WBISS, BLI JACOBSON, JACK L.	200	ASSOCIATE PASTNER	03/11/03 Research on partnerships and TIN. 03/12/03 Prepare for creditors committee meeting (.8); conference with E. Weiss re: plan tax issues	6,50	4, 387, 50	7389559
			(1.2); review of docs. re: plan tax issues (2.0); review research (.8); conference with w/creditors committee, K&B and DP6N et al			
LOCKER, HAREL	20	ASSOCIATE	(1.7). 03/12/03 Research - SEC 165(g)(3).	بر 30. دو 180	1,204.50 1,805.00	7386660 7504144
MELMANI, VIVEK MEISS, BLI	52 th	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE		6. 0. 81 0	2,618.00	7416846
JACOBSON, JACK L.	20	PARTNER		1.60 2.40	1,080.DQ	7389565 7386661
LOCKER, HAREL MEISS, ELI	20	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	03/13/03 Research - SEC 165(g) (3.4). Conferred w/A.C. re: 03/13/03 Research SEC 165(g) (3.4). Conferred w/A.C. re: same (.5); conferred w/A. Mukamal re: same (.5).	# ! 50	1,732.50	7416850
			03/14/03 Conferred w/C. Stern re: preferred stock (1.0); reviewed disclosure statement (1.5); conferred w/h. Mukamal re: disclosure statement (.5); conferred w/M. Hansworth re: disclosure statement (.5).	3 - 50	1,347.50	7473910 7389578
JACOBSON, JACK L. STERN, CHAIM WEIGS, BLI	20 20 20	PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	03/17/03 Conference with E. Weiss re: plan tax issues. 03/17/03 Researched preferred stock issues for E. Weiss. 03/17/03 Revised Disclosure Statement (4.0). Conferred w/DPW & R&B on servicing conversion (.2).	# 9 0 20 0	1,204.50 1,617.00	7385942 7421045

4

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:35

# Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

	53,080.50	115.50	Total			
7416863	962.50	2.50			:	
7421019 7416859	237.00 654.50	0.60 1.70	03/28/03 Telephone call's with B. Steingart re: draft letter. 03/28/03 Revise draft letter to Board. 03/28/03 Reviewed CFC plan (1.0); conferred w/O. Loy re:	ASSOCIATE	<u>t)</u> O	RRISS. BLI
7421015	197.50	D. 50	<pre>03/28/03 Conference with B. Pfeiffer and E. Weise. 03/28/03 Meet with B. Scheler re: tax issues (.2); draft letter to Board (.3).</pre>	ASSOCIATE	35	preiffer, erian d
74047	405,00	0.50		PARTMER	N 40	WEISS, BLI JACOBSON, JACK L.
7403788 7412633	405.00 577.50	0.60 1.50	03/26/03 Review of plan and disclosure statement. 03/26/03 Call W/A. Mukamal re: 382.	PARTNER	35	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7412626	308.00	0.30	03/25/03 Conference with B. Weiss re: plan tax issues. 03/25/03 Call w/P. Palon on tax issues (.2); conferred w/T. Jacobson re: same (.6).	PARTNER ASSOCIATE	20 20	JACOBSON, JACK L. WEISS, ELI
7405720	125.00	0.20	Hansworth on the besser (177)  03/25/03 Call with E. Weiss re: CFC stock and tax issues.	PARTNER	10	PALON, PAUL H.
7412622	924.00	2.40	03/24/03 Research on consolidation issues (1.0); conferred on research re: same (.3); conferred w/DP and Kirkland re: same (.6); conferred w/M.	ASSOCIATE	20	REISS, BLI
7403776 7391998	202.50 1,168.00	0.30 3.20	Statement (.5).  8tatement (.5).  83/24/03 Conference with B. Weiss re: consolidation.  83/24/03 Revised tax disclosure for E. Weiss and J.	PARTNER ASSOCIATE	20	JACOBSON, JACK L. STERN, CHAIM
7412618	1,678.00	2.80	of does re: same (.3).  03/21/03 Conferred w/A. Mukamal re: 382 (.5); conferred  w/J. Jacobson re: 382 (.5); research on 1.382-6  (1.3). Drafted and sent e-mail on disclosure	ASSOCIATE	25	MSISS, ELI
7403772	540.00	0.80		PARTNER	20	JACOBSON, JACK L.
7389590 7412617	1,350.00	2.00 5.60	03/20/03 Conference with B. Weiss re: taxable year (.6); research re: same (1.4) 03/20/03 Conference call on 382 w/Kirkland and DP (1.0);	PARTNER ASSOCIATE	20 0	JACOBSON, JACK L. WBISS, ELI
7412611	462.00	1.20	03/19/03 Meeting with K. Keyes re: tax issues. 03/19/03 Call w/A. Mena on consolidated return issues and motion.	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	20 20	KHURI, NALID NBISS, ELI
7389584 7389587	337.50 337.50	0.50	03/18/03 Review of plan and disclosure Statement. 03/19/03 Review of disclosure Statement (.2); conference with E. Meiss and V. Melwani re: same (.3).	PARTNER PARTNER	2 2 0	JACOBSON, JACK L. JACOBSON, JACK L.
Index Number	Amount	Hours.	Work Date Description	DETAIL Position	ope B M I	UNBILLED T Smployee Name
(00397)	Proforma: 1839421 Status: B		Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	NS CREDITORS	TANNING	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00004 TAX PLANNING

alp\_132: Matter Decail (babstan/168791) R:m Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:36

Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00004 TAX PLANNING

UNBILLED TIME Employee Name Dept

DETAIL
Dept Position Work Date Description

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

(00397)

Proforma: 1839421 Status: B

Hours

Amount

Index Number

Matter Total 115.50 53,080.50

Client: 030792 COMMITTES CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00004 TAX PLANNING

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Sun Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:36

## Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
MATTER: 00505 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Reaponaible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839422 Status: B (00397)

Employee Name
PARTMER HAND E. 15 PARTMER 01/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 security comp. Cheresin.  CHELDRAMIT, VIVEX 15 ASSOCIATE 01/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 security comp. Cheresin.  CHELDRAMIT, VIVEX 15 ASSOCIATE 01/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 security comp. Cheresin.  CHELDRAMIT, VIVEX 15 PARTMER 01/02/03 Review Marxant and Registration Reg
PARTIMER DEPL Dept PARTIMER 01/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  EMANHI, VIVEX 15 ASSOCIATE 01/01/03 Panils to Alkhand re: plan (.5); review for the plan (.5);
CHELGE, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 01/01/3 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior exactive comp. therein.  CHELGE, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review 1.00 4  ELMANI, VIVEX 35 ASSOCIATE 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review 1.00 4  CHELDER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review 1.00 4  CHELDER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review 1.00 4  CHELDER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review 1.00 1.00 1.00  CHELDER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and senior exact on the comp. therein.  OLIAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws (1.1).  PREINDART, SONNIE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws (1.1).  PREINDART, SONNIE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws (1.1).  PREINDART, SONNIE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review memorandum re: various objections to peace and sonior to peace and plan in perparation of bearing re: same (.3) and (.4.00 1.5)  PREINDART, SONIOR 11 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents and Plan. 2.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents (.2); 0.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents (.2); 0.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents (.2); 0.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents (.2); 0.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft on preparation for March (1.1)  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents (.2); 0.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed draft comporate documents (.2); 0.00  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Reviewed from termin (1.1) ASSOCIATE (1.1)  PREINDART (1.1) ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Rev
phologic Name Dept Position Work Date Description:  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 E-mails to Mirkland re: plan (.5); review clarer and senior executive comp. therein.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 4  Agreement (2.0); review charter and by-laws 1.00 2.0  O3/03/03 Review mand comment on disclosure statement and Plan in preparation of bearing ye; sense 1.00  O3/03/03 Review plan and disclosure Statement.  FEIFFER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure Statement. (3).  ILCHIK, EVAN 10 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure Statement. (3).  Teview plan re: same (1).  Teview plan re: same (1).  FEIFFER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Review of matter corporate documents and Plan. 2.00  O3/03/03 Review plan re: same (1).  Teview plan re: same (1).  O3/03/03 Review of pertian and Disclosure Statement. (3).  O3/03/03 Review of pertian of branch 4 1.50  O3/03/03 Review of branch 4 1.50  O3/03/03 Review of pertian of branch 4 1.50  O3/03/03 Revi
mployee Name   Dept   Position   Work Date Description: Hours   Hours   CHELER, ERAD E. 35   PARTNER   03/01/03 Calls red disclosure statement and senior   1.00   1.00   EINMANI, VIVEX   35   ASSOCIATE   03/01/03 Review comp. therein.   1.00   4   RECHELER, BRAD E. 35   PARTNER   03/02/02   Calls ree disclosure statement and senior   1.00   4   RECHELER, BRAD E. 35   PARTNER   03/02/02   Calls ree disclosure statement and senior   1.00   4   RECHELER, BRAD E. 35   PARTNER   03/02/03 Review Marrant and Registration Rights   1.00   1.00   Agreement and comp. therein.   1.00   1.00   1.00   Review Marrant and Comp. therein.   1.00   1.00   1.00   Review Marrant and comp. therein.   1.00   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   30   PARTNER   03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and Dy-laws   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of hearing re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of hearing re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of materiag re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of materiag re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of materiag re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of materiag re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of materiag re same   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of pen issues re: Disclosure statement   2.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of open issues re: Plan and Disclosure   1.00   1.00   RELWANI, VIVEK   35   ASSOCIATE   03/03/03 Review of open issues re: Plan and Disclosure   1.00   1.00   Review plan re: Same   1.00   1.00   Review
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description.  Hours propose Name Dept Position Work Date Description Registration Registration Registration Registration Rights Associate Recent Parameter and Dylaws (1.1).  House PARTYBER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and Dylaws (1.1).  House PARTYBER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and Dylaws (1.1).  House PARTYBER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and Dylaws (1.2) (1.1).  House PARTYBER 03/03/03 Review and comment and Dylaws (1.2) (1.2).  House PARTYBER 03/03/03 Review and comment and Dylaws (1.2) (1.2).  House PARTYBER 03/03/03 Review Dan Ambitaters.  Hours description Rights (1.0)
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review set of language (.3).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  OLAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment (2.0); review charter and by-laws (1.1).  TESINGART, BOANTE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and plan in preparation of beating on 3/3/03 and 3/4/03 he reparation of beating on 3/3/03 and 3/4/03 he reparation of beating on 3/3/03 and 3/4/03 he review plan and disclosure statement.  FEITPER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  1.00 4  4.00 1.10 2.0  7.11 2.0  7.12 3.10 2.0  7.12 3.10 2.0  7.13 3.10 2.0  7.14 3.10 2.0  7.15 3.10 2.0  7.16 3.10 2.0  7.17 3.10 2.0  7.18 3.10 2.0  7.18 3.10 2.0  7.19 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10 2.0  7.11 3.10 2.0  7.12 3.10 2.0  7.13 3.10 2.0  7.14 3.10 2.0  7.15 3.10 2.0  7.16 3.10 2.0  7.17 3.10 2.0  7.18 3.10 2.0  7.19 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10 2.0  7.11 3.10 2.0  7.12 3.10 2.0  7.13 3.10 2.0  7.14 3.10 2.0  7.15 3.10 2.0  7.16 3.10 2.0  7.17 3.10 2.0  7.18 3.10 2.0  7.18 3.10 2.0  7.18 3.10 2.0  7.19 3.10 2.0  7.10 3.10
Dept Position Work Date Description:  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Galls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  OLAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  OLAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review Marrant and Registration Rights  Agreement (2.0); review charter and by-laws (1.1).  TEINGART. SONNIE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and plan in preparation of hearing re: same (1).  ELHANI. VIVEK 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Review plan mand disclosure Statement.  1.00 1.1  SELIPER, BRIAN D 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  1.00 2.0
THE PROPER NAME DEEL Position Work Date Description:  Hours proper Name Deel Position Work Date Description:  ELMANI, VIVEK 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 S-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review  ELMANI, VIVEK 35 PARTNER 03/02/D3 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 4  ELMANI, VIVEK 35 PARTNER 03/02/D3 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 5  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/D3 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 7  PERINGARY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/03/D3 Review Marrant and Registration Rights 3.10 2.0  (1.11).  TEINGARY, BOANTE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/D3 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws 1.70 1.1  Debtore Disclosure Statement and Plan in preparation of hearing re: same.  ELMANI, VIVEK 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/D3 Review plan and disclosure Statement.  ELMANI, VIVEK 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/D3 Review plan and disclosure statement.  ELMANI, VIVEK 35 ASSOCIATE 03/03/D3 Review plan and disclosure statement.  2.00 1.1  81.70 1.1  82.00 1.1  83.00 1.1  84.00 1.1  85.00 1.1  86.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description:  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review setoff language (.5).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review Marrant and Registration Rights Agreement (2.0); review charter and by-laws (1.1).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review Marrant and Registration Rights Agreement (2.0); review charter and by-laws (1.1).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review marrant and Registration Rights Agreement (2.0); review charter and by-laws (1.1).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws (1.1).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws (1.1).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and by-laws (1.1).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and plan in preparation of hearing re: same.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review plan and disclosure statement.
CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 1 2.00 1 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00
THELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 B-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review setoff language (.5).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  OLAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior executive comp. therein.  OLAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review Warrant and Registration Rights Agreement (2.0); review charter and by-laws  TEINGART, BONNIE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review and comment on disclosure statement and 1.70 1.11  TEINGART, BONNIE K. 30 PARTNER 03/03/03 Revise memorandum re: various objections to 4.00 1.11
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description.  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 2.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 fexecutive comp. therein.  ELMANI, VIVEX 35 ASSOCIATE 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review 1.00 fetoff language (.5).  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00 fexecutive comp. therein.  OLAY, DAVID 10 PARTNER 03/03/03 Review Warrant and Registration Rights 3.10 2.0
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHRLER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00  ELWANI, VIVEX 35 ASSOCIATE 03/01/03 E-mails to Kirkland re: plan (.5); review  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00  4  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/02/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  CHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTNER 03/01/03 Calls re: disclosure statement and senior 1.00  Figure 1.00
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description  THOURS  THOU
mployee Name Dept Position Work Date Description Hours

į

\*

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECREANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

# Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REGRENIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT 1 2 5 5 5 5 5 7 5 7 7. Billing Prt : ERAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839422 Status: B (00397) umber

D T I	2 10	ŗ	Market Transmistion	Hours	Amount	Index Number
Employee Name	одал	#OSTC TOTE	OTTO POIC DEPENDENCE.			
			03/04/03 Conference call with Company, committee and	2.00	790.00	7420843
			professionals re: plan and disclosure			
			statement	9	20	7420844
PERIFFER, BRIAN D	35	ASSOCIATE	03/04/03 Meet with B. Steingart and V. Melwani re: plan	0.60	837.00	40044
				5	197_53	7420846
			03/04/03 Meeting with V. Welwani and D. Trucano re: plan	6		
				<u>.</u>	1.809.50	7403455
PILCHIK, EVAN	10	ASSOCIATE	03/04/03 Meeting at Davis Polk	7 6	117.50	7395179
SCHOULDER, ANDREW	35	ASSOCIATE	03/04/03 Review U.S. Bank's objection to Disclosure	0.50	H 40 - L 40	
			Statement.	,	, 1 1	7205190
			03/04/03 Draft and revise summary of U.S. Bank's	1.30	367.00	7000
						1
GOLAY, DAVID	10	PARTNER	03/05/03 Conf. call w/Committee and DPW re: agreement	6.80	4,590.00	CCFC7BJ
						4
STEINGART, BONNIE K.	30	PARTNER	03/05/03 Telephone call with committee regarding	1.80	1,215.00	11.0000
			disclosure statement issues.		) 1 2 3	110355
RESNICK, ALAN	56	COUNSEL	03/05/03 T/c w/Vivek Melwani re: setoff provisions in	1.20	870.00	70.200
,			plan and disclosure statement.		1	741 8964
MELMANI, VIVEK	G	ASSOCIATE	03/05/03 Review of e-mails rs: offsets and intercompany	0.50	X57.00	7 4 4 6 6 6 6
,			claims.	:	,	370000
			03/05/03 Review of Plan and Disclosure Statement.	2.00		3300130
				3.00	T. 445.00	0000
				7.80	3.081.00	7420849
PFBIFFBR, BRIAN D	S	ASSOCIATE	D3/D5/U3 Meecings with piotessionars for the commencer.			
			Company a payer for the tree and and another.			
				3.70	1,424.50	7403458
PILCHIK, EVAN	10	ASSOCIATE	U3)U5)U3 CONTENED CELL FO: Credit someoment (2.0).			
	,		color for passarch remarding pertificate of incorporation	3.00	450.00	7386553
KAPLAN, BREIT	16	ALSC	03)03/03 Repeater regurees 10K and 10Q filings per			
			R. Pilchik			1
	,		or/os/or Review and numbert on warrant agreement.	3.00	2,025.00	7423256
вошах, вакто	t	E Michigan Colo		4.60	3,105.00	7507533
					1 ) )	
			03/06/03 Conf. call w/professionals re: preferred stock.	1.10	742-50	100.000
andres same	ń	ASSOCIATE		2.50	687,50	2001000
hoonea, sairte	ļ				3	CHOTOL
NHOL SSERVICEON	IN In	ASSOCIATE	03/06/03 Review Georgakopoulos proofs of claim (1.0);	2.30	20.00	
					500 50 50	7418867
MELWANI, VIVEX	N H	ASSOCIATE	03/06/03 Review of memo re: claims issues (.4); calls	1.10	266.00	1
				,	42 500 5	7418874
			03/06/03 Review revised plan circulated 3/5.	3 K	336.00	7420862
PERIFFER, BRIAN D	35	ASSOCIATE	03/06/03 Review US Bank guarantee	0.00	1	

3

## Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECRENIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839422 Status: B (00397)

			statement.	77710000		MECHANI, VIVEX
7422104	380.00	D. 80	ostostos wie wie Begnick re: plan & disclosure		) 1	
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	F, 204-00	ð. 20	03/08/03 Update, revise comments to Revised Plan (5.9);	ASSOCIATE	35	MCGUINNESS, JOHN
747747		· !	etatement.			
9787852	725,00	1.00	03/08/03 Telephone conference with Vivek Melwani			
				1	į	CBOMICS, Owner
700000	507.50	0.70		COUNSEL	ب س ا	DECNICE MAN
	1 #4 · U C	0.70	03/07/03 Research re: fair price provisions.	MISC	10	PERSON DANIES.
7106110	1	!				
0000	40.1001	5, 60	03/07/03 Conferred w/A. Mukamal on Disclosure Statement	ASSOCIATE	20	MRISS ELI
1507501	,					
	4,456.00	6.00	03/07/03 Review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIK
	2					
	565.00	1.00				
3318046	1 to 0	0.40	03/07/03 Review summary of anti-takeover provisions.	ASSOCIATE	10	PILCHIK, EVAN
7507486	1 5 4 DO	÷	plan issues.			
	i de	+- +<	03/07/03 Meetings with V. Helwani re: Claims and other			
7420870	A 40 C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C	1 1 2	03/07/03 Telephone call with Houlihan re: plan issues	ASSOCIATE	υ 5	PFSIFFER, BRIAN D
7420869	158 00	3 (	03/07/03 Review Plan and Disclosure Scatement.			
7422099	1.662.50	بر 20				
			0.00000000000000000000000000000000000	ASSOCIATE	35	MELMANI, VIVEK
7422098	360.00	0.80				
7387049	165.DO	0.60			i	undues, watte
7387046	385,00	1.40		STATOORSA	ň	
2282852	1,522.50	2.10		,	1	
100000	580,20	Ф. BO	03/07/03 Reviewed revisions to plan of reorganization.	COUNSEL	L)	RESUICK ALAN
7202811	5	! }	anti-takeover issues.			
70000	A, 902.30	4.30	03/07/03 Review and revise memo to committee re:			
100000	1 7 9 9		designation (1.2).			
			(1.2); review preferred stock certificate of			
			comments on registration rights agreement			
			preferred stock agreements (2.0); review Kak			
	1		03/07/03 Call re: Preferred Scook Cetab (1977 Here Tub			
7507535	3.51D.DO	л c, c,		PARTMER	10	GOLAY, DAVID
7423257	54D.DD	0 %		ASSOCIATE	es Eri	ZIV, ALON
7507516	1,425.00	3.80				
			TOUGH CHOCKCOCK BUCKERS	ASSOCIATE	20	MEISS, ECI
7507520	1,809.50	4.70		ASSOCIATE	10	SILBERSTEIN, ANDREW
7405356	1.653.00	3 80		ASSOCIATE	E	PILCHIK, EVAN
7408164	1,001.00	2.60	Derion Credi	2000		
7420865	158,00	0.40	01/06/01 Weet with A. Ziv re: section 509 research.			
			WOIK LATE DEBOISPILLON	Position	Dept	Employee Name
Index Number	Amount	Яонга		Н	M M	UMBILLED T

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:37

### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

MELNANI, VIVER Employee Name ONBICLED Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REDEGAMIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS GOLAY, DAVID PRBIS, ARIK FALON, PAUL H. PERIFFER, BRIAN D GOLAY, DAVID FALON, PAUL H. KAPLAN, BRETT SILBERSTEIN, ANDREW SCOLL, ADAM PILCHIK, EVAN PFEIPFER, BRIAN D KELMANI, VIVEK STEINGART, BONNIE K. STRINGART, BONNIE K. PREIS, ARIK T I M E Dept 8 ŝ 10 9 2 2 3 35 10 2 ÿ 2 % 监 5 ä 10 DETAIL Position SIN ASSOCIATE PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTMER PARTNER PARTNER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTHER PARTMER Work Date Description 03/10/03 Review charter (.4) and by-laws (.8) and 03/10/03 Review and mark-up of Plan and Disclosure 03/10/03 Mark-up of preferred stock (2.6), mark-up of 03/10/03 Telephone calls with D. Trucano re: claims. 03/10/03 Review and analysis of distribution formulas. 03/10/03 Conference call re intercompany claims and 03/10/03 Review draft certificate of incorporation and 03/10/03 Review term sheet for new secured notes. 03/10/03 Review e-mail re: reorganization issues. 03/08/03 Draft correspondence to Committee re: indenture 03/08/03 Meet with V. Melwani re: plan issues ED/80/E0 03/08/03 Correspondence re: solicitation letters: 03/08/03 Correspondence re: indenture Trustees. 03/11/03 Review Secured Notes Term Sheet 03/11/03 Mark-up of preferred stock terms (3.2); Charter 03/11/03 Begin review of revised plan and disclosure 03/10/03 Research regarding certificates of designations 03/10/03 03/10/03 Review of claims register spreadsheet. 03/10/03 Review and revise disclosure statement and 03/10/03 Call w/David Tepper re: anti-takeover memo; 03/08/03 Review plan and disclosure statement (1.6); 03/08/03 Review Disclosure Statement objections. 03/11/03 Telephone call with team and banks regarding Review of mark-up of disclosure statement and Comments re: Plan & Disclosure Statement. revised plan-Statement. charter, by-laws (2.8). related issues. plan. by laws sent by Kirkland. call w/K&E re: same conference with V. Helwani re: same (.4). trustee plan provisions. statement. per K. Pilchik. certificate of designation (.4). plan revisions (1.0); review and revise above (2.0). agreement (4.1); conference call re: all of warrant agreement and registration rights disclosure statement (1.5). and by-laws comments (2.1); review revised Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Billing Prt : BRAD B. SCHELER 0.40 Q. BG 0.30 5,10 0.20 2.00 0.30 11.40 0.80 1.60 0.50 0.30 s.40 0.40 2,50 1.00 1.80 1.00 2.00 HOLLE 2.50 0.80 1.50 1.60 Proforma: 1839422 Status: B 3,442.50 1,687.50 2,079.00 1,187.50 1,215.00 7,695.00 512.00 237.50 540.00 \$00.00 225.00 696.00 1B7,50 112.50 158.00 475.DO 540.00 202.50 125.00 750.00 375.DO 118.50 950.00 142.50 190.00 Amount Index Number 7423259 7506046 7424335 742088D 7422107 7422106 7422109 7420895 7422113 7381733 7507531 7424336 742210B 7389991 7385848 7424351 7424339 7408168 7422115 7381729 7395938 7395933 7423260 7506047 7405360 (00397)

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CORS CREMITORS MATTER: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstan/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:38

### Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Sections of the control of the contr

STEINGART, BONNIE K. 30 GOLAY, DAVID FALON, PAUL H. WEISS, ELI SILBERSTEIN, ANDREW SCHOULDER, ANDREW PILCHIR, EVAN PPEIFFER, BRIAN D MELMANI, VIVEK RESNICE, ALAN Siployee Name CNBILLED Matter: 00005 PLAN OF RECREANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS PREIS, ARIX RESNICK, ALAM 1 1 M Dept 10 بن 5 ų, ö 10 10 Ķ 5 ىر 7 (J) برر ي DETAIC Position PARTHER ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE COUNSEL PARTMER PARTNER ASSOCIATE TESMOO Work Date Description 63/11/03 Conference call with Houlihan re: open claims 03/12/03 Prep for disclosure statement bearing (.4); 03/11/03 Various calls with Houlihan Lokey re: Plan. 03/11/03 Review credit docs. 03/12/03 Meeting at DPW to negotiate credit agreement 03/12/03 Continue review of revised disclosure 03/11/03 Reviewed disclosure statement. 03/11/03 Office conference with D. Golay re: certificate 03/11/03 Research re: postpetition interest. 03/11/03 Drafting solicitation letter in support 03/11/03 Call with D. Tepper and Houlihan Lokey re: Plan 03/11/03 Reviewing and commenting on Plan (4.0); working 03/11/03 Conference call w/Houliban (1.2); reviewed new 03/11/03 Meetings with V. Nelwani, A. Preis re: plan 03/11/03 Review and comment on revised plan & disclosure 03/11/03 T/c w/Tepper re: Claims (.4); t/c w/HLHZ re: 03/11/03 Reviewed revisions to plan of reorganization 03/11/03 Reviewed revisions to disclosure statement. 03/11/03 T/c w/Brad Scheler re: plan provisions, cap on 03/11/03 Meet with V. Melwani and B. Pfeiffer re: 03/11/03 Review of Disclosure Statement objections of designations (.2); revise same (.4). plan issues (.2). general creditors' claims, and strategy. review objections (1.0); telephone call with postpetition interest research. and distributions. with V. Melwani re: same [.8]; circulating Review new draft of credit agreement (.5). stock (1.1), mark-up of charter, by-laws (1.5) for meeting (.9) cap (1.1). Huber (.4). and related follow-up. statement. summary. comments re: same (.2). notes term sheets (1.6), Mark-ups of preferred issues [1.0]; review materials in preparation issues (1.0); conference call w/Appaloosa re: claims (1.0); review claims issues and claims open claims issues (1.0); t/c w/Kirkland re: Billing Prt Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER 12,50 1.80 0.50 5.00 5.90 1.90 1.20 3.80 Q. 90 2.10 5.80 0.60 0.30 1.50 0.50 0.60 1.50 3.70 3,50 1.10 0.30 Hours Proforma: 1839422 Status: B 2,271.50 1,805.00 1,215.00 8,437.50 2,233.00 1,875.00 1,424.50 1,662.50 1,312.50 412.50 187.50 474.00 652.50 261.00 187.50 225.00 562.50 750.50 797.50 217.50 82.50 Amount Index Number 7395942 7423261 7395194 7424359 7424354 7424353 7408171 7422120 7422118 7382834 7382833 7506048 7416844 7405362 7395195 7424358 7424357 7408170 7420899 7420698 7382835 (00397)

•

alp\_132: Matter Detail (babstam/168791) Run Date & Time: 06/13/03 12:53:38

## Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson

Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

ONBILLED WEINTRAUB, MICHAEL S. 10
GOLAY, DAVID 10 Matter: 00005 FLAN OF RECREANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS RESNICK, ALAM PREIS, ARIK PILCHIK, EVAN MELWANI, VIVEK RESMICE, ALAM Employee Name STEINGART, SONNIE K. SCHOULDER, ANDREW PPEIFFER, BRIAN D H I I I I I 9 К 3 35 35 35 ü Dept Position DETAIL COUNSEL PARTMER PARINER MISC ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE COUNSEL ASSOCIATE Work Date Description 03/13/03 Reviewed revised disclosure statement filed 03/13/03 Conference with Vivek Melwani regarding 03/12/03 03/12/03 Review Plan & Disclosure Statement. 03/13/03 Conference with Brad Scheler and Vivek Melwani 03/13/03 Review revised disclosure statement and plan 03/13/03 Regotiating preferred stock terms (1.3); review 03/12/03 Research re: warrant agreements per B. Pilchik. 03/12/03 Correspondence re: revised plan and first 03/12/03 Commenting on and marking up Plan and 03/12/03 Conference call with Davis, Polk & Mardwell. 03/12/03 Reviewed mark-ups, new drafts of agreements. 03/12/03 Review and comment on plan and disclosure 03/12/03 T/c w/Vivek Melwani re: section 1129(a)(7); 03/13/03 Reviewed revised plan. 03/13/03 Review preferred stock certificates and K&E Participate in meetings with Company, comments. abjections (.5). agreement (4.4); review warrant agreement Disclosure Statement. Kirkland & Ellis re: Committee, and professionals re: plan issues. plan and disclosure statement provisions. review and comment on charter docs and credit and revise registration rights agreement  $\{2,1\}_f$ amended disclosure statement. Disclosure Statement (3.0); follow-up call with atatement. regarding plan provisions. setoffs and other provisions. disclosure statement provisions regarding (.7); telephone call with debtor (.3); review 1.B Houlihan Lokey and Fried Frank re: Plan and Billing Prt : BRAD B. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD B. SCHELER game (.3). 9.60 3.20 5.90 10.10 6.00 0.40 2.80 0.30 0.50 0.80 1.00 0.30 3.30 3.50 HOUTE 1.20 1.50 Proforma: 1839422 Status: B 1,347.50 1,237.50 6,480.00 1,200.00 2,330.50 3,989.50 2,850.00 2,030.00 1,012.50 870.00 170.00 290,00 217.50 362.50 540,00 82.50 Amount Index Number 7423262 7386851 7395199 7424362 7424360 7408172 7420905 7420904 7422124 7386232 7392412 7392410 7392409 7392408 7395947 7395946 (00397)

MELWANI, VIVEK

ĸ

ASSOCIATE

03/13/03 Review Credit Agreement and stock.

statement.

03/13/03 Reviewed mark-up of plan and disclosure

0.80

580.00

0.40

0.80 0.40 200

380.00 475.00

7422131 7422130 7422129 7422127 7392413

190.00 190.00 March 12, 2003.

03/13/03 Review Plan & Disclosure Statement.

03/13/03 Calls and correspondence re: Board structure

03/13/03 Prep for D.S. hearing.

.

## Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

aring (5.0); (4.5). It for Sartaj Hew of guarantee Houses (1.4). hicago, review He while	WEINTRAILS, MICHAEL S. 10 MISC 03/14/03 research fer Explicitik.  SCHELER, BRAD E. 35 PARTMER 03/14/03 Calls with plan, disclosure statement and exit.  STSINGART, BONNIE K. 30 PARTMER 03/14/03 Working travel to NY from Chicago: review of plan and disclosure statement.	ASSOCIATE 03/13/03 Meet with A. Preis re: Plan and Disclosure  Statement.  03/13/03 Review Plan and Disclosure Statement.  26 ASSOCIATE 03/13/03 Markup of Disclosure Statement re: equity  incentive plan.	calls with Kirkland & Ellis re: o disclosure statement. A. Scoll re: disclosure statement. Ith V. Helwani and A. Preis re: plan issues. Plan issues. Registration Rights Agreement (.7), Warrant Agreement (1.6), Marked up By-laws (.4), Marked up Preferred ement (1.1). mark-up of Plan and Disclosure (4.0); calls related thereto v/DFN &	and revise intercompany language in plan closure statement. formulas in plan and disclosure nt. ne calls w/J. Griffich re: plan issues. and comment on disclosure statement. B. Scheler and V. Melwani re: plan	ochemen
ing (5.0);  .5).  for Sartaj 0.80  w of guarantee 2.50  es (1.4),  cago; review 4.00  while	company in statement and s: review of	Disclosure 0.30 ment. 1.80 e: equity 1.70 of nirectors 2.00	Ellis re: 0.50  re statement. 0.30  Preis re: 1.8),  greement (1.8),  reement (.7),  ), Marked up  p Preferred  isclosure  isclosure  5.00	anguage in plan 1.50 losure 0.90 : plan issues. 0.30 statement. 3.40 re: plan 0.30	ct: BRAD 8. SCHELER
0 3,712.50 0 540.00 0 1,187.50	์ คื ค	0 82.50 0 495.00 0 544.00	\$\text{0}\$ 197.50 \$\text{0}\$ 118.50 \$\text{0}\$ 711.00 \$\text{0}\$ 2,156.00 \$\text{0}\$ 1.875.00	0 712.50 0 427.50 0 118.50 0 1,343.00	status: 5
7395950 7395953 7422141 7422138	7423120 7395949	7395209 7395211 7385857 7386859	7420911 7420912 7420913 7408176	7422134 7422134 7420906 7420909 7420910	Index Number

#### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
Natter: 0C005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839422 Status: B (00397)

7420922 7420927	158-00 237-00	0.40 0.60	w/Bondbolders re: deal structure (.7). 03/17/03 Meet with V. Melwani re: plan issues. 03/17/03 Review credit agreements.	ASSOCIATE	35	PFEIFFER, BRIAN D
7422147	1,045.00	2.20				
7422146	1,187.50	2.50	preparation of motice to relevant parties of telephonic appearance.  D3/17/03 Review and analysis of Plan & Disclosure	ASSOCIATE	ယ ဏ	MRIMANI, VIVER
7391688	55.00	0.20	Statement (.2).  Statement (.2):  03/17/03 Review materials in preparation for 3/18  disclosure statement hearing, including	ASSOCIATE	3.5	HUGHES, KATTE
7399952	182.50	0.50	ol/17/03 Discuss plan and disclosure statement with J.  13/17/03 Discuss plan and disclosure  13. rewise Plan and Disclosure	ASSOCIATE	8	FELLER, SEAN
7395960	2,565.00	3.80	Statement revisions (2.5); review same with a Melwani (.5).  03/17/03 working trace to Chicago; review plan and	PARTNER	30	STEINGART, BONNIE K.
7424370	1,125.00	3,00	1 Disclosure	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	35 55	MELMANI, VIVEK PREIS, ARIX
7495958 7422142	540.00 950.00	0.80 2.00	Review charter and by-laws.			
7395956	540.00 742.50	0.80 1.10				
7395955	1,890.00	2.80	03/15/03 Review revisions to displosure statement and 03/15/03 Review revisions to displosure statement and nlam (1.4): review blacklined versions of 2nd	PARTNES	30	STEINGART, BONNIE K.
7384035	474.50	1.30	03/14/03 Reviewed preferred stock section of disclosure	ASSOCIATE	20	STERK, CHAIM
7395213	962.50	3,50	related follow up thereto, including phone call w/HL (1.0) and correspondence with Committee (2.0).  (3/14/03 Revise Second Amended Disclosure Statement and calls.	ASSOCIATE	Ω D	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
7424369	3,000.00	a. DO			;	
7408178 7424368	154.00 1,125.00	0.40 3.00	03/14/03 Working travel NY to Chicago; review Plan and 03/14/03 Working travel NY to Chicago; review Plan and	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE	2 2	PILCHIR, EVAN
7420915	118.50	0.30				
7420914	110.50	0.30	ogen issues in plan (.5).  Ogen issues in plan (.5).  Og/14/03 Telephone call's with A. Huber re: plan and	associate	35	PERIFFER, BRIAN D
7422140	1,425.00	3.00	ording Commonts to Disclosure statement (2.5); address			
Index Number	Amount	Hours	Work Date Description	D B T A I 5 Position	рерс Г Ж Б	ONBILLED TI

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

## Fried, Frank, Marris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00005 PLAM OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

#### Pried, Prank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTER CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839422 Status: B (00397) E.

MACTER: OCCUS FLAM OF RECKEMBLESTION/ DISCHOSORS SISIEMENT	KBOKG	PART TANK TENNE	OCTIVIONED OF DESIGNATION CONTRACTOR OF THE CONT			
UN 31 LLED TI Employee Name	nept X x	DETAIL Pasition	Work Date Description	Hours	Amount	Index Number
			01/20/01 Artendance at complete hearings and related	5.10	3,442.50	7395976
			meetings.			
MELMANI, VIVER	35	ASSOCIATE	03/20/03 Meeting w/B. Pfeiffer re: open plan issues.	1.50	712.50	7422148
				0.80	380.00	7422149
PTEIFFER, BRIAN D	35	ASSOCIATE		0.80	316.00	7420956
			Revise letter to board re: V. Me	0.80	316.00	7420957
					,	22,000,00
PILCHIK, EVAN	2	ASSOCIATE		1.20	300 00	7424386
PREIS, ARIK	5.5	ASSOCIATE	_	9	000	
PORTUGUIT. DEB ANDREW	ň	ASSOCIATE	03/20/03 Review and revise letter to Board.	0.60	165.00	7395229
STRINGART, BONNIB K.	30	PARTNER		1.30	877.50	7395978
	<u>u</u>	ASSOCIATE	Reviewing various plan issues.	1.30	617.50	7497027
				3.50	1,662.50	7497028
PREIFFER, BRIAN D	ᅜ	ASSCCIATE	03/21/03 Draft and revise letter to Board re: Plan.	3.80	1,501.00	7960776
PICCHIK, EVAN	10	ASSOCIATE	03/21/03 Review of Registration Rights Agreement.	1.50	30E 0B	245040
PERRO, DANIEL	16	HISC	03/21/03 Research re: Registration Rights Agreements yet	H . 00	6 4 0	
O MILIOS DOGGISTO	بر د	A COOK TATE	03/22/03 Revise draft letter to Company re: releases.	2.10	829.50	7420970
SCHELER, BRAD E.	ω i Un i	PARTNER	Internal team discussion re: plan a	0.70	490.00	7507529
				3		7420978
PERIFFER, BRIAN D	(J) Ut	ASSOCIATE		1 05	00.200	7424393
PREIS, ARIK	بی U	ASSOCIATE	03/24/03 Assist B. Pfeiffer preparing for crip to carmer			
	n n	Proport PTR	03/24/03 Review and revise letter to Board.	1.10	302.50	7395238
ERICAL NIL	0 I	ASSOCIATE		1.60	616.00	7507518
PERIFFER, BRIAN D	မှ (	ASSOCIATE		5.80	2,291.00	7420983
				;	048	7420985
			03/25/03 Meet with Houlihan re: claims meeting.	2,40	+ + + + + + + + + + + + + + + + + + +	74D819D
PILCHIK, EVAN	5	ASSOCIATE	03/25/03 Review and comment on Registration Rights	5.60	1,000.00	, de 1
POLICE HAT ON	n n	PLAN. LALK	Agreement. 01/25/03 Phone participation in conference call	3.70	1,387.50	7414593
,	i				1	1
PFEIFFER, BRIAN D	35	ASSOCIATE	03/26/03 Revise letter to Board re: plan.	0.30	1 LLG. 50	7408141
	10	ASSOCIATE		3.80	1,463.00	1410041
FERRO, DANIEL	0	MISC		0.40	32.00	746940
	<u>и</u> Э	BRUTGER	agreement. 01/27/01 Review of draft letter regarding D&O, releases	2.50	1,687.50	7404020
picingant, committees	ţ		and indemnity (1.0); teleph			
			and Brian Pfeiffer re: same (1.0); meeting with			
	, 1			0.40	158.00	7421010
PFEIFFER, BRIAN D	ų. U	ASSUCTATE	t ()			

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS
Matter: 05005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COKS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839422 Status: B (00397)

		3E NOTW 'A12	PPEIFFER, BRIAN D 35	PILCHIK, EVAN 10 ZIV. ALON 35 STEINGART, BONNIS K. 30	STGINGART, BONNIB E. 30	21V, ALON 35	U M B I L L E D T I M E Employee Name Dept
		ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE	ASSOCIATE ASSOCIATE PARTNER	PARTNER	ASSOCIATE	DETAIL Position
Matter Total	Total	Steingart re: release issues. 03/31/03 Weet with B. Scheler re: plan issues. 03/31/03 Draft memo re: intercompany claims 03/31/03 Reviewing Second Amended Plan.	letter (1.2).  03/31/03 Revise letter to board re: releases  03/31/03 Telephone call with T. Kiriakos and B.	changes {.4}.  03/28/03 Attend to Registration Rights Agreement.  03/28/03 Research concerning equitable subrogation.  03/31/03 Telephone call with Kiriakos regarding letter  03/31/03 Telephone call with Ririakos regarding letter	research (.7),  03/28/03 Review registration rights agreement (.8);  telephone call with D. Golay re: same (.3),  03/28/03 Telephone call regarding revised letter on D&O  and releases with Tom (.4); review letter and	03/27/03 Research concerning equitable subrogation (4.9); Meeting with Brian Pfeiffer concerning	Hork Date Description
519.90	519.90	0.80 3.20 0.90	0.76 0.20	0.80 0.00 1.50	1.10 0.80	5.60	Hours
252,266.00	252,266.00	316.00 1,264.00 337.50	276.50 79.00	308.00 0.00 1.012.50	742.50 540.00	2,100.00	Amount
		7421041 7421032 7414609	7421037 7421039	7408194 7507501 7404029	7404026 7404027	7507502	Index Number

Client: 030792 COMMITTES COMS CREDITORS
Matter: 00005 PLAN OF REORGANIZATION/DISCLOSURE STATEMENT

.

#### Pried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

						ATRINSPOT DOMNED S.
7395943	877.50	1.30			5 0	MELECULAR DOLLARS
7422119	237.50	0.50		PERMIT		SIBINGSAL, COMMIS S.
7395936	540.00	0.80	:			
			U3/10/03 REVIEW OF BAIG Didet Clark (-27) ************************************			
7424348	187.50	0,50		ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIX
7424340	150.00	0	Cash Management Agre			
	N	01.0	03/10/03 Prepare e-mail corr to R. Kwasteniet (K&E) re:	ASSOCIATE	35	HUGHES, KATIE
7187055	о о о о о о о о о о о о о о о о о о о	0 .		ASSOCIATE	35	MELMANI, VIVEK
7422110		) : ) :	03/07/03 Participate in CFC Sale hearing.	ASSOCIATE	75	ZIV, ALON
7414564	F3F 0F		03/07/03 Review pleadings re: Court bearing.	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIK
7424332	375 00	3 6	03/07/03 Participate in CFC sale hearing.	ASSOCIATE	ω UI	MELNANI, VIVEK
7422101	950.00	•				
			bidding documents (.8); review objections			
13.5010	2,545.00	3.B0		PARTNER		STEINGART, BONNIE K.
7424329	360.00	Ф. BO		ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS. ARIK
7420663	316.00	<b>4-80</b>				
7420856	316.00	0.80	03/06/03 Meet with V. Melwani re: CFC sale	ASSOCIATE	Ç.	PERIPPER BRIAN D
7418875	285.40	0.60			t	MCDAMMI, FIRE
7418870	332.50	0.70		STATE OF SERVICES	7 L	- 2
7504137	750.50	1.90	03/05/03 Mon-working travel to NY (billed at 1/2 time).	ASSOCIATE	ž	DESTRUCTION IN
			motion (.3); related for			
7424319	300.00	0.80	03/04/03 Calls with B. Weiss re: CFSC liquidation			
			audtion and other matters.		ć	### DEC.
7424313	187.50	0.50	03/04/03 Committee conference call re: update of CFC	ASSOCIATE	Ž,	Aldt stade
7420841	1,027.00	2.60	review sale documents.			
,	6 6	4.00	03/04/03 Working travel to Kirkland and Kills offices;	ASSOCIATE	35	EFSIFFER, BRIAN D
7420640	1 580.00	4 00	03/04/03 Correspondence re: update of auction issues.			
3010001	0	1	w/Kirkland and HL (2.6).			
SCRRTM	2,375.00	5.00	03/04/03 Participate in auction (2.4); related meetings			
1						
958BTB4	1,425.00	3.00	03/04/03 Working travel to Chicago; prep for auction	ASSOCIATE	<u>9</u>	MELMANI, VIVEX
50056.52	1,215.00	1.60	03/04/03 Attend auction.	PARTNER	30	STEINGART, BONNIE K.
			CFC and auction.			
7420630	1,896.00	4.60	03/03/03 Review materials and prepare for meetings re:	ASSOCIATE	တ်	PRSIFFER, BRIAN D
7319448	177,50	0.50	01/02/03 Reviewing US Trustee objections to bidding	ASSOCIATE	ᅜ	ZIV. AION
					5	pubrojee neme
Index Number	Amount	Hours.	E Book Date Degoription	DETAIL	1 3 E	• 3
	Status: 8		Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER			Matter: 00006 CFC
(00397)	Proforma: 1839423		S Biling Prt : BRAD B. SCHELER	MS CREDITORS	TTEE CO	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS

# Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

(76500)

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00006 CFC	
Silling Prt : BRAD S. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD S. SCHELER	
Status: B	7,0400

1		41,313.00	89.00	Total			
Page   Position   Work Date Description	741461	187.50	0.50	compel. Reviewing comments to the	ASSOCIATE	n F	ZIV, ALON
Dept   Desilion   North Date Description   North Description   N	7417525	165.00	0.60	Review and revise memo re: Lehman	ASSOCIATE	P.	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
RY N D   F T A I I	7424416	187.50	0.50	Correspondence with committee re: [.3]; discussions with B. Pfeiffer	ASSOCIATE	ω α σ σ	PREIS, ARIK
R X B D E T A I I	746403 742103	540.00 158.00	0.80 0.40	Review Houliban memo on claims amo Correspondence with committee re:	Pacallana	n n	
F. W. B. D. E. T. A. I.	J#0#00	877.50	1.30	CFC liquidating plan revisions call with Nuber re: same (.3).			
A K E D E T A I L	740403	337.50	0.50	to compel. Review Lehman motion to compel	PARTMER	30	STRINGART, BONKIR K.
PARTINER   District   Work Date   Description   Hours   District   District   Work Date   Description   District   Dist	750751	660.00	2,40		ASSOCIATE	35	SCHOOLDER, ANDREW
M. E. D. F. T. I.	,			Reviewing motion to compet Lemman (.d/; reviewing and revising memo summarizing	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS. ARIK
M. E. D. E. T. A. I.   Hours   Description   Nork Date Description   Nort Date Date Date Date Date Description   Nort Date Date Date Date Date Date Date Dat	74047	367.34	2.10				
N.E. D. E.T.A.I.L	740171	220.00	0.80		ASSOCIATE	35	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
N. E   D   F   A   I	742440	112.50	0.30	Piscussions with B. Pfeiffer re: CF	ASSOCIATE	D L	DERIS ARTE
N. E. D. E. T. A. I.	742102	118.50	0.30	Telephone call with V. Melwani Te:			
N. E.   D. E. T. A. I. L.   Lept   Position   Mork   Date Description   Disput   Position   Position   North   Date Description   Disput   Position   Disput   Disp	742102	79.00	0.20	Telephone call with A. Sathy re:			
N.E.   D.E.T.A.I.	74210	1,777-50	2 .5 0 .5 0	Review and comment on CFC plan.	ASSOCIATE	35	PEBIFFER, BRIAN D
N.E.   D. E.T.A.I.	1			reorganization re: CFC			
T. M. B.   D. E. T. A. I.	74244	1,312.50	3.50	Review and comment on Debtors'	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIK
Dept Position	74210	1,659.00	4.20	Review and comment on CFC Plan.	ASSOCIATE	Ç	PERIFFER, BRIAN D
N. H. D. E.T. A. I.	742101	118.50	Q. 3Q	Preiffer re: same (.4).		! !	
N.E.   D.E.T.A.I.L.	74221	665.00	1.40	reorganization.  Review and comment on CFC Plan (1.0);	ASSOCIATE	35	MELMANI, VIVEK
I K E   D E T A I L	100	1.004.00	2.30		PARTNER	Ç	STRINGART, BOMNIE K.
I K E   D E T A I L	24045	55.00	0,20	Review of orders re:	ASSOCIATE	υ 5	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
I K E   D E T A I L   Dept   Position   Mork Date Description   Hours   Hours   Dept   Position   Hours   Mork Date Description     Amount	1	<u> </u>					
R. R. D. E.T.A.I.L	742213	1,900.00	4.00		ASSOCIATE	(,) (5)	MELNANI, VIVEK
I K B   D E T A I L	739595	540.00	0.80		PARTMER	ų O	STRINGART, BONNER K.
I K B D E T A I L  Dept Position Work Date Description Hours Hours Hours Hours  10 ASSOCIATE 03/13/03 Revised memore: Goldman DIP.  10 PARTNER 03/13/03 Travel to Chicago to attend CFC sale hearing; 3.80 2.565.00 working travel.  10 03/13/03 Attend Hearing-sale CFC (2.0); review sale 2.80 1.890.00 order (.8).  11 03/13/03 Review Goldman DIP.	35 P 2 P 7	375.00	1.00		ASSOCIATE	Э. Б	PREIS, ARIK
I K E D E T A I L       Hours       Amount         Dept Position       Work Date Description       Hours       Amount         10 ASSOCIATE       03/12/03 Revised memo re: Goldman DIP.       3.80       1.463.00         10 PARTMER       03/13/03 Travel to Chicago to attend CFC sale hearing; 3.80       2.565.00         30 PARTMER       03/13/03 Attend Hearing-sale CFC (2.0); review male       2.80       1,890.00	742212	142.50	0.30		ASSOCIATE	<u>3</u>	MELNAMI, VIVER
I K E D E T A E L       Rept Position       Nork Date Description       Recount         Dept Position       Nork Date Description       Recount         10 ASSOCIATE       03/12/03 Revised memo re: Goldman DIP.       3.80         10 PARTNER       03/13/03 Travel to Chicago to attend CFC sale hearing;       3.80	739594	1,890.00	2.80	working travel. Attend Hearing-sale CFC (2.0);			
I K B D E T A I L  Dept Position Nork Date Description	739594	2,565.00	3.80		PARTMER	90	STEINGART, BONNIB K.
IKB DETAIL  Dept Position Work Date Description  Hours  Amount	740817	1,463.00	3.80		ASSOCIATE	10	PILCHIK. BYAN
IXE DETAIL		i i	200	Nork Date Description	Position	De pr	Smployee Name
	Index Num	i de la companya de l			ETA	×	

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE COMS CREDITORS Matter: 00006 CFC

à

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru: 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS

Matter: 00006 CFC

UNBILUED TIME DETAIL
Employee Name Dept Position Work Date Description

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER

Proforma: 1839423 Statue: B

(76 E 0 0 )

Index Number

Amount

Hours

Matter Total 89.00

41,313.00

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00006 CFC

#### Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
MATTER: 00008 GENERAL OFFICIAL COMMITTEE MATTERS Silling Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER Proforma: 1839424 Statue: B

(00397)

	SCHOULDER, ANDREW	PRESSE. ARIA	2	ELAPA D			PREIS, ARIX			AN D	HUGHES, KATIE 35		FALON, PAUL H. 1		PREIS, ARIK 35			SCHELER, BRAD E. 35			SCHOULDER, ANDREW 35		PREIFFER, BRIAN D 35				(10 G) (10 G)	CITOCOCO VATTE 35	STRINGART, BONNIB K. 30	LER, BRAD E.	ZIV, ALON 35		Employee Name Le	D T I
	35 ASSOCIATE	all book of the second		ASSOCIATE	S PSSOCIATE		13 WOOD CTATE		35 ASSOCIATE	5 ASSOCIATE	5 ASSOCIATE		10 PARTNER		5 ASSOCIATE			V 7333 203		C PARTNER	5 ASSOCIATE		5 ASSOCIATE					SASSOCIATE	PARTMER	PARTNER	ASSOCIATE		нерг новітіол	UETAI
application. 03/10/03 Update correspondence w/professionals.	03/10/03 Prepare agenda for Committee meeting. 03/10/03 Prepare agenda for Committee meeting. 03/10/03 Revise Houlihan Lokey and Greenhill re	03/10/03	ED/01/10	03/10/03	03/10/03	03/09/03 Correspondence with Committee re: indenture	Committee meeting and confere	ng/07/03 Calle and correspondence re: upcoming	{Indenture trustee} 03/07/03 Analysis and review of issues re: indenture	03/D6/03 Telephone call with commiser to ALL FIRST			03/05/03 Review e-mail correspondence re: reorganization	calls and other matters.	03/04/03 Correspondence with Committee re: upcoming		03/04/03 Various calls w/Xirkland in connection with	chanter 11 case.	transaction issues. $c_1/a_4/a_1$ various calls w/committee in connection with	03/04/03 Review Committee e-mail correspondence re:	Revise memo re: trading		03/03/03 Email correspondence re: financial advisor	preparation of open issues list.	compilation of relevant documents and	03/03/03 Preparation for $3/4/03$ meeting, including		Greenhill. 03/03/03 Review daily news re: Conseco and update to	03/03/03 Seview retention application for notified and		01/02/03 Reviewing projections		MOTY hate property.	EASY THE DESCRIPTION
0.30	0.B0 0.30	0,60	0.20	0.80	0.30	0,40		2.00	0.50	;	0.10	0.20	0.00	6	1.50		3.00		2.50		0.20	† OD	0.30	! !		1,80		0.40	1	D.50	7 P	0.40		Hours
82.50	300.00 82.50	225.00	75.00	910.00	142.50	150.00		750.00	237.50		39.50	55.00	1 6 6	50B.0B	20.700	n 62 n	2,100.00		1,750.00		125,00	275.00	TEG. 30			495.00		110.00		337.50	1.050.00	142.00		Amount
7395193	7424350 7395192	7424349	7424342		7422114 7420891	7424557	1	7424331	7422103		7420B55	7384105		7405676		7424317	7423091	1	7423088		7405671	7395174	6	Ltaucrt		BEODER!	) ) ) 1	7384094		7379000	7376706	7319447		Index Number

3

## Pried, Frank, Marris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

82.50	0.30	03/21/03 Prepare e-mail memo re: BX filed by Conseco re: disclosure statement.	ASSOCIATE	ç. U	HUGHES, KATIE
2,100.00	3,00	03/21/03 Various calls (2.0) and internal meetings (1.0)	PARTNER	3.¢	SCHELER, BRAD E.
125.00	0,20	03/21/03 Review e-mail correspondence re: transaction status and issues.	PARTNER	10	FALON, PAUL #.
632.00	1.60	per A. Schoulver. 03/20/03 Meet with V. Melwani re: numerous open issues including plan, employment issues and hearing.	ASSOCIATE	35	PSEIFFER, BRIAN D
		03/19/03 Assist in revising letter to Board of Directors	PARALEGAL	10	BOSSONG, HARRIET S.
55.00 114.50	0.20	03/19/03 Communications with Houlihan re: retention.			
82.50	0.30				
110.00	0.40	03/17/03 Review pleadings re: Houliban/Greenhill retention.	ASSOCIATE	35	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
		03/17/03 Neet with B. Geer re: Houliban recention and chairman search.	ASSOCIATE	36	PERIFFER, BRIAN D
118_50	, ,	Building.			
55,00	0.20	03/17/01 Review updates re: various items, including Disclosure Statement approval, CFC Sale, and GM	ASSOCIATE	5.5	HUCHES, KATIE
55.00	0.20	03/12/D3 Telephone call with Kathy Keifer (Conseco) re: March 13, 2003 meeting.	ASSOCIATE	برا ت	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
1,472.50	3,10	03/12/03 Committee meeting to hear business update and	ASSCCIATE	ra B	MELWANI, VIVEX
		egulatory issues			
2,565.00	3.80	03/12/03 Conference call and meeting at Davis Polk to	PARTNER		STRINGART, BONNIE K.
		at meeting with company and creditors			
7,700.00	11.00	03/12/03 Prep for, working travel to/from and attendance	PARTNER	<del>ن</del> ي ښ	SCHELER, BRAD B.
1,875,00	3,00	03/12/03 Participate by conference call in meeting with	PARTNER	10	FALON, PAUL H.
i i i		03/14/05 KEYLEW OI COCCUMENTED IN PROPERTY. CO. TOTAL CO	ASSOCIATE	Ç.	SCHOULDER, ANDREW
1,127.50	4.10			i	
487.50	1.30	prep for committee meeting (1.0). 03/11/03 Review of documents in preparation for	ASSOCIATE	35	PREIS, ARIX
		03/11/03 ASETORB CETTR #/commerced memora (1.0), and	ASSOCIATE	35	MELWANI, VIVEK
950.00	S C	03/11/03 Review various update e-mails.	ASSOCIATE	3E	HUGHES, KATIE
	,	conference call and calls with clients [1.5].			
		varte, or contraction (1 s), participate on committee	PHAINDA	ú	SCHELER, BRAD B.
2,100.00	00 E	All to Calle wicompittee in connection with		í	
2	HOLLE	Work Date Description	Position	Dept	mployee Nac
# 2 3 7	<del>!</del>		DETAIL	H 25 (5)	CABILLED T
Statue: B	_	Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD E. SCHELER	NS CREDITORS	TIBE CO	Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS Matter: 00008 GENERAL OFFICIAL COMMITTEE MATTERS
1	-				

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Nork Date Thru: 03/31/03

Client: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
MATTERS COMMITTEE MATTERS UNBILLED TIME DETAIL Billing Prt : BRAD B. SCHELER Responsible Prt: BRAD B. SCHELER Proforma: 1839424 Statue: B (00397)

MELEGACI STUDY OF THE TOURS OF THE STUDY OF
3 Review of 6-K and summary thereof. 1 Review letter to Board.
3.00
300.00 1,425.00
7424387 7497029

Total

85.50 44,481.50

ě

Fried, Frank, Harris, Shriver & Jacobson Work Date Thru : 03/31/03

Clienc: 030792 COMMITTEE CONS CREDITORS
Matter: 00008 GENERAL OFFICIAL COMMITTEE MATTERS

Billing Prt : BRAD E. SCHELER Responsible Prt: SRAD E. SCHELER

Proforma: 1839424 Status: B

(00397)

UNBILLED TIME DETAIL
Employee Name Dept Position

Dept Position Work Date Description

Ноцтв

Amount

Index Number

Matter Total

85.50 44,481.50

ŧ