

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



JULY 12, 2002

GS WEBB, JR.  
BA2DOCS1/105147v1  
INVOICE NO.  
593090

BETHLEHEM STEEL CORPORATION  
BETHLEHEM, PENNSYLVANIA 18016

ATTENTION: KATHLEEN M. MILLS, ESQUIRE

**BILLING SUMMARY**

SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE PERIOD  
JUNE 1, 2002 THROUGH JUNE 30, 2002

<u>MATTER DESCRIPTION/ REFERENCE NUMBER BETHLEHEM TRACKING NO.</u>	<u>FEES</u>	<u>DISBURSEMENTS</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
ASBESTOS SUBPOENA DUCES TECUM (00259:060893 - 593090) BSC #81-00273	500.00	0.00	500.00
ENVIRONMENTAL MULTIMEDIA AGREEMENT (00259:170592 - 593090) BSC# UNKNOWN	924.00	6.00	930.00
FRANK STEWART - SHIPYARD CLASS ACTION UNDER ERISA (00259:147602 - 593090) BSC # 99-00070	10,537.00	480.60	11,017.60
(MACATEE) SUIT FOR PENSION BENEFITS (00259:177225 - 593090) BSC # UNKNOWN	38,833.50	4,474.36	43,307.86
	<b>50,794.5</b>	<b>4,960.96</b>	
TOTAL FOR THESE MATTERS BEING BILLED THIS MONTH			<b>55,755.46</b> =====

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
*Including professional corporations*

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

CLIENT NUMBER / DESCRIPTION MATTER NUMBER / DESCRIPTION	FEEs	DISBURSEMENTS	TOTAL
000259 BETHLEHEM STEEL CORPORATI			
060893 ASBESTOS SUBPOENA DUCES	500.00	0.00	500.00
107592 ENVIRONMENTAL MULTIMEDI	924.00	6.00	930.00
123788 ROBERT J. HARTE ERISA C	0.00	0.00	0.00
147602 SHIPYARD CLASS ACTION U	10,537.00	480.60	11,017.60
164422 (JOHNSON) DEFENSE OF AS	0.00	0.00	0.00
177225 (MACATEE) SUIT FOR PENS	38,833.50	4,474.36	43,307.86
	50,794.50	4,960.96	
TOTAL FOR THESE MATTERS BEING BILLED THIS MONTH			\$ 55,755.46 =====

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

259.60893

SMITH, CRAIG E.

ASBESTOS SUBPOENA DUCES TECUM

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

HECHT, MICHAEL L.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/20/02 CONFERENCES WITH C. SMITH; CONFERENCE WITH W. MORRISSEY AND C. SMITH	1.00
HECHT, MICHAEL L.	TOTAL HOURS 1.00

SMITH, CRAIG E.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/12/02 TELEPHONE CALL WITH MORRISSEY; LETTER TO MORRISSEY	.20
06/17/02 TELEPHONE CALLS WITH GIBBS (KRAMON & GRAHAM); TELEPHONE CALL WITH MORRISSEY	.20
06/20/02 TELEPHONE CALLS WITH WALT MORRISSEY; CONFERENCE WITH MICHAEL HECHT; TELEPHONE CALL WITH GIBBS	1.10
SMITH, CRAIG E.	TOTAL HOURS 1.50
TOTAL HOURS	2.50

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE/HR</u>		<u>AMOUNT</u>
SMITH, CRAIG E.	1.50	290.00	\$	435.00
HECHT, MICHAEL L.	1.00	180.00		180.00
TOTAL	2.50		\$	615.00
TOTAL BILLED FOR LEGAL SERVICES			\$	500.00

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

259.107592

KENNEY, BRIGID E.

ENVIRONMENTAL MULTIMEDIA AGREEMENT

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

KENNEY, BRIGID E.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/04/02 FINISH READING RELEASE SITE CHARACTERIZATION STUDY; REVIEW CONSENT DECREE RE INTERIM MEASURES; LEAVE MESSAGE FOR CARAM	.70
06/27/02 READ NATURE AND EXTENT WORKPLAN	.80
06/28/02 CALL FROM CARAM; REVIEW AND REVISE TRANSMITTAL LETTER	1.30
KENNEY, BRIGID E.	TOTAL HOURS 2.80
TOTAL HOURS	2.80

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE/HR</u>		<u>AMOUNT</u>
KENNEY, BRIGID E.	2.80	330.00	\$	924.00
TOTAL	2.80		\$	924.00
TOTAL BILLED FOR LEGAL SERVICES			\$	924.00

DISBURSEMENTS

LONG DISTANCE TELEPHONE	\$	6.00	
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS		\$	6.00

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

259.147602

WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.

SHIPYARD CLASS ACTION UNDER ERISA

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

MANECHE, MARK D.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/03/02 CALL FROM C. SMITH RE: LEGAL RESEARCH ON STANDING OF EMPLOYEES TO SUE UNDER PENSION AGREEMENT; RESEARCH ON SAME; MEET WITH G.S. WEBB RE: ORAL ARGUMENT STRATEGY	2.20
06/04/02 MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: ORAL ARGUMENT IN FOURTH CIRCUIT	.20
MANECHE, MARK D.	TOTAL HOURS 2.40

SMITH, CRAIG E.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/01/02 CONSIDER PRESENTATION; TELEPHONE CALLS WITH STEWART WEBB	1.60
06/03/02 TRAVEL AND PREPARATION FOR ARGUMENT	6.00
06/04/02 ARGUMENT IN FOURTH CIRCUIT COURT AND RETURN TO OFFICE	7.00
SMITH, CRAIG E.	TOTAL HOURS 14.60

WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/01/02 PREP. FOR ORAL ARGUMENT	3.20
06/03/02 DISCUSS WITH CE SMITH; PREP. FOR ORAL ARGUMENT	7.20
06/03/02 TRAVEL TO RICHMOND	3.20
06/04/02 TRAVEL FROM RICHMOND	3.00
06/04/02 PREP. FOR AND ATTEND ORAL ARGUMENT	5.20
06/05/02 TEL. K. MILLS RE ORAL ARGUMENT	.40
WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.	TOTAL HOURS 22.20

TOTAL HOURS 39.20

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE/HR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
SMITH, CRAIG E.	14.60	290.00	\$ 4,234.00
WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.	22.20	340.00	7,548.00
MANECHE, MARK D.	2.40	225.00	540.00
TOTAL	39.20		\$ 12,322.00
TOTAL BILLED FOR LEGAL SERVICES			\$ 10,537.00

DISBURSEMENTS

05/29/02 TRAVEL	\$ 15.00
EXPENSES-G.S.WEBB-HOTEL RESERVATION 5/29/02 TICKET #8154960087	
05/29/02 TRAVEL EXPENSES-C.SMITH-HOTEL	15.00
RESERVATION 5/29/02 TICKET #8154960088	
06/03/02 LEGAL	132.82
RESEARCH/WESTLAW-M.MANECHE	
06/06/02 TRAVEL EXPENSE GS WEBB, JR.	178.20
RICHMOND, VA 6/4/02 FOR ORAL ARGUMENT (HOTEL & MEALS)	
06/07/02 TRAVEL EXPENSE CE SMITH	133.88
FOURTH CIRCUIT COURT 6/4/02 FOR ARGUMENT (HOTEL)	
INTERNAL REPRODUCTION COSTS	5.70
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$ 480.60

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

259.177225

WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.

(MACATEE) SUIT FOR PENSION BENEFITS

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

KIRALY, JULIA M.

	<u>HOURS</u>
06/12/02 RESEARCH REGARDING WHETHER AN INTERNAL INVESTIGATION MUST BE DISCLOSED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ERISA AS WELL AS WHAT DOCUMENTS ARE CONSIDERED PERTINENT AND REQUIRE DISCLOSURE TO MACATEE.	4.30
06/14/02 RESEARCHING PROCEDURAL REQUIREMENTS FOR FULL AND FAIR REVIEW	4.40
06/15/02 RESEARCH ISSUE OF WHETHER BETHLEHEM STEEL HAD AN OBLIGATION TO DISCLOSE AN INTERNAL INVESTIGATION TO COMPLY WITH THE NOTICE OF DENIAL AND FULL AND FAIR REVIEW REQUIREMENTS OF ERISA.	10.50
06/17/02 RESEARCH PROCEDURAL DUE PROCESS AND NOTICE OF DENIAL	2.70
06/20/02 RESEARCH DECISIONS IN WHICH THE COURT CONSIDERED THE SCOPE OF PERTINENT DOCUMENTS AND WAS REQUIRED TO BE PROVIDED UNDER ERISA	3.50
06/21/02 RESEARCH REGARDING THE ADVERSE INFERENCE RULE, RELEVANT DOCUMENTS REQUIRED TO BE DISCLOSED UNDER SECTION 1024B4, PERTINENT DOCUMENTS TO BE DISCLOSED UNDER SECTION 503; DRAFT LEGAL ARGUMENT FOR NOTICES OF DENIAL; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH REGARDING STATUS OF RESEARCH.	8.20
06/22/02 REVIEW CASES REGARDING REQUIREMENT FOR DISCLOSURE OF RELEVANT DOCUMENTS UNDER SECTION 1024B4.	3.50
06/23/02 REVIEW CASES REGARDING DISCLOSURE OF DOCUMENTS AND THE ADVERSE INFERENCE RULE.	1.50
06/24/02 RESEARCH CASES IN WHICH REMAND WAS THE APPROPRIATE REMEDY; RESEARCH ADVERSE INFERENCE RULE; DRAFT ARGUMENT REGARDING RECEIPT OF PERTINENT DOCUMENTS	8.10
06/25/02 DRAFT ARGUMENTS REGARDING ERISA DUE PROCESS REQUIREMENTS OF NOTICE OF DENIAL AND FULL AND FAIR REVIEW, ADVERSE INFERENCE RULE, REMAND	11.60
06/26/02 RESEARCH REQUIREMENTS FOR REMAND AND IMPOSITION OF STATUTORY FEES FOR FAILURE TO DISCLOSE	6.10

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	DOCUMENTS; DRAFT ARGUMENT REGARDING REMAND AND FEES.	
06/27/02	REVISE DRAFT ARGUMENT; RESEARCH AND DRAFT SUPPORT FOR INDICATED CITES.	3.50
06/28/02	RESEARCH STANDARD FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT, LOCATE CITATIONS, DRAFT ADDITIONAL ARGUMENT REGARDING FACT THAT THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR CONSIDERED ALL EVIDENCE	6.00
06/29/02	REVISE ERISA NOTICE OF DENIAL AND FULL AND FAIR REVIEW ARGUMENTS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.	1.50
06/30/02	REVISE ERISA NOTICE OF DENIAL AND FULL AND FAIR REVIEW ARGUMENTS FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION.	2.60
	KIRALY, JULIA M.	TOTAL HOURS
		78.00

MANECHE, MARK D.

		<u>HOURS</u>
06/05/02	MEET WITH G.S. WEBB RE: FILING MOTION TO STRIKE PLAINTIFF'S SUMMARY JUDGMENT AFFIDAVITS	.10
06/06/02	MEET WITH C. SMITH AND T. OGUNE RE: CASE BACKGROUND AND RESEARCH ISSUES FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION AND MOTION TO STRIKE PLAINTIFF'S AFFIDAVITS; READ DRAFT SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION ARGUMENT	1.70
06/10/02	READ AND ANALYZE PLAINTIFF'S SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMORANDUM; READ AND ANALYZE FOURTH CIRCUIT CASE LAW ON APPROPRIATE SCOPE OF REVIEW OF ADMINISTRATIVE RECORD; MEET WITH C. SMITH AND G. S. WEBB RE: SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION AND MOTION TO STRIKE	4.40
06/11/02	DRAFT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STRIKE MACATEE AND THOMPSON AFFIDAVITS; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME	1.30
06/12/02	DRAFT, REVISE AND EDIT MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STRIKE MACATEE AND THOMPSON AFFIDAVITS; LEGAL RESEARCH ON BINDING EFFECT OF PLAINTIFF'S COUNSEL'S POSITION REGARDING SCOPE OF DISCOVERY; REVIEW CASE LAW AUTHORITIES ON SCOPE OF REVIEW OF DECISION OF PLAN ADMINISTRATOR; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME; OUTLINE SCOPE OF REVIEW ARGUMENT	6.10
06/13/02	DRAFT STANDARD OF REVIEW SECTION OF SUMMARY	3.80

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY



VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	JUDGMENT OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: REVISING MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO STRIKE; REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO STRIKE MEMORANDUM; REVISE STANDARD OF REVIEW ARGUMENT	
06/14/02	REVISE AND EDIT MOTION TO STRIKE MACATEE AND THOMPSON AFFIDAVITS; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME; RESEARCH FOR CASE LAW SUPPORTING STRIKING OF AFFIDAVITS BASED ON REFUSAL TO RESPOND TO DISCOVERY	2.10
06/24/02	MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: STATUS OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM	.30
06/25/02	MEET WITH C. SMITH AND T. OGUNE RE: STATUS OF MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO SUMMARY JUDGMENT AND REMAINING MATTERS; REVIEW, REVISE AND EDIT DRAFT SUMMARY JUDGMENT ARGUMENT SECTION; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME	4.80
06/26/02	REVISE AND EDIT SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM; CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. SMITH AND J. KIRALY RE: SAME; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: STATUS OF OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM	4.70
06/27/02	CONFERENCE CALL WITH C. SMITH AND J. KIRALY RE: STATUS OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM; MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: SAME; MEET WITH T. OGUNE RE: OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM ARGUMENT SECTION	.40
06/28/02	MEET WITH C. SMITH RE: STANDARD OF REVIEW SECTION OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT OPPOSITION MEMORANDUM; CONFERENCE CALL WITH C, SMITH AND J. KIRALY RE: SAME	.30
	MANECHE, MARK D.	TOTAL HOURS 30.00

OGUNE, THEO I.

		<u>HOURS</u>
06/03/02	DRAFTED MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT	2.50
06/05/02	REVIEWED MACATEE'S MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT; REVIEWED CASES ON THE DOCUMENT ISSUE	1.50
06/06/02	PULLED CASES CITED IN MACATEE'S MEMO IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT; MEETING WITH C. SMITH AND M. MANECHE	10.80

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
*Including professional corporations*

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

06/08/02	DRAFTED SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMO; CONDUCTED SUPPLEMENTAL RESEARCH CONSISTENT WITH THE DIRECTION OF ARGUMENTS	10.20
06/09/02	WORKED ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMO AND ATTENDANT RESEARCH	10.00
06/10/02	CONFERENCE WITH C. SMITH; WORKED ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMO; RESEARCHED CASES RE THE EXCLUSION OF VACATION TIME FROM CONTINUOUS SERVICE FOR THE PURPOSES OF CALCULATING ELIGIBILITY FOR PENSION BENEFITS	12.40
06/17/02	WORKED ON SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMO	5.20
06/18/02	FURTHER RESEARCH ON THE ISSUE OF VACATION TIME; ORGANIZED PRIOR FILINGS BY BETH STEEL AND THE PLAN	3.80
06/19/02	FURTHER RESEARCH ON WHAT CONSTITUTES THE RIGHT TO CONTROL, A FACTOR IN DEFINING A COMMON LAW EMPLOYEE; FURTHER RESEARCH ON THE DISTINCTION BETWEEN AN INTERPRETATION AND FACTUAL ISSUES RE THE DISCRETION GRANTED A PLAN ADMINISTRATOR	5.80
06/20/02	DRAFTED LANGUAGE SUMMARIZING SUMMARY JUDGMENT STANDARDS; RESEARCH ON ERISA CASES GRANTING SUMMARY JUDGMENT	3.20
06/21/02	RESEARCH ON THE "RIGHT TO CONTROL" AN EMPLOYEE; SUMMARY JUDGMENT CASES; REVIEW OF CASES RE "RIGHT TO CONTROL"	6.20
06/24/02	SUMMARY JUDGMENT CASES - REVIEW OF CASES WHERE COURTS HAVE GRANTED SUMMARY JUDGMENT TO DEFENDANTS IN CLAIMS RE DENIAL OF ERISA BENEFITS	2.80
06/25/02	MEETING WITH C. SMITH AND M. MANECHE	.80
06/25/02	WORKED ON SECTION OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMO APPLYING THE 4TH CIRCUIT'S 8-1 FACTOR TEST TO ARGUE THE REASONABLENESS OF THE PLAN ADMINISTRATOR'S DECISION; RESEARCHED CASES UPHOLDING THE TYPES OF DECISIONS MADE IN MACATEE'S SITUATION	5.00
06/26/02	RESEARCH ON THE APPLICATION OF THE 4TH CIRCUIT'S REASONABLENESS FACTORS IN THE DETERMINATION WHETHER A PLAN DECISION IS REASONABLE; E-MAIL TO M. MANECHE RE SUMMARY JUDGMENT STANDARDS; REVIEW OF CASES	7.20
06/27/02	REWORKED SECTION OF MEMO DEALING WITH REASONABLENESS FACTORS	5.20

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

06/28/02	REVIEWED 26 C.F.R. SECS. 31.3121(D)(2) AND 31.3306(I)-1(B)(2001) AND DARDEN, AND DRAFTED A PARAGRAPH STATING WHY THE SECTIONS ARE NOT APPLICABLE TO MACATEE'S CASE	2.50
06/29/02	RESEARCHED WHETHER IN ERISA CASES COURTS FOLLOW THE DEFINITION OF EMPLOYEE IN IRS REGULATION; FURTHER RESEARCH ON WHAT CONSTITUTES THE "RIGHT TO CONTROL" AS A FACTOR IN THE DEFINITION OF AN EMPLOYEE UNDER ERISA; DRAFTED SECTION OF SUMMARY JUDGMENT MEMO REBUTTING MACATEE'S RELIANCE ON IRS REGULATION AND DARDEN	2.20
	OGUNE, THEO I.	TOTAL HOURS <u>97.30</u>

SMITH, CRAIG E.

		<u>HOURS</u>
06/03/02	DISCUSSION WITH THEO OGUNE	.10
06/04/02	DISCUSSION WITH THEO OGUNE; DISCUSSION WITH MARK MANECHE; REVIEW MATERIALS	.70
06/06/02	CONFERENCE WITH MARK MANECHE; CONFERENCE WITH THEO OGUNE; CONFERENCE WITH STEWART WEBB; REVIEW PAPERS	2.90
06/07/02	REVIEW PAPERS; TELEPHONE CALL WITH KATHY MILLS	2.50
06/08/02	WORK ON MOTION	1.80
06/10/02	WORK ON MOTION; CONFERENCE WITH MARK MANECHE; TELEPHONE CALL WITH KATHY MILLS	6.50
06/11/02	CALL TO OGUNE; REVIEW MATERIALS; WORK ON MOTION	2.60
06/12/02	WORK ON PAPERS	2.10
06/13/02	CONFERENCE WITH MARK MANECHE; WORK ON PAPERS	2.20
06/14/02	WORK ON PAPERS	4.60
06/15/02	WORK ON PAPERS	3.80
06/16/02	WORK ON PAPERS	.60
06/17/02	WORK ON PAPERS	6.80
06/18/02	TELEPHONE CALL WITH JULIA KIRALY; TELEPHONE CALL WITH THEO OGUNE; WORK ON PAPERS	3.40
06/19/02	WORK ON PAPERS	4.10
06/20/02	WORK ON PAPERS; TELEPHONE CALL WITH KATHY MILLS	6.80
06/21/02	WORK ON PAPERS	5.20
06/22/02	WORK ON PAPERS	5.00
06/24/02	WORK ON PAPERS	.40
06/25/02	CONFERENCE WITH MARK MANECHE; WORK ON PAPERS	5.70

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
Including professional corporations

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

06/26/02	WORK ON PAPERS	3.20
06/27/02	WORK ON PAPERS	3.50
06/28/02	WORK ON PAPERS	3.90
06/29/02	WORK ON PAPERS	6.40
06/30/02	WORK ON PAPERS	2.00
	SMITH, CRAIG E.	TOTAL HOURS 86.80

WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.

		<u>HOURS</u>
06/05/02	TEL. K. MILLS RE SUM.JUDG.MOTION; REVIEW SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS; DISCUSS WITH MD MANECHE	1.00
06/06/02	DISCUSS WITH CE SMITH RE SUM.JUDG.MOTION	.50
06/07/02	WORK ON SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS	.50
06/10/02	DISCUSS SUM.JUDG.MOTION WITH CE SMITH AND WITH MD MANECHE	.80
06/11/02	REVIEW SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS	.60
06/12/02	REVIEW SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS AND DISCUSS WITH CE SMITH	2.10
06/15/02	WORK ON SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS	1.20
06/17/02	REVIEW & REVISE SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS	.40
06/17/02	REVIEW & REVISE MEMO RE MOTION STRIKE; DISCUSS SAME WITH CE SMITH	.60
06/18/02	REVIEW SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS; DISCUSS WITH CE SMITH RE SUM.JUDG.MOTION	.60
06/19/02	DISCUSS WITH CE SMITH RE SUM.JUDG.MOTION ISSUES	.30
06/20/02	REVIEW AND REVISE SUM.JUDG.MOTION PAPERS (FACTS)	.70
06/22/02	REVIEW SUM.JUDG.MOTION MEMO	1.50
06/25/02	DISCUSS WITH CE SMITH RE SUM.JUDG.MOTION	.20
06/28/02	CONF. CALL CE SMITH AND KM MILLS RE: SUM.JUDG.MOTION ISSUES	1.40
	WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.	TOTAL HOURS 12.40

TOTAL HOURS 304.50

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE/HR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
SMITH, CRAIG E.	86.80	290.00	\$ 25,172.00

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
*Including professional corporations*

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

<u>TIMEKEEPER</u>	<u>HOURS</u>	<u>RATE/HR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
WEBB, G. STEWART, JR.	12.40	340.00	4,216.00
KIRALY, JULIA M.	78.00	175.00	13,650.00
MANECHE, MARK D.	30.00	225.00	6,750.00
OGUNE, THEO I.	97.30	180.00	17,514.00
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>304.50</b>		<b>\$ 67,302.00</b>
<b>TOTAL BILLED FOR LEGAL SERVICES</b>			<b>\$ 38,833.50</b>

DISBURSEMENTS

05/27/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-T.OGUNE	\$ 42.01
05/28/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-T.OGUNE	488.44
06/03/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-T.OGUNE	56.20
06/06/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-T.OGUNE	136.74
06/08/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS I. OGUNE	176.08
06/09/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS I. OGUNE	204.64
06/10/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS I. OGUNE	493.09
06/12/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-MARK D. MANECHE	203.06
06/12/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS-JULIA KIRALY	348.00
06/14/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-MARK D. MANECHE	108.65
06/14/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/LEXIS-M.MANECHE	108.00
06/17/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS I. OGUNE	156.22
06/18/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS I. OGUNE	5.44
06/19/02	LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS	354.38

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY

**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
*Including professional corporations*

1800 Mercantile Bank & Trust Building  
Two Hopkins Plaza  
Baltimore, Maryland 21201-2978  
(410) 244-7400, Fax (410) 244-7742  
Federal ID: 52-0517250

Remit to:  
**VENABLE, BAETJER AND HOWARD, LLP**  
P.O. Box 630798  
Baltimore, Maryland 21263-0798



INVOICE NO.  
593090

JUNE 30, 2002

06/20/02	I. OGUNE LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS	559.70	
06/21/02	I. OGUNE LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS	28.27	
06/24/02	I. OGUNE LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS	125.64	
06/25/02	I. OGUNE LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS	276.17	
06/26/02	I. OGUNE LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-MARK D. MANECHE	4.99	
06/26/02	I. OGUNE LEGAL RESEARCH/WESTLAW-THEOPHILUS	314.77	
	I. OGUNE COMMERCIAL MESSENGER	18.67	
	INTERNAL REPRODUCTION COSTS	247.70	
	TELECOPY	17.50	
	<b>TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS</b>		<b>\$ 4,474.36</b>

INVOICES ARE PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
ATTORNEY'S COPY