

**MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC**

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

**CASE SUMMARY**

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Aaron, Robert (CA)	0	0	8.82	8.82
Adams, William (SF)	1.50	382.50	24.30	406.80
Allen, Geraldine (SF)	3.20	510.00	0	510.00
Allen, Leonard (SF)	0	0	1.98	1.98
Andrews III, Thomas (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Araujo, Reynaldo (TX)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Baker, Robert (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Barnes, Hervie (SF)	2.40	450.00	0	450.00
Bates, Lester (SF)	2.40	450.00	0	450.00
Bennett, Darrie (SF)	10.90	1,087.50	6.66	1,094.16
Blasdell, Walter (OR)	3.70	547.50	0	547.50
Bouyea, Roger (SF)	0	0	3.96	3.96
Brain, Robert (OH)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Brenner, Ralph (SF)	3.40	525.00	0	525.00
Brignac, Eva (TX)	1.50	112.50	0	112.50
Brown, Alicia J (PA)	2.00	420.00	0	420.00
Brown, Robert Louis (SF)	2.00	150.00	0	150.00
Brumley, Jimmy Ray (TX)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Burge, Georgene (TX)	2.50	457.50	0	457.50
Burke, James P (PA)	8.50	907.50	6.30	913.80
Burkhart, Nancy (Buffalo)	2.00	420.00	0	420.00
Calloway, George (TX)	0	0	6.66	6.66
Campbell, Patrick (WA)	3.90	562.50	7.02	569.52
Carey, Donald (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Carlson, Thomas (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Cassou, Marcel (SF)	29.50	3,882.50	5.04	3,887.54
Cisneros, Orlando (SF)	9.00	1,320.00	6.12	1,326.12
Clemmons, Durward (OH)	0	0	5.58	5.58

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

**CASE SUMMARY**

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Coleman, James W (TX)	0	0	3.42	3.42
Cruz, Roman (SF)	0	0	2.16	2.16
Dalesky, Sam (OR)	3.50	532.50	10.80	543.30
Dural, Alton (SF)	2.40	450.00	0	450.00
Eastmark, Erling (WA)	6.80	780.00	0	780.00
Edwards, Dianna (SF)	11.80	1,670.00	20.70	1,690.70
Esposito, Frank (NY)	5.50	682.50	5.04	687.54
Floyd, Luther (SF)	5.60	690.00	0	690.00
Ganley, Richard/Marie (SF)	0.40	30.00	0	30.00
Gault, Leroy (SF)	19.20	1,836.50	25.56	1,862.06
Gelling, Noreen (NY)	8.00	870.00	0	870.00
GENERAL	19.00	3,443.00	29.70	3,472.70
Gibson, Mary (TX)	3.00	495.00	18.72	513.72
Godsey, Dornel (TX)	8.50	907.50	0	907.50
Grant, Cleveland (SF)	6.20	735.00	0	735.00
Greenfield, Kenneth (SF)	3.80	555.00	0	555.00
Grube, Norm (SF)	2.20	165.00	0	165.00
Harmon, Sidney (SF)	0.90	67.50	7.56	75.06
Haugh, John J (NY)	4.50	607.50	4.14	611.64
Hazen, Thomas (SF)	5.30	667.50	3.78	671.28
Henderson, Leamorf (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Henry, Dickie (SF)	3.90	562.50	0	562.50
Hoey, Paul (IL)	0	0	14.40	14.40
Houx, Merle (SF)	0	0	4.68	4.68
Howell, Fannie (TX)	0	0	9.00	9.00
Hunsaker, Lewis (SF)	2.10	157.50	0	157.50
Jennings, Sonny (SF)	2.40	450.00	0	450.00
Jessup, Keith (OR)	1.30	97.50	0	97.50

**MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC**

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

**CASE SUMMARY**

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Kaeintz, Robert (SF)	1.40	105.00	0	105.00
Kangas (SF)	0.40	30.00	0	30.00
Kennedy, Corinne (SF)	3.20	459.50	2.88	462.38
Kessler, Karoline (SF)	4.90	637.50	0	637.50
Kortum, Fred (SF)	2.70	472.50	0	472.50
Lacey, James/Lucy (SF)	3.50	494.50	120.24	614.74
Lane, Hiram (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Lawson, Otis (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Limu, Talolo (SF)	3.10	502.50	0	502.50
Loy, Dramia (FL)	0	0	8.82	8.82
Luksys, Francis (SF)	7.40	1,100.00	101.34	1,201.34
Lynch, James E (SF)	4.00	570.00	0	570.00
Mansfield, Howard (WA)	3.80	555.00	0	555.00
McCabe, Thomas (SF)	4.60	615.00	0	615.00
McGonnell, James (SF)	1.80	135.00	0	135.00
McHenry, John E (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
McMahon, Mildred (SF)	2.00	150.00	0	150.00
Millar, Geoffrey (SF)	3.80	555.00	0	555.00
Millay, Richard (SF)	3.20	510.00	0	510.00
Miller, Paul (SF)	1.50	112.50	2.16	114.66
Miller, Robert (SF)	2.30	442.50	0	442.50
Mitchell, Freddie (SF)	3.70	547.50	0	547.50
Monette, Charles (CA)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Morris, Linda (SF)	1.40	105.00	0	105.00
O'Brien, Robert (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Olson, Albon (SF)	3.30	517.50	0	517.50
Omran, Naimeh (SF)	1.90	142.50	0	142.50
Ortiz, Jose (SF)	15.00	2,070.00	12.96	2,082.96

**MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC****January 1 - January 31, 2002****Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation****CASE SUMMARY**

---

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Oteri, Gladys (NY)	3.00	495.00	0	495.00
Paasch, Vernon (WA)	2.30	172.50	0	172.50
Pedrick, Helen (WA)	2.20	165.00	0	165.00
Perry, Angelo (SF)	3.50	532.50	0	532.50
Phillips, David (CA)	0.40	30.00	0	30.00
Polk, James K (SF)	4.20	585.00	0	585.00
Poulsen, Ole E (OH)	1.10	82.50	0	82.50
Pouriea, Robert (OR)	2.80	210.00	3.96	213.96
Quindag, Maria (SF)	1.60	120.00	0	120.00
Quintana, Donald (SF)	3.70	547.50	0	547.50
Rabeaux Sr, Robert (TX)	5.00	645.00	0	645.00
Rasmussen, Lowell (SF)	5.00	533.00	17.10	550.10
Reyes, Apolinario (SF)	3.60	270.00	0	270.00
Romero, Louis (SF)	3.20	240.00	0	240.00
Rowton, Clark (SF)	1.70	127.50	0	127.50
Sahlberg, Carolyn (SF)	1.40	105.00	0	105.00
Saunders, Richard (SF)	2.00	150.00	0	150.00
Seales, Walter (NY)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Sifford, E Maxine (SF)	1.80	135.00	0	135.00
Skolnick, Milton (SF)	2.00	150.00	0	150.00
Smith, Louise (SF)	0	0	0.36	0.36
Souza, Ramona (CA)	1.90	142.50	0	142.50
St. Germain, Paul (SF)	1.80	135.00	0	135.00
Staker, Shirley (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Steineback, William (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Strobel, Robert (SF)	0	0	10.44	10.44
Swegles, Myrtle (SF)	4.00	300.00	0	300.00
Taylor Jr, John (NY)	0.50	37.50	0.72	38.22

---

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

**CASE SUMMARY**

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Thompson, Hebert (SF)	3.00	225.00	0	225.00
Vail, Leonard (MA)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Vinal, Evelyn (SF)	2.00	150.00	0	150.00
Wallin, Albert (WA)	3.00	225.00	0	225.00
Ward, Ethel (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Watkins, Hugh/Donna (SF)	0.70	66.50	6.66	73.16
Watley, James/Ollie (SF)	1.90	142.50	0	142.50
Williams, Lee (SF)	2.30	172.50	0	172.50
Wilmot, Thomas (SF)	2.20	98.50	13.68	112.18
Wright, Allen (SF)	1.50	112.50	0	112.50
Yoshida, Edward (OR)	1.80	135.00	0	135.00
<b>TOTALS</b>	<b>394.60</b>	<b>\$50,116.50</b>	<b>\$ 543.42</b>	<b>\$50,659.92</b>

**MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC**

**January 1 - January 31, 2002**

**Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation**

---

**INVOICE TOTALS**

---

TOTAL FEES	\$50,116.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$543.42
<hr/>	
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT DUE</b>	<b>\$50,659.92</b>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice #00026  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
DONALD S. MACLACHLAN, ESQ.	96.50	255.00	\$24,607.50
SUSAN A. FILL, Paralegal, Research-Reference-Trial Cases	3.80	85.00	\$323.00
GLORIA E. BELLO, Paralegal, Trial Cases	46.90	75.00	\$3,517.50
KATHLEEN L. MCNAMARA, Paralegal, California & General	67.40	75.00	\$5,055.00
SUSAN BOWERS-JOHNSON, MD, MPH	64.80	125.00	\$8,100.00
CAROLYNN EMBARRATO, RN, BSN, MA, Medical Paralegal	17.30	95.00	\$1,643.50
LINDA E. CROSBY, RN, BSN, Medical Paralegal	87.40	75.00	\$6,555.00
VICTORIA WALTHER, Data Entry	10.50	30.00	\$315.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>AARON, ROBERT (Oakland, CA)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	8.82
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 8.82]</u>



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ADAMS, WILLIAM (San Francisco)</u>			
1/2/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.50	382.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ADAMS, WILLIAM (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	24.30
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 24.30]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ALLEN, GERALDINE (WD: LEONARD) (San Francisco)</u>			
1/2/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.70	127.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.20	510.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ALLEN, LEONARD (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	1.98
 SUBTOTAL:	 [ 1.98]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BAKER, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/18/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.30	442.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARNES, HERVIE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/18/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.40	450.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BATES, LESTER (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.40</u>	<u>450.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BENNETT, DARRIE [WD: WILLIAM] (San Francisco)</u>				
1/4/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/24/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. REVIEW SPECIALTY MEDICAL FILE FOLDERS. REVIEW INTERNET PUBMED STUDY ADSTRACTS ON END STAGE RENAL DISEASE, AND DIALYSIS RELATED SEPSIS. BEGIN MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO.	5.90	442.50
1/25/02	LEC	CONTINUE TO PREPARE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO FOR SBJ AND DSM REVIEW IN ORDER TO MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY AND PRESERVE TRIAL RESOLUTION POTENTIAL.	3.50	262.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 10.90	1,087.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BENNETT, DARRIE [WD: WILLIAM] (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	6.66
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 6.66]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BLASDELL, WALTER (Oregon)</u>			
1/4/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/11/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.70	547.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BOUYEA, ROGER (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	3.96
 SUBTOTAL:	 [ 3.96]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRAIN, ROBERT (Ohio)</u>			
1/2/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRENNER, RALPH (San Francisco)</u>			
1/4/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	142.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.40	525.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRIGNAC, EVA (Texas)</u>		
1/21/02	GEB PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.50	112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BROWN, ALICIA J. (Philadelphia, PA)</u>			
1/2/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.50	37.50
1/7/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.00	420.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>BROWN, ROBERT LOUIS (San Francisco)</u>		
1/7/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.00	150.00]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRUMLEY, JIMMY RAY (Texas)</u>			
1/2/02	GEB	CLOSE FILE. REVIEW/COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR PRESERVATION OF BETHLEHEM REFERENCE MATERIALS.	0.50	37.50
1/21/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURGE, GEORGENE AND CAROLYN (Texas)</u>			
1/7/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/22/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.00	75.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.50	457.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURKE, JAMES P. (Pennsylvania)</u>			
1/7/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/10/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	7.00	525.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 8.50	907.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BURKE, JAMES P. (Pennsylvania)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	6.30
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 6.30]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURKHART, NANCY (POSTWEILER) (Buffalo)</u>			
1/4/02	GEB	COMPILE DOCUMENTS REGARDING JUDGE KANE FOR PRESERVATION OF BETHLEHEM REFERENCE MATERIALS.	0.50	37.50
1/8/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.00</u>	<u>420.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CALLOWAY, GEORGE (Jefferson Co., TX)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	6.66
SUBTOTAL:	[ 6.66]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CAMPBELL, PATRICK (Washington)</u>			
1/8/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/17/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.40	180.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.90	562.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CAMPBELL, PATRICK (Washington)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	7.02
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[ 7.02]</u>



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CAREY, DONALD (San Francisco)</u>			
1/8/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/10/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	0.80	60.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.30	442.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CARLSON, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
1/18/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CASSOU, MARCEL (San Francisco)</u>				
1/4/02	SBJ	REVIEWED EXTENSIVE MEDICAL DATA SET TO IDENTIFY MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES TO FACILITATE DISMISSAL. CONTINUED TO PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	0.90	112.50
1/9/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SBJ	CONTINUED REVIEW OF EXTENSIVE MEDICAL DATA SET TO IDENTIFY MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES TO FACILITATE DISMISSAL. CONTINUED TO PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	0.70	87.50
1/16/02	SBJ	CONTINUED REVIEW OF RATHER EXTENSIVE DATA SET TO IDENTIFY MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES TO FACILITATE DISMISSAL. CONTINUED TO PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	7.40	925.00
1/17/02	SBJ	CONTINUED REVIEW OF RATHER EXTENSIVE DATA SET TO BUILD A MEDICAL DEFENSE FOR DISMISSAL. CONTINUED TO PREPARE A MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	6.70	837.50
1/18/02	SBJ	COMPLETED REVIEW OF MEDICAL DATA SET TO BUILD A MEDICAL DEFENSE FOR DISMISSAL. CONTINUED TO PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	4.90	612.50
1/21/02	SBJ	RESEARCHED FIBRINOGENIC AND CARCINOGENIC POTENTIAL OF CHRONIC MEDICATIONS. ANALYZED 8 PULMONARY FUNCTION TESTS FOUND IN THE MEDICAL DATA BASE. RESEARCHED FAMILIAL LUNG CARCINOMAS. COMPLETED MEDICAL ASSESSMENT MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	7.40	925.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
SUBTOTAL:	[ 29.50	3,882.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CASSOU, MARCEL (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	5.04
SUBTOTAL:	[ 5.04 ]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CISNEROS, ORLANDO (San Francisco)</u>			
1/9/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/29/02	SBJ	COMMENCED REVIEW OF MEDICAL DATA SET.	0.70	87.50
1/30/02	SBJ	CONTINUED REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL DATA SET TO DETERMINE MEDICAL BASES FOR DISMISSAL.	4.10	512.50
1/31/02	SBJ	CONTINUED REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL DATA SET TO DETERMINE MEDICAL BASES FOR DISMISSAL.	2.70	337.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 9.00	1,320.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CISNEROS, ORLANDO (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	6.12
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 6.12]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CLEMMONS, DURWARD B. (Cleveland)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	5.58
SUBTOTAL:	[ 5.58]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>COLEMAN, JAMES W. (Texas)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	3.42
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[ 3.42]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CRUZ, ROMAN (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	2.16
SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.16]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DALESKY, SAM (Oregon)</u>			
1/9/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/17/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.50	532.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>DALESKY, SAM (Oregon)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	10.80
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 10.80]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DURAL, ALTON (San Francisco)</u>			
1/10/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/23/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.40	450.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>EASTMARK, ERLING (Washington)</u>				
1/10/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/18/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.30	172.50
	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
1/21/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 6.80	780.00 ]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

11 P.S.

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>EDWARDS, DIANNA (WD: APLEY, MAURICE) (San Francisco)</u>			
1/10/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/25/02	SBJ	COMMENCED EVALUATION OF MEDICAL DATA BASE IN SEARCH OF MEDICAL DISMISSAL POINTS.	2.30	287.50
1/28/02	SBJ	COMPLETED REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL DATA SET. MEMORANDUM OF FINDINGS RE: MEDICAL DISMISSAL POINTS.	8.00	1,000.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 11.80	1,670.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>EDWARDS, DIANNA (WD: APLEY, MAURICE) (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	20.70
SUBTOTAL:	[ 20.70]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ESPOSITO, FRANK (NYC)</u>			
1/11/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	4.00	300.00
1/12/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 5.50	682.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ESPOSITO, FRANK (NYC)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	5.04
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 5.04]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>FLOYD, LUTHER (San Francisco)</u>				
1/4/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.50	187.50
1/12/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/16/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. REVIEW COMPLETE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE CASE MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE.	1.60	120.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 5.60	690.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GANLEY, RICHARD &amp; MARIE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/8/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GAULT, LEROY (San Francisco)</u>				
1/7/02	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE	2.00	60.00
	CEE	BEGIN PREPARATION OF MEDICAL MEMORANDUM AND ORGANIZATION OF SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN PREPARATION TO PRESERVE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND DETERMINE VIABILITY OF CASE.	7.60	722.00
1/8/02	CEE	COMPLETE PREPARATION OF MEDICAL MEMORANDUM AND ORGANIZATION OF FILE FOLDER TO PRESERVE INTEGRITY OF MEDICAL CASE AND DETERMINE IF ANY MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS.	5.90	560.50
1/12/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/30/02	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL MATERIALS INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN ORDER TO PRESERVE LITIGATION POTENTIAL AND EVALUATE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL.	0.70	66.50
	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS	1.50	45.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 19.20	1,836.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GAULT, LEROY (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	25.56
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[ 25.56]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GELLING, NOREEN (New York City)</u>			
1/11/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
1/14/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	4.50	337.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>8.00</u>	<u>870.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GENERAL</u>				
1/7/02	KLM	ASSIST SAF WITH PREPARATION OF BSC AUDIT LETTER.	0.10	7.50
	KLM	ASSIST SAF WITH PREPARATION OF BSC AUDIT LETTER.	0.10	7.50
	SAF	PREPARE FIRST DRAFT OF BSC AUDIT LETTER AND ATTACHMENT - FORWARD TO DSM FOR REVIEW - DISCUSS WITH DSM.	2.00	170.00
1/8/02	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RDC TO WEM ENCLOSING REQUESTED DOCUMENTS FOR DMA MEETING - VERIFY ALL DOCUMENTS HAVE BEEN RECEIVED PER DSM'S REQUEST. FINALIZE DRAFT OF BSC AUDIT LETTER WITH DSM.	1.10	93.50
1/11/02	SAF	PREPARE AND FAX CORRESPONDENCE TO RDC REQUESTING COPY OF SARANAC LABORATORY MEETING AGENDA FORWARDED TO WEM FOR DMA MEETING. UPDATE FILE.	0.20	17.00
1/16/02	SAF	REMINDER CALL TO DSM REGARDING BETHLEHEM AUDIT LETTER. ADVISE LAB OF BETHLEHEM AUDIT LETTER STATUS.	0.10	8.50
	DSM	MEET WITH WALTER MORRISSEY AND DR. DAVID ANDERSON AT BSC MARTIN TOWER REGARDING BETHLEHEM PROJECT.	11.00	2,805.00
1/17/02	SAF	REMINDER CALL TO DSM REGARDING BETHLEHEM AUDIT LETTER. DISCUSS BETHLEHEM AUDIT LETTER WITH LAB. FINALIZE BETHLEHEM AUDIT LETTER WITH DSM.	0.10	8.50
1/22/02	GEB	COMPILE INFORMATION FOR LETTER TO RDC REGARDING COPIES OF ARTICLES PREVIOUSLY PROVIDED TO DMA.	3.00	225.00



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/22/02	SAF	RESPOND TO MEMO FROM DSM REGARDING DMA PROJECT. REVIEW DMA LIST OF PUBLICATIONS AND IDENTIFY DOCUMENTS TO BE OBTAINED. DIRECT GEB TO BEGIN PREPARATION OF CORRESPONDENCE TO RDC REQUESTING ARTICLES IDENTIFIED BY DMA.	0.30	25.50
1/23/02	GEB	REVIEW/REVISE INFORMATION FOR LETTER TO RDC REGARDING COPIES OF ARTICLES PREVIOUSLY PROVIDED TO DMA.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 19.00	3,443.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GENERAL</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	29.70
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 29.70]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GIBSON, MARY (ROY, JR., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
1/14/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>3.00</u>	<u>495.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GIBSON, MARY (ROY, JR., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	18.72
SUBTOTAL:	[ 18.72]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GODSEY, DORNEL (Dallas)</u>			
1/4/02	GEB	COMPILE DOCUMENTS REGARDING EXPERT WITNESSES, ROGGLI AND ROBB, FOR PRESERVATION OF BETHLEHEM REFERENCE MATERIALS.	1.00	75.00
1/7/02	GEB	REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REGARDING ASBESTOS CONFERENCE ON APRIL 8 AND 9, 2002. PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	3.00	225.00
1/8/02	GEB	REVIEW FILE AND PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
1/9/02	GEB	FINALIZE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.00	75.00
1/14/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>8.50</u>	<u>907.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GRANT, CLEVELAND (San Francisco)</u>			
1/2/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.20	165.00
1/15/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/24/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE. INTERNET RESEARCH ON MEDICATIONS CAUSING INTERSTITIAL FIBROSIS. UPDATE MEDICAL MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	2.50	187.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 6.20	735.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GREENFIELD, KENNETH (San Francisco)</u>			
1/2/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.30	172.50
1/15/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.80	555.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GRUBE, NORM (San Francisco)</u>			
1/7/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.20	165.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.20	165.00]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HARMON, SIDNEY (San Francisco)</u>			
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HARMON, SIDNEY (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	7.56
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 7.56]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HAUGH, JOHN J. (New York City)</u>			
1/15/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	3.00	225.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 4.50	607.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HAUGH, JOHN J. (New York City)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	4.14
 SUBTOTAL:	 [ 4.14 ]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HAZEN, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
1/17/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/29/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.90	217.50
1/31/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 5.30	667.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HAZEN, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	3.78
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 3.78]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HENDERSON, LEAMORL (San Francisco)</u>			
1/17/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.30</u>	<u>442.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HENRY, DICKIE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.40	180.00
1/17/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.90	562.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HOEY, PAUL (Chicago)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	14.40
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 14.40]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HOUX, MERLE (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	4.68
SUBTOTAL:	[ 4.68]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HOWELL, FANNIE (GERALD CLARK, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	9.00
SUBTOTAL:	[ 9.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HUNSAKER, LEWIS (San Francisco)</u>		
1/15/02	LEC REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.10	157.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.10	157.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>JENNINGS, SONNY (San Francisco)</u>			
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
1/18/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.40	450.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>JESSUP, KEITH (Oregon)</u>		
1/11/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.30	97.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.30	97.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KAEINTZ, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
1/9/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.40	105.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 1.40	105.00]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KANGAS</u>		
1/10/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KENNEDY, CORINNE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/18/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/30/02	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS	1.30	39.00
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL MATERIALS INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN ORDER TO PRESERVE LITIGATION POTENTIAL AND EVALUATE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL.	0.40	38.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.20	459.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>KENNEDY, CORINNE (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	2.88
 SUBTOTAL:	 [ 2.88]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KESSLER, KAROLINE [WD: JOACHIM] (San Francisco)</u>			
1/8/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATME OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	3.40	255.00
1/18/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 4.90	637.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KORTUM, FRED (San Francisco)</u>			
1/17/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	1.20	90.00
1/21/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>2.70</u>	<u>472.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LACEY, JAMES &amp; LUCY (San Francisco)</u>			
1/21/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/30/02	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS	1.20	36.00
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL MATERIALS INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN ORDER TO PRESERVE LITIGATION POTENTIAL AND EVALUATE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL.	0.80	76.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.50	494.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LACEY, JAMES &amp; LUCY (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	120.24
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 120.24]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LANE, HIRAM (San Francisco)</u>			
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
1/21/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.30	442.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LAWSON, OTIS &amp; ERNESTINE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/22/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/29/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.30</u>	<u>442.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LIMU, TALOLO F. (San Francisco)</u>			
1/9/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.60	120.00
1/22/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.10	502.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LOY, DRAMIA - CLOSED FILE - (Florida)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	8.82
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 8.82]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LUKSYS, FRANCIS (San Francisco)</u>			
1/22/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/28/02	SBJ	COMMENCED REVIEW OF MEDICAL DATA SET SUBMITTED TO DETERMINE MEDICAL BASIS FOR DISMISSAL.	0.70	87.50
1/29/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE MATERIAL FOR SBJ FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE MEDICAL DEFENSE.	0.40	30.00
	SBJ	COMPLETED REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL DATA SET TO DETERMINE MEDICAL BASES FOR DISMISSAL. MEDICAL ASSESSMENT MEMORANDUM OF FINDINGS TO DSM.	4.80	600.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>7.40</u>	<u>1,100.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LUKSYS, FRANCIS (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	101.34
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 101.34]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LYNCH, JAMES E. (San Francisco)</u>			
1/18/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSMBSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.50	187.50
1/23/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 4.00	570.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MANSFIELD, HOWARD (Washington)</u>			
1/22/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.30	172.50
1/23/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.80	555.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>McCABE, THOMAS &amp; JACQUELYN (San Francisco)</u>		
1/14/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.20	165.00
1/17/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
1/25/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 4.60	615.00]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>McGONNELL, JAMES (San Francisco)</u>			
1/23/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.80	135.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.80	135.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>McHENRY, JOHN E. (San Francisco)</u>			
1/21/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>McMAHON, MILDRED (San Francisco)</u>		
1/3/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.00	150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MILLAR, GEOFFREY (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.30	172.50
1/23/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.80	555.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MILLAY, RICHARD [PATRICIA QUINN] (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.70	127.50
1/24/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.20	510.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>MILLER, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>		
1/7/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.50	112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MILLER, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	2.16
SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.16]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MILLER, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
1/18/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
1/24/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.30	442.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MITCHELL, FREDDIE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/22/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.20	165.00
1/24/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.70	547.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>MONETTE, CHARLES (Los Angeles)</u>		
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MORRIS, LINDA (San Francisco)</u>			
1/8/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.40	105.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.40	105.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>O'BRIEN, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
1/17/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>OLSON, ALBON &amp; MARGARET (San Francisco)</u>			
1/8/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
1/25/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.30	517.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>OMRAN, NAIMEH (San Francisco)</u>		
1/2/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	142.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.90	142.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ORTIZ, JOSE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/22/02	SBJ	COMMENCED REVIEW OF MEDICAL DATA BASE.	2.20	275.00
1/23/02	SBJ	CONTINUED REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL DATABASE. COMMENCED PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM TO DSM.	3.20	400.00
1/24/02	SBJ	COMPLETED REVIEW OF MEDICAL DATABASE. PERFORMED DETAILED ANALYSIS OF PFTS TO PROVIDE DEFINITIVE MEDICAL DATA IN SUPPORT OF DISMISSAL.	4.80	600.00
1/25/02	SBJ	COMPLETED MEDICAL DATA ANALYSIS. COMPLETED MEMORANDUM OF MEDICAL DEFENSE DISMISSAL POINTS TO DSM.	3.30	412.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 15.00	2,070.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ORTIZ, JOSE (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	12.96
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 12.96]</u>



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>OTERI, GLADYS (NYC)</u>			
1/16/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
1/28/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.00	495.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>PAASCH, VERNON (Washington)</u>		
1/21/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.30	172.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.30	172.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PEDRICK, HELEN [WD: RAYMOND] (Washington)</u>			
1/18/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
	SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.20 165.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>PERRY, ANGELO (San Francisco)</u>		
1/10/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
1/28/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 3.50	532.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PHILLIPS, DAVID (Oakland, CA)</u>			
1/10/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.		0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>POLK, JAMES K. (San Francisco)</u>			
1/21/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE. RESEARCH PLEURITIC FIBROSIS. UPDATE MEDICAL MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	2.70	202.50
1/28/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 4.20	585.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>POULSEN, OLE E. (Cleveland)</u>		
1/2/02	LEC REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.10	82.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.10	82.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>QUINDAG, MARIA (San Francisco)</u>		
1/7/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.60	120.00
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.60	120.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>QUINTANA, DONALD G. (San Francisco)</u>			
1/9/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
1/29/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.70	547.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>RABEAUX, SR., ROBERT (Texas)</u>			
1/2/02	GEB	CLOSE FILE. REVIEW/COMPILE DOCUMENTS FOR PRESERVATION OF BETHLEHEM REFERENCE MATERIALS.	3.50	262.50
1/29/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>5.00</u>	<u>645.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RASMUSSEN, LOWELL &amp; BETTY-JEANE (Wartnick)</u>				
1/8/02	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE	1.50	45.00
1/29/02	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
1/30/02	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL MATERIALS INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN ORDER TO PRESERVE LITIGATION POTENTIAL AND EVALUATE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL.	0.70	66.50
	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS	1.30	39.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 5.00	533.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RASMUSSEN, LOWELL &amp; BETTY-JEANE (Wartnick)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	17.10
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[ 17.10]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>REYES, APOLINARIO (San Francisco)</u>		
1/8/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.70	202.50
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.60	270.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ROMERO, LOUIS (San Francisco)</u>			
1/8/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.40	180.00
1/10/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.20	240.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ROWTON, CLARK (San Francisco)</u>		
1/3/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.70	127.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.70	127.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SAHLBERG, CAROLYN [WD: ROBERT] (San Francisco)</u>			
1/4/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.40	105.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.40	105.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SAUNDERS, RICHARD &amp; LILLIAN (San Francisco)</u>			
1/4/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
	SUBTOTAL:			[ 2.00 150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SEALES, WALTER (New York City)</u>			
1/16/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[ 0.50 37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SIFFORD, E. MAXINE [WD: ALVIN, JR.] (San Francisco)</u>			
1/2/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.80	135.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SKOLNICK, MILTON &amp; VICKIE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/4/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.00	150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SMITH, LOUISE (WD: RICHARD) - (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	0.36
SUBTOTAL:	[ 0.36]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SOUZA, RAMONA (WD: RAYMOND VARGAS) (Oakland, CA)</u>		
1/3/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	142.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.90	142.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>ST. GERMAIN, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>		
1/8/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.80	135.00]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>STAKER, SHIRLEY [WD: GERALD] (San Francisco)</u>		
1/16/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>STEINEBACH, WILLIAM &amp; LOUISE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/18/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>STROBEL, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	10.44
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[ 10.44 ]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SWEGLES, MYRTLE (WD: JOHN) (San Francisco)</u>			
1/11/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.90	142.50
1/17/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. PREPARE MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO AND INCORPORATE INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.10	157.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 4.00	300.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TAYLOR JR., JOHN (Buffalo)</u>			
1/23/02	LEC RECIEVE, IDENTIFY, PHOTOCOPY, INVENTORY AND COMPARE TO INDEX PATHOLOGY MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM DEFENSE EXPERS FOLLOWING REVIEW. UPDATE PATHOLOGY DATABASE AND CHAIN OF CUSTODY DATABASE.		0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>TAYLOR JR., JOHN (Buffalo)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	0.72
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[ 0.72]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>THOMPSON, HEBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
1/17/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	3.00	225.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 3.00	225.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VAIL, LEONARD (Boston)</u>			
1/17/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	0.50	37.50
1/18/02	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	0.40	30.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 0.90	67.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VINAL, EVELYN H. D. (San Francisco)</u>		
1/2/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 2.00	150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WALLIN, ALBERT (Washington)</u>			
1/16/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.80	60.00
1/22/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
SUBTOTAL:			[ 3.00	225.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WARD, ETHEL (WD: IRWIN) (San Francisco)</u>			
1/15/02	LEC	REVIEW MEDICAL MEMOS OF BSC CASES TO IDENTIFY POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CASES. INCORPORATE MEDICAL MEMO INTO BSC/BRAYTON MEDICAL CASE DISMISSAL RECOMMENDATION LIST DATABASE. PREPARE CASE LIST MEMO FOR DSM REVIEW.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[ 0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>WATKINS, HUGH AND DONNA (San Francisco)</u>		
1/30/02	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL MATERIALS INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN ORDER TO PRESERVE LITIGATION POTENTIAL AND EVALUATE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL.	0.70	66.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[ 0.70	66.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WATKINS, HUGH AND DONNA (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	6.66
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[ 6.66]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WATLEY, JAMES &amp; OLLIE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/9/02	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	142.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.90	142.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILLIAMS, LEE (San Francisco)</u>			
1/3/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.30	172.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.30	172.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILMOT, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
1/30/02	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS	1.70	51.00
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL MATERIALS INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS IN ORDER TO PRESERVE LITIGATION POTENTIAL AND EVALUATE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL.	0.50	47.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 2.20	98.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WILMOT, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>	
1/1/02 - Copy Charges - January 1-31, 2002	13.68
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[ 13.68]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WRIGHT, ALLEN (San Francisco)</u>			
1/11/02	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.50	112.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[ 1.50	112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

January 1 - January 31, 2002

Invoice # 26  
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

---

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>YOSHIDA, EDWARD &amp; ROSALIE (Oregon)</u>		
1/10/02	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
	SUBTOTAL:	[ 1.80	135.00]