

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Aaron, Robert (CA)	5.60	567.00	69.18	636.18
Adams, B. Joyce (TX)	0.10	9.50	0.72	10.22
Adams, John P (Buffalo)	0	0	1.08	1.08
Adams, Roy (Texas)	0	0	0.72	0.72
Adams, William (SF)	0.20	15.00	4.32	19.32
Aiello, James (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Allen, Eleanor (SF)	0.70	52.50	0	52.50
Allen, Geraldine (SF)	1.10	90.50	2.16	92.66
Amataga, Sofala (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Andrews III, Thomas (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Andrews, Charles (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Araujo, Reynaldo (TX)	0	0	2.52	2.52
Attaway, Billy (SF)	4.50	667.50	0	667.50
Baker, Robert (SF)	1.60	390.00	0	390.00
Bangsund, Clark (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Banks, Robert (SF)	2.00	420.00	0	420.00
Barbera, Anthony (Buffalo)	2.10	435.50	18.90	454.40
Barbera, George (Buffalo)	0.40	30.00	3.96	33.96
Barlow, Eugene (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Barnes, Hervie (SF)	0.60	45.00	0	45.00
Barnett, Cheryl (TX)	3.50	262.50	20.70	283.20
Barnett, Juanita (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Bartolotta, Angelo (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Bates, Lester (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Bearden, Rosa (SF)	0.50	37.50	3.78	41.28
Bengis, Milton M (MA)	0.10	9.50	0.90	10.40
Bennett, Darrie (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Berkhofer, Edward (NJ)	0	0	3.60	3.60

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Birchett, Michael (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Black, Fabia (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Black, Warren (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Blackmon Jr, Chester (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Blasdell, Walter (OR)	2.40	450.00	0	450.00
Bouyea, Roger (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Boyer, Joseph (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Brain, Robert (OH)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Branscum, Arlen (SF)	0.70	54.50	0	54.50
Bratcher, Herbert (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Brenner, Ralph (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Brock, Edward (SF)	1.10	82.50	0	82.50
Brown, Billie (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Brown, Jerome (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Brown, Robert L (SF)	0.70	64.50	0	64.50
Brumley, Jimmy Ray (TX)	0.10	8.50	3.42	11.92
Burke, Avery (TX)	4.80	576.00	11.88	587.88
Burke, James P (PA)	2.30	442.50	4.14	446.64
Burkhart, Nancy (Buffalo)	7.00	619.00	49.50	668.50
Burns, Richard (NY)	0.50	21.50	0.72	22.22
Busnardo, Frank (SF)	0	0	8.82	8.82
Butler, Margaret (TX)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Campbell, Patrick (WA)	2.50	457.50	0	457.50
Cappiello, Daniel (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Caputy, Carmen (NY)	0.50	47.50	0	47.50
Carey, Donald (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Carlson, Thomas (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Carr, Janet (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Case, Raymond (SF)	4.00	293.50	0	293.50
Cassidy, Kenneth (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Cassou, Marcel (SF)	0	0	4.32	4.32
Castellano, Salvatore (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Castor, James (SF)	2.80	264.00	0	264.00
Catania, Sam (Buffalo)	4.10	611.50	14.82	626.32
Chase, Maurice (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.50
Chimienti, Leonard (NJ)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Cisneros, Orlando (SF)	0	0	22.68	22.68
Ciulla, John (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Clemmons, Durward B (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Coghlon (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Colridge, Katherine (SF)	0.90	67.50	3.24	70.74
Cormier, Pearl (TX)	1.60	120.00	23.92	143.92
Cormier, Russell (TX)	1.30	97.50	0	97.50
Covier, Martha (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Cox, Donald (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Creps, Charles (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Crespo, Fernando (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Cromwell, Lloyd (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Cruz, Roman (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Dalesky, Sam (OR)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Daniels, Harold (TX)	1.10	82.50	0	82.50
Davis Jr, Jessie (SF)	0	0	0.36	0.36
Day, Gerald (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Delk, Lonza E (SF)	1.10	82.50	2.16	84.66
Dorsey, John (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Dowd, Walter (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Draker, James F (TX)	1.80	135.00	0	135.00
Duke, James/Janice (SF)	1.40	105.00	0	105.00
Dunphy, Mary Alice (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Dural, Alton (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Durkin, Patrick E (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Ealy, George (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Eastmark, Erling (WA)	0.70	52.50	0	52.50
Eckam, Beverly (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Edwards, Dianna (SF)	1.30	123.50	0	123.50
Eldracher, Dennis (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Ellison, Flora Mae (TX)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Emrick, Dennis (CA)	1.30	97.50	0.54	98.04
Esposito, Frank (NY)	5.70	533.50	12.94	546.44
Estes, Margaret (SF)	1.40	105.00	0	105.00
Ezekial, Pinkney (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Faulk, Larry (TX)	0.40	30.00	0	30.00
Finch, John/Mary (SF)	2.60	466.00	0	466.00
Floyd, Luther (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Foster, Billie (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Foux, Seburn (TX)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Frank, Michael (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Freeland, Norma (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Fresquez, David (SF)	1.10	82.50	0	82.50
Ganley, Richard/Marie (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Garofalo, Joseph (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Gault, Leroy (SF)	8.20	433.50	0	433.50
Gelling, Noreen (NY)	5.30	682.50	0	682.50
Gibson Jr, Roy (TX)	0.40	30.00	0	30.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Gill, James (IN)	0.90	67.50	2.16	69.66
Godsey, Dornel (TX)	29.90	2,896.00	2,392.18	5,288.18
Goff, Jeryl R (CA)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Gori, Georgio (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Grahovac, John (SF)	2.00	420.00	1.98	421.98
Grant, Cleveland (SF)	0	0	3.78	3.78
Grube, Norm (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Gushlaw, Richard (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Hammarstrom, Roy (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Hammesfahr, James (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Harhay, Paul (SF)	5.30	373.50	21.06	394.56
Harless, Terry (SF)	0.50	37.50	1.98	39.48
Haugh, John J (NY)	6.30	646.55	58.32	704.87
Hazen, Thomas (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Hemmenway, Travis (TX)	0.70	59.50	0	59.50
Henderson, Leamorl (SF)	0.10	7.50	1.44	8.94
Herrington Jr, Joseph (SF)	1.90	142.50	0	142.50
Hill, Roy (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Holmes, William (TX)	3.80	527.00	24.66	551.66
Howard, Eileen (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Howell, Fannie (TX)	1.20	90.00	0	90.00
Huff, Deward (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Hunsaker, Lewis (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Hust, Sr, Doyle (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Jackson, Sherman (TX)	0	0	0.36	0.36
Jagneaux, Joseph (TX)	1.60	145.00	4.32	149.32
Jeane, Evelyn (TX)	0	0	3.24	3.24
Jennings, Sonny (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Johnson, John (SF)	0.10	7.50	1.80	9.30
Johnson, Nathaniel (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Juste, Salvador (Buffalo)	0.70	56.50	10.98	67.48
Kacmarek (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Kaeintz, Robert (SF)	1.20	90.00	0	90.00
Kennedy, Corinne (SF)	2.70	209.00	3.06	212.06
Kern, Evelynsdale (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Kessler, Judith (SF)	0.40	31.00	0	31.00
Kirchner, Robert (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Kortum, Fred (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Labrana, John (Buffalo)	2.30	451.50	0	451.50
Lacey, James/Lucy (SF)	8.20	428.00	85.14	513.14
Lamb, George E (SF)	1.20	90.00	0	90.00
Lane, Hiram (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Lasher, Aaron (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Leach, Patricia (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Lemieux, Marlin (NY)	5.80	549.00	156.56	705.56
Lewin, Samuel L (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Lewis, George (NY)	0.60	47.00	0	47.00
Limu, Talolo F (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Lindstrom, Rolf L (OH)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Locher, William (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Lockett, Vernon (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Longman, Sandra (CA)	2.30	172.50	0	172.50
Lucas, Helen (IL)	0.80	60.00	4.50	64.50
Luksys, Francis (SF)	0.30	26.50	0	26.50
Lynch, James (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Lynn, Raymond (TX)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Madison, Concetta (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Mak, Benjamin (SF)	0.50	37.50	13.50	51.00
Mambrino, Frank (Buffalo)	19.00	1,834.00	257.10	2,091.10
Maniscalco, Luciano (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Marrale, Mary C (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Martignoni, Thomas (IN)	4.30	592.50	4.86	597.36
Martin, Dennis/Diane (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Martin, James (IN)	4.30	592.50	14.58	607.08
Martin, William (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Martinez, Thomas (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Mathias, Roy (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
McCloud, Fred (SF)	3.90	370.50	0	370.50
McCooley, Matthew (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
McGonnell, James (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
McHenry, Charlie (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
McHugh, James (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
McMahon, Mildred (SF)	1.10	90.50	0	90.50
Mele, Daniel (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Millar, Geoffrey (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Millay, Richard (SF)	3.00	226.00	1.62	227.62
Miller, Byron (SF)	0.60	45.00	0	45.00
Misko, Dennis (SF)	1.80	405.00	0	405.00
Mitchell, Freddie (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Monette, Charles (CA)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Moniz, Daniel (SF)	1.00	83.00	0	83.00
Montero, Raul (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Moody Sr, Walter (NY)	0.50	21.50	0	21.50
Morales, Balbina (CA)	6.80	577.00	1.62	578.62

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Moribello, John (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	5.04	14.54
Morris, Linda (SF)	0.70	52.50	0	52.50
Mortensen, John (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Morton, Gary (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Moses, Leroy (Buffalo)	7.10	664.50	111.08	775.58
Murphy, Francis (NJ)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Murphy, Terrance (CA)	1.50	112.50	0	112.50
Murphy, Timothy	0.40	30.00	1.44	31.44
Nash, Jerry (SF)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Nau, Fred (SF)	0.30	26.50	10.98	37.48
Nissen, Barbara (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
O'Brien, Robert (SF)	1.10	82.50	0	82.50
O'Kane, Brian (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Olson, Albon (SF)	0	0	5.94	5.94
Ortiz, Jose (SF)	0.30	26.50	0	26.50
Ortiz, Ramon (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Oteri, Gladys (NY)	0.70	66.50	0	66.50
Paasch, Vernon (WA)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Palaszynski, John (Buffalo)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Pantano, Thomas (Buffalo)	2.30	450.50	1.80	452.30
Papantonio, Alfred (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Pappas, James (MD)	0.10	9.50	0.36	9.86
Paquin, Laura (Buffalo)	0.50	28.00	0	28.00
Parks, William M (IN)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Perry, Angelo (SF)	2.60	465.00	18.00	483.00
Phillips, David (CA)	0.30	22.50	0	22.50
Pierce Sr, George (NY)	0.40	38.00	0	38.00
Potter, Pama (SF)	1.40	106.00	0.72	106.72

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Prescott, Arlene (SF)	0.30	26.50	3.42	29.92
Prins, Ralph A (SF)	1.20	90.00	0	90.00
Purkey, Jane (SF)	13.40	825.00	11.16	836.16
Quiett, Donald E (SF)	1.50	113.50	2.16	115.66
Quindag, Maria (SF)	0.40	34.00	0	34.00
Quintana, Donald (SF)	1.10	82.50	14.04	96.54
Rabeaux Sr, Robert (TX)	9.10	633.50	66.96	700.46
Rahmani, Habib (SF)	0	0	0.18	0.18
Rancich, Milan (IN)	5.00	645.00	4.32	649.32
Rasmussen, Lowell (CA)	2.40	222.00	3.78	225.78
Robicheaux, Elfert (TX)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Romero, Louis (SF)	0	0	4.50	4.50
Rosignon, Oneslie (TX)	0	0	2.88	2.88
Rowton, Clark (SF)	0.50	41.50	0	41.50
Russell, Daniel (SF)	0.30	26.50	0	26.50
Sahlberg, Carolyn (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Salka, Jonathan (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Samatua, Joe & Meki (SF)	0	0	14.94	14.94
Saunders, Richard (SF)	2.00	199.00	16.38	215.38
Schendel, Keith (NY)	13.20	1,030.00	38.52	1,068.52
Schiess, Clifford (Buffalo)	2.90	501.50	0	501.50
Scime, Alfred (Buffalo)	2.40	459.00	0.72	459.72
Scime, Anthony C (Buffalo)	0.60	53.00	0	53.00
Scime, Carmen (Buffalo)	0.60	53.00	0	53.00
Scime, Santo (Buffalo)	0.40	38.00	0	38.00
Scott, Robert (NY)	0.10	9.50	0.36	9.86
Scott, Wilfred (SF)	0.10	7.50	0	7.50
Seales, Walter (NY)	0.70	66.50	0	66.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Shankle, Eugene (TX)	2.40	460.00	6.84	466.84
Sifford, E Maxine (SF)	1.50	121.50	0	121.50
Skelly, James V (Buffalo)	1.20	94.00	12.60	106.60
Skolnick, Milton (SF)	2.40	276.00	78.66	354.66
Smith, Louise (SF)	3.10	292.50	8.46	300.96
Smith, Mary (Buffalo)	2.00	428.00	9.00	437.00
Solly, William (TX)	0	0	1.44	1.44
Somogye, John M (Buffalo)	0.30	26.50	0	26.50
Souza, Ramona (CA)	1.30	97.50	0	97.50
Spriggs, Carol (IN)	1.70	127.50	0	127.50
St. Germain, Paul (SF)	6.60	665.00	42.84	707.84
Steinebach, William (SF)	1.20	90.00	10.98	100.98
Strack, George (Buffalo)	0.50	47.50	0	47.50
Strobel, Robert (SF)	3.10	292.50	0	292.50
Struening, Mary (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Suhanov, Laura (Buffalo)	0.20	19.00	9.90	28.90
Suitor, Theone (SF)	0.80	60.00	0	60.00
Szymanski, Elsie J (Buffalo)	0.50	47.50	0	47.50
Taylor Jr, John (NY)	0.80	70.00	90.26	160.26
Taylor, Bobbie Lynn (TX)	0.40	30.00	12.24	42.24
Tesch, David R	0.30	26.50	12.42	38.92
Theriot, Charles (TX)	0.40	30.00	1.26	31.26
Thomas, Patsy (SF)	0	0	0.72	0.72
Thompson, Penny (CA)	7.50	916.50	97.76	1,014.26
Thompson, Theopolis (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Torres (MD)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Trimm, Forrest L (SF)	0.90	67.50	0	67.50
Trombley, Katherine (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Tully Sr, Richard (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Ubeda, Joseph (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Vail, Leonard (MA)	2.30	187.50	30.06	217.56
Varellas, Peter (IL)	0.80	60.00	4.32	64.32
Viator, Shirley (TX)	0.40	30.00	0	30.00
Vinal, Evelyn (SF)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Vullo, Phillip (Buffalo)	0.20	15.00	0	15.00
Ward, Ethel (SF)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Watkins, Hugh (SF)	2.00	188.00	0	188.00
Watley, James/Ollie (SF)	1.50	112.50	1.80	114.30
West, Carolyn (TX)	2.30	246.50	9.00	255.50
Wiggins, Barbara (PA)	0	0	3.24	3.24
Williams, Kenneth (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Williams, Patricia (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Wilmot, Thomas (SF)	2.00	190.00	0	190.00
Wilson, Richard (SF)	0.50	37.50	0	37.50
Winter, Wilbur (Buffalo)	0.20	19.00	0	19.00
Wolfe, Glen W (TX)	0	0	2.16	2.16
Woodcock, Lloyd (TX)	2.90	217.50	0	217.50
Wynn, Theodore (MD)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
Yancey, Vernon (FL)	0	0	1.26	1.26
Yoshida, Edward (OR)	1.80	405.00	0.36	405.36
Zerkowski, David (Buffalo)	0.60	49.00	0.36	49.36
Zurek, Matthew (NY)	0.10	9.50	0	9.50
TOTALS	402.30	\$39,814.05	\$4,154.42	\$43,968.97

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

INVOICE TOTALS

TOTAL FEES	\$39,814.05
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$4,154.42
<hr/>	
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$43,968.47

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES	402.30	\$39,814.05

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice #00023
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
DONALD S. MACLACHLAN, ESQ.	45.00	255.00	\$11,475.00
PHILIP S. TARR, ESQ.	7.60	165.00	\$1,254.00
SUSAN A. FILL, Paralegal, Research-Reference-Trial Cases	17.90	85.00	\$1,521.55
GLORIA E. BELLO, Paralegal, Trial Cases	32.90	75.00	\$2,467.50
KATHLEEN L. MCNAMARA, Paralegal, California & General	31.70	75.00	\$2,377.50
LOUISE KNETZGER GALLAGHER, Paralegal, Texas	1.30	85.00	\$110.50
SUSAN BOWERS-JOHNSON, MD, MPH	19.20	125.00	\$2,400.00
CAROLYNN EMBARRATO, RN, BSN, MA, Medical Paralegal	95.30	95.00	\$9,053.50
LINDA E. CROSBY, RN, BSN, Medical Paralegal	102.50	75.00	\$7,687.50
VICTORIA WALTHER, Data Entry	48.90	30.00	\$1,467.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>AARON, ROBERT (Oakland, CA)</u>			
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ADVISING OF DATE PATHOLOGY IS TO BE RETURNED TO BERRY & BERRY. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO MESOTHELIOMA DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.70	144.50
10/19/01	SBJ	REVIEW / ANALYSIS OF TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO NURSING AND EXPERT REPORTS TO UPDATE MEDICAL CASE LIST MEMORANDUM. INTENDED USE TO RECOVER MEDICAL COLLECTION COSTS. FOR SUBSEQUENT DEFENSE.	1.60	200.00
	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.30	97.50
10/31/01	SBJ	REVIEW / ANALYSIS OF TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO NURSING AND EXPERT REPORTS TO UPDATE MEDICAL CASE LIST MEMORANDUM. INTENDED USE TO RECOVER MEDICAL COLLECTION COSTS.	1.00	125.00
SUBTOTAL:			[5.60	567.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>AARON, ROBERT (Oakland, CA)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	42.66
10/18/01 - FedEx Charge - to Marte J. Bassi, Bassi Martini & Blum, San Francisco, CA	26.52
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[69.18]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ADAMS, B. JOYCE (Texas)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ADAMS, B. JOYCE (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.72]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ADAMS, JOHN P. (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.08
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[1.08]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ADAMS, ROY (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.72]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ADAMS, WILLIAM (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ADAMS, WILLIAM (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.32
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[4.32]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>AIELLO, JAMES (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ALLEN, ELEANOR (San Francisco)</u>			
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.70	52.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ALLEN, GERALDINE (WD: LEONARD) (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFFS' RESPONSES TO GRINNELL'S REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION AND SPECIAL INTERROGATORIES. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - VERIFY ENCLOSURES - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.10	90.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ALLEN, GERALDINE (WD: LEONARD) (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.16
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[2.16]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>AMATAGA, SOFALA (San Francisco)</u>		
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ANDREWS III, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ANDREWS, CHARLES (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC BRAYTON/CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	52.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ARAUJO, REYNALDO (Galveston Co., TX) [CLOSED]</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.52
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[2.52]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ATTAWAY, BILLY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/25/01	CEE	REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS WITH PREPARATION OF MEDICAL SYNOPSIS FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	3.00	285.00
10/31/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[4.50	667.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BAKER, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/31/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.60	390.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BANGSUND, CLARK (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BANKS, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/31/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[2.00	420.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARBERA, ANTHONY S. (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.10</u>	<u>435.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BARBERA, ANTHONY S. (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	18.90
SUBTOTAL:	[18.90]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARBERA, GEORGE (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BARBERA, GEORGE (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.96
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[3.96]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARLOW, EUGENE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARNES, HERVIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC BRAYTON/CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.60	45.00
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.60 45.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARNETT, CHERYL (Texas)</u>			
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.20	90.00
10/22/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW.	1.90	142.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>3.50</u>	<u>262.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BARNETT, CHERYL (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	20.70
SUBTOTAL:	[20.70]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARNETT, JUANITA (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BARTOLOTTA, ANGELO (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BATES, LESTER (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BEARDEN, ROSA (San Francisco)</u>		
10/16/01	LEC CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BEARDEN, ROSA (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.78
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[3.78]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BENGIS, MILTON M. (Boston)</u>		
10/18/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BENGIS, MILTON M. (Boston)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.90
SUBTOTAL:	[0.90]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BENNETT, DARRIE [WD: WILLIAM] (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BERKHOFER, EDWARD (New Jersey)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.60
SUBTOTAL:	[3.60]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BIRCHETT, MICHAEL (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BLACK, FABIA (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BLACK, WARREN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.		0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BLACKMON, JR., CHESTER (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BLASDELL, WALTER (Oregon)</u>			
10/22/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
10/23/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.40	450.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BOUYEA, ROGER (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.		0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BOYER, JOSEPH (Cleveland)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRAIN, ROBERT (Ohio)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRANSCUM, ARLEN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB TO BERRY & BERRY ADVISING BETHLEHEM HAS RESOLVED 48 CASES AND REQUESTING ALL SERVICES ON BEHALF OF BETHLEHEM TO STOP. UPDATE BETHLEHEM CASE LIST. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	17.00
	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.70	54.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRATCHER, HERBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
10/22/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRENNER, RALPH (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BROCK, EDWARD (San Francisco)</u>			
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.10	82.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.10	82.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BROWN, BILLIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BROWN, JEROME (Ohio)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BROWN, ROBERT LOUIS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM TO USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.60	57.00
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.70 64.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BRUMLEY, JIMMY RAY (Texas)</u>			
10/26/01	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CDO ADVISING BETHLEHEM HAS BEEN DISMISSED. UPDATE BSC CASE LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	8.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BRUMLEY, JIMMY RAY (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.42
SUBTOTAL:	[3.42]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BURKE, AVERY (Texas)</u>				
10/15/01	LEC	RECEIVE, IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RECEIVED FROM LOCAL COUNSEL. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS AND SHIP VIA FEDEX TO DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. UPDATE MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE AND RADIOLOGY REVIEW DATABASE. UPDATE RADIOLOGY INDEX. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.30	97.50
10/16/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	1.20	36.00
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
10/29/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[4.80	576.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BURKE, AVERY (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	11.88
SUBTOTAL:	[11.88]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURKE, JAMES P. (Pennsylvania)</u>			
10/17/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
10/29/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[2.30	442.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BURKE, JAMES P. (Pennsylvania)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.14
SUBTOTAL:	[4.14]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURKHART, NANCY (POSTWEILER) (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	CEE	CONTINUE TO ORGANIZE MEDICAL FILE FOLDERS FOR BULK MEDICAL RECORDS TO PRESERVE MEDICAL DEFENSE. UPDATE RADIOLOGY AND PATHOLOGY INDEXES. DRAFT ADDITIONAL MEDICAL PROVIDERS FOR FORWARD TO LOCAL COUNSEL IF NEEDED FOR FUTURE.	3.70	351.50
10/16/01	GEB	REVIEW, ORGANIZATION AND PREPARATION OF REFERENCE MATERIALS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.50	112.50
10/17/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.00	95.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>7.00</u>	<u>619.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BURKHART, NANCY (POSTWEILER) (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	49.50
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[49.50]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURNS, RICHARD (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/31/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL FILES FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	12.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	21.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BURNS, RICHARD (New York City)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
SUBTOTAL:	[0.72]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>BUSNARDO, FRANK - CLOSED (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	8.82
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[8.82]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>BUTLER, MARGARET (JAMES BRYAN, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>		
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CAMPBELL, PATRICK (Washington)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE/ORGANIZE ORIGINAL OFFICE FILE.	0.50	37.50
10/30/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.50</u>	<u>457.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CAPPIELLO, DANIEL (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CAPUTY, CARMEN (New York City)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.		0.50	47.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	47.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CAREY, DONALD (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CARLSON, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CARR, JANET (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CASE, RAYMOND (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
10/31/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH PREPARATION AND ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE FOR USE IN FUTURE.	1.30	39.00
	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND IDENTIFY VIA MEDICAL SYNOPSIS RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.40	228.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>4.00</u>	<u>293.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CASSIDY, KENNETH (New York City)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CASSOU, MARCEL (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.32
SUBTOTAL:	[4.32]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CASTELLANO, SALVATORE (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CASTOR, JAMES (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/25/01	CEE	REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS WITH PREPARATION OF MEDICAL SYNOPSIS FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.50	237.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.80	264.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CATANIA, SAM (Buffalo)</u>				
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM TSW ADVISING BETHLEHEM'S DISCOVERY MOTION HAS BEEN RESCHEDULED. UPDATE BETHLEHEM CALENDAR. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO MESOTHELIOMA DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/22/01	CEE	FORWARD RADIOLOGY BACK TO LOCAL COUNSEL AND UPDATE RADIOLOGY INVENTORY.	0.40	38.00
10/24/01	CEE	TRACK RECEIPT OF MEDICAL MATERIALS TO LOCAL COUNSEL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO REFLECT RETURNED RADIOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[4.10	611.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CATANIA, SAM (Buffalo)</u>	
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Tom Wiswall, Phillips Lytle, Buffalo, NY	14.82
 SUBTOTAL:	 [14.82]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CHASE, MAURICE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CHIMENTI, LEONARD (New Jersey)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CISNEROS, ORLANDO (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	22.68
SUBTOTAL:	[22.68]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CIULLA, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CLEMMONS, DURWARD B. (Cleveland)</u>		
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>COGHLON (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>COLRIDGE, KATHERINE (WD: CHARLES) [San Francisco]</u>			
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>COLRIDGE, KATHERINE (WD: CHARLES) [San Francisco]</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.24
SUBTOTAL:	[3.24]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CORMIER, PEARL C. (ODE L., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.90	67.50
10/25/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW.	0.70	52.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.60	120.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CORMIER, PEARL C. (ODE L., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>	
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Cheryl Olsen, Crawford & Olesen, Beaumont, TX	23.92
SUBTOTAL:	[23.92]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CORMIER, RUSSELL (Orange Co., TX)</u>			
10/23/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW.	1.30	97.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.30	97.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>COVIER, MARTHA (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.		0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>COX, DONALD (San Francisco)</u>			
10/22/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CREPS, CHARLES (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CRESPO, FERNANDO (Cleveland, OH)</u>		
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CROMWELL, LLOYD (Ohio)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CRUZ, ROMAN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DALESKY, SAM (Oregon)</u>			
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DANIELS, HAROLD (Texas)</u>			
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.10	82.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.10	82.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>DAVIS, JR., JESSIE (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.36
 SUBTOTAL:	 [0.36]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DAY, GERALD (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DELK, LONZA E. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.10	82.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>DELK, LONZA E. (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.16
SUBTOTAL:	[2.16]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DORSEY, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>1.00</u>	<u>75.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DOWD, WALTER (New York City)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DRAKER, JAMES FRANCIS (Dallas, TX)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	RECEIVE, IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM LOCAL COUNSEL FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS, AND RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL VIA FEDEX. UPDATE RADIOLOGY DATABASE AND TEXAS CASE CHRONOLOGY DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
10/23/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS, PACKAGE AND SHIP VIA FEDEX TO LOCAL COUNSEL FOR RETURN TO PLAINTIFFS. UPDATE RADIOLOGY DATABASE AND FEDEX SHIPPING DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.60	45.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>1.80</u>	<u>135.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DUKE, JAMES & JANICE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	CLOSE OUT OFFICE FILE - UPDATE REFERENCE MATERIAL FOR USE AT FUTURE DATE.	1.40	105.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.40	105.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DUNPHY, MARY ALICE (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DURAL, ALTON (San Francisco)</u>			
10/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>DURKIN, PATRICK E. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>EALY, GEORGE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>EASTMARK, ERLING (Washington)</u>			
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>0.70</u>	<u>52.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ECKAM, BEVERLY (CHAUNCEY) (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>EDWARDS, DIANNA (WD: APLEY, MAURICE) (San Francisco)</u>			
10/24/01	CEE	PREPARE BRIEF MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW AFTER REVIEW OF RECORDS ON FILE. IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL RECORDS AND FLAG ACCORDINGLY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.30	123.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.30	123.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ELDRACHER, DENNIS (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	KLM UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>ELLISON, FLORA MAE (JAMES B., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>		
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>EMRICK, DENNIS & LEANN (Los Angeles)</u>			
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.30	97.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.30	97.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>EMRICK, DENNIS & LEANN (Los Angeles)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.54
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[0.54]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ESPOSITO, FRANK (NYC)</u>				
10/16/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE UNION RECORDS FROM RECORDTRAK. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
	CEE	UPDATE MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY. RECEIVE RADIOLOGY AND PREPARE INDEX AND INVENTORY. ORGANIZE INFORMATION INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS. IDENTIFY MEDICAL PROVIDERS FOR FUTURE REFERENCE. PRESERVE MEDICAL EVIDENCE TRAIL.	3.00	285.00
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
10/22/01	CEE	FORWARD RADIOLOGY BACK TO RECORD TRAK AND ADVISE CONTACT TO SUSPEND PROCESSING OF MEDICAL INFORMATION. RECEIVED MEDICAL RECORDS AND UPDATE MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
10/24/01	CEE	RECEIVE MEDICAL CORRESPONDENCE AND UPDATE MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY ACCORDINGLY. FLAG SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL INFORMATION. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.60	57.00
10/29/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO REFLECT RETURNED RADIOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[5.70	533.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ESPOSITO, FRANK (NYC)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Kim Parsons, Record Trak, King of Prussia, PA	12.22
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[12.94]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ESTES, MARGARET (WD: BENJAMIN) [San Francisco]</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.40	105.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>EZEKIAL, PINKNEY (Ohio)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>FAULK, LARRY (Texas)</u>			
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>FINCH, JOHN & MARY (San Francisco)</u>				
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE.	0.50	37.50
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING DR. MOSCOW'S NOTES FROM HIS MEDICAL RECORDS REVIEW. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIVE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/17/01	KLM	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DSM TO DISCUSS PREPARATION/NEGOTIATION/RESOLUTION OF CASE AT FUTURE DATE.	0.30	22.50
SUBTOTAL:			[2.60	466.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>FLOYD, LUTHER (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>FOSTER, BILLIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.50 37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>FOUX, SEBURN (Texas)</u>			
10/23/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS, PACKAGE AND SHIP VIA FEDEX TO LOCAL COUNSEL FOR RETURN TO PLAINTIFFS. UPDATE RADIOLOGY DATABASE AND FEDEX SHIPPING DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>FRANK, MICHAEL (San Francisco)</u>			
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.90 67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>FREELAND, NORMA (New York City)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>FRESQUEZ, DAVID (San Francisco)</u>		
10/16/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.10	82.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GANLEY, RICHARD & MARIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GAROFALO, JOSEPH (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GAULT, LEROY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REQUESTING SHIP SPECIFICATIONS FROM THE NATIONAL ARCHIVES FOR EACH SHIP LISTED IN PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO STANDARD INTERROGATORIES. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/23/01	CEE	IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL INFORMATION AND PREPARE MEDICAL SYNOPSIS WITH MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.80	266.00
10/25/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH PREPARATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR USE IN FUTURE.	2.30	69.00
10/26/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	3.00	90.00
SUBTOTAL:			[8.20	433.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GELLING, NOREEN (New York City)</u>				
10/17/01	SAF	RECEIVE SPERRY CORP'S MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT. DIRECT GEB TO UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CONSENT TO CHANGE OF ATTORNEY; REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM MALABY & CARLISLE REGARDING SPERRY MOTION FOR SUMMARY JUDGMENT. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	2.50	187.50
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.70	66.50
10/23/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/29/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[5.30	682.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GIBSON, MARY (ROY, JR., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GILL, JAMES (Indiana)</u>			
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/INDIANA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GILL, JAMES (Indiana)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.16
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[2.16]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GODSEY, DORNEL (Dallas)</u>			
10/15/01	LKG	UPDATE CASE FILE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	42.50
	SAF	DISCUSS <u>DAUBERT</u> PROJECT WITH SBJ. RESEARCH EDWIN HOLSTEIN TO DETERMINE CURRENT BUSINESS LOCATION AND LOCATE PREVIOUS TESTIMONY. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.30	195.50
	SBJ	EXAMINATION OF PATHOLOGY MATERIALS, REPORTS AND MEDICAL RECORDS IN RESPONSE TO DEFENDANT EXPERT PATHOLOGIST REQUEST FOR ADDITIONAL PATHOLOGY MATERIALS. DISCUSSED CASE STATUS WITH LEC.	2.70	337.50
	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
	PST	REVIEW/LEGAL ANALYSIS OF DR. LEMEN MATERIALS INCLUDING COMPLETION OF MILLER V. WESTINGHOUSE, 2/20/97, MILLER V. FOSTER WHEELER TRIAL TESTIMONY OF 3/19/97, MILLER V. FOSTER WHEELER DEPOSITION OF 1/6/98, AND LOFGREN V. MOTOROLA, 8/21/97 FOR USE RE: FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	7.00	1,155.00
10/16/01	SAF	RECEIVE ENCLOSURES REFERENCED IN CDO'S OCTOBER 9, 2001 FACSIMILE (CASE LAW, COMMENTARIES, STATUTES). DIRECT GEB TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO MESOTHELIOMA DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM CDO REGARDING TEXAS CASE LAW REGARDING GROSS NEGLIGENCE AND	0.70	52.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		EXEMPLARY DAMAGES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.		
10/16/01	SBJ	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DSM AND DEFENDANT'S PATHOLOGY EXPERT RE: MEDICAL INCONSISTENCIES OF THE DIAGNOSIS. INFORMATION RECORDED AND REFERENCED FOR DEFENSE USE AT A LATER DATE.	1.10	137.50
	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/17/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/18/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/19/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE; ASSIST SAF WITH PREPARATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/22/01	LEC	RECEIVE, IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS, PACKAGE AND SHIP VIA FEDEX TO LOCAL COUNSEL FOR RETURN TO PLAINTIFFS. UPDATE RADIOLOGY DATABASE AND FEDEX SHIPPING DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.80	210.00
10/24/01	VJW	ORGANIZE MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.50	15.00
10/29/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND	1.50	382.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.		
SUBTOTAL:	[29.90	2,896.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GODSEY, DORNEL (Dallas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2,368.26
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Cheryl Olsen, Crawford & Olesen, Beaumont, TX	23.92
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[2,392.18]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>GOFF, JERYL R., ESTATE OF (USDC California)</u>		
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.10	9.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GORI, GEORGIO (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GRAHOVAC, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.00	420.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GRAHOVAC, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.98
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[1.98]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GRANT, CLEVELAND (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.78
SUBTOTAL:	[3.78]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>GRUBE, NORM (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GUSHLAW, RICHARD (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HAMMARSTROM, ROY G. (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>HAMMESFAHR, JAMES (New York City)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HARHAY, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>			
10/24/01	CEE	PREPARE BRIEF MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW AFTER REVIEW OF RECORDS ON FILE. IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL RECORDS AND FLAG ACCORDINGLY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.40	228.00
10/26/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/29/01	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL INFORMATION INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[5.30	373.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HARHAY, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	21.06
 SUBTOTAL:	 [21.06]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HARLESS, TERRY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HARLESS, TERRY (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.98
 SUBTOTAL:	 [1.98]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HAUGH, JOHN J. (New York City)</u>			
10/15/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS REGARDING OUTSTANDING STIPULATION FILING; MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. HEDERMAN. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.60	45.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS ENCLOSING REPORT STATING RECORDS FROM DR. HEDERMAN HAVE BEEN DESTROYED; CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS TO WHG REGARDING DEADLINE TO NOTIFY SPECIAL MASTER OF ANY OUTSTANDING STIPULATIONS. UPDATE BETHLEHEM CALENDAR. DIRECT GEB TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.55
	SBJ	REVIEW / ANALYSIS OF MEDICAL RECORDS TO IDENTIFY SALIENT MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES. TO RECORD AND REFERENCE ISSUES FOR DEFENSE USE AT A LATER DATE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.40	175.00
10/16/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS REGARDING PLAINTIFF'S EVIDENCE TO LINK BETHLEHEM TO PLAINTIFF'S CLAIM. RESEARCH ASBESTOS REFERENCE MATERIAL FROM NEW YORK TIMES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
	CEE	RECEIVED MEDICAL INFORMATION AND UPDATED MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY. CONTINUE TO PREPARE MEDICAL EVIDENCE FOR FUTURE NEED.	0.20	19.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS TO JOHN DEARIE REQUESTING DISMISSAL. DIRECT GEB TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	59.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
10/19/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS ENCLOSING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM DR. PETER ALBERT. DIRECT GEB TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/22/01	SBJ	REVIEWED RECENT MEDICAL RECORDS SUBMISSION. SALIENT MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES IDENTIFIED AND DOCUMENTED. BRIEF MEDICAL ACQUISITION PLAN OUTLINED FOR SUBSEQUENT DEFENSE USE.	1.30	162.50
10/23/01	CEE	RECEIVE MEDICAL CORRESPONDENCE AND REVISE MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY TO REFLECT SUCH. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	38.00
10/29/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM RCS REGARDING REMAINING DEFENDANTS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
SUBTOTAL:			[6.30	646.55]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HAUGH, JOHN J. (New York City)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	58.32
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[58.32]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HAZEN, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HEMMENWAY, TRAVIS (Texas)</u>			
10/26/01	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CDO ADVISING BETHLEHEM HAS BEEN SEVERED FROM ELEVEN PARKER AND PARKS CASES. UPDATE BSC CASE LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	SAF	REVIEW INCOMING CORRESPONDENCE. DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE CASE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	25.50
	LKG	REVIEW INCOMING CORRESPONDENCE. DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE CASE FILE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	25.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>0.70</u>	<u>59.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HENDERSON, LEAMORL (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HENDERSON, LEAMORL (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.44
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[1.44]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HERRINGTON, JR., JOSEPH (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
10/18/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.10	82.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.90	142.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HILL, ROY (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.		0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HOLMES, WILLIAM (Texas)</u>			
10/16/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM CDO ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S EXPERT WITNESS LIST, EXHIBIT LIST AND MOTION TO USE PREVIOUS DISCOVERY FROM RELATED CASES. DIRECT GEB TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM CDO REGARDING PROPOSED EXPERT WITNESS LIST, EXHIBIT LIST AND MOTION TO USE DEPOSITIONS, TRIAL TESTIMONY AND DEFENDANTS' RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.70	52.50
10/25/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.80	24.00
10/30/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[3.80	527.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HOLMES, WILLIAM (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	24.66
SUBTOTAL:	[24.66]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HOWARD, EILEEN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HOWELL, FANNIE (GERALD CLARK, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
10/22/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.20	90.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.20	90.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HUFF, DEWARD (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HUNSAKER, LEWIS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HUST, SR., DOYLE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>JACKSON, SHERMAN (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.36
SUBTOTAL:	[0.36]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>JAGNEAUX, JOSEPH (SHOMO) (Jefferson Co., TX)</u>		
10/15/01	SBJ	REVIEW/ ANALYSIS OF LATEST SUBMISSION OF RECORDS. ALSO MEDICAL CORRESPONDENCE REVIEW AND LOG UPDATE.	0.50	62.50
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.10	82.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.60	145.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>JAGNEAUX, JOSEPH (SHOMO) (Jefferson Co., TX)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.32
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[4.32]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>JEANE, EVELYN (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.24
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[3.24]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>JENNINGS, SONNY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>JOHNSON, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>		
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>JOHNSON, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.80
 SUBTOTAL:	 [1.80]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>JOHNSON, NATHANIEL (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>JUSTE, SALVADOR (Buffalo, NY)</u>		
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTLER - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	19.00
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL - UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR USE AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.70	56.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>JUSTE, SALVADOR (Buffalo, NY)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	10.98
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[10.98]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KACZMAREK (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KAEINTZ, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.20	90.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.20	90.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KENNEDY, CORINNE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/24/01	CEE	PREPARE BRIEF MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW AFTER REVIEW OF RECORDS ON FILE. IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL RECORDS AND FLAG ACCORDINGLY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.70	161.50
10/29/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.70	21.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>2.70</u>	<u>209</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>KENNEDY, CORINNE (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.06
 SUBTOTAL:	 [3.06]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KERN, EVELYNDALE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>KESSLER, JUDITH (San Francisco)</u>		
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO ANDERSON, ROWE AND BUCKLEY'S SUPPLEMENTAL INTERROGATORY. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.40	31.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KIRCHNER, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>KORTUM, FRED (San Francisco)</u>		
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LABRANA, JOHN (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM TSW ENCLOSING PROPOSED NEW ANSWERS FOR SEVEN BUFFALO CASES IN RESPONSE TO RECENTLY AMENDED COMPLAINTS. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/18/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.30</u>	<u>451.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LACEY, JAMES & LUCY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/23/01	CEE	IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL INFORMATION AND PREPARE MEDICAL SYNOPSIS WITH MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.80	171.00
10/29/01	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL INFORMATION INTO SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.00	95.00
	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH THE ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	5.40	162.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[8.20	428.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LACEY, JAMES & LUCY (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	85.14
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[85.14]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LAMB, GEORGE E. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.20	90.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LANE, HIRAM (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LASHER, AARON (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LEACH, PATRICIA [WD: GERALD LEACH] (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LEMIEUX, MARLIN (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	CEE	RECEIVED RADIOLOGY. REVISE INDEX AND PREPARE INVENTORY. PREPARE TO FORWARD TO MEDICAL EXPERT AS APPROPRIATE.	3.60	342.00
10/16/01	CEE	RECEIVE RADIOLOGY AND PREPARE FOR POSSIBLE FORWARD TO MEDICAL EXPERT AS APPROPRIATE. PREPARE RECORDS TO REFLECT SUCH IN ORDER TO PRESERVE MEDICAL EVIDENCE TRAIL.	0.40	38.00
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/19/01	CEE	DISCUSS RETURN OF RADIOLOGY WITH DSM AND MEDICAL DIRECTOR.	0.20	19.00
10/22/01	CEE	FORWARD RADIOLOGY BACK TO PLAINTIFF COUNSEL AND UPDATE RADIOLOGY INVENTORY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO REFLECT RETURNED RADIOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>5.80</u>	<u>549.00]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LEMIEUX, MARLIN (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	146.16
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Kathy Kling, Lipsitz Green, Buffalo, NY	10.40
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[156.56]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LEWIN, SAMUEL L. (Cleveland)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LEWIS, GEORGE (New York City)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.60	47.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>LIMU, TALOLO F. (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>LINDSTROM, ROLF L. (Cleveland)</u>		
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LOCHER, WILLIAM (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>0.80</u>	<u>60.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LOCKETT, VERNON (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LONGMAN, SANDRA (Oakland, CA)</u>			
10/17/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
10/18/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.30	97.50
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>2.30</u>	<u>172.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LUCAS, HELEN (Chicago)</u>			
10/15/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/PREPARE NEW FILE. PREPARE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LUCAS, HELEN (Chicago)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.50
SUBTOTAL:	[4.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LUKSYS, FRANCIS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LYNCH, JAMES E. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LYNN, RAYMOND (Jefferson Co., TX)</u>			
10/19/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/PREPARE NEW FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MADISON, CONCETTA (New York City)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MAK, BENJAMIN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE. REMOVE CASE FROM BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM CASE LIST DATABASE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF EXPERT REPORTS INTO BSC PLAINTIFF EXPERT REPORT CASE LIST DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MAK, BENJAMIN (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	13.50
 SUBTOTAL:	 [13.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MAMBRINO, FRANK & YVONNE (Buffalo)</u>				
10/15/01	CEE	RECEIVED PATHOLOGY. PREPARE INVENTORY, CHAIN OF CUSTODY AND REVISE INDEX. UPDATE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO PRESERVE FILES INTEGRITY FOR FUTURE REFERENCE.	1.40	133.00
	GEB	REVIEW, ORGANIZATION AND PREPARATION OF JUDGE KANE REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BETHLEHEM TRIAL PREPARATION AND TRIALS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	6.00	450.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM TSW RESPONDING TO TEC'S REQUEST REGARDING INFORMATION CONCERNING SCHEDULING IN THE <u>MAMBRINO AND SCHENDEL</u> CASES. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/16/01	GEB	REVIEW, ORGANIZATION AND PREPARATION OF JUDGE KANE REFERENCE MATERIALS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	3.50	262.50
	CEE	REVIEW RECORDS AND PREPARE COMPLETE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW AND DISCUSSION. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	3.10	294.50
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE/ORGANIZE ORIGINAL OFFICE FILE.	0.50	37.50
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
10/19/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND	1.50	382.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.		
10/19/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY. DISCUSS RETURN OF PATHOLOGY WITH DSM AND MEDICAL DIRECTOR.	0.70	66.50
10/22/01	CEE	FORWARD PATHOLOGY AND RADIOLOGY BACK TO LOCAL COUNSEL AND UPDATE RADIOLOGY INVENTORY AND PATHOLOGY CHAIN OF CUSTODY DOCUMENTS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.60	57.00
10/24/01	CEE	TRACK RECEIPT OF MEDICAL MATERIALS TO LOCAL COUNSEL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO REFLECT RETURNED PATHOLOGY AND RADIOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[19.00	1,834.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MAMBRINO, FRANK & YVONNE (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	242.28
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Tom Wiswall, Phillips Lytle, Buffalo, NY	14.82
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[257.10]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>MANISCALCO, LUCIANO (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MARRALE, MARY C. (New York City)</u>		
10/18/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MARTIGNONI, THOMAS (Indiana)</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM HENDERSON DAILY - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/17/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/18/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW AND PREPARE INITIAL CASE SYNOPSIS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.40	105.00
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/INDIANA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[4.30	592.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MARTIGNONI, THOMAS (Indiana)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.86
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[4.86]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MARTIN, DENNIS & DIANE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MARTIN, JAMES (Indiana)</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM HENDERSON DAILY - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/17/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/18/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW AND PREPARE INITIAL CASE SYNOPSIS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.40	105.00
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/INDIANA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			[4.30	592.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MARTIN, JAMES (Indiana)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	14.58
SUBTOTAL:	[14.58

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MARTIN, WILLIAM (MARY) (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE. REMOVE CASE FROM BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM CASE LIST DATABASE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF EXPERT REPORTS INTO BSC PLAINTIFF EXPERT REPORT CASE LIST DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MARTINEZ, THOMAS (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MATHIAS, ROY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>McCLOUD, FRED (San Francisco)</u>		
10/25/01	CEE	REVIEW OF MEDICAL RECORDS WITH PREPARATION OF MEDICAL SYNOPSIS FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.50	237.50
10/29/01	CEE	COMPLETE PREPARATION OF MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.40	133.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[3.90	370.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>McCOOEY, MATTHEW (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>McGONNELL, JAMES (San Francisco)</u>		
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>McHENRY, CHARLIE (San Francisco)</u>		
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>McHUGH, JAMES (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>McMAHON, MILDRED (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO SB DECKING'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - VERIFY ENCLOSURES - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.10	90.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MELE, DANIEL (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MILLAR, GEOFFREY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MILLAY, RICHARD [PATRICIA QUINN] (San Francisco)</u>				
10/15/01	LEC	RECEIVE, IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPATE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM LOCAL COUNSEL FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS, AND RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL VIA FEDEX. UPDATE RADIOLOGY DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.30	97.50
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ADVISING OF DATE BY WHICH THE PATHOLOGY IS TO BE RETURNED TO BERRY & BERRY. UPDATE BETHLEHEM CALENDAR. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIPT/REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REGARDING MEDICAL MATERIALS DATE OF RETURN - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.20	90.00
SUBTOTAL:			[3.00	226.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MILLAY, RICHARD [PATRICIA QUINN] (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.62
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[1.62]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MILLER, BYRON (Estate of ERVIN MILLER) [San Francisco]</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE.	0.60	45.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.60	45.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MISKO, DENNIS (WD: CHRISTINE) [San Francisco]</u>			
10/16/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/17/01	KLM	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DSM TO DISCUSS PREPARATION/NEGOTIATION/RESOLUTION OF CASE AT FUTURE DATE.	0.30	22.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.80	405.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MITCHELL, FREDDIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MONETTE, CHARLES (Los Angeles)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MONIZ, DANIEL (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - VERIFY ENCLOSURES - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S CASE STATUS REPORT. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.00	83.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MONTERO, RAUL (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>MOODY, SR., WALTER (New York City)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/31/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL FILES FOR USE IN FUTURE.	0.40	12.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.50	21.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MORALES, BALBINA (Los Angeles)</u>				
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIPT/REVIEW MEDICAL CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REGARDING PATHOLOGY MATERIAL DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB OFFICE TO BERRY & BERRY RETURNING ORIGINAL PATHOLOGY FROM DR. SALYER, KAISER SACRAMENTO AND DEFENSE CONSULTANT. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	59.50
10/18/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.00	75.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/31/01	LEC	REVIEW COMPLETE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM SPECIALTY FILE FOLDERS INCLUDING DEFENSE EXPERT REPORTS AND IDENTIFY MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES APPLICABLE TO POTENTIAL BSC CODEFENDANT REIMBURSEMENT CASES, BEGIN EXTENSIVE MEDICAL/LEGAL ISSUES MEMO. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	3.50	262.50
	SBJ	REVIEW / ANALYSIS OF TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO NURSING AND EXPERT REPORTS TO UPDATE MEDICAL CASE LIST MEMORANDUM. INTENDED USE TO RECOVER MEDICAL COLLECTION COSTS.	1.20	150.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
SUBTOTAL:	[6.80	577.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MORALES, BALBINA (Los Angeles)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.62
 SUBTOTAL:	 [1.62]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MORIBELLO, JOHN (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MORIBELLO, JOHN (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	5.04
 SUBTOTAL:	 [5.04]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>MORRIS, LINDA (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.70	52.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.70	52.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MORTENSEN, JOHN (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MORTON, GARY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MOSES, LEROY (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	CEE	RECEIVED RADIOLOGY FROM LOCAL COUNSEL.	0.30	28.50
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/16/01	CEE	RECEIVE RADIOLOGY AND PREPARE FOR POSSIBLE FORWARD TO MEDICAL EXPERT. PREPARE INDEX, INVENTORY, ORGANIZE MEDICAL INFORMATION INTO MEDICAL FILE FOLDERS. UPDATE MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY. PRESERVE MEDICAL EVIDENCE TRAIL FOR POSSIBLE ACCESS IN FUTURE.	2.10	199.50
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	76.00
10/19/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY. DISCUSS RETURN OF PATHOLOGY WITH DSM AND MEDICAL DIRECTOR.	0.70	66.50
10/22/01	CEE	ADVISE MEDICAL EXPERT TO SUSPEND ANALYSIS OF EVALUATION. FORWARD RADIOLOGY BACK TO LOCAL COUNSEL. UPDATE RADIOLOGY INDEX - PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	76.00
10/24/01	CEE	TRACK RECEIPT OF MEDICAL MATERIALS TO LOCAL COUNSEL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO REFLECT RETURNED PATHOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	CEE	RECEIVE, REINVENTORY AND FORWARD PATHOLOGY BACK TO LOCAL COUNSEL WITH DEADLINE APPROACHING FOR RETURN. REVISE CHAIN OF CUSTODY DOCUMENTS TO REFLECT SUCH. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.70	161.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
SUBTOTAL:	[7.10	664.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MOSES, LEROY (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	36.90
10/27/01 - FedEx Charge - from Dr. Allen Gibbs, Llandough Hospital, Penarth to MacLachlan Law Offices	74.18
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[111.08]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>MURPHY, FRANCIS (New Jersey)</u>		
10/17/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MURPHY, TERRANCE (Alameda Co., CA)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.10	82.50
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.50	112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MURPHY, TIMOTHY</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MURPHY, TIMOTHY</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.44
SUBTOTAL:	[1.44]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>NASH, JERRY (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>NAU, FRED (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>NAU, FRED (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	10.98
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[10.98]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>NISSEN, BARBARA JOYCE [WD: NELSON] (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>O'BRIEN, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>		
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.10	82.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>O'KANE, BRIAN (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>OLSON, ALBON & MARGARET (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	5.94
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[5.94]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ORTIZ, JOSE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ORTIZ, RAMON (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>[0.10</u>	<u>9.50]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>OTERI, GLADYS (NYC)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.70	66.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.70	66.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>PAASCH, VERNON (Washington)</u>		
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PALASZYNSKI, JOHN (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PANTANO, THOMAS (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
10/19/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[2.30	450.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>PANTANO, THOMAS (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.80
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[1.80]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>PAPANTONIO, ALFRED (New York City)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PAPPAS, JAMES (Baltimore)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>PAPPAS, JAMES (Baltimore)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.36
 SUBTOTAL:	 [0.36]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PAQUIN, LAURA (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/31/01	VJW	ASSIST CEE WITH ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL FILES FOR USE IN FUTURE.	0.30	9.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	28.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PARKS, WILLIAM M. (Indiana)</u>			
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/INDIANA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PERRY, ANGELO (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.10	82.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.60	465.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>PERRY, ANGELO (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	18.00
SUBTOTAL:	[18.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PHILLIPS, DAVID (Oakland, CA)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.30 22.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amou</u>
	<u>PIERCE, SR., GEORGE (New York)</u>		
10/18/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	38.0
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.40	38.0

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>POTTER, PAMA (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING COPY OF PLAINTIFF'S SHIP LIST. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>1.40</u>	<u>106.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>POTTER, PAMA (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
SUBTOTAL:	[0.72]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PRESCOTT, ARLENE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>PRESCOTT, ARLENE (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.42
SUBTOTAL:	[3.42]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PRINS, RALPH A. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.20	90.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>PURKEY, JANE [WD: JAY] (San Francisco)</u>				
10/15/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/16/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	KLM	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DSM TO DISCUSS PREPARATION/NEGOTIATION/RESOLUTION OF CASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.60	45.00
10/17/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.50	75.00
10/18/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/19/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	1.50	45.00
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.30	97.50
SUBTOTAL:			[13.40	825.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>PURKEY, JANE [WD: JAY] (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	11.16
SUBTOTAL:	[11.16]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>QUIETT, DONALD E. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB OFFICE TO BERRY & BERRY REQUESTING ALL SERVICES STOP ON BEHALF OF BETHLEHEM. DIRECT KLM TO UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/17/01	KLM	CLOSE OUT OFFICE FILE - UPDATE REFERENCE MATERIAL FOR USE AT FUTURE DATE.	1.40	105.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.50	113.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>QUIETT, DONALD E. (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.16
 SUBTOTAL:	 [2.16]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>QUINDAG, MARIA (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.40	34.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>QUINTANA, DONALD G. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.10	82.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>QUINTANA, DONALD G. (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	14.04
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[14.04]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RABEAUX, SR., ROBERT (Texas)</u>				
10/15/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	1.50	45.00
	PST	REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF LETTER FROM CDO REGARDING PLAINTIFF'S FIRM SEEKING ASSISTANCE FROM UMPHREY AND REAUD MORGAN AND REQUESTING ADMISSIONS REGARDING 38 ADDITIONAL POTENTIAL WITNESSES FOR USE RE: FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS. DISCUSS WITH LKG.	0.20	33.00
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.30	97.50
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
10/19/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.50	15.00
10/23/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS RETURNED FROM DEFENSE MEDICAL EXPERT FOR COPYING AND REVIEW. PREPARE COVER LETTER, ENCLOSE WITH RADIOLOGY MATERIALS, PACKAGE AND SHIP VIA FEDEX TO LOCAL COUNSEL FOR RETURN TO PLAINTIFFS. UPDATE RADIOLOGY DATABASE AND FEDEX SHIPPING DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.50	187.50
10/26/01	SAF	REVIEW INCOMING CORRESPONDENCE. DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE CASE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	25.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/26/01	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM CDO ADVISING BETHLEHEM HAS BEEN DISMISSED. UPDATE BSC CASE LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/29/01	LKG	REVIEW CASE FILE BASED ON NON-SUIT FOR BSC FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	42.50
10/30/01	VJW	ORGANIZE MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.40	12.00
10/31/01	SBJ	REVIEW / ANALYSIS OF TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO NURSING AND EXPERT REPORTS TO UPDATE MEDICAL CASE LIST MEMORANDUM. INTENDED USE TO RECOVER MEDICAL COLLECTION COSTS.	1.00	125.00
	VJW	ORGANIZE MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.40	12.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[9.10	633.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RABEAUX, SR., ROBERT (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	66.96
 SUBTOTAL:	 [66.96]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RAHMANI, HABIB (WD: SHAISTA) [San Francisco, CA]</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.18
SUBTOTAL:	[0.18]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>RANCICH, MILAN (Indiana)</u>			
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM HENDERSON DAILY - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE/ORGANIZE ORIGINAL OFFICE FILE.	0.50	37.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
10/18/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW AND PREPARE INITIAL CASE SYNOPSIS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.40	105.00
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/INDIANA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.10	82.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[5.00	645.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RANCICH, MILAN (Indiana)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.32
SUBTOTAL:	[4.32]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RASMUSSEN, LOWELL & BETTY-JEANE (Wartnick)</u>				
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REQUESTING SHIP SPECIFICATIONS FROM THE NATIONAL ARCHIVES FOR EACH SHIP LISTED IN PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO STANDARD INTERROGATORIES. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING MEDICAL RECORDS. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIVE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
10/22/01	CEE	RECEIVED MEDICAL INFORMATION AND UPDATE MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY.	0.40	38.00
10/23/01	CEE	IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL INFORMATION AND PREPARE MEDICAL SYNOPSIS WITH MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.60	152.00
SUBTOTAL:			[2.40	222.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RASMUSSEN, LOWELL & BETTY-JEANE (Wartnick)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.78
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[3.78]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ROBICHEAUX, ELFERT (Texas)</u>			
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.80	60.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ROMERO, LOUIS (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.50
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[4.50]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ROSIGNON, ONESLIE (Dallas Co., TX)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.88
SUBTOTAL:	[2.88]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ROWTON, CLARK (San Francisco)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	41.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>RUSSELL, DANIEL (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>SAHLBERG, CAROLYN [WD: ROBERT] (San Francisco)</u>		
10/17/01	KLM	AT FUTURE DATE.UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]



MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SALKA, JONATHAN (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SAMATUA, JOE & MEKI (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	14.94
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[14.94]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SAUNDERS, RICHARD & LILLIAN (San Francisco)</u>				
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO DISCOVERY. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
10/16/01	SBJ	REVIEWED INTERROGATORIES AND SS EARNINGS RECORDS. PERTINENT MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS AND MEDICAL HISTORY RECORDED AND REFERENCED FOR FUTURE DEFENSE USE.	0.60	75.00
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/22/01	CEE	REVIEW INTERROGATORIES AND PREPARE MEDICAL MEMORANDUM FOR DSM REVIEW OF SUCH. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.00</u>	<u>199.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SAUNDERS, RICHARD & LILLIAN (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	16.38
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[16.38]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SCHENDEL, KEITH (DONALD DEC'D) (Buffalo)</u>				
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM TSW TO PJH ENCLOSING LIPSITZ, GREEN'S ANSWERS TO INTERROGATORIES 29 THROUGH 44. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO MESOTHELIOMA DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	PST	REVIEW/ANALYSIS OF DRAFT AMENDED ANSWERS INCLUDING ADDITIONAL DEFENSES FOR USE RE: FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	33.00
	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.00	60.00
10/16/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	1.00	30.00
	CEE	RECEIVED MEDICAL INFORMATION AND UPDATED MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY.	0.20	19.00
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.00	95.00
	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	2.50	75.00
10/18/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	1.60	48.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/19/01	CEE	DISCUSS RETURN OF PATHOLOGY WITH DSM AND MEDICAL DIRECTOR.	0.30	28.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND	1.50	382.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.		
10/22/01	VJW	INDEX AND DATA ENTRY REFERENCE MATERIALS FOR BSC TRIAL DEFENSE USE IN FUTURE.	0.70	21.00
10/31/01	SBJ	REVIEW / ANALYSIS OF TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO NURSING AND EXPERT REPORTS TO UPDATE MEDICAL CASE LIST MEMORANDUM. INTENDED USE TO RECOVER MEDICAL COLLECTION COSTS.	1.30	162.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[13.20	1,030.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SCHENDEL, KEITH (DONALD DEC'D) (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	38.52
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[38.52]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCHIESS, CLIFFORD (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
10/22/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.90	501.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCIME, ALFRED (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM TSW TO WHG ACKNOWLEDGING RECEIPT OF TWO NEW CASES. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
10/22/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.40	459.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SCIME, ALFRED (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
SUBTOTAL:	[0.72]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCIME, ANTHONY C. (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.60	53.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCIME, CARMEN (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.60	53.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCIME, SANTO (Buffalo)</u>		
10/18/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.40	38.00
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.40	38.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCOTT, ROBERT (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SCOTT, ROBERT (New York City)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.36
 SUBTOTAL:	 [0.36]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>SCOTT, WILFRED (San Francisco)</u>		
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	7.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SEALES, WALTER (New York City)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.70 66.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SHANKLE, EUGENE (Jefferson Co., TX)</u>			
10/15/01	SBJ	MEDICAL CORRESPONDENCE REVIEW AND LOG UPDATE.	0.20	25.00
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.70	52.50
10/30/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>2.40</u>	<u>460.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SHANKLE, EUGENE (Jefferson Co., TX)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	6.84
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[6.84]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SIFFORD, E. MAXINE [WD: ALVIN, JR.] (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S RESPONSES TO THORPE INSULATION'S DISCOVERY. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
10/16/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - VERIFY ENCLOSURES - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFFS' RESPONSES TO BRITISH MOTOR CAR DISTRIBUTOR'S REQUESTS FOR PRODUCTION AND SPECIAL INTERROGATORIES. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.50	121.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SKELLY, JAMES V. (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. UPDATE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS CHART. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE/ORGANIZE ORIGINAL OFFICE FILE.	0.50	37.50
10/19/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.20	94.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SKELLY, JAMES V. (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	12.60
 SUBTOTAL:	 [12.60]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SKOLNICK, MILTON & VICKIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
10/16/01	SBJ	REVIEWED / ANALYZED PLAINTIFF'S EXPERT REPORT. REVIEWED PLAINTIFF'S INTERROGATORIES. PERTINENT MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS DOCUMENTED AND REFERENCED FOR DEFENSE USE AT A LATER DATE. FUTURE MEDICAL ACQUISITION PLAN OUTLINED.	1.90	237.50
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.40	276.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SKOLNICK, MILTON & VICKIE (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	78.66
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[78.66]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>SMITH, LOUISE (WD: RICHARD) - (San Francisco)</u>		
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/31/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND IDENTIFY VIA MEDICAL SYNOPSIS RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	3.00	285.00
		SUBTOTAL:	<u>3.10</u>	<u>292.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SMITH, LOUISE (WD: RICHARD) - (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	8.46
 SUBTOTAL:	 [8.46]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SMITH, MARY (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	38.00
10/22/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.00	428.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SMITH, MARY (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	9.00
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[9.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SOLLY, WILLIAM (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.44
SUBTOTAL:	[1.44]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SOMOGYE, JOHN M. (Buffalo)</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SOUZA, RAMONA (WD: RAYMOND VARGAS) (Oakland, CA)</u>			
10/18/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/KAZAN CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.20	90.00
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>1.30</u>	<u>97.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SPRIGGS, CAROL LOU (Indiana)</u>			
10/16/01	KLM ORGANIZE/CLOSE FILE - UPDATE REFERENCE MATERIAL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.		1.70	127.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.70	127.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ST. GERMAIN, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>				
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE MEDICAL RECORDS FROM MJB - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM ST. MARY'S MEDICAL CENTER. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	SBJ	REVIEW OF 2ND SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE TO STANDARD INTERROGATORIES SET II TO IDENTIFY MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES. SALIENT POINTS RECORDED AND REFERENCED FOR LATER DEFENSE USE.	0.30	37.50
10/16/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S DISCOVERY RESPONSES; CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING MEDICAL RECORDS FROM KAISER PERMANENTE-WALNUT CREEK, VOLS. 1-3. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.80	68.00
	KLM	RECEIVE MEDICAL RECORDS AND NEW CASE MATERIALS FROM MJB - VERIFY ENCLOSURES - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
	SBJ	REVIEWED/ ANALYZED RECENT MEDICAL DATA SUBMISSIONS. SEVERAL SALIENT MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES DOCUMENTED AND REFERENCED FOR SUBSEQUENT DEFENSE USE. MEDICAL ACQUISITION PLAN OUTLINED FOR FUTURE REFERENCE.	1.80	225.00
	CEE	RECEIVED MEDICAL INFORMATION AND UPDATED MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY.	0.20	19.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.20	15.00
10/22/01	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS. INITIATE RADIOLOGY AND PATHOLOGY INDEXES AND MEDICAL CHRONOLOGY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.40	228.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[6.60	665.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ST. GERMAIN, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	42.84
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[42.84]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>STEINEBACH, WILLIAM & LOUISE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/29/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.20	90.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.20	90.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>STEINEBACH, WILLIAM & LOUISE (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	10.98
SUBTOTAL:	[10.98]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>STRACK, GEORGE (Buffalo)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.50	47.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	47.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>STROBEL, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
10/31/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND IDENTIFY VIA MEDICAL SYNOPSIS RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.60	247.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[3.10	292.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	STRUENING, MARY [WD: DONALD] (San Francisco)			
10/17/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/24/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SUHANOV, LAURA - [CLOSED] (Buffalo)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL-SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SUHANOV, LAURA - [CLOSED] (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	9.90
SUBTOTAL:	[9.90]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SUTOR, THEONE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/25/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.80	60.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SZYMANSKI, ELSIE J. (Buffalo)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.50	47.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.50 47.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amou</u>
		<u>TAYLOR JR., JOHN (Buffalo)</u>		
10/15/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM TSW REGARDING ORDER GRANTING RENEWAL AND RECONSIDERATION OF MOTIONS; RESERVING DECISION ON GOVERNMENT CONTRACTOR DEFENSE AND MASSACHUSETTS DOCUMENTS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.30	22.
10/22/01	CEE	FORWARD SLIDES BACK TO MEDICAL EXPERT.	0.50	47
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.80	70

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>TAYLOR JR., JOHN (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	75.96
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Michele Carbone, MD, Loyola Univ, Chicago, IL	14.30
	<hr/>
SUBTOTAL:	[90.26]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TAYLOR, BOBBIE LYNN (Texas)</u>			
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.40 30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>TAYLOR, BOBBIE LYNN (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	12.24
 SUBTOTAL:	 [12.24]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TESCH, DAVID R.</u>			
10/18/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/19/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.30	26.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>TESCH, DAVID R.</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	12.42
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[12.42]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>THERIOT, CHARLES & CAROL (Texas)</u>			
10/18/01	GEB	REVIEW/UPDATE CASE SYNOPSIS FOR FUTURE NEGOTIATION AND RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.40	30.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>THERIOT, CHARLES & CAROL (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.26
SUBTOTAL:	[1.26]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>THOMAS, PATSY [WD: CHARLES THOMAS] (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.72
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.72]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>THOMPSON, PENNY [DEC'D - MARY WELTY] (Orange Co., CA)</u>				
10/15/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ADVISING OF REDUCTION IN PLAINTIFF'S DEMAND. DIRECT KLM TO DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO MESOTHELIOMA DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.60	136.00
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REGARDING PROPOSED SETTLEMENT. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.30	22.50
	PST	REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB OF 10-11-01 REGARDING PENNY THOMPSON AND PLAINTIFF'S OFFER TO COMPROMISE PURSUANT TO CCCP SECTION 998 FOR USE RE: FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.10	16.00
10/16/01	SAF	INITIAL REVIEW OF CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB ENCLOSING PLAINTIFF'S AMENDED RESPONSES TO BETHLEHEM'S DISCOVERY REQUESTS. DIRECT KLM TO REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE. WORK ON RESEARCH PROJECT PERTAINING TO DEFENSE ISSUES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	59.50
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE ORIGINAL AND OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB REGARDING BETHLEHEM'S ANSWERS TO SPECIAL INTERROGATORIES AND REQUEST FOR PRODUCTION. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.70	52.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
10/17/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
10/19/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY. DISCUSS RETURN OF PATHOLOGY WITH MEDICAL DIRECTOR AND DSM.	0.60	57.00
10/22/01	CEE	FORWARD PATHOLOGY BACK TO LOCAL COUNSEL AND UPDATE PATHOLOGY CHAIN OF CUSTODY DOCUMENT. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.90	85.50
10/24/01	CEE	TRACK RECEIPT OF MEDICAL MATERIALS TO LOCAL COUNSEL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
10/29/01	CEE	REVISE MEDICAL SUMMARY TO REFLECT RETURNED PATHOLOGY.	0.10	9.50
SUBTOTAL:			[7.50	916.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>THOMPSON, PENNY [DEC'D - MARY WELTY] (Orange Co., CA)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	65.52
10/22/01 - FedEx Charge - to Marte Bassi, Bassi Martini & Blum, San Francisco	32.24
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[97.76]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>THOMPSON, THEOPOLIS (New York)</u>		
10/29/01	CEE REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TORRES (Maryland)</u>		
10/18/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TRIMM, FORREST L. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.90	67.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TROMBLEY, KATHERINE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TULLY, SR., RICHARD (New York City)</u>			
10/29/01	CEE	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE ON FILE AND PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY AS APPROPRIATE FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.10	9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>UBEDA, JOSEPH (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE	ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VAIL, LEONARD (Boston)</u>			
10/17/01	SAF	RECEIVE PLAINTIFF'S DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT. DIRECT GEB TO UPDATE OFFICE FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	8.50
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJM REGARDING VIDEO TRANSCRIPT OF LEONARD VAIL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	1.50	112.50
	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.70	66.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.30	187.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>VAIL, LEONARD (Boston)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	30.06
 SUBTOTAL:	 [30.06]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VARELLAS, PETER (Chicago)</u>			
10/15/01	GEB ORGANIZE/PREPARE NEW FILE. PREPARE TRIAL DOCUMENT LIST. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.		0.80	60.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.80	60.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>VARELLAS, PETER (Chicago)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	4.32
 SUBTOTAL:	 [4.32]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23

Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>VIATOR, SHIRLEY (Texas)</u>		
10/25/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS. PREPARE FOR RETURN SHIPMENT TO LOCAL COUNSEL.	0.40	30.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[0.40	30.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VINAL, EVELYN H. D. (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE ORGANIZE MEDICAL RECORDS FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.		0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VULLO, PHILLIP (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	RECEIVE NEW CASE MATERIAL FROM PHILLIPS LYTLE - DISTRIBUTE. UPDATE OFFICE FILE AND WORKING FILE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.20	15.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	15.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WARD, ETHEL (WD: IRWIN) (San Francisco)</u>			
10/30/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/BRAYTON CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.00	75.00
SUBTOTAL:			[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WATKINS, HUGH AND DONNA (San Francisco)</u>			
10/19/01	KLM	UPDATE JURISDICTIONAL CASE CHART FOR NEGOTIATION & RESOLUTION AT FUTURE DATE.	0.10	7.50
10/23/01	CEE	IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL INFORMATION AND PREPARE MEDICAL SYNOPSIS FOR DSM REVIEW WITH MEDICAL DEFENSE POINTS. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.90	180.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.00	188.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WATLEY, JAMES & OLLIE (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	INCORPORATE SUPPLEMENTAL MEDICAL RECORDS INTO BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILES. PREPARE COPY OF COVER LETTER FOR SBJ FILES AND DSM WORKING FILE. UPDATE MEDICAL RECORDS CHRONOLOGY AND INCORPORATE COPY INTO BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILES. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.30	22.50
10/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC/HANLEY CALIFORNIA CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.20	90.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>1.50</u>	<u>112.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WATLEY, JAMES & OLLIE (San Francisco)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.80
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[1.80]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WEST, CAROLYN (WEBSTER, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
10/15/01	PST	REVIEW LETTER OF 10-12-01 FROM CDO REGARDING DISCOVERY DEADLINES AND MEMO FROM DSM REGARDING EVALUATION OF CASE FOR USE RE: FUTURE RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.10	16.50
	SBJ	UPDATE OF MEDICAL ASSESSMENT MEMORANDUM TO DSM. OUTLINED SALIENT MEDICAL DEFENSE ISSUES.	1.30	162.50
10/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES INTO DSM/BSC TEXAS CASE LIST UPDATE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE IN RESOLUTION PROCESS.	0.90	67.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>2.30</u>	<u>246.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WEST, CAROLYN (WEBSTER, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	9.00
SUBTOTAL:	[9.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WIGGINS, BARBARA (Pittsburgh)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	3.24
SUBTOTAL:	[3.24]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILLIAMS, KENNETH (San Francisco)</u>			
10/15/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>0.50</u>	<u>37.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILLIAMS, PATRICIA (J. FITZGERALD) (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
SUBTOTAL:			[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILMOT, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
10/24/01	CEE	PREPARE BRIEF MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM REVIEW AFTER REVIEW OF RECORDS ON FILE. IDENTIFY SIGNIFICANT MEDICAL RECORDS AND FLAG ACCORDINGLY. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	2.00	190.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>2.00</u>	<u>190.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILSON, RICHARD (San Francisco)</u>			
10/16/01	LEC	CLOSE BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE AND PREPARE FOR ARCHIVE. INCORPORATE PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT MATERIALS INTO PLAINTIFF MEDICAL EXPERT DATABASE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.50	37.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.50	37.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WINTER, WILBUR (Buffalo)</u>			
10/19/01	CEE PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.		0.20	19.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[0.20	19.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WOLFE, GLEN W. (Texas)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	2.16
 SUBTOTAL:	 [2.16]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WOODCOCK, LLOYD (Texas)</u>			
10/23/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, ORGANIZE AND COMPARE TO INVENTORY RADIOLOGY MATERIALS. PREPARE FOR RETURN SHIPMENT TO LOCAL COUNSEL.	2.90	217.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.90	217.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WYNN, THEODORE (Maryland)</u>			
10/18/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.10	9.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.10 9.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>YANCEY, VERNON (Florida)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	1.26
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[1.26]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>YOSHIDA, EDWARD & ROSALIE (Oregon)</u>			
10/17/01	KLM	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DSM TO DISCUSS PREPARATION/NEGOTIATION/RESOLUTION OF CASE AT FUTURE DATE.	0.30	22.50
10/23/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[1.80	405.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>YOSHIDA, EDWARD & ROSALIE (Oregon)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.36
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.36]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ZERKOWSKI, DAVID (Buffalo)</u>			
10/15/01	KLM	PREPARATION/ORGANIZATION OF NEW CASE FILE - DISTRIBUTE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	0.40	30.00
10/19/01	CEE	PREPARE MEDICAL SUMMARY FOR DSM FOR USE IN FUTURE RESOLUTION.	0.20	19.00
SUBTOTAL:			[0.60	49.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

October 15 - October 31, 2001

Invoice # 23
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>ZERKOWSKI, DAVID (Buffalo)</u>	
10/15/01 - Copy Charges - October 15-31, 2001	0.36
SUBTOTAL:	[0.36]

