

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice #00025
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Aaron, Robert (CA)	8.40	846.00	0.36	846.36
Ayala, Raul (FL)	0	0	0.36	0.36
Burke, Avery (TX)	4.40	330.00	0	330.00
Burke, James/Donna (SF)	7.10	957.50	0	957.50
Burke, James P (PA)	1.50	112.50	0	112.50
Case, Raymond (SF)	4.90	570.00	0	570.00
Cassou, Marcel (SF)	3.20	510.00	0	510.00
Castor, James (SF)	1.70	127.50	0	127.50
Chase, Maurice (SF)	1.70	127.50	0	127.50
Cisneros, Orlando (SF)	3.30	247.50	2.34	249.84
Cormier, Pearl (TX)	6.60	885.00	0	885.00
Cruzan, Urdan (SF)	2.00	150.00	5.58	155.58
Delk, Lonza (SF)	0	0	0.18	0.18
Edwards, Dianna (SF)	5.80	705.00	7.56	712.56
Ellison, Flora Mae (TX)	4.70	622.50	0	622.50
Gault, Leroy (SF)	6.30	742.50	81.36	823.86
Gelling, Noreen (NY)	8.80	1,360.00	0	1,360.00
GENERAL	24.10	5,618.50	0	5,618.50
Godsey, Dornel (TX)	10.20	1,720.00	6.30	1,726.30
Harhay, Paul (SF)	6.40	957.00	0.18	957.18
Jagoda, John P (SF)	2.30	172.50	0	172.50
Johnson, Charlotte (MD)	13.10	1,622.50	0	1,622.50
Kennedy, Corinne (SF)	2.80	165.00	2.52	167.52
Kessler, Judith (SF)	5.10	603.00	0	603.00
Lacey, James/Lucy (SF)	7.00	984.00	5.04	989.04
Mambrino, Frank (Buffalo)	8.40	1,234.50	0	1,234.50
Maniscalco, Luciano (SF)	3.50	532.50	0	532.50
McCloud, Fred (SF)	2.00	150.00	6.30	156.30

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice #00025
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
McMahon, Mildred (SF)	0	0	0.18	0.18
Miller, Robert (SF)	5.50	777.50	0	777.50
Nissen, Barbara J (SF)	1.80	135.00	0	135.00
Olson, Albon (SF)	0	0	28.62	28.62
Omran, Naimeh (SF)	0	0	3.96	3.96
Oteri, Gladys (NY)	1.20	90.00	0	90.00
Paasch, Vernon (WA)	8.10	1,047.50	0	1,047.50
Pedrick, Helen (WA)	4.90	637.50	0	637.50
Polk, James K (SF)	5.80	975.00	0	975.00
Pouriea, Robert (OR)	3.30	247.50	0	247.50
Rasmussen, Lowell (SF)	2.20	165.00	16.38	181.38
Russell, Daniel (SF)	1.80	135.00	8.46	143.46
Schendel, Keith (Buffalo)	1.50	112.50	41.37	153.87
Schiess, Clifford (Buffalo)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Scott, Wilfred (SF)	5.10	922.50	0	922.50
Smith, Louise (SF)	2.10	157.50	3.78	161.28
Staker, Shirley (SF)	4.60	615.00	0	615.00
Strobel, Robert (SF)	3.00	495.00	9.18	504.18
Taylor Jr, John (NY)	0.70	59.50	0	59.50
Ubeda, Joseph (SF)	2.00	150.00	0.18	150.18
Vail, Leonard (MA)	1.00	75.00	0	75.00
Vasquez, Max (SF)	1.90	142.50	4.32	146.82
Vinal, Evelyn (SF)	0	0	0.54	0.54
Wallin, Albert (WA)	2.40	180.00	0	180.00
Watkins, Hugh/Donna (SF)	1.50	112.50	0	112.50
West, Carolyn (TX)	3.80	285.00	3.60	288.60
Wilmot, Thomas (SF)	1.80	135.00	3.60	138.60
Witmer, Dale (SF)	0.70	52.50	0	52.50

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice #00025
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE SUMMARY

Case	Hours	Fees	Disb	Fees & Disb
Wright, Allen (SF)	3.70	547.50	0	547.50
Yancey, Vernon (FL)	1.30	97.50	0	97.50
Yoshida, Edward (OR)	2.50	187.50	0	187.50
Young, Charles (SF)	2.50	187.50	0.54	188.04
TOTALS	233.00	\$30,852.50	\$ 242.79	\$31,095.29

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

**Invoice #00025
Bethlehem Steel Corporation**

INVOICE TOTALS

TOTAL FEES	\$30,852.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$242.79
<hr/>	
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$31,095.29

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice #00025
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
DONALD S. MACLACHLAN, ESQ.	70.50	255.00	\$17,977.50
SUSAN A. FILL, Paralegal, Research-Reference-Trial Cases	4.00	85.00	\$340.00
GLORIA E. BELLO, Paralegal, Trial Cases	13.70	75.00	\$1,027.50
KATHLEEN L. MCNAMARA, Paralegal, California & General	49.70	75.00	\$3,727.50
SUSAN BOWERS-JOHNSON, MD, MPH	22.40	125.00	\$2,800.00
LINDA E. CROSBY, RN, BSN, Medical Paralegal	62.20	75.00	\$4,665.00
VICTORIA WALTHER, Data Entry	10.50	30.00	\$315.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>AARON, ROBERT (Oakland, CA)</u>			
12/3/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/17/01	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.20	36.00
	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.60	120.00
12/18/01	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.00	75.00
12/19/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	3.10	232.50
SUBTOTAL:			8.40	846.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>AARON, ROBERT (Oakland, CA)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.36
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.36]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>AYALA, RAUL - CLOSED FILE (Florida)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.36
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.36]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>BURKE, AVERY (Texas)</u>		
12/3/01	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.00	75.00
12/19/01	LEC	PREPARE INVENTORY OF RADIOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL. INCORPORATE INVENTORY INTO MLO RADIOLOGY INVENTORY DATABASE.	3.40	255.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[4.40	330.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>BURKE, JAMES AND DONNA (San Francisco)</u>			
12/3/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/13/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	3.10	387.50
12/14/01	LEC	IDENTIFY, INDEX AND ORGANIZE PATHOLOGY MATERIALS. INCORPORATE INTO BSC PATHOLOGY INVENTORY DATABASE.	2.50	187.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>7.10</u>	<u>957.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>BURKE, JAMES P. (Pennsylvania)</u>		
12/18/01	GEB	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMORANDUM TO PRESERVE BETHLEHEM DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.50	112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CASE, RAYMOND (San Francisco)</u>			
12/4/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/21/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	142.50
	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.50	45.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>4.90</u>	<u>570.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CASSOU, MARCEL (San Francisco)</u>			
12/4/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/10/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.70	127.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>3.20</u>	<u>510.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CASTOR, JAMES (San Francisco)</u>		
12/21/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.70	127.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.70	127.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CHASE, MAURICE (San Francisco)</u>		
12/21/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.70	127.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.70	127.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CISNEROS, ORLANDO (San Francisco)</u>		
12/11/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.60	120.00
12/12/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.70	127.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[3.30	247.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CISNEROS, ORLANDO (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	2.34
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[2.34]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>CORMIER, PEARL C. (ODE L., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
12/11/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.40	300.00
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/14/01	LEC	PREPARE COVER LETTER TO ENCLOSE WITH PATHOLOGY MATERIALS. IDENTIFY, INDEX AND ORGANIZE PATHOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL.	2.70	202.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[6.60	885.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>CRUZAN, URDAN (San Francisco)</u>		
12/27/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[2.00	150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>CRUZAN, URDAN (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	5.58
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[5.58]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>DELK, LONZA E. (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.18
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.18]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>EDWARDS, DIANNA (WD: APLEY, MAURICE) (San Francisco)</u>				
12/12/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/13/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.40	180.00
	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	1.90	142.50
SUBTOTAL:			[5.80	705.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>EDWARDS, DIANNA (WD: APLEY, MAURICE) (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	7.56
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[7.56]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>ELLISON, FLORA MAE (JAMES B., DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
12/12/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/14/01	LEC	PREPARE COVER LETTER TO ENCLOSE WITH PATHOLOGY MATERIALS. IDENTIFY, INDEX AND ORGANIZE PATHOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL.	3.20	240.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>4.70</u>	<u>622.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GAULT, LEROY (San Francisco)</u>			
12/13/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/18/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.10	157.50
	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.70	202.50
SUBTOTAL:			[6.30	742.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GAULT, LEROY (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	81.36
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[81.36]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>GELLING, NOREEN (New York City)</u>			
12/4/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	3.20	400.00
12/13/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/14/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/18/01	LEC	PREPARE INVENTORY OF RADIOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL. INCORPORATE INVENTORY INTO MLO RADIOLOGY INVENTORY DATABASE.	2.60	195.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[8.80	1,360.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GENERAL</u>				
12/3/01	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM MJB TO WHG REGARDING BRAYTON REQUEST FOR WITNESS TO DEPOSE REGARDING BETHLEHEM STEEL SAUCON PLANT - DISTRIBUTE - UPDATE OFFICE FILE.	0.20	17.00
12/4/01	SAF	UPDATE GENERAL MEDICAL-SCIENTIFIC LITERATURE INDEX. PREPARE INDEX TO ASBESTOS AND PLEURA ARTICLES PER DSM REQUEST. FORWARD SELECTED ARTICLES TO DSM.	2.30	195.50
12/7/01	DSM	MEET WITH WALTER MORRISSEY AND DR. DAVID ANDERSON AT BSC MARTIN TOWER REGARDING BETHLEHEM PROJECT.	11.00	2,805.00
12/19/01	DSM	MEET WITH WALTER MORRISSEY AND DR. DAVID ANDERSON AT BSC MARTIN TOWER REGARDING BETHLEHEM PROJECT.	10.00	2,550.00
12/21/01	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM RDC TO DSM REGARDING JUDGE AL WOLIN. REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM DSM TO BRAYTON AND QUINN REGARDING REMOVAL ACTIONS AND ENCLOSING RDC LETTER REGARDING JUDGE WOLIN. UPDATE RDC, BRAYTON AND QUINN FILES. CREATE REMOVAL ACTIONS FILE.	0.30	25.50
12/27/01	SAF	DISCUSS BSC AUDIT LETTER WITH DSM.	0.10	8.50
12/28/01	SAF	DISCUSS BSC AUDIT LETTER WITH DSM. FAX BSC 2000 AUDIT LETTER TO DSM. CREATE 2001 BSC AUDIT LETTER FILE.	0.20	17.00
SUBTOTAL:			[24.10	5,618.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GODSEY, DORNEL (Dallas)</u>				
12/5/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.90	362.50
12/11/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/14/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	LEC	PREPARE COVER LETTER TO ENCLOSE WITH PATHOLOGY MATERIALS. IDENTIFY, INDEX AND ORGANIZE PATHOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL.	2.80	210.00
12/27/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[10.20	1,720.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>GODSEY, DORNEL (Dallas)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	6.30
SUBTOTAL:	[6.30]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>HARHAY, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>			
12/11/01	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.40	42.00
12/12/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/20/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
12/27/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[6.40	957.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>HARHAY, PAUL (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.18
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[0.18]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>JAGODA, JOHN P. (San Francisco)</u>			
12/27/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.30	172.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[2.30 172.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>JOHNSON, CHARLOTTE (Baltimore)</u>				
12/3/01	SAF	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM GSW TO MARYLAND COURT OF SPECIAL APPEALS ENCLOSING BETHLEHEMS SUGGESTION OF BANKRUPTCY AND NOTICE OF AUTOMATIC STAY - DISTRIBUTE - UPDATE BETHLEHEM BANKRUPTCY REFERENCE FILE. DIRECT GEB TO REVIEW AND UPDATE OFFICE FILE.	0.20	17.00
	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM GSW REGARDING SUGGESTION OF BANKRUPTCY FILING.	1.20	90.00
12/4/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/5/01	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.60	48.00
12/14/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/19/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	3.40	425.00
12/20/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM GSW REGARDING APPEAL. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.40	105.00

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/20/01	LEC	PREPARE INVENTORY OF RADIOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL. INCORPORATE INVENTORY INTO MLO RADIOLOGY INVENTORY DATABASE.	2.30	172.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[13.10	1,622.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KENNEDY, CORINNE (San Francisco)</u>			
12/19/01	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.00	30.00
	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.80	165.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>KENNEDY, CORINNE (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	2.52
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[2.52]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>KESSLER, JUDITH (San Francisco)</u>			
12/17/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/28/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.50	187.50
	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.10	33.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[5.10	603.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>LACEY, JAMES & LUCY (San Francisco)</u>			
12/17/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/18/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	1.80	54.00
12/21/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[7.00	984.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>LACEY, JAMES & LUCY (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	5.04
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[5.04]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
<u>MAMBRINO, FRANK & YVONNE (Buffalo)</u>				
12/11/01	VJW	ORGANIZATION OF MEDICAL-ASBESTOS LITERATURE FOR USE AT LATER DATE.	0.90	27.00
12/13/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.40	180.00
	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.10	262.50
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
SUBTOTAL:			[8.40	1,234.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MANISCALCO, LUCIANO (San Francisco)</u>			
12/18/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/21/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>3.50</u>	<u>532.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>McCLOUD, FRED (San Francisco)</u>		
12/18/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[2.00	150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>McCLOUD, FRED (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	6.30
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[6.30]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>McMAHON, MILDRED (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.18
SUBTOTAL:	[0.18]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>MILLER, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>			
12/3/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	237.50
12/18/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/28/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.10	157.50
SUBTOTAL:			[5.50	777.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>NISSEN, BARBARA JOYCE [WD: NELSON] (San Francisco)</u>		
12/28/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.80	135.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>OLSON, ALBON & MARGARET (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	28.62
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[28.62]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>OMRAN, NAIMEH (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	3.96
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[3.96]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>OTERI, GLADYS (NYC)</u>			
12/19/01	GEB	REVIEW FILE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL ARGUMENT FOR USE AT FUTURE DATE.	1.20	90.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.20	90.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PAASCH, VERNON (Washington)</u>			
12/17/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	3.20	240.00
12/18/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/20/01	SBJ	MULTIPLE CANCER ETIOLOGY SCIENTIFIC RESEARCH CONDUCTED TO PROVIDE MEDICAL DEFENSE STRATEGIES FOR DISMISSAL NEGOTIATIONS AND/OR FUTURE DEFENSE.	3.40	425.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>8.10</u>	<u>1,047.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>PEDRICK, HELEN [WD: RAYMOND] (Washington)</u>			
12/20/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	3.40	255.00
	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>4.90</u>	<u>637.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>POLK, JAMES K. (San Francisco)</u>			
12/20/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/27/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/28/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.80	210.00
SUBTOTAL:			<u>5.80</u>	<u>975.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>POURIEA, ROBERT (Oregon)</u>			
12/28/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	3.30	247.50
SUBTOTAL:			[3.30	247.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>RASMUSSEN, LOWELL & BETTY-JEANE (Wartnick)</u>		
12/20/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.20	165.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[2.20	165.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RASMUSSEN, LOWELL & BETTY-JEANE (Wartnick)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	16.38
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[16.38]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>RUSSELL, DANIEL (San Francisco)</u>		
12/10/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.80	135.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.80	135.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>RUSSELL, DANIEL (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	8.46
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[8.46]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>SCHENDEL, KEITH (DONALD DEC'D) (Buffalo)</u>		
12/14/01	GEB	REVIEW CASE SYNOPSIS AND MEDICAL INFORMATION FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CAUSE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.50	112.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.50	112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SCHENDEL, KEITH (DONALD DEC'D) (Buffalo)</u>	
12/28/01 - FedEx Charge - to Dr. Michele Carbone, Oak Park, IL - Return of medical notebook.	41.37
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[41.37]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>SCHIESS, CLIFFORD (Buffalo)</u>		
12/12/01	GEB	REVIEW CASE SYNOPSIS AND MEDICAL INFORMATION FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL CAUSE. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.00	75.00
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>SCOTT, WILFRED (San Francisco)</u>			
12/11/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/20/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.10	157.50
SUBTOTAL:			<u>5.10</u>	<u>922.50</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>SMITH, LOUISE (WD: RICHARD) - (San Francisco)</u>		
12/13/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.10	157.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[2.10	157.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>SMITH, LOUISE (WD: RICHARD) - (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	3.78
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[3.78]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>STAKER, SHIRLEY [WD: GERALD] (San Francisco)</u>			
12/21/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	3.10	232.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[4.60	615.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>STROBEL, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>		
12/13/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
12/21/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[3.00	495.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>STROBEL, ROBERT (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	9.18
SUBTOTAL:	[9.18]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>TAYLOR JR., JOHN (Buffalo)</u>		
12/14/01	SAF PRESERVE MEDICAL ASBESTOS LITERATURE.	0.70	59.50
	SUBTOTAL:	[0.70	59.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

		<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>UBEDA, JOSEPH (San Francisco)</u>		
12/28/01	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.00	150.00
	SUBTOTAL:	[2.00	150.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>UBEDA, JOSEPH (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.18
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>0.18</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>VAIL, LEONARD (Boston)</u>			
12/12/01	GEB	REVIEW FILE FOR POSSIBLE DISMISSAL ARGUMENT FOR USE AT FUTURE DATE.	1.00	75.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.00	75.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>VASQUEZ, MAX (San Francisco)</u>		
12/11/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.90	142.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[1.90	142.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>VASQUEZ, MAX (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	4.32
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[4.32]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>VINAL, EVELYN H. D. (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.54
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.54]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WALLIN, ALBERT (Washington)</u>			
12/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.40	180.00
	SUBTOTAL:		<u>2.40</u>	<u>180.00</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WATKINS, HUGH AND DONNA (San Francisco)</u>			
12/19/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	1.50	112.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[1.50 112.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WEST, CAROLYN (WEBSTER, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>			
12/14/01	LEC	PREPARE COVER LETTER TO ENCLOSE WITH PATHOLOGY MATERIALS. IDENTIFY, INDEX AND ORGANIZE PATHOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL.	1.60	120.00
12/19/01	LEC	PREPARE INVENTORY OF RADIOLOGY MATERIALS FOR RETURN TO LOCAL COUNSEL. INCORPORATE INVENTORY INTO MLO RADIOLOGY INVENTORY DATABASE.	2.20	165.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[3.80	285.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WEST, CAROLYN (WEBSTER, DEC'D) (Texas)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	3.60
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[3.60]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WILMOT, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>			
12/20/01	KLM PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.		1.80	135.00
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.80	135.00]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>WILMOT, THOMAS (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	3.60
 SUBTOTAL:	 <u>[3.60]</u>

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WITMER, DALE (San Francisco)</u>			
12/27/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	0.70	52.50
	SUBTOTAL:			[0.70 52.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>WRIGHT, ALLEN (San Francisco)</u>			
12/3/01	DSM	DIRECT COMMENCEMENT OF ACTIVITIES INTENDED TO DOCUMENT CURRENT STATUS OF BSC NATIONAL CASES; PRESERVE ABILITY TO EVALUATE AND DEFEND BSC NATIONAL CASES AND DETERMINE CANDIDATES FOR FUTURE RESOLUTION.	1.50	382.50
12/28/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.20	165.00
SUBTOTAL:			[3.70	547.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>YANCEY, VERNON (Florida)</u>			
12/19/01	GEB	ORGANIZE/UPDATE OFFICE FILE. REVIEW/DISTRIBUTE CORRESPONDENCE FROM RPM REGARDING US STEEL MEMORANDUM OF LAW. PRESERVE FOR FUTURE USE.	1.30	97.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[1.30	97.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
	<u>YOSHIDA, EDWARD & ROSALIE (Oregon)</u>			
12/31/01	LEC	REVIEW BSC MEDICAL TRIAL ROOM FILE INCLUDING MEDICAL MEMOS AND ORGANIZE TO PRESERVE RESOLUTION POTENTIAL AND MAINTAIN AFFIRMATIVE OUTCOME CAPABILITY. INCORPORATE MEDICAL INFORMATION AND MEDICAL/LEGAL DEFENSE ISSUES MEMO INTO DSM/BSC CASE LIST UPDATE.	2.50	187.50
	SUBTOTAL:		[2.50	187.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

			<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
		<u>YOUNG, CHARLES & SHIRLEY (San Francisco)</u>		
12/27/01	KLM	PREPARE CASE STATUS MEMO FOR PRESERVATION OF FUTURE DEFENSE.	2.50	187.50
		SUBTOTAL:	[2.50	187.50]

MACLACHLAN LAW OFFICES LLC

December 1 - December 31, 2001

Invoice # 25
Bethlehem Steel Corporation

CASE DISBURSEMENTS

	<u>Amount</u>
<u>YOUNG, CHARLES & SHIRLEY (San Francisco)</u>	
12/1/01 - Copy Charges - December 1-31, 2001	0.54
SUBTOTAL:	<u>[0.54]</u>