

EXHIBIT D

Time Records for Current Fee Period

**SUMMARY OF HOURS INCURRED BY
COMPASS ADVISERS, LLP PROFESSIONALS
FOR THE PERIOD FEBRUARY 4, 2005 THROUGH JUNE 6, 2006**

Name of Professional Person	Position (Years with Compass)	Total Hours
Harvey L. Tepner	Partner (Three years)	163.7
Michael J. Conway	Senior Advisor (One year)	16.8
Stuart I. Oran	Senior Advisor (One year)	46.5
Bruce A. Kaufman	Principal (Three years)	173.6
Eileen T. Wiseman	Principal (Three years)	8.6
Michael Fine	Associate (Three years)	86.6
David Imbert	Financial Analyst (Less than one year)	189.5
Total Hours for Billing Period		685.3

Note that, except as indicated below, professionals of Compass Advisers, LLP are not licensed to practice law, although several hold various licenses from the National Association of Securities Dealers.

Phillip Siegel was licensed to practice law in the State of New York but has been inactive for a number of years and did not provide services to the Debtors with respect to this transaction.

Stuart I. Oran was licensed to practice law in the State of New York and the District of Columbia but has been inactive for a number of years.

Allan M. Chapin, a Partner of Compass Advisers, LLP, is licensed to practice law in New York State but did not provide services to the Debtors.

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Harvey L. Tepner – Partner		
4-Feb-05	0.4	t/calls with MJC re options for Chicago Express
4-Feb-05	1.7	discuss content of descriptive information memo for Chicago Express with BAK and SIO; discuss same with BAK and Grende of Huron; review list of prospective contacts with SIO, MF and DI
4-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with Scarince re Chicago Express
4-Feb-05	1.4	t/call with BAK to Frick re Chicago Express engagement; review and edit press release and discuss changes with BAK and SIO; emails to/from and discussion with Butler of ATA re draft press release and review of same
5-Feb-05	0.8	t/call with Scarince of Chicago Express regarding sale process
5-Feb-05	1.2	review data on Chicago Express provided by Huron; forward same to BAK, MJC, SIO and MF; series of emails with SIO re same
6-Feb-05	1.7	work on draft of Compass engagement letter, and t/call discussion of teaser with SIO
7-Feb-05	2.5	series of t/calls re Chicago Express; discuss work program with BAK and MF; review preliminary material provided by Huron; review emails re Chapter 11 M&A from Scarince; work on form of confidentiality agreement and forward to ATA counsel
8-Feb-05	9.0	review due diligence information on Chicago Express; edit teaser; edit CDM; series of t/calls with SIO and BAK to Chicago Express management and ATA mgmt re Chicago Express; series of t/calls and emails with prospective purchasers; review email from Carr re FAA; discuss target list with SIO, DI and BAK
8-Feb-05	0.4	review ATA motion to employ Compass re Chicago Express
9-Feb-05	3.5	travel to Chicago with BAK, SIO, MF for meetings with Chicago Express and ATA
9-Feb-05	2.5	meeting with MJC, SIO, BAK, MF and Chicago Express management to review business of Chicago Express incl. tour of Midway Airport facility
9-Feb-05	4.5	series of t/calls and emails with prospective buyers regarding Chicago Express; work on changes to CDM and overview
9-Feb-05	0.7	review motion authorizing employment of Compass re Chicago Express and series of emails with Akin Gump re same; discuss deficiency notice with ETW
10-Feb-05	2.0	work on revising teaser and CDM for Chicago Express
10-Feb-05	3.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective buyers regarding Chicago Express; emails and discussion with DI re distribution
11-Feb-05	2.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective buyers regarding Chicago Express; emails and discussion with DI re distribution; discuss press reports with Butler of ATA
13-Feb-05	2.0	t/calls with MF and BAK re Chicago Express; discuss same with Beckerman; review NatTel objection to Compass retention; prepare affidavit regarding Compass retention
13-Feb-05	0.5	review emails and attachments regarding Chicago Express business plan
14-Feb-05	1.0	finish preparation of Compass affidavit and follow-up on notarized copy
14-Feb-05	2.5	series of t/calls and emails with prospective buyers regarding Chicago Express; allocation of portion of Bankruptcy Court hearing on Compass retention; review CDM and review status with BAK, MF and DI
15-Feb-05	3.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective buyers regarding Chicago Express; review and final edit of CDM including multiple discussions with MF
16-Feb-05	3.0	work on finalizing CDM for Chicago Express; series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors incl. discussions emails with MF and DI
17-Feb-05	3.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors; review summary of contacts with MF and DI

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Feb-05	4.5	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors incl. discussions with BAK, MF, DI
18-Feb-05	0.6	discuss status of the case with ETW
18-Feb-05	0.8	review new business plan prepared by staff of Chicago Express and discuss with MJC
19-Feb-05	0.6	review various emails from DI re status of due diligence materials and communications with prospective bidders; review various press reports re Chicago Express
20-Feb-05	0.3	review various emails re Chicago Express
22-Feb-05	3.3	t/call with Butler re press interest; emails with Grende re data room and circulation; series of discussions and emails with prospective bidders re due diligence and meetings with management; t/calls re same with Denison and Scarince; discuss status with MF, BAK, Imbert and SIO
23-Feb-05	4.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors and Chicago Express management, incl. discussions with MF and DI; review ATA analysis regarding Chicago Express profitability
24-Feb-05	4.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors incl. discussions with other Compass professionals and Chicago Express management; review email from Carr and t/call with Carr re status of process
25-Feb-05	2.5	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors and Chicago Express management, incl. discussions with BAK, MF and DI
27-Feb-05	0.4	t/call with MF re Chicago Express and review and respond to emails re same
28-Feb-05	0.3	series of emails and t/calls with Akin Gump re telephonic Bankruptcy Court hearing on Chicago Express
28-Feb-05	1.7	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors and Chicago Express management, incl. discussions with DI
1-Mar-05	1.5	series of discussion with Grende and emails and t/calls with bidders; series of emails and t/calls with DI re same
2-Mar-05	2.2	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors incl. discussions with SIO and DI; t/call with Lazard re same
3-Mar-05	1.4	series of t/calls and emails with prospective acquirors and Chicago Express management, incl. discussions with BAK, MF, DI
4-Mar-05	2.7	review emails re call with ATA re update on Chicago Express; t/call with Carr and MF re status of same and potential testimony; t/call with Viets, Frick, SIO, BAK, DI and MF re status; review related emails and faxes re same and prepare for upcoming Bankruptcy Court hearing; series of discussions re same with DI and MF
4-Mar-05	0.3	review consent order for appointment of examiner
7-Mar-05	1.7	review various proposals received including discussions with MF, BAK and DI; review related emails
7-Mar-05	1.5	attendance with MF at Bankruptcy Court re Chicago Express Examiner motion and testimony by HLT on status of sale process
7-Mar-05	2.5	meeting with MF at Baker & Daniels regarding examiner for Chicago Express and status of sale process re Chicago Express
8-Mar-05	2.2	continue to review various proposals received with BAK, DI and MF; series of t/calls with prospective bidders regarding indications of interest received with BAK; discuss status of bidders with BAK and MF and ATA management; review order retaining Compass
9-Mar-05	1.1	conf call with BAK, MJC, MF, DI to ATA and Baker & Daniels re status of Chicago Express bids

Date	TIME Hours	Description
9-Mar-05	3.3	review bids with BAK, MF and DI; series of t/calls with ATA and Navigant re same; t/calls with BAK to various bidders re bids; review amendments to confi agreements and discuss with DI; review with MF summary of bids to date; review BAK email re revised bid summary
10-Mar-05	2.4	review bids with BAK; series of t/calls with and review emails from various bidders re bids; discuss status of bids with Lazard and DI and SIO
10-Mar-05	1.0	conf call with BAK, MJC, ATA and Baker & Daniels re status of Chicago Express bids
10-Mar-05	0.4	review motion to appoint Examiner for Chicago Express and discuss with BAK
11-Mar-05	1.0	Bankruptcy Court status conference regarding Chicago Express with BAK incl. prepare for conf call with BAK
11-Mar-05	2.6	review status of bids with BAK, MF and DI; series of t/calls with various bidders re bids; review latest requests with DI
12-Mar-05	0.8	t/calls with prospective bidders re Chicago Express
13-Mar-05	0.7	review memo from Robinson to Examiner re Chicago Express; review effect of pending bids on Chicago Express creditors; review and respond to emails from prospective bidders
14-Mar-05	3.3	series of t/calls and emails with various bidders re bids incl. multiple discussions with BAK, SIO, DI and MF; t/calls with Hall of Baker & Daniels and Beckerman re draft ATA motion re sale; review memo from Carr to Examiner; discuss same with Beckerman and BAK and MF
15-Mar-05	2.0	review Robinson memo to Examiner re Chicago Express and Carr memo re same; t/calls with Hall of Baker & Daniels and Beckerman re draft ATA motion re sale; discuss same with Beckerman and BAK; review and respond to related emails from Akin Gump re same
15-Mar-05	1.2	series of t/calls and emails with various bidders re bids incl. multiple discussions with BAK, DI and MF; negotiate changes to confis; discuss rotables and review related emails with SIO
16-Mar-05	1.0	series of t/calls and emails with various bidders re bids incl. discussions with BAK, DI and MF
16-Mar-05	1.0	series of t/calls and review emails with Baker & Daniels, Akin Gump, Huron and discussions with Compass professionals re Examiner, sale and bidding procedures, and assertions regarding bids from a prospective bidder
17-Mar-05	1.0	series of t/calls and emails with various bidders re bids incl. discussions with SIO, BAK, DI and MF; prepare draft letter regarding auction
17-Mar-05	1.3	series of t/calls and discussions and review and respond to emails with Baker & Daniels, Akin Gump, Huron and discussions with Compass professionals re Examiner, and sale and bidding procedures and employee retention; review amended draft motion re same
17-Mar-05	1.5	review draft of examiner's report on Chicago Express; discuss with BAK
18-Mar-05	1.0	discussion with BAK re access to CDM for prospective purchasers; review voice mail from Denison re same; series of t/calls with prospective bidders re due diligence information and process; discuss status of bids with DI
19-Mar-05	0.7	review, prepare and respond to emails re to DI and BAK re sale of Chicago Express; discuss Examiner's report with MJC and BAK
20-Mar-05	0.2	review, prepare and respond to emails re to DI and BAK re sale of Chicago Express
20-Mar-05	0.4	review Akin Gump memo re agreement with the Aircraft Mechanics
20-Mar-05	1.0	review final examiner's report for Chicago Express; review final motion regarding KERP for Chicago Express key personnel
21-Mar-05	1.5	review, prepare and respond to series of emails regarding sale of Chicago Express with BAK, DI, MF and Baker & Daniels; review Akin Gump email re same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
22-Mar-05	1.4	series of t/calls with BAK and MF re Chicago Express; series of t/calls with prospective bidders; review emails relating to Chicago Express
23-Mar-05	2.3	t/call with Scarince; conf call with BAK to ATA, Baker & Daniels, Lazard and Akin Gump re status of bids; t/calls with various bidders re status; series of discussions re same with BAK
24-Mar-05	1.0	series of discussions with BAK, DI and MF to review status of Chicago Express bids and due diligence; review related emails
25-Mar-05	3.0	series of discussions with BAK and DI re bids for Chicago Express; review bids; conf call with ATA, Lazard, Botter, etc. re status of bids; series of t/calls with prospective bidders
26-Mar-05	0.2	review and respond to emails re bids for Chicago Express
27-Mar-05	1.5	series of t/calls with BAK re status of Chicago Express bids; conf call with BAK and ATA re logistical issues regarding bids; review and respond to various emails re same
28-Mar-05	4.0	Chicago Express calls; discussion with BAK; all party conf call with BAK and MJC re same; series of t/calls with bidders re auction and qualifications for same; review and discuss press release drafts with BAK and Butler of ATA
29-Mar-05	2.0	Chicago Express calls; discussion with BAK; series of t/calls with bidders re auction and qualifications for same
30-Mar-05	4.0	travel to Indianapolis from New York for Chicago Express auction and meetings at ATA
30-Mar-05	1.0	series of discussions with BAK re Chicago Express auction; review latest bids received
31-Mar-05	10.5	prepare for and attend Chicago Express auction with BAK and DI; participate in negotiations with bidders and coordinate with Botter, ATSB and ATA; discuss press release with Butler and Frick of ATA and review memo to Committee; review various emails regarding Chicago Express
3-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails regarding Chicago Express including comments on commitment letter
4-Apr-05	0.6	discuss status of Chicago Express with BAK; review various emails re Chicago Express and commitment letter
5-Apr-05	0.3	review draft press release for Chicago Express and email comments to ATA mgmt and Baker & Daniels
13-Apr-05	0.4	review email memo on Chicago Express closing status from BAK; review various emails re Chicago Express and discuss with BAK
14-Apr-05	0.4	review and respond to various emails re Chicago Express closing status
15-Apr-05	0.8	review various emails re Chicago Express closing status and discuss same with BAK and Beckerman
20-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re Chicago Express closing status and discuss same with BAK and Beckerman
25-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re Chicago Express closing status and discuss same with BAK and Beckerman
29-Apr-05	0.2	review various emails re Chicago Express closing status and discuss same with BAK and Beckerman
2-May-05	0.1	review Claffey email re Chicago Express
3-May-05	0.2	review various emails re status of Chicago Express sale process
5-May-05	0.2	review various emails re status of Chicago Express sale process
6-May-05	0.4	discuss Chicago Express with Beckerman and BAK
9-May-05	0.3	review various emails re status of Chicago Express sale process
11-May-05	0.3	review various emails re status of Chicago Express sale process
12-May-05	0.4	review various emails re status of Chicago Express sale process
13-May-05	0.4	series of emails t/from BAK re status of Chicago Express sale process
16-May-05	0.4	series of emails t/from BAK re status of Chicago Express sale process

Date	TIME Hours	Description
19-May-05	0.2	emails with DI re Chicago Express
24-May-05	0.2	review emails re progress in sale
26-May-05	0.2	review emails re sale of Chicago Express
6-Jun-05	0.3	review emails re sale of Chicago Express and discuss with BAK
7-Jun-05	0.1	review emails re sale of Chicago Express
13-Jun-05	0.4	review emails from Claffey re sale of Chicago Express
16-Jun-05	0.2	review emails from Claffey re sale of Chicago Express
20-Jun-05	0.1	review email re sale of Chicago Express
27-Jun-05	0.2	review various emails re sale of Chicago Express and discuss with BAK
21-Jul-05	0.6	review various emails re SAAB settlement motions and discuss same with BAK; t/call with Ortega and BAK re same
27-Jul-05	0.4	review Akin Gump email re SAAB settlement and discuss with BAK
4-Aug-05	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re Chicago Express and bidder claims
5-Aug-05	0.4	review and respond to series of emails re Chicago Express and bidder claims, discuss status of closing with ETW
12-Aug-05	0.1	discuss status of closing with ETW
30-Aug-05	0.6	discuss status of Chicago Express with BAK; review related motions for sale of assets re same; review related emails
31-Aug-05	0.4	review various emails re of Chicago Express assets and SAABs
SubTotal	163.7	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Michael J. Conway – Senior Advisor		
4-Feb-05	0.4	t/calls with HLT re options for Chicago Express
9-Feb-05	7.5	travel and meetings in Chicago with HLT, BAK, SIO, MF and Chicago Express management re sale and alternatives
11-Feb-05	1.3	review of draft business plan
18-Feb-05	0.3	discuss business plan with HLT
23-Feb-05	1.5	review of Chicago Express forecasts
23-Feb-05	0.4	discussion with Erik Christian, VP Planning of Sky West Airlines re acquisition of Chicago Express
9-Mar-05	1.2	conference call with HLT, BAK, MF, DI, ATA and counsel on pending disposition of Chicago Express and related FAA operating certificate implications
10-Mar-05	1.9	conference call with HLT, BAK, ATA and counsel on pending disposition of Chicago Express
19-Mar-05	1.2	review of Examiner's report, including discussions with HLT and BAK
24-Mar-05	0.5	discussion with Erik Christian, VP Planning of Sky West Airlines re acquisition of Chicago Express; responded to several inquiries re maintaining FAA Operating Certificate
28-Mar-05	0.6	Committee conference call with HLT and BAK re bid status
SubTotal	16.8	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Stuart I. Oran – Senior Advisor		
4-Feb-05	3.0	review ATA reports for data on Chicago Express; discussion with HLT re same, discuss prospective acquirors' list with HLT, DI, MF
5-Feb-05	2.3	review Chicago Express offering materials
6-Feb-05	3.2	continuing review and drafting of Chicago Express offering materials and teaser; t/calls with HLT re same
7-Feb-05	2.1	review press release, teaser and form of confidentiality agreement
7-Feb-05	0.2	call with Chicago Express CFO
7-Feb-05	2.0	review lists of potential purchasers; review draft of teaser and confidentiality agreement
8-Feb-05	0.4	review revised form of confidentiality agreement
8-Feb-05	0.4	meetings with HLT, BAK and DI to review need and prep of potential acquirors list
8-Feb-05	3.0	review draft of offering memo
8-Feb-05	0.6	t/call with HLT and BAK to CEO and CFO
8-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT to Huron re status of docs
8-Feb-05	1.5	review of and prep of lists of potential purchasers
9-Feb-05	9.0	travel to and meetings in Chicago at Chicago Express with HLT, MJC, BAK, MF and management
9-Feb-05	0.3	discussion with potential acquiror re Chicago Express service to Springfield; draft e-mail re same
10-Feb-05	0.8	review HLT's draft of teaser
10-Feb-05	0.2	review revised draft of teaser
10-Feb-05	0.2	review final edits from Ken Scarince
11-Feb-05	0.8	review management's preliminary plan
11-Feb-05	0.3	review process checklist with NDA results
12-Feb-05	0.2	review article re bid for Chicago Express
15-Feb-05	0.2	review summary contact info
16-Feb-05	0.2	review latest version of process checklist
17-Feb-05	0.9	review Chicago Express presentation to ATA
17-Feb-05	0.1	review daily codeshare bookings
17-Feb-05	0.1	review changes to process checklist
18-Feb-05	1.1	review final of Chicago Express memorandum
19-Feb-05	0.1	review article re bidder for Chicago Express
19-Feb-05	0.1	review latest changes to checklist
21-Feb-05	0.1	review additions to checklist
22-Feb-05	0.9	review current draft of memo and Ken Scarince comments re same
22-Feb-05	0.6	review additional comments to memo
22-Feb-05	0.1	review latest process checklist
23-Feb-05	0.6	review two new lists of potential interested parties
23-Feb-05	1.9	review ATA analysis of benefits/costs of Chicago Express and e-mail Sean Frick re same
23-Feb-05	0.1	review Ken Scarince e-mail re Chicago Express feed and value thereof
23-Feb-05	0.1	review update of process checklist
24-Feb-05	0.1	review latest changes to checklist
25-Feb-05	0.1	follow up with potential bidders
25-Feb-05	0.4	calls to potential acquirors re interest in Chicago Express
25-Feb-05	0.1	review latest process checklist
25-Feb-05	0.1	review report to Committee on Chicago Express
27-Feb-05	0.1	review new progress report to Creditors
28-Feb-05	0.2	discussion with MF re calls to four or five potential bidders
28-Feb-05	0.4	several t/calls with potential acquiror re interest in Chicago Express

Date	TIME Hours	Description
2-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with HLT and potential acquiror re interest in Chicago Express
2-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with potential acquiror re interest in Chicago Express
3-Mar-05	0.4	draft proposed offer letter for potential acquiror
3-Mar-05	2.5	meeting with BAK, MF and potential acquiror re: interest in Chicago Express deal
4-Mar-05	0.5	draft proposed offer letter for potential acquiror
4-Mar-05	0.7	conf call with HLT, BAK, DI, MF, Viets and Frick regarding status
10-Mar-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re status of auction
14-Mar-05	0.3	review e-mails re SAAB parts and discuss with MF and HLT
14-Mar-05	0.2	review new bid sheet provided by DI
15-Mar-05	0.1	review motion for Chicago Express sale
15-Mar-05	0.1	review emails re SAAB parts and forward to HLT
15-Mar-05	0.1	review changes to summary contact list
15-Mar-05	0.3	discuss rotatables and related emails with HLT
17-Mar-05	0.1	review NatTel objection
17-Mar-05	0.4	attention to SAAB parts; info for examiner, including discussions with HLT, BAK and MF
17-Mar-05	0.3	review report of examiner
21-Mar-05	0.1	review Chicago Express update
22-Mar-05	0.2	review final NatTel offer
27-Mar-05	0.1	attn to auction status report
8-Jun-05	0.2	review Beckerman update re Chicago Express
SubTotal	46.5	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Bruce A. Kaufman – Principal		
4-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT to S. Frick of ATA concerning Chicago Express
4-Feb-05	0.7	discuss content of descriptive information memo for Chicago Express with HLT, SIO and D. Grende of Huron
6-Feb-05	2.5	review information related to Chicago Express
6-Feb-05	0.5	t/calls with Huron regarding status of presentation materials for Chicago Express
7-Feb-05	3.3	discuss work program with HLT, review information received from Huron regarding Chicago Express, revise draft fee agreement
8-Feb-05	0.5	t/calls with prospective acquirors of Chicago express
8-Feb-05	1.0	conversation with SIO, DI and HLT and t/call with HLT and SIO regarding Chicago Express w/CEO
8-Feb-05	0.5	t/calls and discussions with HLT, SIO and Huron regarding Chicago Express sale process
9-Feb-05	3.5	travel to Chicago with HLT, SIO, MF for meetings with Chicago Express and ATA
9-Feb-05	6.0	meetings with HLT, MJC, SIO, MF and Chicago Express management to discuss status of Chicago Express and sale process
11-Feb-05	0.3	review Chicago Express teaser
13-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re Chicago Express
14-Feb-05	0.4	review CDM and status with HLT
17-Feb-05	0.3	review news stories concerning Chicago Express sale process
18-Feb-05	0.5	t/calls with prospective acquirors of Chicago Express and discussions with HLT re: same
22-Feb-05	0.2	t/calls and emails with Lazard regarding Chicago Express sale
25-Feb-05	0.2	discussion with HLT and MF regarding bid for Chicago Express
2-Mar-05	0.3	t/calls with MF to prospective acquiror of Chicago Express
3-Mar-05	1.0	t/calls with prospective acquirors of Chicago Express and discussions with HLT re: same
3-Mar-05	2.5	meeting with SIO, MF and prospective acquiror of Chicago Express
4-Mar-05	1.3	t/call with HLT, MF, SIO, DI to G. Viets to update him on the progress of Chicago Express sale, series of conversations during the day with MF concerning same
7-Mar-05	0.6	discuss various proposals with HLT, MF and DI
8-Mar-05	1.6	review status of Chicago Express bidders with HLT, MF, DI and discuss various proposals, t/calls to bidders with HLT
9-Mar-05	2.0	work on draft bid summary, including discussions with DI
9-Mar-05	1.1	t/call with HLT, MJC, MF, DI to G. Viets, S. Frick, D. Grende regarding status of Chicago Express Bid process
9-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with HLT to potential acquirors regarding their bid proposals
10-Mar-05	4.3	t/call with potential acquirors to discuss their bid proposals, discussions with HLT regarding bids and bidders and appointment of Examiner, t/call with Grende of Huron regarding ATSB collateral, A/C leases and other questions, t/call with HLT, MJC, Debtors, Huron and others to update them on the status of the auction process
11-Mar-05	1.5	t/calls with potential acquirors of Chicago Express and discuss with HLT, MF, DI
11-Mar-05	1.0	prep for and t/call with HLT to Bankruptcy Court regarding updating them on the sale process
14-Mar-05	1.7	t/calls with potential acquiror of Chicago Express, including discussions with HLT, MF and DI and discussions with HLT regarding draft motion for sale
15-Mar-05	0.9	t/calls with potential acquirors of Chicago Express, update Debtor and ATSB regarding process, and discuss with HLT
16-Mar-05	0.7	t/calls with potential acquirors of Chicago Express and discuss with HLT, MF, DI

Date	TIME Hours	Description
17-Mar-05	3.1	discussions with SIO, MF and DI regarding sale process and bidding procedures, review bidding procedures, meeting with HLT regarding sale process, series of t/calls with L. Beckerman of Akin, S. Frick of ATA, Lazard, D. Grende of Huron regarding progress of auction process and KERP program, review draft examiners motion and discuss with HLT
18-Mar-05	3.0	series of t/calls with potential acquirors, follow-up on information inquiries, prepare summary of bids for discussion; discuss with HLT
19-Mar-05	0.4	discuss Examiner's report with HLT and MJC
21-Mar-05	4.0	series of t/calls with potential acquirors, t/calls with ATA, Baker & Daniels, ATSB and Committee regarding status of auction process, follow-up on information inquiries, prepare summary of bids for discussion
22-Mar-05	8.0	series of t/calls with potential acquirors, follow-up on information inquiries, prepare summary of bids for discussion; discuss with HLT
23-Mar-05	6.5	series of t/calls with MF and DI to potential acquirors, t/calls with HLT to ATA, Baker & Daniels, ATSB and Committee regarding status of auction process, follow-up on information inquiries
24-Mar-05	8.5	series of t/calls with potential acquirors, t/calls with City of Chicago, T. Hall and J. Carr of Baker Daniels regarding sale process, discuss with HLT and DI
25-Mar-05	9.5	series of t/calls with potential acquirors, ATA, Chicago Express, City of Chicago and other regarding the sale of the Company, discuss with HLT, prepare bid summary with DI
27-Mar-05	5.0	conference call with HLT and ATA to discuss issues pertaining to the viability of Chicago Midway, update bid status report organize travel plans for next week, and discuss with HLT
28-Mar-05	7.0	series of t/calls with prospective bidders for Chicago Express, Committee conference call with HLT, MJC re sale process leadership regarding status of bids, follow-up on correspondence and inquiries for bidders, draft potential press release, coordinate process for auction with Baker & Daniels
29-Mar-05	8.6	series of t/calls to prospective bidders for Chicago Express and follow-up on due diligence inquiries for Chicago Express and discussion with HLT
30-Mar-05	5.5	travel from home to ATA with DI
30-Mar-05	2.5	t/calls with DI to potential acquirors of Chicago Express, follow-up discussions with ATA, Huron and Baker & Daniels and HLT
31-Mar-05	0.2	travel from hotel to auction
31-Mar-05	10.0	attend and supervise Chicago Express auction process with HLT and DI, various discussions with bidders, ATSB, Committee, ATA and Huron
1-Apr-05	0.5	t/calls regarding auction process with winning bidder, Baker & Daniels lawyers and other professionals
1-Apr-05	5.0	travel from ATA to home
1-Apr-05	2.0	t/calls with City of Chicago, winning bidder, D. Grende of Huron, J. Carr of Baker & Daniels regarding auction process
3-Apr-05	2.0	coordinate meetings regarding Chicago Express auction hearing, organize and review files from sale process
4-Apr-05	5.5	travel from home to Baker & Daniels
4-Apr-05	2.0	meetings to prepare for court hearing
4-Apr-05	0.2	travel from Baker & Daniels to Court
4-Apr-05	4.5	attend court hearing regarding Chicago Express sale and discuss with HLT
4-Apr-05	0.3	travel from Court to hotel
13-Apr-05	2.4	series of t/calls and review emails concerning Chicago Express closing including emails concerning the APA, review draft APA, and discuss status with HLT
14-Apr-05	1.5	series of t/calls regarding status of Chicago Express closing with Okun Enterprises and Sabre related issues

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Apr-05	3.5	series of t/calls to back-up bidders and primary bidder to understand issues related to the withdrawal of the Okun Enterprises bid and to determine level of interest of back-up bidders, including conference call with regards to key issues, series of t/calls with S. Frick of ATA and S. Claffey of Baker regarding bidders; discuss status with HLT
18-Apr-05	0.5	discussions with S. Claffey of Baker et al. regarding back-up bidders to Chicago express
19-Apr-05	0.7	discussions regarding back-up bidders to Chicago Express, coordinate discussions with City of Chicago regarding sale
20-Apr-05	1.3	series of t/calls regarding back-up bidders to Chicago Express and discuss with HLT
21-Apr-05	0.5	series of t/call with regards to back-up bidders for Chicago Express
25-Apr-05	0.3	convey contact information regarding reporter inquiry concerning Chicago Express, respond to inquiry from S. Frick of ATA concerning AAFCOR proposal, and discuss with HLT
29-Apr-05	0.2	discuss closing status with HLT
3-May-05	0.9	t/calls and discussions with potential acquirors of Chicago Express, review email correspondence regarding status of discussions with the parties.
3-May-05	0.2	review email reports on the status of Chicago Express sale process
4-May-05	0.4	t/call with S. Claffey of Baker and D. Hirsch of AAFCOR regarding continued interest in ATA
5-May-05	0.4	report to Rick Stearns of Lazard regarding Chicago Express, follow-up on inquires
6-May-05	0.3	respond to inquiry from City of Chicago concerning Chicago Express sale process, and discuss status with HLT
9-May-05	1.2	review email regarding status of Chicago Express sale process, follow-up t/calls with AAFCOR and other interested parties, draft email to debtor
10-May-05	0.2	review email regarding status of Chicago Express sale process
12-May-05	0.5	t/calls to AAFCOR and other prospective Chicago Express acquirors, follow-up with S. Frick of ATA
13-May-05	0.3	review status of Chicago Express sale emails with HLT
16-May-05	0.2	exchange emails with HLT re status of Chicago Express sale
24-May-05	0.4	review information and requests concerning sale of Chicago Express assets
26-May-05	1.2	review emails regarding Chicago Express sale process, including brief review of draft agreements
27-May-05	0.5	review emails concerning status of Chicago Express sale process
31-May-05	0.3	review emails and revised drafts of documents concerning Chicago Express sale
6-Jun-05	2.5	review revised Chicago Express asset purchase agreement
6-Jun-05	0.5	draft and review emails re sale of Chicago Express and discuss with HLT
13-Jun-05	0.4	review updates and emails regarding Chicago Express APA
20-Jun-05	0.3	review updates on Chicago Express sale
24-Jun-05	0.8	t/call with and follow-up on information with E. Haley of CSC concerning information regarding SAABs
27-Jun-05	0.2	review various emails regarding sale of Chicago Express and discuss with HLT
29-Jun-05	0.5	t/call with City of Chicago regarding Chicago Express sale
21-Jul-05	0.3	review various emails regarding SAAB settlement motions and discuss same with HLT, t/call with Ortega of Akin
27-Jul-05	0.4	review Akin Gump email re SAAB settlement and discuss with HLT
16-Aug-05	0.5	t/call with David Bochenek and D. Grande of Huron regarding status of Chicago Express sale
25-Aug-05	0.5	follow up t/calls regarding the sale of ATA's SAAB aircraft
25-Aug-05	0.7	review motions concerning pending Chicago Express transaction
29-Aug-05	0.5	review Colgan financial capability, t/call with Bochenek, review email from S. Frick, t/calls with prospective acquirors

Date	TIME Hours	Description
30-Aug-05	0.5	view summary of Chicago Express motions, follow-up emails with S. Frick and discuss with HLT
31-Aug-05	1.5	emails and calls with various potential acquirors of ATA SAABs
SubTotal	173.6	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Eileen T. Wiseman – Principal		
9-Feb-05	0.1	discuss Notice of Deficiency with HLT
15-Feb-05	0.6	review docket
18-Feb-05	1.6	discuss status of case with HLT and work on monthly information
8-Mar-05	0.7	work on monthly information
10-Mar-05	0.4	t/calls with Baker & Daniels regarding retention order dates
5-Apr-05	0.4	work on monthly information
7-Apr-05	0.4	work on monthly information
19-Apr-05	0.7	work on monthly information
25-May-05	0.3	work on monthly information
6-Jun-05	0.3	work on monthly information
3-Jun-05	0.4	work on monthly information
5-Jul-05	0.2	work on monthly information
22-Jul-05	0.4	work on monthly information
5-Aug-05	0.4	discuss closing information with HLT and write email to Frick regarding same
5-Aug-05	0.2	work on monthly information
12-Aug-05	0.3	t/calls with Frick re closing information and t/call with HLT to discuss same
31-Aug-05	0.2	work on monthly information
2-Sep-05	0.4	work on monthly information
21-Sep-05	0.2	work on monthly information
17-Oct-05	0.2	work on monthly information
7-Nov-05	0.2	work on monthly information
SubTotal	8.6	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Michael Fine – Associate		
4-Feb-05	0.4	discuss list of prospective acquirors with HLT, SIO and DI
7-Feb-05	0.3	discuss work program with HLT and BAK
8-Feb-05	5.0	review and redraft confidential information memorandum
9-Feb-05	4.0	travel to Chicago with HLT, BAK, SIO for Chicago Express Management presentation
9-Feb-05	4.7	meetings in Chicago with HLT, BAK, MJC, SIO and management
10-Feb-05	3.0	mediate Chicago Express Management presentation
10-Feb-05	1.0	review and edit teaser
11-Feb-05	6.0	multiple discussions with DI re: Chicago Express sale process and related documents
13-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re: Chicago Express sale
14-Feb-05	7.0	multiple discussions with DI and HLT re: Chicago Express sale process and related documents
15-Feb-05	0.6	multiple discussions with HLT regarding CDM
16-Feb-05	2.0	review confidential info memorandum with HLT
17-Feb-05	5.0	multiple t/calls with prospective Chicago Express acquirors, including follow-up with HLT, DI, Huron and BMC Group Professionals
18-Feb-05	3.0	multiple t/calls with prospective Chicago Express acquirors, including follow-up with HLT, DI, Huron and BMC Group Professionals
22-Feb-05	1.0	discuss Chicago Express sale process with Lazard
22-Feb-05	5.0	distribute and discuss future distribution of teaser and CA information with DI
22-Feb-05	3.0	prepare electronic data room for sale process with Huron and BMC Group
23-Feb-05	2.0	multiple t/calls with prospective Chicago Express acquirors, including follow-up with HLT, DI, Huron and BMC Group Professionals
23-Feb-05	1.0	t/call with Huron professionals re Chicago Express sale process and upcoming due diligence sessions
24-Feb-05	3.0	read and edit Chicago Express Management presentation, including follow-up call with Huron to discuss
25-Feb-05	3.0	multiple t/calls with prospective Chicago Express acquirors, including follow-up with HLT, BAK, DI, Huron and BMC Group Professionals
27-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re: Chicago Express sale
28-Feb-05	2.0	review electronic data room for Chicago Express
28-Feb-05	0.2	discussion with SIO re prospective acquirors
1-Mar-05	5.0	multiple t/calls with prospective Chicago Express acquirors, including follow-up with DI, Huron and BMC Group Professionals
2-Mar-05	1.0	review current assets of Chicago Express prepare for distribution to prospective acquirors, including discussions with DI and BAK
3-Mar-05	1.5	t/call with HLT, DI and prospective acquiror
3-Mar-05	2.5	meeting with SIO, BAK and potential acquiror
4-Mar-05	0.3	t/call with HLT to Carr re bankruptcy court hearing
4-Mar-05	1.2	t/call with HLT, SIO, BAK, DI to update ATA professionals re Chicago Express, and follow-up discussions with HLT and BAK
7-Mar-05	0.6	discuss various proposals with HLT, BAK, DI
7-Mar-05	1.5	Bankruptcy Court with HLT re Chicago Express Examiner motion and testimony by HLT on status of sale process
7-Mar-05	2.5	meeting with HLT at Baker & Daniels regarding examiner for Chicago Express and status of sale process re Chicago Express
8-Mar-05	0.7	discuss various proposals with HLT, BAK, DI and review status of the bidders
9-Mar-05	1.7	conf call with HLT, MJC, BAK, DI and Baker and Daniels re bid status; review bids with HLT, discuss confi with DI
10-Mar-05	0.4	discuss bidder with DI

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Mar-05	0.6	discuss status of bids with HLT, BAK and DI
14-Mar-05	1.1	discuss status of bids with HLT, BAK and DI and SAABs with HLT and SIO
15-Mar-05	0.4	discuss status of bids with HLT, BAK and DI
16-Mar-05	0.6	discuss bid status with HLT, BAK and DI
17-Mar-05	0.7	discuss status of bids with HLT, SIO BAK and DI
18-Mar-05	0.4	discuss bids and CDMs with DI
22-Mar-05	0.2	t/calls with HLT re Chicago Express sale
23-Mar-05	0.7	t/calls with BAK and DI to prospective bidders
24-Mar-05	0.4	series of discussions with HLT regarding status of bids
SubTotal	86.6	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
David Imbert – Financial Analyst		
4-Feb-05	0.4	discuss list of potential acquirors with HLT, SIO and MF
7-Feb-05	3.0	compiled list of potential acquirors
8-Feb-05	7.0	refined acquiror list and built contact list, including discussions with HLT and BAK
9-Feb-05	4.0	prepared for mailing to potential acquirors
10-Feb-05	9.0	envelope stuffing and mailing of sale memo, including emails and discussions with HLT
11-Feb-05	2.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts, including discussions with HLT and MF
14-Feb-05	4.0	built contact summary checklist, including discussions with MF
15-Feb-05	2.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts
16-Feb-05	5.0	built new potential acquirors contact list and mailed, including discussions with HLT
17-Feb-05	2.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts, including discussions with HLT and MF
18-Feb-05	4.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts, including discussions with HLT and MF
22-Feb-05	3.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts, including discussions with MF
23-Feb-05	3.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts, including discussions with HLT and MF
24-Feb-05	6.0	built new potential acquirors contact list
25-Feb-05	9.0	envelope stuffing and mailing of sale memo, including emails and discussions with HLT and MF
28-Feb-05	4.0	maintenance of potential acquirors contacts, including discussions with HLT
1-Mar-05	3.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with MF and HLT
2-Mar-05	2.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF
3-Mar-05	3.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF
4-Mar-05	4.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF, and conf call with HLT, SIO, BAK, MF, Viets and Frick
7-Mar-05	9.0	processed letters of intent incl emails to and discussions with HLT, BAK, and MF
8-Mar-05	2.0	waiting for, forwarding and discussing letters of intent to HLT, BAK, and MF
9-Mar-05	3.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT, BAK and MF, and conf call with HLT, MJC, BAK, MF and Baker & Daniels
10-Mar-05	5.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF
11-Mar-05	3.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT, BAK and MF
14-Mar-05	4.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT, BAK and MF
15-Mar-05	2.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF
16-Mar-05	2.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF
17-Mar-05	4.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT, BAK, MF

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Mar-05	6.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and MF
21-Mar-05	6.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs
22-Mar-05	4.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs
23-Mar-05	5.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs; t/calls with BAK and MF to prospective bidders
24-Mar-05	7.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs, including discussions with HLT and BAK
25-Mar-05	7.0	processed bids and composed bid summary with BAK, including discussions with HLT
28-Mar-05	4.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs
29-Mar-05	5.0	updated prospective acquiror contact list for confidentiality agreements and CDMs
30-Mar-05	10.0	travel to Indianapolis with BAK; phone conversations with bidders and BAK
31-Mar-05	11.0	Chicago Express auction at Baker and Daniels in Indianapolis with HLT and BAK
1-Apr-05	4.0	meeting with John Denison and Sean Frick at ATA
1-Apr-05	5.0	travel from Indianapolis to home
3-Apr-05	0.5	dropped off confidentiality agreements at BAK's house
4-Apr-05	0.3	t/calls and emails with former bidder regarding conclusion of auction, beginning operating analysis
19-May-05	0.3	exchange emails with HLT regarding status of sale
28-Jun-05	1.0	faxed Ed Halley pages from the CDM and a copy of his signed NDA
SubTotal	189.5	