

EXHIBIT D (cont'd.)

Time Records for Current Fee Period

Date	TIME Hours	Description
25-Mar-05	0.3	review Q Aviation LOI
25-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
26-Mar-05	0.2	review hangar agreement
26-Mar-05	0.2	e-mails re fleet acquisition status
28-Mar-05	0.3	t/call with Barnett, MJC, Denison; attn to fleet status
28-Mar-05	0.2	review revised Q aviation term sheet
28-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
28-Mar-05	0.4	t/calls with HLT and MJC re ATA's fleet acquisition efforts
28-Mar-05	0.7	Committee conf call with HLT, MJC and BAK regarding bids for Chicago Express
29-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
29-Mar-05	0.2	discuss fleet with HLT
30-Mar-05	1.2	numerous conversations with Denison, Barnett, MJC and HLT re lease status; attn to same
30-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
30-Mar-05	1.5	review ATA 10-K
30-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
1-Apr-05	0.4	review Feb 2005 Operating Report
1-Apr-05	0.3	discussions with Denison and Sean Frick re presentation for potential lessors
1-Apr-05	0.2	review e-mails re Boeing assistance with 767s and possibility of Pegasus lease
1-Apr-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
4-Apr-05	0.1	review Barnett info on lease opportunities
4-Apr-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
4-Apr-05	0.3	e-mails with Beckerman re fleet status and discuss with HLT
5-Apr-05	2.2	t/calls with Denison, Barton, AAR, re finding 767s.
5-Apr-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
6-Apr-05	2.1	t/calls with HLT, BAK, Denison, Storch (AAR), Barton (Oakhill), Cebula (Oaktree) re 767s for ATA and corporate finance issues
6-Apr-05	0.2	discuss status of the fleet with HLT
6-Apr-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
7-Apr-05	0.2	review memo to Committee re cash issues
7-Apr-05	0.7	t/call with HLT, BAK, MJC to review status of leases and cash crunch; t/calls to Barton, Taylor re 767s; disc Cebula re same
7-Apr-05	1.2	review cash flow forecasts; t/call with Jack Schultz re same; disc BAK and HLT re same
7-Apr-05	0.2	review Pegasus term sheet for 767
8-Apr-05	0.2	discuss fleet issues and availability with MJC and HLT
8-Apr-05	1.8	conf call with Denison, MJC, HLT, BAK, Huron and ATA Mgmt re POR timetable and follow-up discussion
11-Apr-05	1.1	t/calls Rowan re lease; review Pegasus lease terms and Q aviation lease terms; e-mail Beckerman re review of Q aviation lease; discuss with MJC re same
12-Apr-05	0.2	discuss business plan and cash flow with HLT
12-Apr-05	0.8	t/call Barton re ATA background and terms of proposed lease with AAR venture
12-Apr-05	0.5	t/call Denison re potential A/C lease with AAR; AAR background
12-Apr-05	1.3	Committee and Debtor leadership call with BAK, HLT, MJC and Beckerman re fleet and financing options
13-Apr-05	0.3	discuss work program with HLT
14-Apr-05	0.1	discuss business plan with HLT
15-Apr-05	0.4	discuss status of ATA's cash and fleet and upcoming business plan and establishing plan to review same with HLT, MJC and BAK
18-Apr-05	10.0	travel to Indy with HLT and BAK to meet with ATA; meeting of professionals incl HLT, BAK, MJC and company; prep of list of cash and capital issues for company

Date	TIME Hours	Description
19-Apr-05	11.0	morning meeting with HLT, BAK, MJC, Denison and Frick re ways to save cash and capital; call with Committee re results of profess meeting and aircraft issues;
20-Apr-05	2.1	disc with Viets re aircraft; travel to NY; disc with Schulte re SWA issues several e-mails with Denison re progress on 767s; several calls with Barnett and Viets re same; t/call with Beckerman re same; t/call with M Mandel re same; t/call with Bristol re same
20-Apr-05	3.5	t/call with MJC re 767s and t/call to Pegasus; t/call to Oakhill re same; preparation of long e-mail re solutions to bankruptcy issues for 767 leases, discuss business plan with HLT
20-Apr-05	0.5	discuss changes to lease fleet with HLT and MJC; discuss cash savings potential ideas with HLT
20-Apr-05	1.8	meeting at Compass with Schulte to review strategic options, business plan and cash needs with BAK and HLT and MJC by phone
21-Apr-05	0.1	e-mail to Denison re 767 negotiations
21-Apr-05	3.0	revise and add to list of potential sources of capital for ATA; send out memo for review
21-Apr-05	1.0	long t/call Denison
22-Apr-05	2.1	t/calls Denison; attention to 767 lease issue; disc HLT re list of capital opportunities; revisions to same; attention to memo for Southwest meeting and potential ways to help ATA
25-Apr-05	1.7	t/call with HLT, BAK, MJC, Denison, Frick and others to review company progress on list of capital raising areas
25-Apr-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re Southwest meeting
25-Apr-05	0.4	discussion with Schulte re meeting with Southwest and results of Company call on progress
25-Apr-05	1.3	drafting of ATA liquidity memo for Southwest meeting
25-Apr-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
25-Apr-05	1.0	continue working on ATA liquidity memo for Southwest meeting
25-Apr-05	0.2	t/call Sean Frick re leasing of 767s and retention of Skyworks
25-Apr-05	0.1	e-mail to Denison re 767 negotiations
26-Apr-05	0.1	t/call M Mandel re status of Bristol aircraft
26-Apr-05	0.1	additional t/call to Rick Barnett
26-Apr-05	0.7	discussions with HLT and Denison re the fleet and other outstanding matters
26-Apr-05	0.7	conf call with Committee co-chair, HLT, MJC and BAK re next steps for business plan review and capital requirements
26-Apr-05	1.8	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, BAK; report on business plan, latest financial results and fleet
27-Apr-05	0.4	exchange t/calls with Tom Maher and Dave Treitel re 767 leasing
27-Apr-05	1.0	t/call S Frick re Skyworks engagement; review Skyworks engagement letter and t/call Sean re comments, including discussion with HLT
27-Apr-05	0.3	t/call G August re potential CFO candidate; t/call J Denison re same
27-Apr-05	0.4	t/call D Treitel re engagement of SH&E
27-Apr-05	0.4	discussion with HLT re his series of t/calls with Committee members and creditors re financing needs of ATA
28-Apr-05	0.2	t/call Mark Schulte re status and aircraft leases
28-Apr-05	0.3	continue working on ATA liquidity memo for Southwest meeting
28-Apr-05	0.6	t/call Paul Barton re availability of 767s and proposed terms
28-Apr-05	0.1	t/call Vince Cebula re Pegasus willingness to be lessor
28-Apr-05	0.5	conf call with Beckerman and MJC re 737 term sheet from Q
28-Apr-05	0.3	t/call with MJC to S Weiss at Pegasus and Pete Seidlitz at Bristol
28-Apr-05	3.0	numerous t/calls with Denison, Frick, Seidlitz, Weiss, Cebula re acquisition of 767 aircraft and financing thereof; call with Tom Maher re same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Apr-05	3.0	numerous t/calls with Denison, Beckerman, Mandel, Scott Weiss at Pegasus potential acquisition of 767 from
29-Apr-05	3.5	numerous calls with Denison, Frick, Seidlitz, Weiss, Cebula re acquisition of 767 aircraft and financing thereof; call with Tom Maher re same
29-Apr-05	0.7	Creditors Committee Conf Call with BAK, HLT and MJC re report on fleet status and recent proposed settlements of certain claims
2-May-05	0.3	t/calls to Frick re leases
2-May-05	0.2	review MJC pilot productivity material
2-May-05	0.1	e-mail Frick re United 767
2-May-05	0.3	t/calls with Joe Adams at Fortress re availability of United 767
2-May-05	0.5	t/call with Paul Barton re status of AAR 767s and requirements for leasing
2-May-05	0.1	discussion with BAK re cash flows
2-May-05	0.5	begin review of AmbasadAir sale book
2-May-05	0.2	review monthly cash flow data
3-May-05	0.2	review cash flow report
3-May-05	0.2	review executed AAR LOI
3-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
3-May-05	0.1	t/call with S. Frick re need for 757s
3-May-05	0.3	t/call with T. Maher re download on 767s and negotiations with potential lessors
3-May-05	0.2	t/call with Denison re need for updated projections for lessors
3-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
3-May-05	0.4	conf call with Company and Skyworks to bring them up to date
4-May-05	1.5	conf call with HLT, DI, BAK and MJC to review cash projections
4-May-05	1.8	continued work on memo re proposed financing opportunities from SouthWest and existing holders
5-May-05	2.1	continue working on ATA liquidity memo for SouthWest meeting
5-May-05	0.4	t/call to R. Barnett re status of lease negotiations
5-May-05	0.4	t/call with Denison re status of cost cutting, maintenance issues, aircraft leases
5-May-05	0.3	discussion with HLT re SouthWest memo and structure of a rights offering
5-May-05	0.2	t/call with Sean Frick re projections for lessors
6-May-05	0.2	t/call with Barnett re lease issues
6-May-05	0.2	t/call with Denison re status of cost cutting, maintenance issues, aircraft leases
6-May-05	0.2	discuss fleet status with HLT
6-May-05	0.1	update from HLT re his t/calls with Beckerman and Wright of SouthWest re strategic issues and meeting to explore financing alternatives
6-May-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re interviews for AmbasadAir
7-May-05	0.2	t/call with Sean Frick re status of 767sw and discussion with Skyworks
9-May-05	0.2	t/call with Barnett re lease issues
9-May-05	0.2	e-mails with Beckerman and MJC re lease issues
9-May-05	0.1	e-mails with Pegasus re 757s
9-May-05	0.2	t/call with MJC re changes to lease template for Bankruptcy Court
9-May-05	0.4	t/call with HLT to Beckerman re lease template and t/call to Lazard with HLT re same
10-May-05	0.5	t/call to Tom Maher re lease negotiations
10-May-05	3.2	review Debtors' revised forecast; discussion with BAK re same; t/call with Stan Hula re fleet plan; t/call with Sean Frick re suggested changes to same; t/call with L. Beckerman re same
10-May-05	0.6	t/call with Denison re CFO and fleet changes with HLT and BAK
10-May-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re Committee meeting and recent developments with HLT and BAK
11-May-05	1.2	Committee conf call with BAK, HLT, MJC and DI to discuss new CFO and SVP, exclusivity, sale of AmbasadAir, etc.
11-May-05	1.0	attention to revised business plan and fleet plan, including discussion with HLT

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-May-05	0.4	t/call with Denison re fleet plan, CFO search and business plan, including discussion with HLT
11-May-05	1.5	t/call with various Treasury personnel at Northwest re availability of 747s; CFO availability; t/call with Denison re same; e-mails with Clauss re CFO; t/calls to B.Hahn; voice mail for T.Maher re 747s
11-May-05	0.1	review 1110 notices
11-May-05	1.2	review document that reflects differences between April plan and update
11-May-05	0.1	review e-mail re pilot productivity
11-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
11-May-05	0.8	begin to accumulate ideas for new CFO candidate; e-mails Roy Clauss re same; t/call with Clauss re same
11-May-05	0.6	t/call with Beckerman with HLT re agenda for Committee call and issues to review
12-May-05	0.6	continue focus on analysis of business plan sensitivities, including discussion with HLT
12-May-05	0.1	attention to availability of various 767s
12-May-05	1.2	attention to March Blue Book analysis
12-Mar-05	0.5	review segment profitability
12-May-05	0.2	continued attention to replacement CFO candidates, including discussion with HLT
12-May-05	0.2	series of t/calls from HLT re SouthWest meeting
13-May-05	0.6	review ATA 10Q
13-May-05	0.2	attention to retention of MJC as Interim CFO
13-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
13-May-05	0.3	t/calls with HLT re maintenance program and CFO
16-May-05	0.3	review update on 767 availability
16-May-05	0.1	review resume of potential candidate
16-May-05	0.4	review form of Q Aviation lease
16-May-05	0.2	review report on pending matters, including discussion with HLT
16-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
16-May-05	0.3	review memo on cost-saving ideas
16-May-05	0.2	review update on 767 availability
16-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re fleet and capital raising/cost saving opportunities
16-May-05	0.6	conf call with HLT and Denison re fleet, CFO and exclusivity
16-May-05	1.5	conf call with Beckerman, HLT, DI, Carr and Denison and Frick re CFO and exclusivity and exec. mgmt
17-May-05	0.2	e-mails re ATA cost saving and capital saving items
17-May-05	1.5	Committee conf call with HLT, MJC, DI to review CFO candidate and discuss exclusivity extension
17-May-05	0.3	review and comment on letter re committee objection to extension of exclusivity period
17-May-05	0.6	review and comment on letter of intent for 767s
17-May-05	0.6	series of t/calls from HLT re milestones
17-May-05	0.1	review Fedor e-mail re term sheets
17-May-05	0.1	e-mail and discussion Frick re AAR 767 opportunity
18-May-05	0.2	review e-mail re milestones for CFO
18-May-05	3.4	conf call with SouthWest, HLT and MJC re ATA business plan and capital requirements of ATA, including follow up discussion with MJC and HLT re SouthWest and labor issues
18-May-05	0.2	e-mail and call with Royan Taylor re ATA 767s
18-May-05	0.2	review materials re possible substitution of Airways 737s
18-May-05	0.6	review pilot productivity data
18-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-May-05	0.2	review weekly memo update re 767 status
18-May-05	0.4	review memo on 1113 issues
18-May-05	0.3	review Dick Myer affidavit
19-May-05	1.7	multiple discussions with MJC, HLT, BAK, DI, Akin Gump and ATA re Debtor's 1113 motions and pilot productivity
19-May-05	0.3	review Frick declaration
20-May-05	1.4	Creditor Committee conf call with MJC, HLT, DI regarding 1113 motion and report on SouthWest discussions
20-May-05	0.6	review comments on ALPA interim relief
20-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
20-May-05	0.2	review letter re ALPA interim relief motion
20-May-05	0.2	e-mail and t/call Paul Barton re proposal for 767s
20-May-05	0.1	e-mail Rowan Taylor re 767
20-May-05	0.5	t/call with Committee co-chair re fleet status with HLT; discuss financing options for fleet with HLT
20-May-05	0.3	discuss rights offering and financing concepts with HLT
22-May-05	0.1	e-mails with John Williams re 747-200s
23-May-05	0.1	e-mails J Williams re 747-200s
23-May-05	0.1	review side letter re exclusivity
23-May-05	0.2	review pilot productivity data
23-May-05	0.1	review Paul Barton e-mail re avail of 767s from AAR
23-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
23-May-05	1.0	conference call with HLT, MJC, ATA and their counsel re leases, labor and other matters
23-May-05	0.2	review Skyworks 767 update memo
23-May-05	0.1	discussion with BAK, HLT and F. Conway re preparation for meeting in ATA with management
23-May-05	0.3	t/call with Schulte and HLT re meeting with ATA, SouthWest and ATSB
23-May-05	1.0	t/call with Denison and HLT re fleet and upcoming meeting with SouthWest and ATSB
24-May-05	0.3	attention to material on sale of Chicago Express
24-May-05	0.2	attention to comments on cost benefit of 1113 motion
24-May-05	0.2	e-mails re co fleet plans
24-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
24-May-05	3.0	travel to Washington with HLT for meeting at Akin Gump with ATA, ATSB and SouthWest
24-May-05	0.5	t/calls with HLT, MJC and BAK re rights offering and strategic alternatives
25-May-05	3.0	meeting in Washington with HLT, Beckerman, ATA, ATSB and SouthWest re cash requirements of ATA; including travel to/from meeting
25-May-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
26-May-05	0.4	review first draft of rights offering
26-May-05	0.4	review ALPA long term relief proposal
26-May-05	0.2	review memo re update on pilot agreement
26-May-05	0.6	review cash flow analysis
26-May-05	0.1	t/call Denison re Dave Davis
26-May-05	0.1	review memo re IAA proposal
26-May-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
26-May-05	0.2	review Boeing claims issue memo
26-May-05	0.1	review memo on pending claims matters
27-May-05	1.0	Committee conference call with BAK, MJC, HLT, DI to review results of 1113 motion and meeting with ATSB, ATA and SouthWest
27-May-05	0.3	prepare for conf call on savings and capital improvements, including discussion with HLT

Date	TIME Hours	Description
27-May-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
31-May-05	0.3	review current draft of rights offering
31-May-05	2.0	conf call with Frick, HLT, BAK and MJC re cost savings and capital
31-May-05	1.2	follow-up discussions with HLT, MJC, BAK regarding cost saving initiatives
31-May-05	0.3	discussion with HLT re his t/call with F. Conway of ATA re business plan
31-May-05	0.5	review profit reconciliation
1-Jun-05	0.1	review comments on DIP term sheet
1-Jun-05	0.2	review Boeing stipulations
1-Jun-05	0.3	review final draft of rights offering
1-Jun-05	0.4	review 1110 filings
1-Jun-05	0.4	review 767 term sheet from Q aviation
1-Jun-05	0.6	review docs re Boeing 757s dispute
1-Jun-05	0.3	discuss with HLT and BAK re business plan, discuss with BAK regarding flight schedule and profitability
1-Jun-05	1.0	call with investment banker re financing
2-Jun-05	1.1	review market profitability materials and discuss with Subodh Karnik
2-Jun-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
2-Jun-05	0.4	review CIT lease
2-Jun-05	0.6	review cash flow analysis
2-Jun-05	0.3	discuss route profitability with HLT
3-Jun-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
3-Jun-05	0.2	review update on IAA dispute
3-Jun-05	1.0	call with ATSB and other professionals
3-Jun-05	1.7	conf call with BAK, HLT, Beckerman, ATA, ATSB and Southwest re status report from ATA on corporate finance, fleet and other key issues
3-Jun-05	0.3	discussion with HLT and MJC re HLT's t/calls with Denison and Frick re cash burn, business plan and CFO milestone
3-Jun-05	0.5	t/calls with HLT and Committee member re new business plan and maintenance issues; discussion with HLT the latest summary of aircraft procurement
6-Jun-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re retention of investment banker
6-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
6-Jun-05	0.2	review summary of pending matters
6-Jun-05	0.2	review and comment on evening draft of milestones
6-Jun-05	0.8	discussion with HLT re CFO milestones; attention to same
6-Jun-05	0.3	discuss BETACO with BAK and HLT
7-Jun-05	0.1	review Beckerman e-mail re milestones
7-Jun-05	0.1	review Cottone e-mail re milestones
7-Jun-05	0.2	review F.Conway comments on milestones
7-Jun-05	0.2	review correspondence re IAA issues
7-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
7-Jun-05	0.3	multiple discussions re fees with Committee co-chairs, Beckerman, HLT and MJC
8-Jun-05	1.0	review Denison "preamble" and evaluate in light of current schedule and opportunities
8-Jun-05	1.2	prep for trip to Indy
8-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
8-Jun-05	0.3	review Skyworks update on aircraft
8-Jun-05	0.3	review cash flow analysis
8-Jun-05	0.6	prepare and circulate response to Denison preamble
8-Jun-05	0.3	discuss retention of Banker by Debtor including proposed fees with BAK, HLT and Beckerman
8-Jun-05	0.3	discuss milestones for F. Conway with HLT
9-Jun-05	0.2	review MJC thoughts re preamble
9-Jun-05	0.4	review Navigant proposed Exhibit A

Date	TIME Hours	Description
9-Jun-05	11.0	trip to Indy; meeting at company re labor issues; dinner with senior team, HLT and MJC to discuss business plan and proposed different direction
10-Jun-05	0.3	review 767 passenger layouts
10-Jun-05	0.3	review ATSB reporting package
10-Jun-05	3.0	return trip to New York; review business plan and schedule on account
11-Jun-05	0.4	analyze current price data and send e-mail to Denison re same
12-Jun-05	0.1	review Denison e-mail re current price data
12-Jun-05	0.2	discuss with HLT re investment banker retention documents
13-Jun-05	0.1	review e-mail from Karnik re scheduling changes
13-Jun-05	0.2	review Beckerman comments on investment banker engagement letter
13-Jun-05	0.2	review press reports re ATA aircraft, including discussion with HLT re fleet
13-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
13-Jun-05	0.4	exchange of e-mails with Denison re availability of financing from financial sponsors
13-Jun-05	0.8	review investment banker engagement letter and draft of language re same including discussions with HLT
14-Jun-05	0.2	discuss pricing of Denison options with HLT and BAK
14-Jun-05	0.2	discuss investment banker fee structure with HLT
14-Jun-05	0.4	t/call with Kevin Knight re avail of UA 767s; e-mail to Denison and others re same
14-Jun-05	0.1	discussion with ETW re fee application
15-Jun-05	0.6	begin preparation of interim fee application
15-Jun-05	0.1	review Akin e-mail re AMR claims
15-Jun-05	0.2	e-mail and discussion with BAK re evaluation of AMR claims and methods to evaluate
15-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
15-Jun-05	0.6	continuing review of AMR claims issue
15-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re April 2005 report status
16-Jun-05	0.1	review e-mail re IAA settlement
16-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with David Immelt re major changes since filing date
16-Jun-05	0.2	review letter from Baker & Daniels re changes in management; review Beckerman e-mail re update
16-Jun-05	0.2	review and attention to summary of pending matters
17-Jun-05	1.1	attention to prep of fee application
17-Jun-05	0.2	review ATA Boeing stip
17-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
17-Jun-05	0.3	review 1110 filings
17-Jun-05	0.6	review data re ALPA long-term contract
20-Jun-05	2.0	continue work on first interim fee application
20-Jun-05	0.9	conf call with HLT, MJC, BAK, DI, Frank Conway and Sean Frick re progress on business plan revisions, fleet and cost savings
21-Jun-05	0.3	t/calls Beckerman and HLT and BAK re Mercer arrangements; discuss with HLT re yesterday's call with F. Conway re business plan
21-Jun-05	0.3	attention to retention of investment banker and Skyworks
21-Jun-05	0.9	t/call to S. Karnik re plans for changes to schedule
21-Jun-05	0.2	attention to e-mails re Mercer retention
22-Jun-05	0.4	review Mercer engagement letter
22-Jun-05	0.4	review 1110 filings
22-Jun-05	0.4	review ATSB reporting package
22-Jun-05	0.6	prep for Committee Call
22-Jun-05	1.1	Committee call with HLT, MJC, BAK, DI re business plan
23-Jun-05	1.1	conf call with Frank Conway, Baker and Daniels, Beckerman re Mercer agreement

Date	TIME Hours	Description
23-Jun-05	0.3	review various e-mails re Mercer agreement, 767 leases, blanket approval template
23-Jun-05	0.9	conference call with MJC, ATA and counsel and Akin Gump re Mercer engagement letter for maintenance review
24-Jun-05	0.4	attention to terms of 767 blanket approval
24-Jun-05	0.4	attention to ATSB reporting package
27-Jun-05	0.1	t/call MJC re 767 blanket terms
27-Jun-05	0.2	review ATA docket re rejection of 757
27-Jun-05	0.2	attention to ATSB reporting package
27-Jun-05	0.3	conf call with Frank Conway and HLT re scheduling and business plan
27-Jun-05	0.3	review blanket terms for 767s; t/call M.Mandel re same
27-Jun-05	0.3	attention to AMFA motion
27-Jun-05	0.4	attention to Mercer retention
27-Jun-05	0.6	attention to ATA-Mercer agreement
27-Jun-05	0.4	t/call M.Mandel re 767 terms; review proposed term sheet re same
27-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with HLT and BAK re HLT's t/call with Beckerman re status of various projects and comments re discussions with noteholders
28-Jun-05	0.2	attention to Indiana Finance Authority issue
28-Jun-05	0.2	update on Goodrich claim
28-Jun-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
28-Jun-05	1.8	attention to call agenda; conference call with HLT, BAK, MJC, F. Conway, Frick and Karnik; t/call Beckerman re same; later t/call with HLT, DI and Beckerman re same
28-Jun-05	0.8	attention to Goodrich motion, Committee correspondence, and June load factors
28-Jun-05	0.8	attention to and review of Boeing settlement; t/call with Beckerman and BAK re same, including discussions with HLT, BAK, MJC and DI re same
29-Jun-05	0.3	discussion with HLT re Mercer CVs, attention to 1110 filings
29-Jun-05	1.5	Committee call with HLT, MJC, BAK, DI re cash flow analysis and business plan
29-Jun-05	0.3	t/calls with Arthur and Beckerman re Committee call
29-Jun-05	1.5	discuss strategic options for ATA with BAK, DI, MJC and HLT
29-Jun-05	1.0	series of conversations with HLT re Denison, business plan, cost savings, schedule changes
1-Jul-05	1.8	conf call with HLT, MJC and Committee chair re ATA business plan
1-Jul-05	2.8	review 1110 filings; continuance motion; operating report; bcc filings; Boeing settlement motion
3-Jul-05	0.3	attn to 737 and 767s
5-Jul-05	0.4	work on debtors obligations and whether they have been fulfilled. t/call and e-mail HLT re same
5-Jul-05	1.2	attn to 737 and 767s; review Mercer bios; attn to ATSB reporting package
6-Jul-05	1.6	attn to Mercer bios; attn to application re retention of Jefferies and Skyworks; attn to blanket approval of 767 terms; attn to ATSB reporting package
6-Jul-05	0.5	discuss Denison and strategic alternatives with HLT
7-Jul-05	2.3	attn to IAA lease assumption; attn to Boeing Continental lease; attn to ATSB reporting package
8-Jul-05	4.0	attn to review of ASG variables to consider; continued attn to Boeing/Continental leases; attn to Kent County motion; attn to ATSB reporting package; attn to 737-300 and 737-700 terms; t/call with MJC re potential additional variables for ASG; t/calls and e-mail Humphries re 737-300 and 737-700 terms
8-Jul-05	0.6	attn to objections to Boeing settlement motion; review of 1110 motions; e-mail Seabury re help on lease cost valuation; t/calls HLT re same
11-Jul-05	3.1	attn to IAA lease assumption and need for a Committee call; review draft of Compass report

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Jul-05	0.8	attn to ATSB reporting package; attn to side letter re leasing of 737-300 and 737-700 a/c
11-Jul-05	5.1	review of time records and prep of description of services in fee application
12-Jul-05	0.8	Committee conference call with HLT & MJC re status of Boeing claim
12-Jul-05	4.8	review of time records and prep of description of services in fee application
12-Jul-05	2.2	review 1110 filings; review ATA Q proposed amendment and t/calls with Humphries and MJC re same; e-mails re schedule of Creditors Committee meeting; attn to Boeing settlement motion; attn to ATSB settlement motion
13-Jul-05	2.3	review side letter re a/c leases; review summary of pending matters; review final Boeing settlement agreement; review ATSB reporting package
14-Jul-05	1.0	Committee conference call with BAK, MJC, HLT and DI; discuss IAA issues, Exec. comp issues, implications of business plan; ATSB guarantees
14-Jul-05	1.0	review update on 737 and 767s; attn to upcoming Committee meeting with debtor in Indy; attn to ATSB reporting package
14-Jul-05	0.7	series of conversations with MJC, BAK and HLT re conversations with F. Conway; t/call message to Beckerman re same
15-Jul-05	0.5	additional attn-IAA lease dispute
15-Jul-05	1.1	review ATA press release on maintenance savings; several e-mails re upcoming Creditors Committee meeting in Indy; review numerous docs re IAA lease situation; review ATSB reporting package
15-Jul-05	0.6	discuss business plan and schedule on series of t/calls with Beckerman, HLT and Committee co-chair
18-Jul-05	13.0	travel to Indy and meet with HLT, MJC, BAK and Company management; management presentation; dinner meeting with debtor professionals
18-Jul-05	1.1	review follow-up materials; attn to ATSB reporting package
19-Jul-05	4.0	travel back to NY; review ATSB reporting package
20-Jul-05	4.2	review update re IAA; review draft term sheet re 767s; review company financial statements; review summary of pending matters; disc re July 28 Committee Call; review comments to 767 term sheet; t/call MJC re same; review ATSB reporting package; attn to revised comments to 767 term sheet; conversation Tom Maher re financing, including discussions with HLT
20-Jul-05	1.0	t/call with Thane Carlston of Jefferies to review capital raising issues with HLT; follow-up discussion re strategic alternatives with HLT
21-Jul-05	1.1	review memo on status of aircraft acquisitions; review cash flow analysis for week of Jul 15; review ATSB reporting package
21-Jul-05	0.5	series of discussions re strategic alternatives with MJC and HLT
22-Jul-05	3.1	numerous e-mails re Mercer call and meeting with Company; several t/calls HLT re proposed meeting in Indy with Company management; review agenda items; review draft of IAA agreement; review e-mails re Mercer call; review Goodrich update; review ATSB reporting package
23-Jul-05	0.5	numerous e-mails and t/calls with HLT re meeting with Company management for 25 July
24-Jul-05	0.4	additional e-mails and t/calls with HLT re agenda for meeting with company management;
25-Jul-05	10.5	travel to Indy; meeting with Company management, HLT, BAK, MJC re update to business plan; travel back to NY; review ATSB reporting package; disc re Sage-Popovich report; disc HLT re Jefferies offering memo
26-Jul-05	0.3	attn to ATSB reporting package
26-Jul-05	0.5	series of t/calls with HLT, MJC and BAK re capital raise
27-Jul-05	0.6	attn to ATA investor list; attn to ATSB reporting package; attn to Mikelsons term sheet
27-Jul-05	0.3	discussions with HLT re capital raise and strategic options
28-Jul-05	0.2	follow-up discussion re alternatives with HLT

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Jul-05	1.3	Committee conference call with BAK, HLT, MJC, DI re IAA settlement, CEO comp and JGM severance package
28-Jul-05	1.0	series of t/calls and/or discussions with HLT, MJC, and Committee members re capital raise and strategic options
28-Jul-05	2.3	discussion MJC and HLT re offering memo; attn to IAA settlement motion; review current cash flow analysis; review ATSB reporting package
1-Aug-05	3.8	discussion with BAK re lease rates for aircraft; research same; attn to IAA proposed plans; attn to monthly Company Operating Report; review of Sage-Popovich appraisal materials
2-Aug-05	4.1	t/call with MJC, HLT, BAK and Frank Conway and Mercer re progress on maintenance cost reduction; review cash pro forma; attn to aircraft updates; review ATSB reporting package; review term sheet for proposed new financing; begin review of draft of information memo, including discussion with HLT re interim financing term sheet
3-Aug-05	3.8	continuing review of Jefferies information memo; continuing review of rights offering and new financing; review of ATSB reporting package; review of proposed settlement with Mikelsons; review memo re same; continue working on revised financing proposal, including discussion with HLT re his t/calls with noteholders and Schulte re capital raise
4-Aug-05	3.0	conf call with BAK, HLT and Frank Conway re list of cost savings ideas; review of ATSB reporting package; continuing revisions to proposed financing term sheet
4-Aug-05	1.2	call with HLT, BAK, MJC, DI and Creditors Committee re Mikelsons settlement and other matters
5-Aug-05	2.2	review ATSB reporting package; review cash flow analysis; review summary of pending motions; review summary of fee applications; update call
5-Aug-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re status of leases and fleet
8-Aug-05	0.8	review ATSB reporting package; review MJC e-mail re meeting with ASG; review BAK e-mail re same; review e-mails re proposed new DIP term sheet proposal
8-Aug-05	0.4	t/calls with HLT re meetings with ATA noteholders
9-Aug-05	2.5	review e-mails re ASG discussions; review ATSB reporting package; review revised ATA book;
9-Aug-05	2.4	series of meetings with noteholders to discuss financing options for ATA with HLT
10-Aug-05	0.6	review Mikelsons settlement proposal; review summary of pending matters; review e-mail re ASG;
11-Aug-05	0.5	review e-mail re Aug 16 meeting; review Ferrante material re ASG; review ATSB reporting package
11-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re lease fleet
12-Aug-05	0.6	review ATSB reporting package; review cash flow analysis; review e-mail re 1113 motion and committee call
15-Aug-05	5.0	review ATSB reporting package; review proposal for form of alternative financing; review summary of Debtors 1113 motion; review back up papers re same; review ATA 10-Q; review ATA info memo; attn to sealed declarations; attn to IAA docs;
16-Aug-05	0.3	review Claffey update; review letter from Eric Schaeffer; review list of confidentiality agreements for Jefferies financing
16-Aug-05	1.8	Committee conf call with HLT, BAK, DI, ABT, CJE regarding 1113 motion and status of financing
17-Aug-05	0.4	review ATSB reporting package; review ATSB reporting package for previous day

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Aug-05	2.8	review stip re L-1011; t/call with BAK, ABT, HLT, MJC, Jefferies; review ATSB reporting package; review 1113 objections filed by ALPA; review Committee statement re Debtors motion re collective bargaining agreement; review e-mails re prep session re ASG
19-Aug-05	0.6	review IAA Master Agreement; review ATSB reporting package; review e-mails re prep session for ASG;
19-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re fleet and leases
20-Aug-05	1.5	review 1113 documents
21-Aug-05	0.1	review e-mails re Klein/ASG
22-Aug-05	2.6	review e-mail and materials re 1113 motion and settlement with Mikelsons; review e-mails re Klein and agreement re same; review ATSB reporting package; conf calls with BAK, MJC and Navigant consultants; numerous e-mails re Klein/ASG and review of same
23-Aug-05	1.5	review ATSB reporting package; review e-mails re update on status of ALPA negotiations; review 1110 filing re engine
23-Aug-05	1.0	conference call with BAK, ABT, CJE, MJC, Frank Conway re weekly updating procedures and recent developments
24-Aug-05	1.2	review ATSB reporting package; review e-mails re Fred Klein meeting; review MJC materials re running pro formas
25-Aug-05	1.6	review ATSB reporting package; review materials re sale of Saabs; review material re appointment of additional committee for Chicago Express; attn to e-mails re Fred Klein; review e-mails re calls with Noteholders
25-Aug-05	0.3	series of emails with Beckerman and HLT, MJC, etc. re update and scheduling Committee professionals call
26-Aug-05	3.0	conf call with HLT, MJC, BAK and Akin Gump team; attn to ATSB reporting package; review and attention to e-mails re Fred Klein, professionals call, update of 7/18 plan, and Denison employment terms; review summary of pending matters
27-Aug-05	0.2	attn to e-mail re Denison contract terms
28-Aug-05	0.8	review e-mail re Fred Klein; attn to final terms of Denison agreement
29-Aug-05	2.2	attn to ATSB reporting package; attn to Goodrich motion; attn to OFCCP materials; attn to Colgan motion; t/call with HLT, BAK to M. Mandel re terms of aircraft proposal; review of Oasis lease terms
30-Aug-05	4.2	review MJC e-mail re consultants; attn to financial info provided by ATA; attn to ATSB reporting package; attn to e-mails re follow up on reporting materials; attn to motion re new committee for Chicago Express; review of model sent by Company; review e-mails re Fred Klein and Boeing appraisal proceedings; attn to Oasis letter of intent; review of motion re Colgan transaction;
31-Aug-05	3.1	conf call with Beckerman, MJC and Mandel, together with Skyworks, re aircraft availability, terms and status; disc with HLT re same and his discussion with Denison; conv with Mandel re same; review Mandel e-mail re Bristol; review ATSB Term Sheet; attn to ATSB reporting package
1-Sep-05	0.8	review fuel cost data; review CSC sale order; review ATSB reporting package
2-Sep-05	1.1	review fuel cost data; review Mandel e-mail re conversation with Bristol; review BAK memo re ATA diligence; review ATSB reporting package;
4-Sep-05	0.5	review Summary of Pending Matters
6-Sep-05	1.1	review report on Chicago Express hearing; review Mercer application for additional services; review e-mail re ATA hearing; review e-mail re Mercer; review ATSB reporting package and discuss with BAK and ABT; review e-mail re meeting with ATSB; discussion with HLT re status of fleet
7-Sep-05	1.8	review e-mail re Noteholders proposed term sheet; additional e-mail re same; review summary of Wess-Foothill motion; review ATSB reporting package; review memo re meeting with ATSB on Sept 12; additional memo re same
7-Sep-05	0.1	discuss fee application with ETW

Date	TIME Hours	Description
7-Sep-05	0.4	discussions with HLT re status of work and continuing due diligence and info requests
8-Sep-05	4.1	review memo on search for ATA aircraft; review summary of pending matters; review info on fuel prices; review summary of Hancock motion; review confidential Waveland letter of intent re Chicago Express sale; review ATSB reporting package; t/call with Graber re Mercer duties; review Carr e-mail re Mercer duties; attention to proposed investor list for ATA financing; review F. Conway e-mail re Navigant approval; t/call with HLT, BAK, MJC to Frank Conway
8-Sep-05	0.8	conference call with HLT, MJC, BAK and Akin Gump re Navigant responsiveness, capital raise and Plan B
9-Sep-05	6.7	review fuel pricing data; review e-mail re Navigant approval; review presentation re Creditors' update; t/call re Mercer; review Carr e-mail re Sept 12 meeting; review BAK memo re ATA financial condition; review CIM model and business plan; review update on ALPA negotiations; review cash flow analysis
9-Sep-05	0.8	Conf call with HLT, ABT, BAK and MJC regarding Mercer
9-Sep-05	1.0	Committee conf call with HLT, MJC, CJE and ABT; discuss latest issues re financing and ATA professional retentions, etc.
9-Sep-05	0.2	discussions with HLT and BAK re various emails re meeting with Debtor and due diligence
12-Sep-05	2.1	review ATSB reporting package; list of liquidity items for ATA sent to BAK; review cash comparison; review proposal to ALPA
13-Sep-05	3.2	review Sommer Barnard application; review draft of Noteholder term sheet; review motion to extend exclusivity; review material re Goodrich negotiations
14-Sep-05	4.6	review fuel pricing info; review Goodrich waiver and settlement agreement, including discussion with HLT; additional memo re Goodrich negotiations; review article re ALPA negotiations; review wheel and brake agreement; review material re Mercer expansion of scope, including discussion with HLT; t/calls with HLT, BAK, MJC to Debtor re same; review ATSB reporting package
15-Sep-05	3.6	review additional material re Mercer scope of work, including discussion with HLT; review engine leases; t/call with Graber re Goodrich and Mercer; attn to draft quarterly report; review material re Ambassador; review ATSB reporting package
16-Sep-05	2.0	review documents re Goodrich settlement; review ATA cash flow analysis; review ATSB reporting package
17-Sep-05	3.8	review revised financing timeline and first draft of Plan of Reorganization
19-Sep-05	5.5	review ATA aircraft sublease; review announcement re ALPA tentative agreement; review and revise draft quarterly report; review new proposed term sheet for ATA financing by noteholders; review ATSB reporting package; review summary of pending matters; review and revise new draft of quarterly report
20-Sep-05	4.1	review F. Conway comments on term sheet and 757-200s; review fuel pricing; review e-mails re modification report; follow-up re summary of pending matters; review ATA-Goodrich Wheel and Brake Agreement; review ATA-Cal subleases; review info re spare engine leasing; review e-mail re inventory disposition proposal; review CIT 737 proposal; review ATSB reporting package; discussion with BAK re agenda
21-Sep-05	3.5	review ATA traffic report; review e-mail re CIT 737 proposal; review memo re replacement letter of credit facility; review Claffey update on several matters; review memo re ALPA stipulation; review memo re Goodrich settlement; review summary of IAA motion; review ATSB reporting package
21-Sep-05	1.0	conf call with HLT, BAK, ABT and ATA re update on financial results and capital raise
21-Sep-05	0.4	series of discussions with HLT re financing and cash flow projections

Date	TIME Hours	Description
22-Sep-05	2.3	review update re ATA financing; review fuel pricing data; review ATA cash flow analysis; review analysis of schedule vs forecast; review markup of Plan of Reorganization; review ATSB reporting package
23-Sep-05	1.5	review fuel pricing report; review list of cost reduction proposals; review summary of ATA financial results; review ATSB reporting package
23-Sep-05	0.3	discuss financing and cash requirements with HLT
25-Sep-05	0.1	review Beckerman e-mail re meetings
26-Sep-05	0.3	review info re fuel prices; review ATSB reporting package
27-Sep-05	2.3	review memo re fuel pricing; review memo re tentative agreement with ALPA; review July Operating Report draft and comment on same; review e-mail re effect of fleet changes on modeling; review ATSB reporting package
27-Sep-05	0.4	series of discussions and t/calls with BAK, MJC, ABT and HLT re valuation and cash flow issues
28-Sep-05	4.1	review draft disclosure statement; review draft plan of reorganization; review summary of ATA financial results
29-Sep-05	2.2	review ATSB reporting package for 28th; review Beckerman info re call with Debtors; review fuel pricing info; review summary of pending matters and discuss with HLT, BAK, ABT and MJC; review ATA updated forecast for 2005-2008; review cash flow analysis; review ATSB reporting package for 29th
30-Sep-05	4.5	review ATA memo re change in business plan assumptions; long conf call with F. Conway and others at ATA; review 757-300 memo; review ATA operating report prior to court filing; review ATSB reporting package; review of ATA plan and disclosure statement
1-Oct-05	6.5	review plan and disclosure statement; review 757 operating lease rental report
3-Oct-05	0.3	review ATSB reporting package
3-Oct-05	1.0	Committee conf call with HLT, BAK, ABT, CJE to review status of financing, cash and results to July 31, 2005 and labor deal with ALPA
5-Oct-05	1.0	review ATSB reporting package; review e-mail re 10-7 call; review summary of pending matters
6-Oct-05	5.8	review aircraft acquisition call update; review and analyze settlement agreement with Goodrich, discussion with HLT; t/calls with C. Bowles re same; review report on fuel pricing; t/call with ATA management; review August monthly operating report; review cash flow analysis for Sept 30 week; review e-mail re ATA financing proposals; conversation with Doug Parker and Scott Kirby; discuss Navigant t/call with BAK and HLT; discuss with HLT re prospective investor re investment in ATA
7-Oct-05	2.8	review memo re Goodrich update; review ATSB reporting package for Oct 6; review ATSB reporting package for 10-7; t/call with ATA re financing; Committee update; discussion with HLT re his t/calls with prospective investor re investment in ATA; discussion strategic options with HLT
8-Oct-05	1.0	review ATA discussion materials
9-Oct-05	2.5	extensive review of ATA docs
10-Oct-05	6.5	review fuel pricing info; review notices re lease rejections; review ATSB package for 10-7; review and meeting re ATA valuation, including series of meetings with HLT, BAK and ABT regarding valuation analysis; discussion with HLT re prospective investor's access to due diligence information
11-Oct-05	5.2	review fuel pricing info; review notice of lease rejections; t/call with ATA re capital raise; review ATSB reporting package; review and meeting re ATA valuation with HLT, BAK and ABT; discussion with CJE, ABT and HLT re status of financing and Plan B elements
12-Oct-05	1.1	t/call with HLT, BAK, ABT, MJC, CJE and ATA re OP6; review ATSB reporting package
13-Oct-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package

Date	TIME Hours	Description
14-Oct-05	4.2	Committee calls with HLT, BAK, ABT and CJE re company's new business plan; t/call with ATA re Plan B; review Karnik files re routes; t/call with Mike Mandel; review cash flow analysis for Oct 7 week; review e-mail re co financing including conf call with Navigant, Graber, Hula, Yakola, F. Conway and Compass re status of financing and Plan B elements and discussion with HLT, ABT and CJE re same
15-Oct-05	0.2	additional review of cash flow analysis for week of Oct 7
16-Oct-05	0.2	review Beckerman letter to Carr
17-Oct-05	0.3	review fuel pricing; review ATSB reporting package
17-Oct-05	0.4	discussion with HLT re strategic options
18-Oct-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
18-Oct-05	2.0	series of t/calls and/or discussions re financing status and new business plan with Beckerman, Committee members, BAK, HLT
19-Oct-05	0.5	review summary of pending matters; review e-mail re solicitation motion; review ATSB reporting package
20-Oct-05	3.8	review 2004 motion; review BAK comments on 2004 motion, including discussion with BAK and HLT on 2004 motion; review letter and summary from Jim Carr; review aircraft proofs of claim; review ATSB reporting package; review suggested response to Denison e-mail
21-Oct-05	3.6	Committee call with HLT, BAK and ABT re various matters; ; follow-up t/calls to Beckerman, Botter and Ferrante re same; review Oct 14 cash flow analysis; review e-mail re aircraft letter of intent from Mandel; review ATSB reporting package; review draft letter to Denison
22-Oct-05	0.1	review letter to Denison
24-Oct-05	0.6	review co-chairs' letter to Denison; review ATSB reporting package; review e-mail re solicitation procedures motion
25-Oct-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
25-Oct-05	0.2	discuss options with HLT
26-Oct-05	2.1	t/call with ATA management; review ATSB reporting package; review cash flow analysis for week of Oct 21
26-Oct-05	0.7	t/call with Peko and Graber of ATA with BAK, MJC, HLT and ABT to review latest status of fleet and financing
26-Oct-05	2.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members, Beckerman, HLT, BAK and MJC re status of financing and strategic options available
26-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with Denison with HLT re status of financing
27-Oct-05	4.1	review Denison letter to Committee; review ATSB reporting package; review rental analysis for 737s; review notice re rejection of leases; review summary of Ambassador transaction; review summary of interim fee applications
27-Oct-05	0.3	discuss status of financing and strategic options available with HLT
28-Oct-05	2.5	review ATSB reporting package; review docs re ATA/AMR dispute; Committee call, including discussion with HLT and MJC re status of capital raise
28-Oct-05	1.0	Committee conf call with HLT, MJC, CJE, BAK, ABT; discuss status of financing and ATA's new business plan
29-Oct-05	1.1	conf call with BAK, HLT, Committee leadership and ATA to review status of discussions with investor; review Beckerman email re same
31-Oct-05	2.1	review automatic letter of intent for aircraft; e-mails with Mandel re same; review analysis of Aug operating report; review e-mail re disclosure statement timing; review September operating report; review ATSB reporting package
1-Nov-05	2.8	review Sept operating report; review certificates of no objection re operating leases; review summary of automatic aircraft motion; review memo re revised business plan; review press release re cancellation of service from Indy; e-mails with Grubin re same; call with Grubin re same; review ATSB reporting package
2-Nov-05	0.9	review e-mail re disclosure statement timing; review ATSB reporting package; review Committee joinder to ATA motion re AMR claim

Date	TIME Hours	Description
3-Nov-05	2.2	weekly conf call with ATA mgmt, HLT, BAK, ABT and CJE; t/call with HLT and ABT to co-chair of Committee to discuss earlier call with Debtors; review Debtors' objection to AMR application; review ATSB reporting package; review cash flow analysis for week of Oct 21
4-Nov-05	1.5	review MatlinPatterson term sheet; review ATSB reporting package
7-Nov-05	1.6	review orders rejecting various aircraft; review memo summarizing exclusivity motion; review summary of Denison motion; review ATSB reporting package; review Waveland correspondence re Ambassadair with BAK; review and discuss term sheet with HLT, BAK, MJC, ABT
8-Nov-05	0.2	discuss term sheet with ABT and HLT
8-Nov-05	2.6	e-mail Grubin; review e-mail re objection deadline for exclusivity motion; Committee conf call with BAK, HLT, MJC, ABT, CJE to discuss MatlinPatterson term sheet, exclusivity and cash requirements; t/call with Calavritinos re fleet; review ATSB reporting package
9-Nov-05	0.9	review cash flow analysis for week ended Nov 4; review ATSB reporting package; review Ryan & Co application
9-Nov-05	0.1	discussions with ETW re fee application
9-Nov-05	0.5	discuss with Committee members, Beckerman, HLT, MJC, BAK, and ABT re business plan, strategic options and meetings in Indy
10-Nov-05	2.2	review summary of liquidating Debtors motion; review Denison motion; review new drafts of MatlinPatterson term sheet and commitment letter; discuss the same with HLT and F. Conway; review ATSB reporting package
11-Nov-05	6.0	review changes to MatlinPatterson term sheet with HLT, and BAK; Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, HLT, ABT, CJE to review term sheet from MatlinPatterson and discuss available options; review motion re DIP financing, several affidavits, motion to put MP bid under seal; review quantitative summary of MP term sheet; review memo re differences in drafts of MP term sheet; review revised quantitative summary of MP term sheet; discuss the same with ABT; review ATSB reporting package
12-Nov-05	3.0	review draft of revised business plan
14-Nov-05	2.2	review information on OP6 business plan; review e-mail re Loeb Partners; review ATSB reporting package; e-mails re model for business plan
14-Nov-05	0.6	series of discussions with HLT, ABT and BAK concerning strategic alternatives and other topics
15-Nov-05	6.3	review ATA financial model; trip to company with HLT and BAK; review summary of Colgan transaction; review ATSB reporting package
16-Nov-05	9.6	series of meetings at ATA with management to review new business plan OP7 with BAK and ABT and HLT; including t/calls with MatlinPatterson, Botter, Beckerman, MJC and HLT
17-Nov-05	4.5	review Southwest gate transfer, codeshare and DIP agreements; t/call with US Airways, United re potential bid for ATA; e-mail Botter re meeting with litigator; review cash flow analysis for week ended Nov 11; review memo on summary of new ATA transaction with Southwest; series of t/calls with BAK and HLT re alternative to ATA plan and work required
18-Nov-05	8.5	meeting with Akin Gump attorneys, ABT and BAK to prepare for deposition; review ATSB reporting package; review amended plan and disclosure statement; prep of slides and review of same for presentation at deposition; numerous calls with ABT re same; series of t/calls with Committee members and HLT re alternatives to ATA plan
19-Nov-05	8.0	continue working on prep of slides for depositions; continue review of amended plan and disclosure statement; review slides re comparison of codeshare agreement; review material from Jefferies document production

Date	TIME Hours	Description
20-Nov-05	4.0	review ATA financial projections; conf call with BAK, HLT, MJC and ABT to Akin Gump re options for Committee and support for litigation; review Debtors' motion re Southwest; t/calls with BAK, HLT, MJC, ABT, CJE re analysis for Akin Gump and Compass work program
21-Nov-05	7.5	t/call to Scott Kirby at American West re interest in ATA; t/call Sean Farrot at Deutsche Bank re same; t/call with HLT re interest of American; draft letter to American re same; review OP7 fuel expense analysis; review ATSB reporting package; create list of ATA information requests, including multiple discussions with HLT and Calavritinos re prospective investors in ATA assets
22-Nov-05	4.5	Committee conf call with BAK, HLT, ABT to review options and Committee objections to Debtor's motion re MatlinPatterson; review slides for ATA deposition; review ATA September 10Q; review objection to MP transaction; review ATSB reporting package; multiple discussions with HLT and Calavritinos re prospective investors in ATA assets
23-Nov-05	6.1	review disclosure statement and plan of reorganization
24-Nov-05	2.0	review solicitation procedures motions
28-Nov-05	0.5	review Greenebaum Doll interim fee application; review ATSB reporting package; emails from/to HLT re Committee conf call
29-Nov-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
30-Nov-05	4.0	review plan, liquidation analysis and valuation; review October monthly operating report; review ATSB reporting package
1-Dec-05	1.5	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, HLT, ABT and CJE; discuss status of POR and disclosure statement and review issues re POR
2-Dec-05	4.0	review of plan and disclosure statement; review list of due diligence items; review ATSB reporting package; review update to Debtors model; review cash flow analysis for Nov 18 and 25 weeks; series of discussions and review of valuation with BAK, ABT and HLT
3-Dec-05	3.3	t/call with BAK and B. Buebel of Huron regarding liquidation analysis; conf call with BAK, HLT, ABT and Navigant to review valuation
3-Dec-05	0.1	exchange emails with HLT re fee app
4-Dec-05	0.5	review ATSB term sheet
5-Dec-05	2.8	Committee Conf call with BAK, HLT, MJC, ABT and CJE to review disclosure statement and valuation issues; review info re slots; review issues relating to maintenance reserves; review hearing schedule info; review ATSB reporting package
5-Dec-05	1.0	series of discussions and review of documents and schedules re valuation with HLT, BAK and ABT
6-Dec-05	3.5	review maintenance/expense capitalization issue; review e-mail from AFA re scheduling and Southwest; review latest draft of Plan of Reorganization
7-Dec-05	0.3	review ATSB report for 12-6; review ATSB reporting package for 12-7
7-Dec-05	0.7	discuss POR with Committee co-chair, BAK, HLT and ABT and with MatlinPatterson
8-Dec-05	4.2	review info re Hearing update; review revised draft of Debtors Plan of Reorganization; review ATSB reporting package; review revised version of Disclosure Statement
9-Dec-05	2.1	review draft of codeshare agreement with Southwest; review Committee Plan support letter; review ATSB reporting package; review minority protection and warrant term sheets
10-Dec-05	0.6	review draft of Codeshare Agreement; review revised Warrant term sheet
11-Dec-05	1.5	review revised Plan and Disclosure Statement drafts
12-Dec-05	0.8	review report on Court agenda; review summary of financial results; review ATSB reporting package
13-Dec-05	0.3	review hearing update; review ATSB reporting package

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Dec-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package for 12-13
16-Dec-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
19-Dec-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
20-Dec-05	0.6	review ATSB reporting package for 12-19; review L-1011 transaction and conversation Mike Mandel re same; review timeline of upcoming events; review ATSB reporting package for 12-20
21-Dec-05	0.3	review summary of fee application
21-Dec-05	0.7	review amended aircraft term sheet; review proposal for Mercer extension and discuss with HLT; review ATSB reporting package; e-mails with Beckerman re Mercer
22-Dec-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
23-Dec-05	1.0	review cash flow analysis; review ATSB reporting package; attention to Mercer extension
27-Dec-05	0.2	review summary of financial results; review ATSB reporting package
28-Dec-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package; review info re calculation of rejection damage claims
29-Dec-05	0.8	review draft of letter to Wells Fargo; review ATSB reporting package; revisions to letter to Wells Fargo
30-Dec-05	0.2	review status of MatlinPatterson DIP; review ATSB reporting package
2-Jan-06	0.3	review Nov Operating Report
3-Jan-06	0.1	discuss Court docket with ETW
3-Jan-06	0.2	review ATSB package, review letter to Wells Fargo with HLT and Schaffer including revisions
4-Jan-06	0.2	review ATSB package; conf call with HLT
5-Jan-06	2.3	review new ATA certificate of incorporation, bylaws and letter to Committee and discuss with HLT; t/call with John Strickland re same
6-Jan-06	2.2	conf call with Akin and HLT re ATA governing documents; review revisions to by-laws; review ATSB reporting package
9-Jan-06	2.3	review mark-up of side letter; conf call with HLT to discuss status of ATA governing documents; conf call with MatlinPatterson re same, including discussions with HLT; review ATSB reporting package; discuss agenda with HLT
9-Jan-06	0.5	Committee call with HLT, BAK, ABT, CJE to discuss status
10-Jan-06	0.8	e-mails and discussion re open issues re governing documents for new ATA; review analysis of contracts to be assumed; review ATSB reporting package
10-Jan-06	1.2	conf call with HLT and MatlinPatterson re ATA, and follow-up discussions with HLT and BAK
11-Jan-06	0.2	review press release re realignment of management; continuing discussion of by-law changes; discuss same with HLT and BAK
12-Jan-06	0.8	review summaries of various motions; review ATSB reporting package; review cash flow analysis
13-Jan-06	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
16-Jan-06	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
17-Jan-06	1.1	review summary of motion re agreement with Sabre; review cv's of director nominees; review ATSB reporting package
18-Jan-06	0.6	review summary of Huron fee application; review ATSB reporting package; review cash flow analysis
19-Jan-06	0.7	Committee Call with BAK, ABT, CJE re director nominees
19-Jan-06	0.8	review summary of motion of Key equipment; review ATSB reporting package
24-Jan-06	3.0	review objections to confirmation; review ATSB reporting package
25-Jan-06	2.8	review summaries of key lease documents and motions; review motion re rejection of ILFC aircraft; review ATSB reporting package; review chart of objections to confirmation; review cash flow analysis
26-Jan-06	1.0	Committee Call with HLT, BAK, ABT, CJE re voting, election and pending issues

Date	TIME Hours	Description
26-Jan-06	0.7	review ATSB reporting package; review motion re quest
27-Jan-06	1.1	review Stanfield objection to plan; review Royal Bank of Canada objections to plan; review ATSB reporting package; review response to NatTel objection
28-Jan-06	2.5	review exhibits to Plan
30-Jan-06	0.4	review confirmation hearing update; review ATSB reporting package
31-Jan-06	0.4	review confirmation order; review ATSB reporting package
1-Feb-06	3.0	review liquidating Plan and Disclosure Statement for Chicago Express; review motions re KPMG and Jefferies; review Nov Monthly Operating Analysis; review ATSB reporting package
2-Feb-06	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
3-Feb-06	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
6-Feb-06	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
7-Feb-06	0.3	review motions re US Bancorp and to lift stay on certain insurance proceeds
8-Feb-06	0.2	review Sommer Barnard application for fees; e-mail re status of effectiveness of plan
15-Feb-06	0.1	review ATSB reporting package for 2-13
20-Feb-06	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
21-Feb-06	0.8	review term sheet re 96-97 EETC settlement;
17-Feb-06	0.1	review cash flow analysis for week ended Feb 10
22-Feb-06	0.2	review NatTel emergency motions
23-Feb-06	0.2	review update of NatTel motions
24-Feb-06	0.1	review Navigant fee application motion
24-Feb-06	0.1	review cash flow analysis for week ended Feb 17
SubTotal	1,050.0	

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Bruce A. Kaufman – Principal		
4-Nov-04	5.0	series of t/calls and discussions with M. Kennelly of Huron, D. Golden and L. Beckerman of Akin, HLT, SIO & MJC, to review existing materials and work plan
4-Nov-04	5.4	review public financial materials concerning ATA with HLT, & MF, Committee by-lay draft, summary of proposed AirTran transaction
4-Nov-04	1.2	review comparative analytical materials with SIO
5-Nov-04	1.5	review due diligence materials with HLT & AD
5-Nov-04	9.5	continue review public financial materials, review analyst reports with AD and HLT, organize travel to Indianapolis, coordinate access to online due diligence, review draft confidentiality agreement, cursory review of ATA web site, preliminary review of ATSB DIP agreement, draft preliminary due diligence request
5-Nov-04	2.5	series of t/calls with HLT, MJC, SIO, et al. regarding ATA restructuring alternatives and work program
5-Nov-04	6.3	preliminary review of initial response to due diligence request, review inventory, notables, receivables, appraisals, payables, Fleet Schedules, lease analysis, ATSB reporting package, bookings report and other documents provided
7-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with HLT regarding strategic alternatives
7-Nov-04	0.5	series t/calls with SIO & HLT re reorganization alternatives
7-Nov-04	0.7	t/call with Akin, HLT, SIO & MF to review alternatives and plan meetings with Debtors
8-Nov-04	3.7	travel to Indianapolis for meeting at ATA with HLT, MF
8-Nov-04	4.0	series of meetings with Committee and ATA management and Huron, HLT, MJC, MF & SIO regarding status of the Company
8-Nov-04	6.0	meetings with Debtors regarding status of the Company, meetings with HLT, MJC & MF to discuss due diligence and strategic alternatives, review updated cash flow
8-Nov-04	0.3	travel from ATA to hotel with HLT & MF
8-Nov-04	2.0	review email from L. Beckerman regarding cash collateral, continue review of ATSB DIP agreement, review preliminary draft of Bid Procedures
8-Nov-04	0.3	prepare brief email report to Committee members, HLT & MF
9-Nov-04	0.6	discussions with HLT and MF regarding financial model and due diligence
9-Nov-04	0.3	travel from hotel to ATA with HLT & MF
9-Nov-04	8.0	meetings with HLT, MF, SIO & MJC, Debtors regarding status of the Company, primarily focused on reviewing cash flow forecast and methodology, review DIP Financing presentation
9-Nov-04	3.5	preliminary review of confidential descriptive memorandum prepared by Seabury, Sunshine liquidation analysis, Kroll valuation and other business analysis
9-Nov-04	3.0	travel from ATA to home (less time worked in transit)
9-Nov-04	0.1	discuss bidders procedures with HLT
10-Nov-04	7.0	continue review of ATSB DIP facility, updated cash forecast, components of cash collateral, review due diligence control list, preliminary review of BATA agreements, market share analysis
10-Nov-04	0.9	t/call call with Akin and HLT, MF, PS, SIO & MJC to discuss strategic alternatives and report to Committee
10-Nov-04	1.8	t/call with Committee, HLT, MF, PS, SIO & MJC
10-Nov-04	1.2	series of t/calls with HLT, MF, PS, SIO & MJC regarding strategic alternatives, review of cash flows, etc
11-Nov-04	5.0	travel to ATA from home
11-Nov-05	8.3	meetings at Baker Daniels regarding ATA DIP facility, conf call with creditors committee reps

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Nov-04	1.6	t/calls with HLT to review draft of AirTran asset purchase agreement with Huron, Debtor, ATSB, AirTran, Akin et. al.
11-Nov-04	0.2	review email from Hunt regarding access to information and meetings with ATA management; discuss same with HLT and MJC
11-Nov-04	0.3	travel from meetings to hotel
12-Nov-04	0.3	travel from hotel to ATA
12-Nov-04	5.0	meetings with Debtors regarding status of the Company, focus on lines of business, internal reporting, appropriateness of fleet, review material provided
12-Nov-04	0.5	series of discussions with MJC and HLT diligence
12-Nov-04	0.7	t/call with Committee, HLT, SIO, MF, MJC & AD to review AirTran proposal
12-Nov-04	0.5	Committee Professionals, SIO, HLT, MF, MJC & AD call to review bidders issues for court hearing
12-Nov-04	5.5	travel from ATA to home
13-Nov-04	4.5	organize work process to research break-up fees in chapter 11, review updated acquisition agreement, review objection to bid procedures, review information request from MJC to Huron
13-Nov-04	2.5	series of discussions with HLT to review information on break-up fees in chapter 11
14-Nov-04	2.5	continue review of ATSB DIP agreement and restrictive covenants
14-Nov-04	5.5	travel from office to meetings
14-Nov-04	3.0	meeting with Botter and Ferrante of Akin to prepare HLT for testimony regarding bidders procedures motion an AirTran acquisition agreement
14-Nov-04	2.0	dinner meeting with HLT, M. Carr of Baker, T. Allison of Huron, D. Botter and L. Beckerman of Akin to auction
15-Nov-04	0.4	travel from hotel to meetings for ATA
15-Nov-04	2.5	work on cash collateral and restrictive covenant analysis, series of t/calls with Huron and Lazard, discuss cash collateral and ATSB issues with HLT and L. Beckerman of Akin
15-Nov-04	0.3	discuss cash collateral issues with HLT and MF
15-Nov-04	1.0	attendance with HLT & MF at Baker to discuss issues for Bankruptcy Court hearing regarding DIP and Bidders Procedures
15-Nov-04	3.0	attendance with HLT, MF at Bankruptcy Court for DIP motion and Bidders Procedures motion
15-Nov-04	0.7	discussion with HLT, MF & Huron of working objectives, draft mails concerning financial projections
15-Nov-04	4.0	travel from Indianapolis to home
16-Nov-04	0.5	discuss work program with HLT sit in on t/calls with Huron regarding same
16-Nov-04	6.5	review detailed information concerning Wet leases, fuel consumption, payroll forecast, expected cure costs, continue review of bidders procedures and break-up fee analysis, discuss work program and key due diligence issues with HLT & MF
16-Nov-04	3.2	review and update restrictive covenants, series of t/calls with Huron/Lazard, discuss cash collateral issues with HLT, draft email regarding same
17-Nov-04	0.5	review updated cash reports, updated information on AWA,
17-Nov-04	0.2	review SIO memo with HLT
17-Nov-04	6.0	continue review of asset purchase agreement, draft overview of key issues for email, series of discussions regarding asset purchase agreement and breakup fees in related case with HLT
17-Nov-04	0.3	review of ATSB Security Agreement with HLT
18-Nov-04	5.0	travel from Home to meetings for ATA
18-Nov-04	6.0	meetings with Debtors regarding status of the Company, review preliminary draft of Midway model, review updated information request, review updated cash report,
18-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with HLT regarding financial projections for ATA

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Nov-04	0.4	travel from meetings to hotel
19-Nov-04	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
19-Nov-04	4.5	meetings with Debtors, HLT, MJC & MF regarding status of the Company focus on lines of business
19-Nov-04	1.0	t/calls with Committee and MF, HLT & MJC
19-Nov-04	4.5	travel to NY from Indianapolis with HLT
20-Nov-04	7.3	review background information concerning Southwest Airlines, various emails concerning bidders qualification, review updated cash flow projections, preliminary review of segment financials, review preliminary cure analysis, discuss analysis of ATA model with MF
20-Nov-04	0.3	t/calls with HLT and MF regarding financial model
21-Nov-04	6.4	continue review of background information concerning Southwest, preliminary review of America West proposal and background information
21-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with HLT and T. Allison of Huron regarding information request
21-Nov-04	0.2	discuss with HLT re access to financial information and options for ATA
22-Nov-04	1.0	t/call with Committee
22-Nov-04	2.0	review final AirTran asset acquisition agreement
22-Nov-04	6.6	review analysis of pilot pay, updated cash report, t/call regarding cash collateral issues for the ATSB DIP agreement, review updated news stories and research concerning ATA, bidders and Airline industry, t/calls with S. Choi of Lazard regarding updating DIP covenants
22-Nov-04	1.5	review memo regarding aircraft cures, discuss rejections with HLT & MF
22-Nov-04	1.8	series of discussions with HLT, MF, PS, AD & SIO regarding next steps
23-Nov-04	8.2	series of t/calls regarding updated DIP covenants, review analysis of potential cure payments, review emails regarding lease prepayment issue, review updated ATA 10Q, review response to committee member inquiry, attempted t/calls to Seabury regarding marketing process, discussion with HLT, SIO & MJC re prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information
23-Nov-04	0.3	review 1110 issues including emails with HLT
23-Nov-04	0.3	discuss prospective bidders re ATA with HLT
23-Nov-04	0.3	discuss financial projections with HLT
24-Nov-04	0.8	series of discussions with HLT, SIO, MJC, MF & PS to organize due diligence regarding Debtors financial performance
24-Nov-04	0.5	discussions with HLT and MF regarding work program and reports for Committee
24-Nov-04	5.7	continued review of ATA 10Q, t/calls to Seabury, review memo regarding prepaid rents, continued review of cure payment analysis, review updated cash flow analysis
26-Nov-04	1.4	review draft and final memo to Committee, HLT & MF regarding YTD financial performance and cash flow
26-Nov-04	0.4	emails and t/calls with Huron et. al. regarding M&A process
26-Nov-04	0.4	discuss options for ATA with HLT, MF & MJC
26-Nov-04	1.2	draft email regarding Debtor's business plan, including discussion with HLT & SIO
26-Nov-04	0.6	discuss strategic alternatives for ATA with HLT, MF & MJC
26-Nov-04	6.0	review ATA assessment paper, review response to committee member inquiry, work on recovery analysis draft
27-Nov-04	1.8	discuss financial projections with HLT and T. Allison of Huron
27-Nov-04	0.3	review cash position of debtors with HLT
27-Nov-04	0.5	review 13 week cash flow with HLT & MF
27-Nov-04	1.2	t/call call regarding business plan with MJC, MF, HLT & SIO
27-Nov-04	3.2	review draft Committee memorandum, review debtors financial forecast
28-Nov-04	0.2	review memo concerning forecast and cash flow projections with HLT & MF

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Nov-04	2.6	continue review of Debtor's financial forecast, review MJC comments regarding same, review updated cash flow forecast
28-Nov-04	1.5	preliminary review of KERP motion
29-Nov-04	5.0	travel from home to ATA
29-Nov-04	0.3	discuss KERP with HLT and review related emails
29-Nov-04	1.2	discuss work program with HLT, MF, MJC & SIO
29-Nov-04	1.5	t/call with regard to cash collateral and revisions to the ATSB restrictive covenants
29-Nov-04	0.5	review WACC analysis and discuss with PS
29-Nov-04	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel
30-Nov-04	4.0	meetings with the Debtors regarding cash flow forecast, financial projections, Balance sheet composition, pre-petition claims analysis, follow-up on information required to assess KERP motion, review updated cash forecast, review report to committee concerning cash flow and bookings
30-Nov-04	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
30-Nov-04	0.5	t/call with HLT, MJC, MF and Huron to discuss bidders
30-Nov-04	0.6	t/calls with HLT and MF regarding status of bids and KERP efforts
30-Nov-04	0.3	discuss report to Committee on financial projection model with HLT, MJC & MF
30-Nov-04	6.8	meetings with the Debtors regarding fleet requirements, alternative courses of action, labor relations, military flying, charter flying, financial projections, review updated cash forecast, review updated KERP information
30-Nov-04	0.5	t/call with L. Beckerman of Huron regard to cash collateral and revisions to the ATSB restrictive covenants
30-Nov-04	0.5	travel from ATA to hotel
1-Dec-04	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
1-Dec-04	4.5	review additional information concerning expected prepetition claims, review analysis of 12 month business plan provided to the Committee, review updated cash flow report, reviewed the nature of the Seabury sale process with Huron
1-Dec-04	0.4	t/call with HLT, MF and MJC re review of report to Committee on financial projection model
1-Dec-04	0.3	t/calls with HLT, MF and MJC re leases and financial projections
1-Dec-04	4.0	travel from ATA to home
2-Dec-04	0.4	discuss summary of ATA's prior recapitalization with HLT
2-Dec-04	5.2	work on analysis of KERP costs, review drafts of debtor's proposed KERP motion and supporting materials; discuss same with HLT and MJC and review email re same from Beckerman, draft description of KERP, review additional information provided concerning organization of ATA for KERP
2-Dec-04	0.3	review options with HLT, MJC and MF for ATA
2-Dec-04	0.5	conf call with HLT, MJC, MF and aircraft lessor to review ATA case
2-Dec-04	2.0	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, MF & HLT
2-Dec-04	1.5	review additional information provided by the Debtors concerning accounts receivable asset quality and outstanding liabilities including t/calls with Huron, review updated Cash Flow Forecast
3-Dec-04	0.3	discuss 1110 issues and leases with HLT and MJC
3-Dec-04	1.4	discuss KERP analysis with HLT and review related emails; discuss review of financial forecasts with HLT and MF
3-Dec-04	1.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members regarding analysis of various bids; discuss same with HLT, MF, SIO and MJC; review status of bids
3-Dec-04	4.2	t/call with L. Beckerman of Akin regarding KERP, review additional information forwarded by Huron, review selected KERP information, supervise the collection of additional airline KERP information
3-Dec-04	1.0	begin review of updated Dallas financial forecast

Date	TIME Hours	Description
3-Dec-04	0.8	draft agenda for meetings with Debtor next week, review updated cash flow forecast
4-Dec-04	2.0	conf call with HLT, MF, SIO, MJC and Huron to discuss status of M&A bids, M&A due diligence and information re claims; follow up conf call with Compass team re same
4-Dec-04	2.0	continue review of draft Dallas model
5-Dec-04	1.3	conf call with Huron and HLT, MF, SIO & MJC to discuss status of M&A bids, M&A due diligence and information re claims; follow up conf call with Compass team re same
5-Dec-04	2.6	work on bid and recovery analysis for Committee including multiple discussions with SIO, HLT and MF; review emails re qualifying bidders
5-Dec-04	5.5	work on recovery analysis
6-Dec-04	1.3	review comments on KERP analysis, review additional information concerning KERP
6-Dec-04	0.6	review information on aircraft lease fleet; discuss lease rejections with HLT
6-Dec-04	6.3	work on valuation and recovery including materials for Committee; discuss Southwest transaction; discuss KERP issues with HLT, review selected company analysis
6-Dec-04	5.0	work on recovery analysis
6-Dec-04	1.4	discuss KERP issues with HLT, review selected KERP analysis
6-Dec-04	2.5	review lease rejection and executory contract motions, t/calls and emails with Huron and Akin regarding same
7-Dec-04	2.7	Committee conf call; discuss options for ATA and review of factors affecting recoveries, including preparation
7-Dec-04	0.8	series of calls with HLT and MF incl. review of drafts of presentation to Committee
7-Dec-04	8.7	work on recovery analysis, review additional information provided by debtors, including work on committee presentation
7-Dec-04	1.2	Preliminary review of updated Dallas and Sunshine business models
8-Dec-04	5.0	travel to meetings in Indianapolis
8-Dec-04	1.5	series of discussions with Committee members and Committee counsel regarding bidders for ATA assets and value available for unsecured creditors
8-Dec-04	2.3	discussion with the Debtors regarding lease rejections and executory contract issues, discuss status of 1110 motions with SIO and HLT
8-Dec-04	1.5	discussions with HLT, MJC & MF regarding financial projections and report to Committee, status of various bidders and restructuring alternatives for ATA and unsecured creditors
8-Dec-04	1.5	meetings in Indianapolis regarding updated Dallas and Sunshine models
8-Dec-04	1.0	discussions with A. Singh of Huron regarding the valuation of various bid proposals and Committee objections to the KERP proposal
8-Dec-04	2.0	travel from Indianapolis to Chicago less time worked in transit
9-Dec-04	0.5	travel from hotel to meeting in Chicago
9-Dec-04	0.2	t/calls with HLT and MF regarding update on financial projections
9-Dec-04	2.5	meeting with Debtors, HLT, SIO & MJC regarding prospective bidders and summary financial information regarding reorganized ATA under alternative bids; incl. travel to and from
9-Dec-04	1.7	Committee meeting with HLT, SIO & MJC, including dinner with Committee
9-Dec-04	2.0	travel from Chicago to meeting in Greensboro (1/2)
10-Dec-04	0.2	t/call with A. Singh of Huron regarding expected fleet composition and staffing assumptions
11-Dec-04	1.0	review MF analysis of Sunshine vs. Dallas models
11-Dec-04	1.5	review news stories and emails concerning auction process, review submitted bids and ancillary agreements, bid comparison matrix

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Dec-04	0.6	review ATSB reporting package, analysis of liabilities subject to compromise
11-Dec-04	10.0	work on recovery matrix and conf call with HLT, SIO, MJC & Committee advisors to discuss Southwest proposal
11-Dec-04	3.5	work on recovery matrix, Committee presentation
12-Dec-04	1.0	prepare for Committee meeting
12-Dec-04	1.4	Committee conf call with MF, HLT, SIO & MJC to review Compass analysis of recoveries and discuss strategy for auction
12-Dec-04	5.0	travel to Indianapolis to participate in auction proceedings
12-Dec-04	3.0	meetings at Baker Daniels regarding the evaluation of potential proposals
12-Dec-04	2.7	meeting with MF, HLT, SIO & MJC re bidders to discuss options for improving bid; review various emails re same
12-Dec-04	0.3	series of t/calls with MF, HLT, SIO & MJC re bidders regarding form of bid
12-Dec-04	0.6	meeting with Huron, MF, HLT, SIO & MJC to review scorecard and issues for evaluating bids
12-Dec-04	3.3	work on bid analysis issues with HLT and MF and SIO incl. review of related emails & documents
13-Dec-04	13.0	participate in auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB and various bidders, multiple discussions with Committee members, SIO, HLT & MJC
14-Dec-04	11.2	auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB, MF, HLT, SIO & MJC and various bidders including multiple discussions with Committee members, and counsel including Committee conf call to review status of bidders
15-Dec-04	11.0	auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB and various bidders incl. multiple discussions with Committee members, counsel and HLT, MF, MJC and SIO
16-Dec-04	4.5	travel from auction to office with HLT & MF
16-Dec-04	0.7	Committee conf call with HLT, MF, MJC & SIO to review results of auction
16-Dec-04	0.5	review issues related to the KERP
17-Dec-04	1.0	review work program with HLT and MF including t/call with Huron; discuss KERP with HLT and PS; discuss report to Committee with MF
17-Dec-04	1.3	conf call with HLT, MJC, PS, MRC, Beckerman and Ferrante of Akin Gump re KERP, leases and upcoming sale motion; review related emails re KERP
17-Dec-04	2.5	review revised Dallas and Sunshine models
17-Dec-04	0.3	draft additional information request to Huron regarding KERP
20-Dec-04	0.4	review updated cash flow information with MJC, MF & HLT and report to Committee concerning cash flow, review background information concerning Denison
20-Dec-04	2.0	review backup material concerning KERP analysis
21-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with Committee professionals, SIO, MJC, MF & HLT and ATA to review status of leases
21-Dec-04	1.3	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, MF & HLT to discuss results of bankruptcy court hearing, ATSB, KERP and interview with John proposed Co-CRO
22-Dec-04	1.0	t/call with MJC, HLT, MF and proposed Co-CRO to discuss role of co-CRO
22-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with Beckerman and HLT regarding KERP, leases, ExecuJet, code share and recently filed motions in Court
4-Jan-05	1.5	conference call with L. Beckerman and other professionals to discuss KERP, follow-up conversations with HLT, SIO
4-Jan-05	2.5	t/calls with, Ortega of Akin, B. Buebel and R. Sammon of Huron regarding lease rejection issues, preliminary review of underlying documents
4-Jan-05	1.5	review background material concerning lease rejections and executory contracts
4-Jan-05	1.5	Committee professionals conf call on KERP with HLT & MJC
5-Jan-05	1.0	t/call with G. Viets of ATA and Compass professionals regarding next steps

Date	TIME Hours	Description
5-Jan-05	1.0	t/call with R. Sammon of Huron regarding lease rejections to schedule follow-up discussions concerning lease rejections, follow-up conversations with MRC and MF, continue review of underlying motions and spreadsheet from Huron
5-Jan-05	2.0	t/call with Creditors Committee including follow-up discussion with L. Beckerman of Akin Gump
5-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with MJC, SIO, HLT and Viets re fleet plan and business plan
5-Jan-05	0.5	discussions with MF and HLT regarding cash flow and Saab rejections, review email regarding rejection from R. Sammon of Huron
6-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up call with MJC, SIO and HLT re fleet plan and business plan
6-Jan-05	0.4	review revised KERP terms with PS
6-Jan-05	2.5	review updated cash flow report, follow-up on questions regarding ExecuJet personnel, draft email regarding previous due diligence requests, t/calls and emails regarding updated revised DIP restrictive covenants
6-Jan-05	0.7	t/call and emails regarding lease rejections and executory contract motions
6-Jan-05	0.2	respond to inquiry regarding Seabury work product
7-Jan-05	2.8	review response regarding update of ATSB revised restrictive covenants, review updated cash flow projections, review and analyze revised Fleet and Route plans
10-Jan-05	0.3	prepare for call with Committee with HLT, SIO and MF
10-Jan-05	1.0	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO, MJC & MF; review status of new business plan, CRO and CEO search, KERP and update on cash flow
10-Jan-05	0.5	review timing of projections with MF and HLT
10-Jan-05	0.5	t/calls with Huron regarding motions concerning Conseco, RR and GE
10-Jan-05	0.7	t/calls and emails regarding related party issues
10-Jan-05	0.5	organize t/call regarding revised Fleet and Route structure
10-Jan-05	0.5	review Compass report to Committee regarding cash flow
11-Jan-05	0.2	discuss KERP with HLT and review latest proposal from Debtors; discuss same with Beckerman; review emails related to Committee call and Committee professionals call re same
11-Jan-05	0.1	t/call with J. Pritchett regarding fleet configuration; discuss same with HLT and MF; and with Beckerman; review draft email response
11-Jan-05	2.0	conf call with SIO, HLT, MJC and Huron to review lease issues, KERP, and fleet
11-Jan-05	3.5	review Workers Comp motion, t/calls and emails with Huron regarding same, review underlying documents regarding Workers Comp, RR, GE, Conseco, organize information regarding lease rejection and executory contract issues
12-Jan-05	1.2	Committee conf call with HLT to discuss KERP
12-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with HLT and prospective CRO
12-Jan-05	0.3	discussion with HLT and Kennelly of Huron re P&L and fleet plan
12-Jan-05	0.1	Discussions re fleet plan with SIO
12-Jan-05	0.5	series of discussions with PS and HLT re KERP
13-Jan-05	0.5	discuss KERP revisions with HLT and PS; review Akin Gump email re same and respond
13-Jan-05	1.7	t/call with A. Ferrante of Akin regarding lease rejections and executory contracts, review underlying documentation, review analysis of simulator payment information
13-Jan-05	0.2	review announcements regarding code share
13-Jan-05	1.0	discuss options for ATA with MJC, HLT and SIO
14-Jan-05	0.5	discuss agenda items with HLT and MF for meetings at ATA
14-Jan-05	1.0	t/call with Viets, HLT, MJC, and MF re business plan and new exec. appointments
14-Jan-05	0.7	t/call with Botter, PS and HLT re KERP and debtor's response re same
14-Jan-05	0.7	t/call with Committee
14-Jan-05	1.2	review BETACO leases
14-Jan-05	1.0	review Compass analysis of cash flow for Committee, draft agenda for meetings

Date	TIME Hours	Description
17-Jan-05	6.2	review and organize materials related to executory contract motions, review cash flow information, review revised KERP proposal, review preliminary YTD analysis prepared by MF, repeated follow-up to adjust agenda for next weeks meetings in Indianapolis
17-Jan-05	0.1	review message from Committee member re options for ATA and discuss same with HLT
18-Jan-05	4.5	travel from Home to ATA
18-Jan-05	1.4	series of meetings with Debtor and Huron to discuss status of certain executory contract motions, their business rational and fundamental economics
18-Jan-05	0.8	meeting with ATA and Huron to discuss financial performance of ATA
18-Jan-05	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel
19-Jan-05	0.4	travel from hotel to meetings at ATA
19-Jan-05	7.2	series of meetings at ATA with Debtor and Huron to discuss code sharing, fleet composition, route changes and current financial performance of business lines
19-Jan-05	1.0	series of meetings with Debtors and Huron to discuss status of certain executory contract motions, their business rational and fundamental economics
19-Jan-05	5.0	travel from ATA to home
19-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re results of meetings with Debtors on business plan and review of operations
19-Jan-05	0.3	t/calls with HLT and MF re business plan
20-Jan-05	2.3	discussions with HLT and MF regarding update on Debtor visit, review follow-up material from meeting
20-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with L. Beckerman of Akin regarding ATSB collateral
20-Jan-05	0.5	discuss latest status on fleet with HLT & SIO
20-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up on ATSB collateral issue
20-Jan-05	0.3	t/calls with A. Ferrante of Akin regarding GE/RR maintenance agreements
20-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up on GE/RR issue including t/call with S. Frick of ATA
20-Jan-05	0.8	work on fee application
20-Jan-05	0.6	discuss status of due diligence meetings with HLT and MF; discuss same with MJC including options for ATA
20-Jan-05	4.4	analysis of RAM rotables asset management proposal, t/calls regarding motions to reject maintenance agreements
20-Jan-05	0.5	t/calls and emails to follow-up on questions regarding nature of ATSB collateral
20-Jan-05	0.5	review revised KERP terms, discuss same with MF & HLT
21-Jan-05	0.8	review analysis concerning RR and GE maintenance agreements
21-Jan-05	0.1	discuss with SIO re ATSB appraisal issues
21-Jan-05	0.5	review updated cash flow report, follow-up on questions concerning 757-200 ER auction, review press release regarding management changes
21-Jan-05	0.6	discuss due diligence follow-up with HLT and MJC
21-Jan-05	0.5	review revised KERP terms, discuss same with MF & HLT
24-Jan-05	0.6	review Debtors analysis regarding fleet maintenance costs
24-Jan-05	0.9	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT, MF, MJC and SIO re new presentation; t/calls with Hancock and Botter and t/call message to Cotton re same
24-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with Allison and HLT re status of new initiatives
24-Jan-05	5.0	travel to from New York to Indianapolis
24-Jan-05	0.4	travel from hotel to meetings at ATA
24-Jan-05	0.4	Meeting with SIO to review ATSB collateral analysis based on Memphis Gap/RAM findings
24-Jan-05	0.3	discuss rotables with HLT and HLT analysis re same
25-Jan-05	1.4	meetings at ATA with Huron, HLT and MJC re current status of ATA and near term projections; incl. travel to hotel following meetings
25-Jan-05	0.4	series of t/calls and emails with HLT, Beckerman & Botter re meeting at ATA; discuss same with SIO, MJC, MF and HLT

Date	TIME Hours	Description
25-Jan-05	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel
25-Jan-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
26-Jan-05	6.0	series of meetings at ATA with MF, HLT, MJC & SIO to review presentation and elements of new financial projections including discussion with Denison and t/call with Beckerman; meeting with Southwest re business opportunities at ATA incl. travel from hotel to ATA
26-Jan-05	1.0	t/call with Creditors Committee
26-Jan-05	4.5	travel from ATA to home
27-Jan-05	1.0	review ATA news stories, summary of pending motions, industry news
27-Jan-05	0.5	respond to inquiry regarding RR and GE motions
28-Jan-05	0.3	review emails re aircraft engines and discuss with HLT
31-Jan-05	0.3	review emails concerning tracking code share performance, t/calls with Huron to follow-up
1-Feb-05	0.7	t/calls with ATA/Huron regarding nature of 3 engine leases
1-Feb-05	0.3	t/calls with ATA/Huron with regards to nature and extent of reclamation claims
1-Feb-05	0.5	t/call with HLT and Beckerman regarding exclusivity and labor issues
2-Feb-05	0.5	discuss cash flow forecast with MF, review update of ATSB restrictive covenants
2-Feb-05	1.5	research issues pertaining to Southwest DIP restrictive covenant amendment, including t/calls with L. Beckerman of Akin and B. Buebel of Huron
2-Feb-05	1.7	review DIP proposed amendments to southwest DIP, review draft restrictive covenant calculations by Huron
2-Feb-05	0.2	discuss DIP amendments with HLT
2-Feb-05	1.2	t/call with Creditors Committee, including follow-up conversation with HLT, SIO, MF and MJC re cash flow and exclusivity
3-Feb-05	0.4	review emails regarding engine leases
3-Feb-05	0.2	discuss cash collateral with HLT
3-Feb-05	0.5	review updates to cash flow forecast
3-Feb-05	0.5	review emails regarding fluctuations in cash and revised ATSB cash covenants, discuss materials with MF
3-Feb-05	0.1	review Creditors Committee professional meeting scheduling issues with HLT and SIO
3-Feb-05	0.5	series of calls with HLT and MJC re desired sale of Chicago Express
3-Feb-05	0.5	discuss ATSB collateral issues with HLT & MF
4-Feb-05	0.5	review cash flow update to Committee with MF
4-Feb-05	0.5	review news article
7-Feb-05	3.7	review lease rejections, and renegotiated leases, work on draft analysis concerning lease rejection claims
7-Feb-05	1.0	t/call with Creditors Committee with HLT, SIO and MF re: cash flow
7-Feb-05	0.1	discuss status of aircraft leases with HLT
8-Feb-05	0.2	t/call and emails to ATA regarding ATSB collateral
8-Feb-05	3.5	series of t/call related to obtaining the stipulated loss value of the aircraft, work on analysis of stipulated losses and revision of rotables analysis
8-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with L. Beckerman of Akin regarding ATSB collateral and 757 stipulations
8-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with MJC regarding ATSB collateral and 757 stipulations
9-Feb-05	3.7	travel to Chicago for meetings with Chicago Express and ATA with HLT, SIO & MF
9-Feb-05	4.0	dinner meeting with Committee members, HLT, MJC, SIO and MF; primary topics were management leadership, fleet planning and employee negotiations
10-Feb-05	4.0	all party meeting with ATA management in Chicago, including HLT, SIO, MJC and MF
10-Feb-05	3.5	travel from Chicago to home
11-Feb-05	2.4	review ATSB collateral analysis for Beckerman memo

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Feb-05	1.5	t/call with Committee, HLT, SIO, MF, MJC and follow-up discussions, prepare follow-up email on cash flow
11-Feb-05	0.5	series of t/calls with HLT and MJC, Beckerman and certain Committee members re cash flow issues
13-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT regarding cash flow projection
13-Feb-05	1.0	discuss strategic alternatives with HLT, SIO and MJC
13-Feb-05	0.2	respond to questions regarding EETC auction
14-Feb-05	2.5	t/call and emails concerning issues to be discussed next week including ExecuJet, review cash analysis for Committee, t/calls with analyst concerning public information regarding ATA
14-Feb-05	1.7	series of discussions with HLT re due diligence and ExecuJet
15-Feb-05	5.0	travel to Indianapolis for meeting with ATA
15-Feb-05	1.5	meetings with Debtor, HLT, MF and MJC and Huron regarding rotables, fleet plans, issues pertaining to interrelationship of CE with ATA (accounting issues)
15-Feb-05	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel
15-Feb-05	2.0	series of discussions with Calavritinos, HLT, MJC and ATA senior mgmt re strategic options for ATA and fleet configuration at dinner meeting
16-Feb-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
16-Feb-05	5.7	continuation of meetings concerning fleet, rotables, executed, t/calls with Akin attorney's regarding potential settlement of 757 lease claims, including CEO Search Committee conf call with HLT, MF and MJC
16-Feb-05	4.5	travel from Indianapolis to home
17-Feb-05	0.3	travel from home to auction concerning 757-200ERs
17-Feb-05	12.0	attend auction concerning 757-200ERs, draft and forward email to Committee
17-Feb-05	0.3	travel from auction to home
17-Feb-05	1.6	t/call with Committee, HLT, MJC, SIO and MF and follow-up discussions including preparations regarding fleet analysis
18-Feb-05	0.2	update G. Viets of ATA regarding auction
18-Feb-05	1.2	review ATSB restrictive covenants revisions, series of t/calls regarding coordination with acquirers
21-Feb-05	0.5	review ExecuJet information
21-Feb-05	4.2	work on fee application
22-Feb-05	0.3	discussions re cash and exec. recruiting with SIO and HLT
22-Feb-05	0.4	t/calls and emails regarding simulator rejections
22-Feb-05	0.8	review proposed agreement with US Bancorp, review updated cash flow
22-Feb-05	6.5	work on fee application
23-Feb-05	0.2	discuss ExecuJet with HLT
23-Feb-05	0.4	t/calls and emails regarding GATX deal
23-Feb-05	9.0	work on fee application
24-Feb-05	0.2	t/calls to arrange update from Huron
24-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with L. Beckerman regarding Executed
24-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with MF regarding executes and cash flow
24-Feb-05	0.5	t/call with T. Allison of Huron regarding status of Company with MF, HLT and MJC
24-Feb-05	0.5	review cash flow analysis for Committee, including follow-up with MF
24-Feb-05	2.5	work on fee application
24-Feb-05	0.2	discuss ExecuJet with HLT
25-Feb-05	0.7	t/calls and emails related to analysis of GE simulator rejection
25-Feb-05	1.8	t/call with Committee and follow-up with Committee Chair with HLT, MF and MJC re cash flow, fleet plan, hangar sale
25-Feb-05	0.3	conference call with Arthur C., Creditors Committee Chair, HLT and MJC re industry operating conditions
28-Feb-05	0.3	t/calls and discussions concerning BETACO stipulations

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Feb-05	0.3	series of discussions with HLT re ATA presentation on business plan
1-Mar-05	0.8	review draft Committee presentation from Debtor
2-Mar-05	3.4	work on fee application
2-Mar-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman, HLT and MJC re HLT's discussion with Lazard re ATA's business plan
3-Mar-05	0.7	organize case files
3-Mar-05	0.2	emails with L. Beckerman of Akin Gump regarding new business plan and other matters
3-Mar-05	2.2	conf call with MJC, SIO, Viets, Graber and Barnett re sourcing and getting into service new fleet of 737s and 767s
3-Mar-05	0.5	discuss business plan and due diligence with HLT, MF and MJC
4-Mar-05	2.5	discussion with HLT regarding work plan for next week, scheduling for travel, t/calls with MJC regarding meetings next week, t/calls and emails to B. Buebel of Huron regarding work plan for next week, review spreadsheet regarding 767 availability, work on market value of Lear, Cessna, Helicopter
4-Mar-05	0.6	discussion with HLT and SIO re fleet
6-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re review of ATA business plan
7-Mar-05	4.5	travel to ATA from Home
7-Mar-05	3.5	meetings with Huron, MF, MJC and Debtors regarding status of ATA
7-Mar-05	3.2	dinner with Committee Members, HLT, MF and MJC re: case issues
7-Mar-05	0.4	travel from ATA to Hotel
8-Mar-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
8-Mar-05	6.5	meetings at ATA with Huron, HLT, SIO, MJC, MF and Debtors regarding priorities and fleet plan
8-Mar-05	7.5	travel from ATA to home with HLT and MF including discussion with HLT re: business plans
9-Mar-05	1.4	t/call with HLT, SIO, MJC, MF, DI and Creditors Committee regarding status of Business plan
9-Mar-05	0.3	discuss fleet plan with HLT and MJC
9-Mar-05	0.4	discuss work plan with HLT
9-Mar-05	0.7	series of discussions with HLT to continue review of business plan and prepare for Committee conf call
10-Mar-05	0.7	review status of lease rejection motions with L. Beckerman and N. Ortega of Akin Gump, follow-up on Betaco issues
10-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with B. Buebel of Huron and W. Malone of ATA regarding claims analysis
10-Mar-05	3.7	series of t/calls with Schulte, MJC, HLT, Denison and SIO regarding strategic options for ATA including discussion of fleet
10-Mar-05	0.3	discuss business plan and work program with HLT
11-Mar-05	0.7	discussions with HLT, SIO, MJC regarding corporate strategy for ATA
14-Mar-05	1.1	emails with B. Buebel of Huron regarding scheduling attendance meeting in Indy concerning the business plan, continue research on valuation of ExecuJet,
15-Mar-05	4.5	travel from home to Indy
15-Mar-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
15-Mar-05	7.5	meetings with Debtor, Huron, ATSB regarding issues concerning business plan, follow-up on meetings concerning ExecuJet
15-Mar-05	4.5	travel from ATA to home
16-Mar-05	4.0	work on ExecuJet analysis including discussion with HLT, review cash flow analysis, t/calls with B. Buebel of Huron and L. Beckerman of Akin Gump regarding same
16-Mar-05	0.4	t/calls with ATA bondholders
17-Mar-05	0.4	t/call with S. Frick and J. Denison of ATA regarding ExecuJet negotiations, t/calls and discussions with HLT regarding same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Mar-05	0.2	discuss HLT t/calls with Denison re strategic direction and fleet with HLT and MJC
23-Mar-05	2.5	t/calls and discussion with HLT and MF regarding value of ATA aircraft, BETACO and review cash flow statement
24-Mar-05	2.0	t/call with HLT, DI, MF, MJC, SIO and Committee, follow-up discussions concerning meeting in Indianapolis regarding business plan
24-Mar-05	0.2	prepare conf call with HLT and MF
25-Mar-05	0.2	review news stories regarding airline industry
25-Mar-05	0.3	discuss latest term sheet from Q aviation re aircraft with HLT and MJC
28-Mar-05	0.7	conference call with Creditors Committee, HLT, SIO and MJC to discuss the status of the auction process
1-Apr-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
1-Apr-05	0.7	meetings with HLT and DI at ATA regarding status of business plan process
3-Apr-05	1.0	review emails regarding executory contract issues coordinate responses
4-Apr-05	0.2	discuss hearing with HLT
5-Apr-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
5-Apr-05	7.0	review materials from 10K and monthly operating reports including discussions with DI
5-Apr-05	0.5	discussions with HLT re ASIG stipulations and Southwest DIP agreement
5-Apr-05	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel
6-Apr-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
6-Apr-05	7.5	series of discussions with DI, HLT, SIO and others regarding financial performance, status of cash flow and case strategy
6-Apr-05	5.5	travel from ATA to home
7-Apr-05	6.0	work on cash reports, begin analysis of monthly operating report including discussions with DI and HLT
7-Apr-05	2.6	conference call with MJC, HLT, L. Beckerman of Akin, Huron and ATA regarding potential need to raise new capital, follow-up discussions with HLT, MJC, SIO and others
8-Apr-05	1.5	work with DI regarding update of financial information for ATA and discuss with HLT
8-Apr-05	1.8	t/call with HLT, MJC, Debtors and Huron regarding financing requirements for ATA, including follow-up discussion
8-Apr-05	2.0	t/call with HLT, SIO, MJC, debtors and Huron regarding POR, including follow-up discussion
10-Apr-05	1.3	follow-up on Committee requests concerning cash-flow analysis, review analysis of ATA operating information
11-Apr-05	0.7	series of t/calls with Debtors regarding potential financing issues, POR structure and potential time-line
11-Apr-05	0.4	discuss operating report analysis with DI
12-Apr-05	0.3	discuss business plan and cash flow with HLT
12-Apr-05	1.7	ATA Committee conference call with HLT, SIO, MJC concerning financing issues, review 767-300 LOI, follow-up with Debtors concerning contract rejection motions
12-Apr-05	0.6	discuss operating report analysis with DI
13-Apr-05	0.7	review cash flow analysis draft and discuss with DI, follow-up on code-sharing agreement
13-Apr-05	0.3	discuss work program with HLT
13-Apr-05	1.2	meeting with Allison and HLT re strategic options
14-Apr-05	1.2	series of t/calls and emails regarding various asset rejection motions
14-Apr-05	0.4	discuss code share data and business plan with HLT
14-Apr-05	0.3	discuss operating report and cash flow analysis with DI

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Apr-05	1.4	review motion summaries, respond to inquiries from bondholder, respond to inquiries concerning the ATSB collateral from Akin
15-Apr-05	0.7	discuss status of ATA's cash and fleet and upcoming business plan and establishing plan to review same with HLT, MJC and SIO
15-Apr-05	0.3	discuss operating report and cash flow analysis with DI and HLT
16-Apr-05	2.5	review files and collect notes for meeting regarding Debtors financial projections
18-Apr-05	4.0	travel to Indianapolis with HLT and SIO for meetings with Debtors et. al.
18-Apr-05	2.0	review operating information concerning ATA and t/call with DI
18-Apr-05	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel
18-Apr-05	4.0	meetings with ATA management, HLT, MJC, SIO, ATSB, Committee professionals and Southwest for presentation and discussion of business plan for 2005 incl. prelim discussion re same with Allison & HLT
19-Apr-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
19-Apr-05	5.0	travel from Indianapolis to Home with HLT and SIO
19-Apr-05	4.4	meetings with HLT, SIO, MJC with regards to business plan, potential structure of POR, financing issues
19-Apr-05	1.6	Committee conf call with HLT and SIO to review results of business plan
19-Apr-05	0.2	t/call discussion with DI regarding operating report analysis
20-Apr-05	1.0	t/call with G. Viets and S. Brown of ATA about necessity to sell Ambassador
20-Apr-05	0.7	review cash flow analysis draft and discuss with DI, including follow-up phone calls with Debtors
20-Apr-05	2.5	continue review of revised ATA business plan, including discussion with HLT
20-Apr-05	1.0	discuss and review cost saving initiatives proposed to ATA, including discussion with HLT re Fuel Services Agreement
20-Apr-05	0.4	series of t/calls regarding Sabre and other motions to provide support to Committee positions
20-Apr-05	1.2	review motions related to partial rejection of Florida lease arrangements
20-Apr-05	1.8	meeting at Compass with Schulte to review strategic options, business plan and cash needs with HLT and SIO and MJC by phone
21-Apr-05	0.7	review content of cash flow analysis including discussion with DI, forward to Committee
21-Apr-05	1.5	review draft of first quarterly financial review
21-Apr-05	0.5	review progress on reflecting ATA
21-Apr-05	1.0	t/calls with ATA Bondholders
22-Apr-05	1.5	review operating report analysis and discuss with DI, comparative information from AD
25-Apr-05	1.7	t/call with J. Denison and S. Frick of ATA, HLT, MJC, SIO regarding status of cost saving measures
25-Apr-05	2.0	review ATA business plan and 1st Quarter Financial Information including discussion with DI
25-Apr-05	0.7	review and follow-up on lease objections other legal issues
26-Apr-05	0.7	conf call with Committee co-chair, SIO, MJC and HLT re business plan review and capital requirements
26-Apr-05	2.0	ATA Committee Conference Call with HLT, MJC, SIO regarding next steps for business plan review and capital requirements, including advance prep and follow-up discussion with HLT
26-Apr-05	0.3	discuss operating report analysis with DI
27-Apr-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re daily reporting packages for the ATSB
27-Apr-05	0.4	discuss operating report and cash flow analysis with DI
28-Apr-05	1.0	review cash flow with DI including t/calls with ATA
29-Apr-05	0.7	Committee conf call with HLT, SIO, MJC; report on fleet status and recent proposed settlements of certain claims
2-May-05	2.0	review Ambassador CDM and other information

Date	TIME Hours	Description
2-May-05	0.1	discussion with SIO re cash flows
2-May-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re cash position
2-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re AmbasadAir
3-May-05	0.5	t/calls and discussion with HLT regarding cash flow and AmbasadAir
3-May-05	0.2	review aircraft term sheets
3-May-05	0.3	review email correspondence regarding Indianapolis Airport Authority negotiations
3-May-05	1.4	t/call with S. Frick and S. Brown of ATA regarding AmbasadAir, emails and discussion regarding TransMeridian contract motion
3-May-05	2.8	follow-up discussions with S. Brown and G. Viets of ATA regarding AmbasadAir, follow-up emails requesting more information, review company information provided in response to inquiries, follow-up on TransMeridian contract, draft email response to Committee professionals
4-May-05	0.3	review materials related to operation data processing for ATA, including discussion with HLT
4-May-05	2.0	t/call with ATA, HLT, SIO, MJC, DI regarding Cash flow, follow-up email to L. Beckerman of Akin regarding same, including discussion with DI and Jack Schultz regarding same
4-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT regarding work plan
4-May-05	1.0	review AmbasadAir confidential descriptive memorandum, including discussion with HLT
4-May-05	1.2	work on fee application
5-May-05	3.4	review weekly cash flow report, draft cover memo to report, circulate to Committee; including discussion with DI re cash flow analysis and business plan analysis
6-May-05	0.2	follow-up on inquiry concerning ATSB collateral
6-May-05	0.3	review ALPA response to Debtors motion
6-May-05	4.5	telephonically attend presentations from Investment Bankers for AmbasadAir, follow-up and discussions with HLT, DI, L. Beckerman of Akin and others
9-May-05	0.2	review M. Malone of ATA response to due diligence inquiry
9-May-05	1.2	follow-up on issues via series of t/calls and emails concerning equipment lease rejections
9-May-05	0.5	follow-up on Committee position regarding the sale of AmbasadAir, including t/calls with L. Beckerman and others including discussion with HLT
9-May-05	0.8	discuss work program with HLT and review pending issues with HLT
10-May-05	0.2	discussion with SIO re SIO's review of Debtors' revised forecast
10-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re his review of the weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
10-May-05	1.2	discussions with HLT and MJC re new CFO, new SVP, business plan, cash burn and new financing requirements
10-May-05	0.6	t/call with Denison re CFO and fleet changes with HLT and SIO
10-May-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re Committee meeting and recent developments with HLT and SIO
11-May-05	4.5	travel from home to meetings at ATA
11-May-05	0.2	review email concerning ATA recruiting process
11-May-05	3.0	meeting with Huron and ATA regarding outstanding rejection motions, process for rejection motions with committee, cash flow projection process, issues pertaining to revisions in cash flow estimates
11-May-05	2.5	review weekly cash flow report and discuss with HLT, draft cover memo to report, circulate to Committee, including discussion with DI and Dan Sutter
11-May-05	1.2	Committee conf call with HLT, SIO, MJC and DI to discuss new CFO and SVP, exclusivity, sale of AmbasadAir, etc.
11-May-05	0.4	travel from ATA to hotel

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-May-05	0.3	prepare for Committee conf call with HLT and discuss agenda items
12-May-05	0.4	travel from hotel to ATA
12-May-05	5.0	travel from ATA to home
12-May-05	3.5	meetings with S. Brown of ATA and D. Grende of Huron regarding AmbassadAir, meetings with Sean Frick and others regarding cash flow, business plan and other topics; review weekly cash flow report and discussion with DI and Dan Sutter, including update HLT re activities and meetings at ATA
16-May-05	0.2	review emails regarding BETACO due diligence, including discussion with HLT
16-May-05	0.2	discuss reporting packages for the ATSB with HLT
18-May-05	0.5	discuss business plan analysis with HLT; cash flow analysis including discussions with DI and Dan Sutter
18-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re his review of the weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
19-May-05	0.3	discussion cash flow analysis with DI
19-May-05	0.7	multiple discussions with MJC, SIO, HLT, DI, Akin Gump and ATA re Debtor's 1113 motions and pilot productivity
23-May-05	0.4	series of t/calls with HLT concerning travel arrangements and scope of preparation for Court Hearing regarding ALPA 1113(e) motion
23-May-05	0.2	discussion with SIO, HLT and F. Conway re preparation for meeting in ATA with management
23-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re his t/call with Botter and MJC re labor negotiations and attendance at court hearing
24-May-05	1.7	review cash reports and other ATA operating information
24-May-05	5.2	review motions, affidavits, and analysis concerning ALPA 1113(e) motion
24-May-05	5.0	travel from New York to Louisville Court hearing
24-May-05	0.5	series of t/calls with HLT and D. Botter of Akin regarding ALPA 1113(e) hearing
24-May-05	0.5	t/calls with SIO, MJC and HLT re rights offering and strategic alternatives
25-May-05	0.5	travel from hotel in Louisville to court hearing in New Albany
25-May-05	7.5	attend Court hearing in New Albany primarily regarding the Debtors 1113(e) motion concerning ALPA, including t/call with HLT re same
25-May-05	7.0	travel from Court hearing to home
25-May-05	0.5	work on fee application
25-May-05	0.2	discuss with HLT re his review of the weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
26-May-05	0.5	review weekly cash flow report including follow-up phone call with Debtors, including discussion with DI and Dan Sutter
26-May-05	0.5	review emails regarding lease rejection issues, motion summaries and other matters
26-May-05	0.4	researched and replied to inquiry from Committee member
27-May-05	0.3	discuss and review email concerning additional cost savings to pursue
27-May-05	0.5	review rights offering draft
27-May-05	1.0	Committee conference call with HLT, MJC, SIO, DI to review results of 1113 motion and meeting with ATSB, ATA and SouthWest
27-May-05	0.2	discuss Boeing claim with HLT
27-May-05	0.3	discuss valuation metrics with HLT and DI
31-May-05	2.1	t/call with S. Frick, et al from ATA, Huron and Compass team regarding cost savings initiatives
31-May-05	1.2	follow-up discussions with HLT, SIO, MJC regarding cost saving initiatives
31-May-05	2.0	Committee conference call with L. Beckerman, HLT, SIO and MJC regarding cost saving initiatives, Debtor business plan and other matters
31-May-05	0.5	review analysis with DI regarding financial projections published in 8K, financial projections provided on the call.
31-May-05	4.5	review 8K, MOR and updated projections

Date	TIME Hours	Description
31-May-05	1.0	t/calls with bondholders concerning 8K
1-Jun-05	0.3	review analysis of revised projections with DI and Dan Sutter
1-Jun-05	0.2	t/call with F. Conway of ATA regarding business plan; discuss same with SIO and HLT; discussion with SIO regarding flight schedule and profitability
1-Jun-05	0.5	review April 2005 monthly operating report and discuss with HLT
1-Jun-05	0.4	review reconciliation of business plan drafts
1-Jun-05	3.4	review Boeing claim analysis
1-Jun-05	0.5	review ATSB reporting package, review Compass summary
1-Jun-05	0.2	review ATA docket
1-Jun-05	0.3	review summary of fleet motions from J. Humphrey of Akin
1-Jun-05	1.0	t/call presentation by Jefferies regarding fund raising engagement
1-Jun-05	0.6	review draft rights offering term sheet
1-Jun-05	2.0	work on fee application
2-Jun-05	0.5	review weekly cash flow analysis, including discussion with DI
2-Jun-05	0.1	review email from HLT concerning profitability
2-Jun-05	1.3	t/call with L. Beckerman of Akin and HLT regarding CFO milestones and Compass work program, follow-up on issues pertaining to BETACO
2-Jun-05	0.2	review Compass weekly cash flow report and discuss same with HLT
2-Jun-05	3.8	work on fee application
3-Jun-05	1.7	conf call with HLT, SIO, L. Beckerman of Akin, ATA, ATSB and Southwest regarding status report from ATA on corporate finance, fleet and other key issues
3-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with Schulte regarding rights offering discuss with HLT
3-Jun-05	0.2	review revised financing term sheet
6-Jun-05	0.3	discuss BETACO with HLT and SIO
6-Jun-05	0.2	t/call message to Beckerman concerning investment banker, discuss retention with HLT
6-Jun-05	0.3	review update on IAA settlement discussions
6-Jun-05	0.7	t/call with W. Malone of ATA and B. Buebel of Huron concerning BETACO issues
6-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with HLT and DI re EETC analysis
7-Jun-05	0.7	discuss and review draft analysis of EETC yields to maturity for Boeing claim analysis, including discussion with DI
7-Jun-05	2.5	web search and series of t/calls and emails regarding appropriate rates for BETACO yacht contract
8-Jun-05	0.3	series of t/calls regarding labor issues
8-Jun-05	0.5	review and edit ATA cash analysis with DI
8-Jun-05	0.7	review summary from R. Meyer of ATA regarding labor negotiations
8-Jun-05	0.6	series of discussions with HLT regarding valuation and discount rates for aircraft and lease rejection claims
8-Jun-05	3.4	draft Boeing recovery analysis
8-Jun-05	0.3	discuss retention of Banker by ATA with HLT, SIO and L. Beckerman of Akin
8-Jun-05	0.1	t/call with HLT to Frank Conway of ATA re industry status
8-Jun-05	0.2	discussions with DI re EETC analysis and cash flow analysis with Dan Sutter
9-Jun-05	0.8	t/call with A. Ferrante of Akin regarding Pitney Bowes motion concerning Chicago Express, follow-up emails and analysis
9-Jun-05	0.2	review update on IAA settlement discussions
9-Jun-05	0.3	review update from R. Meyer of ATA regarding labor negotiations
10-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with S. Frick of ATA regarding Boeing recovery analysis, follow-up discussions with L. Beckerman
10-Jun-05	0.5	t/calls and follow-up on Pitney Bowes rejection, follow-up discussions with DI regarding G. strips
10-Jun-05	0.5	review materials concerning BETACO relationship
10-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with DI re EETC analysis

Date	TIME Hours	Description
13-Jun-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss cash covenants with HLT and DI
13-Jun-05	0.5	review revisions to cash collateral motion
13-Jun-05	2.5	t/call with W. Malone of ATA regarding BETACO relationships, discuss BETACO with HLT and review related emails
13-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with DI re investigation of yacht usage by George Mikelsons
14-Jun-05	0.2	discuss weekly ATSB cash flow projections with HLT and DI
14-Jun-05	0.5	t/calls and emails regarding Boeing settlement terms
14-Jun-05	1.2	t/calls with bondholders regarding ATA public information
14-Jun-05	0.2	discuss pricing of Denison options with SIO and HLT
15-Jun-05	0.5	review AMR administrative claim documents, including discussions with SIO and HLT
16-Jun-05	0.3	discuss issues regarding solvency with HLT
16-Jun-05	0.5	review and update cash flow analysis, including discussion with DI and Dan Sutter
16-Jun-05	0.2	review emails regarding IAA settlement discussions, Boeing settlement discussions
16-Jun-05	1.5	review background materials concerning deepening insolvency analysis
17-Jun-05	0.2	review updates on labor negotiations
17-Jun-05	0.2	review Boeing extension stipulations
20-Jun-05	1.1	conf call with ATA sr. mgmt with SIO, MJC, HLT and DI to get update on fleet, cost savings and upcoming business plan; incl. follow-up t/calls to discuss same
20-Jun-05	0.2	review emails concerning mercer retention
20-Jun-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re Mercer retention by Debtors
20-Jun-05	1.0	meeting with ATA bondholder
20-Jun-05	0.5	t/calls with bondholders regarding ATA public information
21-Jun-05	0.2	review update on Goodrich motion
21-Jun-05	0.3	t/calls with SIO and HLT re Mercer; review related emails re same
22-Jun-05	0.2	t/call with W. Malone of ATA concerning BETACO issues
22-Jun-05	0.7	review Boeing proposal regarding claim settlement
22-Jun-05	1.5	discussions with D. Grende of Huron regarding SAAB settlement discussions, review materials
22-Jun-05	0.3	review various emails from HLT re discussions with noteholders
22-Jun-05	1.1	Committee conference call with HLT, MJC, SIO and DI to review latest developments re business plan, new financing, etc.
22-Jun-05	0.5	t/calls with bondholders regarding ATA public information
23-Jun-05	1.5	t/call with A. Ferrante of Akin to discuss AMR claims, review underlying materials, follow-up inquires, discussions with D. Grende of Huron
23-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with DI and Dan Sutter re cash flow analysis
24-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with DI and Dan Sutter re cash flow analysis
27-Jun-05	0.3	email HLT re ATA information requests and discuss with HLT
27-Jun-05	0.4	discuss HLT t/call with Beckerman re status of various projects and comments re discussions with noteholders with HLT
28-Jun-05	1.6	series of t/calls with L. Beckerman of Akin, HLT and SIO re Boeing; series of follow-up discussions regarding same with DI, HLT and SIO
28-Jun-05	1.7	conference call with HLT, SIO, MJC, ATA officials (F. Conway, S. Frick and S. Karnik) re cost savings and progress toward development of updated business plan.
28-Jun-05	1.4	conference call with MJC, HLT, SIO, Akin Gump re upcoming Committee call
29-Jun-05	1.8	discuss strategic options for ATA with HLT, DI, MJC and SIO; review strategic options for ATA including series of discussions regarding same including status of major claims with HLT
29-Jun-05	1.5	Committee conference call with HLT, MJC, SIO and DI to review latest developments re business plan, new financing, Boeing claim, Mercer, etc.

Date	TIME Hours	Description
30-Jun-05	0.5	review updates of fleet issues, briefly review operating report
30-Jun-05	0.8	series of discussions with HLT, Beckerman, DI and MJC re strategic options, discussions with ad hoc committee noteholders, guarantee of subs to ATSB, etc.
30-Jun-05	0.5	series of discussions with HLT, Beckerman, and DI re Boeing claim
30-Jun-05	0.4	discussions with DI re EETC analysis and cash flow analysis
30-Jun-05	5.5	draft of HLT affidavit re Boeing litigation including discussions with HLT, t/calls with S. Frick to locate correct parties for discussions at Boeing, review research regarding Boeing other discussions
1-Jul-05	0.5	brief review of Debtors monthly operating report
1-Jul-05	0.6	work on analysis of historic financial condition, including discussions with PS et al.
1-Jul-05	0.1	review ATA docket
1-Jul-05	0.7	travel to and from Akin Gump for meeting
1-Jul-05	0.4	discuss Boeing claim process with HLT
1-Jul-05	0.4	t/calls with HLT to G. Viets of ATA and other concerning Ambassador
1-Jul-05	0.3	t/calls regarding the creation of an ATA ad hoc bondholder committee
5-Jul-05	0.2	coordinate logistics for fleet conference call discussion
5-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with HLT to Committee co-chair re trading values of EETC's
5-Jul-05	0.5	t/call with Bondholder to discuss public ATA information
5-Jul-05	0.4	series of discussions with HLT and PS re ATSB claim and sub guarantees
6-Jul-05	0.2	coordinate cash report, including discussion with DI and Dan Sutter
6-Jul-05	0.2	review blanket approvals of 767s
7-Jul-05	0.2	review IAA settlement letter
7-Jul-05	0.2	cash flow discussion with DI
8-Jul-05	0.4	review cash flow analysis and discuss with DI
8-Jul-05	0.7	prepare for Boeing claim litigation including multiple discussions with HLT, MJC and DI
8-Jul-05	1.0	review materials concerning IAA settlement discussions, review materials regarding Boeing settlement discussions, including discussion with HLT re IAA lease
11-Jul-05	1.2	discuss and review consolidation analysis with PS and Beckerman
11-Jul-05	4.9	review email pertaining to IAA discussions, follow-up review of issues, t/calls with N. Ortega of Akin, review leases, follow-up email
11-Jul-05	2.3	follow up work and discussions regarding Boeing; settlement discussions with Akin Gump team and MJC, HLT, review Compass expert report, follow-up on interest rate discussions with HLT
12-Jul-05	2.0	work on Boeing claim calculation with MJC and HLT, including discussion with MJC, HLT and DR
12-Jul-05	1.4	series of discussions with Akin Gump team regarding settlement parameters with Boeing review calculations in detail with HLT and review of proposed settlement documents
12-Jul-05	1.7	t/call with S. Claffey of Baker and L. Beckerman of Akin regarding IAA settlement discussions, follow-up conversations with A. Ferrante of Akin, review update
13-Jul-05	0.5	coordinate items for upcoming meetings with ATA regarding business plan with HLT
13-Jul-05	0.6	discussions with PS regarding company guaranty analyses
13-Jul-05	1.0	review Boeing settlement drafts, review memo from J. Humphrey of Akin
13-Jul-05	1.2	follow-up on IAA settlement discussions with D. Yakola of ATA, follow-up conversations with L. Beckerman of Akin
13-Jul-05	0.5	review services rendered section
14-Jul-05	0.3	make travel arrangements for Indy trip
14-Jul-05	0.3	review special charges analysis from PS

Date	TIME Hours	Description
14-Jul-05	0.5	series of conversations with SIO, HLT and MJC re conversations with F. Conway; t/call message to Beckerman re same
14-Jul-05	1.0	t/call with S. Claffey of Baker and L. Beckerman of Akin regarding IAA settlement discussions
14-Jul-05	1.0	Committee conference call with HLT, MJC, SIO, DI to discuss IAA issues, Exec. comp issues, implications of business plan; ATSB guarantees
14-Jul-05	0.3	t/call with Bondholder to discuss public ATA information
15-Jul-05	0.2	review ATA press release
15-Jul-05	0.5	review objections to IAA motion
15-Jul-05	0.2	responded to Bondholder emails
18-Jul-05	0.3	t/calls regarding IAA settlement
18-Jul-05	4.5	travel to Indy for meeting
18-Jul-05	1.5	meetings with ATA regarding Ambassador and other matters
18-Jul-05	6.5	meetings with HLT, MJC, SIO, ATA management, Jefferies/Skyworks, Southwest, ATSB, and Committee professionals and co-chairs Southwest for presentation and discussion of business plan for 2005 and 2006, cash systems, substantive consolidation and cross guarantee issues; including follow-up discussion at dinner with Committee professionals
18-Jul-05	0.3	travel from meeting to hotel
18-Jul-05	0.2	review email concerning Mikelsons' severance
18-Jul-05	0.2	cash flow discussion with DI and Jack Schultz
19-Jul-05	5.5	travel from Indianapolis to NYC
19-Jul-05	0.3	review cash flow analysis, including discussion with DI and Dan Sutter
19-Jul-05	0.2	responded to email from A. Ferrante of Akin regarding IAA settlement
19-Jul-05	3.5	meeting with Smith, Terry, PS and Beckerman to review individual corporate financials
20-Jul-05	1.0	t/call with E. Schaffer and T. Korsman of Committee, DI and HLT
20-Jul-05	0.3	review cash flow analysis, including discussion with DI
20-Jul-05	0.4	review financial projections with HLT
20-Jul-05	0.3	review summary of IAA motion
21-Jul-05	0.3	discuss business plan next steps with HLT; t/call with F. Conway
21-Jul-05	0.1	review ATA docket
21-Jul-05	1.7	review SAAB settlement motion, t/calls with ATA regarding substance of same, follow-up conversations with Akin
21-Jul-05	0.1	email HLT noteholders re info request and discuss with HLT
21-Jul-05	1.5	review Ambassador marketing materials
21-Jul-05	0.2	cash flow analysis discussion with DI
22-Jul-05	1.0	review Sage Popovich report
22-Jul-05	0.5	review projections and liquidation analysis filed by US Airways
22-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with A. Calavritinos of Committee regarding ATA performance
22-Jul-05	1.8	follow-up discussions with N. Ortega of Akin regarding SAAB motion, review updates to IAA discussions, review Goodrich update
22-Jul-05	0.7	t/calls and follow-up concerning the status of Ambassador
22-Jul-05	0.5	review update email on Ambassador marketing process
22-Jul-05	0.8	t/call with HLT re meeting at ATA; series of emails and discussions with F. Conway and HLT re same
25-Jul-05	5.0	travel to Indy for meeting
25-Jul-05	4.5	meeting at ATA with HLT, MJC, SIO, F. Conway to review business plan incl. dinner meeting with ATA senior mgmt re same
25-Jul-05	0.2	review latest draft of IAA settlement and discuss with HLT, review update regarding Goodrich

Date	TIME Hours	Description
26-Jul-05	4.5	meeting at ATA with HLT, MJC, F. Conway, et. al. to review business plan, discuss cross guarantees including dinner meeting with ATA senior mgmt regarding same
26-Jul-05	4.0	travel from Indianapolis to NYC with HLT
26-Jul-05	2.5	review marketing materials update for Ambassador
26-Jul-05	0.5	series of t/calls with SIO, MJC and HLT re capital raise
27-Jul-05	0.5	review cash flow analysis, including discussion with DI and Dan Sutter
27-Jul-05	0.7	review various emails re IAA, including discussions with HLT
27-Jul-05	0.8	t/call with D. Yakola of ATA regarding update to IAA settlement discussions, follow-up with L. Beckerman of Akin
27-Jul-05	0.3	t/calls and/or discussions with HLT regarding strategic options
28-Jul-05	0.2	discuss BETACO with HLT
28-Jul-05	0.5	t/call with D. Yakola of ATA regarding update to IAA settlement discussions, follow-up with L. Beckerman of Akin
28-Jul-05	0.2	discuss IAA settlement and use of Mikelsons yacht with HLT
28-Jul-05	4.4	review update to BETACO analysis, t/calls and follow-up on issues, emails and communications with Akin
28-Jul-05	1.3	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO, MJC, DI re IAA settlement, CEO comp and JGM severance package
28-Jul-05	0.2	cash flow analysis discussion with DI
29-Jul-05	0.5	review ATA monthly operating report
29-Jul-05	0.3	review reservation of rights
29-Jul-05	2.2	t/call with ATA regarding Ambassador draft email regarding update on Ambassador sale process and discuss with HLT
29-Jul-05	0.3	review US trustee's objection to Akin fee application
1-Aug-05	0.3	review format for describing airline performance from HLT
1-Aug-05	0.5	brief review of June operating report
1-Aug-05	2.3	review emails regarding IAA from Akin, series of t/calls regarding status of IAA leasing
1-Aug-05	0.8	follow-up on issues pertaining to BETACO, including t/call with W. Malone of ATA
1-Aug-05	0.2	discussion with SIO re lease rates for aircraft
1-Aug-05	0.2	emails to/from HLT re Committee valuation report
2-Aug-05	0.4	review ATA DIP revisions
2-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with W. Malone of ATA regarding BETACO
2-Aug-05	0.3	review email regarding IAA revisions
2-Aug-05	1.2	conf call with HLT, MJC, SIO and ATA re Mercer
3-Aug-05	0.5	review proposed settlement with Mikelsons
3-Aug-05	1.5	review L. Beckerman of Akin's draft regarding Committee response
3-Aug-05	2.5	review follow-up information concerning BETACO
3-Aug-05	0.3	t/call to M. Hinds of Baker regarding Okun motion
3-Aug-05	2.4	review revised draft ATA offering memorandum
4-Aug-05	0.2	review email concerning ASG appointment
4-Aug-05	0.2	review and respond to email concerning Okun issues
4-Aug-05	1.0	t/call to discuss capital issues
4-Aug-05	1.5	t/call with ABT, DI and Committee re CEO severance arrangement, cash flow report, and process issues
4-Aug-05	1.2	call with HLT, SIO, MJC, DI and Creditors Committee re Mikelsons settlement and other matters
4-Aug-05	1.2	conf call with F. Conway, SIO and HLT to review cash saving initiatives and status of same
5-Aug-05	0.3	review ATA cash flow analysis
5-Aug-05	1.2	review IAA settlement draft agreements

Date	TIME Hours	Description
5-Aug-05	0.5	review Okun objection
5-Aug-05	0.3	review Akin summaries of lease motions
5-Aug-05	0.5	t/call with G. Viets, S. Brown of ATA et. al. concerning progress of Ambassador sale.
5-Aug-05	0.7	t/call regarding the Information Memorandum for ATA fund raising
5-Aug-05	0.2	review Ambassador update
5-Aug-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re status of ATA HQ
5-Aug-05	0.2	update from HLT re his t/calls with Beckerman, Schuller and Steinberg of Jefferies
5-Aug-05	1.0	conf call with Debtor, ATA management, Jefferies and HLT and ABT re Jefferies book
5-Aug-05	0.3	discuss with HLT re email from Beckerman re meeting with Klein of ASG
8-Aug-05	1.3	coordinate meeting to discuss ASG agenda, t/call with ASG, follow-up email, follow-up discussions with Akin and HLT
8-Aug-05	0.4	review revised draft financing proposal
9-Aug-05	1.0	meeting with CJE, ABT and DI regarding ATA next steps review previous analysis of cash, budget variance, and valuation, find pertinent analysis for review
9-Aug-05	0.4	review emails concerning ASG meeting
9-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with M. Hind of Baker regarding Okun motion
9-Aug-05	0.5	review updated ATA investment memorandum
9-Aug-05	0.4	discuss Boeing appraisal process with HLT
10-Aug-05	2.3	review email summary regarding Wells Fargo transaction and other from Akin, follow-up with ATA discuss issues with Akin, including discussion with HLT re Boeing appraisal process
10-Aug-05	0.2	emails regarding coordination of ASG meeting
11-Aug-05	0.3	review ASG engagement letter
12-Aug-05	0.5	review ATA cash flow analysis
15-Aug-05	0.5	review ATA 10Q
15-Aug-05	0.2	review press releases regarding Mikelsons' retirement
15-Aug-05	0.7	review materials regarding 1113 motions
15-Aug-05	0.2	coordinate meeting to discuss ASG agenda
15-Aug-05	0.3	discuss work program with HLT incl. discussion re valuation for Boeing claim
16-Aug-05	0.2	review email from L. Beckerman concerning case status
16-Aug-05	1.8	Committee call with HLT, SIO, DI, ABT, CJE regarding 1113 motion and financing issues
16-Aug-05	0.3	coordinate ATA comps and discuss with ABT
16-Aug-05	0.4	discuss work program with HLT, CJE and ABT
18-Aug-05	0.4	review ALPAs position regarding the reorganization
18-Aug-05	1.7	conf call with HLT, MJC, SIO, ABT, ATA and certain noteholders to review status
18-Aug-05	0.2	t/call to coordinate response to ASG
19-Aug-05	0.5	review extended cash collateral motion
19-Aug-05	0.7	review ATA cash flow analysis
19-Aug-05	0.7	review ATA's motions regarding 1113 rejections
19-Aug-05	0.5	t/call to coordinate response to ASG
19-Aug-05	2.3	prepare update on status of Ambassador, follow-up phone calls with Huron, Adelphi and others
19-Aug-05	1.0	discuss recovery analysis with ABT, locate spreadsheets
19-Aug-05	0.2	discuss with HLT re Committee professional conf call re meeting with ASG
19-Aug-05	0.8	t/call with HLT, Beckerman and Ferrante re Boeing claim
22-Aug-05	0.7	t/calls to follow-up on replacement Wells facility
22-Aug-05	0.5	review draft response to ASG, t/calls with HLT and MJC regarding same
22-Aug-05	0.6	review revised draft of ASG letter, Beckerman response, t/call with MJC

Date	TIME Hours	Description
22-Aug-05	1.3	follow-up on issues pertaining to Ambassador sale and financial performance, draft email update
22-Aug-05	1.0	conference call with MJC, SIO, ATA (Frank Conway, et al) re update pro forma of pending items
23-Aug-05	1.0	conference call with ABT, SIO, CJE, MJC, Frank Conway re weekly updating procedures and recent developments
24-Aug-05	1.7	revisions to and execution of letter to ASG (including discussions with HLT)
25-Aug-05	0.3	coordinate meeting with ASG
26-Aug-05	0.5	follow-up on ATA model
26-Aug-05	1.0	Committee professionals conf call with MJC, SIO, HLT to review status of pending matters re 1113, financing and fleet
28-Aug-05	4.0	update and review time records for fee application
29-Aug-05	0.2	coordinate meeting with ASG
29-Aug-05	0.2	review update on Goodrich motions
29-Aug-05	0.5	t/call with SIO and HLT to M. Mandel re terms of aircraft proposal
30-Aug-05	0.3	emails to ATA regarding weekly update meeting
30-Aug-05	3.0	update and review time records for fee application
30-Aug-05	1.0	Committee call with HLT, CJE and ABT re: Chicago Express and Denison employment
30-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT and MJC re Klein meeting
31-Aug-05	0.8	t/call with MJC to F. Conway of Navigant et. al from ATA regarding cash flow and general update information
31-Aug-05	0.5	review ATA July MOR
1-Sep-05	4.0	update and review time records for fee application
1-Sep-05	1.2	review ATA cash-flow reports
1-Sep-05	0.2	review update on ALPA negotiations
1-Sep-05	0.2	review update on ASG discussions
2-Sep-05	5.0	update and review time records for fee application
2-Sep-05	1.7	emails to W. Malone of ATA regarding follow-up due diligence, conversations with HLT regarding structure for variance report, conversations with ABT regarding same
5-Sep-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman and HLT re Ambassador, including discussion with HLT re same
6-Sep-05	4.0	update and review time records for fee application, including discuss work program with HLT
6-Sep-05	1.2	t/call with N. Ortega of Akin, discussion with HLT, t/call with J. Breen of Adelphi, t/call with HLT and L. Beckerman of Akin, follow-up emails regarding Ambassador sale process, review sale procedures, review overview memo
6-Sep-05	0.3	t/call to W. Malone left message regarding meeting, review updated business plan with ABT
6-Sep-05	0.6	discussion with SIO and ABT regarding state of ATSB collateral and need to evaluate the Debtors' financial forecast
7-Sep-05	0.4	review emails concerning Ambassador, sent message to L. Beckerman of Akin; discuss with HLT re sale of Ambassador
7-Sep-05	0.2	discussions with HLT re status of work and continuing due diligence and info requests
8-Sep-05	0.3	review summary of fleet motions from Akin
8-Sep-05	2.5	t/call with F. Conway of Navigant, HLT, SIO and MJC regarding status of case, cash-flows and financial forecast, update on fundraising process, including follow-up conversations; discuss cash flow and valuation issues with HLT; discussion with HLT re sale of Ambassador
8-Sep-05	0.7	discussions with ABT regarding recovery analysis, financial forecast, variance analysis

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Sep-05	0.4	t/calls and discussions with L. Beckerman of Akin regarding status of motions
9-Sep-05	0.3	partial attendance of Committee call with HLT, SIO, MJC and ABT regarding Mercer
9-Sep-05	0.2	t/calls with J. Peko and F. Conway of Navigant regarding meetings next week
9-Sep-05	3.0	review cash flow analysis, including discussion with CJE and ABT; discussion with HLT and ABT re work program on cash flow projections and valuation
9-Sep-05	0.4	discuss work program with HLT and SIO and upcoming visit to ATA
9-Sep-05	0.3	discuss Chicago Express and Ambassadair with HLT
11-Sep-05	1.2	prepare for trip to Indianapolis
12-Sep-05	4.0	travel from New York to Indianapolis with ABT
12-Sep-05	6.0	review materials regarding, fluctuations, historic performance, market conditions, ATA fundraising process with ABT
12-Sep-05	2.0	review variance analysis discussions with Navigant and ABT, overview discussion of information to be provided going forward
12-Sep-05	0.3	travel from ATA to Hotel with ABT
12-Sep-05	0.3	t/call with HLT re meetings on due diligence at ATA
13-Sep-05	0.3	travel from Hotel to ATA with ABT
13-Sep-05	2.0	meetings with ABT and ATA regarding claims and financial performance with W. Malone of ATA, review underlying materials for meeting, review work product and analysis
13-Sep-05	4.0	meetings with ABT, D. Bochenek of Huron and A. Thayer of ATA regarding financial forecasts, review materials for meeting, review work product and analysis
13-Sep-05	1.0	meetings with ABT and S. Frick of ATA regarding Ambassadair, follow-up emails and notes
13-Sep-05	5.0	travel from ATA to Home with ABT
14-Sep-05	1.2	t/call with HLT, SIO, MJC and Committee Chair to discuss Ad Hoc Bondholder term sheet, follow-up discussion with Fried Frank lawyer, follow-up discussion with HLT
14-Sep-05	0.2	review emails regarding Goodrich negotiations
14-Sep-05	0.3	review emails regarding negotiations with Labor
14-Sep-05	1.0	t/call with D. Bochenek of Huron and A. Thayer of ATA regarding financial forecast, follow-up discussion with ABT
14-Sep-05	0.2	review July fluctuation analysis
14-Sep-05	0.4	t/call with Bondholder
15-Sep-05	0.1	review Mercer extension of agreement
15-Sep-05	1.3	review email concerning revised letter of credit facility, follow-up with L. Beckerman of Akin and W. Malone of ATA, t/call with W. Malone to discuss impact of alternative proposal from Nat. City, draft and forward email L. Beckerman explaining the economic benefits
15-Sep-05	1.3	review cash-flow analysis and review 2nd quarter analysis, including discussions with CJE and ABT
15-Sep-05	0.5	draft summary of Ambassadair sale, including discussion with HLT
16-Sep-05	0.7	emails to request meeting with Subodh to discuss operating statistics, review cash flow analysis and discussion with HLT
16-Sep-05	0.2	review emails concerning the Goodrich settlement
19-Sep-05	0.1	review email concerning expanded mercer retention
19-Sep-05	0.5	review draft POR materials
19-Sep-05	0.5	review ATA tentative agreement with ALPA, including discussion with HLT
19-Sep-05	0.2	t/call with S. Frick of ATA and M. Goodenow of Navigant concerning meeting for tomorrow
19-Sep-05	5.2	organize ATA files