

EXHIBIT D (cont'd.)

Time Records for Current Fee Period

Date	TIME Hours	Description
2-Aug-05	0.2	review email from Beckerman to ATA counsel re o/s requests for information
2-Aug-05	1.7	series of emails with Akin Gump re discussions with noteholders and Jefferies information memo; work on interim financing term sheet incl. discussion with SIO; review MJC email to F. Conway re interim reporting of cash and discuss same with MJC
3-Aug-05	0.3	review proposed settlement agreement with Mikelsons forwarded by Akin Gump
3-Aug-05	2.4	series of emails and t/calls re Jefferies information memo and follow-up call to review; review Jefferies memo and Akin Gump comments re same
3-Aug-05	1.7	series of t/calls with noteholders and Schulte re capital raise; discuss same with SIO
4-Aug-05	1.2	conf call with F. Conway, SIO and BAK to review cash saving initiatives and status of same
4-Aug-05	0.2	review Beckerman email to Ponader re Mikelsons
4-Aug-05	0.3	series of emails to F. Conway and Jefferies re upcoming calls on business operations and to review IM
4-Aug-05	0.6	review SIO markup of interim financing capital raise term sheet; review new version of same
4-Aug-05	1.2	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, MJC, DI to discuss change in Mikelsons status and report on discussion re capital raise
5-Aug-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass report on cash flow and discuss with DI; review MJC email to F. Conway re info request
5-Aug-05	0.5	review various emails re status of leases and fleet; discuss same with SIO
5-Aug-05	0.4	review various emails re status of ATA HQ and discuss with BAK
5-Aug-05	0.8	review and respond to various emails re meeting/conf call with noteholders; t/call with Jefferies and others re same
5-Aug-05	2.5	work on revised financing term sheet
5-Aug-05	1.5	t/calls with F. Conway and MJC re capital raise; t/calls with noteholders re same; t/calls with Beckerman, Schulte and Steinberg of Jefferies re same; update BAK re same
5-Aug-05	1.0	conf call with Debtor, ATA management, Jefferies and BAK and ABT re Jefferies book
5-Aug-05	0.3	review email from Beckerman re meeting with Klein of ASG; discuss same with BAK
8-Aug-05	3.8	work on New DIP financing term sheet; t/call with Strickland re same; review and respond to emails from Akin Gump re same; discuss same with Strickland and review comments re same
8-Aug-05	0.6	t/calls with SIO re meetings with ATA noteholders; emails to/from Jefferies re latest version of book; t/call to ATA re meeting
8-Aug-05	0.6	review teaser from Jefferies for ATA financing; series of emails re noteholders interested in potential interim financing
8-Aug-05	0.6	t/call with BAK re arranging discussion with Boeing claim appraiser and review related emails
8-Aug-05	0.3	discussion with Akin and BAK re his work on coordinate meeting to discuss ASG agenda
9-Aug-05	1.5	review latest version of Jefferies book on ATA
9-Aug-05	2.4	series of meetings with noteholders to discuss financing options for ATA with SIO
9-Aug-05	0.5	discuss Boeing appraisal process with BAK and review related emails
10-Aug-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
10-Aug-05	0.2	review Akin Gump email summarizing settlement with Mikelsons
10-Aug-05	0.2	review Akin Gump email summarizing Wells Fargo due diligence fees for replacement line of credit financing
10-Aug-05	0.3	review various emails re appraisal process
10-Aug-05	0.2	discuss Boeing appraisal process with BAK

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Aug-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
11-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re lease fleet
11-Aug-05	0.7	t/call with Schulte, F. Conway and Jefferies re capital raise and meetings with noteholders and management; review and respond to series of emails re same
12-Aug-05	0.4	review Compass weekly report on cash; review daily reporting package on cash for ATSB
12-Aug-05	0.3	review emails from ATA and SIO re status of ATA's fleet
12-Aug-05	0.1	review email from Ferrante re rejection of ALPA contract
12-Aug-05	2.0	t/call with F. Conway re meeting with noteholders; t/call with noteholder re capital requirements for ATA; t/calls with Jefferies re conf call with noteholders; revise draft term sheet for sub. DIP loan; review and respond to related email
12-Aug-05	0.4	review email from Ferrante with ASG engagement letter
14-Aug-05	0.2	review and respond to Beckerman email re noteholder meeting
15-Aug-05	2.0	review motion and information from ATA re 1113 motion
15-Aug-05	0.5	review ATA 10-Q for June 2005 quarter
15-Aug-05	0.5	discuss work program with BAK incl. discussion re valuation for Boeing claim; review email re ATA HQ resolution
15-Aug-05	1.0	update interim financing term sheet including review and respond to emails re same
15-Aug-05	0.6	review final version of Jefferies Information memoranda; review list of prospective investors re same
15-Aug-05	2.5	t/calls with F. Conway and Jefferies re capital raise and meeting with noteholders; review revised edition of Jefferies book; email to prospective investors regarding sub DIP financing and complete term sheet re same
15-Aug-05	1.3	t/calls with Committee members re capital raise and 1113 motion; discuss same with Beckerman
15-Aug-05	0.2	review Committee objection to extension of exclusivity
16-Aug-05	0.6	discuss work program with BAK, CJE and ABT incl. t/call with MJC re same
16-Aug-05	0.2	review Akin Gump memo re BCC and return of 757 aircraft
16-Aug-05	2.5	series of discussions with noteholders re capital raise for ATA; discuss same with Jefferies; review and respond to emails with noteholders re financing; discuss same with Schulte
16-Aug-05	0.1	review letter from Wells Fargo re replacement of letter of credit facility
16-Aug-05	0.2	preparatory discussion with Beckerman re upcoming Committee call
16-Aug-05	1.8	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, DI, ABT, CJE to review 1113 motion and status of financing
17-Aug-05	0.4	t/call with noteholder re financing
18-Aug-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
18-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with MJC to review results of conf call with ATA and noteholders
18-Aug-05	1.9	conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO, ABT, ATA and noteholders who have executed confis to review status at ATA; incl. review and responding to related emails
18-Aug-05	0.4	t/calls with noteholders re status of ATA and conf call with Debtors; review and respond to email from noteholder
18-Aug-05	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re preparatory call for meeting with ASG
19-Aug-05	0.3	review emails from Beckerman and SIO re L1011's stips; review SIO email re fleet status
19-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with F. Conway re access to information
19-Aug-05	0.2	review MJC emails re due diligence info request from Frank Conway
19-Aug-05	0.2	review email from Skyworks re status of fleet
19-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re fleet and leases
19-Aug-05	0.6	review ALPA and Committee's motions re ATA proposed rejection of collective bargaining agreement
19-Aug-05	0.1	review BAK email re status of Ambassador

Date	TIME Hours	Description
19-Aug-05	1.4	series of t/calls with noteholders and emails re confi and alternative financing; email information re participating noteholders incl. emails to/from Jefferies and noteholders
19-Aug-05	1.2	Committee professional conf call re meeting with ASG; discuss same with BAK
19-Aug-05	0.8	t/call with BAK, Beckerman and Ferrante re Boeing claim
22-Aug-05	0.3	review and respond to emails re due diligence conf call with ATA and issues for Compass to cover
22-Aug-05	0.1	review Akin Gump email on status of labor negotiations
22-Aug-05	1.0	series of t/calls and discussions with BAK and MJC re letter to Boeing litigation appraiser; review drafts of proposed letter
22-Aug-05	0.2	review MJC email and analysis re cash
22-Aug-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
22-Aug-05	0.1	review Akin Gump email re court proceedings and 1113 motion
24-Aug-05	1.0	series of t/calls with noteholders and Committee co-chair re interim financing for ATA
24-Aug-05	0.4	review final draft of letter to appraiser re Boeing and discuss with BAK
25-Aug-05	0.1	review email re sale of Saabs
25-Aug-05	0.4	t/call with Pfeiffer of Fried Frank; emails to/from noteholders re financing
25-Aug-05	0.3	series of emails with Beckerman and MJC, SIO, etc. re update and scheduling Committee professionals call
25-Aug-05	0.2	review emails from BAK re meeting with Fred Klein
26-Aug-05	0.4	review emails re status of fleet; review Claffey and related emails re Denison employment terms
26-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with Denison re financial projections and ATA meetings with potential investors
26-Aug-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email and supporting documents re Chicago Express creditors motion for Committee
26-Aug-05	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re Committee professionals conf call; review BAK email re due diligence request
26-Aug-05	1.0	Committee professionals conf call with MJC, SIO, BAK to review status of pending matters re 1113, financing and fleet
26-Aug-05	0.4	t/call with noteholders re financing options; email draft of interim term to Pfeiffer of Fried Frank
26-Aug-05	0.1	review email re meeting with Klein of ASG
27-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with MJC to review cash status of ATA
28-Aug-05	0.1	review various emails to Committee re Denison employment terms
29-Aug-05	0.5	t/call with SIO and BAK to M. Mandel re terms of aircraft proposal
30-Aug-05	0.3	discuss cash status with ABT and CJE; review BAK email and response re request for cash info
30-Aug-05	0.2	review emails re status of fleet
30-Aug-05	0.2	review emails re status of fleet
30-Aug-05	0.1	review Greenebaum memo re Goodrich status
30-Aug-05	0.2	review Beckerman email re ATA's consultants and related emails
30-Aug-05	0.9	t/call with prospective investor in ATA; review updated Investor summary from Jefferies; t/calls with noteholders re interest in interim financing
30-Aug-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re capital raise activities
30-Aug-05	0.3	t/call with BAK and MJC re Klein meeting; review emails from BAK re meeting with Fred Klein
30-Aug-05	1.0	Committee conf call with BAK, CJE and ABT; review Chicago Express creditors proposal for Committee, Denison employment, etc
31-Aug-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
31-Aug-05	1.5	lunch with Denison in New York
31-Aug-05	0.6	t/call with Beckerman re Mikelsons non-compete; t/call with SIO re fleet

Date	TIME Hours	Description
31-Aug-05	0.8	t/calls with ABT and noteholders re interest in interim financing
1-Sep-05	6.0	travel to/from Herndon, VA for meeting with Fred Klein of ASG; t/call with Ferrante re meeting with Klein, review Ferrante memo to Beckerman re same
1-Sep-05	2.8	meeting with Fred Klein of ASG and MJC to discuss Boeing rejection claim
1-Sep-05	0.1	review Akin Gump email on status of labor negotiations
1-Sep-05	0.3	review Compass weekly cash report incl. email to CJE
1-Sep-05	0.2	review emails re status of ATA fleet
2-Sep-05	0.5	discuss with BAK and ABT financial reports for Committee
2-Sep-05	0.1	review BAK memo to ATA re additional information re POR assumptions
2-Sep-05	0.4	review July 2005 monthly operating report
2-Sep-05	0.3	review term sheet for ATSB post-reorg financing
4-Sep-05	0.1	review and respond to email from MJC re meeting with Fred Klein
5-Sep-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
5-Sep-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman and BAK re Ambassador
6-Sep-05	1.0	t/call with Beckerman and discussion with BAK re Ambassador; review motion for bidding procedures and Akin Gump summary; review BAK emails re Ambassador
6-Sep-05	0.5	discuss status of fleet with SIO; discuss work program with BAK
6-Sep-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re capital raising
6-Sep-05	0.1	review and respond to various emails re meetings with ATSB
7-Sep-05	1.1	t/call with Fried Frank re new interim financing; conf call with noteholders group re new financing; email to/from Jefferies re same
7-Sep-05	0.8	series of t/calls with Beckerman re ATSB meetings and debtor's retention of consultants and call with noteholders; review and respond to related emails re same
7-Sep-05	0.8	discussions with BAK and SIO re status of work and continuing due diligence and info requests
7-Sep-05	0.8	review series of emails and documents re sale of Ambassador and discuss with BAK
7-Sep-05	0.3	review various emails re term sheet for ATSB post-reorg financing
7-Sep-05	0.3	review and respond to various emails re meetings with ATSB; review and respond to emails from noteholders re current status of ATA financing
7-Sep-05	0.3	review analysis of Chicago Express interco a/c; review Chicago Express preference analysis spreadsheet
7-Sep-05	0.2	review Ferrante email re results of Bankruptcy Court hearing re Chicago Express motion for Committee and sale of Chicago Express assets
7-Sep-05	0.1	discuss fee application with ETW
8-Sep-05	1.2	series of t/calls with Committee members re capital raise; discuss status of same with Jefferies; t/calls with noteholders re capital raise and with prospective investor
8-Sep-05	0.4	t/calls with Beckerman re upcoming call with Debtor and review and respond to related emails
8-Sep-05	1.5	conf call with F. Conway, Carr, Beckerman, BAK, MJC and SIO to review capital raise, debtor professional retentions, access to due diligence information, etc.
8-Sep-05	1.2	series of t/calls and discussions with Beckerman, MJC, BAK and SIO re debtor professional retentions, access to due diligence and strategic alternatives
8-Sep-05	0.3	discuss cash flow and valuation issues with BAK
8-Sep-05	0.2	series of emails with noteholders re financing proposal
8-Sep-05	0.5	review latest investor list from Jefferies and forward same to Beckerman; discuss same with Steinberg of Jefferies
8-Sep-05	0.4	review LOI re Ambassador
8-Sep-05	0.5	review Akin Gump summaries re pending Continental leases, John Hancock settlement, etc.

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Sep-05	0.3	review ALPA memo re findings of facts re proposed 1113 labor contract rejection
8-Sep-05	0.2	review Riesman email re agenda for upcoming meeting with ATSB
8-Sep-05	0.3	review email re sale of Ambasadair and discuss with BAK
9-Sep-05	0.4	review Beckerman and Akin Gump emails re Mercer and Navigant
9-Sep-05	0.1	review MJC email re Navigant and Beckerman response
9-Sep-05	0.8	conf call with SIO, ABT, MJC, BAK and ATA re Mercer and cost reduction
9-Sep-05	0.3	discussion with BAK and ABT re work program on cash flow projections and valuation
9-Sep-05	1.1	series of t/calls with noteholders; t/call with Beckerman re calls with noteholders
9-Sep-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re calls with noteholders
9-Sep-05	1.0	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, CJE and ABT; discuss latest issues re financing and ATA professional retentions, etc.
9-Sep-05	0.4	discuss work program with BAK and SIO and upcoming visit to ATA
9-Sep-05	0.2	discuss financing options with Calavritinos
9-Sep-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
9-Sep-05	0.2	review email re postponement of meeting with ATSB; review email re potential interest of strategic financial partner
9-Sep-05	1.2	review various emails re meetings with Debtor and due diligence and discuss same with BAK and SIO; review Akin Gump email re labor negotiations; review Compass report on cash
9-Sep-05	0.3	discuss Chicago Express and Ambasadair with BAK and review related emails
11-Sep-05	0.4	re-review ASG retention letter and email to MJC re same
12-Sep-05	0.3	review MJC email re ASG retention and impact on valuation of Boeing claim;
12-Sep-05	0.9	review and respond to series of emails with Beckerman and MJC re same t/call with MJC and Calavritinos re financing options for ATA; review related email from MJC
12-Sep-05	1.5	series of t/calls with noteholders, Fried Frank, Beckerman and Carlson of Jefferies re financing proposals; discuss same with Calavritinos
12-Sep-05	0.7	t/call with BAK re meetings on due diligence at ATA; review CJE email re cash balances; review ABT schedules re monthly operating performance and balance sheets of ATA
12-Sep-05	0.2	review series of emails re Ambasadair sale
13-Sep-05	0.3	t/call with Bowles re Goodrich settlement and review related email re same
13-Sep-05	1.0	review and respond to series of emails re financing with Beckerman, Committee leadership and Carlson; t/call with Calavritinos re same; discuss same with MJC
13-Sep-05	0.4	review summary of term sheet fro Ad Hoc Committee of noteholders re financing
14-Sep-05	0.4	review Mercer scope of engagement and discuss with SIO and review related emails
14-Sep-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
14-Sep-05	0.2	review Akin Gump memo re liquidating debtors
14-Sep-05	1.2	t/call with Committee leadership, BAK, SIO, and MJC to review proposal from noteholders; follow-up t/call with Fried Frank re same; follow-up discussion with BAK
14-Sep-05	0.4	update by BAK re due diligence
14-Sep-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re financing term sheet
14-Sep-05	0.5	review summary of terms negotiating with ALPA
14-Sep-05	0.6	review various emails re Goodrich proposed settlement and discuss same with SIO
14-Sep-05	0.3	review Ambasadair transaction summary from BAK and related emails
14-Sep-05	0.5	conf call with ABT and legal counsel regarding term sheet
15-Sep-05	0.7	conf call with noteholders with Beckerman re financing proposal from Ad Hoc Committee of Noteholders
15-Sep-05	0.4	review various emails re Ambasadair sale and discuss with BAK
15-Sep-05	0.2	review various emails re Mercer retention and scope of work and discuss with SIO

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Sep-05	0.3	review various emails re Goodrich proposed settlement
15-Sep-05	0.2	review various emails to/from BAK and ATA re National City
16-Sep-05	1.0	series of t/calls with Shinn of Jefferies and t/call with noteholders re financing
16-Sep-05	0.7	review draft of Compass report to Committee on financial performance and discuss with BAK; review BAK email re request of ATA for financial information
16-Sep-05	0.2	review and respond to emails re interest of potential partner for ATA
16-Sep-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
16-Sep-05	2.0	review time records for August
16-Sep-05	0.3	review various emails re Goodrich settlement
18-Sep-05	0.1	review and respond to various emails re proposed ATA financing
18-Sep-05	0.1	review SIO email re Mercer
19-Sep-05	0.7	review draft POR
19-Sep-05	1.1	t/call with Beckerman re valuation and deal with ALPA; discuss same with BAK; review various documents re new agreement with ALPA; review BAK email to ATA re due diligence
19-Sep-05	0.5	t/call with noteholders re financing proposal; review same with Calavritinos
19-Sep-05	0.5	review term sheet from noteholders re financing and review and respond to related emails
19-Sep-05	0.4	t/call with F. Conway re financing process and t/call message for Beckerman re same
20-Sep-05	0.3	review Akin Gump summary of pending matters re Mercer, Chicago Express admin bar date and BP Air Products
20-Sep-05	1.4	t/call with F. Conway re financing; t/call with Beckerman re valuation and financing; t/call with Calavritinos re same; review and respond to related emails; discuss info requirements with BAK and review emails re same; discuss agenda with BAK
20-Sep-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
20-Sep-05	0.3	review series of emails re status of ATA fleet
20-Sep-05	0.2	review email re Goodrich proposed settlement
21-Sep-05	0.2	review Akin Gump memo on IAA admin claim
21-Sep-05	0.1	review email re recommendation of F.Conway re ATA fleet acquisition; review email summarizing proposal for ALPA
21-Sep-05	0.2	review email summarizing status of Ambassador transaction
21-Sep-05	1.0	conf call with BAK, SIO, ABT and ATA re update on financial results and capital raise
21-Sep-05	1.1	series of discussions with BAK, MJC, SIO and ABT and Beckerman re update on financing and cash flow projections; review email from Akin Gump re timing of receipt of info
21-Sep-05	0.2	review Akin Gump memo on Nat City LC facility
21-Sep-05	0.3	review draft of ATA quarterly report with ABT
21-Sep-05	0.2	review Greenebaum email re Goodrich settlement
22-Sep-05	0.6	t/calls with Beckerman re financing alternatives
22-Sep-05	1.0	review draft of ATA quarterly report with ABT and BAK; review series of emails with review of June and July financial results; review Compass weekly cash flow report and email from CJE re amended cash projection balances
22-Sep-05	2.2	series of t/calls with Committee members, BAK, noteholders, Jefferies, Schulte and F. Conway re financing; emails to/from Committee members re same
23-Sep-05	2.5	series of t/calls with Committee members and discussions with SIO, MJC and BAK re financing and cash requirements of ATA
23-Sep-05	0.6	review changes to draft POR
23-Sep-05	0.5	discuss valuation issues with BAK
23-Sep-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB

Date	TIME Hours	Description
23-Sep-05	0.8	review final Compass report on ATA's 2nd quarter; review ATA's email re cost reductions and discuss with BAK
23-Sep-05	0.3	t/call with prospective investor in ATA and email info to Jefferies
25-Sep-05	0.3	review series of emails re discussions with ATA and upcoming Committee call
26-Sep-05	0.4	review and respond to emails re ASG report and Klein mandate; t/call with Ferrante re same
26-Sep-05	0.4	t/call with MJC and Committee co-chair re strategic options
26-Sep-05	0.8	t/call with Fred Klein re Boeing claim report; update Ferrante and MJC re same and review and respond to related emails
26-Sep-05	1.0	ATA financing - t/calls with MJC and noteholders; t/call with Schaffer
26-Sep-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
27-Sep-05	1.0	discussion with noteholders re financing proposal; discuss same with Committee members
27-Sep-05	0.3	discussion with Beckerman re timetable for financing proposals
27-Sep-05	2.0	series of discussions and t/calls with BAK, MJC, ABT and SIO re valuation and cash flow issues; discuss same with Committee co-chair
27-Sep-05	0.6	review Compass draft report on July 2005 results with ABT and review related emails; review BAK email to ATA re same
27-Sep-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email summarizing ALPA agreement
28-Sep-05	0.2	review final Compass report on July 2005 operations
28-Sep-05	0.5	series of emails with Ferrante re receipt of Boeing claim report; t/call re same with Frick
28-Sep-05	0.1	review email from Ferrante re ratification of ALPA agreement
28-Sep-05	0.2	discuss Debtors' capital raise with ABT
29-Sep-05	0.2	review Akin Gump summary of Budapest airport claim and lease of engine
29-Sep-05	0.4	review Compass weekly cash flow report; discuss same with BAK
29-Sep-05	0.1	series of emails with Ferrante re receipt of Boeing claim report; t/call re same with Frick
29-Sep-05	1.2	review draft of ATA disclosure statement and amended draft POR
29-Sep-05	0.8	discuss results of ATA call with Compass with BAK; review ATA forecast for 2005-2008 and discuss with BAK
29-Sep-05	1.0	conf call with BAK, SIO, ABT and MJC and Debtors to review latest forecast and balance sheet
29-Sep-05	0.5	series of discussions with BAK and ABT re valuation issues and new forecast from ATA
29-Sep-05	1.0	dinner meeting with BAK, MJC, Calavritinos, Schaffer to discuss options for Committee
29-Sep-05	0.1	review Beckerman email re receipt of Debtor's financing proposal
30-Sep-05	0.2	review Beckerman email with report from ATA's counsel re receipt of financing proposal for ATA
30-Sep-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
1-Oct-05	0.2	t/call with BAK re valuation work
2-Oct-05	2.5	review draft valuation report and related documents and discuss same with ABT and BAK
2-Oct-05	0.7	review ABT email re summary of ATA's latest business plan; review Aug 2005 operating report
2-Oct-05	0.6	review AGS files on Boeing claim
3-Oct-05	1.0	review ATA's POR and disclosure statement filed with Bankruptcy Court
3-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re valuation and pending financing bids, including discussion with BAK
3-Oct-05	0.3	prepare for Committee conf call with BAK and CJE and ABT
3-Oct-05	1.0	Committee conf call with BAK, ABT, CJE, SIO; review status of financing, Compass reports on cash and results to July 31, 2005 and labor deal with ALPA

Date	TIME Hours	Description
3-Oct-05	0.5	review various emails re ATA's new business plan and discuss same with BAK and ABT
6-Oct-05	1.0	series of t/calls and discussions with BAK and Beckerman re status of bids and due diligence re same
6-Oct-05	0.5	t/calls with Committee co-chair and noteholders re status of pending bid
6-Oct-05	0.5	discuss strategic options with MJC; review email from MJC re potential deal with strategic partner
6-Oct-05	0.5	t/call with prospective investor re investment in ATA; follow-up discussion re same with SIO
6-Oct-05	0.3	review Beckerman emails re potential conflicts for financing proposals and Committee meeting
6-Oct-05	1.2	series of emails with Compass and ATA professionals re weekly status call; discuss weekly status call with BAK; discuss valuation presentation with BAK and ABT
6-Oct-05	0.5	review Akin Gump email summarizing ATA's motion for approving POR and tabulation of votes, etc.
6-Oct-05	0.4	review various emails re Goodrich settlement and discuss same with SIO
6-Oct-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
6-Oct-05	0.3	discuss weekly cash report with ABT and review same
7-Oct-05	0.5	t/call with Committee co-chairs re options for ATA and unsecured creditors
7-Oct-05	1.0	t/calls with prospective investor re investment in ATA; series of emails re same; discuss same with SIO
7-Oct-05	0.5	discuss valuation with BAK and ABT
7-Oct-05	0.5	discuss strategic options with SIO
7-Oct-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
10-Oct-05	4.0	review valuation materials including review sessions with BAK, ABT and SIO
10-Oct-05	0.1	t/call with Committee member re status of financing proposals
10-Oct-05	0.4	review emails from prospective investor re access to due diligence information and discuss with SIO
10-Oct-05	0.3	discuss Boeing claim calculation with BAK and review related emails
11-Oct-05	0.3	review final Boeing settlement agreement and discuss with BAK
11-Oct-05	0.5	discussion with noteholders re financing options
11-Oct-05	0.3	review and respond to series of emails with ATA re conf calls on capital raise; review Beckerman email re same
11-Oct-05	1.0	conf call with F. Conway, etc. re status of financing and Plan B elements and discussion with SIO, ABT and CJE re same
11-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re conf call with F. Conway re status of financing and Plan B elements
11-Oct-05	2.0	review valuation materials including review sessions with BAK, ABT and SIO
11-Oct-05	0.6	review industry research information forwarded from ABT and Committee co-chair
12-Oct-05	2.0	conf call with Subodh Karnik, F. Conway etc re status of financing and Plan B elements and discussion with SIO, BAK, MJC, ABT and CJE
12-Oct-05	0.4	series of t/calls with Beckerman and Committee co-chair following-up on discussion with Debtors re OP6
12-Oct-05	0.4	discussion with MJC, SIO, ABT, BAK re new business plan
12-Oct-05	0.3	review BAK email re rejection of helicopter lease and related motion
13-Oct-05	0.1	review SIO email re proposed ATA schedule changes
14-Oct-05	0.2	t/call with noteholders re status of financing and ATA announcement of route changes
14-Oct-05	1.5	conf call with Navigant, Graber, Hula, Yakola, F. Conway and Compass re status of financing and Plan B elements and discussion with SIO, BAK, ABT and CJE re same; review and respond to related emails

Date	TIME Hours	Description
14-Oct-05	1.3	follow-up discussions with Beckerman, MJC, & Arthur with SIO and ABT re ATA's new business plan; review email from Beckerman re same
14-Oct-05	0.8	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, CJE, ABT to discuss ATA's new business plan
14-Oct-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
14-Oct-05	0.3	review Compass weekly cash flow report
14-Oct-05	0.2	discussion with ETW re monthly information
17-Oct-05	0.2	review S. Frick response re helicopter lease and related emails
17-Oct-05	0.1	review email from F. Conway re discussions with creditors
17-Oct-05	0.4	discuss latest ATSB extension and cash collateral with BAK and review related emails from BAK and CJE
17-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with Committee member re announced changes at ATA
17-Oct-05	0.7	t/calls with noteholders re status of financing
17-Oct-05	0.5	review Beckerman letter to Carr and discuss same with Beckerman and Committee strategic options incl. emails to/from Beckerman
17-Oct-05	0.4	t/call with MJC and discussion with SIO re strategic options
17-Oct-05	0.4	discuss valuation with ABT and BAK
17-Oct-05	0.2	review emails re sale of Ambasadair
17-Oct-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
18-Oct-05	0.4	review various emails re sale of Ambasadair and discuss with BAK; discuss business plan review with ATA and BAK
18-Oct-05	2.0	series of t/calls and/or discussions re financing status and new business plan with Beckerman, Committee members, SIO, BAK
18-Oct-05	0.2	review emails re helicopter and exec. Jets
19-Oct-05	0.2	review various emails re BETACO
19-Oct-05	0.6	review draft of Committee's 2004 motion and discuss with BAK
19-Oct-05	0.6	review Akin Gump summary re pending motions including aircraft rejections; review confidentiality agreement for Compass
19-Oct-05	0.1	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review BAK email re business plan review
19-Oct-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK
19-Oct-05	0.1	review email re extension of Committee's objection rights to solicitation motion
20-Oct-05	1.8	series of discussions with BAK and SIO re proposed 2004 motion and supporting information request; review and respond to related emails and assist in drafting information request; review revised drafts of 2004 motion
20-Oct-05	1.5	review email from Denison and draft response; discuss same with BAK
20-Oct-05	0.3	review letter from Carr re status of current financing proposals
20-Oct-05	0.4	review various emails re Boeing claim and discuss with BAK
21-Oct-05	0.1	review emails re Ambasadair sale status
21-Oct-05	2.7	Committee conference call with BAK, SIO, ABT to review status of discussions re financing, changes to ATA operations and presentation by Debtors; review response of Committee to Debtors' schedule for sharing information
21-Oct-05	0.4	t/call with BAK, SIO, ABT, Beckerman and Botter re response of Committee to Debtors' schedule for sharing information; t/call with Ferrante re same
21-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re options for ATA
21-Oct-05	0.6	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass weekly cash report and discuss with CJE
21-Oct-05	0.2	review BAK email to ATA re request for additional info on Boeing claim, including discussion with BAK re letter to ATA and valuation analysis revisions
22-Oct-05	0.3	review draft of letter from Committee co-chairs to Denison
24-Oct-05	0.1	review Akin Gump email re solicitations motion
24-Oct-05	0.3	review various emails re Ambasadair sale
24-Oct-05	0.2	discussion with BAK re valuation analysis revisions

Date	TIME Hours	Description
25-Oct-05	0.5	discuss Ambassador sale with BAK; discuss return of deposit for Chicago Express bidder with bidder and review related email
25-Oct-05	0.8	t/call with Beckerman and Committee co-chair re communication/update from ATA; discuss current prospects with Committee co-Chair; discuss upcoming conf call with BAK; discuss options with SIO
25-Oct-05	0.1	review BAK email to ATA re Boeing claim
26-Oct-05	0.7	t/call with Peko and Graber of ATA with BAK, MJC, SIO and ABT to review latest status of fleet and financing
26-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with Denison with SIO re status of financing
26-Oct-05	2.5	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members, Beckerman, SIO, BAK and MJC re status of financing and strategic options available
26-Oct-05	0.6	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass weekly cash report
26-Oct-05	0.2	discuss status of Ambassador sale with BAK and review related email
26-Oct-05	0.1	discuss supplemental affidavit with ETW
27-Oct-05	0.6	discuss Boeing claim calculation with BAK and review related emails including t/call with BAK and Frick
27-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with noteholders re status of financing
27-Oct-05	1.2	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members, Beckerman, SIO, BAK and MJC re status of financing and strategic options available
27-Oct-05	0.3	review Denison letter to Committee co-chairs
27-Oct-05	1.0	t/call with Beckerman re update on various discussions with Denison and Carr
27-Oct-05	0.6	review emails re sale of Ambassador; discuss same with BAK and Ortega
27-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with prospective strategic acquiror and forward contact information at Jefferies
28-Oct-05	1.0	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, MJC, ABT, CJE; discuss status of financing and ATA's new business plan
28-Oct-05	0.2	discuss access and confidentiality agreement for strategic investor with Shin of Jefferies
28-Oct-05	1.3	series of t/calls and discussions with Beckerman, MJC and BAK re strategic options; discuss same with certain strategic investors and Schulte
28-Oct-05	0.3	discuss Committee and Debtor cooperation with Karnik
28-Oct-05	0.3	review and respond to series of emails re call with Committee professionals and debtor; review cutoff date for participation right with Beckerman
29-Oct-05	1.1	conf call with BAK, SIO, Committee leadership and ATA to review status of discussions with investor; review Beckerman email re same
29-Oct-05	0.7	conf call with BAK, Beckerman and Ferrante re Boeing lease calculation and options for unsecured creditors; review Akin memo re same
29-Oct-05	0.1	t/call with Committee co chair re ATA's plan
29-Oct-05	0.5	review Akin memo re fee app's for Debtor's professionals
26-Oct-05	0.1	discuss supplemental affidavit with ETW
31-Oct-05	0.2	review Akin email re timetable
31-Oct-05	0.3	t/call with noteholder re investor process and release of restricted information
31-Oct-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
31-Oct-05	0.4	review supplemental affidavit of Compass re MJC and discuss with ETW
31-Oct-05	2.5	update and review Sept. time records
1-Nov-05	0.8	discuss ATA financial results with BAK and ABT; review Sept monthly operating report
1-Nov-05	0.5	t/call with Beckerman re access to ATA information for strategic acquirors; t/call with strategic acquiror re same
1-Nov-05	1.0	t/call with ATA re announcement of closing Indy and upcoming business plan; discuss same with ABT and review press release and draft of ABT email to Committee

Date	TIME Hours	Description
1-Nov-05	0.2	review Beckerman email re supplemental affidavit of Compass re MJC and discuss with ETW
1-Nov-05	0.1	review email re pending Creditors Committee conf call
1-Nov-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
1-Nov-05	0.4	review Akin Gump memo summarizing Automatic Aircraft Transaction Motion re new aircraft
2-Nov-05	0.2	series of emails with ATA re scheduling conf call for update on business plan and financing
2-Nov-05	1.0	discussion with F. Conway re process for new business plan; t/call with Committee co-chair re options for Committee
2-Nov-05	0.1	review email re POR timetable
2-Nov-05	0.2	coordinate t/call with Debtors, BAK and ABT
3-Nov-05	0.3	discuss status of case with Committee member
3-Nov-05	0.5	weekly conf call with SIO, ABT, CJE, ATA to review fleet, routes and cash
3-Nov-05	0.5	t/call with SIO, ABT and Committee co-chair re options for Committee
3-Nov-05	0.3	review Compass weekly cash report
3-Nov-05	0.1	review email re extension of Ambassador sale
3-Nov-05	0.3	review ATA objection to AMR
4-Nov-05	0.2	series of emails with Beckerman re access of potential strategic investors to ATA
7-Nov-05	0.5	review new investment term sheet from MatlinPatterson
7-Nov-05	0.4	review emails re sale of Ambassador and discuss same with BAK
7-Nov-05	0.2	review Akin Gump memo re exclusivity
7-Nov-05	3.7	series of discussions and Conf calls with BAK, ABT, SIO, MJC & Beckerman and/or Committee co-chair re new investment term sheet; review related emails re discussion re same with ALPA and ATA
7-Nov-05	0.4	review CJE draft report of Aug 2005 MOR
7-Nov-05	0.3	review Akin summary of Denison employment agreement
7-Nov-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
8-Nov-05	0.2	t/call with Jacobson re call with Compass and ATA to discuss term sheet
8-Nov-05	0.8	discuss term sheet with SIO and ABT; t/call with F. Conway and Peko re same
8-Nov-05	0.7	t/call with Beckerman and ALPA re options for ATA
8-Nov-05	1.3	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, MJC, ABT, CJE to discuss MatlinPatterson term sheet, exclusivity and cash requirements
8-Nov-05	2.5	series of discussions with Committee co-chair re business plan and strategic options; discuss same with Schaffer; email to/from Committee members re same
9-Nov-05	1.5	series of discussions with Committee co-chair re business plan, strategic options and meetings in Indy; discuss same with Committee members, Beckerman, BAK, SIO, ABT, and MJC
9-Nov-05	0.4	t/call with BAK and ABT to ATA management re business plan and due diligence meeting
9-Nov-05	0.8	review industry research reports re ATA and potential strategic investors
9-Nov-05	0.3	review Compass weekly cash report
9-Nov-05	0.4	discuss fee app preparation with ETW and review related emails
10-Nov-05	0.1	review email from BAK re Ambassador
10-Nov-05	0.3	t/calls with Matlin Paterson re meeting to discuss POR
10-Nov-05	0.6	t/calls with Beckerman re status of term sheet; discuss same with F. Conway and with SIO
10-Nov-05	0.5	discuss work program with BAK; review Akin Gump email re CEO employment agreement
10-Nov-05	0.2	review Akin Gump summary memo re liquidating subs

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Nov-05	2.5	series of discussions with BAK, SIO and Beckerman re new MatlinPatterson term sheet and financing; t/calls with Committee members re same; review and respond to series of emails from Akin Gump re same; review new version of term sheet; discuss with ABT and review spreadsheet re same
11-Nov-05	0.4	t/call with Wright of Southwest re financing for ATA with BAK
11-Nov-05	1.4	t/calls with Committee members re options; discuss same with Botter
11-Nov-05	1.0	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO, ABT, CJE to review term sheet from MatlinPatterson and discuss available options
11-Nov-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
11-Nov-05	2.0	review ATA pleadings and filings re POR and MatlinPatterson financing
12-Nov-05	0.7	t/call with BAK re due diligence visit to ATA; series of emails re same to Compass and Akin professionals re financial information
13-Nov-05	1.4	review financial forecast provided by ATA; review and respond to emails from Botter re same and cc Compass professionals
14-Nov-05	0.2	review emails from Schaffer and Oran re issues for POR
14-Nov-05	0.4	review emails re status of Ambassador sale and discuss with BAK
14-Nov-05	0.3	review series of emails re Loeb resignation from Committee
14-Nov-05	3.5	series of discussions re strategic options and alternative financing with SIO, BAK and ABT including prepare for meetings at ATA; discuss same with Committee members; respond to Botter email and series of t/calls with Botter and Ferrante;
14-Nov-05	0.8	t/calls with MatlinPatterson re proposed investment in ATA with BAK and ABT
14-Nov-05	1.7	series of t/calls and meetings with proposed investors in ATA; discuss same with Ferrante of Akin Gump
14-Nov-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
15-Nov-05	0.7	Committee conf call with BAK, ABT and CJE to discuss options re MatlinPatterson and financing
15-Nov-05	0.6	series of t/calls and emails with MatlinPatterson re proposed meeting
15-Nov-05	1.0	t/calls to Committee members re options and business plan; emails to F. Conway and MJC re meeting at ATA
15-Nov-05	0.7	t/call with noteholder re status of financing; series of discussions and emails with Watzky of MatlinPatterson re financing
15-Nov-05	6.0	travel to Indy with BAK and SIO for meetings at ATA
16-Nov-05	1.0	travel to meeting at ATA
16-Nov-05	10.7	series of meetings at ATA with management to review new business plan OP7 with BAK and ABT and SIO; including t/calls with MatlinPatterson, Botter, Beckerman, MJC and SIO
16-Nov-05	0.8	series of t/calls with prospective competing bidders for ATA assets
17-Nov-05	0.5	series of emails to SIO and to potential strategic investors
17-Nov-05	0.5	travel to meetings at ALPA/ATA with ABT
17-Nov-05	1.2	meeting with ALPA MEC with ABT to review strategic options for ATA; follow up t/calls with Jacobson re same
17-Nov-05	1.0	Committee conf call with ABT and BAK; review terms of MatlinPatterson term sheet and new business plan and discuss options for improving recoveries
17-Nov-05	0.8	t/calls with noteholders re MatlinPatterson plan and alternatives; forward public information re MatlinPatterson bid to same
17-Nov-05	2.5	series of meetings and discussions at ATA with BAK, ABT, Peko, Thayer and Karnik to review financial forecast and results of scheduled service; includes t/call with Frick re amendments to ATA's business plan; review ABT memo to Committee re same
17-Nov-05	2.0	travel from ATA to Chicago
17-Nov-05	0.5	series of t/calls with BAK and SIO re alternative to ATA plan and work required
17-Nov-05	0.3	review Compass weekly report on cash flow

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Nov-05	0.4	review Ferrante info request re MatlinPatterson plan and review SIO and MJC responses
18-Nov-05	1.0	series of t/calls with Committee members and SIO re alternatives to ATA plan
18-Nov-05	0.8	t/calls with prospective strategic investors in ATA assets
18-Nov-05	1.0	t/call with BAK and Beckerman re options for Committee; emails to/from Compass professionals re due diligence call with Sean Frick, and discuss same with BAK
18-Nov-05	0.1	review emails from CJE re conf calls on Nov. 20
18-Nov-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
19-Nov-05	1.3	t/calls with Committee members re options; discuss same with BAK; review and reply to various emails re upcoming conf calls with ALPA and Committee professionals
20-Nov-05	2.0	review latest draft of Disclosure Statement and POR
20-Nov-05	0.8	review drafts of Compass presentations for Akin Gump re Nov. 23 court hearing; review Botter emails re upcoming deposition of ATA and Jefferies; review BAK email re break-up fees
20-Nov-05	0.7	conf call with ABT, ALPA, Calavritinos and Compass to discuss options
20-Nov-05	1.1	t/calls with BAK, SIO, MJC, ABT, CJE re analysis for Akin Gump and Compass work program
20-Nov-05	1.0	conf call with BAK, SIO, MJC and ABT to Akin Gump re options for Committee and support for litigation
20-Nov-05	0.6	series of t/calls with Calavritinos re options for Committee; review and edit draft email to potential strategic investor
20-Nov-05	0.5	t/call with ABT re analysis of ATA's business plan; review same
20-Nov-05	1.0	t/calls with SIO and with Calavritinos and MJC re options for Committee; review various emails from SIO re same
20-Nov-05	0.4	review Akin Gump summary of Gate transfer and code share motion
21-Nov-05	1.8	meeting at Akin Gump to review document production re deposition of Jefferies and F. Conway; follow-up discussion re same with BAK
21-Nov-05	4.0	series of t/calls and emails with prospective investors in ATA assets including multiple discussions with SIO and Calavritinos
21-Nov-05	0.5	series of discussions with Committee members re options for Committee
21-Nov-05	1.4	series of discussions with ABT and BAK re Compass analyses for Akin Gump and Court hearing on Nov. 23 and discuss with BAK; review Compass slide re same; discuss break-up fee research with BAK and CJE
21-Nov-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
21-Nov-05	0.7	further review of Jefferies document production re financing
22-Nov-05	1.8	series of discussions with BAK, CJE, ABT and Akin Gump regarding break-up and expense reimbursement fees, supporting materials for Akin Gump objection; court testimony, etc.; review Compass slide and emails re same
22-Nov-05	1.3	series of discussions with Committee members re options; discuss same with Botter; review support documents required by Akin Gump with BAK and ABT
22-Nov-05	0.7	series of t/calls with prospective investors in ATA assets including multiple discussions with SIO and Calavritinos
22-Nov-05	1.2	review Carlson deposition; review final of Committee objection
22-Nov-05	1.0	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, ABT to review options and Committee objections to Debtor's motion re MatlinPatterson
22-Nov-05	6.5	travel from NY to Louisville with BAK for hearing in bankruptcy court; review deposition documents en route
22-Nov-05	0.5	review ATA 10-Q for Sept 2005 quarter
22-Nov-05	0.1	discuss fee application with ETW
23-Nov-05	1.3	preparatory meeting with BAK, Akin Gump and Schaffer for upcoming Bankruptcy Court hearing

Date	TIME Hours	Description
23-Nov-05	3.0	attendance at Bankruptcy Court with BAK re motion to approve MatlinPatterson fees and expenses; series of meetings and t/calls to negotiate settlement with MatlinPatterson and discuss with Committee members
23-Nov-05	2.0	series of t/calls with Committee members and noteholders to discuss settlement with MatlinPatterson
23-Nov-05	1.0	series of follow-up discussions with BAK, MatlinPatterson and Akin Gump re settlement with MatlinPatterson and next steps
23-Nov-05	4.0	travel from Louisville to Bankruptcy Court and return to NY with BAK, net of other time entries
26-Nov-05	0.2	emails from/to CJE and ABT re Committee conf call
28-Nov-05	2.0	review final disclosure statement and POR documents filed in bankruptcy court
28-Nov-05	0.2	emails from/to SIO re Committee conf call; review email from Akin Gump re same
28-Nov-05	0.4	Committee conf call with BAK, ABT to review and vote on settlement agreement with MatlinPatterson
28-Nov-05	0.4	t/call with BAK to Calavritinos re next steps for POR and negotiating term of options
28-Nov-05	0.5	discuss changes to business plan with BAK; discuss bridge analysis re same
28-Nov-05	1.0	meeting with noteholder re changes to business plan
28-Nov-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
28-Nov-05	0.2	review Akin Gump memo re Greenebaum fee app
29-Nov-05	0.2	discuss forecast EBITDA bridge with BAK and ABT
30-Nov-05	0.7	t/call with Botter re term of options unsecured creditors; discuss review of Debtor's liquidation analysis and valuation with BAK
30-Nov-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
30-Nov-05	0.2	discuss forecast EBITDA bridge with BAK and ABT; review and respond to related emails
30-Nov-05	0.3	discuss need for a "road show" with BAK and review email to Frank Conway
30-Nov-05	0.4	review Akin Gump email re Committee conf call and update on POR documents
1-Dec-05	0.3	review changes to POR
1-Dec-05	0.1	review Akin Gump email re Committee conf call and update on POR documents
1-Dec-05	0.4	t/calls with Watzky re options and investment agreement; email to Botter re same
1-Dec-05	0.2	prep for Committee call with BAK
1-Dec-05	1.5	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO, ABT and CJE; discuss status of POR and disclosure statement and review issues re POR
1-Dec-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re ongoing process to confirmation
1-Dec-05	0.5	t/call with F Conway re valuation, etc.; review work program with BAK and ABT
1-Dec-05	0.5	review EBITDAR assumptions in new plan with ABT
1-Dec-05	0.7	review October 2005 monthly operating report; review latest Compass weekly cash report
2-Dec-05	0.6	review ABT memo re EBITDAR assumptions; discuss same with ABT
2-Dec-05	0.3	t/calls with Chodok of MatlinPatterson re warrants, etc.
2-Dec-05	0.2	t/call with Beckerman re POR timetable and valuation
2-Dec-05	0.3	t/calls with Botter re \$25 mm co-investment right and timing
2-Dec-05	0.5	t/call with noteholders re status of POR
2-Dec-05	3.0	series of discussions and review of valuation with BAK, ABT and SIO; review related emails
2-Dec-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
2-Dec-05	2.5	update and review Oct. time records
3-Dec-05	0.3	review latest changes to POR
3-Dec-05	1.8	conf call with BAK, SIO, ABT and Navigant to review valuation; including follow-up conf call with Compass professionals re same
3-Dec-05	0.3	emails with SIO re fee app; discuss same with ETW

Date	TIME Hours	Description
4-Dec-05	0.4	review emails re financial information in disclosure statement
5-Dec-05	1.5	review latest blackline of disclosure statement and ATSB term sheet
5-Dec-05	0.8	Committee Conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO, ABT and CJE to review disclosure statement and valuation issues
5-Dec-05	3.5	series of discussions and review of documents and schedules re valuation with ABT, BAK and SIO; t/call with Navigant re same; series of discussions with Akin Gump re same
5-Dec-05	0.2	t/call with Watzky re minority protections
5-Dec-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re POR issues and minority protections
5-Dec-05	0.2	discuss ATA fee app with ETW
5-Dec-05	0.3	review and respond to various emails re upcoming court hearings
6-Dec-05	0.4	review ATSB term sheet and discuss with BAK
6-Dec-05	1.2	series of t/calls with Committee members and noteholders re status of POR and o/s issues re valuation and minority protections
6-Dec-05	0.2	t/call with Watzky re warrant term, review minority protections term sheet draft re same
6-Dec-05	4.5	series of discussions and review of materials, emails and other documents with BAK, ABT and Akin Gump re valuation, creditors recoveries, warrants, minority protections and disclosure statement
6-Dec-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
7-Dec-05	6.5	series of discussions, t/calls, review and responses to emails re minority protections, valuation, claims pool, and other disclosure related items including multiple calls with Akin Gump, discussions with Committee co-chair, BAK, SIO and ABT and with MatlinPatterson
7-Dec-05	0.5	review latest changes to disclosure statement and POR
7-Dec-05	0.7	review draft of 10-Q report and discuss with ABT
7-Dec-05	0.3	review draft letter re report to Wells Fargo
7-Dec-05	1.0	meeting with BAK and John Hancock re ATA's POR and subscription rights
8-Dec-05	2.2	series of emails and t/calls with BAK and ABT and Ferrante re warrant and minority protections incl. t/calls with MatlinPatterson
8-Dec-05	0.1	review email from Akin Gump re continuation of disclosure statement hearing
8-Dec-05	0.5	review various emails re disclosure statement and valuation issues
9-Dec-05	0.4	review various emails re disclosure statement and valuation issues
9-Dec-05	3.5	series of t/calls with BAK, ABT, Beckerman and/or MatlinPatterson re minority protections, warrant and valuation language in disclosure statement
10-Dec-05	0.8	continue to review various emails re disclosure statement and valuation issues; review latest draft of minority protection and warrant issues
10-Dec-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
10-Dec-05	0.6	review latest changes to Disclosure Statement; review Committee support letter
10-Dec-05	0.3	review latest Compass report of cash projection
10-Dec-05	0.3	review latest ATSB term sheet and email BAK re same
11-Dec-05	3.0	series of t/calls with BAK, Strickland, Beckerman and/or MatlinPatterson counsel re minority protections and warrant and disclosure statement language; review related emails/documents
11-Dec-05	0.1	review emails from BAK and Beckerman re ATSB term sheet
12-Dec-05	0.2	discuss 10-Q 3rd quarter report with CJE and ABT
12-Dec-05	0.3	review claims pool with BAK and CJE and review model re same
12-Dec-05	1.2	review latest changes to Disclosure Statement; discuss valuation issue and final minority protection language with BAK, ABT and Akin Gump; discuss issues for Disclosure Statement hearing with BAK
13-Dec-05	1.4	review Akin Gump email re status of disclosure statement; t/call with BAK re status of disclosure statement, etc.

Date	TIME Hours	Description
14-Dec-05	1.0	discussion with BAK re "road show" for noteholders; series of t/calls with noteholders re POR and subscription rights; review BAK email re same; discuss Wells Fargo letter with BAK
15-Dec-05	0.3	review emails from Akin Gump re approval of disclosure statement and gate transfers
15-Dec-05	0.2	review various emails re size of GE claim
19-Dec-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
19-Dec-05	0.3	review latest Compass report of cash projection
19-Dec-05	0.5	series of t/calls with noteholders re POR
19-Dec-05	0.2	discuss progress on road show with BAK
20-Dec-05	1.0	series of t/calls with noteholders re POR; review Akin Gump timeline
20-Dec-05	0.2	email to F. Conway re road show meeting with creditors
20-Dec-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
21-Dec-05	0.5	t/call with Schaffer re Wells Fargo letter; discuss same with BAK; review and respond to Beckerman emails re same
21-Dec-05	0.5	discussion with BAK re GE claims and Wells Fargo letter; discuss same with Ferrante
21-Dec-05	0.3	discuss Mercer extension with SIO; review related emails
21-Dec-05	0.3	review latest ATSB draft and emails re same with BAK
22-Dec-05	0.3	review BAK draft of overview of ATA case for inclusion in fee app
22-Dec-05	0.3	t/call with noteholders re POR
23-Dec-05	0.3	review various emails re final draft of ATSB term sheet
23-Dec-05	0.3	t/call with noteholders re POR and financing option
23-Dec-05	0.3	review Compass weekly cash report
23-Dec-05	0.3	emails to/from F. Conway re "road show"
23-Dec-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
24-Dec-05	0.1	review SIO email re Mercer extension
26-Dec-05	0.5	work on draft letter to Wells Fargo re POR
27-Dec-05	0.3	review Compass final report on Oct 2005 results
27-Dec-05	0.1	email to CJE re payments to be made on confirmation of POR
28-Dec-05	0.3	discuss payments to be made on confirmation of POR with CJE and review related email
28-Dec-05	0.8	t/call and meeting with noteholders re POR
28-Dec-05	0.2	review BAK emails re GCAS claim
29-Dec-05	2.0	work on draft letter to Wells Fargo re POR; review SIO comments; discuss same with BAK and Schaffer
29-Dec-05	2.0	update and review Nov. time records
30-Dec-05	0.2	review CJE summary of admin disbursement for ATA for POR
30-Dec-05	0.2	review and respond to emails with Ferrante re GCAS claim
30-Dec-05	0.4	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Akin Gump email re funding of DIP
2-Jan-06	2.5	update and review Nov. time records
2-Jan-06	0.4	review SIO draft of services rendered summary and discuss with ETW
3-Jan-06	0.3	review November 2005 monthly operating report
3-Jan-06	0.3	t/call with Beckerman and Ferrante re documents to review for ATA
3-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Calavritinos re disclosure statement and co-investment
3-Jan-06	0.1	t/call with BAK re review of warrant term sheet
3-Jan-06	0.8	review letter to Wells Fargo with SIO and Schaffer including revisions
3-Jan-06	0.1	emails to F. Conway re "road show"
3-Jan-06	0.6	review latest drafts of warrants and by-laws for Reorg ATA
4-Jan-06	0.5	t/calls with noteholders re POR
4-Jan-06	1.2	t/calls with Strickland and discussions with BAK, SIO and ABT re warrant document and bylaws; review updated bylaws

Date	TIME Hours	Description
4-Jan-06	1.0	t/calls with Schaffer re Wells Fargo and disbursements; discuss and revise letter for Wells Fargo
4-Jan-06	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB, conf call with SIO
4-Jan-06	0.4	discuss amendments to ATSB loan agreement with ABT; review related emails
4-Jan-06	0.2	emails to/from Schaffer re distributions to noteholders; review and reply to emails with F. Conway re "road show"
5-Jan-06	2.3	series of t/calls with Strickland and discussions with BAK, SIO and ABT re warrant document and bylaws; review changes to documents
5-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Schaffer re Wells Fargo and disbursements
5-Jan-06	0.6	series of t/calls and emails with F. Conway and Akin Gump re "road show"
5-Jan-06	0.4	t/calls with noteholders re POR
5-Jan-06	0.5	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss same with BAK; review Compass report re same
5-Jan-06	0.1	review email from Akin Gump re Committee conf call
6-Jan-06	0.3	t/calls with F. Conway re "road show"
6-Jan-06	0.8	review revisions to corp. governance documents; review and respond to related emails
6-Jan-06	1.5	t/call with SIO to Akin Gump and Sidley Austin re corp governance documents
6-Jan-06	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re Committee call and corp governance; also with Arthur Calavritinos
6-Jan-06	0.1	review email from Akin Gump re Committee conf call
8-Jan-06	0.4	email to MatlinPatterson re meeting to review ATA; email to BAK and ABT re analysis of ch 11 fees and review underlying est. amounts
8-Jan-06	0.3	review changes to POR filed in court
9-Jan-06	0.9	emails to and t/call with F. Conway re "road show;" t/calls re same with Chodock of MatlinPatterson and meeting to review performance of ATA; discuss same with SIO
9-Jan-06	2.3	t/calls with Committee co-chair re governance; series of t/calls with Akin Gump and Sidley Austin re corporate governance with SIO; discuss same with ALPA; review related documents re same
9-Jan-06	0.5	Committee call with BAK, SIO, ABT and CJE to discuss governance and Board selection and Compass cash flow report
9-Jan-06	0.5	series of t/calls and emails with MatlinPatterson re call with Compass on Jan 10; discuss agenda with SIO
9-Jan-06	1.0	series of t/calls with AMBAC counsel and noteholders re subscription rights; discuss analysis of rights per claim with BAK
10-Jan-06	1.0	conf call with SIO and MatlinPatterson re ATA
10-Jan-06	0.5	discuss results of MatlinPatterson call with SIO and BAK; review need for "road show" with BAK and review related emails
10-Jan-06	0.4	t/calls with Committee members re "road show" meeting with ATA
10-Jan-06	1.0	series of discussions/emails with BAK and noteholders and Akin Gump re "road show", review and respond to related emails re POR and subscription
10-Jan-06	0.3	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
10-Jan-06	0.2	review various emails re cures and assumption of contracts and discuss with BAK
10-Jan-06	0.3	t/call with Strickland re by-laws and review and respond to related emails
11-Jan-06	0.6	review recovery per dollar of claim and discuss same with ABT and BAK; review BAK emails to noteholder re same
11-Jan-06	0.8	review new management changes at ATA and email Committee re same; discuss with BAK and SIO; review and respond to related emails from Akin Gump and Committee members
11-Jan-06	0.4	series of discussions and emails re payment agent for plan disbursements
11-Jan-06	1.0	review revised exhibits to POR for Jan 17 filing; review related email from Strickland

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Jan-06	0.2	discuss proposed Sabre settlement with BAK
11-Jan-06	0.3	t/call with noteholders re POR and rights offering
12-Jan-06	0.2	email to Carr re payment agent for plan disbursements
12-Jan-06	1.3	series of discussions with BAK and emails with multiple parties re "road show" session with company; series of discussions with noteholders re same
13-Jan-06	1.0	series of discussions with BAK and emails with multiple parties re "road show" session with company; series of discussions with noteholders re same
13-Jan-06	0.4	t/calls with Committee co-chair re meeting with MatlinPatterson and content of "road show"
13-Jan-06	0.4	t/call with Esther Tryban Telser re Board nominees incl review of emails; review email from Akin Gump re same
13-Jan-06	0.3	t/calls with Watzky re meeting with Committee co-chair
13-Jan-06	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB + latest Compass report of weekly cash forecast
13-Jan-06	0.2	review Carr email re list of prospective invitees to "road show"
14-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Calavritinos re financial projections in disclosure statement
15-Jan-06	0.2	review and respond to series of emails from Committee member re valuation of ATA
15-Jan-06	0.2	review docket and email query re same to BAK re professional fees
16-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Calavritinos re admin expenses for ATA
16-Jan-06	0.1	review email from Committee member re valuation
16-Jan-06	0.1	emails to from MatlinPatterson and Calavritinos re meeting
17-Jan-06	0.1	review email response by BAK re professional fees
17-Jan-06	0.6	series of t/calls with BAK and Calavritinos re ATA presentation to creditors and meeting with MatlinPatterson; review and/or reply to related various emails re financing
17-Jan-06	0.3	t/call with Ferrante re ATA Committee conf call; review related emails
17-Jan-06	0.2	review markup of letter to Wells Fargo
17-Jan-06	0.3	review BAK email re Sabre settlement; review Akin Gump summary re same
18-Jan-06	0.1	review email from Ferrante re Committee conf call
18-Jan-06	0.2	review email from Akin Gump re nominees for Board of reorganized ATA
18-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Jim Carr re ATA presentation to creditors
18-Jan-06	0.6	t/call with BAK re ATA presentation to creditors; review related emails
19-Jan-06	0.1	review Beckerman email to Schaeffer re Confirmation hearing
19-Jan-06	0.2	discuss Committee call with BAK
19-Jan-06	0.4	review and respond to series of emails re Board seat on reorganized ATA; review email re noteholder participation in financing
19-Jan-06	0.1	review email from Ferrante re Committee conf call for March 2006
20-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Committee co-chair re investment in Reorg. ATA
22-Jan-06	0.4	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass weekly cash flow report
22-Jan-06	0.2	review Akin Gump summary re Huron 3rd quarter fee request
22-Jan-06	0.1	review Akin Gump summary re Key Equipment Corp request for voting rights
22-Jan-06	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re investment in Reorg. ATA
23-Jan-06	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re investment in Reorg. ATA; t/call with Schaffer re confirmation hearing
23-Jan-06	0.2	t/call with Ferrante re bio for Board position
23-Jan-06	0.7	review new/revise exhibits to POR (B, C and D)
23-Jan-06	0.3	review email from Committee member re labor issue and discuss with BAK and review related emails, including discussion with BAK and L. Beckerman of Akin re issues
23-Jan-06	0.2	review recent research report on ATA route changes
23-Jan-06	0.6	review report of Examiner re Chicago Express

Date	TIME Hours	Description
24-Jan-06	0.6	t/calls re eligibility requirements for Board with Akin Gump and Committee co-chair; forward HLT resume
24-Jan-06	0.3	review Committee objection to NatTel claim for admin expense
24-Jan-06	0.2	review summary of objections to POR
25-Jan-06	0.3	review Akin Gump summaries re Key Equipment Corp lease, Ameritech & ILFC
25-Jan-06	0.8	t/calls with Beckerman and BAK re confirmation issues for ATA; t/call with Schulte re subscription rights; review and respond to email from Schulte
26-Jan-06	0.3	review Akin Gump summary of objections to confirmation
26-Jan-06	0.3	discuss voting results with BAK and review related emails
26-Jan-06	0.1	emails to/from MatlinPatterson re confirmation hearing
26-Jan-06	1.0	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, CJE and ABT to review objections to confirmation, cash report and Board nominees
26-Jan-06	0.4	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass report to the Committee
26-Jan-06	0.2	review Akin Gump summary of Qwest settlement and BAK email re same
27-Jan-06	0.3	series of emails and t/calls re attendance at confirmation hearing in Indianapolis
27-Jan-06	0.2	series of emails with Beckerman re information on HLT re eligibility requirements for Board
27-Jan-06	0.3	review Akin Gump summary of Stanfield & RBC objections to POR re foreign subscription to rights offering
27-Jan-06	0.3	review ATA's objection to NatTel objection to confirmation
29-Jan-06	5.7	travel to Indy from New York re attendance at Bankruptcy Court for confirmation hearing; including discussions re same with Carr, BAK, Beckerman and S. Cohen; review amendments/new exhibits to POR; review email re ILFC
30-Jan-06	11.7	attendance at Bankruptcy Court with BAK for confirmation hearing on POR; including travel to/from court and return trip to NY
31-Jan-06	0.3	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
31-Jan-06	2.0	update and review Dec. time records
1-Feb-06	0.7	review order confirming POR and NatTel objections to same
1-Feb-06	0.2	review Akin Gump summary re DIP fee for Jefferies and KPMG engagement
1-Feb-06	0.2	review Compass report on Nov. 2005 operating report
2-Feb-06	0.1	review Akin Gump summary re Baker & Daniels & Ponader fee apps
3-Feb-06	1.0	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass report on weekly cash report; discuss forecasted variances with BAK and review related emails, including discussion with BAK and CJE re ATA's low cash balances
6-Feb-06	0.4	initial review of Chicago Express POR and Disclosure Statement
6-Feb-06	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; follow-up discussion with BAK re cash flow forecast for ATA
7-Feb-06	0.2	review Akin Gump summary of Bancorp motion for admin claim and George's motion re personal injury
7-Feb-06	0.1	review email to Beckerman re closing of POR and HLT Board position
8-Feb-06	0.1	review Akin Gump summary re Sommer Barnard fee app
8-Feb-06	0.2	review Akin Gump email re status of effective date; review and reply to email re HLT Board eligibility
8-Feb-06	0.2	review emails re discussion with Yakola re cash flow forecast for ATA
9-Feb-06	0.6	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss same with BAK and ABT
9-Feb-06	0.4	discuss results of BAK call with Yakola regarding cash projection; review and reply to BAK email re same
9-Feb-06	0.3	review results of subscription rights participation and discuss with BAK
10-Feb-06	0.2	discuss fee app and request for Chicago Express information with BAK
10-Feb-06	0.5	review Compass report on weekly cash flow forecast and discuss same with BAK

Date	TIME Hours	Description
13-Feb-06	0.6	review recent daily cash reporting packages and discuss cash flow status with BAK and Committee co-chair
14-Feb-06	0.2	review court docket for Feb. 13, 2006
15-Feb-06	0.5	series of t/calls with Strickland and discussion with BAK re advisory Committee re independent director; review related emails with Baker & Daniels and BMC
15-Feb-06	0.2	series of emails with ETW re fee app
15-Feb-06	0.5	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss same with BAK
16-Feb-06	0.3	discuss results of subscription rights participation with BAK and review related emails
17-Feb-06	0.3	review amended results of subscription rights participation and discuss with BAK
17-Feb-06	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass weekly cash report
21-Feb-06	0.5	review series of emails from ETW re fee app and discuss same with ETW and BAK; discuss Chicago Express fee with BAK and review related emails
22-Feb-06	0.2	review emails from Akin Gump re NatTel motion for stay of confirmation and results of Court hearing
22-Feb-06	0.3	review weekly projections and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
22-Feb-06	0.1	discuss fee application with ETW
23-Feb-06	0.2	discussions fee application with ETW and BAK
24-Feb-06	0.2	review Akin Gump summary re Navigant Fee app
24-Feb-06	0.2	discuss ATSB loan and balance with BAK and review related emails for response to Akin Gump
24-Feb-06	2.5	review time records for period and work on fee app outline
27-Feb-06	0.2	review emails re ATSB loan and balance with BAK and review related emails for response to Akin Gump
27-Feb-06	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass weekly report on weekly cash flow forecast
27-Feb-06	0.5	series of emails and t/calls with Strickland and Beckerman re HLT consent to serve on Board and closing issues
28-Feb-06	0.2	t/calls and exchange emails with ETW and Akin Gump re fee application
28-Feb-06	0.6	series of emails and t/calls with Beckerman, BAK& Strickland re HLT consent to serve on Board and closing issues; discuss rates for continuing work on behalf of the Committee and email same; review email re POR going effective
SubTotal	1,701.9	

In re: ATA Holdings Corp., et al. EXHIBIT D
Compass Advisers, LLP – Time Records for the Period November 4, 2004 to February 28, 2006

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Michael J. Conway – Senior Advisor		
4-Nov-04	6.0	discussion with HLT, BAK & SIO re: documents required to prepare for meeting with the Debtors
5-Nov-04	8.0	phone discussions with following aircraft providers to ATA: ILFC, Boeing and GECAS. Phone discussions with Geo. Mikelsons as well as with several Compass associates throughout the day. Also discussed DIP lending with Hawaiian Air and Mesa Air. Review of various ATA documents, t/call with Kurtz re ATSB review
7-Nov-04	5.0	travel time LAS to IND
7-Nov-04	0.7	Committee conference call with HLT, BAK, MF & SIO re alternatives and agenda for meeting with ATA
8-Nov-04	12.0	meetings with Creditors' Committee and ATA and various ATA officials and advisers
8-Nov-04	0.3	travel to hotel
9-Nov-04	0.3	travel to ATA
9-Nov-04	14.0	breakfast meeting with ATA CRO and Compass Associates. Meetings throughout the day and evening with ATA and Huron personnel reviewing ATA financial data, primarily Cash forecasts, collective data analysis
9-Nov-04	0.3	travel to hotel
10-Nov-04	0.3	travel to ATA
10-Nov-04	10.0	meetings with ATA personnel and Huron re cash forecasts and alternative business models; call to ILFC and conference calls with Committee and associates at Compass.
10-Nov-04	0.3	travel to hotel
11-Nov-04	0.3	travel to ATA
11-Nov-04	12.0	meetings with ATA personnel and Huron re cash forecasts and alternative business models; conference calls with Committee and Compass associates
11-Nov-04	0.3	travel to hotel
12-Nov-04	0.3	travel to ATA
12-Nov-04	5.0	meeting with Mesa Air re DIP; various meetings and review of data requests from Huron and development of alternative business models
12-Nov-04	0.5	series of discussions with BAK & HLT re diligence
12-Nov-04	5.5	travel to NYC
13-Nov-04	0.7	discussion with HLT & SIO re components of ATA's various businesses
15-Nov-04	5.0	travel IND/LAS
15-Nov-04	3.0	review of due diligence materials, update from HLT re results of day and work program
16-Nov-04	5.0	review of pilot pay and productivity analysis and other due diligence materials; various calls and emails with Compass associates
17-Nov-04	5.0	travel LAS/IND
17-Nov-04	4.0	dinner with Akin Gump and Compass associates. To go over AirTran Bid and related break fees and update on other potential bidders
18-Nov-04	10.0	attended Court hearing and meetings at Baker Daniels on AirTran bid; Meeting with F/A Committee reps.
19-Nov-04	6.0	meetings at ATA re cash forecasts, other bidder and alternative business models, including discussion with SIO & HLT re prospective bidders re ATA
19-Nov-04	5.0	travel IND/LAS
20-Nov-04	3.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models
21-Nov-04	3.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models including discussion with HLT & SIO
22-Nov-04	5.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models, including discussion with HLT re Midway operations and pilot pay, and prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information

Date	TIME Hours	Description
23-Nov-04	0.7	discuss comp analysis with AD
23-Nov-04	4.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models, including discussion with HLT, SIO & BAK re prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information
24-Nov-04	3.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models, including discussions with BAK, SIO, HLT, MF & PS re analytical work and reports to Committee members
24-Nov-04	0.2	review summary analysis of prepaid rents and discuss same with HLT
24-Nov-04	0.5	discuss comp analysis with AD, SIO and HLT
25-Nov-04	3.2	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models
26-Nov-04	4.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models and status of and options for ATA, discuss same with BAK, MF & HLT
26-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with PS re comp analysis
27-Nov-04	6.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models, including conference call with BAK, MF, HLT & SIO regarding review of business plan for 2005
28-Nov-04	3.0	review of Project Sunshine and discussions re alternative business models, email to/from HLT re updated notes and M&A and financing alternatives
29-Nov-04	3.0	discussion with Hawaiian Air, calls to JetBlue, et al and discussions with Compass associates re cash flow memo and summary of P&L
29-Nov-04	5.0	travel LAS/IND
30-Nov-04	12.0	meetings at ATA with Company and Huron personnel re Project Sunshine (leases, military business, MDW and IND schedule. service, cash forecasts, etc)
1-Dec-04	0.4	travel to ATA with MF & BAK
1-Dec-04	11.2	meetings at ATA with BAK & MF re bidders and related business plans, including t/calls with HLT, MF & BAK re review of report to Committee on financial projection model
1-Dec-04	0.4	travel to hotel with MF
2-Dec-04	9.6	meetings at ATA re bidders and conf call with HLT, SIO, BAK, MF & GECAS re plans for company and related business plans
2-Dec-04	5.7	travel IND/LAS
2-Dec-04	0.2	discuss WACC calculation with PS
3-Dec-04	0.2	discussions and t/calls with HLT & ETW re bid procedures documents
3-Dec-04	6.3	discussions with Akin Gump re leases and KERP; JetBlue as potential bidders
3-Dec-04	0.3	discuss 1110 issues with HLT & BAK
3-Dec-04	1.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members regarding analysis of various bids; discuss same with HLT, MF, SIO and BAK; review status of bids
4-Dec-04	5.0	conference call with Huron and review of KERP and other matters with Compass Associates, including ATSB collateral and Project Sunshine.
5-Dec-04	1.3	conf call with HLT, BAK, SIO & Huron to discuss opens areas needing further analysis and discussion re the three proposals
6-Dec-04	6.3	review of SWA Business Model, including work on valuation and recovery issues with BAK, MF, HLT & SIO, discuss new business plan for prospective Southwest transaction
7-Dec-04	4.1	review of SWA Business Model with PS
8-Dec-04	7.4	review of SWA Business Model (2.0), and travel LAS/MDW (5.0)
8-Dec-04	1.5	series of discussions with Committee members and Committee counsel regarding bidders for ATA assets and value available for unsecured creditors
8-Dec-04	0.4	discuss process with ETW
9-Dec-04	9.3	meeting with Creditors Committee (5.0); dinner with Creditors' Committee (4.0)
10-Dec-04	8.0	meeting with SWA (3.0); travel MDW/PHX (5.0)
11-Dec-04	2.4	conference call with Committee Professionals with HLT, BAK & SIO

Date	TIME Hours	Description
12-Dec-04	14.4	travel PHX/IND (5.0); Committee conference call (1.24); Meetings at Baker & Daniels re asset bidders (8.0).
13-Dec-04	13.0	bid proceedings at Baker & Daniels with HLT, BAK & MF
14-Dec-04	11.2	bid proceedings at Baker & Daniels, review NatTel Bid with HLT, BAK & MF
15-Dec-04	11.0	bid proceedings at Baker & Daniels
16-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with HLT, BAK, SIO, MF, creditors and advisors
16-Dec-04	5.0	travel IND/LAS
17-Dec-04	2.3	conference call re aircraft affirmations with HLT, BAK, MRC & PS, follow up with PS
17-Dec-04	0.7	series of discussions with SIO and HLT re leases and lease rejections, etc.
18-Dec-04	2.5	conference call re aircraft affirmations with HLT, BAK, & PS, follow up with PS
18-Dec-04	0.6	series of t/calls with HLT, SIO, MF, Beckerman, Allison and Viets regarding leases and related issues
19-Dec-04	4.5	KERP review (2.0) and aircraft matters (2.30)
19-Dec-04	1.8	conf call with HLT, SIO & advisors focused on lease rejection and assumption issues
20-Dec-04	4.3	conference call with Debtor re aircraft matters(2.0); review of current lease rates with various lessors(2.0)
20-Dec-04	0.4	review updated cash flow information and report to Committee concerning cash flow, review background information concerning Dennison
21-Dec-04	4.2	conference call with Debtor re aircraft matters(2.0); review of current lease rates with various lessors(2.0)
21-Dec-04	1.3	Committee conf call to discuss results of bankruptcy court hearing, ATSB, KERP and interview with John proposed Co-CRO
21-Dec-04	0.5	t/calls with HLT & SIO regarding options for leases
22-Dec-04	5.0	conference call re aircraft matters
22-Dec-04	2.5	series of t/calls with HLT, SIO and discussions with BAK regarding code share, leasing issues, and discussion with proposed Co-CRO; series of discussions with Viets and Allison regarding leases and ExecuJet
23-Dec-04	4.8	conference call re aircraft matters
24-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with Allison and HLT regarding lessors
27-Dec-04	1.3	discussions re CRO and CEO positions
27-Dec-04	1.2	conf call with HLT, MF and Allison re CRO, lease fleet, ExecuJet, executive decision making, etc.
27-Dec-04	0.3	series of t/calls with SIO and HLT re CRO and ATA operations and leases; t/call with Allison re leases
27-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with HLT, Viets and Allison regarding discussions with lessor
27-Dec-04	0.5	t/call with Beckerman and HLT re options for ATA
28-Dec-04	1.6	discussions re CRO and CEO positions and t/calls with HLT, SIO, MF & Beckerman
29-Dec-04	1.7	discussions re CRO and CEO positions
30-Dec-04	1.6	discussions re CRO and CEO positions
3-Jan-05	1.0	time and expense preparation
3-Jan-05	0.8	t/calls/discussions with HLT and SIO regarding KERP, CRO and lease rejections
3-Jan-05	1.1	conf call with Viets, SIO and HLT re CRO, financial projections and cash flow and KERP
4-Jan-05	0.2	email correspondence with Akin Gump re selection of Executive Search firm
4-Jan-05	1.5	Committee professionals conf call on KERP with HLT & BAK
5-Jan-05	0.5	email correspondence with HLT, SIO, BAK & MF re CRO position
5-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with BAK re lessors and CRO
5-Jan-05	1.0	conf call with Gil Viets and HLT to discuss strategic plan
5-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up discussion with HLT & SIO re issues to due diligence
6-Jan-05	3.5	review of ATA bookings and cash flow data

Date	TIME Hours	Description
6-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up call with BAK, SIO and HLT re fleet plan and business plan
6-Jan-05	2.8	conf call with HLT, SIO and prospective executive recruiters re CEO search at Akin Gump incl. travel to/from Akin Gump
6-Jan-05	0.2	discussion with Beckerman, HLT & SIO re CEO search
7-Jan-05	1.4	review of simulator stipulation notices with MF
10-Jan-05	2.2	review of Seabury MDW Study
11-Jan-05	0.5	discussion with HLT, SIO, BAK & MF re recently announced industry fare cuts and potential impact on ATA
11-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with SIO, HLT and Calavritinos re fleet and availability of new aircraft
11-Jan-05	2.0	conf call with SIO, BAK, HLT and Huron to review lease issues, KERP, and fleet; review related emails and analyses re same
13-Jan-05	2.3	conf. Call with Gil Viets, HLT, SIO, BAK and MF on operation status and business plan update
13-Jan-05	1.7	review KERP Application with HLT, SIO, BAK and MF
13-Jan-05	1.3	review of search firm engagement letter
13-Jan-05	1.0	discuss options for ATA with HLT, BAK and SIO
14-Jan-05	2.2	review of KERP term sheet
14-Jan-05	0.5	email correspondence re search firm engagement letter
14-Jan-05	1.0	t/call with Viets, HLT, BAK, and MF re business plan and new exec. appointments
14-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re options for ATA
15-Jan-05	3.5	review of ATA bookings and cash flow data
16-Jan-05	0.5	email correspondence re search firm engagement letter
17-Jan-05	2.2	review of aircraft availability (B767) provided by foreign lessor and email communication of same to ATA
18-Jan-05	1.0	review of ATA's comments re search firm selection criteria
18-Jan-05	0.8	meeting with ATA and Huron to discuss financial performance of ATA
18-Jan-05	0.1	discuss with HLT re CRO
18-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re Spencer Stuart
19-Jan-05	7.2	series of Conf. Calls with ATA and Huron personnel and SIO, BAK & MF re fleet rationalization, business model status
19-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with HLT and SIO re strategic options for ATA and implementation of code share
20-Jan-05	0.5	discuss with BAK options for ATA
20-Jan-05	2.0	search Committee Conference call with Spencer Stuart
20-Jan-05	0.3	discussion with HLT re options for ATA
20-Jan-05	0.9	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT, MF, BAK & SIO re new presentation
21-Jan-05	0.6	discuss due diligence follow-up with HLT and BAK
23-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re planned trip to Indianapolis
24-Jan-05	4.5	review and assessment of CEO candidates list provided by search firm
24-Jan-05	0.5	t/calls and discussion with BAK, MF, HLT & SIO re new presentation
24-Jan-05	0.2	series of t/calls with Denison, Beckerman, Calavritinos & HLT re meeting with ATA re business plan and strategic options
25-Jan-05	5.0	travel to IND from LAS on ATA
25-Jan-05	2.8	dinner meeting with HLT, BAK & MF re pending IND size down and other related operational issues
25-Jan-05	1.7	meeting with John Denison re his new status at ATA and his views on company prospects and personnel
25-Jan-05	0.4	discuss Beckerman & Botter meeting at ATA with SIO, HLT, MF and BAK
26-Jan-05	4.5	meeting with ATA senior executives and Creditors' Committee, HLT, SIO, BAK and MF to review major changes to ATA's operations
26-Jan-05	2.8	dinner meeting with John Denison to discuss pending operational changes presented by ATA earlier today
27-Jan-05	5.0	travel to IND from LAS on ATA

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Jan-05	0.6	review options for ATA with HLT & SIO
1-Feb-05	0.8	call with M. Bell of SpencerStuart re CEO search
1-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re executive search
2-Feb-05	0.5	review of advance materials for weekly CEO Search conf. call
2-Feb-05	1.2	Committee conf. Call with HLT, SIO, BAK & MF, primary topics were liquidity, fleet and employee negotiations
2-Feb-05	0.4	t/call with HLT and MF re code share and cash flow
3-Feb-05	1.0	series of calls with HLT and BAK re desired sale of Chicago Express
4-Feb-05	1.0	review of Court filings and data provided to ATSB, primarily as it relates to bookings and liquidity issues
4-Feb-05	1.1	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT re options for ATA incl. cash requirements, fleet and business plan
5-Feb-05	1.0	review of Court filings and data provided to ATSB, primarily as it relates to bookings and liquidity issues
7-Feb-05	0.5	review & discussion with M. Bell (Spencer Stuart) re CEO candidate spec sheet
7-Feb-05	0.4	discuss HLT t/call to Allison re cash flow projection with HLT
8-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with BAK regarding ATSB collateral and 757 stipulations
8-Feb-05	5.0	travel to MDW from LAS
9-Feb-05	4.0	dinner meeting with Committee members, HLT, BAK, SIO and MF; primary topics were management leadership, fleet planning and employee negotiations
10-Feb-05	4.0	company presentation to Creditors with HLT, BAK, SIO and MF
10-Feb-05	5.0	travel to LAS from Chicago
11-Feb-05	1.5	Committee conf. call with HLT, SIO, MF and BAK, primary topics were liquidity, fleet and employee negotiations
11-Feb-05	0.5	series of t/calls with HLT and BAK, Beckerman and certain Committee members re cash flow issues
13-Feb-05	1.0	discuss strategic alternatives with BAK, HLT and SIO
14-Feb-05	1.1	discussions with HLT re due diligence
15-Feb-05	3.2	meetings with Company officials (Viets, Denison and Allison) and Arthur C., Chair of Committee and HLT, BAK and MF; primary topics were liquidity, fleet and employee negotiations
15-Feb-05	5.0	travel to IND from LAS
16-Feb-05	2.5	attended Company's Fleet Planning meeting with HLT, MF and BAK
16-Feb-05	1.0	CEO Search Committee conf. call with HLT, MF and BAK
16-Feb-05	1.5	resumption of fleet planning meeting
16-Feb-05	5.0	travel to LAS from Indianapolis
17-Feb-05	0.5	discuss results of auction with Calavritinos and HLT
17-Feb-05	1.6	Committee conf call with BAK, HLT, MF & SIO; discuss fleet issues, most recent cash flow and scheduled meetings with ATA and Committee
22-Feb-05	2.0	review of Court filings and data provided to ATSB, primarily as it relates to bookings and liquidity issues
22-Feb-05	0.4	t/call with HLT re cash forecast and recent results with Viets, Denison, Committee members, etc.
23-Feb-05	1.0	review and discussion with counsel re Discover Card Holdback filing, including discussion with MF re GATX proposal
23-Feb-05	0.4	t/calls with HLT re business prospects and CEO search
24-Feb-05	0.5	conference call with T. Allison, Huron Associates, HLT, MF and BAK primarily relating to fleet planning issues
24-Feb-05	0.5	email correspondence with M. Bell, Spencer Stuart re CEO Search
25-Feb-05	1.8	Committee conf. call with HLT, BAK and MF, primary topics were liquidity, fleet and employee negotiations
25-Feb-05	0.3	conference call with Arthur C., Creditors Committee Chair, HLT and BAK re industry operating conditions

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Feb-05	0.3	series of discussions with HLT re ATA presentation on business plan
28-Feb-05	0.7	portion of dinner meeting with Committee members and HLT re discussion of ATA
28-Feb-05	2.0	review of updated Business Plan
28-Feb-05	5.0	travel to MDW for Committee meeting
1-Mar-05	4.2	attended ATA's meeting with HLT, SIO, MF and Creditors Committee in Chicago to review updated Business Plan
1-Mar-05	4.1	meetings with CEO Search Committee with HLT, SIO and MF for first round of interviews with prospective candidates
1-Mar-05	2.6	dinner meeting with Arthur C., Credit Committee Chair re industry operating conditions and further evaluation of CEO candidate interviews
2-Mar-04	0.4	t/call with Beckerman, HLT and BAK re HLT's discussion with Lazard re ATA's business plan
2-Mar-05	6.6	CEO Search Committee, continuation of first round interviews of prospective candidates
2-Mar-05	5.0	travel MDW to LAS
3-Mar-05	2.2	conference call with ATA (Viets, Barnett, et al), SIO and BAK to discuss fleet status
3-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with HLT and SIO regarding strategic and financial options for ATA
3-Mar-05	0.5	discuss business plan and due diligence with HLT, BAK and MF
4-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with BAK regarding meetings next week
4-Mar-05	0.6	series of t/calls and discussion with HLT re options for ATA and fleet
7-Mar-05	5.0	travel LAS/IND
7-Mar-05	3.5	meeting with Huron, BAK, MF and Debtors regarding status of ATA
7-Mar-05	3.2	dinner with J. Pritchett, AFA Committee rep. and R Swanson, AFA Counsel and HLT, BAK and MF
8-Mar-05	6.5	review and discussions of ATA's fleet acquisition program at ATA's HQ and phone calls to various aircraft providers re availability of lift with HLT, SIO, MF and BAK; review of ATA's business plan and changes to liquidity
8-Mar-05	2.8	dinner with John Denison, ATA CEO
9-Mar-05	0.7	t/calls with HLT re strategic options for ATA
9-Mar-05	2.4	dinner with Gil Viets, (ATA CFO); various topics re ATA operations and financial status discussed
9-Mar-05	1.3	various discussions with John Denison and Gil Viets re potential expansion of code share opportunities with another carrier and related financings
9-Mar-05	3.2	review of ATA's fleet acquisition program at ATA's HQ and phone calls to various aircraft providers re availability of lift
9-Mar-05	1.4	Committee conf call with BAK, MF, SIO, HLT and DI to discuss business plan and pending motions
9-Mar-05	0.3	discuss fleet plan with BAK
9-Mar-05	0.7	series of discussions with HLT to review business plan and prepare for Committee call
10-Mar-05	5.0	travel IND/LAS
10-Mar-05	2.9	series of t/calls with HLT, BAK and SIO regarding strategic options for ATA including discussion of fleet; t/call to Beckerman with HLT re same
11-Mar-05	2.8	several conf call with HLT, BAK and SIO re potential expansion of code share opportunities with another carrier and related financings
11-Mar-05	0.3	t/call with prospective financing source re potential expansion of code share opportunities with another carrier and related financings
11-Mar-05	0.7	t/call with Mark Schulte re potential expansion of code share opportunities with another carrier and related financings
12-Mar-05	2.4	development of talking paper materials for meeting re potential expansion of code share opportunities with another carrier and related financings

Date	TIME Hours	Description
12-Mar-05	1.5	email correspondence with ATA officials re status of fleet procurement and recommendations for outside assistance
14-Mar-05	1.9	discussions with HLT re upcoming meeting with prospective financing source and various fleet and financing strategies
14-Mar-05	0.2	discuss CEO candidate with SIO
14-Mar-05	0.3	emails to/from HLT re lease fleet
14-Mar-05	1.2	t/calls with HLT, Denison, Schulte and SIO re strategic options for ATA and code share
15-Mar-05	0.3	discuss status of 767 and 737s with SIO
15-Mar-05	0.4	discussions and emails from/to HLT re strategic options for ATA and fleet
16-Mar-05	5.0	travel LAS/MDW
16-Mar-05	6.5	CEO Search Committee candidate interviews and dinner with Committee members
17-Mar-05	5.8	CEO Search Committee candidate interviews
17-Mar-05	3.0	travel MDW/LGA
18-Mar-05	1.5	meeting with prospective financing source and Mark Schulte and HLT re potential investment in ATA
18-Mar-05	1.3	meeting with HLT at Compass offices re strategic direction and fleet
18-Mar-05	6.0	travel JFK/LAS
21-Mar-05	1.9	CEO Search Committee conference call and follow on call with Arthur C. and Lisa Beckerman
24-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with SIO and HLT re Committee call
24-Mar-05	2.0	Committee conference call with HLT, BAK, MF, DI and SIO re update on currently pending matters, including fleet, CEO search, Chicago Express sale status
25-Mar-05	0.3	review of ATSB reporting submissions
25-Mar-05	0.3	discuss latest term sheet from Q aviation re aircraft with HLT and BAK
28-Mar-05	0.3	t/call with ATA's Rick Barnett and SIO re fleet acquisition status
28-Mar-05	0.4	t/calls with HLT and SIO re ATA's fleet acquisition efforts
28-Mar-05	0.7	Committee conf call with BAK, HLT and SIO to review bids for Chicago Express
29-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re financial projection and fleet
30-Mar-05	2.3	conference call with John Denison, ATA's CEO, HLT and SIO re status of fleet acquisition initiatives
31-Mar-05	0.3	discuss fleet issues with HLT
31-Mar-05	0.3	t/call with John Denison re meeting with Boeing on Mar. 30th
1-Apr-05	1.2	t/calls with Boeing & Pegasus re 767-300ER lift, and email correspondence with John Denison
4-Apr-05	0.5	review of proposed settlement agreement between Debtor and Signature and ASI
7-Apr-05	2.0	conf call with Denison and ATA, senior management, Baker & Daniels, BAK, HLT and Beckerman re cash requirements and corp financing issues; follow-up calls with HLT, BAK and Beckerman re same
7-Apr-05	0.6	series of discussions with HLT, SIO, BAK regarding ATA capital requirements
7-Apr-05	0.2	review various emails re fleet and discuss with HLT
8-Apr-05	1.8	t/call with HLT, BAK, ATA and Huron re timetable for POR and related matters.
8-Apr-05	0.6	review of draft aircraft lease LOIs and discuss with HLT and SIO
8-Apr-05	1.0	conf call with Denison, HLT, SIO, BAK, Huron and ATA management re POR timetable
11-Apr-05	5.0	travel LAS/IND
11-Apr-05	1.3	fleet discussion with HLT, and then with Gil Viets and John Denison and review of various LOIs received
11-Apr-05	1.9	meeting with Mark Suman re revenue forecast and fleet planning
11-Apr-05	0.3	discuss lease options with SIO
12-Apr-05	8.2	meetings throughout the day at ATA with HLT and BAK re fleet procurement and data to be presented at meeting with Committee professionals on 4/18/05
13-Apr-05	5.0	travel IND/LAS

Date	TIME Hours	Description
13-Apr-05	0.9	review of CEO compensation proposal
15-Apr-05	2.5	t/calls with HLT, SIO and ATA (Denison and Barnett) re fleet procurement, and calls to Pegasus Aviation re same
17-Apr-05	5.0	travel LAS/IND
18-Apr-05	5.2	Business Plan meeting with HLT, SIO and BAK at ATA HQ's
18-Apr-05	1.6	dinner meeting with HLT, SIO, BAK and Arthur C., co-chair of Committee
19-Apr-05	2.2	post Business Plan meeting with HLT, SIO, BAK, John Denison at ATA HQ's
19-Apr-05	5.0	travel IND/LAS
20-Apr-05	0.3	t/call with HLT re business plan presentation; discuss changes to lease fleet with SIO and HLT
20-Apr-05	1.8	t/call with Schulte, HLT, SIO and BAK to review strategic options, business plan and cash needs
20-Apr-05	0.9	t/call with SIO re fleet and t/call with HLT and SIO re same
25-Apr-05	1.7	t/call with HLT, SIO, BAK and ATA officials re capital and cost savings opportunities
26-Apr-05	0.7	conf call with Committee co-chair, SIO, BAK and HLT re business plan review and capital requirements
26-Apr-05	1.9	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO and BAK regarding next steps for business plan review and capital requirements and report on business plan, latest financial results and fleet
27-Apr-05	0.5	t/call with CIT re fleet, and review of 737 Classic term sheet from Q Aviation
28-Apr-05	1.0	t/call with SIO to Akin Gump re Q Aviation term sheet
28-Apr-05	0.6	t/calls with SIO to Pegasus and Oak Hill re B767 aircraft acquisitions.
29-Apr-05	0.7	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO and BAK regarding report on fleet status and recent proposed settlements of certain claims
30-Apr-05	0.6	review of pilot productivity
2-May-05	1.8	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
4-May-05	1.5	conference call with HLT, SIO,DI, BAK, ATA officials re cash forecast
9-May-05	1.4	review of Motion re B767-300 aircraft and correspondence re same with SIO and Beckerman
9-May-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re changes to lease template for Bankruptcy Court
10-May-05	2.2	review of pilot productivity data requested from the Debtor, including discussions with BAK and HLT re new CFO and business plan
10-May-05	0.2	discussion with HLT and SIO re new SVP Karnik
11-May-05	1.2	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, HLT and DI to discuss new CFO and SVP, exclusivity, sale of AmbasadAir, etc.
12-May-05	0.2	series of t/calls from HLT re SouthWest meeting
16-May-05	1.5	discussions with potential buyer for AmbasadAir
16-May-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re his conf call with SIO and Denison re fleet, CFO and exclusivity
17-May-05	2.1	review of ATA operating results and pending motions, including request for extension of "exclusivity."
17-May-05	0.6	series of t/calls from HLT re milestones
17-May-05	0.2	t/call with HLT to prepare for Committee conference call
17-May-05	1.5	Committee conf call with SIO, HLT, DI to review CFO candidate and discuss exclusivity extension

Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-May-05	3.4	conference call with HLT, SIO, SouthWest Airlines officials re suggestions on SWA's further participation in Debtor's efforts to enhance liquidity, and separate follow on discussions with HLT and SIO re SouthWest and labor issues
19-May-05	3.2	review of Debtor's 1113 filings, including multiple discussions with DI, SIO, HLT, BAK, Akin Gump and ATA re Debtor's 1113 motions and pilot productivity
19-May-05	0.2	discuss financing options with Committee member and HLT
20-May-05	1.4	Committee conference call with HLT, DI, SIO re 1113 filings and update to Committee re discussions with SWA
23-May-05	1.0	conference call with HLT, SIO, ATA and their counsel re labor and other matters
23-May-05	0.3	t/call with Botter and HLT re labor negotiations and attendance at court hearing
23-May-05	0.2	review emails re due diligence meetings
23-May-05	0.2	update from HLT re his t/call with Schulte and SIO re meeting with ATA, SouthWest and ATSB
24-May-05	2.2	review of Exhibits filed with Meyer's affidavit for 1113 Motion
24-May-05	0.5	t/calls with SIO, HLT and BAK re rights offering and strategic alternatives
25-May-05	3.3	review of Exhibits filed with Meyer's affidavit for 1113 Motion, including discussion with HLT re same
26-May-05	0.5	review of J. Denison employment agreement
27-May-05	1.0	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK, DI re various matters, including Chicago Express, fleet rationalization and status of negotiations with ALPA
30-May-05	1.2	review of various ATA reports, including the daily reports to ATSB
31-May-05	2.0	conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK, ATA officials re listing of potential cost savings items
31-May-05	1.2	follow-up discussions with HLT, SIO, BAK regarding cost saving initiatives
1-Jun-05	1.0	additional follow up re May 31 conference call discussing cost saving measures
3-Jun-05	0.3	discussion with HLT and SIO re HLT's t/calls with Denison and Frick re cash burn, business plan and CFO milestone
6-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with HLT re exec compensation committee and concepts for new business plan
6-Jun-05	2.2	preparation for and the conference call with the CEO Search Committee re John Denison compensation package
6-Jun-05	1.8	review of NCA Fee criteria and submission of comments on same
6-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with Beckerman, SIO and HLT re HLT's t/calls with Frick and/or F. Conway re F. Conway milestones
7-Jun-05	0.3	multiple discussions re fees with Committee co-chairs, Beckerman, SIO and HLT
9-Jun-05	5.0	travel to Indianapolis
9-Jun-05	2.0	conference call with HLT and ATA officials (J. Denison, R. Meyer, et al) re pilot pay package proposal
9-Jun-05	5.0	dinner meeting with HLT, SIO, J. Denison, S. Karnik and F. Conway re action plan need to update business plan and capital raise
10-Jun-05	0.7	conference call with HLT, Spencer Stuart re J. Denison compensation proposal
10-Jun-05	5.0	travel to LAS from Indianapolis
10-Jun-05	1.0	participate in exec. recruiting committee call with HLT and M. Bell, etc
13-Jun-05	1.5	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Jun-05	1.0	exec. recruiting committee call with HLT and M. Bell, etc
15-Jun-05	0.2	t/calls with HLT re exec compensation
16-Jun-05	0.4	conference call with HLT, Spencer Stuart re J. Denison compensation proposal
17-Jun-05	0.5	exec. recruiting committee call with HLT and M. Bell, etc
20-Jun-05	1.1	conf call with ATA sr. mgmt with SIO, HLT, BAK and DI to get update on fleet, cost savings and upcoming June 30, 2005 business plan; incl. follow-up t/calls re same with HLT and BAK
21-Jun-05	0.3	discussion with Akin Gump (L. Beckerman) re retention of Mercer Consulting re review of Maintenance operations
22-Jun-05	1.1	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK and DI re business plan
23-Jun-05	0.9	conference call with SIO, ATA and counsel and Akin Gump re Mercer engagement letter for maintenance review, and advance preparation.
24-Jun-05	0.6	conference call with HLT, Spencer Stuart re CEO compensation agreement
27-Jun-05	2.0	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
27-Jun-05	0.1	t/call with SIO re 767 blanket terms
28-Jun-05	1.7	conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK, ATA officials (F. Conway, S. Frick and S. Karnik) re cost savings and progress toward development of updated business plan.
28-Jun-05	1.4	conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK, Akin Gump re upcoming Committee call
28-Jun-05	0.4	discuss strategic options and capital requirements for ATA with HLT
29-Jun-05	1.5	Committee conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK, DI re business plan and cash flow analysis and follow on discussions with Compass associates
29-Jun-05	1.5	discuss strategic options for ATA with BAK, DI, HLT and SIO
30-Jun-05	0.8	series of discussions with HLT, BAK, DI and Beckerman re strategic options, discussions with ad hoc committee noteholders, guarantee of subs to ATSB, etc.
30-Jun-05	1.4	CEO Search Committee conference call with HLT re J. Denison compensation agreement and preparation for call
1-Jul-05	1.8	conf call with HLT, SIO and Committee co-chair re strategic alternatives
1-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re fleet
5-Jul-05	0.9	series of discussions with HLT re debtor's compliance with exclusivity, business plan development and back up plans re capital raise, including conversations with HLT and DI re issues for Denison call, Boeing claim and review of May financial results
6-Jul-05	1.3	review of latest Spencer Stuart draft of J. Denison retention package and email correspondence and t/call with HLT re same
6-Jul-05	1.4	review of Compass Flash monthly report and discussions of same with Compass associates on revisions to make report more responsive to users
6-Jul-05	2.2	discussions with Debtor (Sean Frick) re pending blanket approvals being sought for acquisition of B767 aircraft and email correspondence on same
6-Jul-05	1.8	conference call with Akin Gump re preparation for testimony to be given re Committee's objection to proposed procedures for establishing Boeing's claim on returned aircraft, including discussion with HLT re Boeing claim
6-Jul-05	1.5	t/call with Beckerman and HLT re Denison and strategic alternatives
7-Jul-05	5.2	discussions with Akin Gump (Sean O'Donnell) re Boeing claim on B757-300 aircraft and preparation of points memorandum re the pending claims development process.
7-Jul-05	0.3	discuss Boeing claim with HLT
8-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re potential additional variables for ASG
8-Jul-05	0.4	multiple discussions with BAK, HLT and DI re Boeing claim litigation
8-Jul-05	0.2	discuss status of Denison term sheet with HLT
10-Jul-05	5.0	travel IND / LAS
10-Jul-05	4.5	meeting with HLT and Akin Gump litigation team re Boeing claim and preparation for same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Jul-05	10.2	commencement of debtor depositions (Sean Frick) with HLT and review of potential settlement options including dinner meeting
11-Jul-05	2.4	CEO search committee conference call and preparation for same re J. Denison compensation package
12-Jul-05	0.2	t/calls with Humphries and SIO re ATA Q proposed amendment
12-Jul-05	0.8	Committee conference call with HLT & SIO re status of Boeing claim
12-Jul-05	0.5	search committee conference call with HLT re J. Denison comp package
12-Jul-05	8.2	meetings with Akin Gump litigation team and HLT re Boeing claim, including Committee Conf call with HLT, BAK and DR to review proposed settlement parameters with Boeing
13-Jul-05	5.0	travel IND / LAS
14-Jul-05	1.0	Committee conference call with BAK, SIO, HLT and DI; discuss IAA issues, Exec. comp issues, implications of business plan; ATSB guarantees
14-Jul-05	0.5	series of conversations with SIO, BAK and HLT re conversations with F. Conway; t/call message to Beckerman re same
17-Jul-05	11.6	travel LAS /IND; ATA flight experienced a 7 hr. delay due to mechanical problems; during delay, reviewed prior ATA business plans and open issues re J. Denison's comp package.
18-Jul-05	3.4	business plan meeting at ATA headquarters with HLT, BAK and SIO
18-Jul-05	2.5	dinner meeting with HLT, SIO, BAK and Akin Gump attorneys re updated business plan and proposed severance package for ATA Holdings Chairman
19-Jul-05	5.0	travel IND / LAS
20-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re comments to 767 term sheet
20-Jul-05	0.2	follow-up discussions re strategic alternatives with SIO and HLT
21-Jul-05	0.8	review of Compass' "Situation Report" addressing May Operating Report and forecasts for balance of year
21-Jul-05	1.4	review of Bristol 767 proposal and discussion and email on same with M. Mandel, HLT and SIO
21-Jul-05	0.9	phone discussion with M. Schulte re Search Committee matters (J. Denison comp package) and assessment of 7/18 Bus Plan
22-Jul-05	1.2	discussions with Akin Gump and M. Schulte re remaining open issues with respect to J. Denison comp package
22-Jul-05	0.6	discussion with Arthur C. (Committee co-chair re Plan B capital raise alternatives and status of ATA Hawaii service in light of AWA analyst meeting.
24-Jul-05	0.5	series of t/calls with F. Conway, SIO and HLT re agenda for July 25 meeting
25-Jul-05	5.0	travel LAS/IND
25-Jul-05	6.2	meeting with HLT, BAK, SIO, J. Denison, F. Conway (ATA CFO) and other ATA officials re status of cost saving initiatives
26-Jul-05	2.1	meeting with HLT, BAK, F. Conway (ATA CFO) re status of cost saving initiatives
26-Jul-05	5.0	travel IND/LAS
26-Jul-05	0.8	discussion with M. Schulte re potential Plan B scenarios in event Jefferies is not successful with capital raise, and follow on discussions with HLT, BAK, SIO
27-Jul-05	0.3	t/calls with HLT re capital raise and strategic options
28-Jul-05	0.2	t/calls with SIO and HLT re offering memo
28-Jul-05	1.3	Committee conference call with BAK, SIO, HLT, DI re IAA settlement, CEO comp and JGM severance package
28-Jul-05	0.6	t/calls with SIO, HLT re capital raise and strategic options
2-Aug-05	2.2	review of debtor's internal financial reports and email communication to F. Conway (CFO) re suggested weekly cash forecast updates, including discussion with HLT re interim reporting of cash
2-Aug-05	1.2	conf call with BAK, HLT, SIO and ATA re Mercer

Date	TIME Hours	Description
3-Aug-05	1.5	review of Jefferies' Offering Memo and discussions of same with Compass associates and Akin Gump
4-Aug-05	1.2	conf call with F. Conway, SIO and BAK to review cash saving initiatives and status of same
4-Aug-05	1.2	call with HLT, BAK, SIO, DI and Creditors Committee re Mikelsons settlement and other matters
5-Aug-05	0.2	t/calls with F. Conway and HLT re capital raise
7-Aug-05	2.4	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
16-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re work program
18-Aug-05	1.7	Jefferies conference call with prospective investors, HLT, BAK, SIO, ABT
18-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT to review results of conf call with ATA and noteholders
19-Aug-05	0.9	review of ATA 1113 motions
19-Aug-05	1.5	email and phone discussions with Frank Conway re updated pro forma on pending items of fleet, fuel cost, labor and other matters as it impacts forecasted liquidity
20-Aug-05	2.2	review of Boeing settlement agreement and draft letter to ASG in connection with same
21-Aug-05	1.5	additional review of Boeing settlement agreement and draft letter to ASG in connection with same
22-Aug-05	1.0	conference call with BAK, SIO, ATA (Frank Conway, et al) re update pro forma of pending items
22-Aug-05	0.6	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT and BAK re letter to Boeing litigation appraiser
23-Aug-05	1.0	conference call with BAK, SIO, CJE, ABT, Frank Conway re weekly updating procedures and recent developments
25-Aug-05	0.3	series of emails with Beckerman and HLT, SIO, etc. re update and scheduling Committee professionals call
26-Aug-05	1.0	conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK, Committee professionals re fleet status and other pending matters
27-Aug-05	1.5	review of final draft of John Denison employment agreement and recommendation to Committee re approval of same
27-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT to review cash status of ATA
30-Aug-05	1.2	review of ATA lease proposal from New Zealand lessor and discussion of same with Michael Mandel, et al at Akin Gump
30-Aug-05	0.2	t/call with HLT and BAK re Klein meeting
31-Aug-05	1.0	conf call with Beckerman, SIO and Mandel, together with Skyworks, re aircraft availability, terms and status
31-Aug-05	5.0	travel to IAD (via MIA) for meeting with ASG on procedures to be employed in determining Boeing claim
31-Aug-05	0.8	t/call with BAK to F. Conway of Navigant et. al from ATA regarding cash flow and general update information
31-Aug-05	0.4	discussion with John Graber, ATA SVP operations, re fleet rationalization plan, particularly as it may relate to exploring US Airways B737-300s
1-Sep-05	5.0	travel IAD/LAS
1-Sep-05	2.8	meeting with Fred Klein and HLT, ASG re evaluation procedures on determining Boeing claim on returned B757-300 aircraft
2-Sep-05	0.4	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
6-Sep-05	0.6	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
7-Sep-05	1.2	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
8-Sep-05	0.8	conference calls with HLT, SIO, BAK and Akin Gump re Navigant responsiveness, capital raise and Plan B
9-Sep-05	0.8	conf call with HLT, SIO, BAK, ABT regarding Mercer
9-Sep-05	1.0	Committee call with SIO, HLT, CJE and ABT; discuss latest issues re financing and ATA professional retentions, etc.

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Sep-05	0.8	t/call with Arthur C. (Committee co-chair) re Debtors' efforts at capital raise
12-Sep-05	0.9	review of ASG engagement scope and correspondence of same with HLT and Beckerman
12-Sep-05	0.9	t/call with HLT and Calavritinos re financing options for ATA
13-Sep-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re HLT's t/call with Calavritinos re financing with Beckerman, Committee leadership and Carlson
14-Sep-05	1.5	review of bondholder term sheet and conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK re same
18-Sep-05	1.5	review of lease proposals from Pegasus and CAL and email communication with Akin Gump on same
20-Sep-05	0.6	review of quarterly report to Committee
21-Sep-05	0.3	series of discussions with HLT re financing and cash flow projections
23-Sep-05	2.2	series of discussions with Committee co-chair (Arthur C.) re Debtors' capital raise, including phone discussions with Jonathan Ornstein, CEO of Mesa Airlines
23-Sep-05	0.2	series of discussions with HLT re financing and cash requirements of ATA
25-Sep-05	1.3	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
26-Sep-05	0.4	t/call with HLT and Committee co-chair re strategic options
26-Sep-05	0.2	update from HLT re Boeing claim report
26-Sep-05	1.0	ATA financing - t/calls with HLT and noteholders
27-Sep-05	0.3	series of discussions and t/calls with BAK, HLT, ABT and SIO re valuation and cash flow issues
29-Sep-05	1.5	conference call with HLT, SIO, BAK and ABT ATA financial personnel (Frick, Conway, et al) re updated Plan (2005 - @ 8)
29-Sep-05	1.0	dinner with HLT, BAK, Committee members (Arthur C and Eric Schaefer) re Debtors' capital raise and alternative financing
3-Oct-05	1.5	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
6-Oct-05	0.7	t/call with Navigant, ATA and BAK
6-Oct-05	0.5	discuss strategic options with HLT; draft email to HLT re potential deal with strategic partner
11-Oct-05	1.2	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
12-Oct-05	0.4	call with HLT, BAK, ABT, SIO and ATA re OP6; review ATSB reporting package
12-Oct-05	2.0	conf call with Subodh Karnik, F. Conway etc re status of financing and Plan B elements and discussion with HLT, SIO, ABT and CJE same
14-Oct-05	1.3	post-Committee call discussions with Beckerman, HLT, & Arthur with SIO and ABT re ATA's new business plan
17-Oct-05	1.5	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
17-Oct-05	0.2	t/call with HLT re strategic options
25-Oct-05	1.8	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
26-Oct-05	0.7	t/call with Peko and Graber of ATA with BAK, HLT, SIO and ABT to review latest status of fleet and financing
26-Oct-05	2.0	discussions with Navigant officials re status of capital raise, and follow on discussions with HLT, SIO and BAK
27-Oct-05	0.3	discuss status of financing and strategic options available with HLT
28-Oct-05	1.0	Committee conf call with HLT, SIO, CJE, BAK, ABT; discuss status of financing and ATA's new business plan
28-Oct-05	1.0	discussions with Navigant officials re status of capital raise, and follow on discussions with HLT and SIO
31-Oct-05	0.4	review supplemental affidavit of Compass
2-Nov-05	0.8	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
7-Nov-05	1.3	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
7-Nov-05	0.1	discuss Ambassador with BAK
7-Nov-05	1.2	series of discussions and Conf calls with HLT, BAK, SIO, ABT & Beckerman and/or Committee co-chair re new investment term sheet

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Nov-05	1.3	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, HLT, ABT, CJE to discuss MatlinPatterson term sheet, exclusivity and cash requirements
9-Nov-05	0.5	discuss with Committee members, Beckerman, HLT, SIO, BAK, and ABT re business plan, strategic options and meetings in Indy
11-Nov-05	1.0	Committee conf call with HLT, BAK, SIO, ABT, CJE to review term sheet from MatlinPatterson and discuss available options
14-Nov-05	1.1	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB
16-Nov-05	0.7	t/calls with MatlinPatterson, Botter, Beckerman, HLT and SIO re new business plan OP7
20-Nov-05	2.0	discussions with HLT, SIO, BAK and Arthur C. re potential strategies in light of Debtor's Plan as proposed by MatlinPatterson; t/calls with BAK, SIO, HLT, ABT, CJE re analysis for Akin Gump and Compass work program
20-Nov-05	1.0	Committee call with HLT, SIO, BAK, ABT re potential strategies in light of Debtors' Plan as proposed by MatlinPatterson
24-Nov-05	2.1	review of Disclosure Statement
1-Dec-05	1.5	Committee conf call with BAK, HLT, SIO, ABT and CJE; discuss status of POR and disclosure statement and review issues re POR
5-Dec-05	0.8	Committee Conf call with HLT, BAK, SIO, ABT and CJE to review disclosure statement and valuation issues
5-Dec-05	0.3	discuss valuation with BAK re treatment of maintenance costs
8-Dec-05	1.2	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
13-Dec-05	1.6	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
17-Dec-05	1.3	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
21-Dec-05	2.9	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
26-Dec-05	1.1	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
30-Dec-05	1.2	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
3-Jan-06	2.1	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
8-Jan-06	1.4	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
12-Jan-06	1.1	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
16-Jan-06	1.0	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
20-Jan-06	1.9	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
24-Jan-06	1.4	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
28-Jan-06	1.5	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
31-Jan-06	1.1	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
3-Feb-06	0.5	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
9-Feb-06	1.3	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings

Date	TIME Hours	Description
14-Feb-06	1.8	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
19-Feb-06	2.2	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
23-Feb-06	0.9	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
27-Feb-06	1.7	review of various ATA financial reports, including those provided to ATSB and court filings
SubTotal	991.8	

In re: ATA Holdings Corp., et al. **EXHIBIT D**
Compass Advisers, LLP – Time Records for the Period November 4, 2004 to February 28, 2006

Date	TIME Hours	Description
Stuart I. Oran – Senior Advisor		
4-Nov-04	3.5	find and review various background materials, discuss with BAK, MJC & HLT re same
4-Nov-04	1.2	review comparative analytical materials with BAK
5-Nov-04	0.5	t/call with David Kurtz, HLT, BAK & MF re ATSB views
5-Nov-04	0.5	discussion re documents and process with HLT
5-Nov-04	1.5	series of t/calls with HLT, MJC, BAK, et al. regarding ATA restructuring alternatives and work program
6-Nov-04	3.2	review of due diligence materials
7-Nov-04	0.7	conf call with HLT, BAK, MF and Creditors' Committee professionals re Monday meeting in Indianapolis
7-Nov-04	0.2	review memo with HLT re summary of discussions regarding acquisition or financing of ATA
7-Nov-04	0.7	series t/calls with BAK, MJC, MF & HLT re reorganization alternatives
8-Nov-04	2.5	travel to Indianapolis with HLT, BAK & MF for meeting with Creditors Committee
8-Nov-04	9.5	meeting with Creditors Committee, Company officials and HLT, BAK & MF; presentation by Company; further discussions with Huron professionals.
8-Nov-04	0.3	travel to hotel
8-Nov-04	0.3	travel to ATA
9-Nov-04	0.8	breakfast with HLT, MJC and Gil Viets to discuss Company's business plan
9-Nov-04	1.0	meetings at Company with Jim Hlavacek and MJC to discuss Company's business plan
9-Nov-04	3.0	collective data analysis with BAK, MF & MJC
9-Nov-04	0.6	meeting with Gil Viets and Tom Allison re meeting with GECAS to discuss lease plans
9-Nov-04	0.6	meeting with Stan Hula to review schedule issues and new aircraft fleet
9-Nov-04	2.0	meeting with Huron reps, BAK, MF & MJC to review cash flows
9-Nov-04	2.0	review of due diligence materials and filings
9-Nov-04	0.2	calls with SH&E re help with leases
9-Nov-04	2.0	travel back to New York
10-Nov-04	0.2	call to discuss status and results of discussions with senior management, BAK, MF, HLT & MJC
10-Nov-04	0.6	call with Creditors Committee counsel, BAK, MF, MJC & HLT
10-Nov-04	1.0	analysis of collateral available for sale in lieu of State of Indiana
10-Nov-04	1.2	analysis of Military business relative to Omni re valuation
10-Nov-04	1.0	conf call with, BAK, MF, MJC, HLT, Viets and Mickelsons re plans for a downsized fleet
10-Nov-04	1.8	telephonic meeting with BAK, MF, MJC, HLT and creditors to report on events and plan
10-Nov-04	0.8	review new cash flows and new draft of Asset Purchase Agreement. Send e-mail with comments to HLT
11-Nov-04	1.1	calls with Steve Lefkowitz at Caxton-Iseman and Jeff Kurtz at Oak Hill re interest in buying entire business
11-Nov-04	1.4	conf call with creditors committee representatives, BAK, MF, MJC & HLT
11-Nov-04	0.4	meeting with HLT to review status and option for ATA
11-Nov-04	1.2	review AirTran Acquisition Agreement
12-Nov-04	0.4	conversation with HLT and Doug Parker at America West re their interest in purchasing assets
12-Nov-04	1.6	meeting at Oak Hill with HLT to review status of company and opportunity to acquire assets
12-Nov-04	0.2	discuss retention docs with HLT & ETW

Date	TIME Hours	Description
12-Nov-04	1.0	conf call with creditors and advisors, HLT, MF, BAK & MJC
12-Nov-04	0.4	call with Hancock reps re Chicago issues
12-Nov-04	0.1	call to Apollo re interest in assets with HLT
12-Nov-04	1.0	meeting with prospective investor in ATA with HLT
13-Nov-04	1.1	regulatory analysis; e-mail re regulatory issues and need to look at the three pieces
13-Nov-04	0.7	discussion with HLT & MJC re components of ATA's various businesses
13-Nov-04	1.8	analyze potential strawman transaction and draft e-mail memo re same including discussion with HLT & MJC
14-Nov-04	0.1	t/call with HLT re status update
14-Nov-04	2.0	t/call with MF re status and drafting of report to creditors and template of choices
15-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with Jordan Zaken at Apollo re opportunity to purchase assets.
15-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with HLT re status of ct hearing and update from HLT on results of day and work program
15-Nov-04	0.4	t/call with Doug Parker re AWA interest
16-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with Joe Vitale re ALPA position
16-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with HLT re status, plans for tomorrow in Indianapolis
16-Nov-04	0.1	t/call with Rowan Taylor at Oak Hill re interest in transaction
16-Nov-04	0.7	series of t/calls with HLT & MJC re due diligence and sale or refinancing options for reorganizing ATA
17-Nov-04	2.0	travel to Indianapolis for meeting with Company advisors and senior management
17-Nov-04	1.6	meetings with BAK, HLT, MF and Huron re status of analysis
17-Nov-04	1.1	analysis of Debtor plan
17-Nov-04	2.6	meetings with BAK, HLT, MF, MJC and Huron and senior management to review revenue opportunities and costs of post-transaction operation
17-Nov-04	1.8	meetings with BAK, HLT, MF, MJC and Huron re analysis of post-transaction operation
17-Nov-04	2.0	travel back to New York
18-Nov-04	0.1	call with HLT to discuss additional information
18-Nov-04	1.1	review reporting package and documents from Akin Gump
18-Nov-04	0.8	review data and discuss approach to America West with HLT, BAK, MF & MJC
18-Nov-04	0.6	revise submission to America West and send including discussion with HLT
19-Nov-04	0.4	review reporting package
19-Nov-04	0.2	discussion with HLT & MJC re prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information
19-Nov-04	1.4	calls with Sylvia DeLeon re slots, ETOPS and military business requirements
19-Nov-04	2.2	review of Debtor re-fleeted schedule and financial ramifications
21-Nov-04	0.1	conversation with MJC re AWA proposal
22-Nov-04	0.3	meeting HLT, BAK & MF to discuss status and deliverables to Creditors' Committee
22-Nov-04	2.6	conf call with Creditors Committee, discussion with HLT, BAK, MF & MJC re prospective bidder's re ATA and available due diligence information
22-Nov-04	2.1	t/calls with Westjet, Atlas, Southwest and HLT
22-Nov-04	1.8	discuss with HLT, MF, PS, AD & BAK re work plan and compiling data
23-Nov-04	1.8	calls to Fortress, AirTran; review of bidders with HLT
23-Nov-04	1.0	prepare summary report to Committee members re status of discussions with prospective acquirers and investors with HLT
23-Nov-04	1.0	discussion with HLT, BAK & MJC re prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information
23-Nov-04	2.6	calls to Northwest, American; call with Atlas; calls to creditors committee members; attention to information request from committee members, including discussion with HLT
24-Nov-04	0.6	t/calls with several bondholders; disc HLT re Mark Lawrence concerns
24-Nov-04	1.2	lunch with Ed Wegel at Mesa re bid

Date	TIME Hours	Description
24-Nov-04	0.8	discussion with BAK, MJC, HLT, MF & PS re analytical work and reports to Committee members
24-Nov-04	0.1	trade messages with David Cotton
24-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with Mike Miller at Northwest re opportunity
24-Nov-04	0.1	t/calls with HLT and Tom Allison re status
24-Nov-04	0.1	t/call with HLT and Mark Schulte re Southwest meeting
24-Nov-04	0.5	discuss comp analysis with AD, MJC and HLT
25-Nov-04	2.2	review Huron Plan for next 12 month
26-Nov-04	2.3	continue analysis of Huron Plan vs. 737-300 Midway plan
26-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with HLT re status of alternatives for ATA
27-Nov-04	1.2	conf call with BAK, MF, MJC & HLT regarding review of business plan for 2005
27-Nov-04	0.6	discussion with HLT re status of and options for ATA
28-Nov-04	4.1	memo to Creditors Committee analyzing Huron Plan, discuss re same with HLT
29-Nov-04	1.0	meeting with HLT to review status and prospective bidders re ATA; call with Lisa Beckerman; put calls into Heroy; attn to proposal to AA; call with Lee Crockett
29-Nov-04	1.2	discuss work program with HLT, MF, MJC & BAK
29-Nov-04	1.2	call with Mark Schulte (Southwest) to discuss proposal; call with Mike Miller (NWA) to discuss assets they would be interested in; call with J Johnson at AA to discuss why they should be interested in Midway deal, including discussion with HLT
30-Nov-04	0.1	t/call with Joe Vitale re update on events; status of competing bids
30-Nov-04	1.0	discuss prospects of various bidders with Beckerman and HLT
30-Nov-04	2.0	trip to Chicago for meetings with Southwest and America West
30-Nov-04	0.5	travel to ATA
1-Dec-04	2.6	meeting at Skadden with America West to review their proposal with HLT
1-Dec-04	3.8	meeting at Bell Boyd with Southwest to review their proposal with HLT
1-Dec-04	4.0	return trip to NY; review of proposals with HLT
2-Dec-04	1.0	conf call with HLT, MJC, MF & GECAS re plans for company
2-Dec-04	0.8	attn to lease issues
2-Dec-04	2.1	Creditors Committee Conf Call with HLT, BAK & MJC
2-Dec-04	0.4	call with HLT, Doug Parker & Tim Poole at America West to discuss proposal; value of military business
2-Dec-04	0.8	review components of value of military business
2-Dec-04	0.6	call with Mark Schulte re outline of Southwest proposal.
3-Dec-04	0.6	follow-up call with Mark Schulte re fleshing out of Southwest proposal.
3-Dec-04	3.8	analysis of Debtors model describing consequences of proposed Southwest plan
3-Dec-04	1.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members regarding analysis of various bids; discuss same with HLT, MF, MJC and BAK; review status of bids
3-Dec-04	2.0	internal team discussions re various proposals with HLT
4-Dec-04	2.0	conf call with HLT, BAK, MJC & Huron to discuss opens areas needing further analysis and disc re the three proposals
5-Dec-04	1.3	conf call with HLT, BAK, MJC & Huron to discuss opens areas needing further analysis and disc re the three proposals
5-Dec-04	4.0	review of comps; collateral analysis; report to creditors Committee and discuss the same with HLT, BAK & MF
5-Dec-04	0.2	t/call with Beckerman & HLT re schedule of meetings for upcoming week
6-Dec-04	1.6	conf call with HLT & ALPA reps re the three proposals
6-Dec-04	1.8	call with HLT & Mark Schulte re status of Southwest planning
6-Dec-04	0.6	conf call with HLT & AFA re their meeting with America West, KERP and other matters
6-Dec-04	6.3	work on valuation and recovery issues with BAK, MF, HLT and MJC including presentation materials for Committee; discuss new business plan for prospective Southwest transaction

Date	TIME Hours	Description
7-Dec-04	1.6	Creditors Committee conf call
7-Dec-04	1.2	continuing analysis of company plan docs
8-Dec-04	2.8	meetings with HLT; continuing review of valuation
8-Dec-04	1.2	calls with America West re availability of DIP and aircraft; discussions with team re same
8-Dec-04	0.2	discuss process with ETW
8-Dec-04	0.3	discuss status of 1110 motions with HLT and BAK
8-Dec-04	1.5	series of discussions with MJC, HLT, BAK and MF re financial projections and report to Committee, status of various bidders and reviewing options for ATA and unsecured creditors
9-Dec-04	2.5	attention to business plan in prep for meeting with Debtors advisors
9-Dec-04	5.0	meeting at Huron with Committee, Debtors and advisors, HLT, MF, MJC & BAK
9-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with America West re status of their bid
9-Dec-04	0.6	t/call with Schulte re results of ATSB meeting and status of their proposal
10-Dec-04	3.4	meeting in Chicago with HLT & Creditors Committee reps, advisors and Southwest principals and advisors to review their bid proposal
10-Dec-04	2.2	trip back to New York and review of status of America West and Southwest plans
10-Dec-04	5.0	review drafts of all docs submitted in the southwest bid package
11-Dec-04	2.2	conf call with HLT, BAK, MJC & Committee advisors to discuss Southwest proposal
11-Dec-04	4.0	continued review of Southwest bid documents and analysis thereof
12-Dec-04	1.1	meeting with HLT, BAK & PS to review valuation analysis
12-Dec-04	2.0	trip to Indianapolis; continuing review of southwest bid documents
12-Dec-04	1.4	conf call with HLT, MF, BAK, MJC & Committee and advisors to review southwest bid and valuation analysis
12-Dec-04	3.3	continuing review of southwest bid documents and valuation
12-Dec-04	2.7	meeting at Baker and Daniels with HLT, BAK, MF, MJC & AirTran to discuss their bid proposal
13-Dec-04	15.0	meetings all day at auction with committee reps, southwest, atsb, AirTran, HLT, BAK, MF & MJC
14-Dec-04	11.2	meetings all day at auction with committee reps, southwest, atsb, AirTran, HLT, BAK, MF & MJC
15-Dec-04	11.0	auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB and various bidders incl. multiple discussions with Committee members, counsel and BAK, MF, MJC and HLT
15-Dec-04	0.4	t/calls with HLT & BAK re status
16-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with HLT, BAK, MF, MJC, creditors and advisors
16-Dec-04	1.1	review releases; meeting with HLT to review bid status and next steps
16-Dec-04	0.2	t/call Mark Schulte re bid results, Dennison and next steps
17-Dec-04	3.0	review of financing and code-share agreements
17-Dec-04	0.7	series of discussions with HLT and MJC re leases and lease rejections, etc.
18-Dec-04	0.3	calls with HLT re scheduling calls and potential trip to Indy to meet with debtor
18-Dec-04	4.0	continued review of financing, code-share and lease documents
18-Dec-04	0.6	series of t/calls with HLT, MJC, MF, Beckerman, Allison and Viets regarding leases and related issues
19-Dec-04	1.8	conf call with HLT, MJC & advisors focused on lease rejection and assumption issues
19-Dec-04	4.0	continued review and suggested revisions to leasing, financing, codeshare documents
20-Dec-04	0.5	t/calls and discussion re leases and rotatable status with HLT
21-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with Committee professionals and ATA to review status of leases
21-Dec-04	1.3	committee conf call to discuss results of bankruptcy court hearing, ATSB, KERF and interview with John proposed Co-CRO

Date	TIME Hours	Description
21-Dec-04	0.5	t/calls with HLT & MJC regarding options for leases
22-Dec-04	5.0	conf calls with HLT & MJC to review code share agreement
22-Dec-04	2.5	series of t/calls with HLT, MJC and discussions with BAK regarding code share, leasing issues, and discussion with proposed Co-CRO; series of discussions with Viets and Allison regarding leases and ExecuJet
23-Dec-04	0.5	conf call with Committee professionals and ATA to review status of leases
27-Dec-04	0.3	series of t/calls with MJC and HLT re CRO and ATA operations and leases; t/call with Allison re leases
28-Dec-04	1.6	discussions re CRO and CEO positions and t/calls with HLT, MJC, MF & Beckerman
30-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with HLT re CRO
3-Jan-05	2.0	attention to review of lease materials/recovery analysis; potential lease rejections
3-Jan-05	1.3	Creditor Committee Conf call with HLT & MJC
3-Jan-05	1.1	conf call with Viets, MJC and HLT re CRO, financial projections and cash flow and KERP
4-Jan-05	1.0	continue review of lease rejections
4-Jan-05	2.0	calls with Russell Reynolds to review scope of executive search
4-Jan-05	1.1	review of Saab leases
4-Jan-05	1.5	conference call with L. Beckerman and other professionals to discuss KERP, follow-up conversations with HLT, BAK
5-Jan-05	1.0	conf call with Gil Viets and HLT to discuss strategic plan
5-Jan-05	1.2	call with Creditors Committee and HLT, BAK, MF and MJC
5-Jan-05	0.6	review of KERP
5-Jan-05	0.2	call with Sean Frick to review RAM/Memphis Group assignment to value inventory
5-Jan-05	0.2	call with Lisa Beckerman to discuss rotables valuation
5-Jan-05	0.3	calls with Scott Audrain at RAM re rotables valuations
5-Jan-05	0.3	arrangement for call on Thurs to discuss rotables valuation
5-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up discussion with HLT & MJC re issues to due diligence
6-Jan-05	0.6	call with Company and RAM to discuss valuation of rotables and potential for spare parts support
6-Jan-05	2.8	call to interview three executive recruiting firms with HLT & MJC
6-Jan-05	1.5	call with Viets and Huron, HLT & MJC to discuss status of business and open restructuring items.
6-Jan-05	0.5	follow-up call with BAK, MJC and HLT re fleet plan and business plan
6-Jan-05	0.3	discussion with Beckerman, HLT & MJC re CEO search
7-Jan-05	1.1	several calls with RAM to discuss the valuation and spare parts program
10-Jan-05	0.6	follow us call with RAM Memphis Group, Company and Akin to get report on valuation and spare parts program
10-Jan-05	0.3	e-mails and call with John Williams at Memphis to discuss and review valuation
10-Jan-05	1.5	conf call with Committee, HLT and MJC re status
11-Jan-05	0.8	call with Company and Huron and BAK to discuss aircraft, route planning and refueling
11-Jan-05	2.0	call with Huron to review aircraft, route structure and other matters
12-Jan-05	0.1	discussions re fleet plan with BAK
12-Jan-05	0.2	discussions with HLT re fleet, interim CEO/CRO
13-Jan-05	0.3	discussion with Hancock and HLT re fleet and CRO
13-Jan-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re CRO/CFO issues
13-Jan-05	1.0	discuss options for ATA with HLT, BAK and MJC
14-Jan-05	1.0	call with Gil Viets, HLT, BAK, MF and MJC to review organizational restructuring, fleet and schedule
14-Jan-05	1.0	Committee call with HLT, BAK, MF and MJC to review status
14-Jan-05	0.2	call with Mark Schulte to discuss code sharing and organizational changes

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Jan-05	0.4	review and respond to series of emails with Beckerman, HLT and others re CRO; review email from Committee member re labor issues
17-Jan-05	0.3	call with Memphis Group, Debtor and Beckerman to review appraisal of ATSB collateral
17-Jan-05	2.1	review of ATSB collateral docs; review of changes to schedule and fleet
18-Jan-05	2.0	trip to Indy; review route profitability
19-Jan-05	6.0	meetings at Company with Happ, Frick, Viets, Hula, BAK and MF to review fleet, schedule and network plans
19-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with MJC and HLT re strategic options for ATA and implementation of code share
20-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with BAK re ATSB appraisals; review letters from Memphis Group and forward to BAK
20-Jan-05	0.5	discuss latest status on fleet with HLT & BAK
20-Jan-05	0.9	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT, MF, BAK & MJC re new presentation
21-Jan-05	0.1	discussion with BAK re ATSB appraisal issues
21-Jan-05	0.8	conf call with creditors committee reps
21-Jan-05	0.1	discuss retention with ETW
24-Jan-05	0.4	meeting with BAK to review ATSB collateral analysis based on Memphis Group/RAM findings; t/call J Avery at Memphis Group to review assumptions
24-Jan-05	0.3	discussion re Denison staff and schedule changes with BAK, HLT, MF and MJC
24-Jan-05	0.5	t/calls and discussion with BAK, MF, HLT & MJC re new presentation
25-Jan-05	0.6	attention to code-sharing issues
25-Jan-05	0.4	discuss Beckerman & Botter meeting at ATA with MJC, HLT, MF and BAK
26-Jan-05	1.1	review schedule changes, code-share issues, aircraft financing
26-Jan-05	6.0	meeting with ATA, HLT, BAK, MJC, MF and other stakeholders in Indianapolis
27-Jan-05	0.4	discuss with HLT re options for ATA
28-Jan-05	0.6	review options for ATA with HLT & MJC
30-Jan-05	0.3	emails with HLT re status of Chicago Express
31-Jan-05	0.6	discuss with MF re code-share, Chicago Express, slots; discussion Eric Jacobson re same
31-Jan-05	0.2	discussions HLT re Chicago Express; Co cash results
1-Feb-05	0.2	discussion with Paul Barton re interest in financing ATA acquisition of United 737s; e-mail debtor re same
1-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with HLT re sources of financing for aircraft
2-Feb-05	0.4	discussion with Spirit and HLT re use of ATA LGA slots; e-mail debtor re same
2-Feb-05	1.2	Committee conf. call with HLT, MJC, BAK & MF, primary topics were liquidity, fleet and employee negotiations
3-Feb-05	0.1	review Creditors Committee professional meeting scheduling issues with HLT and BAK
3-Feb-05	0.5	discuss HLT t/call with Beckerman and Frick re Chicago Express with HLT, MJC and MF
3-Feb-05	0.2	discuss Chicago Express with HLT
4-Feb-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re Feb 10 meeting issues
4-Feb-05	0.9	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT re options for ATA incl. cash requirements, fleet and business plan
5-Feb-05	1.2	attn to EETC issues and comments
7-Feb-05	0.6	review cash flow forecast
7-Feb-05	1.0	Committee call with HLT, BAK and MF to review status
7-Feb-05	0.4	discuss HLT t/call with Allison re cash flow projection
7-Feb-05	0.5	discuss HLT t/call to Denison re upcoming meeting and financial projection with HLT
8-Feb-05	0.3	discussion with R Taylor and P Barton re interest in leasing aircraft to ATA
8-Feb-05	0.3	review summary of pending matters

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Feb-05	0.1	prepare for trip to Chicago
8-Feb-05	0.3	e-mail and t/call with Bruce Rabinovitz re transferability of ATA LGA gates
9-Feb-05	4.0	dinner meeting with Committee members, HLT, BAK, MJC and MF; primary topics were management leadership, fleet planning and employee negotiations
9-Feb-05	3.7	travel to Chicago for meetings with Chicago Express and ATA with BAK, HLT & MF
10-Feb-05	4.0	attend ATA business plan update meeting with HLT, MJC, BAK and MF
10-Feb-05	0.6	review ATSB reporting package
11-Feb-05	0.3	review update of debtors projected cash flows
11-Feb-05	0.5	review memo re tabs collateral and valuation
11-Feb-05	1.5	Committee conf call with HLT, MJC, BAK and MF re cash flow and lease and follow up discussion
13-Feb-05	1.0	discuss strategic alternatives with BAK, HLT and MJC
14-Feb-05	0.4	review ATSB reporting package
14-Feb-05	0.5	review updated 8 week cash flow analysis
14-Feb-05	0.4	review fleet and engine status report
14-Feb-05	0.7	series of discussions with HLT re due diligence
15-Feb-05	0.2	review news articles
15-Feb-05	0.5	review ATSB reporting package
17-Feb-05	0.5	review 7 week cash flow analysis
17-Feb-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
17-Feb-05	1.6	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, MF & HLT; discuss fleet issues, most recent cash flow and scheduled meetings with ATA and Committee
22-Feb-05	0.5	discuss cash and exec. recruiting with HLT and Committee member; follow-up discussions re same with BAK and HLT
22-Feb-05	0.5	review GATX proposal for 757
22-Feb-05	0.1	discussion with HLT re appointment of Denison as CEO
22-Feb-05	0.5	review ExecuJet info and photos
22-Feb-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
23-Feb-05	0.5	review ATSB reporting package
24-Feb-05	0.2	review ATA first amendment and modification
24-Feb-05	0.1	review plans for Mar 1 professionals and Committee meeting in Chicago
24-Feb-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
24-Feb-05	0.2	review release re increase in Hawaii service
24-Feb-05	0.2	review latest 6 week cash flow forecast
25-Feb-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
28-Feb-05	0.3	series of discussions with HLT re ATA presentation on business plan
28-Feb-05	3.2	review Company draft of business plan
28-Feb-05	2.0	travel to Chicago for professionals meeting and meeting with Creditors Committee
1-Mar-05	9.0	meetings in Chicago with Creditors Committee, HLT, MJC and MF re strategy and business plan
2-Mar-05	0.5	review operating report
2-Mar-05	0.6	review aircraft types for military service
2-Mar-05	0.2	prepare for Gil Viets call Thurs to discuss aircraft requirements and means to fulfill
2-Mar-05	0.2	review SWA DIP amendment
2-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
3-Mar-05	2.2	conf call with MJC, BAK, Viets, Graber and Barnett re sourcing and getting into service new fleet of 737s and 767s
3-Mar-05	0.2	e-mail and conversation with Treitel re leasing needs of ATA
3-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with HLT and MJC regarding strategic and financial options for ATA
4-Mar-05	0.3	discussion and e-mail with Paul Barton re avail of 767-300ERs
4-Mar-05	0.1	discussion with Rick Barnett re same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
4-Mar-05	0.4	discussion with HLT re Co fleet acquisition
4-Mar-05	0.3	conf call with Rick Barnett and Paul Barton re acquisition of 767-300s and 737-300s
4-Mar-05	0.4	discussion with HLT and BAK re fleet and options for ATA
6-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with Treitel re SH&E potential work for aircraft leases
7-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with Rowan Taylor at Oak Hill re interest in financing aircraft for ATA
7-Mar-05	2.3	trip to Indy to meet with Company
8-Mar-05	6.5	meetings with Viets, Dennison, Frick, Graber, Hula, HLT, BAK, MJC and MF re business plan and fleet
8-Mar-05	4.0	return trip to NY
9-Mar-05	0.1	t/call with Treitel re aircraft leases
9-Mar-05	1.4	Committee conf call with BAK, MF, HLT, MJC and DI to discuss business plan and pending motions
9-Mar-05	0.5	series of discussions with HLT to review business plan and prepare for Committee conf call
9-Mar-05	0.3	discuss fleet plan with HLT
10-Mar-05	0.2	e-mail Treitel re aircraft leases; email Barnett re same
10-Mar-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re Co fleet acquisition
10-Mar-05	0.2	discussion with HLT re retention of Schulte for potential code share and mgmt issues
10-Mar-05	2.4	series of t/calls with Schulte, MJC, HLT, Denison and BAK regarding strategic options for ATA including discussion of fleet
11-Mar-05	0.4	discussion re fleet availability
11-Mar-05	0.8	series of t/calls and discussions with HLT, BAK and MJC regarding strategic options for ATA
14-Mar-05	0.2	review CEO candidate qualifications and discuss with MJC
14-Mar-05	0.7	review emails to/from HLT and MJC re lease fleet and discuss strategic options with HLT
15-Mar-05	0.1	review ATA article in The Deal
15-Mar-05	0.3	review email re status of 767 and 737s and discuss with MJC
15-Mar-05	0.2	review memo re pending matters
15-Mar-05	0.1	review ATSB reporting package
15-Mar-05	0.4	discussions and emails with HLT re strategic options for ATA and fleet
16-Mar-05	0.2	review documents re GATX aircraft
16-Mar-05	0.2	review pricing and valuation re ExecuJet aircraft
16-Mar-05	0.3	review 13 week cash flow
16-Mar-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
17-Mar-05	0.4	conf call with HLT and Denison to review personnel moves and status of fleet changes
18-Mar-05	0.8	prepare list of potential sources of capital for ATA
18-Mar-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
18-Mar-05	0.2	review motion
18-Mar-05	0.2	discuss with HLT re HLT t/calls with Denison and MJC re strategic direction and fleet
22-Mar-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
22-Mar-05	0.1	review pending matters list
23-Mar-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package
23-Mar-05	0.2	review 13 week cash flow
24-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with MJC and HLT re Committee call
24-Mar-05	2.0	t/call with HLT, DI, MF, MJC, BAK and Official Committee of unsecured creditors, follow-up discussions concerning meeting in Indianapolis regarding business plan
24-Mar-05	0.2	review ATSB reporting package