

# **EXHIBIT D**

**Time Records for Current Fee Period**

**SUMMARY OF HOURS INCURRED BY  
COMPASS ADVISERS LLP PROFESSIONALS  
FOR THE PERIOD NOVEMBER 4, 2004 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2006**

Name of Professional Person	Position (Years with Compass)	Total Hours
Harvey L. Tepner	Partner (Three years)	1,701.9
Michael J. Conway	Senior Advisor (One year)	991.8
Stuart I. Oran	Senior Advisor (One year)	1,050.0
Bruce A. Kaufman	Principal (Three years)	1,663.6
Phillip Siegel	Principal (Three years)	152.9
Eileen T. Wiseman	Principal (Three years)	200.0
Michael Fine	Associate (Two years)	724.1
Eric J. Kim	Associate (Less than one year)	4.0
David Renke	Associate (One year)	0.7
William E. Sherman	Associate (Two years)	4.0
Ariel B. Treves	Associate (Less than one year)	530.0
Derek B. Cherney	Financial Analyst (Less than one year)	25.3
Matthew R. Ciardiello	Financial Analyst (One year)	41.9
Amy Dildine	Financial Analyst (One year)	57.2
Cory J. Epstein	Financial Analyst (Less than one year)	382.9

<b>Name of Professional Person</b>	<b>Position (Years with Compass)</b>	<b>Total Hours</b>
David Imbert	Financial Analyst (Less than one year)	258.6
Cliff V. Nguyen	Financial Analyst (Less than one year)	23.0
Aaron Wu	Financial Analyst (One year)	15.3
<b>Total Hours for Billing Period</b>		<b>7,827.2</b>

Please note that Compass conducts a detailed review of time records on a quarterly basis and may find hours that were not previously submitted or were misclassified. Compass reserves the right to submit adjustments, if any, in a future application.

Note that, except as indicated below, professionals of Compass Advisers, LLP are not licensed to practice law, although several hold various licenses from the National Association of Securities Dealers.

Phillip Siegel was licensed to practice law in the State of New York but has been inactive for a number of years.

Stuart I. Oran was licensed to practice law in the State of New York and the District of Columbia but has been inactive for a number of years.

Allan M. Chapin, a Partner of Compass Advisers, is licensed to practice law in New York State but did not provide services to the Committee.

**In re: ATA Holdings Corp., et al. EXHIBIT D**  
**Compass Advisers, LLP – Time Records for the Period November 4, 2004 to February 28, 2006**

Date	TIME Hours	Description
<b>Harvey L. Tepner – Partner</b>		
4-Nov-04	6.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Mike Kennelly of Huron Consulting, Golden, Beckerman, BAK, SIO and MJC to set initial work program and meetings with ATA management and advisors; review related emails re same
4-Nov-04	0.5	series of discussions re Compass retention issues with Golden and Beckerman
4-Nov-04	0.2	discuss retention documents with ETW
5-Nov-04	0.8	review draft of Compass retention agreement and discuss same with ETW and PS
5-Nov-04	1.5	review options for reorganizing ATA including summary of proposed AirTran transaction
5-Nov-04	0.6	review draft of and execute confidentiality agreement incl. discussion with Beckerman re same
5-Nov-04	2.5	series of conf calls and discussions with BAK, MJC, SIO, etc. re options for reorganizing ATA and potential discussions with acquirers and sources of financing and due diligence requirements
5-Nov-04	0.5	t/call with Kurtz of Lazard and SIO, MF and MJC
5-Nov-04	1.0	series of conf calls with potential financing sources for alternative DIPS include drafting emails re same
5-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with note holder re options for ATA
5-Nov-04	0.3	t/calls with Kennelly and Allison and Viets re due diligence and information requirements
5-Nov-04	1.5	review due diligence materials with AD and BAK
5-Nov-04	0.5	review options for ATA including M&A and financing options
5-Nov-04	1.3	prepare for meeting with Company and Committee members scheduled for Nov. 8, 2004; review related emails re meeting schedule
6-Nov-04	0.5	review draft of proposed DIP loans and comparison
6-Nov-04	0.3	review proposed Committee bylaws
7-Nov-04	0.7	conf call with BAK, SIO, MF and Akin Gump to review alternatives and agenda for meeting with ATA
7-Nov-04	0.5	series of t/calls with BAK and SIO re reorganization alternatives
7-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with Committee member re meeting logistics and agenda and follow-up
7-Nov-04	0.7	review due diligence information received from Debtors
7-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with BAK regarding strategic alternatives
7-Nov-04	0.3	review email from Beckerman re Indiana DIP proposal
7-Nov-04	0.2	review memo from SIO re summary of discussions regarding acquisition or financing of ATA
8-Nov-04	3.7	travel from NY to Indianapolis for Committee meeting and meetings with ATA (less time spent on other ATA matters), BAK, MF & SIO
8-Nov-04	0.3	(en route to Indianapolis with BAK, MF & SIO) review email from Beckerman to Compass, Debtors' counsel and ATSB counsel re issues pertaining to DIP, sale to AirTran, collateral, etc.
8-Nov-04	4.0	Committee meeting with the Debtors; review presentation from the Debtors including Q and A; followed by Committee meeting; report by Compass on potential alternatives and work program, including discussion with BAK, MJC, MF & SIO
8-Nov-04	2.0	meeting with Huron Consulting, BAK, MJC, MF & SIO, to review due diligence items, discuss available information, and strategic alternatives for ATA
8-Nov-04	2.0	series of discussions with BAK, MJC, MF & SIO to review strategic options and potential improvements to cash flow; includes further discussions with Huron; t/call with major bondholder, and further emails regarding alternative DIP financing sources
8-Nov-04	0.5	series of discussions and emails with major bondholder and financial institution regarding alternative DIP

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Nov-04	0.3	prepare brief email report to Committee members with BAK and MF
8-Nov-04	0.3	travel to hotel
9-Nov-04	0.3	travel to ATA
9-Nov-04	0.8	breakfast meeting with Viets, MJC and SIO to discuss alternative plan and strategic initiatives
9-Nov-04	4.0	travel from Indianapolis; review latest draft of AirTran asset purchase agreement, bidders procedures and DIP loan term sheet from State of Indiana
9-Nov-04	0.6	discussions with BAK and MF re financial model and due diligence; discuss same with Compass team
9-Nov-04	0.5	series of t/calls with PS re information on bidders procedures and break-up fee; discuss same with BAK
9-Nov-04	0.2	discuss retention documents with ETW
9-Nov-04	0.8	series of t/calls with Strickland, O'Dea, Golden and Beckerman re DIP financing and prospective sale to AirTran and options for reorganizing ATA
9-Nov-04	0.7	series of t/calls and discussions with potential new financing sources
9-Nov-04	0.5	review DIP financing presentation of Sept. 20, 2004
9-Nov-04	1.3	review various ATSB daily cash and collateral reports; review cash forecast
9-Nov-04	0.2	email to Compass and Akin Gump teams regarding initial view of cash during forecast 13 week period and bidders procedures
9-Nov-04	0.5	review Akin Gump memo re agenda for Committee conf call and matters for discussion during call and ex officio letters
10-Nov-04	2.2	review Seabury memo on ATA Midway operations; review Huron liquidation analysis; review Kroll valuation analysis of June 2004; review historical operating results by division and scheduled service
10-Nov-04	0.6	review Akin Gump summary memo on first day motions and pleadings
10-Nov-04	1.2	review Akin Gump summary of AirTran asset purchase agreement and markup of bidding procedures; review DIP term sheet and collateral summaries; review various emails from/to Committee members re same and DIP financing; review term sheet re proposed DIP term sheet
10-Nov-04	0.4	review latest ATSB daily cash and collateral reports; review cash forecast
10-Nov-04	1.2	series of t/calls and discussions with BAK, PS, MF and MJC and SIO re options, review of cash flows, etc.; including review of draft report on cash flow
10-Nov-04	0.5	series of t/calls and t/call messages to/from and with prospective investors and/or acquirers for ATA
10-Nov-04	0.9	conf call with Akin Gump and BAK, MF, PS, SIO & MJC to discuss options and legal strategy and report to Committee
10-Nov-04	1.0	t/call with Viets and Mikelsons, SIO, MF and MJC re options for Company
10-Nov-04	0.2	review various emails from Akin Gump regarding request for ex officio membership on Committee, Committee meeting and request for certain documents
10-Nov-04	1.8	Committee conf call with BAK, MF, PS, SIO & MJC; discuss AirTran transaction and options available to ATA
10-Nov-04	1.0	review latest blackline draft of AirTran asset purchase agreement
10-Nov-04	0.3	series of emails with SIO re due diligence trips to Indianapolis and prospective financing sources
11-Nov-04	0.2	review emails from SIO re lease fleet and AirTran transaction and meeting with prospective financial investor
11-Nov-04	0.1	email to prospective financial investor re ATA
11-Nov-04	0.2	review latest summary of AirTran asset purchase agreement from Akin Gump
11-Nov-04	1.0	Committee conf call to review status of AirTran proposal
11-Nov-04	1.6	all party conf call with BAK to review draft of Air Tran asset purchase agreement (Debtor, ATSB, AirTran, etc.)
11-Nov-04	1.0	conf call with Compass professionals to review options for ATA

Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Nov-04	0.7	review break-up fees in chapter 11 cases with PS and draft data prepared by PS and AD
11-Nov-04	1.4	series of t/calls with Huron, BAK, MF, MJC and SIO to discuss due diligence info and options for ATA
11-Nov-04	0.4	review email from Hunt re access to information and meetings with ATA management; discuss same with BAK and MJC
11-Nov-04	0.3	series of t/calls and t/call messages to/from and with prospective investors and/or acquirers for ATA
11-Nov-04	0.5	discuss bidders procedures and court documents with PS & AD
12-Nov-04	1.0	meeting with Prospective investor in ATA with SIO
12-Nov-04	0.7	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, MF, MJC & AD to review status of AirTran proposal
12-Nov-04	0.5	Committee Professionals call with SIO, BAK, MF, MJC & AD to review bidders and issues for court hearing for Nov. 15, 2004
12-Nov-04	0.8	series of t/calls with SIO & MF and certain Committee members re bidders procedures and other prospective bidders/investors for ATA
12-Nov-04	2.5	review information on break-up fees in chapter 11 cases and series of discussions re same with PS, BAK, MF and AD
12-Nov-04	1.5	series of t/calls and t/call messages to/from and with prospective investors and/or acquirers for ATA including related emails, including discussion with PS
12-Nov-04	1.0	discuss draft of Committee objections to bidders procedures with PS & AD and review same; review final Committee objection
12-Nov-04	0.4	review objection of Wilmington Trust to bidding procedures; review additional covenants re Indiana DIP
12-Nov-04	0.2	discuss retention documents with ETW & SIO
12-Nov-04	0.4	review draft of Compass engagement letter and discuss same with ETW
12-Nov-04	0.7	series of discussions with MJC and BAK re due diligence incl. review MJC due diligence request to Huron
13-Nov-04	0.4	review email from SIO re components of ATA's various businesses and discuss same with MJC and SIO
13-Nov-04	0.7	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron
13-Nov-04	0.4	review Wilmington Trust objection to DIP financing; review DOT, FAA and ATSB objection to bidders procedures
13-Nov-04	2.5	review additional due diligence information provided by Debtors and Huron
13-Nov-04	0.7	review latest draft of AirTran asset purchase agreement and related Akin Gump summaries
13-Nov-04	2.5	review information on break-up fees in chapter 11 cases and discuss same with PS, AD, BAK and MF
13-Nov-04	0.2	prepare and respond to series of emails regarding potential prospective bidders for ATA
13-Nov-04	0.5	conf. call with MF on Compass Schedule of Break-Up Fees and Expense Reimbursement with Botter and Ferrante of Akin Gump and PS and AD
14-Nov-04	2.0	review various documents related to sale of Midway assets to AirTran including latest round of asset purchase agreement
14-Nov-04	0.7	review various press and research reports regarding ATA and other low cost carriers
14-Nov-04	0.2	review email and t/call from SIO re options for ATA
14-Nov-04	4.0	travel from NY to Indianapolis with BAK for attendance at Bankruptcy Court for DIP and bidders procedures motion; including review of various documents relating to proposed AirTran transaction
14-Nov-04	2.0	dinner meeting with Carr and Allison, BAK, Botter and Beckerman to review issues relating to AirTran, other alternatives for ATA and chapter 11 issues

Date	TIME Hours	Description
14-Nov-04	3.0	meeting with Botter to prepare for testimony in Bankruptcy Court re bidders procedures motion an AirTran acquisition agreement; follow-up on review of Compass Schedule of Break-Up Fees and Expense Reimbursement with Botter, Ferrante and BAK
15-Nov-04	2.5	prepare for Bidders Procedures motion incl. detailed review of bidders procedures, proposed consideration from AirTran schedules with BAK, Ferrante, Bowles, etc. incl. t/call with PS re same
15-Nov-04	0.5	discuss cash collateral and ATSB issues with BAK and Beckerman and review related email to Huron
15-Nov-04	1.0	attendance at Baker & Daniels to discuss issues for Bankruptcy Court hearing regarding DIP and Bidders Procedures with BAK & MF
15-Nov-04	3.0	attendance at Bankruptcy Court for DIP motion and Bidders Procedures motion with BAK & MF
15-Nov-04	0.5	series of discussions with prospective bidder's re ATA following Bankruptcy Court hearings
15-Nov-04	0.7	discussion with BAK and MF re work program and t/call with Buebel of Huron re same; series of emails to/from Huron re financial projections
15-Nov-04	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re M&A and strategic investor options with PS and AD
15-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with SIO and t/call message to MJC to update both on results of day and work program
15-Nov-04	0.3	discuss cash collateral issues with BAK and MF
15-Nov-04	4.0	travel to NYC from Indianapolis for attendance at Bankruptcy Court for DIP and Bidders Procedures motion with BAK & MF
16-Nov-04	0.2	review emails from Ortega and Beckerman of Akin Gump re Court Hearings
16-Nov-04	0.3	discuss potential interest of airlines bidders for ATA with John Parke
16-Nov-04	0.3	discuss break-up fee analysis with PS
16-Nov-04	0.2	review BAK email on cash collateral
16-Nov-04	0.2	review email from Beckerman and related press stories regarding potential labor actions by flight attendants
16-Nov-04	0.5	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
16-Nov-04	0.3	discuss analysis of ATSB security documents with PS
16-Nov-04	1.6	discuss work program and key due diligence issues with BAK and MF incl. t/calls to Huron; t/call with Allison re same; review work program; 2nd conversation with MF re same
16-Nov-04	0.7	series of t/calls with SIO and MJC re due diligence and sale or refinancing options for reorganizing ATA; review and respond to emails regarding lessors and M&A prospects
16-Nov-04	2.3	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information
16-Nov-04	0.5	series of t/calls with note holders re financing for alternative POR
16-Nov-04	0.2	series of emails/to from Committee members re status of case and setting up times to discuss same
16-Nov-04	0.3	review MJC analysis of leases and email to Huron
16-Nov-04	0.3	review updated draft of Compass affidavit relating to retention and discuss same with ETW
16-Nov-04	0.6	discuss and review consideration of AirTran transaction with MF including valuation of contingency portion
16-Nov-04	1.5	t/call with Botter re prospective Tepner testimony on break-up fees; review proposed direct examination questions; discuss same with PS
16-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with SIO re status, plan for tomorrow in Indianapolis
17-Nov-04	0.2	review SIO concept memo for reorganizing ATA with BAK

Date	TIME Hours	Description
17-Nov-04	0.2	email to Committee members regarding upcoming meeting and update on recent activities
17-Nov-04	0.6	update prospective Tepner testimony on break-up fees
17-Nov-04	0.1	review Claffey response re potential labor actions reported in the press
17-Nov-04	0.3	emails to/from BAK and PS regarding review of ATSB Security Agreement and ATSB funding of America West
17-Nov-04	2.0	series of discussions and emails with PS and BAK re review of AirTran asset purchase agreement and breakup fees in related cases; review schedules re same from PS and AD; review latest round of AirTran documents
17-Nov-04	0.6	series of discussions and emails with Akin Gump regarding review of AirTran asset purchase agreement and bidders procedures including discussion regarding proposed HLT testimony; review related emails from Committee member re same
17-Nov-04	4.0	travel from NY to Indianapolis for due diligence meetings at ATA and attendance at Bankruptcy Court for Bidders Procedures motion with BAK
17-Nov-04	1.7	series of t/calls, t/call messages with prospective bidder's re ATA and available due diligence information
17-Nov-04	0.2	series of t/calls and emails with AD re bondholders of ATA
17-Nov-04	0.2	exchange emails with ETW re procedures
17-Nov-04	0.8	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information with SIO
18-Nov-04	0.2	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidder's re ATA and available due diligence information with SIO & PS
18-Nov-04	3.3	preparation for HLT Court testimony on break-up fees with Botter; attendance at Baker & Daniels to buyer protections with Debtor and AirTran
18-Nov-04	4.5	attendance at Bankruptcy Court for Bidders Procedures motion with MJC; including break-out session at Baker and Daniels to negotiate with AirTran; review Akin Gump memo reporting on results of Court hearing
18-Nov-04	1.7	t/calls with various note holders re status of case and discuss new sources of cash
18-Nov-04	1.2	meeting with the Flight Attendants Union and counsel; t/calls with ALPA counsel re potential meeting
18-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with BAK regarding financial projections for ATA
18-Nov-04	0.5	review SIO concepts for a deal with prospective bidders and discuss with SIO
19-Nov-04	4.5	series of meetings at ATA with Debtor and Huron and BAK, MJC & MF to review due diligence issues and model; email to Akin Gump re access to formulas in model
19-Nov-04	1.0	conf call with BAK, MJC & MF and note holders regarding options for ATA; review and respond to emails from Akin Gump re same
19-Nov-04	1.2	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidder's re ATA and available due diligence information; discuss same with MJC and SIO
19-Nov-04	0.4	review email from Baker & Daniels regarding qualification of a prospective bidders and responses from other parties re same
19-Nov-04	4.5	travel to NY from Indianapolis after due diligence meetings at ATA and attendance at Bankruptcy Court for Bidders Procedures motion with BAK
19-Nov-04	0.2	review email from Committee member regarding ATA operations with MJC
20-Nov-04	1.0	review confidentiality agreement from Southwest and other due diligence materials
20-Nov-04	0.4	review emails from various parties regarding qualification of a prospective bidders
20-Nov-04	0.3	t/calls with BAK and MF re financial model
20-Nov-04	0.3	review MF emails regarding access to Huron financial projection model and review emails re same; draft email to Allison re same
20-Nov-04	0.5	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports



Date	TIME Hours	Description
20-Nov-04	0.3	review Akin Gump summary memo re retention of Debtors professionals
20-Nov-04	2.0	review various due diligence materials on prospective competing bidder's for ATA and ATA assets
21-Nov-04	0.4	t/call with MJC regarding ATA projections and review email and analysis re same
21-Nov-04	0.6	t/call with Allison re access to financial information and options for ATA; discuss same with BAK; emails to/from MF re same
21-Nov-04	0.2	review email regarding qualification of a prospective bidder and responses from other parties re same; review and respond to emails regarding meetings with prospective bidders
22-Nov-04	0.4	t/call with Allison regarding prospective investors and acquirers of ATA and ATA assets; follow-up email re same
22-Nov-04	0.8	review MJC memos re Midway operations and pilot pay and discuss same with MJC
22-Nov-04	0.7	review MF memo re aircraft cures and discuss same with MF; review email from Mandel re aircraft lease rejections and discuss same with BAK
22-Nov-04	0.3	review final executed copy of ATA-AirTran asset purchase agreement
22-Nov-04	3.0	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information; discuss same with MJC and SIO; emails re meetings with prospective investors/acquirors with Akin Gump; review email from AD re same and discuss information on prospective acquirors with AD
22-Nov-04	1.8	discuss with PS, MF, AD, SIO & BAK re work plans
22-Nov-04	0.1	review email from Akin Gump re ex officio membership of Sankaty
22-Nov-04	0.3	t/call with Committee member re status of case
22-Nov-04	6.6	Committee conf call to review issues re ATSB, Compass report on due diligence and strategic options, and ex officio request
22-Nov-04	0.4	series of discussions with MJC, SIO, MF & BAK re status of case and strategic options and discussions with prospective investors
23-Nov-04	0.6	review Debtor's 10-Q for period ended Sept. 30, 2004
23-Nov-04	1.0	prepare summary report to Committee members re status of discussions with prospective acquirors and investors with SIO; respond to emails re same and discuss same with Beckerman and Botter
23-Nov-04	0.2	discuss results to date re discussions with prospective acquirers and investors with PS
23-Nov-04	0.4	discuss providing information to ex officio Committee members with MF and review related emails with Akin Gump
23-Nov-04	3.5	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidder's re ATA and available due diligence information; discuss same with MJC and SIO and BAK; review email from Committee member re same; prepare summary of contacts to date and email same
23-Nov-04	0.4	t/call with Committee members re status of case and discussions with third parties
23-Nov-04	0.6	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
23-Nov-04	1.2	review various emails relating to 1110 issues and discuss same with BAK and MF; review Strickland email re prepaid rents
23-Nov-04	1.2	review and edit draft of Compass affidavit re retention; discuss same with Ferrante of Akin Gump and ETW
23-Nov-04	0.3	discuss financial projections with BAK
23-Nov-04	1.0	review industry news stories and newsletters
23-Nov-04	0.3	discuss prospective bidders re ATA with BAK
24-Nov-04	0.8	series of discussions with BAK, SIO, MJC, MF and PS re analytical work received and reports being prepared for Committee members; review BAK email re same
24-Nov-04	0.5	review latest round of financial projections from Debtors

Date	TIME Hours	Description
24-Nov-04	0.6	review latest comparable company information and discuss same with PS
24-Nov-04	0.5	discuss comp analysis with AD, SIO and MJC
24-Nov-04	0.5	discussions with BAK and MF re work program and reports for Committee
24-Nov-04	0.1	review Ferrante email re treatment of confidential information regarding lease information
24-Nov-04	0.6	t/calls with Allison of Huron to discuss status of conversations with prospective acquirers and debt or equity investors; review various emails between Compass and Huron re same
24-Nov-04	1.5	t/call and discussions with various prospective equity and debt financing sources (incl. certain with SIO)
24-Nov-04	0.7	t/call with certain Committee members re status of case and discussions with third parties; respond to emails re same
24-Nov-04	0.4	review summary analysis of prepaid rents and discuss same with MJC
24-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with Ferrante re Compass draft engagement letter
24-Nov-04	0.2	discuss with MJC re prepaid rents
25-Nov-04	0.2	t/call message to prospective strategic investor/acquirer; email to SIO re strategic review issue
25-Nov-04	0.8	review draft memos to Committee regarding YTD financial performance and latest 13 week cash flow and discuss with MF; review MF memo re due diligence requests
26-Nov-04	1.5	review draft and final memo to Committee regarding YTD financial performance; review drafts of memos regarding latest 13 week cash flow and discuss with BAK and MF; review preliminary draft of cash flow report to Committee from MF
26-Nov-04	0.5	t/call with SIO re status of alternatives for ATA; review email to WestJets re same; review 2nd email from SIO regarding financial projections
26-Nov-04	1.2	series of t/calls with prospective strategic acquirer and review and respond to emails re same
26-Nov-04	0.6	emails to/from PS regarding updated comparable company analysis; review updated comp company analysis
26-Nov-04	0.6	review MJC notes re status of and options for ATA; discuss same with BAK, MF and MJC
26-Nov-04	0.2	review emails from BAK & SIO regarding review of Debtor's business plan
27-Nov-04	0.4	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
27-Nov-04	1.2	conf call with BAK, MF, MJC and SIO regarding review of business plan for 2005
27-Nov-04	0.6	review and respond to email from Committee member re cash position of debtors; discuss same with BAK
27-Nov-04	1.8	discuss financial projections, lease expense, etc. with BAK and t/calls with Allison re same and M&A process
27-Nov-04	1.0	series of emails with prospective strategic acquirer and forward copy of AirTran asset acquisition agreement and bidders procedures; review BAK email re M&A efforts
27-Nov-04	0.6	review SIO notes re status of and options for ATA; discuss same with SIO
27-Nov-04	2.0	review latest 13 week cash flow; review revised draft memo to Committee regarding latest 13 week cash flow and discuss with BAK and MF
28-Nov-04	2.7	work on revised cash flow projection and P&L forecast; revise memo and discuss same with MF and BAK; review memos from SIO and MJC re projections of the debtors and business
28-Nov-04	1.5	revise and update notes on M&A and financing alternatives including emails to/from MJC; email to prospective investor and discuss same with SIO
28-Nov-04	0.3	series of emails re meetings with bidders for ATA

Date	TIME Hours	Description
29-Nov-04	1.0	series of t/calls with Committee members and note holder re funding POR and status of case and upcoming meetings in Chicago
29-Nov-04	2.5	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information; discuss same with MJC and SIO; emails re meetings with prospective investors/acquires with Akin Gump
29-Nov-04	0.4	t/calls and emails with Beckerman re meetings in Chicago
29-Nov-04	1.2	discuss with BAK and MJC and MF and SIO work program and contact program with prospective acquirers
29-Nov-04	0.4	review Committee's limited objections to Debtor's retention of professionals and payment of professional fees
29-Nov-04	0.6	series of t/calls and emails with various institutional note holders re ATA
29-Nov-04	1.2	final review of cash flow memo; discuss same with MF; review MF summary of P&L; discuss same with MJC
29-Nov-04	0.3	discuss KERP with BAK and review related emails
29-Nov-04	0.1	email to/from Ferrante re service list
29-Nov-04	0.4	review industry report on prospective bidders
29-Nov-04	0.2	t/call with ETW and N. Ortega re retention documents
30-Nov-04	1.2	update M&A list and prepare status report to Committee; review and respond to related emails
30-Nov-04	0.3	series of emails re meetings in Chicago and scheduling of Committee conf call; review emails regarding resignation of Goodrich from Committee
30-Nov-04	0.3	review various emails regarding qualified bidders for ATA assets
30-Nov-04	0.6	t/calls with BAK and MF regarding status of discussions at ATA and KERP and memo on business plan
30-Nov-04	0.5	conf. call/meeting with BAK, MJC, MF and Huron to discuss status of bidders
30-Nov-04	4.5	travel to Chicago for meetings with prospective bidders for ATA assets with SIO
30-Nov-04	0.5	series of t/calls with (and t/call messages to) Committee members and note holder re funding POR and status of case
30-Nov-04	0.2	series of emails regarding discussions with aircraft lessors
30-Nov-04	1.0	discuss prospects of various bidders with Beckerman and SIO
30-Nov-04	0.3	review latest draft of report to Committee on financial projection model with BAK, MJC & MF
1-Dec-04	0.4	t/call with BAK, MF and MJC re review of report to Committee on financial projection model
1-Dec-04	8.0	series of meetings with prospective bidders for ATA assets in Chicago with SIO, Botter, Beckerman and Strickland; incl. travel in Chicago to meetings; review various emails re qualified bidders
1-Dec-04	0.3	t/calls with BAK, MF and MJC re leases and financial projections
1-Dec-04	0.4	t/call with MF re status update
1-Dec-04	4.0	travel from Chicago to NY after meetings with prospective bidders for ATA assets with SIO
2-Dec-04	0.6	review memo from MJC re lessors; discuss same with MJC; review summary of lease payments schedule for certain aircraft
2-Dec-04	0.8	review Akin Gump changes to Compass engagement letter and discuss same with PS and ETW
2-Dec-04	0.7	review submission from prospective acquirers and related emails
2-Dec-04	0.5	conf call with SIO, MJC, BAK, MF and aircraft lessor to review ATA case
2-Dec-04	0.7	t/calls with Committee members; follow up discussion with MF re information for ex office members; review and respond to emails from Committee members re same
2-Dec-04	0.3	review options with BAK, MJC and MF for ATA
2-Dec-04	0.4	discuss summary of ATA's prior recapitalization with BAK

Date	TIME Hours	Description
2-Dec-04	1.8	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA and available due diligence information incl. conf call with prospective bidders with SIO & MJC
2-Dec-04	2.1	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, MF and BAK, including travel to/from Akin Gump NY office
2-Dec-04	1.2	review drafts of debtor's proposed KERP motion and supporting materials; discuss same with BAK and MJC and review email re same from Beckerman
3-Dec-04	0.1	review and respond to series of emails regarding meetings with Committee members
3-Dec-04	0.7	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
3-Dec-04	1.3	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA; incl. with Akin Gump and review of qualifications of prospective bidders; discussion with MJC regarding providing due diligence information to certain prospective bidders
3-Dec-04	2.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee members regarding analysis of various bids; discuss same with BAK, MF, SIO and MJC; review status of bids
3-Dec-04	0.4	review Industry news stories and newsletters
3-Dec-04	1.4	discuss KERP analysis with BAK and review related emails; discuss ongoing due diligence efforts and work on new business plan with BAK and MF
3-Dec-04	1.2	review series of emails regarding 1110 issues and leases; discuss same with BAK and MJC
3-Dec-04	0.2	discussions and t/call with ETW & MJC re bid procedures
4-Dec-04	1.3	review industry news stories re ATA; review research report on ATA
4-Dec-04	2.0	conf call with Huron and BAK, MF, SIO & MJC to discuss status of M&A bids, M&A due diligence and information re claims; follow up conf call with Compass team re same
4-Dec-04	0.3	review series of emails regarding meetings with ATSB, Debtors and prospective acquirers; review emails regarding contacts with prospective investors and acquirers
4-Dec-04	0.3	review latest draft of comp. company analysis
5-Dec-04	1.3	conf call with Huron and BAK, MF, SIO & MJC to discuss status of M&A bids, M&A due diligence and information re claims; follow up conf call with Compass team re same
5-Dec-04	1.0	review comp company analysis and discuss with MRC and SIO
5-Dec-04	0.5	t/call with Beckerman + SIO re schedule of meetings for upcoming week; review series of emails regarding meetings with ATSB, Debtors and prospective acquirers
5-Dec-04	2.6	work on bid and recovery analysis for Committee including multiple discussions with SIO, BAK and MF; review emails re qualifying bidders
6-Dec-04	1.8	conf calls with union Committee members regarding issues pertaining to various proposed asset acquisitions with SIO
6-Dec-04	0.8	call with SIO & Mark Schulte re status of Southwest planning
6-Dec-04	6.3	work on valuation and recovery issues with BAK, MF, SIO and MJC including presentation materials for Committee; discuss new business plan for prospective Southwest transaction; discuss KERP issues with BAK
6-Dec-04	0.6	review information on aircraft lease fleet; discuss lease rejections with BAK
6-Dec-04	2.2	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA, available due diligence information and discussion with prospective new financing sources; t/call with Huron re same; review and respond to emails re schedule
6-Dec-04	1.5	review bid documents submitted for ATA incl. related emails

Date	TIME Hours	Description
7-Dec-04	1.2	series of t/calls, t/call messages and emails with and regarding prospective bidders re ATA, available due diligence information and discussion with prospective new financing sources; t/call with Huron re same; review and respond to emails re schedule; draft report
7-Dec-04	6.0	travel to/from Washington for meetings with ATA and ATSB at Akin Gump offices to discuss pending asset sales; review emails related to bid documents submitted for ATA; review Akin Gump memo on KERP
7-Dec-04	3.2	meeting with the Debtors and ATSB and related meetings regarding options for ATA
7-Dec-04	0.8	series of calls with BAK and MF incl. review of drafts of presentation to Committee
7-Dec-04	0.8	t/calls with Committee members re options for ATA
7-Dec-04	1.7	Committee conf call; discuss options for ATA and review of factors affecting recoveries
7-Dec-04	0.3	discussion with prospective investor re components of proposal
7-Dec-04	0.3	review Industry news stories and newsletters
7-Dec-04	0.2	review memo from Ponader re KERP
8-Dec-04	1.8	series of t/calls with respective bidders for ATA assets incl. t/calls with SIO; review related financing documents for bidders; discuss same and military options with SIO; review Beckerman email re AWA
8-Dec-04	0.7	series of t/calls with note holders and other prospective financial investors regarding options for ATA
8-Dec-04	1.5	series of discussions with Committee members and Committee counsel regarding bidders for ATA assets and value available for unsecured creditors; incl. various discussions with MJC, SIO, BAK and MF
8-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with Dietz of PJ Solomon re attendance at Committee meeting and advising ALPA; discuss same with Beckerman and send emails re same to SIO
8-Dec-04	1.5	series of discussions with MJC, SIO, BAK and MF re financial projections and report to Committee, status of various bidders and reviewing options for ATA and unsecured creditors
8-Dec-04	0.3	discuss status of 1110 motions with SIO and BAK
8-Dec-04	4.5	travel to Chicago for meetings with ATA and prospective bidders for ATA assets; review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
9-Dec-04	2.0	series of conversation with financing sources regarding interest in submitting DIP proposal for plan of reorganization
9-Dec-04	0.4	t/calls with BAK and MF regarding update on financial projections
9-Dec-04	0.3	review Akin Gump summary of lease rejection motions
9-Dec-04	2.5	meeting with BAK, SIO, MJC and Debtors regarding prospective bidders and summary financial information regarding reorganized ATA under alternative bids; incl. travel to and from
9-Dec-04	1.7	Committee meeting with BAK, SIO & MJC regarding options for ATA and Committee views re same, including lunch with Committee
9-Dec-04	0.4	discuss Compass retention issues with Committee and Committee co-chair and counsel
9-Dec-04	0.2	t/call with MF regarding results of Committee meeting with Debtor
9-Dec-04	1.0	series of conversations with prospective bidders incl. calls with SIO
9-Dec-04	1.0	dinner meeting with Committee; discuss options for Committee with BAK, SIO & MJC and ATA regarding POR and prospective bidders
10-Dec-04	0.5	series of t/calls and emails regarding alternative financing options for bidders
10-Dec-04	2.6	Committee meeting with Southwest Airlines, SIO, MF, BAK & MJC at Bell Boyd & Lloyd (incl. travel to meeting from hotel)
10-Dec-04	0.4	meeting with Huron to review latest info on bidders

Date	TIME Hours	Description
10-Dec-04	0.4	discussion with Huron regarding other potential bidders incl. various emails re same
10-Dec-04	5.0	travel from Chicago to New York after meetings with ATA, SIO and prospective bidders for ATA assets including t/call with Committee member regarding options; review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization rep
10-Dec-04	0.4	update MF regarding results of meetings in Chicago
10-Dec-04	0.4	review draft of Code Share agreement from bidders
11-Dec-04	0.6	t/call with prospective bidders regarding auction; review NatTel bid
11-Dec-04	1.8	Committee professionals conf call with BAK, SIO & MJC to review bids of AirTran and Southwest
11-Dec-04	2.2	review bid letter and Exhibits from Southwest Airlines; review other emails re qualification of bidders
11-Dec-04	3.5	work on bid analysis issues with BAK and MF; including t/call with MJC re same
11-Dec-04	0.3	review industry news stories and newsletters
11-Dec-04	0.3	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron including bookings and utilization reports
12-Dec-04	3.3	work on bid analysis issues with BAK and MF and SIO incl. review of related emails & documents
12-Dec-04	0.1	review and reply to Ferrante email regarding AMEX confi
12-Dec-04	4.5	travel from NY to Indianapolis for auction including review of related documents and discussions with Akin Gump and SIO; review amended lease rejection summary documents
12-Dec-04	1.4	Committee conf call with MF, BAK, SIO & MJC to review Compass analysis of recoveries and discuss strategy for auction
12-Dec-04	2.7	meeting with bidders to discuss options for improving bid; review various emails re same
12-Dec-04	0.5	review and respond to series of emails and t/calls with prospective bidders
12-Dec-04	0.3	series of t/calls with bidders regarding form of bid with MF, BAK, SIO & MJC
12-Dec-04	0.6	meeting with Huron to review scorecard and issues for evaluating bids, including discussions with MF, BAK, SIO & MJC
13-Dec-04	15.0	participate in auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB and various bidders incl. multiple discussions with Committee members, counsel and BAK, MF, MJC and SIO
14-Dec-04	0.8	Committee conf call to review status of bids and seeking approval for selecting highest bidders
14-Dec-04	11.2	auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB and various bidders incl. multiple discussions with Committee members, counsel and BAK, MF, MJC and SIO; including Committee conf call to review status of bidders
15-Dec-04	11.0	auction for ATA assets; series of meetings with Debtor, ATSB and various bidders incl. multiple discussions with Committee members, counsel and BAK, MF, MJC and SIO
16-Dec-04	0.8	review and respond to various Committee emails regarding results of auction, including meeting with SIO to review bid status and next steps
16-Dec-04	0.7	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, MF & SIO to review results of auction
16-Dec-04	4.5	travel to NY from Indianapolis after auction for ATA gates with BAK & MF
16-Dec-04	1.6	series of t/calls with note holders regarding announced information on Southwest transactions; review email from Ferrante regarding final documentation of deal with Southwest
16-Dec-04	0.5	review Industry news stories re ATA deal with Southwest
17-Dec-04	1.0	review work program with BAK and MF including t/call with Huron; discuss KERP with BAK and PS; discuss report to Committee with MF

Date	TIME Hours	Description
17-Dec-04	0.5	review proposed KERP allocations and amount; review Akin Gump memo re same
17-Dec-04	1.3	conf call with BAK, MJC, PS, MRC, Beckerman and Ferrante of Akin Gump re KERP, leases and upcoming sale motion; review related emails re KERP
17-Dec-04	0.7	series of discussions with SIO and MJC re leases and lease rejections, etc.
17-Dec-04	0.5	t/call with Committee member, SIO, MJC & MF re status of case and likely range of recoveries; review and respond to emails from Committee members re Southwest deal
17-Dec-04	0.7	review various daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
17-Dec-04	0.4	review industry news stories re ATA deal with Southwest
18-Dec-04	1.9	series of t/calls with MF, SIO, MJC, Beckerman, Allison and Viets regarding leases and related issues; review and respond to related emails
18-Dec-04	0.2	review and reply to emails regarding Committee conf call with proposed new co-CRO
18-Dec-04	0.1	review email from Huron re KERP
19-Dec-04	0.6	series of t/calls with MF, SIO, MJC, and Viets regarding leases and scheduled call with Committee professionals and ATA
19-Dec-04	0.2	review and respond to series of emails regarding leases and related conf call among ATA and Committee professionals
19-Dec-04	1.8	conf call with Committee professionals and ATA to review status of leases; follow-up call with Akin Gump, SIO, MF and MJC re same
19-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with Committee member regarding options for ATSB loan
19-Dec-04	0.4	review Oran comments on Code Share agreement and related emails from Akin Gump
20-Dec-04	0.4	conf call with Committee professionals, MJC, MF & BAK and ATA to review status of leases
20-Dec-04	0.5	review cash flow forecast with MF and work program incl. draft of email for Committee
20-Dec-04	0.7	t/calls and discussion re leases and rotatable status with SIO incl. discussion with Schulte re sale motion; review SIO email and responses from Beckerman re same
20-Dec-04	0.3	discuss ATSB issue with Botter and t/call message to Committee member re same; t/call with Committee member re status of case
20-Dec-04	4.5	travel from NY to Indianapolis to attend Bankruptcy Court hearing with MF for DIP loan and sale motions; review filed objections to Southwest transaction; review proposed changes to DIP Order
20-Dec-04	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
20-Dec-04	0.5	review latest draft engagement letter and discuss changes with PS
21-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with Committee professionals, SIO, MJC, MF, BAK and ATA to review status of leases
21-Dec-04	4.3	series of meetings, discussions and conf calls at Baker & Daniels with Debtor and its advisors, ATSB and Akin Gump to discuss leases, DIP loan and code share agreements with Southwest; including multiple discussions with SIO, MJC and BAK; including conf call with SouthWest airlines regarding code share; review related emails regarding closing of SouthWest transaction
21-Dec-04	1.0	attendance at Bankruptcy Court hearings approving sale of midway assets to Southwest and DIP Loan
21-Dec-04	1.3	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, MF & BAK to discuss results of bankruptcy court hearing, ATSB, KERP and interview with John proposed Co-CRO
21-Dec-04	0.5	t/calls with MJC and SIO regarding options for leases
21-Dec-04	0.6	t/call with proposed Co-CRO regarding future role as co-CRO; discuss same with Viets and review related emails

Date	TIME Hours	Description
21-Dec-04	0.4	review emails re cash collateral
21-Dec-04	4.2	travel to NY from Indianapolis after Bankruptcy Court hearing with MF for DIP loan and sale motions
21-Dec-04	0.5	review changes to latest code share agreement
22-Dec-04	1.7	conf call with Akin Gump and ATA and ATA advisors to discuss code share
22-Dec-04	3.5	all party conf call including MJC & SIO to review code share agreement
22-Dec-04	1.0	t/call with proposed Co-CRO to discuss role of co-CRO with MJC, BAK & MF
22-Dec-04	2.5	series of t/calls with MJC, SIO and discussions with BAK regarding code share, leasing issues, and discussion with proposed Co-CRO; series of discussions with Viets and Allison regarding leases and ExecuJet
22-Dec-04	1.5	2nd all party conf call including MJC & SIO to review code share agreement
22-Dec-04	0.3	t/call with Beckerman regarding KERP, leases, ExecuJet, code share and recently filed motions in Court
22-Dec-04	0.6	finalize retention documents including discussion with PS
22-Dec-04	0.4	review court dockets re 341 A meeting of creditors and email from Akin Gump re establishment of bar date; review emails re Southwest proposal and emails from Committee members and SIO re KERP
22-Dec-04	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
22-Dec-04	0.2	discuss retention with ETW
23-Dec-04	0.3	discuss various motions to review with PS and review related emails
23-Dec-04	0.6	reply to email from Jacobson and SIO regarding KERP and review related emails re KERP; t/call with Jacobson re KERP
23-Dec-04	1.0	series of t/calls and emails t/calls with Allison, MJC and/or Calavritinos re leases; review related emails re leases
23-Dec-04	1.2	conf call with Committee co-chairs and proposed Co-CRO re role of Co-CRO incl. t/call with Cotton re same
23-Dec-04	0.5	conf call with Committee professionals, MJC, SIO and ATA to review status of leases
23-Dec-04	1.4	Committee Conf call to discuss closing issues, interview proposed Co-CRO and KERP
23-Dec-04	0.6	finalize retention documents including discussion with ETW and emails with Akin Gump
23-Dec-04	0.5	review and respond to email from Schulte re DIP loan and sale of gates; review latest emails re code share; review emails re cash collateral and Lessor stipulation and discuss same with MF
23-Dec-04	0.4	t/call with MJC re discussions with lessors; review MJC email with suggestions re marketing
24-Dec-04	0.8	t/call with Gary Kelley and Beckerman regarding proposed Co-CRO; t/call to proposed Co-CRO
24-Dec-04	0.7	t/calls with Allison and MJC regarding lessors and email to Committee professionals re same
24-Dec-04	0.5	review and respond to various emails from Committee professionals and Committee members regarding proposed Co-CRO, including discussions with SIO
24-Dec-04	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
27-Dec-04	0.8	review emails from Committee counsel re CRO
27-Dec-04	1.2	conf call with MJC, MF and Allison re CRO, lease fleet, Executed, executive decision making, etc.
27-Dec-04	0.8	t/call with Beckerman and MJC re options for ATA
27-Dec-04	1.2	series of t/calls with MJC and SIO re CRO and ATA operations and leases; t/call with Allison re leases; review SIO memo re work plan



Date	TIME Hours	Description
27-Dec-04	0.4	review draft of letter to ATA re ongoing access to senior management and decision making process; review comments from MJC and Beckerman
27-Dec-04	0.2	discuss KERP issues with MF
27-Dec-04	0.7	conf call with MJC, Viets and Allison regarding discussions with Lessor
27-Dec-04	0.1	review email regarding executive recruiters for new CEO
28-Dec-04	4.3	series of t/calls with Allison, MJC, Viets, Beckerman, Calavritinos and Shearer re Boeing Leases; discuss lease analysis with MF; review various drafts of term sheet with Boeing; incl. review of related emails
28-Dec-04	1.6	series of t/calls with SIO, MJC, Beckerman and discussion with MF re CRO; review info on proposed nominees; work on revisions to letter to Debtor re access
29-Dec-04	1.2	discuss CRO with Beckerman; t/call with Dietz of ALPA re KERP; t/call with MJC re CRO; review Beckerman email re KERP
29-Dec-04	0.5	review latest draft of Boeing term sheet and related correspondence; discuss same with Beckerman
29-Dec-04	0.2	review notices of filing 1110 motions under seal
29-Dec-04	0.1	review Debtor's objection to motion of Committee to employ Lytle Soule & Curlee as special counsel
29-Dec-04	0.4	review and finalize letter to Allison re restructuring committee; discuss with MF
29-Dec-04	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
29-Dec-04	0.2	review SIO email re rotables
29-Dec-04	0.3	review email from Akin Gump re motions filed in Bankruptcy Court
30-Dec-04	0.7	t/call with SIO re CRO; review draft of work plan; review final Boeing letter; review MJC email re CRO
30-Dec-04	0.5	t/calls with Beckerman re Debtors' issues regarding Compass retention application
30-Dec-04	0.4	t/call with Allison regarding next steps for restructuring ATA; review emails regarding CEO search and respond to same
30-Dec-04	2.5	review and update time records for Dec 2004
31-Dec-04	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
31-Dec-04	0.2	t/call with Jacki Pritchett regarding employee issues at ATA; review MJC email re CRO
2-Jan-05	0.7	t/call with Jacki Pritchett regarding employee issues at ATA
3-Jan-05	0.3	discuss KERP issue with PS; review various emails from Debtor re same
3-Jan-05	0.5	t/calls with Committee members re status of CRO, lease rejections and cash flow model
3-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman to review agenda items for Committee conf call and work program
3-Jan-05	0.8	t/calls/discussions with MJC and SIO regarding KERP, CRO and lease rejections
3-Jan-05	0.1	review email regarding executive recruiters interviews for new CEO
3-Jan-05	0.8	Committee conf call; discuss CRO and executive search process, KERP, etc.
3-Jan-05	0.7	review various motions and emails re SAAB aircraft incl. emails from Akin Gump
3-Jan-05	1.1	conf call with Viets, SIO and MJC re CRO, financial projections and cash flow and KERP
3-Jan-05	0.3	review letter from Huron/Kennelly regarding ongoing coordination of activities
4-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with PS regarding SunGard claim including review of claim amount
4-Jan-05	2.7	series of t/calls with Beckerman re KERP and review related emails; work on KERP analysis, follow-up conversations with BAK & SIO
4-Jan-05	1.5	Committee professionals conf call with BAK and MJC on KERP
4-Jan-05	0.2	review fax from Viets re key planning issues for ATA
4-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with Committee members re CRO; review email re same
4-Jan-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports

Date	TIME Hours	Description
5-Jan-05	0.4	email KERP analysis to Compass professionals; review Akin Gump comments on current KERP proposal; review PS email re same
5-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with MJC, SIO, BAK and Viets re fleet plan and business plan
5-Jan-05	0.4	t/call from candidate interested in CRO position and review related email with resume
5-Jan-05	1.3	t/calls with Beckerman and Schulte (with SIO) re CRO and CEO search; t/call with Beckerman and G. Kelly re CRO; submit CRO suggestions to Kelly via email; t/call with Committee member re CRO and status of Compass work program; review related emails to/fro
5-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with MJC re lessors and CRO; discuss strategic business plan with SIO
5-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with Carlson, creditor, re lease rejection claim
5-Jan-05	0.7	discussions with MF and BAK regarding cash flow and Saab rejections and lease rejections; review BAK analysis re same
5-Jan-05	1.7	Committee conference call to discuss KERP, cash flow and CRO
5-Jan-05	0.9	follow up call with Committee professionals re issues to due diligence; follow up discussions with MJC and SIO re same
5-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with Jacobson re CRO and business operations including Chicago Express; t/call with Sankaty re same
6-Jan-05	0.8	series of t/calls with Committee members regarding ATA's business plan and changes in operations
6-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re Sankaty and ATSB
6-Jan-05	0.3	review motion of NatTel for examiner
6-Jan-05	0.6	review proposals from prospective executive recruiters re CEO search
6-Jan-05	0.2	t/call from candidate interested in CRO position and review related email
6-Jan-05	2.8	conf call with MJC & SIO prospective executive recruiters re CEO search at Akin Gump incl. travel to/from Akin Gump
6-Jan-05	0.2	discussion with ETW regarding terms of Compass engagement and Huron inquiry re same; review related email
6-Jan-05	0.9	review follow-up emails from prospective executive recruiters re CEO search including discussion with Beckerman and MJC and SIO re same
6-Jan-05	2.0	t/call with MJC, SIO, BAK, Viets and Hlavacek re fleet plan, business plan and KERP
6-Jan-05	0.6	follow-up call with MJC, SIO and BAK re fleet plan and business plan; t/call with MJC, SIO, BAK, Viets and Hlavacek re fleet plan, business plan and KERP; review BAK email regarding request for info on lease rejections and responses from PS and Huron
6-Jan-05	0.6	review Nov. monthly operating report and review and respond to emails re same from Committee members; review emails re DOT approval of code share
6-Jan-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
7-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with Schulte re CRO and CEO; t/call from financial advisory firm re CRO and review related email
7-Jan-05	0.4	t/calls with Committee member re CRO and CEO search
7-Jan-05	0.7	t/call with Spenser Stuart with Beckerman
7-Jan-05	0.7	t/call with Beckerman re CRO position including t/call message to Kelly of Southwest; t/call with Schulte re CRO and CEO searches; t/call email to Beckerman re same
7-Jan-05	0.5	t/call from candidate interested in CRO position and review related email and forward same to Akin Gump
7-Jan-05	0.1	review email from Ortega of Akin Gump regarding bar date
7-Jan-05	0.5	review email from Debtor's counsel re SAAB leases; review email from Viets re fleet plan

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Jan-05	0.6	review latest ATSB reporting package including bookings report; emails to/from MF and BAK
8-Jan-05	0.1	forward email re CRO candidate to Beckerman
9-Jan-05	0.2	review emails from Beckerman re exec recruiting effort for new CEO and CRO discussion with Southwest
10-Jan-05	1.5	review drafts of latest cash flow report and review with MF; review BAK email re Mikelsons family members of payroll and Debtors responses re same
10-Jan-05	0.5	review latest proposal on KERP and related emails regarding schedule of Committee professionals call
10-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with Beckerman re report to Committee on cash flow and call with Beckerman and Kelly of Southwest re CRO
10-Jan-05	0.4	discuss fleet configuration with SIO and with Committee member
10-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with Viets and Allison re results of Board meeting
10-Jan-05	0.3	prepare for call with Committee with BAK, SIO and MF
10-Jan-05	1.0	Committee conference call with BAK, SIO, MJC & MF; review status of new business plan, CRO and CEO search, KERP and update on cash flow
10-Jan-05	0.4	follow up discussions with Committee members
10-Jan-05	0.5	review timing of projections with MF and BAK; review various emails
10-Jan-05	0.2	review various emails from SIO re due diligence materials and options for ATA
10-Jan-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; review Akin Gump re questions on debtors' reports on schedules and statement of financial affairs
11-Jan-05	1.2	discuss KERP with BAK and review latest proposal from Debtors; discuss same with Beckerman; review emails related to Committee call and Committee professionals call re same; review email from Akin Gump re workmen's comp
11-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with SIO, MJC and Calavritinos re fleet and availability of new aircraft
11-Jan-05	2.0	conf call with SIO, BAK, MJC and Huron to review lease issues, KERP, and fleet; review related emails and analyses re same
11-Jan-05	0.4	review summaries of court docket for recent filings (BMRC); review and respond to email from note holder
11-Jan-05	0.2	review various news stories re new fare structure initiated by Delta
11-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with Jacki Pritchett regarding fleet configuration; discuss same with BAK and MF; and with Beckerman; review draft email response
11-Jan-05	0.2	t/calls with Calavritinos and MJC re CRO and ATA's fleet
11-Jan-05	0.8	t/call with Akin Gump and MJC re Debtors' KERP proposal
12-Jan-05	0.8	t/calls with Beckerman re KERP, CRO and changes in management at ATA; follow-up t/call re meeting with ATA and Committee; review latest KERP term sheet
12-Jan-05	0.5	series of discussions with PS and BAK re KERP
12-Jan-05	1.2	Committee conf call to discuss KERP
12-Jan-05	0.1	discuss with SIO re CRO/CFO issues
12-Jan-05	0.2	Discussions with SIO re fleet, interim CEO/CRO
12-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with prospective CRO
12-Jan-05	0.3	discuss Debtors' comments to Compass engagement letter with PS and Beckerman
12-Jan-05	0.3	review Akin Gump letter to Debtors requesting additional related party information
12-Jan-05	0.3	discussion with BAK and Kennelly of Huron re P&L and fleet plan; review related emails
13-Jan-05	1.0	discuss KERP revisions with BAK; review Akin Gump emails re same and respond; t/call with KERP Beckerman and Botter
13-Jan-05	0.8	t/call with Committee members re business plan
13-Jan-05	0.8	t/call with Viets and with Kennelly of Huron re new business plan for ATA
13-Jan-05	1.0	discuss options for ATA with MJC, BAK and SIO

Date	TIME Hours	Description
13-Jan-05	0.4	review Industry news stories and newsletters re code share
13-Jan-05	0.3	discuss Debtors' comments to Compass engagement letter with PS and Beckerman
13-Jan-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
14-Jan-05	0.1	review emails to Committee from Akin Gump re KERP and bar date for claims
14-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with MJC re options for ATA
14-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with Schulte re CRO and code share with SIO; review draft of Spencer Stuart engagement letter
14-Jan-05	0.5	review latest draft of cash flow report and discuss with MF
14-Jan-05	1.0	t/call with Viets, BAK, MJC, and MF re business plan and new exec. appointments
14-Jan-05	0.9	t/call with Botter, PS and BAK re KERP and debtor's response re same; email to Huron re same
14-Jan-05	1.0	Committee conf call to review new KERP proposal, status of CRO and Compass status report
14-Jan-05	0.8	discuss agenda items with BAK and MF for meetings at ATA; review BAK email re same
14-Jan-05	0.7	review emails from Akin Gump re issues in Compass retention; t/call with Beckerman re Compass retention issues; email to Beckerman and Claffey re same
14-Jan-05	1.2	t/call with Beckerman and Kelly re CRO; t/call with CRO candidate and email results to Beckerman; review emails from Beckerman and Committee members re CRO and management changes
14-Jan-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
15-Jan-05	0.4	review Akin Gump summary of rejection motions
15-Jan-05	0.3	review and respond to emails from Akin Gump re issues in Compass retention; emails re same to Beckerman and Claffey
15-Jan-05	0.4	review and respond to series of emails with Beckerman, SIO and others re CRO; review email from Committee member re labor issues
16-Jan-05	0.4	review various emails re KERP
16-Jan-05	0.2	review Akin Gump summary of rejection motions; review email regarding strategies with aircraft lessors
17-Jan-05	0.4	review revised Compass engagement letter reflecting changes negotiated with Debtors
17-Jan-05	0.7	t/calls with Beckerman and Denison re CRO; series of emails and t/call messages re same
17-Jan-05	0.4	review message from Committee member re options for ATA and discuss same with BAK; emails to/from BAK re same; review emails from BAK re fleet composition
17-Jan-05	0.1	discuss with BAK re options for ATA
18-Jan-05	0.3	review and respond to Debtors email re Compass retention
18-Jan-05	0.7	series of t/calls with Viets, Denison and Botter re CRO; discuss same with MJC
18-Jan-05	0.7	review various reports prepared by Debtors and Compass on YTD financial results for 2004
18-Jan-05	0.4	review various emails re KERP
18-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with Committee member re status of KERP, CRO and business plan
18-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with MJC re Spencer Stuart and review related email
18-Jan-05	0.1	review email from BAK reporting on lease rejection meeting with Debtors
19-Jan-05	0.5	review email from Beckerman re revisions to KERP; review revised KERP proposal from ATA; review and reply to Beckerman email re CRO and status of business plan
19-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with BAK re results of meetings with Debtors on business plan and review of operations

Date	TIME Hours	Description
19-Jan-05	2.3	Committee conf call to discuss KERP, CRO and business plan status
19-Jan-05	0.3	review Wells Fargo statement as Indenture Trustee listing total claim
19-Jan-05	0.3	series of t/calls with Botter and emails regarding KERP
19-Jan-05	1.3	t/call with Beckerman, Claffey and Carr regarding KERP, CRO and senior management
19-Jan-05	0.3	t/calls with BAK and MF re business plan
19-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with MJC and SIO re strategic options for ATA and implementation of code share
19-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with proposed CRO regarding prospective duties
20-Jan-05	0.9	discuss status of due diligence meetings with BAK and MF; discuss same with MJC including options for ATA
20-Jan-05	0.4	review emails from Beckerman re status of KERP and CRO compensation; t/call with Beckerman re same and rotatables
20-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with Committee member re options for ATA
20-Jan-05	0.3	review email of prospective board candidates and reply to Committee member re same
20-Jan-05	1.2	t/calls and emails with Committee members re CEO search and CRO; t/call with Allison re same and business plan
20-Jan-05	1.5	review latest KERP term sheets and Debtors' motion re KERP and severance program; discuss same with Beckerman; follow up call with Beckerman and Botter and Jim Carr re same
20-Jan-05	0.6	Committee conf call to review Debtors' motion re KERP and severance program
20-Jan-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
20-Jan-05	0.4	review Debtors' motion to extend exclusivity
20-Jan-05	0.8	review motions to employ Spencer Stuart; review Debtors' presentation on code share forwarded by BAK
20-Jan-05	0.5	discuss latest status on fleet with BAK and SIO and review related emails from Back and SIO
21-Jan-05	2.0	review latest KERP term sheets from Debtors; review emails from Akin Gump and Committee members re same; discuss same with MF and BAK
21-Jan-05	0.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
21-Jan-05	0.4	discuss due diligence follow-up with BAK and MJC and review related emails
23-Jan-05	0.6	series of t/calls and emails re planned trip to Indianapolis incl. t/call re same with MJC
24-Jan-05	1.0	attendance by telephone at Bankruptcy Court hearing re Compass retention; incl. travel to/from Akin Gump office
24-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with Schulte re CRO
24-Jan-05	1.4	series of t/calls with Denison re action plan for ATA and potential changes; 2nd t/call with Beckerman
24-Jan-05	0.9	series of t/calls and discussions with BAK, MF, MJC and SIO re new presentation; t/calls with Hancock and Botter and t/call message to Cotton re same
24-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with Allison and BAK re status of new initiatives
24-Jan-05	0.1	review Akin Gump email re Mikelsons and severance part of KERP
24-Jan-05	1.0	series of t/calls with various institutional note holders re ATA
24-Jan-05	0.2	review press reports on recent executive changes and draft email to Committee
24-Jan-05	1.4	series of t/calls with Denison, Beckerman, Calavritinos & MJC re meeting with ATA re business plan and strategic options; review related emails re meeting
24-Jan-05	0.3	discuss rotatables with BAK and review email and BAK analysis re same
25-Jan-05	1.2	series of t/calls and emails with BAK, Beckerman & Botter re meeting at ATA; discuss same with SIO, MJC, MF and BAK
25-Jan-05	0.4	review and respond to emails re EETC's proposed foreclosure auction

Date	TIME Hours	Description
25-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with note holder re status of CRO
25-Jan-05	0.4	email to Denison re potential assistance at ATA; review and respond to various emails re new CRO; review Beckerman email re changes to KERP
25-Jan-05	4.0	travel from NY to Indianapolis for meetings at ATA with MF
25-Jan-05	1.7	meetings at ATA with Huron, BAK and MJC re current status of ATA and near term projections; incl. travel to hotel following meetings; series of t/calls and emails regarding status of materials to be presented by ATA
26-Jan-05	6.0	series of meetings at ATA with MF, BAK, MJC & SIO to review presentation and elements of new financial projections including discussion with Denison and t/call with Beckerman; meeting with Southwest re business opportunities at ATA incl. travel from hotel to ATA
26-Jan-05	1.0	Committee conference call to review ATA presentation
26-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with note holder re status of CRO
26-Jan-05	4.0	travel to NY to Indianapolis after meetings at ATA
27-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman regarding Chicago Express and results of meeting at ATA
27-Jan-05	1.2	t/call with Committee members regarding ATA; discuss options with SIO and interest of other carriers in ATA ops; t/call with Denison re cash flow and options for TA
27-Jan-05	0.3	t/call with note holder re status of Indy operations and ATA announcement
27-Jan-05	0.3	review Industry news stories and newsletters re ATA
27-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with prospective acquirer of Chicago Express
27-Jan-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
28-Jan-05	3.8	series of t/calls with Beckerman, Denison, Allison and/or Committee members re business plan and new initiatives; review cash flow with MF
28-Jan-05	0.6	review options for ATA with MJC and with SIO
28-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with prospective acquirer of Chicago Express
28-Jan-05	0.6	t/call with Committee members re fleet and business operations and discussion with labor; review related emails
28-Jan-05	0.3	review emails re aircraft engines and discuss with BAK
28-Jan-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email re pending motions
28-Jan-05	2.0	review and update time records
30-Jan-05	0.3	emails with SIO re status of Chicago Express
30-Jan-05	0.7	t/call with Committee members re status of labor negotiations
30-Jan-05	0.4	review Industry news stories and newsletters re ATA and Chicago Express
31-Jan-05	0.4	t/calls with Allison re information on senior executives related party transactions and Chicago Express
31-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with Denison re Chicago Express and business plan
31-Jan-05	0.5	t/call with MJC re code share template and Chicago Express; review emails re code share from MJC and SIO
31-Jan-05	0.4	t/call with prospective acquirer of Chicago Express
31-Jan-05	0.2	send email to MJC re case administration issues
31-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with Committee member re business operations
31-Jan-05	0.2	emails to Beckerman re updates with Debtor and certain creditors
31-Jan-05	0.2	t/call with Ferrante re upcoming Committee conf call and review email re same
31-Jan-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
1-Feb-05	0.7	review latest drafts of 1110 extensions for aircraft, etc.
1-Feb-05	0.7	t/call with Committee members re status of case; discuss cash flow projections with MF; review MF email to Huron re same
1-Feb-05	0.2	t/call with MJC re executive search
1-Feb-05	0.7	t/call with BAK and Beckerman regarding exclusivity and labor issues; 2nd t/call with Beckerman and MF re Chicago Express

Date	TIME Hours	Description
1-Feb-05	0.7	t/call with Denison & Frick with MF re cash flow and business plan projections
1-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with note holder re status of Indy operations and ATA announcement
1-Feb-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email re pending motions incl. reclamation claims
1-Feb-05	1.2	series of discussions with Scarince re Chicago Express and review related emails and analysis from Scarince
1-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with SIO re sources of financing for aircraft; review related emails
2-Feb-05	0.5	t/call with Allison re cash flow; discuss same with MF
2-Feb-05	0.4	t/call with MF and MJC re code share and cash flow
2-Feb-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
2-Feb-05	0.3	review SIO email re utilization of gates and discuss same
2-Feb-05	0.4	t/call with prospective investor in ATA
2-Feb-05	0.3	discuss DIP amendments with BAK and review related emails from Beckerman
2-Feb-05	1.2	Committee conf call with MJC, SIO, MF and BAK; discuss cash flow and exclusivity
3-Feb-05	0.1	review Creditors Committee professional meeting scheduling issues with SIO and BAK
3-Feb-05	0.7	discuss Chicago Express with MF, BAK and SIO; review email from Huron re same; review email re certificates at Chicago Express
3-Feb-05	1.5	t/call with Beckerman and Frick re Chicago Express; discuss same with SIO, MJC and MF
3-Feb-05	0.8	review and respond to series of emails regarding meetings with Debtors
3-Feb-05	0.9	review emails re extension of cash collateral; discuss same with BAK and MF
3-Feb-05	0.3	discuss collateral issues re amended DIP with MF and BAK
4-Feb-05	0.1	discussion with SIO re Feb 10 meeting issues
4-Feb-05	0.7	review cash flow and discuss with MF
4-Feb-05	0.6	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; review ATA report on Jan 2005 traffic
4-Feb-05	2.0	series of t/calls and discussions with SIO and MJC re options for ATA incl. cash requirements, fleet and business plan; discussion with Committee member re same; t/call with Beckerman re meetings with ATA in Chicago
5-Feb-05	0.2	review emails re meetings in Chicago with ATA and other matters
6-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with Allison re business plan and Chicago Express sale process
6-Feb-05	0.3	review first amendment to DIP loan agreement
7-Feb-05	0.3	discuss status of aircraft leases with BAK and review related emails
7-Feb-05	1.4	t/call with Allison re cash flow projection; discuss same with MF, SIO and MJC; t/call with other Huron personnel re financial projections
7-Feb-05	0.5	discussion with Denison re upcoming meeting and financial projection with SIO; review and respond to series of emails re upcoming meeting in Chicago
7-Feb-05	2.2	series of t/calls with Committee members re cash flow and meetings with ATA; review and respond to related emails
7-Feb-05	0.2	review and respond to emails from note holders
7-Feb-05	1.0	Committee conf call with SIO, BAK and MF; review results of cash flow and cash flow projection
8-Feb-05	0.8	t/call with Beckerman re business plan review and status of Chicago Express; t/call with Denison re business plan and meeting with ATA and Committee;
8-Feb-05	0.4	review and respond to emails related to meeting in Chicago
8-Feb-05	0.4	review Akin Gump email re pending motions incl. reclamation claims and memo on Goodrich
9-Feb-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
9-Feb-05	3.7	travel to Chicago for meetings with Chicago Express and ATA with BAK, SIO & MF

Date	TIME Hours	Description
9-Feb-05	4.0	dinner meeting with Committee members, MJC, BAK, SIO and MF; primary topics were management leadership, fleet planning and employee negotiations
10-Feb-05	4.0	all party meeting with ATA management in Chicago to review most recent business plan, including BAK, SIO & MF
10-Feb-05	4.0	travel from Chicago after meetings with Chicago Express and ATA
11-Feb-05	0.5	review cash flow summary projection provided by Debtors; discuss same with MF
11-Feb-05	0.5	series of t/calls with MJC and BAK, Beckerman and certain Committee members re cash flow issues
11-Feb-05	1.5	Committee conf call with MJC, SIO, BAK and MF; review cash flow summary, discuss pending issues re aircraft leases, etc.
12-Feb-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
12-Feb-05	1.0	t/call with Denison re financial projections, reorganization process and cash flow issues; discuss same with MF
13-Feb-05	1.2	t/calls with MF and BAK re cash flow projection; t/call with Beckerman re discussions with ALPA and Denison; t/call with Allison re cash flow; review email from MJC re marketing candidate for ATA
13-Feb-05	1.0	discuss strategic alternatives with BAK, SIO and MJC
14-Feb-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
14-Feb-05	2.5	discuss cash flow with MF and review draft of Compass report; series of discussions with MJC, SIO and BAK re due diligence; discuss same with Denison; review emails re ExecuJet and discuss with BAK
14-Feb-05	1.0	attendance via conf call of Bankruptcy Court hearing re extension of exclusivity
14-Feb-05	0.8	t/calls with Beckerman re Compass retention order and US Trustee requirements on time records; draft and send letter to US Trustee re same
14-Feb-05	0.5	review Akin Gump memos on ATSB collateral
15-Feb-05	0.3	review email re recent news stories
15-Feb-05	2.0	series of discussions with Calavritinos, BAK, MJC, MF and ATA senior mgmt re strategic options for ATA and fleet configuration at dinner meeting
15-Feb-05	2.0	travel to Indianapolis from Chicago for meetings at ATA
15-Feb-05	1.5	meeting with BAK, MJC and ATA mgmt to review cash flow and fleet plan, including discussion with MF
16-Feb-05	4.5	series of meetings at ATA to review cash flow and discuss fleet configuration; incl. discussions with MJC, BAK, MF and Calavritinos
16-Feb-05	4.0	travel to New York from Indianapolis after meetings at ATA
16-Feb-05	1.0	CEO Search Committee conf. call with MJC, MF and BAK
17-Feb-05	1.5	series of discussions and/emails with BAK regarding auction of EETC aircraft; discuss results of auction with Calavritinos and MJC; discuss ExecuJet with BAK
17-Feb-05	0.3	review industry air traffic analysis prepared by AD
17-Feb-05	2.0	review recent cash flow historic and projected information and latest daily reporting packages from Huron; review draft of MF cash flow memo and discuss same with MF
17-Feb-05	0.3	review Dec. 2004 monthly operating report; review email from Committee member re business plan
17-Feb-05	0.2	review Akin Gump email re pending motions
17-Feb-05	1.6	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, MF & SIO; discuss fleet issues, most recent cash flow and scheduled meetings with ATA and Committee
18-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with Committee member re ATA's restructuring of fleet
18-Feb-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
18-Feb-05	3.0	update time records for Jan and Feb 2005



Date	TIME Hours	Description
18-Feb-05	0.1	review email from Akin Gump re Committee conf call and extension of exclusivity
22-Feb-05	0.1	discussion with SIO re appointment of Denison as CEO
22-Feb-05	0.3	review Committee objection to cash collateral motion of Fleet
22-Feb-05	3.0	series of t/calls re cash forecast and recent results with Viets, Denison, Committee members, etc.; t/calls with MJC re same; discuss cash and exec. recruiting with SIO and Committee member; follow-up discussions re same with BAK and SIO
23-Feb-05	0.2	discuss ExecuJet with BAK
23-Feb-05	0.6	t/calls with MJC re business prospects and CEO search; discuss fleet configuration incl. review of certain proposals received re same
23-Feb-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; review emails re discussions with labor, including discussions with MF
24-Feb-05	0.5	conference call with T. Allison, Huron Associates, MJC, MF and BAK primarily relating to fleet planning issues
24-Feb-05	0.3	discuss ExecuJet with BAK and review related emails
24-Feb-05	2.2	t/call with Beckerman re status of case, meeting with ATA and Compass work program; t/call with Huron re continuing due diligence; review cash flow with MF
25-Feb-05	0.8	review emails related to BAK and Huron discussions of business plan and fleet
25-Feb-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; discuss same with MF
25-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with note holder re status of CRO
25-Feb-05	1.0	meeting with institutional investor re Chicago Express and ATA
25-Feb-05	1.8	Committee conf call with MF, MJC & BAK; discuss cash flow, fleet plan, Chicago hangar sale, etc.
25-Feb-05	0.3	conference call with Arthur C. , Creditors Committee Chair, MJC and BAK re industry operating conditions
26-Feb-05	0.7	t/calls with Denison and Beckerman regarding March 1st meetings in Chicago
26-Feb-05	0.3	email to MF, BAK and PS re reclamation claims and review memo from Akin Gump re same
27-Feb-05	0.3	t/call with Allison re cash flow projection, fleet and March 1st meeting in Chicago
28-Feb-05	1.3	review ATA business plan presentation
28-Feb-05	0.5	series of t/calls with Akin Gump and discussions with MJC, BAK, SIO & MF re ATA presentation on business plan
28-Feb-05	0.7	portion of dinner meeting with Committee members and MJC re discussion of ATA
28-Feb-05	5.0	travel from NY to Chicago for meetings with ATA
1-Mar-05	4.2	meetings with SIO, MF, MJC and ATA management for presentation and discussion of business plan for 2005
1-Mar-05	3.0	Committee meeting with ATA management, MJC, SIO and MF for presentation and discussion of business plan for 2005
1-Mar-05	5.0	travel to New York from Chicago after meetings with ATA
2-Mar-05	1.1	discussion with Lazard re ATA's business plan; t/call with Beckerman, MJC and BAK re same
2-Mar-05	2.0	review Jan 2005 Monthly Operating Report; review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; discuss same with MF; review details of ATA business plan
2-Mar-05	0.3	review 2nd amendment to DIP agreement
3-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with MJC and SIO regarding strategic and financial options for ATA
3-Mar-05	0.5	discuss business plan and due diligence with BAK, MF and MJC and review related emails from Beckerman
4-Mar-05	1.5	series of discussions and t/calls with MJC, SIO, BAK and MF re options for ATA and fleet; review status report of 767's

Date	TIME Hours	Description
4-Mar-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
6-Mar-05	0.2	t/call with BAK re review of ATA business plan
6-Mar-05	4.5	travel from NY to Indianapolis with MF for meetings at ATA and attendance at Bankruptcy Court
7-Mar-05	3.2	dinner meeting with AFA, MF, BAK and MJC and review issues relating to ATA
8-Mar-05	6.5	series of meetings at ATA to review business plan and fleet
8-Mar-05	5.0	travel to NY from Indianapolis with MF and BAK for meetings at ATA and attendance at Bankruptcy Court; including discussions with BAK re business plan
8-Mar-05	0.4	t/call with MJC re strategic options for ATA
9-Mar-05	0.5	review cash flow report and discuss with MF
9-Mar-05	0.7	t/calls with MJC re strategic options for ATA
9-Mar-05	1.5	series of discussions with BAK, SIO, MJC and MF to continue review of business plan and prepare for Committee conf call
9-Mar-05	0.5	discuss fleet plan with SIO and review email from industry consultant; review related email forwarded by MJC
9-Mar-05	1.4	Committee conf call with BAK, MF, SIO, MJC and DI to discuss business plan and pending motions
9-Mar-05	0.8	t/call with Beckerman re status of lease rejections, claims and business plan; discuss work program with BAK
9-Mar-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
9-Mar-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email re pending motions
10-Mar-05	3.7	series of t/calls with Schulte, MJC, BAK, Denison and SIO regarding strategic options for ATA including discussion of fleet; t/call with Beckerman and MJC re same; review related emails re same
10-Mar-05	0.3	discuss business plan and work program with BAK
10-Mar-05	2.0	update and review time records
10-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with Frick re 401-K motion; review related emails and forward to Akin Gump
11-Mar-05	0.4	t/call with noteholders re status of case
11-Mar-05	2.5	series of t/calls and discussions with SIO, BAK and MJC regarding strategic options for ATA; including t/calls with Denison; t/call message to Beckerman re same
11-Mar-05	0.5	t/call with Frick re payment for 401-K and review related emails; forward same to Beckerman
12-Mar-05	0.2	review 6th stipulation regarding cash collateral
13-Mar-05	0.1	t/call with Denison re strategic options
14-Mar-05	0.3	review series of emails to/from MJC and SIO re lease fleet
14-Mar-05	1.2	t/calls with MJC, Denison, Schulte and SIO re strategic options for ATA and code share; update Beckerman re same
14-Mar-05	0.2	review email from Akin Gump re Debtors' pending motions in court re employment and compensation matters
15-Mar-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
15-Mar-05	0.4	series of discussions and emails from/to Denison, MJC, Schulte and SIO re strategic options for ATA
15-Mar-05	0.4	series of discussions and emails regarding fleet with MJC and SIO
15-Mar-05	0.2	review Akin Gump email re pending motions
16-Mar-05	0.4	review various emails regarding maintenance contracts and term sheets
16-Mar-05	0.4	review weekly cash report with MF and review report to Committee
16-Mar-05	0.4	review and discuss BAK memo on ExecuJet with BAK
17-Mar-05	0.2	review information and emails regarding fleet

Date	TIME Hours	Description
17-Mar-05	0.4	conf call with SIO and Dennison to review personnel moves and status of fleet changes
17-Mar-05	0.2	discussion with BAK regarding ExecuJet negotiations
18-Mar-05	2.5	prepare for and meeting with prospective financing source with MJC and Schulte; update Denison and Beckerman re same
18-Mar-05	1.7	series of t/calls with Denison and MJC re strategic direction and fleet; update Beckerman and BAK re same; discuss same with SIO; review related emails re fleet; review SIO memo re sources of capital
18-Mar-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
21-Mar-05	0.3	email to/from Denison regarding management at ATA; emails to/from Committee co-chairs re same
22-Mar-05	0.7	t/call with Committee members re conf call with Denison; t/call with Denison re corporate strategy and options
23-Mar-05	1.2	t/call with Beckerman re exec. management at ATA; conf call with Committee co-chairs and Denison re corporate strategy and options
23-Mar-05	0.2	review Akin Gump summary of Chicago Express rejection of contracts
23-Mar-05	1.2	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; discuss with MF and BAK and discuss cash requirements re cash collateral with MF; review Compass report re cash flow
24-Mar-05	0.4	t/call with MJC and SIO re Committee call; prepare conf call with BAK and MF
24-Mar-05	2.0	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, BAK, MF and DI; discuss cash flow, Chicago Express, fleet plan, legal report, exec. search, etc.
24-Mar-05	0.4	t/call with Carr regarding executive management at ATA; review and respond to various emails with ATA and Committee members regarding fleet
25-Mar-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports including code share results
25-Mar-05	0.3	discuss latest term sheet from Q aviation re aircraft with BAK and MJC
26-Mar-05	0.2	email to/from Frick re due diligence query; review email from Akin Gump re Chicago hangar
28-Mar-05	0.7	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC and SIO to review bids for Chicago Express
28-Mar-05	0.5	discuss fleet with SIO; t/call with MJC re same; review related emails
29-Mar-05	1.0	t/call with MJC re financial projection and fleet; discuss same with Schulte; discuss fleet with SIO; t/call with Denison re fleet and requirements for business plan
29-Mar-05	0.4	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
30-Mar-05	0.3	t/call with Committee members re status of case
30-Mar-05	2.0	t/call with Denison, Frick, SIO & MJC re fleet configuration; review SIO email re status of calls on fleet; review Denison email re exec compensation
31-Mar-05	0.6	discussion with AD regarding North American Airlines
31-Mar-05	0.4	discuss fleet issue with MJC including review of related emails
1-Apr-05	3.0	meetings at ATA with senior mgmt with BAK and DI to review business plan and capital needs of ATA
1-Apr-05	4.0	travel to New York from Indianapolis after meetings at ATA
3-Apr-05	1.7	review ATA Form 10-K for 2004 and Feb 2005 operating report
3-Apr-05	0.1	review emails regarding lease of 767
3-Apr-05	0.5	review competitive information on military business prepared by AD
4-Apr-05	0.6	series of t/calls with Committee co-chair re CEO; discuss court hearing with BAK
4-Apr-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports
4-Apr-05	0.6	review various emails regarding lease fleet; discuss same with SIO
4-Apr-05	0.3	review emails re Southwest DIP

Date	TIME Hours	Description
5-Apr-05	0.3	discuss requirement for financial model with DI
5-Apr-05	0.2	discuss ASIG stipulations with BAK
5-Apr-05	0.2	discuss changes to Southwest DIP agreement with BAK
6-Apr-05	0.2	review various emails regarding status of fleet and discuss with SIO
6-Apr-05	0.5	t/call with BAK re review of current financial results and report to Committee; discuss analysis of financial information with DI
6-Apr-05	1.4	conf call with Denison and ATA senior management, Baker & Daniels, BAK and SIO re cash requirements and corp financing issues
6-Apr-05	0.5	discussion with prospective investors regarding ATA capital requirements
6-Apr-05	1.0	t/calls and discussion with SIO, BAK and Beckerman re key issues regarding financing; discuss same with Committee co-chair
7-Apr-05	0.2	review and respond to emails from Committee members re status of case
7-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re fleet and discuss with MJC
7-Apr-05	1.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB prepared by Huron; review bookings and utilization reports; review and BAK reports on cash; discuss financial analysis with BAK and DI
7-Apr-05	2.0	conf call with Denison and ATA senior management, Baker & Daniels, BAK, MJC and Beckerman re cash requirements and corp financing issues; follow-up calls with MJC, BAK and Beckerman re same
7-Apr-05	0.4	series of emails to/from Beckerman re need for Committee call, report on discussions with Denison, need for additional cash and sources of same
7-Apr-05	0.6	series of discussions with BAK, SIO and MJC regarding ATA capital requirements
7-Apr-05	1.0	t/calls with Denison re business plan and capital requirements
7-Apr-05	0.3	discussion with AD re cash analysis project
7-Apr-05	2.0	t/calls with various noteholders, Lazard and Committee co-chair regarding business plan and capital requirements
8-Apr-05	1.8	conf call with Denison, MJC, BAK, Huron and ATA Mgmt re cash situation
8-Apr-05	0.3	t/call messages and email to Bell of Spencer Stuart re executive compensation
8-Apr-05	0.1	review email from Lazard re participation in due diligence
8-Apr-05	1.0	review various operating reports on operations prepared by ATA and discuss with BAK
8-Apr-05	0.3	discuss fleet issues and availability with SIO and MJC
8-Apr-05	1.8	conf call with Denison, MJC, SIO, BAK, Huron and ATA Mgmt re POR timetable and follow-up discussion
10-Apr-05	0.3	review emails from Denison and SIO re cost savings and from Committee member re airline profitability
11-Apr-05	0.8	t/call with Beckerman re business, exec. compensation and fleet; discuss same with MJC and review related emails re fleet; review email from Denison re capital requirements
11-Apr-05	0.5	t/call with Committee member re status of case
11-Apr-05	0.5	t/call with Bell of Spencer Stuart re exec. compensation; review draft of term sheet re same
11-Apr-05	0.3	review and respond to series of emails regarding conf call with Debtors and Committee professionals
12-Apr-05	0.4	review daily reporting package for the ATSB prepared by Huron
12-Apr-05	0.3	review Greenebaum memo regarding Goodrich claim
12-Apr-05	2.6	series of t/calls with Schulte, Allison, Committee co-chair, Denison, SIO, MJC and BAK re business plan and capital requirements of ATA
12-Apr-05	0.6	discuss comp airline leverage ratios with AD and review prelim analysis prepared by AD

Date	TIME Hours	Description
12-Apr-05	1.3	Committee and Debtor leadership call with BAK, SIO, MJC and Beckerman re fleet and financing options; series of discussions with BAK re same and review emails re same
13-Apr-05	0.3	t/call with Bell re exec compensation
13-Apr-05	0.8	t/call with Denison re business plan and need for additional senior executives; discussion with prospective CFO candidate and review related emails
13-Apr-05	0.4	discuss work program with BAK and SIO including review of related emails
13-Apr-05	1.2	meeting with Allison and BAK re strategic options
13-Apr-05	0.4	discuss cash of comp airlines with AD
13-Apr-05	0.2	review and respond to various emails regarding Creditors Committee conf call and agenda and meeting with ATA and Committee at ATA
14-Apr-05	0.2	t/call with Grende of Huron re Ambassadair
14-Apr-05	0.6	review airline CEO compensation comps and draft of Denison employment term sheets provided by Bell of Spencer Stuart; review MJC comments re same and other related emails
14-Apr-05	0.2	discuss code share data with BAK and review related email
14-Apr-05	0.5	t/call with Committee co-chair re meetings with ATA and review of business plan; emails to Committee co-chair and Beckerman re same; discuss same with BAK and SIO
14-Apr-05	0.2	series of emails to/from Committee co-chairs re meeting with ATA mgmt on April 18
14-Apr-05	0.1	review and respond to Beckerman email re upcoming Committee conf call
15-Apr-05	0.2	t/call with Viets re Ambassadair
15-Apr-05	1.3	discuss status of ATA's cash and fleet with BAK, MJC and SIO, further discussion regarding review of upcoming business plan and establishing plan to review same; review cash report from BAK and DI
15-Apr-05	0.3	t/call with Terry Hall re 737's with Rick Barnett
15-Apr-05	0.8	review daily and weekly reporting package for the ATSB and discuss with BAK and DI; review related emails with Beckerman
15-Apr-05	0.6	series of t/calls with Denison and Allison re business plan and fleet
15-Apr-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email summarizing pending matters
15-Apr-05	0.6	review Southwest 2004 10-K re ATA
15-Apr-05	0.3	review and respond to series of emails re Committee conf call and meeting with Debtors
18-Apr-05	4.0	travel to Indianapolis from New York with BAK and SIO for Chicago Express auction and meetings at ATA
18-Apr-05	7.0	meetings with ATA management, ATSB, Committee professionals, BAK, MJC, SIO and Southwest for presentation and discussion of business plan for 2005 incl. prelim discussion re same with Allison & BAK
19-Apr-05	4.5	meetings at ATA with senior mgmt with BAK, MJC and SIO to review business plan and capital needs of ATA
19-Apr-05	4.0	travel to New York from Indianapolis with BAK and SIO after meetings at ATA
19-Apr-05	1.6	Committee conf call with BAK and SIO to review results of business plan
20-Apr-05	1.6	review daily and weekly reporting package for the ATSB; discussion with BAK re review of new business plan and review of same; review related emails from BAK re same
20-Apr-05	1.0	t/call with MJC re business plan presentation; discuss changes to lease fleet with SIO and MJC; discuss cash savings potential ideas with SIO and review memo re same
20-Apr-05	0.3	discuss latest cash report with BAK
20-Apr-05	0.4	review various emails re Fuel Service Agreement and discuss with BAK
20-Apr-05	0.1	emails from/to noteholder re status of business plan

Date	TIME Hours	Description
20-Apr-05	0.5	review details re US Air/America West transaction and email to/from Botter re same
20-Apr-05	1.8	review SIO memo re cash conservation measures for ATA
20-Apr-05	0.5	discuss fleet issues and availability with SIO and MJC
20-Apr-05	1.8	meeting at Compass with Schulte to review strategic options, business plan and cash needs with BAK and SIO and MJC by phone
21-Apr-05	1.2	series of t/calls to discuss business plan with Beckerman and other Committee members; t/calls with Allison and Frick re CFO
21-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re status of lease fleet
22-Apr-05	0.2	review and respond to email from Committee member re cost of the fuel
22-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re ATA's interest in hiring investment bankers for capital raise
22-Apr-05	0.4	discussion with SIO re list of capital opportunities
24-Apr-05	0.6	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review BAK Compass report on weekly cash position and forecast
24-Apr-05	0.3	t/call with Denison re cash needs and business plan expenses
25-Apr-05	1.7	conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO and ATA to review cash conservation measures and business plan expenses
25-Apr-05	0.1	discuss Southwest meeting with SIO
25-Apr-05	0.4	review various memos and emails re Indianapolis Airport Authority & Signature Flight
25-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re ATA's interest in hiring investment bankers for capital raise
26-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails re status of lease fleet
26-Apr-05	2.0	series of t/calls with Denison re status of management changes and fleet incl. t/call with SIO; t/call with Frick re CFO; discuss fleet with SIO; review BAK report on 1st quarter P&L incl. discussion with BAK
26-Apr-05	0.5	review Akin Gump emails summarizing pending matters
26-Apr-05	0.3	review various emails from Akin Gump re Goodrich objection and DOL settlement
26-Apr-05	0.5	series of t/calls with creditors and Committee members re financing options for ATA
26-Apr-05	0.7	conf call with Committee co-chair, SIO, MJC and BAK re next steps for business plan review and capital requirements
26-Apr-05	0.2	review Akin Gump summary of pending fee app for E&Y
26-Apr-05	1.8	Committee conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO; report on business plan, latest financial results and fleet
27-Apr-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK
27-Apr-05	1.3	series of t/calls with Committee members and creditors re financing needs of ATA; discuss same with SIO
27-Apr-05	0.5	review various news stories re merger World Airways and North American Airlines re effect on ATA military business; send emails re same to Compass and Schulte
27-Apr-05	0.4	discuss Skyworks engagement letter with SIO and review related engagement letter
28-Apr-05	0.4	t/call with CFO candidate and review related emails from same
28-Apr-05	0.2	t/call with Committee co-chair re military business
28-Apr-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re Ambasadair incl. review of investment banking firms; review related email from Beckerman
29-Apr-05	0.2	review email from Akin Gump re proposed lease motion pending in Bankruptcy Court
29-Apr-05	0.7	t/call with Beckerman re Skyworks, SH&E, Ambasadair and discussion corporate finance

Date	TIME Hours	Description
29-Apr-05	0.4	t/calls with Committee member re business operations
29-Apr-05	0.3	emails from/to Committee member re mergers World Airways merger and capital raise for ATA
29-Apr-05	0.7	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, MJC; report on fleet status and recent proposed settlements of certain claims
30-Apr-05	0.4	review various emails re status of leases and fleet
1-May-05	0.5	review ATA March operating report
1-May-05	0.6	review cash report to Committee from Compass; review latest ATSB daily reporting package
2-May-05	0.7	t/call with BAK re cash position and review related emails; review various emails re fleet; review MJC email re pilot productivity
2-May-05	0.4	review series of emails re AmbasadAir and discuss same with BAK
3-May-05	0.4	t/call with Denison re cash requirements and proposed compensation arrangements
3-May-05	0.6	t/call with BAK re cash position; t/calls with Denison and Schulte re same
3-May-05	0.4	review latest term sheet re CEO compensation from M. Bell; forward same to Beckerman and prelim. discussion with Denison
3-May-05	0.5	review series of emails re AmbasadAir and discuss same with BAK
4-May-05	0.7	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK
4-May-05	1.0	t/call with Beckerman re CEO comp proposal, status of union discussions with ATA; discuss CEO comp proposal with Committee co-chair; review Akin Gump comments re CEO comp term sheet
4-May-05	0.4	review various emails re status of leases and fleet
4-May-05	0.2	review email re ATA and Indianapolis Airport property
4-May-05	1.5	conf call with BAK, DI, MJC, SIO and Denison, Frick and Shultz of Huron to review cash flow projections and discuss business plan; review BAK memo re same to Beckerman
4-May-05	0.3	discuss work program with BAK including pending reports to the Committee
4-May-05	1.5	t/calls with Committee members re status of Mikelsons, mgmt compensation, etc.
4-May-05	1.0	review draft of AmbasadAir overview/marketing book; review various emails re AmbasadAir and discuss same with BAK; review Akin Gump summary re motion with AmbasadAir and TransMeridian
5-May-05	0.4	review Compass weekly cash report; review various emails regarding fuel and other costs
5-May-05	1.5	series of t/calls with Committee co-chair, Schulte and Viets re CEO compensation issues; review latest term sheet re CEO compensation and related emails re same
5-May-05	0.7	discuss corporate finance alternatives with SIO including potential for rights offering; review draft memo re same
6-May-05	0.3	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB
6-May-05	0.2	discuss fleet status with SIO and review related emails
6-May-05	0.1	review ALPA response to proposed TransMeridian transaction with AmbasadAir
6-May-05	0.4	review Akin Gump emails summarizing pending matters re Continental and letters of credit facility
6-May-05	0.5	t/calls with Beckerman and Wright of SouthWest re strategic issues and meeting to explore financing alternatives; update SIO re same
6-May-05	1.0	series of t/calls and discussions with Viets, BAK and DI re interviews for AmbasadAir; discuss same with SIO; review various submissions by investment bankers
6-May-05	1.5	review emails re AmbasadAir and banker submissions; discuss same with BAK and review results of interviews with BAK
6-May-05	0.4	t/call with Wright of SouthWest regarding ATA business plan and capital needs
9-May-05	0.2	review proposed term sheet re aircraft lease

Date	TIME Hours	Description
9-May-05	1.0	discuss work program with BAK; review pending issues with BAK and Beckerman re 767, labor, personnel, etc.; t/call with SIO to Lazard re 767 and discuss fleet; report on same to Beckerman with SIO
9-May-05	0.3	discuss business plan due diligence issues with BAK and review related emails
9-May-05	0.1	review BAK memo re GECC business rejections
9-May-05	0.3	review emails re AmbasadAir and investment banker submissions; discuss same with BAK
9-May-05	0.5	email to Committee leadership re pending meeting with SouthWest in NY and review responses to same; discuss same with Beckerman
10-May-05	0.6	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK
10-May-05	0.4	review current load factor forecasts for May and June; review SIO email re 757 aircraft
10-May-05	0.6	review related emails re new SVP Karnik and discuss with MJC and SIO; email to Bell Akin Gump comments on Denison MOU
10-May-05	1.0	discussion with BAK and MJC re new CFO, new SVP, business plan, cash burn and new financing requirements
10-May-05	0.7	t/call with Denison re CFO and fleet changes with BAK and SIO; review and respond to various emails re same
10-May-05	0.6	t/call with Beckerman re Committee meeting and recent developments with BAK and SIO; review various emails re upcoming Committee meeting
11-May-05	0.7	discuss ATA's business and cash requirements with SIO; discuss cash utilization with BAK; review MJC email re pilot productivity
11-May-05	0.6	review email from Bell of Spencer Stuart re Denison MOU; review various emails re new CFO for ATA and candidate bios; discuss same with SIO
11-May-05	0.6	review Akin Gump email summarizing pending matters re Skyworks, exclusivity, etc.; review summary of lease terms for aircraft
11-May-05	0.4	series of emails to/from Akin Gump re fee app; discuss same with ETW
11-May-05	0.6	t/call with Beckerman with SIO re agenda for Committee call and issues to review
11-May-05	0.3	prepare for Committee conf call with BAK and discuss agenda items
11-May-05	1.2	Committee conf call with BAK, SIO, MJC and DI to discuss new CFO and SVP, exclusivity, sale of AmbasadAir, etc.
12-May-05	1.0	review various operating reports forwarded by BAK
12-May-05	0.7	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass email re weekly cash forecast and discuss with DI
12-May-05	0.7	discussion with proposed CFO at ATA and review related email; review resume re proposed CFO forwarded by SIO
12-May-05	0.5	t/call with Beckerman, Denison, Frick & Carr re CFO; discuss same with SIO
12-May-05	0.3	update by BAK re activities and meetings at ATA
12-May-05	0.5	review emails re UAL aircraft and potential lease opportunities for ATA and ATSB position re same; discuss same with SIO
12-May-05	0.5	review email from SouthWest re meeting; series of t/calls to Beckerman, MJC and SIO re same
12-May-05	0.1	review Beckerman email re SouthWest extension of DIP financing
12-May-05	0.6	t/call with Beckerman re exclusivity and professional retentions at ATA
13-May-05	0.2	review emails from/to Committee member re Mickelson and family members' compensation
13-May-05	2.3	series of calls with Beckerman and F.Conway, CFO candidate, and Carr re status of CFO candidates; review related emails re same incl. set up call with F.Conway
13-May-05	0.3	t/calls with SIO re maintenance program and CFO
13-May-05	0.3	review email from Bell of Spencer Stuart re CEO comp; email to Wright of SouthWest re same
16-May-05	0.7	review ATA 10-Q for 1st quarter 2005
16-May-05	0.6	review reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK



Date	TIME Hours	Description
16-May-05	0.2	t/call with Schulte re SouthWest
16-May-05	0.2	review Akin Gump email re GATX
16-May-05	0.7	discussion with SIO re fleet and capital raising/cost saving opportunities; review lists and emails re same; t/calls with Beckerman re CFO
16-May-05	0.8	series of t/calls with CFO candidates re duties and compensation; review CV of prospective candidate
16-May-05	0.8	conf call with SIO and Denison re fleet, CFO and exclusivity; t/call with MJC re same
16-May-05	0.2	emails with Committee member re changes to flight schedule
16-May-05	0.6	review list for Debtors to review re changes at ATA and discuss same with SIO
16-May-05	1.5	conf call with Beckerman, SIO, DI, Carr and Denison and Frick re CFO and exclusivity and exec. mgmt
16-May-05	0.4	t/call with noteholder re ATA
16-May-05	0.2	discuss BETACO and ExecuJet with BAK and related emails
16-May-05	0.2	series of emails re AmbasadAir
17-May-05	0.2	review various emails re lease fleet
17-May-05	2.3	series of t/calls and discussions with Committee co-chair, SIO and MJC re CFO milestones; discuss same with Schulte and discuss form of support and new cash required
17-May-05	1.5	series of t/calls with CFO candidate, Beckerman, Denison and Frick re CFO candidate; review related emails; t/calls and message to Committee co-chair re same
17-May-05	0.4	review latest cash forecast and position with DI
17-May-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman re conditions to extend exclusivity and review related emails
17-May-05	0.2	review various emails re AmbasadAir
17-May-05	0.2	t/call with MJC to prepare for Committee conference call
17-May-05	1.5	Committee conf call with SIO, MJC, DI to review CFO candidate and discuss exclusivity extension
18-May-05	0.5	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK
18-May-05	0.2	series of emails re CFO candidate with Beckerman
18-May-05	0.4	series of discussions with MJC and SIO re SouthWest and labor issues
18-May-05	0.3	t/call with BAK re business plan and ATA events
18-May-05	1.8	t/calls with Bell re exec compensation; t/calls with Beckerman to update on calls with SouthWest and Bell and to discuss pending labor motions; review related emails
18-May-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re discussions with SouthWest
18-May-05	2.0	conf call with SouthWest, SIO and MJC re ATA business plan and capital requirements of ATA, including follow up discussion with MJC and SIO
19-May-05	6.0	review various emails re Debtor's 1113 motions and pilot productivity and work on 1113 related items including multiple discussions with MJC, SIO, BAK, DI, Akin Gump and ATA; review Akin Gump emails re same and notice of Committee meeting
19-May-05	0.6	review cash report incl. discussion with DI
19-May-05	0.4	meeting with Donohue re sale of AmbasadAir
19-May-05	0.4	discuss financing options with Committee member and MJC
20-May-05	1.0	work with DI re 1113 analysis for Committee incl. t/call with Beckerman
20-May-05	0.2	follow-up t/call with Akin Gump re 1113 motion
20-May-05	0.5	t/call with Committee co-chair re fleet status with SIO; discuss financing options for fleet with SIO
20-May-05	0.7	t/call with F.Conway re meeting on business plan; series of emails with ATA mgmt re meeting on labor costs and review of operations; series of emails re court hearings re 1113 motion

Date	TIME Hours	Description
20-May-05	0.2	review Committee letter to ALPA and ATA re 1113; discuss same with Beckerman
20-May-05	0.7	discuss rights offering and financing concepts with SIO; review draft re same from SIO
20-May-05	1.4	Creditor Committee conf call with MJC, SIO, DI regarding 1113 motion and report on SouthWest discussions
22-May-05	0.1	email to MJC re meetings at ATA
22-May-05	0.1	review report from Akin Gump re Huron fees
23-May-05	0.6	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review press article from Committee member re fare increases
23-May-05	0.2	t/call with F.Conway re meetings at ATA
23-May-05	0.7	prepare for meeting in ATA with management including discussions with SIO, BAK and F. Conway; review and respond to related emails.
23-May-05	0.8	t/call with Botter and MJC re labor negotiations and attendance at court hearing; discuss same with BAK; review related emails
23-May-05	1.4	conf call with MJC, SIO, Debtor re leases in Indianapolis for office and hangar, Chicago Express and labor discussions; review related emails; review email from SIO re same
23-May-05	0.7	series of t/calls with Beckerman re meeting with ATA, SouthWest and ATSB; review letter re exclusivity from Carr to Beckerman; review emails with MJC re due diligence meetings
23-May-05	1.5	work on rights offering and POR concepts term sheet incl. valuation analyses
23-May-05	0.7	t/call with Schulte and SIO re meeting with ATA, SouthWest and ATSB; update MJC re same; t/call with Committee co-chair re same
23-May-05	1.0	t/call with Denison and SIO re fleet and upcoming meeting with SouthWest and ATSB
23-May-05	0.4	series of t/calls with BAK concerning travel arrangements and scope of preparation for Court Hearing regarding ALPA 1113(e) motion
24-May-05	0.6	review various emails re 1113 motion
24-May-05	0.2	review series of emails re meetings in DC and due diligence meeting with ATA
24-May-05	3.0	travel with SIO to Washington from NY for meetings at Akin Gump with ATA, ATSB and SouthWest
24-May-05	2.5	work on rights offering and POR concepts term sheet incl. valuation analyses
24-May-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re mergers in airline industry and options for ATA
24-May-05	0.5	t/calls with SIO, MJC and BAK re rights offering and strategic alternatives
24-May-05	0.5	series of t/calls with BAK and D. Botter of Akin regarding ALPA 1113(e) hearing
25-May-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB and discuss with BAK
25-May-05	0.4	finalize memo to ATA re cost savings and initiatives and forward same
25-May-05	0.7	meeting in Washington with executive search Committee members to discuss exec compensation and prepare and reply to various emails re same
25-May-05	0.6	t/calls with BAK re results of court hearing on 1113 motions and meeting with ATSB, ATA and SouthWest; t/call with MJC re same and discussion with exec. search committee members
25-May-05	0.3	discussion with Committee co-chair re value of aircraft and lease rates and emails with BAK re same
25-May-05	3.0	meeting in Washington with SIO, Beckerman, ATA, ATSB and SouthWest re cash requirements of ATA; including travel to/from meeting
25-May-05	2.5	work on rights offering and POR concepts term sheet
26-May-05	0.4	review cash report prepared by Compass and discuss with DI; review daily reporting package for the ATSB
26-May-05	0.1	emails to ATA mgmt re call on business plan
26-May-05	0.2	series of emails with Bell re Denison comp and meeting schedule
26-May-05	0.5	review various emails re 1113 motion

Date	TIME Hours	Description
26-May-05	0.1	review email re IAA discussions
26-May-05	0.2	review and respond to Akin Gump email re Boeing
26-May-05	0.1	review email from Committee member re cash requirements
26-May-05	3.0	travel from Washington to NY after meetings at Akin Gump with ATA, ATSB and SouthWest
27-May-05	0.1	emails to/from ATA mgmt re call on business plan
27-May-05	0.2	discuss Boeing claim with BAK
27-May-05	0.4	t/call with Schulte re rights offering
27-May-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman and Strickland re rights offering
27-May-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email summarizing pending matters re Chicago Express
27-May-05	0.6	discuss valuation metrics with BAK and DI; discuss rights offering and cost savings with SIO and review SIO email re same
27-May-05	0.8	t/call with Committee members re status of case and need for new capital
27-May-05	1.0	Committee conference call with BAK, MJC, SIO, DI to review results of 1113 motion and meeting with ATSB, ATA and SouthWest
30-May-05	1.3	work on revision to rights offering
31-May-05	0.3	review Form 8-K filed with the SEC
31-May-05	0.2	series of emails re call with ATA mgmt re labor costs and all party conf call with ATA
31-May-05	0.7	t/call with F.Conway of ATA re business plan; discuss same with SIO
31-May-05	3.2	conf call with SIO, BAK, MJC and F. Conway, Frick and Karnik re business plan and Compass comments re needed changes; follow-up calls with BAK, SIO and MJC incl. call with Beckerman; review business plan
31-May-05	0.2	review various emails re Chicago Express and IAA deadline
31-May-05	1.5	t/call with Beckerman re rights offering; complete revisions to rights offering
1-Jun-05	0.5	review May 31, 2005 business plan and supporting schedules
1-Jun-05	0.4	review April 2005 monthly operating report and discuss with BAK
1-Jun-05	0.7	t/call with F. Conway re business plan; discuss same with SIO and BAK; 2nd discussion with SIO regarding flight schedule and profitability
1-Jun-05	0.3	discussion with Beckerman re business plan and capital requirements
1-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re business plan and capital requirements for ATA
1-Jun-05	0.5	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
1-Jun-05	0.2	series of emails with Bell and others re exec compensation committee
1-Jun-05	0.5	t/call with noteholders re status of case
1-Jun-05	2.2	revise term sheet for capital raise; review Barry's Jewelers SEC letter re rights offering; review comments from Akin Gump re same; send to Committee co-chairs and review related emails
1-Jun-05	1.0	conf call with ATA to interview investment bankers and review/respond to related emails
2-Jun-05	0.5	continue to review May 31 business plan
2-Jun-05	0.6	discuss route profitability with SIO; review ATA report on market profitability
2-Jun-05	0.4	review Compass weekly cash flow report and discuss same with BAK
2-Jun-05	0.3	emails to/from F. Conway re meeting and business plan and market profitability
2-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with Beckerman and BAK re CFO milestones and Compass work program
2-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with Committee member re maintenance issue and send draft rights offering term sheet
2-Jun-05	0.2	review email from Bell re exec compensation committee call; review Frick email re Memphis Group
2-Jun-05	0.5	review various emails re investment banker interviews including t/call with investment banker candidates; finalize and prepare email re rights offering
2-Jun-05	0.4	discussion with prospective financing source and send email with April Operating Report and latest 10Q, including discussion with DI re 10Q
3-Jun-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB

Date	TIME Hours	Description
3-Jun-05	1.2	t/calls with Denison and Frick re cash burn, business plan and CFO milestone; discuss same with SIO and MJC
3-Jun-05	0.2	review various emails re IAA
3-Jun-05	0.7	t/calls with SIO and Committee member re new business plan and maintenance issues; review latest summary of aircraft procurement and discuss with SIO
3-Jun-05	0.8	series of t/calls with Beckerman and Committee members re cash requirements, new business plan, CFO milestones and Committee composition; review related emails re Stanfield resignation
3-Jun-05	0.6	t/call with Schulte re rights offering; send email to Committee re same and discuss with BAK
3-Jun-05	1.7	conf call with BAK, SIO, Beckerman, ATA, ATSB and Southwest re status report from ATA on corporate finance, fleet and other key issues
4-Jun-05	0.3	email from/to Beckerman re milestones; review press release forwarded by F. Conway
5-Jun-05	0.6	t/call with F. Conway re milestones and emails re same to Beckerman, Frick and F. Conway
5-Jun-05	2.0	review time records for billing
6-Jun-05	0.3	discuss BETACO with BAK and SIO
6-Jun-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
6-Jun-05	1.2	t/calls with Bell re exec. compensation and participate in recruiting committee re same
6-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with MJC re exec compensation committee and concepts for new business plan
6-Jun-05	1.7	t/calls with Frick and/or F. Conway re F. Conway milestones; discuss same with Beckerman, SIO and MJC; review and revise text re same and email to Beckerman and Committee co-chairs
6-Jun-05	0.2	t/call message to Beckerman with BAK re milestones and investment banker proposed letter; discuss same with BAK
6-Jun-05	0.3	review Akin Gump summary of John Hancock Leasing and Committee Objection to Goodrich
6-Jun-05	0.5	review proposed engagement letter from investment banker and discuss with SIO and Beckerman
6-Jun-05	0.2	discussion with BAK and DI re EETC analysis
7-Jun-05	0.2	review revised term sheet for Denison from Spencer Stuart
7-Jun-05	0.2	review and respond to email from Noteholder
7-Jun-05	0.6	discuss work to evaluate Boeing claim with DI and review results; review email re IAA matter from Beckerman
7-Jun-05	2.3	work on Exhibit A milestones for CFO including multiple discussions re fees with Committee co-chairs, Beckerman, SIO and MJC; review related emails; t/call with F. Conway re same; review latest version of proposed investment banker retention agreement
8-Jun-05	0.6	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss cash flow with DI and review related report
8-Jun-05	0.4	review memo from Denison re strategic initiatives and discussion points for June 9 2005 meeting
8-Jun-05	2.4	series of discussions, t/calls, emails with F. Conway, Beckerman, Committee co-chairs and SIO re milestones for F. Conway; redraft and circulate Exhibit A; review email re lease fleet
8-Jun-05	0.8	series of discussions with BAK regarding valuation and discount rates for aircraft and lease rejection claims and review related emails from BAK and DI
8-Jun-05	0.2	review amendments to SouthWest DIP and Investment agreements
8-Jun-05	0.3	discuss retention of Banker by Debtor including proposed fees with BAK, SIO and Beckerman; review SIO memo re same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
8-Jun-05	0.7	meeting with Arthur Calavritinos; t/calls with Frank Conway and BAK; with IISA; discuss state of industry and impact on ATA
8-Jun-05	0.2	review Beckerman email to Committee re status of Chicago Express, CFO, Indy Airport Authority, etc.
9-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with Viets re executive compensation
9-Jun-05	2.0	meeting at ATA with SIO and MJC for presentation from Meyer et al re labor costs
9-Jun-05	4.5	travel to Indianapolis from New York for meetings at ATA
9-Jun-05	5.0	series of meetings (incl. dinner meeting) with ATA management and SIO and MJC to review details of business plan for 2005 and financing requirements
10-Jun-05	1.0	participate in exec. recruiting committee call with MJC and M. Bell, etc
10-Jun-05	4.5	travel to New York from Indianapolis after meetings at ATA
10-Jun-05	0.6	series of t/calls with Beckerman and Committee co-chair re investment banker compensation and results of meeting with ATA sr. management; review and respond to related emails
10-Jun-05	0.6	t/call with Viets re executive compensation and committee composition; review latest draft of proposed term sheet
10-Jun-05	0.7	conference call with MJC, Spencer Stuart re J. Denison compensation proposal
12-Jun-05	0.4	review Jefferies retention documents and discuss with SIO; review email re same from F. Conway
12-Jun-05	0.1	review email from Committee co-chair re retention of CFO at ATA
13-Jun-05	0.8	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss cash covenants for 10th stip with BAK and DI
13-Jun-05	0.6	review results of latest term sheet re CEO; discuss fleet with SIO and review related emails
13-Jun-05	0.2	review email re IAA and potential resolutions
13-Jun-05	0.3	discuss BETACO with BAK and review related emails
13-Jun-05	1.5	review Jefferies retention and discuss with Beckerman and SIO; provide names for Exhibit A re same; t/calls with Jefferies, F. Conway, Committee co-chair, Beckerman and SIO re same
14-Jun-05	0.3	review weekly ATSB cash flow projections with DI and BAK
14-Jun-05	1.5	series of discussions with Beckerman and committee co-chairs re Jefferies retention; discuss same with Jefferies, including discussion with SIO re fee structure
14-Jun-05	2.0	work on sr. mgmt option incentive program with WES and EJK
14-Jun-05	0.2	discuss fee application with ETW
14-Jun-05	0.2	discuss pricing of Denison options with SIO and BAK
15-Jun-05	1.0	exec. recruiting committee call with MJC and M. Bell, etc
15-Jun-05	0.7	t/calls with MJC re exec compensation; review draft of April 2005 report with DI re operating report analysis, including discussion with DI; discuss status with SIO
15-Jun-05	0.6	discussion with Committee member re status of case; t/call messages to F. Conway re same; series of emails with Committee member re same
15-Jun-05	0.7	review emails re AMR claim and discuss with BAK; review AMR court filing re same
15-Jun-05	1.0	series of discussions with Beckerman and Committee co-chair re Jefferies retention; discuss same with Jefferies; revise related emails from Beckerman
15-Jun-05	1.0	work on sr. mgmt option incentive program and draft memo to exec. recruiting committee
16-Jun-05	0.3	discuss issues regarding solvency with BAK
16-Jun-05	0.5	review daily reporting packages for the ATSB; discuss cash flow with DI and review related report
16-Jun-05	0.2	emails with Committee members re discussion of business plan

Date	TIME Hours	Description
16-Jun-05	1.6	series of discussions with Beckerman, etc. and F. Conway re business plan; review email to Beckerman from Carr re ATA executives
16-Jun-05	0.4	conference call with MJC, Spencer Stuart re J. Denison compensation proposal
16-Jun-05	0.3	review changes to Denison proposed term sheet from Bell of Spencer Stuart
16-Jun-05	0.3	review Akin Gump email re pending motions and claims
17-Jun-05	0.2	discuss historical financial results for ATA with DI
17-Jun-05	0.4	review data of labor costs for ATA
17-Jun-05	0.5	exec. recruiting committee call with MJC and M. Bell, etc
17-Jun-05	1.0	series of discussions with noteholders re status of case
17-Jun-05	0.5	series of discussions with noteholders re status of case
17-Jun-05	0.7	conf call with Wells Fargo and its counsel to review current status of ATA's funding initiatives and business plan
17-Jun-05	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re Committee conf call
20-Jun-05	0.2	t/call with DI re historical financial results for ATA; review and respond to emails re changing time for CEO comp. conf call
20-Jun-05	1.1	conf call with ATA sr. mgmt with SIO, MJC, BAK and DI to get update on fleet, cost savings and upcoming June 30, 2005 business plan; incl. follow-up t/calls re same with MJC and BAK
20-Jun-05	0.4	review final application to retain Jefferies
20-Jun-05	0.4	review various emails re Mercer retention by Debtors including discussion re same with BAK; review Beckerman email to Baker & Daniels re ATA's professionals
20-Jun-05	0.1	t/call with Committee co-chair re discussions with other noteholders re financing
20-Jun-05	0.1	t/call with Ortega of Akin Gump re Committee conf call and review related emails
21-Jun-05	0.3	t/calls with SIO and BAK re Mercer; review related emails re same, including discussion with SIO re yesterday's call to F. Conway re business plan
22-Jun-05	0.4	review Greenebaum memo re Goodrich and related pleading by ATA; review BAK memo re Boeing claim
22-Jun-05	0.3	review various emails from BAK re discussions with noteholders
22-Jun-05	1.1	Committee conference call with BAK, MJC, SIO and DI to review latest developments re business plan, new financing, etc.
23-Jun-05	0.2	review emails from MJC and SIO re scheduled service
23-Jun-05	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re conf call and Mercer retention
24-Jun-05	0.6	participate in exec. recruiting committee call with MJC and M. Bell, etc.; incl. related t/calls with Committee co-chair
27-Jun-05	0.3	review BAK email to ATA re outstanding info requests and discuss with BAK
27-Jun-05	0.7	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass cash report to Committee
27-Jun-05	0.3	t/call with Committee co-chair re business plan and industry developments
27-Jun-05	0.5	series of discussions with noteholders re status of case
27-Jun-05	1.0	t/call with Beckerman re status of various projects and comments re discussions with noteholders; discuss same with BAK and SIO including t/call with F. Conway with SIO
27-Jun-05	0.2	review and respond to emails with F. Conway re conference call; emails to/from Beckerman re calls with ATA and Jefferies
27-Jun-05	0.5	review various emails re Mercer retention
28-Jun-05	0.3	review email from Denison re lease fleet; review email re lease rates in market
28-Jun-05	0.2	t/call with Schulte re Baker & Daniels comments on CEO comp term sheet
28-Jun-05	0.2	review latest term sheet re proposed Denison employment
28-Jun-05	1.7	conf call with SIO, MJC, BAK to ATA Sr mgmt re status update on business plan, fleet, revenue and Boeing claim

Date	TIME Hours	Description
28-Jun-05	2.0	t/call with Beckerman, BAK and SIO re Boeing; series of follow-up discussions re same with DI, BAK and SIO; 2nd call with BAK, SIO, DI and Akin Gump to review work program and discuss key case issues; review Akin Gump summary of Boeing settlement with ATA
28-Jun-05	0.4	review various emails re IAA settlement discussions; review letter from State of Indiana counsel re breach of DIP; t/call with Ferrante re Compass issues re Boeing
28-Jun-05	1.5	discuss strategic options and capital requirements for ATA with MJC; t/call with Carlson of Jefferies re same; t/call with Committee co-chair and other Committee members re same; t/call messages to noteholders and counsel
28-Jun-05	0.1	review Beckerman email re Jefferies retention and noteholder issues re same and related correspondence/emails re same
28-Jun-05	1.4	conference call with MJC, SIO, BAK, Akin Gump re upcoming Committee call
29-Jun-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass cash report to Committee
29-Jun-05	0.4	series of discussions with noteholders re status of case
29-Jun-05	0.2	t/call with Donohue re Ambassador intercompany payables
29-Jun-05	0.6	discuss capital requirements and raise with counsel to ad hoc noteholders committee and review with Beckerman; review Beckerman email re change to Jefferies engagement letter
29-Jun-05	2.5	discuss strategic options for ATA with BAK, DI, MJC and SIO; review strategic options for ATA including series of discussions re same including status of major claims with MJC, SIO, BAK, Beckerman and/or Committee co-chair
29-Jun-05	0.2	review Mercer bios and related email; discuss with SIO
29-Jun-05	0.2	t/call with Committee co-chair re Boeing
29-Jun-05	1.5	Committee conference call with BAK, MJC, SIO and DI to review latest developments re business plan, new financing, Boeing claim, Mercer, etc.
29-Jun-05	1.0	conversations with SIO re Denison, business plan, cost savings, schedule changes
30-Jun-05	1.0	conf call with MJC and exec compensation committee to review comments re CEO comp. term sheet
30-Jun-05	0.5	t/call with F. Conway re new business plan and Boeing claim
30-Jun-05	0.3	discuss with lessor re status of case
30-Jun-05	1.2	conf call with Beckerman, Carr and ad hoc committee of noteholders; t/calls with Beckerman to prepare for same; review follow-up emails re same
30-Jun-05	0.8	series of discussions with BAK, Beckerman, DI and MJC re strategic options, discussions with ad hoc committee noteholders, guarantee of subs to ATSB, etc.
30-Jun-05	1.5	series of discussions with BAK, Beckerman, and DI re Boeing claim; work on draft of affidavit re same with BAK; review various emails with Akin Gump re same
30-Jun-05	0.4	review BAK draft of HLT affidavit re Boeing litigation
1-Jul-05	0.3	review ATA May 2005 monthly operating report
1-Jul-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB; review Compass cash report to Committee
1-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with MJC re fleet
1-Jul-05	0.4	series of discussions with noteholders re status of case
1-Jul-05	2.0	review time records for May and June
1-Jul-05	1.8	conf call with MJC, SIO and Committee co-chair re strategic alternatives
1-Jul-05	0.4	t/calls with BAK, G. Viets, Donohue re Ambassador
1-Jul-05	0.4	review F. Conway Exhibit A deliverables
1-Jul-05	2.7	review documents re Boeing claim process and meeting with Akin Gump and discussions with BAK re same
1-Jul-05	0.5	review Committee motion for continuance of Boeing settlement hearing
5-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with MJC and DI re issues for Denison call, Boeing claim and review of May financial results; follow-up t/call message to MJC re same

Date	TIME Hours	Description
5-Jul-05	0.6	t/call with Frick re motion for aircraft; message for MJC re same; review MJC & Frick emails re lease fleet
5-Jul-05	1.4	t/call with Denison re financing, business plan and strategic options for ATA
5-Jul-05	0.4	discussion with noteholder re ATA
5-Jul-05	0.4	series of discussions with PS and BAK re ATSB claim and sub guarantees
5-Jul-05	0.4	email to/from prospective purchaser of Ambassadors; review Jefferies timetable
5-Jul-05	0.2	review bios of Mercer personnel
5-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with Committee co-chair re trading values of EETC's
5-Jul-05	1.2	t/call with Akin Gump re Boeing claim and litigation issues; review documents and analysis re same incl. t/calls and emails to/from Akin Gump
5-Jul-05	0.2	review statistical data re EETC's
5-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re debtors obligations
6-Jul-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
6-Jul-05	0.2	review MJC & SIO emails re lease fleet
6-Jul-05	1.5	discuss Boeing claim with MJC; discuss same with DI and research re same; review YTM's for operating leases with DI
6-Jul-05	1.5	series of t/calls with Beckerman, MJC and SIO re discussion with Denison and strategic alternatives
6-Jul-05	0.3	series of discussions with PS re ATSB claim and sub guarantees
6-Jul-05	0.4	review MJC and SIO emails re Mercer; review Committee statement re Jefferies
6-Jul-05	2.2	meeting at Akin Gump re Boeing litigation including t/call with MJC and Akin Gump; review DI email re Boeing 757's
7-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with Schulte re status of Denison term sheet
7-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with F. Conway re Business Plan; review various emails re 737 and 767 leases
7-Jul-05	0.2	review various emails re Indianapolis Airport Authority leases
7-Jul-05	0.2	EETC discussion with DI
7-Jul-05	0.4	discuss status of ATSB claim and sub guarantees with PS and review related emails
7-Jul-05	2.0	series of discussions with Akin Gump, MJC and DI re Boeing claim; review related emails; review related documents
8-Jul-05	0.4	review cash flow with DI and report to Committee re same
8-Jul-05	0.1	series of emails re scheduling of business plan meeting with ATA
8-Jul-05	0.4	discuss status of Denison term sheet with MJC and review related emails re same
8-Jul-05	0.2	review Akin Gump summary re Kent County claim for admin. expenses
8-Jul-05	0.4	discuss IAA leases with BAK and email to Beckerman re same; review Beckerman response re same
8-Jul-05	0.2	series of discussions with PS re ATSB claim and sub guarantees
8-Jul-05	0.2	EETC discussion with DI
8-Jul-05	4.0	prepare for Boeing claim litigation incl. discussions with and meeting at Akin Gump, multiple discussions with BAK, MJC and DI; review various documents re same incl. Committee objection to same
8-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with SIO re lease cost valuation
9-Jul-05	0.2	review and respond to series of emails re Denison term sheet and next Exec. Recruiting Meeting
9-Jul-05	0.1	review latest court docket
9-Jul-05	0.6	series of discussions with Akin Gump re Boeing claim and litigation preparation; review related emails re same
10-Jul-05	0.2	review F. Conway emails re IAA and due diligence
10-Jul-05	8.0	prepare for Boeing claim litigation including preparation of expert report with DI and series of meetings at Akin Gump, including EETC discussion with DI and Sean O'Donnell; continue working in Indianapolis with MJC
10-Jul-05	4.0	travel to Indianapolis from New York for Boeing hearing and depositions



Date	TIME Hours	Description
11-Jul-05	1.0	conf call with exec compensation committee to review comments re CEO comp. term sheet and discussion with representatives of Debtor
11-Jul-05	0.2	t/call with Schulte re Denison compensation
11-Jul-05	0.3	review series of emails re IAA and HQ leases
11-Jul-05	1.2	continue to prepare for Boeing claim litigation including preparation of expert report with DI and series of meetings at Akin Gump; continue working in Indianapolis with MJC
11-Jul-05	2.3	follow up work and discussions (incl. at dinner) re Boeing claim and ongoing litigations; series of discussions re settlement with Akin Gump team, BAK and MJC incl. t/call with BAK
11-Jul-05	7.0	attend Frick deposition with MJC re Boeing claim at Sommer Barnard
12-Jul-05	0.2	series of emails to/from Beckerman re July 18 meeting with ATA in Indy
12-Jul-05	0.2	review various emails re changes to lease fleet
12-Jul-05	0.5	conf call with MJC to exec compensation committee to review comments re CEO comp. term sheet and discussion with representatives of Debtor
12-Jul-05	2.0	work on Boeing claim calculation with MJC and BAK, including discussion with MJC, BAK and DR
12-Jul-05	4.0	series of discussions with Akin Gump team re settlement parameters with Boeing; attend related session at Sommer Barnard including discussions with Beckerman, Committee members, MJC, and review of proposed settlement documents
12-Jul-05	0.4	discuss with Committee co-chair implications of Boeing claim on creditor pool
12-Jul-05	0.8	Committee conf call with MJC and SIO to review proposed settlement parameters with Boeing
13-Jul-05	0.5	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
13-Jul-05	0.5	coordinate items for upcoming meetings with ATA re business plan with BAK
13-Jul-05	0.2	review series of emails re IAA and HQ leases
13-Jul-05	0.3	discuss ATSB sub guarantee issue with PS and review related email
13-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re upcoming meeting on business plan
13-Jul-05	0.4	series of discussions with Committee members re business plan and implications for creditors
13-Jul-05	4.5	travel from Indianapolis to New York after Boeing hearing and depositions
14-Jul-05	1.3	t/call with F. Conway and emails from/to F. Conway re status of business plan; review emails re lease fleet
14-Jul-05	1.5	series of conversations with SIO, BAK and MJC re conversations with F. Conway; t/call message to Beckerman re same; discussion with Committee members re business plan and capital raise implications
14-Jul-05	0.3	update SIO on status of Boeing claim and discuss upcoming meetings re business plan; review related emails re upcoming meeting at ATA
14-Jul-05	0.3	review Akin Gump memo re IAA and HQ lease
14-Jul-05	0.4	review Southwest analyst call transcript re ATA
14-Jul-05	0.6	series of discussions re ATSB guarantee claims with PS; review PS email to Smith of ATA re same
14-Jul-05	1.0	Committee conference call with BAK, SIO, MJC, DI; discuss IAA issues, Exec. comp issues, implications of business plan; ATSB guarantees
15-Jul-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
15-Jul-05	0.6	prepare for upcoming meeting with Company including review of prior business plans
15-Jul-05	1.6	t/call with F. Conway re business plan and schedule for follow-up; review related emails; discuss same on series of t/calls with Beckerman, SIO and Committee co-chair; review press release on announced cost savings
15-Jul-05	1.0	t/calls with noteholders re status of ATA and press release re maintenance savings
15-Jul-05	0.1	review Beckerman email re extension to file ATSB objection and IAA

Date	TIME Hours	Description
15-Jul-05	0.4	review Committee filings re Indianapolis Airport Authority lease and related emails
15-Jul-05	0.5	series of discussions re ATSB guarantee claims with PS; discuss same with Beckerman
17-Jul-05	0.2	review Beckerman letter to Carr re Mikelsons arrangement
17-Jul-05	0.1	review email re IAA settlement discussions
18-Jul-05	4.5	travel to Indianapolis from New York re ATA meetings
18-Jul-05	4.5	meetings with ATA management, BAK, SIO, MJC, Jefferies/Skyworks, Southwest, ATSB, and Committee professionals and co-chairs Southwest for presentation and discussion of business plan for 2005 and 2006; including follow-up discussion at dinner with Committee professionals and co-chair
18-Jul-05	0.3	t/calls with noteholders re status of ATA and press release re maintenance savings
19-Jul-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
19-Jul-05	4.5	travel from Indianapolis to New York after ATA meetings
19-Jul-05	0.1	t/call with Ferrante of Akin Gump re document for report to Committee
20-Jul-05	0.3	discuss cash flow report with DI and review same
20-Jul-05	1.0	conf call with Eric Schaffer and Tom Korsman, DI and BAK
20-Jul-05	0.4	review various emails and term sheet for CEO
20-Jul-05	0.4	review financial projections with BAK
20-Jul-05	0.4	review various emails re lease fleet and discuss with SIO
20-Jul-05	0.5	follow-up discussions re strategic alternatives with SIO and MJC
20-Jul-05	1.0	t/call with Thane Carlston of Jefferies to review capital raising issues with SIO; follow-up discussion re strategic alternatives with SIO
20-Jul-05	1.8	Committee conf call to discuss IAA potential deal and Compass review of business plan
21-Jul-05	0.2	review various emails re lease fleet
21-Jul-05	0.8	discuss business plan due diligence with BAK; t/call with F. Conway re same incl. emails from and to F. Conway
21-Jul-05	0.3	review Akin Gump summary memo on IAA
21-Jul-05	0.7	series of discussions re strategic alternatives with SIO and MJC; discuss same with Committee co-chair
21-Jul-05	0.2	review BAK emails with noteholders re info request and discuss with BAK
22-Jul-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
22-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re Mercer; review and respond to series of emails re scheduling and agenda for same
22-Jul-05	0.2	review emails re Ambassador
22-Jul-05	0.8	t/call with BAK re meeting at ATA; series of emails and discussions with F. Conway and BAK re same
22-Jul-05	0.2	t/calls with SIO re proposed meeting in Indy with company management
23-Jul-05	0.3	series of emails to/from SIO re meeting with ATA and agenda
24-Jul-05	1.3	series of t/calls with F. Conway, SIO and MJC re agenda for July 25 meeting; review and respond to emails re same with F. Conway and SIO; t/calls with SIO and MJC re same
24-Jul-05	5.0	travel to Indianapolis from Boston
25-Jul-05	0.2	review emails re proposed Mercer conf call
25-Jul-05	0.5	review latest draft of IAA settlement and discuss with BAK; review update re Goodrich
25-Jul-05	4.5	meeting at ATA with F. Conway, BAK, MJC, SIO to review business plan including dinner meeting with ATA senior mgmt re same
25-Jul-05	1.0	review publicly filed information regarding US Airways and America West
25-Jul-05	0.5	review Akin Gump email re pending fee application of Baker and Daniels
25-Jul-05	0.2	discussion with SIO re Jefferies offering memo
26-Jul-05	0.2	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB

Date	TIME Hours	Description
26-Jul-05	4.5	meeting at ATA with BAK, MJC, F. Conway to review business plan incl. dinner meeting with ATA senior mgmt re same
26-Jul-05	4.0	travel from Indianapolis to NYC with BAK
26-Jul-05	0.5	series of t/calls with SIO, MJC and BAK re capital raise
26-Jul-05	0.5	t/calls with noteholders re status of ATA and press release re maintenance savings
26-Jul-05	0.6	review Ambassador information memo and related emails
27-Jul-05	0.5	review and respond to series of emails re Denison employment; review proposed term sheet re Mikelsons
27-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with ALPA Committee member re status of ALPA concerns
27-Jul-05	0.2	review various emails re IAA and discuss with BAK
27-Jul-05	1.5	series of t/calls and/or discussions with SIO, MJC, Schulte, BAK, and H. Shin re capital raise and strategic options; review Jefferies proposed investor list; review Beckerman email re same; review Schulte and MJC emails re same
27-Jul-05	1.5	t/calls with noteholders re status of ATA and press release re maintenance savings
27-Jul-05	0.2	review emails re Ambassador
28-Jul-05	0.2	review Compass weekly report on cash
28-Jul-05	0.6	series of emails with Beckerman, F. Conway, etc. re due diligence and Compass list of initiatives for ATA
28-Jul-05	0.3	review various emails re Denison employment contract
28-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with Beckerman re BETACO, Mercer and capital raise; discuss BETACO with BAK
28-Jul-05	0.7	t/calls with noteholders re status of ATA and press release re maintenance savings
28-Jul-05	0.7	discuss IAA settlement with BAK; review BAK analysis re same; discuss use of Mikelsons yacht with BAK and review related analysis
28-Jul-05	0.2	follow-up discussion re alternatives with SIO
28-Jul-05	1.0	series of t/calls and/or discussions with SIO, MJC, and Committee members re capital raise and strategic options
28-Jul-05	1.3	Committee conference call with BAK, SIO, MJC, DI re IAA settlement, CEO comp and JGM severance package
28-Jul-05	0.2	t/calls with SIO and MJC re offering memo
29-Jul-05	0.4	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
29-Jul-05	0.2	series of emails to/from F. Conway incl. t/call messages re continuing due diligence on business plan and financing
29-Jul-05	2.5	review time records for June and July
29-Jul-05	0.4	t/call with Arthur re industry fundamentals and new financing for ATA
29-Jul-05	0.2	review BAK email re update on Ambassador sale process
31-Jul-05	0.2	series of emails with Beckerman and F. Conway re Mercer discussion
31-Jul-05	0.2	review email from Beckerman re status of IAA
1-Aug-05	0.4	t/call to/from F.Conway re follow-up on due diligence; emails to/from F.Conway re same; review and respond to related email from Beckerman re Mercer
1-Aug-05	0.1	review email from BAK to ATA re BETACO
1-Aug-05	0.3	review series of emails re IAA and ATA HQ incl. email re same from BAK
1-Aug-05	0.3	review email re Ambassador and email to Committee professionals re Ambassador
1-Aug-05	0.6	t/call with Noteholders re status of company financing; review and reply to various emails re Jefferies offering memo
1-Aug-05	0.3	review UST objection to Committee professional's fees
1-Aug-05	0.2	emails to/from BAK re Committee valuation report
2-Aug-05	0.3	review weekly and daily reporting packages for the ATSB
2-Aug-05	0.4	review June 2005 monthly operating report
2-Aug-05	0.1	review email from F. Conway re call on Mercer
2-Aug-05	1.2	conf call with BAK, MJC, SIO and ATA re Mercer
2-Aug-05	0.4	series of t/calls with Beckerman re Jefferies memo and Mikelsons data